EXHIBIT D

Skadden, Arps, Slate, Meagher & Flom IIp and affiliates

Spansion Inc. 915 DeGuigne Drive Sunnyvale, California 94085 Attn: Nancy Richardson June 28, 2010 Bill No.: 1320504

TIN: 13-1777230

PLEASE REMIT TO:			
By Check:	SASM & F LLP P.O. Box 1764 White Plains, NY 10602	<u>By Wire</u> :	In US Dollars to: Citibank, N.A., New York A.B.A. Number: 021000089 Swift Code: CITIUS33 For Credit To Account: 30060143 Reference Bill No.: 1320504

Invoice #: 1320504

Re: Corporate Advice, Financing and Special Projects

TO PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDERED from April 1, 2010 through May 10, 2010, as set forth in the attached Summary of Services as follows:

Business Operations / Strategic Planning

Fees	\$20,302.50
Charges and Disbursements	7.11
Total Business Operations / Strategic Planning	\$20,309.61

Claims Admin. (General)

Fees	\$4,599.50
Charges and Disbursements	39.20
Total Claims Admin. (General)	\$4,638.70

PAYMENT DUE UPON RECEIPT. ***

MAY INCLUDE PROFESSIONAL SERVICES, CHARGES AND DISBURSEMENTS FROM AFFILIATES.

* * *

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES, CHARGES AND DISBURSEMENTS WHICH HAVE NOT BEEN RECORDED AS OF THE ABOVE DATE WILL BE BILLED SUBSEQUENTLY.

Spansion Inc. Omnibus Statement (May, 2010) June 28, 2010 - Summary Page 2

Executory Contracts (Personalty)

Fees	\$3,625.50
Charges and Disbursements	0.00
Total Executory Contracts (Personalty)	\$3,625.50

General Corporate Advice

Fees	\$805.50
Charges and Disbursements	0.00
Total General Corporate Advice	\$805.50

Intellectual Property

Fees	\$268.50
Charges and Disbursements	0.00
Total Intellectual Property	\$268.50

Litigation (General)

Fees	\$132,033.50
Charges and Disbursements	7,148.74
Total Litigation (General)	\$139,182.24

Nonworking Travel Time

Fees	\$895.00
Charges and Disbursements	0.00
Total Nonworking Travel Time	\$895.00

Spansion Inc. Omnibus Statement (May, 2010) June 28, 2010 - Summary Page 3

Regulatory and SEC Matters

Fees	\$2,172.50
Charges and Disbursements	6.16
Total Regulatory and SEC Matters	\$2,178.66

Reorganization Plan / Plan Sponsors

Fees	\$46,051.00
Charges and Disbursements	1,295.02
Total Reorganization Plan / Plan Sponsors	\$47,346.02

Retention / Fee Matters (SASM&F)

Fees	\$30,408.50
Charges and Disbursements	36.62
Total Retention / Fee Matters (SASM&F)	\$30,445.12

Total Fees	\$241,162.00
Total Charges and Disbursements	8,532.85
Grand Total\$	249,694.85

MATTER #1 General Corporate Advice		Bill No	o: 1320504
NAME	RATE	HOURS	TOTAL
PARTNER			
VAN C. DURRER II	\$895	0.90	\$ <u>805.50</u>
TOTAL PARTNER		0.90	\$805.50
MATTER TOTAL		0.90	<u>\$805.50</u>

MATTER #3 Business Operations / Strategic	ATTER #3 Business Operations / Strategic Planning		No: 1320504
NAME	RATE	HOURS	TOTAL
PARTNER			
VAN C. DURRER II	\$895	6.60	\$_5,907.00
TOTAL PARTNER		6.60	\$ 5,907.00
ASSOCIATES			
NATHANIEL E. JACKSON	\$630	2.10	\$ 1,323.00
EMILY C. MA	575	9.30	5,347.50
TOTAL ASSOCIATES		11.40	\$ 6,670.50
BENGOSHI			
HAJIME KANAGAWA	\$680	7.30	\$ 4,964.00
YOSHIKO NAKAYAMA	680	0.20	136.00
TOMOKO SHIMAMURA	525	5.00	2,625.00
TOTAL BENGOSHI		12.50	\$ 7,725.00
MATTER TOTAL		30.50	<u>\$20,302.50</u>

MATTER #5 Claims Admin. (General)	n. (General) Bill No: 13		
NAME	RATE	HOURS	TOTAL
PARTNER			
VAN C. DURRER II	\$895	2.10	\$ <u>1,879.50</u>
TOTAL PARTNER		2.10	\$1,879.50
ASSOCIATE			
DAVIS L. WRIGHT	\$680	4.00	\$ <u>2,720.00</u>
TOTAL ASSOCIATE		4.00	\$2,720.00
MATTER TOTAL		<u>6.10</u>	<u>\$4,599.50</u>

MATTER #8 Executory Contracts (Personalty)		Bill No:	1320504
NAME	RATE	HOURS	TOTAL
PARTNER			
VAN C. DURRER II	\$895	<u>0.10</u> \$	89.50
TOTAL PARTNER		0.10 \$	89.50
ASSOCIATE			
DAVIS L. WRIGHT	\$680	<u>5.20</u> \$	<u>3,536.00</u>
TOTAL ASSOCIATE		5.20	3,536.00
MATTER TOTAL		<u>5.30</u>	3,625.50

MATTER #10 Intellectual Property		Bill No	o: 1320504
NAME	RATE	HOURS	TOTAL
PARTNER			
VAN C. DURRER II	\$895	0.30	\$ <u>268.50</u>
TOTAL PARTNER		0.30	\$268.50
MATTER TOTAL		0.30	<u>\$268.50</u>

MATTER #12 Litigation (General)		Bill No: 1320504		
NAME	RATE	HOURS	TOTAL	
PARTNER				
VAN C. DURRER II	\$895	1.10	\$984.50	
TOTAL PARTNER		1.10	\$ 984.50	
ASSOCIATES				
JOSHUA J. BUGAY YOSEF IBRAHIMI NATHANIEL L. ROWE SUNDEEP S. SIDHU JARRETT VINE DAVIS L. WRIGHT TOTAL ASSOCIATES	\$420 485 575 420 420 680	24.40 35.70 0.70 20.40 37.50 85.10 203.80	<pre>\$ 10,248.00 17,314.50 402.50 8,568.00 15,750.00 57,868.00</pre>	
CLIENT SPECIALIST				
CHRISTINE H. INGRAM	\$345	32.10	\$ 11,074.50	
TOTAL CLIENT SPECIALIST		32.10	\$ 11,074.50	
LEGAL ASSISTANTS				
LEGAL ASSISTANT @	\$295	33.30	\$9,823.50	
TOTAL LEGAL ASSISTANTS		33.30	\$ 9,823.50	
MATTER TOTAL		<u>270.30</u>	<u>\$132,033.50</u>	

MATTER #14 Nonworking Travel Time		Bill No	o: 1320504
NAME	RATE	HOURS	TOTAL
PARTNER			
VAN C. DURRER II	\$448	2.00	\$ <u>895.00</u>
TOTAL PARTNER		2.00	\$895.00
MATTER TOTAL		2.00	<u>\$895.00</u>

MATTER #15 Regulatory and SEC Matters		Bill No:	1320504
NAME	RATE	HOURS	TOTAL
PARTNERS			
ANTHONY W. CLARK VAN C. DURRER II	\$975 895	0.10 \$ <u>1.00</u>	97.50 895.00
TOTAL PARTNERS		1.10 \$	992.50
LEGAL ASSISTANTS			
LEGAL ASSISTANT @	\$295	<u>4.00</u> \$	1,180.00
TOTAL LEGAL ASSISTANTS		4.00 \$	1,180.00
MATTER TOTAL		<u>5.10</u> \$	2,172.50

MATTER #16 Reorganization Plan / Plan Sponsors			l No: 1320504
NAME	RATE	HOURS	TOTAL
PARTNERS			
ANTHONY W. CLARK VAN C. DURRER II	\$975 895	6.00 <u>13.10</u>	\$ 5,850.00 <u>11,724.50</u>
TOTAL PARTNERS		19.10	\$17,574.50
COUNSEL			
HIROSHI SARUMIDA	\$795	4.80	\$ <u>3,816.00</u>
TOTAL COUNSEL		4.80	\$ 3,816.00
ASSOCIATES			
JOSHUA J. BUGAY MEREDITH R. EDELMAN EMILY C. MA DAVIS L. WRIGHT	\$420 525 575 680	5.10 3.00 1.30 29.70	\$ 2,142.00 1,575.00 747.50 20,196.00
TOTAL ASSOCIATES		39.10	\$24,660.50
MATTER TOTAL		<u>63.00</u>	<u>\$46,051.00</u>

MATTER #18 Retention / Fee Matters (SASM&F)	1	Bill	l No: 1320504
NAME	RATE	HOURS	TOTAL
ASSOCIATES			
KIMBERLY JAIMEZ TODD TRUITT DAVIS L. WRIGHT	\$485 575 680	15.20 13.50 20.90	\$ 7,372.00 7,762.50 <u>14,212.00</u>
TOTAL ASSOCIATES		49.60	\$29,346.50
LEGAL ASSISTANTS			
LEGAL ASSISTANT @	\$295	3.60	\$ <u>1,062.00</u>
TOTAL LEGAL ASSISTANTS		3.60	\$ 1,062.00
MATTER TOTAL		<u>53.20</u>	<u>\$30,408.50</u>
CLIENT TOTAL		<u>436.70</u>	<u>\$241,162.00</u>

Spansion Inc. General Corporate A	Advice		Bill Date: 06/28/10 Bill Number: 1320504
NAME	DATE	HOURS	DESCRIPTION
DURRER II VC	04/09/10	0.30	ANALYSIS RE NEW DIRECTOR QUESTIONS RE EXIT FROM BANKRUPTCY (.3).
DURRER II VC	04/13/10	0.60	CALL WITH R. BINGHAM, K. KING AND R. MARMARO RE GENERAL BOARD ISSUES.
		0.90	
Total Partner		0.90	
MATTER TOTAL		<u>0.90</u>	

Spansion Inc. Business Operation	s / Strategic 1	Planning	Bill Date: 06/28/10 Bill Number: 1320504
NAME	DATE	HOURS	DESCRIPTION
DURRER II VC	04/01/10	0.50	CALL WITH A. GALLO RE JAPAN EQUIPMENT FOR SALE (.1); CALL WITH J. ASHBY AND R. KATHURIA RE BIDDING FOR EQUIPMENT IN JAPAN (.3); PREPARE MEMO TO P. JIMENEZ RE SAME (.1).
DURRER II VC	04/05/10	0.50	CALL WITH J. ASHBY RE STRUCTURING ISSUES RE BID FOR JAPAN ASSETS (.2); RESEARCH RE SAME (.3).
DURRER II VC	04/06/10	0.20	ANALYSIS RE CORRESPONDENCE WITH J. ASHBY RE JAPAN LABOR ISSUES (.1); ANALYSIS RE POTENTIAL BID FOR JAPAN ASSETS (.1).
DURRER II VC	04/07/10	0.10	ANALYSIS RE JAPAN LABOR ISSUE (.1).
DURRER II VC	04/08/10	0.80	REVIEW AND REVISE TERM SHEET FOR PURCHASE OF SPANSION JAPAN EQUIPMENT (.7); CORRESPOND WITH J. ASHBY RE SAME (.1).
DURRER II VC	04/09/10	0.30	ANALYSIS RE SPANSION JAPAN LABOR ISSUES (.1); ANALYSIS RE TIMING OF CLOSING AND CONFIRMATION IMPACT (.1); ANALYSIS RE BID FOR SPANSION JAPAN EQUIPMENT (.1).
DURRER II VC	04/14/10	0.20	CALL WITH R. FURR AND J. ASHBY RE COOPERATION WITH SPANSION JAPAN AND CLOSING ISSUES.
DURRER II VC	04/18/10	0.10	ANALYSIS RE EMPLOYEE NOTICE IN JAPAN (.1).
DURRER II VC	04/21/10	0.90	CALL WITH P. JIMENEZ AND GE COUNSEL RE CLOSING MECHANICS (.3); CONFERENCE CALL WITH J. ASHBY AND R. FURR RE SAME (.5); ANALYSIS RE SAME (.1).
DURRER II VC	04/22/10	0.50	CALL WITH R. FURR AND J. ASHBY RE CLOSING UNDER SETTLEMENT WITH SPANSION JAPAN (.2); CALL WITH G. LUNT RE SAME (.2); ANALYSIS RE SAME (.1).

DURRER II VC	04/23/10	0.20	ANALYSIS RE CHANGES TO SPANSION JAPAN SETTLEMENT IMPLEMENTATION DOCUMENTS (.2).
DURRER II VC	04/27/10	0.40	CALL WITH P. JIMENEZ RE CLOSING ISSUES AND TIMING OF PAYMENTS (.2); ANALYSIS RE SIGNING OF DOCUMENTS (.2).
DURRER II VC	04/28/10	0.10	CALL WITH N. RICHARDSON RE CLOSING OF APA (.1).
DURRER II VC	04/29/10	0.30	ANALYSIS RE SIGNATURE PAGES FOR IMPLEMENTING DOCUMENTS UNDER SPANSION JAPAN SETTLEMENT (.2); ANALYSIS RE INTEREST CALCULATION FOR SJ PAYMENT (.1).
DURRER II VC	05/04/10	0.30	ANALYSIS RE TIMING OF CLOSING SPANSION JAPAN SETTLEMENT (.3).
DURRER II VC	05/07/10	0.50	ANALYSIS RE CLOSING ISSUES UNDER JAPAN PLAN (.3); CALL WITH M. LEE RE SAME (.2).
DURRER II VC	05/10/10	0.70	CORRESPOND WITH J. FROST-DAVIES AND J. ASHBY RE CLOSING (.3); ANALYSIS RE GE WITHDRAWAL (.2); COMMUNICATE WITH P. JIMENEZ RE SAME (.1); ANALYSIS RE NOTICE OF EFFECTIVE DATE ON CLOSING UNDER APA (.1).
		6.60	
Total Partner		6.60	
JACKSON NE	04/01/10	0.40	REVIEW AND REVISION OF INTERCOMPANY AGREEMENT.
JACKSON NE	04/19/10	0.30	REVIEW AND DISTRIBUTION OF TRANSACTION DOCUMENTS.
JACKSON NE	05/06/10	1.40	PREPARATION OF BILL OF SALE AND ASSIGNMENT AND ASSUMPTION AGREEMENT.
		2.10	
MA EC	04/27/10	1.90	FINALIZE DEFINITIVE AGREEMENTS FOR EXECUTION.
MA EC	04/28/10	0.50	FINALIZE TECHNICAL SUPPORT AGREEMENT (.3); CIRCULATE

Skadden, Arps, Slate, Meagher & Flom IIp and affiliates ATTORNEY WORK PRODUCT PRIVILEGED AND CONFIDENTIAL 04/29/10 5.80 REVISE APA AND TSA (3.7); MA EC RECIRCULATE DEFINITIVE AGREEMENTS TO SPANSION JAPAN FOR SIGNATURE; CIRCULATE TO SPANSION WORD VERSIONS OF DEFINITIVE AGREEMENTS (1.8); CIRCULATE COMPLETE EXECUTED COPIES OF DEFINITIVE AGREEMENTS (.3). MA EC 04/30/10 0.30 REVIEW PACKAGE OF EXECUTED DEFINITIVE AGREEMENTS SENT FROM SPANSION. MA EC 05/10/10 0.80 COMPILE EXECUTED DEFINITIVE AGREEMENTS AND SEND TO SPANSION AND SPANSION JAPAN. 9.30 Total Associate 11.40 04/05/10 0.20 CHECK CORRESPONDENCES REGARDING KANAGAWA H THE AVOIDANCE RISK UNDER JAPANESE BANKRUPTCY LAW IN CONNECTION WITH THE PURCHASE AND LEASE BACK TRANSACTION WITH JAPANESE INSOLVENT COMPANY. KANAGAWA H 04/06/10 3.50 RESEARCH ON JAPANESE BANKRUPTCY LAW REGARDING WITH THE PURCHASE AND LEASE BACK TRANSACTION WITH JAPANESE INSOLVENT COMPANY; REVIEW EMAIL QUESTION FROM MR. ASHBY AND SEND THE EMAIL ANALYSIS TO HIM. 1.00 REVIEW RESEARCH MATERIAL REGARDING KANAGAWA H 04/07/10 LABOR LAW ISSUE RAISED BY. KANAGAWA H 04/08/10 0.70 REVIEW RESEARCH REPORT FROM T. SHIMAMURA ON JAPANESE LABOR LAW AND MAKE COMMENTS; INSTRUCTION TO T. SHIMAMURA TO REVISE REPORT. KANAGAWA H 04/09/10 1.90 REVIEW DRAFT EMAIL ANALYSIS ON LABOR LAW ISSUE ASSOCIATED WITH POSSIBLE ACQUISITION OF SPANSION JAPAN'S ASSET. 7.30 NAKAYAMA Y 04/07/10 0.20 REVIEW RESEARCH BY SHIMAMURA; SEND MAIL TO KANAGAWA RE: LABOR LAW QUESTION. 0.20

SHIMAMURA T	04/07/10	3.10	RESEARCH RE: JAPANESE LABOR LAW, WHETHER THE ARRANGEMENT IS AVAILABLE THAT CONSIGNING TEST EQUIPMENT TO A COMPANY WHICH WILL PROVIDE SERVICES TO THE OWNER OF THE EQUIPMENT USING THE EQUIPMENT.
SHIMAMURA T	04/08/10	0.80	RESEARCH RE: JAPANESE LABOR LAW, WHETHER THE ARRANGEMENT IS AVAILABLE THAT CONSIGNING TEST EQUIPMENT TO A COMPANY WHICH WILL PROVIDE SERVICES TO THE OWNER OF THE EQUIPMENT USING THE EQUIPMENT, INCLUDING CALL WITH TOKYO LABOR DEPARTMENT.
SHIMAMURA T	04/09/10	1.10	REVISE THE DRAFT OF CORRESPONDENCE OF RESEARCH RE JAPANESE LABOR LAW.
		5.00	
Total Bengoshi		12.50	
MATTER TOTAL		30.50	

Spansion Inc. Claims Admin. (General)

Bill Date: 06/28/10 Bill Number: 1320504

NAME	DATE	HOURS	DESCRIPTION
DURRER II VC	04/02/10	0.40	ANALYSIS RE CLAIM RESERVE UNDER PLAN AND STIPULATION RE SAME (.4).
DURRER II VC	04/12/10	0.20	CALL WITH P. JIMENEZ RE APRIL 26 HEARING (.1); ANALYSIS RE SCHEDULING ORDER (.1).
DURRER II VC	04/14/10	0.10	ANALYSIS RE CLAIM STIPULATION.
DURRER II VC	04/20/10	0.40	ANALYSIS RE SETTLEMENT PAYMENT ISSUE (.2); COMMUNICATE WITH P. JIMENEZ RE SAME (.2).
DURRER II VC	04/23/10	0.30	ANALYSIS RE CLAIMS RESERVE STIPULATION (.3).
DURRER II VC	04/26/10	0.20	ANALYSIS RE OUTCOME OF CLAIMS HEARING (.2).
DURRER II VC	04/28/10	0.30	ANALYSIS RE DISCOVERY RESPONSES (.2); CALL WITH B. HAMILTON RE SAME (.1).
DURRER II VC	05/05/10	0.20	CALL WITH P. JIMENEZ RE TIMING OF SETTLEMENT PAYMENTS (.1); PREPARE MEMO TO J. ASHBY RE SAME (.1).
		2.10	
Total Partner		2.10	
WRIGHT DL	04/02/10	1.40	REVISE STIPULATION WITHDRAWING FIFTH OMNIBUS CLAIM OBJECTION TO SPANSION JAPAN'S ORIGINAL CLAIM AND AMENDED CLAIM (.8); REVIEW COMMENTS FROM SPANSION JAPAN TO STIPULATION (.6).
WRIGHT DL	04/09/10	0.40	DRAFT CORRESPONDENCE TO P. JIMENEZ REGARDING ADDITIONAL LANGUAGE TO CLAIM OBJECTION STIPULATION REQUESTED BY THE UCC (.4).

WRIGHT DL	04/14/10	1.50	FINALIZE STIPULATION WITH SPANSION JAPAN REGARDING WITHDRAW OF CLAIM OBJECTION (.8); REVISE CERTIFICATION OF COUNSEL AND ORDER REGARDING SAME (.3); RESPOND TO INQUIRIES FROM DUANE MORRIS REGARDING REVISIONS TO APRIL 16TH HEARING AGENDA (.2); DRAFT EMAIL TO J. GITTO REGARDING FILING OF STIPULATION (.2).
WRIGHT DL	04/16/10	0.70	RESPOND TO INQUIRIES REGARDING CLAIM WITHDRAW STIPULATION (.3); ATTENDING CONFIRMATION HEARING TO PROVIDE COPIES OF STIPULATION TO RELEVANT PARTIES (.4).
		4.00	
Total Associate		4.00	
MATTER TOTAL		<u>6.10</u>	

Spansion Inc. Executory Contracts	(Personalty)		Bill Date: 06/28/10 Bill Number: 1320504
NAME	DATE	HOURS	DESCRIPTION
DURRER II VC	04/09/10	0.10	CORRESPOND WITH P. JIMENEZ RE R&D AGREEMENT CURE CLAIM (.1).
		0.10	
Total Partner		0.10	
WRIGHT DL	04/02/10	2.40	TELECONFERENCE WITH J. GITTO REGARDING CURE STIPULATION (.3); DRAFT EMAIL CORRESPONDENCE TO J. ASHBY AND M. LU REGARDING ADDITIONAL INFORMATION REQUESTED BY UCC REGARDING EFFECT OF CURE STIPULATION (.3); REVIEW RESPONSES TO SAME (.8); DRAFT EMAIL CORRESPONDENCE TO J. GITTO RESPONDING TO QUESTIONS (1.0).
WRIGHT DL	04/09/10	2.80	REVISE CURE/R&D ASSUMPTION STIPULATION AND CIRCULATE FINAL VERSION TO SPANSION JAPAN (1.3); REVISE CERTIFICATION OF COUNSEL REGARDING SAME (.5); SUPERVISE FILING OF SAME (.4); DRAFT CORRESPONDENCE(S) TO J. GITTO REGARDING CLAIM OBJECTION WITHDRAW STIPULATION (.6).
		5.20	
Total Associate		5.20	
MATTER TOTAL		<u>5.30</u>	

Spansion Inc. Intellectual Property

Bill Date: 06/28/10 Bill Number: 1320504

NAME	DATE	HOURS	DESCRIPTION
DURRER II VC	04/19/10	0.30	ANALYSIS RE COORDINATION OF DEFENSE OF INTELLECTUAL PROPERTY LITIGATION WITH SAMSUNG (.1); CALL WITH N. RICHARDSON RE SAME (.2).
		0.30	
Total Partner		0.30	
MATTER TOTAL		<u>0.30</u>	

Spansion Inc. Litigation (General)

Bill Date: 06/28/10 Bill Number: 1320504

NAME	DATE	HOURS	DESCRIPTION
DURRER II VC	04/19/10	0.90	CALL WITH J. GITTO RE JAPAN LITIGATION SCHEDULE (.1); CALL WITH SENIOR NOTES COUNSEL RE SAME (.2); ANALYSIS RE REPLY TO SPANSION JAPAN REQUEST FOR LITIGATION SCHEDULING ORDER (.6).
DURRER II VC	04/20/10	0.20	CORRESPOND WITH P. JIMENEZ RE SPANSION JAPAN SCHEDULING REQUEST (.2).
		1.10	
Total Partner		1.10	
BUGAY JJ	05/04/10	1.10	REVIEW MATERIALS AND BACKGROUND INFORMATION RE: DOCUMENT SUBPOENA.
BUGAY JJ	05/05/10	8.40	BEGIN TO REVIEW DOCUMENTS RE: REJECTION DAMAGES DISCOVERY.
BUGAY JJ	05/06/10	7.10	CONTINUE TO REVIEW DOCUMENTS IN CONNECTION WITH SPANSION JAPAN REJECTION DAMAGES DOCUMENT REQUEST.
BUGAY JJ	05/07/10	2.10	CONTINUE TO REVIEW DOCUMENTS IN CONNECTION WITH LATEST SPANSION JAPAN REQUEST (2.1).
BUGAY JJ	05/10/10	5.70	REVIEW DOCUMENTS RE: SPANSION JAPAN'S REJECTION DAMAGES REQUEST (5.7).
		24.40	
IBRAHIMI Y	05/05/10	6.70	REVIEW OF DOCUMENTS IN RESPONSE TO SPJ DOCUMENT REQUESTS.
IBRAHIMI Y	05/06/10	7.20	CONTINUE DOCUMENT REVIEW (SECOND FOLDER) IN RESPONSE TO SPANSION JAPAN'S DOCUMENT REQUEST.
IBRAHIMI Y	05/07/10	7.70	CONTINUE DOCUMENT REVIEW IN RESPONSE TO SPANSION JAPAN DOCUMENT REQUEST; REVIEW AND COMPLETE THORODDSEN FOLDER; BEGIN REVIEW OF ASHBY FOLDER.

IBRAHIMI Y	05/08/10	5.20	CONTINUE DOCUMENT REVIEW IN RESPONSE TO SPANSION JAPAN'S DOCUMENT REQUEST.
IBRAHIMI Y	05/09/10	3.50	CONTINUE DOCUMENT REVIEW IN RESPONSE TO SPANSION JAPAN'S DOCUMENT REQUEST.
IBRAHIMI Y	05/10/10	5.40	CONTINUE DOCUMENT REVIEW IN RESPONSE TO SPANSION JAPAN'S REQUEST FOR DOCUMENT PRODUCTION.
		35.70	
ROWE NL	04/08/10	0.30	REVIEWING EMAIL OF T. SHIMAMURA; CALL WITH H. KANAGAWA REGARDING EMAIL.
ROWE NL	04/09/10	0.40	REVIEWING ENGLISH EMAIL OF T. SHIMAMURA.
		0.70	
SIDHU SS	05/05/10	3.80	REVIEW SPANSION DOCUMENTS FOR PURPOSES OF RESPONSE TO SPANSION JAPAN REQUEST FOR PRODUCTION OF DOCUMENTS.
SIDHU SS	05/06/10	4.50	REVIEW SPANSION DOCUMENTS FOR PURPOSES OF RESPONSE TO SPANSION JAPAN REQUEST FOR PRODUCTION OF DOCUMENTS.
SIDHU SS	05/07/10	4.80	REVIEW SPANSION DOCUMENTS FOR PURPOSES OF RESPONSE TO SPANSION JAPAN REQUEST FOR PRODUCTION OF DOCUMENTS.
SIDHU SS	05/10/10	7.30	REVIEW SPANSION DOCUMENTS FOR PURPOSES OF RESPONSE TO SPANSION JAPAN REQUEST FOR PRODUCTION OF DOCUMENTS.
		20.40	
VINE J	04/06/10	1.20	REVIEW CONFIRMATION OPINION (1.2).
VINE J	05/04/10	0.80	DOCUMENT REVIEW FOR SJL REJECTION DAMAGES (.8).
VINE J	05/05/10	4.90	REVIEW SJL REJECTION DAMAGES DOCUMENTS.
VINE J	05/06/10	9.00	REVIEW DOCUMENTS FOR SJL REJECTION DAMAGES CLAIM (9.0).

VINE J	05/07/10	8.20	SJL REJECTION DAMAGES DOCUMENT REVIEW (8.2).
VINE J	05/08/10	3.00	SPJ REJECTION DAMAGES DOCUMENT REVIEW (3.0).
VINE J	05/10/10	10.40	SJL REJECTION DAMAGES DOCUMENT REVIEW (10.4).
		37.50	
WRIGHT DL	04/05/10	0.80	REVIEW SPANSION JAPAN'S MOTION FOR A SCHEDULING ORDER RE CLAIM OBJECTIONS AND PREFERENCE ACTIONS (.8).
WRIGHT DL	04/19/10	8.10	REVIEW SPANSION JAPAN MOTION FOR SCHEDULING ORDER (.8); DRAFT OBJECTION TO SPANSION JAPAN'S MOTION FOR SCHEDULING ORDER (6.4); REVISE OBJECTION (.9).
WRIGHT DL	04/20/10	2.20	REVIEW SENIOR NOTEHOLDERS OBJECTION AND COMMITTEE JOINDER TO SJL MOTION FOR SCHEDULING ORDER (1.3); RESPOND TO INQUIRIES FROM S. ROSS REGARDING ADJOURNMENT OF DEBTORS' OBJECTION TO SJL PROOF OF CLAIM (.3); REVIEW TOKYO ORDER APPROVING SETTLEMENT WITH SJL (.6).
WRIGHT DL	04/22/10	1.00	REVIEW SJL REPLY TO OBJECTIONS RE: MOTION FOR SCHEDULING ORDER (1.0).
WRIGHT DL	04/23/10	4.60	REVIEW GE JAPAN JOINDER RE: MOTION FOR SCHEDULING ORDER (.3); REVIEW CASE LAW CITED BY SJL AND NOTEHOLDERS IN MOTION AND OBJECTION (1.3); DRAFT OUTLINE FOR 4/26 HEARING (.9); REVIEW FILED PLEADINGS TO PREPARE FOR 4/26 HEARING (2.1).

WRIGHT DL	04/26/10	8.60	PREPARE FOR AND ATTEND HEARING ON SPANSION JAPAN MOTION FOR SCHEDULING ORDER (2.2); DRAFT EMAIL TO SPANSION REGARDING HARVESTING OF DOCUMENTS TO RESPOND TO SJL'S REJECTION DAMAGES DISCOVERY REQUESTS (1.1); TELECONFERENCE WITH N. RICHARDSON REGARDING DISCOVERY ISSUES (.2); DRAFT EMAIL TO G. WEILERT (IT) REGARDING CUSTODIAN LIST AND HARVESTING (.3); DRAFT RESPONSES AND OBJECTIONS TO DISCOVERY REQUESTS (4.8).
WRIGHT DL	04/27/10	8.40	DEVELOP SEARCH TERMS AND PROTOCOLS FOR ELECTRONIC DOCUMENTS (1.3); CONTINUE DRAFTING RESPONSES AND OBJECTION TO DISCOVERY REQUESTS (6.4); TELECONFERENCE WITH G. WEILERT REGARDING CUSTODIANS AND RELATED E-DISCOVERY MATTERS (.4); TELECONFERENCE WITH E-DISCOVERY VENDOR REGARDING PRODUCTION AND PROCESSING TIME FRAMES (.3).
WRIGHT DL	04/28/10	4.50	DRAFT EMAILS TO COMPANY REGARDING CUSTODIANS FOR REJECTION DAMAGES DISCOVERY (.6); DRAFT EMAIL TO G. WEILERT AT SPANSION REGARDING EMAIL AND EDOC HARVESTING (.3); TELECONFERENCE WITH G. WEILERT AND C. INGRAM REGARDING TECHNICAL ASPECTS OF ELECTRONIC HARVEST (.2); REVISE SEARCH TERMS (.9); RESPOND TO COMPANY INQUIRIES REGARDING DISCOVERY REQUESTS (.4); REVISE DISCOVERY RESPONSES (1.2); REVIEW SPANSION JAPAN DEFINITIVE AGREEMENTS (.9).
WRIGHT DL	04/29/10	2.00	REVIEW DEFINITIVE SETTLEMENT DOCUMENTATION (1.2); TELECONFERENCE WITH VENDOR REGARDING E-DISCOVERY (.5); DRAFT EMAIL COMMUNICATIONS TO G. WEILERT REGARDING CUSTODIANS AND E-DISCOVERY ISSUES (.3).

WRIGHT DL	05/03/10	2.40	ATTENTION TO ISSUES REGARDING HARVESTING OF DOCUMENTS FROM SPANSION FOR REJECTION DAMAGES DISCOVERY (1.1); DEVELOP LIST OF SEARCH TERMS FOR ELECTRONIC DISCOVERY (1.2); REVIEW NOTICE OF SERVICE OF DISCOVERY FOR DEBTORS' RESPONSES TO REJECTION DAMAGES DISCOVERY (.1).
WRIGHT DL	05/04/10	5.20	CONFERENCE WITH J. VINE, J. BUGAY, Y. IBRAHIMI AND S. SIDHU REGARDING REJECTION DAMAGES DOCUMENT REVIEW AND GENERAL PRODUCTION-RELATED QUESTIONS (1.1); CONTINUE TO DEVELOP ELECTRONIC SEARCH TERMS (2.2); TELECONFERENCE WITH C. INGRAM AND LEGAL TECHNOLOGY VENDOR REGARDING PRODUCTION DETAILS (.5); REVIEW HIT REPORT ON SEARCH TERMS PROVIDED BY VENDOR (.2); REVISE SEARCH TERMS (1.2).
WRIGHT DL	05/04/10	1.00	REVIEW APRIL 30 HEARING TRANSCRIPT TO IDENTIFY PRODUCTION DEADLINES REQUESTED BY THE COURT (1.0).
WRIGHT DL	05/05/10	6.70	REVIEW DOCUMENTS RELATED TO REJECTION DAMAGES DISCOVERY.
WRIGHT DL	05/06/10	8.70	REVIEW DOCUMENTS FOR REJECTION DAMAGES DISCOVERY.
WRIGHT DL	05/07/10	9.70	SECOND REVIEW DOCUMENTS FOR MONDAY PRODUCTION (6.2); REVIEW PRODUCTION DETAILS WITH LEGAL TECHNOLOGY (.7); FIRST REVIEW OF T. THORODDSEN DOCUMENTS (2.8).
WRIGHT DL	05/10/10	11.20	CONTINUE FIRST REVIEW OF REJECTION DAMAGES RELATED DOCUMENTS (6.9); REVIEW FINAL PRODUCTION FOLDER FOR FIRST REJECTION DAMAGES PRODUCTION (1.6); DRAFT COVER LETTER FOR PRODUCTION (.7); ARRANGE FOR NYO PROJECT ASSISTANCE TO HAND DELIVER PRODUCTION (.3); REVIEW GE DRAFT GE NOTICE OF WITHDRAWAL (1.7).
		85.10	
Total Associate	2	203.80	
INGRAM CH	04/20/10	0.20	PREPARE DOCUMENTS FOR STORAGE FROM FTP SITE.

			<u> </u>
INGRAM CH	04/27/10	3.10	ASSIST CASE TEAM WITH ELECTRONIC DISCOVERY PROJECT RE: EMAILS WITH D. WRIGHT RE DISCOVERY ON SPANSION JAPAN REJECT DAMAGES CLAIM (.2); COMMENCE ARRANGEMENTS RE DATA HARVEST (2.1); REVIEW, EDIT AND DISCUSS SEARCH TERMS WITH D. WRIGHT; INITIAL CONFERENCE WITH VENDOR (.8).
INGRAM CH	04/28/10	2.10	ASSIST CASE TEAM WITH ELECTRONIC DISCOVERY PROJECT RE: REVIEW VENDOR REPORT RE EXISTING DATA ON HDS 1& 2, EMAILS ON SAME (.4); CONTINUE WORKING ON SPECS WITH DAVIS AND VENDOR (1.1); REJECTION DAMAGES REVIEW DATABASE CREATION (.3); EMAIL; NEW FILES (.3).
INGRAM CH	04/29/10	2.60	ASSIST CASE TEAM WITH ELECTRONIC DISCOVERY PROJECT RE: CALL WITH KIERSTED RE CLIENT DATA (.4); WORK ON SPEC MODIFICATIONS FOR REJECTION DAMAGES DATA; COMMS. WITH VENDOR, OTHERS (1.8); UPDATE FILE MEMO (.4).
INGRAM CH	04/30/10	1.30	ASSIST CASE TEAM WITH ELECTRONIC DISCOVERY PROJECT RE: CONTINUE WORKING ON DATA PROCESSING PLANS (1.0); COMMUNICATIONS WITH D. WRIGHT RE DATA AND SEARCHING (.3).
INGRAM CH	05/01/10	0.30	ASSIST CASE TEAM WITH ELECTRONIC DISCOVERY PROJECT RE: COMMUNICATIONS WITH VENDOR RE CLIENT DATA AND STATUS.
INGRAM CH	05/01/10	0.20	ASSIST CASE TEAM WITH ELECTRONIC DISCOVERY PROJECT RE: REVIEW INFO ON 4TH HARD DRIVE FILES.
INGRAM CH	05/02/10	0.40	ASSIST CASE TEAM WITH ELECTRONIC DISCOVERY PROJECT RE: WORK WITH VENDOR ON DATA PROCESSING; REVIEW PRELIMINARY INFO ON DRIVES.
INGRAM CH	05/03/10	2.90	ASSIST CASE TEAM WITH ELECTRONIC DISCOVERY PROJECT RE: REVIEWING VENDOR DATA & UPDATED REPORTS & WORK ON DATA PROCESSING LOGISTICS WITH VENDOR (.9); REVIEW FILES RECEIVED (.3); ANALYZE SEARCH RESULTS, DISCUSS WITH VENDOR, WORK ON TERM REVISIONS, DATA COLLECTION (1.7).

			<u></u>
INGRAM CH	05/04/10	1.70	ASSIST CASE TEAM WITH ELECTRONIC DISCOVERY PROJECT RE: UPDATE FILE MEMO (.2); WORK ON SEARCHES WITH VENDOR (.7); REVIEW NEWEST STATISTICS RE REVISED SEARCH TERMS, DISCUSS SAME WITH D. WRIGHT (.6); REVIEW 2ND REVISED RESULTS (.2).
INGRAM CH	05/04/10	2.00	ASSIST CASE TEAM WITH ELECTRONIC DISCOVERY PROJECT RE: WORKING WITH VENDOR ON FINAL REVISED SEARCH RESULTS (.4); LOADING DATA (.8); REVIEW NEWEST CHARTS FROM VENDOR (.4); PREPARE ELECTRONIC DATA FILES FOR ATTORNEY REVIEW (.4).
INGRAM CH	05/05/10	1.90	ASSIST CASE TEAM WITH ELECTRONIC DISCOVERY PROJECT RE: CALL WITH D. WRIGHT RE DATA LOAD (.2); FOLLOWUP ON DATA LOADING (.1); RECEIPT, REVIEW OF DATA AND STATISTICS (.3); RETRIEVE ADDITIONAL FILES (.3); DOCUMENT REVIEW PROJECT SETUP (1.0).
INGRAM CH	05/05/10	1.00	ASSIST CASE TEAM WITH ELECTRONIC DISCOVERY PROJECT RE: CONFERENCE WITH STAFF RE SCHEDULING FRIDAY PRODUCTION AND LOGISTICS (.2); PREPARE FILES FOR ATTORNEY REVIEW (.8).
INGRAM CH	05/06/10	4.30	ASSIST CASE TEAM WITH ELECTRONIC DISCOVERY PROJECT RE: WORK ON DATA REVIEW WITH VENDOR, REVIEWERS (.7); DATA LOADING (.5); SETTING UP, STRUCTURING ATTORNEY REVIEW (1.7);ANALYZE VENDOR REPORTS RE HD 1&2 UNPROCESSED (.7); ANALYZE, DISCUSS FILE REVIEW - WRIGHT (.7).
INGRAM CH	05/07/10	5.00	ASSIST CASE TEAM WITH ELECTRONIC DISCOVERY PROJECT RE: WORK ON PRODUCTION ONE PREPARATION AND CREATION (5.0).
INGRAM CH	05/10/10	3.10	ASSIST CASE TEAM WITH ELECTRONIC DISCOVERY PROJECT RE: PRODUCTION PREPARATION (2.0); LAUNCH NEXT ATTORNEY REVIEW BATCHES (.4); EMAIL PROPOSED PRODUCTION SET TO D WRIGHT (.2); UPDATE FILE MEMO (.4); CALL WITH D. WRIGHT RE PRODUCTION STATUS (.1).

			32.10	
Total C	lient Specia	list	32.10	
HEANEY	СМ	04/01/10	0.70	REVIEW DOCKET RE: UPDATES TO CASE FILES (.3); OBTAIN, REVIEW AND DISTRIBUTE PLEADINGS ON THIRD PARTIES (.4).
HEANEY	СМ	04/02/10	1.60	REVIEW DOCKET RE: UPDATES TO CASE FILES (.3); ASSIST ATTORNEYS WITH PREPARATION OF INTERIM FEE APPLICATIONS (.9); PREPARE, FILE AND DISTRIBUTE SUPPLEMENT TO FEE APPLICATION (.3); COORDINATE WITH THIRD PARTIES RE SERVICE (.1).
HEANEY	СМ	04/05/10	0.70	REVIEW DOCKET RE: UPDATES TO CASE FILES (.3); OBTAIN, REVIEW AND DISTRIBUTE PLEADINGS ON THIRD PARTIES (.4).
HEANEY	СМ	04/06/10	1.10	REVIEW DOCKET RE: UPDATES TO CASE FILES (.3); OBTAIN, REVIEW AND DISTRIBUTE PLEADINGS ON THIRD PARTIES (.7); COORDINATE WITH THIRD PARTIES RE: REQUEST FOR TELEPHONIC APPEARANCE SHEETS (.1).
HEANEY	СМ	04/07/10	0.70	REVIEW DOCKET RE: UPDATES TO CASE FILES (.3); ASSIST ATTORNEY WITH HEARING PREPARATION (.3); COORDINATE WITH THIRD PARTIES RE: REQUEST FOR TELEPHONIC APPEARANCE SHEETS (.1).
HEANEY	СМ	04/08/10	0.70	REVIEW DOCKET RE: UPDATES TO CASE FILES (.3); OBTAIN, REVIEW AND DISTRIBUTE PLEADINGS TO BE USED AS PRECEDENT (.4).
HEANEY	СМ	04/09/10	1.70	REVIEW DOCKET RE: UPDATES TO CASE FILES (.3); ASSIST ATTORNEYS WITH PREPARATION OF CERTIFICATION OF COUNSEL AND STIPULATION (1.4).
HEANEY	СМ	04/12/10	0.70	REVIEW DOCKET RE: UPDATES TO CASE FILES (.3); REVIEW DOCUMENTS FOR DISTRIBUTION ON THIRD PARTIES (.4).
HEANEY	СМ	04/13/10	0.70	REVIEW DOCKET RE: UPDATES TO CASE FILES (.3); REVIEW DOCUMENT FOR DISTRIBUTION ON THIRD PARTIES (.4).

			<u></u>
HEANEY CM	04/14/10	1.40	REVIEW DOCKET RE: UPDATES TO CASE FILES (.3); ASSIST ATTORNEYS WITH PREPARATION OF STIPULATION AND ORDER (.6); PREPARE, FILE, AND DISTRIBUTE CERTIFICATION OF COUNSEL (.4); SERVE CHAMBERS (.1).
HEANEY CM	04/15/10	2.80	REVIEW DOCKET RE: UPDATES TO CASE FILES (.3); REVIEW DOCUMENTS FOR DISTRIBUTION ON THIRD PARTIES (.3); OBTAIN, REVIEW, ORGANIZE DOCUMENTS IN CONNECTION WITH 4-16 HEARING (1.6); ASSIST ATTORNEY WITH HEARING PREPARATION (.6).
HEANEY CM	04/16/10	2.60	REVIEW DOCKET RE: UPDATES TO CASE FILES (.3); REVIEW DOCUMENTS FOR DISTRIBUTION ON THIRD PARTIES (.4); ASSIST ATTORNEYS WITH HEARING (.8); OBTAIN BACKGROUND DOCUMENTS TO BE USED AS PRECEDENT (1.1).
HEANEY CM	04/19/10	2.30	REVIEW DOCKET RE: UPDATE TO CASE FILES (.3); ASSIST WITH DISTRIBUTION OF PLEADINGS ON THIRD PARTIES (.3); ASSIST ATTORNEYS WITH PREPARATION OF OBJECTION TO SJL SCHEDULING MOTION (1.3); PREPARE, FILE AND DISTRIBUTE OBJECTION (.4).
HEANEY CM	04/20/10	0.70	REVIEW DOCKET RE: UPDATES TO CASE FILES (.3); ASSIST WITH PREPARATION OF PLEADINGS FOR DISTRIBUTION ON THIRD PARTIES (.4).
HEANEY CM	04/21/10	0.90	REVIEW DOCKET RE: UPDATES TO CASE FILES (.3); ASSIST WITH DISTRIBUTION OF PLEADINGS ON THIRD PARTIES (.3); REVIEW DOCKET RE: STATUS OF OBJECTIONS TO FEE APPLICATION (.1); DRAFT, EDIT AND REVISE CERTIFICATE OF NO OBJECTION (.2).
HEANEY CM	04/22/10	1.90	REVIEW DOCKET RE: UPDATES TO CASE FILES (.3); ASSIST WITH DISTRIBUTION OF PLEADINGS ON THIRD PARTIES (.3); OBTAIN, ORGANIZE AND PREPARE DOCUMENTS FOR HEARING BINDERS (1.3).

HEANEY CM	04/23/10	0.90	REVIEW DOCKET RE: UPDATES TO CASE FILES (.3); ASSIST WITH DISTRIBUTION OF PLEADINGS ON THIRD PARTIES (.3); REVIEW NOTICE OF CONFIRMATION ORDERS (.3).
HEANEY CM	04/26/10	1.60	REVIEW DOCKET RE: UPDATES TO CASE FILES (.3); REVIEW DOCUMENTS IN CONNECTION WITH DISTRIBUTION (.6); ASSIST ATTORNEY WITH PREPARATION OF RESPONSES AND OBJECTIONS TO DISCOVERY (.7).
HEANEY CM	04/27/10	1.30	REVIEW DOCKET RE: UPDATES TO CASE FILES (.3); ASSIST WITH DISTRIBUTION OF PLEADINGS ON THIRD PARTIES (.4); COORDINATE WITH THIRD PARTIES RE: REQUEST FOR HEARING TRANSCRIPT (.2); ASSIST WITH APPEAL ISSUES (.4).
HEANEY CM	04/28/10	1.60	REVIEW DOCKET RE: UPDATES TO CASE FILES (.3); ASSIST WITH DISTRIBUTION ON THIRD PARTIES (.3); COORDINATE WITH THIRD PARTIES RE: REQUEST FOR TELEPHONIC APPEARANCE SHEETS (.1); ASSIST ATTORNEYS WITH PREPARATION OF OBJECTIONS AND RESPONSES TO DISCOVERY AND DRAFT NOTICE OF SERVICE (.9).
HEANEY CM	04/29/10	0.60	REVIEW DOCKET RE: UPDATES TO CASE FILES (.3); ASSIST WITH DISTRIBUTION OF DOCUMENTS ON THIRD PARTIES (.3).
HEANEY CM	05/03/10	1.60	REVIEW DOCKET RE: UPDATES TO CASE FILES (.3); REVIEW DOCUMENTS FOR DISTRIBUTION ON THIRD PARTIES (.4); EDIT/REVISE NOTICE OF SERVICE OF DISCOVERY (.2); ASSIST ATTORNEYS WITH DOCUMENT REVIEW FOR NOTICE OF SERVICE (.7).
HEANEY CM	05/04/10	0.90	REVIEW DOCKET RE: UPDATES TO CASE FILES (.3); ASSIST WITH DISTRIBUTION OF PLEADINGS ON THIRD PARTIES (.6).
HEANEY CM	05/05/10	0.70	REVIEW DOCKET RE: UPDATES TO CASE FILES (.3); ASSIST WITH DISTRIBUTION OF PLEADINGS ON THIRD PARTIES (.4).

	Skadden,	Arps, Sla	ate, Meagher & Flom IIp and affiliates ATTORNEY WORK PRODUCT <u>PRIVILEGED AND CONFIDENTIAL</u>
HEANEY CM	05/06/10	0.60	REVIEW DOCKET RE: UPDATES TO CASE FILES (.3); REVIEW DOCUMENTS FOR SERVICE ON THIRD PARTIES (.3).
HEANEY CM	05/07/10	0.70	REVIEW DOCKET RE: UPDATES TO CASE FILES (.3); REVIEW DOCUMENTS FOR DISTRIBUTION ON THIRD PARTIES (.4).
HEANEY CM	05/10/10	1.60	REVIEW DOCKET RE: UPDATES TO CASE FILES (.2); REVIEW DOCUMENTS FOR DISTRIBUTION ON THIRD PARTIES (.3); REVIEW DOCKET RE: ALL PLEADINGS FILED BY GE AND DRAFT CHART OF FILINGS (1.1).
		33.30	
Total Legal Assistant		33.30	
MATTER TOTAL		<u>270.30</u>	

Spansion Inc. Nonworking Travel Time

Bill Date: 06/28/10 Bill Number: 1320504

NAME	DATE	HOURS	DESCRIPTION
DURRER II VC	04/16/10	2.00	TRAVEL TO DE FOR RENEWED CONFIRMATION HEARING.
		2.00	
Total Partner		2.00	
MATTER TOTAL		2.00	

Spansion Inc. Regulatory and SEC	Matters		Bill Date: 06/28/10 Bill Number: 1320504
NAME	DATE	HOURS	DESCRIPTION
CLARK AW	04/23/10	0.10	WORK ON AUDIT REQUEST RESPONSE.
		0.10	
DURRER II VC	04/19/10	0.10	ANALYSIS RE AUDIT LETTER REQUEST (.1).
DURRER II VC	04/23/10	0.20	ANALYSIS RE AUDIT LETTER REQUEST (.2).
DURRER II VC	04/26/10	0.40	DRAFT AUDIT LETTER RESPONSE (.4).
DURRER II VC	05/10/10	0.30	FINALIZE AUDIT LETTER (.2); ANALYSIS RE TAX ACCOUNTING ISSUE (.1).
		1.00	
Total Partner		1.10	
SLATER JW	04/23/10	2.20	DRAFT AUDIT LETTER.
SLATER JW	05/07/10	1.80	ASSEMBLE FOR ATTORNEY REVIEW THE AUDIT LETTER.
		4.00	
Total Legal Assistant		4.00	
MATTER TOTAL		<u>5.10</u>	

Bill Date: 06/28/10

Reorganization P	lan / Plan Sponso	ors	Bill Number: 1320504
NAME	DATE	HOURS	DESCRIPTION
CLARK AW	04/02/10	0.70	WORK ON ISSUES RE CONFIRMATION DENIAL (.2); REVIEW CORR AND COURT PAPERS (.5).
CLARK AW	04/05/10	1.70	WORK ON ISSUES RE CONFIRMATION STRATEGY (.8); REVIEW CORR (.5); TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH J. KISPERT (.4).
CLARK AW	04/07/10	0.40	WORK ON ISSUES RE CONFIRMATION STRATEGY AND REVIEW CORR.
CLARK AW	04/15/10	1.10	WORK ON CONVERT APPEAL ISSUES (.7); REVIEW CORR AND COURT PAPERS (.4).
CLARK AW	04/27/10	1.30	WORK ON ISSUES RE APPEAL, STAY; REVIEW CORR AND COURT PAPERS.
CLARK AW	05/03/10	0.60	WORK ON APPEAL STAY ISSUES, REVIEW CORRESP.
CLARK AW	05/04/10	0.20	WORK ON ISSUES RE APPEAL STAY MOTION, REVIEW CORRESP AND COURT PAPERS.
		6.00	
DURRER II VC	04/01/10	0.70	REVIEW JUDGE CAREY OPINION DENYING CONFIRMATION (.5); CORRESPOND WITH R. FURR AND J. KISPERT RE SAME (.2).
DURRER II VC	04/02/10	0.90	CALL WITH R. FURR RE CONFIRMATION STATUS AND NEXT STEPS (.4); ANALYSIS RE EXPERT WITNESS PROPOSALS (.5).
DURRER II VC	04/05/10	0.60	CALL WITH R. FURR RE POSSIBLE CONFIRMATION SETTLEMENT (.1); CALL WITH J. KISPERT AND T. CLARK RE SAME (.5).
DURRER II VC	04/06/10	0.20	ANALYSIS RE CONFIRMATION PROCESS AND TIMING (.2).
DURRER II VC	04/07/10	0.70	CALL WITH J. KISPERT RE CONFIRMATION ISSUES (.2); PREPARE MEMO TO R. FURR RE SAME (.1); RESEARCH RE CONFIRMATION ISSUES (.3); ANALYSIS RE POSSIBLE SETTLEMENT (.1).

Spansion Inc.

Skadden, Arps, Slate, Meagher & Flom IIp and affiliates ATTORNEY WORK PRODUCT PRIVILEGED AND CONFIDENTIAL

	05/03/10	0.30	ANALYSIS RE STAY PENDING APPEAL (.2); PREPARE MEMOS TO J. ASHBY AND P. JIMENEZ RE EFFECTIVE DATE (.1).
DURRER II VC			
DURRER II VC	04/27/10	0.10	ANALYSIS RE IMPACT OF APPEAL OF CONFIRMATION ON SPANSION JAPAN SETTLEMENT (.1).
DURRER II VC	04/21/10	0.10	CALL WITH G. LUNT RE CONFIRMATION APPROVAL AND TIMING OF CLOSE (.1).
DURRER II VC	04/16/10	6.20	ATTEND RENEWED CONFIRMATION HEARING INCLUDING ADDRESSING SPANSION JAPAN CLAIM STIPULATION QUESTIONS FROM COURT (5.8); DRAFT PROPOSED PRESS RELEASE RE SAME (.4).
DURRER II VC	04/15/10	1.20	REVIEW WHITE DECLARATION RE CONFIRMATION ISSUES (.1); REVIEW PLEADINGS BY COMMITTEE AND AD HOC COMMITTEES RE SAME (.5); ANALYSIS RE APPEALS (.4); CALL WITH G. LUNT RE SAME (.2).
DURRER II VC	04/12/10	0.80	ANALYSIS RE RELEASE PROVISIONS OF PLAN (.3); CALL WITH M. LUREY AND N. RICHARDSON RE SAME (.3); REVIEW MEMO TO SPANSION JAPAN RE SAME (.2).
DURRER II VC	04/08/10	0.60	CALL WITH R. FURR RE CONFIRMATION STATUS AND STRATEGY (.3); CORRESPOND WITH M. LUREY RE SAME (.2); ANALYSIS RE SAME (.1).

Skadden, Arps, Slate, Meagher & Flom IIp and affiliates ATTORNEY WORK PRODUCT PRIVILEGED AND CONFIDENTIAL 04/21/10 4.80 REVIEW REQUEST FROM D. WRIGHT, RE: SARUMIDA H TRANSLATION OF THE COURT FILING. REVIEW THE DRAFT AND PREPARE AN ENGLISH TRANSLATION, AND CORRESPONDENCE TO D. WRIGHT, RE: SAME. 4.80 Total Counsel 4.80 BUGAY JJ 04/15/10 5.10 RESEARCH ISSUES RE: DIVESTING JURISDICTION OF BANKRUPTCY COURT UPON FILING OF NOTICE OF APPEAL (3.4); DRAFT MEMOS AND SUMMARY OF CASES RE: SAME TO D. WRIGHT (1.7). 5.10 EDELMAN MR 04/15/10 3.00 RESEARCH RE FINALITY OF CONFIRMATION ORDER (2.2); ANALYSIS RE: SAME (.8). 3.00 MA EC 04/01/10 1.30 REVIEW ORDER DENYING CONFIRMATION OF PLAN. 1.30 WRIGHT DL 04/01/10 1.20 REVIEW CONFIRMATION OPINION AND ORDER ISSUED BY JUDGE CAREY (.9); DRAFT SUMMARY OF SAME (.3). 1.70 ATTEND STATUS CONFERENCE REGARDING WRIGHT DL 04/06/10 CONFIRMATION ORDER (1.7). WRIGHT DL 04/08/10 2.70 REVIEW REVISED PLAN AND PLAN SUPPLEMENT (2.7). WRIGHT DL 04/09/10 1.00 REVIEW REVISED PLAN WITH REGARD TO SPANSION JAPAN RELATED PROVISIONS (1.0).WRIGHT DL 04/12/10 2.60 REVIEW 9019 ORDER AND PLAN REGARDING RELEASE PROVISIONS REGARDING SPANSION JAPAN (1.6); PARTICIPATE IN TELECONFERENCE WITH N. RICHARDSON, M. LUREY, M. LASTOWSKI AND V. DURRER REGARDING SJL RELEASES (.5); REVIEW ADDITIONAL PRODUCTIONS REGARDING CONFIRMATION (.5).

Skadden, Arps, Slate, Meagher & Flom IIp and affiliates ATTORNEY WORK PRODUCT <u>PRIVILEGED AND CONFIDENTIAL</u>

WRIGHT DL	04/13/10	2.80	REVIEW ADDITIONAL PRODUCTIONS TO DETERMINE RELEVANCE TO SPANSION JAPAN (1.9); DRAFT EMAIL COMMUNICATIONS TO B. ROSENBLUM OF JONES DAY REGARDING CLAIM OBJECTION STIPULATION (.5); REVISE CLAIM OBJECTION STIPULATION (.4).
WRIGHT DL	04/15/10	8.60	RESEARCH REGARDING INTERLOCUTORY/FINAL ORDER APPEALS (5.7); DRAFT MEMORANDUM REGARDING RESEARCH AND IMPACT OF CONVERTS NOTICE OF APPEAL ON 4/16 CONFIRMATION HEARING (2.9).
WRIGHT DL	04/16/10	2.20	PREPARE FOR CONFIRMATION HEARING (1.3); RESPOND TO INQUIRIES REGARDING UCC STATEMENT REGARDING CONVERT'S PLAN (.3); RESEARCH CLAIMS AGENT INFORMATION (.6).
WRIGHT DL	04/29/10	2.10	REVIEW PLEADINGS SEEKING STAY RELIEF AND RELATED OBJECTIONS (1.7); RESPOND TO INQUIRIES REGARDING SAME AND IMPACT ON SJL SETTLEMENT (.4).
WRIGHT DL	05/03/10	4.80	REVIEW PLEADINGS, INCLUDING REVIEW OF APPEAL FILED BY CONVERT COMMITTEE TO DETERMINE IMPACT, IF ANY, ON SPANSION JAPAN SETTLEMENT.
		29.70	
Total Associate		39.10	
MATTER TOTAL		<u>63.00</u>	

Skadden, Arps, Slate, Meagher & Flom IIp and affiliates ATTORNEY WORK PRODUCT PRIVILEGED AND CONFIDENTIAL

Spansion Inc. Retention / Fee Matters (SASM&F)			Bill Date: 06/28/10 Bill Number: 1320504
NAME	DATE	HOURS	DESCRIPTION
JAIMEZ K	04/23/10	4.40	REVIEW V. DURRER COMMENTS TO MONTHLY FEE APPLICATION; REVIEW INTERIM COMPENSATION ORDER; REVIEW EMAILS FROM T. TRUITT EXPLAINING FEE APPLICATION PROCESS; BEGIN EDITING FOURTH MONTHLY FEE APPLICATION.
JAIMEZ K	04/24/10	2.70	CONTINUE REVISING FOURTH MONTHLY FEE APPLICATION; REVIEW SAME; CREATE REDLINE OF SAME; COMMUNICATE WITH V. DURRER RE: SAME.
JAIMEZ K	04/28/10	2.50	FURTHER REVISE FOURTH MONTHLY FEE APPLICATION; COMMUNICATE WITH D. WRIGHT AND EPIQ RE: FILING/SERVING THE SAME.
JAIMEZ K	04/29/10	5.60	REVIEW D. WRIGHT'S COMMENTS RE: FOURTH MONTHLY FEE APPLICATION; REVISE SAME; COMMUNICATE WITH ACCOUNTING RE: ACCOUNTING CHART ISSUES; COMMUNICATE WITH D. WRIGHT AND ACCOUNTING RE: SAME; SEARCH DOCKET FOR INTERIM FEE APPLICATION; COORDINATE FILING AND SERVICE OF THE FOURTH MONTHLY FEE APPLICATION.
		15.20	
TRUITT T	04/06/10	3.90	DRAFT FOURTH MONTHLY FEE APPLICATION (3.7); REVIEW AND DRAFT CORRS. RE: FOURTH MONTHLY FEE APPLICATION (.2).
TRUITT T	04/07/10	5.20	DRAFT FOURTH MONTHLY FEE APPLICATION (5.1); DRAFT NOTICE OF FOURTH MONTHLY FEE APPLICATION (.1).
TRUITT T	04/08/10	1.70	REVISE FOURTH MONTHLY FEE APPLICATION (1.7).
TRUITT T	04/09/10	0.80	DRAFT FOURTH MONTHLY FEE APPLICATION (.5); ATTEND TELEPHONE CONF. RE: FOURTH MONTHLY FEE

APPLICATION (.3).

	Skadden, A	rps, Sla	ate, Meagher & Flom IIp and affiliates ATTORNEY WORK PRODUCT <u>PRIVILEGED AND CONFIDENTIAL</u>
TRUITT T	04/14/10	1.90	REVIEW FILINGS IN PREPARATION OF FINALIZING FEE APPLICATION (.4); DRAFT FEE APPLICATION (1.5).
		13.50	
WRIGHT DL	04/02/10	4.30	CONTINUE REVISING FIRST INTERIM FEE APPLICATION (3.9); DRAFT EMAIL TO FEE AUDITOR FORWARDING INTERIM FEE APPLICATION (.2); REVIEW NOTICE OF INTERIM FEE APPLICATION (.2).
WRIGHT DL	04/05/10	7.40	REVIEW FEE AUDITOR'S INITIAL REPORT REGARDING SASMF FIRST INTERIM FEE PERIOD (1.0); DRAFT RESPONSE LETTER REGARDING INITIAL REPORT (3.9); REQUEST ADDITIONAL SUPPORTING DOCUMENTATION (.2); REVIEW SUPPORTING DOCUMENTATION AND INCORPORATE INTO DRAFT RESPONSE (2.3).
WRIGHT DL	04/06/10	5.90	CONTINUE DRAFTING RESPONSE LETTER TO INITIAL FEE REPORT (5.9).
WRIGHT DL	04/09/10	1.10	FINALIZE RESPONSE LETTER (.8); DRAFT EMAIL TO FEE AUDITOR FORWARDING LETTER (.3).
WRIGHT DL	04/29/10	2.20	REVIEW DRAFT JANUARY MONTHLY FEE STATEMENT AND PROVIDE COMMENTS REGARDING SAME (1.7); REVIEW NOTICE OF FEE APPLICATION (.2); SUPERVISE FILING OF SAME (.3).
		20.90	
Total Associate		49.60	
HEANEY CM	04/26/10	0.30	REVIEW DOCKET RE: STATUS OF OBJECTIONS TO FEE APPLICATION (.2); EDIT/REVISE CERTIFICATE OF NO OBJECTION (.1).
HEANEY CM	04/29/10	1.60	TRAIN/MENTOR/ASSIST ATTORNEYS WITH PREPARATION OF FEE APPLICATION FOR FILINGS (1.2); PREPARE, FILE AND DISTRIBUTE FEE APPLICATION (.4).

Skadden, Arps, Slate, Meagher & Flom IIp and affiliates ATTORNEY WORK PRODUCT <u>PRIVILEGED AND CONFIDENTIAL</u>

HEANEY CM	05/05/10	0.60	REVIEW DOCKET RE: OBJECTIONS TO FEE APPLICATIONS AND UPDATES TO CASE CALENDAR (.3); EDIT/REVISE CERTIFICATE OF NO OBJECTION TO SKADDEN FEE APPLICATION (.1); PREPARE, FILE AND DISTRIBUTE CERTIFICATE OF NO OBJECTION (.2).
		2.50	
WELLS K	04/20/10	0.30	DOCKET - RETRIEVE FILINGS FROM DOCKET FOR K. JAIMEZ.
WELLS K	04/23/10	0.30	DOCKET - RETRIEVE, DISTRIBUTE AND REVIEW FILINGS FROM DOCKET.
WELLS K	04/29/10	0.50	DOCKET - RETRIEVE, REVIEW AND DISTRIBUTE FILINGS FROM DOCKET AS PER K. JAIMEZ.
		1.10	
Total Legal Assista	nt	3.60	
MATTER TOTAL		<u>53.20</u>	
CLIENT TOTAL		<u>436.70</u>	

Spansion Inc. Business Operations / Strategic Planning			Bill Date: 06/28/10 Bill Number: 1320504
Disbursement	Date	Vendor/Employee/Dept.	Amount
Messengers/ Courier	05/10/10	Federal Express Corp.	7.11
		TOTAL MESSENGERS/ COUR	IER \$7.11
		TOTAL MATTER	\$7.11

Spansion Inc. Claims Admin. (General)		Bill Date: 06/28/10 Bill Number: 1320504
Disbursement	Date	Vendor/Employee/Dept.	Amount
Outside Re- search/Internet Services	04/07/10	Pacer Service Center	6.00
Outside Re- search/Internet Services	04/07/10	Pacer Service Center	33.20
		TOTAL OUTSIDE RESEARCH/INTERNET SERVI	\$39.20 CES
		TOTAL MATTER	\$39.20

Spansion Inc. Litigation (General)			Bill Date: 06/28/10 Bill Number: 1320504
Disbursement	Date	Vendor/Employee/Dept.	Amount
Postage	04/09/10	Office Admin, D	0.61
		TOTAL POSTAGE	\$0.61
Court Reporting	04/27/10	Veritext New York Repor Company L.L.	ting 188.40
Court Reporting	05/04/10	Veritext New York Repor Company L.L.	ting 322.70
		TOTAL COURT REPORTING	\$511.10
Outside Re- search/Internet Services	04/07/10	Pacer Service Center	44.64
Outside Re- search/Internet Services	04/07/10	Pacer Service Center	5.52
Outside Re- search/Internet Services	04/07/10	Pacer Service Center	7.60
Outside Re- search/Internet Services	04/07/10	Pacer Service Center	63.84
Outside Re- search/Internet Services	04/07/10	Pacer Service Center	12.24
Outside Re- search/Internet Services	04/07/10	Pacer Service Center	46.32
Outside Re- search/Internet Services	04/07/10	Pacer Service Center	2.08
Outside Re- search/Internet Services	04/07/10	Pacer Service Center	40.88
Outside Re- search/Internet Services	04/07/10	Pacer Service Center	2.80
Outside Re- search/Internet Services	04/07/10	Pacer Service Center	1,208.48

Disbursement	Date	Vendor/Employee/Dept.	Amount
		TOTAL OUTSIDE RESEARCH/INTERNET SERVICES	\$1,434.40
Print Images to Paper (from Electronic Media	04/19/10)	Mines ME	1.52
Print Images to Paper (from Electronic Media	04/19/10)	Mines ME	5.84
Print Images to Paper (from Electronic Media	04/19/10)	Mines ME	15.36
Print Images to Paper (from Electronic Media	04/19/10)	Mines ME	15.36
Print Images to Paper (from Electronic Media	04/19/10)	Mines ME	0.64
Print Images to Paper (from Electronic Media	04/19/10)	Mines ME	10.48
Print Images to Paper (from Electronic Media	04/19/10)	Mines ME	11.44
Print Images to Paper (from Electronic Media	04/19/10)	Mines ME	0.40
Print Images to Paper (from Electronic Media	04/19/10)	Mines ME	3.12
Print Images to Paper (from Electronic Media	04/19/10)	Mines ME	4.64
Print Images to Paper (from Electronic Media	04/19/10)	Mines ME	1.52
Print Images to Paper (from Electronic Media	04/19/10)	Mines ME	5.84
Print Images to Paper (from Electronic Media	04/19/10)	Mines ME	15.36
Print Images to Paper (from Electronic Media	04/19/10)	Mines ME	15.36
Print Images to Paper (from Electronic Media	04/19/10)	Mines ME	0.64
Print Images to Paper (from Electronic Media	04/19/10)	Mines ME	10.48
Print Images to Paper (from Electronic Media	04/19/10)	Mines ME	11.44
Print Images to Paper (from Electronic Media	04/19/10)	Mines ME	0.40
Print Images to Paper (from Electronic Media	04/19/10)	Mines ME	3.12

Disbursement	Date	Vendor/Employee/Dept.	Amount
Print Images to Paper (from Electronic Media	04/19/10)	Mines ME	4.64
Print Images to Paper (from Electronic Media	04/26/10)	Ndumu TA	2.00
Print Images to Paper (from Electronic Media	04/26/10)	Ndumu TA	2.32
Print Images to Paper (from Electronic Media	04/26/10)	Ndumu TA	0.96
Print Images to Paper (from Electronic Media	04/26/10)	Ndumu TA	3.36
Print Images to Paper (from Electronic Media	04/26/10)	Ndumu TA	0.80
Print Images to Paper (from Electronic Media	04/26/10)	Ndumu TA	0.48
Print Images to Paper (from Electronic Media	04/26/10)	Ndumu TA	0.16
Print Images to Paper (from Electronic Media	04/26/10)	Ndumu TA	0.64
		TOTAL PRINT IMAGES TO PAPER (FROM ELECTRONIC MEDIA)	\$148.32
DVD creation	05/10/10	Musselman PR	38.00
DVD creation	05/10/10	Poon MY	38.00
		TOTAL DVD CREATION	\$76.00
Production Export (wit Bates and Legends)	h05/10/10	Musselman PR	208.24
		TOTAL PRODUCTION EXPORT (WITH BATES AND LEGENDS)	\$208.24
Loading Images/Data	05/06/10	Musselman PR	4,770.07
		TOTAL LOADING IMAGES/DATA	\$4,770.07
		TOTAL MATTER	\$7,148.74

Spansion Inc. Regulatory and SEC Mat	ters		Bill Date: 06/28/10 Bill Number: 1320504
Disbursement	Date	Vendor/Employee/Dept.	Amount
Outside Re- search/Internet Services	04/07/10	Pacer Service Center	6.16
		TOTAL OUTSIDE RESEARCH/INTERNET SERVI	\$6.16 CES
		TOTAL MATTER	\$6.16

Spansion Inc.Bill Date: 06/28/10Reorganization Plan / Plan SponsorsBill Number: 1320504					
Disbursement	Date	Vendor/Employee/Dept.	Amount		
Air/Rail Travel -	- vendor04/16/10	Durrer II VC	208.00		
feed		Agency: Carlson Wagonlit Travel. Depart: 04-16-2010. From: NYP New York-Penn Station NY To: WIL Wilmington DE Carrier: 2V AMTRAK Class: W COACH; From: WIL Wilmington DE To: WAS Washington DC [Amtrak HQ] Carrier: 2V AMTRAK Class: W COACH. Name: DURRERII, VAN C.			
Air/Rail Travel -	- vendor04/16/10	Durrer II VC	131.00		
feed		Agency: Carlson Wagonlit Travel. Depart: 04-16-2010. From: WIL Wilmington DE To: WAS Washington DC [Amtrak HQ] Carrier: XA AMTRAK PREPAY Class: K COACH. Name: DURRERII, VAN C.			
Air/Rail Travel -	- vendor04/16/10	Durrer II VC	45.00		
feed		Agency: Carlson Wagonlit Travel. Depart: 04-16-2010. From: LAX LOS ANGELES CA-INTL TO: LAX LOS ANGELES CA-INTL UNK=XH Class: Y COACH. Name: DURRERII, VAN C.			
Air/Rail Travel - vendor04/16/10 feed		Durrer II VC	45.00		
		Agency: Carlson Wagonlit Travel. Depart: 04-16-2010. From: LAX LOS ANGELES CA-INTL To: LAX LOS ANGELES CA-INTL UNK=XH Class: Y COACH. Name: DURRERII, VAN C.			
		TOTAL AIR/RAIL TRAVEL - VENDOR FEED	\$429.00		
Lexis/Nexis	04/15/10	Edelman MR	302.40		
		TOTAL LEXIS/NEXIS	\$302.40		
Westlaw	04/15/10	Wright DL	297.30		
Westlaw	04/16/10	Wright DL	146.40		
		TOTAL WESTLAW	\$443.70		

Disbursement	Date	Vendor/Employee/Dept.	Amount
Vendor Hosted Telecon- ferencing	04/07/10	Courtcall, LLC	30.00
Vendor Hosted Telecon- ferencing	04/27/10	Courtcall, LLC	30.00
Vendor Hosted Telecon- ferencing	04/27/10	Courtcall, LLC	30.00
		TOTAL VENDOR HOSTED TELECONFERENCING	\$90.00
Outside Re- search/Internet Services	04/07/10	Pacer Service Center	6.64
Outside Re- search/Internet Services	04/07/10	Pacer Service Center	23.28
		TOTAL OUTSIDE RESEARCH/INTERNET SERVICES	\$29.92
		TOTAL MATTER	\$1,295.02

Spansion Inc. Retention / Fee Matters (SASM&F)		Bill Date: 06/28/10 Bill Number: 1320504	
Disbursement	Date	Vendor/Employee/Dept.	Amount
In-house Reproduction	04/02/10	Copy Center, D	2.30
		TOTAL IN-HOUSE REPRODUCTION	\$2.30
Outside Re- search/Internet Services	04/07/10	Pacer Service Center	34.32
		TOTAL OUTSIDE RESEARCH/INTERNET SERVICES	\$34.32
		TOTAL MATTER	\$36.62

TOTAL CLIENT

\$8,532.85