

**IN THE UNITED STATES BANKRUPTCY COURT
FOR THE SOUTHERN DISTRICT OF TEXAS
HOUSTON DIVISION**

In re:)	
)	Chapter 11
SOUTHERN FOODS GROUP, LLC, <i>et al.</i> ,)	
)	Case No. 19-36313 (DRJ)
Debtors. ¹)	
)	Jointly Administered
)	
)	

**SIXTH MONTHLY FEE APPLICATION OF DAVIS POLK & WARDWELL LLP
FOR ALLOWANCE OF COMPENSATION FOR SERVICES RENDERED AND
REIMBURSEMENT OF EXPENSES INCURRED AS COUNSEL TO THE
DEBTORS AND DEBTORS IN POSSESSION FOR THE PERIOD
APRIL 1, 2020 THROUGH APRIL 30, 2020**

Name of applicant:	Davis Polk & Wardwell LLP
Role in case:	Counsel to the Debtors and Debtors in Possession
Date of retention:	December 6, 2019 <i>nunc pro tunc</i> to November 12, 2019
Period covered:	April 1, 2020 through April 30, 2020

¹ The debtors and debtors in possession in these chapter 11 cases, along with the last four digits of their respective Employer Identification Numbers, are as follows: Southern Foods Group, LLC (1364); Dean Foods Company (9681); Alta-Dena Certified Dairy, LLC (1347); Berkeley Farms, LLC (8965); Cascade Equity Realty, LLC (3940); Country Fresh, LLC (6303); Dairy Information Systems Holdings, LLC (9144); Dairy Information Systems, LLC (0009); Dean Dairy Holdings, LLC (9188); Dean East II, LLC (9192); Dean East, LLC (8751); Dean Foods North Central, LLC (7858); Dean Foods of Wisconsin, LLC (2504); Dean Holding Company (8390); Dean Intellectual Property Services II, Inc. (3512); Dean International Holding Company (9785); Dean Management, LLC (7782); Dean Puerto Rico Holdings, LLC (6832); Dean Services, LLC (2168); Dean Transportation, Inc. (8896); Dean West II, LLC (9190); Dean West, LLC (8753); DFC Aviation Services, LLC (1600); DFC Energy Partners, LLC (3889); DFC Ventures, LLC (4213); DGI Ventures, Inc. (6766); DIPS Limited Partner II (7167); Franklin Holdings, Inc. (8114); Fresh Dairy Delivery, LLC (2314); Friendly’s Ice Cream Holdings Corp. (7609); Friendly’s Manufacturing and Retail, LLC (9828); Garelick Farms, LLC (3221); Mayfield Dairy Farms, LLC (3008); Midwest Ice Cream Company, LLC (0130); Model Dairy, LLC (7981); Reiter Dairy, LLC (3675); Sampson Ventures, LLC (7714); Shenandoah’s Pride, LLC (2858); Steve’s Ice Cream, LLC (6807); Suiza Dairy Group, LLC (2039); Tuscan/Lehigh Dairies, Inc. (6774); Uncle Matt’s Organic, Inc. (0079); and Verifine Dairy Products of Sheboygan, LLC (7200). The debtors’ mailing address is 2711 North Haskell Avenue, Suite 3400, Dallas, TX 75204.

Fees incurred:	\$6,786,794.00
20% holdback:	\$1,357,358.80
Total fees incurred less 20% holdback:	\$5,429,435.20
Expenses incurred:	\$49,280.22 ²
Total fees (80%) and expenses (100%) due:	\$5,478,715.42
Blended rate in this application for all attorneys:	\$1,079.33
Blended rate in this application for all timekeepers:	\$996.90

1. Pursuant to sections 327, 330, and 331 of title 11 of the United States Code (the “**Bankruptcy Code**”), Rule 2016 of the Federal Rules of Bankruptcy Procedure (the “**Bankruptcy Rules**”), Rule 2016-1 of the Bankruptcy Local Rules for the Southern District of Texas (the “**Bankruptcy Local Rules**”), the *Amended Order Approving Application of Debtors for Authority to Employ and Retain Davis Polk & Wardwell LLP as Attorneys for the Debtors Nunc Pro Tunc to the Petition Date* [D.I. 701], and the *Order Establishing Procedures for Interim Compensation and Reimbursement of Expenses for Professionals* [D.I. 580] (the “**Interim Compensation Order**”), the law firm of Davis Polk & Wardwell LLP (“**Davis Polk**”), attorneys for Southern Foods Group, LLC, Dean Foods Company, and certain of their affiliates, as debtors and debtors in possession (collectively, the “**Debtors**”), hereby files this monthly fee application (the “**Monthly Fee Application**”) for (a) compensation in the amount of \$5,429,435.20 (net of \$1,357,358.80) for the reasonable and necessary legal services Davis Polk rendered to the Debtors during the period April 1, 2020 through and including April 30, 2020 (the “**Compensation Period**”) (80%

² This amount reflects a reduction in expenses in the amount of \$4,128.69 on account of the following: (a) \$2,535.90 for word processing, overtime meals, and certain travel charges to comply with the *Guidelines for Reviewing Applications for Compensation and Reimbursement of Expenses Filed under 11 U.S.C. § 330 by Attorneys in Larger Chapter 11 Cases Effective November 1, 2013*; and (b) \$1,592.79 of voluntary write-offs. This amount also includes certain unbilled expenses from previous months uncovered during an internal system reconciliation in the amount of \$13,422.60.

of \$6,786,794.00) and (b) reimbursement in the amount of \$49,280.22 for 100% of the actual and necessary expenses that Davis Polk incurred during the Compensation Period.

Services Rendered and Disbursements Incurred

2. Attached as **Exhibit A** is a billing summary of Davis Polk professionals setting forth the (a) name and title of each individual who performed services during the Compensation Period, (b) aggregate time expended by each such individual during the Compensation Period, (c) hourly billing rate for each such individual, and (d) amount of fees earned by such individual.

3. Attached as **Exhibit B** is a summary setting forth the hours and fees billed by Davis Polk professionals by project category.

4. Attached as **Exhibit C** is a summary setting forth the type of disbursements and amounts incurred by the Davis Polk professionals in connection with the performance of professional services during the Compensation Period.

5. Attached as **Exhibit D** are Davis Polk's itemized time records for the Compensation Period organized by project category with a daily time log describing the time spent by each professional, as well as an itemization of all disbursements incurred.

Reservations

6. This Monthly Fee Application includes all the information and supporting detail regarding fees and expenses available to Davis Polk at the time of the filing of this Monthly Fee Application. If additional information or supporting detail in connection with this Compensation Period should become available, as a result of delays in accounting processing, an inadvertence with respect to time entered in the accounting system, or any other valid reason, Davis Polk reserves the right to make an application to the Court for an allowance of such fees and expenses not included in this Monthly Fee Application.

Notice

7. Pursuant to the Interim Compensation Order, notice of this Fee Statement shall be served upon:

(a) the Debtors (Attn: Gary Rahlfs, gary_rahlf@deanfoods.com, Senior Vice President and Chief Financial Officer);

(b) local counsel to the Debtors, Norton Rose Fulbright US LLP, 1301 McKinney Street, Houston, Texas 77010 (Attn: William R. Greendyke, william.greendyke@nortonrosefulbright.com, Jason L. Boland, jason.boland@nortonrosefulbright.com, Bob Bruner, bob.bruner@nortonrosefulbright.com, and Julie Harrison, julie.harrison@nortonrosefulbright.com);

(c) counsel to the Official Committee of Unsecured Creditors (Attn: Marty L. Brimmage, Jr., mbrimmage@akingump.com, Philip C. Dublin, pdublin@akingump.com, Meredith A. Lahaie, mlahaie@akingump.com, and Joanna Newdeck, jnewdeck@akingump.com);

(d) the Office of the United States Trustee for the Southern District of Texas, 515 Rusk Street, Suite 3516, Houston, Texas 77002 (Attn: Stephen D. Statham and Hector Duran Jr.); and

(e) White & Case LLP (Attn: Philip Abelson, philip.abelson@whitecase.com), as counsel to Coöperatieve Rabobank U.A., New York Branch, the administrative agent under Debtors' prepetition receivables purchase agreement, administrative agent under the Debtors' prepetition secured revolving credit facility, and administrative agent under the Debtors' proposed post-petition financing facility.

WHEREFORE, Davis Polk respectfully requests that the Court authorize (a) allowance of compensation and reimbursement in the amount of (i) \$5,429,435.20 for reasonable and necessary professional services rendered (80% of \$6,786,794.00) and (ii) \$49,280.22 for 100% of actual and necessary costs and expenses incurred, during the Compensation Period, for a total of \$5,478,715.42, (b) payment of the forgoing sums, and (c) such other and further relief as the Court deems just and proper.

Dated: June 5, 2020

Respectfully submitted,

NORTON ROSE FULBRIGHT US LLP

/s/ William R. Greendyke

William R. Greendyke (SBT 08390450)
Jason L. Boland (SBT 24040542)
Robert B. Bruner (SBT 24062637)
Julie Goodrich Harrison (SBT 24092434)
1301 McKinney Street, Suite 5100
Houston, Texas 77010-3095
Tel.: (713) 651-5151
Fax: (713) 651-5246
william.greendyke@nortonrosefulbright.com
jason.boland@nortonrosefulbright.com
bob.bruner@nortonrosefulbright.com
julie.harrison@nortonrosefulbright.com

-and-

DAVIS POLK & WARDWELL LLP

Brian M. Resnick (admitted *pro hac vice*)
Steven Z. Szanzer (admitted *pro hac vice*)
Nate Sokol (admitted *pro hac vice*)
450 Lexington Avenue
New York, New York 10017
Tel.: (212) 450-4000
Fax: (212) 701-5800
brian.resnick@davispolk.com
steven.szanzer@davispolk.com
nathaniel.sokol@davispolk.com

Counsel to the Debtors and Debtors in Possession

EXHIBIT A
COMPENSATION BY PROFESSIONAL
APRIL 1, 2020 THROUGH APRIL 30, 2020

Name of Professional Individual	Position, Year Assumed Position, and Year of Obtaining Relevant License to Practice	Hourly Billing Rate	Total Hours Billed	Total Compensation
Partners				
Azzopardi, Frank J.	Partner; joined partnership 2008; admitted New York 2004	\$1,685	67.8	\$114,243.00
Bauer, David R.	Partner; joined partnership 2018; admitted New York 2008	\$1,530	8.5	\$13,005.00
Birnbaum, Harold	Partner; joined partnership 2016; admitted New York 2009	\$1,655	162.3	\$268,606.50
Burke, Arthur J.	Partner; joined partnership 2000; admitted New York 1994	\$1,685	90.3	\$152,155.50
Crandall, Jeffrey P.	Partner; joined partnership 2011; admitted New York 1983	\$1,685	50.5	\$85,092.50
Curran, William A.	Partner; joined partnership 2017; admitted New York 2010	\$1,655	18.5	\$30,617.50
Dengel, Hilary	Partner; joined partnership 2019; admitted New York 2008	\$1,530	27.3	\$41,769.00
Goldberg, Louis L.	Partner; joined partnership 1997; admitted New York 1991	\$1,685	9.0	\$15,165.00
Kronfeld, Nicholas A.	Partner; joined partnership 1999; admitted New York 1991	\$1,685	6.4	\$10,784.00
Lichter, Brian S.	Partner; joined partnership 2013; admitted New York 2003	\$1,685	9.7	\$16,344.50
Moskowitz, Elliot	Partner; joined partnership 2010; admitted New York 2002	\$1,685	181.8	\$306,333.00
Resnick, Brian M.	Partner; joined partnership 2011; admitted New York 2004	\$1,685	243.4	\$410,129.00
Partner Total:			875.5	\$1,464,244.50

Name of Professional Individual	Position, Year Assumed Position, and Year of Obtaining Relevant License to Practice	Hourly Billing Rate	Total Hours Billed	Total Compensation
Counsel				
Altus, Leslie J.	Counsel; joined Davis Polk 1997; admitted New York 1984	\$1,295	69.8	\$90,391.00
Brecher, Stephen I.	Counsel; joined Davis Polk 2018; admitted New York 2000	\$1,295	70.7	\$91,556.50
Falk, Aryeh Ethan	Counsel; joined Davis Polk 2012; admitted New York 2013	\$1,095	16.2	\$17,739.00
Finelli, Jon	Counsel; joined Davis Polk 2018; admitted New York 2008	\$1,295	1.5	\$1,942.50
Millerman, James M.	Counsel; joined Davis Polk 2009; admitted New York 2000	\$1,295	86.5	\$112,017.50
Plotkin, Lawrence R.	Counsel; joined Davis Polk 2015; admitted New York 1991	\$1,295	112	\$145,040.00
Szanzer, Steven Z.	Counsel; joined Davis Polk 2016; admitted New York 2001	\$1,295	268.3	\$347,448.50
Takhteyev, Andrei	Counsel; joined Davis Polk 2010; admitted New York 2011	\$1,295	72.5	\$93,887.50
White, Erica D.	Counsel; joined Davis Polk 1981; admitted New York 2009	\$1,295	0.6	\$777.00
Windels, James H.R.	Counsel; joined Davis Polk 1990; admitted New York 1990	\$1,685	58.9	\$100,719.00
Zilberberg, David A.	Counsel; joined Davis Polk 2015; admitted New York 1999	\$1,295	9.9	\$12,820.50
Counsel Total:			766.9	\$1,014,339.00
Associates, Law Clerks, and Legal Assistants				
Adamson, Cameron	Associate; joined Davis Polk 2018; admitted New York 2019	\$785	259.5	\$203,707.50
Bernstein, Alexander	Associate; joined Davis Polk 2017; admitted New York 2018	\$1,065	247.3	\$263,374.50
Boehm, Korey	Associate; joined Davis Polk 2018; admitted New York 2019	\$785	3.8	\$2,983.00
Corbett, Richard	Associate; joined Davis Polk 2015; admitted New York 2016	\$1,080	3.4	\$3,672.00
Crane, Gregory, D.	Associate; joined Davis Polk 2018; admitted New York 2019	\$785	205.9	\$161,631.50
Erickson, Jarret	Associate; joined Davis Polk 2018; admitted New York 2018	\$990	17.9	\$17,721.00
Garg, Paavani	Associate; joined Davis Polk 2019; admitted New York 2019	\$785	207.2	\$162,652.00

Name of Professional Individual	Position, Year Assumed Position, and Year of Obtaining Relevant License to Practice	Hourly Billing Rate	Total Hours Billed	Total Compensation
Gibbons, Dan	Associate; joined Davis Polk 2014; admitted New York 2014	\$1,095	9.1	\$9,964.50
Ginder, Kathleen	Associate; joined Davis Polk 2017; admitted New York 2012	\$990	41.8	\$41,382.00
Gordon, Paulina	Associate; joined Davis Polk 2019; admitted New York 2019	\$690	10.7	\$7,383.00
Green, Thomas S.	Associate; joined Davis Polk 2019; admitted New York 2016	\$1,080	20.1	\$21,708.00
Jenkins, Elijah D.	Associate; joined Davis Polk 2018; admitted New York 2020	\$785	22.4	\$17,584.00
Kearney, Daniel P.	Associate; joined Davis Polk 2018; admitted New York 2019	\$785	69.5	\$54,557.50
Lee, Grace	Associate; joined Davis Polk 2019; admitted New York 2020	\$690	196.5	\$135,585.00
Leibowitz, Danielle	Associate; joined Davis Polk 2019; admitted New York 2020	\$690	196.1	\$135,309.00
Malinowsky, Thomas D.	Associate; joined Davis Polk 2015; admitted New York 2016	\$1,080	362.8	\$391,824.00
Mazer, Deborah S.	Associate; joined Davis Polk 2018; admitted New York 2018	\$990	208.8	\$206,712.00
Miller, Benjamin M.	Associate; joined Davis Polk 2015; admitted New York 2016	\$1,080	83.9	\$90,612.00
Netzer, Omer	Associate; joined Davis Polk 2016; admitted New York	\$1,065	167.5	\$178,387.50
O'Young, Jerry	Associate; joined Davis Polk 2020; admitted New York 2019	\$785	169.7	\$133,214.50
Peck, Edward	Associate; joined Davis Polk 2018; admitted New York 2019	\$785	13.2	\$10,362.00
Pittell, Joshua B.	Associate; joined Davis Polk 2019; admitted New York 2019	\$690	305.0	\$210,450.00
Presser, Talya	Associate; joined Davis Polk 2018; admitted New York 2019	\$785	27.9	\$21,901.50
Rarrick, Mohini P. B.	Associate; joined Davis Polk 2019; admitted New York 2019	\$785	132.0	\$103,620.00
Renter, Chelsea	Associate; joined Davis Polk 2019; admitted New York 2020	\$690	44.4	\$30,636.00
Schare, Lindsay	Associate; joined Davis Polk 2014; admitted New York 2013	\$1,095	75.7	\$82,891.50
Siman, Ariel David	Associate; joined Davis Polk 2014; admitted New York 2014	\$1,095	38.0	\$41,610.00

Name of Professional Individual	Position, Year Assumed Position, and Year of Obtaining Relevant License to Practice	Hourly Billing Rate	Total Hours Billed	Total Compensation
Soilleux, Nicholas	Associate; joined Davis Polk 2019; admitted New York 2015	\$1,080	29.1	\$31,428.00
Sokol, Nate	Associate; joined Davis Polk 2016; admitted New York 2017	\$1,065	293.0	\$312,045.00
Somogyi, Ben	Associate; joined Davis Polk 2019; admitted New York 2020	\$690	91.5	\$63,135.00
Thomson, Daniel J.	Associate; joined Davis Polk 2017; admitted New York 2018	\$990	85.7	\$84,843.00
Tsepelman, Bernard	Associate; joined Davis Polk 2016; admitted New York 2017	\$1,065	221.4	\$235,791.00
Walton, Sarah L.	Associate; joined Davis Polk 2019; admitted New York 2015	\$1,095	1.5	\$1,642.50
Wohlberg, Charlie	Associate; joined Davis Polk 2019; admitted New York 2020	\$690	17.3	\$11,937.00
Woller, Christopher C.	Associate; joined Davis Polk 2016; admitted New York 2017	\$1,065	118.6	\$126,309.00
Won, Kimberly (KyungEun)	Associate; joined Davis Polk 2014; admitted New York 2015	\$1,095	57.2	\$62,634.00
Butler, James C.	Law Clerk; joined Davis Polk 2019	\$690	90.8	\$62,652.00
Francis, Brendon E.	Law Clerk; joined Davis Polk 2019	\$785	15.9	\$12,481.50
Jernigan, Ben	Law Clerk; joined Davis Polk 2019	\$690	4.1	\$2,829.00
Liu, Yichen	Law Clerk; joined Davis Polk 2019	\$690	233.3	\$160,977.00
Rubin, Nathaniel F.	Law Clerk; joined Davis Polk 2019	\$785	11.3	\$8,870.50
Simpson, Kendra	Law Clerk; joined Davis Polk 2019	\$690	30.7	\$21,183.00
Stotsky, Jonah J.	Law Clerk; joined Davis Polk 2019	\$690	121.5	\$83,835.00
Turay, Edna	Law Clerk; joined Davis Polk 2019	\$690	64.3	\$44,367.00
Bruney, Theresa	Legal Assistant; joined Davis Polk 2001	\$450	6.3	\$2,835.00
Giddens, Magali	Legal Assistant; joined Davis Polk 2019	\$450	76.0	\$34,200.00
Halford, Edgar Bernard	Legal Assistant; joined Davis Polk 2003	\$450	1.7	\$765.00

Name of Professional Individual	Position, Year Assumed Position, and Year of Obtaining Relevant License to Practice	Hourly Billing Rate	Total Hours Billed	Total Compensation
Hug, Kayla	Legal Assistant; joined Davis Polk 2019	\$325	44.3	\$14,397.50
Nandkeolyar, Anya	Legal Assistant; joined Davis Polk 2019	\$325	9.5	\$3,087.50
Ramjas, Rana S.	Legal Assistant; joined Davis Polk 1995	\$450	65.8	\$29,610.00
Schiavone, Cara	Legal Assistant; joined Davis Polk 2019	\$325	8.4	\$2,730.00
Stevens, Kelsey D.	Legal Assistant; joined Davis Polk 1992	\$450	17.9	\$8,055.00
Sullivan, Bernadette M.	Legal Assistant; joined Davis Polk 1993	\$450	166.1	\$74,745.00
Vanora, Maria F.	Legal Assistant; joined Davis Polk 1985	\$450	8.6	\$3,870.00
Weiss, Alex	Legal Assistant; joined Davis Polk 2017	\$450	1.1	\$495.00
Cooley, Timothy	Discovery Attorney; joined Davis Polk 2019	\$495	51.9	\$25,690.50
Jouvin, Zoe	Discovery Attorney; joined Davis Polk 2020	\$495	29.4	\$14,553.00
Schlosser, Jeremy	Discovery Attorney; joined Davis Polk 2019	\$495	37.9	\$18,760.50
Chau, Kin Man	EDiscovery Analyst; joined Davis Polk 2006	\$405	5.7	\$2,878.50
Ionescu, Alex	EDiscovery Senior Technology Specialist; joined Davis Polk 2018	\$405	1.0	\$405.00
Soussan, Susan	EDiscovery Project Manager; joined Davis Polk 2008	\$505	4.6	\$1,863.00
Denkowski, John P.	Senior Corporate Librarian; joined Davis Polk 1996	\$585	0.7	\$409.50
Florio, Joseph A.	Director, Library Services; joined Davis Polk 1993	\$585	0.3	\$175.50
Reyes, Louis	EDGAR Specialist; joined Davis Polk 2015	\$290	0.6	\$174.00
Tong, Lily	EDGAR Specialist; joined Davis Polk 2013	\$290	0.4	\$116.00
Associates, Law Clerks, and Legal Assistants Total:			5,165.5	\$4,308,210.50
TOTAL			6,807.9	\$6,786,794.00

Grand Total	\$6,786,794.00
Attorney Compensation	\$6,149,783.50
Total Attorney Hours	5,697.80
Blended Attorney Rate	\$1,079.33
Total Timekeeper Hours	6,807.90
Blended Timekeeper Rate	\$996.90

EXHIBIT B
COMPENSATION BY PROJECT CATEGORY
APRIL 1, 2020 THROUGH APRIL 30, 2020

Project Category	Total Hours	Total Fees
Asset Dispositions	3,054.3	\$2,965,475.00
Corporate Governance, Board Matters, and Communications	19.6	\$29,840.00
Creditor/Equityholder/UCC Issues	209.5	\$221,743.50
DPW Retention	23.0	\$17,026.50
Employee/Labor Issues	229.7	\$261,897.50
Financing, Cash Collateral, and Adequate Protection	445.2	\$507,433.00
General Case Administration	100.6	\$98,438.50
Leases and Contracts	185.8	\$196,906.00
Litigation	533.0	\$482,559.50
Non-Davis Polk Retention and Fee Issues	17.0	\$14,377.00
Plan/Disclosure Statement	228.2	\$228,160.00
Preparation of Fee Statements/Applications and Budget	270.2	\$171,278.00
Regulatory and Environmental	199.7	\$242,348.00
Reporting	41.7	\$41,190.00
Hearing Preparation	423.7	\$472,239.00
Business Operations	74.8	\$80,005.50
Collective Bargaining Agreements	751.9	\$755,877.00
TOTAL	6,807.9	\$6,786,794.00

EXHIBIT C
EXPENSE SUMMARY
APRIL 1, 2020 THROUGH APRIL 30, 2020

DISBURSEMENT SUMMARY	
Description	Amount
Court and related fees	\$4,865.00
Postage, courier, & freight	\$769.64
Outside Documents & Research	\$1,470.15
Meals	\$872.11
Travel	\$12,673.19
Computer research	\$28,413.74
Duplication	\$151.70
Litigation Support	\$64.69
TOTAL	\$49,280.22

EXHIBIT D
TIME DETAIL

Time Detail By Project			
Name	Date	Hours	Narrative
R110 ASSET DISPOSITIONS			
Adamson, Cameron	04/01/20	15.9	Review and revise disclosure schedules to various Asset Purchase Agreements (4.4); correspondence with successful bidders regarding signing process (9.1); correspondence with Davis Polk team regarding same (1.4); correspondence with L. Altus regarding tax issues in sale (0.6); correspondence with Davis Polk Intellectual Property Team regarding license issues (0.4).
Altus, Leslie J.	04/01/20	1.4	Correspondence with C Adamson regarding certain Asset Purchase Agreement (0.9); review email regarding tax issues in connection with sale (0.2); email exchange with S. Huber regarding Asset Purchase Agreement schedule (0.3).
Azzopardi, Frank J.	04/01/20	1.3	Correspondence with Davis Polk team regarding license issues (0.6); review response from certain buyer regarding intellectual property issue (0.2); review proposed language to address license issue (0.2); advise Davis Polk team regarding approach to same (0.3).
Bernstein, Alexander	04/01/20	3.0	Review correspondence with Dean Foods and advisors regarding sale objections (0.3); review and revise declarations in support of Sale Reply (2.4); call with L. Schare regarding same (0.3).
Birnbaum, Harold	04/01/20	14.7	Calls and correspondence with successful bidders regarding bids and sale process (8.1); review and provide comments to sale documents (5.3); calls and emails with K. Waterman and others at Dean Foods, J. Kimm and others at Evercore, L. Goldberg and others at Davis Polk regarding sale process (1.3).
Boehm, Korey	04/01/20	1.4	Teleconference with team regarding Sale Reply (1.1); correspondence with J. Millerman regarding asset sales (0.3).
Brecher, Stephen I.	04/01/20	1.8	Review Asset Purchase Agreements (0.2); call with Dean Foods regarding benefits provisions of same (1.0); conference with J. Crandall and K. Ginder regarding same (0.2); review and provide comments to Asset Purchase Agreement (0.2); conference with K. Ginder regarding same (0.2).
Crandall, Jeffrey P.	04/01/20	1.7	Review Asset Purchase Agreement and benefits issues (0.5); call with S. Brecher, and K. Ginder regarding same (0.2); calls with Dean Foods regarding same (1.0)
Crane, Gregory D.	04/01/20	3.9	Review bids (1.4); correspondence with Davis Polk team regarding same (0.9); review existing title and survey materials (0.9); call with Dean Foods team regarding same (0.5); review title materials in data room (0.2).
Curran, William A.	04/01/20	0.4	Review Asset Purchase Agreements and sale objections.
Erickson, Jarret	04/01/20	0.8	Review and revise Sale Reply (0.4); correspondence with J. Millerman, N. Sokol, and Y. Liu regarding same (0.4).
Falk, Aryeh Ethan	04/01/20	0.5	Correspondence with B. Resnick and others regarding statutory liens.
Garg, Paavani	04/01/20	10.8	Revise Sale Orders (8.7); correspondence with Davis Polk team and successful bidders regarding same (2.1).
Ginder, Kathleen	04/01/20	2.0	Call with Dean Foods team regarding employee benefit provisions in Asset Purchase Agreements of winning bidders (1.0); call with S. Brecher and J. Crandall regarding same (0.2); review Asset Purchase Agreements (0.5); review union issues related to the assets for each bidder (0.3).

Time Detail By Project			
Name	Date	Hours	Narrative
Goldberg, Louis L.	04/01/20	3.5	Review bids (2.2); correspondence with Davis Polk team and co-advisors regarding same (1.3).
Ionescu, Alex	04/01/20	0.6	Prepare sale discovery document production.
Jernigan, Ben	04/01/20	2.2	Research regarding section 363 for Sale Reply (2.0); correspondence with Y. Liu regarding same (0.2).
Liu, Yichen	04/01/20	10.5	Review and summarize legal standard in relevant sale pleadings precedents (1.6); correspondence with N. Sokol and J. Millerman regarding same (0.4); review Sale Reply research regarding same and revise corresponding Sale Reply section (1.7); review and summarize sale objections (4.1); prepare email to Dean Foods team regarding same (0.7); correspondence with Davis Polk Finance team regarding lien issues (0.4); review and revise Sale Reply (1.2); attend call with N. Sokol and others from Davis Polk regarding Sale Reply workstreams (partial attendance) (0.4).
Malinowsky, Thomas D.	04/01/20	19.1	Calls with Dean Foods regarding issues in Asset Purchase Agreement (2.3); prepare sale checklist (1.5); prepare comments to Prairie Farms Asset Purchase Agreement (5.5); calls with Evercore and bidder counsel regarding Prairie Farms Asset Purchase Agreement (2.1); review and revise Dairy Farmers of America Asset Purchase Agreement (0.7); prepare issues list regarding certain bids (2.5); review and revise Hawaii Asset Purchase Agreement (2.5); correspondence with Davis Polk team regarding same (2.0).
Millerman, James M.	04/01/20	16.3	Correspondence with Davis Polk team regarding Sale Reply (4.2); review and revise same (2.4); review legal analyses, cases, and other materials collected in connection with same (3.1); review Sale Objections and analyze same (5.0); correspondence with E. Moskowitz regarding Sale Reply (0.5); call with Davis Polk team regarding Sale Reply (1.1).
Moskowitz, Elliot	04/01/20	9.7	Review sale objections and related pleadings (4.2); draft and revise sections of Sale Reply (2.2); review Asset Purchase Agreements for labor issues (1.1); review and revise Sale Reply (2.2).
Pittell, Joshua B.	04/01/20	15.5	Review and revise disclosure schedules to various Asset Purchase Agreements (11.1); correspondence with Davis Polk Mergers & Acquisitions team regarding status of same (0.9); calls with successful bidders regarding transactions and ancillary documents (2.4); calls with J. Sutton regarding disclosure schedules (1.2).
Plotkin, Lawrence R.	04/01/20	5.1	Review bids (2.1); correspondence with Davis Polk team regarding comments to closing conditions and title deliverables for closing for same (0.9); review and revise Asset Purchase Agreements in connection with same (1.3); correspondence with Davis Polk team regarding same (0.8).
Presser, Talya	04/01/20	2.8	Review Asset Purchase Agreements (0.3); review bids and analyze tax issues (2.5).
Rarrick, Mohini P.B.	04/01/20	15.0	Review various sale objections (8.0); update tracker of same (2.0); correspondence with Davis Polk team regarding sale process (1.5); review case law regarding legal standards (2.4); attend call with Davis Polk team regarding Sale Reply (1.1).
Renter, Chelsea	04/01/20	0.7	Review intellectual property issues regarding acquired facilities.

Time Detail By Project			
Name	Date	Hours	Narrative
Resnick, Brian M.	04/01/20	11.2	Calls with Dean Foods and Davis Polk Mergers & Acquisitions team and co-advisors regarding Asset Purchase Agreements (3.7); emails regarding same (0.5); calls with Dean Foods and Evercore regarding Miami sale (0.8); review sale objections (1.6); emails with Davis Polk team regarding same and Sale Reply (1.5); correspondence with E. Moskowitz and others from Davis Polk regarding same (2.0); review email to Dean Foods regarding same (0.2); emails regarding resolutions to sale objections (0.9).
Schare, Lindsay	04/01/20	3.0	Review sale discovery requests (0.4); emails regarding discovery attorneys (0.1); draft and revise witness declarations (2.5).
Siman, Ariel David	04/01/20	1.0	Review Asset Purchase Agreements.
Sokol, Nate	04/01/20	14.2	Correspondence with Davis Polk Mergers & Acquisitions team and Dean Foods regarding bids (1.5); email with Davis Polk tax team regarding tax provisions of Asset Purchase Agreements (0.5); email with B. Resnick, Davis Polk team regarding Ad Hoc Group limited objection to sale (0.8); review sale objections (4.5); emails with S. Szanzer, P. Garg, M. Rarrick, and Y. Liu regarding same (1.7); draft Sale Reply (4.1); call with J. Millerman, Y. Liu, M. Rarrick, and others regarding Sale Reply (1.1).
Somogyi, Ben	04/01/20	0.7	Revise real estate purchase-sale agreement bid tracker (0.5); correspondence with Davis Polk team regarding same (0.2).
Soussan, Susan	04/01/20	1.5	Prepare sale discovery document production (1.2); correspondence with J. Lewis regarding document review for same (0.3).
Szanzer, Steven Z.	04/01/20	17.7	Review sale objections (2.7); draft and revise sale notices (0.9); review and revise Sale Orders (7.5); correspondence with Davis Polk regarding same (1.0); correspondence and calls with bidders and their advisors regarding same (1.9); correspondence with Akin Gump regarding sale status (0.6); correspondence with White & Case regarding same (0.4); correspondence and calls with Dean Foods regarding same (1.7); correspondence and calls with Evercore regarding same (0.7); coordinate court filings regarding sale (0.3).
Thomson, Daniel J.	04/01/20	7.5	Correspondence with Davis Polk Restructuring team regarding Sale Reply (0.9); coordinate review and preparation of incoming sale discovery productions (1.3); review and revise draft Sale Reply (1.4); review and revise declaration in support of same (3.9).
Tsepelman, Bernard	04/01/20	0.4	Prepare schedules to DIP Credit Agreement for J. Pittell (0.2); correspondence with J. Pittell regarding same (0.2).
Windels, James H.R.	04/01/20	0.5	Review Ad Hoc Group sale objection (0.5).
Woller, Christopher C.	04/01/20	2.5	Provide comments to intellectual property provisions of Asset Purchase Agreements (1.8); correspondence with Davis Polk team regarding intellectual property disclosure schedules (0.7).
Zilberberg, David A.	04/01/20	0.5	Emails with C. Adamson regarding sale process (0.2); review Asset Purchase Agreements (0.3).

Time Detail By Project			
Name	Date	Hours	Narrative
Adamson, Cameron	04/02/20	13.7	Correspondence with Davis Polk team, co-advisors, and successful bidders regarding Asset Purchase Agreement signing process (6.7); calls with bidders regarding sale documents (1.2); review disclosure schedules to Asset Purchase Agreements and other transaction documents (4.8); correspondence with Davis Polk mergers & acquisitions regarding sale workstreams and status (1.0).
Altus, Leslie J.	04/02/20	0.7	Correspondence with A Siman regarding tax issues in Asset Purchase Agreement (0.2); review Alvarez & Marsal tax calculations regarding bids (0.5).
Azzopardi, Frank J.	04/02/20	1.3	Correspondence with Davis Polk team regarding license issues (0.6); review response from Dairy Farmers of America regarding intellectual property issue (0.2); review proposed language to address license issue (0.2); advise Davis Polk team regarding approach to same (0.3).
Bernstein, Alexander	04/02/20	3.9	Review and revise Sale Reply (1.6); correspondence with Davis Polk team regarding same (0.6); review and revise declarations in connection with Sale Reply (0.7); correspondence with Davis Polk teams regarding same (0.1); call with Alvarez & Marsal team regarding same (0.3); prepare correspondence with Ad Hoc Group regarding sale discovery requests (0.5); correspondence with Davis Polk team regarding document requests (0.1).
Birnbaum, Harold	04/02/20	15.7	Negotiate bids with bidders (8.3); review and revise transaction documents (5.1); calls and emails with K. Waterman and others at Dean Foods, J. Kimm, and others at Evercore, L. Goldberg, and others at Davis Polk regarding bid (2.3).
Boehm, Korey	04/02/20	2.4	Review and revise Sale Reply.
Brecher, Stephen I.	04/02/20	0.1	Correspondence with T. Malinowsky regarding Asset Purchase Agreements.
Burke, Arthur J.	04/02/20	1.2	Draft and revise rider to Sale Reply.
Crandall, Jeffrey P.	04/02/20	1.2	Review labor issues in Asset Purchase Agreement (0.7); call with bidder regarding same (0.5).
Crane, Gregory D.	04/02/20	5.0	Telephone conference with counsel to Hawaii bidders (0.5); correspondence regarding existing title and survey materials (0.4); review Miami bid (1.1); telephone conference with Hawaii bid counsel (1.9); review Hawaii bid (1.1).
Curran, William A.	04/02/20	0.9	Review and analyze tax issues in Asset Purchase Agreements.
Garg, Paavani	04/02/20	16.3	Revise and finalize Sale Orders (14.0); correspondence with S. Szanzer regarding same (2.3).
Goldberg, Louis L.	04/02/20	4.5	Calls and emails with Dean Foods team and co-advisors regarding sale (3.2); review transaction documents (1.3).
Jernigan, Ben	04/02/20	1.9	Review and revise Sale Reply (1.9).
Liu, Yichen	04/02/20	8.0	Review and revise Sale Reply (2.9); draft responses regarding certain sale objections (0.5); review sale objection and conduct follow-up research (1.3); further revise Sale Reply regarding same (0.6); correspondence with J. Millerman regarding same (0.5); conduct further research regarding same and further revise Sale Reply (1.4); review issues regarding sale objections (0.5); correspondence with Davis Polk team regarding statutory lien issues (0.3).

Time Detail By Project			
Name	Date	Hours	Narrative
Malinowsky, Thomas D.	04/02/20	19.2	Review and revise Asset Purchase Agreement (5.6); calls with co-advisors and bidder regarding same (2.7); correspondence with Davis Polk regarding status of Asset Purchase Agreements (2.1); review and revise schedules to Asset Purchase Agreement (1.2); correspondence with Davis Polk Intellectual Property Team regarding intellectual property sale issues (0.8); review Asset Purchase Agreement and prepare issues list (2.1); call with bidder counsel regarding same (1.2); review and revise certain Asset Purchase Agreement (1.5); review certain Asset Purchase Agreement and prepare issues list regarding same (1.3); calls and emails with Davis Polk team regarding same (0.7).
Millerman, James M.	04/02/20	17.4	Review and analyze sale objections (2.8); review precedent sale replies and other transaction documents regarding same (3.2); correspondence with Davis Polk team regarding same (5.5); review and revise Sale Reply (4.7); correspondence with Davis Polk team regarding same (1.2).
Moskowitz, Elliot	04/02/20	11.1	Review and revise Sale Reply (4.4); review and revise declarations in support of same (0.9); correspondence with Davis Polk team regarding sale objections and proposed resolutions (4.9); correspondence with Davis Polk team regarding Sale Reply (0.9).
Netzer, Omer	04/02/20	3.2	Research regarding Sale Reply (2.8); correspondence with N. Sokol regarding same (0.4).
Pittell, Joshua B.	04/02/20	14.6	Review and revise disclosure schedules to Asset Purchase Agreements (11.8); correspondence with Davis Polk Mergers & Acquisitions team regarding sale workstreams and status (1.0); calls with buyers regarding transaction documents (1.2); update transaction documents tracker (1.4).
Plotkin, Lawrence R.	04/02/20	4.8	Review real estate issues in certain Asset Purchase Agreement (0.7); call with bidder real estate counsel regarding Asset Purchase Agreement and closing conditions for sale (0.3); further review of documents regarding same (1.3); prepare for and attend call with bidder counsel regarding certain bid (0.8); revise Asset Purchase Agreement for same (0.9); calls and emails with Dean Foods regarding delivery of title materials and closing (0.8).
Presser, Talya	04/02/20	1.2	Review tax issues in connection with sale.
Rarrick, Mohini P.B.	04/02/20	13.2	Review and revise Sale Reply (2.7); review precedent case law regarding Sale Reply (4.0); correspondence with N. Sokol, Y. Liu, and J. Millerman regarding same (1.3); review sale objections (5.2).
Renter, Chelsea	04/02/20	3.0	Draft disclosure schedules for Asset Purchase Agreements (1.8); call with Davis Polk team regarding sale process and status (1.2).
Resnick, Brian M.	04/02/20	8.6	Calls with Davis Polk Mergers & Acquisitions team, Dean Foods, Evercore and Alvarez & Marsal regarding Asset Purchase Agreement negotiations (2.4); review and revise Sale Reply (3.4); calls with Davis Polk team regarding sale objections in connection with same (2.3); review sale objections (0.5).
Schare, Lindsay	04/02/20	9.6	Draft and revise declarations in support of Sale Reply; (6.8) correspondence with Davis Polk team and co-advisors regarding same (0.8); review draft Sale Reply (0.9); review sale discovery document production (1.1).

Time Detail By Project			
Name	Date	Hours	Narrative
Siman, Ariel David	04/02/20	1.3	Review Asset Purchase Agreements.
Sokol, Nate	04/02/20	15.7	Email with J. Erickson, O. Netzer, and others regarding sale objections research workstreams (2.3); email with Evercore team and Alvarez & Marsal team regarding sale process (1.5); review declarations in support of Sale Reply (0.8); correspondence with L. Schare and others regarding same (0.2); email with N. Haughey, L. Schare, and others regarding creditors' claims in connection with same (1.3); draft Sale Reply (5.7); correspondence with J. Millerman, Y. Liu, B. Resnick, E. Moskowitz, and others regarding same (2.4); calls and emails with co-advisors and Dean Foods regarding bid (1.5).
Somogyi, Ben	04/02/20	0.8	Correspondence regarding real estate purchase-sale agreement bids.
Soussan, Susan	04/02/20	0.6	Prepare sale discovery document production.
Szanzer, Steven Z.	04/02/20	19.4	Review sale objections (4.3); review markups of Sale Orders from bidder counsel (6.5); correspondence with P. Garg regarding same (1.8); correspondence and calls with bidders and their advisors (2.2); correspondence and calls with Akin Gump regarding sale status (0.3); correspondence and calls with White & Case regarding same (0.2); correspondence and calls with Dean Foods regarding same (0.5); correspondence and calls with Evercore regarding same (1.0); review Sale Reply (1.9); coordinate filing of same and related documents (0.3); correspondence with Davis Polk regarding same (0.4).
Thomson, Daniel J.	04/02/20	7.0	Review and revise Sale Reply (2.4); review and revise declarations in support of same (3.3); correspondence with Davis Polk team regarding sale discovery document production (1.3).
Woller, Christopher C.	04/02/20	4.2	Call with bidder regarding intellectual property issues (0.5); review and revise Asset Purchase Agreement in connection with same (0.5); review disclosure schedules (1.1); further review and revise Asset Purchase Agreement (0.6); call with bidder regarding same (0.3); draft rider to certain Asset Purchase Agreement (0.4); correspondence with Davis Polk team regarding trademark issues (0.4); review license issues (0.4).
Adamson, Cameron	04/03/20	11.0	Call with Davis Polk Mergers & Acquisitions team regarding sale workstreams (0.9); call with J. Sutton and others from Dean Foods regarding Asset Purchase Agreement disclosure schedules and sale status (1.7); review and revise transaction ancillary documents (4.5); review and revise Asset Purchase Agreement disclosure schedules (3.9).
Altus, Leslie J.	04/03/20	3.7	Review tax liability calculation by Alvarez & Marsal (1.6); call W. Curran and others regarding same (0.5); call with A. Ulyanenko regarding same (1.1); review email regarding certain Asset Purchase Agreement (0.5).
Azzopardi, Frank J.	04/03/20	1.1	Call with C. Woller and H. Birnbaum regarding intellectual property issues in Asset Purchase Agreement (0.6); correspondence with Davis Polk Mergers & Acquisitions team regarding same (0.3); follow-up correspondence with Davis Polk team regarding license issue (0.2).

Time Detail By Project			
Name	Date	Hours	Narrative
Bernstein, Alexander	04/03/20	2.3	Correspondence with Davis Polk team regarding Sale Reply (0.2); review and revise declarations regarding same (0.3); correspondence with Davis Polk team and Norton Rose team regarding same (0.3); review and prepare sale discovery production (0.7); correspondence with Davis Polk team and Akin Gump team regarding same (0.4); correspondence with Ad Hoc Group regarding same (0.2); further correspondence with Davis Polk team regarding same (0.2).
Birnbaum, Harold	04/03/20	11.9	Review Asset Purchase Agreement (4.7); review and revise ancillary documents (2.7); calls and emails with K. Waterman and others at Dean Foods, J. Kimm and others at Evercore, L. Goldberg and others at Davis Polk (3.0); call with F. Azzopardi and C. Woller regarding intellectual property sale issues (0.6); call with Davis Polk Mergers & Acquisitions team regarding sale workstreams (0.9).
Crane, Gregory D.	04/03/20	1.1	Review sale property information (0.3); revise Asset Purchase Agreement in connection with same (0.2); correspondence with Davis Polk Mergers & Acquisitions team regarding same (0.2); review and revise certain real estate ancillary document (0.4).
Curran, William A.	04/03/20	3.2	Review and revise Asset Purchase Agreement in connection with tax issues (2.0); conduct tax analysis regarding closing (0.7); call with L. Altus and others regarding same (0.5).
Garg, Paavani	04/03/20	12.1	Draft and revise Sale Orders (9.6); correspondence with S. Szanzer regarding same (2.5).
Ionescu, Alex	04/03/20	0.6	Prepare sale discovery document production.
Liu, Yichen	04/03/20	1.3	Review sale objections.
Malinowsky, Thomas D.	04/03/20	13.5	Review and revise Prairie Farms Asset Purchase Agreement (2.3); review and revise IRG Asset Purchase Agreement (2.9); correspondence with Davis Polk Intellectual Property Team regarding intellectual property issue regarding sales (0.8); review markup to Miami Asset Purchase Agreement and prepare issues list regarding same (2.7); call with Mana counsel regarding Miami Asset Purchase Agreement (1.4); correspondence among Davis Polk Mergers & Acquisitions team and Dean Foods regarding status of transactions (1.7); coordinate Sale Order authorizations with bidders and Davis Polk Restructuring team (0.8); call with Davis Polk Mergers & Acquisitions team regarding workstreams (0.9).
Miller, Benjamin M.	04/03/20	4.3	Review regulatory submission materials (2.5); correspondence with Davis Polk team and co-advisors regarding same (1.2); correspondence with Davis Polk team and co-advisors regarding sale objections (0.3); call with C. Wohlberg regarding regulatory inquiry (0.3).
Millerman, James M.	04/03/20	3.0	Review sale objections (1.2); finalize Sale Reply (1.8).
Moskowitz, Elliot	04/03/20	1.3	Correspondence with Davis Polk team regarding Sale Reply (1.3).
Netzer, Omer	04/03/20	0.6	Call with J. Sutton regarding certain assets.
Pittell, Joshua B.	04/03/20	14.1	Review and revise Asset Purchase Agreements disclosure schedules (10.9); calls with J. Sutton regarding same (1.7); draft escrow release instructions and coordinate wire instructions for depositors (1.5); attend Davis Polk Mergers & Acquisitions team call regarding sale workstreams (0.9).
Plotkin, Lawrence R.	04/03/20	1.8	Review and revise Hawaii Asset Purchase Agreement (1.4); correspondence with Davis Polk team regarding same (0.4).

Time Detail By Project			
Name	Date	Hours	Narrative
Presser, Talya	04/03/20	1.9	Call with Alvarez & Marsal team regarding tax issues in connection with sale (1.1); call with L. Altus and others from Davis Polk tax team regarding same (0.5); correspondence with same regarding same (0.3).
Rarrick, Mohini P.B.	04/03/20	6.5	Correspondence with Davis Polk team regarding revised Sale Orders (3.0); review sale objections and complete tracker of same (3.5).
Renter, Chelsea	04/03/20	3.1	Review and revise Asset Purchase Agreements disclosure schedules.
Resnick, Brian M.	04/03/20	6.4	Emails with Davis Polk team and objectors regarding Sale Orders (2.8); correspondence with Davis Polk team regarding same (1.8); emails with Davis Polk team regarding Asset Purchase Agreement (1.5); call with J. Stegenga regarding asset sale issues (0.3).
Schare, Lindsay	04/03/20	0.5	Coordinate sale discovery document production.
Siman, Ariel David	04/03/20	5.3	Review Asset Purchase Agreements for tax issues (3.7); call with L. Altus and others regarding same (0.5); call with A. Ulyanenko and others regarding same (1.1).
Simpson, Kendra	04/03/20	0.5	Call with Davis Polk tax team regarding Asset Purchase Agreement tax analysis.
Sokol, Nate	04/03/20	5.0	Email with S. Szanzer, P. Garg, B. Resnick, J. Ktsanes, and others regarding Sale Orders (1.8); email with J. Cohen, A. Burke, B. Resnick, and others regarding certain sale objection (1.2); correspondence with S. Szanzer and P. Garg regarding Sale Order (0.7); review and revise proposed Sale Orders (1.0); correspondence with S. Szanzer and P. Garg regarding same (0.3).
Soussan, Susan	04/03/20	0.6	Prepare sale discovery document production.
Szanzer, Steven Z.	04/03/20	9.0	Review correspondence regarding sale process (0.8); review markups of Sale Orders (1.4); further revisions to same (2.8); correspondence with Davis Polk team regarding same (0.7); correspondence and calls with bidders and their advisors (1.1); correspondence and calls with objectors regarding same (0.4); correspondence and calls with Akin Gump regarding sale status (0.3); correspondence and calls with White & Case regarding same (0.3); correspondence and calls with Dean Foods regarding same (0.2); correspondence and calls with Evercore regarding same (0.3); review reply to certain objection (0.7).
Thomson, Daniel J.	04/03/20	2.7	Review sale discovery document production.
Woller, Christopher C.	04/03/20	5.8	Prepare disclosure schedules for Asset Purchase Agreements (2.1); review and revise Prairie Farms Asset Purchase Agreement (1.2); correspondence with Latham & Watkins regarding intellectual property provisions in Dairy Farmers of America Asset Purchase Agreement (0.5); call with F. Azzopardi and H. Birnbaum regarding intellectual property issues (0.6); draft issues list regarding Producer's intellectual property issues (0.5); draft issues list regarding Dairy Farmers of America intellectual property issues (0.4); review Dairy Farmers of America license mark-up (0.5).

Time Detail By Project			
Name	Date	Hours	Narrative
Adamson, Cameron	04/04/20	7.5	Attend pre-call with Davis Polk team regarding ancillary sale documents (1.3); attend call with bidder counsel regarding same (1.3); call with Davis Polk Intellectual Property Team regarding intellectual property sale issues (0.6); attend call with Davis Polk Mergers & Acquisitions team regarding workstreams (1.3); review Asset Purchase Agreements disclosure schedules (2.4); call with J. Sutton regarding same (0.6).
Altus, Leslie J.	04/04/20	1.2	Correspondence regarding Asset Purchase Agreements (0.3); correspondence with A. Siman regarding tax research questions in connection with same (0.3); review Alvarez & Marsal tax calculations (0.6).
Azzopardi, Frank J.	04/04/20	0.7	Correspondence with Davis Polk Mergers & Acquisitions team regarding intellectual property licensing issue (0.6); correspondence with same regarding same (0.1).
Birnbaum, Harold	04/04/20	10.9	Review Asset Purchase Agreement (3.4); review and revise ancillary transaction documents (4.0); calls and emails with K. Waterman and others at Dean Foods, J. Kimm and others at Evercore, L. Goldberg and others at Davis Polk regarding sale process (1.6); correspondence with Davis Polk Intellectual Property Team regarding intellectual property issues (0.6); correspondence with same regarding same (1.3).
Burke, Arthur J.	04/04/20	1.5	Draft response to sale objection (1.1); correspondence with Davis Polk team regarding same (0.4).
Crane, Gregory D.	04/04/20	0.1	Review correspondence regarding real estate bid.
Curran, William A.	04/04/20	0.3	Review Asset Purchase Agreement (0.3).
Garg, Paavani	04/04/20	7.0	Review and revise Sale Orders (5.4); correspondence with S. Szanzer regarding same (0.9); correspondence with bidder counsel regarding same (0.7).
Liu, Yichen	04/04/20	2.5	Review certain objection (0.3); prepare draft sale reply to same (2.1); correspondence with N. Sokol regarding same (0.1).
Malinowsky, Thomas D.	04/04/20	12.7	Prepare revised draft of Miami Asset Purchase Agreement (1.8); review bidder counsel comments to Miami Asset Purchase Agreement and prepare issues list regarding same (3.7); correspondence with Davis Polk Intellectual Property Team and H. Birnbaum regarding intellectual property issues (0.6); calls with Davis Polk team regarding status of various sale agreements (1.3); coordinate filing of Sale Orders and transaction document exhibits with Davis Polk restructuring team (0.9); preparation for and pre-call with Dean Foods regarding Dean Foods Transition Services Agreement and commercial agreements (1.3); call with Latham & Watkins and Dairy Farmers of America regarding Transition Services Agreement and intellectual property licenses (1.3); emails with same regarding same (1.3); follow-up correspondence with Dean Foods regarding same (0.5).
Miller, Benjamin M.	04/04/20	1.2	Prepare precedent summary for sale objection reply.
Pittell, Joshua B.	04/04/20	11.2	Prepare updates to Asset Purchase Agreement disclosure schedules (7.5); call with J. Sutton regarding same (0.6); revise ancillary transaction agreements (0.5); attend call with Davis Polk Mergers & Acquisitions team regarding status and deliverables (1.3); calls with bidder regarding transaction documents (1.3).

Time Detail By Project			
Name	Date	Hours	Narrative
Rarrick, Mohini P.B.	04/04/20	2.6	Review correspondence with Davis Polk team regarding sale process (0.8); review sale objections (1.8).
Renter, Chelsea	04/04/20	6.7	Call with Dean Foods regarding Asset Purchase Agreement (1.0); call with Dairy Farmers of America regarding Asset Purchase Agreement (1.0); correspondence with Davis Polk team regarding Asset Purchase Agreements and disclosure schedules (1.0); revise disclosure schedules (3.7).
Resnick, Brian M.	04/04/20	3.9	Emails with Davis Polk team and bidders regarding revisions to Sale Orders (2.4); correspondence with Davis Polk team regarding same (0.4); review certain sale objection (0.1); review draft reply thereto (0.2); emails with Davis Polk team regarding same (0.2); correspondence with H. Birnbaum regarding Asset Purchase Agreement (0.6).
Siman, Ariel David	04/04/20	2.0	Review Asset Purchase Agreements for tax issues.
Sokol, Nate	04/04/20	4.8	Review and revise Sale Orders (1.3); email P. Garg, B. Resnick, and S. Szanzer regarding same (2.0); email with Norton Rose team, Chambers, and others regarding Dairy Farmers of America Sale Order (0.5); review and revise sale reply to certain objections (0.8); correspondence with B. Resnick and A. Burke regarding same (0.2).
Somogyi, Ben	04/04/20	0.3	Review correspondence with Davis Polk team and bidder counsel regarding purchase of Reno facility.
Szanzer, Steven Z.	04/04/20	1.0	Review emails regarding status of Sale Orders and Asset Purchase Agreements.
Woller, Christopher C.	04/04/20	7.2	Pre-call with Dean Foods regarding intellectual property issues (1.0); call with Dean Foods and Dairy Farmers of America regarding Transition Services Agreement and trademark license with Dean Foods (1.0); revise license draft following discussions (1.1); finalize comments to Asset Purchase Agreement disclosure schedules (2.0); correspondence with C. Renter regarding same (0.8); discussion with Shearman & Sterling regarding intellectual property issues (0.5); correspondence with Dean Foods regarding open intellectual property issues (0.4); correspondence with Davis Polk Mergers & Acquisitions team regarding sale status (0.4).
Adamson, Cameron	04/05/20	7.1	Review Asset Purchase Agreement disclosure schedules (1.6); call with J. Sutton regarding same (0.6); attend call with Davis Polk Mergers & Acquisitions team regarding sale status and workstreams (0.6); review revisions to ancillary transaction documents (1.7); attend call with Dean Foods team regarding sale status (1.7); review Asset Purchase Agreement (0.9).
Azzopardi, Frank J.	04/05/20	0.6	Analyze licensing issues (0.4); correspondence with Davis Polk team regarding same (0.2).
Bernstein, Alexander	04/05/20	0.2	Correspondence with Davis Polk team regarding sale discovery requests.
Birnbaum, Harold	04/05/20	4.9	Review transaction documents (1.5); call with T. Malinowsky and Dean Foods team regarding disclosure schedules (0.8); calls and emails with Dean Foods team and Davis Polk team regarding sale status (2.0); call with Davis Polk Mergers & Acquisitions team regarding sale status and workstreams (0.6).

Time Detail By Project			
Name	Date	Hours	Narrative
Brecher, Stephen I.	04/05/20	0.4	Correspondence with H. Birnbaum regarding labor transition issues following transactions (0.2); correspondence with J. Crandall regarding same (0.2).
Burke, Arthur J.	04/05/20	0.7	Correspondence with Davis Polk team regarding sale objection response.
Crandall, Jeffrey P.	04/05/20	0.4	Review Asset Purchase Agreement labor issues (0.2); correspondence with S. Brecher regarding same (0.2).
Crane, Gregory D.	04/05/20	0.1	Review correspondence regarding real estate bid.
Garg, Paavani	04/05/20	8.4	Review and revise Sale Orders (5.9); correspondence with Creditors' Committee and DIP Agent regarding same (0.8); correspondence with buyer counsel regarding same (0.5); correspondence with B. Resnick, S. Szanzer, N. Sokol, and Davis Polk Mergers & Acquisitions team regarding same (1.2).
Malinowsky, Thomas D.	04/05/20	9.5	Review Asset Purchase Agreements (1.5); calls with Davis Polk and Dean Foods teams regarding sale status (1.7); correspondence with Davis Polk Intellectual Property Team regarding intellectual property issues (0.7); review intellectual property comments to Dean Foods cooperation agreement (1.2); call with buyer counsel regarding execution of Asset Purchase Agreement (0.9); revise disclosure schedules to Asset Purchase Agreement (1.6); call with Dean Foods and H. Birnbaum regarding disclosure schedules (0.8); correspondence with Davis Polk Restructuring team regarding Sale Orders (0.5); call with Davis Polk Mergers & Acquisitions team regarding workstreams (0.6).
Pittell, Joshua B.	04/05/20	10.8	Review and revise Asset Purchase Agreement disclosure schedules (7.9); calls with J. Sutton regarding same (0.6); call with buyer counsel regarding same (0.5); calls with Davis Polk Mergers & Acquisitions team regarding sale status and workstreams (0.6); finalize good faith deposit escrow release instructions (0.4); review and revise buyers' drafts of ancillary transaction documents (0.8).
Renter, Chelsea	04/05/20	3.2	Review and revise Asset Purchase Agreement disclosure schedules.
Resnick, Brian M.	04/05/20	1.8	Emails with Davis Polk team and buyer counsel regarding Sale Orders (1.0); emails with Davis Polk team regarding response to certain objection (0.2); call with Kristy Waterman regarding asset sale status (0.6).
Schare, Lindsay	04/05/20	0.3	Emails with B. Miller and E. Moskowitz regarding sale discovery document productions.
Sokol, Nate	04/05/20	5.5	Review and revise Sale Orders (2.2); email P. Garg, B. Resnick, and S. Szanzer regarding same (3.3).
Szanzer, Steven Z.	04/05/20	5.5	Finalize Sale Orders and Asset Purchase Agreements (4.7); correspondence with B. Resnick, N. Sokol, and P. Garg regarding same (0.8).
Woller, Christopher C.	04/05/20	2.7	Review disclosure schedules to Asset Purchase Agreements (1.8); call with buyer Intellectual Property Team regarding intellectual property issues (0.2); correspondence with Dean Foods team regarding same (0.3); correspondence with buyer Intellectual Property Team regarding ancillary agreements (0.4).

Time Detail By Project			
Name	Date	Hours	Narrative
Adamson, Cameron	04/06/20	9.0	Call with J. Sutton regarding Asset Purchase Agreement disclosure schedules (0.4); call with Davis Polk Mergers & Acquisitions team regarding sale status and workstreams (0.5); attend call with buyer counsel regarding business issues (0.8); review and revise Asset Purchase Agreement disclosure schedules (1.5); correspondence with Davis Polk team, Dean Foods team, and buyer counsel regarding same (1.6); review Asset Purchase Agreement execution checklist (0.4); correspondence with buyer counsel regarding same (3.8).
Azzopardi, Frank J.	04/06/20	1.1	Analysis regarding intellectual property issues (0.6); correspondence with C. Woller regarding same (0.3); correspondence with Davis Polk team regarding same (0.2).
Birnbaum, Harold	04/06/20	7.6	Review and revise ancillary transaction documents (1.6); calls and emails with Dean Foods team and co-advisors regarding sale (2.2); calls and emails with buyer regarding same (1.8); correspondence with Davis Polk team regarding same (2.0).
Crane, Gregory D.	04/06/20	0.7	Review real estate lease materials in connection with sales.
Curran, William A.	04/06/20	0.2	Review summary of Asset Purchase Agreement tax calculations.
Garg, Paavani	04/06/20	3.1	Review and revise Sale Orders.
Malinowsky, Thomas D.	04/06/20	12.5	Correspondence with Davis Polk and Dean Foods teams regarding license issues in connection with sale (2.1); prepare final revisions to Dairy Farmers of America transaction documents and coordinate execution of same (1.5); calls with Latham & Watkins regarding final documents (0.5), correspondence with Davis Polk Intellectual Property Team regarding disclosure schedules issues (0.8); discuss business issues with buyer counsel (0.8); review disclosure schedules regarding same (2.2); correspondence with Davis Polk Mergers & Acquisitions, intellectual property, and restructuring teams regarding sale process (2.7); call with Davis Polk Mergers & Acquisitions team regarding sale status and workstreams (0.5); calls and emails with bidder regarding diligence questions (1.4).
Pittell, Joshua B.	04/06/20	13.3	Review and revise Asset Purchase Agreement disclosure schedules (9.7); call with J. Sutton regarding same (0.4); attend call with Davis Polk Mergers & Acquisitions team regarding sale status and workstreams (0.5); prepare good faith deposit escrow release instructions (1.5); update Asset Purchase Agreement execution checklists (1.2).
Renter, Chelsea	04/06/20	0.6	Review and revise Asset Purchase Agreement disclosure schedules (0.3); call with M. Niermann and C. Woller regarding intellectual property license issues (0.3).
Resnick, Brian M.	04/06/20	1.9	Correspondence with Davis Polk team and Dean Foods team regarding Asset Purchase Agreement issues (1.0); call with Dean Foods team regarding same (0.9).
Siman, Ariel David	04/06/20	0.6	Review Asset Purchase Agreements tax summary.

Time Detail By Project			
Name	Date	Hours	Narrative
Sokol, Nate	04/06/20	4.0	Correspondence with S. Szanzer, P. Garg, and others from Davis Polk regarding Sale Orders (1.2); email with G. Packer regarding real estate sales (0.2); email with M. Niermann, K. Waterman, T. Murray, and J. Sutton regarding sale objection (0.2); call with M. Niermann, K. Waterman, T. Murray, and J. Sutton regarding same (0.6); email C. Woller regarding same (0.1); review intellectual property issues (0.8); call J. Hallock regarding same (0.1); review Dean Foods customer communications regarding sales (0.6); email S. Lowenberg regarding same (0.2).
Soussan, Susan	04/06/20	0.6	Coordinate sale discovery document production.
Szanzer, Steven Z.	04/06/20	2.9	Finalize Sale Orders and Asset Purchase Agreements (2.5); correspondence with escrow agent and Davis Polk Mergers & Acquisitions team regarding release of good faith deposits (0.4).
Woller, Christopher C.	04/06/20	1.7	Call with M. Niermann and C. Renter regarding intellectual property issues (0.3); review Asset Purchase Agreement disclosure schedules (0.6); correspondence with F. Azzopardi regarding trademark license (0.4); correspondence with Davis Polk team regarding trademark license issue (0.4).
Adamson, Cameron	04/07/20	13.4	Attend call with Dean Foods team regarding sale status (1.5); attend call with Akin Gump team regarding sale status (1.1); correspondence with same regarding same (0.3); calls and emails with buyer counsel regarding transaction document finalization and closing process (6.0); correspondence with Davis Polk team regarding same (3.7); attend call with Davis Polk Mergers & Acquisitions team regarding sale status workstreams (0.8).
Azzopardi, Frank J.	04/07/20	2.8	Correspondence with Davis Polk team regarding license issue (1.4); call with C. Woller regarding same (0.3); analyze same (0.7); correspondence with Shearman & Sterling regarding open intellectual property issues (0.4).
Birnbaum, Harold	04/07/20	5.9	Call with Akin Gump team regarding sale status (1.1); review Asset Purchase Agreement (1.8); call with Dean Foods team regarding sale status (1.5); correspondence with Davis Polk team regarding same (1.2); call with C. Woller regarding Asset Purchase Agreement (0.3).
Crane, Gregory D.	04/07/20	3.2	Correspondence with Davis Polk Real Estate team regarding deeds and other closing deliverables (0.4); prepare real estate riders to closing checklists (1.3); review and revise Asset Purchase Agreement disclosure schedules (0.6); prepare conveyance documents (0.9).
Garg, Paavani	04/07/20	2.8	Review and revise Sale Orders (2.4); correspondence with S. Szanzer regarding same (0.4).
Kearney, Daniel P.	04/07/20	1.1	Research license issues.
Malinowsky, Thomas D.	04/07/20	14.8	Review and revise Prairie Farms transaction documents (2.5); finalize Miami Asset Purchase Agreement (3.6); prepare closing checklist regarding same (0.7); call with Akin Gump team regarding sale status and correspondence regarding same (1.1); review and revise Hawaii transaction documents (3.9); calls with Dean Foods team regarding sale status (1.5); attend call with Davis Polk Mergers & Acquisitions team regarding sale status and workstreams (0.8); correspondence with same regarding same (0.7).

Time Detail By Project			
Name	Date	Hours	Narrative
Millerman, James M.	04/07/20	1.4	Review Sale Order treatment of objections and other items (1.2); correspondence with N. Sokol regarding objections (0.2).
Pittell, Joshua B.	04/07/20	14.5	Review and revise buyers' Asset Purchase Agreement disclosure schedule drafts (8.3); correspondence with J. Sutton regarding same (1.2); correspondence with buyer counsel regarding same (1.1); update Asset Purchase Agreement execution and closing checklists (1.9); attend call with Davis Polk Mergers & Acquisitions team regarding sale status and workstreams (0.8); compile fully executed transaction documents for buyers and distribute to parties (1.2).
Plotkin, Lawrence R.	04/07/20	1.3	Review Asset Purchase Agreements terms and prepare for closing transfer of real estate (0.8); review property information for same (0.5).
Rarrick, Mohini P.B.	04/07/20	0.7	Review correspondence with Davis Polk team regarding sale process.
Renter, Chelsea	04/07/20	3.8	Review trademark license agreements.
Resnick, Brian M.	04/07/20	1.3	Emails with Dean Foods and Davis Polk team regarding Asset Purchase Agreement issues (0.5); call with Dean Foods team and co-advisors regarding sale status (0.8).
Siman, Ariel David	04/07/20	0.8	Prepare tax issues list regarding certain Asset Purchase Agreement.
Sokol, Nate	04/07/20	2.2	Email with Dean Foods regarding Sale Orders (0.2); email with K. Waterman, J. Sutton, G. Packer, and M. Niermann regarding sale objection responses (0.6); call with J. Kimm, K. Waterman, B. Resnick, and others regarding sale status (0.8); call with C. Woller regarding intellectual property questions (0.3); call with I. Roberts regarding sale objection (0.2); email C. Woller, B. Resnick, S. Szanzer, and others regarding same (0.1).
Somogyi, Ben	04/07/20	1.1	Review successful bid documents (0.3); review Asset Purchase Agreement disclosure schedules (0.8).
Sullivan, Bernadette M.	04/07/20	3.5	Correspondence with G. Crane and L. Plotkin regarding deeds, transfer tax forms, and other conveyance documents (0.5); review acquired properties chart (3.0).
Szanzer, Steven Z.	04/07/20	3.5	Correspondence with Dean Foods and Davis Polk Mergers & Acquisitions team regarding document retention (0.3); finalize Harmoni Sale Order and Asset Purchase Agreement (0.5); review Sale Orders entered (0.2); correspondence and calls with N. Sokol and B. Resnick regarding certain sale objections (0.3) finalize Mana Sale Order and Asset Purchase Agreement (0.5); correspondence with N. Sokol regarding certain sale objections (0.2); correspondence with Davis Polk Mergers & Acquisitions team regarding deposits (0.2); review emails regarding certain sale transaction (0.4); review emails regarding certain sale transactions (0.2); review Court filings related to sales (0.5); correspondence and call with N. Sokol regarding same (0.2).

Time Detail By Project			
Name	Date	Hours	Narrative
Woller, Christopher C.	04/07/20	4.2	Research trademark license issues (1.1); review trademark license agreement provisions (1.1); call with N. Sokol regarding intellectual property issues (0.3); review summaries of same from C. Renter (0.6); call with H. Birnbaum regarding Asset Purchase Agreement (0.3); review and revise Prairie Farms Asset Purchase Agreement (0.3); call with F. Azzopardi regarding trademark license issue (0.3); correspondence with D. Kearney regarding trademark issues (0.2).
Adamson, Cameron	04/08/20	8.3	Coordinate Asset Purchase Agreement execution matters with buyers (6.9); calls with Dean Foods regarding same (1.4).
Azzopardi, Frank J.	04/08/20	5.3	Correspondence with C. Woller and Dean Foods regarding open intellectual property sale issues (1.6); review Sale Order regarding same (0.3); review license analysis and other potential assumption issues (0.6); correspondence with Davis Polk team regarding same (0.6); call with J. Altman regarding same (0.5); further correspondence with Davis Polk team regarding sale process (1.7).
Bernstein, Alexander	04/08/20	0.2	Correspondence with Davis Polk team regarding potential asset sales.
Birnbaum, Harold	04/08/20	6.5	Review and revise Asset Purchase Agreement and ancillary transaction documents (5.4); correspondence with buyers, K. Waterman and others at Dean Foods, T. Malinowsky and others at Davis Polk regarding sale process (1.1).
Crane, Gregory D.	04/08/20	1.2	Telephone conference with Davis Polk real estate team regarding closing deliverables (0.6); correspondence with potential bidder regarding bid (0.2); review closing deliverables requirements (0.4)
Garg, Paavani	04/08/20	0.6	Review Bidding Procedures Order (0.2); email correspondence with S. Szanzer regarding outstanding Sale Order issues (0.4).
Kearney, Daniel P.	04/08/20	7.8	Conduct legal research regarding licenses (7.4); email correspondence with Davis Polk team regarding same (0.4).
Malinowsky, Thomas D.	04/08/20	9.7	Calls with Dean Foods, Prairie Farms, and Shearman & Sterling regarding Prairie Farms Asset Purchase Agreement (4.2); revisions to Asset Purchase Agreement to reflect same (3.0); emails with Davis Polk team and others regarding Dairy Farmers of America closing checklist and workstreams (1.2); call with Davis Polk team and Dean Foods regarding open issues in Hawaii transaction (0.6); emails with same regarding same (0.7).
Millerman, James M.	04/08/20	2.4	Review outstanding sale objections (0.5); call with N. Sokol regarding same (0.3); correspondence with Davis Polk team regarding same (0.5); correspondence with Davis Polk team regarding sale termination (0.4); review Bidding Procedures Order and Asset Purchase Agreement in connection with same (0.7).
O'Young, Jerry	04/08/20	0.2	Email correspondence with T. Malinowsky regarding sale process.
Pittell, Joshua B.	04/08/20	10.6	Prepare updates to the Asset Purchase Agreement disclosure schedules (7.4); discuss same with J. Sutton (1.1); review and revise closing checklists (1.4); analyze permits required for each buyer and compile spreadsheet containing same (0.7).
Plotkin, Lawrence R.	04/08/20	1.6	Telephone conferences with Davis Polk team and review of background property files for disposition of real property in Asset Purchase Agreements.

Time Detail By Project			
Name	Date	Hours	Narrative
Renter, Chelsea	04/08/20	4.9	Review license agreements (1.0); review and revise Asset Purchase Agreement disclosure schedules (2.9); teleconference with Dean Foods regarding same (0.8); teleconference with Dean Foods regarding intellectual property issues (0.2).
Resnick, Brian M.	04/08/20	3.9	Calls with Evercore and Dean Foods regarding asset sale issues (1.6); emails with Davis Polk mergers & acquisitions team regarding same (1.4); calls with Davis Polk team and Alvarez & Marsal regarding sale closing issues and wind down (0.9).
Sokol, Nate	04/08/20	2.1	Email with C. Woller regarding sale objection (0.4); call with J. Millerman regarding same (0.3); email with F. Azzopardi, C. Woller, B. Resnick, and others regarding sale objection (0.3); email K. Waterman, M. Nierman, and others regarding same (0.1); email with M. Schriro regarding asset sales (0.3); review Bidding Procedures Order and Escrow Agreement (0.6); email P. Garg, B. Resnick, and J. Millerman regarding same (0.1).
Somogyi, Ben	04/08/20	1.5	Attend teleconference with L. Plotkin, G. Crane, and B. Sullivan regarding closing deliverables (0.5); review real estate conveyance materials (1.0).
Sullivan, Bernadette M.	04/08/20	4.4	Participate in team conference call with F. Azzopardi, B. Resnick, and others regarding sale objection (0.3); review real estate documents related to sale (3.0); correspondence with Davis Polk real estate team regarding closing process (1.1).
Szanzer, Steven Z.	04/08/20	1.1	Correspondence and calls with potential buyer regarding potential transaction.
Windels, James H.R.	04/08/20	1.3	Review Asset Purchase Agreement closing conditions.
Woller, Christopher C.	04/08/20	9.1	Review Asset Purchase Agreement intellectual property schedules (0.4); call with M. Niermann regarding same (0.3); call with F. Azzopardi and Shearman & Sterling regarding open intellectual property issues in Asset Purchase Agreement (0.6); attend call with potential purchaser (1.0); correspondence regarding intellectual property strategy with F. Azzopardi (0.6); review intellectual property licenses and prepare analysis of same (2.8); research regarding trademark licenses (2.4); emails with D. Kearney regarding same (0.4); review and revise materials regarding sale process (0.6).
Adamson, Cameron	04/09/20	4.1	Call with Davis Polk mergers & acquisitions team regarding transaction status (1.0); coordinate Asset Purchase Agreement execution matters (3.1).
Altus, Leslie J.	04/09/20	1.7	Analysis of tax issues in connection with Dairy Farmers of America Asset Purchase Agreement (1.5); email with S. Huber, Alvarez & Marsal and PricewaterhouseCoopers regarding same (0.2).
Azzopardi, Frank J.	04/09/20	1.6	Correspondence with Davis Polk team regarding open intellectual property issues (0.5); review analysis circulated by Shearman & Sterling regarding licenses (0.4); advise Davis Polk team regarding follow-up research regarding same (0.7).
Birnbaum, Harold	04/09/20	5.0	Review and revise Asset Purchase Agreement and ancillary transaction documents (4.0); correspondence with bidders, K. Waterman and others at Dean Foods, T. Malinowsky, and others at Davis Polk regarding same (1.0).

Time Detail By Project			
Name	Date	Hours	Narrative
Crane, Gregory D.	04/09/20	3.5	Telephone conference with Davis Polk real estate team regarding title information (0.5); correspondence with Producers' counsel regarding same (0.3); review existing title documentation (2.7)
Curran, William A.	04/09/20	1.0	Analyze Dean Foods equity issue (0.5); correspondence with L. Altus regarding same (0.5).
Garg, Paavani	04/09/20	0.7	Call with Creditors Committee regarding asset sale process.
Kearney, Daniel P.	04/09/20	0.5	Conduct legal research regarding licenses.
Malinowsky, Thomas D.	04/09/20	9.3	Review Prairie Farms Asset Purchase Agreement disclosure schedules (0.7); call with Shearman & Sterling regarding same (0.2); correspondence with Davis Polk mergers & acquisitions team regarding same (0.1); review and revise Asset Purchase Agreement to reflect changes (5.7); discussions with Dean Foods regarding net working capital calculations (0.6); call with Latham & Watkins regarding same (1.3). correspondence w/ Restructuring regarding vendor issues relating to sale (0.7).
Millerman, James M.	04/09/20	0.3	Correspondence with Davis Polk team regarding sale objection.
O'Young, Jerry	04/09/20	8.0	Call with Davis Polk mergers & acquisitions team regarding sales process (1.0); correspondence with same regarding potential bidder (2.0); review and revise Prairie Farms and Dairy Farmers of America Asset Purchase Agreements (2.0); draft closing checklists for same (3.0).
Pittell, Joshua B.	04/09/20	8.8	Prepare updates to Asset Purchase Agreement disclosure schedules (5.3); calls with buyer's counsel regarding same (1.5); call with J. Sutton regarding same (0.5); call with Davis Polk mergers & acquisitions team regarding status and deliverables (partial attendance) (0.5); update acquired and excluded real property schedules for buyers (1.0).
Plotkin, Lawrence R.	04/09/20	2.3	Review and revise Dean Foods property information charts (1.2); review background property files (1.1).
Resnick, Brian M.	04/09/20	6.4	Emails with Davis Polk team, Evercore, and Dean Foods regarding asset sale closing issues (2.5); calls with Dean Foods, Davis Polk team, Evercore, and Alvarez & Marsal team regarding same and antitrust issues (3.2); call with Creditors Committee advisors regarding asset sale update (0.7).
Sokol, Nate	04/09/20	1.7	Email with B. Resnick, Davis Polk mergers & acquisitions team and others regarding Dairy Farmers of America Asset Purchase Agreement requirements (0.2); review potential bid letter (0.1); email Davis Polk mergers & acquisitions team regarding same (0.1); call with Davis Polk mergers & acquisitions team, Dean Foods, and Akin Gump team regarding sale process status (0.7); email with F. Azzopardi, C. Woller, B. Resnick, and others regarding sale objection (0.6).
Somogyi, Ben	04/09/20	4.7	Correspondence with L. Plotkin, G. Crane, and B. Sullivan regarding closing deliverables (1.2); revise Dean Foods property chart (3.5).
Sullivan, Bernadette M.	04/09/20	2.6	Attend call with Davis Polk real estate team (0.5); review and revise Dean Foods property charts (1.2); review hazard determinations (0.5); correspondence with L. Plotkin regarding mortgaged plants (0.4).
Woller, Christopher C.	04/09/20	0.6	Review case law regarding trademark assignability (0.4); correspondence with D. Kearney regarding same (0.2).

Time Detail By Project			
Name	Date	Hours	Narrative
Adamson, Cameron	04/10/20	4.8	Call with Latham & Watkins regarding Dairy Farmers of America closing checklist (0.6); conference with Davis Polk team regarding Dairy Farmers of America Asset Purchase Agreement (0.5); coordinate Asset Purchase Agreement execution matters (3.7).
Altus, Leslie J.	04/10/20	1.9	Analyze sale issues (1.7); correspondence with Davis Polk and B. Pederson regarding same (0.2).
Azzopardi, Frank J.	04/10/20	1.3	Correspondence with Davis Polk team regarding sale objection and analysis of case law (0.6); correspondence with Dean Foods regarding sale analysis (0.7).
Birnbaum, Harold	04/10/20	4.7	Review and revise Asset Purchase Agreement and ancillary transaction documents (3.7); correspondence with bidders, K. Waterman, and others at Dean Foods, T. Malinowsky, and others at Davis Polk (1.0).
Crane, Gregory D.	04/10/20	6.5	Telephone conference with Davis Polk real estate team regarding data room review (0.5); prepare template, draft email regarding review (0.6); review existing title documentation (4.3); review Asset Purchase Agreement (1.1).
Gordon, Paulina	04/10/20	4.3	Review deeds and other real estate deliverables for sales.
Kearney, Daniel P.	04/10/20	4.3	Conduct legal research regarding licenses.
Malinowsky, Thomas D.	04/10/20	9.4	Finalize Prairie Farms Asset Purchase Agreement (0.7); review closing checklist regarding same (0.4); review Prairie Farms proposed assumed contracts schedules (0.3); correspondence with Davis Polk mergers & acquisitions team regarding same (4.5); correspondence with Evercore, Davis Polk mergers & acquisitions team regarding Hawaii TSA services (2.0); emails with same regarding same (1.1); correspondence with Davis Polk restructuring team regarding Asset Purchase Agreements (0.4).
Netzer, Omer	04/10/20	4.8	Draft wind down motion.
O'Young, Jerry	04/10/20	7.0	Correspondence with Davis Polk mergers & acquisitions team regarding sales process (2.0); review Asset Purchase Agreement (2.5); review email correspondence with Davis Polk team regarding same process (1.5); draft closing checklist (0.5); correspondence with Shearman & Sterling regarding closing checklist and proposed assumed contract schedules (0.5).
Peck, Edward	04/10/20	0.8	Review of title and survey documentation for Asset Purchase Agreements.
Pittell, Joshua B.	04/10/20	5.5	Calls with buyer's counsel to finalize Asset Purchase Agreement disclosure schedules (0.8); review and revise closing checklists (3.2); draft escrow release instructions (1.2); update Non-Disclosure Agreement tracker (0.3).
Plotkin, Lawrence R.	04/10/20	2.3	Review supporting documentation for unidentified real properties conveyance in Asset Purchase Agreements (2.0); revise Dean Foods property chart (0.3).
Rarrick, Mohini P.B.	04/10/20	0.6	Review correspondence from Davis Polk team and Dean Foods regarding sale process.
Renter, Chelsea	04/10/20	0.8	Review and revise Asset Purchase Agreement intellectual property exhibits and disclosure schedules.
Resnick, Brian M.	04/10/20	3.8	Correspondence with Evercore, Dean Foods and Davis Polk team regarding potential asset purchasers and other closing issues regarding sales.

Time Detail By Project			
Name	Date	Hours	Narrative
Sokol, Nate	04/10/20	1.1	Correspondence with F. Azzopardi, C. Woller, B. Resnick, and others regarding sale objection (0.9); correspondence with G. Packer regarding real estate sales (0.2).
Somogyi, Ben	04/10/20	1.8	Review conveyance documents for owned real estate assets (1.5); review and respond to correspondence with Davis Polk real estate team regarding same (0.3),
Sullivan, Bernadette M.	04/10/20	2.2	Correspondence with Davis Polk team to coordinate processing real estate documents (1.2); correspondence with G. Crane regarding review of Prairie Farms properties (1.0).
Woller, Christopher C.	04/10/20	2.7	Review and revise intellectual property assignability analysis (1.7); discuss same with D. Kearney (0.4); correspondence with Davis Polk restructuring team regarding same (0.3); provide comments to Dairy Farmers of America intellectual property schedules (0.3).
Won, Kimberly (KyungEun)	04/10/20	3.1	Attend call with L Plotkin and G Crane regarding real estate sale updates (0.5); review closing checklist and real property materials (2.6).
Crane, Gregory D.	04/11/20	2.0	Review existing title documentation.
Gordon, Paulina	04/11/20	6.4	Compile information for preparing deeds and other real estate deliverables.
Malinowsky, Thomas D.	04/11/20	1.7	Correspondence with Davis Polk restructuring team regarding cure costs (0.7); correspondence with Davis Polk team regarding Hawaii transaction (0.3); draft update for Creditors Committee and DIP lenders regarding same (0.7).
O'Young, Jerry	04/11/20	1.3	Review correspondence regarding potential sale.
Pittell, Joshua B.	04/11/20	2.1	Review sale diligence questions from buyer (1.5); review and revise closing checklists (0.6).
Resnick, Brian M.	04/11/20	0.5	Emails with Davis Polk team and Evercore regarding asset sale issues.
Somogyi, Ben	04/11/20	3.5	Review conveyance documents for owned real estate assets.
Sullivan, Bernadette M.	04/11/20	3.8	Review real estate documents relating to potential sale sites (2.0); revise Dean Foods property chart. (1.8).
Adamson, Cameron	04/12/20	1.5	Update closing checklists for Asset Purchase Agreement.
Azzopardi, Frank J.	04/12/20	1.4	Prepare for call with Dean Foods regarding sale (0.2); correspondence with Davis Polk team regarding Shearman & Sterling trademark analysis (0.3); call with Dean Foods regarding Shearman & Sterling intellectual property analysis (0.4); email same regarding same (0.5).
Crane, Gregory D.	04/12/20	1.4	Review existing title documentation.
Malinowsky, Thomas D.	04/12/20	0.8	Review closing checklists (0.4); correspondence with Davis Polk mergers & acquisitions team regarding same (0.4).
O'Young, Jerry	04/12/20	4.1	Correspondence with T. Malinowsky regarding escrow agreement (0.4); draft escrow agreement (3.7).
Peck, Edward	04/12/20	11.1	Review proposed Dairy Farmers of America purchases (4.5); review Dean Foods property chart (4.0); correspondence with Davis Polk real estate team regarding same (2.6).
Pittell, Joshua B.	04/12/20	2.0	Review and revise closing checklists (0.9); review and revise updates to Asset Purchase Agreements disclosure schedules (1.1).
Resnick, Brian M.	04/12/20	1.5	Correspondence with Dean Foods, J. Kimm, and Davis Polk team regarding asset sale issues.

Time Detail By Project			
Name	Date	Hours	Narrative
Somogyi, Ben	04/12/20	1.1	Review conveyance documents for owned real estate assets (1.0); review and respond to correspondence with Davis Polk team regarding same (0.1).
Sullivan, Bernadette M.	04/12/20	6.4	Review real estate documents relating to potential sale sites (3.0); revise Dean Foods property chart (2.0); prepare legal descriptions for sale properties (1.4).
Woller, Christopher C.	04/12/20	0.8	Call with Dean Foods and Davis Polk team regarding licenses (0.5); correspondence with F. Azzopardi regarding same (0.3).
Adamson, Cameron	04/13/20	9.5	Call with Davis Polk mergers & acquisitions regarding closing process (0.5); call with Prairie Farms regarding closing checklist (0.8); correspondence with Davis Polk team regarding real estate sales (0.5); coordinate Asset Purchase Agreement execution matters (7.7).
Azzopardi, Frank J.	04/13/20	0.6	Correspondence with Davis Polk intellectual property team regarding sale objection (0.4); correspondence with Davis Polk team regarding same (0.2).
Birnbaum, Harold	04/13/20	3.9	Call with Davis Polk mergers & acquisitions team regarding closing process (0.5); review and revise Asset Purchase Agreement (2.4); correspondence with B. Resnick and Davis Polk team, J. Kimm, and others at Evercore and bidders regarding deal closings (1.0).
Butler, James C	04/13/20	0.1	Discuss sale objections with N. Sokol.
Crane, Gregory D.	04/13/20	2.4	Compile and review title spreadsheet (1.1); correspondence with Dean Foods regarding same (0.4); review related title materials in data room (0.9)
Kearney, Daniel P.	04/13/20	1.8	Review email correspondence with C. Woller regarding license (0.2); review and revise draft reply to objection (1.6).
Malinowsky, Thomas D.	04/13/20	11.9	Prepare draft Hawaii Asset Purchase Agreement for bidder (0.5); correspondence with Dean Foods and H. Birnbaum regarding same; further revisions to same (7.0); correspondence regarding Hawaii Asset Purchase Agreement disclosure schedules with J. Pittell (0.4); correspondence with Davis Polk mergers & acquisitions team regarding sale process (0.5); compile sale precedent documents in follow-up to same (1.3); correspondence with buyer regarding Miami diligence questions (0.6); correspondence with Davis Polk finance team regarding checklist workstream (0.6); emails with Davis Polk team and Dean Foods regarding sale process and closing issues (1.0).
Millerman, James M.	04/13/20	0.3	Correspondence with Davis Polk team regarding asset sales and sale objections.
O'Young, Jerry	04/13/20	9.2	Review email correspondence with Davis Polk team regarding sale process (2.5); email correspondence with Davis Polk mergers & acquisitions team and Dean Foods regarding all sales (2.2); draft escrow agreement (2.5); attend calls with Dean Foods and Davis Polk regarding closing checklists and sales matters (2.0).
Peck, Edward	04/13/20	1.3	Revise title ownership chart for Dairy Farmers of America sale.

Time Detail By Project			
Name	Date	Hours	Narrative
Pittell, Joshua B.	04/13/20	11.0	Call with buyer regarding closing checklist (0.5); call with Davis Polk mergers & acquisitions team regarding closing checklists for all buyers (1.9); review and revise new buyer Asset Purchase Agreement disclosure schedules (3.7); review outstanding diligence requests to Asset Purchase Agreement disclosure schedules (2.7); correspondence with Dean Foods and Evercore team regarding same (2.2).
Plotkin, Lawrence R.	04/13/20	1.3	Review Dean Foods property information charts (1.0); correspondence with Davis Polk team regarding same (0.3).
Presser, Talya	04/13/20	1.8	Correspondence with Davis Polk team regarding tax consequences of sales.
Rarrick, Mohini P.B.	04/13/20	2.2	Review and revise Hawaii sale motion (1.2); correspondence with N. Sokol and Davis Polk team regarding same (1.0).
Resnick, Brian M.	04/13/20	2.2	Correspondence with Davis Polk mergers & acquisitions team, Dean Foods and Evercore regarding asset sale closing issues.
Sullivan, Bernadette M.	04/13/20	4.8	Review Dean Foods property chart (3.5); correspondence with Davis Polk real estate team regarding same (1.3).
Szanzer, Steven Z.	04/13/20	0.8	Correspondence with Davis Polk mergers & acquisitions team and B. Resnick regarding sale deposit (0.2); correspondence with Davis Polk mergers & acquisitions team and N. Sokol regarding Harmoni, Dairy Farmers of America, and Prairie Farms transactions (0.4); correspondence with Norton Rose and N. Sokol regarding Hawaii sale process (0.2).
Woller, Christopher C.	04/13/20	3.0	Conduct legal research related to license issue.
Won, Kimberly (KyungEun)	04/13/20	2.1	Review Asset Purchase Agreement and closing checklists.
Adamson, Cameron	04/14/20	9.9	Call with Dairy Farmers of America regarding closing checklist (0.9); correspondence with J. Pittell and J. O'Young regarding closing process (0.5); call with Creditors Committee regarding sale process (0.5); call with Producers Dairy regarding closing checklist (0.6); coordinate Asset Purchase Agreement execution matters (7.4).
Altus, Leslie J.	04/14/20	0.5	Email C. Adamson regarding Producers Dairy sale tax issues; (0.2); review Foreign Investment in Real Property Tax Act certificate for sales (0.3).
Azzopardi, Frank J.	04/14/20	0.9	Review objection reply (0.5); correspondence with Davis Polk team regarding same (0.4).
Bernstein, Alexander	04/14/20	1.0	Correspondence with Davis Polk team regarding potential asset sale and deposits.
Birnbaum, Harold	04/14/20	1.5	Call with Dairy Farmers of America and Latham & Watkins regarding closing checklist (0.9); correspondence with Davis Polk team and Dean Foods regarding sale deposit (0.3); correspondence with Davis Polk team and Dean Foods regarding Prairie Farms bid (0.3).
Butler, James C	04/14/20	2.0	Prepare response to sale objections.
Crane, Gregory D.	04/14/20	7.1	Telephone conference with Latham & Watkins real estate team (0.5); telephone conference with Producers counsel (0.5); correspondence with title company (0.3); prepare list of corporate entities party to real estate documents (0.7); review existing title documentation (5.1).
Curran, William A.	04/14/20	0.1	Email K. Simpson regarding Foreign Investment in Real Property Tax Act certificate

Time Detail By Project			
Name	Date	Hours	Narrative
Malinowsky, Thomas D.	04/14/20	11.4	Review and revise Hawaii Asset Purchase Agreement (2.0); correspondence with Davis Polk intellectual property team regarding same (0.2); email with bidder regarding same (2.5); correspondence with Davis Polk finance team regarding Dairy Farmers of America closing checklist (0.5); prepare for and attend call with Latham & Watkins and Dairy Farmers of America regarding closing checklist (1.1); call with Creditors Committee regarding sale workstreams (0.7); correspondence with Dean Foods regarding permit transfer workstreams (0.6); discussions with Davis Polk team and Alvarez & Marsal team regarding assumption and assignment workstreams for Dairy Farmers of America and Prairie Farms transactions (0.8); correspondence with Davis Polk team regarding sale deposit (0.9); correspondence with Davis Polk intellectual property team regarding open issues for Dairy Farmers of America transaction (0.5); emails with Davis Polk team and Dean Foods regarding sale process and closing issues (1.6).
Millerman, James M.	04/14/20	0.6	Review emails from Davis Polk team, Dean Foods, and co-advisors regarding asset sales.
Netzer, Omer	04/14/20	0.4	Attend call with the Creditors Committee advisors regarding sale process.
O'Young, Jerry	04/14/20	9.5	Correspondence with Davis Polk mergers & acquisitions team and Dean Foods regarding all sales (4.0); correspondence with lender regarding establishing escrow account (0.5); revise escrow agreement (1.0); call with Davis Polk team regarding closing checklist and sales matters (2.0); draft Board resolutions regarding same (2.0).
Pittell, Joshua B.	04/14/20	8.8	Calls with buyers regarding closing checklists (1.4); review precedent Board resolutions for transaction closings (2.3); draft bring-down certificate (1.5); review and revise escrow agreement exhibit (0.8); review question from S. Lowenberg regarding asset sale logistics (1.8); review Bidding Procedures Order and escrow agreement to analyze deposit issues (1.0).
Plotkin, Lawrence R.	04/14/20	4.9	Review Dairy Farmers of America closing process issues (3.0) call with Davis Polk team regarding Dairy Farmers of America closing checklist (0.9); compile missing property files and identify missing information regarding same (0.5); conference call with Dean Foods regarding Producers Asset Purchase Agreement (0.5).
Presser, Talya	04/14/20	0.3	Review securitization facility documents in connection with sales.
Rarrick, Mohini P.B.	04/14/20	2.4	Draft Hawaii sale motion (2.1); correspondence with N. Sokol regarding same (0.3).
Renter, Chelsea	04/14/20	2.2	Review and revise intellectual property assignment agreements
Resnick, Brian M.	04/14/20	2.2	Emails with Davis Polk team and Dean Foods regarding closing issues (0.9); call with Shearman & Sterling regarding Prairie Farms sale process (0.4); attend bi-weekly call with Creditors Committee advisors regarding sale process (0.4); correspondence with Creditors Committee regarding same (0.5).
Simpson, Kendra	04/14/20	4.2	Revise Foreign Investment in Real Property Tax Act certificates.

Time Detail By Project			
Name	Date	Hours	Narrative
Sokol, Nate	04/14/20	2.2	Attend sales update call with Creditors' Committee advisors (0.5); email with F. Azzopardi, C. Woller, B. Resnick, and others regarding sale objection and response (0.3); review bidding procedures materials (0.4); email Davis Polk litigation team and Davis Polk mergers & acquisitions team regarding same (0.1); call with M. Niermann regarding sale objections (0.5); email same regarding same (0.4).
Somogyi, Ben	04/14/20	1.3	Attend teleconference with Davis Polk team regarding real property assets and conveyance documents.
Sullivan, Bernadette M.	04/14/20	3.2	Conference calls with Shearman & Sterling, Latham & Watkins, and Dean Foods regarding sale process (1.0); review real estate documentation regarding property being conveyed (0.8); correspondence with G. Crane regarding sale workstreams (1.4).
Szanzer, Steven Z.	04/14/20	0.6	Correspondence with N. Sokol regarding sale motion (0.3); review emails with Davis Polk team regarding sale transaction (0.3).
Windels, James H.R.	04/14/20	1.8	Emails with Davis Polk team regarding good faith deposit issues.
Woller, Christopher C.	04/14/20	4.6	Review intellectual property assignment agreements for Producers Dairy Asset Purchase Agreement (1.1); review and revise sale objection reply (3.3); correspondence with F. Azzopardi regarding same (0.2).
Won, Kimberly (KyungEun)	04/14/20	3.8	Attend call with Davis Polk team regarding Dairy Farmers of America closing checklist (0.6); attend call with Dairy Farmers of America's real estate counsel regarding closing deliverables (0.9); correspondence with L. Plotkin and G. Crane regarding same and sales workstreams (2.3).
Adamson, Cameron	04/15/20	11.5	Attend Mana closing checklist call (0.5); attend Harmoni closing checklist call (0.5); review assignment issues (0.6); call with T. Malinowsky regarding same (0.5); coordinate closing matters and review closing documents (5.8); correspondence with Davis Polk team, co-advisors, and buyer teams regarding same (3.6).
Azzopardi, Frank J.	04/15/20	6.4	Call with C. Woller regarding response to sale objection (0.6); correspondence with Davis Polk team regarding same (0.7); consider analysis and case law regarding same (2.4); further correspondence with Davis Polk team regarding same (0.2); call with Davis Polk Intellectual Property team regarding same (0.5); review and revise objection response (1.4); call with Dean Foods regarding factual background in connection with same (0.6).
Bauer, David R.	04/15/20	0.9	Correspondence with F. Azzopardi and D. Kearney regarding analysis of license agreement.
Bernstein, Alexander	04/15/20	1.2	Correspondence with Davis Polk team regarding asset dispositions and good faith deposit issue (0.6); correspondence with J. Windels regarding same (0.2); correspondence with N. Sokol regarding same (0.2); further correspondence with Davis Polk team regarding same (0.2).
Birnbaum, Harold	04/15/20	2.3	Closing calls with buyers (1.0); calls and correspondence with K. Waterman and others at Dean Foods and B. Resnick and others at Davis Polk regarding sales (1.3).

Time Detail By Project			
Name	Date	Hours	Narrative
Crane, Gregory D.	04/15/20	5.7	Call with title company in connection with closing (0.5); call with Shearman & Sterling real estate team regarding same (0.5); correspondence with title companies regarding same (0.4); correspondence with Davis Polk team regarding corporate documents (0.3); review same (0.6); review title documents (3.4).
Curran, William A.	04/15/20	1.3	Conference with Alvarez & Marsal team regarding tax analysis (0.6); prepare Foreign Interest in Real Property Tax Act certificates (0.7).
Garg, Paavani	04/15/20	0.4	Review Bidding Procedures regarding good faith deposit issues.
Kearney, Daniel P.	04/15/20	4.8	Review transaction documents in connection with license (3.3); correspondence with D. Bauer and F. Azzopardi regarding same (1.0); call with F. Azzopardi, C. Woller and, M. Niermann regarding same (0.5).
Liu, Yichen	04/15/20	1.4	Prepare initial draft of reply to sale objection (1.2); correspondence with N. Sokol and Davis Polk Intellectual Property team regarding same (0.2).
Malinowsky, Thomas D.	04/15/20	13.2	Prepare summary of open items across all deals (2.3); call with Hawaii counsel regarding draft Asset Purchase Agreement (0.8); prepare summary of issues of same (1.0); coordinate wire instructions with Dean Foods team (0.7); review assignment issue and discuss same with C. Adamson (0.5); review precedent language for certificates regarding same (1.5); prepare for and conduct Miami call (1.2); review Dairy Farmers of America and Prairie Farms signing documents (1.7); correspondence with Davis Polk Labor team regarding Hawaii transaction (0.8); correspondence with Davis Polk Restructuring and Finance teams regarding securitization collection (0.5); review Dairy Farmers of America Asset Purchase Agreement (0.7); correspondence with Davis Polk team regarding same (1.5).
Netzer, Omer	04/15/20	0.4	Attend biweekly call with the Akin Gump team regarding sale.
O'Young, Jerry	04/15/20	9.6	Review correspondence with Davis Polk team regarding sale (1.5); correspondence with Davis Polk Mergers & Acquisitions team and Dean Foods team regarding all sales (0.6); draft omnibus resolutions (4.0); draft omnibus secretary certificate (1.0); revise closing checklist regarding Prairie Farms (1.0); attend closing checklist calls (1.0); correspondence with buyers regarding closing (0.5).
Pittell, Joshua B.	04/15/20	12.0	Calls with buyers regarding checklists and status (1.0); review and respond to buyers' diligence requests relating to Asset Purchase Agreements (2.4); review and revise Clean Team Agreement (1.0); correspondence with B. Miller regarding same (0.2); coordinate closing matters (7.4).
Plotkin, Lawrence R.	04/15/20	5.4	Calls with buyers regarding conveyance of real properties (1.5); review and analyze issues at certain property (1.4); review files and land records relating to same (0.5); correspondence with Dean Foods and Dairy Farmers of America counsel regarding same (1.7); correspondence with local counsel regarding property (0.3).
Rarrick, Mohini P.B.	04/15/20	2.8	Review case law regarding Hawaii Sale Motion (2.5); review correspondence with Davis Polk team regarding sale process (0.3).
Renter, Chelsea	04/15/20	0.3	Review ownership of transferred domain names.

Time Detail By Project			
Name	Date	Hours	Narrative
Resnick, Brian M.	04/15/20	0.4	Attend weekly update call with Akin Gump regarding sale.
Siman, Ariel David	04/15/20	0.8	Analyze tax questions regarding sale.
Simpson, Kendra	04/15/20	1.9	Further revise Foreign Interest in Real Property Tax Act certificates (1.3); attend call with Alvarez & Marsal regarding emergence (0.6).
Sokol, Nate	04/15/20	4.1	Email with F. Azzopardi, C. Woller, B. Resnick, and others regarding sale objection and response (1.0); call with M. Niermann regarding sale objection (0.5); review and revise Hawaii Sale Motion and Magro declaration (1.8); email P. Garg and Evercore team regarding same (0.5); attend biweekly status call with Akin Gump regarding sale (partial attendance) (0.3).
Somogyi, Ben	04/15/20	2.4	Attend teleconference regarding real estate assets and conveyance documents (1.5); correspondence regarding title documents for owned real property (0.9).
Sullivan, Bernadette M.	04/15/20	5.8	Conduct due diligence regarding certain property (3.8); review tax records for certain property (2.0).
Thomson, Daniel J.	04/15/20	1.6	Review and revise draft email regarding good faith deposit.
Tsepelman, Bernard	04/15/20	0.8	Revise checklists for asset sale transactions (0.3); correspondence with C. Adamson and T. Malinowsky regarding closing checklist and issues under the transition services agreements (0.5).
Windels, James H.R.	04/15/20	3.0	Review good faith deposit issues.
Woller, Christopher C.	04/15/20	4.6	Call with F. Azzopardi regarding Sale Objection response (0.6); review and revise same (0.9); conduct additional research regarding trademark issue (1.8); review domain name transfer issue (0.4); call with Dean Foods team regarding license and historical background (0.6); review license agreement (0.3).
Won, Kimberly (KyungEun)	04/15/20	2.5	Call with Prairie Farms' real estate counsel regarding closing deliverables (0.5); call with Dairy Farmers of America's counsel regarding deeds and deliverables (1.0); correspondence with Davis Polk team and local counsel regarding foregoing and subdivision of property (1.0).
Adamson, Cameron	04/16/20	9.3	Attend Transition Services Agreement call with Dean Foods and Dairy Farmers of America teams (1.0); attend Dairy Farmers of America closing checklist call (0.8); attend Prairie Farms closing checklist call (0.5); attend Producers Dairy closing checklist call (0.5); coordinate closing matters for Asset Purchase Agreement and review related documents (6.5).
Azzopardi, Frank J.	04/16/20	2.8	Call with C. Woller regarding analysis and response to Sale Objection (1.2); correspondence with Davis Polk team regarding (1.6).
Bernstein, Alexander	04/16/20	1.6	Correspondence with Davis Polk team regarding asset dispositions and good faith deposits (0.4); review correspondence with Dean Foods and Davis Polk team regarding same (0.1); prepare correspondence to buyers regarding same (0.5); correspondence with J. Windels and D. Thomson regarding same (0.6).
Birnbaum, Harold	04/16/20	5.9	Call with Dean Foods regarding Transition Services Agreement (1.0); attend closing calls with buyers (1.8); review and prepare issues list regarding Hawaii Asset Purchase Agreement (3.1).
Butler, James C	04/16/20	6.5	Draft reply to sale objections (5.5); revise reply notice (1.0).

Time Detail By Project			
Name	Date	Hours	Narrative
Crane, Gregory D.	04/16/20	6.6	Call with local counsel regarding real estate issue (0.5); call with Shearman & Sterling regarding same (0.8); attend Prairie Farms closing checklist call (partial attendance) (0.2); attend Producers Dairy closing checklist call (0.5); correspondence with title companies (0.2); review existing title documentation (4.4).
Curran, William A.	04/16/20	0.3	Tax analysis regarding asset dispositions.
Garg, Paavani	04/16/20	2.8	Draft Sale Order (2.4); call with N. Sokol regarding Hawaii Sale Motion (0.3); correspondence with N. Sokol regarding same (0.1).
Kearney, Daniel P.	04/16/20	10.0	Draft response to sale objection (6.2); conduct case law research regarding licenses (3.3); correspondence with C. Woller regarding same (0.5).
Malinowsky, Thomas D.	04/16/20	14.9	Review Dairy Farmers of America Asset Purchase Agreement and prepare summary of same (2.3); prepare for and conduct call with Latham & Watkins and Dairy Farmers of America regarding closing checklist and related workstreams (1.6); prepare for and conduct call with Prairie Farms and Shearman & Sterling regarding closing checklist and related workstreams (1.3); correspondence with Davis Polk Real Estate team, Evercore team, and Sherman & Sterling regarding sale proposal (1.0); further revise resolutions (0.3); review Reno closing documents and prepare revised drafts master assignment (1.6); correspondence with Davis Polk team and buyer counsel regarding clean team requests (1.8); review Hawaii Asset Purchase Agreement (4.3); discuss Sale Objection with Davis Polk Intellectual Property team and M. Niemann (0.7).
Millerman, James M.	04/16/20	0.4	Review draft response to buyer regarding good faith deposit.
O'Young, Jerry	04/16/20	8.8	Review correspondence with Davis Polk team regarding sale (2.0); correspondence with Davis Polk Mergers & Acquisitions team and Dean Foods regarding all sales (1.5); draft omnibus resolutions (2.8); draft revisions to Prairie Farms closing checklist (0.5); attend closing checklist calls (1.8); correspondence with Davis Polk team regarding same (0.2).
Pittell, Joshua B.	04/16/20	11.2	Calls with buyers regarding closing checklists and deliverables (1.8); call with K. Stockler regarding certain resolutions (0.4); coordinate closing matters (6.0); prepare closing deliverables (3.0).
Plotkin, Lawrence R.	04/16/20	5.5	Correspondence with Dean Foods and local counsel regarding subdivision of property (0.5); review same and correspondence with Davis Polk team regarding same (1.2); review consent requirements for Hawaii lease (1.8); coordinate conveyance of real property assets in Asset Purchase Agreements (2.0).
Rarrick, Mohini P.B.	04/16/20	2.9	Review case law regarding sale process (2.5); correspondence regarding same with Davis Polk team (0.4).
Renter, Chelsea	04/16/20	0.2	Correspondence with Davis Polk team regarding Asset Purchase Agreements disclosure schedules and closing checklists.

Time Detail By Project			
Name	Date	Hours	Narrative
Resnick, Brian M.	04/16/20	1.7	Correspondence with Evercore team and others regarding potential bidders (0.3); correspondence with Davis Polk team regarding closing issues (0.4); correspondence with Dean Foods regarding same (0.5); correspondence with Davis Polk team regarding good faith deposit (0.2); correspondence with Davis Polk team regarding trademark issues (0.3).
Siman, Ariel David	04/16/20	1.5	Review Foreign Interest in Real Property Tax Act certificates.
Simpson, Kendra	04/16/20	4.2	Draft and update Foreign Interest in Real Property Tax Act Certificates.
Sokol, Nate	04/16/20	2.7	Call with P. Garg regarding Hawaii Sale Motion (0.3); email same regarding same (0.1); email with T. Malinowsky, S. Szanzer, and Evercore team regarding sale closing issues (0.5); review Bidding Procedures materials (0.3); email Davis Polk Litigation team and Davis Polk Mergers & Acquisitions team regarding same (0.1); email with P. Garg, S. Szanzer, and others regarding Hawaii Sale Motion and related issues (0.7); email with J. Butler regarding objection to motion to intervene and request for hearing (0.4); email with F. Azzopardi, C. Woller, B. Resnick, and others regarding sale objection and response (0.3).
Somogyi, Ben	04/16/20	2.8	Attend closing calls regarding real property assets (1.0); attend call with local counsel regarding Homewood facility (0.5); attend call with Sherman & Sterling regarding same (0.8); review correspondence regarding same (0.5).
Sullivan, Bernadette M.	04/16/20	6.7	Prepare conveyance documents (3.1); correspondence with Davis Polk Real Estate team regarding certain property (0.5); correspondence with Davis Polk Managing Attorney's Office and N. Sokol regarding obtaining certified copies of bankruptcy order (0.4); review title reports (2.7).
Szanzer, Steven Z.	04/16/20	0.9	Review emails regarding buyer deposit (0.2); review emails regarding Reno sale (0.1); review emails regarding Hawaii sale (0.3); correspondence with N. Sokol regarding same (0.3).
Thomson, Daniel J.	04/16/20	2.3	Research regarding good faith deposit (0.6); revise draft letter regarding same (1.7).
Windels, James H.R.	04/16/20	1.8	Review good faith deposit issues (1.8).
Woller, Christopher C.	04/16/20	10.3	Draft reply related to sale objection and licensing issues (6.7); conduct further research regarding same (1.8); correspondence with Davis Polk team regarding same (0.6); call with F. Azzopardi regarding same (1.2).
Won, Kimberly (KyungEun)	04/16/20	1.5	Review and correspondence with Mana's real estate counsel regarding closing checklist (0.7); calls with Dean Foods, local counsel, Dairy Farmers of America's counsel, and Prairie Farm's counsel regarding parcel to be subdivided (0.8).
Adamson, Cameron	04/17/20	10.7	Call with Dean Foods team regarding Asset Purchase Agreement (1.0); attend biweekly sales call with Creditors Committee (0.5); call with Dean Foods regarding tax issues (0.4); correspondence with Davis Polk team regarding Clean Team Agreement (0.9); coordinate closing matters for Asset Purchase Agreements (7.9).
Azzopardi, Frank J.	04/17/20	6.9	Review correspondence regarding and draft of response to sale objection (0.8); consider case law analysis regarding same (1.2); correspondence with Davis Polk team with respect to same (0.5); further review draft and analysis (4.4).

Time Detail By Project			
Name	Date	Hours	Narrative
Bauer, David R.	04/17/20	2.3	Correspondence with F. Azzopardi regarding response to sale objection (0.9); review and revise outline of arguments regarding same (0.8); review case law regarding same (0.6).
Birnbaum, Harold	04/17/20	7.1	Review and comment regarding Asset Purchase Agreement (3.5); call with K. Waterman and others at Dean Foods and Davis Polk team regarding same (1.0); correspondence with same regarding same (0.6); coordinate closing matters and review relevant documents (2.0).
Burke, Arthur J.	04/17/20	0.5	Prepare for call with Creditors Committee counsel regarding status update.
Crane, Gregory D.	04/17/20	5.4	Draft seller estoppel (0.6); correspondence with Mana counsel regarding same and other deliverables (0.2); call with Shearman & Sterling regarding same (0.4); call with title company regarding same (0.9); review existing title documentation (3.3).
Curran, William A.	04/17/20	0.6	Analyze various dispositions (0.1); call with Dean Foods team regarding same (0.4); call with L. Altus regarding same (0.1).
Garg, Paavani	04/17/20	2.1	Draft Sale Order (1.1); attend biweekly sale call with Creditors Committee (0.5); call with I. Roberts and N. Sokol regarding Prairie Farms sale (0.5).
Kearney, Daniel P.	04/17/20	6.7	Conduct legal research regarding licenses (3.0); revise response to sale objection (3.5); correspondence with B. Resnick, F. Azzopardi, and N. Sokol regarding same (0.2).
Malinowsky, Thomas D.	04/17/20	12.1	Review buyer letter regarding diligence access and correspondence with Dean Foods and co-advisors regarding same (2.9); prepare for and conduct biweekly sale call with Creditors Committee (0.5); call with potential buyer counsel regarding Asset Purchase Agreement (0.7); review and revise disclosure schedules for same (3.8); correspondence with H. Birnbaum regarding same (0.5); further revise same (1.9); correspondence with Davis Polk Intellectual Property team regarding Hawaii intellectual property (0.5); review certain escrow agreement and correspondence regarding approach to same with J. O'Young (1.3).
Netzer, Omer	04/17/20	0.5	Attend biweekly sale call with Creditors Committee.
O'Young, Jerry	04/17/20	8.4	Review correspondence with Davis Polk team on sale process (2.0); correspondence with Davis Polk Mergers & Acquisitions team and Dean Foods regarding all sales (1.0); draft estimated closing statement (1.5); attend call with buyer counsel and Dean Foods team regarding permit transfers (0.5); draft summary of action items for permit transfers to update Davis Polk Mergers & Acquisitions team (0.4); review closing checklist and correspondence with sale parties regarding same (1.8); review escrow agreement (0.3); call with T. Malinowsky regarding same (0.6); correspondence with same regarding same (0.3).
Pittell, Joshua B.	04/17/20	10.0	Coordinate closing matters (4.7); draft closing deliverables (5.3).
Plotkin, Lawrence R.	04/17/20	3.9	Prepare disposition of real property pursuant to approved Asset Purchase Agreements (2.7); review and locate unidentified properties (1.2).
Rarrick, Mohini P.B.	04/17/20	1.2	Review case law regarding sale process.
Renter, Chelsea	04/17/20	0.3	Review and respond to emails regarding intellectual property transfers.

Time Detail By Project			
Name	Date	Hours	Narrative
Resnick, Brian M.	04/17/20	6.4	Calls with K. Waterman and others at Dean Foods, Evercore team, and Davis Polk team regarding closing issues (3.4); emails with same regarding same (1.3); attend biweekly sale call with Creditors Committee (0.6); correspondence with Davis Polk team regarding license issue (0.7); review research regarding same (0.4).
Siman, Ariel David	04/17/20	1.5	Review the Foreign Interest in Real Property Tax Act certificates in connection with real estate sale.
Sokol, Nate	04/17/20	5.2	Email with F. Azzopardi, B. Resnick, and others regarding Land O' Lake Sale Objection response (1.4); review and revise T. Magro declaration (0.2); email Evercore team regarding same (0.1); call with F. Azzopardi, B. Resnick, and others regarding Land O' Lake Sale Objection response (0.5); attend biweekly sale call with Creditors Committee (0.5); call with S. Szanzer regarding Hawaii Sale Motion (0.4); email Davis Polk Mergers & Acquisitions team regarding same (0.2); call with I. Roberts and P. Garg regarding Prairie Farms sale and Land O'Lakes sale objection (0.5); call with M. Niermann regarding Land O'Lakes and CROPP sale objections (0.5); email with J. Schembri, P. Garg, and others regarding Sale Motion (0.2); call with K. Waterman, Evercore team, Davis Polk Mergers & Acquisitions team, and others regarding Mana communications and closing issues (0.7).
Sullivan, Bernadette M.	04/17/20	4.5	Revise Dean Foods property chart (2.9); coordinate delivery of certified copies of bankruptcy order with R. Bruner (0.4); correspondence with Republic Title of Texas regarding same (0.3); correspondence with B. Somogyi and G. Crane regarding same (0.4); review Seller Estoppel Certificate (0.5).
Szanzer, Steven Z.	04/17/20	9.6	Review and revise Hawaii Sale Motion and Magro Declaration in support thereof (6.8); call with N. Sokol regarding same (0.5); review emails regarding Hawaii sale (0.5); review and revise Hawaii Sale Order (1.1); correspondence with P. Garg regarding same (0.2); review update emails regarding Prairie Farms sale (0.2); correspondence with N. Sokol and P. Garg regarding status of sales (0.3).
Won, Kimberly (KyungEun)	04/17/20	5.5	Review draft seller estoppel (1.8); review and prepare comments to Hawaii Asset Purchase Agreement (3.5); review name changes (0.2).
Adamson, Cameron	04/18/20	0.5	Review Clean Team Agreement.
Azzopardi, Frank J.	04/18/20	2.4	Review response from buyer counsel to sale objection argument (0.3); review and respond to follow-up regarding same (0.2); correspondence with Davis Polk team regarding new arguments and structure (1.3); call with C. Woller regarding open points (0.6).
Bauer, David R.	04/18/20	0.7	Correspondence with F. Azzopardi regarding comments to reply regarding sale objection (0.3); correspondence with C. Woller regarding same (0.4).
Birnbaum, Harold	04/18/20	1.0	Review Clean Team Agreement (0.4); correspondence with K. Waterman, Dean Foods, J. Kimm, and others at Evercore regarding same (0.6).
Crane, Gregory D.	04/18/20	5.3	Review corporate documents and existing deeds.
Garg, Paavani	04/18/20	0.5	Call with N. Sokol and potential buyer counsel regarding Hawaii Sale Order (0.3); revise Hawaii Sale Order (0.2).
Kearney, Daniel P.	04/18/20	6.3	Conduct legal research regarding licenses (2.3); revise response to sale objection (4.0).

Time Detail By Project			
Name	Date	Hours	Narrative
Malinowsky, Thomas D.	04/18/20	11.0	Correspondence with Davis Polk Mergers & Acquisitions and Labor teams, Dean Foods legal team, and Hawaii counsel regarding open issues in Hawaii transaction (2.8); compile documents for Hawaii transaction (2.5); review Hawaii section 365 contracts (1.2); call with counsel and follow-up regarding Clean Team Agreement arrangements (1.3); call with J. O'Young regarding Prairie Farms escrow agreement (0.3); review closing statement drafts (1.4); call with J. O'Young regarding resolutions (0.5); numerous calls and emails regarding various sale transactions (1.0),
O'Young, Jerry	04/18/20	3.5	Review correspondence with Davis Polk team regarding all sales (0.6); draft estimated closing statement for Dairy Farmers of America (1.0); review and revise omnibus resolutions (0.8); call with T. Malinowsky regarding same (0.5); review escrow agreement revised drafts from Shearman & Sterling and draft email summary of issues (0.3); call with T. Malinowsky regarding same (0.3).
Pittell, Joshua B.	04/18/20	7.2	Prepare closing deliverables (5.8); prepare updates to Asset Purchase Agreements disclosure schedules (1.4).
Rarrick, Mohini P.B.	04/18/20	0.2	Review correspondence with Davis Polk team regarding Hawaii Sale Order.
Resnick, Brian M.	04/18/20	0.8	Correspondence with Dean Foods and Davis Polk team regarding asset sale and closing issues.
Sokol, Nate	04/18/20	1.5	Call with J. Schembri, P. Garg, and others regarding Hawaii Sale Motion (0.5); email J. Schembri, P. Garg, and others regarding same (0.1); email with F. Azzopardi, C. Woller, B. Resnick, and others regarding Sale Objection and response (0.3); call with C. Woller regarding same (0.1); email with T. Malinowsky, S. Szanzer, and others regarding sale closing issues (0.5).
Szanzer, Steven Z.	04/18/20	1.3	Review revised Hawaii Sale Motion and Order (0.5); correspondence with N. Sokol and P. Garg regarding same (0.1); review emails regarding Hawaii Asset Purchase Agreement (0.4); correspondence with Davis Polk Mergers & Acquisitions team regarding section 363 questions (0.3).
Woller, Christopher C.	04/18/20	8.1	Draft response to Sale Objection (6.6); call with N. Sokol regarding same (0.1); correspondence with Davis Polk team regarding same (0.8); correspondence with F. Azzopardi regarding same (0.6).
Azzopardi, Frank J.	04/19/20	5.6	Revise Sale Objection response to reflect revised analysis and arguments (1.4); correspondence with Davis Polk team regarding analysis and refining arguments (2.2); further revise Sale Objection response (0.9); correspondence with Davis Polk team regarding license relating to Hawaiian plant (0.6); advise Dean Foods regarding approach to license (0.3); follow-up correspondence with Dean Foods (0.2).
Bauer, David R.	04/19/20	4.6	Review and revise Sale Objection response (3.7); correspondence with F. Azzopardi and C. Woller regarding same (0.9).
Crane, Gregory D.	04/19/20	6.0	Review title information and online resources.
Kearney, Daniel P.	04/19/20	2.0	Review and revise argument in response to Sale Objection (1.8); correspondence with C. Woller regarding same (0.2).

Time Detail By Project			
Name	Date	Hours	Narrative
Malinowsky, Thomas D.	04/19/20	7.4	Discussions with Davis Polk Real Estate team regarding certain shared property (0.7); coordinate intellectual property documentation with Davis Polk Intellectual Property team (0.8); review and revise Hawaii Asset Purchase Agreement and disclosure schedules (4.7); calls and emails with Davis Polk team regarding same and other transactions (1.2).
O'Young, Jerry	04/19/20	2.9	Draft estimated closing statement for Prairie Farms (0.5); revise draft of Prairie Farms escrow agreement (2.1); correspondence with T. Malinowsky regarding same (0.3).
Pittell, Joshua B.	04/19/20	3.2	Prepare closing deliverables.
Plotkin, Lawrence R.	04/19/20	1.3	Review documents for certain shared property and analyze same (0.9); review land records and title materials for same (0.4).
Rarrick, Mohini P.B.	04/19/20	1.8	Review and revise Hawaii Sale Motion (1.5); correspondence with N. Sokol regarding same (0.3).
Resnick, Brian M.	04/19/20	1.5	Correspondence with Davis Polk team regarding asset sale issues (0.3); review reply to Sale Objection (0.7); correspondence with Davis Polk team regarding same (0.5).
Sokol, Nate	04/19/20	3.0	Email Dean Foods, P. Garg, and others regarding Hawaii Sale Motion (0.4); email F. Azzopardi, C. Woller, B. Resnick, and others regarding Sale Objection and response (1.0); review and revise response draft (0.3); email with T. Malinowsky, S. Szanzer, and others regarding sale closing issues (1.3).
Somogyi, Ben	04/19/20	0.7	Review valuations for real estate.
Woller, Christopher C.	04/19/20	4.4	Review and revise response to Sale Objection (3.5); correspondence with F. Azzopardi regarding same (0.9).
Won, Kimberly (KyungEun)	04/19/20	0.3	Correspondence regarding real estate closing deliverables.
Adamson, Cameron	04/20/20	14.5	Review and revise closing checklist for Hawaii Asset Purchase Agreement (1.5); attend Miami closing checklist call (0.5); conference with Dean Foods regarding Hawaii Asset Purchase Agreement (0.6); attend Prairie Farms closing checklist call (0.6); prepare closing documents (9.8); correspondence with Davis Polk team regarding same (1.5).
Altus, Leslie J.	04/20/20	0.3	Correspondence with buyer's counsel and Davis Polk team regarding tax issues.
Azzopardi, Frank J.	04/20/20	0.4	Calls and correspondence with Shearman & Sterling and Dean Foods teams regarding Sale Objection response (0.4).
Birnbaum, Harold	04/20/20	7.0	Review and respond to closing matters (2.1); attend Miami closing checklist call (0.5); attend Prairie Farms closing checklist call (0.6); calls and correspondence with K. Waterman and others regarding sale status (1.1); review and comment regarding Hawaii Asset Purchase Agreement and closing documents for other transactions (2.7).
Crane, Gregory D.	04/20/20	12.2	Coordinate closing including reviewing closing documents (9.8); calls and emails regarding property descriptions and valuations for deeds (2.4).
Curran, William A.	04/20/20	0.6	Analyze transfer taxes in connection with sale.
Lichter, Brian S.	04/20/20	2.4	Calls with Davis Polk teams, title companies and Alvarez & Marsal regarding real estate issues for deeds and transfer tax forms.

Time Detail By Project			
Name	Date	Hours	Narrative
Malinowsky, Thomas D.	04/20/20	13.7	Draft documents relating to Hawaii transaction (5.2); correspondence with Davis Polk team and buyer team regarding same (1.5); draft letter regarding certain real estate issues (2.6); conduct closing checklist call with Prairie Farms team (0.6); prepare for same (0.5); conduct closing workstreams call with Miami buyer (0.5); prepare for same (0.6); review and revise Omnibus Resolutions (1.3); coordinate with Dean Foods team regarding title certificates for vehicles (0.9).
O'Young, Jerry	04/20/20	9.6	Review correspondence with Davis Polk team regarding closing and sale matters (1.3); correspondence with Davis Polk Mergers & Acquisitions team and Dean Foods regarding all sales (1.2); correspondence with opposing counsel regarding pre-closing matters (1.1); review and revise Omnibus Resolutions(1.5); draft omnibus secretary certificate (1.9); draft revisions to closing checklist regarding Prairie Farms (0.9); attend closing checklist calls (1.1); attend call with Dean Foods team regarding sales matters (0.6).
Pittell, Joshua B.	04/20/20	11.4	Attend calls regarding closing checklist with buyers (1.1); prepare closing deliverables (5.5); coordinate closing matters (4.8).
Plotkin, Lawrence R.	04/20/20	1.2	Review Asset Purchase Agreement in connection with disposition of real properties (0.7); review correspondence regarding resolution of shared property (0.2); call with R. Ramjas regarding release of mortgage (0.3).
Ramjas, Rana S.	04/20/20	5.0	Conferences with G. Crane (0.3); draft release of mortgages forms (4.7).
Rarrick, Mohini P.B.	04/20/20	0.3	Review correspondence with Davis Polk team regarding Hawaii sale.
Renter, Chelsea	04/20/20	0.5	Correspondence with Dean Foods regarding intellectual property renewals.
Resnick, Brian M.	04/20/20	3.3	Calls with K. Waterman and others regarding asset sale and closing issues (2.4); correspondence with Davis Polk team and Evercore regarding same (0.9).
Simpson, Kendra	04/20/20	0.3	Respond to questions regarding Foreign Interest in Real Property Tax Act certificate and related issues.
Sokol, Nate	04/20/20	1.5	Email with F. Azzopardi, C. Woller, B. Resnick, and others regarding Sale Objection and response (0.4); email with M. Niermann, S. Szanzer, and others regarding sale objections (0.3); correspondence with Davis Polk Mergers & Acquisitions team, B. Resnick, and others regarding sale closing issues (0.5); email with C. Woller regarding Sale Objection and response (0.3).
Somogyi, Ben	04/20/20	3.0	Attend calls regarding closings (1.1); review and respond to correspondence regarding legal descriptions for deeds (0.4); review legal descriptions for real property assets (1.5).
Sullivan, Bernadette M.	04/20/20	12.8	Retrieve and review forms of deeds and transfer tax forms (1.8); prepare Dean Foods property chart, inventory deeds, and transfer tax forms and execution requirements (8.6); correspondence with Davis Polk Real Estate team regarding same (1.1); review and organize same (1.3).

Time Detail By Project			
Name	Date	Hours	Narrative
Szanzer, Steven Z.	04/20/20	0.8	Correspondence with T. Malinowsky and N. Sokol regarding status of Hawaii sale (0.2); review emails regarding Hawaii Sale Motion for same (0.3); correspondence with B. Resnick and N. Sokol regarding professional fees (0.2); correspondence with B. Miller and N. Sokol regarding Notices of Bid results (0.1).
Woller, Christopher C.	04/20/20	3.8	Draft license between potential buyer and Dairy Farmers of America regarding certain trademark (3.3); review and revise response to Sale Objection (0.5).
Won, Kimberly (KyungEun)	04/20/20	4.8	Calls and correspondence with Davis Polk team and buyers regarding real estate deliverables under Asset Purchase Agreements (2.1); review real estate deliverables (2.7).
Adamson, Cameron	04/21/20	11.7	Correspondence with Davis Polk team regarding closing process (0.5); conference with Dean Foods regarding closing updates (1.0); attend Dairy Farmers of America closing checklist call (0.9); attend transitional agreements call (0.9); attend biweekly sale call with Creditors Committee (0.5); attend Producers Dairy closing checklist call (0.5); conference with R. North regarding closing issues (0.3); coordinate and prepare closing materials (7.1).
Altus, Leslie J.	04/21/20	1.1	Review tax information (0.3); call with counsel for Producers Dairy regarding same (0.4); correspondence with W. Curran regarding same (0.4).
Azzopardi, Frank J.	04/21/20	1.6	Review license issues (0.6); correspondence with Davis Polk team regarding same (0.6); correspondence with Dean Foods regarding Sale Objection response (0.4).
Bernstein, Alexander	04/21/20	0.1	Correspondence with Davis Polk team regarding sale processes.
Birnbaum, Harold	04/21/20	7.5	Correspondence with Davis Polk team and Dean Foods regarding closing matters (1.1); calls and correspondence with K. Waterman and others at Dean Foods and Davis Polk team regarding sale process (1.0); attend Dairy Farmers of America closing checklist call (0.9); attend biweekly sales call with Creditors Committee (0.5); call with Producers Dairy regarding closing checklist (0.5); review and revise Hawaii Asset Purchase Agreement and closing documents for other transactions (3.5).
Butler, James C	04/21/20	0.4	Revise response notice regarding individual dairy farmer's objections.
Crane, Gregory D.	04/21/20	14.7	Review title documents and other real estate closing documents (8.1); attend Dairy Farmers of America closing checklist call (0.9); attend Producers Dairy closing checklist call (0.5); review various Asset Purchase Agreements (2.1); correspondence with buyers and Davis Polk team regarding closing (3.1).
Curran, William A.	04/21/20	0.5	Conference with Producers Dairy team regarding closing (0.4); correspondence with L. Altus and others from Davis Polk team regarding same (0.1).
Garg, Paavani	04/21/20	0.3	Revise Hawaii Sale Motion.
Lichter, Brian S.	04/21/20	2.3	Correspondence with G. Crane, B. Sullivan, and T. Malinowsky regarding real estate issues (0.7); calls and correspondence with Dean Foods team and title company regarding real estate workstreams and closing procedures (1.6).

Time Detail By Project			
Name	Date	Hours	Narrative
Malinowsky, Thomas D.	04/21/20	15.5	Calls with Dean Foods legal team regarding sale status (1.7); call with Latham & Watkins and Dairy Farmers of America regarding closing workstreams (0.9); prepare for same (0.3); attend biweekly sale call with Creditors Committee (0.5); draft transaction documents in connection with Hawaii transaction (3.5); respond to diligence questions and issues regarding Clean Team Agreement (2.0); review Prairie Farms escrow agreement (1.2); review secretary certificate and resolutions (1.0); review stock powers documents for Dairy Farmers of America transaction (0.8); correspondence with Davis Polk Intellectual Property team and M. Niermann regarding closing (1.3); attend transitional agreement call (0.9); call with Producers Dairy regarding closing checklist (0.5); correspondence with buyers regarding closing (0.9).
Millerman, James M.	04/21/20	1.3	Correspondence with Davis Polk team regarding Producers' Sale Order (0.8); review same (0.5).
Netzer, Omer	04/21/20	0.5	Attend standing call with Akin Gump team.
O'Young, Jerry	04/21/20	8.1	Review Prairie Farms Asset Purchase Agreement and in connection with distribution center issues (1.0); review correspondence with Davis Polk team regarding sale (2.0); correspondence with Davis Polk Mergers & Acquisitions team and Dean Foods regarding all sales (1.0); correspondence with opposing counsel regarding pre-closing matters (0.6); review and revise Omnibus Resolutions (0.5); draft omnibus secretary certificate (1.0); attend closing checklist calls (1.4); review closing requirements (0.6).
Pittell, Joshua B.	04/21/20	10.7	Attend closing checklist calls.
Presser, Talya	04/21/20	1.5	Attend buyer closing checklist calls (1.0); research tax issues (0.5).
Ramjas, Rana S.	04/21/20	11.3	Draft mortgage releases (6.3); correspondence with B. Sullivan and other regarding same (0.9); conferences with G. Crane regarding transfer tax forms (0.4); draft transfer tax forms (3.7).
Renter, Chelsea	04/21/20	0.3	Review emails with Davis Polk team regarding sale process.
Resnick, Brian M.	04/21/20	5.1	Correspondence with Dean Foods and Davis Polk team regarding Hawaii, Dairy Farmers of America, Producers Dairy, Prairie Farms, and other asset sale issues (2.9); calls with Davis Polk team and Dean Foods regarding same (1.7); attend bi-weekly sale call with Creditors Committee (0.5).
Soilleux, Nicholas	04/21/20	2.0	Prepare lease assignment documents.
Sokol, Nate	04/21/20	2.0	Email with C. Woller regarding Sale Objection and response (0.3); review and revise De Minimis Asset Sale notice (0.3); email G. Packer regarding same (0.1); attend biweekly sale call with Creditors Committee advisors (0.5); email with I. Roberts regarding Sale Objection and response (0.3); email with F. Azzopardi, B. Resnick, C. Woller, and others regarding same (0.1); email with Davis Polk Mergers & Acquisitions team and others regarding sale closing issues (0.4).
Somogyi, Ben	04/21/20	1.4	Attend Dairy Farmers of America closing checklist calls (partial attendance) (0.6); draft valuations chart for real property assets (0.8).
Stevens, Kelsey D.	04/21/20	1.2	Resolve issues regarding conveyances and transfer tax.

Time Detail By Project			
Name	Date	Hours	Narrative
Sullivan, Bernadette M.	04/21/20	10.8	Revise and distribute Dean Foods property chart (4.8); prepare and process transfer tax returns and forms (3.6); correspondence with Latham & Watkins, Shearman & Sterling, and title company regarding transfers (2.4).
Szanzer, Steven Z.	04/21/20	0.9	Review update emails regarding Hawaii sale (0.3); correspondence and call with N. Sokol regarding De Minimis Asset Sale Notice (0.3); attend biweekly sale call with Creditors Committee (partial attendance) (0.3).
Woller, Christopher C.	04/21/20	4.7	Coordinate filing of Sale Objection response (0.2); finalize draft of license (2.2); correspondence with F. Azzopardi regarding same (0.6); review F. Azzopardi comments to same (0.6); call with M. Niermann at Dean Foods regarding open intellectual property matters (0.6); coordinate responses to Prairie Farms intellectual property follow-up questions (0.5)
Won, Kimberly (KyungEun)	04/21/20	4.9	Correspondence with Davis Polk team and buyers regarding deeds, transfer tax forms, and other real estate deliverables (0.6); review and revise draft deeds (3.9); correspondence with buyer's counsel and title company regarding same (0.4).
Adamson, Cameron	04/22/20	7.8	Attend Miami closing checklist call (0.5); correspondence with Davis Polk team regarding closing process (0.7); attend Harmoni closing checklist call (0.5); attend transitional agreements call (0.6); attend Prairie Farms closing checklist call (0.9); coordinate closing matters for various sales (4.0); correspondence with Davis Polk Intellectual Property team regarding licenses (0.6).
Altus, Leslie J.	04/22/20	1.4	Review email and research regarding tax issues (0.9); email exchanges with Davis Polk and Alvarez & Marsal teams regarding same (0.3); email G. Crane regarding state tax issue (0.2).
Azzopardi, Frank J.	04/22/20	0.6	Correspondence with Davis Polk team regarding license.
Birnbaum, Harold	04/22/20	6.5	Correspondence with Davis Polk team regarding sale and closing matters (1.8); calls and correspondence with Dean Foods team regarding sale and closing (0.9); attend closing checklist calls (1.9); review and revise Hawaii Asset Purchase Agreement and closing documents for other transactions (1.9).
Burke, Arthur J.	04/22/20	1.5	Correspondence with Davis Polk team regarding Food Lion motion and bondholder filing.
Butler, James C	04/22/20	0.8	Draft and revise notice responding to individual farmers' sale objection.
Crane, Gregory D.	04/22/20	15.1	Attend closing checklist calls (partial attendance) (1.0); attend call with Davis Polk team regarding closing (0.7); review and revise real estate closing documents and conveyance documents (8.3); call with N. Soilleux, B. Somogyi, and R. Ramjas regarding transfer tax and mortgage releases (0.7); call with B. Lichter regarding sale status (0.8); review Asset Purchase Agreements (1.8); correspondence with Davis Polk team regarding sale and closing (1.4); correspondence with L. Plotkin regarding property (0.4).
Curran, William A.	04/22/20	0.1	Correspondence with Davis Polk Tax team regarding transfer tax.
Garg, Paavani	04/22/20	5.1	Revise proposed notice of assumption and assignment and proposed assigned contracts schedule (4.4); revise Hawaii Sale Order and Motion (0.7).

Time Detail By Project			
Name	Date	Hours	Narrative
Lichter, Brian S.	04/22/20	1.0	Calls with G. Crane regarding sale status (0.8); review correspondence with G. Crane, title companies, opposing counsel and Dean Foods regarding sale and real estate documents (0.2).
Malinowsky, Thomas D.	04/22/20	12.6	Attend call regarding Miami transitional matters (0.8); attend closing workstreams call with Prairie Farms and Shearman & Sterling (0.9); prepare for same (0.5); discussions with Davis Polk Intellectual Property team and Dean Foods regarding license (0.9); revise Hawaii sale documents in connection with same (4.0) correspondence with Davis Polk team and Hawaii buyer regarding same (0.6); correspondence with J. Dawson regarding closing statements (1.1); correspondence with Davis Polk Restructuring team, G. Packer, and J. Sutton regarding certain leases (0.7); prepare initial draft letter agreement for parcel (1.7); correspondence with Davis Polk team regarding same (1.4).
Nandkeolyar, Anya	04/22/20	2.5	Review and revise transfer tax forms (2.0); correspondence with Davis Polk Tax team regarding transfer tax forms (0.5).
O'Young, Jerry	04/22/20	7.9	Review correspondence with Davis Polk team regarding sales (1.1); correspondence with Davis Polk Mergers & Acquisitions team and Dean Foods regarding all sales (1.8); correspondence with opposing counsel regarding pre-closing matters (1.0); review and revise Omnibus Resolutions (0.6); retrieve organizational documents (1.0); review closing documents provided by opposing counsel (0.5); attend closing checklist calls (1.9).
Pittell, Joshua B.	04/22/20	8.9	Calls with buyers regarding closing checklist (1.0); call with buyer regarding transition process (1.0); review and revise closing deliverables (4.5); coordinate regarding closing matters (2.4).
Plotkin, Lawrence R.	04/22/20	1.4	Review updated real estate disposition files (1.2); correspondence with G. Crane regarding proposed terms for property (0.2).
Presser, Talya	04/22/20	0.7	Correspondence with Davis Polk team regarding transfer tax.
Ramjas, Rana S.	04/22/20	12.5	Call with B. Sullivan regarding sale workstreams (0.8); conferences with G. Crane and others regarding mortgage releases (0.7); draft transfer tax forms (11.0).
Rarrick, Mohini P.B.	04/22/20	0.5	Review correspondence with Davis Polk team regarding sale process.
Renter, Chelsea	04/22/20	5.8	Conduct chain of title diligence.
Resnick, Brian M.	04/22/20	4.1	Correspondence with Davis Polk Mergers & Acquisitions team regarding Hawaii and other asset sale closing issues (2.3); correspondence with Dean Foods, Davis Polk team and Evercore regarding same (1.3); call with K. Waterman and others regarding same (0.5).
Soilleux, Nicholas	04/22/20	9.0	Review title affidavits and water liens (7.2); review and draft emails to Davis Polk Real Estate team regarding same (1.1); call with G. Crane, B. Somogyi, and R. Ramjas regarding mortgage releases (0.7).
Sokol, Nate	04/22/20	1.2	Email with F. Azzopardi, C. Woller, B. Resnick, and others regarding Sale Objection and response (0.3); email with C. Woller and others regarding same (0.2); email with T. Malinowsky, S. Szanzer, L. Plotkin, and others regarding funds (0.7).

Time Detail By Project			
Name	Date	Hours	Narrative
Somogyi, Ben	04/22/20	7.5	Attend teleconference with N. Soilleux, G. Crane, and R. Ramjas regarding mortgage releases (0.7); draft mortgage releases (4.0); draft Creditors Committee terminations (0.8); correspondence with borrower's counsel regarding mortgage releases (0.7); correspondence with title company regarding mortgage releases (1.3).
Stevens, Kelsey D.	04/22/20	5.3	Consider and coordinate logistics regarding deed conveyances and transfer tax.
Sullivan, Bernadette M.	04/22/20	14.5	Call with R. Ramjas regarding sale workstreams (0.8); calls with title companies regarding mortgage releases (2.2); revise Dean Foods property chart and distribute to Davis Polk team (6.4); retrieve information for and prepare transfer tax forms and deeds (5.1).
Szanzer, Steven Z.	04/22/20	2.0	Correspondence with B. Resnick, P. Garg, and Davis Polk Mergers & Acquisitions team regarding Hawaii sale (0.8); finalize Hawaii Sale Motion (1.2).
Vanora, Maria F.	04/22/20	3.3	Draft transfer tax forms.
Woller, Christopher C.	04/22/20	3.5	Review Hawaii Asset Purchase Agreement (1.1); correspondence with N. Sokol regarding filing Sale Objection response (0.4); prepare intellectual property assignment documents for closings (0.7); review certain license agreements (1.3).
Won, Kimberly (KyungEun)	04/22/20	5.1	Review and revise draft deeds.
Adamson, Cameron	04/23/20	7.9	Attend call with Davis Polk Mergers & Acquisitions team regarding workstreams and sale status (0.9); attend Dairy Farmers of America closing checklist call (1.0); coordinate closing matters for Asset Purchase Agreement (4.4); review Transition Services Agreement (1.6).
Altus, Leslie J.	04/23/20	0.4	Review and respond to email from real estate team regarding state filings.
Azzopardi, Frank J.	04/23/20	0.4	Correspondence with Davis Polk team regarding license and status of sale.
Birnbaum, Harold	04/23/20	1.8	Attend Dairy Farmers of America closing checklist call (1.0); call with Davis Polk Mergers & Acquisitions team regarding status of sales (partial attendance) (0.8).
Crane, Gregory D.	04/23/20	12.4	Call with B. Lichter regarding closing deliverables and workstreams (0.8); call with R. Ramjas and B. Sullivan regarding transfer tax forms (0.9); review same (3.5); attend Dairy Farmers of America closing call (1.0); review Asset Purchase Agreements (2.2); review real estate closing documents (4.0).
Curran, William A.	04/23/20	1.6	Analyze tax issues in sale.
Garg, Paavani	04/23/20	1.3	Draft notice for Hawaii assets sale (1.3).
Lichter, Brian S.	04/23/20	1.7	Calls with Davis Polk team regarding status of closing deliverables and workstreams (0.8); review correspondence regarding same (0.9).

Time Detail By Project			
Name	Date	Hours	Narrative
Malinowsky, Thomas D.	04/23/20	10.6	Review certain sale documents and disclosure schedules (1.7); call with Shearman & Sterling regarding same (0.4); review Transition Services Agreement (1.9); review Dairy Farmers of America escrow agreement (0.8); correspondence with Davis Polk team regarding certain side letter (0.4); correspondence with Davis Polk team regarding closing payments (0.6); review Miami Asset Purchase Agreement (1.5); conduct standing Dairy Farmers of America pre-closing workstreams call (1.0); prepare for same (0.7); review section 365 contracts (0.4); call with Davis Polk Mergers & Acquisitions team regarding open items in various transactions and workstreams (0.9); correspondence with Davis Polk team in preparation for closings (0.3).
Nandkeolyar, Anya	04/23/20	4.1	Review and revise state transfer tax forms with new updates (1.9); review and revise additional state transfer tax forms with new updates (1.0); populate state transfer tax forms with new updates (1.2).
O'Young, Jerry	04/23/20	10.1	Review correspondence with Davis Polk team regarding sales status (1.1); attend call with Davis Polk Mergers & Acquisitions team regarding workstreams and closing status (0.9); correspondence with Davis Polk Mergers & Acquisitions team and Dean Foods regarding all sales (1.5); correspondence with opposing counsel regarding pre-closing matters (1.6); correspondence regarding know-your-customer matters with escrow agent (1.0); review comments received by opposing counsel and draft revisions to closing documents (1.5); draft updates to closing checklist regarding Prairie Farms (0.5); attend closing checklist calls and calls regarding sales matters (2.0).
Pittell, Joshua B.	04/23/20	10.2	Attend Davis Polk Mergers & Acquisitions team call regarding status (0.9); attend closing checklist calls with buyers (1.0); review and revise closing deliverables (4.7); call with buyer regarding certain section 365 contracts (0.4); coordinate closing matters (3.2).
Plotkin, Lawrence R.	04/23/20	8.1	Preparation for real estate closings (4.7); review Hawaii Asset Purchase Agreement closing requirements (0.5); review transfer taxes computation and related matters (0.4); review and provide comments to title affidavits (1.6); correspondence with Sherman & Sterling regarding delivery of releases (0.1); attend call with Davis Polk Real Estate team regarding closing and workstreams (0.8).
Ramjas, Rana S.	04/23/20	7.5	Continue to draft transfer tax forms (6.6); call with G. Crane and R. Ramjas regarding transfer tax forms (0.9).
Rarrick, Mohini P.B.	04/23/20	0.5	Review Hawaii Sale Motion.
Renter, Chelsea	04/23/20	1.6	Conduct chain of title diligence.
Resnick, Brian M.	04/23/20	3.7	Correspondence with Evercore and Dean Foods regarding asset sale closing issues (2.3); correspondence with T. Magro and A. Burke regarding sale update (0.8); call with K. Waterman regarding Dairy Farmers of America and other closing issues (0.6).
Siman, Ariel David	04/23/20	1.1	Review Foreign Interest in Real Property Tax Act certificates.
Simpson, Kendra	04/23/20	4.9	Review and revise Foreign Interest in Real Property Tax Act certificates.

Time Detail By Project			
Name	Date	Hours	Narrative
Soilleux, Nicholas	04/23/20	5.0	Review mortgage releases (3.0); review title requirements and related issues (1.2); call with B. Lichter and L. Plotkin regarding closing deliverables and workstreams (0.8).
Sokol, Nate	04/23/20	2.5	Email with Dean Foods regarding sale closing issues (0.4); email with T. Malinowsky, S. Szanzer, L. Plotkin, and others regarding funds (0.2); email with Evercore and Davis Polk Mergers & Acquisitions team regarding sale correspondence (0.2); email with Evercore and Davis Polk Mergers & Acquisitions team regarding sale correspondence (0.7); email with G. Packer regarding De Minimis Asset Sale notice (0.2); review IRG Motion to Compel Return of Deposits (0.4); email Davis Polk team regarding same (0.1); email with M. Niermann regarding Sale Objections (0.3).
Somogyi, Ben	04/23/20	2.1	Attend teleconference with buyer counsel regarding closing process (1.0); draft mortgage releases (0.7); draft Creditors Committee terminations (0.3); correspondence with buyer's counsel regarding mortgage releases (0.1).
Stevens, Kelsey D.	04/23/20	5.9	Consider and coordinate logistics regarding deed conveyances and transfer taxes.
Sullivan, Bernadette M.	04/23/20	11.2	Call with G. Crane and R. Ramjas (0.9); prepare real estate transfer tax forms and related materials (7.3); obtain missing information for same from Dean Foods and other diligence (1.3); correspondence with Davis Polk team and Dean Foods regarding same (1.7).
Szanzer, Steven Z.	04/23/20	1.4	Review informal objections to Hawaii sale (0.2); correspondence and call with P. Garg regarding same (0.2); correspondence with buyer regarding same (0.1); correspondence and calls regarding transfer taxes and other closing payables (0.4); correspondence with J. Sutton and N. Sokol regarding sale of membership interests (0.3); review emails regarding Land O' Lakes (0.2).
Vanora, Maria F.	04/23/20	3.0	Review and revise transfer tax forms.
Woller, Christopher C.	04/23/20	1.3	Review certain Asset Purchase Agreement intellectual property covenants (0.8); review transitional trademark assignment language (0.5).
Won, Kimberly (KyungEun)	04/23/20	5.2	Review and revise drafts of deeds.
Adamson, Cameron	04/24/20	9.6	Attend Logix closing checklist call (0.5); attend biweekly sales call with Creditors Committee (0.5); call with Davis Polk team call regarding closing funds flow (0.5); call with Dean Foods regarding Transition Services Agreement (0.7); attend Harmoni closing checklist call (0.5); coordinate closing matters and review closing documents (6.9).
Azzopardi, Frank J.	04/24/20	2.4	Correspondence with Davis Polk team and Dean Foods regarding Meadow Gold license and Land O' Lakes license (0.6); review draft Meadow Gold license (0.9); review draft of licensing proposal (0.9).
Birnbaum, Harold	04/24/20	6.3	Review closing matters and related documents (3.3); calls and emails with K. Waterman and others at Dean Foods, and T. Malinowsky and others at Davis Polk team regarding same (3.0).

Time Detail By Project			
Name	Date	Hours	Narrative
Brecher, Stephen I.	04/24/20	3.4	Call with J. Pittell regarding same in connection with sale transactions (0.4); correspondence with Alvarez & Marsal and Dean Foods regarding same (1.6); correspondence with BRG and Akin Gump regarding same (0.9); review employee offer letters (0.3); correspondence with K. Ginder regarding same (0.2).
Butler, James C	04/24/20	1.5	Review and revise objection to individual dairy farmer's request for hearing.
Crane, Gregory D.	04/24/20	13.8	Coordinate signature page logistics for mortgage releases (0.4); review grantee entity spreadsheet, assign properties to entities based on primary facility function (0.9); correspondence with L&W, S&S on Birmingham issue (0.3); review signature packets for transfer tax forms, revise same (1.2); telephone conference with R. Ramjas, B. Sullivan on transfer tax forms (0.5); review transfer tax forms (1.4); review documents in data room relating to issue at Akron site (1.1); correspondence with A&M regarding property valuations (0.4); update tracker spreadsheet of property information, including reconciling parcels (1.7); correspondence with DPW M&A team regarding resolutions (0.3); telephone conference with DPW M&A team regarding closing payments (0.5); coordinate delivery of sale orders to title companies (0.3); coordinate responses to lease questions from S&S (0.6); review draft letter agreement regarding Birmingham site (0.3); coordinate with IL consultant on MyDecs (0.2); correspondence with title companies regarding forms of deeds, revise same (3.7)..
Garg, Paavani	04/24/20	2.1	Review and revise Sale Order for Logix (0.2); review IRG motion to compel return of good faith deposit (1.2); attend biweekly sales call with Creditors Committee (0.7).
Lichter, Brian S.	04/24/20	0.8	Review correspondence with Davis Polk team, opposing counsel, and others regarding closing deliverables.
Malinowsky, Thomas D.	04/24/20	13.4	Revise Transition Services Agreement (3.2); correspondence with Davis Polk team regarding Livonia properties (1.3); review closing checklist regarding Hawaii assets (1.4); draft letter regarding Birmingham sale (3.4); prepare for and attend biweekly sales call with Creditors Committee (0.8); correspondence with Davis Polk team regarding Omnibus Resolutions (0.6); correspondence regarding sale closings (2.7).
Moskowitz, Elliot	04/24/20	0.9	Correspondence with Davis Polk team regarding Mana transaction.
Nandkeolyar, Anya	04/24/20	2.9	Review and revise Ohio transfer tax forms (1.6); update Ohio and Hawaii transfer tax forms (1.3);
Netzer, Omer	04/24/20	0.5	Attend biweekly sales call with Creditors Committee.
O'Young, Jerry	04/24/20	8.8	Review correspondence with Davis Polk Mergers & Acquisitions team regarding sale process (1.5); correspondence with buyer counsel regarding pre-closing matters (0.5); review and revise Dairy Farmers of America escrow agreement (4.0); correspondence with Dean Foods and Davis Polk team regarding closing checklist and sales matters (1.0); revise Omnibus Resolutions (1.8).
Pittell, Joshua B.	04/24/20	9.3	Attend buyer closing checklist calls (1.1); review and revise closing deliverables (7.7); review and revise Non-Disclosure Agreement tracker (0.5).

Time Detail By Project			
Name	Date	Hours	Narrative
Plotkin, Lawrence R.	04/24/20	8.8	Review and revise closing issues lists regarding disposition of real properties (4.5); review funding mechanics with buyer counsel (1.3); review missing properties list (2.0); review and revise Birmingham letter (1.0).
Ramjas, Rana S.	04/24/20	6.5	Draft transfer tax forms (3.5); draft chart with list of signatories and outstanding issues in connection with transfer tax forms (1.5); correspondence with G. Crane, B. Somogyi, and B. Sullivan regarding sale process (3.0).
Renter, Chelsea	04/24/20	1.8	Review and revise intellectual property assignment agreements.
Resnick, Brian M.	04/24/20	4.6	Emails with Davis Polk team regarding Dairy Farmers of America closing and related issues (2.3); calls with Dean Foods and Davis Polk team regarding same (1.6); attend biweekly sales call with Creditors Committee (0.7).
Simpson, Kendra	04/24/20	1.2	Draft Foreign Interest in Real Property Tax Act Certificates.
Soilleux, Nicholas	04/24/20	4.0	Review correspondence and email with Davis Polk team regarding disposition of Miami and Reno properties.
Sokol, Nate	04/24/20	3.2	Attend biweekly sales call with Creditors Committee (0.8); correspondence with T. Malinowsky, S. Szanzer, L. Plotkin, and others regarding closing flow of funds (0.5); review de minimis Asset Purchase Agreement (0.3); email J. Sutton, S. Szanzer, and others regarding same (0.1); review objection to individual dairy farmers motion to intervene and request hearing (0.1); email J. Butler regarding same (0.1); call with M. Niermann regarding Land O' Lakes and CROPP sale objections (0.9); email B. Resnick and Davis Polk intellectual property team regarding same (0.2); email with T. Malinowsky regarding sale closing issues (0.2).
Somogyi, Ben	04/24/20	6.4	Review and revise legal descriptions for conveyed real property assets (3.5); draft execution documents for transfer tax forms (1.5); correspondence with G. Crane, B. Sullivan, and R. Ramjas regarding same (1.4).
Stevens, Kelsey D.	04/24/20	5.5	Coordinate deed conveyances and payment of transfer taxes.
Sullivan, Bernadette M.	04/24/20	8.7	Correspondence with Davis Polk team regarding sale process (1.0); draft transfer tax forms for real property dispositions (4.7); review closing issues (4.0).
Szanzer, Steven Z.	04/24/20	2.7	Review IRG motion to compel return of good faith deposit (0.4); review IRG limited objection to Logix sale (0.3); correspondence with Davis Polk Mergers & Acquisitions team regarding amendments to Prairie Farm sale (0.2); attend biweekly sales call with Creditors Committee (0.7); correspondence with Davis Polk Mergers & Acquisitions and Davis Polk Real Estate teams regarding closing funds flow (0.6); review Asset Purchase Agreement for de minimis asset sale (0.5).
Vanora, Maria F.	04/24/20	2.3	Draft real property transfer tax forms.
Woller, Christopher C.	04/24/20	1.9	Emails regarding Land O' Lakes license agreement negotiations (0.3); review and revise trademark license agreement (1.6).
Adamson, Cameron	04/25/20	3.3	Review and revise escrow side letters (1.5); review closing matters and related documents (1.7).
Azzopardi, Frank J.	04/25/20	1.0	Call with Dean Foods regarding Land O' Lakes license negotiations (0.6); correspondence with same regarding same (0.4).

Time Detail By Project			
Name	Date	Hours	Narrative
Birnbaum, Harold	04/25/20	0.5	Correspondence with K. Waterman and T. Malinowsky and others at Davis Polk regarding closing matters.
Burke, Arthur J.	04/25/20	0.5	Revise draft response regarding Bondholder sale pleading.
Crane, Gregory D.	04/25/20	9.5	Correspondence with L. Plotkin regarding status of real estate deliverables for closing (0.4); prepare signature page packets to deeds for Dean Foods (2.1); correspondence with B. Somogyi regarding drafting deeds (0.4); draft deeds (5.9); correspondence with B. Sullivan and R. Ramjas regarding transfer tax forms (0.7).
Ginder, Kathleen	04/25/20	0.3	Review letter to transitioning employees.
Malinowsky, Thomas D.	04/25/20	7.2	Revise Transition Services Agreement (2.5); revise Dairy Farmers of America closing statement (1.3); prepare form of funds flow for sale transactions (1.1) correspondence with J. Pittell regarding same (0.4); correspondence with Davis Polk team regarding intellectual property license issue and closing matters (1.9).
Netzer, Omer	04/25/20	0.7	Correspondence with N. Sokol and S. Szanzer regarding CROPP negotiations.
O'Young, Jerry	04/25/20	3.0	Review correspondence regarding closing items (0.8); correspondence with Davis Polk Mergers & Acquisitions team regarding closing matters (0.5); review and revise Prairie Farms escrow agreement (1.2); correspondence with Citibank regarding same (0.2); correspondence with Shearman & Sterling regarding closing documents (0.3).
Pittell, Joshua B.	04/25/20	2.4	Review and revise closing deliverables (1.4); correspondence with Davis Polk team and buyers counsel regarding closing matters (1.0).
Rarrick, Mohini P.B.	04/25/20	0.3	Review correspondence with Davis Polk team regarding sale process.
Resnick, Brian M.	04/25/20	1.9	Call with Dean Foods, F. Azzopardi, and Nate Sokol regarding strategy around Land O' Lakes license assignment (0.9); emails with Dean Foods and Davis Polk team regarding closing issues (1.4).
Simpson, Kendra	04/25/20	0.9	Correspondence with Alvarez & Marsal regarding property taxes
Sokol, Nate	04/25/20	3.8	Call with K. Waterman, B. Resnick, F. Azzopardi, and others regarding Land O' Lakes license agreement (0.9); email same regarding same (0.5); review correspondence and voicemails regarding same (0.4); email with T. Malinowsky, S. Szanzer, and others regarding sale closing issues (0.3); review CROPP transaction materials (1.2); email M. Niermann, S. Szanzer, and others regarding same (0.3); review De Minimis Asset Purchase Agreement notice and related documentation (0.1); email Akin Gump and others regarding same (0.1).
Sokol, Nate	04/25/20	0.2	Email with J. Pittell regarding Board Omnibus Resolutions
Somogyi, Ben	04/25/20	6.4	Draft special warranty deeds to convey real property.
Szanzer, Steven Z.	04/25/20	1.5	Review emails with Davis Polk team regarding Livonia property (0.2); correspondence with N. Sokol regarding CROPP (0.3); review correspondence with N. Sokol and Dean Foods and other materials regarding same (1.0).

Time Detail By Project			
Name	Date	Hours	Narrative
Woller, Christopher C.	04/25/20	1.2	Call with Dean Foods and Davis Polk Restructuring team regarding intellectual property licenses (0.5); correspondence with F. Azzopardi regarding same (0.3); emails with Dean Foods regarding Dairy Farmers of America trademark schedule (0.2); review Dairy Farmers of America trademark schedule (0.2).
Won, Kimberly (KyungEun)	04/25/20	1.1	Correspondence with L. Plotkin and G. Crane real property closing deliverables (0.6); review and revise correspondence with Dean Foods regarding Dean Foods same (0.5).
Adamson, Cameron	04/26/20	3.9	Correspondence with Davis Polk team regarding Livonia property (0.5); revise closing checklists and review other closing matters (2.7); calls with buyers regarding transitional matters (0.7).
Azzopardi, Frank J.	04/26/20	1.1	Correspondence with Davis Polk team Meadow Gold license (0.4); revise same (0.5); analyze related strategy and next steps (0.2).
Birnbaum, Harold	04/26/20	1.0	Correspondence with Dean Foods and T. Malinowsky regarding closing matters.
Crane, Gregory D.	04/26/20	9.5	Correspondence with L. Plotkin on status of real estate deliverables for closing (0.3); draft deeds (6.3); review and revise same (1.2); prepare supplemental signature pages (0.8); correspondence with Davis Polk Mergers & Acquisitions team regarding funds flow (0.2); correspondence regarding rent amounts (0.4); correspondence with title companies regarding logistics for original signature pages (0.3).
Curran, William A.	04/26/20	0.2	Review sale proceeds escrow agreement.
Malinowsky, Thomas D.	04/26/20	7.2	Calls and emails with Davis Polk Intellectual Property team and M. Niermann regarding POG and Meadow Gold licenses for Hawaii transactions (1.5); call with Davis Polk Real Estate team and Dean Foods regarding Hawaii lease consent (0.9); review and revise Birmingham letter (0.8); review and revise Dairy Farmers of America escrow agreement (1.1); correspondence with Davis Polk team regarding compensation plan and interaction with sales (1.4); calls with Davis Polk team regarding Omnibus Resolutions (1.5).
Netzer, Omer	04/26/20	2.3	Call with M. Niermann and others regarding CROPP transaction (0.4); review and revise Joint Venture Termination Agreement (1.9).
O'Young, Jerry	04/26/20	3.3	Review email correspondence with Davis Polk team regarding sale process (1.0); revise escrow agreement with Dairy Farmers of America (1.7); correspondence with opposing counsel regarding escrow agreement and pre-closing matters (0.3); correspondence with Davis Polk Mergers & Acquisitions regarding Omnibus Resolutions (0.3).
Pittell, Joshua B.	04/26/20	9.2	Review and revise closing deliverables (3.2); call with Davis Polk Intellectual Property team and M. Niermann regarding license transfer issues (0.4); call with Evercore, Dean Foods, and Davis Polk team regarding closing matters (0.4); review closing matters and related documents (5.2).
Plotkin, Lawrence R.	04/26/20	3.5	Review real estate conveyances (2.0); telephone conferences and correspondence with Davis Polk team regarding same (1.0); research land records for missing information for same (0.5).
Renter, Chelsea	04/26/20	0.6	Review and revise intellectual property assignment agreements.

Time Detail By Project			
Name	Date	Hours	Narrative
Resnick, Brian M.	04/26/20	1.1	Call with Dean Foods and Davis Polk team regarding CROPP Joint Venture (0.8); emails with Davis Polk Mergers & Acquisitions team regarding transaction closings (0.3).
Soilleux, Nicholas	04/26/20	2.5	Correspondence with Davis Polk team regarding real property transfer taxes.
Sokol, Nate	04/26/20	2.7	Call with K. Waterman and Davis Polk team regarding CROPP and Land O' Lakes sale objections (0.8); email with K. Waterman, B. Resnick, F. Azzopardi, and others regarding Land O' Lakes sale objection (0.9); call with S. Szanzer and Shearman & Sterling regarding same (0.2); call with Dean Foods, Evercore team, Davis Polk Mergers & Acquisitions team, and others regarding sale closing issues (0.8).
Somogyi, Ben	04/26/20	4.6	Draft special warranty deeds to real property.
Sullivan, Bernadette M.	04/26/20	5.2	Draft transfer tax forms (2.0); review documents regarding fair market value (2.5); correspondence with Davis Polk team regarding same (0.7).
Szanzer, Steven Z.	04/26/20	5.1	Review CROPP transaction materials (0.5); call with Dean Foods regarding same (0.6); follow-up call with N. Sokol regarding same (0.2); correspondence with M. Niemann and O. Netzer regarding revision of joint venture termination agreement (0.3); review and revise same (1.0); review correspondence with Davis Polk team regarding same (0.2); correspondence with White & Case regarding De Minimis asset sale (0.3); correspondence with Davis Polk Mergers & Acquisitions team regarding Prairie Farms sale (0.2); correspondence with Davis Polk Mergers & Acquisitions and Davis Polk Real Estate teams regarding Hawaii government and lease issue (0.4); call with Dean Foods, J. Kimm, and Davis Polk Mergers & Acquisitions team regarding Livonia property (0.5); call with I. Roberts regarding same (0.2); correspondence with H. Birnbaum regarding same (0.2); correspondence with N. Sokol and I. Roberts regarding Land O' Lakes sale objection (0.2); correspondence with C. Woller regarding trademark assignment issues (0.3).
Woller, Christopher C.	04/26/20	2.4	Call with Dean Foods regarding POG trademark licenses (0.5); email Davis Polk Restructuring team regarding same (0.4); review license assignment agreements provided by Dairy Farmers of America (0.4); email Logix regarding Meadow Gold license (0.3); email Dean Foods regarding intellectual property assignments (0.3); review bankruptcy filings related to trademark license (0.2); update Meadow Gold license agreement (0.3).
Won, Kimberly (KyungEun)	04/26/20	2.6	Draft special warranty deeds for Hawaii properties (1.0); draft assignment of leases for same (0.6); correspondence with G. Crane and L. Plotkin regarding sale process (1.0).
Adamson, Cameron	04/27/20	11.4	Call with Dean Foods regarding Uncle Matt's transitional items (1.0); review Dairy Foods of America closing issues (0.9); attend Miami closing checklist call (0.5); call with Dean Foods regarding closing status (0.6); draft tax holdback for Asset Purchase Agreement (1.5); review closing matters and related documents (6.9).
Altus, Leslie J.	04/27/20	0.5	Correspondence with Davis Polk team regarding Nevada transfer tax issues (0.2); review Foreign Interest in Real Property Tax Act certificates (0.1); review property tax issues (0.2).

Time Detail By Project			
Name	Date	Hours	Narrative
Azzopardi, Frank J.	04/27/20	0.6	Correspondence with Davis Polk team regarding license assignment open issues.
Bernstein, Alexander	04/27/20	0.2	Correspondence with Davis Polk team regarding asset dispositions.
Birnbaum, Harold	04/27/20	3.2	Correspondence with Dean Foods and B. Resnick regarding closing matters (1.5); review and revise closing documents (1.7).
Butler, James C	04/27/20	0.6	Review requests for hearing filed by individual dairy farmers.
Crane, Gregory D.	04/27/20	14.0	Review deeds, revise same (3.8); revise assignment of Mana leases (0.8); revise closing checklists (0.5); coordinate wiring instructions for Producers deal (0.2); correspondence with Logix counsel regarding valuations (0.4); correspondence with L. Plotkin regarding Livonia issue (0.1); correspondence with Shearman & Sterling regarding signature packets, valuations (0.4); correspondence with B. Somogyi regarding releases (0.4); revise signature packets (2.6); correspondence with title company regarding local Hawaii requirements for sale order (0.2); coordinate signature page delivery to DFA (0.3); inventory, review executed signature pages from client (0.8); correspondence with title companies regarding revised resolutions (0.4); revise deeds based on feedback from title companies (2.1); respond to questions from B. Sullivan on transfer tax forms (0.5); telephone conference with Latham & Watkins on status of closing deliverables (0.5).
Curran, William A.	04/27/20	0.3	Review sale proceeds escrow agreement.
Garg, Paavani	04/27/20	2.3	Revise Section 365 Orders (2.3).
Ginder, Kathleen	04/27/20	0.9	Call with Dean Foods and Prairie Farms regarding transitioning employees.
Goldberg, Louis L.	04/27/20	1.0	Review closing issues and related documents.
Malinowsky, Thomas D.	04/27/20	14.9	Revise Dairy Farmers of America closing statement (2.5); correspondence with Davis Polk team regarding Meadow Gold license agreement (1.3); review Miami closing items (1.5); draft closing funds flow (0.8); review closing documents regarding Prairie Farms transaction (3.8); review closing documents regarding Dairy Farmers of America transaction (2.5); correspondence with Davis Polk team and Dean Foods regarding sale closings (2.5).
Netzer, Omer	04/27/20	3.6	Call with M. Niermann and others regarding CROPP transaction (0.5); review and revise joint venture termination agreement (2.1); call regarding same with CROPP counsel and others (0.6); correspondence with M. Niermann and S. Szanzer regarding same (0.4).
O'Young, Jerry	04/27/20	11.1	Review correspondence with Davis Polk team regarding closing matters (2.0); email correspondence with Davis Polk Mergers & Acquisitions team regarding closing deliverables (1.0); email correspondence with Latham & Watkins and Shearman & Sterling regarding closing deliverables (0.5); update closing Prairie Farms checklist (0.5); correspondence with Dean Foods regarding closing matters (1.0); correspondence with Davis Polk team regarding sales status (3.0); revise Dairy Farmers of America escrow agreement (1.5); finalize execution versions of closing documents (1.6).

Time Detail By Project			
Name	Date	Hours	Narrative
Pittell, Joshua B.	04/27/20	13.0	Review and revise closing deliverables (3.9); coordinate closing matters with Dean Foods and buyers (4.0); review and respond to email correspondence from buyers regarding closing matters (4.1); calls with buyers regarding same (1.0).
Plotkin, Lawrence R.	04/27/20	11.8	Review closing deliverables (2.0); review and revise Logix Asset Purchase Agreement (2.0); correspondence with Davis Polk team regarding same (3.0); review Dairy Farms of America and Prairie Farms deeds and transfer tax computations (2.8); correspondence with Davis Polk team and Dean Foods regarding outstanding closing issues (2.0).
Ramjas, Rana S.	04/27/20	5.0	Correspondence with B. Sullivan regarding sale process (2.0); revise transfer tax forms (3.0).
Rarrick, Mohini P.B.	04/27/20	0.6	Review notice provisions of Logix Sale Order (0.3); correspondence regarding same with Davis Polk real estate team (0.3).
Renter, Chelsea	04/27/20	3.3	Review and revise intellectual property assignment agreements.
Resnick, Brian M.	04/27/20	1.8	Email with Davis Polk team and Dean Foods regarding asset sale closing issues.
Siman, Ariel David	04/27/20	0.7	Review Foreign Interest in Real Property Tax Act certificates.
Simpson, Kendra	04/27/20	0.8	Review Foreign Interest in Real Property Tax Act certificate requirements.
Soilleux, Nicholas	04/27/20	3.3	Correspondence with Davis Polk team and buyers regarding closing issues.
Sokol, Nate	04/27/20	0.5	Call with M. Niermann, S. Szanzer, and others regarding CROPP transaction.
Somogyi, Ben	04/27/20	6.5	Draft mortgage releases for conveyed real property assets (2.0); correspond with buyer counsel regarding mortgage releases (1.0); revise deeds for conveyed real property assets (3.5).
Sullivan, Bernadette M.	04/27/20	13.1	Prepare and revise transfer tax forms (4.0); update master charts and assemble legal descriptions (2.0); prepare execution packages (2.0); correspondence with Davis Polk team regarding sale closings (2.0); calculate transfer taxes (3.1).
Szanzer, Steven Z.	04/27/20	6.5	Correspondence with M. Niermann and O. Netzer regarding CROPP transaction (0.6); call with CROPP and M. Niermann regarding joint venture termination agreement (0.6); correspondence with D. McGehrin regarding Logix Sale Order (0.2); correspondence with E. Moskowitz regarding IRG limited objection (0.1); correspondence with P. Garg regarding same (0.3); correspondence with Pepper Hamilton regarding same (0.5); review and revise Logix Sale Order (0.6); correspondence with P. Garg regarding same (0.5); correspondence with Pepper Hamilton regarding same (0.2); correspondence with Davis Polk Real Estate team regarding same (0.3); correspondence with Blalock Walters regarding same (0.3); review and revise notice for same (0.2); correspondence with Davis Polk team regarding Mana closing issues (0.3); correspondence with Davis Polk Mergers & Acquisitions team regarding Professional Fee Escrow Agreement (0.2); review revised joint venture termination agreement (0.8); correspondence with O. Netzer and M. Niermann regarding same (0.2); review emails with Davis Polk team regarding Land O' Lakes issues (0.6).

Time Detail By Project			
Name	Date	Hours	Narrative
Woller, Christopher C.	04/27/20	6.2	Finalize execution versions of intellectual property assignment agreements for each sale transaction (4.2); correspondence with C. Renter regarding same (0.3); response to intellectual property ownership questions from Latham & Watkins (1.1); update license agreement (0.6).
Won, Kimberly (KyungEun)	04/27/20	1.3	Review and revise Miami deeds (1.0); correspondence with L. Plotkin and G. Crane regarding Hawaii deeds and title deliverables (0.3).
Adamson, Cameron	04/28/20	12.1	Attend Dairy Farmers of America closing checklist call (1.0); attend biweekly sales call with Creditors Committee (0.5); attend Hawaii closing checklist call (0.6); review and revise Non-Disclosure Agreements(1.5); review closing matters and related documents (8.5).
Altus, Leslie J.	04/28/20	0.5	Research regarding emergence structure tax issues.
Azzopardi, Frank J.	04/28/20	0.3	Correspondence with Davis Polk team discussions regarding Meadow Gold license.
Bernstein, Alexander	04/28/20	0.1	Correspondence with Davis Polk team regarding asset sales status.
Birnbaum, Harold	04/28/20	4.0	Correspondence with Dean Foods and Davis Polk regarding closing matters (1.0); review and revise closing documents (3.0).
Brecher, Stephen I.	04/28/20	0.9	Correspondence with K. Ginder regarding Prairie Farm transitioning employees (0.4); call with Dean Foods regarding Prairie Farms transitioning employees (0.5).
Butler, James C	04/28/20	3.8	Review Dean Foods sale documents for privilege.
Crandall, Jeffrey P.	04/28/20	1.2	Review Prairie Farms transitioning employee issues.
Crane, Gregory D.	04/28/20	12.4	Attend Logix closing status call (0.5); attend DFA closing checklist call (0.5); review and revise deeds (0.9); review and revise assignment of leases for Prairie deal (0.6); revise Prairie Farms deeds to reflect comments from title company (0.8); prepare transfer tax chart (2.6); correspondence with Logix's counsel on corporate documents (0.2); correspondence with Republic title on resolutions (0.2); draft name-change affidavits for Ohio deeds (0.6); correspondence regarding lease of headquarters property (0.4); correspondence regarding expired PINs at Illinois properties (0.3); correspondence with client regarding reconciliation of Irondale, AL property with documents in data room (0.7); revise deeds to reflect corrected closing date (0.9); revise deeds to reflect comments from title company (0.7); updates to transfer tax forms (0.8); correspondence regarding mortgage releases (0.3); draft bills of sale for DFA closing (1.4).
Garg, Paavani	04/28/20	0.2	Attend biweekly sales call with Creditors Committee (0.2).
Ginder, Kathleen	04/28/20	2.0	Review treatment of transitioning employees (1.5); call with Dean Foods regarding same (0.5).
Lichter, Brian S.	04/28/20	0.4	Correspondence with L. Plotkin regarding sale status.
Malinowsky, Thomas D.	04/28/20	14.0	Draft Dairy Farmers of America and Prairie Farms closing documents (4.7); correspondence with Davis Polk team regarding closing checklist and closing documents for Hawaii assets sale (2.0); prepare lease consent form (2.8); revise Transition Services Agreement (2.5); review sale closing documents (2.0).

Time Detail By Project			
Name	Date	Hours	Narrative
Netzer, Omer	04/28/20	0.9	Attend biweekly sales call with Creditors Committee (0.5); correspondence with M. Niermann regarding joint venture termination agreement (0.4).
O'Young, Jerry	04/28/20	9.9	Review correspondence with Davis Polk team regarding closing matters regarding sales (2.0); correspondence with Davis Polk Mergers & Acquisitions team members regarding pre-closing and closing deliverables (1.0); correspondence with Latham & Watkins and Shearman & Sterling regarding closing deliverables (1.0); correspondence with Dean Foods regarding closing deliverables same (1.0); update Prairie Farms closing checklist (0.5); attend checklist calls regarding all sales (2.0); finalize executed Secretary Certificate (0.5); prepare Secretary Certificates for title companies (1.0); correspondence with Citibank and Dean Foods regarding Know Your Customer matters (0.9).
Pittell, Joshua B.	04/28/20	12.1	Review and revise closing deliverables (5.9); calls with buyers regarding status of same (1.1); correspondence with Dean Foods and buyers regarding closing matters (5.1).
Plotkin, Lawrence R.	04/28/20	11.5	Review real property conveyances (5.0); correspondence with Davis Polk team regarding same (3.0); review title records to resolve open items (2.0); computation of transfer taxes for Prairie Farms property transfers (1.0); review transfer tax forms and deeds (0.5).
Ramjas, Rana S.	04/28/20	7.5	Correspondence with B. Sullivan regarding closing items (2.0); update transfer tax forms (5.5).
Rarrick, Mohini P.B.	04/28/20	0.2	Review correspondence with Davis Polk team regarding Hawaii assets sale.
Resnick, Brian M.	04/28/20	3.0	Calls with K. Waterman regarding asset sale closing issues (0.4); emails with Davis Polk Mergers & Acquisitions and Davis Polk Antitrust teams regarding same (2.2); attend biweekly sales call with Creditors Committee (0.4).
Soilleux, Nicholas	04/28/20	1.0	Correspondence with Davis Polk team regarding sale process.
Sokol, Nate	04/28/20	0.7	Attend biweekly sales call with Creditors Committee.
Somogyi, Ben	04/28/20	9.5	Draft transfer tax calculation chart (3.5); correspond with buyer counsels regarding mortgage releases (2.0); review closing checklist (1.0); draft exhibits to title affidavit (1.0); correspondence with Dean Foods regarding capital improvements at owned facilities (0.5); revise special warranty deeds (1.0); draft signature pages for mortgage releases (0.5).
Sullivan, Bernadette M.	04/28/20	14.4	Review and revise Prairie Farms transfer tax forms (12.4); correspondence with Davis Polk team regarding sale process (2.0).
Szanzer, Steven Z.	04/28/20	0.9	Correspondence with M. Niermann regarding joint venture termination agreement (0.4); review same (0.2); attend biweekly sales call with Creditors Committee (0.3).
Woller, Christopher C.	04/28/20	0.6	Emails with Latham & Watkins regarding trademark filings (0.3); review case filings regarding same (0.3).
Won, Kimberly (KyungEun)	04/28/20	4.8	Review and revise Hawaii assets deeds.
Adamson, Cameron	04/29/20	12.8	Attend Dairy Farmers of America closing checklist call (0.5); attend Miami closing checklist call (0.6); attend Prairie Farms closing checklist call (0.8); call with Davis Polk Mergers & Acquisitions team regarding closing status (0.7); call with Latham & Watkins regarding Dairy Farmers of America closing (0.6); review closing matters and documents (9.6).

Time Detail By Project			
Name	Date	Hours	Narrative
Bernstein, Alexander	04/29/20	2.1	Correspondence with Davis Polk team regarding trademark license (0.7); telephone conference with C. Woller regarding same (0.7); review pleadings regarding same (0.2); correspondence with J. Butler regarding same (0.2); correspondence with Davis Polk team regarding same (0.3).
Birnbaum, Harold	04/29/20	5.2	Correspondence with Dean Foods, B. Resnick and Davis Polk regarding closing matters (3.0); review and revise closing documents (2.2).
Brecher, Stephen I.	04/29/20	3.1	Correspondence and calls with Davis Polk team regarding transitioning employees (1.0); correspondence with J. Crandall and K. Ginder regarding treatment of transitioning employees (0.5); review and update employee lists (0.2); correspondence with Shearman & Sterling regarding same (0.6); correspondence with Dean Foods regarding same (0.6); further correspondence with Shearman & Sterling regarding same (0.2).
Butler, James C	04/29/20	3.0	Review of sale documents for responsiveness and privilege.
Crandall, Jeffrey P.	04/29/20	0.8	Review transitioning employee issues.
Crane, Gregory D.	04/29/20	12.5	Telephone conference with DPW Real Estate team on closing status (0.6); attend Prairie Farms closing checklist call (0.4); attend DFA closing checklist call (0.4); review and revise deeds (1.4); review Uncle Matt's assignment of lease (0.4); update tracking spreadsheet, including final reconciliation of DFA properties (2.6); correspondence regarding conforming changes to transfer tax forms (0.4); correspondence with client regarding Irondale, AL issue (0.2); correspondence with L. Plotkin regarding IL property issue (0.4); revise tenant estoppel letters for Mana closing (0.8); coordinate messenger service for delivery of deeds to title company (0.2); telephone conference with Shearman & Sterling on recording logistics (0.5); revise transfer tax chart (2.2); correspondence with Hawaii title regarding corporate documentation (0.1); correspondence regarding Hawaii transfer tax forms (0.4); revise Illinois transfer tax forms (1.0); prepare execution versions of assignment of leases (0.5).
Ginder, Kathleen	04/29/20	0.5	Call with Dean Foods regarding transitioning employees.
Lichter, Brian S.	04/29/20	0.5	Attend Dairy Farmers of America closing checklist call (0.3); email with L. Plotkin regarding closing status (0.2).
Malinowsky, Thomas D.	04/29/20	17.4	Correspondence with Davis Polk team regarding Dairy Farmers of America closing and closing statements (1.9); revise Asset Purchase Agreement amendment (1.0); revise Transition Services Agreement and closing checklist (4.0); revise Meadow Gold documents (2.3); calls and emails regarding Prairie Farms closing and closing checklist updates (4.5); prepare for Miami closing checklist call (0.5) attend same (0.6); discussions with Davis Polk team and Dean Foods regarding funds flows (0.8); calls and emails with Davis Polk team and Dean Foods regarding open closing items for closings (1.8).
Netzer, Omer	04/29/20	1.9	Review De Minimis Sale notice (1.0); correspondence with Norton Rose team regarding same (0.4); correspondence with B. Resnick and others regarding Land O' Lakes license issues (0.5).

Time Detail By Project			
Name	Date	Hours	Narrative
O'Young, Jerry	04/29/20	11.9	Review email correspondence with Davis Polk team regarding closing matters (2.0); correspondence with Dean Foods Mergers & Acquisitions regarding closing deliverables (1.0); correspondence with Latham & Watkins and Shearman & Sterling regarding closing deliverables (0.5); update Prairie Farms closing checklist (0.5); compile executed K. Waterman signature packets (1.0); correspondence with Dean Foods regarding closing matters (1.0); attend checklist calls regarding all sales (3.0); revise Secretary Certificate (1.4); revise escrow agreements regarding Prairie Farms and Dairy Farmers of America (1.5).
Pittell, Joshua B.	04/29/20	15.5	Review and revise closing deliverables (8.1); calls with buyers regarding closing checklists and status (2.8); review and revise funds flow memorandums (2.1); coordinate closing matters and review related documents (2.5).
Plotkin, Lawrence R.	04/29/20	13.2	Review real estate conveyances (3.0); prepare deeds and transfer tax forms (3.0); complete transfer tax computations (4.5); review sale closing matters (2.7).
Ramjas, Rana S.	04/29/20	6.5	Revise transfer tax forms (3.5); correspondence with the Davis Polk Real Estate team regarding same and related matters (3.0).
Renter, Chelsea	04/29/20	0.7	Revise intellectual property assignment agreement.
Resnick, Brian M.	04/29/20	2.8	Emails with Davis Polk Mergers & Acquisitions team and others regarding closing issues.
Soilleux, Nicholas	04/29/20	1.8	Correspondence with Davis Polk team and buyers regarding Producers Dairy transaction.
Sokol, Nate	04/29/20	0.5	Correspondence with B. Resnick, S. Szanzer, E. Moskowitz, and others regarding Land O' Lakes sale objection.
Somogyi, Ben	04/29/20	12.1	Draft mortgage releases (3.5); correspondence with buyer counsel and Dean Foods regarding same (2.0); revise same (1.0); correspondence with L. Plotkin, K. Won, G. Crane, B. Sullivan, and R. Ramjas regarding closing deliverables (1.5); attend teleconference with K. Won regarding mortgage releases (2.0); correspondence with buyer counsel regarding special warranty deeds (2.1).
Sullivan, Bernadette M.	04/29/20	13.9	Correspondence with Davis Polk team regarding sale status (3.0); revise all transfer tax forms (4.5); correspondence regarding modifications of deeds (3.5); review Dairy Farmers of America and Prairie Farms transfer forms (2.9).
Szanzer, Steven Z.	04/29/20	4.2	Correspondence with J. Sutton regarding Dairy Farmers of America contract designation schedule (0.1) review emails with Davis Polk team regarding Land O' Lakes issues (1.4); review updates regarding litigation and negotiations of same (0.2); call with litigation and intellectual property teams regarding same (0.5); call with B. Sargent regarding same (0.4); update Davis Polk teams regarding same (0.2); finalize De Minimis Asset Sale Notice and correspondence with J. Sutton regarding same (0.4); review joint venture termination agreement (0.5); correspondence and call with M. Niermann regarding same (0.5).
Woller, Christopher C.	04/29/20	2.4	Revise draft of Meadow Gold license (1.2); correspondence with litigation and restructuring teams regarding intellectual property assignment issues (0.6); calls with F. Azzopardi regarding closing issues (0.6).

Time Detail By Project			
Name	Date	Hours	Narrative
Won, Kimberly (KyungEun)	04/29/20	6.4	Correspondence with L. Plotkin and G. Crane regarding real property transfer issues (1.0); review and revise mortgage releases and signature pages for same (2.4); review lease assignment agreement (3.0).
Adamson, Cameron	04/30/20	15.0	Attend Harmoni closing call (0.3); attend Hawaii closing call (0.4); attend Dairy Farmers of America closing checklist call (1.0); attend Prairie Farmers closing checklist call (0.6); call with Logix counsel regarding employment matters (0.7); review closing matters and related documents (12.0).
Birnbaum, Harold	04/30/20	7.3	Correspondence with Dean Foods and Davis Polk team regarding closing matters (2.3); review and revise closing documents (5.0).
Brecher, Stephen I.	04/30/20	2.4	Correspondence with Dean Foods regarding transitioning employees (1.5); correspondence with B. Resnick regarding transition incentives (0.9).
Crandall, Jeffrey P.	04/30/20	1.2	Review transitioning employee issues (0.6); call with S. Brecher regarding same (0.6).
Crane, Gregory D.	04/30/20	12.6	Attend DFA closing status calls (0.7); attend Prairie Farms closing call (0.2); correspondence regarding Louisville lease (0.2); correspondence with Latham & Watkins regarding valuations (0.6); revise DFA assignments of leases (1.5); prepare execution versions of Logix closing deliverables (0.6); prepare execution version of PF assignment of leases (0.2); prepare comments to IL transfer tax forms (0.6); prepare execution versions of deeds, coordinate delivery of same to title companies (3.8); revise transfer tax forms per buyer counsel comments (1.1); correspondence with Latham & Watkins on revisions to IL deeds (0.4); correspondence with title companies on submission of transfer tax forms (0.5); review, respond to questions from title companies on deeds (1.8); correspondence regarding outstanding signature pages (0.4).
Ginder, Kathleen	04/30/20	0.3	Calls with S. Brecher regarding transitioning employees.
Lichter, Brian S.	04/30/20	0.6	Correspondence with L. Plotkin regarding closing status.
Liu, Yichen	04/30/20	5.1	Attend call with Citibank regarding Land O'Lakes escrow arrangement (0.3); call with S. Szanzer regarding same (0.1); retrieve and review precedent escrow agreements (0.4); draft Land O'Lakes Escrow Agreement (2.1); correspondence with S. Szanzer regarding same (0.4); revise Land O'Lakes Escrow Agreement (0.7); correspondence with Land O' Lakes and Citibank regarding same (0.4); review revised draft of same (0.7).
Malinowsky, Thomas D.	04/30/20	16.7	Review and revise closing documents (3.0); revise funds flow and amendment to Asset Purchase Agreement in preparation for Dairy Farmers of America closing (6.5); review Miami Asset Purchase Agreement and call with buyer regarding employee matters (1.3);, ; prepare for and conduct Hawaii closing (3.4); correspondence with Logix counsel and Davis Polk team regarding same (2.5).

Time Detail By Project			
Name	Date	Hours	Narrative
O'Young, Jerry	04/30/20	13.5	Review email correspondence regarding closing matters (3.0); correspondence with Davis Polk Mergers & Acquisitions team regarding closing deliverables (2.0); correspondence with opposing Latham & Watkins counsel and Shearman & Sterling regarding closing deliverables (1.0); correspondence with Dean Foods regarding closing deliverables (2.0); attend closing checklist calls (2.0); prepare execution versions of same (1.5); review lease agreements between Prairie Farms and Dean Foods (1.0); review to closing workstreams and correspondence with Davis Polk team regarding same (1.0).
Pittell, Joshua B.	04/30/20	11.8	Review and revise closing deliverables (7.2); attend closing calls with buyers (2.2); coordinate closing matters with Dean Foods and buyers (2.4).
Plotkin, Lawrence R.	04/30/20	11.0	Review real estate conveyance (5.0); review and revise documents regarding same (6.0).
Ramjas, Rana S.	04/30/20	4.0	Finalize transfer tax forms (3.1); correspondence with G. Crane and B. Sullivan regarding same (0.9).
Rarrick, Mohini P.B.	04/30/20	0.4	Review correspondence with Davis Polk team regarding sales process.
Resnick, Brian M.	04/30/20	2.0	Emails with Davis Polk Mergers & Acquisitions team regarding closing issues (1.4); correspondence with H. Birnbaum regarding same (0.6).
Soilleux, Nicholas	04/30/20	0.5	Correspondence with Davis Polk team regarding closing statements for Miami.
Somogyi, Ben	04/30/20	9.3	Draft mortgage release forms and signature packets for same (5.0); correspondence with lender counsel regarding mortgage releases (1.3); correspondence with buyer title companies regarding mortgage releases (2.0); attend teleconference with buyer counsel regarding closing deliverables (1.0).
Sullivan, Bernadette M.	04/30/20	13.6	Revise Dairy Farmers of America transfer tax forms (3.0); prepare new state transfer tax forms (3.6); correspondence with Dean Foods and Davis Polk team regarding same (4.0); draft additional materials for same (3.0).
Szanzer, Steven Z.	04/30/20	3.0	Review emails with Davis Polk team regarding Land O' Lakes litigation and negotiations (0.4); correspondence with C. Adamson and J. Sutton regarding De Minimis asset sales (0.1); correspondence and call with Citibank regarding Land O' Lakes escrow arrangement (0.5); review and revise agreement for same (1.5); correspondence and call with Y. Liu regarding same (0.2); correspondence with B. Sargent and Citibank regarding same (0.3).
Woller, Christopher C.	04/30/20	0.8	Prepare Logix Meadow Gold license.
Won, Kimberly (KyungEun)	04/30/20	2.2	Correspondence with Dean Foods, Davis Polk team, and others regarding mortgage releases.
Total R110 ASSET DISPOSITIONS		3,054.3	
R120 CORPORATE GOVERNANCE, BOARD MATTERS AND COMMUNICATIONS			
Resnick, Brian M.	04/02/20	0.9	Attend Board update call.
Resnick, Brian M.	04/08/20	0.5	Call with K. Waterman regarding Board issues.
Resnick, Brian M.	04/09/20	0.2	Emails with Joelle Frank regarding communications.

Time Detail By Project			
Name	Date	Hours	Narrative
Resnick, Brian M.	04/13/20	0.5	Call with E. Beringause regarding Board materials (0.2); call with K. Waterman regarding same (0.3).
Resnick, Brian M.	04/14/20	3.0	Call with Dean Foods regarding call with J. Turner (0.5); call with J. Turner and Dean Foods management (1.0); review and revise materials for same (0.6); correspondence with Alvarez & Marsal and Davis Polk team regarding same (0.9).
Schare, Lindsay	04/14/20	2.0	Review and revise Board materials.
Resnick, Brian M.	04/15/20	0.8	Call with K. Waterman and Alvarez & Marsal to prepare for Board meeting (0.5); review documents for same (0.3).
Birnbaum, Harold	04/16/20	2.5	Prepare slides for Board meeting (1.0); attend Board meeting (1.0); calls and correspondence with K. Waterman and others at Dean Foods and B. Resnick and others at Davis Polk regarding Board meeting (0.5).
Burke, Arthur J.	04/16/20	0.9	Call with Dean Foods Board of Directors regarding case status and regulatory review process.
Malinowsky, Thomas D.	04/16/20	0.4	Review Board slides.
Resnick, Brian M.	04/16/20	1.9	Review Board materials (0.2); correspondence with K. Waterman regarding same (0.2); pre-call with Dean Foods management team (0.5); participate in Board call (1.0).
Resnick, Brian M.	04/20/20	0.3	Discuss Board issues with K. Waterman.
Resnick, Brian M.	04/22/20	0.1	Review press release regarding sale.
Resnick, Brian M.	04/26/20	0.2	Emails with K. Waterman and Davis Polk team regarding Board materials.
Szanzer, Steven Z.	04/26/20	0.3	Correspondence with B. Resnick and H. Birnbaum regarding upcoming Board call.
Resnick, Brian M.	04/27/20	0.2	Emails with K. Waterman regarding Board issues.
Garg, Paavani	04/28/20	0.8	Draft case timeline presentation for Board meeting.
Garg, Paavani	04/29/20	0.6	Correspondence with Davis Polk team regarding Board materials (0.1); call with B. Resnick, Alvarez & Marsal and K. Waterman regarding Board materials (0.5).
Resnick, Brian M.	04/29/20	0.7	Call with K. Waterman and Alvarez & Marsal team regarding Board materials (0.5); review same (0.2).
Szanzer, Steven Z.	04/29/20	0.8	Call with Alvarez & Marsal team and others regarding materials for Board call (0.5); finalize same and circulate (0.3).
Burke, Arthur J.	04/30/20	1.0	Attend Dean Foods Board meeting telephonically.
Resnick, Brian M.	04/30/20	1.0	Participate in Board meeting telephonically.
Total R120 CORPORATE GOVERNANCE, BOARD MATTERS AND COMMUNICATIONS		19.6	
R125 CREDITOR/EQUITYHOLDER/UCC ISSUES			
Altus, Leslie J.	04/01/20	1.2	Call with Alvarez & Marsal regarding tax issues (0.4); research regarding same (0.5); call with Davis Polk tax team regarding same (0.3).
Garg, Paavani	04/01/20	0.9	Calls with creditors regarding proofs of claim forms.
Netzer, Omer	04/01/20	0.5	Attend weekly call with Akin Gump team.
Siman, Ariel David	04/01/20	1.6	Correspondence with L. Altus and A. Ulyanenko and others regarding net operating loss issues.
Simpson, Kendra	04/01/20	0.4	Discuss Net operating loss issues with Alvarez & Marsal team, L. Altus, T. Presser, and A. Siman.
Sokol, Nate	04/01/20	0.5	Attend weekly call with Akin Gump team.
Altus, Leslie J.	04/02/20	0.3	Research regarding tax issues.

Time Detail By Project			
Name	Date	Hours	Narrative
Curran, William A.	04/02/20	1.0	Analysis regarding tax issues.
Florio, Joseph A.	04/02/20	0.3	Retrieve tax information for A. Siman.
Siman, Ariel David	04/02/20	4.9	Research tax deferral.
Siman, Ariel David	04/03/20	3.5	Research tax deferral.
Curran, William A.	04/04/20	0.7	Analyze tax issues.
Garg, Paavani	04/06/20	0.8	Calls with creditors regarding proofs of claim forms.
Liu, Yichen	04/06/20	0.4	Review motions to deem proofs of claim timely filed.
Altus, Leslie J.	04/07/20	2.0	Conduct analysis regarding stock question (1.3); email with Davis Polk team regarding same (0.3); attend conference call with Alvarez & Marsal and Davis Polk team regarding same (0.4).
Curran, William A.	04/07/20	0.8	Call with Davis Polk team and Alvarez & Marsal team regarding tax issues (0.4); analysis regarding same (0.4).
Garg, Paavani	04/07/20	0.8	Calls with creditors regarding bar date and case status.
Presser, Talya	04/07/20	1.1	Call with Davis Polk team and Alvarez & Marsal regarding tax issues (0.4); prepare for same (0.5); correspondence with Davis Polk team regarding same (0.2).
Resnick, Brian M.	04/07/20	0.2	Emails with Davis Polk team regarding Creditors Committee issues.
Siman, Ariel David	04/07/20	0.5	Conference call with Davis Polk team and Alvarez & Marsal regarding stock question (0.4); correspondence with Davis Polk tax team regarding same (0.1).
Simpson, Kendra	04/07/20	0.5	Call with Davis Polk team and Alvarez & Marsal team regarding stock question and tax issues (0.4); correspondence with Davis Polk team regarding same (0.1).
Sokol, Nate	04/07/20	0.7	Call with Davis Polk tax team and Alvarez & Marsal tax team regarding equity and tax issues (0.4); correspondence with same regarding same (0.3)
Altus, Leslie J.	04/08/20	1.0	Email Davis Polk and Alvarez & Marsal team regarding stock transfer issues (0.3); review stock holder documentation in connection with same (0.2); review draft letter for same (0.3); email stock holder team regarding same (0.2).
Garg, Paavani	04/08/20	2.1	Review precedent cases for bar date motions (1.4); calls with parties in interest to answer questions regarding case (0.7).
Liu, Yichen	04/08/20	1.0	Review schedules and proofs of claim in (0.7); correspondence with B. Resnick and N. Sokol regarding same (0.3).
Netzer, Omer	04/08/20	0.9	Attend weekly call with Akin Gump (0.5); weekly call with White & Case (0.4).
Resnick, Brian M.	04/08/20	0.7	Attend weekly call with Akin Gump (0.5); emails with M. Lahaie regarding creditor issues (0.2).
Schare, Lindsay	04/08/20	0.2	Emails regarding Creditors Committee discovery requests.
Sokol, Nate	04/08/20	1.4	Attend weekly call with White & Case team (0.4); review proofs of claim (0.9); email B. Resnick and Y. Liu regarding same (0.1).
Szanzer, Steven Z.	04/08/20	1.1	Attend weekly call with Akin Gump (0.5); attend weekly call with White & Case (0.4); respond to creditor inquiries (0.2).
Altus, Leslie J.	04/09/20	1.4	Analyze stock transfer issues (0.8); call with T. Geher and Alvarez & Marsal regarding same (0.6).
Liu, Yichen	04/09/20	1.1	Review and summarize certain late-filed proofs of claim (0.9); correspondence with N. Sokol regarding same (0.2).
Simpson, Kendra	04/09/20	0.6	Correspondence with Davis Polk team regarding stock transfer issues.

Time Detail By Project			
Name	Date	Hours	Narrative
Sokol, Nate	04/09/20	1.5	Call with D. Parham regarding administrative claim motion (0.5); call with J. Luna and J. Erickson regarding motion for administrative claim payment (0.3); call with L. Altus, Alvarez & Marsal tax team, and others regarding stock transfer and other tax issues (0.7).
Garg, Paavani	04/10/20	2.1	Calls with parties in interest to answer questions regarding case (1.9); review 1113/1114 hearing exhibits (0.2).
Liu, Yichen	04/10/20	0.8	Correspondence with certain creditors regarding proofs of claim (0.4); review relevant proofs of claims (0.3); correspondence with B. Resnick and N. Sokol regarding same (0.1).
Schare, Lindsay	04/10/20	0.5	Correspondence regarding Creditors Committee discovery requests.
Sokol, Nate	04/10/20	0.6	Email Davis Polk mergers & acquisitions team and B. Resnick regarding Non-Disclosure Agreement (0.3); call with D. Parham regarding motion for administrative claim payment (0.3).
Thomson, Daniel J.	04/10/20	0.4	Email with Davis Polk litigation team regarding Creditors Committee discovery requests.
Erickson, Jarret	04/13/20	4.4	Review and revise Non-Disclosure Agreement (0.7); correspondence with N. Sokol regarding same (0.3); correspondence with J. Sutton regarding same (0.1); research set-off issue (2.1); draft correspondence and analysis regarding same for N. Sokol (1.2).
Garg, Paavani	04/13/20	0.6	Return calls of parties in interests to answer questions regarding case (0.6).
Erickson, Jarret	04/14/20	1.3	Review and revise stipulation for abatement of administrative expense claim (0.9); correspondence with N. Sokol regarding same (0.2); review and finalize Non-Disclosure Agreement (0.2).
Kearney, Daniel P.	04/14/20	9.7	Conduct case law research regarding licenses (4.1); review and revise draft reply to objection regarding same (5.6).
Sokol, Nate	04/14/20	1.0	Email J. Erickson regarding motions for allowance of administrative expense (0.8); email D. Keeton, E. Jarret and others regarding Non-Disclosure Agreements (0.2).
Szanzer, Steven Z.	04/14/20	0.2	Correspondence with N. Sokol regarding creditor inquiry.
Garg, Paavani	04/15/20	1.8	Review case precedents for bar date motions.
Millerman, James M.	04/15/20	0.5	Review correspondence with Davis Polk Tax team regarding tax refund issues.
Sokol, Nate	04/15/20	1.3	Email with J. Erickson and vendor counsel regarding motions for administrative expenses (0.4); email with Y. Liu, Epiq team, and others regarding late-filed claims motions (0.6); email with S. Huber and others regarding tax payment issues (0.3).
Altus, Leslie J.	04/16/20	2.3	Review state tax returns (1.1); prepare issues list regarding same (0.9); correspondence with W. Curran and C. Adamson regarding same (0.3).
Garg, Paavani	04/16/20	0.5	Review precedent for Deferred Compensation Order.
Liu, Yichen	04/16/20	1.5	Review late-filed claims motion and related proofs of claims (0.3); prepare email to Dean Foods team summarizing status and advising approach (0.6); review proof of claim and motion to deem late-filed proof of claim timely filed (0.2); prepare email to Dean Foods team regarding same (0.4).
Resnick, Brian M.	04/16/20	0.2	Correspondence with N. Sokol and others regarding claim filings.

Time Detail By Project			
Name	Date	Hours	Narrative
Sokol, Nate	04/16/20	1.5	Email with vendor counsel regarding proof of claim issues (0.7); review applications to approve late-filed proofs of claim (0.5); email Y. Liu, B. Resnick, and Epiq team regarding same (0.1); email with Dean Foods and Y. Liu regarding motions to approve late-filed proofs of claim (0.2).
Altus, Leslie J.	04/17/20	2.0	Review returns regarding tax issues (0.3); call with S. Huber and Alvarez & Marsal regarding same (0.4); correspondence with W. Curran regarding same (0.1); review summary document and payment documentation (0.9); email buyer's counsel regarding tax issues (0.3).
Liu, Yichen	04/17/20	0.7	Correspondence with N. Sokol regarding motions to deem late-filed proofs of claim timely filed (0.2); review same (0.2); retrieve precedent stipulations regarding same (0.3).
Millerman, James M.	04/17/20	0.5	Review correspondence with Davis Polk Tax team regarding tax refund issues.
Sokol, Nate	04/17/20	0.3	Email with D. Keeton, J. Erickson and others regarding Non-Disclosure Agreements.
Szanzer, Steven Z.	04/17/20	0.5	Review emails regarding professional fees (0.3); team correspondence regarding tax refund issues (0.2).
Liu, Yichen	04/18/20	1.9	Retrieve precedent stipulations regarding late-filed proofs of claim (0.8); draft stipulations to deem proofs of claim timely filed (1.1).
Sokol, Nate	04/18/20	0.3	Email with K. Waterman, J. Sutton, and E. Jarret regarding Non-Disclosure Agreements.
Liu, Yichen	04/19/20	1.4	Draft stipulations to deem proofs of claim timely filed.
Sokol, Nate	04/19/20	0.3	Email with K. Waterman, J. Sutton, and E. Jarret regarding Non-Disclosure Agreements.
Liu, Yichen	04/20/20	0.4	Review amended late-filed proof of claim and motion to deem claim timely filed (0.2); review correspondence regarding same (0.1); review invoice supporting certain proof of claim (0.1).
Sokol, Nate	04/20/20	1.5	Email with vendor counsel regarding proofs of claim issues (0.7); email with Akin Gump, vendor counsel, and Davis Polk team regarding proofs of claim issues (0.8).
Szanzer, Steven Z.	04/20/20	2.4	Review and revise stipulations regarding late-filed claims (1.4); correspondence with N. Sokol regarding same (0.6); correspondence with B. Resnick regarding same (0.2); review email regarding Centimark payment (0.1); correspondence with N. Sokol and P. Garg regarding rolling stock leases (0.1).
Liu, Yichen	04/21/20	0.7	Review and revise stipulations regarding late-filed proofs of claim (0.5); correspondence with N. Sokol regarding same (0.1); review correspondence regarding same (0.1).
Netzer, Omer	04/21/20	0.4	Correspondence with P. Garg and M. Rarrick regarding bar date motion.
Siman, Ariel David	04/21/20	0.6	Review tax refund issues.
Sokol, Nate	04/21/20	1.4	Email with vendor counsel regarding proofs of claim issues (0.9); review and revise proof of claim stipulations (0.4); email Akin Gump, White & Case, and claimant's counsel regarding same (0.1).
Szanzer, Steven Z.	04/21/20	0.8	Finalize stipulations for late-filed claims.
Bernstein, Alexander	04/22/20	0.4	Correspondence with Dean Foods and Davis Polk team regarding late-filed proof claim (0.2); correspondence with Davis Polk team regarding same (0.2).
Garg, Paavani	04/22/20	0.8	Respond to calls from creditors to answer questions regarding case.

Time Detail By Project			
Name	Date	Hours	Narrative
Liu, Yichen	04/22/20	1.0	Review proofs of claims (0.3); review filings regarding same (0.3); correspondence with Davis Polk team and Epiq team regarding same (0.4).
Millerman, James M.	04/22/20	4.3	Correspondence with Davis Polk Tax team regarding tax refund question (0.7); research regarding same (2.2); draft research summary and issues lists for Davis Polk Tax team regarding same (1.4).
Netzer, Omer	04/22/20	0.5	Attend weekly call with Akin Gump team.
Rarrick, Mohini P.B.	04/22/20	0.6	Review status of administrative claims.
Resnick, Brian M.	04/22/20	0.5	Attend weekly update call with Akin Gump.
Siman, Ariel David	04/22/20	2.2	Review question regarding Dean Foods Net Operating Loss issues.
Sokol, Nate	04/22/20	0.3	Attend weekly call with Akin Gump.
Szanzer, Steven Z.	04/22/20	1.4	Attend weekly call with Akin Gump (0.3); attend weekly call with White & Case (0.5); correspondence with N. Sokol regarding sale objection (0.2); call with Pepper Hamilton regarding same (0.4).
Altus, Leslie J.	04/23/20	3.7	Call with Davis Polk Tax and Restructuring teams regarding Net Operating Loss carryback issues (0.9); follow-up with W. Curran regarding same (0.3); correspondence with A. Siman, T. Presser and K. Simpson regarding same (0.4); correspondence with A. Ulyanenko regarding same (0.3); correspondence with B. Resnick and N. Sokol regarding same (0.2); correspondence with White & Case regarding same (0.3); follow-up research (1.3).
Bernstein, Alexander	04/23/20	0.2	Correspondence with Davis Polk team regarding late-filed proof of claim (0.1); correspondence with plaintiff's counsel and Davis Polk team regarding same (0.1).
Garg, Paavani	04/23/20	0.9	Return calls with parties in interest to answer questions regarding case (0.4); correspondence with Davis Polk team regarding Net Operating Loss (0.5).
Green, Thomas S.	04/23/20	4.6	Correspondence with J. Millerman regarding tax research overview (0.5); research regarding tax issues (4.1).
Millerman, James M.	04/23/20	5.7	Correspondence with Davis Polk team regarding tax issues (1.7); review research regarding tax issues (3.5); correspondence with Davis Polk Restructuring team regarding legal research regarding same (0.5).
Netzer, Omer	04/23/20	6.8	Correspondence with L. Altus regarding tax issues (0.5); correspondence with J. Millerman regarding same (0.5); correspondence with T. Presser, N. Sokol, and J. Millerman regarding same (2.1); review and revise Bar Date Motion (3.7).
Presser, Talya	04/23/20	4.0	Review Net Operating Loss issues.
Rarrick, Mohini P.B.	04/23/20	3.8	Review case law regarding administrative claims (2.8); correspondence with J. Millerman, O. Netzer, and T. Green regarding same (1.0).
Siman, Ariel David	04/23/20	0.5	Review and analyze question regarding Dean Foods Net Operating Loss.
Simpson, Kendra	04/23/20	0.5	Correspondence with Davis Polk Restructuring team regarding Net Operating Loss carrybacks issues.
Green, Thomas S.	04/24/20	6.0	Correspondence with J. Millerman and M. Rarrick regarding tax claim issues (0.2); call with Davis Polk team regarding same (0.7); research regarding same (5.1).

Time Detail By Project			
Name	Date	Hours	Narrative
Millerman, James M.	04/24/20	6.6	Correspondence with Davis Polk team regarding tax claim issues (2.3); review research in connection with same (3.8); call with Davis Polk Restructuring team regarding same (0.5).
Netzer, Omer	04/24/20	4.7	Call with J. Millerman, T. Green, and M. Rarrick regarding tax claim issues (0.7); review caselaw regarding same (3.2); review proofs of claim filings (0.8).
Presser, Talya	04/24/20	1.0	Correspondence with Davis Polk team regarding CARES Act tax refund procedures.
Rarrick, Mohini P.B.	04/24/20	1.6	Review case law regarding administrative claims bar date (0.9), teleconference with J. Millerman, T. Green, and O. Netzer regarding CARES Act tax refund procedures (0.7).
Sokol, Nate	04/24/20	0.2	Email with R. Landy, J. Crandall, S. Brecher, and S. Szanzer regarding PBGC proofs of claim.
Millerman, James M.	04/25/20	0.5	Correspondence with Davis Polk Restructuring team regarding tax claims issues.
Netzer, Omer	04/25/20	0.7	Review caselaw and research regarding tax claims issues.
Rarrick, Mohini P.B.	04/25/20	0.4	Review correspondence with Davis Polk team regarding tax claims issues.
Schlosser, Jeremy	04/25/20	4.5	Review documents for Creditors Committee discovery requests (4.2); correspondence with L. Schare regarding same (0.3).
Millerman, James M.	04/26/20	2.5	Correspondence with Davis Polk team regarding tax claims issues (0.7); review research regarding same (1.8).
Rarrick, Mohini P.B.	04/26/20	0.6	Review caselaw regarding tax claims issues (0.4); correspondence with J. Millerman and T. Green regarding same (0.2).
Green, Thomas S.	04/27/20	1.9	Research regarding tax claims issues (1.3); call with J. Millerman and M. Rarrick regarding same (0.6).
Millerman, James M.	04/27/20	1.8	Review applicable law and materials in connection with tax claims issues (0.7); correspondence with Davis Polk team regarding same (0.5); call with T. Green and M. Rarrick regarding same (0.6).
Netzer, Omer	04/27/20	2.5	Call with J. Millerman and others regarding tax claims issues (0.5); review caselaw regarding same (0.9); call with K. Decker and others regarding set-off questions (0.6); correspondence with K. Decker and others regarding same (0.5).
Rarrick, Mohini P.B.	04/27/20	2.3	Review case law regarding tax claim issues (1.7); call with J. Millerman and T. Green regarding same (0.6).
Resnick, Brian M.	04/27/20	0.2	Emails with Akin Gump regarding creditor interests.
Curran, William A.	04/28/20	1.0	Correspondence with L. Altus regarding CARES Act refund procedures.
Erickson, Jarret	04/28/20	0.2	Review and revise Bondholder Non-Disclosure Agreements.
Green, Thomas S.	04/28/20	3.3	Analyze case law regarding claims issue (2.8); correspondence with Davis Polk team regarding same (0.5).
Millerman, James M.	04/28/20	2.5	Correspondence with Davis Polk team regarding tax claims issues (0.7); review research regarding same (1.0); correspondence with Davis Polk Tax team regarding same (0.8).
Netzer, Omer	04/28/20	0.5	Call with J. Millerman and others regarding tax claims issues (0.5).
Rarrick, Mohini P.B.	04/28/20	2.6	Review case law regarding CARES Act tax refund procedures (1.7); teleconference with Davis Polk Tax and Restructuring teams regarding same (0.9).

Time Detail By Project			
Name	Date	Hours	Narrative
Sokol, Nate	04/28/20	1.5	Call with S. Szanzer and others regarding pension termination and PBGC proofs of claim (0.2); call with J. Landry, W. Owen and Davis Polk team regarding same (1.0); email Dean Foods and Davis Polk teams regarding same (0.3).
Szanzer, Steven Z.	04/28/20	1.1	Correspondence with B. Resnick regarding PBGC proofs of claims (0.2); pre-call with N. Sokol and others regarding same (0.3); call with PBGC regarding same (0.4); email B. Resnick regarding same (0.2).
Altus, Leslie J.	04/29/20	0.8	Email J. Millerman regarding tax claims issues (0.5); research regarding same (0.3).
Erickson, Jarret	04/29/20	1.2	Review and revise Bondholder Non-Disclosure Agreements (0.8); correspondence with N. Sokol regarding same (0.2); correspondence with Paul Weiss regarding same (0.2).
Green, Thomas S.	04/29/20	1.1	Analyze case law regarding tax claims issues.
Millerman, James M.	04/29/20	3.0	Correspondence with Davis Polk team members regarding tax claims research and workstreams (0.9); review research in connection with same (2.1).
Netzer, Omer	04/29/20	0.4	Attend weekly update call with Akin Gump.
Rarrick, Mohini P.B.	04/29/20	1.3	Review case law regarding tax claims issues.
Resnick, Brian M.	04/29/20	1.0	Attend weekly update call with Akin Gump (0.5); attend weekly update call with White & Case (0.5).
Szanzer, Steven Z.	04/29/20	0.4	Attend weekly update call with Akin Gump (0.3); correspondence with N. Sokol regarding same (0.1).
Altus, Leslie J.	04/30/20	2.1	Call with J. Millerman and Davis Polk Restructuring team regarding tax claims issues (1.3); research regarding same (0.8).
Erickson, Jarret	04/30/20	0.6	Review and revise Bondholder Non-Disclosure Agreements (0.4); correspondence with N. Sokol regarding same (0.1); correspondence with Paul Weiss regarding same (0.1).
Green, Thomas S.	04/30/20	3.2	Call with J. Millerman and M. Rarrick regarding tax claims issues (0.2), call with Davis Polk Tax team regarding same (1.2); follow-up call with Davis Polk Restructuring team regarding same (0.2); legal research regarding same (1.6).
Millerman, James M.	04/30/20	6.0	Legal research regarding tax claim issues (2.8); correspondence with Davis Polk team regarding same (1.8); call with L. Altus and others regarding same (1.2); call with Davis Polk Restructuring team regarding same (0.2).
Moskowitz, Elliot	04/30/20	2.9	Correspondence with Davis Polk team regarding Land O' Lakes deposition (2.9).
Presser, Talya	04/30/20	1.5	Correspondence with Davis Polk team regarding Net Operating Loss refunds.
Rarrick, Mohini P.B.	04/30/20	4.4	Review case law regarding tax claims issues (2.1); correspondence with J. Millerman and L. Altus regarding same (0.8); teleconference with Davis Polk Tax and Davis Polk Restructuring teams (0.9); teleconference with Davis Polk Restructuring team regarding same (0.5).
Resnick, Brian M.	04/30/20	0.2	Calls with M. Lahaie and P. Dublin regarding creditors issues.
Siman, Ariel David	04/30/20	0.8	Call with Davis Polk Tax and Restructuring teams regarding tax claims issues.
Simpson, Kendra	04/30/20	0.9	Call with Davis Polk Restructuring regarding tax refund issues.
Szanzer, Steven Z.	04/30/20	0.4	Call with Davis Polk Tax and Restructuring teams regarding tax claim issues (attend in part).

Time Detail By Project			
Name	Date	Hours	Narrative
Total R125 CREDITOR/EQUITYHOLDER/UCC ISSUES		209.5	
R130 DPW RETENTION			
Lee, Grace	04/06/20	1.4	Review conflicts check process (0.7); coordinate supplemental conflicts check (0.7).
Sokol, Nate	04/06/20	0.4	Email with S. Szanzer and G. Lee regarding supplemental conflicts check process.
Szanzer, Steven Z.	04/06/20	0.3	Correspondence with N. Sokol and B. Resnick regarding supplemental conflicts check.
Lee, Grace	04/07/20	1.1	Prepare list for supplemental conflicts check.
Lee, Grace	04/08/20	0.7	Coordinate and conduct supplemental conflicts check process.
Sokol, Nate	04/08/20	0.5	Email with G. Lee regarding supplemental conflicts check.
Lee, Grace	04/09/20	2.9	Prepare Notice of Appearance list for conflicts check (1.3); conduct supplemental conflicts check (1.5).
Lee, Grace	04/10/20	2.5	Coordinate and conduct supplemental conflicts check.
Sokol, Nate	04/12/20	0.2	Email with M. Olson and G. Lee regarding supplemental conflicts check.
Lee, Grace	04/13/20	0.2	Review email correspondence from Alvarez & Marsal team regarding supplemental conflicts check process.
Lee, Grace	04/14/20	3.2	Conduct supplemental conflicts check.
Sokol, Nate	04/14/20	0.3	Email with G. Lee regarding supplemental conflicts review.
Lee, Grace	04/15/20	2.9	Conduct supplemental conflicts check.
Sokol, Nate	04/15/20	0.2	Email with G. Lee and M. Olson regarding supplemental conflicts check.
Lee, Grace	04/16/20	0.5	Review correspondence from Alvarez & Marsal regarding potential parties in interest for supplemental conflicts check.
Lee, Grace	04/19/20	0.4	Correspondence with N. Sokol regarding status of supplemental conflicts check.
Lee, Grace	04/21/20	0.2	Correspondence with B. Resnick, N. Sokol, and others regarding supplemental conflicts check.
Sokol, Nate	04/21/20	0.3	Email with G. Lee regarding supplemental conflicts review.
Sokol, Nate	04/22/20	0.2	Email with G. Lee and others regarding supplemental conflicts check.
Lee, Grace	04/23/20	0.7	Email with Davis Polk conflicts department regarding supplemental conflicts check.
Sokol, Nate	04/23/20	0.2	Email with G. Lee regarding supplemental conflicts check.
Lee, Grace	04/24/20	1.8	Conduct supplemental conflicts check.
Sokol, Nate	04/24/20	0.3	Email G. Lee regarding supplemental conflicts check.
Lee, Grace	04/27/20	1.2	Conduct supplemental conflicts check.
Lee, Grace	04/30/20	0.4	Correspondence with Davis Polk team regarding for supplemental conflicts check.
Total R130 DPW RETENTION		23.0	
R135 EMPLOYEE/LABOR ISSUES			
Brecher, Stephen I.	04/01/20	1.5	Correspondence with Alvarez & Marsal regarding COBRA (0.2); correspondence with Davis Polk team regarding treatment of retiree plans (1.3).
Altus, Leslie J.	04/02/20	0.2	Review correspondence regarding employment tax questions.
Brecher, Stephen I.	04/02/20	0.8	Review correspondence regarding pension plans (0.4); correspondence with B. Tsepelman regarding same (0.4).
Sokol, Nate	04/02/20	0.4	Correspondence with S. Brecher, B. Resnick, E. Moskowitz, J. Millerman, and others regarding retirement plan issues.

Time Detail By Project			
Name	Date	Hours	Narrative
Brecher, Stephen I.	04/06/20	0.2	Call with K. Ginder regarding compensation plan documents.
Ginder, Kathleen	04/06/20	0.2	Call with S. Brecher regarding compensation plan documents.
Brecher, Stephen I.	04/07/20	4.6	Call with Akin Gump regarding compensation plan (0.3); call with Dean Foods regarding labor issues (0.5); call with J. Crandall and K. Ginder regarding compensation plan and pension issues (0.9); review deferred compensation agreements (0.5); correspondence with K. Ginder regarding same (0.4); review compensation plan revisions (0.3); call with Davis Polk restructuring team regarding pension plan and deferred compensation plan issues (0.6); call with J Crandall, K. Ginder, and E. Turay regarding same (0.7); review PBGC issues (0.4).
Crandall, Jeffrey P.	04/07/20	3.2	Review deferred compensation plan and pension issues (1.5); call with Davis Polk restructuring team regarding same (0.6); call with S. Brecher and K. Ginder regarding same (0.7); review union negotiation updates (0.2); review severance issues (0.2).
Ginder, Kathleen	04/07/20	2.4	Calls with J. Crandall and S. Brecher regarding deferred compensation plan and pension issues (0.7); call with Davis Polk restructuring team regarding same (0.6); review compensation plan and award documents (1.1).
Moskowitz, Elliot	04/07/20	0.6	Call with Davis Polk team regarding deferred compensation plan and pension plan issues.
Netzer, Omer	04/07/20	0.9	Call regarding deferred compensation plan and pension plan issues with Davis Polk team (0.6); correspondence with E. Moskowitz regarding same (0.3).
Resnick, Brian M.	04/07/20	1.3	Call with Davis Polk team regarding deferred compensation plan and pension plan issues (1.2); follow-up call with K. Waterman regarding same (0.1).
Sokol, Nate	04/07/20	1.5	Call with Davis Polk team regarding deferred compensation plan and pension plan issues (0.6); correspondence with same regarding same (0.9).
Szanzer, Steven Z.	04/07/20	3.7	Call with Davis Polk team regarding deferred compensation plan and pension plan issues (0.6); correspondence with B. Resnick and E. Moskowitz regarding same (0.5); review Court filings and consider same (0.6); call with Dean Foods team regarding same (1.2); correspondence with Davis Polk team regarding WARN Act issues (0.4); analyze same (0.4).
Turay, Edna	04/07/20	0.9	Correspondence with J. Crandall, S. Brecher and K. Ginder regarding pension issues (0.3); call with Davis Polk team regarding same (0.6).
Brecher, Stephen I.	04/08/20	1.9	Call with Davis Polk team regarding pension plan premiums (1.0); review draft summary regarding same (0.5); research regarding same (0.2); correspondence with K. Ginder regarding WARN Act issues (0.2).
Crandall, Jeffrey P.	04/08/20	2.5	Review pension premium and related issues (1.7); call with Davis Polk team regarding WARN Act and premium issues (0.8).
Ginder, Kathleen	04/08/20	4.0	Research regarding WARN Act notice (2.2); research regarding pension premiums (1.8).
Resnick, Brian M.	04/08/20	1.0	Calls with Dean Foods regarding employee matters.
Szanzer, Steven Z.	04/08/20	0.2	Review emails regarding WARN issues.
Turay, Edna	04/08/20	9.1	Research regarding pension premium issue (6.6); correspondence with J. Crandall, S. Brecher, and K. Ginder regarding same (2.5).

Time Detail By Project			
Name	Date	Hours	Narrative
Crandall, Jeffrey P.	04/09/20	0.8	Review pension issues.
Ginder, Kathleen	04/09/20	1.9	Review WARN Act (1.4); review pension premium issues (0.2); review of rules relating to plan premiums (0.3).
Turay, Edna	04/09/20	2.7	Review WARN Act research summary (1.5); research regarding premiums (1.2).
Crandall, Jeffrey P.	04/10/20	4.0	Call with co-advisors regarding pension issues (1.0); review research regarding same (1.9); correspondence with K. Ginder and E. Turay regarding same (0.8); review WARN Act issues (0.3).
Ginder, Kathleen	04/10/20	3.4	Correspondence with J. Crandall regarding plan premium rules (1.0); review premium rules (1.4); call with co-advisors regarding plans (1.0).
Resnick, Brian M.	04/10/20	0.2	Emails with Davis Polk labor team regarding WARN Act issues.
Turay, Edna	04/10/20	6.1	Correspondence with J. Crandall and K. Ginder regarding revised premium analysis summary (1.0); research regarding plan liquidation analysis (5.1).
Crandall, Jeffrey P.	04/11/20	1.0	Review pension plan issues (0.7); call with K. Ginder and E. Turay regarding same (0.3).
Ginder, Kathleen	04/11/20	0.3	Call with J. Crandall and E. Turay regarding treatment of premiums.
Turay, Edna	04/11/20	3.0	Call with J. Crandall and K. Ginder regarding bankruptcy liquidation requirements (0.3); revise research summary regarding same (2.7).
Crandall, Jeffrey P.	04/12/20	0.2	Review pension plan issues.
Brecher, Stephen I.	04/13/20	6.9	Revise WARN Act analysis (2.0); correspondence with J. Crandall and K. Ginder regarding WARN Act, deferred compensation trust, and pension plan issues (2.9); calls with J. Crandall and K. Ginder regarding deferred compensation trust (0.3); correspondence with J. Crandall and K. Ginder regarding pension plan issues (1.6); correspondence with N. Sokol regarding same (0.1).
Crandall, Jeffrey P.	04/13/20	4.6	Review pension-related issues (1.1); correspondence with Davis Polk team and Wells Fargo regarding same (1.3); review WARN Act issues (0.9); correspondence with S. Brecher and K. Ginder regarding WARN Act (0.8); review retiree claims issues (0.5).
Ginder, Kathleen	04/13/20	1.9	Correspondence with J. Crandall and S. Brecher regarding WARN Act exceptions and compensation plan matters (1.4); correspondence with Davis Polk restructuring team regarding WARN Act (0.2); review deferred compensation plan documents (0.3).
Resnick, Brian M.	04/13/20	0.3	Emails with Davis Polk labor team regarding severance and WARN Act issues.
Sokol, Nate	04/13/20	1.5	Call with Davis Polk team and Dean Foods regarding labor issues (0.5); correspondence with J. Crandall, R. Herring, and others regarding deferred employee compensation trust (0.6); email same regarding same (0.2); correspondence with P. Garg regarding same (0.2).
Szanzer, Steven Z.	04/13/20	0.7	Review correspondence with Davis Polk team regarding pension claims (0.2); correspondence with N. Sokol regarding same (0.2); review WARN Act analysis (0.3).
Turay, Edna	04/13/20	4.0	Correspondence with K. Ginder regarding research regarding PBGC claims (0.5); research regarding same (3.5).

Time Detail By Project			
Name	Date	Hours	Narrative
Brecher, Stephen I.	04/14/20	2.7	Call with J. Crandall and K. Ginder regarding WARN Act and pension plan issues (0.3); draft summary (2.0); call with J. Crandall and K. Ginder regarding same (0.4).
Crandall, Jeffrey P.	04/14/20	1.7	Review compensation plan issues (0.2); review WARN Act issues (0.2); review pension issues (0.6); call with K. Ginder and S. Brecher regarding pension liabilities (0.4); review union updates (0.3).
Garg, Paavani	04/14/20	2.2	Review precedent motions regarding pension plans.
Ginder, Kathleen	04/14/20	1.0	Review pension plans (0.5); call with J. Crandall and S. Brecher regarding pension liabilities (0.3); review WARN Act (0.2).
Turay, Edna	04/14/20	5.5	Research regarding pension liabilities (4.5); research regarding WARN Act exceptions (1.0).
Crandall, Jeffrey P.	04/15/20	2.2	Calls with E. Turay, K. Ginder regarding pension termination (0.5); review plan termination issues (1.0); correspondence with Davis Polk team regarding pension liability issues (0.7).
Ginder, Kathleen	04/15/20	2.8	Preparation of summary of plan termination issues (1.8); call with J. Crandall and E. Turay regarding same (0.5); review potential claims in respect of same (0.5).
Sokol, Nate	04/15/20	0.4	Email with P. Garg regarding Deferred Compensation Motion issues.
Turay, Edna	04/15/20	8.2	Revise summary of potential liabilities (1.0); research liabilities (1.8); research WARN Act (2.1); call with J. Crandall and K. Ginder regarding pension termination issues (0.5); research regarding pension termination premiums (2.4); correspondence with Davis Polk team regarding same (0.4).
Crandall, Jeffrey P.	04/16/20	2.9	Review pension termination issues (0.8); calls with K. Ginder and E. Turay regarding same (1.0); correspondence with Davis Polk Restructuring team regarding same (0.6); review deferred compensation plan issues (0.5).
Ginder, Kathleen	04/16/20	1.9	Calls with J. Crandall and E. Turay regarding pension termination issues (1.0); review claims in respect of same (0.5); review deferred compensation plan motion (0.4).
Resnick, Brian M.	04/16/20	0.4	Correspondence with Davis Polk team regarding pension issues.
Turay, Edna	04/16/20	6.8	Research pension plan termination premium and payment schedule (2.5); research regarding claims for same (3.3); calls with J. Crandall and K. Ginder regarding same (1.0).
Bernstein, Alexander	04/17/20	0.2	Review correspondence with Davis Polk team regarding pension termination questions.
Brecher, Stephen I.	04/17/20	1.2	Correspondence with J. Stegenga regarding pension issues (0.4); call with J. Stegenga regarding WARN Act (0.2); review correspondence and research regarding same (0.6).
Crandall, Jeffrey P.	04/17/20	0.1	Review pension issues.
Garg, Paavani	04/17/20	2.9	Draft Deferred Compensation Motion.
Crandall, Jeffrey P.	04/18/20	0.2	Review pension issues.
Moskowitz, Elliot	04/18/20	0.6	Correspondence with Davis Polk team regarding pension issues.
Brecher, Stephen I.	04/19/20	0.4	Correspondence with J. Crandall regarding pension plan termination premiums (0.2); correspondence with Dean Foods regarding same (0.1); correspondence with K. Ginder regarding WARN Act (0.1).
Crandall, Jeffrey P.	04/19/20	0.5	Review pension plan termination issues.

Time Detail By Project			
Name	Date	Hours	Narrative
Brecher, Stephen I.	04/20/20	0.9	Call with Dean Foods regarding pension plan termination premiums (0.6); correspondence with N. Sokol regarding deferred compensation plan motion (0.2); correspondence with K. Ginder regarding WARN Act (0.1).
Crandall, Jeffrey P.	04/20/20	1.0	Review pension plan termination issues (0.5); call with Dean Foods regarding same (0.4); review WARN Act issues (0.1).
Ginder, Kathleen	04/20/20	1.1	Prepare WARN Act analysis (0.1); call with Dean Foods regarding pension plan termination premiums (0.4); research pension plan termination premiums (0.3); review deferred compensation plan motion (0.3).
Netzer, Omer	04/20/20	0.5	Call regarding pension plan termination claims with Dean Foods and others.
Resnick, Brian M.	04/20/20	0.7	Correspondence with Davis Polk team regarding labor and pension issues (0.3); correspondence with Davis Polk team regarding PBGC discussions (0.4).
Sokol, Nate	04/20/20	0.5	Call with Dean Foods regarding pension plan termination (0.4); correspondence with Davis Polk Executive Compensation team regarding same (0.1).
Brecher, Stephen I.	04/21/20	5.4	Call with J. Crandall regarding PBGC issues (0.5); call with Dean Foods regarding same (0.7); correspondence with N. Sokol regarding deferred compensation plan issues (0.2); call with PBGC (0.5); call with J. Crandall regarding WARN Act issue (0.7); call with E. Turay regarding same (0.6); call with Davis Polk Restructuring team regarding compensation plan issues (0.9); provide comments to employee notice and frequently asked questions (1.3).
Crandall, Jeffrey P.	04/21/20	3.4	Call with S. Brecher regarding PBGC issues (0.5); call with Dean Foods team regarding same (0.7); calls Davis Polk Restructuring team regarding WARN Act (0.8); call with PBGC and Dean Foods regarding pension termination issues (0.7); call with S. Brecher regarding WARN Act issues (0.7).
Garg, Paavani	04/21/20	0.7	Call with Davis Polk Executive Compensation team regarding WARN Act (partial attendance).
Ginder, Kathleen	04/21/20	1.4	Call with Davis Polk Restructuring team regarding pension plan termination premiums and WARN Act analysis (0.9); review WARN Act (0.2); review compensation plan issues (0.3).
Netzer, Omer	04/21/20	0.6	Call with Davis Polk Executive Compensation team regarding WARN Act (partial attendance).
Resnick, Brian M.	04/21/20	1.5	Call with Davis Polk team regarding WARN Act issues (0.9); correspondence with K. Waterman and N. Sokol regarding same and other labor issues (0.6).
Sokol, Nate	04/21/20	1.1	Call with S. Brecher, J. Crandall, K. Ginder, and S. Szanzer regarding WARN Act procedures (0.9); email S. Brecher, J. Crandall, K. Ginder, S. Szanzer, and Evercore team regarding WARN Act procedures (0.2).
Szanzer, Steven Z.	04/21/20	4.8	Review summary of WARN Act research (0.4); correspondence with Davis Polk Executive Compensation team and N. Sokol regarding PBGC claims and WARN Act (0.3); call with Davis Polk Executive Compensation team and N. Sokol regarding same (0.9); review additional materials and emails regarding same (0.5); review and revise Deferred Compensation Motion (2.2); correspondence with N. Sokol and P. Garg regarding same (0.5).

Time Detail By Project			
Name	Date	Hours	Narrative
Turay, Edna	04/21/20	7.2	Call with S. Brecher regarding WARN Act (0.6); research regarding WARN Act and WARN notice (3.7); call with Davis Polk Restructuring team regarding same (0.9); research regarding pension plan termination premiums (2.0).
Bernstein, Alexander	04/22/20	0.1	Call with S. Brecher and K. Ginder regarding employee incentive and retention plan.
Brecher, Stephen I.	04/22/20	4.8	Review WARN Act issues (1.0); correspondence with J. Crandall regarding WARN Act notices (0.3); correspondence with Davis Polk Restructuring team regarding PBGC issues (0.4); review revised compensation plan (0.2); call with A. Bernstein regarding same (0.1); correspondence with M. Gibbons regarding same (0.1); call with J. Crandall, K. Ginder, and E. Turray regarding WARN Act and PBGC issues (1.2); call with J. Crandall regarding same (0.5); call with Davis Polk Restructuring team regarding PBGC issues (0.5); review deferred employee compensation plan motion (0.3); correspondence with K. Ginder regarding pension plan (0.2).
Crandall, Jeffrey P.	04/22/20	3.1	Review WARN Act issues (0.3); call with Davis Polk Restructuring team regarding PBGC issues (0.5); calls with S. Brecher regarding WARN notices (0.5); review pension plan termination issues (0.6); call with S. Brecher, K. Ginder, and E. Turay regarding WARN Act and PBGC issues (1.2).
Garg, Paavani	04/22/20	1.0	Revise Deferred Compensation Motion (1.0).
Ginder, Kathleen	04/22/20	2.7	Research regarding termination premiums (0.7); call with J. Crandall, S. Brecher, and E. Turay regarding termination premiums and WARN Act (1.2); call with Davis Polk Restructuring team regarding pension plan termination premiums and other PBGC issues (0.5); review deferred employee compensation plan motion (0.2); call with A. Bernstein regarding employee compensation plan (0.1).
Mazer, Deborah S.	04/22/20	0.4	Correspondence with B. Resnick, S. Brecher, and others regarding PBGC issues.
Netzer, Omer	04/22/20	0.6	Call with Davis Polk Executive Compensation regarding PBGC issues (0.5); correspondence with S. Brecher regarding same (0.1).
Resnick, Brian M.	04/22/20	0.5	Call with Davis Polk Executive Compensation team regarding PBGC issues.
Sokol, Nate	04/22/20	0.5	Call with Davis Polk Executive Compensation team regarding pension plan termination issues.
Szanzer, Steven Z.	04/22/20	0.5	Call with Davis Polk Executive Compensation team regarding PBGC issues.
Turay, Edna	04/22/20	4.2	Research regarding WARN Act exceptions and notice (0.8); research regarding pension plan termination premiums (1.7); call with J. Crandall, S. Brecher, and K. Ginder regarding WARN Act and PBGC issues (1.2); call with Davis Polk Restructuring team regarding same (0.5).
Brecher, Stephen I.	04/23/20	1.1	Correspondence with Dean Foods regarding employee compensation (0.2); correspondence with J. Crandall and K. Ginder regarding Creditors Committee questions regarding same (0.3); call with Creditors Committee regarding same (0.4); correspondence with K. Ginder regarding employee compensation plan (0.2).
Crandall, Jeffrey P.	04/23/20	0.6	Review deferred employee compensation plan motion (0.2); calls with S. Brecher, K. Ginder, and Akin Gump regarding employee compensation (0.4).

Time Detail By Project			
Name	Date	Hours	Narrative
Ginder, Kathleen	04/23/20	1.5	Correspondence with Correspondence with J. Crandall and S. Brecher regarding deferred employee compensation plan motion (0.2); review compensation plan documents in preparation for call with Creditors Committee (0.4); call with Creditors Committee regarding same (0.5); review compensation issues following sale (0.4).
Szanzer, Steven Z.	04/23/20	0.8	Review and revise Deferred Compensation Motion.
Brecher, Stephen I.	04/24/20	0.3	Correspondence with M. Gribbons regarding compensation plan issues.
Crandall, Jeffrey P.	04/24/20	0.4	Review correspondence with Davis Polk team regarding compensation plan issues.
Ginder, Kathleen	04/24/20	0.2	Correspondence with Prairie Farms' counsel regarding employee benefit plans.
Resnick, Brian M.	04/24/20	0.7	Emails with Davis Polk team regarding WARN Act and pension plan termination.
Szanzer, Steven Z.	04/24/20	0.6	Correspondence with Norton Rose and P. Garg regarding Deferred Compensation Motion (0.2); review emails with Davis Polk team regarding employee compensation plan payments (0.4).
Bernstein, Alexander	04/25/20	0.1	Review correspondence from Davis Polk team regarding labor questions.
Brecher, Stephen I.	04/25/20	1.9	Review correspondence with Davis Polk and Dean Foods regarding payroll timing (0.3); correspondence with Davis Polk Mergers & Acquisitions team regarding transaction timing in connection with same (0.5); call with J. Crandall and K. Ginder regarding compensation plan payments (0.4); correspondence with same regarding same (0.7).
Crandall, Jeffrey P.	04/25/20	0.7	Review compensation plan motion issues (0.3); call with S. Brecher and K. Ginder regarding same (0.4).
Ginder, Kathleen	04/25/20	0.7	Correspondence with Dean Foods and Prairie Farms regarding employee benefit plans (0.2); call with S. Brecher and J. Crandall regarding compensation plan issues (0.5).
Brecher, Stephen I.	04/26/20	2.7	Call with S. Szanzer regarding compensation plan issues (0.5); review documents regarding same (0.3); call with Dean Foods and Alvarez & Marsal team regarding same (0.7); call with M. Gribbons and K. Waterman regarding same (0.8); prepare for Creditors Committee call regarding same (0.4).
Crandall, Jeffrey P.	04/26/20	0.6	Review compensation plan motion issues.
Ginder, Kathleen	04/26/20	2.0	Call with Davis Polk Restructuring and Mergers & Acquisitions teams regarding payment timing of compensation plan issues (0.3); call with Alvarez & Marsal regarding same (0.2); correspondence with Dean Foods regarding of compensation plan issues (0.8); call with S. Brecher, M. Gribbons, and K. Waterman regarding same (0.7).
Szanzer, Steven Z.	04/26/20	2.4	Call with S. Brecher regarding compensation plan issues (0.5); call with Dean Foods and Alvarez & Marsal team regarding same (0.7); correspondence with S. Brecher regarding same (0.2); call with J. Stegenga regarding WARN Act payments (0.3); correspondence with White & Case regarding same (0.7).

Time Detail By Project			
Name	Date	Hours	Narrative
Brecher, Stephen I.	04/27/20	6.7	Call with B. Fox regarding compensation plan issues (0.2); review compensation plan documents and motion regarding same (0.3); call with J. Crandall and K. Ginder regarding same (0.7); call with Creditors Committee and Akin Gump regarding same (1.0); correspondence with Dean Foods regarding WARN Act payments (0.1); call with Alvarez & Marsal regarding compensation plan issues (0.4); call with M. Gribbons regarding same (0.4); call with M. Gribbons regarding WARN Act payments (0.6); call with S. Szanzer regarding same (0.1); call with White & Case regarding same (0.3); correspondence with K. Ginder regarding employee notices (0.3); correspondence with B. Resnick regarding compensation plan issues payments and WARN Act (0.2); correspondence with Alvarez & Marsal regarding compensation plan issues (0.5); correspondence with K. Ginder regarding same (0.2); correspondence with T. Malinowsky regarding same (0.2); correspondence with K. Ginder and E. Turay regarding WARN Act issue research (0.3); review WARN research (0.7); correspondence with E. Turray regarding same (0.2).
Crandall, Jeffrey P.	04/27/20	1.3	Review WARN issues (0.4); review compensation plan motion issues (0.4); correspondence with K. Ginder and S. Brecher regarding same (0.5).
Ginder, Kathleen	04/27/20	2.6	Correspondence with J. Crandall and S. Brecher regarding payout of compensation plan motion payment (0.4); call with Alvarez & Marsal team regarding compensation plan motion payments (0.3); call with Dean Foods and Alvarez & Marsal team regarding compensation plan issues (0.2); review employee lists and documents in connection with same (1.0); call with White & Case regarding WARN Act payments (0.2); research regarding same (0.5).
Resnick, Brian M.	04/27/20	0.4	Emails with Davis Polk team and Dean Foods regarding WARN Act and severance issues.
Szanzer, Steven Z.	04/27/20	0.7	Correspondence and calls with S. Brecher regarding WARN Act payments (0.5); call with White & Case regarding same (0.2).
Turay, Edna	04/27/20	5.0	Correspondence with S. Brecher and K. Ginder regarding research assignment regarding WARN Act payments (0.2); research same (4.8).
Brecher, Stephen I.	04/28/20	2.2	Correspondence with Akin Gump regarding compensation plan issues (0.4); correspondence with Shearman & Sterling regarding same (0.2); correspondence with Davis Polk team regarding same (1.2); review compensation plan payments (0.3); correspondence with K. Waterman regarding employee communications (0.1).
Crandall, Jeffrey P.	04/28/20	0.8	Review short term disability issues (0.2); review pension termination and PBGC issues (0.6).
Resnick, Brian M.	04/28/20	0.1	Emails with Dean Foods regarding compensation plan issues.
Turay, Edna	04/28/20	0.8	Research regarding WARN Act payments.

Time Detail By Project			
Name	Date	Hours	Narrative
Brecher, Stephen I.	04/29/20	4.5	Conference call with Creditors Committee regarding WARN Act (0.5); calls with Dean Foods regarding same (1.4); review employee lists and documents regarding same (0.2); call with Shearman & Sterling regarding same (0.5); call with D. Rutz regarding same (0.3); review and update employee lists (0.2); correspondence with Shearman & Sterling regarding same (0.6); correspondence with Dean Foods regarding same (0.6); further correspondence with Shearman & Sterling regarding same (0.2).
Crandall, Jeffrey P.	04/29/20	2.2	Calls with Davis Polk team regarding same (0.9); call with Dean Foods and S. Brecher regarding same (0.4); call with Shearman & Sterling and S. Brecher regarding same (0.4); review COBRA issues (0.5).
Ginder, Kathleen	04/29/20	0.9	Call with BRG and Dean Foods regarding WARN Act payments (0.5); review employee lists and documents in connection with same (0.4).
Resnick, Brian M.	04/29/20	0.5	Emails with Davis Polk team regarding WARN Act and other labor issues (0.3); emails with Davis Polk team regarding PBGC issues (0.2).
Brecher, Stephen I.	04/30/20	4.4	Calls with J. Crandall regarding same (0.3); calls and correspondence with Shearman & Sterling regarding same (0.8); review pleadings regarding same (0.3); correspondence with Davis Polk team regarding PBGC issues (0.3); correspondence with J. Crandall regarding same (0.7); correspondence with D. Rutz regarding same (0.2); call with K. Ginder same(0.3); correspondence with M. Gribbons regarding same (0.5); update same (0.6); correspondence with Shearman & Sterling regarding same (0.2); correspondence with Dean Foods regarding same (0.2).
Crandall, Jeffrey P.	04/30/20	0.7	Review PBGC issues (0.5); review compensation plan motion issues (0.2).
Total R135 EMPLOYEE/LABOR ISSUES		229.7	
R140 FINANCING, CASH COLLATERAL AND ADEQUATE PROTECTION			
Dengel, Hilary	04/02/20	2.1	Review financing matters regarding sale transactions.
Finelli, Jon	04/02/20	0.6	Call with Davis Polk team and Dean Foods regarding deposit accounts and DIP Facility and securitization facility.
Takhteyev, Andrei	04/02/20	1.3	Call with Davis Polk team and Dean Foods regarding administration and wind-down of securitization facility (0.6); call with B. Tsepelman regarding same (0.4) review securitization facility documents in connection with same (0.3).
Tsepelman, Bernard	04/02/20	3.0	Telephone conference with Davis Polk team and Dean Foods regarding deposit accounts and wind-down of securitization facility (0.6); call with A. Takhteyev regarding same (0.4); email correspondence with H. Dengel, B. Resnick, A. Takhteyev, N. Sokol, S. Szanzer, S. Brecher regarding same (1.8); correspondence with N. Sokol regarding same (0.2).
Takhteyev, Andrei	04/03/20	0.3	Correspondence with Davis Polk team regarding DIP Facility and wind-down and administration of securitization facility.

Time Detail By Project			
Name	Date	Hours	Narrative
Tsepelman, Bernard	04/03/20	1.5	Correspondence with E. Deguia and J. Sutton regarding deposit accounts and wind-down of the securitization facility (0.4); correspondence with N. Sokol regarding same (0.1); correspondence with A. Siman regarding existing securitization facility documentation (0.1); correspondence with A. Bernstein and N. Sokol regarding letters of credit and wind-down of securitization facility (0.5); correspondence with B. Resnick, H. Dengel and S. Brecher regarding securitization facility and wind-down of Dean's operations (0.4).
Resnick, Brian M.	04/04/20	0.2	Update call with P. Abelson regarding financing issues.
Corbett, Richard	04/06/20	1.2	Review correspondence with Davis Polk team regarding financing issues.
Dengel, Hilary	04/06/20	1.0	Review procedure for wind-down of securitization facility.
Garg, Paavani	04/06/20	1.0	Call with Davis Polk Finance team and regarding securitization facility (0.5); call with White & Case team regarding process for wind-down of estates (0.5).
Resnick, Brian M.	04/06/20	1.6	Call with White & Case team regarding securitization and related financing issues (0.5); call with Alvarez & Marsal team regarding same (0.5); call with White & Case team regarding securitization facility issues (0.3); emails with Davis Polk team regarding same (0.3).
Sokol, Nate	04/06/20	1.0	Call with Davis Polk Finance team and Alvarez & Marsal team regarding securitization facility wind-down (0.5); call with White & Case team regarding securitization facility wind-down (0.5).
Takhteyev, Andrei	04/06/20	2.7	Call with Alvarez & Marsal team regarding securitization facility wind-down (0.5); call with White & Case team regarding same (0.5); further call with Alvarez & Marsal team regarding same (0.5); prepare for calls (0.9); review correspondence with Davis Polk team regarding amendment to securitization facility and wind-down (0.3).
Tsepelman, Bernard	04/06/20	3.2	Call with Davis Polk and Alvarez & Marsal teams regarding securitization facility (0.5); email correspondence with same regarding same (0.6); email correspondence with White & Case team regarding same (0.3); further call with Alvarez & Marsal team regarding same (0.5); call with White & Case team regarding same (0.5); correspondence with Davis Polk and White & Case teams regarding same (0.8).
Corbett, Richard	04/07/20	0.9	Call with White & Case team and Davis Polk Finance team regarding securitization facility wind-down (0.5); call with Alvarez & Marsal team and Davis Polk Finance team regarding same (partial attendance) (0.4).
Dengel, Hilary	04/08/20	1.3	Revise amendments to securitization facility to address wind-down.
Resnick, Brian M.	04/08/20	0.9	Emails with Davis Polk finance team regarding securitization facility issues.
Sokol, Nate	04/08/20	0.2	Email with B. Resnick and others regarding Westchester bond motion.
Tsepelman, Bernard	04/08/20	3.6	Review and revise amendments to the securitization facility (1.7); correspondence with Davis Polk finance team regarding same (1.0); correspondence with H. Dengel, B. Resnick, A. Takhteyev, N. Sokol, B. Fox, and J. Mostrom regarding same (0.9).
Dengel, Hilary	04/09/20	1.0	Correspondence with Davis Polk team regarding amendments to securitization facility.

Time Detail By Project			
Name	Date	Hours	Narrative
Resnick, Brian M.	04/09/20	1.2	Call with White & Case regarding securitization facility wind-down (0.8); emails with Davis Polk team regarding same (0.4).
Sokol, Nate	04/09/20	0.8	Call with White & Case regarding wind-down of securitization facility.
Takhteyev, Andrei	04/09/20	2.3	Review and revise securitization facility amendment (1.9); correspondence with Davis Polk team regarding same (0.4).
Tsepelman, Bernard	04/09/20	7.8	Review and revise securitization facility amendment (6.4); correspondence with Davis Polk team regarding same (1.4).
Garg, Paavani	04/10/20	1.4	Review precedent regarding DIP credit agreement amendment (1.3); call with N. Sokol regarding same (0.1).
Resnick, Brian M.	04/10/20	0.4	Emails with Davis Polk team regarding DIP credit agreement amendment.
Sokol, Nate	04/10/20	0.1	Call with P. Garg regarding motions to amend financing agreements.
Tsepelman, Bernard	04/10/20	12.2	Review and revise securitization facility amendment (12.6); email correspondence with N. Sokol and P. Garg regarding same (0.2).
Altus, Leslie J.	04/11/20	0.5	Teleconference with N. Sokol regarding securitization facility amendments.
Garg, Paavani	04/11/20	2.3	Draft DIP Credit Agreement amendment motion.
Sokol, Nate	04/11/20	1.3	Review and revise DIP Credit Agreement amendment motion (0.6); email P. Garg regarding same (0.2); call with L. Altus regarding securitization facility amendments (0.5).
Tsepelman, Bernard	04/11/20	7.4	Review and revise securitization facility amendment (6.7); review DIP Credit Agreement amendment motion (0.2); correspondence with N. Sokol and G. Paavani regarding same (0.3); correspondence with L. Altus regarding tax questions in connection with securitization facility amendment (0.2)
Altus, Leslie J.	04/12/20	1.7	Analysis regarding securitization facility amendment (0.3); teleconference with B. Tsepelman and N. Sokol regarding DIP Credit Agreement and securitization facility (1.4).
Falk, Aryeh Ethan	04/12/20	1.0	Review DIP Credit Agreement amendment motion.
Tsepelman, Bernard	04/12/20	11.6	Review and revise securitization facility amendment (10.7); telephone conference with L. Altus and N. Sokol regarding tax issues in connection with securitization facility amendment (1.4); email correspondence with A. Takhteyev and R. Picard regarding same (0.2).
Altus, Leslie J.	04/13/20	2.8	Research regarding securitization facility wind-down issues (1.7); correspondence with N. Kronfeld regarding same (0.2); correspondence with Davis Polk tax team and Alvarez & Marsal regarding same (0.9).
Falk, Aryeh Ethan	04/13/20	0.9	Call with B. Resnick regarding securitization facility issues (0.3); review DIP Credit Agreement amendment motion (0.6).
Garg, Paavani	04/13/20	2.2	Review and revise DIP Credit Agreement amendment.
Resnick, Brian M.	04/13/20	0.3	Call with A. Falk regarding securitization issues.
Siman, Ariel David	04/13/20	3.7	Research regarding certain tax consequences of securitization facility amendment (3.0); call with L. Altus regarding same (0.7).
Sokol, Nate	04/13/20	0.6	Email with Davis Polk Finance team regarding DIP and securitization facility amendments (0.6).
Tsepelman, Bernard	04/13/20	11.3	Review and revise securitization facility amendment (11.4); correspondence with N. Sokol regarding same (0.1); correspondence with L. Altus regarding same (0.2).
Sokol, Nate	04/14/20	0.2	Email with A. Falk and P. Garg regarding DIP credit agreement and securitization facility amendments

Time Detail By Project			
Name	Date	Hours	Narrative
Takhteyev, Andrei	04/14/20	1.5	Correspondence with Davis Polk team regarding securitization facility, DIP and related issues (1.1); review securitization facility documents and cash flow analysis (0.4).
Tsepelman, Bernard	04/14/20	14.1	Review and revise securitization facility amendment (12.4); correspondence with H. Dengel and A. Takhteyev regarding same (0.3); review updated cash flow forecast (0.6); correspondence with H. Dengel, B. Resnick, B. Fox and N. Haughey regarding same (0.8); correspondence with T. Malinowsky regarding finance checklist for the securitization facility amendments (0.4).
Dengel, Hilary	04/15/20	1.4	Review potential financing agreement amendments for wind-down.
Garg, Paavani	04/15/20	1.5	Call with co-advisors regarding securitization facility (0.8); revise DIP Amendment Motion (0.7).
Ginder, Kathleen	04/15/20	0.5	Call with Alvarez & Marsal regarding DIP and securitization facility amendment (partial attendance).
Netzer, Omer	04/15/20	0.6	Attend weekly call with the White & Case.
Rarrick, Mohini P.B.	04/15/20	0.6	Teleconference with Davis Polk and Alvarez & Marsal teams regarding amendments to financing documents (partial attendance).
Resnick, Brian M.	04/15/20	1.4	Attend weekly update call with White & Case (0.6); call with Davis Polk team and Alvarez & Marsal regarding DIP Facility amendment (0.8).
Sokol, Nate	04/15/20	2.4	Email with B. Resnick, Davis Polk Finance team, and others regarding DIP and securitization facility amendments (0.4); call with Davis Polk Finance team, Alvarez & Marsal regarding same (0.8); email with Davis Polk Finance team regarding same (0.8); attend weekly call with White & Case (partial attendance) (0.4).
Takhteyev, Andrei	04/15/20	3.0	Call with Alvarez & Marsal regarding DIP and securitization facility wind-down and amendments (0.8); prepare for same (0.7); review securitization facility documents (0.8) correspondence with Davis Polk team regarding same (0.7).
Tsepelman, Bernard	04/15/20	8.3	Prepare securitization facility amendment (6.9); telephone conference with Davis Polk team and Alvarez & Marsal team regarding DIP and securitization facility amendment (0.8); correspondence with J. Crandall and N. Sokol regarding same (0.3); correspondence with H. Dengel, N. Sokol, and L. Altus regarding same (0.3).
Corbett, Richard	04/16/20	0.7	Attend call with Davis Polk Finance and Restructuring teams regarding DIP amendment (0.3); attend call with White & Case regarding same (partial attendance) (0.4).
Crandall, Jeffrey P.	04/16/20	0.8	Call with Davis Polk and White & Case regarding DIP and securitization facility amendment (0.5); pre-call with Davis Polk Restructuring and Finance teams regarding same (0.3).
Garg, Paavani	04/16/20	0.8	Call with Davis Polk team and White & Case regarding DIP and securitization facility amendment (0.5); attend pre-call with Davis Polk team regarding same (0.3).
Ginder, Kathleen	04/16/20	0.8	Call with Davis Polk Restructuring and Finance teams regarding DIP and securitization facility amendment, (0.3); call with Davis Polk team and White & Case regarding same (0.5).
Netzer, Omer	04/16/20	0.8	Call with Davis Polk team and White & Case team regarding DIP and securitization facility amendment (0.5); pre-call with Davis Polk Finance and Restructuring teams (0.3).

Time Detail By Project			
Name	Date	Hours	Narrative
Resnick, Brian M.	04/16/20	1.3	Correspondence with Davis Polk team regarding DIP and securitization facility amendment (0.5); call with Davis Polk team regarding same (0.3); call with Davis Polk team and White & Case regarding same (0.5).
Sokol, Nate	04/16/20	1.7	Email with Davis Polk Finance team and others regarding DIP and securitization facility amendments (0.8); email Davis Polk Executive Compensation team regarding same (0.1); call with Davis Polk team regarding same (0.3); call with Davis Polk team and White & Case team regarding same (0.5).
Takhteyev, Andrei	04/16/20	4.1	Call with Davis Polk team regarding DIP and securitization facility amendments (0.3); call with Davis Polk team and White & Case regarding same (0.5); correspondence with co-advisors regarding same (0.2); review DIP and securitization facility documents (1.7); call with B. Tsepelman regarding same (1.4).
Tsepelman, Bernard	04/16/20	13.1	Revise draft securitization facility amendment (8.2); call with A. Takhteyev regarding same (1.4); prepare summary of securitization facility amendments and issues list related thereto (1.3); call with Davis Polk team regarding same (0.3); call with Davis Polk team and White & Case regarding same (0.5); correspondence with B. Resnick, H. Dengel, J. Crandall, A. Takhteyev, N. Sokol, P. Abelson, and C. Pesant regarding same (0.8); correspondence with N. Haughey and A. Takhteyev regarding deposit accounts (0.2); correspondence with J. Mostrom and A. Takhteyev regarding financial data (0.4).
Turay, Edna	04/16/20	0.8	Call with Davis Polk Restructuring and Finance teams regarding DIP and securitization facility amendments (0.3); call with Davis Polk team and White & Case regarding same (0.5).
Dengel, Hilary	04/17/20	1.4	Review securitization facility wind-down issues.
Falk, Aryeh Ethan	04/17/20	1.3	Review revised DIP Amendment motion (0.3); call with N. Sokol, A. Takhteyev, B. Tsepelman and P. Garg regarding securitization facility amendment (0.5); call with N. Sokol and P. Garg regarding same (0.5).
Garg, Paavani	04/17/20	3.4	Draft motion to amend securitization facility (2.4); attend call with A. Falk and N. Sokol regarding same (0.5); call with N. Sokol, A. Falk, B. Tsepelman, and A. Takhteyev regarding same (0.5).
Rarrick, Mohini P.B.	04/17/20	0.2	Review correspondence with Davis Polk team regarding DIP Facility amendment.
Sokol, Nate	04/17/20	2.3	Call with B. Baines regarding surety bond issues (0.3); call with A. Falk and P. Garg regarding DIP and securitization facility amendments (0.5); call with A. Falk, B. Tsepelman, and others regarding DIP and securitization facility amendments (0.5); call with J. Mostrom, G. Steagall, and others regarding hedges (1.0).
Tsepelman, Bernard	04/17/20	8.4	Revise securitization facility amendments (5.8); call with White & Case team regarding same (0.8); correspondence with H. Dengel and A. Takhteyev regarding same (0.8); call with A. Falk, A. Takhteyev, N. Sokol, and P. Garg regarding same (0.5); call with the Dean Foods, co-advisors, Rabobank, and Dairy Farmers of America regarding financing issues (0.5).
Altus, Leslie J.	04/18/20	0.6	Correspondence with A. Siman regarding securitization facility.

Time Detail By Project			
Name	Date	Hours	Narrative
Falk, Aryeh Ethan	04/18/20	0.2	Correspondence with N. Sokol regarding securitization facility amendment.
Siman, Ariel David	04/18/20	1.5	Review securitization facility documents (0.9); correspondence with L. Altus regarding same (0.6).
Sokol, Nate	04/18/20	1.8	Email with Davis Polk Executive Compensation team, Davis Polk Finance team, and others regarding DIP and securitization facility amendments.
Takhteyev, Andrei	04/18/20	2.2	Review and revise securitization facility amendments (1.9); correspondence with Davis Polk team regarding same (0.3).
Tsepelman, Bernard	04/18/20	8.4	Revise securitization facility amendment (7.3); correspondence with A. Siman regarding tax issues in connection with same (0.6); correspondence with A. Siman and N. Sokol regarding same (0.3); correspondence with N. Sokol, C. Pesant, and P. Abelson regarding securitization facility amendments (0.2).
Altus, Leslie J.	04/19/20	0.8	Call with A. Siman regarding securitization facility.
Resnick, Brian M.	04/19/20	0.3	Correspondence with Davis Polk team regarding DIP and securitization facility amendment.
Siman, Ariel David	04/19/20	0.8	Call with L. Altus regarding securitization facility.
Sokol, Nate	04/19/20	0.2	Email with Dean Foods team regarding DIP and securitization facility amendments.
Takhteyev, Andrei	04/19/20	3.0	Call with B. Tsepelman regarding securitization facility amendments (1.5); review same (1.5).
Tsepelman, Bernard	04/19/20	11.1	Revised securitization facility amendments (9.3); call with A. Takhteyev regarding same (1.5); correspondence with H. Dengel, A. Takhteyev, N. Sokol, and C. Pesant regarding same (0.3).
Millerman, James M.	04/20/20	0.5	Correspondence with Davis Polk team regarding hedging issues.
Rarrick, Mohini P.B.	04/20/20	0.4	Review correspondence with Davis Polk team regarding hedges (0.2); review correspondence with Davis Polk team regarding DIP Credit Agreement (0.2).
Resnick, Brian M.	04/20/20	1.2	Correspondence with Davis Polk team and others regarding DIP and securitization facility amendments (1.0); call with K. Waterman regarding hedges (0.2).
Sokol, Nate	04/20/20	0.5	Review hedge contract documents (0.4); email J. Sutton regarding same (0.1).
Szanzer, Steven Z.	04/20/20	0.8	Correspondence with N. Sokol regarding hedges (0.4); review emails with Davis Polk team and Dean Foods regarding same (0.4).
Takhteyev, Andrei	04/20/20	2.1	Review revised securitization facility amendments (1.0); call with C. Pesant and B. Tsepelman regarding same (1.1).
Tsepelman, Bernard	04/20/20	7.7	Revise securitization facility amendments (3.1); call with C. Pesant and A. Takhteyev regarding same (1.1); correspondence with H. Dengel, A. Takhteyev, C. Pesant, and P. Abelson regarding same (0.3); review provisions in securitization facility documents and prepare summary of same (3.2);.
White, Erika D.	04/20/20	0.6	Correspondence with N. Sokol regarding hedges.
Corbett, Richard	04/21/20	0.4	Call with Davis Polk team regarding DIP amendment.
Falk, Aryeh Ethan	04/21/20	0.7	Review DIP Amendment Motion (0.2); correspondence with Davis Polk Finance team regarding same (0.1); call with N. Sokol, P. Garg and Davis Polk Finance team regarding same (0.4).

Time Detail By Project			
Name	Date	Hours	Narrative
Garg, Paavani	04/21/20	0.4	Call with N. Sokol, A. Falk, and Davis Polk Finance team regarding DIP amendment.
Millerman, James M.	04/21/20	0.4	Review hedges motion (0.2); correspondence with Davis Polk team regarding same (0.2).
Rarrick, Mohini P.B.	04/21/20	0.1	Review correspondence with Davis Polk team regarding DIP amendment.
Resnick, Brian M.	04/21/20	0.8	Correspondence with Davis Polk team regarding DIP and securitization facility amendment (0.4); correspondence with Dean Foods team regarding hedges (0.2); call with P. Abelson regarding DIP amendment (0.2).
Sokol, Nate	04/21/20	0.8	Correspondence with A. Falk, P. Garg, and Davis Polk Finance team regarding DIP and securitization facility amendments (0.4); call with same regarding same (0.4).
Takhteyev, Andrei	04/21/20	1.1	Correspondence with Davis Polk Finance team regarding DIP and securitization facility amendments and asset sales (0.7); call with Davis Polk Restructuring team regarding same (0.4).
Tsepelman, Bernard	04/21/20	3.6	Prepare issues list regarding securitization facility amendments (2.1); correspondence with H. Dengel, A. Takhteyev, and C. Pesant regarding same (0.9); call with A. Falk, N. Sokol, and P. Garg regarding amendments to DIP and securitization facility (0.4); correspondence with P. Abelson regarding same (0.2).
Dengel, Hilary	04/22/20	2.6	Review issues regarding DIP and securitization facility amendments (2.0); call with White & Case regarding same (0.6).
Garg, Paavani	04/22/20	1.2	Revise DIP Amendment Motion.
Netzer, Omer	04/22/20	0.5	Attend weekly call with the White & Case.
Rarrick, Mohini P.B.	04/22/20	0.4	Review correspondence with Davis Polk team regarding DIP amendment.
Resnick, Brian M.	04/22/20	1.4	Call with White & Case regarding DIP and securitization facility amendments (0.6); correspondence with Alvarez & Marsal and Davis Polk Finance team regarding same (0.8).
Sokol, Nate	04/22/20	1.9	Call with Davis Polk Finance team and White & Case team regarding DIP and securitization facility amendments (0.6); email with Davis Polk Finance team, White & Case team, and Alvarez & Marsal regarding DIP and securitization facility amendments (0.8); attend weekly call with White & Case (0.5).
Szanzer, Steven Z.	04/22/20	0.3	Review emails with Davis Polk team regarding DIP amendment and hedges.
Takhteyev, Andrei	04/22/20	2.4	Calls with White & Case team regarding DIP and securitization facility amendments (0.6); review amendments (1.0); correspondence with Alvarez & Marsal team regarding same (0.8).
Tsepelman, Bernard	04/22/20	3.1	Call with White & Case team regarding DIP and securitization facility amendments (0.6); correspondence with same regarding same (1.0); correspondence with A. Takhteyev, N. Sokol, B. Fox, and J. Stegenga regarding DIP facility (1.5).
Corbett, Richard	04/23/20	0.2	Review correspondence with Davis Polk Finance team regarding credit agreement.

Time Detail By Project			
Name	Date	Hours	Narrative
Sokol, Nate	04/23/20	1.1	Email Davis Polk Finance team, White & Case team, and Alvarez & Marsal regarding DIP and securitization facility amendments (0.2); email L. Altus, B. Resnick, and W. Curran regarding DIP provisions (0.2); email Davis Polk Finance team, A. Falk, and P. Garg regarding DIP and securitization facility amendments (0.2); call with P. Abelson regarding hedges portfolio (0.4); email B. Resnick and Dean Foods regarding same (0.1).
Szanzer, Steven Z.	04/23/20	0.3	Review emails with Davis Polk team regarding hedges and DIP amendment.
Takhteyev, Andrei	04/23/20	0.9	Review draft of DIP amendment (0.7); call with B. Tsepelman regarding same (0.2).
Tsepelman, Bernard	04/23/20	1.9	Review draft of DIP amendment (0.4); call with A. Takhteyev regarding same (0.2); correspondence with H. Dengel regarding same (0.1); correspondence with N. Sokol regarding same (0.2); correspondence with H. Dengel, A. Takhteyev, A. Falk, N. Sokol, B. Fox, C. Pesant, and R. Gottlieb regarding DIP and securitization facility amendments (0.6); correspondence with A. Raja regarding exhibits to DIP Credit Agreement (0.1); correspondence with A. Takhteyev and R. Corbett regarding DIP amendment (0.3).
Dengel, Hilary	04/24/20	0.6	Review DIP facility amendments.
Falk, Aryeh Ethan	04/24/20	1.3	Review conformed credit agreement (0.7); call with Davis Polk Restructuring team regarding next steps for DIP and securitization facility amendments (0.6).
Francis, Brendon E.	04/24/20	1.8	Call with A Takhteyev and B Tsepelman regarding DIP facility amendments (0.8); review draft of same (1.0).
Resnick, Brian M.	04/24/20	1.1	Emails with Dean Foods, Alvarez & Marsal, and Davis Polk team regarding DIP and securitization facility amendments (0.8); calls with Alvarez & Marsal regarding same (0.3).
Sokol, Nate	04/24/20	0.2	Call with P. Abelson regarding DIP and securitization facility amendments (0.1); email Davis Polk finance team and Alvarez & Marsal regarding same (0.1)
Takhteyev, Andrei	04/24/20	2.8	Review revised drafts of DIP and securitization facility amendments (1.3); correspondence with Davis Polk team regarding same and related matters (1.5).
Tsepelman, Bernard	04/24/20	8.8	Review and revise DIP facility amendment (2.3); review and revise securitization facility amendment (2.1); prepare conformed version of amended DIP Credit Agreement (0.6); correspondence with H. Dengel, A. Takhteyev, and B. Francis regarding same (1.8); telephone conference with B. Fox regarding cash flow forecast and financial terms of amendments (0.4); correspondence with B. Fox and J. Mostrom regarding same (1.1); correspondence with B. Resnick and N. Sokol regarding cash flow forecast (0.3); email correspondence with N. Sokol regarding amendment process and timing (0.2).
Dengel, Hilary	04/25/20	1.8	Review DIP facility amendments.
Falk, Aryeh Ethan	04/25/20	1.9	Revise DIP Amendment Motion.
Garg, Paavani	04/25/20	2.9	Revise DIP Amendment Motion.
Resnick, Brian M.	04/25/20	1.5	Email Davis Polk Finance team regarding DIP facility amendment (1.1); call with B. Fox regarding same (0.2); call with P. Abelson regarding same (0.2).

Time Detail By Project			
Name	Date	Hours	Narrative
Takhteyev, Andrei	04/25/20	3.0	Review DIP and securitization facility amendments (1.4); call with B. Tsepelman and others regarding same (0.9); correspondence with Davis Polk team regarding same (0.7).
Tsepelman, Bernard	04/25/20	12.9	Prepare issues list in connection with draft DIP Facility amendment (1.2); correspondence with R. Gottlieb regarding same (0.4); revise same (6.3); telephone conference with A. Takhteyev and others regarding same (0.9); telephone conferences with J. Mostrom regarding business terms and mechanics of same (0.7); correspondence with N. Sokol and B. Fox regarding same (0.6); correspondence with N. Sokol regarding terms of DIP Facility payoff (0.3); correspondence with T. Malinowsky and N. Sokol regarding DIP Facility events of default (0.8); correspondence with H. Dengel, B. Resnick, A. Takhteyev, N. Sokol, and J. Mostrom regarding cash flow forecast and related terms of DIP Facility amendment (1.7)
Dengel, Hilary	04/26/20	3.9	Review DIP Facility amendment workstreams and documents (1.2); correspondence with Davis Polk team regarding same (2.7).
Falk, Aryeh Ethan	04/26/20	0.6	Review correspondence with Davis Polk team regarding DIP Facility amendment (0.3); correspondence with Davis Polk Finance and Restructuring teams regarding same (0.2); call with P. Garg regarding same (0.1).
Garg, Paavani	04/26/20	2.0	Revise DIP Amendment Motion (1.9); call with A. Falk regarding same (0.1).
Rarrick, Mohini P.B.	04/26/20	0.2	Review correspondence with Davis Polk team regarding DIP Facility amendment.
Resnick, Brian M.	04/26/20	0.3	Review DIP Amendment Motion.
Szanzer, Steven Z.	04/26/20	2.4	Review emails with Davis Polk team regarding DIP Facility Amendment (0.8); correspondence with A. Falk and P. Garg regarding same (0.5); correspondence and call with P. Abelson regarding same (0.2); correspondence with Davis Polk Finance team regarding same (0.5); correspondence with White & Case and Akin Gump regarding same (0.4).
Takhteyev, Andrei	04/26/20	4.9	Review and revise DIP and securitization facility amendments (2.3); correspondence with Davis Polk team and co-advisors regarding same (2.6).
Tsepelman, Bernard	04/26/20	11.7	Review and revise securitization facility amendment (3.6); correspondence with A. Takhteyev regarding same (0.9); review DIP Amendment Motion (1.2); correspondence with H. Dengel and A. Takhteyev regarding DIP Facility Amendment (2.1); prepare revised conformed DIP Credit Agreement (0.6); correspondence with A. Falk, P. Garg, and B. Francis regarding DIP Amendment Motion (0.6); review revised cash flow forecast (0.4); correspondence with B. Fox, J. Mostrom, N. Haughey, B. Resnick, and A. Takhteyev regarding same (1.1); telephone conferences with J. Mostrom and N. Haughey regarding same (1.2).
Falk, Aryeh Ethan	04/27/20	0.4	Email with Alvarez & Marsal and Davis Polk teams regarding DIP carve-out.
Francis, Brendon E.	04/27/20	4.5	Prepare and revise conformed versions of DIP Credit Agreement (3.6); correspondence with A. Takhteyev regarding same (0.3); correspondence with Davis Polk team regarding same (0.6)
Rarrick, Mohini P.B.	04/27/20	0.3	Review correspondence with Davis Polk team regarding DIP Credit Agreement.

Time Detail By Project			
Name	Date	Hours	Narrative
Resnick, Brian M.	04/27/20	1.3	Emails with White & Case, Davis Polk team, Alvarez & Marsal team, and Dean Foods regarding DIP Facility amendment (1.0); call with P. Abelson regarding same (0.3).
Szanzer, Steven Z.	04/27/20	0.5	Review emails with Davis Polk team regarding DIP Facility amendment.
Takhteyev, Andrei	04/27/20	8.8	Review and revise drafts of DIP and securitization facility amendments (5.5); correspondence with Davis Polk team and co-advisors regarding same (3.3)
Tsepelman, Bernard	04/27/20	10.1	Review draft securitization facility amendments and prepare issues list in connection therewith (1.7); revise draft securitization facility amendments (2.4); telephone conference with A. Takhteyev regarding same (0.5); email correspondence with C. Pesant regarding same (0.2); telephone conference with J. Mostrom regarding cash flow forecast (0.1); revise DIP Facility amendment (2.1); correspondence with R. Gottlieb and P. Abelson regarding same (0.2); correspondence with E. Deguia, B. Fox, J. Mostrom, P. Kast, H. Dengel, and A. Takhteyev regarding DIP Facility amendment (2.3); correspondence with B. Francis regarding timing of DIP Facility amendment and sale closings (0.6)
Dengel, Hilary	04/28/20	3.8	Review DIP Facility amendment workstreams and documents (1.5); correspondence with Davis Polk team regarding same (2.3).
Falk, Aryeh Ethan	04/28/20	1.0	Call with P. Garg regarding DIP Amendment Motion (0.5); call with P. Garg and others regarding same (0.5).
Francis, Brendon E.	04/28/20	2.2	Draft officer's certificate in connection with DIP Facility amendment (0.7); prepare execution documents for Dean Foods (0.7); correspondence with Davis Polk team and Dean Foods regarding same (0.8)
Garg, Paavani	04/28/20	2.9	Revise DIP Amendment Motion (0.6); call with A. Falk regarding same (0.5); call with A. Falk and others regarding same (0.5) review amendment to DIP Credit Agreement (1.3).
Rarrick, Mohini P.B.	04/28/20	0.8	Review correspondence with Davis Polk team regarding DIP Facility amendment.
Resnick, Brian M.	04/28/20	2.1	Emails with Alvarez & Marsal and Davis Polk team regarding DIP Facility amendment (1.3); calls with P. Abelson regarding same (0.3); call with Akin Gump and White & Case regarding same (0.5).
Szanzer, Steven Z.	04/28/20	1.0	Review emails regarding DIP facility amendment (0.5); correspondence with P. Garg and A. Falk regarding DIP Amendment Motion (0.5).
Takhteyev, Andrei	04/28/20	7.4	Review DIP Amendment Motion (0.9); review and revise DIP and securitization facility amendments (3.1); correspondence with Davis Polk team and co-advisors regarding same (0.9); calls with B. Tsepelman regarding same (2.5)

Time Detail By Project			
Name	Date	Hours	Narrative
Tsepelman, Bernard	04/28/20	8.2	Review draft securitization facility amendments and revise issues list in connection therewith (1.7); correspondence with H. Dengel, A. Takhteyev, and C. Pesant regarding same (0.6); telephone conferences with A. Takhteyev regarding same (2.5); email correspondence with B. Bennett regarding terms of Asset Purchase Agreements in connection with DIP and securitization facility amendments (0.2); review closing documents for same (0.5); email correspondence with A. Takhteyev and B. Francis regarding same (0.4); review and revise DIP Facility amendment (0.4); email correspondence with H. Dengel, A. Takhteyev, and R. Gottlieb regarding same (0.3); further revise securitization facility amendments and issues list (1.6).
Dengel, Hilary	04/29/20	3.2	Review DIP Facility amendment workstreams and documents (1.0); correspondence with Davis Polk team regarding same (2.2).
Falk, Aryeh Ethan	04/29/20	1.8	Review and revise DIP Amendment Motion (1.1); email Alvarez & Marsal and Davis Polk teams regarding Professional Fee Escrow Agreement (0.4); correspondence with P. Garg and S. Szanzer regarding DIP Amendment Motion (0.3).
Francis, Brendon E.	04/29/20	4.8	Revise securitization facility amendments (2.9); revise execution documents for same (0.4); correspondence with Dean Foods and Davis Polk team regarding same (0.5); revise conformed DIP Credit Agreement (1.0).
Garg, Paavani	04/29/20	4.0	Revise DIP Amendment Motion (3.0); review DIP Facility amendments (1.0).
Resnick, Brian M.	04/29/20	1.5	Emails with Davis Polk team regarding DIP Facility amendment (1.0); review DIP Amendment Motion (0.5).
Szanzer, Steven Z.	04/29/20	2.3	Review emails with Davis Polk team regarding DIP facility amendments (0.6); call with White & Case regarding same (0.4); correspondence with P. Garg and A. Falk regarding same (0.8); call with Davis Polk team regarding same (0.5).
Takhteyev, Andrei	04/29/20	9.1	Review and revise DIP credit agreement and securitization amendments (3.6); emails and calls with B. Tsepelman regarding terms of DIP and securitization facility amendments (2.2); correspondence with Davis Polk team regarding same (1.0); review and analyze existing DIP and securitization facility documents (2.3).

Time Detail By Project			
Name	Date	Hours	Narrative
Tsepelman, Bernard	04/29/20	13.8	Review and revise securitization facility amendments (3.6); prepare conformed draft of securitization facility documents (1.9); correspondence with A. Takhteyev and B. Francis regarding same (0.4); review and revise DIP Amendment Motion (1.2); further revise draft of conformed securitization facility documents (2.4); correspondence with A. Takhteyev, C. Pesant, and V. Spears regarding same (0.2); correspondence with H. Dengel and A. Takhteyev regarding same (1.3); telephone conference with A. Takhteyev and J. Mostrom regarding economic terms of amendments (0.7); revise execution documents for same (0.3); email correspondence with B. Francis regarding same (0.1); email correspondence with H. Dengel, A. Takhteyev, and A. Falk regarding cash flow forecast and related items (0.8); email correspondence with H. Dengel, J. Finelli, and A. Takhteyev regarding deposit account control agreements (0.4); review and revise officer's certificate in connection with securitization facility amendment (0.3); correspondence with T. Malinowsky regarding status of sale transactions in connection with amendments(0.2).
Bernstein, Alexander	04/30/20	0.2	Correspondence from Davis Polk team regarding DIP Amendment Motion (0.1); review pleadings regarding same (0.1).
Crandall, Jeffrey P.	04/30/20	0.8	Review DIP amendment with respect to securitization issues (0.2); review DIP amendment issues (0.4); call with B. Tsepelman regarding same (0.2).
Falk, Aryeh Ethan	04/30/20	0.6	Review amended DIP budget notice (0.2); calls with P. Garg regarding same (0.2); N. Sokol regarding securitization facility amendment issues (0.1); email B. Tsepelman regarding same (0.1).
Francis, Brendon E.	04/30/20	2.6	Draft securitization facility amendment officer's certificate (0.4); attend call with White & Case regarding securitization facility amendment (0.5); correspondence with Davis Polk team regarding same (1.1); revise conformed DIP Credit Agreement (0.6)
Garg, Paavani	04/30/20	2.5	Revise DIP Amendment Motion (2.5).
Rarrick, Mohini P.B.	04/30/20	0.3	Review correspondence with Davis Polk team regarding DIP Facility amendment.
Resnick, Brian M.	04/30/20	3.9	Emails with Davis Polk and White & Case teams regarding DIP Facility amendment (1.8); calls with Dean Foods regarding same (0.6); negotiate DIP Facility Amendment settlement with White & Case and Akin Gump (1.5).
Szanzer, Steven Z.	04/30/20	0.8	Review Creditors Committee's objection to DIP Amendment Motion (0.3); correspondence with Davis Polk team regarding same (0.3); review DIP Agent's response to same (0.2).
Takhteyev, Andrei	04/30/20	8.0	Review and revise DIP and securitization facility amendments (2.9); correspondence with Davis Polk team, White & Case, and co-advisors regarding same (3.2); correspondence regarding same and interaction of amendments and asset sales (1.9)

Time Detail By Project			
Name	Date	Hours	Narrative
Tsepelman, Bernard	04/30/20	12.1	Revise securitization facility amendments (0.8); prepare revised conformed securitization facility documents (2.5); correspondence with A. Takhteyev and C. Pesant regarding same (4.1); correspondence with H. Dengel, A. Takhteyev, C. Pesant, and V. Spears regarding same (0.8); review and revise DIP Facility amendments (0.6); telephone conferences with R. Gottlieb, R. Bennett, and P. Abelson regarding same (1.0); email correspondence with E. Deguia, B. Fox, J. Mostrom, and A. Takhteyev regarding economic terms of same (0.9); correspondence with B. Resnick, A. Falk, H. Dengel and A. Takhteyev regarding terms of the DIP Facility amendment and status thereof (0.8); telephone conference with J. Crandall regarding same (0.2); email correspondence with J. Crandall and S. Brecher regarding same (0.1); email correspondence with K. Waterman, A. Takhteyev, and B. Francis regarding execution of same (0.3)
Total R140 FINANCING, CASH COLLATERAL AND ADEQUATE PROTECTION		445.2	
R145 GENERAL CASE ADMINISTRATION			
Bernstein, Alexander	04/01/20	0.3	Review new docket entries and filings.
Sokol, Nate	04/01/20	0.3	Correspondence with S. Szanzer regarding case workstreams.
Bernstein, Alexander	04/02/20	0.5	Review docket filings.
Liu, Yichen	04/03/20	0.2	Correspondence with G. Lee regarding notice and service.
Erickson, Jarret	04/06/20	1.1	Call with B. Resnick, N. Sokol, and others regarding upcoming workstreams.
Garg, Paavani	04/06/20	1.1	Call with B. Resnick, N. Sokol, S. Szanzer, J. Millerman, Y. Liu, O. Netzer, and J. Erikson regarding workstreams.
Liu, Yichen	04/06/20	3.5	Attend workstreams call with B. Resnick, S. Szanzer, N. Sokol and others (1.1); review correspondence regarding same (0.2); review and revise case calendar (1.8); prepare weekly calendar alert email (0.4).
Millerman, James M.	04/06/20	1.7	Correspondence with Davis Polk restructuring team regarding workstreams (0.6); attend call with Davis Polk restructuring team regarding same (1.1).
Netzer, Omer	04/06/20	0.4	Attend workstreams call with B. Resnick and others (partial attendance).
Sokol, Nate	04/06/20	2.0	Call with Davis Polk restructuring team regarding case workstreams (1.1); produce updated case calendar (0.4); produce updated case calendar (0.5).
Szanzer, Steven Z.	04/06/20	1.8	Review workstreams outline (0.2); attend team call regarding workstreams (1.1); follow-up correspondence with N. Sokol regarding same (0.3); review weekly calendar alerts (0.2).
Bernstein, Alexander	04/07/20	0.6	Attend workstreams call (0.5); review recent filings (0.1).
Butler, James C	04/07/20	0.5	Attend workstream call.
Erickson, Jarret	04/07/20	0.4	Attend workstreams call (partial attendance).
Garg, Paavani	04/07/20	0.5	Attend workstreams call.
Giddens, Magali	04/07/20	0.8	Review recent filings and upcoming calendar dates.
Lee, Grace	04/07/20	0.4	Attend workstreams call (partial attendance).
Leibowitz, Danielle	04/07/20	0.4	Attend workstreams call (partial attendance).
Liu, Yichen	04/07/20	0.6	Attend workstreams call (0.5); review docket filings and revise case calendar (0.1).

Time Detail By Project			
Name	Date	Hours	Narrative
Netzer, Omer	04/07/20	0.5	Attend workstreams call.
Resnick, Brian M.	04/07/20	1.2	Call with J. Stegenga and B. Fox regarding case status (0.8); correspondence with Davis Polk team regarding workstreams (0.4).
Sokol, Nate	04/07/20	0.3	Attend workstreams call (partial attendance).
Thomson, Daniel J.	04/07/20	0.5	Attend workstreams call.
Garg, Paavani	04/08/20	0.4	Attend workstreams call (0.4).
Giddens, Magali	04/08/20	0.6	Review recent filings regarding case status.
Liu, Yichen	04/08/20	0.5	Attend workstreams call (0.4); review docket filings and distribute same to Davis Polk team (0.1).
Netzer, Omer	04/08/20	0.4	Correspondence with S. Szanzer and other regarding current workstreams.
Resnick, Brian M.	04/08/20	0.7	Call with K. Waterman and N. Sokol regarding case workstreams.
Sokol, Nate	04/08/20	2.3	Correspondence with B. Resnick, S. Szanzer, O. Netzer, and Akin Gump team regarding case workstreams (1.4); attend workstreams call (0.4); call with B. Resnick and K. Waterman regarding case workstreams (0.5).
Szanzer, Steven Z.	04/08/20	1.9	Correspondence with B. Resnick and N. Sokol regarding workstreams (0.4); call with K. Waterman regarding same (0.5); Davis Polk team call regarding same (0.5); review docket filings (0.5).
Resnick, Brian M.	04/09/20	1.2	Call with N. Sokol regarding case workstreams (0.2); call with K. Waterman and Davis Polk team regarding same (0.5); correspondence regarding same with Davis Polk team (0.5).
Sokol, Nate	04/09/20	1.1	Call with B. Resnick regarding case workstreams (0.2); call with B. Resnick and K. Waterman regarding same (0.5); attend Dean Foods and co-advisors call regarding same (0.4).
Bernstein, Alexander	04/10/20	0.8	Attend workstreams call (0.3); review recent filings (0.5).
Garg, Paavani	04/10/20	0.3	Attend workstreams call.
Giddens, Magali	04/10/20	0.1	Correspond with O. Netzer regarding preparing pro hac vice application.
Lee, Grace	04/10/20	0.3	Attend workstreams call.
Leibowitz, Danielle	04/10/20	0.3	Attend workstreams call.
Liu, Yichen	04/10/20	0.8	Attend workstreams call (0.3); review docket filings and distribute same (0.3); review and revise case calendar (0.2).
Netzer, Omer	04/10/20	0.5	Attend workstreams call (0.3); correspondence with Davis Polk team regarding same (0.2).
Sokol, Nate	04/10/20	0.6	Attend workstreams call (0.3); email with Norton Rose regarding filing deadlines and requirements (0.3).
Thomson, Daniel J.	04/10/20	0.3	Attend workstreams call.
Bernstein, Alexander	04/12/20	0.2	Review recent filings.
Sokol, Nate	04/12/20	1.3	Call with K. Waterman and others regarding case workstreams.
Garg, Paavani	04/13/20	1.4	Correspondence with N. Sokol regarding workstreams (0.2); attend call with Davis Polk restructuring team regarding upcoming workstreams (1.2).
Liu, Yichen	04/13/20	1.9	Review docket filings (0.3); prepare weekly calendar email (0.7); attend workstreams call with Davis Polk restructuring team (0.9).
Millerman, James M.	04/13/20	1.2	Calls with Davis Polk restructuring team regarding bankruptcy work streams.
Rarrick, Mohini P.B.	04/13/20	0.8	Teleconference with Davis Polk restructuring team regarding case workstreams (0.5); review and distribute docket filings (0.3).

Time Detail By Project			
Name	Date	Hours	Narrative
Resnick, Brian M.	04/13/20	1.0	Calls with Davis Polk restructuring team regarding various issues.
Sokol, Nate	04/13/20	1.2	Call with Davis Polk restructuring team regarding workstreams and strategy (1.0); review workstreams chart (0.2).
Szanzer, Steven Z.	04/13/20	1.7	Review and consider workstreams chart (0.2); Davis Polk team calls regarding same (1.1); correspondence with N. Sokol regarding same (0.4).
Giddens, Magali	04/14/20	0.3	Prepare pro hac vice application for O. Netzer.
Rarrick, Mohini P.B.	04/14/20	0.5	Attend workstreams call.
Sokol, Nate	04/14/20	0.5	Correspondence with B. Resnick, K. Waterman, S. Szanzer, J. Stegenga, and B. Fox regarding case timeline and strategy.
Bernstein, Alexander	04/15/20	0.1	Review docket filings.
Giddens, Magali	04/15/20	0.5	Review docket filings.
Netzer, Omer	04/15/20	0.4	Review pro hac vice application.
Rarrick, Mohini P.B.	04/15/20	0.3	Review and distribute docket filings.
Rarrick, Mohini P.B.	04/16/20	0.3	Review and distribute docket filings.
Bernstein, Alexander	04/17/20	0.3	Attend workstreams call.
Butler, James C	04/17/20	0.3	Attend workstreams call.
Garg, Paavani	04/17/20	0.3	Attend workstreams call.
Giddens, Magali	04/17/20	1.0	Review docket filings.
Lee, Grace	04/17/20	0.3	Attend workstreams call.
Leibowitz, Danielle	04/17/20	0.3	Attend workstreams call.
Liu, Yichen	04/17/20	0.5	Attend workstreams call (0.3); review and revise case calendar (0.2).
Mazer, Deborah S.	04/17/20	0.3	Attend workstreams call.
Rarrick, Mohini P.B.	04/17/20	0.6	Attend workstreams call (0.3); review and distribute docket filings (0.3).
Schare, Lindsay	04/17/20	0.5	Attend workstreams call.
Sokol, Nate	04/17/20	1.0	Attend workstreams call (0.3); correspondence with S. Szanzer and P. Garg regarding workstreams (0.7).
Netzer, Omer	04/19/20	0.1	Correspondence with N. Sokol regarding workstreams.
Azzopardi, Frank J.	04/20/20	0.3	Correspondence regarding pro hac vice application.
Garg, Paavani	04/20/20	1.0	Call with S. Szanzer and N. Sokol regarding workstreams.
Giddens, Magali	04/20/20	0.9	Prepare pro hac vice application for F. Azzopardi (0.5); correspondence with same regarding same (0.3); correspondence with Norton Rose team regarding same (0.1).
Liu, Yichen	04/20/20	1.0	Review docket filings (0.2); review and revise case calendar (0.5); draft weekly calendar email (0.3).
Millerman, James M.	04/20/20	0.4	Correspondence with Davis Polk team regarding workstreams.
Netzer, Omer	04/20/20	0.4	Attend workstreams call.
Resnick, Brian M.	04/20/20	0.4	Correspondence with Davis Polk team regarding workstreams.
Sokol, Nate	04/20/20	1.6	Call with S. Szanzer and P. Garg regarding workstreams (partial attendance) (0.3); produce updated case calendar (0.4); email Alvarez & Marsal team regarding same (0.1); email with Norton Rose Team regarding case logistics (0.5); email with S. Szanzer, K. Waterman, and Epiq team regarding service (0.3).
Szanzer, Steven Z.	04/20/20	1.0	Call with P. Garg and N. Sokol regarding workstreams.
Bernstein, Alexander	04/21/20	0.6	Attend workstreams call (0.3); review new docket filings (0.2); correspondence with Norton Rose team, and Davis Polk team regarding pro hac application (0.1).
Butler, James C	04/21/20	0.3	Attend workstreams call.
Garg, Paavani	04/21/20	0.9	Attend call with S. Szanzer, O. Netzer, N. Sokol, and others regarding workstreams (0.6); attend workstreams call (0.3).

Time Detail By Project			
Name	Date	Hours	Narrative
Giddens, Magali	04/21/20	0.4	Prepare pro hac vice application for A. Burke (0.3); correspondence with A. Burke, A. Bernstein, and J. Harrison regarding same (0.1).
Lee, Grace	04/21/20	0.3	Attend workstreams call.
Leibowitz, Danielle	04/21/20	0.3	Attend workstreams call.
Liu, Yichen	04/21/20	1.0	Attend workstreams call (0.3); attend workstreams call with S.Szanzer, N. Sokol, and others from Davis Polk Restructuring team (0.6); review and revise case calendar (0.1).
Netzer, Omer	04/21/20	0.9	Attend workstreams call (0.3); attend workstreams call with S. Szanzer and others from Davis Polk Restructuring team (0.6).
Rarrick, Mohini P.B.	04/21/20	1.5	Attend workstreams call (0.3); review and distribute docket filings (1.0); review case workstreams (0.2).
Simpson, Kendra	04/21/20	0.3	Correspondence with Davis Polk team regarding workstreams.
Sokol, Nate	04/21/20	1.9	Attend workstreams call (0.3); call with Alvarez & Marsal team regarding workstreams and case strategy (1.0); call with Davis Polk Restructuring team regarding workstreams (0.6).
Szanzer, Steven Z.	04/21/20	1.4	Call with Davis Polk Restructuring team regarding workstreams (0.6); follow-up correspondence with N. Sokol regarding Dean Foods management (0.8).
Thomson, Daniel J.	04/21/20	0.3	Attend workstreams call.
Garg, Paavani	04/22/20	0.5	Attend call with Davis Polk Restructuring team regarding case workstreams.
Liu, Yichen	04/22/20	0.7	Attend workstreams call with S. Szanzer, N. Sokol, and others from Davis Polk Restructuring team (0.5); review and revise case calendar (0.2).
Netzer, Omer	04/22/20	0.5	Attend workstreams call with S. Szanzer and others from Davis Polk Restructuring team.
Rarrick, Mohini P.B.	04/22/20	1.3	Attend workstreams call with S. Szanzer and others from Davis Polk Restructuring team (0.5); review and distribute docket filings (0.8).
Sokol, Nate	04/22/20	0.9	Call with Davis Polk Restructuring team regarding workstreams (0.5); correspondence with Davis Polk team regarding same (0.4).
Szanzer, Steven Z.	04/22/20	1.0	Call with Davis Polk Restructuring team regarding workstreams (0.5); correspondence with N. Sokol regarding case and Dean Foods management (0.5).
Bernstein, Alexander	04/23/20	1.2	Review new filings.
Liu, Yichen	04/23/20	0.5	Review docket filings (0.1); review and revise case calendar (0.4).
Rarrick, Mohini P.B.	04/23/20	0.4	Review and distribute docket filings.
Resnick, Brian M.	04/23/20	0.5	Call with Dean Foods team and co-advisors regarding workstreams and status.
Sokol, Nate	04/23/20	1.6	Email with Akin Gump regarding filings and case update (0.5); attend workstreams call with Dean Foods and co-advisors (0.5); email with Norton Rose and Epiq teams regarding service (0.6).
Szanzer, Steven Z.	04/23/20	0.5	Attend update call with Dean Foods and co-advisors.
Bernstein, Alexander	04/24/20	0.5	Attend workstreams call (0.3); review recent filings (0.2).
Butler, James C	04/24/20	0.3	Attend workstreams call.
Garg, Paavani	04/24/20	1.7	Attend workstreams call (0.3); attend workstreams call (1.2); prepare for same (0.2).
Lee, Grace	04/24/20	0.3	Attend workstreams call.
Leibowitz, Danielle	04/24/20	0.3	Attend workstreams call.

Time Detail By Project			
Name	Date	Hours	Narrative
Liu, Yichen	04/24/20	1.5	Attend workstreams call (0.3); attend workstreams call with Davis Polk Restructuring team (1.2).
Mazer, Deborah S.	04/24/20	0.3	Attend workstreams call.
Netzer, Omer	04/24/20	0.9	Attend workstreams call (0.3); correspondence with S. Szanzer and N. Sokol regarding outstanding items (0.6).
Rarrick, Mohini P.B.	04/24/20	0.8	Attend workstreams call (0.5); review and distribute docket filings (0.3).
Resnick, Brian M.	04/24/20	0.5	Correspondence with S. Szanzer and N. Sokol regarding general case issues.
Schare, Lindsay	04/24/20	0.4	Attend workstreams call.
Sokol, Nate	04/24/20	1.5	Attend workstreams call (0.3); call with Davis Polk Restructuring team regarding workstreams and strategy (1.2).
Szanzer, Steven Z.	04/24/20	1.7	Attend call with Davis Polk Restructuring team regarding workstreams (1.2); correspondence with N. Sokol regarding same (0.5).
Thomson, Daniel J.	04/24/20	0.3	Attend workstreams call.
Resnick, Brian M.	04/25/20	0.2	Emails with Davis Polk team regarding case status.
Sokol, Nate	04/25/20	0.5	Correspondence with S. Szanzer regarding workstreams.
Liu, Yichen	04/26/20	1.5	Review docket filings and revise case calendar (1.1); draft weekly email calendar alert (0.4).
Bernstein, Alexander	04/27/20	0.3	Review recent docket filings.
Giddens, Magali	04/27/20	0.5	Review docket filings.
Liu, Yichen	04/27/20	0.7	Draft and revise weekly calendar alert email (0.2); review docket filings and revise case calendar (0.5).
Rarrick, Mohini P.B.	04/27/20	0.5	Review and distribute court filings.
Sokol, Nate	04/27/20	0.7	Email with Davis Polk Restructuring team regarding case workstreams.
Szanzer, Steven Z.	04/27/20	0.2	Review weekly calendar alert and correspondence with Y. Liu regarding same.
Bernstein, Alexander	04/28/20	0.1	Review docket filings.
Netzer, Omer	04/28/20	0.4	Correspondence with the Davis Polk Litigation team regarding case filings.
Rarrick, Mohini P.B.	04/28/20	0.4	Review and distribute docket filings.
Resnick, Brian M.	04/28/20	0.3	Emails with Davis Polk team regarding case administration issues.
Simpson, Kendra	04/28/20	0.8	Correspondence with Davis Polk Tax team regarding tax refund issues
Sokol, Nate	04/28/20	0.4	Email with Davis Polk Restructuring team regarding case workstreams.
Rarrick, Mohini P.B.	04/29/20	0.9	Review and distribute docket filings (0.6); review case workstreams (0.3).
Sokol, Nate	04/29/20	1.3	Attend weekly update call with Akin Gump (0.5); review correspondence with Davis Polk team regarding case workstreams (0.8).
Liu, Yichen	04/30/20	0.3	Review docket filing and distribute same (0.1); revise case calendar (0.2).
Rarrick, Mohini P.B.	04/30/20	0.5	Review and distribute docket filings (0.3); correspondence regarding case workstreams with S. Szanzer (0.2).
Sokol, Nate	04/30/20	0.6	Review correspondence with Davis Polk team regarding case workstreams.
Total R145 GENERAL CASE ADMINISTRATION		100.6	
R150 LEASES AND CONTRACTS			

Time Detail By Project			
Name	Date	Hours	Narrative
Sokol, Nate	04/01/20	1.0	Email with vendor counsel regarding cure cost objections and assumption procedures (0.8); email S. Szanzer, T. Behnke, and others regarding same (0.2).
Sokol, Nate	04/03/20	0.9	Email with vendor counsel regarding cure cost objections and assumption procedures (0.4); email with S. Szanzer, T. Behnke, and others regarding same (0.1); email with T. Behnke, J. Sutton, and others regarding cure cost reconciliation and preparation of proposed assumption lists (0.4).
Butler, James C	04/04/20	0.5	Research regarding contract clause issues.
Sokol, Nate	04/04/20	0.5	Call with T. Behnke, J. Sutton, P. Garg, and others regarding cure cost reconciliation and preparation of proposed assumption lists.
Butler, James C	04/05/20	2.0	Research regarding contract clause issues.
Thomson, Daniel J.	04/05/20	1.4	Research regarding contract termination.
Butler, James C	04/06/20	2.8	Research regarding contract clause issues.
Garg, Paavani	04/06/20	0.7	Call with N. Sokol and others regarding process to reconcile cure costs (0.5; email N. Sokol regarding same (0.2).
Mazer, Deborah S.	04/06/20	0.9	Review documents and filings related to contractual dispute.
Sokol, Nate	04/06/20	1.5	Email with vendor counsel regarding questions regarding contract treatment following sales (1.0); call with S. Szanzer, T. Behnke, J. Sutton, and others regarding section 365 and assumption process (0.5).
Szanzer, Steven Z.	04/06/20	5.0	Correspondence with N. Sokol regarding section 365(d)(4) motion (0.2); review contract logs (0.5); review and revise section 365 Order (2.7); correspondence with P. Garg regarding same (0.2); call with J. Sutton and Alvarez & Marsal regarding Proposed Assumed Contracts Schedules (0.7); correspondence and call with J. Webb regarding same (0.3); correspondence with N. Sokol and Davis Polk Mergers & Acquisitions team regarding same (0.4).
Thomson, Daniel J.	04/06/20	1.1	Draft and conduct research regarding response letter for contract dispute.
Erickson, Jarret	04/07/20	2.0	Review service agreements and termination issues (1.1); summarize analysis of same (0.7); correspondence with N. Sokol regarding same (0.2).
Mazer, Deborah S.	04/07/20	1.9	Correspondence with N. Sokol and Dean Foods team regarding contractual dispute (0.5); review documents related to same (1.4).
Resnick, Brian M.	04/07/20	0.2	Emails with Davis Polk team regarding section 365(d)(4) issues.
Sokol, Nate	04/07/20	1.5	Email with T. Behnke, J. Sutton, and others regarding section 365 and assumption process (0.2); email with M. Reining, and others regarding section 365(d)(4) motion (0.3); email with G. Packer and J. Sutton regarding same (0.2); call with T. Behnke, J. Sutton, and others regarding section 365 and assumption process (0.8).

Time Detail By Project			
Name	Date	Hours	Narrative
Szanzer, Steven Z.	04/07/20	6.3	Review and revise section 365 Order (2.5); correspondence and calls with P. Garg regarding same (0.5); review emails regarding rolling stock (0.3); call with Alvarez & Marsal regarding proposed assumed contract schedules (0.7); correspondence with Alvarez & Marsal regarding same (0.3); correspondence with N. Sokol regarding section 365(d)(4) issue (0.3); review emails regarding same (0.3); correspondence with B. Resnick regarding same (0.2); correspondence with N. Sokol and with J. Sutton regarding contract assumption issue (0.3); correspondence and call with J. Webb regarding proposed assumed contract schedules (0.2); correspondence with N. Sokol regarding rejection issue (0.2); review emails regarding assumption and assignment issues (0.3); correspondence with N. Sokol regarding same (0.2).
Sokol, Nate	04/08/20	1.7	Email with M. Reining and others regarding extension motion (0.4); call with S. Szanzer and G. Packer regarding lease amendment (0.5); call with G. Packer regarding plant wind-down and equipment disposals (0.5); email with T. Behnke, J. Sutton, and others regarding section 365 and assumption process (0.3).
Szanzer, Steven Z.	04/08/20	2.8	Correspondence and call with N. Sokol regarding lease rejection issues (0.3); correspondence with T. Behnke regarding contract schedules (0.9); correspondence with N. Sokol regarding same (0.4); correspondence with G. Packer and N. Sokol regarding lease issues (0.7); review lease amendment (0.5).
Garg, Paavani	04/09/20	4.1	Review and revise Section 365 Order (1.5); draft assumption and rejection motion (2.6).
Resnick, Brian M.	04/09/20	0.2	Call with K. Waterman regarding cure costs.
Sokol, Nate	04/09/20	3.8	Email with R. North, M. Williams, S. Lowenberg, and others regarding contract dispute issues (0.7); call with T. Behnke, B. Fox, and J. Sutton regarding section 365 assumption process (0.5); call with J. Sutton regarding section 365 assumption process (0.5); review Latham & Watkins's revised draft of section 365 order (0.6); email P. Garg regarding same (0.1); email with vendor counsel regarding questions regarding contract treatment (1.2); email with G. Packer, S. Szanzer, and P. Garg regarding lease amendment (0.2).
Garg, Paavani	04/10/20	0.5	Call with Latham & Watkins regarding section 365 order.
Liu, Yichen	04/10/20	0.7	Review and revise proposed order for section 365 motion (0.5); correspondence with N. Sokol and Norton Rose team regarding same (0.2).
Sokol, Nate	04/10/20	3.9	Email with vendor counsel regarding contract treatment following sales (1.0); email with J. Ktsanes and P. Garg regarding section 365 order (0.2); email with Norton Rose team regarding section 365 motion (0.6); call with J. Boland regarding same (0.1); call with J. Ktsanes and others regarding section 365 order (0.3); email with T. Behnke, J. Sutton, and others regarding section 365 and assumption process (0.7); review and revise section 365 order (0.6); email P. Garg regarding same (0.2); email with Davis Polk mergers & acquisitions team regarding assumption process (0.2).
Thomson, Daniel J.	04/10/20	1.2	Review and conduct research regarding response letter from vendor.

Time Detail By Project			
Name	Date	Hours	Narrative
Garg, Paavani	04/11/20	0.7	Draft Proposed Assumed Contracts Notice.
Schare, Lindsay	04/11/20	0.3	Emails with Davis Polk team regarding contract issues.
Garg, Paavani	04/12/20	0.2	Email correspondence with Davis Polk team regarding section 365 order.
Sokol, Nate	04/12/20	0.5	Email with vendor counsel regarding questions regarding contract treatment after sales.
Garg, Paavani	04/13/20	3.2	Revise section 365 orders (1.6); draft Proposed Assumption and Assignment Notice (1.6).
Liu, Yichen	04/13/20	0.9	Review and revise section 365 proposed order and certificate of counsel (0.3); correspondence with S. Szanzer regarding same (0.1); correspondence with Norton Rose team regarding same (0.1); correspondence with J. O'Young regarding assumption of executory contracts and cure costs (0.4).
Sokol, Nate	04/13/20	1.7	Email with vendor counsel, S. Szanzer and others regarding cure reconciliation and contract schedules
Szanzer, Steven Z.	04/13/20	6.0	Review and revise section 365 order (1.0); correspondence with P. Garg regarding same (0.3); correspondence with parties in interest regarding same (0.7); review and revise Proposed Assumed Contracts Notice schedule (1.6); correspondence with P. Garg regarding same (0.3); review Latham & Watkins' comments to same (0.2); correspondence with P. Garg regarding same (0.2); review and revise section 365 order and Certification of Counsel for same (0.7); correspondence with Y. Liu regarding same (0.2); review emails regarding proposed assumed contracts schedules (0.3); review emails regarding contract issues (0.3); correspondence with J. Sutton regarding proposed assumed contracts schedule for Producers transaction (0.2).
Garg, Paavani	04/14/20	4.5	Revise assumption and rejection motion for lease (2.0); revise proposed assumption and assignment notice (2.5).
Sokol, Nate	04/14/20	2.1	Email with vendor counsel, S. Szanzer, and others regarding cure reconciliation and contract schedules (1.3); email with J. Sutton, T. Behnke, S. Szanzer, and others regarding cure reconciliation and contract schedules (0.8).
Szanzer, Steven Z.	04/14/20	2.0	Review emails regarding contract assumption objections (0.3); review email and materials regarding Producers contract schedule (0.4); correspondence with N. Sokol regarding same (0.2); correspondence with Davis Polk mergers & acquisitions team regarding Dairy Farmers of America's contract schedule (0.2); review revised proposed assumed contracts schedules (0.3); correspondence with P. Garg regarding same (0.2); correspondence with N. Sokol and P. Garg regarding contract issues (0.4).
Resnick, Brian M.	04/15/20	0.3	Call with K. Waterman regarding executory contract issues.
Sokol, Nate	04/15/20	1.5	Email with vendor counsel, S. Szanzer, and others regarding cure reconciliation and contract schedules (0.9); email with Latham & Watkins regarding cure reconciliation and contract schedules (0.2); review lease motion (0.3); email G. Packer, S. Szanzer, and P. Garg regarding same (0.1).
Garg, Paavani	04/16/20	2.9	Review case precedents regarding potential executory contracts (0.5); attend call with Alvarez & Marsal team regarding cure costs reconciliation (partial attendance) (0.5); review buyer comments to section 365 Orders (1.2); correspondence with S. Szanzer regarding same (0.7).

Time Detail By Project			
Name	Date	Hours	Narrative
Sokol, Nate	04/16/20	4.0	Email with T. Behnke, J. Sutton, S. Szanzer, P. Garg, and others regarding cure reconciliation and contract schedules (0.8); call with S. Szanzer, P. Garg, and Alvarez & Marsal team regarding cure reconciliation and contract schedules (1.0); email with vendor counsel, S. Szanzer, and others regarding cure reconciliation and contract schedules (1.1); email with L. Plotkin, G. Crane, and others regarding lease assumption issues (1.1).
Szanzer, Steven Z.	04/16/20	2.4	Review emails with Davis Polk team regarding contract schedules and related notices (0.6); review and consider comments to Section 365 Orders (1.0); review emails regarding same (0.6); review emails regarding Dallas headquarters lease motion (0.2).
Garg, Paavani	04/17/20	2.5	Revise Section 365 Orders and Proposed Assumption and Assignment Notices (1.6); review case precedents regarding certain leases (0.9).
Sokol, Nate	04/17/20	1.0	Email with lessor counsel regarding lease issues (0.7); call with J. Ktsanes regarding contact assumption issues (0.3).
Szanzer, Steven Z.	04/17/20	4.3	Correspondence with N. Sokol and P. Garg regarding status of Section 365 Orders and related notices (0.4); review revised versions of same (1.7); review and revise lease motion (1.8); correspondence with N. Sokol and P. Garg regarding same (0.4).
Garg, Paavani	04/18/20	0.7	Revise lease motion.
Sokol, Nate	04/18/20	0.6	Review and revise lease motion (0.2); email G. Packer and P. Garg regarding same (0.1); email with J. Sutton, T. Behnke, P. Garg, S. Szanzer, and others regarding cure reconciliation and contract schedules (0.3).
Sokol, Nate	04/19/20	0.3	Email with J. Sutton, T. Behnke, P. Garg, S. Szanzer, and others regarding cure reconciliation and contract schedules.
Garg, Paavani	04/20/20	2.9	Revise proposed Assumption and Assignment Notices (2.0); correspondence regarding same (0.9).
Sokol, Nate	04/20/20	2.0	Email with vendor counsel regarding equipment lease issues (0.5); call with J. Mudd regarding equipment leases (0.5); call with T. Behnke, J. Sutton, and J. Dawson regarding cure reconciliation and contract schedules (0.5); call with J. Sutton regarding cure reconciliation and contract schedules (0.3); call with vendor counsel regarding cure reconciliation and contract schedules (0.2).
Szanzer, Steven Z.	04/20/20	3.3	Correspondence with P. Garg and N. Sokol regarding Harmoni contract schedule and notice (0.5); review and revise same (0.2); correspondence with J. Sutton and Alvarez & Marsal regarding same (0.3); correspondence with P. Garg and N. Sokol regarding Producers Dairy contract schedule and notice (0.5); review and revise same (0.2); correspondence with J. Sutton and Alvarez & Marsal regarding same (0.3); review and revise Harmoni Section 365 Order (0.3); correspondence with P. Garg regarding same (0.3); correspondence with P. Garg regarding Prairie Farms contract schedule and notice (0.4); correspondence with N. Sokol regarding service for notices (0.1); review correspondence with Dean Foods regarding same (0.2).
Garg, Paavani	04/21/20	1.5	Review Section 365 Order revised drafts (0.5); revise Proposed Assumption and Assignment Notices (1.0).

Time Detail By Project			
Name	Date	Hours	Narrative
Netzer, Omer	04/21/20	0.3	Correspondence with J. Sutton regarding contract terminations (0.3).
Sokol, Nate	04/21/20	1.9	Email with vendor counsel regarding equipment lease issues (1.5); call with K. Waterman, and J. Sutton regarding cure reconciliation and contract schedules (0.4).
Szanzer, Steven Z.	04/21/20	2.8	Review emails from T. Cohen regarding equipment leases (0.3); correspondence and calls regarding notices and schedules for proposed contract assumptions (1.5); correspondence and call with T. Cohen regarding contract rejection protocol (0.7); correspondence with N. Sokol regarding same (0.3).
Sokol, Nate	04/22/20	2.3	Call with vendor counsel regarding equipment leases (0.8); email vendor counsel and Dean Foods regarding same (0.2); call with A. Bierce regarding equipment leases (0.3); correspondence with S. Szanzer regarding vendor lease inquiries (0.3); email vendor counsel regarding equipment leases (0.1); email vendor counsel and Dean Foods regarding same (0.1); call with K. Kress regarding vendor lease inquiries (0.5); emails and call with J. Sutton, T. Behnke, Latham & Watkins, and Shearman & Sterling regarding contract schedules.
Szanzer, Steven Z.	04/22/20	3.1	Correspondence and calls with T. Cohen, A. Feld, and N. Sokol regarding contract rejection protocol (0.5); review stipulation for same (0.1); correspondence with N. Sokol regarding same (0.1); finalize contract schedules and notices for Mana, Harmoni, and Producers Dairy (1.5); correspondence with N. Sokol, P. Garg, Houlihan Lokey, Latham & Watkins, and J. Sutton regarding Dairy Farmers of America contract schedule (0.5); correspondence with N. Sokol, P. Garg, Shearman & Sterling, and J. Sutton regarding Prairie Farms contract schedule (0.4).
Garg, Paavani	04/23/20	5.1	Revise proposed assumption and assignment notices and schedules (4.8); attend call with Alvarez & Marsal regarding cure costs (0.3).
Netzer, Omer	04/23/20	1.3	Call with S. Szanzer and others regarding rejection of leases (0.5); correspondence with S. Szanzer and N. Sokol regarding same (0.8).
Sokol, Nate	04/23/20	6.3	Email with vendor counsel regarding equipment lease issues (0.8); email with J. Sutton, T. Behnke, S. Szanzer, P. Garg, Latham & Watkins, and Shearman & Sterling regarding cure reconciliation and contract schedules (1.1); call with Alvarez & Marsal team regarding same (0.3); correspondence with R. Aguilar, P. Garg, and others regarding cure objection (0.4); call with H. Chung and others regarding lease equipment issues (0.5); emails and call with J. Sutton, T. Behnke, S. Szanzer, P. Garg, Latham & Watkins, and Shearman & Sterling regarding contract schedules (3.2).

Time Detail By Project			
Name	Date	Hours	Narrative
Szanzer, Steven Z.	04/23/20	5.3	Finalize contract schedule and notice for Prairie Farms (1.5); correspondence with N. Sokol, Latham & Watkins, Houlihan Lokey, Alvarez & Marsal, and J. Sutton regarding Dairy Farmers of America contract schedule (1.5); correspondence with Latham & Watkins regarding Section 365 Order (0.2); review and finalize Hawaii contract schedule (1.2); review emails with Davis Polk team regarding rejection protocols (0.2); review and revise consensual stipulation for same (0.5); correspondence with N. Sokol and B. Resnick regarding assumption of contracts (0.2).
Garg, Paavani	04/24/20	2.8	Revise proposed assumption and assignment notices (2.1); revise Section 365 Order (0.7).
Sokol, Nate	04/24/20	1.6	Email with J. Mudd, G. Packer, lessor counsel regarding equipment lease issues (0.5); email with J. Sutton, T. Behnke, S. Szanzer, P. Garg, Latham & Watkins, and Shearman & Sterling regarding cure reconciliation and contract schedules (0.7); email with vendor counsel regarding cure reconciliation and contract schedules (0.4).
Szanzer, Steven Z.	04/24/20	1.8	Review emails with Davis Polk team regarding leased equipment (0.2); review correspondence with contract counterparties (0.3); finalize assumption and assignment contract schedule and notice for Dairy Farmers of America (1.0); review emails with Davis Polk team and buyer counsel regarding supplementing Prairie Farm's contract schedule (0.3).
Sokol, Nate	04/25/20	0.9	Email with vender counsel regarding cure reconciliation and contract issues (0.3); email with vender counsel regarding equipment lease issues (0.3); draft Sabatte stipulation regarding contract rejection (0.2); email S. Szanzer, O. Netzer, and D. Mazer regarding same (0.1).
Garg, Paavani	04/26/20	1.4	Revise Dairy Farmers of America section 365 Order (1.0); call with S. Szanzer regarding Section 365 Orders (0.4).
Sokol, Nate	04/26/20	0.7	Email with vendor counsel regarding cure reconciliation and contract issues (0.3); email with vendor counsel regarding equipment lease issues (0.4).
Szanzer, Steven Z.	04/26/20	2.4	Correspondence with Latham & Watkins regarding contract assumption issues (0.1); review and revise Sabatte stipulation regarding contract rejection (0.7); correspondence with O. Netzer and B. Resnick regarding same (0.3); correspondence with P. Garg regarding Dairy Farmers of America Section 365 Order (0.5); review and revise same (0.8).
Garg, Paavani	04/27/20	2.3	Revise Section 365 Orders (2.3).
Netzer, Omer	04/27/20	2.3	Correspondence with J. Sutton, P. Garg, and R. North regarding contract rejections (1.4); review rejection procedures regarding same (0.9).
Resnick, Brian M.	04/27/20	0.4	Emails with S. Szanzer regarding contract assumption issues.
Sokol, Nate	04/27/20	1.0	Email with vendor counsel regarding cure reconciliation and contract issues (0.8); review correspondence with same regarding same (0.2).

Time Detail By Project			
Name	Date	Hours	Narrative
Szanzer, Steven Z.	04/27/20	2.6	Correspondence with P. Garg regarding Section 365 Orders (0.3); review and revise of same (1.2); correspondence and call with D. McGehrin regarding financial wherewithal issue (0.2); review emails regarding cure objections (0.5); correspondence with K. Kress regarding Nestle contracts (0.2); correspondence with O. Netzer and J. Sutton regarding contract rejection (0.2).
Garg, Paavani	04/28/20	3.1	Review contracts to identify executory nature (0.6); calls with contract counterparties regarding case status and contract issues (0.3); draft supplemental notice of proposed assumed contracts (1.7); revise Section 365 Orders for buyers (0.5).
Liu, Yichen	04/28/20	0.6	Review late-filed cure objections (0.5); correspondence with S. Szanzer and Epiq team regarding same (0.1).
Netzer, Omer	04/28/20	3.8	Correspondence with N. Bloomfield regarding stipulation regarding contract rejection issues (0.4); correspondence with R. North, J. Sutton, and N. Sokol regarding contract rejection motion (3.4).
Resnick, Brian M.	04/28/20	0.4	Call with K. Waterman regarding Dallas headquarters lease (0.2); emails with same and Davis Polk team regarding same (0.2).
Sokol, Nate	04/28/20	0.6	Email with vender counsel regarding cure reconciliation and contract issues (0.5); review correspondence with same regarding same (0.1).
Szanzer, Steven Z.	04/28/20	5.0	Correspondence with G. Packer, K. Waterman, B. Resnick, and L. Plotkin regarding Dallas headquarters lease amendment (1.5); review same (0.4); review emails with Davis Polk team regarding Hawaii lease assignment (0.2); review emails with Davis Polk team regarding contract objections (0.3); correspondence with T. Cohen regarding contract rejection stipulation (0.1); correspondence with Davis Polk team and J. Sutton regarding contract rejection issues (0.3); revise supplemental contract notice for Mana (1.2); correspondence and call with P. Garg regarding same (0.3); correspondence with Dean Foods regarding post-sale operations integration issue (0.4); correspondence with Houlihan Lokey and J. Sutton regarding Dairy Farmers of America supplemental contract notice (0.3).
Falk, Aryeh Ethan	04/29/20	0.5	Call with J. Argentina regarding Penske contract (0.1); correspondence with S. Szanzer regarding same (0.2); email J. Argentina regarding same (0.2).
Garg, Paavani	04/29/20	5.3	Email correspondence with S. Szanzer regarding contract objections (1.0); review tracker for same (0.6); revise Section 365 Orders (0.5); draft certification of counsel for same (0.5); draft Dairy Farmers of America supplemental notice of assumption and assignment (2.7).
Netzer, Omer	04/29/20	3.2	Communications with J. Teicher, S. Szanzer and R. North regarding contracts rejection.
Szanzer, Steven Z.	04/29/20	1.5	Review and revise Dallas headquarters lease amendment (0.4); correspondence with G. Packer, S. Coleman, and L. Plotkin regarding same (0.6); team correspondence regarding contract objection issues (0.5).
Garg, Paavani	04/30/20	3.5	Revise certification of counsel for section 365 Orders (2.2); revise supplemental notices of assumption and assignment (1.0); call with Shearman & Sterling regarding Section 365 Order (0.3).

Time Detail By Project			
Name	Date	Hours	Narrative
Netzer, Omer	04/30/20	2.2	Call with J. Teicher regarding rejection of agreements (0.5); correspondence with J. Teicher regarding same (0.6); correspondence with S. Szanzer and others regarding same (1.1).
Resnick, Brian M.	04/30/20	1.5	Calls with Davis Polk team and Dean Foods regarding contracts issues .
Sokol, Nate	04/30/20	0.3	Call with vender counsel regarding cure reconciliation and contract issues.
Szanzer, Steven Z.	04/30/20	4.3	Finalize Harmoni section 365 Order (1.1); finalize Prairie Farms section 365 Order and Certification of Counsel for same (2.3); correspondence with P. Garg regarding objection tracker and review same (0.9).
Total R150 LEASES AND CONTRACTS		185.8	
R155 LITIGATION			
Bernstein, Alexander	04/01/20	3.5	Prepare stipulation regarding motion to lift automatic stay (1.3); research regarding same (0.9); prepare correspondence with plaintiffs regarding same (1.2); correspondence with D. Leibowitz regarding same (0.1).
Leibowitz, Danielle	04/01/20	4.5	Review insurance policy documents (0.4); correspondence with J. Butler regarding same (0.6); review and revise email summarizing insurance policies (0.3); review precedent lift stay motions and orders (1.5); draft email to A. Bernstein regarding same (0.3); research regarding same (1.4).
Resnick, Brian M.	04/01/20	1.3	Prepare for Sale Hearing.
Bernstein, Alexander	04/02/20	2.3	Research regarding motions to lift automatic stay (0.9); prepare pleadings regarding same (1.3); correspondence with D. Leibowitz regarding litigation workstreams (0.1).
Leibowitz, Danielle	04/02/20	0.7	Research in connection with lift stay motion (0.6); call with A. Bernstein regarding litigation workstreams (0.1).
Bernstein, Alexander	04/03/20	7.4	Correspondence with Davis Polk team regarding motions to lift automatic stay (1.5); draft and prepare brief regarding same (2.0); research regarding same (2.9); telephone conference with N. Sokol and D. Leibowitz regarding same (0.8); prepare for same (0.2).
Leibowitz, Danielle	04/03/20	3.8	Call with A. Bernstein and N. Sokol regarding next steps for personal injury cases (0.8); research in connection with personal injury cases (2.5); email A. Bernstein regarding same (0.5).
Schare, Lindsay	04/03/20	0.4	Emails with Davis Polk team regarding upcoming litigation workstreams.
Sokol, Nate	04/03/20	0.8	Call with D. Leibowitz and A. Bernstein regarding lift stay motions and pending litigation.
Bernstein, Alexander	04/04/20	3.4	Prepare stipulation regarding motions to lift automatic stay (0.2); draft pleadings regarding same (3.2).
Thomson, Daniel J.	04/04/20	1.8	Conduct research regarding automatic stay issues (1.4); email Davis Polk team regarding same (0.4).
Bernstein, Alexander	04/05/20	0.9	Correspondence with Davis Polk team regarding motions to lift automatic stay (0.4); correspondence with plaintiffs' counsel regarding same (0.5).

Time Detail By Project			
Name	Date	Hours	Narrative
Bernstein, Alexander	04/06/20	8.9	Draft pleadings regarding motions to lift automatic stay (4.5); telephone conference with D. Leibowitz regarding same (1.0); prepare for same (0.3); correspondence with Davis Polk team regarding same (1.3); research regarding same (0.6); correspondence with Dean Foods and Davis Polk team regarding same (0.4); telephone conference with plaintiff's counsel and D. Leibowitz regarding personal injury action (0.3); correspondence with plaintiff's counsel and Davis Polk team regarding same (0.4); correspondence with L. Schare regarding litigation workstreams (0.1).
Leibowitz, Danielle	04/06/20	7.4	Research regarding personal injury plaintiffs' claims (3.3); calls with A. Bernstein regarding same (1.0); call with A. Bernstein and plaintiff's counsel regarding personal injury claims (0.3); review motion to lift automatic stay and research related issues (2.0); update personal injury case tracker (0.8).
Schare, Lindsay	04/06/20	0.4	Emails regarding productions.
Sokol, Nate	04/06/20	0.5	Call with J. Regas and J. Sutton regarding pending litigation issues (0.2); email with A. Bernstein, D. Leibowitz, and others regarding pending litigation and lift stay motion issues (0.3).
Bernstein, Alexander	04/07/20	5.2	Telephone conference with D. Leibowitz regarding motions to lift automatic stay (0.7); telephone conference with Davis Polk team regarding same (0.5); prepare for same (0.7); research legal issues regarding same (1.8); further correspondence with Davis Polk team regarding same (0.6); correspondence with Dean Foods and Davis Polk team regarding same (0.9).
Leibowitz, Danielle	04/07/20	4.0	Review motion to lift automatic stay and research related issues (2.8); calls with A. Bernstein regarding same (0.7); discuss next steps in personal injury cases with E. Moskowitz, B. Resnick, N. Sokol and A. Bernstein (0.5).
Resnick, Brian M.	04/07/20	0.5	Call with Davis Polk Litigation team regarding automatic stay litigation.
Schare, Lindsay	04/07/20	0.9	Correspondence with Davis Polk team regarding Creditors' Committee document requests.
Sokol, Nate	04/07/20	0.9	Email with J. Regas regarding pending litigation (0.2); call with B. Resnick, A. Bernstein, and D. Leibowitz regarding pending litigation and lift stay motions (0.5); email with A. Bernstein regarding same (0.2).
Bernstein, Alexander	04/08/20	1.3	Correspondence with L. Schare regarding litigation workstreams (0.1); correspondence with Davis Polk team regarding motions to lift automatic stay (0.2); correspondence with plaintiffs' counsel and Davis Polk team regarding same (1.0).
Sokol, Nate	04/08/20	0.3	Email with A. Bernstein and D. Leibowitz regarding lift stay motions.
Bernstein, Alexander	04/09/20	4.4	Correspondence with plaintiffs' counsel, Davis Polk team regarding motions to lift automatic stay and personal injury cases (0.8); telephone conference with N. Sokol, D. Leibowitz regarding same (0.3); correspondence with plaintiffs' counsel and Davis Polk team regarding same (0.2); correspondence with Davis Polk team regarding same (0.4); prepare stipulations regarding same (2.2); review correspondence with Davis Polk team regarding same (0.4).

Time Detail By Project			
Name	Date	Hours	Narrative
Leibowitz, Danielle	04/09/20	1.7	Correspondence with A. Bernstein regarding personal injury cases (0.6); call with A. Bernstein and N. Sokol regarding personal injury case (0.3); review correspondence and personal injury case tracker (0.8).
Resnick, Brian M.	04/09/20	0.3	Emails with Davis Polk team regarding automatic stay and related litigations.
Sokol, Nate	04/09/20	0.5	Call with A. Bernstein and D. Leibowitz regarding lift stay motion (0.3); correspondence with A. Bernstein, D. Leibowitz, and plaintiff's counsel regarding lift stay motion (0.2).
Bernstein, Alexander	04/10/20	3.2	Telephone conferences with plaintiffs' counsel and Davis Polk team regarding motions to lift automatic stay (0.6); prepare for same (0.4); prepare stipulations regarding same (1.7); telephone conference with N. Sokol regarding same (0.2); correspondence with Davis Polk team regarding same (0.1); correspondence with plaintiffs' counsel and Davis Polk team regarding same (0.2).
Leibowitz, Danielle	04/10/20	0.6	Call with A. Bernstein, N. Sokol, and plaintiff's counsel regarding personal injury case (0.4); call with A. Bernstein, N. Sokol, and plaintiff's counsel regarding personal injury case (0.2).
Mazer, Deborah S.	04/10/20	3.8	Research legal issues related to section 549 motion (2.9); draft same (0.8); teleconference with N. Sokol regarding same (0.1).
Schare, Lindsay	04/10/20	0.5	Team call regarding workstreams
Sokol, Nate	04/10/20	0.7	Call with A. Bernstein, D. Leibowitz, and others regarding lift stay motion.
Bernstein, Alexander	04/11/20	0.7	Correspondence with Davis Polk team regarding motions to lift automatic stay (0.4); correspondence with plaintiffs' counsel and Davis Polk team regarding same (0.2); correspondence with Norton Rose team and Davis Polk team regarding resetting hearing regarding same (0.1).
Leibowitz, Danielle	04/11/20	0.5	Revise personal injury case tracker.
Sokol, Nate	04/11/20	0.2	Email with A. Bernstein and D. Leibowitz regarding lift stay motions.
Thomson, Daniel J.	04/11/20	2.2	Research regarding automatic stay issue (2.0); correspondence with Davis Polk team regarding same (0.2).
Bernstein, Alexander	04/13/20	2.6	Correspondence with plaintiffs' counsel and Davis Polk team regarding motions to lift automatic stay (0.5); correspondence with Davis Polk team regarding same (0.9); correspondence with Norton Rose team and Davis Polk team regarding hearing regarding same (0.6); prepare stipulation regarding same (0.3); correspondence with L. Schare regarding litigation workstreams (0.3).
Leibowitz, Danielle	04/13/20	0.8	Revise personal injury case tracker.
Resnick, Brian M.	04/13/20	0.5	Call with Akin Gump team regarding Creditors Committee discovery issues (0.4); call with M. Lahaie regarding same (0.1).
Schare, Lindsay	04/13/20	1.2	Meet and confer call with Creditors Committee regarding Rule 2004 discovery (0.5); emails with E. Moskowitz and A. Bernstein regarding same (0.3); correspondence with Davis Polk team regarding document collection and review (0.4).
Sokol, Nate	04/13/20	0.6	Email with A. Bernstein, D. Leibowitz regarding pending litigation and lift stay motions (0.3); email with J. Regas and others regarding potential clawback actions (0.3).

Time Detail By Project			
Name	Date	Hours	Narrative
Soussan, Susan	04/13/20	0.5	Correspondence with L. Schare regarding document collection for Creditors Committee discovery requests.
Thomson, Daniel J.	04/13/20	1.0	Coordinate with vendor regarding processing and review of document production (0.4); email with Davis Polk litigation team regarding same (0.6).
Bernstein, Alexander	04/14/20	5.8	Correspondence with L. Schare regarding litigation workstreams (0.5); telephone conference with plaintiffs' counsel and D. Leibowitz regarding request to lift automatic stay (0.3); prepare for same (0.3); prepare stipulation regarding same (1.1); correspondence with Davis Polk team regarding stipulation regarding same (0.2); review pleadings and research regarding same (0.3); correspondence with plaintiffs' counsel and Davis Polk team regarding motions to lift automatic stay (2.0); correspondence with Davis Polk team regarding same (0.3); telephone conference with D. Leibowitz regarding same (0.8).
Leibowitz, Danielle	04/14/20	3.7	Call with A. Bernstein regarding status of personal injury cases (0.8); call with A. Bernstein and plaintiff's counsel regarding personal injury case (0.2); review precedent stipulations relating to lifting automatic stay (1.1); review and revise draft stipulation for personal injury case (1.3); further revise draft stipulation (0.3).
Schare, Lindsay	04/14/20	1.4	Call with D. Thomson and A. Bernstein regarding Creditors' Committee discovery (0.8); call with A. Bernstein regarding same (0.4); emails with Dean Foods regarding document collection (0.2).
Sokol, Nate	04/14/20	0.3	Call with M. Rarrick regarding potential clawback actions.
Soussan, Susan	04/14/20	1.1	Review Creditors Committee discovery production preparations (0.4); quality check document production (0.7).
Thomson, Daniel J.	04/14/20	6.4	Confer with Davis Polk litigation team regarding litigation workstreams (0.8); email with same regarding automatic stay issue (2.6); correspondence with Davis Polk litigation and restructuring teams regarding sale deposit (3.0).
Bernstein, Alexander	04/15/20	7.5	Call with J. Butler regarding Creditors Committee discovery requests (0.7); correspondence with Davis Polk discovery attorneys regarding same (0.5); correspondence with L. Schare regarding same (0.2); review documents regarding same (4.2); correspondence with Dean Foods and Davis Polk team regarding same (0.2); further correspondence with Davis Polk team regarding same (0.2); correspondence with Davis Polk team regarding lift stay inquiries (0.4); correspondence with plaintiffs' counsel and Davis Polk team regarding same (0.2); call with plaintiffs' counsel and D. Leibowitz regarding same (0.2); review correspondence from Davis Polk team regarding research regarding motion to lift automatic stay (0.7).
Butler, James C	04/15/20	0.7	Call with A. Bernstein regarding Creditors Committee discovery requests.
Cooley, Timothy	04/15/20	6.9	Review documents for Creditors Committee discovery requests.
Jouvin, Zoe	04/15/20	2.6	Review documents for Creditors Committee discovery requests.
Lee, Grace	04/15/20	0.9	Review document review protocol for Creditors Committee discovery requests (0.4); call with D. Thomson and others regarding same (0.5).

Time Detail By Project			
Name	Date	Hours	Narrative
Leibowitz, Danielle	04/15/20	3.1	Call with Davis Polk Litigation team regarding Creditors Committee discovery request (0.5); review documents regarding same (1.8); correspondence with L. Schare regarding same (0.5); call with A. Bernstein and plaintiff's counsel regarding personal injury case (0.2); review correspondence with same regarding same (0.1).
Resnick, Brian M.	04/15/20	0.4	Call with K. Waterman and D. Thomson regarding potential vendor litigation (0.3); review emails regarding same (0.1).
Schare, Lindsay	04/15/20	2.2	Correspondence with B. Miller regarding objection to lift stay motion (0.4); correspondence with discovery attorneys and Davis Polk team regarding Creditors Committee discovery requests (1.8).
Schlosser, Jeremy	04/15/20	7.2	Review documents for Creditors Committee discovery requests (6.9); call with D. Thomson and others regarding same (0.3).
Soussan, Susan	04/15/20	0.5	Review documents for Creditors Committee discovery requests.
Thomson, Daniel J.	04/15/20	3.4	Call with Davis Polk Litigation team regarding Creditors Committee discovery requests (0.7); email with same regarding same (0.6); review documents for same (1.8); attend call with B. Resnick and K. Waterman regarding potential vendor litigation (0.3).
Bernstein, Alexander	04/16/20	7.1	Correspondence with Davis Polk team regarding Creditors Committee discovery requests (0.7); correspondence with Dean Foods team regarding same (0.7); prepare stipulation regarding motions to lift automatic stay (2.1); correspondence with Davis Polk team regarding same (1.3); correspondence with plaintiffs counsel regarding same (0.2); correspondence with Dean Foods team regarding lift stay inquiries (0.3); correspondence with Davis Polk team regarding Creditors Committee discovery requests (0.5); review documents for same (0.7); prepare summary of document review (0.6).
Cooley, Timothy	04/16/20	10.0	Review documents for Creditors Committee discovery requests.
Jouvin, Zoe	04/16/20	6.8	Review documents for Creditors Committee discovery requests.
Lee, Grace	04/16/20	3.4	Review documents for Creditors Committee discovery requests.
Leibowitz, Danielle	04/16/20	2.9	Review documents for Creditors Committee discovery requests (1.3); correspondence with L. Schare regarding same (0.5); review and revise stipulation regarding automatic stay (1.1).
Schare, Lindsay	04/16/20	1.5	Email K. Waterman regarding document production for Creditors Committee discovery requests (0.5); correspondence with Dean Foods regarding document collections (0.2); correspondence with database vendor regarding same (0.3); correspondence with Davis Polk Litigation team regarding same (0.5).
Schlosser, Jeremy	04/16/20	5.0	Review documents for Creditors Committee discovery requests.
Thomson, Daniel J.	04/16/20	1.4	Email with Davis Polk Litigation team and Dean Foods regarding document collection for Creditors Committee discovery requests.

Time Detail By Project			
Name	Date	Hours	Narrative
Bernstein, Alexander	04/17/20	4.3	Correspondence with Davis Polk team regarding informal discovery request (0.5); correspondence with Dean Foods and Davis Polk team regarding same (0.1); correspondence with opposing counsel and Davis Polk team regarding same (0.2); correspondence with Davis Polk team regarding motions to lift automatic stay (0.3); correspondence with Dean Foods and Davis Polk team regarding same (0.6); prepare stipulations regarding same (1.1); correspondence with Davis Polk team regarding document review for Creditors Committee discovery requests (0.8); correspondence with Davis Polk team and discovery attorneys regarding same (0.6); further correspondence with Dean Foods and Davis Polk team regarding same (0.1).
Butler, James C	04/17/20	6.7	Review documents for Creditors Committee discovery requests.
Cooley, Timothy	04/17/20	8.7	Review documents for Creditors Committee discovery requests.
Jouvin, Zoe	04/17/20	4.8	Review documents for Creditors Committee discovery requests.
Lee, Grace	04/17/20	1.7	Review documents for Creditors Committee discovery requests.
Leibowitz, Danielle	04/17/20	4.1	Review documents for Creditors Committee discovery requests (3.4); review draft stipulation to modify automatic stay (0.4); revise automatic stay case tracker (0.3).
Schare, Lindsay	04/17/20	2.2	Correspondence with discovery attorneys regarding document review for Creditors Committee discovery requests (1.5); emails with K. Waterman regarding same (0.4); call with same regarding same (0.3).
Schlosser, Jeremy	04/17/20	2.9	Review documents for Creditors Committee discovery requests.
Soussan, Susan	04/17/20	0.3	Correspondence with Z. Jouvin regarding Creditors Committee discovery requests.
Thomson, Daniel J.	04/17/20	1.8	Emails with Davis Polk Litigation team, discovery attorneys, and Dean Foods team regarding document production for Creditors Committee discovery requests.
Bernstein, Alexander	04/18/20	0.2	Correspondence with Davis Polk team regarding Creditors Committee discovery requests.
Cooley, Timothy	04/18/20	3.7	Review documents for Creditors Committee discovery requests.
Jouvin, Zoe	04/18/20	5.8	Review documents for Creditors Committee discovery requests.
Schare, Lindsay	04/18/20	0.4	Correspondence with database vendor regarding document management.
Thomson, Daniel J.	04/18/20	0.4	Email with database vendor and Davis Polk litigation team and Dean Foods regarding document collection and review for Creditors Committee discovery requests.
Bernstein, Alexander	04/19/20	0.4	Correspondence with Davis Polk team regarding Creditors Committee discovery requests (0.1); correspondence with Davis Polk team regarding informal discovery request (0.1); correspondence with opposing counsel and Davis Polk team regarding same (0.2).
Cooley, Timothy	04/19/20	3.6	Review documents for Creditors Committee discovery requests.
Lee, Grace	04/19/20	0.5	Review documents for Creditors Committee discovery requests.

Time Detail By Project			
Name	Date	Hours	Narrative
Schare, Lindsay	04/19/20	0.5	Correspondence with discovery attorneys regarding document review for Creditors Committee discovery requests (0.3); correspondence with A. Bernstein regarding same (0.2).
Bernstein, Alexander	04/20/20	9.6	Correspondence with Davis Polk team regarding personal injury cases (1.5); correspondence with Dean Foods and Davis Polk team regarding same (0.4); correspondence with opposing counsel and Davis Polk team regarding informal discovery requests (0.2); correspondence with Davis Polk team regarding same (0.1); call with L. Schare regarding document review for Creditors Committee discovery requests (0.2); review documents for same (0.3); correspondence with Davis Polk team regarding same (0.3); call with D. Leibowitz and N. Sokol regarding Food Lion motion to lift automatic stay (0.6); call with B. Miller and Davis Polk Restructuring team regarding same (0.4); call with Dairy Farmers of America counsel regarding same (0.4); call with movants' counsel and Davis Polk team regarding same (0.7); correspondence with D. Leibowitz regarding same (0.2); correspondence with Davis Polk team, Evercore team, and Alvarez & Marsal team regarding same (0.2); correspondence with Davis Polk team regarding same (0.2); correspondence with Norton Rose team and Davis Polk team regarding same (0.1); correspondence with Dean Foods regarding same (0.1); prepare objection regarding same (3.7).
Burke, Arthur J.	04/20/20	3.5	Correspondence with Dean Foods, co-counsel, and buyer counsel regarding Food Lion motion to lift stay (2.5); prepare pleading regarding same (1.0).
Cooley, Timothy	04/20/20	10.0	Review documents for Creditors Committee discovery requests.
Jouvin, Zoe	04/20/20	2.5	Review documents for Creditors Committee discovery requests.
Leibowitz, Danielle	04/20/20	1.8	Call with A. Bernstein and N. Sokol regarding Food Lion lift stay motion (0.6); review various docket filings and prepare draft response to same (1.2).
Miller, Benjamin M.	04/20/20	5.0	Review issues related to Food Lion lift stay motion (4.1); call with A. Bernstein and Davis Polk Restructuring team regarding same (0.4); correspondence with A. Burke regarding same (0.5).
Moskowitz, Elliot	04/20/20	2.4	Review Food Lion lift-stay motion (0.3); correspondence with Davis Polk team and opposing counsel regarding same (1.7); correspondence with Davis Polk team regarding Creditors Committee discovery requests (0.4).
Resnick, Brian M.	04/20/20	2.1	Calls with G. Hasse regarding Food Lion lift stay motion (0.2); calls with Davis Polk team and K. Waterman regarding same (0.8); review filings in connection with same (0.3); emails with Davis Polk team regarding same (0.4); call with counterparties regarding same (0.4).
Schare, Lindsay	04/20/20	1.4	Call with Davis Polk team regarding Food Lion lift stay motion (0.4); follow-up call regarding same (0.4); correspondence with K. Waterman regarding Creditors Committee discovery requests (0.3); correspondence with discovery attorneys regarding document review for same (0.3).
Schlosser, Jeremy	04/20/20	6.3	Review documents for Creditors Committee discovery requests.

Time Detail By Project			
Name	Date	Hours	Narrative
Sokol, Nate	04/20/20	1.4	Call with A. Bernstein and D. Leibowitz regarding lift stay motions (0.6); call with S. Szanzer, A. Bernstein, and B. Miller regarding same (0.4); email with A. Bernstein and others regarding pending litigation and lift stay motions (0.4).
Szanzer, Steven Z.	04/20/20	0.8	Call with N. Sokol, A. Bernstein, and B. Miller regarding Food Lion lift stay motion (0.4); correspondence with same regarding same (0.4).
Thomson, Daniel J.	04/20/20	2.0	Review documents for Creditors Committee discovery requests (1.6); email with Davis Polk team and database vendor regarding document collection for same (0.4).
Bernstein, Alexander	04/21/20	8.2	Review correspondence from Dean Foods regarding ongoing litigation (0.1); correspondence with Dean Foods and Davis Polk teams regarding informal discovery request (0.3); correspondence with Davis Polk team regarding same (0.1); call with J. Matthews regarding same (0.3); review motion to lift automatic stay regarding personal injury case (0.2); call with D. Leibowitz regarding same (0.4); correspondence with Dean Foods, Davis Polk team regarding same (0.2); call with Dean Foods and D. Leibowitz regarding same (0.5); prepare stipulations regarding same (1.1); correspondence with Davis Polk team regarding same (1.0); correspondence with plaintiffs' counsel and Davis Polk team regarding same (0.1); prepare objection regarding motion to lift automatic stay (2.7); correspondence with Davis Polk team regarding same (0.5); call with B. Miller regarding same (0.3); correspondence with Davis Polk team and co-advisors regarding same (0.4).
Burke, Arthur J.	04/21/20	1.0	Revise opposition to Food Lion lift stay motion.
Jouvin, Zoe	04/21/20	2.5	Review documents for Creditors Committee discovery requests.
Leibowitz, Danielle	04/21/20	3.1	Review and revise draft response to Food Lion lift stay motion (0.7); review and revise draft stipulation to modify automatic stay (0.9); review documents in connection with informal discovery request (0.6); call with A. Bernstein regarding same (0.4); call with A. Bernstein and Dean Foods team regarding same (0.5).
Miller, Benjamin M.	04/21/20	1.4	Review issues related to Food Lion lift stay motion (1.1); call with A. Bernstein regarding same (0.3).
Moskowitz, Elliot	04/21/20	1.1	Review draft response to Food Lion lift stay motion (0.9); revise stipulation with Food Lion (0.2).
Resnick, Brian M.	04/21/20	1.1	Review response to Food Lion lift stay motion (0.5); correspondence with Davis Polk team regarding same (0.2); call with G. Hasse regarding Food Lion lift stay motion (0.1); correspondence with Davis Polk team and Dean Foods regarding same (0.3).
Schare, Lindsay	04/21/20	0.3	Correspondence with Davis Polk Litigation team regarding document review for Creditors Committee discovery requests.
Schlosser, Jeremy	04/21/20	1.7	Review documents for Creditors Committee discovery requests.
Thomson, Daniel J.	04/21/20	3.1	Review documents for Creditors Committee discovery requests.

Time Detail By Project			
Name	Date	Hours	Narrative
Bernstein, Alexander	04/22/20	11.0	Prepare stipulations regarding lift-stay requests (1.3); correspondence with plaintiffs' counsel and Davis Polk team regarding same (1.1); correspondence with Davis Polk team regarding same (0.7); correspondence with N. Sokol regarding same (0.1); call with plaintiff's counsel regarding motion to lift automatic stay (0.2); review local rules regarding same (0.1); prepare response to motion to lift automatic stay (3.7); review and revise declaration regarding same (0.6); correspondence with Davis Polk team regarding same (0.6); call with D. Leibowitz regarding same (0.4); correspondence with Davis Polk team and co-advisors regarding same (0.2); correspondence with Dean Foods and Davis Polk team regarding informal discovery request (0.2); correspondence with opposing counsel and Davis Polk team regarding same (0.2); correspondence with Davis Polk team regarding same (0.4); call with plaintiff's counsel regarding motion to extend automatic stay (0.3); correspondence with Davis Polk team regarding same (0.2); correspondence with L. Schare regarding document review for Creditors Committee discovery requests (0.5); correspondence with L. Schare regarding litigation workstreams (0.2).
Butler, James C	04/22/20	0.2	Review documents for Creditors Committee discovery requests.
Cooley, Timothy	04/22/20	4.7	Review documents for Creditors Committee discovery requests.
Jouvin, Zoe	04/22/20	4.3	Review documents for Creditors Committee discovery request.
Lee, Grace	04/22/20	0.6	Review documents for Creditors Committee discovery requests.
Leibowitz, Danielle	04/22/20	9.0	Review and revise declaration in support of objection to Food Lion lift stay motion (1.9); call with A. Bernstein regarding same (0.4); legal research regarding Food Lion lift stay motion (2.7); draft objection to same (2.9); correspondence with L. Schare regarding document review for Creditors Committee discovery requests (0.3); review documents relating to same (0.8).
Miller, Benjamin M.	04/22/20	1.0	Review issues for objection to Food Lion lift stay motion.
Moskowitz, Elliot	04/22/20	2.0	Correspondence with Davis Polk team regarding automatic stay issues (1.4); correspondence with same regarding objection to Food Lion lift stay motion (0.6).
Schare, Lindsay	04/22/20	1.6	Review document production request in connection with Creditors Committee discovery (1.0); email E. Moskowitz and Creditors Committee regarding status and scope of same (0.6).
Schlosser, Jeremy	04/22/20	7.5	Review documents for Creditors Committee discovery requests.
Thomson, Daniel J.	04/22/20	1.4	Review documents for Creditors Committee discovery requests (0.6); email with Davis Polk Litigation team regarding discovery workstreams (0.8).

Time Detail By Project			
Name	Date	Hours	Narrative
Bernstein, Alexander	04/23/20	6.3	Correspondence with Davis Polk team regarding informal discovery request (0.2); correspondence with opposing counsel and Davis Polk team regarding same (0.3); correspondence with D. Leibowitz regarding same (0.1); review summary chart regarding same (0.3); correspondence with movants' counsel and Davis Polk team regarding same (0.2); correspondence with Dean Foods and Davis Polk team regarding ongoing litigation (0.1); prepare stipulation regarding motions to lift automatic stay (0.3); correspondence with Davis Polk team regarding same (0.6); correspondence with movants' counsel and Davis Polk team regarding same (0.3); prepare objection to motion to lift automatic stay (1.6); correspondence with Davis Polk team regarding same (0.3); correspondence with Davis Polk team and co-advisors regarding same (0.2); call with D. Leibowitz and N. Haughey regarding same (0.5); call with D. Leibowitz regarding same (0.2); review and revise declaration regarding same (0.8); correspondence with Davis Polk team regarding same (0.1); correspondence with Davis Polk team regarding Creditors Committee discovery requests (0.1); correspondence with Davis Polk team and discovery attorneys regarding document review for same (0.1).
Burke, Arthur J.	04/23/20	1.0	Review and revise objection to Food Lion motion to lift the stay.
Butler, James C	04/23/20	2.8	Review documents for Creditors Committee discovery requests.
Cooley, Timothy	04/23/20	4.3	Review documents for Creditors Committee discovery requests.
Ionescu, Alex	04/23/20	0.2	Review documents for Creditors Committee discovery requests.
Lee, Grace	04/23/20	0.5	Review documents for Creditors Committee discovery requests.
Leibowitz, Danielle	04/23/20	6.7	Review and process Dean Foods documents in connection with informal discovery request (1.6); prepare document tracker regarding same (1.1); call with N. Haughey and A. Bernstein regarding objection to Food Lion lift stay motion (0.5); call with A. Bernstein regarding same (0.2); review and revise declaration in support of same (1.9); update lift stay case tracker (0.4); review documents for Creditors Committee discovery requests (0.7); correspondence with Davis Polk Litigation team regarding same (0.3).
Miller, Benjamin M.	04/23/20	5.1	Prepare antitrust section to objection to Food Lion lift stay motion.
Moskowitz, Elliot	04/23/20	1.8	Revise Sabatte family stipulation (0.8); respond to Creditors Committee discovery requests (0.6); review Bondholder pleading regarding Food Lion lift stay motion (0.4).
Resnick, Brian M.	04/23/20	1.4	Correspondence with Davis Polk team regarding automatic stay issues (0.4); review Bondholder pleading regarding Food Lion lift stay motion (0.7); correspondence with Dean Foods regarding same (0.3).

Time Detail By Project			
Name	Date	Hours	Narrative
Schare, Lindsay	04/23/20	2.4	Correspondence with Davis Polk team regarding document preservation (0.6); review related emails (0.2); correspondence with discovery attorneys regarding document review for Creditors Committee discovery requests (1.0); email Creditors Committee regarding scope of same (0.1); call with K. Waterman regarding document preservation (0.5).
Schlosser, Jeremy	04/23/20	1.5	Review documents for Creditors Committee discovery requests.
Sokol, Nate	04/23/20	0.8	Call with K. Waterman and others regarding document preservation (0.5); email A. Bernstein and D. Leibowitz regarding pending litigation and lift stay motions (0.3).
Bernstein, Alexander	04/24/20	8.4	Prepare stipulations regarding lift stay motions (0.5); correspondence with plaintiffs' counsel regarding same (0.3); correspondence with Davis Polk team regarding same (0.8); telephone conference with N. Sokol and D. Leibowitz regarding same (0.5); correspondence with Dean Foods and Davis Polk team regarding same (0.5); correspondence with Davis Polk team and opposing counsel regarding informal discovery request (2.0); review documents in connection with same (0.2); prepare objection regarding motion to lift automatic stay (2.7); review pleadings regarding same (0.3); correspondence with Dean Foods and Davis Polk team regarding same (0.3); correspondence with Davis Polk team regarding same (0.3).
Jouvin, Zoe	04/24/20	0.1	Review documents for Creditors Committee discovery requests.
Leibowitz, Danielle	04/24/20	1.6	Call with A. Bernstein and N. Sokol regarding next steps for personal injury cases (0.5); update personal injury case tracker (0.5); review and produce documents for informal discovery request (0.6).
Moskowitz, Elliot	04/24/20	1.0	Correspondence with Davis Polk team regarding automatic stay issues.
Resnick, Brian M.	04/24/20	1.5	Call with E. Neiger regarding potential avoidance actions analysis (0.2); emails with Davis Polk team regarding response to Food Lion lift stay motion (0.8); call with M. Seider regarding same (0.2); emails regarding automatic stay litigations (0.3).
Schare, Lindsay	04/24/20	3.1	Prepare chart regarding employee departures for Creditors Committee discovery requests (0.9); emails with Davis Polk team regarding document review in connection with same (0.4); review Board minutes and materials in connection with same (1.0); further correspondence with Davis Polk team emails regarding same (0.5); correspondence with Dean Foods regarding same (0.3).
Sokol, Nate	04/24/20	1.0	Email with A. Bernstein and D. Leibowitz regarding pending litigation and lift stay motions (0.5); call with A. Bernstein and D. Leibowitz regarding same (0.5).
Thomson, Daniel J.	04/24/20	4.3	Email with Davis Polk Litigation team and document vendor regarding document review and production for Creditors Committee discovery requests (2.1); review documents for same (2.2).

Time Detail By Project			
Name	Date	Hours	Narrative
Bernstein, Alexander	04/25/20	4.1	Prepare objection to motion to lift automatic stay (3.0); prepare declaration regarding same (0.3); correspondence with Davis Polk team regarding same (0.6); correspondence with opposing counsel and Davis Polk team regarding informal discovery request (0.2).
Moskowitz, Elliot	04/25/20	2.3	Revise Food Lion opposition brief and declaration.
Resnick, Brian M.	04/25/20	2.0	Review and revise response to Food Lion lift stay motion (1.5); emails with Davis Polk team regarding same (0.5).
Schare, Lindsay	04/25/20	4.5	Review productions in response Creditors Committee Discovery request.
Bernstein, Alexander	04/26/20	7.5	Prepare objection regarding motion to lift automatic stay (3.0); research regarding same (0.8); prepare declaration regarding same (0.8); correspondence with Davis Polk team regarding same (1.0); telephone conference with D. Leibowitz regarding same (0.3); correspondence with Dean Foods and Davis Polk team regarding same (0.4); correspondence with other stakeholders and Davis Polk team regarding same (0.3); telephone conference with opposing counsel regarding same (0.4); prepare for same (0.4); review correspondence from plaintiff's counsel regarding stipulation regarding motion to lift automatic stay (0.1).
Burke, Arthur J.	04/26/20	1.0	Revise Food Lion motion opposition brief.
Lee, Grace	04/26/20	1.1	Review documents for Creditors Committee discovery requests.
Leibowitz, Danielle	04/26/20	3.8	Review and revise objection to Food Lion lift stay motion (2.1); legal research for same (0.8); further revise same (0.4); email E. Moskowitz regarding same (0.5).
Miller, Benjamin M.	04/26/20	0.6	Review Dairy Farmers of America comments to Food Lion motion opposition brief.
Resnick, Brian M.	04/26/20	1.3	Review and revise reply to Food Lion motion response (0.5); emails with Davis Polk team regarding same (0.4); call with counsel to movants regarding same (0.4).
Schare, Lindsay	04/26/20	1.2	Review and revise documents regarding employee departures for Creditors Committee discovery requests (0.5); emails with Davis Polk team regarding same (0.3); emails regarding review of Board materials for Creditors Committee Discovery (0.4).
Schlosser, Jeremy	04/26/20	1.3	Review documents for Creditors Committee discovery requests.
Bernstein, Alexander	04/27/20	5.6	Prepare objection regarding motion to lift automatic stay (1.7); prepare declaration regarding same (0.4); correspondence with Davis Polk team regarding objection regarding same (0.4); correspondence with Dean Foods and Davis Polk team regarding objection regarding same (0.5); correspondence with Norton Rose team, Davis Polk team regarding filing same (0.2); telephone conference with opposing counsel and Davis Polk team regarding same (0.5); correspondence with Davis Polk team regarding same (0.7);; correspondence with Davis Polk team regarding pending litigation (0.1); correspondence with Dean Foods and Davis Polk team regarding same (0.1); prepare stipulation regarding motions to lift automatic stay (0.3); correspondence with Davis Polk team regarding same (0.4); correspondence with plaintiff's counsel and Davis Polk team regarding same (0.1); correspondence with Dean Foods and Davis Polk team regarding same (0.2).

Time Detail By Project			
Name	Date	Hours	Narrative
Burke, Arthur J.	04/27/20	5.0	Correspondence with Davis Polk team regarding Food Lion motion to lift the stay (2.5); revise opposition brief for same (2.5).
Lee, Grace	04/27/20	1.0	Review documents for Creditors Committee discovery requests.
Leibowitz, Danielle	04/27/20	0.6	Review documents for Creditors Committee discovery requests.
Moskowitz, Elliot	04/27/20	3.0	Review Food Lion motion reply.
Resnick, Brian M.	04/27/20	0.5	Call with Food Lion.
Schare, Lindsay	04/27/20	4.1	Review document productions for Creditors Committee discovery requests (3.0); correspondence with Davis Polk team regarding same (1.1).
Thomson, Daniel J.	04/27/20	2.1	Review documents for Creditors Committee's discovery requests.
Bernstein, Alexander	04/28/20	6.9	Prepare stipulation regarding motion to lift automatic stay (0.4); telephone conference with D. Leibowitz regarding same (0.5); correspondence with Davis Polk team regarding same (0.9); correspondence with opposing counsel and Davis Polk team regarding same (0.4); telephone conference with plaintiff's counsel and D. Leibowitz regarding same (0.4); prepare for same (0.3); correspondence with Norton Rose team and Davis Polk team regarding same (0.2); correspondence with Dean Foods and Davis Polk team regarding Food Lion motion to lift automatic stay (0.1); correspondence with Dean Foods regarding same (0.4); review Food Lion motion reply (0.3); prepare proposed order regarding same (0.7); correspondence with Davis Polk team regarding same (0.8); correspondence with Norton Rose and Davis Polk team regarding same (0.3); correspondence with Davis Polk team regarding order regarding motion to lift automatic stay (0.3); telephone conference with B. Bruner regarding same (0.3); correspondence with Norton Rose team and Davis Polk team regarding same (0.3); correspondence with L. Schare regarding litigation workstreams (0.3).
Ionescu, Alex	04/28/20	0.7	Prepare documents review for Creditors Committee discovery requests.
Lee, Grace	04/28/20	3.2	Review documents for Creditors Committee discovery requests.
Leibowitz, Danielle	04/28/20	2.1	Call with J. Masten regarding stipulation to modify automatic stay (0.5); call with A. Bernstein regarding personal injury case deadlines (0.4); review filings and local court rules regarding personal injury case deadlines (0.7); review proposed order for court to grant objection to Food Lion motion (0.1); review correspondence regarding court order relating to S. Morgan personal injury case (0.1); draft motion to vacate court order relating to S. Morgan personal injury case (0.3).
Leibowitz, Danielle	04/28/20	1.7	Review documents for Creditors Committee discovery requests.
Moskowitz, Elliot	04/28/20	0.4	Call with plaintiff's counsel regarding pre-petition lawsuit.
Schare, Lindsay	04/28/20	2.0	Emails with Davis Polk team regarding Creditors Committee discovery requests.
Szanzer, Steven Z.	04/28/20	0.4	Review and revise proposed order denying Food Lion motion (0.2); correspondence with B. Resnick and Davis Polk Litigation team regarding same (0.2).

Time Detail By Project			
Name	Date	Hours	Narrative
Thomson, Daniel J.	04/28/20	1.6	Correspondence with Davis Polk Litigation team regarding Creditors Committee's discovery requests.
Bernstein, Alexander	04/29/20	4.1	Prepare motion to vacate (1.3); correspondence with Norton Rose team and Davis Polk team regarding same (0.8); correspondence with Davis Polk team regarding same (0.2); correspondence with opposing counsel and Davis Polk team regarding informal discovery request (0.1); correspondence with Davis Polk team regarding same (0.1); correspondence with Dean Foods and Davis Polk team regarding same (0.3); correspondence with Davis Polk team regarding motions to lift automatic stay (0.2); correspondence with opposing counsel and Davis Polk team regarding same (0.4); analyze issues relating to same (0.2); prepare stipulation regarding same (0.5).
Lee, Grace	04/29/20	2.9	Review documents for Creditors Committee discovery requests.
Leibowitz, Danielle	04/29/20	8.4	Draft motion to vacate (1.8); draft proposed order regarding same (0.3); review documents for Creditors Committee discovery requests (6.3).
Moskowitz, Elliot	04/29/20	3.3	Correspondence with Davis Polk team regarding Land O' Lakes trademark dispute (1.6); review document productions for Creditors Committee discovery requests (0.6); correspondence with counsel regarding pre-petition lawsuit (0.4) correspondence with Davis Polk team regarding personal injury lawsuit issues (0.7).
Schare, Lindsay	04/29/20	5.0	Review document productions for Creditors Committee discovery requests (4.1); emails with vendor regarding same (0.5); emails with E. Moskowitz and K. Waterman regarding same (0.4).
Thomson, Daniel J.	04/29/20	4.2	Review documents for Creditors Committee discovery requests
Bernstein, Alexander	04/30/20	5.1	Telephone conference with D. Leibowitz regarding motions to lift stay (0.3); correspondence with opposing counsel and Davis Polk team regarding same (0.7); correspondence with Davis Polk team regarding same (1.2); prepare stipulations regarding same (1.4); analyze issues regarding same (0.1); correspondence with Dean Foods and Davis Polk team regarding same (0.2); correspondence with Dean Foods and Davis Polk team regarding informal discovery request (0.3); correspondence with Davis Polk team regarding same (0.6); review and prepare motion to vacate (0.3).
Kearney, Daniel P.	04/30/20	1.0	Prepare for Land O' Lakes trademark dispute deposition (0.5); attend deposition (0.5).
Lee, Grace	04/30/20	2.0	Prepare deposition notice related Land O'Lakes trademark dispute (0.7); review documents for Creditors Committee discovery requests (1.3).
Leibowitz, Danielle	04/30/20	5.1	Review draft stipulation to modify automatic stay for personal injury case (0.6); correspondence with A. Bernstein regarding same (0.3); draft motion to modify automatic stay for personal injury case (1.4); update personal injury case tracker (0.9); review joint stipulation to vacate (0.4); review, documents for informal discovery request (0.8); review documents for Creditors Committee discovery requests (0.7).

Time Detail By Project			
Name	Date	Hours	Narrative
Schare, Lindsay	04/30/20	5.3	Review document productions for Creditors Committee discovery requests (4.5); correspondence with D. Thomson and vendor regarding same (0.8).
Thomson, Daniel J.	04/30/20	10.8	Review documents for Creditors Committee discovery requests (8.1); correspondence with L. Schare and vendor regarding same (2.7).
Total R155 LITIGATION		533.0	
R160 NON-DPW RETENTION AND FEE ISSUES			
Butler, James C	04/03/20	0.1	Correspondence with Ernst & Young team regarding U.S. Trustee comments to retention application.
Sokol, Nate	04/06/20	0.9	Email with M. Hosback, A. Smith, others regarding PricewaterhouseCoopers and Ernst & Young retention applications and fee statements (0.5); email with J. Mostrom, K. Waterman regarding professional fee applications and payment (0.2); email with Norton Rose team regarding professional fee applications and payment (0.2).
Szanzer, Steven Z.	04/06/20	0.3	Correspondence with N. Sokol regarding supplemental PricewaterhouseCoopers retention application.
Butler, James C	04/07/20	0.7	Review U.S. Trustee comments to Ernst & Young retention application (0.1); draft amended proposed order for Ernst & Young retention application (0.6).
Sokol, Nate	04/07/20	0.2	Email with J. Butler regarding Ernst & Young retention application.
Butler, James C	04/08/20	0.9	Review and revise amended proposed Ernst & Young retention order.
Butler, James C	04/09/20	0.8	Revise Ernst & Young retention order and application.
Sokol, Nate	04/09/20	0.5	Email with J. Butler and others regarding Ernst & Young retention application (0.3); review and revise Ernst & Young retention application (0.2).
Butler, James C	04/10/20	0.6	Correspondence with local counsel regarding Ernst & Young retention order (0.2); Review and revise same (0.4).
Butler, James C	04/13/20	1.5	Revise Ernst & Young amended proposed retention order.
Liu, Yichen	04/13/20	0.8	Review Deloitte retention application for scope of services (0.5); correspondence with N. Sokol regarding same (0.3).
Sokol, Nate	04/13/20	0.6	Email with J. Butler and others regarding Ernst & Young retention application (0.3); email with Y. Liu and Norton Rose team regarding Deloitte fee application (0.3).
Szanzer, Steven Z.	04/13/20	0.6	Review and revise amended order for Ernst & Young retention (0.5); correspondence with J. Butler regarding same (0.1).
Butler, James C	04/14/20	0.7	Revise amended proposed Ernst & Young retention order and notice.
Liu, Yichen	04/14/20	1.9	Correspondence with PricewaterhouseCoopers and Deloitte regarding monthly fee applications and interim fee applications (0.4); review same (1.2); correspondence with Norton Rose team regarding same (0.3).
Sokol, Nate	04/14/20	0.6	Email with A. Clark, Y. Liu and others regarding PricewaterhouseCoopers interim fee application (0.3); email with J. Butler and others regarding Ernst & Young retention application (0.3).
Erickson, Jarret	04/15/20	0.5	Review and analyze financial advisors engagement letters (0.4); correspondence with B. Resnick and No. Sokol regarding same (0.1).

Time Detail By Project			
Name	Date	Hours	Narrative
Liu, Yichen	04/15/20	0.6	Correspondence with PricewaterhouseCoopers and Deloitte teams regarding monthly and interim fee applications (0.3); review same (0.2); correspondence with Norton Rose team regarding same (0.1).
Sokol, Nate	04/15/20	0.3	Email with Y. Liu and Norton Rose team regarding Deloitte monthly fee application.
Sokol, Nate	04/16/20	0.3	Email with J. Dawson and Alvarez & Marsal team regarding professional fee applications.
Sokol, Nate	04/20/20	0.3	Email with Dean Foods regarding professional fee applications.
Sokol, Nate	04/23/20	0.2	Email with A. Clark and others regarding PricewaterhouseCoopers application.
Sokol, Nate	04/27/20	0.5	Call with G. Packer, O. Netzer, and others regarding Cushman retention.
Liu, Yichen	04/28/20	1.4	Review Interim Compensation Order and Evercore Retention Order regarding transaction fees (0.6); correspondence with S. Szanzer and B. Resnick regarding same (0.5); correspondence with Deloitte & Touche and Norton Rose team regarding Deloitte & Touche fee applications (0.3).
Szanzer, Steven Z.	04/28/20	0.5	Coordinate filing and service of Alvarez & Marsal's March fee application (0.2); review Court filings regarding Evercore fees and correspondence with B. Resnick regarding same (0.3).
Liu, Yichen	04/29/20	0.7	Correspondence with Deloitte & Touche team and Norton Rose team regarding Deloitte & Touche monthly and interim fee applications.
Total R160 NON-DPW RETENTION AND FEE ISSUES		17.0	
R170 PLAN/DISCLOSURE STATEMENT			
Resnick, Brian M.	04/01/20	0.3	Calls with B. Britton regarding potential Plan.
Liu, Yichen	04/03/20	2.7	Review and retrieve plan and disclosure statement precedents (2.5); correspondence with O. Netzer, N. Sokol, and P. Garg regarding same (0.2).
Netzer, Omer	04/03/20	1.7	Review plan and disclosure statement precedents.
Liu, Yichen	04/04/20	0.3	Retrieve relevant plan and disclosure statement precedents.
Netzer, Omer	04/04/20	0.2	Correspondence with Y. Liu regarding plan precedents.
Liu, Yichen	04/06/20	1.1	Review plan and disclosure statement precedents (0.9); correspondence with O. Netzer regarding same (0.2).
Resnick, Brian M.	04/06/20	0.3	Correspondence with Davis Polk team regarding plan issues and strategy.
Sokol, Nate	04/06/20	0.5	Call with J. Mostrom, N. Haughey, and others regarding section 1129 analysis (0.4); email with same regarding same (0.1).
Crandall, Jeffrey P.	04/07/20	0.8	Correspondence with Davis Polk team regarding labor issues for Plan.
Erickson, Jarret	04/07/20	0.5	Call with S. Szanzer, N. Sokol, and O. Netzer regarding Plan workstreams.
Liu, Yichen	04/07/20	4.9	Draft Disclosure Statement (4.4); attend call with S. Szanzer, N. Sokol, and O. Netzer regarding Plan and Disclosure Statement (0.5)
Netzer, Omer	04/07/20	5.7	Call with S. Szanzer and others regarding drafting Plan (0.5); draft Plan of Liquidation (5.2).
Resnick, Brian M.	04/07/20	0.8	Call with Davis Polk team regarding plan of liquidation issues (0.5); call with B. Britton regarding potential Plan (0.3).

Time Detail By Project			
Name	Date	Hours	Narrative
Sokol, Nate	04/07/20	1.5	Email with J. Mostrom, N. Haughey, and others regarding section 1129 liquidation analysis (0.2); email with Norton Rose team regarding Plan and Disclosure Statement preparations (0.3); call with S. Szanzer, O. Netzer, J. Erickson, Y. Liu regarding same (0.5); correspondence with B. Resnick, E. Moskowitz, O. Netzer, and others regarding same (0.5).
Szanzer, Steven Z.	04/07/20	1.0	Call with Davis Polk team regarding Plan and Disclosure Statement (0.5); correspondence with N. Sokol and O. Netzer regarding same (0.5).
Liu, Yichen	04/08/20	1.7	Review and revise Disclosure Statement.
Liu, Yichen	04/09/20	6.7	Review and revise Disclosure Statement (2.9); correspondence with Epiq team regarding voting procedures (0.2); correspondence with N. Sokol and O. Netzer regarding same (0.4); call with N. Sokol and O. Netzer regarding Plan and Disclosure Statement (0.4); review case law regarding classification of claims (2.8).
Netzer, Omer	04/09/20	6.3	Call with N. Sokol regarding Plan (0.4); call with N. Sokol and Y. Liu regarding same (0.4); draft Plan (5.5).
Resnick, Brian M.	04/09/20	0.4	Email with Davis Polk team regarding Plan and Disclosure Statement issues.
Sokol, Nate	04/09/20	1.4	Call with O. Netzer regarding Plan and Disclosure Statement preparations (0.7); email with Davis Polk capital markets and tax teams regarding Plan and Disclosure Statement preparations (0.3); call with Y. Liu and O. Netzer regarding Plan and Disclosure Statement preparations (0.4).
Altus, Leslie J.	04/10/20	2.0	Review precedent disclosure statements (1.3); correspondence with Davis Polk tax team and N. Sokol regarding Plan and Disclosure Statement (0.7).
Curran, William A.	04/10/20	1.0	Conference with L. Altus regarding Disclosure Statement.
Gibbons, Dan	04/10/20	0.8	Discuss Disclosure Statement with N Sokol.
Kronfeld, Nicholas A.	04/10/20	0.4	Correspondence with N. Sokol and D. Gibbons regarding liquidating trust issues (0.3); email with B. Resnick regarding same (0.1).
Liu, Yichen	04/10/20	3.9	Research regarding classification of claims.
Netzer, Omer	04/10/20	2.8	Correspondence with L. Altus regarding tax issues in Plan (1.1); review plan precedents (1.7).
Resnick, Brian M.	04/10/20	0.5	Emails with Davis Polk restructuring team regarding plan issues.
Sokol, Nate	04/10/20	2.4	Review Plan research and precedent (0.2); review and revise Disclosure Statement (0.8); email Y. Liu regarding same (0.2); correspondence with B. Curran, N. Kronfeld, L. Altus, O. Netzer, and others regarding Plan and Disclosure Statement preparations (1.2).
Altus, Leslie J.	04/11/20	2.1	Analyze plan timing issues.
Liu, Yichen	04/11/20	5.8	Research regarding classification of claims (3.5); review and revise Disclosure Statement (2.3).
Sokol, Nate	04/11/20	3.3	Review and revise Disclosure Statement (2.6); email Y. Liu regarding same (0.4); email D. Gibbons regarding same (0.3).
Liu, Yichen	04/12/20	5.1	Review precedent plan and disclosure statement (1.9); review and revise Disclosure Statement (3.2).
Altus, Leslie J.	04/13/20	1.8	Analysis regarding plan tax consequences.
Curran, William A.	04/13/20	0.5	Correspondence with L. Altus regarding plan emergence structure.
Gibbons, Dan	04/13/20	0.7	Review Disclosure Statement.
Jenkins, Elijah D.	04/13/20	1.1	Review Disclosure Statement precedents.

Time Detail By Project			
Name	Date	Hours	Narrative
Liu, Yichen	04/13/20	2.6	Review and revise Disclosure Statement (0.8); review precedent plans and disclosure statements (0.6); correspondence with N. Sokol and O. Netzer regarding same (0.5); correspondence with Epiq team regarding voting procedures (0.2); review proposed order for Plan Exclusivity Motion (0.3); correspondence with Norton Rose team regarding same (0.2).
Netzer, Omer	04/13/20	2.5	Call with B. Resnick and others (1.1); review and revise Plan (1.4).
Resnick, Brian M.	04/13/20	0.3	Emails with Davis Polk team regarding Plan issues.
Simpson, Kendra	04/13/20	2.1	Attend call regarding plan analysis with Davis Polk tax team.
Sokol, Nate	04/13/20	0.3	Email with Alvarez & Marsal team regarding Plan structure and planning.
Altus, Leslie J.	04/14/20	1.5	Analyze Plan emergence issues (1.0); correspondence with W. Curran regarding same (0.5).
Liu, Yichen	04/14/20	4.6	Call with N. Sokol regarding Disclosure Statement (0.4); review comments to Disclosure Statement (0.5); review precedents regarding administrative class impairment (1.2); review and revise Disclosure Statement (1.5); correspondence with P. Garg regarding same (0.1); draft email to Norton Rose team regarding releases in Plan and complex case procedures (0.9).
Netzer, Omer	04/14/20	3.4	Draft Plan.
Szanzer, Steven Z.	04/14/20	5.3	Review memorandum regarding confirmation timeline (1.0); correspondence with Alvarez & Marsal regarding same (1.3); call with K. Waterman and Alvarez & Marsal review and revise same (0.5); review and revise Disclosure Statement (2.0); correspondence with N. Sokol regarding same (0.5).
Altus, Leslie J.	04/15/20	1.2	Analyze emergence plan (0.3); call with Alvarez & Marsal regarding same (0.9).
Liu, Yichen	04/15/20	5.7	Review and summarize precedents regarding claim classification (3.3); review and summarize precedents regarding opt-outs (1.9); review email regarding foregoing from Norton Rose team (0.3); review and revise Disclosure Statement (0.2).
Netzer, Omer	04/15/20	8.9	Draft Plan.
Resnick, Brian M.	04/15/20	0.2	Call with B. Britton regarding plan.
Altus, Leslie J.	04/16/20	0.4	Review tax materials from A. Ulyanenko.
Garg, Paavani	04/16/20	1.1	Review case precedents for emergence structures.
Liu, Yichen	04/16/20	3.4	Review and revise Disclosure Statement (0.7); retrieve, review, and summarize precedents regarding claim treatment (1.6); prepare summary table regarding opt-outs (0.5); prepare summary email to Davis Polk team regarding foregoing (0.6).
Netzer, Omer	04/16/20	11.6	Draft Plan (10.8); correspondence with N. Sokol regarding same (0.4); correspondence with S. Szanzer regarding same (0.4).
Sokol, Nate	04/16/20	0.3	Email O. Netzer and P. Garg regarding Plan structure and strategy.
Altus, Leslie J.	04/17/20	1.4	Teleconference with N. Sokol regarding Plan structure tax issues (0.5); analysis regarding same (0.6); correspondence with M. Verdolini regarding same (0.3).
Netzer, Omer	04/17/20	1.1	Review and revise draft Plan.
Sokol, Nate	04/17/20	0.5	Call with L. Altus regarding Plan structure tax issues.
Szanzer, Steven Z.	04/17/20	0.2	Review emails with Davis Polk team regarding Plan issues.
Jenkins, Elijah D.	04/19/20	1.1	Review disclosure statement precedents.

Time Detail By Project			
Name	Date	Hours	Narrative
Altus, Leslie J.	04/20/20	0.6	Review California notice regarding section 1146 issues (0.3); email exchanges with Davis Polk and Alvarez & Marsal regarding same (0.3).
Resnick, Brian M.	04/20/20	0.5	Correspondence with Davis Polk team regarding Plan issues.
Sokol, Nate	04/20/20	0.5	Email with B. Resnick and S. Szanzer regarding Plan structure and strategy.
Szanzer, Steven Z.	04/20/20	0.8	Review Plan research emails from Davis Polk team (0.3); consider Plan structure issues (0.3); correspondence with B. Resnick and N. Sokol regarding same (0.2).
Altus, Leslie J.	04/21/20	0.8	Correspondence with Alvarez & Marsal regarding Plan tax issues (0.5); correspondence with N. Kronfeld and others regarding Plan timeline (0.3).
Garg, Paavani	04/21/20	4.7	Call with N. Sokol and S. Szanzer regarding claims classification (0.5); review Plan precedents regarding same (3.4); call with Davis Polk Restructuring team and Alvarez & Marsal regarding Plan structures (0.8).
Liu, Yichen	04/21/20	1.0	Correspondence with O. Netzer regarding Solicitation Motion (0.1); retrieve and review precedent solicitation motions (0.4); draft Solicitation Motion (0.5).
Netzer, Omer	04/21/20	4.8	Call with the Alvarez & Marsal team regarding Plan structure (0.9); review and revise Plan (3.4); call with S. Szanzer, N. Sokol, and P. Garg regarding same (0.5).
Resnick, Brian M.	04/21/20	1.0	Call with Alvarez & Marsal team regarding Plan (0.9); correspondence with Davis Polk team regarding same (0.1).
Sokol, Nate	04/21/20	0.3	Call with S. Szanzer, O. Netzer and P. Garg regarding Plan structure and strategy (partial attendance).
Szanzer, Steven Z.	04/21/20	1.6	Call with Alvarez & Marsal regarding Plan issues (0.9); call with N. Sokol, O. Netzer and P. Garg regarding same (0.5); correspondence with J. Stegenga regarding same (0.2).
Garg, Paavani	04/22/20	1.3	Review case precedents regarding claims classification.
Liu, Yichen	04/22/20	3.8	Retrieve and review precedent solicitation motions (0.8); draft Solicitation Motion (2.8); review and revise Disclosure Statement (0.2).
Netzer, Omer	04/22/20	5.3	Correspondence with J. Millerman regarding Plan structure tax issues (0.3); correspondence with B. Resnick and others regarding Plan structure (0.8); review and revise Plan (4.2).
Resnick, Brian M.	04/22/20	0.8	Correspondence with Davis Polk and Alvarez & Marsal teams regarding Plan structure and strategy.
Simpson, Kendra	04/22/20	0.8	Research regarding plan structures.
Sokol, Nate	04/22/20	0.4	Email with B. Resnick, S. Szanzer, and others regarding Plan structure and strategy (0.2); email N. Haughey regarding same (0.2).
Szanzer, Steven Z.	04/22/20	2.0	Review summaries and timelines for Plan structures (1.0); correspondence with Davis Polk team regarding same (0.5); correspondence with Norton Rose regarding same (0.3); correspondence with Alvarez & Marsal team regarding same (0.2).
Garg, Paavani	04/23/20	1.0	Call with Alvarez & Marsal regarding Plan structures.
Liu, Yichen	04/23/20	0.9	Draft and revise Solicitation Motion.
Netzer, Omer	04/23/20	1.0	Call with Alvarez & Marsal team regarding Plan structure.
Resnick, Brian M.	04/23/20	1.0	Call with Alvarez & Marsal team regarding Plan structure.
Sokol, Nate	04/23/20	1.0	Call with Alvarez & Marsal team regarding Plan structure.
Szanzer, Steven Z.	04/23/20	1.0	Call with Alvarez & Marsal regarding Plan structure.

Time Detail By Project			
Name	Date	Hours	Narrative
Altus, Leslie J.	04/24/20	2.8	Call with D. Drier and A. Ulyanenko regarding plan structure tax issues (0.5); research regarding same (0.5); call with Alvarez & Marsal and Davis Polk Tax team regarding same (1.0); correspondence with W. Curran regarding same (0.3); correspondence with A. Siman regarding same (0.2); follow-up correspondence with Davis Polk Restructuring team regarding same (0.3).
Garg, Paavani	04/24/20	0.8	Call with Akin Gump regarding Plan structure.
Liu, Yichen	04/24/20	0.3	Review correspondence with Davis Polk team regarding Plan and Disclosure Statement (0.1); review Local Rules regarding same (0.2).
Netzer, Omer	04/24/20	1.3	Correspondence with L. Altus and others regarding Plan structure tax issues (0.3); correspondence with D. Gibbons and others regarding plan structure capital markets issues (0.6); correspondence with B. Bruner regarding Plan filing (0.4).
Rarrick, Mohini P.B.	04/24/20	0.4	Call with Akin Gump regarding Plan structure.
Resnick, Brian M.	04/24/20	1.3	Emails with Davis Polk team and Alvarez & Marsal teams regarding Plan issues (0.6); call with Akin Gump regarding same (0.7).
Sokol, Nate	04/24/20	0.7	Call with Alvarez & Marsal team, Akin Gump, and Davis Polk Restructuring team regarding Plan structure (0.5); email with O. Netzer and others regarding same (0.2).
Szanzer, Steven Z.	04/24/20	2.1	Call with Akin Gump regarding Plan (0.8); correspondence with B. Resnick and N. Sokol regarding same (1.3).
Netzer, Omer	04/25/20	0.4	Correspondence with L. Altus regarding Plan structure tax issues.
Altus, Leslie J.	04/26/20	4.9	Review precedent disclosure statements (1.3); research regarding Plan structure (1.8); research regarding Plan structure tax issues (1.2); correspondence with J. Millerman regarding same (0.4); email with T. Presser regarding same (0.2).
Netzer, Omer	04/26/20	1.6	Review disclosure statements precedents (1.1); correspondence with T. Presser regarding same (0.5).
Presser, Talya	04/26/20	0.5	Correspondence with L. Altus regarding Plan tax issues .
Altus, Leslie J.	04/27/20	3.5	Research regarding Plan structure tax issues (2.8); email Davis Polk Tax team regarding same (0.5); email A. Ulyanenko regarding same (0.1) email with T. Presser regarding same (0.1).
Liu, Yichen	04/27/20	0.9	Retrieve and review precedent solicitation motions for combined disclosure statement and Plan hearing (0.5); revise Solicitation Motion (0.4).
Resnick, Brian M.	04/27/20	0.3	Call with Davis Polk team regarding Plan structure.
Altus, Leslie J.	04/28/20	1.8	Research regarding Plan structure tax issues (0.5); call with Davis Polk Tax team regarding same (0.8); email Davis Polk Restructuring team regarding same (0.5).
Liu, Yichen	04/28/20	3.6	Review and revise Solicitation Motion (3.3); review and revise Disclosure Statement (0.3).
Netzer, Omer	04/28/20	1.7	Correspondence with T. Presser regarding Plan tax issues (0.3); review caselaw regarding same (1.4).
Presser, Talya	04/28/20	1.0	Correspondence with Davis Polk team regarding Plan and Disclosure Statement tax issues.

Time Detail By Project			
Name	Date	Hours	Narrative
Szanzer, Steven Z.	04/28/20	1.6	Call with B. Resnick and others regarding Plan (0.3); correspondence with Norton Rose regarding same (0.2); review and revise same (1.0); correspondence with M. Lahaie regarding same (0.1).
Altus, Leslie J.	04/29/20	4.2	Research regarding Plan structure issues (3.2); call with O. Netzer and Davis Polk Tax team regarding same (1.0).
Liu, Yichen	04/29/20	4.4	Revise Solicitation Motion (1.1); correspondence with O. Netzer regarding same (0.1); retrieve and review precedent plan exclusivity motions (0.5); draft Second Plan Exclusivity Motion (2.7).
Netzer, Omer	04/29/20	1.5	Call with L. Altus and others regarding Plan tax issues (0.7); review Solicitation Motion (0.8).
Presser, Talya	04/29/20	5.8	Review Disclosure Statement.
Simpson, Kendra	04/29/20	3.2	Review disclosure statement tax issues
Szanzer, Steven Z.	04/29/20	0.1	Correspondence with Y. Liu and N. Sokol regarding Plan Exclusivity Motion.
Altus, Leslie J.	04/30/20	1.4	Research regarding plan structure (0.9); email with W. Curran regarding same (0.2); teleconference with A. Ulyanenko regarding same (0.3).
Netzer, Omer	04/30/20	4.5	Calls regarding tax refund issues with J. Millerman, L. Altus and others (2.1); review caselaw regarding same (2.4).
Presser, Talya	04/30/20	2.0	Discuss plan and tax disclosure.
Total R170 PLAN/DISCLOSURE STATEMENT		228.2	
R175 PREPARATION OF FEE STATEMENTS/APPLICATIONS AND BUDGET			
Giddens, Magali	04/01/20	2.4	Review and revise March invoice detail (0.8); calls with J. Cicchini, N. Kurian, and G. Quiah regarding time entries (1.0); review February fee application (0.4); call with V. Childs and N. Kurian regarding same (0.2).
Hug, Kayla	04/01/20	2.4	Review and revise March invoice detail (0.8); calls with J. Cicchini, N. Kurian, and G. Quiah regarding time entries (1.0); review February fee application (0.4); call with V. Childs and N. Kurian regarding same (0.2).
Giddens, Magali	04/02/20	2.6	Correspondence with Davis Polk team regarding February invoice detail (0.9); review February invoice detail (1.7).
Hug, Kayla	04/02/20	7.5	Review and revise March invoice detail (7.0); review February fee application (0.2); email correspondence with M. Giddens regarding fee application preparation process (0.3).
Giddens, Magali	04/03/20	1.4	Review and revise March invoice detail.
Hug, Kayla	04/03/20	6.5	Review and revise March invoice detail (6.0); email correspondence with M. Giddens regarding fee application preparation process (0.5).
Liu, Yichen	04/03/20	0.2	Correspondence with L. Schare regarding time entry questions.
Hug, Kayla	04/05/20	0.4	Email correspondence with Y. Liu regarding fee application preparation process.
Liu, Yichen	04/05/20	0.9	Correspondence with K. Hug regarding fee application preparation process (0.2); correspondence with Davis Polk team regarding same (0.3) prepare email to Davis Polk team regarding March time entry (0.4).
Hug, Kayla	04/06/20	4.6	Email correspondence with N. Kurian regarding fee application preparation process (0.5); review and revise March invoice detail (3.9); correspondence with Y. Liu regarding same (0.2).

Time Detail By Project			
Name	Date	Hours	Narrative
Liu, Yichen	04/06/20	0.6	Call with M. Giddens regarding March invoice detail (0.3); correspondence with K. Hug regarding same (0.1);
Hug, Kayla	04/07/20	6.1	correspondence with D. Leibowitz regarding time entry (0.2). Correspondence with Y. Liu regarding March invoice detail (0.3); email correspondence with N. Kurian regarding same (0.6); correspondence with M. Giddens regarding same (0.2); review and revise March invoice detail (5.0).
Liu, Yichen	04/07/20	4.1	Review and revise March invoice detail (3.7); correspondence with K. Hug regarding same (0.4).
Giddens, Magali	04/08/20	0.4	Correspondence with O. Altman regarding March invoice detail.
Hug, Kayla	04/08/20	4.6	Correspondence with N. Kurian regarding March invoice detail (0.8); correspondence with Y. Liu regarding same (0.3); review and revise March invoice detail (3.5).
Liu, Yichen	04/08/20	10.1	Review and revise March invoice detail (9.6); correspondence with K. Hug regarding same (0.5).
Giddens, Magali	04/09/20	2.3	Correspondence with Y. Liu regarding March invoice detail (0.2); correspondence with K. Hug and O. Altman regarding status of same (0.2); correspondence with N. Kurian regarding same (0.1); review and revise March invoice detail(1.8).
Liu, Yichen	04/09/20	3.7	Review and revise March invoice detail (3.2); correspondence with K. Hug and M. Giddens regarding same (0.5).
Giddens, Magali	04/10/20	4.6	Review and revise March invoice detail (4.5); correspondence with Y. Liu regarding time entries (0.1).
Hug, Kayla	04/10/20	0.3	Email correspondence with Davis Polk team regarding March invoice detail.
Liu, Yichen	04/10/20	2.5	Review and revise March invoice detail (2.2); correspondence with K. Hug and M. Giddens regarding same (0.3).
Giddens, Magali	04/11/20	5.1	Review and revise March invoice detail (4.5); correspondence with J. Cicchini regarding same (0.6);
Liu, Yichen	04/12/20	2.6	Review March invoice detail.
Sokol, Nate	04/12/20	4.3	Review and revise March invoice detail.
Giddens, Magali	04/13/20	2.6	Review and revise March invoice detail.
Hug, Kayla	04/13/20	0.1	Correspondence with M. Giddens regarding March fee application timeline.
Liu, Yichen	04/13/20	5.6	Review and revise March invoice detail (4.8); call with M. Giddens regarding same (0.3); correspondence with Davis Polk team regarding same (0.5).
Rarrick, Mohini P.B.	04/13/20	1.8	Review and revise March invoice detail.
Sokol, Nate	04/13/20	0.4	Email with Y. Liu and M. Rarrick regarding March fee application.
Szanzer, Steven Z.	04/13/20	0.3	Correspondence with Y. Liu and N. Sokol regarding March invoice detail.
Giddens, Magali	04/14/20	3.8	Review and revise March invoice detail.
Liu, Yichen	04/14/20	2.3	Review and revise March invoice detail (1.9); correspondence with M. Giddens regarding same (0.3); correspondence with S. Szanzer and N. Sokol regarding same (0.1).
Rarrick, Mohini P.B.	04/14/20	2.0	Review certificates of no objection to interim fee applications (1.5); review and revise March invoice detail (0.5).
Szanzer, Steven Z.	04/14/20	0.3	Correspondence with Davis Polk team regarding March invoice detail.
Giddens, Magali	04/15/20	2.6	Review and revise March invoice detail (1.6); call with Y. Liu regarding same (1.0).

Time Detail By Project			
Name	Date	Hours	Narrative
Liu, Yichen	04/15/20	4.3	Review and revise March invoice detail (2.1); call with M. Giddens and C. Cicchini regarding same (1.0); correspondence with M. Rarrick regarding same (0.5); email N. Sokol regarding same (0.7).
Rarrick, Mohini P.B.	04/15/20	4.0	Review and revise March invoice detail (3.0); review certificates of no objection regarding February fee applications (1.0).
Liu, Yichen	04/16/20	4.2	Call with N. Sokol and M. Rarrick regarding March invoice preparation (0.5); review and revise March invoice detail (3.7).
Rarrick, Mohini P.B.	04/16/20	2.8	Review and revise March invoice detail (2.3); call with N. Sokol regarding March invoice preparation (0.5).
Sokol, Nate	04/16/20	0.5	Call with M. Rarrick and Y. Liu regarding March invoice preparation.
Giddens, Magali	04/17/20	2.3	Review and revise March invoice detail.
Liu, Yichen	04/17/20	5.9	Review and revise March invoice detail (5.8); correspondence with Davis Polk team regarding same (0.1).
Rarrick, Mohini P.B.	04/17/20	3.2	Review and revise March invoice detail.
Bernstein, Alexander	04/18/20	1.9	Review March invoice detail (1.8); correspondence with Davis Polk team regarding same (0.1).
Liu, Yichen	04/18/20	5.0	Review and revise March invoice detail (4.3); correspondence with M. Rarrick regarding same (0.5); correspondence with Davis Polk Litigation team regarding privilege review of same (0.2).
Rarrick, Mohini P.B.	04/18/20	4.9	Review and revise March invoice detail (4.7); correspondence with Y. Liu and N. Sokol regarding same (0.2).
Sokol, Nate	04/18/20	4.0	Review and revise March invoice detail.
Bernstein, Alexander	04/19/20	1.2	Review March invoice detail (1.1); correspondence with Davis Polk team regarding same (0.1).
Liu, Yichen	04/19/20	2.7	Review and revise March invoice detail (2.6); correspondence with N. Sokol regarding same (0.1).
Rarrick, Mohini P.B.	04/19/20	1.1	Review and revise March invoice detail.
Sokol, Nate	04/19/20	3.3	Review and revise March invoice detail.
Bernstein, Alexander	04/20/20	2.7	Review March invoice detail (2.3); correspondence with Davis Polk team regarding same (0.4).
Giddens, Magali	04/20/20	0.6	Review March invoice detail.
Liu, Yichen	04/20/20	5.0	Correspondence with A. Bernstein regarding March invoice (0.6); correspondence with N. Sokol regarding same (0.3); correspondence with M. Rarrick regarding same (0.1); review and revise March invoice detail (3.1); correspondence with M. Giddens and K. Hug regarding March expense disbursements (0.2); correspondence with N. Kurian regarding same (0.2); correspondence with B. Resnick regarding February invoice detail (0.1); correspondence with M. Giddens regarding March invoice detail (0.4).
Rarrick, Mohini P.B.	04/20/20	2.9	Review and revise March invoice detail (2.5); correspondence with Davis Polk team regarding same (0.4).
Szanzer, Steven Z.	04/20/20	0.2	Correspondence with Y. Liu and M. Rarrick regarding March invoice detail.
Bernstein, Alexander	04/21/20	0.7	Review March invoice detail (0.6); correspondence with Davis Polk team regarding same (0.1).
Giddens, Magali	04/21/20	2.9	Review and revise March invoice detail .
Hug, Kayla	04/21/20	0.6	Correspondence with M. Giddens and N. Kurian regarding March invoice detail.

Time Detail By Project			
Name	Date	Hours	Narrative
Liu, Yichen	04/21/20	4.2	Review and revise March invoice detail (3.0); correspondence with M. Rarrick regarding same (0.4); correspondence with M. Giddens regarding same (0.4); call with M. Giddens regarding same (0.3); correspondence with N. Kurian regarding same (0.1).
Rarrick, Mohini P.B.	04/21/20	5.2	Review and revise March invoice detail (4.5); correspondence with Davis Polk team regarding same (0.7).
Szanzer, Steven Z.	04/21/20	0.3	Correspondence with Y. Liu and B. Resnick regarding March invoice detail.
Giddens, Magali	04/22/20	4.3	Review and revise March disbursement detail entries.
Hug, Kayla	04/22/20	3.2	Correspondence with N. Kurian regarding March invoice detail (0.5); correspondence with M. Giddens regarding same (0.2); review and revise same (2.5).
Liu, Yichen	04/22/20	0.8	Correspondence with S. Szanzer and B. Resnick regarding March invoice detail (0.5); correspondence with M. Giddens regarding same (0.3).
Rarrick, Mohini P.B.	04/22/20	0.8	Review and revise March invoice detail.
Szanzer, Steven Z.	04/22/20	5.8	Review and revise March invoice detail (5.5); correspondence with M. Rarrick, Y. Liu, and N. Sokol regarding same (0.3).
Thomson, Daniel J.	04/22/20	1.5	Review March invoice detail.
Giddens, Magali	04/23/20	4.3	Review March invoice detail and related fee issues.
Hug, Kayla	04/23/20	3.0	Correspondence with M. Giddens and N. Kurian regarding March invoice detail (1.0); review and revise March invoice detail (2.0).
Liu, Yichen	04/23/20	5.3	Review and revise March invoice detail (4.2); correspondence with S. Szanzer and N. Sokol regarding same (0.5); correspondence with M. Rarrick regarding same (0.3); correspondence with M. Giddens regarding same (0.3).
Rarrick, Mohini P.B.	04/23/20	1.7	Review and revise March invoice detail.
Szanzer, Steven Z.	04/23/20	0.3	Correspondence with Y. Liu, M. Rarrick, and N. Sokol regarding March invoice detail.
Thomson, Daniel J.	04/23/20	1.3	Review March invoice detail.
Giddens, Magali	04/24/20	5.1	Review March invoice detail.
Hug, Kayla	04/24/20	4.0	Review March invoice detail (3.0); correspondence with Davis Polk Travel department regarding disbursement inquiries (0.6); correspondence with M. Giddens regarding same (0.4).
Liu, Yichen	04/24/20	5.4	Draft March Fee Application (0.6); review and revise March invoice detail (3.0); attend call with S. Szanzer and others from Davis Polk regarding billing process (1.0); correspondence with M. Giddens regarding March invoice detail (0.3); correspondence with N. Sokol regarding same (0.1); correspondence with M. Rarrick regarding same (0.3); correspondence with N. Kurian regarding same (0.1).
Rarrick, Mohini P.B.	04/24/20	2.7	Review and revise March invoice detail.
Sokol, Nate	04/24/20	0.8	Call with S. Szanzer, Y. Liu, M. Rarrick, and others regarding invoice preparation process.
Szanzer, Steven Z.	04/24/20	0.8	Call with Davis Polk team regarding invoice preparation process.
Liu, Yichen	04/25/20	2.9	Review and revise March invoice detail (0.3); draft Davis Polk March Fee Application (2.3); correspondence with M. Giddens regarding same and March invoice detail (0.3).
Giddens, Magali	04/26/20	4.6	Review and revise March Fee Application .
Liu, Yichen	04/26/20	0.2	Correspondence with M. Giddens regarding Davis Polk March Fee Application and March invoice detail.
Rarrick, Mohini P.B.	04/26/20	1.1	Review and revise March invoice detail.

Time Detail By Project			
Name	Date	Hours	Narrative
Sokol, Nate	04/26/20	1.3	Review and revise March Fee Application (1.0); email M. Rarrick and Y. Liu regarding same (0.3).
Giddens, Magali	04/27/20	9.8	Review and revise March invoice detail.
Hug, Kayla	04/27/20	1.0	Email correspondence with Davis Polk team regarding timekeeper summary chart.
Liu, Yichen	04/27/20	6.4	Finalize March Fee Application (3.9); review March expense disbursements (1.0); correspondence with M. Giddens regarding same (0.7); calls with S. Szanzer regarding same (0.2); correspondence with B. Resnick and S. Szanzer regarding same (0.4); correspondence with M. Rarrick regarding same (0.2).
Rarrick, Mohini P.B.	04/27/20	1.0	Correspondence with Y. Liu regarding March invoice detail (0.5); review March Fee Application (0.5).
Szanzer, Steven Z.	04/27/20	1.8	Correspondence and call with Y. Liu regarding March Fee Application (0.3); review and revise same (1.3); correspondence with B. Resnick regarding same (0.2).
Giddens, Magali	04/28/20	4.1	Review and revise April invoice detail.
Liu, Yichen	04/28/20	0.5	Correspondence with M. Giddens regarding April time entries.
Giddens, Magali	04/29/20	5.1	Review and revise April invoice detail.
Liu, Yichen	04/29/20	0.2	Correspondence with M. Giddens regarding April time entries.
Liu, Yichen	04/30/20	0.5	Correspondence with M. Giddens regarding April invoice detail (0.4); correspondence with U.S. Trustee regarding LEDES file for March Fee Application (0.1).
Total R175 PREPARATION OF FEE STATEMENTS/APPLICATIONS AND BUDGET		270.2	
R180 REGULATORY AND ENVIRONMENTAL			
Burke, Arthur J.	04/01/20	3.0	Correspondence with Davis Polk team regarding Department of Justice inquiries (0.8); prepare for and call with buyer counsel regarding Department of Justice status and strategy (0.7); calls and emails with Evercore team regarding Department of Justice inquiry (0.5); correspondence with Davis Polk team regarding antitrust analysis and status (0.5); correspondence with Evercore regarding same (0.5).
Miller, Benjamin M.	04/01/20	2.3	Review Department of Justice and other regulatory submissions (0.5); call with Department of Justice regarding regulatory review (0.4); call with bidder counsel regarding same (0.4); correspondence with Davis Polk team regarding Department of Justice questions (1.0).
Wohlberg, Charlie	04/01/20	0.1	Review regulatory inquiries in connection with potential Dean Foods transaction.
Burke, Arthur J.	04/02/20	2.3	Calls and emails with bidder counsel, Evercore, and Department of Justice regarding regulatory review (1.5); calls and emails with Department of Justice, Dean Foods, and Davis Polk team regarding status of same (0.8).
Miller, Benjamin M.	04/02/20	7.8	Analysis of regulatory issues (3.5); review correspondence regarding Department of Justice inquiries (3.0); call with Department of Justice (0.3); calls with Davis Polk team regarding Department of Justice questions (0.6); attend update call with Dean Foods legal team regarding same (0.4).
Resnick, Brian M.	04/02/20	0.6	Calls with A. Burke and K. Waterman regarding antitrust issues.

Time Detail By Project			
Name	Date	Hours	Narrative
Wohlberg, Charlie	04/02/20	4.8	Analyze case law pertaining to regulatory issues in connection with bankruptcy proceeding (4.5); correspondence with B Miller concerning same (0.3).
Schiavone, Cara	04/03/20	0.4	Correspondence with C. Wohlberg and B. Miller regarding regulatory submission materials (0.2); prepare documents for submission to Department of Justice (0.2).
Wohlberg, Charlie	04/03/20	7.6	Review regulatory submission materials (7.2); correspondence with B. Miller concerning same (0.3); correspondence with C. Schiavone concerning production requirements in connection with same (0.1).
Miller, Benjamin M.	04/04/20	1.5	Prepare responses to Department of Justice and other regulators.
Rubin, Nathaniel F.	04/04/20	0.3	Research regarding jurisdictional issues.
Wohlberg, Charlie	04/04/20	2.1	Review regulatory submission materials (2.0); correspondence with B. Miller concerning same (0.1).
Miller, Benjamin M.	04/05/20	0.9	Prepare Department of Justice production materials (0.8); correspondence with C. Schiavone regarding same (0.1).
Schiavone, Cara	04/05/20	4.8	Prepare documents for submission to Department of Justice.
Wohlberg, Charlie	04/05/20	2.7	Correspondence with C. Schiavone concerning regulatory submission materials (0.1); review Dean Foods documents in connection with same (2.6).
Burke, Arthur J.	04/06/20	2.3	Calls and emails with Department of Justice and buyer counsel regarding Department of Justice inquiries (1.3); prepare for same (0.2); call with Department of Justice (0.8).
Miller, Benjamin M.	04/06/20	2.4	Call with N. Rubin regarding regulatory issues (0.4); call with Dean Foods business team in connection with same (0.8); prepare Department of Justice submission materials (0.5); finalize regulatory submission materials (0.4); call with N. Rubin regarding regulatory issues (0.3).
Resnick, Brian M.	04/06/20	1.7	Correspondence with A. Burke regarding antitrust issues and strategy (0.6); calls with Dean Foods regarding same (1.1).
Rubin, Nathaniel F.	04/06/20	0.3	Conference with B. Miller regarding status of antitrust issues.
Schiavone, Cara	04/06/20	1.2	Prepare Department of Justice submission materials.
Burke, Arthur J.	04/07/20	3.7	Calls and emails with Dean Foods and Evercore team regarding Department of Justice regulatory review status (1.0); review draft consent decree (1.2); call with B. Miller regarding same (0.3); call with buyer counsel regarding status of regulatory review (0.5); prepare for and participate in call with Department of Justice regarding regulatory review status (0.5); call with B. Resnick regarding same (0.2).
Miller, Benjamin M.	04/07/20	2.4	Finalize Department of Justice submission material (0.6); attend call with Dean Foods and Evercore team regarding Department of Justice regulatory review (1.0); review draft Department of Justice consent decree (0.5); call with A. Burke regarding same (0.3).
Resnick, Brian M.	04/07/20	1.2	Call with Dean Foods, Evercore, and Davis Polk team regarding antitrust issues (1.0); calls with A. Burke regarding same (0.2).
Sokol, Nate	04/07/20	0.6	Call with D. Zilberberg regarding environmental questions.
Zilberberg, David A.	04/07/20	3.0	Review environmental documents (2.4); call with N. Sokol regarding same (0.6).

Time Detail By Project			
Name	Date	Hours	Narrative
Burke, Arthur J.	04/08/20	3.8	Prepare for and participate in call with Department of Justice (1.5); calls and emails with Dairy Farmers of America regarding consent decree (0.8); follow up correspondence with same regarding Department of Justice information requests (0.5); correspondence with Dean Foods and Davis Polk team regarding Prairie Farms deal status and Department of Justice review (1.0).
Miller, Benjamin M.	04/08/20	2.0	Call with Department of Justice (0.5); preparation for same (0.9); call with Dairy Farmers of America counsel regarding consent decree (0.6).
Resnick, Brian M.	04/08/20	0.4	Correspondence with A. Burke and K. Waterman regarding antitrust issues.
Burke, Arthur J.	04/09/20	2.3	Correspondence with Dean Foods and Davis Polk team regarding Department of Justice investigation (1.8); correspondence with same regarding Dairy Farmers of America consent decree (0.5).
Miller, Benjamin M.	04/09/20	0.3	Correspondence with Davis Polk intellectual property team regarding brand issues.
Woller, Christopher C.	04/09/20	0.4	Correspondence with Davis Polk team regarding Department of Justice draft consent decree.
Burke, Arthur J.	04/10/20	2.0	Correspondence with Dean Foods and Davis Polk team regarding Prairie Farms Asset Purchase Agreement and Department of Justice engagement.
Miller, Benjamin M.	04/10/20	2.1	Call with Department of Justice and Dairy Farmers of America counsel regarding consent decree (0.8); call with Department of Justice regarding Prairie Farms bid (0.4); correspondence regarding information requests (0.4); call with Prairie Farms antitrust counsel (0.5).
Resnick, Brian M.	04/10/20	0.4	Correspondence with A. Burke regarding antitrust issues.
Zilberberg, David A.	04/11/20	0.6	Review tax credit issue and emails regarding same.
Burke, Arthur J.	04/13/20	2.0	Correspondence with Dean Foods, Prairie Farms counsel, and Department of Justice regarding Prairie Farms status.
Miller, Benjamin M.	04/13/20	1.4	Correspondence with Prairie Farms counsel and Department of Justice (0.7); review Department of Justice requests (0.7).
Resnick, Brian M.	04/13/20	1.3	Calls with J. Kimm and K. Waterman regarding antitrust issues (0.9); call with M. Lahaie regarding same (0.4).
Burke, Arthur J.	04/14/20	3.0	Prepare for and call with Department of Justice regarding competitive landscape (1.5); prepare for and participate in call with Department of Justice regarding Evercore shop process (1.0); calls and emails regarding waiver letter (0.5).
Ionescu, Alex	04/14/20	2.5	Prepare Dean Foods materials for production for regulatory requests.
Miller, Benjamin M.	04/14/20	7.5	Correspondence with Davis Polk team and Dean Foods regarding Department of Justice requests (3.8); calls with Department of Justice and Prairie Farms counsel regarding Prairie Farms bid (1.1); calls with Department of Justice and Dean Foods regarding sale facilities (1.5); calls with Evercore and Department of Justice regarding shop process (1.1).
Resnick, Brian M.	04/14/20	1.8	Calls with Dean Foods and Davis Polk team regarding antitrust issues regarding Prairie Farms and Dairy Farmers of America (1.3); call with Department of Justice regarding same (0.5).
Schiavone, Cara	04/14/20	0.8	Prepare document production for Department of Justice.
Siman, Ariel David	04/14/20	0.8	Research question regarding CARES ACT.

Time Detail By Project			
Name	Date	Hours	Narrative
Sokol, Nate	04/14/20	0.3	Email with D. Zilberberg, and J. Lichstein regarding environmental regulatory issues.
Altus, Leslie J.	04/15/20	0.7	Email A. Siman and N. Sokol regarding environmental tax credit.
Burke, Arthur J.	04/15/20	7.5	Draft letters to Department of Justice regarding (2.3); call with B. Miller regarding same (0.2); prepare for and participate in call with Department of Justice regarding Prairie Farms sale (2.1); follow-up calls with Department of Justice, Dean Foods, and Prairie Farms counsel regarding same (1.4); prepare and review submission to Department of Justice in connection with same (1.5).
Miller, Benjamin M.	04/15/20	10.0	Prepare submissions to Department of Justice (1.9); call with Prairie Farms counsel regarding same (0.5); call with Department of Justice (0.9); call with Dean Foods team regarding status of regulatory review (0.5); draft letter regarding regulatory inquiries (5.7); call with A. Burke regarding same (0.2); review Davis Polk team correspondence regarding same (0.3).
Resnick, Brian M.	04/15/20	2.4	Call with Dean Foods and Davis Polk Antitrust team regarding status of Department of Justice review of Prairie Farms sale (0.5); call with Department of Justice regarding same (0.9); follow-up call with A. Burke and K. Waterman regarding same (0.2); correspondence with Davis Polk team regarding response to Department of Justice (0.8).
Schiavone, Cara	04/15/20	1.2	Prepare document production to Department of Justice.
Sokol, Nate	04/15/20	0.2	Email with D. Zilberberg and J. Lichstein regarding environmental regulatory issues.
Thomson, Daniel J.	04/15/20	1.8	Correspondence with Davis Polk Antitrust team and conduct research regarding request for information from Department of Justice.
Burke, Arthur J.	04/16/20	4.6	Prepare and submit Department of Justice materials regarding Prairie Farms (3.3); calls and correspondence with Department of Justice, Prairie Farms counsel, and Dean Foods regarding deal status (1.3).
Miller, Benjamin M.	04/16/20	7.5	Finalize letter to Department of Justice regarding regulatory review.
Resnick, Brian M.	04/16/20	0.6	Review letter to Department of Justice and related materials (0.3); correspondence with Davis Polk Antitrust team regarding same (0.3).
Rubin, Nathaniel F.	04/16/20	4.6	Prepare and submit Department of Justice materials regarding Prairie Farms (3.3); calls and correspondence with Department of Justice, Prairie Farms counsel, and Dean Foods regarding deal status (1.3).
Thomson, Daniel J.	04/16/20	3.1	Review and revise declaration from co-advisor in response to regulatory request (2.7); correspondence with Davis Polk and advisor teams regarding same (0.4).
Burke, Arthur J.	04/17/20	3.5	Calls and correspondence with Department of Justice regarding consent decree (1.2); calls and emails with Dean Foods and Davis Polk team regarding status of Department of Justice review of Prairie Farms transaction (1.3); calls and correspondence with Prairie Farms counsel and state Attorney General regarding same (1.0).
Miller, Benjamin M.	04/17/20	1.9	Review Department of Justice data requests.
Sokol, Nate	04/17/20	0.3	Email with D. Zilberberg, J. Lichstein, and L. Altus regarding environmental regulatory issues.

Time Detail By Project			
Name	Date	Hours	Narrative
Zilberberg, David A.	04/17/20	0.5	Review environmental issues (0.3); correspondence with N Sokol and L Altus regarding same (0.2).
Kronfeld, Nicholas A.	04/18/20	1.0	Review presentation and analyze securities law compliance issues.
Miller, Benjamin M.	04/18/20	1.2	Review Department of Justice data requests.
Burke, Arthur J.	04/19/20	0.5	Correspondence with Davis Polk team regarding Department of Justice information requests.
Miller, Benjamin M.	04/19/20	0.2	Finalize Department of Justice data submission.
Sokol, Nate	04/19/20	0.3	Email with D. Zilberberg and J. Lichstein regarding environmental regulatory issues.
Zilberberg, David A.	04/19/20	1.4	Correspondence with N. Sokol, L. Altus, and J. Lichstein regarding Miami property (0.8); review site agreements in connection with same (0.6).
Burke, Arthur J.	04/20/20	0.5	Prepare for and call with state General Counsel regarding regulatory review status.
Millerman, James M.	04/20/20	0.4	Review media article regarding antitrust review and email Davis Polk team regarding same.
Sokol, Nate	04/20/20	1.6	Email D. Zilberberg and J. Lichstein regarding environmental regulatory issues (0.2); call with D. Zilberberg and J. Lichstein regarding same (0.6); review letter to environmental regulator (0.6); email D. Zilberberg and J. Lichstein regarding same (0.2).
Zilberberg, David A.	04/20/20	1.7	Conference call with J. Lichstein and N Sokol (0.6); review draft documents in connection with same (0.4); review site agreements for same (0.7).
Burke, Arthur J.	04/21/20	1.2	Calls and emails with buyer counsel regarding status of consent decree negotiations (0.7); respond to Department of Justice inquiries (0.5).
Burke, Arthur J.	04/22/20	1.0	Prepare for and call with Department of Justice regarding consent decree negotiations.
Miller, Benjamin M.	04/22/20	2.9	Review Department of Justice and state Attorney General requests (1.4); correspondence with same regarding regulatory negotiations and issues (1.5).
Burke, Arthur J.	04/23/20	0.5	Prepare for and call with Department of Justice regarding consent decree and information requests
Miller, Benjamin M.	04/23/20	3.5	Review and analyze Department of Justice and state Attorney General requests (3.2); call with N. Rubin regarding legal research in connection with same (0.3).
Rubin, Nathaniel F.	04/23/20	6.1	Conference with B. Miller regarding legal research regarding regulatory antitrust inquiries (0.3); legal research regarding prior litigation (1.0); legal research regarding mergers (4.8).
Burke, Arthur J.	04/24/20	2.0	Revise Dairy Farmers of America consent decree (0.5); calls and emails with Davis Polk team and Dean Foods regarding Franklin option issue (1.0); prepare for and call with Creditors Committee (0.5).
Chau, Kin Man	04/24/20	1.0	Participate in call with State Attorney General regarding Dean Foods matters.
Curran, William A.	04/24/20	1.9	Conference with Alvarez & Marsal team regarding CARES Act tax refund procedures (1.0); research regarding same (0.9).
Miller, Benjamin M.	04/24/20	2.3	Prepare responses to Department of Justice and State Attorney General requests.
Zilberberg, David A.	04/24/20	1.0	Email with J. Barret regarding permit transfers (0.3); review permit transfer documents (0.7).
Bernstein, Alexander	04/25/20	0.1	Review correspondence with Dean Foods and Davis Polk team regarding regulator correspondence.

Time Detail By Project			
Name	Date	Hours	Narrative
Miller, Benjamin M.	04/25/20	0.2	Prepare responses to Department of Justice and State Attorney General requests.
Sokol, Nate	04/25/20	0.6	Email with A. Bernstein, A. Burke, and B. Miller regarding antitrust issues.
Burke, Arthur J.	04/26/20	1.0	Calls and emails with Davis Polk team and Dean Foods regarding Franklin option issue.
Resnick, Brian M.	04/26/20	0.3	Correspondence with A. Burke regarding antitrust issues (0.2); emails with K. Waterman regarding Franklin antitrust issues (0.1).
Presser, Talya	04/27/20	0.8	Discuss CARES Act refund issues.
Zilberberg, David A.	04/27/20	0.8	Conference call with Dean Foods regarding permit transfers (0.5); review permit transfer documents (0.3).
Miller, Benjamin M.	04/28/20	2.7	Prepare responses to Department of Justice and State Attorney General requests (1.2); review and revise same (1.2); call with Department of Justice regarding Franklin facility (0.3).
Resnick, Brian M.	04/28/20	0.5	Correspondence with A. Burke regarding antitrust issues.
Szanzer, Steven Z.	04/28/20	0.3	Call with Department of Justice regarding antitrust issues.
Zilberberg, David A.	04/28/20	0.4	Review permit transfers.
Burke, Arthur J.	04/29/20	4.0	Correspondence with Davis Polk team regarding consent decree status (1.0); review draft consent decree (3.0).
Miller, Benjamin M.	04/29/20	1.3	Call with Dean Foods regarding Department of Justice engagement strategy.
Resnick, Brian M.	04/29/20	1.9	Preparatory call with Dean Foods regarding Department of Justice call (0.4); call with Dairy Farmers of America team regarding same (0.7); emails with Davis Polk team regarding antitrust approval (0.8).
Burke, Arthur J.	04/30/20	4.5	Correspondence with Davis Polk team regarding Department of Justice consent decree status (1.0); review and revise consent decree (3.5).
Miller, Benjamin M.	04/30/20	0.6	Correspondence with Davis Polk team regarding Dairy Farmers of America consent decree.
Resnick, Brian M.	04/30/20	1.4	Emails with Davis Polk team regarding antitrust issues (0.4); calls with Dean Foods and A. Burke regarding same (1.0).
Total R180 REGULATORY AND ENVIRONMENTAL		199.7	
R185 REPORTING			
Denkowski, John P.	04/01/20	0.7	Research SEC filings regarding filed Forms 15.
Gibbons, Dan	04/01/20	1.4	Analyze questions regarding Form 10-Q reporting obligation and respond to Dean Foods.
Jenkins, Elijah D.	04/01/20	0.6	Review Form 15 filing precedents.
Kronfeld, Nicholas A.	04/01/20	0.1	Email with J. Sutton regarding reporting.
Finelli, Jon	04/02/20	0.9	Draft Form 8-K and emails with Davis Polk team regarding same.
Tsepelman, Bernard	04/02/20	0.2	Review draft Form 8-K (0.1); email correspondence with J. Finelli regarding same (0.1).
Walton, Sarah L.	04/02/20	1.5	Prepare Form 8-K.
Gibbons, Dan	04/06/20	0.4	Review Form 8-K requirements for asset sales.
Sokol, Nate	04/06/20	0.3	Email D. Gibbons regarding Dean Foods SEC reporting requirements.
Gibbons, Dan	04/07/20	0.4	Review reporting obligations.
Kronfeld, Nicholas A.	04/07/20	0.4	Emails with D. Gibbons and K. Waterman regarding reporting.
Resnick, Brian M.	04/07/20	0.2	Emails with Davis Polk team regarding SEC filing obligations.

Time Detail By Project			
Name	Date	Hours	Narrative
Sokol, Nate	04/07/20	0.3	Email with G. Wellsfry regarding reporting obligation.
Kronfeld, Nicholas A.	04/09/20	0.4	Call with B. Resnick regarding reporting requirements.
Resnick, Brian M.	04/09/20	0.5	Call with N. Kronfeld regarding SEC reporting (0.3); review article regarding same (0.1); email with Dean Foods regarding same (0.1).
Simpson, Kendra	04/10/20	1.7	Attend call with Davis Polk Team regarding disclosure and research sections Form 13D and 382 regulation.
Kronfeld, Nicholas A.	04/13/20	0.8	Emails with Davis Polk team regarding SEC reporting (0.2); correspondence with L. Altus regarding suspension of reporting obligations (0.3); review same (0.3).
Resnick, Brian M.	04/13/20	0.2	Emails with N. Kronfeld and K. Waterman regarding SEC filing requirements.
Szanzer, Steven Z.	04/13/20	0.1	Correspondence with B. Resnick and N. Kronfeld regarding SEC issues.
Kronfeld, Nicholas A.	04/14/20	0.3	Email B. Resnick regarding Net Operating Losses issue and SEC reporting (0.1); email B. Resnick regarding question in connection with same (0.2).
Sokol, Nate	04/16/20	0.4	Review payment schedule (0.3); email G. Wellsfry and others regarding same (0.1).
Kronfeld, Nicholas A.	04/17/20	0.1	Consider securities law issues regarding swaps.
Kronfeld, Nicholas A.	04/21/20	0.2	Correspondence with Davis Polk and Dean Foods team regarding SEC reporting.
Sokol, Nate	04/21/20	0.8	Call with G. Wellsfry regarding monthly operating reports (0.5); email with G. Wellsfry and others regarding monthly operating reports (0.3).
Gibbons, Dan	04/22/20	0.6	Prepare request regarding SEC reporting.
Kronfeld, Nicholas A.	04/22/20	0.2	Email K. Waterman regarding SEC reporting (0.1); email D. Gibbons regarding SEC reporting (0.1).
Gibbons, Dan	04/23/20	0.8	Prepare extension request to Forms 10-K/A and 10-Q filings.
Jenkins, Elijah D.	04/23/20	2.2	Review no action letter precedents (0.7); review SEC relief disclosure (1.0); review legal bulletin regarding SEC reporting (0.5).
Kronfeld, Nicholas A.	04/23/20	0.2	Correspondence with E. Jenkins and D. Gibbons regarding SEC reporting.
Jenkins, Elijah D.	04/24/20	2.2	Prepare no action letter (1.2); draft COVID-19 Form 8-K (1.0).
Gibbons, Dan	04/25/20	0.6	Prepare no action letter (1.2); draft COVID-19 Form 8-K (1.0).
Jenkins, Elijah D.	04/25/20	5.9	Review no action letter requirements and prepare for call with SEC (4.0); prepare COVID-19 Form 8-K (1.9).
Gibbons, Dan	04/26/20	1.1	Prepare talking points for call with SEC regarding relief from filing obligations.
Jenkins, Elijah D.	04/26/20	0.5	Update COVID-19 Form 8-K.
Gibbons, Dan	04/27/20	0.7	Revise talking points for call with SEC regarding relief from filing obligations.
Jenkins, Elijah D.	04/27/20	4.8	Update no action letter (4.1); revise draft COVID-19 Form 8-K (0.7).
Kronfeld, Nicholas A.	04/27/20	0.7	Draft COVID-19 Form 8-K (0.2); review and revise no-action letter and talking points (0.5).
Reyes, Louis	04/27/20	0.6	Prepare filing version of Form 8-K (0.5); correspondence with Davis Polk team regarding same (0.1).
Gibbons, Dan	04/28/20	0.3	Revise COVID-19 Form 8-K.
Jenkins, Elijah D.	04/28/20	3.7	Review and revise no action letter materials (2.7); revise draft COVID-19 Form 8-K (1.0).
Kronfeld, Nicholas A.	04/28/20	0.3	Review and revise COVID-19 Form 8-K.
Tong, Lily	04/28/20	0.2	Revise COVID-19 Form 8-K (0.1); correspondence with Davis Polk team regarding same (0.1).

Time Detail By Project			
Name	Date	Hours	Narrative
Gibbons, Dan	04/29/20	0.5	Call with Alvarez & Marsal regarding status of Dean Foods operations
Jenkins, Elijah D.	04/29/20	0.3	Revise COVID-19 Form 8-K.
Tong, Lily	04/29/20	0.2	Revise COVID-19 Form 8-K (0.1); submit filing to SEC (0.1).
Gibbons, Dan	04/30/20	0.8	Revise bullet points for call with SEC regarding reporting suspension.
Kronfeld, Nicholas A.	04/30/20	1.3	Review talking points for call with SEC.
Szanzer, Steven Z.	04/30/20	0.1	Correspondence with D. Gibbons regarding Form 8K.
Total R185 REPORTING		41.7	
R190 HEARING PREPARATION			
Bernstein, Alexander	04/01/20	3.4	Correspondence with Davis Polk team regarding witness and exhibit list (1.0); correspondence with Norton Rose team regarding same (0.5); correspondence with Davis Polk and Latham & Watkins teams regarding Sale Hearing (0.6); telephone conference with Davis Polk team regarding same (0.5); correspondence with Davis Polk team regarding same (0.8).
Butler, James C	04/01/20	5.4	Review web conference system for remote hearing (1.0); draft and revise witness and exhibit list for Sale Hearing (3.9); attend call with Davis Polk Litigation team regarding Sale Hearing (0.5).
Leibowitz, Danielle	04/01/20	0.6	Attend call regarding Sale Hearing with Davis Polk Litigation team (0.5); review witness and exhibit lists submitted by objecting parties ahead of Sale Hearing (0.1).
Moskowitz, Elliot	04/01/20	3.5	Correspondence with Dairy Farmers of America regarding Sale Hearing strategy (1.1); correspondence with Dean Foods and Davis Polk team regarding hearing preparation (2.4).
Pittell, Joshua B.	04/01/20	1.0	Correspondence with Davis Polk specialist groups to assist with Sale Hearing preparations.
Schare, Lindsay	04/01/20	7.9	Attend Davis Polk team call regarding Sale Hearing preparation (0.5); call with Latham & Watkins regarding same (0.6); draft and revise examination outlines (6.8).
Sokol, Nate	04/01/20	0.5	Call with Davis Polk restructuring and Litigation teams regarding Sale Hearing preparation.
Bernstein, Alexander	04/02/20	3.4	Review and prepare motion to seal (0.6); correspondence with Norton Rose team and Davis Polk team regarding same (0.1); prepare witness and exhibit list (0.8); correspondence with Davis Polk team regarding same (0.1); correspondence with Norton Rose team and Davis Polk team regarding same (0.7); prepare witness materials (0.9); correspondence with Davis Polk team regarding hearing agenda (0.2).
Butler, James C	04/02/20	3.8	Review hearing remote participation software (0.9); prepare and revise amended exhibit and witness list for Sale Hearing (2.5); review and revise exhibit materials for Sale Hearing (0.4).
Liu, Yichen	04/02/20	3.8	Draft Sale Hearing agenda.
Moskowitz, Elliot	04/02/20	2.6	Attend test video conference to prepare for Sale Hearing (0.7); correspondence with Prairie Farms counsel regarding Sale Hearing (0.7); correspondence with Dairy Farmers of America counsel regarding same (1.2).
Resnick, Brian M.	04/02/20	5.5	Revise oral argument (0.9); discuss same with N. Sokol (0.6); prepare for Sale Hearing (4.0).

Time Detail By Project			
Name	Date	Hours	Narrative
Schare, Lindsay	04/02/20	3.2	Revise witness outlines for Sale Hearing (1.6); test court videoconference program (0.3); correspondence with co-advisors regarding Sale Hearing (0.6); correspondence with Davis Polk team regarding Sale Hearing (0.3); review and revise witness and exhibit list (0.4).
Sokol, Nate	04/02/20	4.0	Produce Sale Hearing talking points (3.2); correspondence with B. Resnick, P. Garg, and S. Szanzer regarding same (0.8).
Bernstein, Alexander	04/03/20	3.1	Correspondence with Davis Polk team regarding witness and exhibit list (0.2); attend Sale Hearing telephonically (2.9).
Burke, Arthur J.	04/03/20	4.0	Prepare for and attend Sale Hearing telephonically (3.5); correspondence with Davis Polk team regarding same (0.5).
Butler, James C	04/03/20	2.9	Correspondence with L. Schare regarding Sale Hearing (0.1); attend Sale Hearing telephonically (2.8).
Garg, Paavani	04/03/20	2.4	Attend Sale Hearing telephonically.
Liu, Yichen	04/03/20	3.8	Attend Sale Hearing telephonically (2.8); prepare for same (0.4); review and revise hearing agenda (0.6).
Malinowsky, Thomas D.	04/03/20	4.3	Correspondence with bidders regarding Sale Hearing (1.1); attend Sale Hearing telephonically (3.2).
Millerman, James M.	04/03/20	4.6	Prepare for Sale Hearing (1.9); attend Sale Hearing telephonically (2.7).
Moskowitz, Elliot	04/03/20	4.5	Prepare for Sale Hearing (1.9); attend Sale Hearing telephonically (2.6).
Netzer, Omer	04/03/20	1.0	Attend Sale Hearing telephonically.
Rarrick, Mohini P.B.	04/03/20	1.6	Attend Sale Hearing telephonically
Resnick, Brian M.	04/03/20	4.6	Review and revise oral argument for Sale Hearing (1.3); emails with Davis Polk team, Evercore, and Alvarez & Marsal regarding same (0.6); attend Sale Hearing telephonically (2.7).
Schare, Lindsay	04/03/20	4.8	Prepare filings for Sale Hearing (1.2); revise witness outlines for hearing (0.8); attend Sale Hearing telephonically (2.8).
Sokol, Nate	04/03/20	5.0	Prepare Sale Hearing talking points (1.2); email B. Resnick and S. Szanzer regarding same (0.3); attend Sale Hearing telephonically (3.0); correspondence with Davis Polk team regarding Sale Hearing and go-forward workstreams (0.5).
Szanzer, Steven Z.	04/03/20	5.6	Prepare for Sale Hearing and draft talking points for same (1.0); team correspondence and calls regarding strategies for same (1.8); attend Sale Hearing telephonically (2.8).
Thomson, Daniel J.	04/03/20	2.8	Attend Sale Hearing telephonically.
Moskowitz, Elliot	04/06/20	0.7	Correspondence with team regarding Section 1113 Hearing preparation.
Bernstein, Alexander	04/08/20	3.8	Prepare witness and exhibit list for sections 1113/1114 hearing (1.0); correspondence with Davis Polk team regarding same (0.3); correspondence with Norton Rose team regarding same (0.4); prepare witness materials for sections 1113/1114 hearing (2.0); correspondence with Davis Polk team regarding same (0.1).
Butler, James C	04/08/20	0.5	Review and revise exhibit and witness list for sections 1113/1114 hearing.

Time Detail By Project			
Name	Date	Hours	Narrative
Bernstein, Alexander	04/09/20	2.7	Prepare exhibit and witness list for sections 1113/1114 hearing (0.3); correspondence with Davis Polk team regarding same (0.2); correspondence with Norton Rose team regarding same (0.1); prepare witness outlines for same (0.8); correspondence with D. Leibowitz regarding same (0.3); correspondence with Davis Polk team regarding same (0.8); correspondence with Norton Rose team and Davis Polk team regarding hearing scheduling regarding automatic stay and personal injury cases (0.2).
Butler, James C	04/09/20	1.6	Coordinate remote hearing participation for Dean Foods and Davis Polk attorneys (1.0); revise exhibit and witness list for sections 1113/1114 hearing (0.6).
Leibowitz, Danielle	04/09/20	3.6	Draft direct examination outline (3.0); update direct examination outline (0.6).
Bernstein, Alexander	04/10/20	3.2	Prepare witness materials for sections 1113/1114 hearing (2.6); correspondence with Davis Polk team regarding same (0.4); correspondence with Norton Rose team and Davis Polk team regarding hearing regarding lift stay motions (0.2).
Butler, James C	04/10/20	0.6	Draft and circulate instructions regarding remote hearing access to Davis Polk team and co-advisors.
Butler, James C	04/12/20	0.4	Email D. Mazer regarding hearing preparation (0.1); draft guidance for witness regarding hearing preparation software (0.3).
Bernstein, Alexander	04/13/20	2.8	Correspondence with Davis Polk team regarding sections 1113/1114 hearing preparation (0.5); telephone conference with D. Leibowitz regarding same (0.2); telephone conference with J. Stotsky regarding same (0.1); review and prepare hearing materials (1.6); correspondence with Davis Polk team regarding same (0.4).
Burke, Arthur J.	04/13/20	1.5	Review and revise talking points for sections 1113/1114 hearing.
Butler, James C	04/13/20	7.8	Attend hearing preparation session with D. Mazer (0.2); email J. Windels regarding hearing technology (0.2); prepare exhibit and witness list for sections 1113/1114 hearing (4.9); attend D. Lee hearing preparation session (1.0); correspondence with Dean Foods regarding hearing technology (0.9); attend J. Mostrom hearing preparation session (0.2); correspondence with Davis Polk team regarding hearing preparation (0.4).
Lee, Grace	04/13/20	4.3	Update sections 1113/1114 hearing exhibits (1.6); attend D. Lee hearing preparation session (1.0); attend teleconference with D. Mazer and others regarding preparations for sections 1113/1114 hearing (0.4); produce chart regarding union information for sections 1113/1114 hearing (1.1); attend teleconference with D. Mazer regarding sections 1113/1114 hearing exhibits (0.2).
Leibowitz, Danielle	04/13/20	0.4	Draft summary of labor-related requirements in preparation for hearing.
Mazer, Deborah S.	04/13/20	8.1	Attend D. Lee witness preparation session (1.1); attend J. Mostrom witness preparation session (0.2). Teleconferences with Davis Polk team regarding sections 1113/1114 papers and hearing (0.8); emails with Davis Polk team regarding same (3.2); emails with Norton Rose regarding same (0.7); prepare for sections 1113/1114 hearing (2.1).
Miller, Benjamin M.	04/13/20	0.4	Draft hearing talking points regarding Prairie Farms status.
Moskowitz, Elliot	04/13/20	3.9	Prepare for sections 1113/1114 hearing.

Time Detail By Project			
Name	Date	Hours	Narrative
Resnick, Brian M.	04/13/20	0.8	Review and revise hearing talking points (0.5); emails with Davis Polk team regarding same (0.3).
Sokol, Nate	04/13/20	1.5	Prepare hearing talking points (0.8); email Davis Polk antitrust team, Davis Polk mergers & acquisitions team, B. Resnick, and others regarding same (0.2); email with Dean Foods team regarding sections 1113/1114 hearing logistics (0.5).
Stotsky, Jonah J.	04/13/20	2.1	Call with D. Mazer, A. Bernstein, D. Leibowitz, and G. Lee regarding hearing preparation (0.4); conference with A. Bernstein regarding hearing exhibits (0.1); compile portfolio of hearing exhibits (1.3); circulate hearing materials to E. Moskowitz and Davis Polk team (0.3).
Windels, James H.R.	04/13/20	2.1	Prepare for sections 1113/1114 hearing.
Bernstein, Alexander	04/14/20	1.3	Prepare for sections 1113/1114 hearing (0.2); attend sections 1113/1114 hearing telephonically (1.1).
Burke, Arthur J.	04/14/20	1.5	Prepare for and participate in sections 1113/1114 hearing telephonically.
Butler, James C	04/14/20	1.4	Assist potential Dean Foods witness in preparing for and attending sections 1113/1114 hearing telephonically (0.4); attend section 1113 hearing telephonically (1.0).
Erickson, Jarret	04/14/20	0.4	Attend sections 1113/1114 hearing telephonically (in part).
Lee, Grace	04/14/20	1.2	Attend sections 1113/1114 hearing telephonically (1.0); correspondence with Davis Polk team regarding same (0.2).
Leibowitz, Danielle	04/14/20	1.2	Attend sections 1113/1114 hearing telephonically (1.0); correspondence with G. Lee regarding same (0.2).
Liu, Yichen	04/14/20	1.2	Attend sections 1113/1114 hearing telephonically (1.0); correspondence with Davis Polk team in preparation for same (0.2).
Mazer, Deborah S.	04/14/20	2.7	Attend sections 1113/1114 hearing telephonically (1.0); prepare for same (1.7).
Moskowitz, Elliot	04/14/20	4.3	Prepare for and participate in sections 1113/1114 hearing.
Rarrick, Mohini P.B.	04/14/20	1.0	Attend sections 1113/1114 hearing telephonically.
Resnick, Brian M.	04/14/20	3.1	Review and revise oral argument (0.8); emails with Dean Foods and co-advisors regarding same (0.3); prepare for sections 1113/1114 hearing (0.5); participate in same telephonically (1.2); correspondence regarding same with Davis Polk team (0.3).
Sokol, Nate	04/14/20	1.7	Prepare hearing talking points (1.4); email Davis Polk antitrust team, Davis Polk mergers & acquisitions team, B. Resnick and others regarding same (0.3)
Stotsky, Jonah J.	04/14/20	2.4	Circulate hearing materials for E. Moskowitz and others (1.4); attend section 1113 hearing telephonically (1.0).
Windels, James H.R.	04/14/20	1.5	Attend section 1113 hearing telephonically. Emails with Davis Polk team regarding deposit issues.
Bernstein, Alexander	04/19/20	0.6	Prepare witness and exhibit list for April 22 Hearing (0.3); correspondence with Norton Rose and Davis Polk teams regarding same (0.1); correspondence with Davis Polk team regarding same (0.2).
Butler, James C	04/19/20	0.6	Draft witness and exhibit list for April 22 Hearing.
Azzopardi, Frank J.	04/20/20	0.6	Prepare for April 22 Hearing.
Bernstein, Alexander	04/20/20	0.4	Correspondence with Norton Rose and Davis Polk teams regarding witness and exhibit list for April 22 Hearing (0.2); correspondence with Norton Rose and Davis Polk teams regarding hearing agenda (0.2).
Butler, James C	04/20/20	0.7	Prepare witness and exhibit list for April 22 Hearing (0.6); correspondence with local counsel regarding same list (0.1).

Time Detail By Project			
Name	Date	Hours	Narrative
Garg, Paavani	04/20/20	0.7	Draft talking points for April 22 Hearing.
Mazer, Deborah S.	04/20/20	0.5	Correspondence with E. Moskowitz regarding April 23 Hearing.
Szanzer, Steven Z.	04/20/20	0.3	Correspondence with B. Resnick and N. Sokol regarding preparations for upcoming hearings.
Bernstein, Alexander	04/21/20	1.9	Review and revise witness and exhibit list for April 22 Hearing (0.4); correspondence with Davis Polk team regarding same (0.2); correspondence with Norton Rose and Davis Polk teams regarding same (0.3); prepare agenda for upcoming hearings (0.4); correspondence with Norton Rose and Davis Polk teams regarding same (0.1); call with N. Sokol regarding hearing preparation (0.3); correspondence with Davis Polk team regarding hearing dates (0.1); correspondence with Norton Rose and Davis Polk teams regarding same (0.1).
Butler, James C	04/21/20	3.3	Prepare witness and exhibit lists for April 22 and April 23 Hearings (3.2); correspondence with D. Mazer regarding preparation for upcoming hearings (0.1).
Moskowitz, Elliot	04/21/20	0.8	Prepare for April 23 Hearing.
Resnick, Brian M.	04/21/20	0.3	Correspondence with Davis Polk team regarding upcoming hearings.
Sokol, Nate	04/21/20	2.0	Email with Norton Rose team and Davis Polk team regarding hearing scheduling and logistics (0.2); call with A. Bernstein regarding same (0.3) prepare hearing talking points (0.9); email D. Mazer regarding same (0.3); email Dean Foods Mergers & Acquisitions team regarding same (0.3).
Szanzer, Steven Z.	04/21/20	0.8	Correspondence with N. Sokol regarding talking points and preparation for upcoming hearing.
Bernstein, Alexander	04/22/20	0.2	Correspondence with Norton Rose team and Davis Polk team regarding witness and exhibit list (0.1); correspondence with same regarding hearing scheduling (0.1).
Burke, Arthur J.	04/22/20	1.5	Prepare for April 23 Hearing (1.5).
Butler, James C	04/22/20	2.6	Review and revise witness declaration (1.4); correspondence with Davis Polk team regarding hearing preparation (0.2); collect materials in preparation for same (1.0).
Lee, Grace	04/22/20	0.8	Review union sections 1113/1114 objection to prepare for April 23, 2020 hearing.
Leibowitz, Danielle	04/22/20	0.3	Correspondence with D. Mazer, G. Lee, and J. Stotsky regarding April 23 Hearing (0.2); review correspondence regarding same (0.1).
Liu, Yichen	04/22/20	0.7	Prepare documents for April 22 hearing (0.3); correspondence with J. Butler and N. Sokol regarding upcoming hearings (0.4).
Mazer, Deborah S.	04/22/20	4.3	Prepare for April 23 Hearing.
Moskowitz, Elliot	04/22/20	1.9	Prepare for April 23 Hearing.
Resnick, Brian M.	04/22/20	2.9	Review and revise talking points for hearing (1.2); discuss with N. Sokol (0.2); review pleadings to prepare for hearing (1.5).
Sokol, Nate	04/22/20	3.0	Prepare hearing talking points (1.4); email B. Resnick and Davis Polk Antitrust and Mergers & Acquisitions teams regarding same (0.4); email with Norton Rose team, Akin Gump, White & Case, Dean Foods, and the co-advisors regarding hearing logistics (0.4); prepare hearing talking points (0.6); email B. Resnick regarding same (0.2).
Stotsky, Jonah J.	04/22/20	0.6	Correspondence with Davis Polk Litigation team regarding preparation for April 23 Hearing (0.1); compile exhibits to for same (0.5).
Adamson, Cameron	04/23/20	1.8	Attend April 23 Hearing telephonically.

Time Detail By Project			
Name	Date	Hours	Narrative
Bernstein, Alexander	04/23/20	1.6	Attend April 23 Hearing telephonically.
Burke, Arthur J.	04/23/20	1.3	Prepare for and attend April 23 Hearing telephonically.
Butler, James C	04/23/20	1.0	Attend April 23 Hearing telephonically.
Garg, Paavani	04/23/20	2.7	Attend April 23 Hearing telephonically.
Lee, Grace	04/23/20	1.9	Attend April 23 Hearing telephonically.
Leibowitz, Danielle	04/23/20	0.9	Attend April 23 Hearing telephonically .
Liu, Yichen	04/23/20	2.4	Attend April 23 Hearing telephonically (2.1); correspondence with Davis Polk team regarding logistics for same (0.3).
Mazer, Deborah S.	04/23/20	2.0	Attend April 23 Hearing telephonically.
Moskowitz, Elliot	04/23/20	2.4	Attend April 23 Hearing telephonically (2.1); correspondence with Davis Polk team regarding logistics for same (0.3).
Rarrick, Mohini P.B.	04/23/20	1.4	Attend April 23 Hearing telephonically.
Resnick, Brian M.	04/23/20	4.7	Review and revise talking points for April 23 Hearing (0.6); correspondence with Davis Polk team regarding same (0.3); review pleadings in preparation for same (1.4); participate in April 23 Hearing telephonically (2.0); review section 1113/1114 pleadings in preparation for April 23 Hearing (0.4).
Sokol, Nate	04/23/20	2.1	Prepare hearing talking points (0.9); email B. Resnick regarding same (0.2); attend April 23 Hearing telephonically (1.0).
Stotsky, Jonah J.	04/23/20	1.9	Attend April 23 Hearing telephonically.
Szanzer, Steven Z.	04/23/20	3.6	Review and finalize talking points for hearing (1.0); attend April 23 Hearing telephonically (2.0); follow-up correspondence with Davis Polk team regarding same (0.6).
Bernstein, Alexander	04/24/20	0.2	Correspondence with Davis Polk team regarding exhibit and witness list for April 28 Hearing.
Butler, James C	04/24/20	0.4	Draft exhibit and witness list for April 28 Hearing.
Resnick, Brian M.	04/25/20	0.4	Prepare for April 28 Hearing.
Sokol, Nate	04/25/20	0.2	Email Norton Rose regarding April 28 Hearing logistics.
Bernstein, Alexander	04/26/20	3.5	Prepare talking points for April 28 Hearing (2.7); correspondence with Davis Polk team regarding same (0.1); correspondence with Davis Polk team regarding witness and exhibit list for same (0.2); prepare witness outline for same (0.4); call with D. Leibowitz regarding same (0.1).
Butler, James C	04/26/20	1.0	Prepare witness and exhibit list for April 28 Hearing.
Leibowitz, Danielle	04/26/20	6.6	Call with A. Bernstein regarding April 28 Hearing preparation (0.3); draft talking points for same (3.3); draft direct examination outline for G. Rahlfs (3.0).
Liu, Yichen	04/26/20	1.7	Draft agenda for April 28 Hearing (1.3); correspondence with S. Szanzer regarding April 28 Hearing (0.1); correspondence with N. Sokol and others from Davis Polk team regarding same (0.2); correspondence with J. Butler regarding same (0.1).
Resnick, Brian M.	04/26/20	2.5	Review Food Lion materials for April 28 Hearing (1.4); emails with Davis Polk team regarding same and related research (0.6); prepare talking points for April 28 Hearing (0.5).
Szanzer, Steven Z.	04/26/20	0.3	Correspondence with B. Resnick, N. Sokol, and Y. Liu regarding April 28 Hearing.
Azzopardi, Frank J.	04/27/20	1.4	Review hearing oral argument materials (0.6); correspondence with Davis Polk team regarding same (0.8).

Time Detail By Project			
Name	Date	Hours	Narrative
Bernstein, Alexander	04/27/20	5.2	Prepare talking points for April 28 Hearing (3.3); telephone conference with D. Leibowitz regarding same (0.6); correspondence with D. Leibowitz regarding same (0.2); prepare witness for same (0.3); prepare witness and exhibit list for same (0.1); correspondence with Davis Polk team regarding same (0.7).
Butler, James C	04/27/20	2.7	Revise witness and exhibit list for April 28 Hearing (0.7); correspondence with Norton Rose team regarding filing of witness and exhibit list and agenda for April 28 Hearing (0.2); correspondence with G. Rahlfs regarding hearing preparation (0.4); attend G. Rahlfs' hearing preparation session (0.3); correspondence with Davis Polk team regarding hearing attendance technology (0.3); correspondence with J. Schembri and B. Sadeghi's regarding same (0.1); correspondence with B. Sadeghi regarding hearing preparation (0.3); attend hearing preparation session for B. Sadeghi (0.3); correspondence with Y. Liu regarding April 28 Hearing logistics (0.1).
Garg, Paavani	04/27/20	2.1	Draft talking points for April 28 Hearing.
Kearney, Daniel P.	04/27/20	1.3	Prepare oral arguments for April 28 Hearing.
Leibowitz, Danielle	04/27/20	7.7	Call with B. Resnick and others regarding April 28 Hearing talking points (0.7); draft and revise same (4.1); call with A. Bernstein regarding same (0.2); review and revise talking points (0.9); correspondence with G. Rahlfs hearing preparation (0.2); correspondence with A. Bernstein regarding Food Lion hearing preparations (0.4); review correspondence with Dairy Farmers of America regarding same (1.2).
Liu, Yichen	04/27/20	1.4	Draft and revise agenda for April 28 Hearing (0.7); correspondence with Davis Polk team regarding same (0.3); correspondence with Norton Rose team regarding same (0.2); correspondence with Davis Polk team and co-advisors regarding logistics for April 28 Hearing (0.2).
Resnick, Brian M.	04/27/20	5.7	Calls with Davis Polk team and Dean Foods regarding lift-stay motion (1.7); review legal materials in preparation for April 28 Hearing (1.5); review and revise talking points for same (2.5).
Szanzer, Steven Z.	04/27/20	2.2	Review and revise agenda for April 28 Hearing (0.2); review and revise talking points for same (1.5); correspondence with B. Resnick, P. Garg, and A. Burke regarding same (0.3); correspondence with Norton Rose team regarding potential hearing times (0.2).
Woller, Christopher C.	04/27/20	0.4	Correspondence with Davis Polk team regarding potential oral argument regarding intellectual property matters (0.3); call with F. Azzopardi regarding same (0.1).
Azzopardi, Frank J.	04/28/20	3.4	Correspondence with Davis Polk team regarding oral argument preparations (1.2); review materials for same (2.2).
Bernstein, Alexander	04/28/20	2.9	Prepare for April 28 Hearing (0.3); review notes regarding same (0.1); correspondence with Davis Polk team regarding same (0.3); correspondence with Davis Polk team regarding hearing dates (0.1); attend telephonic hearing (2.1).
Burke, Arthur J.	04/28/20	6.0	Attend April 28 Hearing telephonically (3.0); correspondence with Dean Foods regarding consent decree negotiations and related issues (3.0).
Butler, James C	04/28/20	2.0	Attend April 28 Hearing telephonically.
Garg, Paavani	04/28/20	2.1	Attend April 28 Hearing telephonically.

Time Detail By Project			
Name	Date	Hours	Narrative
Kearney, Daniel P.	04/28/20	5.9	Prepare oral arguments (3.1); review caselaw for oral arguments (2.7); correspondence with C. Woller regarding same (0.1).
Lee, Grace	04/28/20	0.4	Attend April 28 Hearing telephonically.
Leibowitz, Danielle	04/28/20	2.4	Attend April 28 Hearing telephonically (2.1); correspondence with Davis Polk team regarding same (0.3).
Liu, Yichen	04/28/20	2.7	Attend April 28 Hearing telephonically (1.6); correspondence with Davis Polk team regarding same (0.2); review precedent Solicitation Motions for combined hearing (0.9).
Mazer, Deborah S.	04/28/20	2.3	Attend April 28 Hearing telephonically (2.0); correspondence with G. Lee regarding same (0.3).
Netzer, Omer	04/28/20	1.5	Attend April 28 Hearing telephonically.
Rarrick, Mohini P.B.	04/28/20	1.0	Attend April 28 Hearing telephonically.
Resnick, Brian M.	04/28/20	5.3	Prepare for April 28 Hearing (2.2); participate in same (2.0); review talking points for Land O' Lakes hearing (0.7); review case law regarding same (0.4).
Sokol, Nate	04/28/20	1.5	Attend April 28 Hearing telephonically.
Szanzer, Steven Z.	04/28/20	4.1	Prepare for April 28 Hearing (1.0); participate in same (2.0); follow-up correspondence and calls with Davis Polk team regarding same (0.3); correspondence with Norton Rose regarding scheduling upcoming hearings and notices for same (0.5); review and revise summary of hearing for K. Waterman (0.3).
Woller, Christopher C.	04/28/20	5.1	Draft oral argument talking points (4.5); review D. Kearney materials for same (0.6).
Azzopardi, Frank J.	04/29/20	5.9	Prepare for oral arguments regarding Land O' Lakes trademark dispute (2.8); calls with Davis Polk team regarding same (1.8); further correspondence with Davis Polk team regarding necessary steps for hearing and deposition (1.3).
Bernstein, Alexander	04/29/20	4.5	Correspondence with Davis Polk team regarding hearing scheduling (0.1); correspondence with Norton Rose team and Davis Polk team regarding same (0.1); correspondence with Epiq team and Davis Polk team regarding same (0.2); telephone conference with opposing counsel and Davis Polk team regarding hearing, witnesses, and exhibits (0.4); further telephone conference with opposing counsel and Davis Polk team regarding same (0.3); prepare for same (0.6); correspondence with E. Moskowitz regarding same (0.3); correspondence with Davis Polk team regarding same (0.3); correspondence with Davis Polk team regarding witness and exhibit list (0.2); correspondence with Norton Rose team and Davis Polk team regarding same (0.2); prepare same (0.6); correspondence with opposing counsel and Davis Polk team regarding same (0.3); telephone conference with Davis Polk team regarding hearing (0.7); telephone conference with S. Szanzer regarding same (0.1); correspondence with Davis Polk team regarding same (0.1).
Butler, James C	04/29/20	3.7	Draft and revise witness and exhibit list for April 30 hearing (1.6); attend strategy call in advance of April 30 hearing (0.6); review materials for April 30 deposition (1.0); coordinate logistics for April 30 deposition (0.5).
Falk, Aryeh Ethan	04/29/20	1.5	Call with B. Resnick, E. Moskowitz, and others regarding DIP Facility amendment hearing preparations (0.6); correspondence with P. Garg regarding same (0.2); review P. Garg talking points for same (0.2); revise same (0.5).

Time Detail By Project			
Name	Date	Hours	Narrative
Garg, Paavani	04/29/20	1.6	Draft DIP Facility amendment talking points for hearing.
Kearney, Daniel P.	04/29/20	6.3	Prepare oral arguments materials for Land O' Lakes trademark dispute (5.1); correspondence with F. Azzopardi and C. Woller regarding same (0.5); correspondence with B. Resnick, F. Azzopardi, and C. Woller regarding oral argument strategy (0.7).
Liu, Yichen	04/29/20	1.7	Draft agenda for April 30 Hearing (1.3); correspondence with Davis Polk team and Norton Rose team regarding same (0.2); correspondence with Davis Polk team and co-advisors regarding electronic hearing logistics (0.2).
Moskowitz, Elliot	04/29/20	0.4	Call with Davis Polk team regarding DIP Amendment hearing preparation.
Resnick, Brian M.	04/29/20	4.8	Calls with Davis Polk Intellectual property and Litigation team regarding Land O' Lakes hearing preparation (1.5); review and revise oral argument for same (1.0); review case law regarding same (1.8); review and revise oral argument for DIP Amendment Motion (0.5).
Szanzer, Steven Z.	04/29/20	1.6	Correspondence with P. Garg regarding April 30 Hearing notice (0.2); coordinate issues and logistics relating to April 30 Hearing (0.6); correspondence and calls with Davis Polk team regarding talking points for April 30 hearing (0.8).
Woller, Christopher C.	04/29/20	4.6	Prepare oral argument regarding license assignment (3.9); call with A. Bernstein regarding potential deposition regarding same (0.7).
Azzopardi, Frank J.	04/30/20	3.7	Prepare for April 30 deposition and Hearing (2.4); correspondence with Davis Polk team regarding same (0.8); attend deposition telephonically (0.5).
Bernstein, Alexander	04/30/20	7.8	Attend deposition regarding Land O' Lakes license agreement issue (0.5); review materials in preparation for same (2.1); prepare exhibits for same (0.1); correspondence with Davis Polk team regarding same (0.3); correspondence with Land O' Lakes and Davis Polk team regarding same (0.2); correspondence with Latham & Watkins team and Davis Polk team regarding same (0.2); correspondence with Davis Polk team regarding same (1.7); review pleadings regarding same (0.9); attend hearing telephonically (1.6); correspondence with Y. Liu regarding exhibit and witness list (0.2).
Butler, James C	04/30/20	6.0	Prepare for April 30 deposition (1.0); prepare exhibits for same vendor (2.0); coordinate remote deposition logistics with Davis Polk, opposing counsel, counsel for parties in interest, and outside vendor (2.1); attend deposition telephonically (0.4); attend April 30 Hearing telephonically (0.4); discuss exhibits for same with D. Leibowitz (0.1).
Dengel, Hilary	04/30/20	3.2	Review materials for DIP Amendment Hearing (1.0); attend DIP Amendment Hearing telephonically (1.0); correspondence with Davis Polk team regarding same (1.2).
Falk, Aryeh Ethan	04/30/20	2.0	Call with P. Garg regarding DIP Amendment Hearing talking points (0.1); review Creditors Committee's objection to DIP Amendment Motion in preparation for hearing (0.3); correspondence regarding securitization facility amendment and hearing talking points and filing regarding same (1.0); participate in call with G. Berube regarding testimony for same (0.3); review revised talking points for April 30 Hearing (0.3).
Garg, Paavani	04/30/20	3.8	Prepare talking points for DIP Amendment Hearing (2.1); attend April 30 Hearing telephonically (1.7).

Time Detail By Project			
Name	Date	Hours	Narrative
Liu, Yichen	04/30/20	1.9	Draft amended agenda for April 30 Hearing (0.4); correspondence with Davis Polk and Norton Rose teams regarding same (0.3); attend April 30 Hearing telephonically (1.1); correspondence with Davis Polk team regarding logistics for same (0.1).
Mazer, Deborah S.	04/30/20	0.7	Attend April 30 Hearing telephonically (in part).
Moskowitz, Elliot	04/30/20	3.3	Prepare for April 30 Hearing (0.7); participate in same and related settlement discussions (2.6).
Netzer, Omer	04/30/20	1.3	Attend April 30 Hearing telephonically.
Resnick, Brian M.	04/30/20	2.6	Review and revise talking points for April 30 Hearing (1.4); review case law for same (0.5); participate in same telephonically (0.7).
Sokol, Nate	04/30/20	2.5	Attend hearing telephonically (2.0); review correspondence with Davis Polk team regarding same (0.5).
Szanzer, Steven Z.	04/30/20	2.0	Review talking points and emails in preparation for April 30 Hearing (0.8); attend same telephonically (0.7); participate in related settlement discussions (0.5).
Takhteyev, Andrei	04/30/20	1.6	Attend April 30 Hearing telephonically (0.8); participate in related settlement discussions (0.8).
Tsepelman, Bernard	04/30/20	1.1	Attend DIP Amendment Hearing telephonically (0.6); correspondence with B. Resnick, E. Moskowitz, and Evercore team regarding same (0.5).
Woller, Christopher C.	04/30/20	2.8	Prepare for April 30 deposition and Hearing (2.4); attend deposition telephonically (0.4).
Total R190 HEARING PREPARATION		423.7	
R195 BUSINESS OPERATIONS			
Sokol, Nate	04/01/20	0.5	Call with G. Steagall and M. McNamara regarding utilities adequate assurance requests and service issues.
Netzer, Omer	04/03/20	2.1	Draft Wind-Down Motion.
Sokol, Nate	04/03/20	0.8	Call with J. Sutton regarding equipment disposal and plant closures issues (0.6); email O. Netzer, J. Sutton, G. Packer, and J. Mudd regarding same (0.2).
Sokol, Nate	04/07/20	1.2	Email with G. Steagall and M. Namara regarding utility issues (0.3); call with S. Lowenberg and E. Hinson regarding vendor payment issues (0.5); call with G. Steagall and M. Namara regarding utility issues (0.4).
Netzer, Omer	04/08/20	3.2	Draft wind down motion.
Sokol, Nate	04/08/20	2.2	Email with R. North, M. Williams, S. Lowenberg, and others regarding contract dispute and vendor payment issues (1.2); email with C. Rubio regarding adequate assurance request (0.4); email with J. Kimm, A. Singh, and G. Packer regarding facility closures and wind-down (0.6).
Szanzer, Steven Z.	04/08/20	0.3	Review emails with Davis Polk team regarding Wells Fargo account.
Sokol, Nate	04/09/20	1.3	Email with J. Mudd and G. Packer regarding operational wind-down issues (0.9); email with G. Steagall and others regarding utility adequate assurance requests (0.4).
Bernstein, Alexander	04/10/20	0.1	Correspondence from Dean Foods and Davis Polk team regarding customer correspondence.
Sokol, Nate	04/10/20	0.3	Email with G. Steagall and others regarding utility adequate assurance agreements and account transitions.

Time Detail By Project			
Name	Date	Hours	Narrative
Bernstein, Alexander	04/11/20	0.7	Correspondence with L. Schare regarding customer dispute requests (0.3); correspondence with Davis Polk team regarding customer dispute (0.4).
Netzer, Omer	04/11/20	2.6	Draft wind down motion.
Sokol, Nate	04/11/20	0.8	Review and revise wind down motion (0.6); email O. Netzer regarding same (0.2).
Netzer, Omer	04/12/20	2.4	Draft plant shutdown motion.
Netzer, Omer	04/13/20	7.2	Draft wind down motion.
Sokol, Nate	04/13/20	3.1	Email with J. Sutton, J. Dawson, and others regarding vendor payment inquiries (0.7); call with J. Sutton, R. Condit, and others regarding vendor payment inquiries (0.8); email with O. Netzer, J. Mudd, and J. Sutton regarding wind down and related issues (1.2); email with G. Steagall, M. Rarrick, and others regarding utility inquiries (0.4).
Szanzer, Steven Z.	04/13/20	3.0	Review and revise wind down motion (2.5); correspondence with O. Netzer regarding same (0.5).
Bernstein, Alexander	04/14/20	0.1	Correspondence with Davis Polk team regarding customer dispute.
Netzer, Omer	04/14/20	4.2	Review and revise wind down motion (3.6); correspondence with S. Szanzer and K. Waterman regarding same (0.6).
Rarrick, Mohini P.B.	04/14/20	0.5	Review adequate assurance remittance issue (0.4); correspondence with N. Sokol regarding same (0.1).
Sokol, Nate	04/14/20	0.2	Email with G. Steagall, M. Rarrick and others regarding utility inquiries
Szanzer, Steven Z.	04/14/20	0.9	Review revised Wind Down Motion (0.5); correspondence with O. Netzer regarding same (0.4).
Netzer, Omer	04/15/20	2.3	Review and revise Wind-Down Motion.
Sokol, Nate	04/15/20	0.5	Correspondence with D. Thomson, B. Resnick, and Dean Foods regarding vendor payment disputes (0.5).
Sokol, Nate	04/16/20	2.9	Email with G. Steagall, M. Rarrick, and others regarding utility inquiries (0.2); email with R. North and others regarding vendor payment issues (0.9); email with G. Packer regarding plant closures and land sales (0.6); email with J. Matthews and others regarding insurance questions (1.2).
Netzer, Omer	04/17/20	3.9	Review and revise Wind-Down Motion (3.2); correspondence with J. Thompson, S. Szanzer, and N. Sokol regarding same (0.7).
Sokol, Nate	04/17/20	1.3	Review hedge materials (0.5); email J. Mostrom, G. Steagall, and others regarding same (0.1); email with O. Netzer regarding Wind-Down Motion (0.6); email K. Waterman and G. Packer regarding same (0.1).
Szanzer, Steven Z.	04/17/20	0.7	Review emails with Davis Polk team regarding Wind-Down Motion (0.3); review and consider comments to same (0.3); correspondence with O. Netzer regarding same (0.1).
Netzer, Omer	04/20/20	6.2	Draft Wind-Down Motion.
Rarrick, Mohini P.B.	04/20/20	1.1	Draft notice regarding utility services (0.7); teleconference with utility provider regarding adequate assurance (0.4).
Sokol, Nate	04/20/20	1.4	Call with M. Rarrick regarding utilities issues (0.3); review hedge contract documents (0.7); call with E. White regarding same (0.2); email Dean Foods regarding same (0.2).
Szanzer, Steven Z.	04/20/20	1.5	Finalize Wind-Down Motion.
Netzer, Omer	04/21/20	1.4	Review objection to Wind-Down Motion(0.6); correspondence with N. Sokol regarding same (0.5); review Wind-Down Motion (0.3).

Time Detail By Project			
Name	Date	Hours	Narrative
Rarrick, Mohini P.B.	04/21/20	0.6	Teleconference with utility provider and N. Sokol regarding adequate assurance request (0.4); review correspondence from same regarding same (0.2).
Sokol, Nate	04/21/20	0.9	Call with M. Rarrick and M. Roth regarding utilities services (0.3); email with G. Packer, A. Bierce, and others regarding plant closures (0.3); email with S. Lowenberg and others regarding vendor issues (0.3).
Netzer, Omer	04/22/20	0.4	Correspondence with N. Sokol regarding Wind-Down Motion.
Sokol, Nate	04/22/20	1.9	Email with Davis Polk Restructuring team regarding plant closure issues (0.2); email with G. Packer, J. Sutton, and others regarding plant closures and related issues (0.7); email with J. Dawson, J. Sutton, and others regarding payment issues (0.3); email with S. Lowenberg regarding vendor inquiries (0.2); email with M. Williams regarding payment inquiries (0.2); email with Epiq team and Norton Rose team regarding service (0.3).
Sokol, Nate	04/23/20	0.3	Email with B. Resnick and S. Szanzer regarding utility contracts.
Thomson, Daniel J.	04/23/20	0.7	Review Borden filings.
Rarrick, Mohini P.B.	04/24/20	1.0	Review notice to utility providers (0.2); update list of executed adequate assurance agreements (0.5); correspondence with G. Steagall and M. McNamara regarding same (0.3).
Sokol, Nate	04/24/20	0.9	Email with R. North regarding vendor inquiries (0.3); review utilities notice letter (0.3); email M. Rarrick and S. Szanzer regarding same (0.3).
Szanzer, Steven Z.	04/24/20	0.5	Review and revise form email to utility providers (0.3); correspondence with M. Rarrick and N. Sokol regarding same (0.2).
Rarrick, Mohini P.B.	04/27/20	1.9	Review utilities adequate assurance agreements (0.8); correspondence with utility providers regarding notices of sale (1.1).
Szanzer, Steven Z.	04/27/20	0.3	Review emails regarding utility deposits.
Rarrick, Mohini P.B.	04/28/20	0.4	Correspondence with utility providers and S. Szanzer regarding adequate assurance agreements.
Szanzer, Steven Z.	04/28/20	0.3	Call with M. Rarrick regarding utilities.
Rarrick, Mohini P.B.	04/29/20	0.8	Review utilities notice (0.3); call regarding same with S. Szanzer (0.2); correspondence with utility providers (0.3).
Szanzer, Steven Z.	04/29/20	0.2	Review emails regarding utility deposits.
Rarrick, Mohini P.B.	04/30/20	0.5	Review utilities adequate assurance agreements.
Szanzer, Steven Z.	04/30/20	2.3	Prepare vendor talking points (0.5); correspondence with B. Fox and B. Resnick regarding same (0.6); correspondence with T. Malinowsky regarding same (0.3); correspondence with Dairy Farmers of Amera and Alvarez & Marsal regarding same (0.9).
Total R195 BUSINESS OPERATIONS		74.8	
R205 COLLECTIVE BARGAINING AGREEMENTS			
Crandall, Jeffrey P.	04/01/20	0.3	Review section 1113 updates.

Time Detail By Project			
Name	Date	Hours	Narrative
Lee, Grace	04/01/20	14.6	Review declarations in support of Sections 1113/1114 Motion (3.4); call with D. Mazer regarding same (0.1) call with E. Moskowitz, D. Lee, and bidder regarding developments with unions (0.6); email D. Lee regarding declaration in support of Sections 1113/1114 Motion (0.5); call with J. Windels, D. Mazer, and J. Stotsky regarding Sections 1113/1114 Motion (1.2); revise draft of Sections 1113/1114 Motion (8.4); correspondence with K. Ginder regarding Collective Bargaining Agreements (0.4).
Mazer, Deborah S.	04/01/20	11.2	Call with G. Lee regarding section 1113 papers (0.1); call with J. Windels, G. Lee, and J. Stotsky regarding section 1113 papers (1.2); call with Alvarez & Marsal team regarding section 1113 diligence (0.3); draft Sections 1113/1114 Motion and review and revise declaration supporting same (8.4); emails with Davis Polk team regarding same (1.2).
Moskowitz, Elliot	04/01/20	2.8	Correspondence with Dean Foods and Dairy Farmers of America regarding union negotiations and related strategy (2.8).
Stotsky, Jonah J.	04/01/20	10.5	Review and revise declaration (1.8); email T. Magro regarding same (0.4); correspondence with Davis Polk team regarding same (0.3); call with J. Windels, D. Mazer, and G. Lee regarding Sections 1113/1114 Motion and declarations (1.2); review and revise Sections 1113/1114 Motion sections (6.8).
Windels, James H.R.	04/01/20	3.0	Call with Davis Polk team regarding Sections 1113/1114 Motion (1.2); correspondence with Davis Polk team regarding same (1.8).
Bernstein, Alexander	04/02/20	0.5	Correspondence with Davis Polk team regarding section 1113 issues (0.3); correspondence with Dean Foods and Davis Polk team regarding same (0.2).
Brecher, Stephen I.	04/02/20	3.0	Correspondence with Davis Polk team regarding Sections 1113/1114 Motion (1.0); call with Dean Foods regarding same (0.5); revise same (1.2); correspondence with G. Lee regarding same (0.1); correspondence with J. Millerman regarding Sections 1113/1114 Motion (0.2).
Bruney, Theresa	04/02/20	1.4	Review Sections 1113/1114 Motion and prepare table of authorities.
Erickson, Jarret	04/02/20	4.5	Research section 1114 issue related to objection by plan beneficiary (1.9); draft summary of same (2.1); correspondence with E. Moskowitz and N. Sokol regarding same (0.5).
Ginder, Kathleen	04/02/20	0.4	Review declaration of D. Lee.
Lee, Grace	04/02/20	13.2	Attend call with Davis Polk team, Dean Foods team, and buyer counsel regarding developments with unions (0.5); call with D. Lee regarding same (0.8); call with D. Mazer, J. Stotsky, and D. Leibowitz regarding Sections 1113/1114 Motion (1.3); call with D. Leibowitz regarding Sections 1113/1114 Motion (0.2); revise D. Lee Declaration and Sections 1113/1114 Motion (10.9); call with D. Mazer regarding same (0.4).

Time Detail By Project			
Name	Date	Hours	Narrative
Leibowitz, Danielle	04/02/20	11.2	Call with D. Mazer, G. Lee, J. Stotsky regarding Sections 1113/1114 Motion (1.3); call with Davis Polk Litigation team and D. Lee regarding Sections 1113/1114 Motion and related papers (0.8); calls with D. Mazer regarding Sections 1113/1114 Motion and next steps (0.9); call with J. Stotsky regarding Sections 1113/1114 Motion and related papers (0.1); call with G. Lee regarding Sections 1113/1114 Motion and related papers (0.2); review, and revise Sections 1113/1114 Motion and related papers (7.9).
Mazer, Deborah S.	04/02/20	13.3	Call with D. Lee, Alvarez & Marsal team, and Davis Polk team regarding factual issues for Sections 1113/1114 Motion (0.8); call with Davis Polk team and Shearman & Sterling team regarding Prairie Farms union negotiations (0.5); call with Alvarez & Marsal team regarding declaration supporting Sections 1113/1114 Motion (0.3); calls with G. Lee, D. Leibowitz, and J. Stotsky regarding Sections 1113/1114 Motion (1.3); calls with D. Leibowitz regarding same (0.9); calls with G. Lee regarding same (0.4); draft Sections 1113/1114 Motion (9.1).
Moskowitz, Elliot	04/02/20	0.8	Call with D. Lee regarding union related issues.
Stotsky, Jonah J.	04/02/20	13.7	Revise Sections 1113/1114 Motion (1.9); review and revise declaration (4.4); correspondence regarding same with D. Mazer and others (1.8); calls with D. Mazer, D. Leibowitz, and G. Lee sections 1113/1114 papers (1.3); calls with D. Leibowitz regarding same (0.1); further revise Sections 1113/1114 Motion (3.3); further revise declarations in support of same (0.9).
Windels, James H.R.	04/02/20	4.5	Prepare Sections 1113/1114 Motion (3.2); call with D. Lee regarding same (0.8); call with D. Lee and buyer counsel regarding union issues (0.5).
Brecher, Stephen I.	04/03/20	0.5	Call with G. Lee regarding Sections 1113/1114 Motion.
Brune, Theresa	04/03/20	4.9	Review and revise Sections 1113/1114 Motion of Debtors.
Crandall, Jeffrey P.	04/03/20	0.4	Review union negotiation updates.
Halford, Edgar Bernard	04/03/20	1.7	Review and revise Sections 1113/1114 Motion.
Lee, Grace	04/03/20	14.6	Calls with D. Mazer, J. Stotsky, and D. Leibowitz regarding Sections 1113/1114 Motion (1.1); calls with E. Moskowitz, J. Windels, and others regarding same (0.4); calls with E. Moskowitz, J. Windels, D. Lee, and others regarding same (0.5); call with D. Leibowitz regarding same (0.1); call with D. Mazer, D. Slipakoff regarding declaration in support of Sections 1113/1114 Motion (0.6); call with D. Mazer and A. Weiss regarding exhibits for the Sections 1113/1114 Motion (0.2); further call with J. Windels, D. Mazer, and D. Lee regarding D. Lee Declaration in support of Sections 1113/1114 Motion (1.6); revise D. Lee Declaration and Sections 1113/1114 Motion (9.6); call with S. Brecher regarding Sections 1113/1114 Motion (0.5).
Leibowitz, Danielle	04/03/20	9.1	Calls with D. Mazer, J. Stotsky, and G. Lee regarding Sections 1113/1114 Motion and related papers (1.1); call with D. Mazer, J. Stotsky, G. Lee, J. Windels, and E. Moskowitz regarding same (0.4); call with D. Mazer regarding same (0.1); call with G. Lee regarding same (0.1); review, and revise Sections 1113/1114 Motion and related papers (7.4).

Time Detail By Project			
Name	Date	Hours	Narrative
Mazer, Deborah S.	04/03/20	16.2	Call with G. Lee, D. Slipakoff regarding D. Lee Declaration in support of Sections 1113/1114 Motion (0.6); call with G. Lee and A. Weiss regarding exhibits for Sections 1113/1114 Motion (0.2); call with J. Windels, G. Lee, D. Lee regarding D. Lee Declaration in support of Sections 1113/1114 Motion (1.6); call with Alvarez & Marsal team regarding declaration in support of Sections 1113/1114 Motion (0.2); emails with Alvarez & Marsal team regarding same (0.5); call with D. Lee regarding declaration in support of same (0.5); calls with G. Lee, D. Leibowitz, and J. Stotsky regarding Sections 1113/1114 Motion (1.1); call with E. Moskowitz, J. Windels, G. Lee, D. Leibowitz, J. Stotsky regarding same (0.4); review and revise same and related papers (11.7); call with D. Leibowitz regarding same (0.1).
Moskowitz, Elliot	04/03/20	4.2	Correspondence with Morgan Lewis regarding union negotiations (0.6); correspondence with Davis Polk team and Dean Foods regarding same (0.7); call with Davis Polk Litigation team regarding Sections 1113/1114 Motion (0.4); call with Producers regarding union issues (0.5); call with Industrial Realty Group regarding same (0.5); call with B. Resnick regarding same (0.3); review various section 1113 materials (1.2).
Resnick, Brian M.	04/03/20	0.6	Call with E. Moskowitz regarding union issues (0.3); emails with Davis Polk team regarding strategy for same (0.3).
Stotsky, Jonah J.	04/03/20	12.4	Review and update Sections 1113/1114 Motion (2.3); correspondence with D. Mazer regarding same (0.5); calls with E. Moskowitz, J. Windels, D. Mazer, D. Leibowitz, and G. Lee regarding motion and declarations (0.4); calls with D. Mazer, D. Leibowitz, and G. Lee regarding motion and declarations (1.1); call with D. Mazer, D. Leibowitz, G. Lee, and D. Lee regarding declaration (0.5); review and revise declaration (0.5); correspondence with J. Windels regarding same (0.3); review and revise Sections 1113/1114 Motion (6.8).
Weiss, Alex	04/03/20	1.1	Revise Collective Bargaining Agreement chart (0.9); call with D. Mazer and G. Lee regarding same (0.2).
Windels, James H.R.	04/03/20	7.5	Review Sections 1113/1114 Motion and declarations in support of same (4.9); call with D. Mazer, G. Lee, and D. Lee regarding D. Lee Declaration (1.6); call with D. Slipakoff regarding declaration in support of Sections 1113/1114 Motion (0.6); call with E. Moskowitz and Davis Polk team regarding same (0.4).
Bernstein, Alexander	04/04/20	0.2	Correspondence with Dean Foods and Davis Polk team regarding section 1113.
Crandall, Jeffrey P.	04/04/20	0.4	Review union negotiation updates.
Lee, Grace	04/04/20	16.9	Calls with D. Mazer, J. Stotsky, and D. Leibowitz regarding Sections 1113/1114 Motion (1.8); calls with J. Windels and others regarding same (0.3); call with D. Mazer, D. Slipakoff regarding same (0.3); call with J. Windels, D. Mazer, D. Lee regarding D. Lee Declaration (1.5); revise and prepare for submission of the Sections 1113/1114 Motion and declarations (13.2).

Time Detail By Project			
Name	Date	Hours	Narrative
Leibowitz, Danielle	04/04/20	11.2	Calls with D. Mazer, J. Stotsky, and G. Lee regarding Sections 1113/1114 Motion and related papers (1.8); call with D. Mazer, J. Stotsky, G. Lee, and J. Windels regarding Sections 1113/1114 Motion and related papers (0.3); review, and revise Sections 1113/1114 Motion and related papers (8.7); finalize declarations for filing (0.4).
Malinowsky, Thomas D.	04/04/20	0.8	Call with Davis Polk team regarding Prairie Farms union issues.
Mazer, Deborah S.	04/04/20	11.3	Call with G. Lee, D. Leibowitz, J. Stotsky regarding Sections 1113/1114 Motion (1.8); call with J. Windels, G. Lee, and D. Lee regarding D. Lee Declaration in support of Sections 1113/1114 Motion (1.5); call with J. Windels and G. Lee regarding same (0.3); call with Alvarez & Marsal team regarding J. Mostrom Declaration (0.3); call with D. Slipakoff regarding Sections 1113/1114 Motion (0.3); call with G. Lee and D. Slipakoff regarding same (0.3); emails with Alvarez & Marsal team regarding J. Mostrom Declaration (0.3); review and revise Sections 1113/1114 Motion and related papers (6.5).
Moskowitz, Elliot	04/04/20	5.0	Review and revise draft of Sections 1113/1114 Motion and related papers (3.3); correspondence with Davis Polk team regarding same (1.4); call with B. Resnick regarding same (0.3).
Resnick, Brian M.	04/04/20	0.9	Review Sections 1113/1114 Motion (0.3); emails with Davis Polk team regarding same (0.3); call with E. Moskowitz and J. Windels regarding strategy (0.3).
Sokol, Nate	04/04/20	1.8	Review Sections 1113/1114 Motion and related declarations (1.4); correspondence with D. Mazer, J. Windels, and E. Moskowitz regarding same (0.4).
Stotsky, Jonah J.	04/04/20	12.1	Review and update declaration (0.8); correspondence with J. Windels and D. Mazer regarding same; (0.3); compile and review exhibits for Sections 1113/1114 Motion and declarations (6.6); review and revise same (0.7); correspondence with D. Leibowitz regarding same (0.1); calls with J. Windels, D. Mazer, D. Leibowitz, and G. Lee regarding same (0.3); calls with D. Mazer, D. Leibowitz, and G. Lee regarding same (1.8); coordinate service of Sections 1113/1114 Motion (0.8); further revise Sections 1113/1114 Motion (0.5); correspondence with D. Mazer regarding same (0.2).
Windels, James H.R.	04/04/20	9.5	Review and revise Sections 1113/1114 Motion (5.2); call with B. Resnick regarding same (0.3); correspondence with Davis Polk team same (2.2) call with Davis Polk team regarding same (0.3); call with D. Lee regarding declaration (1.5).
Bernstein, Alexander	04/05/20	0.2	Review correspondence from Davis Polk team regarding section 1113.
Leibowitz, Danielle	04/05/20	0.5	Call with Davis Polk team regarding Sections 1113/1114 Motion (0.3); correspondence with G. Lee regarding same (0.1); correspondence with J. Stotsky regarding same (0.1).
Mazer, Deborah S.	04/05/20	1.4	Calls with Davis Polk team regarding Sections 1113/1114 Motion (0.3); revise same (0.8); emails with same regarding same (0.3).
Moskowitz, Elliot	04/05/20	1.2	Correspondence with Davis Polk team regarding Sections 1113/1114 Motion and union issues (0.9); call with same regarding same (0.3).

Time Detail By Project			
Name	Date	Hours	Narrative
Stotsky, Jonah J.	04/05/20	1.1	Call with Davis Polk team regarding Sections 1113/1114 Motion (0.3); review and finalize same (0.7); correspondence with Davis Polk team regarding same (0.1).
Bernstein, Alexander	04/06/20	0.4	Correspondence with Davis Polk team regarding section 1113 issues and negotiations.
Crandall, Jeffrey P.	04/06/20	0.3	Review union negotiation updates.
Moskowitz, Elliot	04/06/20	6.2	Correspondence with team regarding labor negotiations (3.9); correspondence with buyer teams regarding same (1.1); correspondence with unions regarding labor negotiations (1.2).
Resnick, Brian M.	04/06/20	0.7	Call with Shearman & Sterling regarding section 1113 issues (0.4); emails with Davis Polk team regarding same (0.3).
Szanzer, Steven Z.	04/06/20	0.5	Review emails and correspondence regarding union issues.
Windels, James H.R.	04/06/20	0.3	Emails with Davis Polk team regarding status of union issues.
Bernstein, Alexander	04/07/20	2.8	Correspondence with Davis Polk team regarding section 1113 (0.3); review section 1113 filings (1.8); telephone conference with Dean Foods and Davis Polk team regarding union negotiations (0.7).
Lee, Grace	04/07/20	2.2	Review and analyze precedents regarding sections 1113/1114 filings (1.2); call with Dean Foods team and Davis Polk team regarding status of union negotiations (0.7); call with D. Mazer, J. Stotsky, and D. Leibowitz regarding next steps (0.3).
Leibowitz, Danielle	04/07/20	2.9	Call with Davis Polk and Dean Foods teams regarding sections 1113 and 1114 issues (0.7); attend call with D. Mazer, G. Lee, and J. Stotsky discussing next steps (0.3); research labor issues relating to section 1113 (1.9).
Mazer, Deborah S.	04/07/20	2.6	Call with Davis Polk team and Dean Foods team regarding sections 1113 and 1114 update (0.7); correspondence with Davis Polk team regarding same (0.7); call with D. Leibowitz, G. Lee, and J. Stotsky regarding next steps (0.3); analyze legal issues regarding same (0.9).
Moskowitz, Elliot	04/07/20	5.5	Correspondence with Dean Foods regarding union negotiations (2.3); correspondence with Dean Foods regarding labor question (1.1); correspondence with Davis Polk team regarding section 1113 next steps (0.9); call with Dean Foods and Davis Polk team regarding labor workstreams (0.7); call with Dairy Farmers of America's counsel regarding section 1113 issues (0.5).
Resnick, Brian M.	04/07/20	1.1	Emails with E. Moskowitz and others regarding Collective Bargaining Agreement negotiations and section 1113 issues (0.4); call with Dean Foods regarding same (0.7).
Sokol, Nate	04/07/20	0.5	Call with E. Moskowitz, D. Lee, and others regarding labor negotiations and section 1113 process (partial attendance).
Stotsky, Jonah J.	04/07/20	2.2	Review precedent section 1113 proposals and amendments (1.2); call with Dean Foods and Davis Polk team regarding labor workstreams and updates (0.7); call with D. Mazer, D. Leibowitz, and D. Lee regarding upcoming section 1113 hearing and workstreams (0.3).
Windels, James H.R.	04/07/20	0.7	Call with Dean Foods regarding status of union issues.
Bernstein, Alexander	04/08/20	1.0	Correspondence with D. Mazer regarding sections 1113/1114 Motion and hearing (0.6); correspondence with Davis Polk team regarding same (0.4).
Crandall, Jeffrey P.	04/08/20	0.2	Review sections 1113/1114 updates.

Time Detail By Project			
Name	Date	Hours	Narrative
Lee, Grace	04/08/20	6.4	Draft supplemental declaration in support of sections 1113/1114 Reply (4.2); review correspondence regarding labor negotiations and create tracker for ame (2.2).
Leibowitz, Danielle	04/08/20	5.5	Research labor law issues relating to sections 1113/1114 (3.6); correspondence with D. Mazer regarding same (0.3) attend teleconference with Davis Polk litigation team regarding union negotiations (0.5); review D. Lee declaration and sections 1113/1114 (1.1).
Mazer, Deborah S.	04/08/20	6.7	Telephonic conference with E. Moskowitz, D. Leibowitz, D. Lee, union representatives, and bidder representatives regarding sections 1113/1114 issues (0.6); telephonic conferences with D. Leibowitz regarding sections 1113/1114 issues (0.6); telephonic conference with A. Bernstein regarding sections 1113/1114 reply papers (0.5); research sections 1113/1114 issues (2.3); emails with Davis Polk team regarding same (1.6); review draft sections 1113/1114 documentation (1.1).
Moskowitz, Elliot	04/08/20	5.5	Correspondence with Davis Polk team regarding union issues (1.3); correspondence with Davis Polk team regarding sections 1113/1114 Motion preparation (3.2); correspondence with Davis Polk team and counsel regarding Prairie Farms labor issues (1.0).
Resnick, Brian M.	04/08/20	1.2	Correspondence with E. Moskowitz and J. Windels regarding sections 1113/1114 strategy.
Stotsky, Jonah J.	04/08/20	1.9	Review sections 1113/1114 proposal and amendment procedures and precedents (1.6); correspondence with Davis Polk team regarding same (0.3).
Szanzer, Steven Z.	04/08/20	0.4	Review emails from Davis Polk team regarding sections 1113/1114 process and updates.
Bernstein, Alexander	04/09/20	1.9	Telephone conference with Davis Polk team regarding sections 1113/1114 Reply (0.7); review pleadings regarding sections 1113/1114 (1.1); correspondence with Davis Polk team regarding objection regarding same (0.1).
Crandall, Jeffrey P.	04/09/20	0.2	Review sections 1113/1114 issues.
Lee, Grace	04/09/20	6.1	Correspondence with J. Windels, D. Mazer, and others regarding sections 1113/1114 Reply (0.5); update tracker for union negotiations (0.4); attend teleconference with Davis Polk team regarding union negotiations workstreams (0.1); review objections to the sections 1113/1114 Motion (1.1); prepare for teleconference with Dean Foods (0.6); correspondence with D. Mazer regarding same (0.3); teleconference with Davis Polk team, Dean Foods regarding sections 1113/1114 Reply (1.0); draft supplemental declaration in support of same (2.1)
Leibowitz, Danielle	04/09/20	5.6	Research regarding sections 1113/1114 process (3.1); review research regarding sections 1113/1114 issues (0.4); summarize same for Davis Polk litigation team (0.6); correspondence with D. Mazer regarding same (0.2); review and revise stipulation to adjourn sections 1113/1114 hearing for certain unions (0.5); collect and review sections 1113/1114 reply precedents (0.3); call with Davis Polk team regarding sections 1113/1114 workstreams (0.5).
Mazer, Deborah S.	04/09/20	5.5	Calls and correspondence with Davis Polk team regarding sections 1113/1114 Reply (2.2); draft same (3.3).
Resnick, Brian M.	04/09/20	0.5	Emails with Davis Polk litigation team regarding sections 1113/1114 strategy.

Time Detail By Project			
Name	Date	Hours	Narrative
Stotsky, Jonah J.	04/09/20	1.4	Call with Davis Polk team regarding sections 1113/1114 workstreams (0.6); review draft declaration in support of sections 1113/1114 Reply (0.5); correspondence with A. Bernstein regarding same (0.3).
Windels, James H.R.	04/09/20	3.0	Correspondence with Davis Polk team regarding status of union discussions (2.0) review objections to sections 1113/1114 motion (1.0)
Bernstein, Alexander	04/10/20	0.6	Review pleadings regarding sections 1113/1114 motion (0.5); correspondence with Davis Polk team regarding same (0.1).
Lee, Grace	04/10/20	7.6	Revise supplemental declaration in support of sections 1113/1114 motion (6.7); update tracker for union negotiations (0.3); analyze objections to the sections 1113/1114 motion (0.2); correspondence with J. Windels, D. Mazer, and D. Lee regarding status of union negotiations (0.4).
Leibowitz, Danielle	04/10/20	8.5	Correspondence with D. Mazer regarding sections 1113/1114 Reply (0.7); correspondence with G. Lee regarding same (0.2); draft same (7.6).
Mazer, Deborah S.	04/10/20	4.4	Correspondence with J. Windels, G. Lee and D. Lee regarding sections 1113/1114 Reply (0.5); teleconferences with Davis Polk team regarding same (1.0); research issues related to same (2.3); draft same (0.6).
Resnick, Brian M.	04/10/20	0.4	Calls with J. Windels and H. Birnbaum regarding sections 1113/1114 process (0.2); emails with Davis Polk team regarding same (0.2).
Sokol, Nate	04/10/20	0.2	Email with J. Windels, D. Mazer, and others regarding sections 1113/1114 Motion and Sale Objections.
Windels, James H.R.	04/10/20	4.0	Correspondence regarding sections 1113/1114 Motion (2.5); review union negotiation status (1.5).
Bernstein, Alexander	04/11/20	0.6	Review and revise Sections 1113/1114 Reply (0.4); correspondence with Davis Polk team regarding same (0.2).
Lee, Grace	04/11/20	1.8	Revise supplemental declaration in support of sections 1113/1114 Reply (1.2); correspondence with J. Windels, D. Mazer, and D. Lee regarding same (0.6).
Leibowitz, Danielle	04/11/20	0.9	Draft sections 1113/1114 Reply.
Mazer, Deborah S.	04/11/20	4.8	Draft sections 1113/1114 Reply (4.0); correspondence with J. Windels, G. Lee, and D. Lee regarding same (0.8).
Moskowitz, Elliot	04/11/20	2.4	Correspondence with Davis Polk team regarding labor developments and related issues.
Stotsky, Jonah J.	04/11/20	3.1	Review Sabatte objection, correspondence, and transcript of sale hearing (1.1); draft reply (1.1); update and circulate revised proposed sections 1113/1114 Order (0.9).
Windels, James H.R.	04/11/20	3.8	Review and revise sections 1113/1114 Reply and declarations (2.8); correspondence with Dean Foods and Davis Polk team regarding same (1.0).
Bernstein, Alexander	04/12/20	0.3	Correspondence with Davis Polk team regarding sections 1113/1114 issues.
Lee, Grace	04/12/20	0.9	Prepare exhibits in support of sections 1113/1114 Reply.
Leibowitz, Danielle	04/12/20	0.6	Revise sections 1113/1114 Reply.
Mazer, Deborah S.	04/12/20	3.4	Attend teleconference with J. Stotsky regarding sections 1113/1114 Reply (0.1); draft same (2.4); emails with Davis Polk team regarding same (0.7); emails with Creditors Committee regarding same (0.2).

Time Detail By Project			
Name	Date	Hours	Narrative
Moskowitz, Elliot	04/12/20	7.9	Correspondence with Davis Polk team regarding negotiations and labor updates (1.2); revise sections 1113/1114 Reply (3.7); revise declarations in support of same (0.9); call with K. Waterman regarding same (1.0); correspondence with B. Resnick regarding same (0.4); review case law in support of sections 1113/1114 position (0.7).
Resnick, Brian M.	04/12/20	0.5	Emails with Davis Polk team regarding sections 1113/1114 litigation (0.3); review sections 1113/1114 Reply (0.2).
Stotsky, Jonah J.	04/12/20	2.9	Call with D. Mazer regarding sections 1113/1114 Reply issues (0.1); correspondence regarding same (1.2); correspondence with G. Lee regarding exhibits for sections 1113/1114 Reply (0.2); review and revise same (1.4).
Windels, James H.R.	04/12/20	1.2	Review revisions to sections 1113/1114 Reply (1.0); correspondence with Davis Polk team regarding same (0.2).
Bernstein, Alexander	04/13/20	6.1	Research regarding sections 1113/1114 (1.3); correspondence with Davis Polk team regarding same (3.2); telephone conference with Davis Polk team regarding sections 1113/1114 pleadings (0.3); review same (0.9); further correspondence with Davis Polk team regarding same (0.2); telephone conference with D. Mazer regarding same (0.2).
Butler, James C	04/13/20	1.3	Research regarding sections 1113/1114.
Ginder, Kathleen	04/13/20	0.3	Call with J. Crandall and S. Brecher regarding Collective Bargaining Agreements.
Lee, Grace	04/13/20	6.7	Revise supplemental declaration in support of sections 1113/1114 Reply (3.8); correspondence with E. Moskowitz, J. Windels, D. Lee, and others regarding union negotiations (0.4); revise sections 1113/1114 Reply (2.5).
Leibowitz, Danielle	04/13/20	14.3	Review and revise sections 1113/1114 Reply (1.5); call with D. Lee, J. Goodchild, D. Bordoni, and Davis Polk labor team regarding sections 1113/1114 process status (0.5); correspondence with D. Mazer regarding stipulations to adjourn sections 1113/1114 hearing (0.5); correspondence with D. Mazer, J. Stotsky, and G. Lee regarding sections 1113/1114 Reply and related papers (0.6); revise union stipulations to adjourn sections 1113/1114 hearing (0.9); prepare sections 1113/1114 hearing agenda (0.6); review and revise sections 1113/1114 Reply and related papers (4.3); revise stipulations regarding sections 1113/1114 hearing (0.5); prepare sections 1113/1114 hearing agenda (0.6); review and revise sections 1113/1114 Reply and related papers (4.3).
Mazer, Deborah S.	04/13/20	11.1	Teleconferences with Davis Polk team regarding sections 1113/1114 papers and hearing (0.8); emails with Davis Polk team regarding same (3.2); emails with Norton Rose regarding same (0.7); draft sections 1113/ 1114 papers (6.4).
Moskowitz, Elliot	04/13/20	6.9	Revise sections 1113/1114 Reply and declarations (3.6); correspondence with Davis Polk team regarding same (2.4); review legal research relating to sections 1113/1114 proceedings (0.9).
Resnick, Brian M.	04/13/20	0.7	Emails with Davis Polk litigation team and other parties regarding sections 1113/1114 litigation issues.

Time Detail By Project			
Name	Date	Hours	Narrative
Stotsky, Jonah J.	04/13/20	8.6	Correspondence with Davis Polk team regarding sections 1113/1114 Order (0.3); correspondence with A. Bernstein and D. Mazer regarding research regarding liquidation issues (6.6); correspondence with N. Sokol regarding same (0.1); draft and circulate research summary to E. Moskowitz and others (1.2); draft sections 1113/1114 Reply and declarations and circulate for Davis Polk labor team review (0.4).
Windels, James H.R.	04/13/20	0.9	Calls and emails with Davis Polk team regarding sections 1113/1114 Reply.
Bernstein, Alexander	04/14/20	0.2	Correspondence with Davis Polk team regarding sections 1113/1114 (0.1); review correspondence with Dean Foods and Davis Polk team regarding same (0.1).
Moskowitz, Elliot	04/14/20	2.7	Correspondence with Davis Polk team regarding sections 1113/1114 and labor issues.
Stotsky, Jonah J.	04/14/20	6.3	Correspondence with D. Mazer regarding sections 1113/1114 workstreams (0.2); research sections 1113/1114 issues (4.6); draft research summary regarding same (1.5).
Bernstein, Alexander	04/15/20	0.4	Correspondence with Davis Polk team regarding sections 1113/1114 issues (0.3); correspondence with Dean Foods and Davis Polk team regarding same (0.1).
Lee, Grace	04/15/20	1.0	Attend teleconference with J. Windels and D. Mazer regarding Sections 1113/1114 Motion (0.4); call with D. Mazer regarding next steps regarding same (0.3); correspondence with Davis Polk Mergers & Acquisitions team regarding same (0.3).
Mazer, Deborah S.	04/15/20	1.5	Call with J. Windels and G. Lee regarding Sections 1113/1114 Motion (0.4); call with G. Lee regarding same (0.3); correspondence with Davis Polk team regarding same (0.8).
Resnick, Brian M.	04/15/20	0.4	Correspondence with Davis Polk team regarding section 1113/1114 issues.
Windels, James H.R.	04/15/20	0.4	Call with D. Mazer and G. Lee regarding Sections 1113/1114 Motion.
Bernstein, Alexander	04/16/20	0.2	Correspondence with Davis Polk team regarding section 1113/1114 issues.
Crandall, Jeffrey P.	04/16/20	0.4	Review union negotiations updates.
Lee, Grace	04/16/20	2.0	Attend call with J. Windels and D. Mazer regarding other sections 1113/1114 proposals (0.4); calls with D. Mazer regarding same (0.1); draft correspondence related to sections 1113 and 1114 proposals (1.1); prepare schedule of Collective Bargaining Agreements (0.4).
Mazer, Deborah S.	04/16/20	7.5	Call with J. Pittell regarding asset sales in connection with sections 1113/1114 process (0.9); call with J. Windels and G. Lee regarding Sections 1113/1114 Motion (0.4); call with G. Lee regarding same (0.1); draft same (6.1).
Moskowitz, Elliot	04/16/20	2.7	Correspondence with Davis Polk team regarding sections 1113/1114 issues (1.9); correspondence with same regarding status of sales in connection with same (0.8).
Pittell, Joshua B.	04/16/20	0.9	Call with D. Mazer regarding Section 1113/1114 workstreams and sale status in connection with same.
Resnick, Brian M.	04/16/20	0.2	Correspondence with Davis Polk team regarding sections 1113/1114 issues.
Stotsky, Jonah J.	04/16/20	9.2	Draft Sections 1113/1114 Motion`.
Windels, James H.R.	04/16/20	0.9	Review Sections 1113/1114 Motions (0.5); call with D. Mazer and G. Lee regarding same (0.4).

Time Detail By Project			
Name	Date	Hours	Narrative
Bernstein, Alexander	04/17/20	1.5	Review pleadings regarding Sections 1113/1114 Motion (0.9); correspondence with Davis Polk team regarding same (0.2); correspondence with Davis Polk team regarding strategy regarding section 1113 process (0.3); review correspondence with Dean Foods and Davis Polk team regarding same (0.1).
Crandall, Jeffrey P.	04/17/20	0.5	Review Collective Bargaining Agreement issues.
Lee, Grace	04/17/20	6.2	Review and analyze case law relating to Sections 1113/1114 Reply (1.7); draft Sections 1113/1114 Motion in connection with additional sale transactions (2.5); review union objections (0.8); attend teleconference with J. Windels, D. Mazer, and others regarding same (0.5); review correspondence with Davis Polk team regarding closing facilities (0.7).
Leibowitz, Danielle	04/17/20	3.1	Review union objections to Sections 1113/1114 Motion (1.0); call with D. Mazer regarding same (0.2); call with Davis Polk Litigation team regarding same (0.5); review and summarize case law cited in union objections (1.4).
Mazer, Deborah S.	04/17/20	3.6	Call with J. Windels and others regarding Sections 1113/1114 Motion and union objections (0.5); draft Sections 1113/1114 Reply (3.1).
Moskowitz, Elliot	04/17/20	6.4	Review union objections (0.7); correspondence with Davis Polk team regarding same and Sections 1113/1114 Reply (0.4); correspondence with Davis Polk team regarding status of sales in connection with same (1.6); correspondence with Davis Polk team regarding sections 1113/1114 issues (3.7).
Pittell, Joshua B.	04/17/20	1.4	Correspondence with Davis Polk team regarding status of sales in connection with sections 1113/1114 issues.
Resnick, Brian M.	04/17/20	0.3	Emails with Davis Polk team regarding sections 1113/1114 issues.
Sokol, Nate	04/17/20	0.3	Call with J. Windels and others regarding section 1113/1114 filings (partial attendance).
Stotsky, Jonah J.	04/17/20	6.8	Correspondence with E. Moskowitz regarding sections 1113/1114 issues (0.9); additional research regarding same (1.1); revise Sections 1113/1114 Motion (4.3); call with Davis Polk Litigation team regarding union objections to Sections 1113/1114 Motion (0.5).
Windels, James H.R.	04/17/20	2.8	Call with Davis Polk team regarding Sections 1113/1114 Motion and related issues (0.5); review union objections (2.3).
Lee, Grace	04/18/20	7.3	Draft Sections 1113/1114 Reply (4.3); review and revise declaration in support of same (1.0); correspondence with D. Mazer regarding same (0.1); attend call with D. Mazer, J. Stotsky, and D. Leibowitz regarding sections 1113/1114 workstreams (0.1); further revise declaration for sections 1113/1114 Motion (1.0); review Collective Bargaining Agreements related to sale transactions (0.8).
Leibowitz, Danielle	04/18/20	6.9	Legal research relating to union objection to Sections 1113/1114 Motion (1.5); review and revise Sections 1113/1114 Reply (5.3); call with D. Mazer, J. Stotsky, and G. Lee regarding same (0.1).
Mazer, Deborah S.	04/18/20	7.0	Correspondence with Davis Polk team regarding Sections 1113/1114 Motion (1.4); review and revise Sections 1113/1114 Motions (5.5); call with Davis Polk team regarding sections 1113/1114 workstreams (0.1).
Stotsky, Jonah J.	04/18/20	8.8	Draft Section 1113/1114 Reply (8.7); call with D. Mazer, D. Leibowitz, and G. Lee regarding workstreams for same (0.1).

Time Detail By Project			
Name	Date	Hours	Narrative
Windels, James H.R.	04/18/20	2.5	Emails with Davis Polk team regarding sections 1113/1114 workstreams (0.8); review draft pleadings in connection with same (0.7); review and revise draft declaration (1.0).
Bernstein, Alexander	04/19/20	0.2	Correspondence with Davis Polk team regarding sections 1113/1114 process and strategy.
Lee, Grace	04/19/20	1.1	Revise declarations in support of Sections 1113/1114 Reply (0.9); call with D. Mazer and Davis Polk team regarding same (0.2).
Leibowitz, Danielle	04/19/20	1.8	Review and revise declaration for Sections 1113/1114 Motion (1.4); correspondence with D. Mazer regarding same (0.2); correspondence with J. Pittell regarding same (0.2).
Mazer, Deborah S.	04/19/20	2.6	Teleconference with Davis Polk team regarding sections 1113/1114 papers (0.2); draft same (2.4).
Moskowitz, Elliot	04/19/20	2.1	Correspondence with Davis Polk team regarding section 1113/1114 issues (1.2); review draft Sections 1113/1114 Motion (0.5); call with Logix counsel regarding same (0.4).
Stotsky, Jonah J.	04/19/20	1.8	Revise Sections 1113/1114 Motion (1.1); review and revise declaration in support of same (0.7).
Windels, James H.R.	04/19/20	1.2	Emails with Davis Polk team regarding Sections 1113/1114 Motions and transactions.
Bernstein, Alexander	04/20/20	0.1	Review correspondence from Davis Polk team regarding section 1113/1114 issues.
Lee, Grace	04/20/20	3.6	Review and revise Sections 1113/1114 Motions (1.5); call with D. Mazer, D. Leibowitz, and J. Stotsky regarding same (0.4); call with D. Mazer regarding Sections 1113/1114 Reply (0.2); prepare proposed orders and schedules for Sections 1113/1114 Motions (1.5).
Leibowitz, Danielle	04/20/20	2.5	Review and revise declaration in support of Producers Dairy Sections 1113/1114 Reply (1.4); call with D. Mazer, J. Stotsky, and G. Lee regarding same (0.4); review email updates regarding sales in connection with revision to sections 1113/1114 papers (0.3); call with J. Pittell regarding same (0.4).
Mazer, Deborah S.	04/20/20	6.5	Call with G. Lee regarding sections 1113/1114 papers (0.2); call with G. Lee, D. Leibowitz, and J. Stotsky regarding same (0.4); draft Sections 1113/1114 Motions (5.9).
Moskowitz, Elliot	04/20/20	6.5	Revise Sections 1113/1114 Sale Reply and declarations (3.3); correspondence with Davis Polk team regarding sections 1113/1114 issues (1.9); calls with F. Perillo regarding union issues (0.6); correspondence with Davis Polk team regarding sections 1113/1114 negotiations (0.7).
Pittell, Joshua B.	04/20/20	0.4	Call with D. Leibowitz regarding sale process in connection with sections 1113/1114 process.
Resnick, Brian M.	04/20/20	0.7	Correspondence with Davis Polk team regarding sections 1113/1114 issues.
Stotsky, Jonah J.	04/20/20	3.0	Draft Sections 1113/1114 Motion (2.6); call with D. Mazer, D. Leibowitz, and G. Lee regarding workstreams in connection with same (0.4).
Bernstein, Alexander	04/21/20	0.5	Review correspondence from Davis Polk team regarding sections 1113/1114 issues (0.3); review correspondence from union regarding same (0.2).

Time Detail By Project			
Name	Date	Hours	Narrative
Lee, Grace	04/21/20	3.3	Revise declaration and exhibits in support of Sections 1113/1114 Reply (2.2); call with D. Lee and D. Mazer regarding declaration in support of same (0.3); correspondence with D. Lee and D. Slipakoff regarding declaration in support of same (0.4); call with D. Mazer regarding declaration in support of same (0.4).
Leibowitz, Danielle	04/21/20	2.7	Review and revise Sections 1113/1114 Motion.
Mazer, Deborah S.	04/21/20	9.5	Call with E. Moskowitz regarding sections 1113/1114 papers (0.5); call with B. Resnick, E. Moskowitz, S. Szanzer, and N. Sokol regarding sections 1113/1114 sale issues (0.4); call with D. Lee and G. Lee regarding supplemental declaration (0.3); call with G. Lee regarding same (0.4); correspondence with C. Adamson regarding Producers Dairy sale and related labor issues (0.2); draft sections 1113/1114 papers (7.7).
Moskowitz, Elliot	04/21/20	8.4	Correspondence with Davis Polk team regarding Hawaii sections 1113/1114 negotiations (1.6); correspondence with counsel to Mana regarding same (1.0); review and revise Sections 1113/1114 Sale Reply and related declarations (2.1); correspondence with team regarding Sections 1113/1114 Motion (0.5); further correspondence with team regarding Sections 1113/1114 Motion (0.6); call with counsel to Dairy Farmers of America regarding sections 1113/1114 issues (0.7); review legal research regarding same (0.8); call with D. Mazer regarding sections 1113/1114 papers (0.5); call with B. Resnick, S. Szanzer, N. Sokol and others regarding sections 1113/1114 issues (0.4); correspondence with same regarding same (0.2).
Resnick, Brian M.	04/21/20	0.4	Call with Davis Polk Litigation team regarding sections 1113/1114.
Sokol, Nate	04/21/20	0.5	Call with D. Mazer, E. Moskowitz and others regarding sections 1113/1114 filings (0.4); correspondence with same regarding same (0.1).
Szanzer, Steven Z.	04/21/20	0.8	Call with Davis Polk Litigation team regarding sections 1113/1114 (0.4); correspondence with same regarding same (0.4).
Bernstein, Alexander	04/22/20	0.4	Review correspondence with Davis Polk team regarding sections 1113/1114 issues and strategy.
Lee, Grace	04/22/20	7.6	Attend call with M. Adams and D. Mazer regarding Sections 1113/1114 Motion (0.7); finalize Sections 1113/1114 Reply and declarations (1.2); revise Sections 1113/1114 Reply and declarations (4.9); review union sections 1113/1114 objection to prepare for April 23, 2020 hearing (0.8).
Mazer, Deborah S.	04/22/20	6.7	Call with E. Moskowitz regarding sections 1113/1114 papers (0.3); call with E. Moskowitz and Dean Foods team regarding Section 1113/1114 Motion (0.4); correspondence with Davis Polk team regarding same (0.4); call with G. Lee and M. Adams regarding same (0.7); correspondence with G. Lee regarding same (0.8); draft sections 1113/1114 papers (4.1).

Time Detail By Project			
Name	Date	Hours	Narrative
Moskowitz, Elliot	04/22/20	7.0	Calls with union counsel regarding sections 1113/1114 issues (0.8); correspondence with Davis Polk team regarding Hawaii sections 1113/1114 negotiations (1.2); correspondence with Davis Polk team, Mana's counsel, and Dean Foods regarding Mana sections 1113/1114 negotiations (1.6); correspondence with Davis Polk team and Dean Foods regarding Section 1114 Motion (1.8); call with B. Resnick regarding same (0.2); correspondence with same regarding same (0.4); correspondence with Creditors Committee regarding labor negotiations (0.7); call with D. Mazer regarding sections 1113/1114 papers (0.3).
Resnick, Brian M.	04/22/20	1.2	Correspondence with Davis Polk team and Dean Foods regarding sections 1113/1114 strategy (1.0); call with E. Moskowitz regarding section 1114 (0.2).
Stotsky, Jonah J.	04/22/20	3.8	Review and finalize Sections 1113/1114 Motion (2.2); correspondence with D. Mazer regarding same (0.1); finalize sections 1113/1114 papers (0.4); review Sections 1113/1114 Motion (1.1).
Bernstein, Alexander	04/23/20	0.1	Correspondence with D. Mazer regarding sections 1113/1114 stipulation.
Crandall, Jeffrey P.	04/23/20	0.2	Review Collective Bargaining Agreement negotiation update.
Lee, Grace	04/23/20	3.9	Prepare section 1114 proposals (3.3); revise Sections 1113/1114 Motion and declarations (0.5).
Mazer, Deborah S.	04/23/20	10.6	Correspondence with G. Lee regarding sections 1113/1114 papers (0.3); correspondence with S. Brecher regarding PBGC issue (0.2); correspondence with D. Leibowitz and J. Stotsky regarding sections 1113/1114 updates (0.3); call with Shearman & Sterling regarding sections 1113/1114 issues (0.2); draft sections 1113/1114 papers (9.6).
Moskowitz, Elliot	04/23/20	3.0	Correspondence with Davis Polk team and Dean Foods regarding sections 1113/1114 negotiations with unions (1.3); correspondence with Davis Polk team regarding additional sections 1113/1114 workstreams (1.7).
Pittell, Joshua B.	04/23/20	0.4	Correspondence with D. Mazer regarding sale status in connection with sections 1113/1114 workstreams.
Resnick, Brian M.	04/23/20	0.7	Correspondence with Davis Polk Litigation team regarding sections 1113/1114 issues (0.2); call with K. Waterman and E. Moskowitz regarding sections 1113/1114 settlement (0.3); review Sections 1113/1114 Motions (0.2).
Stotsky, Jonah J.	04/23/20	2.6	Review pleadings related to sections 1113/1114 (0.9); draft sections 1113/1114 stipulation (1.1); correspondence with D. Leibowitz and G. Lee regarding same (0.4); correspondence with D. Leibowitz and D. Mazer regarding sections 1113/1114 workstreams (0.2).
Szanzer, Steven Z.	04/23/20	0.4	Review emails with Davis Polk team regarding sections 1113/1114 workstreams.
Lee, Grace	04/24/20	5.6	Revise Logix Sections 1113/1114 Motion and declarations (4.1); correspondence with D. Lee and D. Mazer regarding same (0.3); revise same (1.1).
Leibowitz, Danielle	04/24/20	1.8	Review and revise Logix Sections 1113/1114 Motion.

Time Detail By Project			
Name	Date	Hours	Narrative
Mazer, Deborah S.	04/24/20	8.0	Attend teleconference with F. Perillo and E. Moskowitz regarding Sections 1113/1114 Motions (0.5); attend teleconference with D. Lee regarding Sections 1113/1114 Declaration (0.5); correspondence with E. Moskowitz and J. Windels regarding same (1.1); ; emails with Norton Rose regarding filing same (0.2); draft sections 1113/1114 papers (5.7).
Moskowitz, Elliot	04/24/20	3.8	Calls and correspondence with F. Perillo regarding union negotiations and papers (1.6); call with Creditors Committee regarding union negotiation status (0.4); review and revise Logix Sections 1113/1114 Motion and Declaration (1.8).
Resnick, Brian M.	04/24/20	0.6	Emails with E. Moskowitz regarding sections 1113/1114 strategy and potential settlements.
Stotsky, Jonah J.	04/24/20	2.3	Draft proposed Sections 1113/1114 Order (1.1); correspondence with D. Mazer, D. Leibowitz, and G. Lee regarding same (0.4); review Logix Sections 1113/1114 Motion (0.8).
Szanzer, Steven Z.	04/24/20	0.2	Correspondence with Davis Polk team regarding union issues.
Windels, James H.R.	04/24/20	0.7	Correspondence with Davis Polk team regarding sections 1113/1114 filings.
Lee, Grace	04/25/20	1.5	Revise Sections 1113/1114 Motion.
Mazer, Deborah S.	04/25/20	2.1	Draft Sections 1113/1114 Motion (0.7); correspondence with Davis Polk team regarding same (0.4).
Lee, Grace	04/26/20	1.9	Prepare declarations in support of further Sections 1113/1114 Motion.
Mazer, Deborah S.	04/26/20	1.7	Draft sections 1113/1114 papers (1.4); emails with Davis Polk team regarding same (0.3).
Bernstein, Alexander	04/27/20	0.2	Review filing regarding sections 1113/1114.
Lee, Grace	04/27/20	4.6	Revise declarations in support of Sections 1113/1114 Motion (2.5); prepare exhibits to same (1.7); attend teleconference with D. Slipakoff and D. Mazer regarding declaration in support of same (0.3).
Mazer, Deborah S.	04/27/20	7.4	Correspondence with E. Moskowitz regarding revised proposed sections 1113/1114 orders (0.2); correspondence with G. Lee regarding sections 1113/1114 papers (0.2); attend teleconference with D. Slipakoff and others regarding sections 1113/1114 papers (0.3); draft sections 1113/1114 papers (6.7).
Moskowitz, Elliot	04/27/20	5.5	Correspondence with Dean Foods team and co-counsel regarding Hawaii labor negotiations (2.4); correspondence with Davis Polk team regarding Mana labor issues (0.5); review sections 1113/1114 issues (1.6); revise proposed Sections 1113/1114 Order (0.6); correspondence with counsel to Dairy Farmers of America regarding sections 1113/1114 issues (0.4).
Netzer, Omer	04/27/20	0.3	Correspondence with D. Mazer regarding Sections 1113/1114 Motion.
Resnick, Brian M.	04/27/20	0.5	Emails with Davis Polk team regarding sections 1113/1114 negotiations.
Bernstein, Alexander	04/28/20	0.4	Review Sections 1113/1114 Motion.
Lee, Grace	04/28/20	3.0	Review Logix proposed Sections 1113/1114 Order (0.8); review precedent notices of rejection of Collective Bargaining Agreements (0.3); review Sections 1113/1114 Motion, exhibits, and declarations (1.6).

Time Detail By Project				
Name	Date	Hours	Narrative	
Mazer, Deborah S.	04/28/20	4.5	Correspondence with E. Moskowitz regarding sections 1113/1114 papers (0.1); draft same (4.4).	
Moskowitz, Elliot	04/28/20	6.2	Prepare for and participate in sections 1113/1114 negotiations (3.9); correspondence with Davis Polk team regarding sections 1113/1114 issues (1.9); review Sections 1113/1114 Motion (0.9).	
Resnick, Brian M.	04/28/20	0.2	Emails with Davis Polk team regarding sections 1113/1114 issues.	
Mazer, Deborah S.	04/29/20	2.1	Correspondence with Davis Polk team regarding Sabatte Sections 1113/1114 Motion (0.3); draft same (1.8).	
Moskowitz, Elliot	04/29/20	2.9	Correspondence with Davis Polk team regarding sections 1113/1114 issues (2.9).	
Ginder, Kathleen	04/30/20	0.9	Review collective bargaining agreements.	
Lee, Grace	04/30/20	4.8	Prepare notice of rejection of Collective Bargaining Agreements (1.1); collect and review Collective Bargaining Agreements for same (0.8); review and review Sabatte Sections 1113/1114 Motion (1.7); revise and revise declaration and exhibits in support of same (1.2).	
Mazer, Deborah S.	04/30/20	7.4	Correspondence with E. Moskowitz and G. Lee regarding Sections 1113/1114 Motion (0.3); draft same (7.1).	
Moskowitz, Elliot	04/30/20	3.5	Call with counsel to Mana regarding labor issues (0.7); correspondence with Davis Polk team regarding Mana labor issues (0.4); review Sabatte Sections 1113/1114 Motion (1.4); correspondence with Davis Polk team regarding open labor issues (0.7).	
Total R205 COLLECTIVE BARGAINING AGREEMENTS		751.9		
TOTAL		6,807.9		
DISBURSEMENT DETAIL				
Date	Vendor Name	Expense Type	Description	Amount
01/08/20		Court and related fees	Payee: Sokol, Nate, CourtCall, 1/8/2020,	\$170.00
01/23/20		Court and related fees	Payee: Sokol, Nate, CourtCall, 1/23/2020,	\$212.00
04/09/20	TSG Reporting, Inc	Court and related fees	VENDOR: TSG Reporting, Inc, INVOICE #: 686043, DATE: 4/9/2020 Witness Matthew Niemann 3/11 Req By Grace Lee	\$1,582.30
04/09/20	TSG Reporting, Inc	Court and related fees	VENDOR: TSG Reporting, Inc, INVOICE #: 207855, DATE: 4/9/2020 Witness Anthony Magro 3/10 Req By Grace Lee	\$2,835.70
04/30/20		Court and related fees	Pacer transactions 04/2020	\$65.00

DISBURSEMENT DETAIL				
Date	Vendor Name	Expense Type	Description	Amount
01/06/20		Meals	Payee: Millerman, James M., OT 7:58 PM, Chopt,	\$15.85
01/13/20		Meals	Payee: Adamson, Cameron, OT 6:29 PM, Roti Modern Mediterranean,	\$15.08
01/16/20		Meals	Payee: Millerman, James M., OT 8:02 PM, Chopt,	\$14.99
01/17/20		Meals	Payee: Resnick, Brian M., Starbucks, 1/17/2020,	\$10.14
01/18/20		Meals	Payee: Millerman, James M., OT 2:38 PM, Two Tablespoons,	\$20.00
01/21/20		Meals	Payee: Millerman, James M., OT 6:58 PM, Chopt,	\$16.07
01/22/20		Meals	Payee: Millerman, James M., OT 7:56 PM, Chopt,	\$11.52
01/23/20		Meals	Payee: Millerman, James M., OT 6:32 PM, Chopt,	\$18.01
02/05/20		Meals	Payee: Millerman, James M., OT 6:58 PM, Chopt,	\$15.85
02/08/20		Meals	Payee: Adamson, Cameron, OT 2:38 AM, Dough Boys Pizza,	\$20.00
02/16/20		Meals	Payee: Millerman, James M., OT 1:52 PM, Two Tablespoons,	\$20.00
02/17/20		Meals	Payee: Millerman, James M., OT 1:08 PM, Chopt,	\$12.83
02/24/20		Meals	Payee: Resnick, Brian M., Hudson News, 2/24/2020,	\$12.93
02/24/20		Meals	Payee: Resnick, Brian M., Estuary, 2/24/2020,	\$276.20
02/25/20		Meals	Payee: Resnick, Brian M., Lebanese Taverna Express, 2/25/2020,	\$14.24
03/09/20		Meals	Payee: Windels, James H.R., 3/9/2020,	\$86.08
03/09/20		Meals	Payee: Windels, James H.R., District Market, 3/9/2020, Lunch at Airport	\$20.03
03/10/20		Meals	Payee: Windels, James H.R., 3/10/2020,	\$69.28

DISBURSEMENT DETAIL				
Date	Vendor Name	Expense Type	Description	Amount
03/11/20		Meals	Payee: Windels, James H.R., 3/11/2020,	\$46.32
03/11/20		Meals	Payee: Windels, James H.R., 3/11/2020,	\$71.97
03/12/20		Meals	Payee: Windels, James H.R., 3/12/2020,	\$44.32
03/13/20		Meals	Payee: Windels, James H.R., El Premio Restaurant - Meal at Airport, 3/13/2020,	\$40.40
04/01/20		Outside Documents & Research	Restructuring Concepts/netDockets: Yichen Liu; 4/1/2020 6:46:00 AM; Description: Single case search; Charge id: 284558	\$5.44
04/01/20		Outside Documents & Research	Restructuring Concepts/netDockets: Yichen Liu; 4/1/2020 5:27:00 PM; Description: Single case search; Charge id: 284751	\$5.44
04/01/20		Outside Documents & Research	Restructuring Concepts/netDockets: Yichen Liu; 4/1/2020 5:30:00 PM; Description: Downloaded S0258: Docket #1375 (Main Document); Charge id: 284752	\$3.27
04/01/20		Outside Documents & Research	courtlink: Search For Grace Lee	\$0.10
04/01/20		Outside Documents & Research	courtlink: Document View For Korey Boehm	\$0.22
04/01/20		Outside Documents & Research	courtlink: Single Search For Korey Boehm	\$7.22
04/02/20		Outside Documents & Research	Restructuring Concepts/netDockets: Yichen Liu; 4/2/2020 1:54:00 PM; Description: Single case search; Charge id: 284951	\$5.44
04/02/20		Outside Documents & Research	Restructuring Concepts/netDockets: Yichen Liu; 4/2/2020 1:55:00 PM; Description: Downloaded E0110: Docket #518; Charge id: 284953	\$3.27
04/02/20		Outside Documents & Research	Restructuring Concepts/netDockets: Yichen Liu; 4/2/2020 1:43:00 PM; Description: Downloaded B0157: Docket #481; Charge id: 284933	\$3.27
04/02/20		Outside Documents & Research	Restructuring Concepts/netDockets: Yichen Liu; 4/2/2020 1:45:00 PM; Description: Single case search; Charge id: 284936	\$5.44

DISBURSEMENT DETAIL				
Date	Vendor Name	Expense Type	Description	Amount
04/02/20		Outside Documents & Research	Restructuring Concepts/netDockets: Yichen Liu; 4/2/2020 1:50:00 PM; Description: Downloaded F0132: Docket #316; Charge id: 284946	\$3.27
04/02/20		Outside Documents & Research	Restructuring Concepts/netDockets: Yichen Liu; 4/2/2020 1:52:00 PM; Description: Single case search; Charge id: 284947	\$5.44
04/02/20		Outside Documents & Research	Restructuring Concepts/netDockets: Yichen Liu; 4/2/2020 1:35:00 PM; Description: Single case search; Charge id: 284926	\$5.44
04/02/20		Outside Documents & Research	Restructuring Concepts/netDockets: Yichen Liu; 4/2/2020 1:36:00 PM; Description: Downloaded W0082: Docket #1533; Charge id: 284927	\$3.27
04/02/20		Outside Documents & Research	Restructuring Concepts/netDockets: Yichen Liu; 4/2/2020 1:29:00 PM; Description: Single case search; Charge id: 284912	\$5.44
04/02/20		Outside Documents & Research	Restructuring Concepts/netDockets: Yichen Liu; 4/2/2020 1:46:00 PM; Description: Downloaded S0243: Docket #590; Charge id: 284939	\$3.27
04/02/20		Outside Documents & Research	Restructuring Concepts/netDockets: Yichen Liu; 4/2/2020 1:47:00 PM; Description: Single case search; Charge id: 284941	\$5.44
04/02/20		Outside Documents & Research	Restructuring Concepts/netDockets: Yichen Liu; 4/2/2020 1:32:00 PM; Description: Downloaded A0295: Docket #975; Charge id: 284917	\$3.27
04/02/20		Outside Documents & Research	Restructuring Concepts/netDockets: Yichen Liu; 4/2/2020 1:34:00 PM; Description: Single case search; Charge id: 284925	\$5.44
04/02/20		Outside Documents & Research	Restructuring Concepts/netDockets: Yichen Liu; 4/2/2020 10:14:00 AM; Description: Downloaded E0110: Docket #403; Charge id: 284843	\$3.27
04/02/20		Outside Documents & Research	Restructuring Concepts/netDockets: Yichen Liu; 4/2/2020 1:37:00 PM; Description: Single case search; Charge id: 284928	\$5.44

DISBURSEMENT DETAIL				
Date	Vendor Name	Expense Type	Description	Amount
04/02/20		Outside Documents & Research	Restructuring Concepts/netDockets: Yichen Liu; 4/2/2020 1:38:00 PM; Description: Downloaded S0226: Docket #2371; Charge id: 284929	\$3.27
04/02/20		Outside Documents & Research	Restructuring Concepts/netDockets: Yichen Liu; 4/2/2020 9:42:00 AM; Description: Downloaded A0295: Docket #764; Charge id: 284806	\$3.27
04/02/20		Outside Documents & Research	Restructuring Concepts/netDockets: Yichen Liu; 4/2/2020 9:59:00 AM; Description: Single case search; Charge id: 284818	\$5.44
04/02/20		Outside Documents & Research	Restructuring Concepts/netDockets: Yichen Liu; 4/2/2020 1:29:00 PM; Description: Downloaded B0159: Docket #315; Charge id: 284914	\$3.27
04/02/20		Outside Documents & Research	Restructuring Concepts/netDockets: Yichen Liu; 4/2/2020 1:31:00 PM; Description: Single case search; Charge id: 284915	\$5.44
04/02/20		Outside Documents & Research	Restructuring Concepts/netDockets: Yichen Liu; 4/2/2020 10:12:00 AM; Description: Single case search; Charge id: 284836	\$5.44
04/02/20		Outside Documents & Research	Restructuring Concepts/netDockets: Yichen Liu; 4/2/2020 10:13:00 AM; Description: Single case search; Charge id: 284840	\$5.44
04/02/20		Outside Documents & Research	Restructuring Concepts/netDockets: Yichen Liu; 4/2/2020 1:40:00 PM; Description: Downloaded S0226: Docket #2367; Charge id: 284930	\$3.27
04/02/20		Outside Documents & Research	Restructuring Concepts/netDockets: Yichen Liu; 4/2/2020 1:42:00 PM; Description: Single case search; Charge id: 284931	\$5.44
04/02/20		Outside Documents & Research	Restructuring Concepts/netDockets: Yichen Liu; 4/2/2020 9:59:00 AM; Description: Downloaded P0175: Docket #316; Charge id: 284819	\$3.27
04/02/20		Outside Documents & Research	Restructuring Concepts/netDockets: Yichen Liu; 4/2/2020 10:11:00 AM; Description: Single case search; Charge id: 284835	\$5.44

DISBURSEMENT DETAIL				
Date	Vendor Name	Expense Type	Description	Amount
04/02/20		Outside Documents & Research	Restructuring Concepts/netDockets: Yichen Liu; 4/2/2020 9:42:00 AM; Description: Single case search; Charge id: 284805	\$5.44
04/03/20		Outside Documents & Research	Restructuring Concepts/netDockets: Yichen Liu; 4/3/2020 1:40:00 PM; Description: Downloaded T0184: Docket #3383; Charge id: 285234	\$3.27
04/03/20		Outside Documents & Research	Restructuring Concepts/netDockets: Yichen Liu; 4/3/2020 6:23:00 PM; Description: Downloaded W0092: Docket #310 (Proposed Order); Charge id: 285271	\$3.27
04/03/20		Outside Documents & Research	Restructuring Concepts/netDockets: Yichen Liu; 4/3/2020 6:24:00 PM; Description: Single case search; Charge id: 285272	\$5.44
04/03/20		Outside Documents & Research	Restructuring Concepts/netDockets: Yichen Liu; 4/3/2020 6:01:00 PM; Description: Single case search; Charge id: 285261	\$5.44
04/03/20		Outside Documents & Research	Restructuring Concepts/netDockets: Yichen Liu; 4/3/2020 6:04:00 PM; Description: Downloaded P0175: Docket #340 (Main Document); Charge id: 285262	\$3.27
04/03/20		Outside Documents & Research	Restructuring Concepts/netDockets: Yichen Liu; 4/3/2020 1:33:00 PM; Description: Single case search; Charge id: 285227	\$5.44
04/03/20		Outside Documents & Research	Restructuring Concepts/netDockets: Yichen Liu; 4/3/2020 1:34:00 PM; Description: Single case search; Charge id: 285228	\$5.44
04/03/20		Outside Documents & Research	Restructuring Concepts/netDockets: Yichen Liu; 4/3/2020 6:07:00 PM; Description: Downloaded P0175: Docket #339; Charge id: 285265	\$3.27
04/03/20		Outside Documents & Research	Restructuring Concepts/netDockets: Yichen Liu; 4/3/2020 6:08:00 PM; Description: Single case search; Charge id: 285266	\$5.44
04/03/20		Outside Documents & Research	Restructuring Concepts/netDockets: Yichen Liu; 4/3/2020 1:36:00 PM; Description: Single case search; Charge id: 285231	\$5.44
04/03/20		Outside Documents & Research	Restructuring Concepts/netDockets: Yichen Liu; 4/3/2020 1:37:00 PM; Description: Single case search; Charge id: 285232	\$5.44

DISBURSEMENT DETAIL				
Date	Vendor Name	Expense Type	Description	Amount
04/03/20		Outside Documents & Research	Restructuring Concepts/netDockets: Yichen Liu; 4/3/2020 7:55:00 PM; Description: Single case search; Charge id: 285327	\$5.44
04/03/20		Outside Documents & Research	Restructuring Concepts/netDockets: Yichen Liu; 4/3/2020 7:55:00 PM; Description: Single case search; Charge id: 285328	\$5.44
04/03/20		Outside Documents & Research	Restructuring Concepts/netDockets: Yichen Liu; 4/3/2020 7:18:00 PM; Description: Downloaded C0127: Docket #6273; Charge id: 285319	\$3.27
04/03/20		Outside Documents & Research	Restructuring Concepts/netDockets: Yichen Liu; 4/3/2020 7:19:00 PM; Description: Downloaded C0127: Docket #6783; Charge id: 285320	\$3.27
04/03/20		Outside Documents & Research	Restructuring Concepts/netDockets: Yichen Liu; 4/3/2020 7:21:00 PM; Description: Single case search; Charge id: 285323	\$5.44
04/03/20		Outside Documents & Research	Restructuring Concepts/netDockets: Yichen Liu; 4/3/2020 7:21:00 PM; Description: Single case search; Charge id: 285324	\$5.44
04/03/20		Outside Documents & Research	Restructuring Concepts/netDockets: Yichen Liu; 4/3/2020 7:15:00 PM; Description: Downloaded T0181: Docket #341 (Exhibit A); Charge id: 285313	\$3.27
04/03/20		Outside Documents & Research	Restructuring Concepts/netDockets: Yichen Liu; 4/3/2020 7:16:00 PM; Description: Single case search; Charge id: 285314	\$5.44
04/03/20		Outside Documents & Research	Restructuring Concepts/netDockets: Yichen Liu; 4/3/2020 7:55:00 PM; Description: Downloaded F0132: Docket #373; Charge id: 285329	\$3.27
04/03/20		Outside Documents & Research	Restructuring Concepts/netDockets: Yichen Liu; 4/3/2020 7:17:00 PM; Description: Single case search; Charge id: 285317	\$5.44
04/03/20		Outside Documents & Research	Restructuring Concepts/netDockets: Yichen Liu; 4/3/2020 7:18:00 PM; Description: Single case search; Charge id: 285318	\$5.44

DISBURSEMENT DETAIL				
Date	Vendor Name	Expense Type	Description	Amount
04/03/20		Outside Documents & Research	Restructuring Concepts/netDockets: Yichen Liu; 4/3/2020 7:11:00 PM; Description: Downloaded T0184: Docket #4055; Charge id: 285307	\$3.27
04/03/20		Outside Documents & Research	Restructuring Concepts/netDockets: Yichen Liu; 4/3/2020 7:12:00 PM; Description: Downloaded T0184: Docket #4054; Charge id: 285308	\$3.27
04/03/20		Outside Documents & Research	Restructuring Concepts/netDockets: Yichen Liu; 4/3/2020 7:20:00 PM; Description: Downloaded C0127: Docket #6079; Charge id: 285321	\$3.27
04/03/20		Outside Documents & Research	Restructuring Concepts/netDockets: Yichen Liu; 4/3/2020 7:20:00 PM; Description: Single case search; Charge id: 285322	\$5.44
04/03/20		Outside Documents & Research	Restructuring Concepts/netDockets: Yichen Liu; 4/3/2020 7:14:00 PM; Description: Single case search; Charge id: 285311	\$5.44
04/03/20		Outside Documents & Research	Restructuring Concepts/netDockets: Yichen Liu; 4/3/2020 7:14:00 PM; Description: Downloaded T0181: Docket #341 (Main Document); Charge id: 285312	\$3.27
04/03/20		Outside Documents & Research	Restructuring Concepts/netDockets: Yichen Liu; 4/3/2020 6:50:00 PM; Description: Downloaded F0132: Docket #375 (Exhibit A); Charge id: 285288	\$3.27
04/03/20		Outside Documents & Research	Restructuring Concepts/netDockets: Yichen Liu; 4/3/2020 6:50:00 PM; Description: Single case search; Charge id: 285289	\$5.44
04/03/20		Outside Documents & Research	Restructuring Concepts/netDockets: Yichen Liu; 4/3/2020 7:16:00 PM; Description: Single case search; Charge id: 285315	\$5.44
04/03/20		Outside Documents & Research	Restructuring Concepts/netDockets: Yichen Liu; 4/3/2020 7:16:00 PM; Description: Single case search; Charge id: 285316	\$5.44
04/03/20		Outside Documents & Research	Restructuring Concepts/netDockets: Yichen Liu; 4/3/2020 6:57:00 PM; Description: Downloaded V0064: Docket #231; Charge id: 285294	\$3.27

DISBURSEMENT DETAIL				
Date	Vendor Name	Expense Type	Description	Amount
04/03/20		Outside Documents & Research	Restructuring Concepts/netDockets: Yichen Liu; 4/3/2020 7:10:00 PM; Description: Single case search; Charge id: 285306	\$5.44
04/03/20		Outside Documents & Research	Restructuring Concepts/netDockets: Yichen Liu; 4/3/2020 6:35:00 PM; Description: Single case search; Charge id: 285281	\$5.44
04/03/20		Outside Documents & Research	Restructuring Concepts/netDockets: Yichen Liu; 4/3/2020 6:35:00 PM; Description: Single case search; Charge id: 285282	\$5.44
04/03/20		Outside Documents & Research	Restructuring Concepts/netDockets: Yichen Liu; 4/3/2020 7:12:00 PM; Description: Downloaded T0184: Docket #4015; Charge id: 285309	\$3.27
04/03/20		Outside Documents & Research	Restructuring Concepts/netDockets: Yichen Liu; 4/3/2020 7:13:00 PM; Description: Downloaded T0184: Docket #3649; Charge id: 285310	\$3.27
04/03/20		Outside Documents & Research	Restructuring Concepts/netDockets: Yichen Liu; 4/3/2020 6:37:00 PM; Description: Downloaded F0132: Docket #374 (Main Document); Charge id: 285285	\$3.27
04/03/20		Outside Documents & Research	Restructuring Concepts/netDockets: Yichen Liu; 4/3/2020 6:50:00 PM; Description: Downloaded F0132: Docket #375 (Main Document); Charge id: 285287	\$3.27
04/03/20		Outside Documents & Research	Restructuring Concepts/netDockets: Yichen Liu; 4/3/2020 6:29:00 PM; Description: Downloaded E0115: Docket #583 (Main Document); Charge id: 285275	\$3.27
04/03/20		Outside Documents & Research	Restructuring Concepts/netDockets: Yichen Liu; 4/3/2020 6:29:00 PM; Description: Downloaded E0115: Docket #583 (Proposed Order); Charge id: 285276	\$3.27
04/03/20		Outside Documents & Research	Restructuring Concepts/netDockets: Yichen Liu; 4/3/2020 6:51:00 PM; Description: Downloaded W0082: Docket #293; Charge id: 285290	\$3.27
04/03/20		Outside Documents & Research	Restructuring Concepts/netDockets: Yichen Liu; 4/3/2020 6:57:00 PM; Description: Single case search; Charge id: 285293	\$5.44

DISBURSEMENT DETAIL				
Date	Vendor Name	Expense Type	Description	Amount
04/03/20		Outside Documents & Research	Restructuring Concepts/netDockets: Yichen Liu; 4/3/2020 6:33:00 PM; Description: Single case search; Charge id: 285279	\$5.44
04/03/20		Outside Documents & Research	Restructuring Concepts/netDockets: Yichen Liu; 4/3/2020 6:34:00 PM; Description: Downloaded B0063: Docket #2052 (Main Document); Charge id: 285280	\$3.27
04/03/20		Outside Documents & Research	Restructuring Concepts/netDockets: Yichen Liu; 4/3/2020 6:22:00 PM; Description: Downloaded W0092: Docket #308; Charge id: 285269	\$3.27
04/03/20		Outside Documents & Research	Restructuring Concepts/netDockets: Yichen Liu; 4/3/2020 6:23:00 PM; Description: Downloaded W0092: Docket #310 (Main Document); Charge id: 285270	\$3.27
04/03/20		Outside Documents & Research	Restructuring Concepts/netDockets: Yichen Liu; 4/3/2020 6:35:00 PM; Description: Downloaded S0243: Docket #519; Charge id: 285283	\$3.27
04/03/20		Outside Documents & Research	Restructuring Concepts/netDockets: Yichen Liu; 4/3/2020 6:36:00 PM; Description: Single case search; Charge id: 285284	\$5.44
04/03/20		Outside Documents & Research	Restructuring Concepts/netDockets: Yichen Liu; 4/3/2020 6:25:00 PM; Description: Downloaded E0115: Docket #581; Charge id: 285273	\$3.27
04/03/20		Outside Documents & Research	Restructuring Concepts/netDockets: Yichen Liu; 4/3/2020 6:28:00 PM; Description: Downloaded E0115: Docket #582; Charge id: 285274	\$3.27
04/03/20		Outside Documents & Research	Restructuring Concepts/netDockets: Yichen Liu; 4/3/2020 6:05:00 PM; Description: Downloaded P0175: Docket #341 (Main Document); Charge id: 285263	\$3.27
04/03/20		Outside Documents & Research	Restructuring Concepts/netDockets: Yichen Liu; 4/3/2020 6:06:00 PM; Description: Downloaded P0175: Docket #341 (Proposed Form of Order); Charge id: 285264	\$3.27
04/03/20		Outside Documents & Research	Restructuring Concepts/netDockets: Yichen Liu; 4/3/2020 6:30:00 PM; Description: Single case search; Charge id: 285277	\$5.44

DISBURSEMENT DETAIL				
Date	Vendor Name	Expense Type	Description	Amount
04/03/20		Outside Documents & Research	Restructuring Concepts/netDockets: Yichen Liu; 4/3/2020 6:30:00 PM; Description: Single case search; Charge id: 285278	\$5.44
04/03/20		Outside Documents & Research	Restructuring Concepts/netDockets: Yichen Liu; 4/3/2020 6:20:00 PM; Description: Downloaded W0092: Docket #309; Charge id: 285267	\$3.27
04/03/20		Outside Documents & Research	Restructuring Concepts/netDockets: Yichen Liu; 4/3/2020 6:22:00 PM; Description: Downloaded W0092: Docket #582; Charge id: 285268	\$3.27
04/03/20		Outside Documents & Research	Restructuring Concepts/netDockets: Yichen Liu; 4/3/2020 1:42:00 PM; Description: Downloaded T0184: Docket #3382; Charge id: 285235	\$3.27
04/03/20		Outside Documents & Research	Restructuring Concepts/netDockets: Yichen Liu; 4/3/2020 1:44:00 PM; Description: Downloaded T0184: Docket #3384; Charge id: 285236	\$3.27
04/03/20		Outside Documents & Research	Restructuring Concepts/netDockets: Yichen Liu; 4/3/2020 1:32:00 PM; Description: Single case search; Charge id: 285225	\$5.44
04/03/20		Outside Documents & Research	Restructuring Concepts/netDockets: Yichen Liu; 4/3/2020 1:32:00 PM; Description: Single case search; Charge id: 285226	\$5.44
04/03/20		Outside Documents & Research	Restructuring Concepts/netDockets: Yichen Liu; 4/3/2020 1:35:00 PM; Description: Single case search; Charge id: 285229	\$5.44
04/03/20		Outside Documents & Research	Restructuring Concepts/netDockets: Yichen Liu; 4/3/2020 1:35:00 PM; Description: Single case search; Charge id: 285230	\$5.44
04/03/20		Outside Documents & Research	Restructuring Concepts/netDockets: Yichen Liu; 4/3/2020 8:32:00 AM; Description: Single case search; Charge id: 285153	\$5.44
04/03/20		Outside Documents & Research	Restructuring Concepts/netDockets: Yichen Liu; 4/3/2020 8:33:00 AM; Description: Downloaded S0258: Docket #1169; Charge id: 285154	\$3.27

DISBURSEMENT DETAIL				
Date	Vendor Name	Expense Type	Description	Amount
04/03/20		Outside Documents & Research	courtlink: Search For Jonah Stotsky	\$0.66
04/04/20		Outside Documents & Research	Restructuring Concepts/netDockets: Yichen Liu; 4/4/2020 11:37:00 AM; Description: Downloaded F0132: Docket #118; Charge id: 285365	\$3.27
04/04/20		Outside Documents & Research	courtlink: Single Search For Danielle Leibowitz	\$3.60
04/06/20		Outside Documents & Research	Restructuring Concepts/netDockets: Yichen Liu; 4/6/2020 7:29:00 AM; Description: Single case search; Charge id: 285620	\$5.44
04/06/20		Outside Documents & Research	courtlink: Document View For Danielle Leibowitz	\$0.55
04/06/20		Outside Documents & Research	courtlink: Single Search For Danielle Leibowitz	\$7.20
04/07/20		Outside Documents & Research	courtlink: Search For Grace Lee	\$0.11
04/07/20		Outside Documents & Research	courtlink: Search For Jonah Stotsky	\$0.11
04/08/20		Outside Documents & Research	Restructuring Concepts/netDockets: Paavani Garg; 4/8/2020 10:33:00 AM; Description: Downloaded C0127: Docket #4861; Charge id: 286180	\$3.27
04/08/20		Outside Documents & Research	Restructuring Concepts/netDockets: Paavani Garg; 4/8/2020 10:43:00 AM; Description: Single case search; Charge id: 286183	\$5.44
04/08/20		Outside Documents & Research	Restructuring Concepts/netDockets: Paavani Garg; 4/8/2020 10:47:00 AM; Description: Downloaded T0181: Docket #658; Charge id: 286186	\$3.27
04/08/20		Outside Documents & Research	Restructuring Concepts/netDockets: Marjorie Richmond; 4/8/2020 11:31:00 AM; Description: Single case search; Charge id: 286196	\$5.44

DISBURSEMENT DETAIL				
Date	Vendor Name	Expense Type	Description	Amount
04/08/20		Outside Documents & Research	Restructuring Concepts/netDockets: Paavani Garg; 4/8/2020 10:31:00 AM; Description: Single case search; Charge id: 286178	\$5.44
04/08/20		Outside Documents & Research	Restructuring Concepts/netDockets: Paavani Garg; 4/8/2020 10:32:00 AM; Description: Downloaded C0127: Docket #4951 (Main Document); Charge id: 286179	\$3.27
04/08/20		Outside Documents & Research	Restructuring Concepts/netDockets: Paavani Garg; 4/8/2020 10:44:00 AM; Description: Downloaded T0181: Docket #236; Charge id: 286184	\$3.27
04/08/20		Outside Documents & Research	Restructuring Concepts/netDockets: Paavani Garg; 4/8/2020 10:45:00 AM; Description: Downloaded T0181: Docket #111 (Main Document); Charge id: 286185	\$3.27
04/08/20		Outside Documents & Research	Restructuring Concepts/netDockets: Marjorie Richmond; 4/8/2020 11:34:00 AM; Description: Downloaded T0181: Docket #5; Charge id: 286198	\$3.27
04/08/20		Outside Documents & Research	Restructuring Concepts/netDockets: Marjorie Richmond; 4/8/2020 11:37:00 AM; Description: Single case search; Charge id: 286199	\$5.44
04/09/20		Outside Documents & Research	courtlink: Document View For Danielle Leibowitz	\$0.11
04/09/20		Outside Documents & Research	courtlink: Single Search For Danielle Leibowitz	\$3.60
04/10/20		Outside Documents & Research	Restructuring Concepts/netDockets: Paavani Garg; 4/10/2020 2:29:00 PM; Description: Downloaded L0093: Docket #106 (Main Document); Charge id: 286588	\$3.27
04/10/20		Outside Documents & Research	Restructuring Concepts/netDockets: Paavani Garg; 4/10/2020 2:29:00 PM; Description: Downloaded U0041: Docket #586 (Main Document); Charge id: 286589	\$3.27
04/10/20		Outside Documents & Research	Restructuring Concepts/netDockets: Paavani Garg; 4/10/2020 7:05:00 AM; Description: Multiple case search; Charge id: 286478	\$21.78

DISBURSEMENT DETAIL				
Date	Vendor Name	Expense Type	Description	Amount
04/10/20		Outside Documents & Research	Restructuring Concepts/netDockets: Paavani Garg; 4/10/2020 2:26:00 PM; Description: Multiple case search; Charge id: 286587	\$21.78
04/10/20		Outside Documents & Research	Restructuring Concepts/netDockets: Paavani Garg; 4/10/2020 2:30:00 PM; Description: Multiple case search; Charge id: 286590	\$21.78
04/10/20		Outside Documents & Research	Restructuring Concepts/netDockets: Paavani Garg; 4/10/2020 2:34:00 PM; Description: Downloaded B0156: Docket #280 (Main Document); Charge id: 286591	\$3.27
04/10/20		Outside Documents & Research	courtlink: Search For Alexander Bernstein	\$0.61
04/11/20		Outside Documents & Research	Restructuring Concepts/netDockets: Paavani Garg; 4/11/2020 5:19:00 AM; Description: Single case search; Charge id: 286715	\$5.44
04/11/20		Outside Documents & Research	Restructuring Concepts/netDockets: Paavani Garg; 4/11/2020 5:24:00 AM; Description: Single case search; Charge id: 286716	\$5.44
04/11/20		Outside Documents & Research	Restructuring Concepts/netDockets: Paavani Garg; 4/11/2020 5:45:00 AM; Description: Downloaded B0156: Docket #294; Charge id: 286719	\$3.27
04/11/20		Outside Documents & Research	Restructuring Concepts/netDockets: Paavani Garg; 4/11/2020 5:46:00 AM; Description: Downloaded B0156: Docket #314; Charge id: 286720	\$3.27
04/11/20		Outside Documents & Research	Restructuring Concepts/netDockets: Paavani Garg; 4/11/2020 5:26:00 AM; Description: Downloaded U0041: Docket #594; Charge id: 286717	\$3.27
04/11/20		Outside Documents & Research	Restructuring Concepts/netDockets: Paavani Garg; 4/11/2020 5:44:00 AM; Description: Single case search; Charge id: 286718	\$5.44
04/12/20		Outside Documents & Research	courtlink: Search For Alexander Bernstein	\$0.21
04/13/20		Outside Documents & Research	Restructuring Concepts/netDockets: Yichen Liu; 4/13/2020 1:59:00 PM; Description: Single case search; Charge id: 287130	\$5.44

DISBURSEMENT DETAIL				
Date	Vendor Name	Expense Type	Description	Amount
04/14/20		Outside Documents & Research	Restructuring Concepts/netDockets: Paavani Garg; 4/14/2020 10:12:00 AM; Description: Downloaded T0095: Docket #721 (Main Document); Charge id: 287239	\$3.27
04/14/20		Outside Documents & Research	Restructuring Concepts/netDockets: Paavani Garg; 4/14/2020 10:13:00 AM; Description: Downloaded T0095: Docket #763; Charge id: 287240	\$3.27
04/14/20		Outside Documents & Research	Restructuring Concepts/netDockets: Joseph A. Florio; 4/14/2020 10:16:00 AM; Description: Single case search; Charge id: 287243	\$5.44
04/14/20		Outside Documents & Research	Restructuring Concepts/netDockets: Joseph A. Florio; 4/14/2020 10:19:00 AM; Description: Single case search; Charge id: 287244	\$5.44
04/14/20		Outside Documents & Research	Restructuring Concepts/netDockets: Paavani Garg; 4/14/2020 10:05:00 AM; Description: Downloaded H0008: Docket #973 (Main Document); Charge id: 287233	\$3.27
04/14/20		Outside Documents & Research	Restructuring Concepts/netDockets: Paavani Garg; 4/14/2020 10:07:00 AM; Description: Downloaded F0026: Docket #1147 (Main Document); Charge id: 287234	\$3.27
04/14/20		Outside Documents & Research	Restructuring Concepts/netDockets: Paavani Garg; 4/14/2020 10:11:00 AM; Description: Downloaded C0112: Docket #837 (Main Document); Charge id: 287237	\$3.27
04/14/20		Outside Documents & Research	Restructuring Concepts/netDockets: Paavani Garg; 4/14/2020 10:12:00 AM; Description: Downloaded C0112: Docket #876; Charge id: 287238	\$3.27
04/14/20		Outside Documents & Research	Restructuring Concepts/netDockets: Paavani Garg; 4/14/2020 9:58:00 AM; Description: Downloaded Z0009: Docket #215; Charge id: 287226	\$3.27
04/14/20		Outside Documents & Research	Restructuring Concepts/netDockets: Paavani Garg; 4/14/2020 9:59:00 AM; Description: Multiple case search; Charge id: 287227	\$21.78
04/14/20		Outside Documents & Research	Restructuring Concepts/netDockets: Paavani Garg; 4/14/2020 10:14:00 AM; Description: Downloaded T0095: Docket #760; Charge id: 287241	\$3.27

DISBURSEMENT DETAIL				
Date	Vendor Name	Expense Type	Description	Amount
04/14/20		Outside Documents & Research	Restructuring Concepts/netDockets: Paavani Garg; 4/14/2020 10:15:00 AM; Description: Downloaded G0109: Docket #279 (Main Document); Charge id: 287242	\$3.27
04/14/20		Outside Documents & Research	Restructuring Concepts/netDockets: Paavani Garg; 4/14/2020 10:03:00 AM; Description: Downloaded A0016: Docket #1840 (Main Document); Charge id: 287231	\$3.27
04/14/20		Outside Documents & Research	Restructuring Concepts/netDockets: Paavani Garg; 4/14/2020 10:04:00 AM; Description: Downloaded H0008: Docket #851; Charge id: 287232	\$3.27
04/14/20		Outside Documents & Research	Restructuring Concepts/netDockets: Joseph A. Florio; 4/14/2020 10:21:00 AM; Description: Single case search; Charge id: 287245	\$5.44
04/14/20		Outside Documents & Research	Restructuring Concepts/netDockets: Paavani Garg; 4/14/2020 5:28:00 AM; Description: Multiple case search; Charge id: 287166	\$21.78
04/14/20		Outside Documents & Research	Restructuring Concepts/netDockets: Paavani Garg; 4/14/2020 10:08:00 AM; Description: Downloaded B0025: Docket #1749; Charge id: 287235	\$3.27
04/14/20		Outside Documents & Research	Restructuring Concepts/netDockets: Paavani Garg; 4/14/2020 10:09:00 AM; Description: Downloaded B0025: Docket #1825; Charge id: 287236	\$3.27
04/14/20		Outside Documents & Research	Restructuring Concepts/netDockets: Paavani Garg; 4/14/2020 7:58:00 AM; Description: Multiple case search; Charge id: 287190	\$21.78
04/14/20		Outside Documents & Research	Restructuring Concepts/netDockets: Paavani Garg; 4/14/2020 8:00:00 AM; Description: Downloaded E0008: Docket #3059 (Main Document); Charge id: 287192	\$3.27
04/14/20		Outside Documents & Research	Restructuring Concepts/netDockets: Paavani Garg; 4/14/2020 9:59:00 AM; Description: Multiple case search; Charge id: 287228	\$21.78
04/14/20		Outside Documents & Research	Restructuring Concepts/netDockets: Paavani Garg; 4/14/2020 10:02:00 AM; Description: Downloaded A0016: Docket #493 (Main Document); Charge id: 287230	\$3.27

DISBURSEMENT DETAIL				
Date	Vendor Name	Expense Type	Description	Amount
04/14/20		Outside Documents & Research	Restructuring Concepts/netDockets: Paavani Garg; 4/14/2020 5:30:00 AM; Description: Downloaded L0093: Docket #129 (Main Document); Charge id: 287167	\$3.27
04/14/20		Outside Documents & Research	Restructuring Concepts/netDockets: Paavani Garg; 4/14/2020 7:56:00 AM; Description: Multiple case search; Charge id: 287188	\$21.78
04/15/20		Outside Documents & Research	Restructuring Concepts/netDockets: Mohini Rarrick; 4/15/2020 9:38:00 AM; Description: Multiple case search; Charge id: 287519	\$21.78
04/15/20		Outside Documents & Research	Restructuring Concepts/netDockets: Mohini Rarrick; 4/15/2020 9:39:00 AM; Description: Downloaded G0121: Docket #1984 (Main Document); Charge id: 287520	\$3.27
04/15/20		Outside Documents & Research	Restructuring Concepts/netDockets: Mohini Rarrick; 4/15/2020 10:10:00 AM; Description: Downloaded O0059: Docket #15 (Proposed Order); Charge id: 287532	\$3.27
04/15/20		Outside Documents & Research	Restructuring Concepts/netDockets: Mohini Rarrick; 4/15/2020 10:11:00 AM; Description: Downloaded U0049: Docket #552 (Main Document); Charge id: 287533	\$3.27
04/15/20		Outside Documents & Research	Restructuring Concepts/netDockets: Paavani Garg; 4/15/2020 7:46:00 AM; Description: Downloaded S0226: Docket #3277; Charge id: 287491	\$3.27
04/15/20		Outside Documents & Research	Restructuring Concepts/netDockets: Mohini Rarrick; 4/15/2020 8:14:00 AM; Description: Multiple case search; Charge id: 287494	\$21.78
04/15/20		Outside Documents & Research	Restructuring Concepts/netDockets: Mohini Rarrick; 4/15/2020 9:39:00 AM; Description: Downloaded G0121: Docket #1984 (Proposed Order); Charge id: 287521	\$3.27
04/15/20		Outside Documents & Research	Restructuring Concepts/netDockets: Mohini Rarrick; 4/15/2020 10:06:00 AM; Description: Downloaded O0059: Docket #15 (Main Document); Charge id: 287529	\$3.27
04/15/20		Outside Documents & Research	Restructuring Concepts/netDockets: Paavani Garg; 4/15/2020 7:36:00 AM; Description: Single case search; Charge id: 287490	\$5.44

DISBURSEMENT DETAIL				
Date	Vendor Name	Expense Type	Description	Amount
04/15/20		Outside Documents & Research	Restructuring Concepts/netDockets: Mohini Rarrick; 4/15/2020 10:11:00 AM; Description: Downloaded U0049: Docket #552 (Proposed Order); Charge id: 287534	\$3.27
04/16/20		Outside Documents & Research	Restructuring Concepts/netDockets: Paavani Garg; 4/16/2020 1:50:00 PM; Description: Downloaded R0121: Docket #213; Charge id: 288035	\$3.27
04/16/20		Outside Documents & Research	Restructuring Concepts/netDockets: Paavani Garg; 4/16/2020 1:53:00 PM; Description: Downloaded R0121: Docket #176 (Main Document); Charge id: 288037	\$3.27
04/16/20		Outside Documents & Research	Restructuring Concepts/netDockets: Paavani Garg; 4/16/2020 11:33:00 AM; Description: Single case search; Charge id: 287940	\$5.44
04/16/20		Outside Documents & Research	Restructuring Concepts/netDockets: Paavani Garg; 4/16/2020 2:00:00 PM; Description: Downloaded R0121: Docket #13; Charge id: 288039	\$3.27
04/16/20		Outside Documents & Research	courtlink: Document View For James Butler	\$2.09
04/16/20		Outside Documents & Research	courtlink: Single Search For James Butler	\$3.60
04/16/20		Outside Documents & Research	courtlink: Document View For Jonah Stotsky	\$0.22
04/16/20		Outside Documents & Research	courtlink: Search For Jonah Stotsky	\$0.11
04/16/20		Outside Documents & Research	courtlink: Single Search For Jonah Stotsky	\$3.60
04/18/20		Outside Documents & Research	Restructuring Concepts/netDockets: Yichen Liu; 4/18/2020 6:37:00 PM; Description: Downloaded F0143: Docket #1095 (Exhibit Stipulation); Charge id: 288550	\$3.27

DISBURSEMENT DETAIL				
Date	Vendor Name	Expense Type	Description	Amount
04/18/20		Outside Documents & Research	Restructuring Concepts/netDockets: Yichen Liu; 4/18/2020 6:39:00 PM; Description: Downloaded L0011: Docket #7050; Charge id: 288552	\$3.27
04/18/20		Outside Documents & Research	Restructuring Concepts/netDockets: Yichen Liu; 4/18/2020 6:43:00 PM; Description: Multiple case search; Charge id: 288553	\$21.78
04/18/20		Outside Documents & Research	Restructuring Concepts/netDockets: Yichen Liu; 4/18/2020 6:44:00 PM; Description: Multiple case search; Charge id: 288554	\$21.78
04/18/20		Outside Documents & Research	Restructuring Concepts/netDockets: Yichen Liu; 4/18/2020 6:56:00 PM; Description: Downloaded E0103: Docket #272; Charge id: 288557	\$3.27
04/18/20		Outside Documents & Research	Restructuring Concepts/netDockets: Yichen Liu; 4/18/2020 7:00:00 PM; Description: Downloaded M0161: Docket #826 (Exhibit 1); Charge id: 288558	\$3.27
04/18/20		Outside Documents & Research	Restructuring Concepts/netDockets: Yichen Liu; 4/18/2020 6:49:00 PM; Description: Downloaded L0092: Docket #2681; Charge id: 288555	\$3.27
04/18/20		Outside Documents & Research	Restructuring Concepts/netDockets: Yichen Liu; 4/18/2020 6:50:00 PM; Description: Multiple case search; Charge id: 288556	\$21.78
04/18/20		Outside Documents & Research	Restructuring Concepts/netDockets: Yichen Liu; 4/18/2020 7:02:00 PM; Description: Downloaded C0193: Docket #1015 (Exhibit 1); Charge id: 288559	\$3.27
04/18/20		Outside Documents & Research	Restructuring Concepts/netDockets: Yichen Liu; 4/18/2020 7:04:00 PM; Description: Downloaded M0143: Docket #824; Charge id: 288560	\$3.27
04/18/20		Outside Documents & Research	Restructuring Concepts/netDockets: Yichen Liu; 4/18/2020 6:35:00 PM; Description: Multiple case search; Charge id: 288547	\$21.78
04/18/20		Outside Documents & Research	Restructuring Concepts/netDockets: Yichen Liu; 4/18/2020 6:36:00 PM; Description: Multiple case search; Charge id: 288548	\$21.78

DISBURSEMENT DETAIL				
Date	Vendor Name	Expense Type	Description	Amount
04/18/20		Outside Documents & Research	Restructuring Concepts/netDockets: Yichen Liu; 4/18/2020 7:08:00 PM; Description: Downloaded C0019: Docket #1877; Charge id: 288563	\$3.27
04/18/20		Outside Documents & Research	Restructuring Concepts/netDockets: Yichen Liu; 4/18/2020 7:05:00 PM; Description: Downloaded I0041: Docket #617; Charge id: 288561	\$3.27
04/18/20		Outside Documents & Research	Restructuring Concepts/netDockets: Yichen Liu; 4/18/2020 7:07:00 PM; Description: Downloaded H0061: Docket #1401 (Main Document); Charge id: 288562	\$3.27
04/20/20		Outside Documents & Research	VENDOR: CSC, INVOICE #: 86109503211, DATE: 4/20/2020	\$349.72
04/22/20		Outside Documents & Research	Restructuring Concepts/netDockets: Paavani Garg; 4/22/2020 6:39:00 AM; Description: Single case search; Charge id: 289487	\$5.44
04/24/20		Outside Documents & Research	courtlink: Single Search For Danielle Leibowitz	\$3.60
04/28/20		Outside Documents & Research	courtlink: Search For Alexander Bernstein	\$0.31
04/29/20		Outside Documents & Research	courtlink: Search For Alexander Bernstein	\$0.10
04/30/20		Outside Documents & Research	LEXISNEXIS ONLINE & RELATED CHARGES ACCT # 124GRR BILLING MONTH ENDED (04/30/2020)	\$93.72
03/27/20		Postage, courier & freight	450 LEXINGTON A-1224 E 32-714pm-10/2	\$80.59
04/06/20	Washington Express	Postage, courier & freight	VENDOR: Washington Express; INVOICE#: 188188; DATE: 4/15/2020 - Courier Services 04/15/20	\$135.86
04/06/20	Washington Express	Postage, courier & freight	VENDOR: Washington Express; INVOICE#: 188188; DATE: 4/15/2020 - Courier Services 04/15/20	\$79.48

DISBURSEMENT DETAIL				
Date	Vendor Name	Expense Type	Description	Amount
04/09/20		Postage, courier & freight	From Joshua B. Pittell to Kristy Waterman/9026 McCraw Dr/DALLAS TX 75209/FedEx Tracking # 391764869464	\$24.86
04/09/20		Postage, courier & freight	From Joshua B. Pittell to Jay Sutton/8428 Snow Goose Way/FORT WORTH TX 76118/FedEx Tracking # 391761078148	\$24.86
04/13/20		Postage, courier & freight	From Joshua B. Pittell to Jay Sutton/8428 SNOW GOOSE WAY/FORT WORTH TX 76118/FedEx Tracking # 391839974160	\$38.43
04/13/20		Postage, courier & freight	From Joshua B. Pittell to Kristy Waterman/9026 MCCRAW DR/DALLAS TX 75209/FedEx Tracking # 391840512543	\$38.43
04/15/20	Washington Express	Postage, courier & freight	VENDOR: Washington Express; INVOICE#: 188188; DATE: 4/15/2020 - Courier Services 04/15/20	\$123.86
04/15/20	Washington Express	Postage, courier & freight	VENDOR: Washington Express; INVOICE#: 188188; DATE: 4/15/2020 - Courier Services 04/15/20	\$79.48
04/16/20		Postage, courier & freight	From Nate Sokol to Steve Szanzer/1224 East 32nd Street/Brooklyn NY 11210/Hand Delivery - NPD LOGISTICS Tracking # CSTM0327596	\$101.64
04/30/20		Postage, courier & freight	450 LEXINGTON A-223 E 66 S-942am-10/2	\$42.15
01/01/20		Travel	Payee: Millerman, James M., OT 11:46 AM	\$15.00
01/17/20		Travel	Payee: Millerman, James M., OT 11:19 AM	\$37.00
01/21/20		Travel	Payee: Millerman, James M., OT 9:53 PM	\$19.00
01/24/20		Travel	AIRFARE/Resnick,Brian M Mr./02-18-20/MIA IAH LGA/Economy Class	\$614.09
01/29/20		Travel	AIRFARE/Resnick,Brian M Mr./02-10-20/LGA IAH LGA/Economy Class	\$1,023.12
01/31/20		Travel	AIRFARE/Sokol,Nathaniel Mr./02-10-20/LGA IAH LGA/Economy	\$1,174.87
01/31/20		Travel	AIRFARE/Resnick,Brian M Mr./01-31-20/Electronic Miscellaneous Document/Economy	\$82.64

DISBURSEMENT DETAIL				
Date	Vendor Name	Expense Type	Description	Amount
02/05/20		Travel	AIRFARE/Resnick,Brian M Mr./02-05-20/JAC SLC DFW/Economy Class	\$650.00
02/06/20		Travel	AIRFARE/Resnick,Brian M Mr./02-07-20/DFW LGA/Economy Class	\$500.00
02/07/20		Travel	Payee: Adamson, Cameron, OT 12:16 AM, Uber, (work done on 2/6/20)	\$32.47
02/08/20		Travel	Payee: Adamson, Cameron, OT 5:00 AM,(work done on 2/7/20)	\$31.38
02/11/20		Travel	AIRFARE/Sokol,Nathaniel Mr./02-11-20/IAH LGA/Economy	\$74.07
02/11/20		Travel	AIRFARE/Resnick,Brian M Mr./02-11-20/IAH LGA/Economy	\$659.97
02/12/20		Travel	AIRFARE/Bernstein,Alexander/02-17-20/LGA IAH/Economy	\$293.58
02/12/20		Travel	AIRFARE/Bernstein,Alexander/02-19-20/IAH LGA/Economy	\$583.53
02/13/20		Travel	AIRFARE/Moskowitz, Elliot Mr./02-18-20/JFK IAH JFK/Economy Class	\$1,146.01
02/14/20		Travel	AIRFARE/Sokol,Nathaniel Mr./02-18-20/LGA IAH LGA/Economy	\$1,133.92
02/15/20		Travel	Payee: Millerman, James M., OT 9:27 PM	\$23.50
02/16/20		Travel	Payee: Millerman, James M., OT 9:37 AM	\$19.00
02/16/20		Travel	Payee: Millerman, James M., OT 8:18 AM	\$16.00
02/17/20		Travel	Payee: Millerman, James M., OT 7:55 PM	\$18.00
02/17/20		Travel	Payee: Szanzer, Steven Z., OT 6:30 PM	\$40.53
02/18/20		Travel	AIRFARE/Resnick,Brian M Mr./02-19-20/IAH LGA/Economy Class	\$583.53
02/20/20		Travel	Payee: Szanzer, Steven Z., OT 12:30 AM, Late night on 2/20	\$53.20
02/21/20		Travel	AIRFARE/Resnick,Brian M Mr./02-24-20/LGA IAD/Economy	\$447.05

DISBURSEMENT DETAIL				
Date	Vendor Name	Expense Type	Description	Amount
02/23/20		Travel	Payee: Malinowsky, Thomas D., 2/23/2020, 13.57, 450 Lexington, Union square	\$13.57
02/24/20		Travel	Payee: Resnick, Brian M., 2/24/2020, Uber, Home, Airport	\$51.46
02/24/20		Travel	Payee: Resnick, Brian M., 2/24/2020, Uber, Dulles, VA, 901 15th St, Washington DC	\$123.32
02/24/20		Travel	Payee: Resnick, Brian M., 2/25/2020, Uber, 1500 I St, Washington DC, Airport	\$64.01
02/25/20		Travel	Payee: Resnick, Brian M., 2/25/2020, Uber, 1200 16th St, Washington DC, 901 15th St, Washington DC	\$19.74
02/25/20		Travel	AIRFARE/Resnick,Brian M Mr./02-25-20/DCA LGA/Economy	\$405.03
02/25/20		Travel	Payee: Resnick, Brian M., 2/25/2020-2/25/2020, , The Jefferson	\$367.84
02/25/20		Travel	Payee: Resnick, Brian M., 2/25/2020, Uber, Airport, Home	\$90.11
02/25/20		Travel	Payee: Szanzer, Steven Z., OT 9:50 PM, Uber,	\$16.43
02/26/20		Travel	Payee: Szanzer, Steven Z., OT 1:17 AM, Uber, Late night on 2/26	\$86.13
02/27/20		Travel	Payee: Szanzer, Steven Z., OT 11:59 PM,	\$62.50
02/28/20		Travel	AIRFARE/Resnick,Brian M Mr./03-03-20/LGA DFW LGA/Economy Class	\$447.05
03/02/20		Travel	Payee: Szanzer, Steven Z., OT 8:20 PM, Uber,	\$66.50
03/03/20		Travel	Payee: Szanzer, Steven Z., OT 9:19 PM,	\$73.19
03/06/20		Travel	Payee: Netzer, Omer, OT 10:20 PM, Curb,	\$20.16
03/09/20		Travel	Payee: Windels, James H.R., 3/9/2020-3/12/2020, Four Seasons Hotel - Houston	\$1,187.33
03/09/20		Travel	Payee: Windels, James H.R., 3/9/2020, Peacock Cab, Houston Airport, Hotel	\$65.00

DISBURSEMENT DETAIL				
Date	Vendor Name	Expense Type	Description	Amount
03/12/20		Travel	Payee: Windels, James H.R., 3/12/2020, Yellow Cab Houston, Four Seasons Hotel, Airport	\$70.00
03/12/20		Travel	Payee: Szanzer, Steven Z., OT 11:59 PM,	\$49.66
04/15/20		Travel	Payee: Resnick, Brian M., OT 10:40 PM,	\$122.70
			Lexis	\$20,404.86
			Westlaw	\$8,008.88
			Standard Duplication (B/W copies)	\$1.50
			Electronic Copies (Color)	\$150.00
			Binding	\$0.20
			Lit Doc Mgt-Data Storage	\$64.69
TOTAL				\$49,280.22