DEVELOPMENT SPECIALISTS, INC. Patrick J. O'Malley Steven L. Victor 10 South LaSalle Street, Suite 3300

Debtor.

Chicago, Illinois 60603 Telephone: (312) 263-4141

Fax: (312) 263-1180

Accountant for William A. Brandt, Jr., Chapter 11 Trustee

### UNITED STATES BANKRUPTCY COURT SOUTHERN DISTRICT OF NEW YORK

In re: : Chapter 11

CHINA FISHERY GROUP LIMITED (CAYMAN) : Case No. 16-11895 (JLG)

et al.,

Debtors.<sup>1</sup>
: (Jointly Administered)

In re: : Chapter 11

CFG Peru Investments Pte. Limited (Singapore), : Case No. 16-11914 (JLG)

: (Jointly Administered)

The Debtors are China Fishery Group Limited (Cayman), Pacific Andes International Holdings Limited (Bermuda), N.S. Hong Investment (BVI) Limited, South Pacific Shipping Agency Limited (BVI), China Fisheries International Limited (Samoa), CFGL (Singapore) Private Limited, Chanery Investment Inc. (BVI), Champion Maritime Limited (BVI), Growing Management Limited (BVI), Target Shipping Limited (HK), Fortress Agents Limited (BVI), Ocean Expert International Limited (BVI), Protein Trading Limited (Samoa), CFG Peru Investments Pte. Limited (Singapore), Smart Group Limited (Cayman), Super Investment Limited (Cayman), Pacific Andes Resources Development Limited (Bermuda), Nouvelle Foods International Ltd., Golden Target Pacific Limited, Pacific Andes International Holdings (BVI) Limited, Zhonggang Fisheries Limited, Admired Agents Limited, Chiksano Management Limited, Clamford Holding Limited, Excel Concept Limited, Gain Star Management Limited, Grand Success Investment (Singapore) Private Limited, Hill Cosmos International Limited, Loyal Mark Holdings Limited, Metro Island International Limited, Mission Excel International Limited, Natprop Investments Limited, Pioneer Logistics Limited, Sea Capital International Limited, Shine Bright Management Limited, Superb Choice International Limited, Toyama Holdings Limited (BVI) and Pacific Andes Enterprises (HK).

# NOTICE OF FEES FOR SERVICES RENDERED BY DEVELOPMENT SPECIALISTS, INC., FORMER ACCOUNTANT TO THE CHAPTER 11 TRUSTEE, DURING THE POST-CONFIRMATION PERIOD

PLEASE TAKE NOTICE that on June 10, 2021, the Court entered an order confirming the *Creditor Plan Proponents' Chapter 11 Plan for CFG Peru Investments Pte. Ltd. (Singapore)* (the "Plan") [Docket No. 2569]. Prior to the entry of this order, Development Specialists, Inc. ("DSI") served as accountant to William A. Brandt, Jr., in his capacity as the chapter 11 trustee (the "Chapter 11 Trustee"). In the period since the Court entered the order confirming the Plan, DSI has incurred limited fees in connection with its employment by the Chapter 11 Trustee.

PLEASE TAKE FURTHER NOTICE that a hearing on the Thirteenth Interim and Final Fee Application of Development Specialists, Inc. for Compensation for Services Rendered and Reimbursement of Expenses as Accountant to the Chapter 11 Trustee for (I) the Thirteenth Interim Period from November 1, 2020 Through and Including June 10, 2021 and (II) the Entire Case Period from November 10, 2016 Through and Including June 10, 2021 (the "Application") will be held telephonically before the Honorable James L. Garrity, Jr., United States Bankruptcy Judge for the Southern District of New York, in the United States Bankruptcy Court for the Southern District of New York, One Bowling Green, Courtroom 601, New York, New York, 10004 (the "Bankruptcy Court"), on October 27, 2021 at 11:00 a.m. (Prevailing Eastern Time) the ("Hearing").

PLEASE TAKE FURTHER NOTICE that pursuant to the Application, DSI requested payment of fees incurred in connection with its former employment as accountant to the Chapter 11 Trustee during the post-confirmation period (the "Post-Confirmation Fees") in an amount up to \$25,000 (the "Post-Confirmation Fees Voluntary Cap"). At the request of the Office of the

## 16-11895-jlg Doc 2781 Filed 10/26/21 Entered 10/26/21 14:56:47 Main Document Pg 3 of 8

United States Trustee, DSI submits this notice and the time detail attached as Exhibit A with respect to Post-Confirmation Fees.

Dated: October 26, 2021

Chicago, Illinois

DEVELOPMENT SPECIALISTS, INC.

10 South LaSalle St.

**Suite 3300** 

Chicago, IL 60603

Telephone: (312) 263-4141

Fax: (312) 263-1180 svictor@dsiconsulting.com

Former Accountant for

William A. Brandt, Jr., Chapter 11 Trustee

16-11895-jlg Doc 2781 Filed 10/26/21 Entered 10/26/21 14:56:47 Main Document Pg 4 of 8

#### Exhibit A

No. 12905



REMIT TO:

10 South LaSalle Street, Suite 3300, Chicago, IL 60603-1026 Telephone: 312.263.4141 Telecopier: 312.263.1180

Date: 10/13/2021

Michael E. Foreman Plan Administrator of CFG Peru Investments Pte. Ltd. c/o Foreman Law PLLC 24 Talcott Road Rye Brook, NY 10573

			F.E.I.N.	36-2967476
Description of Services and Disbursements	Fees	Disbursements	Credits	Balance
For professional services rendered from July 27, 2021 through September 14, 2021				
Fees per attached category summary:	\$24,723.00			
Total				\$24,723.00
TIMELY PAYMENT OF INVOICES IS ALWAYS APPRECIATED.				PAY AMOUNT ABOVE

Page: 1 CFG Peru Singapore 10/13/2021

#### William A. Brandt, Jr. as Chapter 11 Trustee

07/27/2021	CEV	Compile monthly fee statements and prepare	HOURS
		calculations for the 13th interim and final fee application.	0.60
08/03/2021	CEV	E-mails with Liz Downing and Nick Hagen regarding the final fee applications.	0.30
08/10/2021	CEV	Draft exhibits for the final fee application.  Compile data for the final fee application and exhibits regarding time by category and by professional.	0.50
08/16/2021	CEV	E-mails with Patty Taubr regarding reports needed	
00/10/2021	CEV	for the final DSI fee application.  E-mails with Chris DePaul regarding expense and payment information for the final DSI fee	0.10
		application.	0.30
	CEV	Revise the draft fee application with expense and payment information.	0.30
	CEV	Draft narratives for the 13th interim and final fee application.	2.30
08/17/2021	CEV	E-mail from Chris DePaul regarding payment	
	CEV	information for the final fee application. E-mails with Patty Taubr regarding category reports	0.10
		for the 13th interim fee period.	0.20
	CEV	Revise the draft 13th interim and final fee application.	0.80
08/19/2021	CEV	Continue preparation of calculations for the entire case period and the 13th interim period.	1.10
	CEV	E-mail from Yiman Zhang regarding docket research on	
	CEV	fee applications. Review docket research received from Yiman Zhang.	0.10
08/20/2021	CEV	Telephone call with Steve Victor regarding status of the final fee application.	0.10
08/24/2021	CEV	Review and revise the draft 13th and final fee application.	1.20
	CEV	Review and revise the draft 13th and final fee application.	1.20
08/26/2021	CEV	Review and revise the 13th interim and final fee application.	2.40
08/27/2021	CEV	Revise the DSI 13th interim and final fee application.	2.80
08/30/2021	CEV	Telephone call with Pat O'Malley and Patty Taubr regarding entire case period fee information for the 13th interim and final fee application.	0.10

Page: 2 CFG Peru Singapore 10/13/2021

William A. Brandt, Jr. as Chapter 11 Trustee

	CEV	E-mails with Pat O'Malley regarding entire case	HOURS
	-	period fee information for the 13th interim and final fee application.	0.20
	CEV	Review and revise the 13th interim and final fee	
		application.	0.80
09/01/2021	CEV	E-mails with Chris DePaul and Dinah Deloria regarding updated payment information for the 13th	
	CEV	interim fee period. Review and revise the 13th interim and final fee	0.30
	CEV	application. E-mails with Pat O'Malley regarding the 13th interim	2.40
	02.	and final fee application.	0.10
09/03/2021	CEV	Telephone call with Pat O'Malley regarding status of	0.00
	CEV	the fee application and related matters. Review and revise the 13th interim and final fee	0.20
		application.	2.70
09/07/2021	CEV	E-mails with Chris DePaul regarding expense discrepancy in the final fee application.	0.30
	CEV	E-mails with Chris DePaul regarding the updated summary of payments received and review same.	0.10
	CEV	Review and revise the 13th interim and final fee	
	CEV	application. Telephone call with the Trustee regarding	6.50
	CEV	information for the DSI's fee application. E-mails (0.50) and telephone call (0.40) with Chris	0.30
		DePaul regarding the fee application and her review of same.	0.90
	CEV	E-mails with Nick Hagen regarding the Skadden 13th and final fee application.	0.10
00/00/0001			0.10
09/08/2021	CEV	Telephone call with Pat O'Malley regarding reconciliation of certain fee and expense amounts	
	CEV	for the fee application. E-mails with Chris DePaul regarding reconciliation	0.10
		of certain fee and expense amounts for the fee application.	0.10
	CEV	E-mails with Pat O'Malley and Chris DePaul regarding reconciliation of certain fee and expense amounts	
	Q.T.I.	for the fee application.	0.10
	CEV	E-mails with Taylor Caruso and Patty Taubr regarding time reports to reconcile certain fee amounts.	0.20
	CEV	Review and revise the 13th interim and final fee application.	4.70
09/09/2021	CEV	Review and revise the fee application narratives and	
	CEV	the hours, fees and expenses charts. E-mails with Pat O'Malley and Chris DePaul regarding	7.90
		reconciliation of certain time entries and expenses.	0.40
	CEV	E-mails with Chris DePaul regarding her review of the fee application.	0.60
	CEV	Telephone call with Pat O'Malley, Chris DePaul and Taylor Caruso regarding status of the fee	
		application.	0.30
09/10/2021	CEV	Finalize the draft 13th interim and final fee application.	4.30
	CEV	E-mails with Liz Downing and Nick Hagen regarding review of the 13th interim and final fee	4.30

Page: 3 CFG Peru Singapore 10/13/2021

William A. Brandt, Jr. as Chapter 11 Trustee

					HOURS	
		application.			0.30	
	CEV	E-mail to Pat O'Malley, Steve Victor,	Chris	DePaul		
		and Taylor Caruso forwarding the draft	t fee			
		application for review.			0.10	
	CEV	E-mails with Bethany Davies regarding	her r	eview of		
		the draft fee application.			0.20	
	CEV	E-mails with Taylor Caruso regarding	reconc	iliation		
		of certain time entries.			0.20	
	CEV	E-mails with Patty Taubr and Lauren La	akeber	q		
		regarding exhibits to and finalizing				
		application.			0.30	
09/13/2021	CEV	Review the Skadden-reviewed draft of	the DS	T fee		
03/13/2021	OL.	application and incorporate comments				
		application draft (0.60); e-mails with				
		regarding same (0.20).	II IVICK	nagen	0.80	
	CEV	Review comments and edits received from	om Ret	hanv	0.00	
	CHV	Davies and incorporate same into the		iiaiiy		
		application.	100		0.70	
	CEV	Draft the certification for the fee as	nnlica	tion	0.20	
	CEV	E-mails with Steve Victor and Lauren			0.20	
	CHV	regarding the certification for the fe			0.30	
	CEV	E-mails with Chris DePaul regarding the		iicacion.	0.30	
	OLV	certification for the fee application			0.20	
	CEV	Telephone call with Steve Victor rega:		the fee	0.20	
	02.	application.	_ 0_1119	0110 200	0.20	
	CEV	E-mails with Liz Downing and Nick Hage	en rea	arding	**-*	
		the estimate of fees for preparation of	_	_		
		fee application.			0.40	
	CEV	E-mails with Lauren Lakeberg regarding	a prep	aration		
		of the fee application for filing.	5 FF		0.30	
	CEV	Multiple e-mails with Chris DePaul red	gardin	α		
		revisions to the fee application.	J	,	0.80	
	CEV	E-mails with Chris DePaul regarding s	i anat.u	res for		
		the fee application.	_ 5		0.10	
	CEV	Finalize the fee application narrative	es. ch	arts and		
		exhibits.	,		4.30	
	CEV	E-mails with Nick Hagen and Lauren La	kebera			
		regarding the fee application and file			0.40	
09/14/2021	CEV	E-mails with Nick Hagen and Liz Downing	na rea	arding		
03/11/2021	02.	the 13th interim and final fee applica	_	a_a_ng	0.20	
					60.30	24 722 00
		Fee Application/Client Billing			00.30	24,723.00
		FOR THE FOREGOING PROFESSIONAL SERVICE	ES REN	DERED:	60.30	24,723.00
		RECAPITULATION				
CC	ONSULTA		URS	HOURLY RATE	TOTA	L
	. E. Va	<del></del>	.30	\$410.00	\$24,723.0	0

TOTAL CURRENT WORK 24,723.00

BALANCE DUE \$24,723.00