20-11563-scc Doc 1979 Filed 10/26/21 Entered 10/26/21 20:59:12 Main Document Pg 1 of 357

Hearing Date and Time: November 16, 2021, at 11:00 a.m. (prevailing Eastern Time) Objection Date and Time: November 9, 2021, at 4:00 p.m. (prevailing Eastern Time)

DAVIS POLK & WARDWELL LLP

450 Lexington Avenue

New York, New York 10017 Telephone: (212) 450-4000 Facsimile: (212) 701-5800

Marshall S. Huebner
Timothy Graulich
James I. McClammy
Stephen D. Piraino

Erik Jerrard (admitted pro hac vice)

Counsel to the Debtors and Debtors in Possession

UNITED STATES BANKRUPTCY COURT SOUTHERN DISTRICT OF NEW YORK

In re:

GRUPO AEROMÉXICO, S.A.B. de C.V., et al.,

Debtors.¹

Chapter 11

Case No. 20-11563 (SCC)

(Jointly Administered)

COVER SHEET TO THE FOURTH INTERIM APPLICATION OF DAVIS POLK & WARDWELL LLP FOR COMPENSATION FOR SERVICES RENDERED AND REIMBURSEMENT OF EXPENSES INCURRED AS COUNSEL TO THE DEBTORS AND DEBTORS IN POSSESSION FOR THE PERIOD FROM MAY 1, 2021 THROUGH SEPTEMBER 30, 2021

In accordance with Rule 2016-1 of the Local Rules of Bankruptcy Procedure, incorporating the Amended Guidelines for Fees and Disbursements for Professionals in the Southern District of New York Bankruptcy Cases [General Order M-447], among other guidelines (the "Local Guidelines") and the Order Pursuant to 11 U.S.C. §§ 105(a) and 331

¹ The Debtors in these cases, along with each Debtor's registration number in the applicable jurisdiction, are as follows: Grupo Aeroméxico, S.A.B. de C.V. 286676; Aerovías de México, S.A. de C.V. 108984; Aerolitoral, S.A. de C.V. 217315; Aerovías Empresa de Cargo, S.A. de C.V. 437094-1. The Debtors' corporate headquarters is located at Paseo de la Reforma No. 243, piso 25 Colonia Cuauhtémoc, Mexico City, C.P. 06500.

Establishing Procedures for Interim Compensation and Reimbursement of Expenses for Retained Professionals, dated September 8, 2020 [ECF No. 360] (the "Interim Compensation Order"), Davis Polk & Wardwell LLP ("Davis Polk"), counsel for the above-captioned debtors and debtors in possession (collectively, the "Debtors"), submits this summary (this "Summary") of fees and expenses sought as actual and necessary in the fee application to which this Summary is attached (the "Application") for the period of May 1, 2021 through September 30, 2021 (the "Fee Period").

General Information

Name of Applicant: Davis Polk & Wardwell LLP

Counsel to the Debtors and Debtors in

Possession

Authorized to Provide Services to: Grupo Aeroméxico, S.A.B. de C.V., *et al.*

Petition Date: June 30, 2020

Retention Date: September 8, 2020 *nunc pro tunc* to June 30,

2020

Date of Order Approving Retention: September 8, 2020 [ECF No. 361]

Summary of Fees and Expenses Requested for the Fee Period

Time Period Covered by This Application: May 1, 2021 through September 30, 2021

Total Compensation Requested: \$9,869,695.00²

Total Expenses Requested: \$39,086.17

² The total compensation and expenses requested accounts for voluntary write-offs in an aggregate amount of \$337,245.00 reflected in the monthly statements filed during the Fee Period and incorporated in the total Compensation and Expenses reflected in this Application. In addition, following discussions with the U.S. Trustee, Davis Polk agreed to write off an additional amount of \$35,000.00, for a total voluntary reduction of \$372,245.00.

Total Compensation and Expenses

\$9,908,781.17

Requested:

Summary of Past Requests for Compensation and Prior Payments

Compensation Sought in This Application

Already Paid Pursuant to a Compensation

Order but Not yet Allowed:

\$2,308,554.80

Expenses Sought in This Application

Already Paid Pursuant to a Compensation

Order but Not yet Allowed:

\$11,195.21

Total Compensation and Expenses Sought

in This Application Already Paid

Pursuant to a Compensation Order but

Not yet Allowed:

\$2,319,750.01

Summary of Rates and Other Related Information for the Fee Period

Blended Rate in This Application for All

Partners, of Counsel, and Associates:

\$1,184.78

Blended Rate in This Application for All

Timekeepers:

\$1,176.50

Number of Professionals Included in This

Application:

62

Difference Between Fees Budgeted and

Compensation Sought for This Period:

Number of Professionals Billing Fewer Than 15 Hours During This Period:

19

Increase in Rates Since Date of Retention:

The Application includes a customary annual rate increase for all time keepers since Davis Polk's retention in the Chapter 11 Cases, which was disclosed on the Court docket in the Third Supplemental Declaration of Timothy Graulich in Support of the Application of Debtors for Authority to Employ and Retain Davis Polk & Wardwell LLP as Attorneys for the Debtors Nunc Pro Tunc to the Petition Date [ECF No.

752].

20-11563-scc Doc 1979 Filed 10/26/21 Entered 10/26/21 20:59:12 Main Document Pg 4 of 357

This is a(n):	monthly	x interim	final application
1 1115 15 a(11).	monuny	<u>_A</u> _ IIItCI IIII	mai application

Summary of Prior Monthly Fee Statements of Davis Polk & Wardwell LLP

Period Covered and ECF No.	Total Fees Requested	Total Expenses Requested	Total Fees and Expenses	Fees Paid	Expenses Paid	Total Balance Remaining to be Paid
05/1/2021 - 05/31/2021 ECF No. 1379	\$1,175,677.00	\$3,999.72	\$1,179,676.72	\$940,541.60	\$3,999.72	\$235,135.40
06/1/2021 - 06/30/2021 ECF No. 1656	\$1,710,016.50	\$7,195.49	\$1,717,211.99	\$1,368,013.20	\$7,195.49	\$342,003.30
07/1/2021 - 07/31/2021 ECF No. 1656	\$2,396,476.50	\$4,331.77	\$2,400,808.27	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$2,400,808.27
08/1/2021 - 08/31/2021 ECF No. 1958	\$2,169,956.50	\$13,520.05	\$2,183,476.55	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$2,183,476.55
09/1/2021 - 09/30/2021 ECF No. 1959	\$2,452,568.50	\$10,039.14	\$2,462,607.64	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$2,427,607.64 ³

³ The total remaining balance to be paid for the period of September 1, 2021 through September 30, 2021 reflects the write off of an additional amount of \$35,000.00 which was not previously reflected in *Fourteenth Monthly Fee Statement of Davis Polk & Wardwell LLP for Compensation for Services and Reimbursement of Expenses Incurred as Counsel to the Debtors and Debtors In Possession for the Period from September 1, 2021 through September 30, 2021* [ECF No. 1959].

20-11563-scc Doc 1979 Filed 10/26/21 Entered 10/26/21 20:59:12 Main Document Pg 5 of 357

DAVIS POLK & WARDWELL LLP

450 Lexington Avenue

New York, New York 10017 Telephone: (212) 450-4000 Facsimile: (212) 701-5800

Marshall S. Huebner Timothy Graulich James I. McClammy Stephen D. Piraino

Erik Jerrard (admitted pro hac vice)

Counsel to the Debtors and Debtors in Possession

UNITED STATES BANKRUPTCY COURT SOUTHERN DISTRICT OF NEW YORK

In re:

GRUPO AEROMÉXICO, S.A.B. de C.V., et al.,

Debtors.1

Chapter 11

Case No. 20-11563 (SCC)

(Jointly Administered)

FOURTH INTERIM APPLICATION OF DAVIS POLK & WARDWELL LLP FOR COMPENSATION FOR SERVICES RENDERED AND REIMBURSEMENT OF EXPENSES INCURRED AS COUNSEL TO THE DEBTORS AND DEBTORS IN POSSESSION FOR THE PERIOD FROM MAY 1, 2021 THROUGH SEPTEMBER 30, 2021

Pursuant to sections 327, 330, and 331 of chapter 11 of title 11 of the United States Code (the "Bankruptcy Code"), Rule 2016 of the Federal Rules of Bankruptcy Procedure (the "Bankruptcy Rules"), Rule 2016-1 of the Local Rules of Bankruptcy Procedure, incorporating the Amended Guidelines for Fees and Disbursements for Professionals in the Southern District of New York Bankruptcy Cases [General Order M-447], among other guidelines (the "Local").

¹ The Debtors in these cases, along with each Debtor's registration number in the applicable jurisdiction, are as follows: Grupo Aeroméxico, S.A.B. de C.V. 286676; Aerovías de México, S.A. de C.V. 108984; Aerolitoral, S.A. de C.V. 217315; Aerovías Empresa de Cargo, S.A. de C.V. 437094-1. The Debtors' corporate headquarters is located at Paseo de la Reforma No. 243, piso 25 Colonia Cuauhtémoc, Mexico City, C.P. 06500.

Guidelines"), the United States Trustee's Guidelines for Reviewing Applications for Compensation and Reimbursement of Expenses Filed Under 11 U.S.C. § 330 for Attorneys in Larger Chapter 11 Cases effective as of November 1, 2013 (the "U.S. Trustee Guidelines," and together with the Local Guidelines, the "Fee Guidelines"), and the Order Pursuant to 11 U.S.C. §§ 105(a) and 331 Establishing Procedures for Interim Compensation and Reimbursement of Expenses for Retained Professionals [ECF No. 360] (the "Interim Compensation Order"), Davis Polk & Wardwell LLP ("Davis Polk"), counsel for the above-captioned debtors and debtors in possession (collectively, the "**Debtors**"), submits this Fourth Interim Application for Compensation for Services Rendered and Reimbursement of Expenses Incurred for the Period from May 1, 2021 through September 30, 2021 (this "Application"). By this Application, Davis Polk seeks allowance of compensation for actual and necessary professional services rendered for the Debtors in the total amount of \$9,869,695.00, and for reimbursement of actual, necessary disbursements that Davis Polk incurred in connection with such services in the total amount of \$39,086.17, for an aggregate total of \$9,908,781.17 during the period of May 1, 2021 through September 30, 2021 (the "Fee Period").

Jurisdiction

- 1. The United States Bankruptcy Court for the Southern District of New York (the "Court") has jurisdiction over this matter pursuant to 28 U.S.C. §§ 157 and 1334. This is a core proceeding pursuant to 28 U.S.C. § 157(b)(2).
 - 2. Venue is proper pursuant to 28 U.S.C. §§ 1408 and 1409.

Background

3. On June 30, 2020, (the "Petition Date"), the Debtors each commenced in this Court a voluntary case (the "Chapter 11 Cases") under chapter 11 the Bankruptcy Code. The Debtors are operating their businesses and managing their properties as debtors-in-possession

pursuant to sections 1107(a) and 1108 of the Bankruptcy Code. On July 1, 2020, the Court entered an order [ECF No. 30] authorizing the joint administration and procedural consolidation of the Debtors' Chapter 11 Cases pursuant to Bankruptcy Rule 1015(b). No entity has requested the appointment of a trustee or examiner in these Chapter 11 Cases. On July 13, 2020, the United States Trustee for the Southern District of New York (the "U.S. Trustee") appointed an official committee of unsecured creditors (the "Committee") pursuant to section 1102 of the Bankruptcy Code [ECF No. 92].

- 4. Detailed information regarding the Debtors' business, capital structure, and the circumstances leading to the commencement of these Chapter 11 Cases is set forth in the Declaration of Ricardo Javier Sánchez Baker in Support of the Debtors' Chapter 11 Petitions and First Day Pleadings [ECF No. 20], filed with the Court on the Petition Date.
- 5. On September 8, 2020, the Court entered the Interim Compensation Order, which sets forth the procedures for interim compensation and reimbursement of expenses for all professionals in these cases.

The Debtors' Retention of Davis Polk

- 6. On September 8, 2020, the Court entered the *Order Approving Application of Debtors for Authority to Employ and Retain Davis Polk & Wardwell LLP as Attorneys for the Debtors Nunc Pro Tunc to the Petition Date* [ECF No. 361] (the "**Retention Order**"), authorizing Davis Polk's retention by the Debtors. The Retention Order attached hereto as **Exhibit B** and incorporated by reference allows the Debtors to compensate and reimburse Davis Polk in accordance with the Bankruptcy Code, the Bankruptcy Rules, the Local Guidelines, and the Interim Compensation Order.
- 7. The Retention Order also authorizes the Debtors to compensate Davis Polk at its hourly rates charged for services of this type and for the firm's actual, necessary expenses

incurred in connection such services rendered during the Fee Period. Among other things, it permits Davis Polk to render the following services:

- a. Providing advice, representation and preparation of necessary documentation and pleadings and taking all necessary or appropriate actions in connection with statutory bankruptcy issues, strategic transactions, asset sale transactions, real estate, intellectual property, employee benefits, business and tort commercial and governmental litigation and corporate and tax matters;
- b. Counseling the Debtors with regard to their rights and obligations as debtors in possession, and their powers and duties in the continued management and operation of their businesses and properties;
- c. Taking all necessary or appropriate actions to protect and preserve the Debtors' estates, including the prosecution of actions on the Debtors' behalf, the defense of any actions commenced against the Debtors, the negotiation of disputes in which the Debtors are involved and the preparation of objections to claims filed against the Debtors' estates;
- d. Taking all necessary or appropriate actions in connection with any chapter 11 plan, all related disclosure statements and all related documents and such further actions as may be required in connection with the administration of the Debtors' estates; and
- e. Acting as restructuring counsel for the Debtors and performing all other necessary or appropriate legal services in connection with the Chapter 11 Cases.

Compensation Paid and Its Sources

8. All services during the Fee Period for which compensation is requested by Davis Polk were performed for or on behalf of the Debtors. Additionally, Davis Polk has not received any payment or promises of payment from any source for services rendered or to be rendered in any capacity whatsoever in connection with matters covered by this Application. A certification confirming Davis Polk's compliance with the Fee Guidelines is annexed hereto as **Exhibit A**.

20-11563-scc Doc 1979 Filed 10/26/21 Entered 10/26/21 20:59:12 Main Document Pg 9 of 357

- 9. To the extent that billable time or disbursement charges for services rendered or expenses incurred relate to the Fee Period, but were not processed prior to the preparation of this Application, Davis Polk reserves the right to request compensation for such services and reimbursement of such expenses in a future fee application.
- 10. These professional services were rendered by Davis Polk's partners, counsel, associates and paraprofessionals from its various practice groups, including restructuring, litigation, corporate, intellectual property, executive compensation and benefits, and tax.

Summary of Professional Compensation and Reimbursement of Expenses Requested

During the Fee Period, Davis Polk's professionals and paraprofessionals 11. expended a total of 8,418.8 hours in connection with providing necessary services. Davis Polk has been able to efficiently provide services by utilizing the expertise of professionals and paraprofessionals within relevant practice groups to effectively advise the Debtors regarding discrete issues and ensuring that the level of seniority is commensurate with the assignment. Davis Polk, in connection with services rendered on behalf of the Debtors, respectfully requests allowance of reasonable compensation of such services rendered in the total amount of \$9,869,695.00 and reimbursement of actual and necessary expenses incurred in the amount of \$39,086.17, for an aggregate total of \$9,908,781.17 for the Fee Period. Annexed hereto as **Exhibit C** is a list of Davis Polk professionals and paraprofessionals, their position with the firm, the department in which the individual practices, the hourly rate charged for their services, the number of hours worked on this matter, and other pertinent information. Exhibit D annexed hereto is a list of the various categories and the total fees and total hours expended by subject matter category. Davis Polk engaged in ongoing discussions with the Debtors regarding budgeting and staffing issues. In addition to those discussions, annexed hereto as Exhibit G and **Exhibit H**, respectively, are Davis Polk's budget and its staffing plan in connection with services

20-11563-scc Doc 1979 Filed 10/26/21 Entered 10/26/21 20:59:12 Main Document Pg 10 of 357

rendered to the Debtors for the period of May 1, 2021 through August 31, 2021. Davis Polk maintained computerized, detailed time records for the Fee Period organized by project category with a daily time log describing the time spent by each timekeeper, as well as an itemization of all disbursements incurred. The detailed records for the Fee Period are annexed hereto as **Exhibit I**.

Case Status

- 12. The Debtors commenced these Chapter 11 Cases in the throes of an unprecedented pandemic that has dramatically affected the Debtors' business and the entire global aviation industry. Aeroméxico is the leading airline in Mexico and, pre-pandemic, was sufficiently capitalized to continue its operational initiatives and take advantage of its strategic partnerships. However, among many other things, the pandemic caused and continues to cause severe travel restrictions, including the outright closure of borders, a severe decline in passenger demand and significantly reduced flight operations. Notwithstanding the Debtors undertaking significant cost reduction and liquidity preservation measures to protect their business, the negative effects of the pandemic led to the filing of these Chapter 11 Cases. The Debtors commenced these Chapter 11 Cases to, among other things, preserve value, reduce costs, negotiate key lease and collective bargaining agreements, and rationalize their fleet.
- 13. Since the filing of the Third Interim Application of Davis Polk & Wardwell LLP for Compensation for Services Rendered and Reimbursement of Expenses Incurred as Counsel to the Debtors and Debtors in Possession for the Period from January 1, 2021 through April 30, 2021 [ECF No. 1346], the Debtors have made significant progress toward their restructuring goals including:
 - (a) participated in a mediation pursuant to the *Order Appointing the Honorable Sean H. Lane as Mediator* [ECF No. 1527], conducted a robust exit-financing

marketing process, analyzed and reviewed resulting proposals for such exit financing and related terms, prepared for, and conducted, extensive negotiations with numerous stakeholders and counterparties relating to same, and ultimately filed the Debtors Motion for Entry of an Order (I) Authorizing the Debtors Entry into, and Performance Under, the Debt Financing Commitment Letter, (II) Authorizing the Debtors Entry Into, and Performance Under, the Equity Commitment Letter, (III) Authorizing the Debtors Entry Into, and Performance Under, the Subscription Agreement and (IV) Authorizing Incurrence, Payment, and Allowance of Related Premiums, Fees, Costs, and Expenses as Superpriority Administrative Expense Claims [ECF No. 1860];

- (b) negotiated, drafted, and filed the *Debtors' Joint Plan of Reorganization Under Chapter 11 of the Bankruptcy Code* [ECF Nos. 1806, 1896] and related documents, including their *Disclosure Statement for the Joint Chapter 11 Plan of Reorganization of Grupo Aeroméxico, S.A.B. de C.V. and Its Affiliated Debtors* [ECF Nos. 1807, 1897];
- (c) negotiated, and obtained approval for, numerous agreements with various aircraft counterparties, resulting in the significant upgrades to the Debtors' fleet, including the addition of new aircraft and the assumption of amended leases related to equipment already in the Debtors' possession;
- (d) continued the Debtors' claims analysis, including expunging over 150 claims from the claims registers, reclassifying or otherwise modifying over 1,700 claims filed in the Chapter 11 Cases, and communications and extensive negotiations with stakeholders related thereto;
- (e) negotiated, and obtaining approval for, severance packages for terminated employees, as required by Mexican law;
- (f) analyzed issues related to the Debtors' loyalty program, and extensive negotiations with various constituencies in connection therewith;
- (g) prepared and obtained approval of numerous motions and applications; and
- (h) continued to address extremely in-depth issues surrounding numerous diligence requests from various parties in interest while providing an ever-increasing volume of relevant information.
- 14. As the foregoing summary demonstrates, the Debtors have accomplished a great deal during the Fee Period, and continue to make progress on many different fronts.

Summary of Services Rendered

15. Davis Polk provided extensive and critical professional advice and other services in connection with the key developments described above and on myriad other important issues, often on an urgent basis and within a limited time frame. Summaries of significant services are detailed below in accordance with Davis Polk's internal system of project categories:

Aircraft/Engines

Fees: \$1,555,005.50, Total Hours: 1,328.8

- Under this project category, Davis Polk assisted the Debtors with the fleet rationalization process, among other things. Specifically, Davis Polk:
 - Prepared motions to approve numerous aircraft financing transactions, related claims settlements, and sealing motions and declarations related to the same, negotiated the same with counterparties and their respective advisors, and extensive analysis related thereto;
 - Assisted in negotiating agreements with various counterparties for the addition of aircraft and equipment to the Debtors' fleet and the assumption of leases, including amended leases, related to additional aircraft and equipment, including preparing and filing numerous motions, orders, and other filings related thereto;
 - Prepared motions to reject certain equipment and negotiated the terms of the return of various rejected equipment with certain equipment counterparties;
 - Participated in weekly calls with co-advisors, responded to legal inquiries for the Debtors' fleet team, and discussed fleet rationalization workstreams;
 - Negotiated settlements and various other issues with fleet counterparties;
 and
 - o Corresponded with the Debtors, their advisors, and various creditor constituencies with respect to the foregoing.

Automatic Stay/Litigation

Fees: \$394,113.50, Total Hours: 336.40

- Under this project category, Davis Polk assisted the Debtors with issues related to current and potential litigation and related automatic stay issues. Specifically, Davis Polk:
 - Analyzed potential litigation issues relating to the Debtors' exit financing and plan of reorganization, and related mediation discussions;
 - o Negotiated a settlement in connection with the Newrest litigation and

- drafted pleadings and subpoenas in connection with the Newrest litigation including, among other things, the motion for approval of settlement;
- Reviewed and revised Rule 2004 discovery document hold notice and reviewed and responded to Rule 2004 requests;
- o Prepared and participated in witness depositions;
- o Drafted Third Removal Extension motion; and
- Analyzed research regarding contempt sanctions.

Bar Date/Estimation/Claims Allowance Issues

Fees: \$619,311.00, Total Hours: 623.7

- Under this project category, Davis Polk assisted the Debtors' with omnibus claim objections pleadings and related materials. Specifically, Davis Polk:
 - Drafted and filed numerous omnibus claims objections, declarations, and other filings related thereto, and reviewed and revised schedules related to same;
 - Corresponded extensively with customers, creditors, and creditors' counsels regarding proofs of claim, claims objections, and settlements;
 - o Drafted claimant and customer communications for the Debtors, and coordinated dissemination of the same;
 - Researched issues related to claims methodology, claim calculations, and the validity of claims; and
 - Corresponded with the Debtors and their advisors with respect to the foregoing.

Corporate Governance, Board Matters and Communications

Fees: \$498,991.50, Total Hours: 347.0

- Under this project category, Davis Polk assisted the Debtors' board of directors (the "Board") and management team with analysis and advice regarding corporate governance issues, legal issues and interaction with the press, among other things. Specifically, Davis Polk:
 - Advised, prepared materials for, and participated in numerous meeting and calls with the Board and various committees, including on issues regarding Mexican Law, exit financing and the plan of reorganization; and
 - Attended various calls with the management team and Board to provide legal updates in connection with the Chapter 11 Cases.

Creditor/UCC/AHC

Fees: \$317,449.50, Total Hours: 260.1

- Under this project category, Davis Polk assisted the Debtors with coordinating and communicating with creditors, including the Committee and Ad Hoc Committees on a variety of issues. Specifically, Davis Polk:
 - Prepared, reviewed, and revised materials for, corresponded with, and participated in meetings with the Committee, Ad Hoc Committees and other creditor groups regarding all aspects of the Chapter 11 Cases;
 - Reviewed and revises objection to PLM motion and materials in support of same;
 - Analyzed issues, responded to filings, and prepared presentation related to the Debtors' loyalty program, and extensive negotiations with various constituencies in connection therewith;
 - o Responded to Creditors Committee document requests;
 - Reviewed Creditors Committee claims trading motion and coordinated with various constituencies on review of same; and
 - Provided information, analyses, and presentations to the Committee's advisors and responded to inquiries and comments.

Customer/Vendor/Non-Aircraft Lease/ Non-Aircraft Contract Issues

Fees: \$119,780.50, Total Hours: 111.5

- Under this project category, Davis Polk assisted the Debtors with issues related to the Debtors' customers and vendors, negotiations with lease and contract parties and preparation of pleadings and litigation regarding the Debtors' agreements, among other things. Specifically, Davis Polk:
 - Advised and strategized with the Debtors' management and other advisors regarding critical vendor issues and processes to stabilize the business and ensure uninterrupted operations;
 - Prepared and reviewed various pleadings regarding the assumption, assignment or rejection of certain executory contacts and unexpired leases, including drafting the GSA settlement agreement;
 - Reviewed and analyzed numerous executory and other contracts, leases, and agreements in response to inquiries from the Debtors and the Debtors' other advisors and conducted research related to same; and
 - Conducted various conferences and negotiations with contractual counterparties and parties in interest regarding certain executory contracts and leases and potential transactions.

Employee/Pension Issues

Fees: \$94,305.00, Total Hours: 96.9

- Under this project category, Davis Polk assisted the Debtors with the review and analysis of employee-related issues including compensation, bonuses, incentive plans, severance, union related issues, insurance benefits and retirement plan issues, among other things. Specifically, Davis Polk:
 - Researched and analyzed executive compensation issues and responded to severance diligence; and
 - o Negotiated and drafted numerous filings, including reviewing and revising the outsourcing severance motion and the pilot severance motion.

Financing

Fees: \$3,275,159.00, Total Hours: 2,521.8

- Under this project category, Davis Polk assisted the Debtors with issues related to exit financing. Specifically, Davis Polk:
 - Drafted various mediation materials, drafted and negotiated the mediation order, prepared for, and participated in, the mediation;
 - o Drafted and negotiated revised exit financing Non-Disclosure Agreements and coordinated on and responded to exit financing diligence requests;
 - o Conducted various conferences and negotiations with exit financing stakeholders regarding exit financing opportunities, proposals, and process;
 - Reviewed and negotiated exit financing commitment letters and supporting materials;
 - Analyzed securities, regulatory, and Mexican law implications of proposed exit financing transactions;
 - o Drafted the Exit Financing Commitment Letter motion; and
 - Analyzed the shareholder support agreement in relation to exit financing issues.

General Case Administration

Fees: \$434,616.00, Total Hours: 420.1

- Under this project category, Davis Polk assisted the Debtors with general matters related to case administration, including case coordination, case calendaring, preparation of schedules, the filing of court papers, and tasks that do not fall within the other project categories. Specifically, Davis Polk:
 - Prepared for, coordinated, and attended weekly internal call on case status in order to develop and efficiently manage workstreams;
 - o Engaged in small-group correspondences and calls amongst the Davis Polk

- team to coordinate workstreams, provide updates, and coordinate hearing schedules;
- Drafted numerous Certificates of No Objection and various other notices;
 and
- Filed, among other things, monthly operating reports, stipulations, motions, notices, orders, and declarations.

Non-DPW Retention and Fee Issues

Fees: \$66,361.00, Total Hours: 59.7

- Under this project category, Davis Polk assisted the Debtors with the preparation and review of retention materials for the Debtors' non-Davis Polk professionals. Specifically, Davis Polk:
 - Assisted and responded to inquiries from the Debtors' other professionals with respect to retention;
 - Attended multiple calls and corresponded with the Debtors, Debtors' other professionals, and the U.S. Trustee regarding retention updates;
 - Corresponded with the Debtors and Debtors' other professionals regarding review of parties in interest list and related supplemental declarations identifying additional parties in interest who were not included as part of the initial disclosure;
 - Corresponded with the Debtors and Debtors' other professionals regarding interim fee applications;
 - o Responded to inquiries from ordinary course professionals; and
 - o Prepared court filings seeking authority for the Debtors to employ, retain, and compensate certain professionals in the ordinary course of business.

Non-Working Travel:

Fees: \$11,635.00, Total Hours: 13.0

- This category includes time attributable to non-working travel, which is billed at less than full hourly rates. Specifically, this travel includes:
 - o Non-working travel to and from Mexico City for meetings with the Debtors.

Plan/Disclosure Statement

Fees: \$1,896,896.50, Total Hours: 1,746.4

- Under this project category, Davis Polk assisted the Debtors with drafting a Chapter 11 plan and accompanying Disclosure Statement. Specifically, Davis Polk:
 - o Reviewed, revised, and filed Third Motion to Extend Exclusivity Periods;

- Attended multiple calls and corresponded with the Debtors and Debtors' other professionals regarding Plan timeline and Plan structural issues;
- o Drafted and revised the Chapter 11 Plan and Chapter 11 Plan term sheet;
- Drafted and revised Disclosure Statement and related solicitation materials and exhibits;
- o Researched various solicitation and Plan-related issues: and
- Drafted presentation on Plan waterfall analysis and analyzed materials related to same.

DPW Retention/Preparation of Fee Statements/Applications Budget

Fees: \$50,125.00, Total Hours: 69.1

- Under this project category, Davis Polk assisted the Debtors with issues related to Davis Polk's retention, including the preparation and review of Davis Polk's monthly fee applications and interim fee application. Specifically, Davis Polk:
 - o Drafted and prepared various monthly fee statements;
 - o Conducted semi-annual conflict review; and
 - o Drafted and prepared the Third Interim Fee Application.

IP, Regulatory and Tax

Fees: \$458,967.50, Total Hours: 390.5

- Under this project category, Davis Polk assisted the Debtors with regulatory and tax issues, and other reporting activities, among other things. Specifically, Davis Polk:
 - Reviewed and advised on various tax matters in connection with the Plan, Disclosure Statement and exit financing;
 - o Drafted a presentation to the Department of Justice on antitrust issues; and
 - Analyzed antitrust issues under the Hart-Scott-Rodino Act, including review of data room document and regulatory filings.

Hearing Preparation/Attendance

Fees: \$99,907.00, Total Hours: 81.9

- Under this project category, Davis Polk Davis Polk performed services related to preparations for and attendance of various hearings. Specifically, Davis Polk:
 - Drafted and filed numerous court papers relating to hearing administration, including hearing agendas;
 - Prepared talking points, witnesses, and other materials, and otherwise prepared for various hearings; and
 - o Telephonically attended:

20-11563-scc Doc 1979 Filed 10/26/21 Entered 10/26/21 20:59:12 Main Document Pg 18 of 357

■ The Exclusivity Hearing on June 22, 2021; and

■ The September 20th Omnibus Hearing.

Credit Card Receivables

Fees: \$12,071.50, Total Hours: 11.9

 Under this project category, Davis Polk assisted the Debtors with issues relating to their credit card processing agreements and receivables securitization trusts,

including reviewing and revising CEBURES notice of presentment.

Actual and Necessary Expenses

16. As set forth in **Exhibit E** hereto, Davis Polk has incurred or disbursed \$39,086.17

in expenses in providing professional services to the Debtors during the Fee Period. These

expense amounts are intended to cover Davis Polk's direct operating costs, which costs are not

incorporated into the Davis Polk hourly billing rates. Only clients for whom the services are

actually used are separately charged for such services. The effect of including such expenses as

part of the hourly billing rates would unfairly impose additional costs upon clients who do not

require extensive photocopying, delivery, and other services. Davis Polk charges all of its

bankruptcy clients \$0.10 per page for photocopying and printing job expenses. On several

occasions, overnight delivery of documents and other materials were required as a result of

circumstances necessitating the use of such express services.

17. Regarding providers of online legal research (e.g., LexisNexis and Westlaw),

Davis Polk charges all of its clients the standard usage rates these providers charge, which, due

to contractual flat fees, may not always equal Davis Polk's actual cost. Davis Polk currently is

under contract to pay these providers a flat fee every month. Charging its clients the online

providers' standard usage rates allows Davis Polk to cover adequately the monthly flat fees it

must pay to these types of providers.

14

20-11563-scc Doc 1979 Filed 10/26/21 Entered 10/26/21 20:59:12 Main Document Pg 19 of 357

18. Davis Polk has made every effort to minimize its expenses in the Chapter 11 Cases. The actual expenses incurred in providing professional services to the Debtors were necessary, reasonable, and justified under the circumstances to serve the needs of the Debtors, their estates, and other parties in interest.

Davis Polk's Requested Compensation and Reimbursement Should Be Allowed

19. Section 331 of the Bankruptcy Code provides for interim compensation of professionals and incorporates the substantive standards of section 330 of the Bankruptcy Code to govern the Court's award of such compensation. Section 330 of the Bankruptcy Code provides that a court may award a professional employed under section 327 of the Bankruptcy Code "reasonable compensation for actual necessary services rendered ... and reimbursement for actual, necessary expenses." 11 U.S.C. § 330(a)(1). Section 330 also sets forth the criteria for the award of such compensation and reimbursement:

In determining the amount of reasonable compensation to be awarded, the court should consider the nature, extent, and the value of such services, taking into account all relevant factors, including –

- (a) the time spent on such services;
- (b) the rates charged for such services;
- (c) whether the services were necessary to the administration of, or beneficial at the time at which the service was rendered toward the completion of, a case under this title;
- (d) whether the services were performed within a reasonable amount of time commensurate with the complexity, importance, and nature of the problem, issue, or task addressed; and
- (e) whether the compensation is reasonable based on the customary compensation charged by comparably skilled practitioners in cases other than cases under this title.

11 U.S.C. § 330(a)(3).

20. The foregoing professional services were performed by Davis Polk in an efficient manner, were necessary and appropriate to the administration of the Chapter 11 Cases, and were

20-11563-scc Doc 1979 Filed 10/26/21 Entered 10/26/21 20:59:12 Main Document Pg 20 of 357

in the best interests of the Debtors, their estates, and other parties in interest. Compensation for the foregoing services as requested is commensurate with the complexity, importance, and nature of the problems, issues, and tasks involved. As required by the U.S. Trustee Guidelines, annexed hereto as **Exhibit F** is a chart setting forth the comparative blended rates of the professionals and paraprofessionals who rendered services with a corresponding comparison of rates for professionals and paraprofessionals not involved in these Chapter 11 Cases.

Notice

21. The Debtors will provide notice of this Application in accordance with the Interim Compensation Order. The Debtors submit that no other or further notice be given.

[Remainder of Page Left Blank Intentionally]

20-11563-scc Doc 1979 Filed 10/26/21 Entered 10/26/21 20:59:12 Main Document Pg 21 of 357

WHEREFORE, Davis Polk, in connection with services rendered on behalf of the Debtors,

respectfully requests allowance of reasonable compensation of such services rendered in the total

amount of \$9,869,695.00 and reimbursement of actual and necessary expenses incurred in the

amount of \$39,086.17, for an aggregate total of \$9,908,781.17 for the Fee Period.

Dated: October 26, 2021

New York, New York

DAVIS POLK & WARDWELL LLP

By: /s/ Timothy Graulich

450 Lexington Avenue

New York, New York 10017

Telephone: (212) 450-4000

Facsimile: (212) 701-5800

Marshall S. Huebner

Timothy Graulich

James I. McClammy

Stephen D. Piraino

Erik Jerrard (admitted pro hac vice)

Counsel to the Debtors and Debtors in

Possession

20-11563-scc Doc 1979 Filed 10/26/21 Entered 10/26/21 20:59:12 Main Document Pg 22 of 357

Exhibit A

Certification of Compliance with Fee Guidelines

20-11563-scc Doc 1979 Filed 10/26/21 Entered 10/26/21 20:59:12 Main Document Pg 23 of 357

DAVIS POLK & WARDWELL LLP

450 Lexington Avenue

New York, New York 10017 Telephone: (212) 450-4000 Facsimile: (212) 701-5800

Marshall S. Huebner Timothy Graulich James I. McClammy Stephen D. Piraino

Erik Jerrard (admitted pro hac vice)

Counsel to the Debtors and Debtors in Possession

UNITED STATES BANKRUPTCY COURT SOUTHERN DISTRICT OF NEW YORK

In re:

GRUPO AEROMÉXICO, S.A.B. de C.V., et al.,

Debtors.1

Chapter 11

Case No. 20-11563 (SCC)

(Jointly Administered)

CERTIFICATION OF TIMOTHY GRAULICH IN SUPPORT OF FOURTH INTERIM APPLICATION OF DAVIS POLK & WARDWELL LLP FOR COMPENSATION FOR SERVICES RENDERED AND REIMBURSEMENT OF EXPENSES INCURRED AS COUNSEL TO THE DEBTORS AND DEBTORS IN POSSESSION FOR THE PERIOD FROM MAY 1, 2021 THROUGH SEPTEMBER 30, 2021

- I, Timothy Graulich, hereby certify that:
- 1. I am an attorney admitted into practice in the State of New York and a partner at the law firm of Davis Polk & Wardwell LLP ("Davis Polk"), located at 450 Lexington Avenue, New York, New York. I am familiar with the work performed on behalf of the above-captioned debtors and debtors in possession ("Debtors") by Davis Polk.

¹ The Debtors in these cases, along with each Debtor's registration number in the applicable jurisdiction, are as follows: Grupo Aeroméxico, S.A.B. de C.V. 286676; Aerovías de México, S.A. de C.V. 108984; Aerolitoral, S.A. de C.V. 217315; Aerovías Empresa de Cargo, S.A. de C.V. 437094-1. The Debtors' corporate headquarters is located at Paseo de la Reforma No. 243, piso 25 Colonia Cuauhtémoc, Mexico City, C.P. 06500.

20-11563-scc Doc 1979 Filed 10/26/21 Entered 10/26/21 20:59:12 Main Document Pg 24 of 357

2. I have reviewed the Fourth Interim Application of Davis Polk & Wardwell LLP for Compensation for Services Rendered and Reimbursement of Expenses Incurred as Counsel to the Debtors and Debtors in Possession for the Period from May 1, 2021 through September 30, 2021 (the "Application") to certify to certain matters addressed in the (i) Order Pursuant to 11 U.S.C. §§ 105(a) and 331 Establishing Procedures for Interim Compensation and Reimbursement of Expenses for Retained Professionals, dated September 8, 2020 [ECF No. 360] (the "Interim Compensation Order"), (ii) Rule 2016-1 of the Local Rules of Bankruptcy Procedure, incorporating the Amended Guidelines for Fees and Disbursements for Professionals in the Southern District of New York Bankruptcy Cases [General Order M-447], among other guidelines (the "Local Guidelines"), and (iii) the United States Trustee's Guidelines for Reviewing Applications for Compensation and Reimbursement of Expenses Filed Under 11 U.S.C. § 330 for Attorneys in Larger Chapter 11 Cases effective as of November 1, 2013 (the "U.S. Trustee Guidelines," and together with Local Guidelines, the "Fee Guidelines").² The Application covers the period May 1, 2021 through September 30, 2021 (the "Fee Period").

3. To the best of my knowledge, information and belief, the statements contained in the foregoing Application are true and accurate in all material respects and comply with the Fee Guidelines in material part. Davis Polk responds to the questions identified in the U.S. Trustee Guidelines as follows:

Question 1: Did you agree to any variations from, or alternatives to, your standard or customary billing rates, fees, or terms for services pertaining to this engagement that were provided during the application period? If so, please explain.

² Capitalized terms used but not otherwise defined herein shall have the meanings ascribed to them in the Interim Compensation Order.

<u>Answer</u>: Davis Polk has agreed to negotiated discounts off of its standard rates.

Question 2: If the fees sought in the Application as compared to the fees budgeted for the time period covered by the Application are higher by 10% or more, did you discuss the reasons for the variation with the client?

<u>Answer</u>: The fees sought in the Application do not exceed the fees budgeted for the May 1, 2021 through August 31, 2021 period, the originally contemplated fee period.

Question 3: Have any of the professionals included in the Application varied their hourly rate based on geographic location of the bankruptcy case?

Answer: As disclosed in the Retention Application, no.

<u>Question 4</u>: Does the Application include time or fees related to reviewing or revising time records or preparing, reviewing, or revising invoices?

<u>Answer</u>: The Application does not include time and fees related to reviewing or revising time records or preparing, reviewing, or revising invoices in connection with the preparation of five monthly fee statements relating to the Fee Period covered by the Application. The Application requests compensation for 1 hour for each of the five monthly fee statements prepared during the Fee Period. All other time related to preparation of the monthly fee statement has been voluntarily written off.

Question 5: Does the Application include time or fees for reviewing time records to redact any privileged or other confidential information? If so, please quantify hours and fees.

<u>Answer</u>: The Application does not include time and fees related to reviewing time records to redact any privileged or other confidential information. As set forth in the response to question 4, Davis Polk has written off all fees related to such time.

<u>Question 6</u>: Did the Application include any rate increases since retention in these cases?

Answer: The Application includes a customary annual rate increase for all time keepers since Davis Polk's retention in the Chapter 11 Cases, which was disclosed on the Court docket in the *Third Supplemental Declaration of Timothy Graulich in Support of the Application of Debtors for Authority to Employ and Retain Davis Polk & Wardwell LLP as Attorneys for the Debtors* Nunc Pro Tunc to the Petition Date [ECF No. 752].

Question 7: Did the client agree when retaining Davis Polk to accept all future rate increases? If not, did Davis Polk inform the client that they need not agree to modified rates or terms in order to have you continue the representation, consistent with ABA Formal Ethics Opinion 11-458?

<u>Answer</u>: The client was informed regarding Davis Polk's rates and potential future rate increases as part of its approval of Davis Polk's retention application. The client did not agree at that time to accept all future rate increases. As described in the *Third Supplemental Declaration of Timothy Graulich in Support of the Application of Debtors for Authority to Employ and Retain Davis Polk & Wardwell LLP as Attorneys for the Debtors Nunc Pro Tunc to the Petition Date [ECF No. 752], the client agreed to the customary annual rate increase.*

Dated: October 26, 2021

New York, New York

By: /s/ Timothy Graulich

Timothy Graulich Partner

Davis Polk & Wardwell LLP

20-11563-scc Doc 1979 Filed 10/26/21 Entered 10/26/21 20:59:12 Main Document Pg 27 of 357

Exhibit B

Retention Order

UNITED STATES BANKRUPTCY COURT SOUTHERN DISTRICT OF NEW YORK

In re:

GRUPO AEROMÉXICO, S.A.B. de C.V., et al.,

Debtors.¹

Chapter 11

Case No. 20-11563 (SCC)

(Jointly Administered)

ORDER APPROVING APPLICATION OF DEBTORS FOR AUTHORITY TO EMPLOY AND RETAIN DAVIS POLK & WARDWELL LLP AS <u>ATTORNEYS FOR THE DEBTORS NUNC PRO TUNC TO THE PETITION</u> <u>DATE</u>

Upon the Application (the "Application")² of Grupo Aeroméxico, S.A.B. de C.V. and its affiliates that are debtors and debtors in possession in these proceedings (collectively, the "Debtors") for entry of an order, pursuant to section 327(a) of the Bankruptcy Code, Bankruptcy Rules 2014(a) and 2016(b) and Local Rules 2014-1 and 2016-1, approving the employment and retention of Davis Polk as restructuring counsel for the Debtors *nunc pro tunc* to the Petition Date, pursuant to the terms set forth in the Application and in the Graulich Declaration; and the Court having jurisdiction to consider the matters raised in the Application pursuant to 28 U.S.C. §§ 157 and 1334 and the Amended Standing Order of Reference M-431, dated January 31, 2012 (Preska, C.J.); and consideration of the Motion and the relief requested therein being a core proceeding

¹ The Debtors in these cases, along with the each Debtor's registration number in the applicable jurisdiction, are as follows: Grupo Aeroméxico, S.A.B. de C.V. 286676; Aerovías de México, S.A. de C.V. 108984; Aerolitoral, S.A. de C.V. 217315; Aerovías Empresa de Cargo, S.A. de C.V. 437094-1. The Debtors' corporate headquarters is located at Paseo de la Reforma No. 243, piso 25 Colonia Cuauhtémoc, Mexico City, C.P. 06500.

² Capitalized terms used but not otherwise defined herein shall have the meanings ascribed to them in the Application.

under 28 U.S.C. § 157(b); and venue being proper before the Court pursuant to 28 U.S.C. §§ 1408 and 1409; and due and proper notice of the Application and opportunity for a hearing on the Application having been given to the parties listed therein, and it appearing that no other or further notice need be provided; and the Debtors having resolved any objections that the United States Trustee raised informally by the filing of the First Supplemental Declaration of Timothy Graulich in Support of the Application of Debtors for Entry of an Order Authorizing the Debtors to Employ Davis Polk & Wardwell LLP as Attorneys for the Debtors Nunc Pro Tunc to the Petition Date (the "Supplemental Declaration" and, together with the Graulich Declaration, the "Graulich **Declarations**") and revisions to the originally proposed order"; and the Court having reviewed and considered the Application, the Graulich Declarations and the Sánchez Declaration; and the Court having held a hearing on the Application; and the Court having determined that the legal and factual bases set forth in the Application and at the hearing establish just cause for the relief granted herein; and the Court having found that the relief requested in the Application being in the best interests of the Debtors, their creditors, their estates and all other parties in interest; and upon all of the proceedings had before the Court; and after due deliberation and sufficient cause appearing therefor,

IT IS HEREBY ORDERED THAT:

- The relief requested in the Application is hereby granted as set forth herein.
- 2. The Debtors are hereby authorized to employ and retain Davis Polk *nunc* pro tunc to the Petition Date in the Chapter 11 Cases, all as contemplated by the Application and on the terms provided in the Application, as modified herein, the

Graulich Declarations and the Sánchez Declaration, to the extent that the terms of the Application do not conflict with the terms of this Order.

- 3. Davis Polk is hereby authorized to render the following professional services:
 - a. Providing advice, representation and preparation of necessary documentation and pleadings and taking all necessary or appropriate actions in connection with statutory bankruptcy issues, strategic transactions, asset sale transactions, real estate, intellectual property, employee benefits, business and tort commercial and governmental litigation and corporate and tax matters;
 - b. Counseling the Debtors with regard to their rights and obligations as debtors in possession, and their powers and duties in the continued management and operation of their businesses and properties;
 - c. Taking all necessary or appropriate actions to protect and preserve the Debtors' estates, including the prosecution of actions on the Debtors' behalf, the defense of any actions commenced against the Debtors, the negotiation of disputes in which the Debtors are involved and the preparation of objections to claims filed against the Debtors' estates;
 - d. Taking all necessary or appropriate actions in connection with any chapter 11 plan, all related disclosure statements and all related documents and such further actions as may be required in connection with the administration of the Debtors' estates; and
 - e. Acting as restructuring counsel for the Debtors and performing all other necessary or appropriate legal services in connection with the Chapter 11 Cases.
- 4. Davis Polk shall be compensated in accordance with and will file interim and final fee applications for allowance of its compensation and expenses and shall be

subject to sections 330 and 331 of the Bankruptcy Code, the Bankruptcy Rules, the Local Rules, and applicable law.

- 5. Prior to any increases in Davis Polk's rates for any individual retained by Davis Polk and providing services in these cases, Davis Polk shall file a supplemental affidavit with the Court and provide ten business days' notice to the Debtors, the United States Trustee and the Official Committee of Unsecured Creditors. The supplemental affidavit shall explain the basis for the requested rate increases in accordance with section 330(a)(3)(F) of the Bankruptcy Code and state whether the Debtors have consented to the rate increase. The United States Trustee retains all rights to object to any rate increase on all grounds including, but not limited to, the reasonableness standard provided for in section 330 of the Bankruptcy Code.
- 6. Notwithstanding anything to the contrary in the Application, Davis Polk shall apply any remaining amounts of its prepetition retainer as a credit toward postpetition fees and expenses, after such postpetition fees and expenses are approved pursuant to the first order of the Court awarding fees and expenses to Davis Polk.
- 7. Any Bankruptcy Rule (including, but not limited to, Bankruptcy Rule 6004(h)) or Local Rule that might otherwise delay the effectiveness of this Order is hereby waived, and the terms and conditions of this Order shall be effective and enforceable immediately upon its entry.
- 8. The relief granted herein shall be binding upon any chapter 11 trustee appointed in any of the Chapter 11 Cases or upon any chapter 7 trustee appointed in the event of a subsequent conversion of any of the Chapter 11 Cases to cases under chapter 7.

9. To the extent that there may be any inconsistency between the terms of the

Application, the Graulich Declarations, the Sánchez Declaration and this Order, the terms

of this Order shall govern.

10. The Debtors and Davis Polk are authorized to take all such actions as are

necessary or appropriate to implement the terms of this Order.

11. The Court shall retain jurisdiction to hear and determine all matters arising

from or related to the implementation, interpretation and enforcement of this Order.

Dated:

September 8, 2020

New York, New York

/S/ Shelley C. Chapman

THE HONORABLE SHELLEY C. CHAPMAN UNITED STATES BANKRUPTCY JUDGE

6

 $\underline{\text{Exhibit } \mathbf{C}}$ Professional and Paraprofessional Fees for Fee Period

Name of Professional Individual	Position, Year Assumed Position, Prior Relevant Experience, Year of Obtaining Relevant License to Practice	Department	Hourly Billing Rate	Total Hours Billed	Total Compensation
Blanco, Maurice	Partner; joined partnership in 2008; admitted New York 2002	Capital Markets	\$1,790	16.6	\$29,714.00
Borchardt, Leo	Partner; joined partnership in 2016; admitted New York 2007	Corporate	\$1,765	117.1	\$206,681.50
Buchwald, Lara Samet	Partner; joined partnership 2017; admitted New York 2009	Litigation	\$1,765	44.5	\$78,542.50
Burke, Arthur J.	Partner; joined partnership in 2000; admitted New York 1994	Antitrust & Competition	\$1,790	28.1	\$50,299.00
Crandall, Jeffrey P.	Partner; joined partnership in 2011; admitted New York 1983	Executive Compensation	\$1,790	1.0	\$1,790.00
Farr, Lucy W.	Partner; joined partnership in 2003; admitted New York 1996	Tax	\$1,790	27.1	\$48,509.00
Florack, James A.	Partner; joined partnership in 1994; admitted New York 1988	Finance	\$1,790	10.2	\$18,258.00
Graulich, Timothy	Partner; joined partnership in 2009; admitted New York 1995	Restructuring	\$1,790	1027.1	\$1,838,509.00
Huebner, Marshall S.	Partner; joined partnership in 2002; admitted New York 1994	Restructuring	\$1,790	61.7	\$110,443.00
Jackson, Vanessa L.	Partner; joined partnership 2019; admitted New York 2013	Finance	\$1,635	101.6	\$166,116.00

Name of Professional Individual	Position, Year Assumed Position, Prior Relevant Experience, Year of Obtaining Relevant License to Practice	Department	Hourly Billing Rate	Total Hours Billed	Total Compensation
McClammy, James I.	Partner; joined partnership in 2015; admitted New York 1999	Litigation	\$1,765	72.7	\$128,315.50
Partner Total	:			1,507.7	\$2,677,177.50
Counsel					
Altus, Leslie J.	Counsel; joined Davis Polk 1985; admitted New York 1984	Tax	\$1,345	49.3	\$66,308.50
Spearing, Nicholas	Counsel, joined Davis Polk 2015; admitted England and Wales 1978	Corporate	\$1,345	9.5	\$12,777.50
Sturm, Josh	Counsel; joined Davis Polk 2020; admitted New York 2007	Restructuring	\$1,345	137.8	\$185,341.00
Szanzer, Steven Z.	Counsel; joined Davis Polk 2016; admitted New York 2001	Restructuring	\$1,345	541.7	\$728,586.50
White, Erika D.	Counsel, joined Davis Polk 1981; admitted New York 1982	Restructuring	\$1,345	1.9	\$2,555.50
Counsel Total	Counsel Total:			740.2	\$995,569.00
Associates, Law Clerks and Legal Assistants					
Bane, Abraham	Associate; joined Davis Polk 2019; admitted New York 2020	Restructuring	\$835	248.6	\$207,581.00
Cheng, Eric Y.	Associate; joined Davis Polk 2019; admitted New York 2020	Finance	\$835	7.4	\$6,179.00
Dartez, Jackson	Associate; joined Davis Polk 2018; admitted New York 2019	Litigation	\$1,060	5.2	\$5,512.00

Name of Professional Individual	Position, Year Assumed Position, Prior Relevant Experience, Year of Obtaining Relevant License to Practice	Department	Hourly Billing Rate	Total Hours Billed	Total Compensation
De Mullewie, Leonore	Associate; joined Davis Polk 2019; admitted Brussels 2016	Corporate	\$1,155	15.8	\$18,249.00
Dekhtyar, Mariya	Associate; joined Davis Polk 2020; admitted New York	Restructuring	\$600	28.9	\$17,340.00
Manya	2021	Restructuring	\$740	97.9	\$72,446.00
Donnelly, Jacob M.	Associate; joined Davis Polk 2020; admitted New York 2021	Tax	\$740	71.1	\$52,614.00
Erickson, Jarret	Associate; joined Davis Polk 2018; admitted New York 2018	Restructuring	\$1,140	75.9	\$86,526.00
Ford, Stephen	Associate; joined Davis Polk 2020; admitted New York 2019	Restructuring	\$1,060	497.0	\$526,820.00
Garg, Paavani	Associate; joined Davis Polk 2019; admitted New York 2019	Restructuring	\$1,060	60.0	\$63,600.00
Green, Thomas S.	Associate; joined Davis Polk 2019; admitted New York 2016	Restructuring	\$1,175	206.2	\$242,285.00
Herts, Dylan	Associate; joined Davis Polk 2020; admitted New York 2020	Litigation	\$835	34.7	\$28,974.50
Hwang, Eric	Associate; joined Davis Polk 2019; admitted New York 2020	Restructuring	\$835	23.7	\$19,789.50
Jerrard, Erik	Associate; joined Davis Polk 2015; admitted New York 2016	Restructuring	\$1,175	1,067.7	\$1,254,547.50
Joe, Tina Hwa	Associate; joined Davis Polk 2017; admitted New York 2014	Litigation	\$1,175	6.9	\$8,107.50

Name of Professional Individual	Position, Year Assumed Position, Prior Relevant Experience, Year of Obtaining Relevant License to Practice	Department	Hourly Billing Rate	Total Hours Billed	Total Compensation
Katz, Michael	Associate; joined Davis Polk 2018; admitted New York 2019	Finance	\$1,060	62.4	\$66,144.00
Lee, Lloyd	Associate; joined Davis Polk 2020; admitted New York 2021	Finance	\$740	25.3	\$18,722.00
Lempel, Jesse	Associate; joined Davis Polk 2020; admitted New York 2020	Litigation	\$835	7.9	\$6,596.50
Marienko, Anna	Associate; joined Davis Polk 2018; admitted New York 2019	Litigation	\$1,060	14.6	\$15,476.00
Masaro, Matthew Bruno	Associate; joined Davis Polk 2019; admitted New York 2020	Restructuring	\$835	589.7	\$492,399.50
Melcer, Moshe	Associate; joined Davis Polk 2020; admitted New Jersey 2020	Restructuring	\$740	603.3	\$446,442.00
Morrison, Gregory S.	Associate, joined Davis Polk in 2016; admitted New York 2015	Antitrust & Competition	\$1,175	17.3	\$20,327.50
O'Sullivan, Damian	Associate; joined Davis Polk 2020; admitted New Jersey 2021	Restructuring	\$740	92.0	\$68,080.00
Parrott, Andy T.	Associate; joined Davis Polk 2017; admitted New York 2018	Litigation	\$1,140	7.9	\$9,006.00
Piraino, Stephen D.	Associate; joined Davis Polk 2014; admitted New York 2014	Restructuring	\$1,175	804.3	\$945,052.50
Rincon, Cristina M.	Associate; joined Davis Polk 2016; admitted New York 2015	Litigation	\$1,175	132.4	\$155,570.00

Name of Professional Individual	Position, Year Assumed Position, Prior Relevant Experience, Year of Obtaining Relevant License to Practice	Department	Hourly Billing Rate	Total Hours Billed	Total Compensation
Romero- Wagner, Alex B.	Associate; joined Davis Polk 2019; admitted New York 2020	Restructuring	\$835	10.1	\$8,433.50
Siman, Ariel David	Associate; joined Davis Polk 2014; admitted New York 2014	Tax	\$1,175	115.6	\$135,830.00
Simmonds, Alexander W.	Associate; joined Davis Polk 2016; admitted New York 2017	Corporate	\$1,155	96.3	\$111,226.50
Sokol, Nate	Associate; joined Davis Polk 2016; admitted New York 2017	Restructuring	\$1,155	5.7	\$6,583.50
Steinberg, Richard J.	Associate; joined Davis Polk 2019; admitted New York 2019	Restructuring	\$1,060	691.7	\$733,202.00
Talamás Velázquez, Ernesto	Associate; joined Davis Polk 2018; admitted New York 2019	Capital Markets	\$1,060	8.5	\$9,010.00
Troconis, Adela	Associate; joined Davis Polk 2015; admitted New York 2016	Finance	\$1,175	157.4	\$184,945.00
Weigel, Heather	Associate; joined Davis Polk 2017; admitted New York 2018	Mergers & Acquisitions	\$1,140	72.8	\$82,992.00
Hanson, Cole	Law Clerk; joined Davis Polk 2021	Restructuring	\$600	24.6	\$14,760.00
Houston, Kamali	Law Clerk; joined Davis Polk 2020	Litigation	\$740	7.5	\$5,550.00
Joffroy, Elena	Law Clerk; joined Davis Polk 2020	Litigation	\$740	19.4	\$14,356.00

Name of Professional Individual	Position, Year Assumed Position, Prior Relevant Experience, Year of Obtaining Relevant License to Practice	Department	Hourly Billing Rate	Total Hours Billed	Total Compensation
Krishnan, Rahul	Law Clerk; joined Davis Polk 2019	Litigation	\$835	13.8	\$11,523.00
Echegaray, Pablo	Discovery Attorney; joined Davis Polk 2019	Litigation	\$530	22.6	\$11,978.00
Joshi, Neeraj	Discovery Attorney; joined Davis Polk 2020	Litigation	\$530	16.4	\$8,692.00
Sanfilippo, Anthony Joseph	Discovery Attorney; joined Davis Polk 2004	Litigation	\$530	23.7	\$12,561.00
Altman, Olivia	Legal Assistant; joined Davis Polk 2019	Corporate	\$480	25.0	\$12,000.00
Farrell, Annie	Legal Assistant; joined Davis Polk 2020	Litigation	\$350	2.9	\$1,015.00
Giddens, Magali	Legal Assistant; joined Davis Polk 2019	Corporate	\$480	47.6	\$22,848.00
Hirakawa, Lisa	Legal Assistant; joined Davis Polk 2014	Litigation	\$480	1.5	\$720.00
Kelley, Kaitlyn	Legal Assistant; joined Davis Polk 2021	Litigation	\$350	1.0	\$350.00
Pagnotta, Ariana	Court Clerk; joined Davis Polk 2019	Managing Attorney's Office	\$230	2.7	\$621.00
Associates, La	aw Clerks and Legal Assistant		6,170.9	\$6,243,583.50	
TOTAL FEES					916,330.00

20-11563-scc Doc 1979 Filed 10/26/21 Entered 10/26/21 20:59:12 Main Document Pg 39 of 357

Name of Professional Individual	Position, Year Assumed Position, Prior Relevant Experience, Year of Obtaining Relevant License to Practice	Department	Hourly Billing Rate	Total Hours Billed	Total Compensation
(Less 50% Discount for Non-Working Travel Time)					11,635.00)
GRAND TOTAL					\$9,869,695.00 ¹

¹ This amount reflects a reduction in fees in the amount of \$372,245.00 on account of the following: (a) \$11,635.00 from a 50% reduction of Non-Working Travel Time; (b) \$325,610.00 of voluntary write-offs reflected in the monthly statements filed in the Fee Period; and (c) additional voluntary write-offs of \$35,000.

 $\underline{\textbf{Exhibit D}}$ Fees by Project Category for Fee Period

Project Category	Total Hours	Total Fees
Aircraft/Engines	1,328.8	\$1,555,005.50
Automatic Stay/Litigation	336.4	\$394,113.50
Bar Date/Estimation/Claims Allowance Issues	623.7	\$619,311.00
Corporate Governance, Board Matters and Communications	347.00	\$498,991.50
Creditor/UCC/AHC	260.1	\$317,449.50
Customer/Vendor/Non-Aircraft Lease/Non-Aircraft Contract Issues	111.5	\$119,780.50
Employee/Pension Issues	96.9	\$94,305.00
Financing	2,521.8	\$3,275,159.00
General Case Administration	420.1	\$434,616.00
Non-DPW Retention and Fee Issues	59.7	\$66,361.00
Non-Working Travel (50%)	13.0	\$11,635.00
Plan/Disclosure Statement	1,746.4	\$1,896,896.50
DPW Retention/Preparation of DPW Fee Statements/Applications and Budget	69.1	\$50,125.00
IP, Regulatory and Tax	390.5	\$458,967.50
Hearing Preparation/Attendance	81.9	\$99,907.00
Credit Card Receivables	11.9	\$12,071.50
Total	8,418.8	\$9,869,695.00 ¹

¹ This amount reflects a reduction in fees in the amount of \$372,245.00 on account of the following: (a) \$11,635.00 from a 50% reduction of Non-Working Travel Time; (b) \$325,610.00 of voluntary write-offs reflected in the monthly statements filed in the Fee Period; and (c) additional voluntary write-offs of \$35,000.

Exhibit E Expense Summary

Expense Category	Service Provider (if applicable)	Total Expenses
Court and Related Fees	Veritext LLC, CourtSolutions, CourtAlert.com, and Pacer transactions	\$4,877.46
Postage, Courier & Freight	N/A	\$1,260.10
Outside Documents & Research	Courtlink and Restructuring Concepts	\$4,260.46
Meals	See Meal Detail provided in Davis Polk's Monthly Fee Statements	\$488.80
Travel	See Travel Detail provided in Davis Polk's Monthly Fee Statements	\$2,328.93
Computer Research	LexisNexis and Westlaw	\$22,454.32
Electronic Discovery Services	Consilio Inc.	\$3,416.10
TOTAL	\$39,086.17	

 $\underline{\textbf{Exhibit F}}$ Customary and Comparable Compensation Disclosures for the Fee Period

	BLENDED HOURLY RATE				
CATEGORY OF TIMEKEEPER	Professionals at the New York Office of Davis Polk & Wardwell LLP for a 12-Month Period Ending on September 30, 2021, Excluding Bankruptcy Matters ¹	Davis Polk Aeroméxico Fourth Interim Fee Application			
Partner	\$1,600.44	\$1,775.67			
Counsel	\$1,284.18	\$1,345.00			
Other Attorneys ²	\$871.35	\$1,019.02			
Non-Lawyers	\$417.20	\$473.50			
All Timekeepers Aggregated	\$1,004.82	\$1,176.50			

¹ This blended hourly rate is adjusted to exclude hours and compensation billed to certain clients with special billing arrangements.

² This category includes Law Clerks, Discovery Attorneys, and Summer Associates.

Exhibit G

Budget by Project Category for the May 1, 2021 through August 31, 2021 Period¹

Project Category	Estimated Hours	Estimated Fees
Aircraft/Engines	538.11- 822.99	\$631,321.78 - \$965,550.95
Automatic Stay/Litigation	219.02 - 334.97	\$206,935.73 - \$316,489.94
Bar Date/Estimation/Claims Allowance Issues	473.37 - 723.97	\$481,910.90 - \$737,040.20
Corporate Governance Board Matters And Comm.	126.06 - 192.79	\$193,854.40 - \$296,483.20
Creditor/UCC/AHC Issues	203.32 - 310.96	\$254,827.03 - \$389,735.45
Customer/Vendor/Non-Aircraft Lease/Non-Aircraft Contract	89.42 - 136.76	\$95,843.45 - \$146,584.10
Employee/Pension Issues	78.71 - 120.38	\$75,197.38 - \$115,007.75
Financing	1,880.23 - 2,875.65	\$2,407,512.29 - \$3,682,077.62
General Case Administration	288.41 - 441.09	\$300,016.85 - \$458,849.30
Non- DPW Retention and Fee Issues	42.84 - 65.52	\$48,332.28 - \$73,919.95
Non-Working Travel	11.05 - 16.90	\$9,889.75 - \$15,125.50
Plan and Disclosure Statement	1,110.27 - 1,698.06	\$1,183,574.43 - \$1,810,172.65
DPW Retention/Preparation of DPW Fee Statement/Application	47.26 - 72.28	\$32,865.68 - \$50,265.15
IP, Regulatory And Tax	250.58 - 383.24	\$299,177.05 - \$457,564.90
Hearing Preparation/Attendance	40.78 - 62.37	\$51,728.96 - \$79,114.88
Credit Card Receivables	7.61 - 11.64	\$8,106.24 - \$12,397.78
Total	5,407.03 - 8,269.57	\$6,281,094.17 - \$9,606,379.32

¹ The Budget and Staffing Plan for the Fee Period that Davis Polk shared with the Debtors did not include fees budgeted for the period of September 1, 2021 through September 30, 2021 as the Fee Period was only contemplated to cover the period of May 1, 2021 through August 31, 2021.

Exhibit H

Staffing Plan by Timekeeper Category for the May 1, 2021 through August 31, 2021 Period

Category of Timekeeper	Number of Timekeepers Expected To Perform Significant Work Across All Matters During the Fee Period	Average Hourly Rate
Partner	6	\$1,790
Counsel	5	\$1,345
Associate	20	\$995
Law Clerk	3	\$740
Paraprofessional	3	\$480
Total	37	\$1,070

20-11563-scc Doc 1979 Filed 10/26/21 Entered 10/26/21 20:59:12 Main Document Pg 45 of 357

Exhibit I

Time and Disbursement Detail for Fee Period

		Time	Detail By Project
Name	Date	Hours	Narrative
AM100 Aircraft/Engir	nes		
Sturm, Josh Jerrard, Erik	05/02/21 05/03/21	0.2 0.8	Correspondence with T. Green regarding Delta motion. Call with M. Melcer, J. Strum, and Morris Nichols regarding fleet transaction motion (0.4); review precedent regarding same (0.4).
Melcer, Moshe	05/03/21	0.5	Call with E. Jerrard, J. Sturm and Morris Nichols regarding fleet transaction motion (0.4); correspondence with T. Green regarding same (0.1).
Piraino, Stephen D.	05/03/21	0.2	Correspondence with T. Green and others regarding Boeing orders.
Sturm, Josh	05/03/21	4.0	Correspondence with T. Green and Morris Nichols regarding Delta motion (0.8); call with M. Melcer, E. Jerrard, and Morris Nichols regarding fleet transaction motion (0.4); correspondence with T. Graulich and C. Hansen regarding transaction documents redaction issues (0.3); call with C. Hansen regarding same (0.5); review correspondence with White & Case regarding Santander redaction comments (0.2); correspondence with White & Case regarding AerCap order (0.5); correspondence with same to coordinate submission of same (0.3); correspondence with T. Green regarding review of MTU agreements (0.5); review correspondence with Pillsbury Winthrop regarding Air Lease order (0.2); correspondence with A. Andreeva regarding same (0.3).
Giddens, Magali	05/04/21	0.3	Review correspondence with T. Green and others regarding redactions of transactions documents.
Graulich, Timothy	05/04/21	0.8	Call with A. Conesa and R. Sanchez Baker regarding fleet plan.
Sturm, Josh	05/04/21	3.7	Review hearing transcript regarding Air Lease order submission procedures (0.3); correspondence with White & Case and Pillsbury Winthrop regarding same (0.4); coordinate submission of fleet orders (0.8); correspondence with Akin Gump regarding assumption motions (0.2); correspondence with Davis Polk Fleet team regarding same (0.2); correspondence with T. Graulich regarding Boeing motion status (0.2); coordinate with Davis Polk Fleet team regarding Morris Nichols declaration in support of Delta motion (0.5); coordinate with Davis Polk Fleet team regarding distribution of fleet orders (0.5); review precedent motions (0.3); correspondence with White & Case regarding Avolon lease terms (0.3).
Bane, Abraham	05/05/21	0.7	Correspondence with T. Green regarding Boeing orders (0.3); review final drafts of same (0.4).
Piraino, Stephen D.	05/05/21	0.5	Correspondence with J. Sturm and T. Green regarding Boeing redactions.
Sturm, Josh	05/05/21	3.8	Correspondence with T. Green and White & Case regarding finalization of Boeing orders (0.7); correspondence with A. Bane and S. Piraino regarding notice with respect to material not redacted (0.6); correspondence with Davis Polk Fleet team and Chambers regarding entry of remaining Boeing orders (0.8); correspondence with Pillsbury Winthrop regarding same (0.3); correspondence with White & Case regarding aircraft rejection rights (0.7); correspondence with Ad Hoc Group regarding confidentiality of fleet materials (0.3); correspondence with Davis Polk Fleet team regarding same (0.4).

		Time	Detail By Project
Name	Date	Hours	Narrative
Piraino, Stephen D.	05/06/21	0.2	Correspondence with Davis Polk Fleet team regarding fleet
Cture lash	05/00/04	0.4	issues.
Sturm, Josh	05/06/21	2.4	Correspondence with E. Herrera-Tarrazas regarding Boeing motion approval (0.2); correspondence with A. Andreeva
			regarding Clover effectiveness (0.4); correspondence with
			same regarding Air Lease agreement (0.5); coordinate refiling
			of fleet orders (0.7); correspondence with A. Andreeva
Sturm, Josh	05/07/21	1.7	regarding execution of approved fleet agreements (0.6). Review and revise draft of NAC letter of intent (0.4);
Glami, 003m	00/07/21	1.7	correspondence with Davis Polk and White & Case teams
			regarding same (0.6); correspondence with White & Case
			regarding Air Lease letter of intent (0.3); correspondence with
Sturm, Josh	05/08/21	0.2	Morris Nichols regarding Delta motion (0.4). Review correspondence with Skyworks regarding NAC
Sturm, Josh	03/00/21	0.2	negotiations.
Bane, Abraham	05/10/21	0.6	Revise notice of Boeing order (0.4); correspondence with J.
			Sturm regarding same (0.2).
Green, Thomas S. Sturm, Josh	05/10/21 05/10/21	1.2 4.2	Analyze SMBC leases. Correspondence with T. Graulich regarding status of fleet
Sturrii, Josii	03/10/21	4.2	matters (0.2); correspondence with Skyworks, Davis Polk
			Fleet team, and Morris Nichols regarding status of Delta
			motion (1.1); correspondence with Morris Nichols regarding
			Delta Hearing (0.3); review comments to SMBC lease
			agreement (0.4); correspondence with White & Case regarding NAC comments (0.4); correspondence with T.
			Green regarding same (0.4); correspondence with Skyworks
			regarding same (0.3); correspondence with Davis Polk Fleet
			team regarding notice of redacted Boeing filings (0.6);
			correspondence with White & Case regarding runway costs (0.5).
Bane, Abraham	05/11/21	0.9	Draft Notice of Filing of Location of Redacted Documents
			(0.6); correspondence with S. Piraino and J. Sturm regarding
Cturns look	05/11/21	2.0	same (0.1); coordinate filling of same (0.2).
Sturm, Josh	05/11/21	2.0	Correspondence with Davis Polk Fleet team regarding Notice of Filing of Location of Redacted Documents (0.3); coordinate
			filing of same (0.2); correspondence with T. Graulich regarding
			same (0.1); correspondence with Davis Polk Fleet team and
Cturns look	05/10/01	0.0	White & Case regarding GE engine agreement (1.4).
Sturm, Josh	05/12/21	8.0	Correspondence with Morris Nichols regarding status of Delta motion (0.3); correspondence with White & Case and
			Skyworks regarding GE engine agreement (0.3);
			correspondence with R. Smith regarding Santander
Cturns look	05/42/24	0.4	agreement costs (0.2). Correspondence with White & Case regarding Avolon
Sturm, Josh	05/13/21	0.4	agreement.
Green, Thomas S.	05/14/21	0.3	Call with White & Case regarding Avolon motion to approve
			aircraft leases.
Melcer, Moshe	05/14/21	0.3	Correspondence with T. Green regarding Avolon motion to
Sturm, Josh	05/14/21	1.8	approve aircraft leases. Call with White & Case regarding Avolon transaction (0.5);
,	· · · - ·	0	correspondence with White & Case regarding Avolon motion
			to approve aircraft leases (0.7); correspondence with T. Green
			and Davis Polk Fleet team regarding preparation of same (0.6).
Melcer, Moshe	05/15/21	0.1	(0.0). Email with T. Green regarding Avolon motion to approve
•			aircraft leases.

		Time	Detail By Project
Name	Date	Hours	Narrative
Sturm, Josh	05/15/21	0.6	Review summary of Avolon transaction (0.2); correspondence with Davis Polk Fleet team regarding same (0.4).
Green, Thomas S.	05/16/21	2.6	Review and revise Avolon motion.
Melcer, Moshe	05/16/21	4.7	Draft motion to approve aircraft leases (3.8); draft sealing motion regarding same (0.7); correspondence with T. Green regarding same (0.1); email with J. Sturm regarding same (0.1).
Sturm, Josh	05/16/21	8.0	Comment on draft Avolon motion (0.8).
Green, Thomas S.	05/17/21	0.9	Review and revise Avolon motion.
Graulich, Timothy	05/18/21	3.4	Call with R. Sanchez Baker and A. Conesa regarding fleet plan (0.8); review and revise draft term sheet for aircraft leases (2.6).
Melcer, Moshe	05/18/21	0.4	Correspondence with T. Green regarding motion to approve aircraft leases (0.1); review and revise same (0.3).
Sturm, Josh	05/18/21	1.1	Correspondence with Davis Polk Fleet team regarding request to review Aeroméxico opinion (0.2); review revisions to Avolon motion (0.7); correspondence with Davis Polk Fleet team regarding same (0.2).
Graulich, Timothy	05/19/21	1.8	Review and comment on motion to approve aircraft leases.
Green, Thomas S.	05/19/21	0.5	Review and revise Avolon proposed order (0.3); correspondence with J. Sturm and M. Melcer regarding same (0.2).
Melcer, Moshe	05/19/21	2.4	Review and revise motion to approve aircraft leases (1.5); correspondence with T. Green regarding same (0.5); review and revise draft motion to shorten time for same (0.1); correspondence with J. Sturm and T. Green regarding same (0.1); correspondence with same and T. Graulich regarding
Sturm, Josh	05/19/21	3.3	same (0.2). Correspondence with Davis Polk Fleet team and White & Case regarding fleet issues (0.5); correspondence with Chambers regarding motion to approve aircraft leases materials (0.1); review Aeroméxico opinion (0.5); correspondence with K. Kinder regarding same (0.2); comment on Avolon motion materials (0.8); correspondence with Davis Polk Fleet team regarding same (0.6); correspondence with Clifford Chance regarding advisor Non-Disclosure Agreements (0.3); correspondence with Davis Polk Fleet team regarding same (0.3).
Graulich, Timothy	05/20/21	2.2	Call with J. Sturm regarding Avolon and Delta motions (0.4); review and comment on engines motion (1.8).
Melcer, Moshe	05/20/21	0.6	Review and revise motion to approve aircraft leases.
Piraino, Stephen D. Sturm, Josh	05/20/21 05/20/21	0.2 5.6	Email with J. Sturm regarding information sharing. Correspondence with Davis Polk Fleet team regarding motion to approve aircraft leases materials (0.2); call with Skyworks regarding MTU agreement (0.5); correspondence with Same regarding Avolon motion (0.6); correspondence with M. Melcer regarding same (0.3); correspondence with Morris Nichols and Aeroméxico regarding Delta motion (0.3); comment on same (1.2); call with T. Graulich regarding same and Avolon motion (0.4); correspondence with Morris Nichols regarding same (0.2); review MTU agreement (0.9); correspondence with T. Green regarding same (0.3); correspondence with White & Case and Skyworks regarding same (0.4); correspondence with Davis Polk Fleet team regarding Carlyle lease motion (0.3).
Bane, Abraham	05/21/21	0.8	Review Boeing Order (0.6); correspondence with J. Sturm

		Time	Detail By Project
Name	Date	Hours	Narrative
Graulich, Timothy	05/21/21	3.6	regarding same (0.2). Call with A. Conesa and R. Sanchez Baker regarding fleet plan issues (0.8); review and comment on term sheet for same (2.8).
Melcer, Moshe	05/21/21	0.7	Draft declaration in support of motion to approve aircraft leases.
Sturm, Josh	05/21/21	3.7	Call with C. Hansen regarding pending lease negotiations (0.4); correspondence with same regarding same (0.3); correspondence with Skyworks regarding MTU agreement (0.8); review comments to Delta motion (0.3); correspondence with J. Barsalona regarding same (0.1); correspondence with T. Graulich regarding draft Delta agreement motion (0.2); correspondence with Skyworks regarding Flight Safety negotiations (0.6); correspondence with White & Case regarding JOLCO document requests (0.4); correspondence with Morris Nichols regarding draft of Delta motion (0.2); correspondence with Davis Polk Fleet team regarding Avolon motion (0.4).
Sturm, Josh	05/22/21	0.1	Correspondence with A. Andreeva regarding Creditors Committee request for JOLCO document request.
Green, Thomas S.	05/24/21	0.2	Analyze provisions of bylaws.
Sturm, Josh	05/24/21	2.2	Call with White & Case regarding pending aircraft lessor issues (0.3); review Delta motion (0.5); correspondence with Morris Nichols regarding same (0.1); call with Clifford Chance regarding JOLCO document request (0.5); correspondence with White & Case regarding same (0.2); call with A. Andreeva regarding same (0.3); correspondence with Clifford Chance regarding bylaws (0.3).
Melcer, Moshe	05/25/21	1.8	Email with J. Sturm and T. Green regarding pending fleet matters (0.2); review precedent regarding omnibus assumption procedures with respect to aircraft transactions (0.3); review and revise draft motion to approve aircraft leases (1.3).
Sturm, Josh	05/25/21	2.7	Correspondence with T. Green regarding SMBC lease questions (0.3); correspondence with C. Hansen, White & Case and T. Graulich regarding DAE transaction (0.9); correspondence with M. Melcer regarding pending fleet matters (0.6); call with Davis Polk Fleet team regarding same (0.4); review sealing precedent (0.3); correspondence with Davis Polk Fleet team regarding same (0.2).
Ford, Stephen	05/26/21	0.4	Research issues regarding advisor Non-Disclosure Agreement (0.3); correspondence with J. Sturm regarding same (0.1).
Graulich, Timothy	05/26/21	2.7	Review and revise Avolon motion.
Melcer, Moshe	05/26/21	1.5	Review and revise motion to approve aircraft leases (1.2); review and revise declaration in support of same (0.2); email with White & Case regarding proposed aircraft transactions (0.1).
Sturm, Josh	05/26/21	2.9	Correspondence with T. Green regarding Avolon motion (0.5); correspondence with C. Hansen regarding sealing procedures (0.5); correspondence with Davis Polk Fleet and White & Case teams regarding fleet items (0.4); correspondence with Davis Polk Fleet team regarding lessor advisor Non-Disclosure Agreements (0.6); correspondence with White & Case regarding same (0.4); correspondence with M. Melcer and White & Case regarding draft aircraft lessor motions (0.5).
Melcer, Moshe	05/27/21	1.1	Correspondence with White & Case regarding motion to

		Time I	Detail By Project
Name	Date	Hours	Narrative
			approve aircraft leases issues (0.2); review and revise motion to approve aircraft leases (0.5); email with J. Sturm and T. Green regarding same (0.3); review and revise sealing motion related to aircraft motion (0.1).
Sturm, Josh	05/27/21	1.6	Correspondence with White & Case regarding SMBC lease issue (0.6); correspondence with White & Case and Clifford Chance regarding JOLCO document request (0.7); review revisions to Avolon motion (0.3).
Melcer, Moshe	05/28/21	0.4	Call with Davis Polk, SkyWorks, and White & Case fleet teams regarding outstanding tasks (partial attendance).
Sturm, Josh	05/28/21	1.1	Call with Skyworks and White & Case regarding lease restructurings (0.7); correspondence with T. Graulich regarding pending fleet matters (0.1); correspondence with White & Case regarding GE letter of intent (0.1); correspondence with Clifford Chance regarding JOLCO document request (0.2).
Melcer, Moshe	05/29/21	0.1	Email with T. Green regarding fleet workstreams.
Sturm, Josh	05/31/21	0.2	Correspondence with T. Green regarding aircraft agreement.
Total AM100 Aircraft	Engines	91.5	
AM110 Automatic Sta	ay/Litigation		
Rincon, Cristina M.	05/05/21	0.2	Email with J. McClammy regarding settlement discussions with Newrest (0.1); email with Aeroméxico regarding same (0.1).
Joe, Tina Hwa	05/06/21	3.1	Review and revise opposition brief to motion for approval of settlement.
Rincon, Cristina M. McClammy, James I.	05/06/21 05/07/21	0.2 0.9	Coordinate call with Aeroméxico to discuss Newrest issues. Call with Aeroméxico and Davis Polk Litigation team regarding Newrest settlement (0.5); correspondence with same regarding same (0.4).
Rincon, Cristina M.	05/07/21	1.3	Call with Aeroméxico and Davis Polk Litigation team regarding Newrest settlement (0.5); correspondence with same regarding same (0.8).
Joe, Tina Hwa	05/08/21	0.7	Review and revise opposition brief to motion for approval of settlement.
Joe, Tina Hwa	05/10/21	0.1	Correspondence with Davis Polk Restructuring team regarding opposition brief to motion for approval of settlement.
Piraino, Stephen D. Masaro, Matthew Bruno	05/10/21 05/12/21	0.2 0.5	Email with T. Green and others regarding fleet orders. Correspondence with S. Piraino, Epiq, and Aeroméxico litigation counsel regarding ongoing litigation and automatic stay (0.2); review litigation schedules (0.2); correspondence with S. Piraino regarding same (0.1).
Piraino, Stephen D.	05/12/21	0.2	Correspondence with M. Masaro and others regarding litigation issues.
Joe, Tina Hwa	05/13/21	0.4	Review draft Creditors Committee filing (0.2); review draft declaration in support of same (0.2).
Joe, Tina Hwa	05/21/21	1.0	Review PLM discovery requests (0.3); review Creditors Committee's draft discovery requests regarding same (0.2); call with Davis Polk Restructuring and Litigation teams regarding PLM discovery issues (0.5).
McClammy, James I.	05/21/21	1.0	Call with Davis Polk Restructuring and Litigation teams regarding PLM discovery issues (0.5); review discovery drafts regarding same (0.5).

Time Detail By Project				
Name	Date	Hours	Narrative	
Masaro, Matthew Bruno	05/22/21	0.6	Correspondence with S. Cunningham, Epiq, and others regarding lift stay notice.	
Masaro, Matthew Bruno	05/26/21	0.1	Correspondence with S. Cunningham regarding lift stay stipulation.	
Joe, Tina Hwa	05/27/21	0.5	Correspondence with Davis Polk Fleet team regarding litigation strategy related to fleet issues.	
Total AM110 Automa Stay/Litigation	tic	11.0	5 3,	
AM130 Bar Date/Esti	mation/Claims A	Illowance Iss	ues	
Ford, Stephen	05/03/21	0.5	Call with R. Steinberg, S. Piraino, AlixPartners, and others	
			regarding claims analysis.	
Piraino, Stephen D.	05/03/21	1.3	Call with R. Steinberg, S. Ford, AlixPartners, and others regarding claims analysis (0.5); correspondence with same and Rothschild regarding same (0.6); correspondence with E Jerrard regarding claims (0.2).	
Steinberg, Richard J.	05/03/21	1.3	Draft correspondence regarding customer claims (0.1); email with AlixPartners regarding same (0.1); email with Aeroméxic regarding same (0.1); call with S. Ford, S. Piraino, AlixPartners, and others regarding claims analysis (0.5); review and reply to informal responses received to omnibus claim objection (0.5).	
Sturm, Josh	05/03/21	1.1	Call with lessor counsel regarding claim objections (0.4); correspondence with Davis Polk team regarding same (0.3); correspondence with lessor counsel regarding same (0.4).	
Melcer, Moshe	05/04/21	8.0	Analyze scheduled claims.	
Melcer, Moshe	05/05/21	0.2	Analyze scheduled claims.	
Steinberg, Richard J.	05/05/21	0.9	Review and reply to informal responses received to omnibus claim objection (0.5); call with claimants regarding same (0.2 email with AlixPartners regarding same (0.2).	
Steinberg, Richard J.	05/06/21	0.3	Review and reply to informal responses received to omnibus claim objection (0.2); correspondence with claimants regarding same (0.1).	
Graulich, Timothy	05/07/21	2.6	Call with Bank of America regarding claims estimates (0.6); correspondence with S. Piraino regarding claims issues (0.7 review revised claims estimate (1.3).	
Sturm, Josh	05/07/21	1.3	Review summary of Aeroméxico aircraft claims analysis and messages to public holders.	
Steinberg, Richard J.	05/08/21	0.2	Email with K. Lee regarding PLM and Aimia claims.	
Jerrard, Erik	05/10/21	0.5	Call with Ad Hoc Group regarding claims analysis.	
Steinberg, Richard J.	05/10/21	0.5	Correspondence with M. Masaro regarding foreign claims.	
Ford, Stephen	05/11/21	2.3	Review intercompany claims analysis.	
Graulich, Timothy	05/11/21	2.8	Correspondence with S. Piraino regarding claims objections	
Jerrard, Erik	05/11/21	0.5	(0.5); review intercompany claims analysis (2.3). Call with potential stakeholder regarding claims allocation.	
Melcer, Moshe	05/11/21	0.3	Analyze objections to claims.	
Steinberg, Richard J.	05/11/21	2.1	Correspondence with lenders regarding claims allowance (1.1); correspondence with S. Piraino regarding same (0.3); email with claimants regarding informal responses to omnibulations objection (0.3); call with claimants regarding same (0.4).	
Steinberg, Richard J.	05/12/21	0.2	Email with AlixPartners regarding informal responses receive to omnibus claims objections.	
Jerrard, Erik	05/13/21	0.7	Correspondence with Aeroméxico regarding customer claim	
Melcer, Moshe	05/13/21	1.1	Review and record correspondence with claimants (0.2); dra	

		Time	Detail By Project
Name	Date	Hours	Narrative
			Certificate of No Objection for omnibus claim objection (0.7); analyze amended claims (0.2).
Steinberg, Richard J.	05/13/21	0.9	Correspondence with claimants regarding informal response to claim objections.
Sturm, Josh	05/13/21	0.3	Correspondence with S. Chiu regarding claims allowance process.
Sturm, Josh	05/14/21	0.3	Correspondence with Skyworks regarding Clover claims methodology.
Jerrard, Erik	05/16/21	1.1	Call with AlixPartners and Sainz Abogados regarding claims issues (0.5); review customer claims data in preparation for same (0.6).
Melcer, Moshe	05/16/21	0.1	Review informal response to claim objections.
Steinberg, Richard J.	05/16/21	1.7	Call with AlixPartners and Sainz Abogados regarding claims issues (0.5); correspondence with same regarding same (0.7); review correspondence regarding informal responses to claim objections (0.5).
Sturm, Josh	05/16/21	0.2	Correspondence with T. Green regarding Clover claim methodology.
Masaro, Matthew Bruno	05/17/21	0.6	Correspondence with T. Graulich and E. Jerrard regarding claims issues.
Steinberg, Richard J.	05/17/21	4.4	Review correspondence with claimants regarding informal responses to omnibus claim objections (1.4); review claims regarding omnibus claim objection (1.3); email with AlixPartners regarding same (0.1); email with Sainz Abogados regarding same (0.3); draft Certificates of No Objection for same (0.6); review and revise proposed orders for omnibus claim objections (0.7).
Steinberg, Richard J.	05/18/21	2.2	Correspondence with claimants regarding informal responses to claim objections (0.3); email with AlixPartners regarding same (0.1); email with Sainz Abogados regarding same (0.2); review and revise Certificates of No Objection for same (0.7); review and revise proposed orders and schedules for omnibus claim objections (0.7); correspondence with Chambers regarding same (0.2).
Jerrard, Erik	05/19/21	0.7	Review and comment on claims analysis to be potentially served on counterparties (0.5); email with R. Steinberg regarding same (0.2).
Steinberg, Richard J.	05/19/21	4.0	Review and revise unsecured claims spreadsheet (0.9); email with E. Jerrard regarding claims reconciliation process (0.4); correspondence with M. Melcer regarding same (0.5); email with AlixPartners regarding same (0.3); correspondence with S. Piraino regarding claim estimate public disclosure (0.6); email with claimants regarding informal responses to claims objections (0.9); correspondence with M. Melcer regarding same (0.4).
Sturm, Josh	05/19/21	0.4	Correspondence with B. Smith regarding Avolon claims (0.2); correspondence with Skyworks regarding same (0.2).
Graulich, Timothy	05/20/21	4.9	Review and comment on claims disclosure (3.4); call with H. Parkhill and L. Donahue regarding claims disclosure (0.5); call with A. Conesa and R. Sanchez Baker regarding exit process (1.0).
Jerrard, Erik	05/20/21	1.9	Call with R. Steinberg regarding claims estimates (0.4); analyze claims issues (0.3); review draft notice of claims disclosure (0.4); review precedent regarding same (0.8).
Piraino, Stephen D.	05/20/21	0.7	Correspondence with R. Steinberg regarding claims estimates (0.4); review presentation on claims issues (0.3).

		Time	Detail By Project
Name	Date	Hours	Narrative
Steinberg, Richard J.	05/20/21	8.9	Call with AlixPartners and Skyworks regarding sublease claims (1.3); correspondence with Davis Polk team regarding claims update (0.6); correspondence with T. Graulich regarding same (0.3); correspondence with AlixPartners regarding same (0.5); correspondence with S. Piraino regarding claims estimates (0.6); call with E. Jerrard regarding same (0.4); correspondence with claimants regarding settlement orders (0.4); review and revise public disclosure claim and financial materials (2.2); draft status report to annex public disclosure materials (2.3); correspondence to Aeroméxico regarding same (0.3).
Sturm, Josh	05/20/21	2.6	Call with AlixPartners, Skyworks, and others regarding sublease claims (0.5) (partial attendance); correspondence with Davis Polk Fleet team regarding Air Lease claim transfer (0.3); correspondence with Davis Polk team regarding claims analysis presentation (0.8); correspondence with Skyworks regarding Clover claims process (0.4); correspondence with M. Edelman regarding reconciliation of AerCap claims (0.3); correspondence with Davis Polk team regarding same (0.3).
Graulich, Timothy	05/21/21	1.5	Review and comment on claims disclosure (1.1); call with Rothschild regarding same (0.4).
Jerrard, Erik	05/21/21	0.7	Correspondence with White & Case and Davis Polk team regarding Clover claims process (0.4); correspondence with Davis Polk team regarding liquidated claims amount (0.3).
Melcer, Moshe	05/21/21	0.6	Review correspondence regarding potential claims objections.
Piraino, Stephen D. Steinberg, Richard J.	05/21/21 05/21/21	0.3 6.7	Email with Davis Polk team regarding claims filing. Correspondence with Epiq regarding claims register (0.4); further review and revise public disclosure of claim and financial materials (1.2); correspondence with the Creditors Committee, Cleary Gottlieb and Ad Hoc Group regarding same (0.4); call with M. Melcer regarding same (0.3); correspondence with Aeroméxico regarding same (0.2); emails with the Davis Polk and Rothschild teams to coordinate public disclosure of claim and financial materials (0.4); call with Rothschild regarding same (0.3); revise claims status report (2.0); communication with Epiq regarding public disclosure (0.4); correspondence to chambers regarding same (0.2); call with S. Piraino regarding same (0.4); calls with M. Melcer regarding claims objections (0.5).
Sturm, Josh	05/21/21	0.7	Correspondence with White & Case and Davis Polk team regarding Clover claims process (0.4); correspondence with Davis Polk team regarding liquidated claims amount (0.3).
Melcer, Moshe	05/24/21	0.3	Correspondence with R. Steinberg regarding upcoming claim objection.
Steinberg, Richard J.	05/24/21	1.1	Correspondence with M. Melcer regarding omnibus claims objections (0.2); review rider regarding incorrect debtor claims (0.4); correspondence to E. Jerrard regarding claims workstreams (0.5).
Sturm, Josh	05/24/21	0.8	Correspondence with Skyworks and White & Case regarding aircraft lessor claims.
Jerrard, Erik	05/25/21	1.9	Call with stakeholder regarding claims analysis (0.3); analyze issues regarding same (0.7); call with R. Steinberg and M. Melcer regarding claims workstreams (0.9).
Melcer, Moshe	05/25/21	2.0	Draft rider to omnibus claims objections (1.1); call with E. Jerrard and R. Steinberg regarding claims workstreams (0.9).
Steinberg, Richard J.	05/25/21	0.9	Call with E. Jerrard and M. Melcer regarding claims

	Time Detail By Project			
Name	Date	Hours	Narrative	
Sturm, Josh	05/25/21	1.2	workstreams. Correspondence with B. Smith and Skyworks regarding Avolon claim (0.4); correspondence with Davis Polk team regarding outstanding claims issues (0.8).	
Jerrard, Erik	05/26/21	0.7	Call with R. Steinberg, Sainz Abogados, AlixPartners, and others regarding claims objections.	
Masaro, Matthew Bruno	05/26/21	0.6	Call with AlixPartners and others regarding claims (0.5); correspondence with third-party counsel and others regarding same (0.1).	
Melcer, Moshe	05/26/21	2.9	Email with R. Steinberg regarding claims issues (0.1); analyze unliquidated claims (0.6); call with AlixPartners and Davis Polk Restructuring teams regarding claims objection (0.7); email with AlixPartners and Epiq regarding upcoming objections (0.2); review claims related to assumed contracts (0.4); review motions related to same (0.4); call with R. Steinberg regarding	
Piraino, Stephen D.	05/26/21	0.7	claims workstreams (0.5). Call with E. Jerrard, Sainz Abogados, AlixPartners, and others regarding claims objections.	
Steinberg, Richard J.	05/26/21	6.7	Call with M. Melcer regarding claims workstreams (0.5); email with Davis Polk team, Sainz Abogados and AlixPartners regarding summary of claims workstreams (2.5); call with E. Jerrard, AlixPartners, Sainz Abogados, and others regarding claims objections (0.7); prepare for same (1.1); email with J. Sturm regarding claims workstreams (0.2); email with M. Masaro regarding same (0.5); correspondence with S. Piraino and M. Melcer regarding claims objections (0.3); review and revise updated claims estimation analysis (0.7); email with S.	
Sturm, Josh	05/26/21	2.2	Piraino and E. Jerrard regarding same (0.2). Correspondence with White & Case regarding claims questions (0.3); review correspondence from R. Steinberg regarding claims issues (0.5); call with AlixPartners and White & Case regarding claims (0.5); correspondence with T. Green and T. Graulich regarding claims tracker (0.6); correspondence with White & Case regarding JSA claim amounts (0.3).	
Erickson, Jarret Jerrard, Erik	05/27/21 05/27/21	0.6 0.7	Review claims objections workstreams. Call with M. DeGraf regarding claims analysis (0.3); email with	
Melcer, Moshe	05/27/21	1.7	Davis Polk team regarding claims issues (0.4). Correspondence with J. Sturm regarding rejection claims (0.3); review and summarize aircraft rejection claims (0.9); correspondence with R. Steinberg regarding claims workstreams (0.3); email with J. Erickson regarding upcoming	
Steinberg, Richard J.	05/27/21	3.8	claims workstreams (0.2). Correspondence with Epiq regarding claims reconciliation (0.6); email with AlixPartners regarding same (0.2); correspondence with M. Melcer regarding same (1.0); email with M. Masaro regarding claim objections (0.1); email with T. Graulich regarding updated claims estimation analysis (0.2); revise same (0.2); email with Vedder Price regarding certain AerCap claims (0.4); email with Epiq, Sainz Abogados, and AlixPartners teams regarding claims objections (0.5); call with AlixPartners regarding same (0.6).	
Sturm, Josh	05/27/21	1.7	Call with Holland & Knight regarding JSA claims documentation (0.5); correspondence with Davis Polk team regarding claim amount summary (0.4); call with same regarding same (0.4); correspondence with same regarding	

		Time	Detail By Project
Name	Date	Hours	Narrative
Erickson, Jarret	05/28/21	1.3	transfer notices (0.4). Call with M. Melcer regarding omnibus claims objection (0.2); review previous omnibus claims objections (0.5); review claims procedure order (0.4); correspondence with M. Melcer
Jerrard, Erik	05/28/21	0.7	and others regarding claims issues (0.2). Correspondence with S. Piraino regarding claims objection (0.4); email with J. Erickson and M. Melcer regarding claims issues (0.3).
Melcer, Moshe	05/28/21	1.8	Email with S. Piraino, E. Jerrard, and J. Erickson regarding upcoming claim objections (0.5); review claims regarding assumed contracts (0.6); email with Cleary Gottlieb regarding same (0.4); correspondence with E. Jerrard regarding same (0.1); call with J. Erickson regarding omnibus claims objection (0.2).
Piraino, Stephen D.	05/28/21	0.2	Correspondence with R. Steinberg regarding claims issues.
Melcer, Moshe	05/30/21	1.5	Review precedent claim objections.
Melcer, Moshe	05/31/21	3.7	Review precedent omnibus claims objections (1.2); email with J. Erickson regarding upcoming claim objections (0.4); email with AlixPartners regarding same (0.1); draft notice for omnibus claims objections (0.2); draft omnibus claims objections (0.9); call with AlixPartners, R. Steinberg, and others regarding same (0.5); call with R. Steinberg regarding same (0.2); email with J. Erickson regarding upcoming claim
Steinberg, Richard J.	05/31/21	2.4	objections (0.2). Call with M. Melcer, AlixPartners, and others regarding omnibus claims objections (0.5); correspondence with M. Melcer and J. Erickson regarding same (0.9); call with M. Melcer regarding same (0.2); review pleadings regarding same (0.8).
Total AM130 Bar Date/Estimation/Clair Allowance Issues	ms	110.1	
AM140 Corporate Go	vernance, Board	Matters and	d Communications
Graulich, Timothy	05/05/21	2.2	Review and revise Board presentation.
Graulich, Timothy	05/06/21		Review and comment on CIM presentation.
Graulich, Timothy	05/11/21	1.5	Attend Restructuring committee meeting.
Graulich, Timothy Graulich, Timothy	05/18/21 05/24/21	0.5 3.2	Review and revise Board presentation on Mexican law issues. Call with A. Conesa, R. Sanchez Baker and A. Sainz regarding Board issues (0.5); call with A. Sainz regarding same (0.4); review Board presentation on Mexican law issues (2.3).
Piraino, Stephen D.	05/24/21	0.3	Call with Davis Polk team regarding corporate governance issues.
Graulich, Timothy	05/27/21	1.2	Participate in Board Restructuring Committee call.
Total AM140 Corpora Governance, Board M Communications	ate	10.5	
AM150 Creditor/UCC Graulich, Timothy	/ AHC Issues 05/03/21	2.2	Call with Akin Gump and Ducera regarding PLM motion (0.5); review PLM motion (1.7).
Piraino, Stephen D.	05/03/21	1.1	Call with Akin Gump and Ducera regarding PLM (0.5); prepare for same (0.2); call with R. Steinberg regarding same (0.2); email with T. Graulich regarding same (0.2).

Nama	Doto	Herror	Normativa
Name Stainbarg Dishard I	Date 05/03/34	Hours	Narrative
Steinberg, Richard J.	05/03/21	6.1	Call with Aeroméxico regarding PLM (0.2); call with K. Lee regarding same (0.3); call with Akin Gump and Ducera
			regarding same (0.5); call with S. Piraino regarding same
			(0.2); draft correspondence regarding same (0.7); draft
			objection to PLM motion (4.2).
Graulich, Timothy	05/04/21	0.7	Attend weekly call with Creditor Committee advisors and
Craulicit, Tilliotity	03/04/21	0.7	Debtor co-advisors (AlixPartners, Skyworks, others).
Jerrard, Erik	05/04/21	0.6	Attend weekly call with Creditor Committee advisors and
oonara, Em	00/04/21	0.0	Debtor co-advisors (AlixPartners, Skyworks, others).
Masaro, Matthew	05/04/21	0.7	Attend weekly call with Creditors Committee advisors and
Bruno	00/04/21	0.1	Debtor co-advisors (AlixPartners, Skyworks, others) (0.6);
2.4.10			correspondence with same regarding Willkie Farr issues (0.1).
Piraino, Stephen D.	05/04/21	3.3	Review and revise objection to PLM motion (2.0);
ao, Otopilon D.	30/0 1/2 1	0.0	correspondence with R. Steinberg regarding same (0.3);
			attend weekly call with Creditors Committee advisors and
			Debtor co-advisors (AlixPartners, Skyworks, others) (0.6);
			correspondence with Akin Gump team regarding creditor
			issues (0.4).
Steinberg, Richard J.	05/04/21	7.2	Review and revise objection to PLM motion (6.9); call with S.
- to	00/01/21		Piraino regarding same (0.3).
Jerrard, Erik	05/05/21	0.4	Email with AlixPartners and White & Case regarding
· · · · · · · · · · · · · · · · · · ·			information request from Creditors Committee.
Piraino, Stephen D.	05/05/21	1.3	Correspondence with Davis Polk team regarding PLM (0.4);
, 1		_	review and revise objection to same (0.9).
Steinberg, Richard J.	05/05/21	2.4	Correspondence with T. Graulich and S. Piraino regarding
			PLM motion (0.4); correspondence with Davis Polk Finance
			team regarding same (0.5); review and revise objection to
Charlish Timesther	05/00/04	0.0	PLM motion (1.5).
Graulich, Timothy	05/06/21	6.3	Review and revise objection to PLM motion (5.8); call with
Jerrard Erik	05/06/21	0.0	Cleary Gottlieb regarding same (0.5).
Jerrard, Erik	05/06/21	0.9	Call with Cleary Gottlieb regarding PLM motion (0.5); review
Diraina Stanhan D	05/06/24	2.0	PLM motion (0.4).
Piraino, Stephen D.	05/06/21	3.9	Correspondence with R. Steinberg and others regarding PLM
			(1.2); call with Cleary Gottlieb regarding same (0.5); review
Stoinhora Dishard I	05/06/24	10	and revise objection to PLM motion (2.2).
Steinberg, Richard J.	05/06/21	1.9	Correspondence with S. Piraino regarding PLM motion (0.3);
			call with Cleary Gottlieb regarding same (0.5); correspondence with Davis Polk Litigation team regarding
Graulich Timothy	05/07/24	2.4	same (1.1).
Graulich, Timothy	05/07/21	3.1	Call with R. Sanchez Baker regarding objection to PLM motion
Jorrand Erile	05/07/04	0.6	(0.8); review and revise declarations in support of same (2.3).
Jerrard, Erik	05/07/21	0.6	Call with claimholder regarding case issues.
Piraino, Stephen D.	05/07/21	1.1	Call with creditor regarding creditor issues (0.6);
			correspondence with Willkie Farr team regarding same (0.3);
Ctainbara Diabard !	05/07/04	F 0	correspondence with Davis Polk team regarding PLM (0.2).
Steinberg, Richard J.	05/07/21	5.0	Revise objection to PLM motion (3.1); email with T. Graulich
			and S. Piraino regarding same (1.1); email with Davis Polk
			Litigation team regarding same (0.4); email with K. Lee
			regarding same (0.1); email with Aeroméxico regarding same
Dantan Jackson	05/00/04	0.0	(0.3)
Dartez, Jackson	05/08/21	2.9	Review and revise objection to PLM motion.
Steinberg, Richard J.	05/08/21	5.8	Revise objection to PLM motion (5.3); email with S. Piraino
			regarding same (0.3); email with Davis Polk Litigation team
			regarding same (0.2).

	Time Detail By Project			
Name	Date	Hours	Narrative	
Steinberg, Richard J.	05/09/21	1.9	Correspondence with S. Piraino regarding PLM (0.3); email with J. McClammy and others regarding same (0.2); revise objection to PLM motion (1.2); email with Aeroméxico regarding same (0.2)	
McClammy, James I.	05/10/21	1.8	Review PLM motion papers (1.0); correspondence with T. Graulich and others regarding strategy related to same (0.8).	
Melcer, Moshe Piraino, Stephen D.	05/10/21 05/10/21	0.4 1.9	Research issues regarding objection to PLM motion. Correspondence with R. Steinberg regarding PLM motion issues (0.2); correspondence with T. Graulich regarding PLM (0.6); call with R. Sanchez Baker and other regarding PLM motion (0.3); call with Simpson Thacher and others regarding same (0.3); correspondence with Rothschild regarding same (0.3); email with AlixPartners and Morris Nichols regarding Creditors Committee information sharing (0.2).	
Steinberg, Richard J.	05/10/21	2.2	Call with Aeroméxico regarding PLM motion.	
Graulich, Timothy	05/11/21	3.9	Attend weekly call with Creditors Committee advisors and Debtor co-advisors (AlixPartners, Skyworks, others) (0.7); review and revise objection to PLM motion (3.2).	
Jerrard, Erik	05/11/21	0.7	Attend weekly call with Creditors Committee advisors and Debtor co-advisors (AlixPartners, Skyworks, and others).	
Piraino, Stephen D.	05/11/21	3.3	Correspondence with bondholder (0.4); correspondence with Willkie Farr regarding creditor issues (0.3); attend weekly call with Creditors Committee advisors and Debtor co-advisors (AlixPartners, Skyworks, others) (0.7); email with T. Graulich regarding objection to PLM motion (0.1); review revised draft of same (1.4); correspondence with R. Steinberg regarding	
Steinberg, Richard J.	05/11/21	2.1	PLM (0.4). Correspondence with S. Piraino regarding PLM (0.2); email with Cleary Gottlieb regarding same (0.1); revise objection to PLM motion (1.6); email with S. Piraino regarding same (0.2).	
Dartez, Jackson	05/12/21	0.4	Call with Davis Polk Litigation and Restructuring teams regarding PLM motion.	
Graulich, Timothy	05/12/21	5.1	Correspondence with S. Piraino regarding PLM (0.4); review and revise objection to PLM motion (4.3); correspondence with J. McClammy regarding same (0.4).	
Jerrard, Erik	05/12/21	0.5	Call with Davis Polk Litigation and Restructuring teams regarding PLM motion.	
Joe, Tina Hwa	05/12/21	0.6	Call with Davis Polk Litigation and Restructuring team regarding PLM motion (0.4); correspondence with Davis Polk Restructuring team regarding same (0.2).	
McClammy, James I.	05/12/21	1.0	Correspondence with T. Graulich, T. Joe, and others regarding PLM motion and strategy related to same.	
Piraino, Stephen D.	05/12/21	2.8	Correspondence with T. Graulich regarding objection to PLM motion (0.4); correspondence with R. Steinberg regarding same (0.3); review and revise objection to PLM motion (1.5); call with Davis Polk Litigation and Restructuring team regarding PLM motion (0.4); correspondence with Davis Polk team regarding objection to same (0.2).	
Steinberg, Richard J.	05/12/21	9.2	Correspondence with Davis Polk Litigation team regarding PLM motion (0.9); review and revise objection to PLM Motion (3.6); email with Cleary Gottlieb regarding same (0.2); email with T. Graulich regarding same (0.4); email with Willkie Farr regarding same (0.2); review and revise declaration in support of objection to PLM motion (3.9).	
Sturm, Josh	05/12/21	0.2	Correspondence with A. Andreeva regarding Creditors Committee document request.	

	Time Detail By Project			
Name	Date	Hours	Narrative	
Graulich, Timothy	05/13/21	3.4	Call with L. Donahue and others regarding Plan (0.8); call with H. Parkhill regarding exit financing (0.5); review and revise presentation on Plan (2.1).	
Piraino, Stephen D.	05/13/21	0.9	Call with Creditors Committee regarding PLM (0.5); review PLM pleading (0.2); correspondence with Akin Gump regarding same (0.2).	
Steinberg, Richard J.	05/13/21	9.1	Correspondence with S. Piraino regarding PLM motion (0.9); email with K. Lee regarding same (0.3); email with Cleary Gottlieb regarding same (0.2); email with Willkie Farr regarding same (0.2); email with Aeroméxico regarding same (0.6); call with Cleary Gottlieb regarding same (1.2); review and revise objection to same (2.5); review and revise declarations in support of PLM motion (2.6); call with Willkie Farr regarding same (1.0)	
Dartez, Jackson	05/14/21	0.7	Review and revise PLM motion.	
Joe, Tina Hwa	05/14/21	0.5	Email with Davis Polk Litigation team regarding finalizing objection to PLM motion.	
Piraino, Stephen D.	05/14/21	1.1	Correspondence with Davis Polk team regarding PLM (0.4); review and coordinate final objection to PLM motion (0.7).	
Steinberg, Richard J.	05/14/21	8.8	Review draft pleadings regarding PLM (2.2); call with Cleary Gottlieb regarding same (0.3); revise objection to PLM motion (2.7); revise declarations in support of same (2.0); prepare for filing objection to PLM motion (1.4); email with Chambers regarding same (0.2)	
Dartez, Jackson	05/17/21	0.4	Call with Davis Polk Restructuring team, Willkie Farr, Simpson Thacher, and Cleary Gottlieb regarding same and potential discovery issues regarding same.	
Graulich, Timothy	05/17/21	2.1	Call with D. Zylberberg regarding PLM (0.4); review response to PLM motion (1.7).	
Piraino, Stephen D.	05/17/21	0.8	Call with Davis Polk Restructuring team, Willkie Farr, Simpson Thacher, and Cleary Gottlieb regarding same and potential discovery issues regarding same (0.4); correspondence with T. Graulich regarding PLM (0.4).	
Steinberg, Richard J.	05/17/21	2.4	Correspondence with S. Piraino regarding PLM motion (0.4); email with K. Lee regarding same (0.2); call with Davis Polk Restructuring team, Willkie Farr, Simpson Thacher, and Cleary Gottlieb regarding same and potential discovery issues regarding same (0.4); prepare for same (1.1); review Ad Hoc Group's joinder (0.3).	
Graulich, Timothy	05/18/21	0.8	Attend weekly call with Creditors Committee advisor and Debtor co-advisors (AlixPartners, Skyworks, others).	
Masaro, Matthew Bruno	05/18/21	1.0	Attend weekly call with Creditors Committee advisor and Debtor co-advisors (AlixPartners, Skyworks, others) (0.8); prepare for same (0.2).	
Piraino, Stephen D.	05/18/21	1.8	Correspondence with T. Graulich regarding PLM (0.5); email with Davis Polk team regarding PLM (0.2); review and revise PLM issue summary (0.3); attend weekly call with Creditors Committee advisor and Debtor co-advisors (AlixPartners, Skyworks, others) (0.8).	
Steinberg, Richard J.	05/18/21	2.3	Draft Aeroméxico materials regarding PLM motion.	
Ford, Stephen	05/19/21	0.4	Call with R. Steinberg regarding PLM.	
Piraino, Stephen D. Steinberg, Richard J.	05/19/21 05/19/21	0.2 2.4	Correspondence with Davis Polk team regarding PLM motion. Revise Aeroméxico materials regarding PLM motion (1.5); call with S. Ford regarding PLM (0.4); email with K. Lee regarding same (0.2); email with T. Graulich and S. Piraino regarding same (0.2); email with Akin Gump regarding same (0.1).	

	Time Detail By Project			
Name	Date	Hours	Narrative	
Graulich, Timothy	05/20/21	0.8	Call with Ad Hoc Group regarding PLM motion (0.5); call with K. Lee regarding same (0.3).	
Piraino, Stephen D.	05/20/21	0.7	Correspondence with Davis Polk team regarding PLM motion.	
Steinberg, Richard J.	05/20/21	1.5	Correspondence with K. Lee regarding PLM (0.5); call with	
-			Akin Gump and Ducera regarding same (0.7); correspondence with Sainz Abogados regarding same (0.3).	
Dartez, Jackson	05/21/21	0.3	Call with Davis Polk Restructuring and Litigation teams regarding PLM motion (partial attendance).	
Piraino, Stephen D.	05/21/21	0.9	Correspondence with Davis Polk team regarding PLM (0.4); call with Davis Polk Restructuring and Litigation teams regarding PLM (0.5).	
Steinberg, Richard J.	05/21/21	1.0	Correspondence with Sainz Abogados regarding PLM (0.3); correspondence with S. Piraino regarding same (0.2); call with Davis Polk Restructuring and Litigation teams regarding PLM motion (0.5).	
Graulich, Timothy	05/24/21	1.5	Attend management presentation call to Ad Hoc Group.	
Masaro, Matthew Bruno	05/24/21	0.1	Correspondence with T. Green regarding Creditors Committee bylaws.	
Piraino, Stephen D.	05/24/21	1.2	Attend management presentation call to Ad Hoc Group (partial attendance).	
Steinberg, Richard J.	05/24/21	0.8	Correspondence with S. Piraino regarding PLM.	
Graulich, Timothy	05/25/21	0.7	Call with FTI and Creditors Committee advisors.	
Jerrard, Erik	05/25/21	0.7	Attend weekly call with Creditors Committee advisor and Debtor co-advisors (AlixPartners, Skyworks, others).	
Masaro, Matthew Bruno	05/25/21	1.1	Correspondence with R. Steinberg regarding PLM (0.1); review documents regarding same (0.3); attend weekly call with Creditors Committee advisor and Debtor co-advisors	
Piraino, Stephen D.	05/25/21	1.4	(AlixPartners, Skyworks, others) (0.7). Attend weekly call with Creditors Committee advisor and Debtor co-advisors (AlixPartners, Skyworks, others) (0.7); call with R. Steinberg regarding PLM (0.2); call with noteholder regarding creditor issues (0.5).	
Rincon, Cristina M.	05/25/21	0.2	Correspondence with T. Joe regarding loyalty program issues.	
Steinberg, Richard J.	05/25/21	1.2	Correspondence with T. Graulich and S. Piraino regarding PLM (0.6); call with S. Piraino regarding same (0.2); email with Ad Hoc Group professionals regarding same (0.1); email with Davis Polk Litigation team regarding same (0.1); email with M. Masaro regarding same (0.2).	
Masaro, Matthew Bruno	05/26/21	0.3	Correspondence with R. Steinberg regarding PLM motion (0.1); review diligence related to same (0.2).	
Steinberg, Richard J.	05/26/21	0.7	Correspondence with M. Masaro regarding PLM.	
Dartez, Jackson	05/27/21	0.5	Call with Davis Polk Restructuring and Litigation team regarding PLM motion.	
Graulich, Timothy	05/27/21	3.0	Call with Davis Polk Restructuring and Litigation teams regarding PLM motion (0.6); call with A. Conesa and R. Sanchez Baker regarding same (0.7); call with Akin Gump team regarding same (0.7); review discovery requests regarding same (1.0).	
Masaro, Matthew Bruno	05/27/21	1.6	Correspondence with R. Steinberg and others regarding PLM (0.5); call with Akin Gump regarding same (0.5); review diligence related to same (0.6).	
Piraino, Stephen D.	05/27/21	2.3	Call with Akin Gump regarding same (0.4); prepare for same (0.2); call with R. Steinberg regarding same (0.2); call with Davis Polk Restructuring and Litigation teams regarding PLM (0.6); call with creditor regarding creditor issues (0.9).	
Rincon, Cristina M.	05/27/21	0.6	Call with Davis Polk Restructuring and Litigation teams	

		Time	Detail By Project
Name	Date	Hours	Narrative
Steinberg, Richard J.	05/27/21	3.1	regarding PLM motion. Correspondence with Sainz Abogados regarding PLM (0.4); call with S. Piraino regarding same (0.2); call with Davis Poll Restructuring and Litigation teams regarding PLM motion (0.6); call with Akin Gump and Ducera regarding PLM (0.6); correspondence with J. Erickson regarding same (1.3).
Total AM150 Creditor Issues	r/UCC/AHC	160.8	
AM170 Customer/Ve	ndor/Non-Aircra	ift Lease/Non	-Aircraft Contract Issues
Katz, Michael	05/03/21	0.2	Call with Aeroméxico and AlixPartners regarding vendor payment escalations.
Masaro, Matthew Bruno	05/03/21	0.1	Correspondence with R. Steinberg and others regarding vendor payment escalation issue.
Piraino, Stephen D.	05/03/21	0.4	Call with Aeroméxico and AlixPartners regarding vendor payment escalations (0.2); email with Aeroméxico regarding vendor escalation issues (0.2).
Katz, Michael	05/04/21	0.4	Review vendor contract (0.3); correspondence with S. Pirain regarding comments to same (0.1).
Masaro, Matthew Bruno	05/04/21	1.1	Correspondence with Aeroméxico and others regarding contract rejections (0.3); correspondence with Akin Gump at others regarding assumption motions (0.8).
Piraino, Stephen D.	05/04/21	0.9	Attend procurement council meeting (0.7); correspondence with M. Katz regarding vendor payment escalation issue (0.2)
Katz, Michael	05/05/21	0.5	Call with Aeroméxico and AlixPartners regarding vendor payment escalations.
Masaro, Matthew Bruno	05/05/21	1.4	Correspondence with Akin Gump, Cleary Gottlieb, and other regarding Airport Assumption motions order (0.7); review an revise same (0.4); correspondence with S. Piraino, Akin Gump, Cleary Gottlieb, and others regarding Airport Assumption Motions (0.3).
Piraino, Stephen D.	05/05/21	1.4	Call with Aeroméxico and AlixPartners regarding vendor payment escalations (0.5); correspondence with Davis Polk team regarding vendor issues (0.4); correspondence with Masaro and Cleary Gottlieb regarding airport assumption motion (0.5).
Katz, Michael	05/07/21	0.3	Call with AlixPartners and Aeroméxico teams regarding vendor payment escalations (0.2) (partial attendance); correspondence regarding same (0.1).
Piraino, Stephen D.	05/07/21	0.6	Call with Aeroméxico and AlixPartners regarding vendor payment escalations.
Graulich, Timothy	05/10/21	4.1	Call with R. Sanchez Baker regarding objection to PLM moti (0.3); call with Simpson Thacher regarding PLM (0.4); review objection to PLM motion (3.4).
Katz, Michael	05/10/21	0.2	Call with Aeroméxico and AlixPartners regarding vendor payment escalations.
Masaro, Matthew Bruno	05/10/21	0.6	Correspondence with Akin Gump, and others regarding Airp Assumption Motions (0.1); review and revise same (0.2); correspondence with third-party counsel and others regarding claims (0.3).
Piraino, Stephen D.	05/10/21	0.4	Call with Aeroméxico and AlixPartners regarding vendor payment escalations (0.2); correspondence with AlixPartner and Morris Nichols regarding vendor payment escalation issues (0.2).

Name	Date	Hours	Narrative
Piraino, Stephen D.	05/11/21	0.4	Attend procurement council meeting (partial attendance).
Piraino, Stephen D.	05/12/21	0.3	Call with Aeroméxico and AlixPartners regarding vendor
o -	05/40/04		payment escalations.
Graulich, Timothy	05/13/21	4.3	Call with Willkie Farr regarding objection to PLM motion (0.5)
			review and revise same (1.9); review and revise declarations
Manara Matthau	05/40/04	0.1	in support of same (1.9).
Masaro, Matthew	05/13/21	0.1	Correspondence with S. Piraino regarding lease assumption
Bruno Graulich, Timothy	05/14/21	4.4	procedures and motions. Review and finalize objection to PLM motion (2.2); review an
Graditori, Timotriy	03/14/21	4.4	revise declarations in support of same (2.2).
Masaro, Matthew	05/14/21	0.2	Correspondence with Cleary Gottlieb and others regarding
Bruno	03/14/21	0.2	contract assumption notices (0.1); review contract assumption
Diulio			notices (0.1).
Katz, Michael	05/17/21	0.4	Call with Aeroméxico and AlixPartners regarding vendor
race, mioriaci	00/11/21	0.4	payment escalations (0.3); email with S. Piraino regarding
			summary of same (0.1).
Piraino, Stephen D.	05/17/21	0.4	Call with Aeroméxico and AlixPartners regarding vendor
, 2.13p11011 2 1	· · · · · · · · ·	0.1	payment escalations.
Katz, Michael	05/18/21	0.5	Review vendor contract (0.1); email with Aeroméxico
,			regarding same (0.2); call with same regarding same (0.2).
Masaro, Matthew	05/18/21	0.2	Correspondence with S. Piraino regarding assumption order
Bruno			3 3 1
Piraino, Stephen D.	05/18/21	0.4	Call with Aeroméxico and AlixPartners regarding vendor
			payment escalations (0.2); correspondence with K. Beckema
			regarding same (0.2).
Katz, Michael	05/19/21	0.4	Call with Aeroméxico and AlixPartners regarding vendor
			payment escalations.
Masaro, Matthew	05/19/21	0.9	Review and revise assumption orders (0.7); correspondence
Bruno			with S. Piraino, M. Melcer, and others regarding same (0.2).
Melcer, Moshe	05/19/21	0.9	Revise proposed assumption order (0.5); review and revise
			schedules regarding same (0.4).
Piraino, Stephen D.	05/19/21	0.4	Call with Aeroméxico and AlixPartners regarding vendor
			payment escalations.
Masaro, Matthew	05/20/21	0.5	Correspondence with S. Piraino and others regarding contra
Bruno			assumption issue (0.3); correspondence with Aeroméxico ar
D: : 0: 1 D	05/04/04		others regarding contract rejection issues (0.2).
Piraino, Stephen D.	05/21/21	1.7	Analyze vendor issues.
Masaro, Matthew	05/24/21	0.3	Correspondence with Aeroméxico and others regarding
Bruno Biraina Stanban D	05/04/04	0.4	contract rejection settlements.
Piraino, Stephen D.	05/24/21	0.4	Call with Aeroméxico and AlixPartners regarding vendor
Masaro, Matthew	05/25/21	0.5	payment escalations.
Masaro, Matthew Bruno	03/23/21	0.5	Correspondence with Aeroméxico and others regarding contract rejections (0.3); review and revise stipulation and
טומוט			agreed rejection order (0.2).
Piraino, Stephen D.	05/25/21	1.0	Attend procurement council meeting.
Katz, Michael	05/26/21	0.5	Call with Aeroméxico and AlixPartners regarding vendor
,	00/20/21	0.0	payment escalations.
Masaro, Matthew	05/26/21	2.2	Correspondence with S. Piraino, Aeroméxico, and others
Bruno			regarding contract rejections (1.1); review and revise rejection
			order related to same (0.5); correspondence with S. Piraino
			and M. Melcer regarding same (0.3); correspondence with M
			Melcer and R. Steinberg regarding contract rejections and
			claims (0.3).
Melcer, Moshe	05/26/21	0.3	Draft proposed order for lease rejection.
Piraino, Stephen D.	05/26/21	0.5	Call with AlixPartners, Aeroméxico team and M. Katz
			regarding vendor payment escalation issues.
			18

		Time	ime Detail By Project		
Name	Date	Hours	Narrative		
Katz, Michael	05/27/21	0.3	Call with Aeroméxico and AlixPartners regarding vendor payment escalations.		
Masaro, Matthew Bruno	05/27/21	0.5	Correspondence with third-party counsel and AlixPartners regarding contracts (0.3); correspondence with AlixPartners		
Katz, Michael	05/28/21	0.3	and S. Piraino regarding contract assumption (0.2). Email with S. Piraino regarding vendor contract (0.1); revise contract (0.2).		
Piraino, Stephen D.	05/28/21	3.4	Email with M. Katz regarding vendor escalation issues (0.2); review and revise vendor agreements (3.2).		
Total AM170 Customer/Vendor/No Lease/Non-Aircraft (Issues		39.2			
AM180 Employee/Pe	ension Issues				
Masaro, Matthew Bruno	05/03/21	5.2	Review and revise pilot severance motion (4.3); correspondence with S. Piraino, AlixPartners, Aeroméxico, and others regarding same (0.9).		
Piraino, Stephen D.	05/03/21	0.2	Correspondence with M. Masaro and, A. Bane regarding employee motion.		
Jerrard, Erik	05/04/21	0.2	Call with S. Brecher and S. Piraino regarding management incentive plan.		
Masaro, Matthew Bruno	05/04/21	2.5	Review and revise pilot severance motion (0.9); correspondence with AlixPartners, Aeroméxico, S. Piraino, and others regarding same (1.6).		
Piraino, Stephen D.	05/04/21	1.4	Call with E. Jerrard and S. Brecher regarding management incentive plan (0.2); review and revise pilot severance motior (0.7); correspondence with M. Masaro and A. Perez regardin same (0.5).		
Bane, Abraham	05/05/21	1.5	Review and revise pilot severance motion (1.3); correspondence with M. Masaro regarding same (0.2).		
Masaro, Matthew Bruno	05/05/21	2.8	Correspondence with Aeroméxico and others regarding pilot severance motion (1.1); review and revise same (0.9); review and revise declarations in support of same (0.8).		
Piraino, Stephen D.	05/05/21	0.7	Review and revise pilot severance motion.		
Bane, Abraham	05/06/21		Correspondence with S. Piraino regarding pilot severance motion (0.2); revise same (0.4).		
Bane, Abraham	05/07/21	0.3	Correspondence with T. Graulich regarding pilot severance motion (0.2); correspondence with S. Piraino regarding same (0.1).		
Masaro, Matthew Bruno	05/10/21	0.6	Correspondence with A. Bane and others regarding pilot severance motion (0.1); correspondence with AlixPartners ar others regarding same (0.5).		
Masaro, Matthew Bruno	05/11/21	0.3	Review and revise pilot severance motion (0.1); correspondence with S. Piraino and others regarding same (0.2).		
Piraino, Stephen D. Masaro, Matthew Bruno	05/11/21 05/12/21	0.4 0.8	Email with AlixPartners regarding pilot severance motion. Review and revise pilot severance motion (0.4); correspondence with AlixPartners and others regarding same (0.4).		
Piraino, Stephen D.	05/12/21	0.4	Correspondence with M. Masaro regarding pilot severance motion.		
Graulich, Timothy Masaro, Matthew Bruno	05/13/21 05/13/21	1.2 1.7	Review and comment on pilot severance motion. Review and revise pilot severance motion (1.0); correspondence with AlixPartners, S. Piraino, others regarding		

	Time Detail By Project				
Name	Date	Hours	Narrative		
Melcer, Moshe Masaro, Matthew Bruno	05/13/21 05/14/21	2.3 6.0	same (0.7). Review and revise pilot severance motion. Review and revise pilot severance motion (1.5); review and revise declarations in support of same (1.4); correspondence with A. Schwartz regarding same (1.0); correspondence with S. Piraino, AlixPartners, A. Sainz, Aeroméxico, and others		
Melcer, Moshe Piraino, Stephen D.	05/14/21 05/14/21	0.7 1.8	regarding same and FTI diligence (2.1). Review and revise pilot severance motion. Extensive correspondence with M. Masaro, A. Perez and others regarding pilot severance motion.		
Masaro, Matthew Bruno	05/15/21	1.0	Review and revise pilot severance motion (0.8); correspondence with S. Piraino and others regarding same (0.2).		
Masaro, Matthew Bruno	05/16/21	2.6	Call with A. Schwartz, A. Sainz, and S. Piraino regarding pilot severance motion (1.0); review and revise same (1.1); correspondence with S. Piraino, Aeroméxico, AlixPartners, and others regarding same (0.5).		
Piraino, Stephen D.	05/16/21	1.4	Call with A. Schwartz, A. Sainz and M. Masaro regarding pilot severance motion (1.0); correspondence with M. Masaro regarding same (0.4).		
Graulich, Timothy	05/17/21	2.3	Correspondence with E. Jerrard and M. Masaro regarding pilot severance motion (0.6); review and revise pilot severance motion (1.7).		
Jerrard, Erik	05/17/21	0.9	Correspondence with T. Graulich and M. Masaro regarding pilot severance motion (0.6); analyze same (0.3).		
Masaro, Matthew Bruno	05/17/21	1.7	Review and revise pilot severance motion (1.0); correspondence with AlixPartners, Aeroméxico, Sainz Abogados, and others regarding same (0.7).		
Masaro, Matthew Bruno	05/18/21	1.1	Review and revise pilot severance motion (0.8); correspondence with S. Piraino, O. Altman, and others regarding same (0.3).		
Piraino, Stephen D.	05/18/21	1.3	Correspondence with T. Graulich regarding compensation issue (0.3); correspondence with M. Masaro regarding same (0.3); correspondence with T. Graulich and S. Presser regarding union issue (0.7).		
Masaro, Matthew Bruno	05/20/21	0.7	Research plan provision precedents regarding MIP issues (0.6); correspondence with S. Piraino regarding same (0.1).		
Masaro, Matthew Bruno	05/24/21	0.3	Correspondence with A. Schwartz and S. Piraino regarding pilot severance motion diligence.		
Piraino, Stephen D.	05/24/21	0.4	Correspondence with M. Masaro and A. Schwartz regarding pilot severance motion diligence.		
Masaro, Matthew Bruno	05/25/21	1.3	Call with S. Piraino and AlixPartners regarding pilot severance motion (0.4); review court orders regarding same (0.3); correspondence with E. Jerrard and S. Piraino regarding same (0.6).		
Piraino, Stephen D.	05/25/21	0.4	Call with M. Masaro and AlixPartners regarding pilot severance motion.		
Masaro, Matthew Bruno	05/26/21	0.7	Draft diligence questions regarding pilot severance motion (0.5); correspondence with AlixPartners and others regarding same (0.2).		
Total AM180 Employ Issues	ee/Pension	47.7			
AM190 Financing Florack, James A.	05/03/21	0.5	Correspondence from Davis Polk Finance team regarding		

Time Detail By Project			
Name	Date	Hours	Narrative
Ford, Stephen	05/03/21	6.2	financing issues. Call with E. Jerrard regarding Non-Disclosure Agreement issues (0.6); review and revise Non-Disclosure Agreements (2.6); research issues regarding same (3.0).
Graulich, Timothy	05/03/21	0.7	Call with A. Conesa and R. Sanchez Baker regarding exit financing.
Jerrard, Erik	05/03/21	4.3	Call with S. Ford regarding Non-Disclosure Agreement issues (0.6); email with same regarding same (1.1); review revised drafts of exit financing Non-Disclosure Agreement (2.6).
Piraino, Stephen D.	05/03/21	0.7	Attend daily contingency update call with Aeroméxico and Rothschild.
Troconis, Adela	05/03/21	0.7	Attend daily contingency update call with Aeroméxico and Rothschild.
Ford, Stephen	05/04/21	7.4	Review and provide comments regarding Non-Disclosure Agreements (4.8); research regarding same (2.0); correspondence with E. Jerrard regarding same (0.2); correspondence with Rothschild team regarding same (0.2); call with S. Haq regarding same (0.2).
Jerrard, Erik	05/04/21	4.3	Review and revise exit financing Non-Disclosure Agreements (2.6); email with S. Ford regarding same (1.1); email with Rothschild regarding issues related to same (0.6).
Piraino, Stephen D.	05/04/21	0.6	Attend daily contingency update call with Aeroméxico and Rothschild.
Troconis, Adela	05/04/21	0.6	Attend daily contingency update call with Aeroméxico and Rothschild.
Cheng, Eric Y.	05/05/21	1.2	Review assignment and acceptance agreement (0.5); email with A. Troconis regarding notice of confirmation (0.4); email with advisors regarding same (0.3).
Florack, James A.	05/05/21	0.5	Attend daily contingency update call with Aeroméxico and Rothschild (partial attendance).
Ford, Stephen	05/05/21	7.4	
Jerrard, Erik	05/05/21	2.6	Correspondence with S. Ford regarding exit financing Non-Disclosure Agreement issues (0.9); call with same and Rothschild regarding same (0.5); review and revise Non-Disclosure Agreements (1.2).
Piraino, Stephen D.	05/05/21	0.9	Attend daily contingency update call with Aeroméxico and Rothschild.
Troconis, Adela	05/05/21	1.7	Attend daily contingency update call with Aeroméxico and Rothschild (0.9); correspondence with R. Steinberg regarding stipulation implication on DIP Credit Agreement (0.5); correspondence with R. Steinberg regarding loyalty program stipulations (0.3).
Florack, James A. Ford, Stephen	05/06/21 05/06/21	0.8 9.0	Review financing transaction consent documents. Review and comment on exit financing Non-Disclosure Agreements (5.8); research issues regarding same (2.0); correspondence with E. Jerrard regarding same (0.4); call wit S. Haq regarding same (0.1); further correspondence with E. Jerrard regarding same (0.4); correspondence with Rothschild regarding same (0.3).
Graulich, Timothy	05/06/21	0.8	Attend daily contingency update call with Aeroméxico and Rothschild.
Jerrard, Erik	05/06/21	5.0	Call with A. Troconis and S. Alessio Robles regarding Mexica law consents (0.3); call with counsel to stakeholder regarding

		Time	Detail By Project
Name	Date	Hours	Narrative
			Non-Disclosure Agreements (0.3); call with S. Haq regarding same (0.2); analyze revised drafts of Non-Disclosure Agreement and related issues (3.9); email with Aeroméxico regarding same (0.3).
Piraino, Stephen D.	05/06/21	1.1	Attend daily contingency update call with Aeroméxico and Rothschild (0.9); correspondence with Sainz Abogados regarding financing issues (0.2).
Troconis, Adela	05/06/21	0.3	Correspondence with S. Piraino, E. Jerrard, and S. Alessio regarding assignment of DIP loans.
Ford, Stephen	05/07/21	7.4	Review and comment on exit financing Non-Disclosure Agreements (3.7); research issues regarding same (2.3); cal with E. Jerrard regarding same (0.6); email with same regarding same (0.4); correspondence with Rothschild regarding same (0.2); call with S. Haq regarding same (0.2).
Jerrard, Erik	05/07/21	8.0	Correspondence with S. Ford regarding Non-Disclosure Agreement issues (0.9); call with same regarding same (1.3) review Non-Disclosure Agreements received from various parties (4.1); email with Rothschild regarding Non-Disclosure Agreements (0.6); research relating to Non-Disclosure Agreement leasing issues (1.1).
Piraino, Stephen D.	05/07/21	1.0	Attend daily contingency update call with Aeroméxico and Rothschild.
Troconis, Adela	05/07/21	1.0	Attend daily contingency update call with Aeroméxico and Rothschild.
Jerrard, Erik	05/09/21	2.4	Review and revise Non-Disclosure Agreements (0.9); correspondence with Skyworks regarding Non-Disclosure Agreement language (0.6); research issues regarding leases in Non-Disclosure Agreement (0.9).
Cheng, Eric Y.	05/10/21	0.4	Correspondence with Aeroméxico regarding assignment agreement.
Florack, James A. Ford, Stephen	05/10/21 05/10/21	0.5 8.8	Review financing documents. Call with E. Jerrard regarding exit financing Non-Disclosure Agreements (0.7); call with same and D. Martinez regarding same (0.2); call with potential exit lender regarding same (0. correspondence with Davis Polk team regarding execution o same (0.2); review and comment on exit financing Non-Disclosure Agreements (4.8); research issues regarding sam (2.5); correspondence with Aeroméxico regarding same (0.1)
Jerrard, Erik	05/10/21	6.0	correspondence with Rothschild regarding same (0.2). Call with potential exit lender regarding Non-Disclosure Agreement (0.9); email with counsel to stakeholder regarding Non-Disclosure Agreement (0.4); review and revise Non-Disclosure Agreement (1.1); email with T. Graulich regarding Non-Disclosure Agreement (0.7); call with D. Martinez and S Ford regarding same (0.2); email with Rothschild team regarding Non-Disclosure Agreements (0.8); call with S. Ford regarding same (0.7); email with same regarding same (1.2).
Piraino, Stephen D.	05/10/21	0.6	regarding same (0.7); email with same regarding same (1.2) Attend daily contingency update call with Aeroméxico and Rothschild.
Troconis, Adela	05/10/21	0.5	Attend daily contingency update call with Aeroméxico and Rothschild.
Cheng, Eric Y. Florack, James A.	05/11/21 05/11/21	0.2 0.7	Email with advisors regarding engine purchase. Attend daily contingency update call with Aeroméxico and
Ford, Stephen	05/11/21	11.3	Rothschild (partial attendance). Call with T. Graulich, E. Jerrard, S. Piraino, A. Troconis, and others regarding equity conversion (1.3); review and

		Time	Detail By Project
Name	Date	Hours	Narrative
			extensively comment on exit financing Non-Disclosure Agreement (6.0); review Non-Disclosure Agreement precedent (2.0); correspondence with E. Jerrard regarding same (0.4); correspondence with Aeroméxico regarding same (0.1); call with potential lender counsel and others regarding potential exit financing lender Non-Disclosure Agreement (1.0); call with E. Jerrard and potential stakeholder regarding Non-Disclosure Agreement (0.2); correspondence with S. Haq and Rothschild team regarding same (0.3).
Graulich, Timothy	05/11/21	1.3	Call with A. Troconis, S. Piraino, E. Jerrard, S. Ford, and others regarding equity conversion.
Jerrard, Erik	05/11/21	5.0	Call with T. Graulich, S. Piraino, S. Ford, A. Troconis, and others regarding equity conversion (1.3); call with S. Ford and potential stakeholder regarding Non-Disclosure Agreement (0.2); correspondence with S. Ford regarding Non-Disclosure Agreement issues (0.3); call with potential stakeholder regarding Non-Disclosure Agreement (0.1); call with counsel to exit financing provider relating to same (0.3); review and revise Non-Disclosure Agreement (2.3); email with Rothschild regarding same (0.5).
Piraino, Stephen D.	05/11/21	2.3	Attend daily contingency update call with Aeroméxico and Rothschild (1.0); call with T. Graulich, E. Jerrard, S. Ford, A. Troconis, and others regarding equity conversion (1.3).
Troconis, Adela	05/11/21	2.3	Attend daily contingency update call with Aeroméxico and Rothschild (1.0); call with T. Graulich, S. Piraino, and E. Jerrard regarding equity conversion (1.3).
Cheng, Eric Y.	05/12/21	0.4	Call with Rothschild and A. Troconis regarding assignment of DIP loans (0.2); email with A. Troconis regarding same (0.2).
Ford, Stephen	05/12/21	6.1	Review and extensively revise exit financing Non-Disclosure Agreements (5.1); email with E. Jerrard regarding same (0.4); call with same regarding same (0.3); correspondence with Rothschild regarding same (0.3).
Graulich, Timothy	05/12/21	0.9	Call with A. Conesa and R. Sanchez Baker regarding exit financing.
Jerrard, Erik	05/12/21	2.4	Call with S. Ford regarding Non-Disclosure Agreements (0.3); email with Rothschild process regarding same (0.6); review comments to form Non-Disclosure Agreements from stakeholder (1.4); email with counsel to stakeholder regarding Non-Disclosure Agreement (0.1).
Piraino, Stephen D.	05/12/21	0.6	Attend daily contingency update call with Aeroméxico and Rothschild.
Troconis, Adela	05/12/21	1.0	Attend daily contingency update call with Aeroméxico and Rothschild (0.6); correspondence with E. Cheng regarding assignment of DIP loans (0.2); call with Rothschild and E. Cheng regarding same (0.2).
Cheng, Eric Y.	05/13/21	1.2	Email with agent regarding lender registry (0.4); email with Rothschild regarding DIP issue (0.4); email with A. Troconis regarding same (0.4).
Florack, James A.	05/13/21	0.7	Correspondence with Davis Polk Finance team regarding DIP financing issues.
Ford, Stephen	05/13/21	2.0	Review and revise exit financing Non-Disclosure Agreements (1.1); correspondence with E Jerrard regarding same (0.4); correspondence with Rothschild team regarding same (0.2); call with Davis Polk team regarding Aeroméxico execution of Non-Disclosure Agreements (0.3).
Jerrard, Erik	05/13/21	1.6	Correspondence with Rothschild and Davis Polk Restructuring 23

	Time Detail By Project			
Name	Date	Hours	Narrative	
			team regarding exit financing process (0.6); attend weekly update call with Apollo advisors (0.3) (partial attendance); email with Rothschild regarding Non-Disclosure Agreement process (0.7).	
Piraino, Stephen D.	05/13/21	1.6	Correspondence with Rothschild regarding exit financing (0.8); attend weekly update call with Apollo advisors (0.8).	
Troconis, Adela	05/13/21	0.8	Attend daily contingency update call with Aeroméxico and Rothschild (0.5); attend weekly update call with Apollo advisors (0.3).	
Cheng, Eric Y.	05/14/21	1.4	Review lender registry (0.8); email with agent regarding same (0.3); email with Rothschild regarding same (0.3).	
Ford, Stephen	05/14/21	4.2	Review and revise exit financing Non-Disclosure Agreements (3.3); correspondence with E. Jerrard regarding same (0.6); correspondence with Rothschild regarding same (0.2); correspondence with Aeroméxico regarding same (0.1).	
Graulich, Timothy	05/14/21	3.2	Call with PLM regarding exit financing issues (0.5); call with A. Conesa and R. Sanchez Baker regarding exit financing (0.8); participate in restructuring committee call regarding same	
Hirakawa, Lisa	05/14/21	0.3	(1.2); call with potential exit investors regarding same (0.7). Correspondence with Aeroméxico regarding exit financing Non-Disclosure Agreement	
Jerrard, Erik	05/14/21	1.4	Call with stakeholder regarding exit financing process (0.9); call with Rothschild, PLM, and Davis Polk Restructuring team	
Piraino, Stephen D.	05/14/21	2.3	regarding exit financing process (0.5). Call with stakeholder regarding exit financing process (0.9); call with Rothschild, PLM, and Davis Polk Restructuring team regarding same (0.5); correspondence with R. Arnold regarding same (0.2); attend daily contingency update call with Aeroméxico and Rothschild (0.7).	
Jerrard, Erik	05/16/21	1.6	Analyze equity conversion schedule in response to stakeholder inquiry.	
Cheng, Eric Y.	05/17/21	0.6	Email with Sainz Abogados regarding folios mercantiles (0.2); email with agent regarding same (0.2); email with Cleary Gottlieb regarding same (0.2).	
Ford, Stephen	05/17/21	11.2	Review and revise exit financing Non-Disclosure Agreements (6.4); research precedent regarding same (2.3); correspondence with M. Landess and Rothschild regarding same (0.6); call with E. Jerrard regarding Non-Disclosure Agreements issues (0.3); email with same regarding same (0.6); call with S. Haq regarding same (0.4); call with potential financing party regarding same (0.4); call with potential financing party regarding same (0.2).	
Graulich, Timothy	05/17/21	4.9	Call with A. Conesa and R. Sanchez Baker regarding exit financing process (1.5); review and revise presentation on exit financing for the Department of Justice (3.4).	
Hirakawa, Lisa	05/17/21	0.1	Correspondence with Aeroméxico regarding exit financing Non-Disclosure Agreement.	
Jerrard, Erik	05/17/21	0.8	Call with S. Ford regarding Non-Disclosure Agreements issues (0.3); analyze Non-Disclosure Agreement comments (0.4); email with counsel to stakeholder regarding same (0.1).	
Piraino, Stephen D.	05/17/21	1.8	Attend daily contingency update call with Aeroméxico and Rothschild (1.0); correspondence with potential financing party (0.8).	
Troconis, Adela	05/17/21	1.0	Attend daily contingency update call with Aeroméxico and Rothschild.	
Florack, James A.	05/18/21	8.0	Review DIP financing issues.	

	Time Detail By Project			
Name	Date	Hours	Narrative	
Ford, Stephen	05/18/21	3.5	Review and revise exit financing Non-Disclosure Agreements (2.5); correspondence with E. Jerrard regarding same (0.3); correspondence with Rothschild and Skyworks regarding same (0.6); correspondence with Aeroméxico regarding same (0.1).	
Graulich, Timothy	05/18/21	4.1	Call with stakeholder, E. Jerrard, and S. Piraino regarding potential exit financing opportunities (0.6); call with stakeholder regarding claim sale and exit status (0.5); review and revise presentation on exit for the Department of Justice (3.0).	
Jerrard, Erik	05/18/21	1.8	Correspondence with S. Ford regarding Non-Disclosure Agreement issues (0.3); email with stakeholders regarding same (0.3); research issues regarding same and claims trading (0.6); call with stakeholder, T. Graulich, and S. Piraino regarding potential exit financing opportunities (0.6).	
Piraino, Stephen D.	05/18/21	2.4	Attend daily contingency update call with Aeroméxico and Rothschild (1.1); email with Rothschild regarding process letter (0.1); correspondence with E. Jerrard and T. Graulich regarding financing (0.6); call with same and stakeholder regarding potential exit financing opportunities (0.6).	
Troconis, Adela	05/18/21	1.0	Attend daily contingency update call with Aeroméxico and Rothschild.	
Ford, Stephen	05/19/21	4.7	Review and revise exit financing Non-Disclosure Agreements (4.0); correspondence with potential financing party regarding same (0.1); call with Davis Polk team regarding execution of same (0.1); correspondence with Aeroméxico regarding same (0.1); call with E. Jerrard regarding Non-Disclosure Agreement issues (0.2); correspondence with Rothschild regarding same (0.2).	
Graulich, Timothy	05/19/21	3.6	Call with A. Conesa and R. Sanchez Baker regarding exit financing (0.7); call with potential exit financing provider and E Jerrard regarding exit financing (0.8); review credit agreement (0.8); review and comment on presentation on exit for the Department of Justice (1.3).	
Hirakawa, Lisa	05/19/21	0.5	Correspondence with Aeroméxico regarding exit financing Non-Disclosure Agreement.	
Jerrard, Erik	05/19/21	2.5	Call with potential exit financing provider and T. Graulich regarding exit financing (0.8); review credit agreement schedule in preparation for same (0.4); call with S. Ford regarding Non-Disclosure Agreement issues (0.2); email with Creditors Committee regarding same (0.4); call with S. Piraino regarding same (0.2); email with potential financing party regarding same (0.5).	
Piraino, Stephen D.	05/19/21	2.8	Call with potential financing party regarding exit financing (1.1); prepare for same (0.3); correspondence with T. Goren regarding exit financing Non-Disclosure Agreement (0.2); call with E. Jerrard regarding same (0.2); attend daily contingency update call with Aeroméxico and Rothschild (1.0).	
Troconis, Adela	05/19/21	0.9	Attend daily contingency update call with Aeroméxico and Rothschild.	
Ford, Stephen	05/20/21	6.4	Review and revise exit financing Non-Disclosure Agreements (4.5); review precedent regarding same (1.0); correspondence with E. Jerrard regarding same (0.2); correspondence with potential financing party regarding same (0.1); correspondence with potential financing party regarding same (0.2); correspondence with Aeroméxico regarding exit	

		Time	Detail By Project
Name	Date	Hours	Narrative
			financing Non-Disclosure Agreements (0.1); correspondence
Hirakawa, Lisa	05/20/21	0.2	with Rothschild regarding same (0.3). Correspondence with Aeroméxico regarding exit financing
	05/00/04	0.0	Non-Disclosure Agreement.
Jerrard, Erik	05/20/21	2.2	Email with S. Ford regarding Non-Disclosure Agreement comments (0.4); review exit financing Non-Disclosure
			Agreements (1.6); correspondence with S. Ford regarding
Piraino, Stephen D.	05/20/21	1.0	same (0.2). Attend daily contingency update call with Aeroméxico and
r name, etephen b.	00/20/21	1.0	Rothschild.
Ford, Stephen	05/21/21	4.5	Review and revise exit financing Non-Disclosure Agreements (3.2); correspondence with Rothschild regarding same (0.3);
			email with E. Jerrard regarding same (0.3); call with same
			regarding same (0.2); correspondence with Davis Polk team regarding execution of Non-Disclosure Agreements (0.2);
			correspondence with Aeroméxico regarding same (0.1);
Graulich, Timothy	05/21/21	2.8	correspondence with third-party counsel regarding same (0.2 Call with potential investors regarding exit financing.
Hirakawa, Lisa	05/21/21	0.4	Prepare exit financing Non-Disclosure Agreements for
Laurend Falls	05/04/04	4.4	execution.
Jerrard, Erik	05/21/21	1.4	Call with S. Ford regarding Non-Disclosure Agreement issues (0.2); email with potential exit financing provider regarding
			same (0.9); email with S. Ford regarding Non-Disclosure
Piraino, Stephen D.	05/21/21	1.1	Agreement (0.3). Attend daily contingency update call with Aeroméxico and
T Italito, Otophon D.	03/21/21	1.1	Rothschild (0.5); call with potential financing party regarding
Ohana Fria V	05/04/04	0.0	exit financing (0.6).
Cheng, Eric Y.	05/24/21	0.6	Email with Sainz Abogados regarding RAM lien searches (0.3); email with Cleary Gottlieb regarding same (0.3).
Ford, Stephen	05/24/21	3.3	Review and revise exit financing Non-Disclosure Agreements
			(2.9); correspondence with Rothschild regarding same (0.2); correspondence with E. Jerrard regarding same (0.2).
Jerrard, Erik	05/24/21	4.1	Attend management meeting with potential exit financing
			parties (1.7); call with potential exit financing party counsel
			regarding same (0.2); email with T. Graulich regarding cleansing material for exit financing process (0.6);
			correspondence with S. Piraino regarding same (0.3); email
			with S. Ford regarding exit financing issues (0.5); review exit financing Non-Disclosure Agreement (0.8).
Piraino, Stephen D.	05/24/21	0.6	Attend daily contingency update call with Aeroméxico and
Ford, Stephen	05/25/21	4.2	Rothschild. Review and revise exit financing Non-Disclosure Agreements
rora, otopnon	00/20/21	7.2	(3.3); correspondence with E. Jerrard regarding same (0.1);
			correspondence with Rothschild regarding same (0.1); call
			with R. Arnold regarding same (0.1); correspondence with S. Haq regarding same (0.4); correspondence with Davis Polk
			team regarding same (0.1); correspondence with Aeroméxico
Graulich, Timothy	05/25/21	1.6	regarding same (0.1). Call with H. Parkhill and L. Donahue regarding exit financing
Craumon, minotily	00,20,21	1.0	process (0.7); call with A. Conesa and R. Sanchez Baker
Jorrand Crit	05/05/04	0.0	regarding same (0.9).
Jerrard, Erik	05/25/21	0.6	Email with Rothschild regarding exit financing analysis (0.5); call with S. Ford regarding Non-Disclosure Agreement issues
			(0.1).
Piraino, Stephen D.	05/25/21	0.5	Attend daily contingency update call with Aeroméxico and

	Time Detail By Project				
Name	Date	Hours	Narrative		
Troconis, Adela	05/25/21	0.5	Rothschild. Attend daily contingency update call with Aeroméxico and		
Ford, Stephen	05/26/21	1.5	Rothschild. Review and revise exit financing Non-Disclosure Agreements (0.9); call with counsel to potential exit provider regarding		
			same (0.1); correspondence with Rothschild regarding same (0.1); call with third-party counsel regarding Non-Disclosure Agreement (0.2); correspondence with Davis Polk team regarding execution of same (0.2).		
Graulich, Timothy	05/26/21	1.0	Call with A. Conesa and R. Sanchez Baker regarding exit financing process.		
Jerrard, Erik	05/26/21	1.9	Review confidentiality provisions of DIP Credit Agreement (0.6); email with Rothschild team regarding same (0.7); review exit financing Non-Disclosure Agreement issues (0.6).		
Piraino, Stephen D.	05/26/21	1.0	Attend daily contingency update call with Aeroméxico and Rothschild.		
Troconis, Adela	05/26/21	1.0	Attend daily contingency update call with Aeroméxico and Rothschild.		
Ford, Stephen	05/27/21	2.2	Review and revise exit financing Non-Disclosure Agreements (1.8); correspondence with third-party counsel regarding same (0.1); correspondence with Aeroméxico regarding same (0.2); correspondence with Rothschild regarding same (0.1).		
Graulich, Timothy	05/27/21	1.5	Call with potential investor regarding participation in exit financing (0.8); call with Cleary Gottlieb regarding issues regarding same (0.7).		
Jerrard, Erik	05/27/21	2.7	Call with potential financing party regarding potential exit financing (0.9); correspondence with S. Ford regarding Non-Disclosure Agreement issues (0.2); call with M. Melcer regarding exit financing issues (0.1); email with same regarding same (0.4); review precedent regarding same (0.6); attend weekly update call with Apollo advisors (0.5).		
Melcer, Moshe	05/27/21	0.7	Research exit financing issues (0.6); call with E. Jerrard regarding same (0.1).		
Piraino, Stephen D.	05/27/21	1.3	Attend daily contingency update call with Aeroméxico and Rothschild (0.5); attend weekly update call with Apollo advisors (0.5); email with T. Graulich regarding financing issues (0.3).		
Troconis, Adela	05/27/21	1.0	Attend daily contingency update call with Aeroméxico and Rothschild.		
Ford, Stephen	05/28/21	3.3	Review and revise exit financing Non-Disclosure Agreements (2.7); correspondence with Rothschild and Skyworks regarding exit financing Non-Disclosure Agreements (0.5); call with E. Jerrard regarding same (0.1).		
Graulich, Timothy	05/28/21	1.1	Call with A. Conesa and R. Sanchez Baker regarding exit financing (0.7); call with counsel to potential investor regarding potential investor proposal (0.4).		
Jerrard, Erik	05/28/21	1.6	Review exit financing Non-Disclosure Agreements and comments thereto (1.5); call with S. Ford regarding same (0.1).		
Piraino, Stephen D.	05/28/21	0.8	Email with Davis Polk Finance team regarding DIP credit agreement (0.2); attend daily contingency update call with Aeroméxico and Rothschild (0.6).		
Troconis, Adela	05/28/21	0.6	Attend daily contingency update call with Aeroméxico and Rothschild.		
Graulich, Timothy	05/29/21	0.9	Call with A. Conesa, R. Sanchez Baker and H. Parkhill regarding exit financing proposal.		

	Time Detail By Project				
Name	Date	Hours	Narrative		
Total AM190 Financir	ng	259.8			
AM200 General Case Administration					
Bane, Abraham	05/02/21	0.7	Revise interim fee order (0.6); correspondence with E. Jerrard regarding same (0.1).		
Giddens, Magali	05/04/21	1.1	Correspondence with J. Sturm regarding Boeing Hearing transcript (0.1); correspondence with Veritext regarding same (0.1); correspondence with R. Steinberg regarding same (0.1); correspondence with Davis Polk Restructuring team regarding same (0.2); review transcript regarding same (0.4); review docket filings (0.2).		
Jerrard, Erik	05/04/21	1.8	Prepare for weekly workstreams call with Davis Polk Restructuring team.		
Melcer, Moshe	05/04/21	0.2	Review and revise case status update.		
Sturm, Josh	05/04/21	0.2	Correspondence with M. Giddens and others regarding Boeing Hearing transcript.		
Bane, Abraham	05/05/21	1.2	Attend weekly workstreams call with Davis Polk Restructuring team (1.0); prepare for same (0.2).		
Ford, Stephen	05/05/21	1.0	Attend weekly workstreams call with Davis Polk Restructuring team.		
Graulich, Timothy	05/05/21	1.0	Attend weekly workstreams call with Davis Polk Restructuring team.		
Jerrard, Erik	05/05/21	1.3	Attend weekly workstreams call with Davis Polk Restructuring team (1.0); email with M. Melcer regarding same (0.3)		
Melcer, Moshe	05/05/21	1.5	Attend weekly workstreams call with Davis Polk Restructuring team (1.0); review and revise case status summary (0.4); review notices of appearance (0.1).		
Piraino, Stephen D.	05/05/21	1.3	Attend weekly workstreams call with Davis Polk Restructuring team (1.1); correspondence with Chambers regarding submission (0.2).		
Steinberg, Richard J.	05/05/21	1.0	Attend weekly workstreams call with Davis Polk Restructuring team.		
Sturm, Josh	05/05/21	1.0	Attend weekly workstreams call with Davis Polk Restructuring team.		
Giddens, Magali	05/10/21	0.2	Review stipulation and protective order between Aeroméxico, Creditors Committee, and Delta.		
Altman, Olivia	05/11/21	0.3	File Notice of Filing of Location of Redacted Documents (0.2); correspondence with Epiq regarding same (0.1).		
Melcer, Moshe	05/11/21	0.2	Review and revise status update.		
Bane, Abraham	05/12/21	1.0	Attend weekly workstreams call with Davis Polk Restructuring team.		
Ford, Stephen	05/12/21	0.9	Attend weekly workstreams call with Davis Polk Restructuring team.		
Graulich, Timothy	05/12/21	0.9	Correspondence with S. Piraino and E. Jerrard regarding workstreams.		
Jerrard, Erik	05/12/21	2.9	Attend weekly workstreams call with Davis Polk Restructuring team (1.0); prepare for same (1.7); correspondence with S. Piraino regarding case updates (0.2).		
Masaro, Matthew Bruno	05/12/21	1.0	Attend weekly workstreams call with Davis Polk Restructuring team.		
Melcer, Moshe	05/12/21	1.2	Attend weekly workstreams call with Davis Polk Restructuring team (1.0); follow-up update to case status summary (0.2).		
Piraino, Stephen D.	05/12/21	1.0	Attend weekly workstreams call with Davis Polk Restructuring team.		
Steinberg, Richard J.	05/12/21	1.0	Attend weekly workstreams call with Davis Polk Restructuring		

Time Detail By Project				
Name	Date	Hours	Narrative	
			team.	
Sturm, Josh	05/12/21	1.0	Attend weekly workstreams call with Davis Polk Restructurin team.	
Giddens, Magali	05/13/21	0.4	Review docket filings.	
Piraino, Stephen D.	05/13/21	0.6	Attend daily contingency update call with Aeroméxico and	
A.I	05/44/04	0.5	Rothschild.	
Altman, Olivia	05/14/21	0.5	File objection to PLM motion and R. Sanchez Baker and T. Graulich declarations in support of same (0.4);	
			correspondence with R. Steinberg regarding same (0.1).	
Jerrard, Erik	05/14/21	0.3	Review monthly operating report.	
Altman, Olivia	05/17/21	0.4	File Certificates of No Objection for GAP, ASUR and AICM & OMA motions.	
Masaro, Matthew	05/17/21	1.2	Correspondence with T. Graulich, E. Jerrard, and others	
Bruno			regarding monthly operating report (0.3); review and revise Certificates of No Objection for airport assumption motions (0.7); correspondence with T. Graulich and S. Piraino	
Diraina Stanban D	05/17/01	0.2	regarding same (0.2). Call with Chambers regarding scheduling.	
Piraino, Stephen D. Altman, Olivia	05/17/21 05/18/21	0.2 1.0	File pilot severance motion (0.3); correspondence with Epiq regarding same (0.1); file Certificates of No Objection (0.5); correspondence with Epiq regarding same (0.1).	
Jerrard, Erik	05/18/21	0.9	Review Certificates of No Objection for claims objection (0.4	
			correspondence with T. Graulich and S. Piraino regarding case status (0.5).	
Melcer, Moshe	05/18/21	0.2	Review and revise case update.	
Bane, Abraham	05/19/21	1.6	Attend weekly workstreams call with Davis Polk Restructurin team (1.0); draft notice of adjournment of May 21 Hearing (0.4); correspondence with S. Piraino regarding same (0.1); coordinate filing of same (0.1).	
Dekhtyar, Mariya	05/19/21	0.1	Attend weekly workstreams call with Davis Polk Restructurin team (partial attendance).	
Ford, Stephen	05/19/21	0.5	Attend weekly workstreams call with Davis Polk Restructurin	
Giddens, Magali	05/19/21	0.8	team (partial attendance). File notice of adjournment of May 21 Hearing (0.1); correspondence with A. Bane regarding same (0.1);	
			correspondence with Epiq regarding same (0.1); review	
Graulich, Timothy	05/19/21	0.9	docket filings (0.5). Attend weekly workstreams call with Davis Polk Restructurin	
Gradition, Timothy	00/ 13/2 l	0.9	team.	
Green, Thomas S.	05/19/21	0.5	Attend weekly workstreams call with Davis Polk Restructurin	
Jerrard, Erik	05/19/21	2.0	team (partial attendance). Attend weekly workstreams call with Davis Polk Restructurin	
			team (1.0); email with M. Melcer regarding same (0.3); revie case management order regarding case timing (0.4); email	
			with J. Barsalona regarding same (0.3).	
Masaro, Matthew	05/19/21	1.0	Attend weekly workstreams call with Davis Polk Restructurin	
Bruno Melcer, Moshe	05/19/21	1.2	team. Attend weekly workstreams call with Davis Polk Restructurin	
5.551, 14100110	00, 10,21	1.2	team (1.0); update case status summary following same (0.2	
Piraino, Stephen D.	05/19/21	0.9	Attend weekly workstreams call with Davis Polk Restructurin team.	
Steinberg, Richard J.	05/19/21	1.0	Attend weekly workstreams call with Davis Polk Restructuring team.	
Sturm, Josh	05/19/21	0.5	Attend weekly workstreams call with Davis Polk Restructurin team (partial attendance).	

		Time	Detail By Project
Name	Date	Hours	Narrative
Altman, Olivia	05/20/21	0.3	Correspondence with Epiq regarding service of assumption order.
Jerrard, Erik	05/20/21	0.5	Email with T. Graulich regarding case scheduling (0.2); email with J. Barsalona regarding same (0.3).
Piraino, Stephen D.	05/20/21	0.2	Correspondence with E. Jerrard regarding case updates
Altman, Olivia	05/21/21	0.9	File status report (0.2); correspondence with Davis Polk team regarding same (0.3); review docket (0.4).
Altman, Olivia	05/24/21	0.3	Review docket updates.
Giddens, Magali	05/24/21	0.3	Correspondence with Davis Polk team regarding filing notice of scheduled omnibus hearings on docket (0.1); file same (0.2).
Jerrard, Erik	05/24/21	1.1	Email with AlixPartners and M. Masaro regarding monthly operating reports (0.4); email with Chambers regarding omnibus hearing scheduling (0.3); coordinate noticing of sam (0.4).
Masaro, Matthew Bruno	05/24/21	0.4	Review monthly operating report rule change (0.3); correspondence with AlixPartners and others regarding same (0.1).
Melcer, Moshe	05/24/21	0.3	Draft notice of omnibus hearing.
Jerrard, Erik	05/25/21	1.5	Prepare for weekly workstreams call with Davis Polk Restructuring team.
Masaro, Matthew Bruno	05/25/21	0.2	Correspondence with AlixPartners and others regarding monthly operating report.
Melcer, Moshe	05/25/21	0.6	Review and revise case status summary.
Piraino, Stephen D.	05/25/21	0.2	Correspondence with R. Steinberg regarding case workstreams.
Bane, Abraham	05/26/21	1.1	Attend weekly workstreams call with Davis Polk Restructuring team.
Ford, Stephen	05/26/21	1.0	Attend weekly workstreams call with Davis Polk Restructuring team.
Graulich, Timothy	05/26/21	1.0	Attend weekly workstreams call with Davis Polk Restructuring team.
Green, Thomas S.	05/26/21	1.0	Attend weekly workstreams call with Davis Polk Restructuring team.
Jerrard, Erik	05/26/21	2.2	Attend weekly workstreams call with Davis Polk Restructuring team (1.0); prepare for same (0.9); email with M. Melcer regarding same (0.3).
Masaro, Matthew Bruno	05/26/21	1.1	Attend weekly workstreams call with Davis Polk Restructuring team (1.0); correspondence with S. Piraino regarding same (0.1).
Melcer, Moshe	05/26/21	1.3	Attend weekly workstreams call with Davis Polk Restructuring team (1.0); review and revise case status summary (0.3).
Piraino, Stephen D.	05/26/21	0.7	Attend weekly workstreams call with Davis Polk Restructuring team (partial attendance).
Steinberg, Richard J.	05/26/21	1.0	Attend weekly workstreams call with Davis Polk Restructuring team.
Sturm, Josh	05/26/21	1.1	Attend weekly workstreams call with Davis Polk Restructuring team.
Erickson, Jarret	05/27/21	0.8	Correspondence with R. Steinberg regarding case workstreams.
Masaro, Matthew Bruno	05/28/21	1.0	Review and revise Certificate of No Objection for pilot severance motion (0.4); correspondence with A. Schwartz regarding same (0.2); correspondence with S. Piraino, Chambers, and others regarding same (0.4).
Piraino, Stephen D.	05/28/21	0.4	Chambers, and others regarding same (0.4). Correspondence with E. Jerrard regarding case workstreams 30

Time Detail By Project			
Name	Date	Hours	Narrative
			(0.2); correspondence with M. Masaro regarding same (0.2).
Melcer, Moshe	05/30/21	0.2	Review and revise summary of case status.
Masaro, Matthew	05/31/21	0.5	Review and revise notice of adjournment of May 21 Hearing
Bruno			(0.3); correspondence with S. Piraino and M. Giddens regarding same (0.2).
Total AM200 General Administration	Case	62.8	
AM210 Non-DPW Ret	ention and Fee	leeupe	
Bane, Abraham	05/03/21	1.0	Draft revised proposed interim fee order for Sainz Abogados
Bane, Abraham	00/00/21	1.0	(0.7); correspondence with E. Jerrard regarding same (0.2);
Jornard Erile	05/02/24	0.5	correspondence with Chambers regarding same (0.1).
Jerrard, Erik	05/03/21	0.5	Call with Sainz Abogados, Aeroméxico, and Morris Nichols
D: : 0: : -	05/00/04		regarding potential professional retention.
Piraino, Stephen D.	05/03/21	0.1	Call with J. Barsalona regarding retention issue.
Jerrard, Erik	05/07/21	0.2	Call with J. Barsalona and T. Thoroddsen regarding potential
			retention.
Masaro, Matthew	05/10/21	0.1	Correspondence with Aeroméxico regarding ordinary course
Bruno			retention.
Masaro, Matthew	05/11/21	0.1	Correspondence with Aeroméxico and others regarding
Bruno			ordinary course retention.
Bane, Abraham	05/12/21	0.7	Correspondence with E. Jerrard regarding potential retention
,			(0.3); review issues regarding same (0.4).
Jerrard, Erik	05/12/21	1.6	Call with professional counsel and Morris Nichols regarding
• - · · · · · · · · · · · · · · · · · ·			retention issues (0.4); analyze related issues (1.2).
Piraino, Stephen D.	05/12/21	0.6	Correspondence with E. Jerrard and others regarding
r mame, eteprion 2.	00/12/21	0.0	retention issues (0.2); call with professional counsel and
			Morris Nichols regarding same (0.4).
Masaro, Matthew	05/13/21	0.1	Correspondence with AlixPartners and ordinary course
Bruno	03/13/21	0.1	professional regarding retention of same.
Steinberg, Richard J.	05/13/21	0.6	Review potential retention application issues (0.5); email with
otelliberg, Nichard 5.	03/13/21	0.0	E. Jerrard regarding same (0.1).
Jerrard, Erik	05/14/21	1.1	Email with J. Barsalona regarding The Lee Group ("TLG")
Jenaiu, Enk	03/14/21	1.1	
			retention application (0.4); review TLG retention application
N	05/47/04	0.4	(0.7).
Masaro, Matthew	05/17/21	0.1	Correspondence with Aeroméxico regarding ordinary course
Bruno	05/40/04	0.5	professional retention.
Jerrard, Erik	05/18/21	0.5	Email with M. Melcer regarding potential retention issue.
Masaro, Matthew	05/18/21	0.2	Correspondence with Morris Nichols and Aeroméxico
Bruno			regarding ordinary course professional retention.
Melcer, Moshe	05/18/21	0.3	Review precedent auditor engagement letters.
Jerrard, Erik	05/19/21	0.3	Email with Davis Polk and Morris Nichols teams regarding
			potential retention.
Piraino, Stephen D.	05/19/21	0.5	Call with Morris Nichols regarding retention application.
Jerrard, Erik	05/20/21	1.1	Email with T. Graulich and S. Piraino regarding potential
			retention (0.7); analyze potential retention issues (0.4).
Jerrard, Erik	05/24/21	0.2	Email with A. Schwartz regarding TLG retention.
Masaro, Matthew	05/25/21	0.1	Correspondence with E. Jerrard regarding ordinary course
Bruno			professional retention.
Jerrard, Erik	05/26/21	0.6	Call with J. Barsalona regarding ordinary course professiona
	33.20.21	0.0	retention.
Masaro, Matthew	05/26/21	0.1	Correspondence with E. Jerrard and others regarding ordina
Bruno	30/20/2 I	0.1	course professional retention.
Jerrard, Erik	05/27/21	1.2	Correspondence with Davis Polk Restructuring team regardi

		Time	Detail By Project
Name	Date	Hours	Narrative
Masaro, Matthew Bruno	05/27/21	0.1	Correspondence with E. Jerrard and others regarding ordinary course professional retention.
Jerrard, Erik	05/28/21	1.1	Call with J. Barsalona, AlixPartners, and M. Masaro regarding ordinary course professional retention (0.8); call with D. DeBassio regarding monthly fee statements (0.3).
Masaro, Matthew Bruno	05/28/21	0.6	Call with J. Barsalona, AlixPartners, and E. Jerrard regarding ordinary course professional retention.
Total AM210 Non-DP and Fee Issues	W Retention	13.7	
AM230 Plan/Disclosu	ure Statement		
Bane, Abraham	05/03/21	0.9	Call with M. Masaro, S. Piraino, E. Jerrard, and AlixPartners regarding Plan (0.4); review presentation regarding same (0.5).
Jerrard, Erik	05/03/21	3.2	Call with A. Bane, M. Masaro, S. Piraino, and AlixPartners regarding Plan (0.4); call with Rothschild and AlixPartners team regarding same (0.6); analyze Plan structuring and creditor distribution issues and materials from AlixPartners related to same (1.0); correspondence with S. Piraino regarding Plan structuring and creditor distributions (0.4); analyze Plan developments (0.4); update Plan term sheet reflecting same (0.4).
Masaro, Matthew Bruno	05/03/21	1.5	Call with A. Bane S. Piraino, E. Jerrard and AlixPartners regarding Plan (0.4); review and revise Disclosure Statement (1.1).
Piraino, Stephen D.	05/03/21	0.4	Call with A. Bane, M. Masaro, E. Jerrard, and AlixPartners regarding Plan.
Bane, Abraham	05/04/21	4.4	Call with E. Jerrard, S. Piraino, R. Steinberg, S. Ford, and M. Masaro regarding Plan structuring and drafting (0.5); review case law regarding same (3.6); call with E. Jerrard regarding same (0.3).
Ford, Stephen	05/04/21	1.0	Call with M. Masaro, E. Jerrard, S. Piraino, and R. Steinberg regarding Plan Status (0.5); prepare for same (0.1); research issues regarding Plan term sheet (0.3); review and revise Plan term sheet (0.1).
Jerrard, Erik	05/04/21	4.1	Call with M. Masaro, S. Ford, S. Piraino and R. Steinberg regarding Plan status and drafting (0.5); prepare for same (0.6); call with A. Bane regarding Plan structuring and creditor distribution issues (0.4); review case law and secondary sources related to same (2.6).
Masaro, Matthew Bruno	05/04/21	8.0	Call with E. Jerrard and others regarding Plan and Disclosure Statement (0.5); correspondence with same regarding ballot and related disclosures (0.3).
Piraino, Stephen D.	05/04/21	0.5	Call with S. Ford, E. Jerrard and R. Steinberg regarding Plan status and drafting.
Steinberg, Richard J.	05/04/21	0.5	Call with M. Masaro, S. Ford, E. Jerrard and S. Piraino regarding Plan status and drafting.
Jerrard, Erik	05/05/21	1.7	Review and revise Plan term sheet.
Piraino, Stephen D.	05/07/21	2.1	Correspondence with T. Graulich regarding Plan issues (0.9); review and revise Disclosure Statement (1.2).
Graulich, Timothy	05/10/21	4.4	Call with A. Conesa and R. Sanchez Baker regarding Plan issues (0.8); review intercompany claims analysis (3.6).
Bane, Abraham	05/11/21	3.9	Call with S. Piraino, T. Graulich, E. Jerrard, S. Ford, and M. Masaro regarding Plan issues (0.4); call with E. Jerrard regarding Plan structuring and creditor distribution (0.3);

	Time Detail By Project			
Name	Date	Hours	Narrative	
Ford, Stephen	05/11/21	1.5	review and research case law regarding same (3.2). Call with A. Conesa and R. Sanchez Baker regarding Plan issues (1.1); call with R. Steinberg, E. Jerrard, T. Graulich, S. Piraino, and A. Bane regarding same (0.4).	
Graulich, Timothy	05/11/21	1.5	Call with A. Conesa and R. Sanchez Baker regarding Plan issues (1.1); call with R. Steinberg, S. Ford, S. Piraino, E. Jerrard, A. Bane, and M. Masaro regarding same (0.4).	
Jerrard, Erik	05/11/21	1.0	Call with A. Bane, S. Piraino, T. Graulich, S. Ford, and M. Masaro regarding Plan issues (0.4); prepare for same (0.3); call with A. Bane regarding Plan structuring and creditor distributions (0.3).	
Masaro, Matthew Bruno	05/11/21	0.5	Call with R. Steinberg, A. Bane, E. Jerrard, T. Graulich, S. Ford, and S. Piraino regarding Plan issues.	
Piraino, Stephen D.	05/11/21	0.2	Call with A. Bane, E. Jerrard, T. Graulich, S. Ford, and M. Masaro regarding Plan issues (partial attendance).	
Steinberg, Richard J.	05/11/21	0.7	Call with A. Bane, E. Jerrard, T. Graulich, S. Ford, and M. Masaro regarding Plan issues (0.4); prepare for same (0.3).	
Masaro, Matthew Bruno	05/12/21	0.2	Correspondence with Epiq and others regarding electronic voting for Plan solicitation.	
Bane, Abraham	05/13/21	1.8	Call with AlixPartners and Rothschild regarding Plan (0.8); review case law and presentation regarding same (1.0).	
Jerrard, Erik Piraino, Stephen D.	05/13/21 05/13/21	0.8 2.9	Call with AlixPartners and Rothschild regarding Plan. Call with AlixPartners and Rothschild regarding Plan (0.8);	
Altman, Olivia	05/18/21	1.5	review and research Plan issues (2.1). Research plan precedents (1.2); correspondence with M. Masaro regarding same (0.3).	
Masaro, Matthew Bruno	05/18/21	2.7	Correspondence with S. Piraino and others regarding Plan and Disclosure Statement (0.3); review precedents related to same (2.4).	
Steinberg, Richard J.	05/18/21	3.0	Review and revise Disclosure Statement (2.8); email with AlixPartners regarding same (0.2).	
Masaro, Matthew Bruno	05/19/21	2.8	Research plan provision precedents.	
Altman, Olivia	05/20/21	1.3	Research plan precedents.	
Graulich, Timothy Graulich, Timothy	05/20/21 05/24/21	0.3 0.7	Call with R. Cooper regarding Disclosure Statement. Call with A. Conesa and R. Sanchez Baker regarding exit financing.	
Jerrard, Erik	05/24/21	7.2	Correspondence with M. Melcer regarding research regarding Disclosure Statement issues (0.4); email with T. Graulich and S. Piraino regarding Plan (1.0); correspondence with S. Piraino and H. Weigel regarding same (0.4).	
Masaro, Matthew Bruno	05/24/21	1.0	Correspondence with AlixPartners and others regarding Disclosure Statement exhibits (0.1); correspondence with R. Steinberg and others regarding same and claims (0.2); research issues regarding same (0.7).	
Melcer, Moshe	05/24/21	1.4	, ,	
Piraino, Stephen D.	05/24/21	0.7	Correspondence with M. Masaro regarding Plan issues (0.2); research Plan issues (0.5).	
Steinberg, Richard J.	05/24/21	2.4	Review draft liquidation analysis (1.1); review and revise Disclosure Statement (1.0); correspondence with M. Masaro regarding Disclosure Statement (0.3).	
Bane, Abraham	05/25/21	0.3	Call with E. Jerrard, S. Piraino, and R. Steinberg regarding Plan term sheet.	
Graulich, Timothy	05/25/21	4.8	Review and revise foreign investment memorandum and	

Time Detail By Project				
Name	Date	Hours	Narrative	
Jerrard, Erik	05/25/21	1.7	related scenarios. Review precedent releases and exculpation Plan pleadings (0.4); email with AlixPartners regarding Plan term sheet (0.4); call with R. Steinberg, S. Piraino and A. Bane regarding Plan term sheet (0.3); call with AlixPartners, S. Piraino, and R. Steinberg regarding draft liquidation analysis (0.6) (partial attendance).	
Masaro, Matthew Bruno	05/25/21	2.7	Correspondence with AlixPartners and others regarding Plan and Disclosure Statement (1.0); correspondence with S. Piraino and others regarding same (0.4); review and revise Disclosure Statement (0.7); research issues regarding same (0.6).	
Piraino, Stephen D.	05/25/21	1.5	Correspondence with M. Masaro regarding Plan issues (0.3); call with E. Jerrard, A. Bane, and R. Steinberg regarding Plan term sheet (0.3); call with E. Jerrard and AlixPartners regarding draft liquidation analysis (0.9).	
Steinberg, Richard J.	05/25/21	5.0	Call with E. Jerrard, S. Piraino, and AlixPartners regarding draft liquidation analysis (0.9); review and revise liquidation analysis (1.2); correspondence with S. Piraino regarding same (0.3); call with E. Jerrard, S. Piraino, and A. Bane regarding Plan term sheet (0.3); review and revise Disclosure Statement (1.2).	
Graulich, Timothy	05/26/21	3.3	Review and revise Plan term sheet.	
Jerrard, Erik	05/26/21	2.6	Review and revise Plan term sheet.	
Piraino, Stephen D.	05/26/21	1.0	Correspondence with M. Masaro regarding Plan issues (0.3); review Plan term sheet (0.4); correspondence with R. Sanchez Baker and co-advisors regarding timeline regarding same (0.3).	
Graulich, Timothy	05/27/21	3.7	Review and revise Plan term sheet.	
Jerrard, Erik	05/27/21	0.5	Correspondence with S. Piraino regarding Plan term sheet.	
Masaro, Matthew Bruno	05/27/21	0.6	Research Disclosure Statement issues (0.4); correspondence with Epiq and others regarding precedent related to same (0.2).	
Melcer, Moshe	05/27/21	0.7	Review precedent regarding exclusivity extension.	
Piraino, Stephen D.	05/27/21	0.5	Review and revise Plan term sheet.	
Steinberg, Richard J.	05/27/21	2.2	Review and revise Disclosure Statement.	
Graulich, Timothy	05/28/21	4.7	Review and comment on Plan term sheet.	
Masaro, Matthew Bruno	05/28/21	2.4	Review and revise Disclosure Statement motion (0.3); correspondence with R. Steinberg, S. Piraino, and others regarding same (0.3); research issues regarding same (1.8).	
Piraino, Stephen D.	05/28/21	1.9	Email with T. Graulich regarding shareholder agreement (0.2); analyze Plan issues (1.9).	
Melcer, Moshe	05/30/21	3.7	Research and summarize precedent extensions of exclusivity periods (1.6); draft motion to extend exclusivity periods (2.1).	
Graulich, Timothy	05/31/21	2.3	Review and revise Plan term sheet.	
Jerrard, Erik	05/31/21	1.1	Review and revise Plan term sheet.	
Steinberg, Richard J.	05/31/21	2.4	Review and revise Disclosure Statement.	
Total AM230 Plan/Dis Statement	closure	115.1		
AM240 DPW Retention	n/Preparation of	DPW Fee S	tatements/Applications and Budget	
Bane, Abraham	05/24/21	1.0	Correspondence with M. Dekhtyar regarding Third Interim Fee Application (0.4); review and revise same (0.6).	
Dekhtyar, Mariya	05/24/21	3.9	Draft Third Interim Fee Application (3.4); email with A. Scalzo regarding calculations related to same (0.3); email with N.	

		Time	Detail By Project
Name	Date	Hours	Narrative
			Kurian regarding same (0.1); correspondence with A. Bane
	0-10-10-1		regarding same (0.1).
Dekhtyar, Mariya	05/25/21	0.7	Draft Third Interim Fee Application (0.5); email with A. Bane
			regarding same (0.1); email with N. Kurian regarding
D.111 M.:	05/00/04	0.5	calculations related to same (0.1).
Dekhtyar, Mariya	05/26/21	0.5	Review and revise Third Interim Fee Application (0.4); email
Laurand Fulls	05/07/04	4.0	with A. Bane regarding same (0.1).
Jerrard, Erik	05/27/21	1.0	Review, revise and finalize April Monthly Fee Statement.
Dekhtyar, Mariya	05/28/21	1.7	Correspondence with A. Bane regarding Third Interim Fee
			Application (0.2); correspondence with N. Kurian regarding
			same (0.4); compile Third Interim Fee Application LEDES file
Dolchtung Marius	05/00/04	1.0	(0.2); review and revise Third Interim Fee Application (0.9).
Dekhtyar, Mariya	05/29/21	1.8	Review and revise Third Interim Fee Application.
Total AM240 DPW		10.6	
Retention/Preparati			
Statements/Applica	tions and		
Budget			
AM250 IP, Regulato	rv and Tax		
Altus, Leslie J.	05/01/21	1.4	Review email from A. Siman regarding tax issues (0.4); review
,			DIP agreement (0.7); correspondence with A. Siman regarding
			same (0.3).
Donnelly, Jacob M.	05/02/21	0.2	Correspondence with A. Siman regarding cancellation of
	00/02/2	0	indebtedness income.
Altus, Leslie J.	05/03/21	0.2	Review email from A. Sainz regarding tax issues (0.1); email
,,	00,00,2	V	with S. Piraino regarding same (0.1).
Burke, Arthur J.	05/03/21	1.0	Call with C. Toledo, L. Aziz, D. Herts, and others regarding
,			antitrust issues (0.4); prepare for same (0.2); email with
			Aeroméxico regarding same (0.4).
Donnelly, Jacob M.	05/03/21	1.4	Research issues regarding indebtedness income issues (0.9);
,, -			draft email to A. Siman summarizing same (0.5).
Herts, Dylan	05/03/21	0.6	Call with C. Toledo, L. Aziz, A. Burke, and others regarding
, ,			antitrust issues (0.4); prepare for same (0.1); email with G.
			Morrison regarding same (0.1).
Morrison, Gregory S.	05/03/21	1.0	Call with C. Toledo, L. Aziz, A. Burke, and others regarding
			antitrust issues (0.4); prepare for same (0.6).
Piraino, Stephen D.	05/03/21	0.2	Correspondence with Davis Polk Tax team and others
•			regarding tax issues.
Altus, Leslie J.	05/04/21	0.3	Review memorandum on Mexican law tax issues.
Burke, Arthur J.	05/04/21	0.5	Correspondence with Davis Polk Antitrust team regarding
			regulatory filing strategy and data requests.
Herts, Dylan	05/04/21	0.6	Email with AlixPartners and Morgan Lewis regarding data for
			antitrust analysis (0.3); email with G. Morrison regarding same
			(0.1); review same (0.2).
Burke, Arthur J.	05/05/21	1.0	Review and revise presentation to the Department of Justice
			on antitrust issues (0.5); email with Davis Polk Antitrust team
			regarding same (0.5).
Herts, Dylan	05/05/21	8.0	Email with G. Morrison regarding antitrust analysis status
			(0.1); email with A. Burke and G. Morrison regarding
			presentation to Department of Justice on antitrust issues (0.4);
			draft email to Morgan Lewis regarding same (0.2); review
			document regarding same (0.1).
Morrison, Gregory S.	05/05/21	0.4	Review and revise presentation to the Department of Justice
- •			on antitrust issues.
Burke, Arthur J.	05/06/21	1.0	Correspondence with Davis Polk Antitrust team regarding

	Time Detail By Project				
Name	Date	Hours	Narrative		
Herts, Dylan	05/06/21	1.8	information request (0.5); review and revise presentation to Department of Justice on antitrust issues (0.5). Email with G. Morrison regarding antitrust analysis of joint venture agreement (0.3); draft issues list regarding same (0.8); call with G. Morrison regarding outstanding antitrust		
Morrison, Gregory S.	05/06/21	0.7	analysis and information requests (0.7). Call with D. Herts regarding outstanding antitrust analysis and information requests.		
Burke, Arthur J.	05/07/21	2.0	Call with Morgan Lewis, D. Herts, and others regarding antitrust analysis (0.5); correspondence with Davis Polk Antitrust team regarding Section 8 of the Clayton Act, Mexican filing strategy, and presentation to Department of Justice on antitrust issues (1.5).		
Herts, Dylan	05/07/21	2.1	Email with A. Burke and G. Morrison regarding antitrust analysis of joint venture agreement (0.3); call with Morgan Lewis, A. Burke, and others regarding antitrust analysis (0.5); prepare for same (0.2); draft outline for call regarding antitrust analysis of joint venture agreement (0.5); email with G. Morrison regarding same (0.2); prepare for same (0.4).		
Morrison, Gregory S.	05/07/21	2.0	Call with Morgan Lewis, A. Burke, and others regarding antitrust analysis (0.5); call with Mexican antitrust counsel regarding COFECE timeline and strategy (0.5); correspondence with Aeroméxico regarding information request for Clayton Act Section 8 analysis (1.0).		
Herts, Dylan	05/08/21	0.2	Email with A. Burke regarding antitrust analysis (0.1); email with Sainz Abogados and Aziz & Kaye regarding same (0.1).		
Herts, Dylan	05/09/21	1.2	Review and comment on draft antitrust filing (0.6); email with A. Burke with summary of same (0.5); email with G. Morrison regarding same (0.1).		
Morrison, Gregory S. De Mullewie, Léonore	05/09/21 05/10/21	1.1 0.9	Review and revise draft COFECE antitrust filing. Correspondence with Apollo and Aeroméxico regarding global filing analysis.		
Herts, Dylan	05/10/21	1.3	Email with A. Burke regarding draft antitrust filing (0.2); review same (0.2); email with Aziz & Kaye, Sainz Abogados, A. Burke, and G. Morrison regarding same (0.1); correspondence with K. Kelley regarding upcoming Aeroméxico call concerning antitrust analysis (0.2); prepare for same (0.1); email with same regarding same (0.3); email with AlixPartners regarding antitrust information request (0.1); email with Morgan Lewis regarding same (0.1).		
Burke, Arthur J.	05/11/21	1.5	Correspondence with Davis Polk Antitrust team regarding presentation to the Department of Justice on antitrust analysis (0.5); email with Davis Polk Antitrust team regarding Section 8 of the Clayton Act analysis (0.5); review COFECE analysis (0.5).		
Herts, Dylan	05/11/21	2.6	Call with J. Wallden, K. Altagracia, C. Guerrero, Sainz Abogados, Aziz & Kaye, and K. Kelley regarding antitrust analysis (0.6); prepare for same (0.3); prepare summary of same for A. Burke and G. Morrison (0.4); email with same regarding same (0.3); review joint venture agreement (0.3); email with C. Guerrero regarding antitrust information requests (0.1); email with A. Burke regarding same (0.2); review draft antitrust filing (0.3); email with G. Morrison regarding same (0.1).		
Kelley, Kaitlyn Burke, Arthur J.	05/11/21 05/12/21	1.0 2.2	Call with Aeroméxico regarding antitrust issues. Review and revise COFECE filing (2.1); call with D. Herts		

	Time Detail By Project			
Name	Date	Hours	Narrative	
Herts, Dylan	05/12/21	4.8	regarding draft antitrust filing (0.1). Email with Aziz & Kaye regarding draft antitrust filing (0.5); email with A. Burke regarding same (0.3); call with A. Burke regarding same (0.1); email with D. DeBassio regarding antitrust information request (0.2); draft memorandum regarding joint venture agreement (2.6); review and comment on draft antitrust filing (1.1).	
Burke, Arthur J.	05/13/21	2.0	Call with Creel, Morgan Lewis, Aziz & Kaye, Sainz Abogados, and D. Herts regarding antitrust filing (0.7); review comments to filings related to same (0.3); call with Morgan Lewis regarding antitrust issues (0.5); analyze Section 8 of the Clayton Act issues (0.5).	
Herts, Dylan	05/13/21	2.7	Coordinate call with Creel, Morgan Lewis, Aziz & Kaye, Sainz Abogados, and Davis Polk Antitrust teams regarding antitrust filing (0.1); email with A. Burke regarding antitrust information requests (0.2); review draft antitrust filing (0.4); call with Creel, Morgan Lewis, Aziz & Kaye, Sainz Abogados, and A. Burke regarding antitrust filing (0.7); prepare for same (0.4); email with A. Burke regarding same (0.2); review outstanding antitrust information requests (0.3); email with A. Burke regarding same (0.2); review draft memorandum regarding joint venture agreement (0.2).	
Burke, Arthur J.	05/14/21	0.5	Correspondence with Davis Polk Antitrust team regarding	
Herts, Dylan	05/14/21	0.2	Mexican filing. Review antitrust information request status (0.1); correspondence with A. Burke regarding same (0.1).	
Burke, Arthur J.	05/17/21	0.5	Review and revise presentation to the Department of Justice on antitrust analysis (0.2); correspondence with Davis Polk Antitrust team regarding Clayton Act issues (0.2); call with D. Herts regarding review of COFECE antitrust filing (0.1).	
Herts, Dylan	05/17/21	1.5	Call with G. Morrison regarding review of COFECE antitrust filing (0.5); call with A. Burke regarding same (0.1); email with Davis Polk Antitrust team regarding same (0.1); email with Morgan Lewis regarding presentation to the Department of Justice on antitrust analysis (0.1); review same (0.6); email with G. Morrison regarding same (0.1).	
Morrison, Gregory S.	05/17/21	1.1	Call with D. Herts regarding review of COFECE antitrust filing (0.5); review and revise presentation to the Department of Justice on antitrust analysis (0.6).	
Burke, Arthur J.	05/18/21	0.8	Revise COFECE filing (0.4); email with Davis Polk Antitrust team regarding same (0.4).	
De Mullewie, Léonore	05/18/21	0.4	Compile antitrust filings analysis information.	
Herts, Dylan	05/18/21	0.4	Email with G. Morrison regarding antitrust information requests (0.2); email with J. Wallden, Aeroméxico, Sainz Abogados, and Aziz & Kaye regarding same (0.2).	
Morrison, Gregory S.	05/18/21	1.1	Correspondence with Morgan Lewis regarding additional antitrust information requests (0.2); correspondence with L. De Mullewie regarding antitrust filings analysis (0.2); draft summary of Section 8 of the Clayton Act analysis (0.7).	
Burke, Arthur J.	05/19/21	0.5	Correspondence with Morgan Lewis regarding presentation to	
Herts, Dylan	05/19/21	0.3	the Department of Justice on antitrust analysis. Review Aziz & Kaye's comments to presentation to the Department of Justice on antitrust analysis (0.1); review	
Burke, Arthur J.	05/20/21	1.0	responses to antitrust information requests (0.2). Correspondence with Davis Polk Antitrust team regarding	

		Time	Detail By Project
Name	Date	Hours	Narrative
			Section 8 of the Clayton Act analysis (0.5); correspondence
			with same regarding Mexican competition filing (0.5).
De Mullewie,	05/20/21	0.5	Compile antitrust filings analysis information.
Léonore	05/00/04	4.0	D :
Herts, Dylan	05/20/21	1.3	Review summary of Section 8 of the Clayton Act analysis (0.2); review revisions to antitrust filing (0.4); email with G. Morrison regarding same (0.1); email with same regarding antitrust information sharing (0.2).
Morrison, Gregory S.	05/20/21	0.6	Review revised COFECE filing.
Burke, Arthur J.	05/21/21	1.0	Review and revise COFECE filing (0.2); correspondence with Davis Polk Antitrust team regarding analysis of Clayton Act issues (0.3); correspondence with Davis Polk Antitrust team regarding Clayton Act analysis (0.5).
Morrison, Gregory S.	05/21/21	0.3	Review and revise summary of Section 8 of the Clayton Act analysis.
Herts, Dylan	05/24/21	1.1	Review presentation to the Department of Justice on antitrust analysis (0.8); email with G. Morrison regarding same (0.3).
Morrison, Gregory S.	05/24/21	0.9	Review and revise summary of Section 8 of the Clayton Act analysis.
Burke, Arthur J.	05/25/21	0.5	Correspondence with Davis Polk Antitrust team regarding Mexican filings and Clayton Act analysis (0.2); call with G. Morrison regarding Section 8 of the Clayton Act analysis (0.3).
Herts, Dylan	05/25/21	0.3	Review presentation to the Department of Justice on antitrust analysis (0.2); email with G. Morrison regarding same (0.1).
Morrison, Gregory S.	05/25/21	1.4	Email with Morgan Lewis regarding Section 8 of the Clayton Act analysis (1.1); call with A. Burke regarding same (0.3).
Burke, Arthur J.	05/26/21	1.0	Correspondence with Davis Polk Antitrust team regarding Mexican filings (0.5); review presentation to the Department of Justice on antitrust analysis (0.5).
De Mullewie, Léonore	05/26/21	1.5	Analyze global antitrust filing.
Morrison, Gregory S.	05/26/21	0.5	Correspondence with Aeroméxico regarding antitrust information requests.
Burke, Arthur J.	05/27/21	0.8	Call with G. Morrison regarding Section 8 of the Clayton Act analysis (0.1); correspondence with Morgan Lewis regarding same (0.7).
De Mullewie, Léonore	05/27/21	0.5	Analyze global antitrust filing.
Morrison, Gregory S.	05/27/21	0.1	Call with A. Burke regarding Section 8 of the Clayton Act analysis.
Herts, Dylan	05/28/21	0.6	Email with G. Morrison regarding antitrust information request (0.1); email with J. Wallden regarding same (0.1); review memorandum regarding joint venture agreement (0.4).
Morrison, Gregory S.	05/28/21	0.2	Call with Morgan Lewis regarding antitrust information requests.
Total AM250 IP, Regu Tax	ılatory and	62.1	·
TOTAL		994.9	

20-11563-scc Doc 1979 Filed 10/26/21 Entered 10/26/21 20:59:12 Main Document Pg 82 of 357

DISBURSEMENT SUMMARY	
Description	Amount
Court and related fees	\$177.87
Postage, courier & freight	\$402.18
Outside Documents & Research	\$1,284.05
Computer research	\$2,135.62
TOTAL	\$3,999.72

DISBURSEMENT DETAIL						
Date	Vendor Name	Expense Type	Description	Amount		
05/03/21		Computer research	Westlaw usage by STEINBERG,RICH on 05/03/2021	\$117.75		
05/04/21		Computer research	Westlaw usage by BANE,ABRAHAM on 05/04/2021	\$109.88		
05/04/21		Computer research	Westlaw usage by STEINBERG,RICH on 05/04/2021	\$222.90		
05/05/21		Computer research	Westlaw usage by STEINBERG,RICH on 05/05/2021	\$236.42		
05/09/21		Computer research	Westlaw usage by STEINBERG,RICH on 05/09/2021	\$13.82		
05/10/21		Computer research	LEXIS; SEARCH;ACCESS CHARGE	\$72.80		
05/10/21		Computer research	Westlaw usage by MELCER,MOSHE on 05/10/2021	\$13.82		
05/11/21		Computer research	LEXIS; SEARCH;ACCESS CHARGE	\$72.80		
05/12/21		Computer research	Westlaw usage by JERRARD,ERIK on 05/12/2021	\$48.44		
05/13/21		Computer research	Westlaw usage by MELCER,MOSHE on 05/13/2021	\$27.64		
05/14/21		Computer research	Westlaw usage by STEINBERG,RICH on 05/14/2021	\$13.82		
05/24/21		Computer research	Westlaw usage by MELCER,MOSHE on 05/24/2021	\$52.87		

DISBURSEMENT DETAIL Expense Date Vendor Name Description Amount Type LEXIS; US TREATISES; DOC ACCESS 05/24/21 Computer \$49.90 research 05/25/21 Computer LEXIS; US TREATISES; DOC ACCESS \$49.90 research 05/25/21 Computer Westlaw usage by STEINBERG.RICH on \$176.33 research 05/25/2021 05/26/21 Computer Westlaw usage by STEINBERG, RICH on \$37.65 research 05/26/2021 05/26/21 Computer LEXIS; SEARCH; ACCESS CHARGE \$52.00 research 05/28/21 Computer LEXIS; SEARCH; ACCESS CHARGE \$312.00 research Computer LEXIS: US LAW REVIEWS AND 05/28/21 \$55.68 research JOURNALS; DOC ACCESS 05/28/21 Computer LEXIS; US TREATISES; DOC ACCESS \$399.20 research 04/30/21 Court and Payee: Altman, Olivia, CourtSolutions, \$70.00 related fees 4/30/2021, CourtAlert.com: B. Eng, D. Thomson; Court 05/31/21 Court and \$42.87 NYSD; Index No. 1:20-cv-05006; In Re: LSC related fees Communications, Inc. 05/31/21 Court and Pacer transactions 05/2021 \$65.00 related fees 05/04/21 Outside Restructuring Concepts/netDockets: Abraham \$3.27 **Documents** Bane; 5/4/2021 4:27:00 PM; Description: & Research Downloaded D0003: Docket #20112 (Main Document); Charge id: 351604 05/04/21 Outside Restructuring Concepts/netDockets: Abraham \$21.78 **Documents** Bane; 5/4/2021 4:25:00 PM; Description: & Research Multiple case search; Charge id: 351603 05/07/21 Outside Restructuring Concepts/netDockets: Abraham \$5.44 **Documents** Bane; 5/7/2021 2:30:00 PM; Description: & Research Single case search; Charge id: 351903 Restructuring Concepts/netDockets: Moshe 05/13/21 Outside \$5.44 Melcer; 5/13/2021 2:36:00 PM; Description: **Documents** & Research Single case search; Charge id: 352516

DISBURSEMENT DETAIL Expense Date Vendor Name Description Amount Type 05/19/21 Outside courtlink: SEARCH ACCESS CHARGE For \$3.95 **Documents BLANK BLANK** & Research courtlink: US DOCKETS DOC ACCESS For 05/19/21 Outside \$0.28 **BLANK BLANK Documents** & Research 05/19/21 Restructuring Concepts/netDockets: Moshe \$21.78 Outside Melcer; 5/19/2021 8:20:00 AM; Description: **Documents** & Research Multiple case search; Charge id: 353035 Restructuring Concepts/netDockets: Moshe 05/19/21 Outside \$21.78 **Documents** Melcer; 5/19/2021 10:05:00 AM; Description: Multiple case search; Charge id: 353041 & Research 05/19/21 Outside Restructuring Concepts/netDockets: Moshe \$21.78 Melcer; 5/19/2021 11:10:00 AM; Description: **Documents** Multiple case search; Charge id: 353056 & Research 05/19/21 Outside Restructuring Concepts/netDockets: Marjorie \$5.44 Richmond; 5/19/2021 2:51:00 PM; Description: Documents Single case search; Charge id: 353074 & Research 05/19/21 Outside Restructuring Concepts/netDockets: Moshe \$21.78 Melcer; 5/19/2021 8:17:00 AM; Description: **Documents** Multiple case search; Charge id: 353033 & Research 05/19/21 Outside Restructuring Concepts/netDockets: Moshe \$21.78 **Documents** Melcer; 5/19/2021 8:19:00 AM; Description: & Research Multiple case search: Charge id: 353034 05/19/21 Outside Restructuring Concepts/netDockets: Marjorie \$3.27 **Documents** Richmond; 5/19/2021 2:54:00 PM; Description: & Research Downloaded A0319: Docket #1143 (Exhibit B -Rights Offering Term Sheet); Charge id: 353075 05/19/21 Outside Restructuring Concepts/netDockets: Marjorie \$3.27 **Documents** Richmond; 5/19/2021 3:02:00 PM; Description: & Research Downloaded A0319: Docket #1484 (Main Document); Charge id: 353076 05/20/21 Outside Restructuring Concepts/netDockets: Marjorie \$5.44 Richmond; 5/20/2021 7:31:00 AM; Description: **Documents** & Research Single case search; Charge id: 353100 05/20/21 Outside Restructuring Concepts/netDockets: Richard \$21.78 **Documents** Steinberg; 5/20/2021 4:28:00 PM; Description: & Research Multiple case search: Charge id: 353150

DISBURSEMENT DETAIL Expense Date Vendor Name Description Amount Type Restructuring Concepts/netDockets: Richard 05/20/21 Outside \$21.78 Steinberg; 5/20/2021 4:30:00 PM; Description: **Documents** & Research Multiple case search; Charge id: 353151 05/20/21 Outside Restructuring Concepts/netDockets: Richard \$3.27 Steinberg; 5/20/2021 4:41:00 PM; Description: **Documents** Downloaded R0067: Docket #10648; Charge & Research id: 353154 05/20/21 Restructuring Concepts/netDockets: Richard Outside \$21.78 **Documents** Steinberg; 5/20/2021 4:42:00 PM; Description: & Research Multiple case search: Charge id: 353155 05/20/21 Restructuring Concepts/netDockets: Richard Outside \$3.27 Steinberg; 5/20/2021 4:44:00 PM; Description: **Documents** Downloaded I0042: Docket #1515; Charge id: & Research 353156 05/20/21 Outside Restructuring Concepts/netDockets: Richard \$3.27 **Documents** Steinberg; 5/20/2021 4:32:00 PM; Description: & Research Downloaded A0123: Docket #13002; Charge id: 353152 05/20/21 Outside Restructuring Concepts/netDockets: Richard \$21.78 **Documents** Steinberg; 5/20/2021 4:37:00 PM; Description: Multiple case search; Charge id: 353153 & Research Restructuring Concepts/netDockets: Moshe 05/24/21 Outside \$5.44 **Documents** Melcer; 5/24/2021 5:13:00 PM; Description: Single case search; Charge id: 353535 & Research Restructuring Concepts/netDockets: Moshe 05/24/21 Outside \$3.27 Documents Melcer; 5/24/2021 12:35:00 PM; Description: & Research Downloaded A0078: Docket #1479 (Exhibit(s) G-H); Charge id: 353487 05/24/21 Outside Restructuring Concepts/netDockets: Moshe \$3.27 Melcer; 5/24/2021 12:35:00 PM; Description: Documents & Research Downloaded A0078: Docket #1479 (Exhibit(s) I-1); Charge id: 353488 Restructuring Concepts/netDockets: Moshe 05/24/21 Outside \$21.78 **Documents** Melcer: 5/24/2021 11:54:00 AM: Description: & Research Multiple case search; Charge id: 353464 05/24/21 Outside Restructuring Concepts/netDockets: Moshe \$3.27 Melcer; 5/24/2021 12:12:00 PM; Description: **Documents** & Research Downloaded U0011: Docket #2755 (Main Document); Charge id: 353467

DISBURSEMENT DETAIL Expense Amount **Date Vendor Name** Description Type 05/24/21 Outside Restructuring Concepts/netDockets: Moshe \$3.27 **Documents** Melcer: 5/24/2021 12:35:00 PM: Description: & Research Downloaded A0078: Docket #1479 (Part(s) 2); Charge id: 353481 Outside Restructuring Concepts/netDockets: Moshe 05/24/21 \$3.27 Documents Melcer; 5/24/2021 12:35:00 PM; Description: & Research Downloaded A0078: Docket #1479 (Part(s) 3); Charge id: 353482 05/24/21 Outside Restructuring Concepts/netDockets: Moshe \$3.27 Melcer; 5/24/2021 12:46:00 PM; Description: Documents Downloaded S0017: Docket #665 (Appendix & Research C); Charge id: 353510 05/24/21 Outside Restructuring Concepts/netDockets: Moshe \$3.27 Melcer; 5/24/2021 12:47:00 PM; Description: **Documents** Downloaded S0017: Docket #665 (Appendix & Research D); Charge id: 353511 05/24/21 Outside Restructuring Concepts/netDockets: Moshe \$3.27 Melcer; 5/24/2021 5:13:00 PM; Description: Documents Downloaded D0004: Docket #4417 (Appendix & Research Liquidation Analyses); Charge id: 353536 Restructuring Concepts/netDockets: Moshe 05/24/21 Outside \$5.44 **Documents** Melcer; 5/24/2021 5:18:00 PM; Description: & Research Single case search; Charge id: 353537 05/24/21 Restructuring Concepts/netDockets: Moshe Outside \$3.27 Melcer; 5/24/2021 12:48:00 PM; Description: **Documents** Downloaded F0016: Docket #944 (Appendix A & Research - Debtors' Joint Plan of Reorganization Under Chapter 11 of the); Charge id: 353514 Restructuring Concepts/netDockets: Moshe 05/24/21 Outside \$3.27 **Documents** Melcer; 5/24/2021 12:48:00 PM; Description: Downloaded F0016: Docket #944 (Appendix B & Research - Liquidation Analysis); Charge id: 353515 Restructuring Concepts/netDockets: Moshe 05/24/21 Outside \$3.27 Melcer; 5/24/2021 12:44:00 PM; Description: **Documents** & Research Downloaded N0007: Docket #5742 (Exhibit F.2); Charge id: 353503 05/24/21 Outside Restructuring Concepts/netDockets: Moshe \$3.27 Melcer; 5/24/2021 12:44:00 PM; Description: **Documents** & Research Downloaded N0007: Docket #5742 (Exhibit G); Charge id: 353504

DISBURSEMENT DETAIL Expense Amount **Date Vendor Name** Description Type 05/24/21 Outside Restructuring Concepts/netDockets: Moshe \$3.27 **Documents** Melcer; 5/24/2021 12:50:00 PM; Description: & Research Downloaded G0065: Docket #673; Charge id: 353518 Outside Restructuring Concepts/netDockets: Moshe 05/24/21 \$3.27 **Documents** Melcer; 5/24/2021 12:57:00 PM; Description: & Research Downloaded P0094: Docket #1071; Charge id: 353519 05/24/21 Outside Restructuring Concepts/netDockets: Moshe \$3.27 Melcer; 5/24/2021 12:46:00 PM; Description: Documents Downloaded S0017: Docket #665 (Appendix & Research A); Charge id: 353508 05/24/21 Outside Restructuring Concepts/netDockets: Moshe \$3.27 Melcer; 5/24/2021 12:46:00 PM; Description: **Documents** Downloaded S0017: Docket #665 (Appendix & Research B); Charge id: 353509 05/24/21 Outside Restructuring Concepts/netDockets: Moshe \$3.27 Melcer; 5/24/2021 12:41:00 PM; Description: Documents Downloaded F0008: Docket #1589 (Main & Research Document); Charge id: 353497 Restructuring Concepts/netDockets: Moshe 05/24/21 Outside \$3.27 **Documents** Melcer; 5/24/2021 12:41:00 PM; Description: & Research Downloaded F0008: Docket #1589 (Exhibit); Charge id: 353498 05/24/21 Restructuring Concepts/netDockets: Moshe Outside \$3.27 Melcer; 5/24/2021 12:47:00 PM; Description: **Documents** Downloaded S0017: Docket #665 (Appendix & Research E); Charge id: 353512 05/24/21 Outside Restructuring Concepts/netDockets: Moshe \$3.27 **Documents** Melcer: 5/24/2021 12:48:00 PM: Description: Downloaded F0016: Docket #944 (Main & Research Document); Charge id: 353513 Restructuring Concepts/netDockets: Moshe 05/24/21 Outside \$3.27 Melcer; 5/24/2021 12:43:00 PM; Description: **Documents** & Research Downloaded N0007: Docket #5742 (Exhibit B); Charge id: 353501 05/24/21 Outside Restructuring Concepts/netDockets: Moshe \$3.27 Melcer; 5/24/2021 12:43:00 PM; Description: **Documents** & Research Downloaded N0007: Docket #5742 (Exhibit F.1); Charge id: 353502

DISBURSEMENT DETAIL Expense Amount **Date Vendor Name** Description Type 05/24/21 Outside Restructuring Concepts/netDockets: Moshe \$3.27 Melcer; 5/24/2021 12:36:00 PM; Description: **Documents** & Research Downloaded U0004: Docket #13321 (Main Document); Charge id: 353491 Restructuring Concepts/netDockets: Moshe Outside 05/24/21 \$3.27 Documents Melcer; 5/24/2021 12:36:00 PM; Description: & Research Downloaded U0004: Docket #13321 (Appendix A); Charge id: 353492 05/24/21 Outside Restructuring Concepts/netDockets: Moshe \$3.27 Melcer; 5/24/2021 12:45:00 PM; Description: Documents & Research Downloaded A0032: Docket #1240; Charge id: 353506 05/24/21 Outside Restructuring Concepts/netDockets: Moshe \$3.27 Melcer; 5/24/2021 12:46:00 PM; Description: **Documents** Downloaded S0017: Docket #665 (Main & Research Document); Charge id: 353507 05/24/21 Outside Restructuring Concepts/netDockets: Moshe \$3.27 Melcer; 5/24/2021 12:36:00 PM; Description: Documents Downloaded U0004: Docket #13321 (Appendix & Research D); Charge id: 353495 Restructuring Concepts/netDockets: Moshe 05/24/21 Outside \$3.27 **Documents** Melcer; 5/24/2021 12:36:00 PM; Description: & Research Downloaded U0004: Docket #13321 (Appendix E); Charge id: 353496 05/24/21 Restructuring Concepts/netDockets: Moshe Outside \$3.27 Melcer; 5/24/2021 12:35:00 PM; Description: **Documents** Downloaded A0078: Docket #1479 (Exhibit(s) & Research A-B); Charge id: 353485 05/24/21 Outside Restructuring Concepts/netDockets: Moshe \$3.27 **Documents** Melcer; 5/24/2021 12:35:00 PM; Description: Downloaded A0078: Docket #1479 (Exhibit(s) & Research C-F); Charge id: 353486 05/24/21 Restructuring Concepts/netDockets: Moshe Outside \$3.27 Melcer; 5/24/2021 12:43:00 PM; Description: **Documents** & Research Downloaded N0007: Docket #5742 (Main Document); Charge id: 353499 05/24/21 Outside Restructuring Concepts/netDockets: Moshe \$3.27 Melcer; 5/24/2021 12:43:00 PM; Description: **Documents** & Research Downloaded N0007: Docket #5742 (Exhibit A); Charge id: 353500

DISBURSEMENT DETAIL Expense Amount **Date Vendor Name** Description Type 05/24/21 Outside Restructuring Concepts/netDockets: Moshe \$3.27 **Documents** Melcer: 5/24/2021 12:35:00 PM: Description: & Research Downloaded A0078: Docket #1479 (Exhibit(s) I-2); Charge id: 353489 Restructuring Concepts/netDockets: Moshe 05/24/21 Outside \$3.27 Documents Melcer; 5/24/2021 12:35:00 PM; Description: & Research Downloaded A0078: Docket #1479 (Exhibit(s) I-3); Charge id: 353490 05/24/21 Outside Restructuring Concepts/netDockets: Moshe \$3.27 Melcer; 5/24/2021 12:12:00 PM; Description: Documents & Research Downloaded U0011: Docket #2755 (Blackline Copy); Charge id: 353468 05/24/21 Outside Restructuring Concepts/netDockets: Moshe \$3.27 Melcer; 5/24/2021 12:34:00 PM; Description: **Documents** & Research Downloaded A0078: Docket #1479 (Main Document); Charge id: 353480 05/24/21 Outside Restructuring Concepts/netDockets: Moshe \$3.27 Melcer; 5/24/2021 12:36:00 PM; Description: Documents Downloaded U0004: Docket #13321 (Appendix & Research B); Charge id: 353493 Restructuring Concepts/netDockets: Moshe 05/24/21 Outside \$3.27 **Documents** Melcer; 5/24/2021 12:36:00 PM; Description: & Research Downloaded U0004: Docket #13321 (Appendix C); Charge id: 353494 Restructuring Concepts/netDockets: Moshe 05/24/21 Outside \$3.27 Melcer; 5/24/2021 12:35:00 PM; Description: **Documents** Downloaded A0078: Docket #1479 (Part(s) 4); & Research Charge id: 353483 05/24/21 Outside Restructuring Concepts/netDockets: Moshe \$3.27 **Documents** Melcer; 5/24/2021 12:35:00 PM; Description: Downloaded A0078: Docket #1479 (Part(s) 5): & Research Charge id: 353484 05/24/21 Restructuring Concepts/netDockets: Moshe Outside \$5.44 **Documents** Melcer; 5/24/2021 5:19:00 PM; Description: & Research Single case search; Charge id: 353538 05/24/21 Outside Restructuring Concepts/netDockets: Moshe \$3.27 **Documents** Melcer; 5/24/2021 5:19:00 PM; Description: Downloaded U0004: Docket #12638; Charge & Research id: 353539

DISBURSEMENT DETAIL Expense Date Vendor Name Description Amount Type 05/24/21 Outside Restructuring Concepts/netDockets: Moshe \$3.27 Melcer; 5/24/2021 12:48:00 PM; Description: **Documents** & Research Downloaded F0016: Docket #944 (Appendix C - Financial Projections); Charge id: 353516 Restructuring Concepts/netDockets: Moshe 05/24/21 Outside \$3.27 Documents Melcer; 5/24/2021 12:49:00 PM; Description: & Research Downloaded M0059: Docket #1242; Charge id: 353517 05/24/21 Outside Restructuring Concepts/netDockets: Moshe \$5.44 Documents Melcer; 5/24/2021 5:20:00 PM; Description: Single case search; Charge id: 353542 & Research 05/24/21 Outside Restructuring Concepts/netDockets: Moshe \$5.44 Melcer; 5/24/2021 5:24:00 PM; Description: **Documents** Single case search; Charge id: 353543 & Research Restructuring Concepts/netDockets: Moshe 05/24/21 Outside \$3.27 Documents Melcer; 5/24/2021 1:05:00 PM; Description: & Research Downloaded T0134: Docket #233; Charge id: 353520 05/24/21 Outside Restructuring Concepts/netDockets: Moshe \$3.27 Documents Melcer; 5/24/2021 5:25:00 PM; Description: Downloaded U0011: Docket #2340 (Appendix & Research B - Liquidation Analysis); Charge id: 353544 05/24/21 Outside Restructuring Concepts/netDockets: Moshe \$5.44 Melcer; 5/24/2021 5:45:00 PM; Description: **Documents** & Research Single case search; Charge id: 353545 05/24/21 Restructuring Concepts/netDockets: Moshe Outside \$5.44 Melcer; 5/24/2021 5:19:00 PM; Description: Documents Single case search; Charge id: 353540 & Research 05/24/21 Restructuring Concepts/netDockets: Moshe Outside \$5.44 Melcer; 5/24/2021 5:20:00 PM; Description: Documents & Research Single case search; Charge id: 353541 Restructuring Concepts/netDockets: Moshe 05/25/21 Outside \$5.44 **Documents** Melcer; 5/25/2021 8:44:00 AM; Description: & Research Single case search; Charge id: 353598 05/25/21 Outside Restructuring Concepts/netDockets: Moshe \$3.27 **Documents** Melcer; 5/25/2021 8:46:00 AM; Description: Downloaded F0016: Docket #789 (Main & Research Document); Charge id: 353599 Restructuring Concepts/netDockets: Moshe 05/25/21 Outside \$21.78 Documents Melcer; 5/25/2021 7:41:00 AM; Description: Multiple case search; Charge id: 353580 & Research

DISBURSEMENT DETAIL Expense Date Vendor Name Description Amount Type 05/25/21 Outside Restructuring Concepts/netDockets: Moshe \$3.27 **Documents** Melcer: 5/25/2021 9:07:00 AM: Description: & Research Downloaded W0091: Docket #2528; Charge id: 353602 Restructuring Concepts/netDockets: Moshe 05/25/21 Outside \$3.27 Melcer; 5/25/2021 9:12:00 AM; Description: **Documents** & Research Downloaded A0123: Docket #13015; Charge id: 353603 05/25/21 Outside Restructuring Concepts/netDockets: Moshe \$21.78 Melcer; 5/25/2021 8:41:00 AM; Description: **Documents** Multiple case search; Charge id: 353595 & Research 05/26/21 Outside Restructuring Concepts/netDockets: Moshe \$3.27 Melcer; 5/26/2021 11:09:00 AM; Description: **Documents** Downloaded D0099: Docket #3395; Charge id: & Research 353746 05/26/21 Outside Restructuring Concepts/netDockets: Moshe \$3.27 **Documents** Melcer: 5/26/2021 11:11:00 AM: Description: & Research Downloaded N0109: Docket #1578; Charge id: 353748 Restructuring Concepts/netDockets: Moshe 05/26/21 \$3.27 Outside Melcer; 5/26/2021 11:17:00 AM; Description: Documents & Research Downloaded F0145: Docket #1031; Charge id: 353754 05/26/21 Outside Restructuring Concepts/netDockets: Moshe \$3.27 Melcer; 5/26/2021 11:18:00 AM; Description: **Documents** Downloaded T0218: Docket #1159 (Main & Research Document); Charge id: 353755 05/26/21 Outside Restructuring Concepts/netDockets: Moshe \$21.78 Melcer: 5/26/2021 11:08:00 AM: Description: **Documents** & Research Multiple case search: Charge id: 353744 05/26/21 Restructuring Concepts/netDockets: Moshe Outside \$21.78 Melcer: 5/26/2021 11:09:00 AM: Description: **Documents** Multiple case search: Charge id: 353745 & Research 05/26/21 Outside Restructuring Concepts/netDockets: Moshe \$3.27 **Documents** Melcer; 5/26/2021 11:12:00 AM; Description: & Research Downloaded S0187: Docket #3467 (Main Document); Charge id: 353751 05/26/21 Outside Restructuring Concepts/netDockets: Moshe \$3.27 **Documents** Melcer; 5/26/2021 11:15:00 AM; Description: Downloaded S0187: Docket #3373 (Main & Research Document); Charge id: 353752

DISBURSEMENT DETAIL Expense Amount **Date Vendor Name** Description Type 05/26/21 Outside Restructuring Concepts/netDockets: Moshe \$3.27 **Documents** Melcer: 5/26/2021 11:20:00 AM: Description: & Research Downloaded A0222: Docket #1507 (Main Document); Charge id: 353757 05/26/21 Outside Restructuring Concepts/netDockets: Moshe \$3.27 Melcer; 5/26/2021 11:21:00 AM; Description: Documents & Research Downloaded H0063: Docket #1754; Charge id: 353758 05/27/21 Outside Restructuring Concepts/netDockets: Moshe \$3.27 Melcer: 5/27/2021 2:06:00 PM: Description: Documents Downloaded D0004: Docket #4946; Charge id: & Research 354026 05/27/21 Outside Restructuring Concepts/netDockets: Moshe \$3.27 Melcer; 5/27/2021 2:10:00 PM; Description: **Documents** & Research Downloaded N0007: Docket #1627 (Proposed Order); Charge id: 354027 05/27/21 Outside Restructuring Concepts/netDockets: Moshe \$3.27 Melcer; 5/27/2021 2:02:00 PM; Description: Documents Downloaded D0004: Docket #1679 (Exhibit & Research Form of Order); Charge id: 354020 Restructuring Concepts/netDockets: Moshe 05/27/21 Outside \$3.27 **Documents** Melcer; 5/27/2021 2:03:00 PM; Description: & Research Downloaded D0004: Docket #1679 (Main Document); Charge id: 354021 05/27/21 Restructuring Concepts/netDockets: Moshe Outside \$3.27 Melcer; 5/27/2021 1:52:00 PM; Description: **Documents** Downloaded A0123: Docket #6689; Charge id: & Research 354013 05/27/21 Outside Restructuring Concepts/netDockets: Moshe \$3.27 **Documents** Melcer: 5/27/2021 1:52:00 PM: Description: & Research Downloaded A0123: Docket #6497; Charge id: 354014 Restructuring Concepts/netDockets: Moshe 05/27/21 Outside \$3.27 Melcer; 5/27/2021 2:10:00 PM; Description: **Documents** & Research Downloaded N0007: Docket #1627 (Main Document); Charge id: 354028 05/27/21 Outside Restructuring Concepts/netDockets: Moshe \$3.27 **Documents** Melcer; 5/27/2021 1:56:00 PM; Description: & Research Downloaded A0123: Docket #3440; Charge id: 354018

DISBURSEMENT DETAIL Expense Date Vendor Name Description Amount Type 05/27/21 Outside Restructuring Concepts/netDockets: Moshe \$3.27 **Documents** Melcer: 5/27/2021 1:59:00 PM: Description: & Research Downloaded A0123: Docket #1657; Charge id: 354019 05/27/21 Outside Restructuring Concepts/netDockets: Moshe \$3.27 Documents Melcer; 5/27/2021 1:13:00 PM; Description: & Research Downloaded A0128: Docket #1061 (Exhibit C); Charge id: 354002 05/27/21 Outside Restructuring Concepts/netDockets: Moshe \$3.27 Melcer: 5/27/2021 1:15:00 PM: Description: Documents Downloaded A0334: Docket #123; Charge id: & Research 354003 Restructuring Concepts/netDockets: Moshe 05/27/21 Outside \$3.27 Melcer; 5/27/2021 2:03:00 PM; Description: **Documents** & Research Downloaded D0004: Docket #2702; Charge id: 354022 05/27/21 Outside Restructuring Concepts/netDockets: Moshe \$3.27 Melcer; 5/27/2021 2:04:00 PM; Description: Documents Downloaded D0004: Docket #3433; Charge id: & Research 354023 05/27/21 Outside Restructuring Concepts/netDockets: Moshe \$21.78 **Documents** Melcer; 5/27/2021 1:49:00 PM; Description: & Research Multiple case search; Charge id: 354010 05/27/21 Restructuring Concepts/netDockets: Moshe Outside \$3.27 Melcer; 5/27/2021 1:49:00 PM; Description: **Documents** Downloaded A0123: Docket #7077; Charge id: & Research 354011 05/27/21 Outside Restructuring Concepts/netDockets: Moshe \$3.27 Melcer: 5/27/2021 1:11:00 PM: Description: **Documents** & Research Downloaded B0079: Docket #103 (Main Document): Charge id: 353996 05/27/21 Outside Restructuring Concepts/netDockets: Moshe \$3.27 Melcer: 5/27/2021 1:11:00 PM: Description: Documents Downloaded B0079: Docket #103 (Exhibit A -& Research Proposed Order); Charge id: 353997 05/27/21 Outside Restructuring Concepts/netDockets: Moshe \$3.27 **Documents** Melcer; 5/27/2021 1:54:00 PM; Description: & Research Downloaded A0123: Docket #5479; Charge id: 354016

DISBURSEMENT DETAIL Expense Date Vendor Name Description Amount Type 05/27/21 Outside Restructuring Concepts/netDockets: Moshe \$3.27 **Documents** Melcer: 5/27/2021 1:55:00 PM: Description: & Research Downloaded A0123: Docket #5022; Charge id: 354017 05/27/21 Outside Restructuring Concepts/netDockets: Moshe \$3.27 Documents Melcer; 5/27/2021 1:13:00 PM; Description: & Research Downloaded A0128: Docket #1061 (Exhibit A); Charge id: 354000 05/27/21 Outside Restructuring Concepts/netDockets: Moshe \$3.27 Documents Melcer; 5/27/2021 1:13:00 PM; Description: Downloaded A0128: Docket #1061 (Exhibit B); & Research Charge id: 354001 Restructuring Concepts/netDockets: Moshe 05/27/21 Outside \$21.78 Melcer; 5/27/2021 12:44:00 PM; Description: **Documents** & Research Multiple case search; Charge id: 353976 05/27/21 Outside Restructuring Concepts/netDockets: Moshe \$21.78 Melcer: 5/27/2021 1:48:00 PM: Description: **Documents** & Research Multiple case search; Charge id: 354008 05/27/21 Outside Restructuring Concepts/netDockets: Moshe \$21.78 **Documents** Melcer; 5/27/2021 1:48:00 PM; Description: Multiple case search; Charge id: 354009 & Research Restructuring Concepts/netDockets: Moshe 05/27/21 Outside \$3.27 **Documents** Melcer; 5/27/2021 1:00:00 PM; Description: & Research Downloaded E0042: Docket #3234 (Main Document); Charge id: 353979 05/27/21 Restructuring Concepts/netDockets: Moshe Outside \$21.78 Documents Melcer; 5/27/2021 1:09:00 PM; Description: Multiple case search; Charge id: 353995 & Research 05/27/21 Outside Restructuring Concepts/netDockets: Moshe \$3.27 Melcer; 5/27/2021 1:11:00 PM; Description: **Documents** & Research Downloaded B0079: Docket #103 (Exhibit B -Commitment Letter); Charge id: 353998 05/27/21 Outside Restructuring Concepts/netDockets: Moshe \$3.27 **Documents** Melcer: 5/27/2021 1:12:00 PM: Description: & Research Downloaded A0128: Docket #1061 (Main Document); Charge id: 353999 05/27/21 Restructuring Concepts/netDockets: Moshe Outside \$3.27 Melcer; 5/27/2021 12:47:00 PM; Description: **Documents** & Research Downloaded E0042: Docket #2384 (Main Document); Charge id: 353977

DISBURSEMENT DETAIL Expense Date Vendor Name Description Amount Type Restructuring Concepts/netDockets: Moshe 05/27/21 Outside \$3.27 **Documents** Melcer: 5/27/2021 12:58:00 PM: Description: & Research Downloaded E0042: Docket #2492; Charge id: 353978 05/30/21 Outside Restructuring Concepts/netDockets: Moshe \$5.44 Melcer; 5/30/2021 7:23:00 AM; Description: **Documents** & Research Single case search; Charge id: 354291 05/30/21 Restructuring Concepts/netDockets: Moshe Outside \$3.27 **Documents** Melcer; 5/30/2021 6:23:00 PM; Description: Downloaded T0202: Docket #1077 (Main & Research Document); Charge id: 354379 05/30/21 Outside Restructuring Concepts/netDockets: Moshe \$3.27 Melcer; 5/30/2021 6:35:00 PM; Description: **Documents** Downloaded N0108: Docket #354; Charge id: & Research 354380 05/30/21 Outside Restructuring Concepts/netDockets: Moshe \$3.27 **Documents** Melcer: 5/30/2021 6:15:00 PM: Description: & Research Downloaded K0018: Docket #716; Charge id: 354373 05/30/21 Outside Restructuring Concepts/netDockets: Moshe \$3.27 Melcer; 5/30/2021 6:18:00 PM; Description: **Documents** & Research Downloaded G0063: Docket #1150 (Main Document); Charge id: 354374 05/30/21 Restructuring Concepts/netDockets: Moshe Outside \$3.27 Melcer; 5/30/2021 6:21:00 PM; Description: **Documents** Downloaded F0145: Docket #856; Charge id: & Research 354377 05/30/21 Outside Restructuring Concepts/netDockets: Moshe \$3.27 Melcer: 5/30/2021 6:21:00 PM: Description: **Documents** & Research Downloaded H0124: Docket #494; Charge id: 354378 05/30/21 Outside Restructuring Concepts/netDockets: Moshe \$21.78 Melcer: 5/30/2021 5:24:00 PM: Description: **Documents** Multiple case search; Charge id: 354365 & Research 05/30/21 Outside Restructuring Concepts/netDockets: Moshe \$21.78 **Documents** Melcer: 5/30/2021 6:08:00 PM: Description: & Research Multiple case search; Charge id: 354368 05/30/21 Outside Restructuring Concepts/netDockets: Moshe \$3.27 Melcer; 5/30/2021 6:11:00 PM; Description: **Documents** Downloaded H0089: Docket #1091 (Main & Research Document); Charge id: 354371

DISBURSEMENT DETAIL Expense Amount **Date Vendor Name** Description Type 05/30/21 Outside Restructuring Concepts/netDockets: Moshe \$3.27 Melcer: 5/30/2021 6:13:00 PM; Description: **Documents** & Research Downloaded V0029: Docket #965 (Main Document); Charge id: 354372 Restructuring Concepts/netDockets: Moshe 05/30/21 Outside \$5.44 Melcer; 5/30/2021 12:50:00 PM; Description: **Documents** & Research Single case search; Charge id: 354349 05/30/21 Restructuring Concepts/netDockets: Moshe Outside \$3.27 **Documents** Melcer; 5/30/2021 12:50:00 PM; Description: Downloaded F0016: Docket #844: Charge id: & Research 354350 05/30/21 Outside Restructuring Concepts/netDockets: Moshe \$21.78 Melcer; 5/30/2021 6:19:00 PM; Description: **Documents** Multiple case search; Charge id: 354375 & Research Outside 05/30/21 Restructuring Concepts/netDockets: Moshe \$3.27 **Documents** Melcer; 5/30/2021 6:20:00 PM; Description: & Research Downloaded T0151: Docket #4719; Charge id: 354376 05/30/21 Outside Restructuring Concepts/netDockets: Moshe \$21.78 **Documents** Melcer; 5/30/2021 4:48:00 PM; Description: Multiple case search; Charge id: 354363 & Research Restructuring Concepts/netDockets: Moshe 05/30/21 Outside \$3.27 **Documents** Melcer; 5/30/2021 5:24:00 PM; Description: Downloaded W0051: Docket #4483 (Main & Research Document); Charge id: 354364 05/30/21 Restructuring Concepts/netDockets: Moshe Outside \$3.27 Melcer: 5/30/2021 11:28:00 AM: Description: Documents & Research Downloaded D0004: Docket #4946; Charge id: 354341 05/30/21 Outside Restructuring Concepts/netDockets: Moshe \$3.27 Melcer; 5/30/2021 11:33:00 AM; Description: Documents & Research Downloaded D0004: Docket #5225; Charge id: 354342 05/30/21 Outside Restructuring Concepts/netDockets: Moshe \$3.27 **Documents** Melcer; 5/30/2021 6:09:00 PM; Description: & Research Downloaded F0145: Docket #1031; Charge id: 354369 05/30/21 Outside Restructuring Concepts/netDockets: Moshe \$3.27 **Documents** Melcer; 5/30/2021 6:11:00 PM; Description: Downloaded T0218: Docket #1159 (Main & Research Document); Charge id: 354370

DISBURSEMENT DETAIL Expense Date Vendor Name Description Amount Type 05/30/21 Outside Restructuring Concepts/netDockets: Moshe \$5.44 **Documents** Melcer; 5/30/2021 12:28:00 PM; Description: & Research Single case search; Charge id: 354345 05/30/21 Outside Restructuring Concepts/netDockets: Moshe \$5.44 Melcer; 5/30/2021 12:29:00 PM; Description: **Documents** & Research Single case search; Charge id: 354346 05/30/21 Restructuring Concepts/netDockets: Moshe \$5.44 Outside Melcer; 5/30/2021 11:03:00 AM; Description: **Documents** Single case search; Charge id: 354335 & Research 05/30/21 Outside Restructuring Concepts/netDockets: Moshe \$5.44 **Documents** Melcer; 5/30/2021 11:09:00 AM; Description: Single case search; Charge id: 354336 & Research 05/30/21 Outside Restructuring Concepts/netDockets: Moshe \$3.27 Documents Melcer; 5/30/2021 12:55:00 PM; Description: & Research Downloaded F0016: Docket #853; Charge id: 354351 05/30/21 Outside Restructuring Concepts/netDockets: Moshe \$21.78 Melcer; 5/30/2021 4:34:00 PM; Description: **Documents** & Research Multiple case search; Charge id: 354362 Restructuring Concepts/netDockets: Moshe 05/30/21 Outside \$3.27 **Documents** Melcer; 5/30/2021 11:20:00 AM; Description: Downloaded N0007: Docket #2959; Charge id: & Research 354339 05/30/21 Restructuring Concepts/netDockets: Moshe Outside \$5.44 Melcer; 5/30/2021 11:28:00 AM; Description: **Documents** & Research Single case search; Charge id: 354340 05/30/21 Outside Restructuring Concepts/netDockets: Moshe \$3.27 **Documents** Melcer; 5/30/2021 10:27:00 AM; Description: & Research Downloaded M0059: Docket #599; Charge id: 354329 05/30/21 Restructuring Concepts/netDockets: Moshe Outside \$3.27 Melcer; 5/30/2021 10:28:00 AM; Description: **Documents** & Research Downloaded M0059: Docket #929; Charge id: 354330 05/30/21 Outside Restructuring Concepts/netDockets: Moshe \$5.44 **Documents** Melcer; 5/30/2021 11:54:00 AM; Description: Single case search; Charge id: 354343 & Research 05/30/21 Outside Restructuring Concepts/netDockets: Moshe \$3.27 Melcer; 5/30/2021 11:54:00 AM; Description: Documents & Research Downloaded A0287: Docket #433; Charge id: 354344

DISBURSEMENT DETAIL Expense Date Vendor Name Description Amount Type Restructuring Concepts/netDockets: Moshe 05/30/21 Outside \$5.44 **Documents** Melcer; 5/30/2021 10:53:00 AM; Description: & Research Single case search; Charge id: 354333 05/30/21 Outside Restructuring Concepts/netDockets: Moshe \$3.27 Melcer; 5/30/2021 10:54:00 AM; Description: **Documents** Downloaded U0004: Docket #1853; Charge id: & Research 354334 05/30/21 Restructuring Concepts/netDockets: Moshe Outside \$3.27 **Documents** Melcer; 5/30/2021 7:28:00 AM; Description: & Research Downloaded N0007: Docket #2863 (Proposed Order); Charge id: 354294 Restructuring Concepts/netDockets: Moshe 05/30/21 Outside \$5.44 Melcer; 5/30/2021 7:37:00 AM; Description: **Documents** Single case search; Charge id: 354295 & Research 05/30/21 Outside Restructuring Concepts/netDockets: Moshe \$5.44 **Documents** Melcer; 5/30/2021 11:17:00 AM; Description: & Research Single case search; Charge id: 354337 Restructuring Concepts/netDockets: Moshe 05/30/21 Outside \$3.27 **Documents** Melcer; 5/30/2021 11:20:00 AM; Description: Downloaded N0007: Docket #5488; Charge id: & Research 354338 Restructuring Concepts/netDockets: Moshe 05/30/21 Outside \$5.44 **Documents** Melcer; 5/30/2021 10:16:00 AM; Description: Single case search; Charge id: 354327 & Research Restructuring Concepts/netDockets: Moshe 05/30/21 Outside \$5.44 **Documents** Melcer; 5/30/2021 10:26:00 AM; Description: & Research Single case search; Charge id: 354328 Outside Restructuring Concepts/netDockets: Moshe 05/30/21 \$3.27 Melcer; 5/30/2021 10:29:00 AM; Description: Documents Downloaded M0059: Docket #1250; Charge id: & Research 354331 05/30/21 Outside Restructuring Concepts/netDockets: Moshe \$5.44 **Documents** Melcer; 5/30/2021 10:53:00 AM; Description: & Research Single case search; Charge id: 354332 05/30/21 Outside Restructuring Concepts/netDockets: Moshe \$3.27 **Documents** Melcer; 5/30/2021 7:23:00 AM; Description: Downloaded N0007: Docket #1627 (Main & Research Document); Charge id: 354292

DISBURSEMENT DETAIL Expense Date Vendor Name Description Amount Type 05/30/21 Outside Restructuring Concepts/netDockets: Moshe \$3.27 **Documents** Melcer; 5/30/2021 7:25:00 AM; Description: & Research Downloaded N0007: Docket #1627 (Proposed Order); Charge id: 354293 Restructuring Concepts/netDockets: Moshe 05/30/21 Outside \$5.44 Melcer; 5/30/2021 10:15:00 AM; Description: **Documents** & Research Single case search; Charge id: 354325 05/30/21 Restructuring Concepts/netDockets: Moshe Outside \$5.44 **Documents** Melcer; 5/30/2021 10:15:00 AM; Description: & Research Single case search: Charge id: 354326 05/31/21 Restructuring Concepts/netDockets: Moshe Outside \$3.27 Melcer; 5/31/2021 8:06:00 AM; Description: **Documents** Downloaded A0141: Docket #558; Charge id: & Research 354393 05/31/21 Outside Restructuring Concepts/netDockets: Moshe \$3.27 **Documents** Melcer; 5/31/2021 8:06:00 AM; Description: & Research Downloaded M0040: Docket #2355 (Main Document); Charge id: 354394 05/31/21 Outside Restructuring Concepts/netDockets: Moshe \$21.78 **Documents** Melcer; 5/31/2021 4:41:00 PM; Description: Multiple case search; Charge id: 354416 & Research Restructuring Concepts/netDockets: Moshe 05/31/21 Outside \$21.78 Melcer; 5/31/2021 4:41:00 PM; Description: **Documents** Multiple case search; Charge id: 354417 & Research Restructuring Concepts/netDockets: Moshe 05/31/21 Outside \$3.27 **Documents** Melcer; 5/31/2021 8:09:00 AM; Description: & Research Downloaded B0077: Docket #384 (Main Document); Charge id: 354397 05/31/21 Outside Restructuring Concepts/netDockets: Moshe \$3.27 Melcer; 5/31/2021 8:10:00 AM; Description: **Documents** & Research Downloaded B0016: Docket #1976; Charge id: 354398 Restructuring Concepts/netDockets: Moshe 05/31/21 Outside \$3.27 **Documents** Melcer: 5/31/2021 6:33:00 AM: Description: & Research Downloaded F0093: Docket #201 (Main Document); Charge id: 354385 Restructuring Concepts/netDockets: Moshe 05/31/21 Outside \$3.27 Melcer; 5/31/2021 6:34:00 AM; Description: **Documents** & Research Downloaded C0175: Docket #548; Charge id: 354386

DISBURSEMENT DETAIL Expense Date Vendor Name Description Amount Type 05/31/21 Outside Restructuring Concepts/netDockets: Moshe \$21.78 **Documents** Melcer: 5/31/2021 8:13:00 AM: Description: & Research Multiple case search; Charge id: 354401 05/31/21 Outside Restructuring Concepts/netDockets: Moshe \$21.78 Melcer; 5/31/2021 8:13:00 AM; Description: **Documents** Multiple case search; Charge id: 354402 & Research 05/31/21 Restructuring Concepts/netDockets: Moshe Outside \$3.27 Melcer; 5/31/2021 6:35:00 AM; Description: **Documents** & Research Downloaded S0151: Docket #312; Charge id: 354389 05/31/21 Outside Restructuring Concepts/netDockets: Moshe \$3.27 Melcer; 5/31/2021 8:05:00 AM; Description: **Documents** Downloaded L0073: Docket #682; Charge id: & Research 354392 05/31/21 Outside Restructuring Concepts/netDockets: Moshe \$3.27 **Documents** Melcer; 5/31/2021 8:07:00 AM; Description: & Research Downloaded K0016: Docket #719; Charge id: 354395 05/31/21 Outside Restructuring Concepts/netDockets: Moshe \$3.27 **Documents** Melcer; 5/31/2021 8:08:00 AM; Description: Downloaded G0067: Docket #2325; Charge id: & Research 354396 05/31/21 Outside Restructuring Concepts/netDockets: Moshe \$21.78 Melcer; 5/31/2021 6:30:00 AM; Description: **Documents** & Research Multiple case search; Charge id: 354383 05/31/21 Restructuring Concepts/netDockets: Moshe Outside \$3.27 Melcer; 5/31/2021 6:32:00 AM; Description: Documents & Research Downloaded T0202: Docket #1077 (Main Document); Charge id: 354384 05/31/21 Outside Restructuring Concepts/netDockets: Moshe \$3.27 Melcer; 5/31/2021 6:34:00 AM; Description: Documents & Research Downloaded H0038: Docket #1059 (Main Document): Charge id: 354387 05/31/21 Outside Restructuring Concepts/netDockets: Moshe \$3.27 **Documents** Melcer; 5/31/2021 6:35:00 AM; Description: & Research Downloaded V0029: Docket #695 (Main Document); Charge id: 354388 05/31/21 Outside Restructuring Concepts/netDockets: Moshe \$21.78 Melcer; 5/31/2021 6:25:00 AM; Description: **Documents** & Research Multiple case search; Charge id: 354381

DISBURSEMENT DETAIL Expense Date **Vendor Name** Description Amount Type 05/31/21 Restructuring Concepts/netDockets: Moshe \$3.27 Outside **Documents** Melcer: 5/31/2021 6:26:00 AM: Description: & Research Downloaded M0059: Docket #1856; Charge id: 354382 05/31/21 Outside Restructuring Concepts/netDockets: Moshe \$21.78 Melcer; 5/31/2021 4:56:00 PM; Description: **Documents** & Research Multiple case search; Charge id: 354418 05/31/21 Outside Restructuring Concepts/netDockets: Moshe \$3.27 Melcer; 5/31/2021 4:57:00 PM; Description: **Documents** Downloaded H0124: Docket #469: Charge id: & Research 354419 Restructuring Concepts/netDockets: Moshe 05/31/21 Outside \$3.27 Melcer; 5/31/2021 8:11:00 AM; Description: **Documents** Downloaded L0042: Docket #663 (Main & Research Document); Charge id: 354399 05/31/21 Outside Restructuring Concepts/netDockets: Moshe \$3.27 Melcer: 5/31/2021 8:12:00 AM: Description: **Documents** & Research Downloaded L0042: Docket #663 (Exhibit B -Claims to be Reclassified); Charge id: 354400 Postage, 05/11/21 From Richard J. Steinberg to Timothy Graulich \$113.68 courier & freight 05/11/21 Postage, From Richard J. Steinberg to Richard J. \$127.00 courier & Steinberg freight 05/11/21 From Richard J. Steinberg to James I. \$115.00 Postage, courier & McClammy freight From Olivia Altman to Andrea Schwartz 05/12/21 Postage, \$23.00 courier & freight 05/19/21 Postage, From Olivia Altman to Shelley Chapman \$23.50 courier & freight **TOTAL** \$3,999.72

Time Detail By Project				
Name	Date	Hours	Narrative	
AM100 Aircraft/Eng	ines			
Green, Thomas S. Melcer, Moshe	06/01/21 06/01/21	0.4 2.6	Review and revise lessor proposal questions. Draft motion to approve aircraft transactions (1.4); correspondence with T. Green regarding same (0.1); correspondence with J. Sturm regarding same (0.2); draft motion to approve settlement related to aircraft transaction (0.9).	
Sturm, Josh	06/01/21	4.2	Correspondence with M. Melcer regarding Clover Rule 9019 motion (0.4); correspondence with T. Green regarding Wings agreement (0.6); correspondence with White & Case regarding Carlyle agreement (0.4); correspondence with Davis Polk Fleet team regarding Carlyle motion status (0.3); correspondence with White & Case and Davis Polk Fleet team regarding Embraer confidentiality (0.7); comment on Carlyle motion (0.4); correspondence with Davis Polk Fleet team regarding same (0.5); review Norton Rose confidentiality comments (0.3); comment on Avolon motion (0.6).	
Graulich, Timothy Melcer, Moshe	06/02/21 06/02/21	2.8 3.0	Review and revise Clover Rule 9019 motion. Review and revise motion to approve aircraft transactions (0.9); draft motion to approve settlement related to aircraft transaction (1.7); email with J. Sturm and T. Green regarding same (0.3); email with T. Graulich regarding same (0.1).	
Sturm, Josh	06/02/21	2.2	Correspondence with Morris Nichols regarding engine payment motion (0.3); comment on revised Carlyle motion (0.5); correspondence with M. Melcer regarding same (0.2); comment on revised Clover Rule 9019 motion (0.6); correspondence with M. Melcer regarding same (0.3); correspondence with A. Husain regarding aircraft (0.3).	
Melcer, Moshe	06/03/21	4.6	Review and revise draft settlement motion relating to aircraft transaction (2.5); call with J. Sturm regarding Clover Rule 9019 motion (0.4); email with White & Case and Skyworks regarding same (0.2); email with AlixPartners and Skyworks regarding same (0.2); draft motion to approve aircraft transactions (1.3).	
Sturm, Josh	06/03/21	4.5	Call with A. Hussein regarding FlightSafety negotiations (0.4); correspondence with Skyworks and Davis Polk Fleet teams regarding Aviator order (0.7); review comments to Clover Rule 9019 motion (0.3); correspondence with Davis Polk Fleet team regarding same (0.8); correspondence with T. Green regarding GenX extension (0.4); correspondence with Skyworks, Rothschild and Davis Polk Fleet team regarding Avolon Non-Disclosure Agreement (0.7); correspondence with White & Case and Skyworks regarding FlightSafety agreements (0.4); review White & Case's comments to Clover Rule 9019 motion (0.4); call with M. Melcer regarding same (0.4).	
Melcer, Moshe	06/04/21	1.8	Review and revise motion to approve settlement related to aircraft transactions (1.3); call with Skyworks regarding same (0.5).	
Sturm, Josh	06/04/21	1.7	Correspondence with M. Melcer regarding Clover Rule 9019 motion (0.9); correspondence with C. Dietz regarding Avolon agreement terms (0.8).	
Melcer, Moshe	06/06/21	1.5	Call with J. Sturm regarding settlement motion related to aircraft transactions (0.4); review and revise settlement motion related to aircraft transactions (1.1).	

Time Detail By Project			
Name	Date	Hours	Narrative
Sturm, Josh	06/06/21	0.4	Call with M. Melcer regarding settlement motion related to aircraft transactions.
Green, Thomas S.	06/07/21	0.8	Review and revise GE documents.
Melcer, Moshe	06/07/21	0.5	Review and revise motion to approve aircraft settlement (0.4); email Skyworks and White & Case regarding same (0.1).
Sturm, Josh	06/07/21	1.9	Correspondence with Skyworks and White & Case regarding simulators (0.5); correspondence with T. Green regarding GenX agreement (0.6); correspondence with A. Andreeva and Skyworks regarding FlightSafety (0.4); review GE lease extension comments (0.4).
Green, Thomas S.	06/08/21	0.4	Call with J. Sturm regarding GE amendment.
Melcer, Moshe	06/08/21	0.3	Review and revise motion to approve aircraft transactions.
Sturm, Josh	06/08/21	2.5	Comment on GE agreement (0.5); correspondence with White & Case regarding Ex-Im agreements (0.4); correspondence with White & Case regarding MUFG letter of intent (0.3); correspondence with M. Melcer regarding pending fleet motions (0.4); call with T. Green regarding GE amendment (0.4); correspondence with White & Case regarding GE agreement (0.3); correspondence with Morris Nichols and Aeroméxico regarding engine payment motion (0.2).
Melcer, Moshe	06/09/21	0.1	Review and revise motion to approve aircraft transaction.
Sturm, Josh	06/09/21	0.9	Call with Ex-Im regarding long-term agreement (0.4); correspondence with White & Case regarding Yamasa JOLCO agreements (0.2); correspondence with Vedder Price regarding Ex-Im agreement (0.3).
Melcer, Moshe	06/10/21	1.4	Review and revise motion to approve aircraft transactions (1.1); email with J. Sturm regarding same (0.1); email with Skyworks and White & Case regarding same (0.2).
Sturm, Josh	06/10/21	1.1	Correspondence with White & Case regarding Avolon agreement (0.7); correspondence with Morris Nichols regarding revisions to engine payment motion (0.4).
Melcer, Moshe	06/11/21	0.7	Review and revise motion to approve aircraft transactions (0.6); correspondence with J. Sturm regarding same (0.1).
Sturm, Josh	06/11/21	0.8	Correspondence with M. Melcer regarding Avolon motion (0.5); comment on Avolon order (0.3)
Sturm, Josh	06/14/21	0.4	Correspondence with R. Smith regarding financed aircraft delivery (0.3); review correspondence with Ex-Im regarding term sheet (0.1).
Sturm, Josh	06/15/21	0.2	Correspondence with Morris Nichols regarding engine payment motion revisions.
Green, Thomas S.	06/16/21	0.5	Correspondence with M. Melcer regarding unredacted orders (0.2); analyze same (0.3).
Sturm, Josh	06/16/21	1.1	Correspondence with Morris Nichols regarding engine payment motion (0.2); correspondence with Davis Polk Fleet team regarding status of Avolon motion (0.1); correspondence with White & Case and Skyworks regarding Ex-Im agreement (0.3); correspondence with Skyworks regarding TrueNoord negotiations (0.5).
Green, Thomas S. Sturm, Josh	06/17/21 06/17/21	0.2 1.7	Analyze SMBC lease. Correspondence with Skyworks regarding TrueNoord (0.3); correspondence with White & Case and Davis Polk Finance team regarding Ex-Im engine (0.3); correspondence with Skyworks regarding Runway agreement (0.3); comment on Aeroméxico letter of intent (0.5); correspondence with A. Andreeva regarding same (0.2); review correspondence from Morris Nichols and Skyworks regarding engine payment

Time Detail By Project			
Name	Date	Hours	Narrative
Sturm, Josh	06/18/21	0.9	motion (0.1). Correspondence with Skyworks regarding TrueNoord (0.2); correspondence with White & Case regarding Ex-Im
Melcer, Moshe	06/21/21	0.1	agreement (0.2); correspondence with Vedder Price and White & Case regarding same (0.5). Email with Holland & Knight regarding draft motion to approve
			aircraft transactions.
Sturm, Josh Melcer, Moshe	06/21/21 06/22/21	0.3 0.2	Call with White & Case regarding AerCap transaction. Correspondence with J. Sturm regarding motion to approve aircraft transactions.
Sturm, Josh	06/22/21	1.0	Review correspondence with Aeroméxico regarding additional engines (0.6); call with A. Andreeva regarding same (0.4).
Melcer, Moshe	06/23/21	0.7	Call with Aeroméxico, Skyworks, White & Case, and Davis Polk Fleet teams regarding engines (0.5); review motions to approve aircraft transactions (0.2).
Piraino, Stephen D.	06/23/21	0.5	Call with Aeroméxico Fleet team regarding engines.
Sturm, Josh	06/23/21	1.3	Call with Aeroméxico, White & Case and AlixPartners
			regarding additional engine (0.5); correspondence with Davis Polk Fleet team regarding same (0.2); correspondence with White & Case and Davis Polk Fleet team regarding aircraft leasing issues (0.4); correspondence with M. Melcer regarding
			fleet update (0.2).
Green, Thomas S.	06/24/21	2.0	Analyze rejection orders and stipulations for Skyworks modeling.
Melcer, Moshe	06/24/21	0.2	Review draft motion to approve aircraft transactions.
Sturm, Josh	06/24/21	1.0	Correspondence with White & Case and Skyworks regarding Ex-Im agreement (0.3); correspondence with White & Case and Davis Polk Finance team regarding engine replacement (0.2); correspondence with M. Landess regarding damaged engine replacement (0.3); correspondence with M. Melcer regarding Clover Rule 9019 motion (0.2).
Melcer, Moshe	06/25/21	0.2	Review motion to approve aircraft transactions.
Sturm, Josh	06/25/21	0.6	Correspondence with M. Melcer regarding Clover Rule 9019 motion (0.3); review correspondence with White & Case regarding same (0.3).
Melcer, Moshe	06/27/21	0.4	Email with J. Sturm regarding motion to approve aircraft transactions (0.1); review draft motion to approve aircraft transactions (0.3).
Sturm, Josh	06/27/21	0.4	Comment on Clover Rule 9019 motion.
Green, Thomas S.	06/28/21	1.4	Review and revise representation and warranty letter.
Melcer, Moshe	06/28/21	2.6	Review and revise motion to approve aircraft transactions (2.4); correspondence with J. Sturm regarding same (0.2).
Sturm, Josh	06/28/21	3.3	Comment on Aviator motion (0.6); correspondence with Davis Polk Fleet team regarding same (0.4); correspondence with C. Hansen regarding GE agreement (0.6); review draft of same (0.4); correspondence with Davis Polk Fleet team and Skyworks regarding Fuyo stipulation (0.3); call with A. Andreeva regarding Ex-Im timing (0.2); correspondence with M. Melcer regarding Clover Rule 9019 motion (0.8).
Melcer, Moshe	06/29/21	0.6	Review and revise motion to approve aircraft transactions (0.4); email with J. Sturm and T. Green regarding motion to approve aircraft transactions (0.2).
Sturm, Josh	06/29/21	4.6	Correspondence with Davis Polk Fleet team regarding pending fleet matters (0.4); correspondence with White & Case and Davis Polk Restructuring and Fleet teams regarding DAE negotiations (0.9); correspondence with White & Case

Time Detail By Project			
Name	Date	Hours	Narrative
			and Davis Polk Restructuring and Fleet teams regarding motion for approval of potential DAE agreement (0.7); correspondence with White & Case regarding GE engine lease agreement terms (0.6); correspondence with C. Dietz and Davis Fleet Polk team regarding Fuyo letter of intent (0.4); review comments to Clover Rule 9019 motion (0.5); correspondence with Davis Polk and Clifford Chance regarding same (0.8); call with Clifford Chance regarding same (0.3).
Graulich, Timothy Green, Thomas S.	06/30/21 06/30/21	2.8 1.1	Review and revise letter of intent motion. Review and revise DAE motion (0.9); call with J. Sturm and
Melcer, Moshe	06/30/21	2.4	others regarding same (0.2). Email with J. Sturm and T. Green regarding fleet workstreams (0.4); call with T. Green and others regarding same (0.2); draft
Sturm, Josh	06/30/21	3.5	motion to approve aircraft transactions (1.8). Call with White & Case regarding DVB/MUFG representations (0.5); correspondence with Skyworks and White & Case regarding DAE letter of intent (0.7); correspondence with White & Case regarding Technic services (0.4); correspondence with Davis Polk Fleet team regarding pending aircraft lease negotiations (0.6); call with M. Landess regarding same (0.3); correspondence with White & Case and Skyworks regarding DAE negotiations (0.6); correspondence with White & Case regarding engine purchase (0.4).
Total AM100 Aircraft/	Engines	77.3	
AM110 Automatic Sta Joffroy, Elena	ay/Litigation 02/01/21	3.2	Analyze case law regarding contempt sanctions (1.4); revise contempt motion (0.6); revise declaration in support of same (1.2).
Joffroy, Elena	02/18/21	0.7	Draft letter to court regarding Newrest contempt sanctions.
Joffroy, Elena	02/25/21	0.2	
Joffroy, Elena	02/26/21	3.3	Draft information subpoenas regarding Newrest entities.
McClammy, James I.	06/01/21	1.1	Call with Aeroméxico regarding counteroffer (0.7); email with same regarding same (0.4).
McClammy, James I.	06/02/21	0.2	Correspondence with Davis Polk Litigation team regarding Newrest.
McClammy, James I.	06/09/21	0.5	Call with R. Krammer regarding Newrest (0.3); email with same regarding same (0.2).
McClammy, James I. Rincon, Cristina M.	06/11/21 06/11/21	1.5 0.3	Analyze issues regarding Newrest counteroffer. Review Newrest counteroffer (0.1); correspondence with Aeroméxico regarding same (0.2).
Rincon, Cristina M. Jerrard, Erik	06/15/21 06/16/21	0.3 1.0	Call with Aeroméxico regarding Newrest counteroffer. Correspondence with J. McClammy and T. Graulich regarding
Rincon, Cristina M.	06/16/21	0.1	litigation issues. Review flight volume information in preparation for Newrest settlement.
Rincon, Cristina M.	06/22/21	1.8	Correspondence with Aeroméxico regarding Newrest's response to settlement (0.4); draft settlement agreement (1.4).
Piraino, Stephen D.	06/23/21	0.3	Call with C. Rincon and others regarding Newrest settlement (0.2); correspondence with Willkie Farr regarding same (0.1).
Rincon, Cristina M.	06/23/21	0.2	Call with S. Piraino and others regarding Newrest settlement.
McClammy, James I.	06/25/21	0.6	Correspondence with Davis Polk team regarding Newrest (0.4); call with R. Krammer regarding same (0.2).
Rincon, Cristina M.	06/25/21	0.3	Call with R. Krammer regarding Newrest litigation (0.2); email

Time Detail By Project			
Name	Date	Hours	Narrative
McClammy, James I. McClammy, James I.	06/26/21 06/28/21	0.5 1.1	with Aeroméxico regarding Newrest (0.1). Correspondence with R. Krammer regarding Newrest. Correspondence with Davis Polk team regarding Newrest
Rincon, Cristina M.	06/28/21	1.3	(0.5); call with Willkie Farr regarding Newrest resolution (0.6). Call with Willkie Farr regarding Newrest settlement (0.2); correspondence with J. McClammy regarding same (0.1); draf
Rincon, Cristina M.	06/29/21	1.2	Newrest settlement agreement (1.0). Draft Newrest settlement agreement (0.6); draft Rule 9019 motion regarding same (0.6).
Graulich, Timothy	06/30/21	0.7	Correspondence with J. McClammy regarding litigation issues.
Masaro, Matthew Bruno	06/30/21	0.2	Correspondence with S. Cunningham, T. Graulich, and others regarding automatic stay lift stipulation.
McClammy, James I.	06/30/21	2.3	Call with advisor regarding litigation issues (1.0); correspondence with T. Graulich and others regarding litigation issues (0.8); review agreements regarding litigation issues (0.5).
Rincon, Cristina M.	06/30/21	2.6	Draft term sheet for Newrest settlement (1.3); draft Rule 9019 order (1.3).
Total AM110 Automa Stay/Litigation	tic	25.5	
AM130 Bar Date/Esti	mation/Claims <i>A</i>	llowance Iss	sues
Joffroy, Elena	02/19/21	1.0	Analyze case law regarding claims issue.
Erickson, Jarret	06/01/21	6.1	Review and revise omnibus claim objections (3.5); research and review precedent regarding same (1.1); review and revise notices for same (0.6); correspondence with M. Melcer regarding same (0.9).
Jerrard, Erik	06/01/21	0.6	Email with M. Melcer regarding omnibus claims objections.
Masaro, Matthew Bruno	06/01/21	0.2	Correspondence with AlixPartners regarding claim objections.
Melcer, Moshe	06/01/21	5.8	Draft omnibus claims objection (4.3); email with J. Erickson and R. Steinberg regarding same (0.6); correspondence with J. Erickson regarding same (0.4); correspondence with R. Steinberg regarding same (0.1); email with Sainz Abogados regarding same (0.1); email with AlixPartners regarding same (0.3).
Erickson, Jarret	06/02/21	1.5	Review proposed schedules to omnibus claims objections (0.2); call with M. Melcer regarding same (0.1); correspondence with AlixPartners regarding same (0.2); review notice procedures and deadlines for omnibus claims objection (0.3); review and revise omnibus claims objections (0.7).
Graulich, Timothy	06/02/21	2.6	Review and revise omnibus claims objections.
Jerrard, Erik	06/02/21	2.4	Review and revise filing version of omnibus claims objections (1.3) email with M. Melcer and J. Erickson regarding same (0.7); email with committee counsel regarding same (0.4).
Melcer, Moshe	06/02/21	4.4	Review and revise omnibus claim objection (1.7); correspondence with R. Steinberg regarding same (0.3); call with J. Erickson regarding schedules to same (0.1); email with Sainz Abogados regarding same (0.3); email with AlixPartners regarding same (0.2); email with T. Graulich regarding same (0.2); email with Aeroméxico regarding same (0.4); correspondence with J. Erickson and R. Steinberg regarding same (0.3); review proposed schedules for omnibus claim objections (0.9).

Time Detail By Project			
Name	Date	Hours	Narrative
Sturm, Josh	06/02/21	0.8	Correspondence with C. Hansen and Davis Polk team regarding reimbursement of passenger claims (0.7); correspondence with S. Piraino regarding same (0.1).
Erickson, Jarret	06/03/21	1.0	Review and revise omnibus claims objections (0.4); review and revise notices regarding same (0.3); coordinate filing of same (0.3).
Graulich, Timothy	06/03/21	0.7	Correspondence with S. Piraino and E. Jerrard regarding customer claims.
Jerrard, Erik	06/03/21	1.5	Call with AlixPartners, Sainz Abogados, and Davis Polk Restructuring team regarding customer claims (0.8); review and revise customer claims communications (0.7).
Melcer, Moshe	06/03/21	2.7	Review and revise omnibus claim objections (1.7); coordinate with Aeroméxico, Sainz Abogados, AlixPartners, Epiq, and Davis Polk Claims team regarding same (0.7); email with J. Erickson regarding claims workstreams (0.2); analyze withdrawn claims (0.1).
Piraino, Stephen D.	06/03/21	1.0	Call with AlixPartners, Sainz Abogados and Davis Polk Restructuring team regarding customer claims (0.8); correspondence with E. Jerrard regarding claims issues (0.2).
Sturm, Josh	06/03/21	0.5	Call with Skyworks and White & Case regarding Ex-Im claims.
Erickson, Jarret	06/04/21	0.9	Review correspondence from creditors regarding omnibus
Znokoon, oanot	00/01/21	0.0	claims objections (0.4); draft email responses to same (0.5).
Melcer, Moshe	06/04/21	3.3	Analyze objected claims (0.8); draft correspondence to claimants regarding same (1.1); email with Sainz Abogados regarding translations of same (0.1); review and revise claimant inbound tracker (0.4); review and summarize claims related aircraft transactions (0.7); correspondence with J.
Sturm, Josh	06/04/21	1.1	Sturm regarding same (0.2). Call with Skyworks and White & Case regarding Ex-Im claims (0.5); correspondence with M. Melcer regarding resolving
Melcer, Moshe	06/05/21	0.1	creditor proofs of claim (0.6). Review correspondence from White & Case regarding aircraft claims settlement.
Masaro, Matthew Bruno	06/06/21	0.1	Correspondence with M. Melcer regarding proof of claim.
Sturm, Josh	06/06/21	0.4	Correspondence with Davis Polk team and other advisors regarding reconciliation of creditor claims.
Erickson, Jarret	06/07/21	0.7	Review correspondence from creditors regarding omnibus claims objection (0.3); draft correspondence regarding same (0.4)
Masaro, Matthew Bruno	06/07/21	1.0	Correspondence with M. Melcer regarding claims objections (0.3); review proofs of claim related to same (0.7).
Melcer, Moshe	06/07/21	2.6	Draft correspondence to claimants regarding objected claims (1.3); analyze claims related to assumed contracts (0.6); correspondence with M. Masaro regarding same (0.2); analyze claims related to aircraft (0.5).
Sturm, Josh	06/07/21	3.3	Review Clover claims settlement order (0.5); correspondence with M. Melcer, T. Graulich and White & Case regarding same (1.0); correspondence with Clifford Chance regarding same (0.6); correspondence with Epiq regarding addressing same in claims register (0.3); correspondence with M. Melcer and White & Case regarding Santander settlement (0.9).
Erickson, Jarret	06/08/21	1.9	Review creditor correspondence regarding omnibus claims objections (0.8); draft responses to same (1.1).
Melcer, Moshe	06/08/21	1.8	Draft correspondence to claimants regarding objected claims (0.6); coordinate with Sainz Abogados team regarding

Time Detail By Project			
Name	Date	Hours	Narrative
			translations of same (0.1); review and revise claimant inbound tracker (0.7); correspondence with J. Erickson regarding same (0.3); correspondence with J. Sturm regarding aircraft claims (0.1).
Erickson, Jarret	06/09/21	1.0	Research security interest issue (0.7); correspondence with M. Melcer regarding same (0.3).
Jerrard, Erik	06/09/21	1.7	Email with M. Melcer regarding claims analysis (0.5); analyze customer claims information provided by Aeroméxico (1.2).
Melcer, Moshe	06/09/21	2.6	Analyze priority of claims (1.8); draft correspondence to claimant regarding objected claim (0.3); coordinate with Sainz Abogados for translation of claimant correspondence (0.1); correspondence with J. Erickson regarding same (0.2); review customer claims summary (0.2).
Piraino, Stephen D.	06/09/21	0.2	Email with Davis Polk team regarding claims issue.
Sturm, Josh	06/09/21	0.4	Correspondence with White & Case and Davis Polk team regarding claimant claims.
Erickson, Jarret	06/10/21	1.9	Call with M. Melcer regarding claims workstreams (0.7); correspondence with creditor regarding omnibus claims objections (1.2).
Melcer, Moshe	06/10/21	1.9	Correspondence with claimant regarding objected claim (0.1); review and revise claimant inbound tracker (0.4); call with J. Erickson regarding claims workstreams (0.7); correspondence with M. Masaro regarding disputed claims (0.1); correspondence with claimant regarding objected claim (0.3); analyze objected claims (0.3).
Erickson, Jarret	06/11/21	2.3	Call with Aeroméxico, AlixPartners, and others regarding refunds to customers (1.0); call with AlixPartners and M. Melcer regarding upcoming omnibus claims objections (0.7); review correspondence from creditors regarding omnibus claims objections (0.6)
Jerrard, Erik	06/11/21	0.9	Correspondence with J. Erickson and M. Melcer regarding customer claims approach.
Melcer, Moshe	06/11/21	2.9	Call with Aeroméxico, AlixPartners, and others regarding refunds to customers (1.0); call with J. Erickson and AlixPartners regarding upcoming omnibus claims objections (0.7); correspondence with J. Erickson regarding same (0.5); review, analyze, and summarize fleet claims (0.7).
Piraino, Stephen D.	06/11/21	0.8	Correspondence with E. Jerrard and others regarding customer claims approach.
Melcer, Moshe	06/12/21	0.5	Email with AlixPartners regarding upcoming claims rejections (0.1); review, analyze, and summarize fleet claims (0.4).
Melcer, Moshe Erickson, Jarret	06/13/21 06/14/21	0.3 1.3	Correspondence with claimant regarding objected claim. Review customer inquiries regarding omnibus claims objection (0.2); draft correspondence regarding same (0.3); correspondence with M. Melcer regarding same (0.3); review
Melcer, Moshe	06/14/21	1.5	fleet claims reconciliation issues (0.5). Correspondence with claimant regarding objected claim (0.3); review and revise claimant inbound tracker (0.2); email with AlixPartners, Davis Polk, and Skyworks teams regarding fleet claims (0.2); email with J. Erickson regarding same (0.3); email with J. Sturm regarding same (0.2); analyze fleet claims (0.3).
Sturm, Josh	06/14/21	0.6	Correspondence with M. Melcer regarding JSA claim (0.4); review correspondence with T. Haga regarding claims (0.2).
Erickson, Jarret	06/15/21	1.7	Call with M. Melcer regarding outstanding claims workstreams (0.6); prepare for same (0.3); correspondence with creditors

Time Detail By Project			
Name	Date	Hours	Narrative
			regarding omnibus claims objection (0.8).
Jerrard, Erik	06/15/21	1.8	Email with J. Erickson and M. Melcer regarding claims issues
Masaro, Matthew	06/15/21	0.6	(0.7); analyze claims issues (1.1). Correspondence with Allen & Overy regarding claims (0.2);
Bruno	00/10/21	0.0	call with third-party counsel regarding same (0.4).
Melcer, Moshe	06/15/21	2.7	Review and revise claimant inbound tracker (0.5); draft email to claimant counsel regarding fleet claims (0.2); draft correspondence to claimant regarding objected claim (0.3); review and revise draft responses regarding consumer claims (0.2); email with E. Jerrard about claims and currency considerations (0.1); analyze objected claims (0.2); analyze fleet claims (0.4); email with J. Sturm regarding same (0.2); call with J. Erickson regarding outstanding claims
			workstreams (0.6).
Sturm, Josh	06/15/21	0.5	Correspondence with creditor and Davis Polk team regarding claims issues (0.2); correspondence with M. Melcer and T. Thoroddsen regarding JSA claims (0.3).
Erickson, Jarret	06/16/21	1.3	Call with M. Melcer regarding outstanding claims workstream (0.4); review correspondence from creditors regarding omnibus claims objection (0.2); review and revise responses to same (0.7).
Melcer, Moshe	06/16/21	5.0	Analyze unperfected secured claims (1.2); correspondence with R. Steinberg regarding upcoming objections (0.4); call with J. Erickson regarding outstanding claims workstreams (0.6); research precedent omnibus claims objections (0.8); correspondence with Skyworks, White & Case, and Davis Policet team regarding fleet claims (0.6); analyze fleet claims (0.9); correspondence with claimant regarding claims objection (0.2); review and revise claimant inbound tracker (0.3).
Sturm, Josh Erickson, Jarret	06/16/21 06/17/21	0.4 2.2	Correspondence with M. Melcer regarding JSA claim. Correspondence with M. Melcer regarding omnibus claims objections and other claims workstreams (0.1); call with Davis Polk and AlixPartners Claims teams regarding claims objections (1.0); prepare for same (0.4); review correspondence from creditors regarding omnibus claims objection (0.2); review and revise responses to same (0.5).
Jerrard, Erik	06/17/21	1.0	Call with Davis Polk and AlixPartners Claims teams regarding claims objections.
Melcer, Moshe	06/17/21	4.6	Correspondence with claimant regarding objected claims (0.3); review and revise claimant inbound tracker (0.4); review precedent claim objections (0.5); call with Skyworks regarding fleet claims (0.5); review fleet claims (0.7); email with claiman counsel regarding fleet claims settlement (0.4); review and revise customer claim emails (0.6); call with Davis Polk and AlixPartners Claims teams regarding claims objections (1.0); correspondence with AlixPartners regarding fleet claims (0.2)
Sturm, Josh	06/17/21	1.4	Correspondence with M. Melcer and Skyworks regarding BBAM claims (0.3); correspondence with Davis Polk and Skyworks regarding BBAM claims settlement motion (0.5); correspondence with M. Melcer regarding JSA claims (0.6).
Melcer, Moshe	06/18/21	0.3	Review and compile fleet claims.
Sturm, Josh	06/18/21	8.0	Correspondence with Davis Polk Fleet team regarding insure claims related to Ex-Im agreement.
Melcer, Moshe	06/20/21	0.3	Draft motion to approve aircraft transactions.
Erickson, Jarret	06/21/21	1.2	Call with E. Jerrard, M. Melcer, and AlixPartners regarding

			Detail By Project
Name	Date	Hours	Narrative
			claims (0.5); prepare for same (0.4); call with M. Melcer regarding customer claims and upcoming omnibus claims objections (0.3).
Jerrard, Erik	06/21/21	0.5	Call with J. Erickson, M. Melcer, and AlixPartners regarding claims.
Masaro, Matthew Bruno	06/21/21	0.4	Correspondence with M. Melcer regarding claims (0.2); review proofs of claim regarding same (0.2).
Melcer, Moshe	06/21/21	1.8	Coordinate with Sainz Abogados regarding claimant correspondence (0.1); call with E. Jerrard, J. Erickson, and AlixPartners regarding claims (0.5); call with J. Erickson regarding customer claims and upcoming omnibus claim objections (0.3); draft email to customer claimants (0.5); analyze airport and aircraft claims (0.4).
Sturm, Josh	06/21/21	0.5	Correspondence with M. Melcer regarding fleet claims resolutions.
Erickson, Jarret	06/22/21	0.7	Call with creditors regarding omnibus claims objection (0.6); review and revise email responses to same (0.1).
Melcer, Moshe	06/22/21	0.3	Email claimant counsel regarding withdrawn claims (0.1); review claim withdrawals (0.1); compile aircraft claims (0.1).
Sturm, Josh	06/22/21	0.8	Correspondence with M. Melcer regarding fleet claims resolutions (0.4); correspondence with A. Andreeva regarding Ex-Im long term claims (0.4).
Erickson, Jarret	06/23/21	0.7	Calls with M. Melcer regarding upcoming omnibus claims objections (0.2); review correspondence from creditors regarding same (0.2); review and revise responses to same (0.3).
Melcer, Moshe	06/23/21	1.8	Revise claimant inbound tracker (0.2); email with J. Erikson regarding upcoming omnibus claim objections (0.2); email with AlixPartners regarding same (0.3); call with J. Erikson regarding same (0.2); draft rider for omnibus claims objection (0.9).
Erickson, Jarret	06/24/21	2.1	Call with M. Melcer regarding upcoming omnibus claims objections (0.4); review and revise presentation on same to Aeroméxico (1.5); correspondence with AlixPartners team regarding same (0.2).
Jerrard, Erik Melcer, Moshe	06/24/21 06/24/21	1.7 6.8	Review and revise claims objections exhibits. Call with J. Erickson regarding upcoming omnibus claim objections (0.4); draft riders for new bases to omnibus claim objections (5.3); correspondence with J. Erickson regarding same (0.1); review and comment on presentation on custome claims from AlixPartners (0.7); email with AlixPartners
Erickson, Jarret	06/25/21	4.1	regarding same (0.3). Call with M. Melcer regarding omnibus claims objections (0.6) call with same and AlixPartners regarding same (0.4); call with same and Epiq regarding same (0.5); call with Aeroméxico regarding same (0.4); review and revise presentation on same to Aeroméxico (0.8); correspondence with AlixPartners team and M. Melcer regarding same (0.4); review draft schedules regarding same(0.6); review draft objections (0.4).
Jerrard, Erik	06/25/21	0.8	Correspondence with M. Melcer and J. Erickson regarding customer claims issues.
Melcer, Moshe	06/25/21	2.8	Call with AlixPartners and J. Erickson regarding omnibus claims objections (0.6); call with same and Epiq regarding same (0.5); correspondence with Aeroméxico, AlixPartners and J. Erickson regarding customer claims (0.4); call with J. Erickson regarding omnibus claims objections (0.4);

Name	Date	Hours	Narrative
Hume	Date	Hours	correspondence with customers regarding objections (0.7);
			review correspondence from claimant regarding claim
			objection (0.2).
Sturm, Josh	06/25/21	0.4	Review correspondence with T. Green regarding lessor
	00/07/04		claims.
Melcer, Moshe	06/27/21	8.0	Email with AlixPartners and Davis Polk Claims teams
			regarding upcoming omnibus claims objections (0.6); correspondence with J. Erickson regarding same (0.2).
Erickson, Jarret	06/28/21	7.2	Call with M. Melcer regarding upcoming claim objections (0.3)
			call with same regarding customer claims (0.4); call with
			AlixPartners, Aeroméxico, and Davis Polk Claims teams
			regarding same (1.1); review draft schedules to same (0.5);
			review and revise draft omnibus claims objections (2.8);
lamand Fuile	00/00/04	2.4	research issues regarding same (2.1).
Jerrard, Erik	06/28/21	2.4	Review and revise claims objections correspondence for customer claims (1.6); email with M. Melcer regarding same
			(0.8).
Melcer, Moshe	06/28/21	5.7	Call with AlixPartners, Aeroméxico, and Davis Polk Claims
,			teams regarding customer claims (1.1); call with Epiq,
			AlixPartners, and Davis Polk Claims teams regarding
			upcoming objections (0.6); review correspondence from
			claimant regarding claim objection (0.1); call with J. Erickson
			regarding upcoming claim objections (0.3); call with same
			regarding customer claims (0.4); review and revise claimant
			inbound tracker (0.1); draft emails for customer claimants (0.3); correspondence with J. Erickson regarding upcoming
			claim objections (0.2); draft omnibus claims objection (2.2);
			email with AlixPartners regarding upcoming omnibus claim
			objections (0.2); draft email to Aeroméxico regarding custome
			omnibus claim objections (0.2).
Erickson, Jarret	06/29/21	1.4	Review and revise omnibus claims objections (0.7); call with
			creditors regarding same (0.5); review and revise responses
Malaan Maalaa	00/00/04	0.7	to inquiries from creditors regarding same (0.2).
Melcer, Moshe	06/29/21	2.7	Call with White & Case, Skyworks, Clifford Chance, and
			others regarding motion to approve fleet claims settlement motion (0.3); correspondence with claimant regarding objected
			claim (0.2); revise claimant inbound tracker (0.2); email with
			Aeroméxico regarding customer claim objections (0.2); draft
			omnibus claims objection (1.8).
Sturm, Josh	06/29/21	0.3	Correspondence with M. Melcer regarding Aviator claim.
Erickson, Jarret	06/30/21	2.6	Review and revise omnibus claims objections correspondence
			(1.4); correspondence with M. Melcer regarding same (0.8);
			correspondence with Aeroméxico regarding same (0.2);
			review omnibus claims objections and schedules regarding same (0.2).
Melcer, Moshe	06/30/21	2.3	Draft omnibus claims objection (0.5); correspondence with
5.551, 14155/16	33,33721	2.0	claimant regarding objected claim (0.2); revise claimant
			inbound tracker (0.2); correspondence with J. Erickson
			regarding customer claim emails (0.5); review and revise
			customer claim emails (0.9).
Total AM130 Bar		148.2	
Date/Estimation/Claims			
Allowance Issues			

		Time I	Detail By Project
Name	Date	Hours	Narrative
Graulich, Timothy	06/03/21	2.7	Review and revise Board presentation regarding exit financing issues.
Graulich, Timothy	06/10/21	1.5	Participate in Board Restructuring Committee meeting.
Piraino, Stephen D.	06/14/21	1.6	Call with A. Sainz regarding corporate governance matters (0.6); research corporate governance issue (0.5); draft
Graulich, Timothy	06/15/21	4.5	presentation for Board Restructuring Committee (0.5). Review and revise Board presentation (2.8); attend Special Committee meeting (1.4); call with M. Huebner regarding same (0.3).
Huebner, Marshall S.	06/15/21	1.7	Attend Special Committee meeting (1.4); call with T. Graulich regarding same (0.3).
Graulich, Timothy	06/17/21	3.1	Review Board materials (2.2); call with J. Arrigunaga and A. Sainz regarding Board meeting (0.9).
Piraino, Stephen D.	06/17/21	0.3	Revise Board presentation.
Graulich, Timothy	06/18/21	4.2	Review Board materials (1.2); call with P. Carter regarding Board issues (0.5); attend Board meeting (2.5).
Huebner, Marshall S.	06/18/21	1.9	Attend Board meeting.
Jerrard, Erik	06/18/21	1.1	Review and revise proposed Board materials (0.8); call with management and co-advisors regarding Board meeting updates (0.3).
Graulich, Timothy	06/22/21	2.1	Call with J. Arrigunaga regarding Board meeting (0.9); review Board presentation (1.2).
Graulich, Timothy	06/25/21	3.3	Review and revise Board materials.
Graulich, Timothy	06/26/21	2.2	Review and revise Board materials.
Graulich, Timothy	06/27/21	2.8	Prepare for Board meeting.
Graulich, Timothy	06/28/21	4.6	Attend Board meeting (1.6); prepare for same (3.0).
Huebner, Marshall S.	06/28/21	1.6	Attend Board meeting.
Jerrard, Erik	06/28/21	2.0	Attend Board meeting (1.7); correspondence with S. Piraino regarding Board meeting preparation (0.3).
Piraino, Stephen D.	06/28/21	1.6	Attend Board meeting.
Graulich, Timothy	06/30/21	0.9	Call with R. Miaja regarding Board letter (0.5); review revised Board letter (0.4).
McClammy, James I.	06/30/21	0.5	Correspondence with T. Graulich and R. Miaja regarding Board letter (0.3); review draft letter (0.2).
Total AM140 Corpora	ite	44.2	
Governance, Board M Communications	Matters and		
AM150 Creditor/UCC Graulich, Timothy	/AHC Issues 06/01/21	1.2	Attend weekly call with Creditors Committee advisors and
Citation, Timothy	00/01/21	1.2	Debtor co-advisors (AlixPartners, Skyworks, others) (0.5) (partial attendance); call with FTI and Willkie Farr regarding FAA matters (0.7).
Masaro, Matthew Bruno	06/01/21	1.0	Attend weekly call with Creditors Committee advisors and Debtor co-advisors (AlixPartners, Skyworks, others).
Piraino, Stephen D.	06/01/21	2.1	Call with FTI and Willkie Farr regarding FAA matters (0.6); attend bi-weekly update call with Ad Hoc Group advisors and Debtor co-advisors (0.5); attend weekly call with Creditors Committee advisors and Debtor co-advisors (AlixPartners, Skyworks, others) (1.0).
Graulich, Timothy	06/02/21	0.3	Call with UCC regarding shareholder support agreement (0.3
Piraino, Stephen D.	06/02/21	0.7	Review UCC trading motion.
Graulich, Timothy	06/03/21	1.2	Review UCC trading motion (0.6); call with A. Schwartz regarding same (0.6).
Piraino, Stephen D.	06/03/21	0.7	Correspondence with Davis Polk team regarding UCC trading

	Time Detail By Project				
Name	Date	Hours	Narrative		
Piraino, Stephen D.	06/04/21	1.1	motion. Call with A. Schwartz and H. Parkhill regarding UCC trading motion (0.7); correspondence with T. Graulich regarding same		
Graulich, Timothy	06/08/21	0.7	(0.2); call with T. Goren regarding same (0.2). Attend weekly call with Creditors Committee advisors and		
Jerrard, Erik	06/08/21	0.6	Debtor co-advisors (AlixPartners, Skyworks, others). Attend weekly call with Creditors Committee advisors and Debtor co-advisors (AlixPartners, Skyworks, others).		
Masaro, Matthew Bruno	06/08/21	0.6	Attend weekly call with Creditors Committee advisors and Debtor co-advisors (AlixPartners, Skyworks, others).		
Piraino, Stephen D.	06/08/21	0.6	Attend weekly call with Creditors Committee advisors and Debtor co-advisors (AlixPartners, Skyworks, others).		
Masaro, Matthew Bruno	06/09/21	1.1	Call with Cleary Gottlieb, Creel, Sainz Abogados, and others regarding Mexican law considerations.		
Piraino, Stephen D.	06/09/21	1.4	Review and analyze presentation on loyalty program (0.5); review and revise response to Committee letter (0.2); review and analyze UCC trading motion (0.7).		
Huebner, Marshall S. Jerrard, Erik	06/10/21 06/10/21	0.3 0.8	Correspondence with T. Graulich regarding bidding issues. Call with Chambers, A. Schwartz, and committee regarding UCC trading motion.		
Piraino, Stephen D.	06/10/21	2.2	Call with A. Schwartz regarding UCC trading motion (0.5); attend Chambers conference regarding same (0.8); prepare for same (0.9).		
Graulich, Timothy	06/14/21	1.7	Call with A. Schwartz regarding UCC trading motion (1.3); correspondence with S. Piraino regarding same (0.4).		
Masaro, Matthew Bruno	06/15/21	0.3	Attend weekly call with Creditors Committee advisors and Debtor co-advisors (AlixPartners, Skyworks, others).		
Piraino, Stephen D.	06/15/21	0.5	Attend weekly call with Creditors Committee advisors and Debtor co-advisors (AlixPartners, Skyworks, others) (0.3); correspondence with co-advisors regarding UCC trading motion (0.2).		
Graulich, Timothy	06/16/21	1.3	Call with H. Parkhill regarding PLM (0.5); review loyalty program proposal (0.8).		
Piraino, Stephen D.	06/16/21	0.2	Call with Rothschild team regarding PLM.		
Piraino, Stephen D.	06/17/21	1.7	Draft response to Creditors Committee claims trading motion.		
Jerrard, Erik	06/18/21	0.4	Correspondence with S. Piraino regarding response to Creditors Committee claims trading motion.		
Piraino, Stephen D.	06/20/21	0.7	Review Creditors Committee claims trading motion (0.4); correspondence with Willkie Farr and T. Graulich regarding same (0.3).		
Piraino, Stephen D.	06/21/21	0.8	Call with Willkie Farr team regarding creditor issues (0.6); correspondence with T. Goren regarding same (0.1); email with Rothschild regarding PLM (0.1).		
Rincon, Cristina M.	06/21/21	1.1	Attend daily contingency update call with Aeroméxico and Rothschild.		
Jerrard, Erik	06/22/21	0.9	Attend weekly call with Creditors Committee advisors and Debtor co-advisors (AlixPartners, Skyworks, others).		
Masaro, Matthew Bruno	06/22/21	0.7	Attend weekly call with Creditors Committee advisors and Debtor co-advisors (AlixPartners, Skyworks, others).		
Piraino, Stephen D.	06/22/21	1.3	Attend weekly call with Creditors Committee advisors and Debtor co-advisors (AlixPartners, Skyworks, others) (0.9); review updated presentation from lenders (0.4).		
Graulich, Timothy	06/25/21	1.3	Review Creditors Committee letter (0.5); correspondence with E. Jerrard regarding same (0.8).		
Piraino, Stephen D.	06/25/21	0.1	Call with N. Bane regarding PLM.		
Rincon, Cristina M.	06/25/21	0.2	Review Creditors Committee letter (0.1); correspondence with		

		Time I	Detail By Project
Name	Date	Hours	Narrative
Bane, Abraham	06/28/21	2.1	S. Piraino regarding same (0.1). Review Creditors Committee letter (0.8); correspondence with E. Jerrard regarding same (0.1); draft response same (1.2).
Jerrard, Erik	06/28/21	0.5	Email with A. Bane regarding response to Creditors Committee letter.
Piraino, Stephen D.	06/28/21	0.5	Correspondence with R. Sanchez Baker and D. Zylberberg regarding PLM.
Bane, Abraham	06/29/21	1.9	Draft response to Creditors Committee letter (1.6); correspondence with T. Graulich, S. Piraino, and E. Jerrard
Jerrard, Erik	06/29/21	1.3	regarding same (0.3). Attend weekly call with Creditors Committee advisors and Debtor co-advisors (AlixPartners, Skyworks, others) (0.5); correspondence with stakeholder regarding claims trading (0.4); review and revise response to Creditors Committee letter (0.4).
Piraino, Stephen D.	06/29/21	1.2	Attend weekly call with Creditors Committee advisors and Debtor co-advisors (AlixPartners, Skyworks, others) (0.5); correspondence with co-advisors, E. Jerrard and A. Bane regarding Creditors Committee letter (0.7).
Bane, Abraham	06/30/21	0.7	Revise response to Creditors Committee letter (0.5); correspondence with S. Piraino and E. Jerrard regarding same (0.2).
Piraino, Stephen D.	06/30/21	1.6	Correspondence with T. Graulich and R. Robles regarding Creditors Committee letter (0.2); email with Aeroméxico team regarding same (0.2); attend weekly call with Creditors Committee advisors and Debtor co-advisors (AlixPartners, Skyworks, others) (0.5); correspondence with co-advisors regarding Creditors Committee letter (0.7).
Total AM150 Creditor	r/UCC/AHC	39.6	
AM170 Customer/Ver Bane, Abraham	ndor/Non-Aircra 06/01/21	aft Lease/Non- 1.0	-Aircraft Contract Issues Correspondence with M. Katz regarding vendor issues (0.3); review vendor letter (0.2); correspondence with S. Piraino and K. Beckerman regarding same (0.1); call with AlixPartners, Aeroméxico, and S. Piraino regarding vendor issues (0.4).
Katz, Michael	06/01/21	0.6	Email with A. Bane regarding background to vendor request (0.4); email with AlixPartners regarding contract clause (0.2).
Masaro, Matthew Bruno	06/01/21	0.6	Correspondence with AlixPartners regarding contract clause (0.2): correspondence with Cleary Gottlieb and Willkie Farr regarding same (0.1).
Piraino, Stephen D.	06/01/21	1.0	Attend procurement council meeting (0.6); call with A. Bane, AlixPartners and Aeroméxico regarding vendor issues (0.4).
Piraino, Stephen D.	06/02/21	1.1	Correspondence with Aeroméxico regarding veridor issues (0.4). (0.2); review and revise vendor agreement (0.7); correspondence with A. Bane regarding vendor issues (0.1); correspondence with J. Sturm regarding customer question (0.1).
Masaro, Matthew Bruno	06/03/21	1.2	Correspondence with third-party counsel, AlixPartners, and others regarding claim withdrawals (0.1); correspondence with AlixPartners and others regarding contract assumptions (0.3); review and revise assumption notice (0.5); correspondence with Cleary Gottlieb, Willkie Farr, and others regarding same (0.3).

Time Detail By Project			
Name	Date	Hours	Narrative
Piraino, Stephen D.	06/03/21	0.3	Correspondence with M. Masaro regarding executory contract matters.
Masaro, Matthew Bruno	06/04/21	0.9	Review and revise assumption notice (0.5); correspondence with M. Giddens, S. Piraino, and others regarding same (0.4).
Piraino, Stephen D.	06/04/21	0.4	Review assumption notice (0.2); correspondence with M. Masaro regarding same (0.2).
Katz, Michael	06/08/21	0.3	Call with Aeroméxico and AlixPartners regarding vendor payment escalations (0.2); correspondence with S. Piraino regarding same (0.1).
Piraino, Stephen D.	06/08/21	1.1	Call with Aeroméxico and AlixPartners regarding vendor payment escalations (0.2); correspondence with M. Katz regarding same (0.1); review and analyze vendor issues (0.8).
Piraino, Stephen D.	06/09/21	0.3	Call with K. Beckeman regarding vendor issues.
Katz, Michael	06/10/21	0.3	Review foreign vendor contracts (0.3); email with S. Piraino
Piraino, Stephen D.	06/10/21	0.5	regarding same (0.1). Correspondence with M. Katz regarding vendor issues (0.2);
Katz, Michael	06/11/04	0.4	review and analyze vendor issues (0.3).
Masaro, Matthew Bruno	06/11/21 06/11/21	0.1 0.1	Email with Aeroméxico regarding vendor contracts. Correspondence with third-party counsel regarding contract
Katz, Michael	06/14/21	0.2	rejection. Review vendor contracts (0.1); email with Aeroméxico regarding same (0.1).
Masaro, Matthew Bruno	06/14/21	0.8	Review and revise contract rejection order (0.4); correspondence with S. Piraino, Aeroméxico and third-party
			counsel regarding same (0.2); correspondence with Aeroméxico and S. Piraino regarding additional contract rejections and related proofs of claim (0.2).
Katz, Michael	06/15/21	0.9	Review vendor contracts (0.8); correspondence with S. Piraino regarding same (0.1).
Masaro, Matthew Bruno	06/15/21	0.5	Correspondence with AlixPartners, S. Piraino and others regarding contract rejection order (0.3); review and revise same (0.2).
Piraino, Stephen D.	06/15/21	0.2	Review and revise lease rejection order.
Katz, Michael	06/16/21	1.2	Call with Aeroméxico and AlixPartners regarding vendor payment escalations (0.2); draft vendor contract (0.6); correspondence with Aeroméxico regarding contract issues (0.4).
Piraino, Stephen D.	06/16/21	0.3	Call with K. Beckeman regarding vendor issues (0.1); review and revise vendor communication (0.2).
Masaro, Matthew Bruno	06/18/21	0.2	Correspondence with third-party counsel and others regarding contract rejection.
Katz, Michael	06/21/21	0.4	Review vendor contract amendment (0.1); email with S. Piraino regarding analysis (0.1); call with Aeroméxico and AlixPartners regarding vendor payment escalations (0.2).
Masaro, Matthew Bruno	06/21/21	0.2	Correspondence with third-party counsel and Aeroméxico regarding contract ejection.
Piraino, Stephen D.	06/21/21	0.1	Call with K. Beckeman regarding vendor issues.
Masaro, Matthew Bruno	06/22/21	0.2	Review and revise contract termination agreement (0.1); correspondence with third-party counsel regarding same (0.1)
Piraino, Stephen D.	06/22/21	0.5	Attend procurement council meeting.
Katz, Michael	06/23/21	0.2	Correspondence with Aeroméxico regarding vendor contact negotiations.
Masaro, Matthew Bruno	06/24/21	0.2	Correspondence with lease counterparties and others regarding contract assumption and rejection.
Masaro, Matthew Bruno	06/25/21	0.7	Correspondence with M. Melcer and others regarding contract assumptions (0.2); correspondence with third-party counsel

	Time Detail By Project			
Name	Date	Hours	Narrative	
			and Aeroméxico regarding contract rejection (0.2); review and revise rejection order (0.2); correspondence with S. Piraino regarding same (0.1).	
Masaro, Matthew Bruno	06/27/21	0.1	Correspondence with third-party counsel regarding contract rejection.	
Melcer, Moshe	06/27/21	0.3	Draft proposed order for assumption notice.	
Katz, Michael	06/28/21	0.2	Call with Aeroméxico and AlixPartners regarding vendor payment escalations.	
Masaro, Matthew Bruno	06/28/21	0.4	Correspondence with third-party counsel regarding contract rejection (0.1); review and revise order regarding same (0.2); correspondence with Chambers and others regarding assumption order (0.1).	
Melcer, Moshe	06/28/21	0.1	Revise proposed order for assumption notice.	
Katz, Michael	06/29/21	0.5	Draft GSA settlement agreement (0.4); email with Aeroméxico regarding same (0.1).	
Masaro, Matthew Bruno	06/29/21	0.3	Correspondence with third-party counsel and others regarding rejection order (0.2); correspondence with AlixPartners and others regarding contract assumption (0.1).	
Masaro, Matthew Bruno	06/30/21	0.4	Correspondence with third-party counsel, Willkie Farr, S. Piraino, and others regarding contract rejection.	
Total AM170		19.0	,	
Customer/Vendor/N Lease/Non-Aircraft (Issues				
AM180 Employee/Pe	ension Issues			
Joffroy, Elena	02/21/21	2.4	Draft declaration of R. Salazar in support of Collective Bargaining Agreement Approval motion.	
Joffroy, Elena	02/24/21	1.4	Revise S. Barroso declaration in support of Collective Bargaining Agreement Approval motion (0.9); revise R. Sanchez Baker declaration in support of same (0.5).	
Joffroy, Elena	02/25/21	2.9	Revise R. Sanchez Baker declaration in support of Collective Bargaining Agreement Approval motion (1.8); revise S. Barroso declaration in support of same (1.1).	
Joffroy, Elena	02/26/21	2.5	Coordinate translation of Collective Bargaining Agreement documents (0.6); revise declarations in support of Collective Bargaining Agreement Approval motion (1.9).	
Joffroy, Elena	02/27/21	1.8	Revise declarations in support of Collective Bargaining Agreement Approval motion.	
Masaro, Matthew Bruno	06/01/21	0.1	Correspondence with Aeroméxico and others regarding pilot severance motion and order.	
Masaro, Matthew Bruno	06/02/21	0.8	Review severance diligence (0.3); correspondence with AlixPartners, Aeroméxico, Sainz Abogados, and others regarding same (0.4); correspondence with S. Piraino regarding same (0.1).	
Piraino, Stephen D.	06/02/21	0.5	Correspondence with M. Masaro and A. Perez regarding severance.	
Masaro, Matthew Bruno	06/04/21	0.9	Review and revise outsourcing severance motion (0.7); correspondence with Sainz Abogados and others regarding same (0.2).	
Masaro, Matthew Bruno	06/07/21	2.7	Review and revise outsourcing severance motion (2.5); correspondence with S. Piraino and others regarding same (0.2).	
Piraino, Stephen D.	06/07/21	0.7	Review and revise outsourcing severance motion (0.4); correspondence with M. Masaro regarding same (0.3).	

Time Detail By Project			
Name	Date	Hours	Narrative
Masaro, Matthew Bruno	06/09/21	0.1	Correspondence with AlixPartners and others regarding outsourcing severance motion.
Masaro, Matthew Bruno	06/10/21	0.3	Correspondence with S. Piraino and others regarding outsourcing severance motion.
Piraino, Stephen D.	06/10/21	0.4	Correspondence with M. Masaro, A. Perez, and others regarding outsourcing severance motion.
Masaro, Matthew Bruno	06/11/21	0.4	Correspondence with AlixPartners regarding outsourcing severance motion.
Masaro, Matthew Bruno	06/12/21	1.5	Review and revise outsourcing severance motion (1.3); correspondence with S. Piraino regarding same (0.2).
Piraino, Stephen D.	06/12/21	0.4	Review and revise outsourcing severance motion.
Masaro, Matthew Bruno	06/13/21	1.6	Review and revise outsourcing severance motions (0.7); review and revise declarations in support of same (0.7); correspondence with S. Piraino and others regarding same (0.2).
Masaro, Matthew Bruno	06/14/21	0.8	Review and revise outsourcing severance motion (0.6); correspondence with Aeroméxico, AlixPartners, S. Piraino, and others regarding same (0.2).
Masaro, Matthew Bruno	06/15/21	1.1	Review and revise outsourcing severance motion (0.7); correspondence with S. Piraino, AlixPartners, and others regarding same (0.4).
Piraino, Stephen D.	06/15/21	2.2	Review executive compensation note (0.4); call with S. Brecher regarding compensation (0.3); email with T. Graulic regarding executive compensation (0.2); correspondence w T. Graulich and E. Jerrard regarding same (0.5); correspondence with M. Masaro regarding outsourcing severance motion (0.8).
Graulich, Timothy	06/16/21	2.3	Correspondence with S. Piraino regarding severance issue: (0.5); review and comment on outsourcing severance motio (1.8).
Masaro, Matthew Bruno	06/16/21	2.2	Review and revise outsourcing severance motion (1.5); correspondence with AlixPartners, Aeroméxico, T. Graulich and S. Piraino regarding same (0.7).
Piraino, Stephen D.	06/16/21	1.1	Correspondence with T. Graulich regarding compensation issue (0.2); correspondence with M. Masaro regarding outsourcing severance motion (0.3); correspondence with same and T. Graulich regarding same (0.4); correspondence with M. Masaro and AlixPartners regarding severance (0.2)
Masaro, Matthew Bruno	06/17/21	1.6	Review and revise outsourcing severance motion (1.0); correspondence with Aeroméxico, Sainz Abogados, and others regarding same (0.6).
Piraino, Stephen D.	06/17/21	0.3	Correspondence with M. Masaro regarding outsourcing severance motion.
Masaro, Matthew Bruno	06/18/21	0.7	Review and revise severance motion and declarations in support of same (0.4); correspondence with S. Piraino, A. Schwartz, AlixPartners, Aeroméxico, and others regarding same (0.3).
Masaro, Matthew Bruno	06/21/21	0.3	Correspondence with S. Piraino, Willkie Farr, and Cleary Gottlieb regarding severance motion.
Masaro, Matthew Bruno	06/22/21	2.7	Review and revise outsourcing severance motion and declarations in support of same (1.6); correspondence with Schwartz regarding same (0.3); correspondence with Aeroméxico, Sainz Abogados, AlixPartners, and S. Piraino regarding same (0.8).
Piraino, Stephen D.	06/22/21	0.8	Correspondence with AlixPartners team and M. Masaro regarding severance motion (0.2); review same (0.2);

		Time	Detail By Project
Name	Date	Hours	Narrative
Masaro, Matthew Bruno	06/23/21	0.8	correspondence with M. Masaro regarding same (0.4). Review and revise severance motion (0.3); correspondence with Aeroméxico, AlixPartners, and others regarding same
Graulich, Timothy	06/24/21	0.5	(0.5). Call with S. Piraino, M. Masaro and Willis Towers regarding employment compensation (partial attendance).
Masaro, Matthew Bruno	06/24/21	2.0	Review and revise severance motion and declarations in support of same (1.1); correspondence with AlixPartners, Sainz Abogados, and others regarding same (0.9).
Piraino, Stephen D.	06/24/21	2.7	Call with T. Graulich, M. Masaro and Willis Towers regarding employment compensation (0.8); prepare for same (0.5); correspondence with M. Masaro regarding compensation research (0.4); review compensation research and revise internal memorandum on same (0.7); review filing version of outsourcing severance motion (0.3).
Total AM180 Employ Issues	ee/Pension	43.5	
AM190 Financing			
Florack, James A. Ford, Stephen	06/01/21 06/01/21	0.5 0.9	Review DIP financing documents. Review and comment on exit financing Non-Disclosure Agreements (0.7); correspondence with E. Jerrard regarding same (0.1); correspondence with Rothschild regarding same (0.1).
Graulich, Timothy	06/01/21	1.7	Call with A. Conesa and R. Sanchez Baker regarding exit financing (1.0); call with potential investors regarding exit financing (0.7).
Jackson, Vanessa L.	06/01/21	0.6	Attend daily contingency update call with Aeroméxico and Rothschild.
Jerrard, Erik	06/01/21	5.2	Correspondence with T. Graulich and S. Piraino regarding enfinancing proposal (1.8); analyze exit financing issues (1.9); correspondence with T. Graulich and stakeholder regarding same (0.9); call with potential exit financing provider regarding same (0.6).
Piraino, Stephen D.	06/01/21	1.3	Attend daily contingency update call with Aeroméxico and Rothschild (0.9); review and analyze shareholder agreement (0.4).
Troconis, Adela	06/01/21	1.4	Attend daily contingency update call with Aeroméxico and Rothschild (0.9); attend weekly update call with Apollo advisors (0.5).
Ford, Stephen	06/02/21	0.6	Review and comment on exit financing Non-Disclosure Agreements.
Graulich, Timothy	06/02/21	1.3	Call with A. Conesa and R. Sanchez Baker regarding exit financing (0.8); call with A. Sainz regarding Mexican law issues related to same (0.5).
Jackson, Vanessa L.	06/02/21	0.8	Attend daily contingency update call with Aeroméxico and Rothschild (0.4); call with Rothschild, A. Troconis, S. Piraino and E. Jerrard regarding equity conversion (0.4).
Jerrard, Erik	06/02/21	1.9	Review exit financing timeline (0.4); email with R. Arnold regarding exit financing (0.4); call with Rothschild, V. Jackso S. Piraino, and A. Troconis regarding equity conversion (0.4) analyze exit financing issue following up from same (0.7).
Piraino, Stephen D.	06/02/21	2.0	Correspondence with T. Graulich regarding shareholder support agreement (0.3); analyze shareholder support agreement (0.3); call with Rothschild, A. Troconis, E. Jerrard

		Time	Detail By Project
Name	Date	Hours	Narrative
Troconis, Adela	06/02/21	1.8	and V. Jackson regarding equity conversion (0.4); attend daily contingency update call with Aeroméxico and Rothschild (1.0). Attend daily contingency update call with Aeroméxico and Rothschild (1.0); call with Rothschild, V. Jackson, S. Piraino, and E. Jerrard regarding equity conversion (0.4); correspondence with Rothschild, A. Sainz and E. Jerrard regarding Moving Law considerations on same (0.4).
Ford, Stephen	06/03/21	0.4	regarding Mexican law considerations on same (0.4). Review and comment on exit financing Non-Disclosure Agreements (0.3); correspondence with Rothschild team regarding same (0.1).
Graulich, Timothy	06/03/21	2.4	Call with A. Conesa and R. Sanchez Baker regarding exit financing (0.9); review revised exit financing proposal (0.7); call with H. Parkhill regarding same (0.8).
Jerrard, Erik	06/03/21	5.0	Email with J. Sturm, Skyworks and AlixPartners regarding information sharing for lease counterparty in exit financing process (0.5); email with S. Ford regarding exit financing Non-Disclosure Agreement issues (0.7); review and comment on exit financing proposal (0.9); email with T. Graulich and S. Piraino regarding same (0.4); call with stakeholder regarding potential exit financing (0.8); correspondence with S. Piraino and J. Sturm regarding potential exit financing provider inquiry (0.3); analyze exit financing inquiry and research issues regarding same (1.4).
Piraino, Stephen D.	06/03/21	1.9	Correspondence with E. Jerrard regarding exit financing matters (0.5); review and analyze exit financing proposal (0.9); attend daily contingency update call with Aeroméxico and Rothschild. (0.5).
Troconis, Adela	06/03/21	0.5	Attend daily contingency update call with Aeroméxico and Rothschild.
Florack, James A.	06/04/21	0.5	Review correspondence with Davis Polk Finance team regarding financing issues.
Ford, Stephen	06/04/21	3.6	Call with E. Jerrard regarding exit financing Non-Disclosure Agreements (0.3); review and comment on exit financing Non-Disclosure Agreements (2.4); correspondence with potential exit financing Non-Disclosure Agreement counterparties (0.5); correspondence with Rothschild regarding same (0.1); correspondence with Davis Polk team regarding execution of same (0.3).
Graulich, Timothy	06/04/21	2.2	Call with A. Conesa and R. Sanchez Baker regarding exit financing process (1.0); call with H. Parkhill regarding same (0.6); call with counsel to potential investor regarding same (0.6).
Jackson, Vanessa L.	06/04/21	0.9	Attend daily contingency update call with Aeroméxico and Rothschild (0.5) (partial attendance); call with S. Piraino, A. Troconis, and others regarding shareholder support
Jerrard, Erik	06/04/21	3.5	agreement (0.4). Call with S. Ford regarding exit financing Non-Disclosure Agreement (0.3); call with stakeholder regarding same (0.4); email with co-advisors regarding same (0.4); email with Rothschild and S. Ford regarding same (0.9); email with AlixPartners and Skyworks to discuss claims disclosure question from exit financing provider (0.4); analyze claims materials relating to same (1.1)
Piraino, Stephen D.	06/04/21	1.5	materials relating to same (1.1). Attend daily contingency update call with Aeroméxico and Rothschild (0.7); call with V. Jackson, A. Troconis and others on Davis Polk team regarding shareholder support agreement

Time Detail By Project			
Name	Date	Hours	Narrative
Troconis, Adela	06/04/21	1.2	(0.4); correspondence with T. Graulich regarding same (0.4). Attend daily contingency update call with Aeroméxico and Rothschild (0.7); call with V. Jackson, S. Piraino and others regarding shareholder support agreement (0.4); prepare for same (0.1)
Ford, Stephen	06/07/21	1.7	same (0.1). Review and comment on exit financing Non-Disclosure Agreements (1.2); call with potential exit financing Non- Disclosure Agreement counterparty regarding same (0.2); correspondence with Rothschild regarding same (0.2); correspondence with E. Jerrard regarding same (0.1).
Graulich, Timothy	06/07/21	1.3	Call with A. Conesa and R. Sanchez Baker regarding exit financing (0.5); call with R. Cooper regarding same (0.4); call with H. Parkhill regarding same (0.4).
Jerrard, Erik	06/07/21	1.5	Call with counsel to stakeholder and S. Piraino regarding exit financing process (0.4); email with Rothschild regarding same (0.3); review and revise exit financing Non-Disclosure Agreements (0.8).
Piraino, Stephen D.	06/07/21	2.6	Attend daily contingency update call with Aeroméxico and Rothschild (0.6); call with counsel to stakeholder and E. Jerrard regarding exit financing process (0.4); email with Cleary Gottlieb regarding diligence (0.2); review exit financing proposal (0.4); call with Rothschild regarding exit financing (0.4); review UCC letter regarding same (0.4); email with Aeroméxico, co-advisors regarding same (0.2).
Troconis, Adela	06/07/21	0.6	Attend daily contingency update call with Aeroméxico and Rothschild.
Ford, Stephen	06/08/21	2.9	Review and revise exit financing Non-Disclosure Agreements (2.2); correspondence with E. Jerrard regarding same (0.2); correspondence with Rothschild regarding same (0.2); call with potential exit financing Non-Disclosure Agreement counterparty regarding exit financing (0.3).
Jackson, Vanessa L.	06/08/21	0.9	Attend daily contingency update call with Aeroméxico and Rothschild.
Jerrard, Erik	06/08/21	3.0	Email with S. Ford regarding exit financing Non-Disclosure Agreement (0.3); analyze issues regarding same (0.7); call with AlixPartners and Rothschild regarding exit financing data room (0.7); call with S. Piraino regarding exit financing motion (0.3); attend daily contingency update call with Aeroméxico and Rothschild (1.0).
Piraino, Stephen D.	06/08/21	1.3	Call with E. Jerrard regarding exit financing motion (0.3); attend daily contingency update call with Aeroméxico and Rothschild (1.0).
Troconis, Adela	06/08/21	1.0	Attend daily contingency update call with Aeroméxico and Rothschild.
Ford, Stephen	06/09/21	0.4	Review and comment on exit financing Non-Disclosure Agreements (0.2); correspondence with exit financing Non-Disclosure Agreement counterparties regarding same (0.1); correspondence with Rothschild regarding same (0.1).
Graulich, Timothy	06/09/21	2.6	Call with A. Conesa and R. Sanchez Baker regarding exit financing (1.0); call with potential financing party regarding same (0.8); call with H. Parkhill regarding same (0.8).
Jerrard, Erik	06/09/21	2.4	Attend daily contingency update call with Aeroméxico and Rothschild (1.1); email with S. Piraino regarding exit financing inquiry (0.3); call with Creel, Cleary Gottlieb, Sainz Abogados, A. Troconis, and others regarding Mexican governance issues and equity conversion (1.0).

		Time	Detail By Project
Name	Date	Hours	Narrative
Melcer, Moshe	06/09/21	1.7	Draft commitment letter motion (1.5); call with S. Piraino regarding same (0.2).
Piraino, Stephen D.	06/09/21	4.5	Email with potential exit financing party regarding exit financing (0.3); correspondence with E. Jerrard and M. Masaro regarding exit financing process (0.7); call with Aeroméxico, Rothschild and AlixPartners regarding same (0.4); review precedent commitment letter motions (0.3); call with M. Melcer regarding commitment letter motion (0.2);
			review exit financing proposal (0.4); call with Davis Polk, Cleary Gottlieb, Sainz Abogados and Creel teams regarding Mexican governance issues and equity conversion (1.1); attend daily contingency update call with Aeroméxico and Rothschild (1.1).
Troconis, Adela	06/09/21	1.4	Call with Creel, Cleary Gottlieb, Sainz Abogados, E. Jerrard, and others regarding Mexican governance issues and equity conversion (1.0); attend daily contingency update call with Aeroméxico and Rothschild (0.4) (partial attendance).
Ford, Stephen	06/10/21	0.6	Review and comment on exit financing Non-Disclosure Agreements.
Graulich, Timothy	06/10/21	2.5	Call with A. Conesa and R. Sanchez Baker regarding exit financing (0.8); call with L. Donahue regarding same (0.9); call with counsel to potential investor regarding same (0.8).
Jackson, Vanessa L.	06/10/21	1.9	Attend daily contingency update call with Aeroméxico and Rothschild (0.8); review exit financing proposals (1.1).
Jerrard, Erik	06/10/21	3.0	Review exit financing proposal (2.1); draft summary of same (0.6); attend weekly update call with Apollo advisors (0.3).
Melcer, Moshe	06/10/21	2.9	Draft Commitment Letter motion (2.8); call with S. Piraino regarding exit financing (0.1).
Piraino, Stephen D.	06/10/21	1.7	Call with M. Melcer regarding exit financing (0.1); attend weekly update call with Apollo advisors (0.3); call with Aeroméxico and co-advisors regarding exit financing (0.4); review proposal regarding same (0.9).
Troconis, Adela	06/10/21	1.9	Attend daily contingency update call with Aeroméxico and Rothschild (0.8); call with Aeroméxico and co-advisors regarding exit financing (0.4); correspondence with V. Jackson regarding same (0.4); attend weekly update call with Apollo advisors (0.3).
Florack, James A.	06/11/21	1.0	Attend daily contingency update call with Aeroméxico and Rothschild.
Graulich, Timothy	06/11/21	1.4	Call with T. Goren regarding exit financing (0.5); call with A. Conesa and R. Sanchez Baker regarding same (0.9).
Huebner, Marshall S.	06/11/21	0.2	Correspondence with T. Graulich regarding exit financing issues.
Jackson, Vanessa L.	06/11/21	2.4	Attend daily contingency update call with Aeroméxico and Rothschild (1.2); review DIP credit agreement in connection
Jerrard, Erik	06/11/21	4.9	with conversion mechanics (1.2). Correspondence with T. Graulich and V. Jackson regarding exit financing timeline and milestones (1.4); call with UCC advisors, S. Piraino, and others regarding exit financing (0.5); attend update call with Aeroméxico management (1.1); call with S. Piraino and others regarding exit financing (1.2); correspondence with T. Graulich and Rothschild regarding same (0.7).
Piraino, Stephen D.	06/11/21	3.2	Attend daily contingency update call with Aeroméxico and Rothschild (1.1); call with UCC advisors, E. Jerrard, and others regarding exit financing (0.5); call with E. Jerrard and 22

		Time	Detail By Project
Name	Date	Hours	Narrative
Troconis, Adela	06/11/21	2.1	others regarding same (1.2); call with Rothschild regarding same (0.4). Attend daily contingency update call with Aeroméxico and Rothschild (1.1); review obligations under credit agreement related to exit financing (0.7); correspondence with V. Jackson
Graulich, Timothy	06/13/21	2.1	regarding exit financing (0.7), correspondence with V. Jackson regarding exit financing (0.3). Review revised exit financing proposal (1.2); call with H. Parkhill regarding same (0.9).
Jackson, Vanessa L.	06/13/21	1.6	Attend daily contingency update call with Aeroméxico and Rothschild (1.0); correspondence with Davis Polk Finance
Jerrard, Erik	06/13/21	2.5	team and others regarding exit financing issues (0.6) Call with Aeroméxico and co-advisors regarding exit financing (0.9); call with S. Piraino regarding same (0.1); review exit
Piraino, Stephen D.	06/13/21	1.0	financing proposal (1.5). Call with Aeroméxico and co-advisors regarding exit financing (0.9); call with E. Jerrard regarding exit financing (0.1).
Troconis, Adela	06/13/21	1.0	Attend daily contingency update call with Aeroméxico and Rothschild.
Florack, James A.	06/14/21	1.0	Attend daily contingency update call with Aeroméxico and Rothschild.
Graulich, Timothy	06/14/21	4.7	Correspondence with S. Piraino and E. Jerrard regarding exit financing (0.5); call with A. Conesa and R. Sanchez Baker regarding same (1.0); call with A. Sainz regarding same (0.5); call with A. Conesa and R. Sanchez regarding same (0.4); call with H. Parkhill and counsel to potential investor regarding
Jackson, Vanessa L.	06/14/21	4.0	same (0.6); correspondence with V. Jackson regarding same (0.6); review revised proposal regarding same (1.1). Attend daily contingency update call with Aeroméxico and Rothschild (1.0); call with AlixPartners, Rothschild, and Sainz Abogados regarding exit financing (0.5) (partial attendance); call with management and co-advisors regarding same (0.6);
Jerrard, Erik	06/14/21	5.1	review precedent exit facilities (1.9). Call with AlixPartners, Rothschild, and Sainz Abogados regarding exit financing (0.6); call with management and coadvisors regarding same (0.8); call with counsel to stakeholder regarding same (0.7); call with Davis Polk Restructuring and Finance teams regarding same (0.7); review DIP order related to financing issue (0.6); email with Davis Polk Finance team regarding same (0.3); email with V. Jackson and A. Troconis regarding exit financing (0.4); call with Aeroméxico management and advisors regarding case updates and exit
Piraino, Stephen D.	06/14/21	7.9	financing (1.0). Correspondence with T. Graulich and E. Jerrard regarding exit financing (0.6); correspondence with E. Jerrard regarding same (0.6); review and analyze financing proposal (0.9); correspondence with T. Graulich regarding same (1.1); call with AlixPartners, Rothschild, and Sainz Abogados regarding same (0.6); call with co-advisors regarding same (1.3); call with financial advisor to stakeholder Rothschild and Davis Polk teams regarding same (1.1); call with Davis Polk Restructuring
Troconis, Adela	06/14/21	4.0	and Finance teams regarding same (0.6); attend daily contingency update call with Aeroméxico and Rothschild (1.1). Attend daily contingency update call with Aeroméxico and Rothschild (1.0); call with AlixPartners, Rothschild, and Sainz Abogados regarding exit financing (0.6); call with management and co-advisors regarding same (0.8); correspondence with V.

		Time	Detail By Project
Name	Date	Hours	Narrative
			Jackson regarding status of same (0.4); call with Davis Polk Restructuring and Finance teams regarding same (0.7); draft exit financing commitment papers (0.5).
Florack, James A.	06/15/21	0.5	Correspondence with Davis Polk Finance team regarding exit- financing updates.
Ford, Stephen	06/15/21	1.7	Review and comment on exit financing Non-Disclosure Agreements (1.5); correspondence with exit financing parties regarding same (0.2).
Graulich, Timothy	06/15/21	3.8	Call with A. Conesa and R. Sanchez Baker regarding exit financing process (1.0); call with counsel to potential investor regarding exit financing proposal (0.5); call with A. Conesa and R. Sanchez Baker regarding exit financing process (1.0); call with S. Piraino and others regarding same (1.3).
Jerrard, Erik	06/15/21	1.6	Call with counsel to stakeholder, A. Troconis, and S. Piraino regarding exit financing (0.6); attend daily contingency update call with Aeroméxico and Rothschild (1.0).
Piraino, Stephen D.	06/15/21	2.9	Attend daily contingency update call with Aeroméxico and Rothschild (1.0); call with counsel to stakeholder, E. Jerrard, A. Troconis and others regarding exit financing (0.6); call with T. Graulich and others regarding exit financing process (1.3).
Troconis, Adela	06/15/21	1.6	Attend daily contingency update call with Aeroméxico and Rothschild (1.0); call with counsel to stakeholder, E. Jerrard, S. Piraino and others regarding exit financing (0.6).
Graulich, Timothy	06/16/21	4.0	Call with H. Parkhill regarding initial valuation materials (0.6); correspondence with J. McClammy regarding litigation issues (0.7); call with counsel to potential investor regarding proposed exit financing (0.5); revise presentation on valuation materials (2.2).
Jackson, Vanessa L.	06/16/21	1.1	Attend daily contingency update call with Aeroméxico and Rothschild.
Jerrard, Erik	06/16/21	6.9	Extensive review and revision of exit financing timeline (3.8); correspondence with Davis Polk Finance team (A. Troconis) regarding same (0.4); correspondence with Rothschild regarding same (0.4); call with R. Arnold regarding same (0.3); call with Rothschild and Davis Polk Finance and Restructuring teams regarding delivery of initial valuation materials (1.2); call with Rothschild, counsel and financial advisor to stakeholder regarding exit financing status (0.8).
Piraino, Stephen D.	06/16/21	2.2	Call with Rothschild, counsel and financial advisor to stakeholder regarding exit financing status (0.8); correspondence with E. Jerrard regarding exit financing (0.3); attend daily contingency update call with Aeroméxico and Rothschild (1.1).
Troconis, Adela	06/16/21	2.8	Review precedents regarding exit financing (0.8); attend daily contingency update call with Aeroméxico and Rothschild (1.1); call with Rothschild and Davis Polk Finance and Restructuring teams regarding delivery of initial valuation materials (0.9) (partial attendance); review exit financing timeline (0.5).
Florack, James A. Ford, Stephen	06/17/21 06/17/21	0.7 2.3	Review exit financing issues. Review and revise exit financing Non-Disclosure Agreements.
Graulich, Timothy	06/17/21	2.0	Call with A. Conesa and R. Sanchez Baker regarding exit financing (0.8); call with H. Parkhill regarding update on same (0.5); review Apollo letters regarding exit financing process (0.7).
Huebner, Marshall S.	06/17/21	0.3	Correspondence with T. Graulich regarding exit financing issues.

		ı ime i	Detail By Project
Name	Date	Hours	Narrative
Jackson, Vanessa L.	06/17/21	0.8	Attend daily contingency update call with Aeroméxico and Rothschild.
Jerrard, Erik	06/17/21	4.9	Correspondence with Aeroméxico regarding exit financing next steps and Plan term sheet (0.6); correspondence with S. Ford regarding exit financing Non-Disclosure Agreement issue (0.2); review and analyze Apollo regarding DIP financing and Cleary Gottlieb letter to Davis Polk (2.6); draft issues list regarding same (0.7); attend daily contingency update call with Aeroméxico and Rothschild (0.8).
Melcer, Moshe	06/17/21	0.1	Review Apollo exit financing letter.
Piraino, Stephen D.	06/17/21	1.6	Email with V. Jackson regarding exit financing (0.2); correspondence with E. Jerrard regarding same (0.2); review and analyze letter from Apollo regarding DIP financing (0.4); attend daily contingency update call with Aeroméxico and Rothschild (0.8).
Rincon, Cristina M.	06/17/21	0.7	Attend daily contingency update call with Aeroméxico and Rothschild.
Troconis, Adela	06/17/21	0.8	Attend daily contingency update call with Aeroméxico and Rothschild.
Graulich, Timothy	06/18/21	3.4	Call with A. Conesa and R. Sanchez Baker regarding commitment letter (0.9); review proposed comment letter (1.8) call with L. Donahue regarding same (0.7).
Jerrard, Erik	06/18/21	6.2	Attend daily contingency update call with Aeroméxico and Rothschild (1.0); review and analyze Apollo exit financing letter (1.1); correspondence with Davis Polk Restructuring and Financing teams regarding same (0.8); call with R. Arnold regarding exit financing (0.3); correspondence with Davis Polk Finance team regarding exit financing commitment (0.7); review same (1.2); review exit financing Non-Disclosure Agreements (0.6); correspondence with S. Ford regarding same (0.5).
Katz, Michael McClammy, James I.	06/18/21 06/18/21	0.2 1.0	Review Apollo exit financing letter. Attend daily contingency update call with Aeroméxico and
•		1.0	Rothschild.
Melcer, Moshe Piraino, Stephen D.	06/18/21 06/18/21	0.1 1.4	Review Apollo exit financing letter. Correspondence with T. Graulich, E. Jerrard and others regarding exit financing (0.3); attend daily contingency update call with Aeroméxico and Rothschild (1.1).
Rincon, Cristina M.	06/18/21	0.8	Review letter from Apollo regarding DIP financing (0.4); review news reports regarding DIP financing (0.4).
Troconis, Adela	06/18/21	3.6	Email with White & Case regarding reinvestment of insurance proceeds (1.0); correspondence with T. Green regarding same (0.2); attend daily contingency update call with Aeroméxico and Rothschild (1.1); call with A. Conesa, R. Sanchez Baker, R. Arnold, M. Sutter, L. Donahue, T. Perez, A. Sainz, and others regarding letter from Apollo related to exit financing (0.3); review commitment materials (1.0).
Graulich, Timothy	06/19/21	2.8	Call with S. Piraino and E. Jerrard regarding commitment letter (0.7); review documents supporting same (2.1).
Jerrard, Erik	06/19/21	2.8	Review drafts of proposed term sheets (1.6); call with S. Piraino and others regarding exit financing strategy and process (1.2).
Piraino, Stephen D.	06/19/21	1.2	Call with E. Jerrard and others regarding exit financing strategy and process.
Troconis, Adela	06/19/21	1.7	Review commitment materials (0.8); prepare issues list regarding same (0.9).

		Time	Detail By Project
Name	Date	Hours	Narrative
Jerrard, Erik	06/20/21	3.1	Analyze drafts of proposed term sheets (1.9); correspondence with Davis Polk Finance team regarding same (0.8); correspondence with co-advisors regarding same (0.4).
Piraino, Stephen D. Borchardt, Leo	06/20/21 06/21/21	0.2 5.6	Correspondence with E. Jerrard regarding exit financing. Review correspondence from E. Jerrard and related documentation regarding equity commitment (3.5); call with E. Jerrard regarding same (0.2); call with Davis Polk Restructuring and Finance teams regarding commitment materials (0.6); call with A. Simmonde regarding same (0.2);
Ford, Stephen	06/21/21	3.2	correspondence with A. Simmonds regarding same (0.2); comment on issues list (0.9). Review and revise exit Non-Disclosure Agreements (3.0); correspondence with E. Jerrard regarding same (0.1);
Graulich, Timothy	06/21/21	6.3	correspondence with Rothschild regarding same (0.1). Call with A. Conesa and R. Sanchez Baker regarding commitment letter (1.0); call with L. Borchardt regarding same (0.7); review and comment on commitment letter (4.6).
Jackson, Vanessa L.	06/21/21	4.6	Attend daily contingency update call with Aeroméxico and Rothschild (1.1); call with Davis Polk Restructuring and Finance teams commitment materials (0.6); review draft commitment materials (2.9).
Jerrard, Erik	06/21/21	5.4	Email with L. Borchardt, A. Simmonds, and H. Weigel regarding equity commitment (0.7); call with L. Borchardt regarding same (0.2); call with Davis Polk Restructuring and Finance teams commitment materials (0.6); prepare for same (0.4); call with S. Piraino and others regarding exit financing and case strategy (1.1); draft response to Apollo exit commitment letter (1.3); attend daily contingency update call with Aeroméxico and Rothschild (1.1).
Katz, Michael	06/21/21	1.3	Correspondence with A. Troconis regarding precedent exit financing documentation and background (0.6); correspondence with L. Lee regarding exit financing background (0.1); correspondence with Davis Polk Restructuring team regarding financing issues list (0.6).
Lee, Lloyd	06/21/21	1.0	Call with M. Katz and A. Troconis regarding exit financing (0.4); attend daily contingency update call with Aeroméxico and Rothschild (0.6) (partial attendance).
Piraino, Stephen D.	06/21/21	3.2	Attend daily contingency update call with Aeroméxico and Rothschild (1.0); call with E. Jerrard and others regarding exit financing and case strategy (1.1); review commitment letter (0.5); call with Davis Polk Corporate team regarding exit financing (0.6).
Simmonds, Alexander W.	06/21/21	6.2	Call with Davis Polk Restructuring and Finance teams regarding commitment materials (0.6); review rights offering term sheet and related materials, including equity commitment letter (1.8); prepare rights offering issues list (3.5); email with H. Weigel regarding same (0.1); correspondence with E. Jerrard regarding precedents (0.2).
Troconis, Adela	06/21/21	4.2	Review and revise exit financing commitment letter (2.1); attend daily contingency update call with Aeroméxico and Rothschild (1.0); call with M. Katz and L. Lee regarding exit financing (0.4); call with Davis Polk Restructuring and Finance teams regarding commitment materials (0.3); review letter in response to Apollo commitment letter (0.4).
Weigel, Heather	06/21/21	8.4	Review draft rights offering materials (1.5); review draft exit financing materials (0.4); call with Davis Polk Restructuring

		Time	Detail By Project
Name	Date	Hours	Narrative
			and Finance teams commitment materials (0.6); call with L. Borchardt regarding same (0.2); correspondence with A. Simmonds regarding same (0.2); correspondence with E. Jerrard regarding rights offering (0.2); review precedent term sheet regarding same (0.8); review and revise rights offering term sheet (4.5).
Borchardt, Leo	06/22/21	6.1	Review rights offer term sheet and precedents (2.5); review and comment on issues list regarding same (2.2); call with H. Weigel and A. Simmonds regarding same (0.5); attend daily contingency update call with Aeroméxico and Rothschild (0.5) (partial attendance); call with Davis Polk Restructuring and Finance teams regarding exit financing issues (0.4).
Florack, James A.	06/22/21	1.0	Analyze exit financing issues.
Ford, Stephen	06/22/21	3.8	Review and revise exit financing Non-Disclosure Agreements (3.1); correspondence with Rothschild and Skyworks teams regarding same (0.4); correspondence with E. Jerrard regarding same (0.1); correspondence with Davis Polk team regarding execution of same (0.2).
Graulich, Timothy	06/22/21	1.5	Call with FTI regarding exit financing (0.7); call with A. Conesa and R. Sanchez Baker regarding exit financing and Plan issues (0.8).
Jackson, Vanessa L.	06/22/21	4.2	Attend daily contingency update call with Aeroméxico and Rothschild (0.5); call with Davis Polk Restructuring and Finance teams regarding exit financing issues (0.4); review draft commitment papers (3.3).
Jerrard, Erik	06/22/21	2.9	Revise letter in response to Apollo commitment letter (0.3); review comments to exit financing Non-Disclosure Agreement (0.4); review and comment on debt commitment letter issues list (1.8); call with R. Arnold regarding exit financing next steps (0.4).
Piraino, Stephen D.	06/22/21	3.4	Correspondence with T. Graulich and E. Jerrard regarding exit financing (0.7); correspondence with E. Jerrard regarding same (0.6); call with R. Arnold regarding same (0.2); correspondence with T. Graulich, V. Jackson and E. Jerrard regarding same (0.5); call with Aeroméxico team and coadvisors regarding same (1.0); review exit financing issues list (0.4).
Simmonds, Alexander W.	06/22/21	4.8	Review and revise rights offer term sheet (3.9); correspondence with E. Jerrard and S. Robles regarding issues list regarding same (0.4); call with L. Borchardt and H. Weigel regarding same (0.5).
Troconis, Adela	06/22/21	2.6	Prepare basket chart regarding exit financing proposal (0.3); attend daily contingency update call with Aeroméxico and Rothschild (1.0); correspondence with V. Jackson regarding Apollo commitment letter (0.3); prepare rights offering term sheet and equity commitment letter issues lists (1.0).
Weigel, Heather	06/22/21	0.9	Call with L. Borchardt and A. Simmonds regarding rights offering term sheet issues list (0.5); research and review precedents for same and backstop commitment agreements (0.4).
Borchardt, Leo	06/23/21	4.5	Attend daily contingency update call with Aeroméxico and Rothschild (1.0); call with A. Sainz, S. Robles, S. Piraino, and A. Simmonds regarding rights offering implementation (1.1); call with H. Weigel and A. Simmonds regarding rights offering materials (0.3); call with V. Jackson and others regarding rights offering materials (0.8); call with counsel and financial 27

		Time	Detail By Project
Name	Date	Hours	Narrative
			advisor to stakeholder, , Rothschild and Davis Polk teams regarding exit financing (0.6); analyze rights offering materials (0.7).
Ford, Stephen	06/23/21	1.0	Review and revise exit financing Non-Disclosure Agreements (0.7); call with Rothschild team regarding same (0.1); correspondence with E. Jerrard regarding same (0.1); correspondence with Davis Polk team regarding execution of same (0.1).
Graulich, Timothy	06/23/21	1.0	Call with A. Conesa and R. Sanchez Baker regarding exit financing.
Green, Thomas S.	06/23/21	0.4	Research issues regarding DIP credit agreement.
Jackson, Vanessa L.	06/23/21	3.6	Attend daily contingency update call with Aeroméxico and Rothschild (1.0); call with L. Borchardt and others regarding rights offering materials (0.8); call with Sainz Abogados regarding same (0.5); revise issues list (1.3).
Jerrard, Erik	06/23/21	5.6	Call with counsel to stakeholder regarding exit financing next steps (0.5); call with potential exit financing lender and S. Piraino regarding exit financing issues (0.7); correspondence with S. Piraino regarding update on same (0.3); email with potential exit financing lender regarding claims issues (0.4); correspondence with Davis Polk Restructuring, Finance, and Corporate teams regarding rights offering next steps (0.8); call with A. Sainz, S. Robles, L. Borchardt, and A. Simmonds regarding rights offering implementation (1.1); call with L. Borchardt regarding same (0.4); correspondence with R. Arnold regarding exit financing (0.3); attend daily contingency update call with Aeroméxico and Rothschild (1.1).
Katz, Michael	06/23/21	1.1	Call with A. Sainz, S. Robles, L. Borchardt, and A. Simmonds regarding rights offering implementation.
Lee, Lloyd	06/23/21	1.0	Attend daily contingency update call with Aeroméxico and Rothschild.
Piraino, Stephen D.	06/23/21	4.3	Correspondence with E. Jerrard regarding exit financing (0.8); call with counsel and financial advisor to stakeholder, Rothschild and Davis Polk teams regarding exit financing (0.6); call with potential exit financing lender and E. Jerrard regarding exit financing issues (0.7); call with A. Sainz, S. Robles, L. Borchardt, and A. Simmonds regarding rights offering implementation (1.1); attend daily contingency update call with Aeroméxico and Rothschild (1.1).
Rincon, Cristina M.	06/23/21	1.1	Attend daily contingency update call with Aeroméxico and Rothschild.
Simmonds, Alexander W.	06/23/21	4.6	Attend daily contingency update call with Aeroméxico and Rothschild (1.0); call with A. Sainz, S. Robles, L. Borchardt, and E. Jerrard regarding rights offering implementation (1.1); call with L. Borchardt and H. Weigel regarding rights offering materials (0.3); correspondence with S. Robles regarding same (0.3); revise rights offering term sheet (1.9).
Troconis, Adela	06/23/21	3.7	Attend daily contingency update call with Aeroméxico and Rothschild (1.0); prepare basket chart regarding exit financing (0.5); prepare rights offering term sheet and equity commitment letter issues lists (1.1); call with Sainz Abogados and Davis Polk teams regarding equity commitment for exit financing (1.1).
Weigel, Heather	06/23/21	2.4	Call with L. Borchardt and A. Simmonds regarding rights offering materials (0.3); call with A. Sainz, S. Robles, L. Borchardt, and A. Simmonds regarding rights offering

		Time	Detail By Project
Name	Date	Hours	Narrative
Borchardt, Leo	06/24/21	5.4	implementation (1.1); attend daily contingency update call with Aeroméxico and Rothschild (1.0). Review correspondence and supporting documentation from E. Jerrard regarding rights offering (1.1); review precedent rights offering underwriting and anchor investment structures (1.9); call with A. Sainz and Davis Polk Restructuring and Corporate teams regarding Mexican law implications on rights offering (1.2); prepare for same (0.8); correspondence with A. Troconis, V. Jackson, H. Weigel, A. Simmonds and E. Jerrard
Ford, Stephen	06/24/21	1.6	regarding exit financing (0.4). Review and revise exit financing Non-Disclosure Agreements (1.1); correspondence with E. Jerrard regarding same (0.1); correspondence with Rothschild regarding same (0.2); correspondence with Davis Polk team regarding execution of same (0.2).
Graulich, Timothy	06/24/21	1.0	Call with A. Conesa and R. Sanchez Baker regarding exit financing and strategy.
Jackson, Vanessa L.	06/24/21	1.6	Attend daily contingency update call with Aeroméxico and Rothschild (0.7); review DIP credit agreement relating to event of loss provisions (0.9).
Jerrard, Erik	06/24/21	3.3	Review exit financing proposal sent to Mexican shareholders (0.6); correspondence with T. Graulich and S. Piraino regarding same (0.3); correspondence with Creditors Committee and potential exit financing providers regarding next steps in exit financing process (0.6); review comments to exit financing Non-Disclosure Agreement (1.0); attend daily contingency update call with Aeroméxico and Rothschild (0.8).
Piraino, Stephen D.	06/24/21	1.5	Attend daily contingency update call with Aeroméxico and Rothschild (0.8); review and analyze exit financing proposal (0.5); email with T. Graulich and E. Jerrard regarding exit financing (0.2).
Troconis, Adela	06/24/21	2.6	Attend daily contingency update call with Aeroméxico and Rothschild (0.7); analyze implications from DIP credit agreement of replacement of engine (1.4); correspondence with V. Jackson regarding insurance proceeds and replacement of engine (0.5).
Weigel, Heather	06/24/21	0.7	Prepare rights offering term sheet and equity commitment letter issues lists.
Borchardt, Leo	06/25/21	5.0	Attend daily contingency update call with Aeroméxico and Rothschild (1.0); call with Creditors Committee advisors, Sainz Abogados, and Davis Polk Finance team regarding shareholder support agreement (0.8); call with potential bidder advisors, Sainz Abogados, A. Troconis, and A. Simmonds regarding equity conversion schedule (0.8); correspondence with H. Weigel, A. Simmonds, E. Jerrard, V. Jackson, and A. Troconis regarding rights offering (0.4); review and comment on rights offering term sheet (1.7); correspondence with A. Simmonds regarding same (0.3).
Florack, James A. Ford, Stephen	06/25/21 06/25/21	0.5 1.7	Review exit financing terms. Review and revise exit financing Non-Disclosure Agreements (0.4); update tracker and database regarding same (1.0); correspondence with Davis Polk support staff regarding execution of Non-Disclosure Agreements (0.2); correspond with Rothschild regarding Non-Disclosure Agreements (0.1).
Graulich, Timothy	06/25/21	1.0	Call with A. Conesa and R. Sanchez Baker regarding exit financing.

		Time I	Detail By Project
Name	Date	Hours	Narrative
Jackson, Vanessa L.	06/25/21	3.7	Attend daily contingency update call with Aeroméxico and Rothschild (0.9); call with interested party regarding financing issues (0.5); review draft commitment papers (2.3).
Jerrard, Erik	06/25/21	7.2	Attend daily contingency update call with Aeroméxico and Rothschild (0.9); call with Creditors Committee advisors, Sainz Abogados, and Davis Polk Finance team regarding shareholder support agreement (0.8); analyze shareholder support agreement (0.7); email with Davis Polk Corporate team regarding same (0.6); call with S. Piraino regarding exit financing (0.3); call with potential bidder advisors, Sainz Abogados, L. Borchardt, and A. Simmonds regarding equity conversion schedule (0.8); research and analyze precedent regarding equity commitments and related documentations (2.3); revise DIP milestone timeline (0.8).
Masaro, Matthew Bruno	06/25/21	0.9	Call with Creditors Committee advisors, Sainz Abogados, and Davis Polk Finance team regarding shareholder support agreement.
Piraino, Stephen D.	06/25/21	3.1	Call with Willkie Farr, Morrison & Foerster, Sainz Abogados and Davis Polk teams regarding shareholder support agreement (0.6); call with potential bidder advisors, Sainz Abogados, L. Borchardt, and A. Simmonds regarding equity conversion schedule (0.8); call with E. Jerrard regarding exit financing (0.3); correspondence with C. Rincon regarding same (0.4); attend daily contingency update call with Aeroméxico and Rothschild (1.0).
Rincon, Cristina M.	06/25/21	1.0	Attend daily contingency update call with Aeroméxico and Rothschild.
Simmonds, Alexander W.	06/25/21	5.9	Call with Creditors Committee advisors, Sainz Abogados, and Davis Polk Finance team regarding shareholder support agreement (0.7); attend daily contingency update call with Aeroméxico and Rothschild (1.0); call with potential bidder advisors, Sainz Abogados, E. Jerrard, and L. Borchardt regarding equity conversion schedule (0.8); correspondence with L. Borchardt, H. Weigel, E. Jerrard, V. Jackson, and A. Troconis regarding rights offering (0.4); revise rights offering term sheet (2.7); correspondence with L. Borchardt regarding same (0.3).
Troconis, Adela	06/25/21	3.1	Attend daily contingency update call with Aeroméxico and Rothschild (1.0); call with Creditors Committee advisors, Sainz Abogados, and Davis Polk Finance team regarding shareholder support agreement (0.7); call with potential bidder advisors, Sainz Abogados, L. Borchardt, and A. Simmonds regarding equity conversion schedule (0.8); correspondence with L. Borchardt, V. Jackson, H. Weigel, A. Simmonds and E. Jerrard regarding exit financing (0.6).
Weigel, Heather	06/25/21	2.1	Call with potential bidder advisors, Sainz Abogados, L. Borchardt, and A. Simmonds regarding equity conversion schedule (0.8); correspondence with L. Borchardt, A. Simmonds, E. Jerrard, V. Jackson, and A. Troconis regarding rights offering (0.4); email with Davis Polk and Sainz Abogados teams regarding call regarding rights offering materials (0.2); attend conference with Willkie Farr, Davis Polk and Sainz Abogados teams regarding shareholders agreement (0.7).
Jerrard, Erik	06/26/21	4.4	Draft DIP credit agreement summary and timing requirements in preparation for Board presentation and related analysis

		Time I	Detail By Project
Name	Date	Hours	Narrative
Borchardt, Leo	06/27/21	3.1	(3.7); correspondence with T. Graulich regarding same (0.7). Call with Sainz Abogados team, H. Weigel, A. Simmonds and E. Jerrard regarding equity commitment financing (0.8); call with H. Weigel and A. Simmonds regarding same (0.3); review and comment on issues list (2.0).
Jerrard, Erik	06/27/21	5.8	Call with Sainz Abogados team, L. Borchardt, H. Weigel, and A. Simmonds regarding equity commitment financing (0.8); review and revise Board materials regarding credit agreement process (1.1); analyze DIP credit agreement schedule (2.3); correspondence with Sainz Abogados and Davis Polk Corporate teams regarding exit financing process timing (0.8); correspondence with Aeroméxico and co-advisors regarding same (0.8).
Simmonds, Alexander W.	06/27/21	4.8	Call with Sainz Abogados team, H. Weigel, L. Borchardt and E. Jerrard regarding equity commitment financing (0.8); call with L. Borchardt and H. Weigel regarding same (0.3); review and revise issues list and related email form (3.7).
Weigel, Heather	06/27/21	8.1	Call with Sainz Abogados team, A. Simmonds, L. Borchardt and E. Jerrard regarding equity commitment financing (0.8); correspondence with Davis Polk team regarding exit financing updates (0.3); call with A. Simmonds and L. Borchardt regarding same (0.3); review and revise rights offering term sheet (5.5); review and revise issues list regarding same (1.2).
Borchardt, Leo	06/28/21	1.4	Attend daily contingency update call with Aeroméxico and Rothschild.
Ford, Stephen	06/28/21	0.2	Correspondence with Davis Polk team regarding execution of exit financing Non-Disclosure Agreements (0.1); correspondence with Rothschild team regarding same (0.1).
Graulich, Timothy	06/28/21	1.7	Call with S. Piraino and E. Jerrard regarding exit financing (0.8); meet with H. Parkhill regarding same (0.9).
Jerrard, Erik	06/28/21	4.5	Correspondence with S. Piraino regarding initial valuation materials (0.3); correspondence with interested parties regarding initial valuation materials (0.5); email with A. Troconis regarding same (0.8); analyze DIP credit agreement for initial valuation issues (0.4); email with Aeroméxico regarding same (0.3); email with Rothschild regarding same (0.4); email with T. Graulich regarding same (0.4); attend daily contingency update call with Aeroméxico and Rothschild (1.4).
Lee, Lloyd	06/28/21	0.5	Correspondence with Davis Polk Finance team regarding exit facility term sheet.
Piraino, Stephen D.	06/28/21	5.2	Correspondence with T. Graulich regarding shareholder support agreement (3.8); attend daily contingency update call with Aeroméxico and Rothschild (1.4).
Rincon, Cristina M.	06/28/21	0.5	Review shareholder support agreement for exit financing issues.
Simmonds, Alexander W.	06/28/21	4.2	Attend daily contingency update call with Aeroméxico and Rothschild (1.1); correspondence with L. Borchardt regarding issues list (0.2); review and revise issues list (1.2); correspondence with Sainz Abogados and Aeroméxico regarding same (0.1); review and revise exit facility term sheet (1.6).
Troconis, Adela	06/28/21	2.2	Attend daily contingency update call with Aeroméxico and Rothschild (1.1); correspondence with V. Jackson and E. Jerrard regarding exit financing (1.1).
Borchardt, Leo	06/29/21	2.3	Correspondence with A. Simmonds regarding exit debt financing commitment (0.1); call with Aeroméxico, Davis Polk, 31

		Time	Detail By Project
Name	Date	Hours	Narrative
Graulich, Timothy	06/29/21	4.0	and AlixPartners teams regarding exit financing (0.7); review and comment on revised exit facility term sheet (1.5). Call with Aeroméxico, Davis Polk, and AlixPartners teams regarding exit financing (0.7); call with A. Conesa and R.
Jackson, Vanessa L.	06/29/21	2.2	Sanchez Baker regarding exit financing (0.8); call with V. Jackson and R. Sanchez Baker regarding debt financing term sheet (0.5); call with H. Parkhill regarding equity conversion issues (0.4); review valuation materials (1.6). Review exit facility term sheet (1.5); call with Aeroméxico,
			Davis Polk, and AlixPartners teams regarding exit financing (0.7).
Jerrard, Erik	06/29/21	3.7	Call with Aeroméxico, Davis Polk, and AlixPartners teams regarding exit financing (0.7); review and analyze new debt financing proposal (2.0); correspondence with DIP lenders regarding initial valuation material delivery (0.7); correspondence with Aeroméxico regarding Plan process and filing milestones in DIP credit agreement (0.3).
Katz, Michael	06/29/21	0.7	Call with Aeroméxico, Davis Polk, and AlixPartners teams regarding exit financing.
Lee, Lloyd	06/29/21	0.7	Call with Aeroméxico, Davis Polk, and AlixPartners teams regarding exit financing.
Melcer, Moshe	06/29/21	0.2	Email with Davis Polk Plan and Finance teams regarding DIP and Plan milestones.
Piraino, Stephen D.	06/29/21	1.4	Review exit financing proposal (0.4); correspondence with E. Jerrard regarding exit financing (0.3); call with Aeroméxico, Davis Polk and AlixPartners teams regarding same (0.7).
Simmonds, Alexander W.	06/29/21	1.8	Correspondence with A. Conesa and R. Sanchez Baker regarding exit facility term sheet (0.1); correspondence with L. Borchardt regarding same (0.1); call with Aeroméxico, Davis Polk, and AlixPartners teams regarding exit financing (0.7); revise exit facility term sheet (0.9).
Troconis, Adela	06/29/21	1.2	Comment on exit debt financing commitment letter (0.5); call with Aeroméxico, Davis Polk and AlixPartners teams regarding exit financing (0.7).
Borchardt, Leo	06/30/21	3.6	Attend daily contingency update call with Aeroméxico and Rothschild (0.9); review and comment on exit facility term sheet (2.6); call with A. Simmonds regarding same (0.1).
Graulich, Timothy	06/30/21	1.4	Call with H. Parkhill regarding exit financing next steps (0.6); call with A. Conesa and R. Sanchez Baker regarding exit financing (0.8);
Jackson, Vanessa L.	06/30/21	2.4	Attend daily contingency update call with Aeroméxico and Rothschild (0.9); review exit facility term sheet (1.5).
Jerrard, Erik	06/30/21	2.7	Correspondence with stakeholders regarding exit financing process (0.4); email with Davis Polk team regarding same (1.1); attend daily contingency update call with Aeroméxico and Rothschild (0.9); call with S. Piraino regarding exit financing (0.3).
Katz, Michael	06/30/21	0.7	Review closing documents (0.6); email with L. Lee regarding same (0.1).
Piraino, Stephen D.	06/30/21	3.5	Attend daily contingency update call with Aeroméxico and Rothschild (0.9); review exit financing proposal (0.4); call with E. Jerrard regarding exit financing (0.3); call with Aeroméxico, Davis Polk and AlixPartners teams regarding same (0.7); correspondence with T. Graulich and E. Jerrard regarding same (0.4); review letter regarding DIP financing (0.2); correspondence with T. Graulich, J. McClammy, E. Jerrard 32

		Time	Detail By Project
Name	Date	Hours	Narrative
Simmonds, Alexander W.	06/30/21	2.8	and C. Rincon regarding exit financing (0.6). Attend daily contingency update call with Aeroméxico and Rothschild (1.0); finalize exit facility term sheet (0.9); correspondence with H. Weigel regarding same (0.8); call with
Troconis, Adela	06/30/21	7.7	L. Borchardt regarding same (0.1). Attend daily contingency update call with Aeroméxico and Rothschild (0.9); prepare exit debt financing grid with key business terms (6.8).
Total AM190 Financi	ng	467.2	
AM200 General Case	Administration		
Giddens, Magali	06/01/21	0.7	Correspondence with Epiq regarding service of order
Jerrard, Erik	06/01/21	2.1	regarding payment to pilots (0.1); review docket filings (0.6). Prepare for weekly workstreams call with Davis Polk
Melcer, Moshe	06/01/21	0.2	Restructuring team. Review and revise summary of case status.
Altman, Olivia	06/02/21	0.2	Review docket filings.
Bane, Abraham	06/02/21	1.0	Attend weekly workstreams call with Davis Polk Restructuring team.
Ford, Stephen	06/02/21	1.0	Attend weekly workstreams call with Davis Polk Restructuring team.
Graulich, Timothy	06/02/21	1.0	Attend weekly workstreams call with Davis Polk Restructuring team.
Jerrard, Erik	06/02/21	1.6	Attend weekly workstreams call with Davis Polk Restructuring team (1.0); email with M. Melcer regarding same (0.4); call with S. Piraino regarding case updates (0.2).
Masaro, Matthew Bruno	06/02/21	1.0	Attend weekly workstreams call with Davis Polk Restructuring team.
Melcer, Moshe	06/02/21	1.8	Attend weekly workstreams call with Davis Polk Restructuring team (1.0); review and revise summary of case status (0.1); correspondence with Willkie Farr and S. Piraino regarding exclusivity extension (0.1); review and revise motion to extend exclusivity periods (0.6).
Piraino, Stephen D.	06/02/21	1.7	Attend weekly workstreams call with Davis Polk Restructuring team (1.0); correspondence with T. Graulich regarding case updates (0.5); call with E. Jerrard regarding same (0.2).
Sturm, Josh	06/02/21	1.2	Attend weekly workstreams call with Davis Polk Restructuring team (1.0); correspondence with T. Graulich regarding UST concerns (0.2).
Altman, Olivia	06/03/21	0.6	File omnibus claims objections (0.4); correspondence with M. Melcer regarding same (0.2).
Masaro, Matthew Bruno	06/03/21	0.3	Review and revise case timeline (0.2); correspondence with S. Piraino regarding same (0.1).
Piraino, Stephen D.	06/03/21	0.4	Call with Chambers regarding hearing scheduling (0.2); correspondence with M. Masaro regarding case timeline (0.2).
Altman, Olivia Giddens, Magali	06/04/21 06/04/21	0.2 0.7	Correspondence with Epiq regarding service. File notice of assumption of executory contracts and unexpired leases on docket (0.2); correspondence with M. Masaro regarding same (0.1); correspondence with Epiq regarding service of same (0.1); review docket filings (0.3).
Jerrard, Erik	06/04/21	0.4	Call with S. Piraino regarding case updates.
Masaro, Matthew Bruno	06/04/21	0.1	Correspondence with T. Graulich and others regarding case timeline.
Piraino, Stephen D.	06/04/21	1.2	Correspondence with E. Jerrard regarding case updates (0.4); call with same regarding same (0.4); email with M. Masaro

		Time	Detail By Project
Name	Date	Hours	Narrative
			regarding case timeline (0.4).
Masaro, Matthew	06/06/21	0.1	Correspondence with S. Piraino and others regarding case
Bruno Giddens, Magali	06/08/21	0.8	timeline. Correspondence with M. Melcer regarding filing motion to
Gladens, Magaii	00/00/21	0.0	extend exclusivity periods (0.1); file same (0.2); review docket filings (0.5).
Jerrard, Erik	06/08/21	2.7	Call with S. Piraino to discuss case updates (0.4); prepare for
			weekly workstreams call with Davis Polk Restructuring team (2.3).
Melcer, Moshe	06/08/21	0.3	Review and revise summary of case status.
Piraino, Stephen D.	06/08/21	0.2	Call with E. Jerrard regarding case updates.
Jerrard, Erik	06/09/21	2.2	Draft response letter to committee (1.4); correspondence with S. Piraino regarding case workstreams (0.8).
Piraino, Stephen D.	06/09/21	0.2	Email with Aeroméxico team regarding revised Rule 2019 statement.
Giddens, Magali	06/10/21	0.1	Correspondence with S. Piraino regarding April 20 Hearing transcript.
Jerrard, Erik	06/10/21	0.4	Call with S. Piraino regarding case updates.
Melcer, Moshe	06/10/21	0.2	Correspondence with E. Jerrard regarding upcoming hearings.
Piraino, Stephen D.	06/10/21	0.4	Correspondence with E. Jerrard regarding upcoming hearings.
Piraino, Stephen D.	06/13/21	0.2	Call with A. Schwartz regarding case workstreams.
Giddens, Magali	06/14/21	0.3	Review docket filings.
Jerrard, Erik	06/14/21	2.3	Email with AlixPartners regarding case administration (0.2); correspondence with T. Graulich and S. Piraino regarding case updates (0.8); review case management order (0.7);
			email with J. Barsalona regarding same (0.3); correspondence with S. Piraino regarding case strategy (0.3).
Altman, Olivia	06/15/21	0.6	File Notice of Omnibus Fee Hearing (0.3); review docket filings (0.3).
Jerrard, Erik	06/15/21	4.9	Prepare for weekly workstreams call with Davis Polk Restructuring team (2.5); correspondence with T. Graulich and S. Piraino regarding case strategy (1.8); email with Chambers regarding Omnibus Fee Hearing scheduling (0.2); review Notice of Omnibus Fee Hearing (0.2); email with M. Melcer regarding same (0.2).
Masaro, Matthew Bruno	06/15/21	0.9	Call with A. Schwartz and AlixPartners regarding monthly operating reports (0.5); correspondence with AlixPartners, M.
Melcer, Moshe	06/15/21	1.1	Giddens, and others regarding same (0.4). Review and revise summary of case status (0.5); coordinate hearing attendance (0.3); draft notice of August Omnibus
Piraino, Stephen D.	06/15/21	0.6	Hearing (0.3). Call with A. Schwartz regarding case workstreams (0.3); correspondence with E. Jerrard regarding case workstreams
Bane, Abraham	06/16/21	1.0	(0.3). Attend weekly workstreams call with Davis Polk Restructuring team.
Dekhtyar, Mariya	06/16/21	0.2	Attend weekly workstreams call with Davis Polk Restructuring team (partial attendance).
Erickson, Jarret	06/16/21	1.1	Attend weekly workstreams call with Davis Polk Restructuring team.
Ford, Stephen	06/16/21	1.0	Attend weekly workstreams call with Davis Polk Restructuring team.
Graulich, Timothy	06/16/21	1.0	Attend weekly workstreams call with Davis Polk Restructuring team.
Jerrard, Erik	06/16/21	1.9	Attend weekly workstreams call with Davis Polk Restructuring team (1.1); email with M. Melcer regarding same (0.4);

		Time I	Detail By Project
Name	Date	Hours	Narrative
Masaro, Matthew Bruno	06/16/21	1.1	correspondence with S. Piraino regarding case updates (0.4). Attend weekly workstreams call with Davis Polk Restructuring team.
Melcer, Moshe	06/16/21	1.3	Attend weekly workstreams call with Davis Polk Restructuring team and take notes (1.0); review and revise summary of case status (0.3).
Piraino, Stephen D.	06/16/21	1.0	Attend weekly workstreams call with Davis Polk Restructuring team.
Rincon, Cristina M. Sturm, Josh	06/16/21 06/16/21	0.1 1.0	Correspondence with J. McClammy regarding case updates. Attend weekly workstreams call with Davis Polk Restructuring team.
Altman, Olivia	06/17/21	0.8	Coordinate June 22nd Exclusivity Hearing attendance (0.3); file June 22nd Exclusivity Hearing agenda (0.3); correspondence with M. Melcer regarding same (0.2).
Jerrard, Erik	06/17/21	1.9	Review and revise June 22nd Exclusivity Hearing agenda (0.3); email with M. Melcer regarding same (0.2); review and revise committee filing (0.6); correspondence with S. Piraino regarding same (0.4); call with A. Schwartz and S. Piraino regarding case updates(0.4).
Masaro, Matthew Bruno	06/17/21	0.1	Review June 22nd Exclusivity Hearing agenda.
Piraino, Stephen D. Jerrard, Erik	06/17/21 06/18/21	0.4 0.8	Call with A. Schwartz and E. Jerrard regarding case updates. Review publications regarding Aeroméxico cases (0.2); email with co-advisors regarding same (0.3); correspondence with S. Piraino regarding case updates (0.3).
Melcer, Moshe	06/18/21	0.6	Draft letter to Chambers regarding extension of objection deadline (0.2); revise distribution lists (0.3); review and revise June 22nd Exclusivity Hearing agenda (0.1).
Piraino, Stephen D. Melcer, Moshe	06/18/21 06/20/21	0.1 1.1	Correspondence with E. Jerrard regarding case updates. Draft notice of revised proposed order regarding same (0.7); draft June 22nd Exclusivity Hearing agenda (0.3); review and revise summary of case status (0.1).
Altman, Olivia	06/21/21	0.8	File revised proposed exclusivity order (0.3); file amended June 22nd Exclusivity Hearing agenda (0.2); review docket (0.3).
Melcer, Moshe	06/21/21	0.6	Review and revise June 22nd Exclusivity Hearing agenda (0.4); review and revised proposed order for same (0.2).
Piraino, Stephen D. Altman, Olivia	06/21/21 06/22/21	0.4 0.3	Correspondence with M. Masaro regarding case updates. Correspondence with Epiq regarding service of withdrawal notices (0.2); coordinate June 22nd Exclusivity Hearing attendance (0.1).
Graulich, Timothy	06/22/21	3.1	Call with stakeholder regarding same (0.4); review revised business plan (2.7).
Huebner, Marshall S.	06/22/21	0.3	Correspondence with T. Graulich regarding upcoming meeting and call with Mexican government and Aeroméxico.
Jerrard, Erik	06/22/21	1.4	Prepare for weekly workstreams call with Davis Polk Restructuring team.
Melcer, Moshe	06/22/21	0.2	Review and revise summary of case status.
Altman, Olivia	06/23/21	1.0	Rreview dockets for Global Aviation precedents.
Bane, Abraham	06/23/21	1.0	Attend weekly workstreams call with Davis Polk Restructuring team.
Erickson, Jarret	06/23/21	1.1	Attend weekly workstreams call with Davis Polk Restructuring team.
Ford, Stephen	06/23/21	0.9	Attend weekly workstreams call with Davis Polk Restructuring team.
Graulich, Timothy	06/23/21	2.0	Attend weekly workstreams call with Davis Polk Restructuring

		Time	Detail By Project
Name	Date	Hours	Narrative
Jerrard, Erik	06/23/21	2.4	team (1.0); correspondence with S. Piraino and E. Jerrard regarding workstreams (1.0). Outline summary of next steps for Davis Polk restructuring team (1.0); attend weekly workstreams call with Davis Polk Restructuring team (1.0); correspondence with Davis Polk
Masaro, Matthew Bruno	06/23/21	1.0	Restructuring team regarding same (0.4). Attend weekly workstreams call with Davis Polk Restructuring team.
Melcer, Moshe	06/23/21	2.0	Attend workstreams call weekly with Davis Polk Restructuring team (1.0); review precedent fee applications (0.9); review and revise summary of case status (0.1).
Piraino, Stephen D.	06/23/21	1.6	Attend weekly workstreams call with Davis Polk Restructuring team (1.0); review summary of case status (0.4); email with M. Melcer and T. Graulich regarding case updates (0.2).
Sturm, Josh	06/23/21	1.0	Attend weekly workstreams call with Davis Polk Restructuring team.
Altman, Olivia	06/24/21	1.7	Research Mesa Air precedent related documents for Plan issues (1.0); file severance motion (0.3); coordinate service of same with Epiq (0.4).
Jerrard, Erik	06/24/21	0.6	Correspondence with T. Graulich regarding case status.
Piraino, Stephen D.	06/24/21	0.4	Correspondence with E. Jerrard regarding case updates.
Altman, Olivia	06/25/21	0.1	Correspondence with Davis Polk team regarding hearing transcript.
Jerrard, Erik	06/25/21	1.3	Correspondence with S. Piraino regarding case update (0.2); correspondence with T. Graulich regarding same (1.1).
Piraino, Stephen D.	06/25/21	0.5	Correspondence with E. Jerrard regarding case update.
Jerrard, Erik	06/28/21	0.6	Correspondence with S. Piraino regarding case updates (0.4); correspondence with T. Graulich regarding case updates (0.2).
Piraino, Stephen D.	06/28/21	0.4	Correspondence with E. Jerrard regarding case updates (0.2); call with J. Eisen and E. Jerrard regarding scheduling (0.2).
Jerrard, Erik	06/29/21	3.3	Prepare for weekly workstreams call with Davis Polk Restructuring team (1.7); email with same regarding same (0.5); correspondence with T. Graulich and S. Piraino regarding case updates (0.6); correspondence with S. Piraino regarding same (0.5).
Melcer, Moshe Piraino, Stephen D.	06/29/21 06/29/21	0.5 0.8	Review and revise case status update. Correspondence with E. Jerrard regarding case updates (0.2); correspondence with same and T. Graulich regarding same (0.6).
Sturm, Josh	06/29/21	1.0	Correspondence with Davis Polk team regarding workstreams.
Bane, Abraham	06/30/21	1.1	Attend weekly workstreams call with Davis Polk Restructuring team.
Erickson, Jarret	06/30/21	1.1	Attend weekly workstreams call with Davis Polk Restructuring team.
Ford, Stephen	06/30/21	1.1	Attend weekly workstreams call with Davis Polk Restructuring team.
Graulich, Timothy	06/30/21	0.8	Attend weekly workstreams call with Davis Polk Restructuring team (partial attendance).
Jerrard, Erik	06/30/21	1.4	Attend weekly workstreams call with Davis Polk Restructuring team (1.1); email with M. Melcer regarding same (0.3).
Masaro, Matthew Bruno	06/30/21	1.1	Attend weekly workstreams call with Davis Polk Restructuring team.
Melcer, Moshe	06/30/21	1.1	Attend weekly workstreams call with Davis Polk Restructuring team.
Piraino, Stephen D.	06/30/21	2.0	Attend weekly workstreams call with Davis Polk Restructuring

		Time	Detail By Project
Name	Date	Hours	Narrative
			team (1.1); correspondence with E. Jerrard regarding case
			updates (0.3); correspondence with M. Masaro regarding same (0.1); call with A. Schwartz regarding same (0.5).
Rincon, Cristina M.	06/30/21	0.4	
Turioori, Oriotiria ivi.	00/00/21	0.4	case updates.
Sturm, Josh	06/30/21	1.1	Attend weekly workstreams call with Davis Polk Restructuring team (1.0); prepare for same (0.1).
Total AM200 Genera	l Case	95.9	
Administration			
AM210 Non-DPW Re	tention and Fee I	ssues	
Piraino, Stephen D.	06/02/21	0.1	Correspondence with T. Graulich regarding retention issue.
Jerrard, Erik	06/04/21	3.1	Review and revise De La Vega retention application (1.3);
			email with Morris Nichols regarding same (0.4);
			correspondence with same and S. Piraino regarding retention
			of same (0.3); call with Aeroméxico and Morris Nichols to
			discuss other retentions (0.4); email with co-advisors regarding interim fee application process (0.7).
Jerrard, Erik	06/14/21	0.4	
oonara, Em	00/11/21	0.1	applications.
Jerrard, Erik	06/15/21	0.3	
			interim fee applications.
Masaro, Matthew	06/15/21	0.4	Correspondence with AlixPartners and Aeroméxico regarding
Bruno			ordinary course professional retention (0.2); review order
Diraina Stanban D	06/16/21	0.2	regarding same (0.2). Call with A. Aranalde regarding retention issue.
Piraino, Stephen D. Jerrard, Erik	06/24/21	0.2 1.1	Call with D. Abbott, A. Sainz, S. Piraino, and others regarding
ocitara, Erik	00/24/21		KPMG retention issues (0.5); correspondence with D. Abbott
			regarding same (0.3); correspondence with T. Graulich
			regarding same (0.3).
Jerrard, Erik	06/28/21	3.1	
–	00/00/04	4.0	Morris Nichols and Sainz Abogados regarding same (0.8).
Jerrard, Erik	06/30/21	1.9	Email with A. Schwartz regarding upcoming retention
			applications (0.6); update retention outline and fact summary for KPMG issue (1.3).
Total AM210 Non-DF	PW Retention	10.6	101 Kt WO 1850e (1.5).
and Fee Issues	W Retermon	10.0	
AM220 Non Worlding	Travel		
AM220 Non-Working Graulich, Timothy	06/27/21	6.5	Travel from New York City to Mexico City.
Graulich, Timothy	06/29/21	6.5	Travel from Mexico City to New York City.
Total AM220 Non-We		13.0	non-mondo oky to How Fork Oky.
AM230 Plan/Disclos		2.2	Povious T. Crauliahla commente to Plan town shoot (4.4):
Bane, Abraham	06/01/21	3.3	Review T. Graulich's comments to Plan term sheet (1.1); review and revise same (1.6); call with S. Piraino, E. Jerrard,
			and S. Ford regarding Plan (0.3); call with S. Ford regarding
			same (0.1); correspondence with same and E. Jerrard
			regarding same (0.2).
Ford, Stephen	06/01/21	3.3	Call with S. Piraino, A. Bane, and E. Jerrard regarding Plan
			(0.3); call with A. Bane regarding same (0.1); research issues
			regarding Plan term sheet (1.9); review and revise Plan term
Croulish Timethy	06/04/24	2.5	sheet (1.0).
Graulich, Timothy	06/01/21	3.5	Call with S. Piraino and E. Jerrard regarding Plan issues (1.1)

		Time	Detail By Project
Name	Date	Hours	Narrative
Jerrard, Erik	06/01/21	2.4	review revised Plan term sheet (2.4). Call with S. Piraino, S. Ford and A. Bane regarding Plan (0.3); review and revise motion to extend exclusivity periods (1.3);
Masaro, Matthew Bruno	06/01/21	6.2	review and revise Plan term sheet (0.8). Review and revise Disclosure Statement (2.7); research issues regarding same (0.9); review and revise solicitation procedures motion (2.0); research issues regarding same
Melcer, Moshe Piraino, Stephen D.	06/01/21 06/01/21	0.1 1.8	(0.5); correspondence with S. Piraino regarding same (0.1). Review comments to motion to extend exclusivity periods. Correspondence with T. Graulich and E. Jerrard regarding Plan issues (1.0); call with E. Jerrard, S. Ford, and A. Bane regarding same (0.3); call with Sainz Abogados and
Jerrard, Erik	06/02/21	4.0	Rothschild regarding same (0.5). Call with Rothschild and Sainz Abogados regarding Plan (0.3); call with committee advisors regarding Plan exclusivity (0.3); analyze Plan issues relating to exit financing proposal and Mexican corporate law (2.3); review and revise Plan
Masaro, Matthew Bruno	06/02/21	5.9	provisions (1.1). Review and revise Disclosure Statement (3.8); review and revise solicitation motion (1.2); call with S. Piraino regarding Disclosure Statement issues (0.1); research issues regarding same (0.8).
O'Sullivan, Damian	06/02/21	0.5	Call with M. Masaro regarding Disclosure Statement and solicitation procedures.
Piraino, Stephen D.	06/02/21	1.2	Correspondence with E. Jerrard regarding exclusivity (0.2); correspondence with same and Willkie Farr regarding same (0.2); call with D. Sinclair regarding same (0.1); call with M. Masaro regarding Disclosure Statement issues (0.1); review and analyze Plan issues (0.6).
Jerrard, Erik	06/03/21	3.8	Review and revise Plan term sheet (3.4); email with Davis Polk Plan team (S. Ford, A. Bane) regarding same (0.4).
Masaro, Matthew Bruno	06/03/21	6.6	Review and revise Disclosure Statement (1.2); review and revise motion and order regarding same (3.3); correspondence with S. Piraino, D. O'Sullivan, and others regarding same (1.0); review research regarding Plan issues (0.8); correspondence with S. Piraino regarding same (0.3).
Melcer, Moshe	06/03/21	0.3	Review and revise motion to extend exclusivity periods (0.2); correspondence with E. Jerrard regarding same (0.1).
Piraino, Stephen D.	06/03/21	2.9	Review and analyze Disclosure Statement issues (1.8); correspondence with M. Masaro regarding same (1.1).
Bane, Abraham	06/04/21	0.4	Correspondence with S. Ford regarding Plan (0.1); review E. Jerrard's comments to Plan term sheet (0.3).
Masaro, Matthew Bruno	06/04/21	4.5	Review and revise Disclosure Statement (1.0); correspondence with S. Piraino and others regarding same (1.5); research issues regarding same (0.3); draft Disclosure Statement issues list (1.5); correspondence with Sainz
Piraino, Stephen D.	06/04/21	3.7	Abogados and others regarding same (0.2). Review and revise Disclosure Statement (2.1); correspondence with M. Masaro and Sainz Abogados regarding same (0.9); review and revise Disclosure Statement issues list (0.7).
Jerrard, Erik	06/06/21	1.9	Review and revise motion to extend exclusivity periods (1.3); email with M. Melcer regarding same (0.4); email with stakeholders regarding same (0.2).
Melcer, Moshe Jerrard, Erik	06/06/21 06/07/21	0.2 4.8	Review and revise motion to extend exclusivity periods. Email with S. Piraino regarding Plan term sheet (0.2); review

		Time	Detail By Project
Name	Date	Hours	Narrative
M	00/07/04	0.4	and revise Plan term sheet (2.6); email with Aeroméxico regarding motion to extend exclusivity periods (0.4); review and revise motion to extend exclusivity periods (1.2); email with DIP lenders regarding Plan exclusivity (0.4).
Masaro, Matthew Bruno	06/07/21	2.1	Review and revise Disclosure Statement (0.5); review and revise motion regarding same (0.5); review and revise Plan term sheet (0.5); call with D. O'Sullivan regarding Disclosure Statement motion exhibits (0.6).
O'Sullivan, Damian	06/07/21	0.9	Call with M. Masaro regarding Disclosure Statement motion exhibits (0.6); review correspondence regarding same (0.2); review precedent exhibits regarding same (0.1).
Piraino, Stephen D.	06/07/21	4.6	Review Plan term sheet (0.7); correspondence with E. Jerrard regarding same (0.2); research and analyze Plan issues (3.7).
Bane, Abraham	06/08/21	1.3	Call with AlixPartners, E. Jerrard, and S. Ford regarding Plan timeline (0.5); call with E. Jerrard, S. Piraino, and S. Ford regarding Plan (0.3); correspondence with M. Masaro and others regarding Plan term sheet (0.5).
Ford, Stephen	06/08/21	1.3	Call with Sainz Abogados regarding Plan term sheet (0.5); call with E. Jerrard, S. Piraino, and A. Bane regarding Plan (0.3); call with AlixPartners, E. Jerrard, and A. Bane regarding Plan timeline (0.5).
Graulich, Timothy	06/08/21	3.1	Call with A. Conesa and R. Sanchez Baker regarding exit financing (1.0); correspondence with M. Masaro regarding Plan term sheet (0.5); review Plan term sheet (1.6)
Jerrard, Erik	06/08/21	4.6	Email with Aeroméxico regarding motion to extend exclusivity periods (0.6); review, finalize and coordinate filing of same (0.5); call with A. Bane, S. Piraino, and S. Ford regarding Plan (0.3); correspondence with M. Masaro regarding issues regarding same (0.4); email with Sainz Abogados regarding Disclosure Statement (0.9); correspondence with same regarding Plan term sheet (0.6); prepare issues list in preparation for same (0.8); call with AlixPartners, A. Bane, and S. Ford regarding Plan timeline (0.5).
Masaro, Matthew Bruno	06/08/21	7.5	Review and revise Disclosure Statement (1.4); review and revise motion regarding same (1.4); review and revise exhibits regarding same (1.5); correspondence with S. Piraino and D. O'Sullivan regarding same (1.0); correspondence with E. Jerrard regarding same (0.4); correspondence with Sainz Abogados and others regarding same (1.0); correspondence with same regarding Plan term sheet (0.8).
Melcer, Moshe	06/08/21	1.5	Review and revise motion to extend exclusivity periods (0.9); call with Sainz Abogados regarding Plan term sheet (0.6).
O'Sullivan, Damian	06/08/21	3.0	Draft and revise exhibit citizenship declaration and accompanying notice (1.9); correspondence with M. Masaro regarding same (0.4); review precedents for approach and timing regarding same (0.7).
Piraino, Stephen D.	06/08/21	5.4	Correspondence with M. Masaro regarding Disclosure Statement (0.9); correspondence with Sainz Abogados regarding Plan (0.8); call with S. Ford, A. Bane, and E. Jerrard regarding Plan (0.3); review and revise Disclosure Statement (3.4).
Bane, Abraham	06/09/21	0.9	Correspondence with M. Masaro regarding Disclosure Statement (0.3); review precedent regarding same (0.6).
Jerrard, Erik	06/09/21	2.6	Research Plan exclusivity issues (1.5); email with Davis Polk Restructuring team regarding same (0.4); review and revise Plan timeline from AlixPartners (0.7).

		Time	Detail By Project
Name	Date	Hours	Narrative
Masaro, Matthew Bruno	06/09/21	6.4	Review and revise Disclosure Statement (3.1); review and revise motion and exhibits regarding same (1.8); correspondence with D. O'Sullivan and others regarding same (0.5); correspondence with S. Piraino, E. Jerrard, and others
Melcer, Moshe	06/09/21	0.2	regarding same and Plan (1.0). Review and summarize precedent exclusivity extension motions.
O'Sullivan, Damian	06/09/21	0.6	Review Disclosure Statement and precedent motion regarding same (0.4); correspondence with M. Masaro regarding same (0.2).
Piraino, Stephen D.	06/09/21	0.7	Correspondence with M. Masaro regarding liquidation analysis (0.3); review Disclosure Statement issues list (0.4).
Jerrard, Erik	06/10/21	1.3	Analyze Plan exclusivity issues (0.6); review comments to Plan term sheet (0.7).
Masaro, Matthew Bruno	06/10/21	4.1	Review and revise Disclosure Statement (1.3); review and revise motion and exhibits regarding same (2.1); correspondence with D. O'Sullivan and others regarding same (0.2); research issues regarding same (0.5).
O'Sullivan, Damian	06/10/21	0.9	Draft solicitation procedures (0.7); correspondence with M. Masaro regarding Disclosure Statement motion exhibits (0.2).
Piraino, Stephen D. Sturm, Josh	06/10/21 06/10/21	2.8 0.2	Review and analyze Plan and Disclosure Statement issues. Correspondence with Davis Polk team regarding Disclosure Statement fleet issues.
Ford, Stephen	06/11/21	2.8	Review research regarding Plan.
Jerrard, Erik	06/11/21	3.4	Review and revise Plan term sheet (2.1); email with Rothschild and AlixPartners regarding same (0.6); call with T. Kessler regarding Plan exclusivity (0.3); call with S. Piraino regarding same (0.4).
Masaro, Matthew Bruno	06/11/21	7.4	Correspondence with S. Piraino, Sainz Abogados, E. Jerrard, and others regarding Disclosure Statement and motion and exhibits regarding same (3.1); review and revise same (4.3).
O'Sullivan, Damian	06/11/21	0.6	Correspondence with M. Masaro regarding Disclosure Statement motion exhibits (0.2); review precedent regarding same (0.4).
Piraino, Stephen D.	06/11/21	3.4	Call with É. Jerrard regarding Plan exclusivity (0.4); correspondence with M. Masaro, Sainz Abogados, E. Jerrard, and others regarding Disclosure Statement and motion and exhibits regarding same (3.0).
Bane, Abraham	06/14/21	1.1	Call with Rothschild regarding Plan waterfall (0.7); review presentation on same (0.4).
Ford, Stephen	06/14/21	0.8	Call with Rothschild, AlixPartners, and Davis Polk team regarding Plan waterfall.
Graulich, Timothy	06/14/21	3.4	Review and revise Plan term sheet.
Jerrard, Erik	06/14/21	5.8	Call with Rothschild, AlixPartners, and Davis Polk team regarding Plan waterfall (0.8); review Plan structure materials (1.3); review and revise Plan term sheet per discussions with co-advisors and Aeroméxico (3.7).
Masaro, Matthew Bruno	06/14/21	2.5	Review and revise Disclosure Statement motion and order (0.8); review and revise exhibits to same (1.7).
O'Sullivan, Damian	06/14/21	2.2	Draft solicitation procedures exhibit to Disclosure Statement motion (1.8); compile and review precedents for other motion exhibits (0.4).
Bane, Abraham	06/15/21	3.2	Call with E. Jerrard, S. Piraino and others regarding Plan (0.4); correspondence with S. Ford regarding same (0.1); call with E. Jerrard regarding Plan term sheet (0.4); review and revise same (2.3).

		Time	Detail By Project
Name	Date	Hours	Narrative
Ford, Stephen	06/15/21	1.7	Call with A. Bane, M. Masaro, and others regarding Plan (0.4); research issues regarding Plan (1.3).
Graulich, Timothy	06/15/21	2.4	Review and revise Plan term sheet.
Jerrard, Erik	06/15/21	2.4	Call with A. Bane regarding Plan term sheet (0.4); email with same regarding same (0.4); call with A. Bane, S. Piraino, and others regarding Plan (0.4); review and revise Plan term sheet (0.7); email with Aeroméxico regarding Plan exclusivity stakeholder comments (0.5).
Masaro, Matthew Bruno	06/15/21	2.8	Call with D. O'Sullivan regarding Disclosure Statement motion exhibits (0.3); call with S. Ford, A. Bane, and others regarding Plan (0.4); correspondence with S. Piraino regarding same and Disclosure Statement (0.8); review and revise same (0.7); review and revise Disclosure Statement motion (0.6).
O'Sullivan, Damian	06/15/21	3.6	Revise solicitation and voting procedures exhibit to Disclosure Statement motion (2.4); draft additional exhibits to same (0.8); call with M. Masaro regarding same (0.3); email with M. Masaro regarding same (0.1).
Piraino, Stephen D.	06/15/21	1.2	Call with A. Bane, E. Jerrard, and others regarding Plan (0.4); coordinate Plan workstreams (0.8).
Altman, Olivia	06/16/21	0.3	Retrieve precedent disclosure statement hearing transcripts.
Bane, Abraham	06/16/21	2.3	Review and revise Plan term sheet (2.1); correspondence with E. Jerrard regarding same (0.2).
Ford, Stephen	06/16/21	3.8	Review Rothschild and AlixPartners materials in connection with Plan (2.8); review and revise Plan (1.0).
Giddens, Magali	06/16/21	1.7	Research issues regarding Plan summary translations.
Jerrard, Erik	06/16/21	5.7	Correspondence with counterparties (Apollo, Creditors Committee) regarding Plan exclusivity extension (0.4); review and revise Plan term sheet (4.6); email with co-advisors regarding same (0.7).
Masaro, Matthew Bruno	06/16/21	7.7	Review and revise Disclosure Statement, Disclosure Statement motion, exhibits (5.0); correspondence with S. Piraino and others regarding same (0.3); research issues regarding same (1.7); correspondence with K. Lee, AlixPartners, and others regarding Plan waterfall analysis (0.7).
Melcer, Moshe	06/16/21	0.1	Email with E. Jerrard regarding exclusivity extension.
O'Sullivan, Damian	06/16/21	2.8	
Piraino, Stephen D.	06/16/21	3.8	Correspondence with E. Jerrard regarding Plan and Plan term sheet (0.9); call with Rothschild and Davis Polk team regarding same (1.0); correspondence with T. Graulich and E. Jerrard regarding Plan (0.7); review and revise Plan term sheet (0.5); review and revise steps slides (0.5); correspondence with M. Masaro regarding same (0.2).
Ford, Stephen	06/17/21	5.0	Research issues regarding Plan (4.4); email with E. Jerrard regarding same (0.2); call with same regarding same (0.4).
Graulich, Timothy	06/17/21	5.2	Call with B. Miller regarding exclusivity (0.4); review and revise Plan term sheet (4.8).
Jerrard, Erik	06/17/21	4.5	Call with S. Ford regarding research issues regarding Plan (0.4); email with S. Ford and A. Bane regarding Plan issues (0.3); review and analyze precedent Plans regarding same (2.1); review and revise Plan term sheet (0.9); email with coadvisors regarding same (0.8).
Masaro, Matthew	06/17/21	4.5	Review and revise Disclosure Statement, Disclosure

Nama	Data	Uerre	Narrativo
Name	Date	Hours	Narrative
Bruno			Statement motion, and exhibits to same (0.4); research regarding Section 503 issues (3.0); draft memorandum
			regarding same (0.8); correspondence with S. Piraino
			regarding same (0.3), correspondence with 3. Finanto
O'Sullivan, Damian	06/17/21	4.7	Review and revise master and beneficial ballots (3.7); review
O Gaillvari, Darrilari	00/11/21	7.7	precedent regarding same (0.8); correspondence with M.
			Masaro regarding same (0.2).
Piraino, Stephen D.	06/17/21	3.5	Research and analyze Plan issues (1.2); correspondence wit
		0.0	T. Graulich and E. Jerrard regarding exclusivity (0.9); review
			and analyze response to same (0.5); correspondence with co
			advisors regarding exclusivity (0.7); call with W. Kocovski
			regarding same (0.2).
Graulich, Timothy	06/18/21	3.8	Review and revise Plan term sheet.
Masaro, Matthew	06/18/21	1.3	Review and revise solicitation procedures (1.1);
Bruno			correspondence with D. O'Sullivan regarding same (0.2).
O'Sullivan, Damian	06/18/21	0.3	Review and analyze M. Masaro comments to solicitation and
			voting procedures.
Masaro, Matthew	06/19/21	0.6	Review and revise ballots.
Bruno		_	
Jerrard, Erik	06/20/21	0.5	Review and revise notice of proposed exclusivity order (0.3);
	00/00/04		email with M. Melcer regarding same (0.2).
O'Sullivan, Damian	06/20/21	2.5	Revise solicitation and voting procedures (2.3);
D AL I	00/04/04	0.7	correspondence with M. Masaro regarding same (0.2).
Bane, Abraham	06/21/21	0.7	Review revised presentation on Plan waterfall analysis (0.4);
			call with Davis Polk, AlixPartners, and Rothschild teams
Ford Ctombon	06/04/04	4.0	regarding Plan (0.3).
Ford, Stephen	06/21/21	4.2	Review and revise Plan (3.4); review presentation on Plan
			waterfall analysis (0.5); call with Davis Polk, AlixPartners, and Rothschild teams regarding Plan (0.3).
Graulich, Timothy	06/21/21	2.2	Call with R. Cooper regarding exclusivity (0.8); call with T.
Graditori, Timotriy	00/21/21	2.2	Goren and B. Miller regarding exclusivity (0.4); call with D.
			Abbott and K. Coleman regarding Plan issue (0.4); review
			potential shareholder proposal (0.6).
Jerrard, Erik	06/21/21	2.3	Correspondence with S. Piraino regarding Plan (0.4); review
Jonara, Elik	00,21,21	2.0	and revise Plan (0.9); call with Davis Polk, AlixPartners, and
			Rothschild teams regarding Plan (0.3); review AlixPartners
			value materials in preparation for same (0.7).
Masaro, Matthew	06/21/21	4.3	Review and revise ballots and other solicitation documents
Bruno	· · · · · · · · · · · · · · · · · ·		(2.9); correspondence with D. O'Sullivan regarding same (0.1
			correspondence with S. Piraino regarding Plan and Disclosur
			Statement (0.2); correspondence with T. Green and others
			regarding same (0.1); correspondence with Sainz Abogados
			and S. Piraino regarding ballots and solicitation (0.4);
			correspondence with T. Graulich regarding Disclosure
			Statement motion (0.2); review and revise Disclosure
			Statement (0.2); review and revise citizenship declaration
a.a ·	00/01/5		(0.1); correspondence with D. O'Sullivan regarding same (0.1
O'Sullivan, Damian	06/21/21	1.4	Revise citizenship declaration for ballots (0.4); revise
			Disclosure Statement (0.4); draft notice of Plan Supplement
D	00/04/04		(0.6).
Piraino, Stephen D.	06/21/21	0.3	Call with Davis Polk, AlixPartners, and Rothschild teams
Danie Alemai	00/00/04	2 -	regarding Plan.
Bane, Abraham	06/22/21	0.5	Call with AlixPartners, Rothschild, and Davis Polk teams
Fand Otamber	00/00/04	0.5	regarding Plan waterfall analysis.
Ford, Stephen	06/22/21	3.5	Call with AlixPartners, Rothschild, and Davis Polk teams
			regarding Plan waterfall analysis (0.5); review and revise Pla

		Time	Detail By Project
Name	Date	Hours	Narrative
Jerrard, Erik	06/22/21	2.0	(3.0). Review Plan waterfall analysis materials (0.7); call with AlixPartners, Rothschild, and Davis Polk teams regarding same (0.5); email with AlixPartners regarding Plan structuring
Masaro, Matthew Bruno	06/22/21	2.4	(0.8). Review and revise ballots (2.0); correspondence with D. O'Sullivan regarding same (0.1); correspondence with M. Melcer, Skyworks, and others regarding solicitation of votes
O'Sullivan, Damian	06/22/21	1.0	(0.3). Review and revise Disclosure Statement motion exhibits (0.7); correspondence with M. Masaro regarding same (0.3).
Piraino, Stephen D.	06/22/21	0.7	Call with AlixPartners, Rothschild, and Davis Polk teams regarding Plan waterfall analysis (0.5); revise relevant event filing regarding exclusivity (0.2
Bane, Abraham	06/23/21	1.1	Call with AlixPartners, Rothschild and Davis Polk teams regarding Plan (0.7); review presentation on Plan waterfall analysis (0.4).
Ford, Stephen	06/23/21	7.9	Draft Plan (4.2); research issues regarding same (3.0); call with AlixPartners, Rothschild and Davis Polk teams regarding Plan (0.7).
Graulich, Timothy	06/23/21	2.8	Review and comment on Plan waterfall analysis.
Jerrard, Erik	06/23/21	2.2	Call with AlixPartners, Rothschild and Davis Polk teams regarding Plan (0.7); extensive email with T. Graulich and S. Piraino regarding Plan timing (1.3); call with M. Sutter and S. Piraino regarding Disclosure Statement (0.2).
Masaro, Matthew Bruno	06/23/21	9.0	Research issues regarding Plan and Disclosure Statement (5.1); review and revise memorandum related to same (2.7); correspondence with S. Piraino and T. Graulich regarding same (0.3); correspondence with D. O'Sullivan regarding Disclosure Statement (0.2); call with AlixPartners, Rothschild and Davis Polk teams regarding Plan (0.7).
O'Sullivan, Damian	06/23/21	4.2	Review and revise Disclosure Statement motion exhibits (3.9); correspondence with M. Masaro regarding same (0.3).
Piraino, Stephen D.	06/23/21	1.0	Call with AlixPartners, Rothschild and Davis Polk teams regarding Plan (0.7); email with T. Graulich regarding Plan structure (0.1); call with E. Jerrard and M. Sutter regarding Disclosure Statement (0.2).
Ford, Stephen	06/24/21	8.5	Draft Plan (5.0); research issues regarding same (3.5).
Graulich, Timothy	06/24/21	5.2	Call with J. Arrigunaga and H. Parkhill regarding Plan process (0.8); review and comment on Plan term sheet (4.4).
Masaro, Matthew Bruno	06/24/21	3.9	Review and revise solicitation procedures, ballots, and Disclosure Statement motion (0.8); correspondence with White & Case and others regarding same (0.4); correspondence with S. Piraino, Willis Towers, and others regarding Plan and Disclosure Statement (1.0); research issues regarding same (1.7).
O'Sullivan, Damian	06/24/21	4.0	Revise Disclosure Statement motion exhibits (3.0); review and revise Disclosure Statement (0.8); correspondence with M. Masaro regarding same (0.2).
Piraino, Stephen D. Bane, Abraham	06/24/21 06/25/21	2.9 1.3	Research and analyze Plan issues. Call with Rothschild team regarding Plan waterfall analysis
Ford, Stephen	06/25/21	5.0	(0.5); call with S. Ford regarding Plan (0.2); revise same (0.6). Call with A. Bane regarding Plan (0.2); call with Rothschild, Davis Polk, AlixPartners and Aeroméxico teams regarding Plan waterfall analysis (0.7); review and revise Plan (3.2); call with S. Haq and R. Arnold regarding Plan waterfall analysis

		Time	Detail By Project
Name	Date	Hours	Narrative
			(0.1); correspondence with Rothschild regarding same (0.1); research issues regarding Plan waterfall analysis for presentation on same (0.7).
Graulich, Timothy Masaro, Matthew Bruno	06/25/21 06/25/21	0.5 0.5	Call with R. Sanchez Baker regarding Plan waterfall analysis. Review and revise Disclosure Statement, Disclosure Statement motion, exhibits (0.4); call with S. Piraino regarding
O'Sullivan, Damian	06/25/21	0.3	Disclosure Statement (0.1). Email with M. Masaro regarding ballots and voting procedures
Piraino, Stephen D.	06/25/21	3.3	(0.1); review comments to same (0.2). Call with M. Masaro regarding Disclosure Statement (0.1); review and revise Disclosure Statement (3.2).
Bane, Abraham	06/27/21	5.6	Revise revised Plan term sheet (0.8); draft Plan (4.2); review precedent for same (0.6).
Jerrard, Erik	06/27/21	2.2	Extensive correspondence with T. Graulich, V. Jackson, and A. Troconis regarding Plan filing timing (1.4); correspondence with Rothschild regarding same (0.8);
Bane, Abraham	06/28/21	1.9	Review and revise Plan (1.6); review Plan term sheet regarding same (0.3).
Ford, Stephen	06/28/21	0.2	Correspondence with E. Jerrard regarding presentation on Plan waterfall analysis (0.1); correspondence with R. Arnold regarding same (0.1).
Graulich, Timothy	06/28/21	4.2	
Jerrard, Erik	06/28/21	1.6	Review and revise Plan term sheet.
Masaro, Matthew Bruno	06/28/21	2.1	Review and revise Disclosure Statement (0.4); review and revise exhibits regarding same (1.2); correspondence with S. Piraino, E. Jerrard, and D. O'Sullivan regarding same (0.5).
O'Sullivan, Damian	06/28/21	4.0	Review and revise ballots (2.9); review Rule 2019 statement, standstill agreements and offering memorandum on same (0.6); correspondence with S. Piraino and M. Masaro regarding ballots and voting procedures (0.3); correspondence with M. Masaro regarding ballots (0.2).
Piraino, Stephen D. Bane, Abraham	06/28/21 06/29/21	3.8 2.2	Review and revise Disclosure Statement. Draft Plan (2.0); correspondence with S. Ford regarding same
bane, Abranam	06/29/21	2.2	(0.2).
Ford, Stephen	06/29/21	7.7	Research issues regarding Plan (3.0); review and revise Plan (4.7).
Graulich, Timothy	06/29/21	1.5	Call with A. Sainz regarding Plan issues (0.4); correspondence with S. Piraino and E. Jerrard regarding Plan timeline (0.6); call with R. Cooper regarding Plan term sheet (0.5.
Masaro, Matthew Bruno	06/29/21	1.8	Review and revise Disclosure Statement motion exhibits (1.4); correspondence with S. Piraino regarding Disclosure Statement motion (0.2); correspondence with D. O'Sullivan regarding exhibits regarding same (0.2).
O'Sullivan, Damian	06/29/21	2.9	Revise Disclosure Statement (2.2); review precedent regarding same (0.4); correspondence with M. Masaro regarding same and regarding comments to Disclosure Statement motion exhibits (0.3).
Piraino, Stephen D. Bane, Abraham	06/29/21 06/30/21	4.0 2.3	Review and revise Disclosure Statement. Draft Plan tracker (0.8); call with S. Ford regarding same (0.2);
Ford, Stephen	06/30/21	5.2	revise Plan (1.3). Correspondence with M. Masaro regarding Plan and Disclosure Statement (0.2); research issues regarding Plan (2.0); review and revise Plan (2.3); draft Plan tracker (0.3); call with A. Bane regarding same (0.2); correspondence with same regarding same (0.2).

		Time	Detail By Project
Name	Date	Hours	Narrative
Graulich, Timothy	06/30/21	4.4	Call with R. Sanchez Baker regarding Plan waterfall analysis
Jerrard, Erik	06/30/21	4.2	(0.5); review and comment on Disclosure Statement (3.9). Call with Aeroméxico, Davis Polk, Rothschild and AlixPartner
- ,			teams regarding Plan waterfall analysis (0.5); correspondence with J. McClammy T. Graulich regarding Plan updates and
Masaro, Matthew	06/30/21	3.0	disclosures (1.0); review and revise Plan (2.7). Review and revise Disclosure Statement (0.9); review and
Bruno	00/30/21	5.0	revise Disclosure Statement motion (0.9); review and revise exhibits regarding same (0.8); correspondence with S. Piraino
O'Sullivan, Damian	06/30/21	1.6	D. O'Sullivan, and T. Graulich regarding same (0.4). Review and revise Disclosure Statement (0.7); research
O Guiiivan, Baniian	00/30/21	1.0	precedents regarding potential management incentive programs (0.8); correspondence with M. Masaro regarding same (0.1).
Piraino, Stephen D.	06/30/21	1.2	Review and revise Disclosure Statement (0.5); call with
			Aeroméxico, Davis Polk, Rothschild and AlixPartners teams regarding Plan waterfall analysis (0.5); call with M. Masaro
			regarding Disclosure Statement (0.2).
Total AM230 Plan/Di Statement	sclosure	389.3	
			tatements/Applications and Budget
Dekhtyar, Mariya	06/01/21	2.0	Review and revise Third Interim Fee Application (1.6); email with A. Bane regarding same (0.1); email with M. Giddens regarding same (0.3).
Giddens, Magali	06/01/21	0.9	Review Third Interim Fee Application disbursements.
Dekhtyar, Mariya	06/02/21	0.2	Email with A. Bane regarding Third Interim Fee Application.
Giddens, Magali Dekhtyar, Mariya	06/02/21 06/03/21	0.6 0.4	Review Third Interim Fee Application disbursements detail. Review and revise Third Interim Fee Application (0.2); review
Dekityar, Mariya	00/03/21	0.4	Third Interim invoices (0.2).
Giddens, Magali	06/03/21	0.8	Review Third Interim Fee Application disbursements detail.
Dekhtyar, Mariya	06/07/21	0.8	Call with M. Giddens regarding Third Interim Fee Application issues (0.3); email with same regarding same (0.2); review Third Interim invoice (0.3).
Giddens, Magali	06/07/21	2.4	Review Third Interim Fee Application receipts (0.8); prepare
•			file regarding same (0.9); research regarding origin of same (0.3); call with M. Dekhtyar regarding Third Interim Fee
			Application issues (0.3); correspondence to A. Bane regardin
Bane, Abraham	06/09/21	2.1	same (0.1). Draft Third Interim Fee Application (1.9); correspondence with
			E. Jerrard regarding same (0.2).
Dekhtyar, Mariya	06/09/21	0.8	Correspondence with A. Bane regarding Third Interim invoice (0.2); review and revise Third Interim compiled invoice (0.6).
Bane, Abraham	06/10/21	0.4	Review and revise Third Interim Fee Application.
Dekhtyar, Mariya	06/10/21	1.8	Review and revise Third Interim Fee Application (1.1);
			correspondence with M. Giddens regarding same (0.3); email with A. Bane regarding same (0.2); email with E. Jerrard regarding same (0.1); review certification issue regarding same (0.1).
Giddens, Magali	06/10/21	0.7	Review correspondence from E. Castillo regarding Third Interim Fee Application disbursements (0.2); correspondence with A. Bane regarding Third Interim Fee Application disbursement issue (0.5).
Jerrard, Erik	06/10/21	3.7	Review and revise Third Interim Fee Application.
Bane, Abraham	06/11/21	0.7	Review and revise Third Interim Fee Application (0.4);

		Time	Detail By Project
Name	Date	Hours	Narrative
Dekhtyar, Mariya	06/11/21	4.0	correspondence with M. Dekhtyar regarding same (0.3). Review and revise Third Interim Fee Application (1.2); research issue regarding same (0.1); review correspondence from E. Jerrard regarding billing issue (0.1); email with A. Bane regarding Third Interim Fee Application (1.2); email with N. Kurian regarding Third Interim Fee Application (0.6); correspondence with M. Giddens regarding same (0.1); draft email to E. Jerrard regarding Third Interim Fee Application (0.4); email with M. Giddens regarding same (0.1); review
Giddens, Magali	06/11/21	1.7	Third Interim detail (0.2). Review and prepare disbursements for Third Interim Fee Application.
Dekhtyar, Mariya	06/12/21	0.5	Review Third Interim Fee Application receipts (0.1); email with M. Giddens regarding same (0.2); email with A. Bane
Dekhtyar, Mariya	06/13/21	0.1	regarding same (0.2). Email with A. Bane regarding Third Interim Fee Application receipts.
Bane, Abraham	06/15/21	0.8	Review and revise Third Interim Fee Application (0.4); correspondence with M. Dekhtyar regarding same (0.3); correspondence with E. Jerrard regarding same (0.1).
Dekhtyar, Mariya	06/15/21	2.8	Call with N. Kurian regarding Third Interim Fee Application (0.3); correspondence with same and M. Giddens regarding same (0.1); review and revise Third Interim Fee Application (1.2); email with A. Bane regarding same (0.7); review receipts regarding same (0.2); email with M. Roberts regarding same
Giddens, Magali	06/15/21	3.2	(0.1); correspondence with M. Giddens regarding same (0.2). Review and prepare disbursements detail for Third Interim Fee Application.
Dekhtyar, Mariya	06/16/21	1.1	Email with M. Roberts regarding Third Interim Fee Application (0.1); call with N. Kurian regarding Third Interim Fee Application (0.4); email with same regarding same (0.1); email with A. Bane regarding same (0.5).
Dekhtyar, Mariya	06/17/21	0.9	Review Third Interim Fee Application receipts (0.1); email with A. Bane regarding same (0.2); email with M. Roberts regarding same (0.1); correspondence with A. Bane regarding Third Interim Fee Application issues (0.3); email with M. Giddens regarding same (0.2).
Dekhtyar, Mariya	06/20/21	0.3	Email with A. Bane regarding Third Interim Fee Application (0.2); research Third Interim Fee Application issue (0.1).
Bane, Abraham	06/21/21	0.9	Correspondence with E. Jerrard regarding Third Interim Fee Application (0.2); correspondence with M. Dekhtyar regarding same (0.3); review and revise same (0.2); correspondence with T. Graulich regarding same (0.2).
Dekhtyar, Mariya	06/21/21	2.5	Email with A. Bane regarding Third Interim Fee Application (0.1); review Third Interim Fee Application (1.5); email with A. Bane regarding same (0.4); call with E. Castillo regarding same (0.3); email with E. Castillo regarding Third Interim Fee Application (0.1); correspondence with A. Bane regarding Third Interim Fee Application (0.1).
Bane, Abraham Dekhtyar, Mariya	06/22/21 06/22/21	1.2 1.2	Finalize Third Interim Fee Application. Compile and finalize Third Interim Fee Application (0.4); email with A. Bane regarding same (0.2); review and revise same (0.2); email with A. Bane regarding same (0.2); review Third Interim Fee Application (0.2).
Altman, Olivia	06/23/21	0.6	Review Third Interim Fee Application (0.2); file Third Interim Fee Application (0.3); correspondence with Davis Polk team

Time Detail By Project			
Name	Date	Hours	Narrative
Dekhtyar, Mariya	06/23/21	0.4	regarding filing (0.1). Review and revise Third Interim Fee Application invoice (0.2); email with E. Jerrard regarding Third Interim Fee Application (0.1); email with same and O. Altman regarding filing of same (0.1).
Jerrard, Erik	06/23/21	0.9	Review filing version of Third Interim Fee Application.
Jerrard, Erik	06/29/21	1.0	Review and revise May monthly fee statement.
Dekhtyar, Mariya	06/30/21	0.2	Email with A. Bane regarding fee application issue.
Total AM240 DPW Retention/Preparatio Statements/Applicati Budget		42.6	
AM250 IP, Regulatory	and Tax		
Burke, Arthur J.	06/01/21	1.0	Call with Morgan Lewis, D. Herts, and G. Morrison regarding antitrust issues (0.3); correspondence with Davis Polk Antitrust team regarding same (0.7).
De Mullewie, Léonore	06/01/21	0.6	Analyze antitrust global filing.
Herts, Dylan	06/01/21	0.6	Call with Morgan Lewis, A. Burke, and G. Morrison regarding antitrust issues (0.3); prepare for same (0.2); email with G. Morrison regarding antitrust information requests (0.1).
Morrison, Gregory S.	06/01/21	0.8	Call with Morgan Lewis, A Burke, and D. Herts regarding antitrust issues (0.5); draft update to Aeroméxico regarding same (0.3).
De Mullewie, Léonore	06/02/21	0.2	Analyze antitrust global filing.
Herts, Dylan	06/02/21	0.1	Email with G. Morrison regarding antitrust information requests.
Morrison, Gregory S.	06/02/21	0.1	Correspondence with D. Herts regarding profit sharing issue in a joint cooperation agreement.
Piraino, Stephen D.	06/02/21	0.1	Call with M. Awada regarding antitrust issues.
Burke, Arthur J.	06/03/21	1.0	Correspondence with Davis Polk Antitrust team regarding
Herts, Dylan	06/03/21	0.4	Department of Justice strategy and timing. Correspondence with G. Morrison regarding antitrust information requests (0.2); email with same regarding same (0.2).
Morrison, Gregory S.	06/03/21	1.1	Correspondence with D. Herts regarding Department of Justice antitrust review strategy (0.5); review documents in response to economist antitrust data requests (0.6).
Burke, Arthur J.	06/04/21	1.0	Correspondence with economist regarding antitrust data (0.5); call with Morgan Lewis, D. Herts, and G. Morrison regarding antitrust analysis (0.5).
De Mullewie, Léonore	06/04/21	0.4	Analyze antitrust global filing.
Herts, Dylan	06/04/21	1.9	Analyze data for antitrust analysis (0.6); email with G. Morrison regarding same (0.2); call with J. Wallden, Aeroméxico Finance team, Sainz Abogados, Aziz & Kaye, and others regarding antitrust information request (0.3); call with Morgan Lewis, A. Burke, and G. Morrison regarding antitrust analysis (0.5); draft summary of same (0.1); email with G. Morrison regarding same (0.2).
Morrison, Gregory S.	06/04/21	1.5	Call with Aeroméxico regarding documents in response to economist antitrust data requests (1.0); call with Morgan Lewis, A. Burke, and D. Herts regarding antitrust analysis

		Time	Detail By Project
Name	Date	Hours	Narrative
Burke, Arthur J.	06/08/21	0.5	(0.5). Correspondence with Davis Polk Antitrust team regarding
Morrison, Gregory S.	06/08/21	0.1	Department of Justice antitrust strategy. Revise draft update to Aeroméxico regarding approach to
De Mullewie,	06/09/21	0.4	Department of Justice antitrust regulatory review. Analyze global antitrust filing.
Léonore Burke, Arthur J.	06/10/21	0.5	Correspondence with Davis Polk Antitrust team regarding
De Mullewie,	06/10/21	0.7	Department of Justice antitrust strategy. Analyze global antitrust filings.
Léonore Burke, Arthur J.	06/15/21	0.5	Call with Morgan Lewis regarding Department of Justice antitrust review strategy.
Morrison, Gregory S.	06/15/21	0.7	Call with Morgan Lewis regarding Department of Justice antitrust review strategy (0.5); email with Aeroméxico regarding same (0.2).
Altus, Leslie J.	06/16/21	0.8	Call with S. Piraino and L. Farr regarding tax implications on Plan.
Piraino, Stephen D.	06/16/21	1.2	Call with L. Altus and L. Farr regarding tax implications on Plan (0.8); prepare for same (0.2); email with Sainz Abogados regarding tax issues (0.2).
Jerrard, Erik	06/18/21	0.4	
Masaro, Matthew Bruno	06/18/21	1.2	Review and revise presentation on Mexican corporate and tax law (0.9); correspondence with S. Piraino and others regarding same (0.3).
Piraino, Stephen D.	06/18/21	0.1	
Herts, Dylan	06/20/21	0.2	Review emails regarding antitrust filing and outreach status.
Altus, Leslie J.	06/21/21	0.3	Email with S. Piraino regarding tax implications on Plan (0.1); call with same regarding same (0.2).
De Mullewie, Léonore	06/21/21	1.0	Analyze and coordinate Global antitrust filing.
Graulich, Timothy	06/21/21	0.4	Call with counsel to potential investor regarding Chambers conference.
Herts, Dylan	06/21/21	0.1	Review extension request submission for Mexican antitrust filing.
Masaro, Matthew Bruno	06/21/21	1.4	Review and revise presentation on Mexican corporate and tax law issues (0.7); correspondence with S. Piraino, Sainz Abogados team and others regarding same (0.7).
Piraino, Stephen D.	06/21/21	2.9	Correspondence with A. Siman regarding tax issues (0.6); call with AlixPartners regarding same (0.3); review and revise presentation on Mexican corporate and tax law issues (0.6); call with L. Altus regarding tax implications on Plan (0.2); call with Chevez, Sainz Abogados and Davis Polk teams regarding tax issues (0.7); prepare for same (0.3); correspondence with M. Masaro regarding presentation on Mexican corporate and tax law issues (0.2).
Burke, Arthur J.	06/22/21	0.5	Correspondence with Davis Polk Antitrust team regarding Department of Justice timing and strategy.
Herts, Dylan	06/22/21	0.3	Email with A. Burke, Sainz Abogados, and Aziz & Kaye regarding antitrust outreach.
Masaro, Matthew Bruno	06/22/21	0.3	Review and revise presentation on Mexican corporate and tax law issues (0.2); correspondence with Sainz Abogados and others regarding same (0.1).
Siman, Ariel	06/22/21	2.2	Review and analyze presentation on Mexican corporate and tax law issues.

		Time	Detail By Project
Name	Date	Hours	Narrative
Burke, Arthur J.	06/23/21	0.8	Call with D. Herts, S. Piraino and others regarding antitrust issues (0.4); correspondence with Davis Polk Antitrust team regarding same (0.4).
De Mullewie, Léonore	06/23/21	0.7	Analyze and coordinate Global antitrust filing.
Herts, Dylan	06/23/21	1.4	Review summaries of calls with Morgan Lewis regarding antitrust analysis (0.2); call with S. Piraino, A Burke, and others regarding antitrust issues (0.4); prepare for same (0.2); call with C. Toledo, Sainz Abogados, and Aziz & Kaye regarding antitrust outreach (0.4); email with G. Morrison regarding same (0.2).
Piraino, Stephen D.	06/23/21	0.4	Call with D. Herts, A. Burke and others regarding antitrust issues.
Herts, Dylan	06/24/21	0.2	Correspondence with A. Burke regarding Department of Justice outreach (0.1); review notes regarding same (0.1).
De Mullewie, Léonore	06/25/21	0.7	Analyze and coordinate Global antitrust filing.
Herts, Dylan	06/25/21	0.6	Correspondence with A. Burke regarding antitrust outreach timing (0.1); email with L. De Mullewie regarding ex-US filings (0.2); correspondence with same regarding same (0.3).
Herts, Dylan	06/28/21	0.6	Call with G. Morrison regrading antitrust workstreams (0.4); prepare for same (0.1); review draft memorandum regarding antitrust analysis (0.1).
Morrison, Gregory S.	06/28/21	0.4	Call with D. Herts regarding antitrust workstreams.
Total AM250 IP, Regulatory and Tax		33.3	
AM260 Hearing Prep	aration/Attendance		
Jerrard, Erik	06/16/21	0.4	Email with Creditors Committee counsel regarding June 22nd Exclusivity Hearing status (0.3); email with T. Graulich regarding same (0.1).
Melcer, Moshe	06/17/21	0.6	Review and revise June 22nd Exclusivity Hearing agenda.
Melcer, Moshe	06/18/21	0.2	Email with E. Jerrard regarding June 22nd Exclusivity Hearing.
Melcer, Moshe	06/20/21	1.4	Review and revise June 22nd Exclusivity Hearing talking points.
Graulich, Timothy	06/21/21	2.7	Prepare for June 22nd Exclusivity Hearing.
Jerrard, Erik	06/21/21	4.2	Review and revise talking points for June 22nd Exclusivity Hearing (1.5); call with M. Melcer regarding June 22nd Exclusivity Hearing preparation (0.3); email with T. Graulich regarding same (0.4); email with Aeroméxico communications consultant regarding same (0.8); email with M. Melcer regarding same (0.6); correspondence with B. Miller, T. Goren, and T. Graulich regarding same (0.6).
Melcer, Moshe	06/21/21	0.4	Review and revise talking points for exclusivity hearing (0.2); email with Chambers regarding same (0.2).
Piraino, Stephen D.	06/21/21	0.3	Correspondence with Davis Polk team regarding June 22nd Exclusivity Hearing.
Bane, Abraham	06/22/21	0.6	Attend June 22nd Exclusivity Hearing.
Erickson, Jarret	06/22/21	8.0	Attend June 22nd Exclusivity Hearing (0.6); prepare for same (0.2).
Graulich, Timothy	06/22/21	4.7	Attend June 22nd Exclusivity Hearing (0.6); prepare for same (3.7); attend Chambers conference (0.4).
Jerrard, Erik	06/22/21	2.5	Attend June 22nd Exclusivity Hearing (0.6); prepare for same (0.8); correspondence with S. Piraino and T. Graulich regarding update related to same (0.8); correspondence with

20-11563-scc Doc 1979 Filed 10/26/21 Entered 10/26/21 20:59:12 Main Document Pg 149 of 357

Time Detail By Project			
Name	Date	Hours	Narrative
			Aeroméxico communications consultant regarding same (0.3).
Katz, Michael	06/22/21	0.6	Attend June 22nd Exclusivity Hearing.
Masaro, Matthew Bruno	06/22/21	0.7	Attend June 22nd Exclusivity Hearing.
Melcer, Moshe	06/22/21	0.9	Attend June 22nd Exclusivity Hearing (0.6); prepare for same (0.3).
Piraino, Stephen D.	06/22/21	1.5	Call with J. Brandt regarding June 22nd Exclusivity Hearing (0.1); attend June 22nd Exclusivity Hearing (0.6); prepare for same (0.4); attend Chambers conference (0.4).
Rincon, Cristina M.	06/22/21	0.6	Attend June 22nd Exclusivity Hearing.
Jerrard, Erik	06/23/21	0.3	Correspondence with A. Bane regarding hearing dates.
Piraino, Stephen D.	06/24/21	0.2	Email with D. Sinclair and E. Jerrard regarding hearing.
, 1		23.6	
AM270 Credit Card F	Receivables		
Piraino, Stephen D.	06/21/21	0.3	Correspondence with S. Robles and M. Masaro regarding CEBURES.
Piraino, Stephen D.	06/30/21	0.1	Correspondence with M. Masaro regarding CEBURES.
Total AM270 Credit Card Receivables		0.4	
TOTAL		1,473.2	

DISBURSEMENT SUMMARY			
Description	Amount		
Court and related fees	\$1,264.27		
Postage, courier & freight	\$148.70		
Outside Documents & Research	\$796.67		
Meals	\$20.00		
Travel	\$1,091.97		
Computer research	\$3,873.88		
TOTAL	\$7,195.49		

DISBURSEMENT DETAIL Expense Date Vendor Name Description Amount Type 06/01/21 Westlaw usage by KROIZER, ZVI on \$38.44 Computer research 06/01/2021 06/01/21 Computer Westlaw usage by STEINBERG,RICH on \$20.79 06/01/2021 research 06/02/21 Computer Westlaw usage by KROIZER, ZVI on \$174.53 research 06/02/2021 06/03/21 Computer LEXIS; SEARCH; ACCESS CHARGE \$52.85 research 06/03/21 Computer LEXIS; US TREATISES; DOC ACCESS \$608.59 research 06/03/21 Computer LEXIS; SEARCH; ACCESS CHARGE \$52.85 research 06/03/21 Computer \$50.72 LEXIS; US TREATISES; DOC ACCESS research 06/03/21 Computer Westlaw usage by MASARO, MATTHEW on \$59.22 research 06/03/2021 06/03/21 Computer Westlaw usage by KROIZER, ZVI on \$80.01 research 06/03/2021 LEXIS; US TREATISES; DOC ACCESS 06/04/21 Computer \$50.72 research 06/04/21 Computer Westlaw usage by KROIZER, ZVI on \$41.58 research 06/04/2021 06/07/21 Computer LEXIS; SEARCH; ACCESS CHARGE \$197.63 research 06/09/21 Computer LEXIS; US TREATISES; DOC ACCESS \$126.43 research 06/09/21 Computer LEXIS; SEARCH; ACCESS CHARGE \$65.88 research 06/09/21 Computer Westlaw usage by KROIZER, ZVI on \$11.23 research 06/09/2021 06/09/21 Computer Westlaw usage by MELCER, MOSHE on \$11.23 research 06/09/2021 06/10/21 Computer Westlaw usage by KROIZER, ZVI on \$13.23 research 06/10/2021

DISBURSEMENT DETAIL Expense Amount **Date Vendor Name** Description Type 06/10/21 LEXIS; US TREATISES; DOC ACCESS Computer \$126.43 research 06/15/21 Computer Westlaw usage by BANE, ABRAHAM on \$184.63 research 06/15/2021 06/16/21 Computer Westlaw usage by BANE.ABRAHAM on \$30.00 research 06/16/2021 06/17/21 Computer LEXIS; SEARCH; ACCESS CHARGE \$229.39 research 06/17/21 Computer LEXIS; US TREATISES; DOC ACCESS \$73.37 research 06/17/21 Computer LEXIS; SEARCH; ACCESS CHARGE \$76.46 research Computer 06/20/21 LEXIS; SEARCH; ACCESS CHARGE \$64.05 research 06/20/21 Computer LEXIS; US MEDICAL REFERENCES; DOC \$34.29 research **ACCESS** 06/20/21 Computer LEXIS; US MOTIONS; DOC ACCESS \$258.80 research 06/20/21 Computer LEXIS; US PLEADINGS; DOC ACCESS \$64.70 research 06/20/21 Computer Westlaw usage by DARTEZ, JACKSON on \$258.67 research 06/20/2021 06/23/21 Computer LEXIS; SEARCH; ACCESS CHARGE \$448.37 research 06/23/21 Computer LEXIS; US TREATISES; DOC ACCESS \$368.79 research 11/10/20 Veritext LLC Court and VENDOR: Veritext LLC, INVOICE #: 4644547, \$121.00 related fees DATE: 11/10/2020 req by Magali Giddens VENDOR: Veritext LLC, INVOICE #: 4898790, 03/22/21 Veritext LLC Court and \$139.15 related fees DATE: 3/22/2021 Reg by Magali 05/05/21 Veritext LLC Court and VENDOR: Veritext LLC, INVOICE #: 4990816, \$350.90 related fees DATE: 5/5/2021 Reg by Magali Giddens 06/22/21 Court and Payee: Melcer, Moshe, Court Solutions, \$70.00 related fees 6/22/2021,

06/01/21

06/01/21

06/01/21

06/01/21

06/01/21

06/03/21

Invoice Date: August 4, 2021 **DISBURSEMENT DETAIL Expense Date Vendor Name** Description Amount Type 06/30/21 Court and Pacer transactions 06/2021 \$12.50 related fees CourtAlert.com: B. Eng, D. Thomson; Court 06/30/21 Court and \$41.92 NYSD; Index No. 1:20-cv-05006; In Re: LSC related fees Communications, Inc. 06/30/21 Court and Pacer transactions 06/2021 \$8.30 related fees 06/30/21 Court and Pacer transactions 06/2021 \$429.10 related fees 06/30/21 Court and Pacer transactions 06/2021 \$91.40 related fees 06/22/21 Meals Payee: Masaro, Matthew Bruno, OT 8:01 PM, \$20.00 DIG - Madison Square 06/01/21 Outside Restructuring Concepts/netDockets: Moshe \$5.44 Melcer; 6/1/2021 10:38:00 AM; Description: **Documents** Single case search; Charge id: 354477 & Research Restructuring Concepts/netDockets: Stephen 06/01/21 Outside \$3.27 Ford; 6/1/2021 6:26:00 PM; Description: **Documents** Downloaded I0089: Docket #1467; Charge id: & Research 354548 Outside

Documents

& Research

Documents

& Research

Documents

& Research

Documents

& Research

Documents & Research

Outside

Outside

Outside

Outside

Outside

Documents

& Research

Restructuring Concepts/netDockets: Moshe

Melcer; 6/1/2021 12:55:00 PM; Description:

Restructuring Concepts/netDockets: Moshe

Restructuring Concepts/netDockets: Moshe

Restructuring Concepts/netDockets: Stephen

Restructuring Concepts/netDockets: Moshe

Melcer; 6/1/2021 10:39:00 AM; Description:

Restructuring Concepts/netDockets: Stephen

Ford; 6/3/2021 9:39:00 AM; Description: Single

Downloaded F0016: Docket #789 (Main

Ford; 6/1/2021 6:25:00 PM; Description: Single

Melcer; 6/1/2021 6:09:00 PM; Description:

Multiple case search; Charge id: 354546

case search; Charge id: 354547

Document); Charge id: 354478

case search; Charge id: 354755

Melcer; 6/1/2021 1:11:00 PM; Description:

Multiple case search; Charge id: 354522

Multiple case search; Charge id: 354520

\$21.78

\$21.78

\$21.78

\$5.44

\$3.27

\$5.44

DISBURSEMENT DETAIL Expense Date Vendor Name Description Amount Type Restructuring Concepts/netDockets: Stephen 06/03/21 Outside \$3.27 **Documents** Ford: 6/3/2021 9:39:00 AM: Description: & Research Downloaded W0091: Docket #1812; Charge id: 354756 06/03/21 Restructuring Concepts/netDockets: Stephen Outside \$3.27 **Documents** Ford; 6/3/2021 9:40:00 AM; Description: & Research Downloaded W0091: Docket #1813; Charge id: 354757 06/09/21 Outside Restructuring Concepts/netDockets: Moshe \$3.27 Melcer; 6/9/2021 3:07:00 PM; Description: Documents Downloaded S0243: Docket #769 (Exhibit & Research EXH-B (DSouza Declaration)); Charge id: 355676 06/09/21 Outside Restructuring Concepts/netDockets: Moshe \$21.78 Melcer: 6/9/2021 2:58:00 PM: Description: **Documents** Multiple case search; Charge id: 355671 & Research Restructuring Concepts/netDockets: Moshe 06/09/21 Outside \$5.44 Melcer; 6/9/2021 3:04:00 PM; Description: **Documents** Single case search; Charge id: 355672 & Research 06/09/21 Restructuring Concepts/netDockets: Moshe \$3.27 Outside Melcer; 6/9/2021 3:06:00 PM; Description: Documents & Research Downloaded S0243: Docket #769 (Main Document); Charge id: 355673 06/09/21 Restructuring Concepts/netDockets: Moshe Outside \$3.27 Melcer; 6/9/2021 3:06:00 PM; Description: **Documents** Downloaded S0243: Docket #769 (Notice); & Research Charge id: 355674 06/09/21 Outside Restructuring Concepts/netDockets: Moshe \$3.27 Melcer: 6/9/2021 3:06:00 PM: Description: **Documents** & Research Downloaded S0243: Docket #769 (Exhibit A (Proposed Order)): Charge id: 355675 06/10/21 Outside Restructuring Concepts/netDockets: Moshe \$3.27 Melcer: 6/10/2021 9:25:00 AM: Description: **Documents** & Research Downloaded S0243: Docket #793 (Exhibit B); Charge id: 355748 06/10/21 Outside Restructuring Concepts/netDockets: Moshe \$5.44 **Documents** Melcer; 6/10/2021 8:46:00 AM; Description: & Research Single case search; Charge id: 355741 06/10/21 Restructuring Concepts/netDockets: Moshe Outside \$3.27 Melcer; 6/10/2021 8:47:00 AM; Description: **Documents** & Research Downloaded S0243: Docket #815 (Main Document); Charge id: 355744

DISBURSEMENT DETAIL Expense Amount **Date Vendor Name** Description Type 06/10/21 Outside Restructuring Concepts/netDockets: Moshe \$3.27 **Documents** Melcer: 6/10/2021 8:47:00 AM: Description: & Research Downloaded S0243: Docket #815 (Exhibit 1); Charge id: 355745 06/10/21 Outside Restructuring Concepts/netDockets: Moshe \$3.27 Documents Melcer; 6/10/2021 9:25:00 AM; Description: & Research Downloaded S0243: Docket #793 (Main Document); Charge id: 355746 06/10/21 Outside Restructuring Concepts/netDockets: Moshe \$3.27 Documents Melcer; 6/10/2021 9:25:00 AM; Description: Downloaded S0243: Docket #793 (Exhibit A); & Research Charge id: 355747 Restructuring Concepts/netDockets: Moshe 06/11/21 Outside \$21.78 Melcer; 6/11/2021 1:10:00 PM; Description: **Documents** & Research Multiple case search; Charge id: 355934 06/11/21 Outside Restructuring Concepts/netDockets: Moshe \$21.78 Melcer: 6/11/2021 1:10:00 PM: Description: **Documents** & Research Multiple case search; Charge id: 355935 06/15/21 Outside Restructuring Concepts/netDockets: Stephen \$5.44 **Documents** Ford; 6/15/2021 10:42:00 AM; Description: Single case search; Charge id: 356404 & Research Restructuring Concepts/netDockets: Stephen 06/15/21 Outside \$3.27 **Documents** Ford; 6/15/2021 10:47:00 AM; Description: Downloaded P0028: Docket #170 (Main & Research Document); Charge id: 356405 Restructuring Concepts/netDockets: Stephen 06/15/21 Outside \$3.27 Ford: 6/15/2021 2:13:00 PM: Description: Documents & Research Downloaded W0001: Docket #26155; Charge id: 356460 06/15/21 Outside Restructuring Concepts/netDockets: Stephen \$3.27 Ford; 6/15/2021 3:23:00 PM; Description: Documents & Research Downloaded T0016: Docket #11836 (Main Document): Charge id: 356475 06/15/21 Outside Restructuring Concepts/netDockets: Stephen \$5.44 **Documents** Ford; 6/15/2021 2:06:00 PM; Description: & Research Single case search; Charge id: 356456 06/15/21 Outside Restructuring Concepts/netDockets: Moshe \$3.27 Melcer; 6/15/2021 9:47:00 PM; Description: **Documents** & Research Downloaded R0067: Docket #8581; Charge id: 356604

DISBURSEMENT DETAIL Expense Date Vendor Name Description Amount Type 06/15/21 Outside Restructuring Concepts/netDockets: Moshe \$3.27 **Documents** Melcer: 6/15/2021 9:50:00 PM: Description: & Research Downloaded H0063: Docket #1775; Charge id: 356608 06/15/21 Restructuring Concepts/netDockets: Moshe Outside \$3.27 **Documents** Melcer; 6/15/2021 9:30:00 PM; Description: & Research Downloaded S0226: Docket #7213; Charge id: 356590 06/15/21 Outside Restructuring Concepts/netDockets: Moshe \$3.27 Documents Melcer: 6/15/2021 9:33:00 PM: Description: Downloaded W0071: Docket #4531; Charge id: & Research 356592 Restructuring Concepts/netDockets: Moshe 06/15/21 Outside \$21.78 Melcer; 6/15/2021 9:35:00 PM; Description: **Documents** & Research Multiple case search; Charge id: 356594 06/15/21 Outside Restructuring Concepts/netDockets: Moshe \$21.78 **Documents** Melcer: 6/15/2021 9:35:00 PM: Description: & Research Multiple case search; Charge id: 356595 06/15/21 Outside Restructuring Concepts/netDockets: Moshe \$3.27 **Documents** Melcer; 6/15/2021 9:45:00 PM; Description: Downloaded T0151: Docket #4744; Charge id: & Research 356603 06/15/21 Outside Restructuring Concepts/netDockets: Moshe \$21.78 Melcer; 6/15/2021 9:49:00 PM; Description: **Documents** & Research Multiple case search; Charge id: 356607 06/15/21 Restructuring Concepts/netDockets: Moshe Outside \$21.78 Melcer; 6/15/2021 9:29:00 PM; Description: Documents Multiple case search; Charge id: 356589 & Research 06/15/21 Outside Restructuring Concepts/netDockets: Stephen \$3.27 Ford; 6/15/2021 5:07:00 PM; Description: **Documents** & Research Downloaded E0051: Docket #5327; Charge id: 356493 Restructuring Concepts/netDockets: Moshe 06/15/21 Outside \$21.78 **Documents** Melcer: 6/15/2021 9:32:00 PM: Description: & Research Multiple case search; Charge id: 356591 06/15/21 Outside Restructuring Concepts/netDockets: Stephen \$5.44 Ford; 6/15/2021 3:54:00 PM; Description: **Documents** & Research Single case search; Charge id: 356481

DISBURSEMENT DETAIL Expense Date Vendor Name Description Amount Type Restructuring Concepts/netDockets: Stephen 06/15/21 Outside \$3.27 **Documents** Ford: 6/15/2021 4:56:00 PM: Description: & Research Downloaded E0051: Docket #5326; Charge id: 356489 06/15/21 Outside Restructuring Concepts/netDockets: Stephen \$5.44 Ford; 6/15/2021 5:02:00 PM; Description: **Documents** & Research Single case search; Charge id: 356491 06/15/21 Restructuring Concepts/netDockets: Stephen Outside \$3.27 Ford; 6/15/2021 5:05:00 PM; Description: **Documents** & Research Downloaded E0051: Docket #5371: Charge id: 356492 06/15/21 Outside Restructuring Concepts/netDockets: Stephen \$5.44 Ford; 6/15/2021 2:52:00 PM; Description: **Documents** Single case search; Charge id: 356474 & Research \$3.27 06/15/21 Outside Restructuring Concepts/netDockets: Stephen **Documents** Ford; 6/15/2021 3:24:00 PM; Description: & Research Downloaded T0016: Docket #11836 (Exhibit 3(b) - Cumulative blackline that compares the Revised Litigation Trust A); Charge id: 356476 Restructuring Concepts/netDockets: Stephen 06/15/21 Outside \$3.27 Ford; 6/15/2021 3:32:00 PM; Description: **Documents** & Research Downloaded T0016: Docket #14337; Charge id: 356478 06/15/21 Outside Restructuring Concepts/netDockets: Stephen \$3.27 Ford; 6/15/2021 3:37:00 PM; Description: **Documents** Downloaded T0016: Docket #14364; Charge & Research id: 356479 06/15/21 Outside Restructuring Concepts/netDockets: Stephen \$5.44 Ford: 6/15/2021 3:53:00 PM: Description: **Documents** & Research Single case search: Charge id: 356480 06/15/21 Outside Restructuring Concepts/netDockets: Stephen \$3.27 Ford: 6/15/2021 2:12:00 PM: Description: **Documents** Downloaded W0001: Docket #26289: Charge & Research id: 356459 06/15/21 Outside Restructuring Concepts/netDockets: Stephen \$5.44 **Documents** Ford: 6/15/2021 4:29:00 PM: Description: & Research Single case search; Charge id: 356484 06/15/21 Outside Restructuring Concepts/netDockets: Stephen \$5.44 Ford; 6/15/2021 1:42:00 PM; Description: **Documents** & Research Single case search; Charge id: 356436

DISBURSEMENT DETAIL Expense Date Vendor Name Description Amount Type 06/16/21 Outside Restructuring Concepts/netDockets: Moshe \$21.78 **Documents** Melcer; 6/16/2021 6:27:00 AM; Description: & Research Multiple case search; Charge id: 356624 06/16/21 Outside Restructuring Concepts/netDockets: Moshe \$21.78 Melcer; 6/16/2021 6:27:00 AM; Description: **Documents** Multiple case search; Charge id: 356625 & Research 06/16/21 Restructuring Concepts/netDockets: Moshe Outside \$3.27 Melcer; 6/16/2021 6:25:00 AM; Description: **Documents** & Research Downloaded P0102: Docket #3763; Charge id: 356622 06/16/21 Restructuring Concepts/netDockets: Moshe Outside \$21.78 Melcer; 6/16/2021 6:23:00 AM; Description: **Documents** Multiple case search; Charge id: 356619 & Research 06/16/21 Outside Restructuring Concepts/netDockets: Moshe \$21.78 **Documents** Melcer; 6/16/2021 6:23:00 AM; Description: & Research Multiple case search; Charge id: 356620 06/16/21 Restructuring Concepts/netDockets: Moshe Outside \$5.44 Melcer; 6/16/2021 6:25:00 AM; Description: **Documents** & Research Single case search; Charge id: 356621 Restructuring Concepts/netDockets: Moshe 06/16/21 Outside \$21.78 **Documents** Melcer; 6/16/2021 6:27:00 AM; Description: Multiple case search; Charge id: 356623 & Research 06/17/21 Outside Restructuring Concepts/netDockets: Stephen \$3.27 Ford: 6/17/2021 11:22:00 AM: Description: **Documents** Downloaded D0004: Docket #4417 (Appendix & Research Debtors' Joint Plan of Reorganization); Charge id: 356870 Restructuring Concepts/netDockets: Stephen 06/17/21 Outside \$3.27 Ford; 6/17/2021 11:23:00 AM; Description: Documents Downloaded D0004: Docket #4417 (Appendix & Research Valuation Analyses); Charge id: 356871 Outside Restructuring Concepts/netDockets: Stephen 06/17/21 \$3.27 Ford; 6/17/2021 8:46:00 AM; Description: **Documents** & Research Downloaded D0004: Docket #4417 (Main Document); Charge id: 356844 06/17/21 Outside Restructuring Concepts/netDockets: Stephen \$5.44 Ford; 6/17/2021 8:46:00 AM; Description: **Documents** & Research Single case search; Charge id: 356843 06/20/21 courtlink: SEARCH ACCESS CHARGE For Outside \$11.87 Documents JACKSON DARTEZ & Research

DISBURSEMENT DETAIL Expense Date Vendor Name Description Amount Type 06/20/21 Outside courtlink: US DOCKETS DOC ACCESS For \$0.84 **Documents** JACKSON DARTEZ & Research 06/23/21 Outside Restructuring Concepts/netDockets: Moshe \$21.78 Melcer; 6/23/2021 10:55:00 AM; Description: **Documents** & Research Multiple case search; Charge id: 357486 06/23/21 Restructuring Concepts/netDockets: Moshe \$5.44 Outside Melcer; 6/23/2021 11:32:00 AM; Description: **Documents** Single case search; Charge id: 357499 & Research 06/23/21 Outside Restructuring Concepts/netDockets: Moshe \$21.78 **Documents** Melcer; 6/23/2021 10:55:00 AM; Description: Multiple case search; Charge id: 357485 & Research 06/23/21 Outside Restructuring Concepts/netDockets: Moshe \$21.78 **Documents** Melcer; 6/23/2021 10:56:00 AM; Description: Multiple case search; Charge id: 357487 & Research 06/24/21 Outside Restructuring Concepts/netDockets: Moshe \$21.78 Melcer; 6/24/2021 5:57:00 PM; Description: Documents Multiple case search; Charge id: 357666 & Research 06/24/21 Outside Restructuring Concepts/netDockets: Moshe \$3.27 Melcer; 6/24/2021 5:59:00 PM; Description: **Documents** & Research Downloaded R0067: Docket #9971 (Main Document); Charge id: 357667 06/24/21 Outside Restructuring Concepts/netDockets: Moshe \$21.78 Melcer: 6/24/2021 7:07:00 PM: Description: **Documents** Multiple case search; Charge id: 357669 & Research 06/24/21 Outside Restructuring Concepts/netDockets: Moshe \$21.78 **Documents** Melcer; 6/24/2021 7:07:00 PM; Description: & Research Multiple case search; Charge id: 357670 06/24/21 Outside Restructuring Concepts/netDockets: Stephen \$3.27 Ford; 6/24/2021 7:10:00 AM; Description: **Documents** & Research Downloaded S0067: Docket #19; Charge id: 357558 06/24/21 Outside Restructuring Concepts/netDockets: Stephen \$3.27 Ford; 6/24/2021 7:11:00 AM; Description: **Documents** Downloaded S0095: Docket #221; Charge id: & Research 357560 06/24/21 Outside Restructuring Concepts/netDockets: Moshe \$5.44 **Documents** Melcer; 6/24/2021 8:16:00 AM; Description: & Research Single case search: Charge id: 357569

DISBURSEMENT DETAIL Expense Date Vendor Name Description Amount Type Restructuring Concepts/netDockets: Moshe 06/24/21 Outside \$21.78 **Documents** Melcer; 6/24/2021 10:25:00 AM; Description: & Research Multiple case search; Charge id: 357633 06/24/21 Outside Restructuring Concepts/netDockets: Moshe \$21.78 Melcer; 6/24/2021 5:43:00 PM; Description: **Documents** Multiple case search; Charge id: 357665 & Research 06/24/21 Restructuring Concepts/netDockets: Stephen \$5.44 Outside Ford; 6/24/2021 7:09:00 AM; Description: **Documents** & Research Single case search; Charge id: 357556 06/24/21 Outside Restructuring Concepts/netDockets: Stephen \$5.44 **Documents** Ford; 6/24/2021 7:10:00 AM; Description: Single case search; Charge id: 357557 & Research 06/24/21 Outside Restructuring Concepts/netDockets: Stephen \$5.44 **Documents** Ford; 6/24/2021 7:11:00 AM; Description: & Research Single case search; Charge id: 357559 06/29/21 Outside Restructuring Concepts/netDockets: Moshe \$21.78 Melcer; 6/29/2021 5:26:00 PM; Description: Documents Multiple case search; Charge id: 358197 & Research courtlink: SEARCH ACCESS CHARGE For 06/30/21 Outside \$3.95 **Documents** DAMIAN OSULLIVAN & Research 06/30/21 Outside courtlink: US DOCKETS DOC ACCESS For \$0.28 **Documents** DAMIAN OSULLIVAN & Research 06/30/21 Outside Restructuring Concepts/netDockets: Damian \$3.27 **Documents** O'Sullivan: 6/30/2021 9:33:00 AM: Description: & Research Downloaded P0013: Docket #848; Charge id: 358244 06/30/21 Outside Restructuring Concepts/netDockets: Damian \$3.27 O'Sullivan; 6/30/2021 9:35:00 AM; Description: **Documents** Downloaded P0013: Docket #558 (Main & Research Document); Charge id: 358245 06/30/21 Outside Restructuring Concepts/netDockets: Damian \$5.44 O'Sullivan; 6/30/2021 7:40:00 AM; Description: **Documents** & Research Single case search; Charge id: 358227 06/18/21 Postage, From Matthew Bruno Masaro to Andrea B. \$70.70 courier & Schwartz freight

20-11563-scc Doc 1979 Filed 10/26/21 Entered 10/26/21 20:59:12 Main Document Pg 160 of 357

DISBURSE	DISBURSEMENT DETAIL				
Date	Vendor Name	Expense Type	Description	Amount	
06/23/21		Postage, courier & freight	From Abraham Bane to Andrea B. Schwartz	\$23.00	
06/25/21		Postage, courier & freight	From Mariya Dekhtyar to Andrea Schwartz	\$55.00	
06/22/21		Travel	Payee: Masaro, Matthew Bruno, OT 9:26 PM, Lyft	\$21.73	
06/24/21		Travel	AIRFARE/Graulich,Timothy Mr./06-27-21/LGA ATL MEX/Business Class	\$279.99	
06/24/21		Travel	AIRFARE/Graulich,Timothy Mr./06-29-21/MEX JFK/Business Class	\$790.25	
TOTAL	•	·		\$7,195.49	

Time Detail By Project			
Name	Date	Hours	Narrative
AM100 Aircraft/Engi			
Graulich, Timothy Melcer, Moshe	07/01/21 07/01/21	1.6 1.6	Review and comment on motion to approve letters of intent. Correspondence with J. Sturm regarding motion to approve aircraft transaction (0.2); call with Davis Polk Fleet team and White & Case regarding fleet workstreams (0.7); draft motion to approve aircraft transactions (0.7).
Sturm, Josh	07/01/21	2.9	Correspondence with T. Graulich and Skyworks regarding rejection procedures (0.7); correspondence with Davis Polk Fleet team regarding timeline for same (0.4); correspondence with Skyworks regarding same (0.3); correspondence with Davis Polk Fleet team regarding DAE motion (0.4); comment on revised draft (0.3); correspondence with White & Case regarding same (0.3); correspondence with same and Davis Polk Fleet team regarding North Shore agreement (0.5).
Melcer, Moshe	07/02/21	2.1	Review and revise motion to approve aircraft transactions (1.5); correspondence with T. Green regarding fleet workstreams (0.3); coordinate with White & Case and Skyworks regarding aircraft transactions (0.3).
Sturm, Josh	07/02/21	0.6	Call with A. Andreeva regarding MUFG transfer (0.3); correspondence with T. Graulich regarding status of fleet motions (0.3).
Green, Thomas S.	07/04/21	2.7	Review and revise Fuyo documents.
Melcer, Moshe	07/04/21	4.4	Draft motion to approve aircraft transactions (2.2); draft sealing motion regarding same (0.9); compile summary of fleet motions status (1.1); email with J. Sturm and T. Green regarding same (0.2).
Sturm, Josh	07/04/21	0.6	Correspondence with M. Melcer and T. Green regarding pending fleet motions (0.4); review correspondence with Skyworks regarding same (0.2).
Green, Thomas S.	07/05/21	0.3	Correspondence with M. Melcer regarding Fuyo and DAE motions.
Sturm, Josh	07/05/21	1.2	Comment on DAE motion (1.0); correspondence with Davis Polk Fleet team regarding same (0.2).
Melcer, Moshe	07/06/21	1.9	Review and revise motion to approve aircraft transactions (1.5); review and revise summary of fleet motion status (0.3); email with J. Sturm and T. Green regarding same (0.1).
Sturm, Josh	07/06/21	0.7	Correspondence with Davis Polk Fleet team regarding comments to DAE motion (0.4); correspondence with same, White & Case, and Skyworks regarding same (0.1); correspondence with Morris Nichols and Davis Polk Fleet team regarding fleet motions (0.2).
Jerrard, Erik	07/07/21	0.7	Call with J. Barsalona regarding engine transaction motion (0.4); call with same and A. Remming regarding same (0.3).
Melcer, Moshe	07/07/21	0.7	Review and revise motion to approve aircraft transactions (0.5); email with J. Sturm, T. Green, and White & Case regarding same (0.2).
Piraino, Stephen D. Sturm, Josh	07/07/21 07/07/21	0.2 2.2	Call with J. Wallden regarding fleet issues. Call with Davis Polk Fleet team and White & Case regarding fleet workstreams (0.9); correspondence with Davis Polk Fleet team regarding White & Case's comments to DAE motion (0.3); correspondence with M. Landess regarding same (0.2); review Fuyo motion (0.5); correspondence with Davis Polk Fleet team regarding same (0.3).
Graulich, Timothy Melcer, Moshe	07/08/21 07/08/21	2.3 2.3	Review and revise aircraft motion. Review and revise motion to approve aircraft transactions

Time Detail By Project			
Name	Date	Hours	Narrative
Sturm, Josh	07/08/21	1.4	(1.3); call with Davis Polk Fleet team and White & Case regarding fleet workstreams (0.6); review precedent settlement language (0.2); draft rider for same (0.2). Correspondence with Davis Polk Fleet team regarding pending fleet filings (0.6); correspondence with A. Andreeva regarding GEnx draft lease extension (0.3); correspondence with White & Case regarding Norton Rose comments to fleet
Szanzer, Steven Z.	07/08/21	0.6	issue (0.5) Call with Davis Polk Fleet team and White & Case regarding fleet workstreams.
Green, Thomas S.	07/09/21	1.0	Correspondence with S. Szanzer and M. Melcer regarding fleet workstreams.
Melcer, Moshe	07/09/21	2.4	Review and revise draft motion to approve aircraft transactions (1.2); correspondence with S. Szanzer and T. Green regarding fleet workstreams (1.2).
Szanzer, Steven Z.	07/09/21	1.4	Correspondence with Davis Polk Fleet team regarding fleet issues.
Melcer, Moshe	07/10/21	0.5	Revise motion to approve aircraft transactions (0.4); email with S. Szanzer and T. Green regarding same (0.1).
Melcer, Moshe	07/11/21	1.2	Review and revise motion to approve aircraft transactions (0.8); draft declaration in support of same (0.4).
Graulich, Timothy Green, Thomas S.	07/12/21 07/12/21	1.3 3.8	Review and revise motion to approve aircraft transactions. Review and revise North Shore motion (2.1); review and revise DAE motion (1.3); correspondence with S. Szanzer regarding same (0.2); correspondence with J. Sturm regarding redactions for same (0.2).
Melcer, Moshe	07/12/21	4.4	Review and revise motion to approve aircraft transactions (3.0); call with S. Szanzer regarding North Shore motion (0.6); revise sealing motion in connection with aircraft approval motion (0.7); correspondence with T. Green regarding same (0.1).
Szanzer, Steven Z.	07/12/21	7.6	Review North Shore amended engine lease (0.4); correspondence with M. Melcer regarding same (0.7); review and revise motion for same (4.9); call with M. Melcer regarding same (0.6); correspondence with T. Green regarding same (0.3); correspondence with M. Melcer regarding DAE sealing motion (0.4); correspondence with White & Case regarding DAE redactions (0.3).
Melcer, Moshe	07/13/21	4.9	Review and revise motion to approve aircraft transactions (2.8); correspondence with S. Szanzer regarding same (0.1); review and revise motion to approve engine transactions (1.8); correspondence with T. Green regarding same (0.2).
Szanzer, Steven Z.	07/13/21	6.9	Review and revise DAE sealing motion (3.2); correspondence with T. Green and White & Case regarding redactions and timing for same (0.5); correspondence with M. Melcer, T. Green, and White & Case regarding Aviator motion (0.5); correspondence with Skyworks regarding North Shore claims settlement (0.2); review and revise North Shore motion (2.5).
Green, Thomas S.	07/14/21	1.4	Correspondence with Davis Polk Fleet team regarding Flight Safety (0.5); review memorandum regarding same (0.3); correspondence with S. Szanzer regarding payments for same (0.2); call with Davis Polk Fleet team and White & Case regarding fleet workstreams (0.4).
Melcer, Moshe	07/14/21	2.7	Review and revise sealing motion (0.4); review and revise motion to approve aircraft engine transactions (1.8); call with White & Case regarding same (0.2); call with S. Szanzer and

	Time Detail By Project			
Name	Date	Hours	Narrative	
Szanzer, Steven Z.	07/14/21	7.2	Skyworks regarding same (0.3). Review and revise DAE sealing motion (0.9); correspondence with M. Melcer regarding same (0.9); review and analyze comments to North Shore motion (1.0); correspondence with M. Melcer regarding same (1.1); review and revise aircraft transactions motion (0.8); correspondence with M. Melcer regarding same (0.7); correspondence with M. Melcer regarding DAE documents (0.4); correspondence with T. Green regarding same (0.3); review and analyze comments to aircraft approval motion (0.3); call with M. Melcer and Skyworks regarding same (0.3); correspondence with M. Melcer, T. Green, and A. Troconis regarding notice	
Green, Thomas S. Melcer, Moshe	07/15/21 07/15/21	1.9 8.9	requirements for motions (0.5). Review and revise fleet pleadings. Correspondence with T. Green regarding outstanding fleet motions (0.3); review and revise motion to approve aircraft transactions (3.6); correspondence with T. Green regarding same (0.4); correspondence with S. Szanzer regarding same (0.1); review and revise sealing motion regarding same (0.9); draft declaration in support of same (0.8); review and revise motion to approve aircraft equipment transactions (1.6); correspondence with S. Szanzer regarding same (0.1); draft sealing motion regarding same (0.6); call with Davis Polk Fleet team and White & Case regarding fleet workstreams (0.5).	
Piraino, Stephen D.	07/15/21	0.4	Correspondence with S. Szanzer regarding fleet issues (0.2); call with Aeroméxico team regarding same (0.2).	
Szanzer, Steven Z.	07/15/21	7.5	Correspondence with Skyworks, White & Case, and M. Melcer regarding North Shore motion (0.5); correspondence with White & Case, Skyworks, and Davis Polk Fleet team regarding DAE motion (0.8); correspondence with AlixPartners and Aeroméxico regarding Flight Safety payments (0.4); correspondence with T. Green regarding same (0.4); correspondence with M. Melcer regarding Aviator motion (0.4); email with Cleary Gottlieb regarding DAE motion (0.3); correspondence with M. Melcer, White & Case, and Skyworks regarding same (0.3); review and revise Landess Declaration in support of same (2.2); correspondence with White & Case and Skyworks regarding sealing motion for same (0.6); correspondence with White & Case and Skyworks regarding redactions for same (0.5); review summary of fleet workstreams in preparation for call with M. Melcer regarding same (0.3); call with Davis Polk Fleet team and White & Case regarding fleet workstreams (0.5); correspondence with M. Melcer following-up on same (0.3).	
Szanzer, Steven Z.	07/15/21	3.3	Review and analyze Sidley Austin's comments to North Shore motion (0.4); correspondence with M. Melcer, T. Green, White & Case, and Skyworks regarding same (0.4); review revised version of same (0.5); correspondence with Clifford Chance regarding DAE motion (0.3); review and analyze comments to same (0.3); correspondence with White & Case, Skyworks, and M. Melcer regarding same (0.4); correspondence with White & Case regarding Orix and CAE transactions (0.3); correspondence with Davis Polk Fleet team regarding Holland & Knight's comments to Fuyo motion (0.2); correspondence with Davis Polk team regarding filing motion (0.3); correspondence with T. Graulich regarding DAE documents	

Time Detail By Project				
Name	Date	Hours	Narrative	
Green, Thomas S.	07/16/21	9.9	(0.2). Review and revise Aviator motion (1.5); review and revise Fuyo motion (1.2); review and revise DAE sealing motion (2.3); review and revise North Shore motion and related pleadings (3.9); call with Sidley Austin regarding same (0.6); call with Davis Polk Fleet team regarding same (0.4).	
Melcer, Moshe	07/16/21	7.6	Draft DAE sealing motion (0.4); draft motion to approve aircraft transactions (2.4); call with Holland & Knight regarding same (0.2); correspondence with same and S. Szanzer regarding same (0.2); revise same (1.2); revise draft to approve equipment transactions (2.3); call with White & Case and others regarding same (0.2); correspondence with T. Green regarding same (0.2); call with Skyworks and Davis Polk Fleet teams regarding same (0.2); draft declaration in support of same (0.3).	
Szanzer, Steven Z.	07/16/21	7.3	Review and consider comments to DAE sealing motion (0.3); review and consider comments to declaration in support of same (0.3); correspondence with Skyworks, White & Case, Clifford Chance and Davis Polk Fleet team regarding same (0.6); review and consider comments to North Shore motion (0.9); correspondence with Skyworks, White & Case, and Davis Polk Fleet team regarding same (1.0); correspondence with Sidley Austin regarding same (0.3); review and revise North Shore sealing motion (1.1); correspondence with M. Melcer and T. Green regarding same (0.4); correspondence with Skyworks, White & Case, Clifford Chance and Davis Polk Fleet team regarding DAE motion (1.2); review email regarding Flight Safety (0.2); correspondence with Davis Polk Fleet team regarding fleet issues (1.0).	
Green, Thomas S. Green, Thomas S.	07/17/21 07/18/21	1.3 0.5	Correspondence with counterparties regarding North Shore. Call with M. Melcer regarding Orix, Aviator, and Fuyo (0.2);	
Melcer, Moshe	07/18/21	4.4	review and revise pleadings for same (0.3). Review and revise motion to approve aircraft transactions (2.1); draft related sealing motion (1.4); draft declarations in support of same (0.5); call with T. Green regarding Orix, Aviator, and Fuyo (0.2); correspondence with S. Szanzer regarding same (0.2).	
Szanzer, Steven Z.	07/18/21	9.7	Review and revise Aviator motion (2.0); correspondence with M. Melcer regarding same (0.7); review and revise Orix motion (3.0); correspondence with T. Green regarding same (0.5); correspondence with M. Melcer regarding same (0.5); correspondence with same regarding Fuyo motion (0.3); review and revise Orix sealing motion (0.6); correspondence with M. Melcer regarding same (0.5); review and revise Landess declaration in support of Orix motion (0.7); correspondence with M. Melcer regarding same (0.6);	
Green, Thomas S.	07/19/21	3.4	correspondence with T. Green regarding redactions (0.3). Call with Linklaters regarding MUFG (0.3); prepare for same (0.3); correspondence with M. Giddens regarding motion service (0.2); analyze DAE order (0.5); call with White & Case regarding MUFG (0.2); call with K. Collins regarding Flight Safety (0.2); analyze assumption procedures order (0.3); review Flight Safety memorandum (0.4); review and revise Aviator sealing motion (0.4); correspondence with M. Melcer regarding same (0.1); analyze Ex-Im transaction structure (0.5).	

Time Detail By Project				
Name	Date	Hours	Narrative	
Melcer, Moshe	07/19/21	3.9	Review and revise motion to approve aircraft transactions (2.4); correspondence with S. Szanzer and Holland & Knight regarding same (0.2); revise related sealing motion (0.4); revise declaration in support of same (0.3); email with Chambers regarding same (0.2); call with S. Szanzer regarding same (0.1); correspondence with A. Romero-Wagner regarding fleet workstreams (0.3).	
Romero-Wagner, Alex B.	07/19/21	0.8	Correspondence with M. Melcer regarding aircraft leasing motions.	
Szanzer, Steven Z.	07/19/21	5.8	Correspondence with Davis Polk Fleet team regarding motion filed (0.2); review, revise, and finalize DAE motions (1.4); correspondence with Davis Polk Fleet team, White & Case, Skyworks, and Clifford Chance regarding same (1.3); correspondence with White & Case regarding redactions (0.2); review and revise Fuyo motion (1.0); correspondence with M. Melcer regarding same (1.0); correspondence and calls with Linklaters and T. Green regarding DVB/MUFG transfer (0.6); correspondence with K. Collins and A. Andreeva regarding Flight Safety (0.1).	
Graulich, Timothy Green, Thomas S.	07/20/21 07/20/21	2.4 2.2	Review and revise aircraft lease assumption motion. Call with K. Collins regarding Flight Safety (0.4); call with White & Case and others regarding Ex-Im (0.3); call with K. Beckeman regarding Flight Safety (0.2); correspondence with J. Sturm regarding same (0.2); correspondence with A. Romero-Wagner and M. Melcer regarding fleet workstreams (1.1).	
Melcer, Moshe	07/20/21	9.8	Review and revise fleet status summary (0.7); draft motion to approve aircraft transactions (6.0); correspondence with S. Szanzer regarding same (0.2); draft related sealing motion (1.3); draft related declaration (1.0); correspondence with T. Green and A. Romero-Wagner regarding outstanding fleet workstreams (0.4); correspondence with T. Green regarding same (0.2).	
Romero-Wagner, Alex B.	07/20/21	1.3	Correspondence with T. Green and M. Melcer regarding aircraft leasing motions (0.5); correspondence with M. Melcer regarding same (0.8).	
Szanzer, Steven Z.	07/20/21	9.4		
Green, Thomas S.	07/21/21	4.7	Call with Davis Polk Fleet team regarding fleet (0.5); review and revise Ex-Im omnibus claims agreement (0.3); review and	

		Time	Detail By Project
Name	Date	Hours	Narrative
Melcer, Moshe	07/21/21	0.7	revise SMBC sealing motion (0.8); correspondence with A. Wagner regarding fleet workstreams (0.2); review and revise fleet workstreams summary (0.7); review and revise Aviator declaration (0.3); review and revise Fuyo declaration (0.3); review and revise CAE motion (0.5); review and revise sealing motion regarding same (0.5); call with White & Case regarding timing (0.2); analyze SMBC confidentiality issues (0.6); research issues regarding CMO (0.1). Draft declaration in support of motion to approve aircraft
			transactions (0.5); revise fleet status summary (0.1); correspondence with S. Ford regarding aircraft finance inquiry (0.1).
Romero-Wagner, Alex B.	07/21/21	2.3	Correspondence with Davis Polk Fleet team regarding fleet motions (0.3); revise motions to approve aircraft transactions (1.5); correspondence with S. Szanzer and others regarding same (0.5).
Steinberg, Richard J.	07/21/21	2.6	Correspondence with S. Szanzer and T. Green regarding fleet workstreams and related claims (0.9); email with S. Szanzer regarding aircraft settlements (0.4); correspondence with T. Green regarding fleet motions (0.5); revise Fuyo motion (0.2); revise CAE motion (0.6).
Szanzer, Steven Z.	07/21/21	8.7	Review and consider comments to Orix documents (0.7); review and revise same (1.1); correspondence with A. Romero and T. Green regarding same (1.0); correspondence with Skyworks and White & Case regarding SMBC motion (0.3); correspondence with T. Green and White & Case regarding Ex-Im (0.9); correspondence with T. Green, AlixPartners, and AMX regarding Flight Safety (0.4); call with Davis Polk Fleet team regarding fleet workstreams (0.5); review fleet workstreams summary (0.3); review and revise declaration in support of Fuyo motion (0.4); correspondence with T. Green regarding same (0.4); review and revise CAE documents (1.0); correspondence with White & Case and Skyworks regarding Orix status (0.2); correspondence with White & Case regarding redactions (0.3); correspondence with White & Case regarding Yamas (0.2).
Graun, Thomas S	07/22/21	0.9	Call with M. Landess, C. Hansen, and Davis Polk Fleet team regarding fleet issues.
Green, Thomas S.	07/22/21	4.1	Call with M. Landess, C. Hansen, and Davis Polk Fleet team regarding fleet issues (1.0); call with Skyworks regarding CAE (0.4); analyze memorandum regarding same (0.3); call with Vedder Price regarding Ex-Im (0.3); correspondence with S. Szanzer regarding same (0.4); revise Fuyo motion (0.9); review and revise fleet workstreams table (0.5); email with Davis Polk Fleet team regarding Flight Safety (0.2); correspondence with J. Sturm regarding same (0.1).
Piraino, Stephen D.	07/22/21	0.8	Call with M. Landess, C. Hansen, and Davis Polk Fleet team regarding fleet issues.
Romero-Wagner, Alex B.	07/22/21	1.6	Call with M. Landess, C. Hansen, and Davis Polk Fleet team regarding fleet issues (1.0); email with Davis Polk Fleet team regarding fleet motions (0.6).
Steinberg, Richard J.	07/22/21	2.6	Call with Skyworks regarding CAE settlement and motion (0.6); call with Vedder Price regarding Ex-Im settlement (0.4); email with AlixPartners regarding same (0.2); revise Fuyo motion (0.5); email with AlixPartners regarding SMBC

		Time	Detail By Project
Name	Date	Hours	Narrative
Szanzer, Steven Z.	07/22/21	4.9	settlement (0.3); research issues regarding finance lease assumption motions (0.6). Correspondence with Skyworks regarding CAE and other
			transactions (0.8); review CAE transaction documents (0.2); review and consider comments to Fuyo motion (0.4); correspondence with White & Case and Skyworks regarding same (0.3); correspondence with White & Case regarding Orix documents (0.3); call with M. Landess, C. Hansen, and Davis Polk Fleet team regarding fleet issues (1.0); review emails with Davis Polk Fleet team regarding Ex-Im (0.8); correspondence with T. Green and R. Steinberg regarding same (0.6); review updated fleet workstream summary (0.3); correspondence with Davis Polk Fleet team regarding same (0.2).
Green, Thomas S.	07/23/21	2.9	Review Aviator pleadings (0.9); call with White & Case regarding same (0.1); review and revise workstreams summary (0.3); call with White & Case regarding CAE (0.2); review and revise SMBC (0.3); correspondence regarding Fuyo (0.2); call with Vedder Price regarding Ex-Im (0.4); research issues regarding same (0.5).
Melcer, Moshe	07/23/21	0.3	Correspondence with T. Green regarding draft fleet motions (0.2); call with S. Szanzer regarding same (0.1).
Romero-Wagner, Alex B.	07/23/21	8.0	Revise motion to approve aircraft transactions.
Steinberg, Richard J.	07/23/21	2.8	Call with Vedder Price regarding Ex-Im settlement (0.3); revise Fuyo motion (2.3); email with Holland & Knight regarding same (0.2).
Szanzer, Steven Z.	07/23/21	5.6	Correspondence with B. Thorsness and T. Green regarding Ex-Im (0.8); correspondence with White & Case, Skyworks, and Orix regarding documents and redactions (0.5); correspondence with White & Case regarding Aviator redactions (0.2); correspondence with White & Case regarding CAE (0.3); review and revise Fuyo documents (0.8); correspondence with R. Steinberg regarding same (0.8); correspondence with same regarding SMBC (0.2); review and consider DVB/MUFG language (0.2); correspondence with T. Green regarding same (0.4); correspondence with T. Green regarding same (0.4); review and revise SMBC sealing motion (0.4); correspondence with Davis Polk Fleet team regarding same (0.4).
Steinberg, Richard J.	07/24/21	1.5	Call with T. Green regarding Ex-Im (0.3); revise declaration in support of Fuyo motion (0.9); email with Skyworks and White & Case regarding same (0.1); email with Holland & Knight regarding same (0.2)
Szanzer, Steven Z.	07/25/21	2.7	Correspondence with T. Green regarding Orix documents (0.2); correspondence with T. Green, White & Case, and Skyworks regarding Aviator documents (0.3); review proposed redactions (0.1); correspondence with R. Steinberg, White & Case, and Skyworks regarding Fuyo documents (0.3); review and consider comments to same (0.6); review revised drafts of same (0.8); correspondence with T. Green regarding CAE (0.4).
Green, Thomas S.	07/26/21	1.5	Call with Linklaters regarding MUFG (0.2); review SMBC motion (0.2); correspondence with A. Romero-Wagner regarding Orix (0.1); revise CAE motion (1.0).

		Time I	Detail By Project
Name	Date	Hours	Narrative
Steinberg, Richard J.	07/26/21	0.9	Email with Holland & Knight regarding Fuyo motion (0.1); email with S. Szanzer regarding fleet motions (0.4); email to White & Case and Skyworks regarding SMBC (0.4).
Szanzer, Steven Z.	07/26/21	4.9	Review and consider proposed redactions for Orix documents (0.3); correspondence with White & Case regarding same (0.3); correspondence with Holland & Knight regarding timing for Fuyo filings (0.1); correspondence with T. Green and M. Melcer regarding Clover (0.3); correspondence with T. Green regarding NAC (0.1); review and revise Fuyo documents (0.4); correspondence with R. Steinberg regarding same (0.4); correspondence with Davis Polk Fleet team, White & Case, and Skyworks regarding SMBC motion (0.4); review simulator analysis (0.4); review and revise CAE motion (1.0); correspondence with T. Green regarding same (0.9); correspondence with A. Andreeva and T. Green regarding DVG/MUFG (0.3).
Green, Thomas S.	07/27/21	1.5	Revise Ex-Im letter of intent (0.3); call with Linklaters regarding MUFG (0.2); correspondence with Davis Polk Fleet team regarding Fuyo (0.3); call with White & Case regarding Aviator motion issues (0.1); revise Aviator motion (0.4); review and revise SMBC sealing motion (0.1); correspondence with S. Szanzer regarding NAC (0.1).
Steinberg, Richard J.	07/27/21	1.3	Revise Fuyo motion (0.5); email with Skyworks regarding SMBC motion (0.2); email with S. Szanzer regarding same (0.1); revise CAE sealing motion (0.5).
Szanzer, Steven Z.	07/27/21	7.5	Review and consider comments to CAE motion (0.4); correspondence with White & Case and T. Green regarding same (0.4); review and consider comments to Fuyo documents (0.5); correspondence with T. Green, White & Case, and Skyworks regarding same (0.5); correspondence with Aviator's counsel regarding documents (0.2); review and revise same (0.5); correspondence with T. Green regarding (0.3); correspondence with White & Case regarding same (0.5); review and revise correspondence regarding DVB/MUFG (0.4); correspondence with T. Green and Linklaters regarding same (0.3); correspondence with White & Case regarding Aviator redactions (0.2); correspondence with White & Case regarding SMBC and Aviator documents (0.3); correspondence with T. Green regarding same (0.3); review and revise SMBC and Aviator sealing motions (0.6); correspondence with Davis Polk Fleet team regarding same (0.9); review emails regarding Ex-Im (0.3); review and consider comments to SMBC motion (0.5); correspondence with T. Green and R. Steinberg regarding CAE sealing motion (0.3); correspondence with T. Green regarding NAC (0.1).
Green, Thomas S.	07/28/21	2.7	Call with O'Melveny & Myers regarding claims (0.4); call with A. Andreeva and Davis Polk Fleet team regarding retaining ordinary course professional for fleet workstream (0.2); review and revise Fuyo motion (0.8); call with S. Szanzer regarding same (0.4); call with Linklaters regarding MUFG (0.3); review Aviator for filing (0.4); call with White & Case regarding BNDES (0.2).
Romero-Wagner, Alex B.	07/28/21	0.8	Revise motion to approve aircraft transaction.
Steinberg, Richard J. Szanzer, Steven Z.	07/28/21 07/28/21	1.1 7.8	Review and revise SMBC assumption motion. Correspondence with White & Case regarding Aviator 11

		Time I	Detail By Project
Name	Date	Hours	Narrative
			redactions (0.2); correspondence with White & Case and Skyworks regarding CAE documents (0.4); review and consider comments to same (0.8); correspondence with Davis Polk Fleet team regarding same (0.3); correspondence with T. Green regarding DVG/MUFG and correspondence with White & Case same (0.3); call with T. Green regarding Fuyo motion (0.4); review and consider comments to same (0.6); correspondence with Skyworks regarding Orix (0.2); correspondence with A. Andreeva and correspondence with T. Green regarding BNDES (0.3); review, revise, and finalize Aviator documents (1.8); review NAC omnibus claims agreement (1.0); correspondence with T. Green regarding same (0.4); review emails regarding Flight Safety (0.1); correspondence with T. Green regarding fleet workstreams (1.0).
Green, Thomas S.	07/29/21	0.6	Review and revise Fuyo motion (0.3); call with White & Case regarding same (0.3).
Steinberg, Richard J.	07/29/21	0.6	Review and revise Fuyo motion (0.4); email with S. Szanzer regarding same (0.2).
Szanzer, Steven Z.	07/29/21	4.2	Correspondence with J. Sturm, T. Green, and AlixPartners regarding Flight Safety (0.2); review, revise, and finalize Fuyo documents (0.8); coordinate filing and service of same (0.7); call with White & Case regarding fleet workstreams (0.6); correspondence with same and Skyworks regarding DVB/MUFG (0.3); review and revise CAE sealing motion (1.3); correspondence with T. Green and R. Steinberg regarding same and other CAE documents (0.3).
Green, Thomas S.	07/30/21	3.2	Analyze presentation on Lufthansa (0.9); correspondence with S. Szanzer regarding NAC and other matters (0.3); analyze Ex-Im transaction (0.7); correspondence with M. Melcer regarding fleet (0.8); call with Davis Polk Fleet team regarding fleet motions (0.5).
Melcer, Moshe	07/30/21	1.4	Call with Davis Polk Fleet team regarding fleet motions (0.5); correspondence with S. Szanzer regarding motion to approve equipment transaction (0.4); call with Davis Polk, White & Case, Skyworks, and AlixPartners teams regarding motion to approve aircraft transactions (0.5).
Piraino, Stephen D. Steinberg, Richard J. Szanzer, Steven Z.	07/30/21 07/30/21 07/30/21	0.5 0.5 2.2	Call with Davis Polk Fleet team regarding fleet motions. Call with Davis Polk Fleet team regarding fleet motions. Call with Willkie Farr regarding aircraft transactions (0.3); correspondence with T. Green regarding same (0.3); correspondence with White & Case, Skyworks, AlixPartners, and Davis Polk Fleet team regarding same (1.2); correspondence with T. Green and correspondence with White & Case regarding NAC agreement (0.3); correspondence with I. Renzi regarding maintenance agreement (0.1).
Total AM100 Aircraft/Engines 273.		273.1	
AM110 Automatic Sta Jerrard, Erik	y/Litigation 07/01/21	0.9	Correspondence with T. Graulich regarding upcoming litigation (0.3); correspondence with same and D. Abbot regarding same (0.6).
McClammy, James I.	07/01/21	1.7	Correspondence with C. Rincon regarding litigation updates (0.5); review and comment on Newrest settlement agreement

		Time	Detail By Project
Name	Date	Hours	Narrative
			(0.4); review correspondence regarding same (0.2);
			correspondence with Davis Polk Litigation team regarding
Dinaina Ctamban D	07/04/04	2.0	litigation issue (0.6).
Piraino, Stephen D.	07/01/21	3.2	Correspondence with T. Graulich, D. Abbot and E. Jerrard
			regarding litigation issues (1.0); review memorandum on
Houston, Kamali	07/02/21	0.6	potential litigation issue (2.2). Call with C. Rincon and A. Marienko regarding litigation
Houston, Naman	01/02/21	0.0	workstreams.
Marienko, Anna	07/02/21	2.0	Call with C. Rincon and K. Houston regarding litigation
,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,			workstreams (0.5); review pleadings related to same (1.5).
Masaro, Matthew	07/02/21	0.8	Review and revise proposed stipulation to stay Newrest
Bruno			proceeding (0.6); correspondence with S. Piraino and others
			regarding same (0.2).
Piraino, Stephen D.	07/02/21	0.4	Correspondence with M. Masaro regarding stipulation to stay
			Newrest proceeding (0.2); review same (0.2).
Rincon, Cristina M.	07/02/21	2.0	Review and revise Newrest settlement agreement (0.7);
			correspondence with J. McClammy regarding Newrest
			settlement agreement (0.5); call with A. Marienko and K.
	07/05/04	0.0	Houston regarding litigation workstreams (0.8).
McClammy, James I.	07/05/21	0.9	Review Newrest settlement agreement (0.4); correspondence
Crauliah Timathu	07/06/04	0.5	with Davis Polk Litigation team regarding same (0.5).
Graulich, Timothy	07/06/21	0.5	Correspondence with J. McClammy and D. Abbott regarding
Houston, Kamali	07/06/21	2.0	Rule 2004 discovery process. Draft litigation hold notice.
McClammy, James I.	07/06/21	1.5	Correspondence with Davis Polk Litigation team regarding
McClailling, Jailles I.	07700721	1.5	discovery (1.0); call with Morris Nichols regarding discovery
			and litigation issues (0.5).
Piraino, Stephen D.	07/06/21	0.7	Correspondence with D. DeBassio regarding creditor diligence
r mamo, otopnon b.	01100121	0.7	(0.2); call with Morris Nichols regarding discovery and litigation
			issues (0.5).
Rincon, Cristina M.	07/06/21	0.8	Call with Davis Polk Restructuring team and Morris Nichols
,			regarding Rule 2004 discovery (0.7); review revised Rule 2004
			discovery document hold notice (0.1).
Graulich, Timothy	07/07/21	0.7	Review Creditors Committee requests for documents.
Houston, Kamali	07/07/21	1.4	Draft Rule 2004 discovery document hold notice.
Masaro, Matthew	07/07/21	0.1	Correspondence with plaintiff's counsel and others regarding
Bruno			proposed stipulation to stay Newrest proceeding.
McClammy, James I.	07/07/21	1.5	Correspondence with Davis Polk Litigation team regarding
D: : 01 D	07/07/04	0.0	Creditors Committee discovery request.
Piraino, Stephen D.	07/07/21	0.9	Correspondence with A. Sainz, E. Jerrard and R. Steinberg
			regarding Rule 2004 discovery requests (0.6);
			correspondence with E. Jerrard and R. Steinberg regarding
Rincon, Cristina M.	07/07/21	0.9	same (0.3). Revise Rule 2004 discovery document hold notice.
Houston, Kamali	07/07/21	0.9	Revise Rule 2004 discovery document hold notice (0.1); call
riouston, Raman	07700721	0.5	with Morris Nichols and Davis Polk team regarding production
			planning (0.4).
McClammy, James I.	07/08/21	1.8	Call with Morris Nichols and Davis Polk team regarding
, ,		-	discovery issues (0.8); correspondence with Davis Polk
			Litigation team regarding discovery issues (1.0).
Piraino, Stephen D.	07/08/21	1.1	Email with J. McClammy regarding document custodians
			(0.3); correspondence with J. McClammy and T. Graulich
			regarding Rule 2004 discovery (0.8).
Rincon, Cristina M.	07/08/21	0.9	Call with Aeroméxico Legal team and Morris Nichols regarding
			Rule 2004 discovery document hold notice (0.7); analyze Rule
			2004 discovery document preservation issues (0.1); review

		Time	Detail By Project
Name	Date	Hours	Narrative
Houston, Kamali Jerrard, Erik	07/09/21 07/09/21	0.4 0.9	revised Rule 2004 discovery document hold notice (0.1). Review custodian list of document review. Review document search requests (0.7); email with S. Piraino,
McClammy, James I.	07/09/21	1.1	J. McClammy, and C. Rincon regarding same (0.2). Correspondence with Davis Polk Litigation team regarding document discovery inquiries (0.5); analyze Newrest
Rincon, Cristina M.	07/09/21	2.7	settlement issues (0.6). Analyze Rule 2004 discovery issues (0.2); call with Morris Nichols and Aeroméxico Legal team regarding document collection (0.8); format search terms (0.3); analyze document collection issue (1.2); review Newrest settlement agreement (0.2).
McClammy, James I.	07/11/21	1.4	Call with Morris Nichols and others regarding search terms and custodians.
Rincon, Cristina M.	07/12/21	0.2	Email with Aeroméxico regarding Newrest claims.
McClammy, James I.	07/13/21	1.5	Call with Morris Nichols and Aeroméxico regarding discovery issues (1.2); correspondence with same regarding retention notice (0.3).
Rincon, Cristina M.	07/13/21	0.1	Review email regarding Rule 2004 discovery.
McClammy, James I.	07/14/21	0.4	Correspondence with Davis Polk Litigation team regarding Newrest settlement issues.
Rincon, Cristina M.	07/14/21	1.0	Revise Newrest settlement agreement (0.8); review proposed stipulation to stay Newrest proceeding (0.2).
Houston, Kamali	07/15/21	0.5	Correspondence with Davis Polk Litigation team regarding discovery issues.
Jerrard, Erik	07/15/21	0.4	Correspondence with C. Rincon and S. Piraino regarding document custodians.
Piraino, Stephen D.	07/15/21	0.2	Correspondence with C. Rincon regarding document retention.
Rincon, Cristina M.	07/15/21	4.3	Correspondence with L. Jacobs and D. Darcy regarding data collection (0.4); analyze Rule 2004 discovery document hold and discovery issues (0.8); correspondence with Davis Polk eDiscovery team regarding same (1.3); correspondence with Davis Polk Restructuring and Finance teams regarding document custodians (0.8); correspondence with Morris Nichols regarding search terms (1.0).
Jerrard, Erik	07/16/21	0.3	
Rincon, Cristina M.	07/16/21	3.0	Format Rule 2004 discovery search terms (0.3); correspondence with Morris Nichols regarding same (0.3); correspondence with Davis Polk eDiscovery team regarding document collection (1.0); correspondence with Davis Polk eDiscovery team regarding document collection (0.5); call with L. Lewis regarding formatting discovery search terms (0.4); correspondence with Davis Polk Restructuring and Finance teams regarding custodians (0.5).
Rincon, Cristina M.	07/19/21	0.2	Email with Davis Polk Litigation team regarding Rule 2004 discovery requests.
Echegaray, Pablo	07/20/21	3.9	Review Rule 2004 discovery search term hits (3.7); call with C. Rincon, K. Houston, and others regarding Rule 2004 discovery search term hits (0.2).
Houston, Kamali	07/20/21	0.3	Correspondence with Davis Polk team regarding document review.
Joshi, Neeraj	07/20/21	1.3	Call with C. Rincon, K. Houston, and others regarding Rule 2004 discovery search term hits (0.2); correspondence with C. Rincon and Davis Polk Discovery team regarding Rule 2004

Name	Date	Hours	Narrative
Tanno -	J uli	liouis	discovery search term issues (0.3); review Rule 2004
			discovery search term hits (0.8).
Rincon, Cristina M.	07/20/21	3.0	Correspondence with D. Darcy regarding reviewers (0.5);
			review and coordinate discovery workstream issues (2.5).
Sanfilippo, Anthony	07/20/21	3.1	Call with C. Rincon, K. Houston, and others regarding Rule
Joseph	01720721	• • • • • • • • • • • • • • • • • • • •	2004 discovery search term hit (0.2); review Rule 2004
•			discovery search term hits (2.9).
Echegaray, Pablo	07/21/21	12.5	Review Rule 2004 discovery search term hits.
Joshi, Neeraj	07/21/21	9.8	Correspondence with C. Rincon regarding Rule 2004
,	****		discovery search term hits (0.3); review Rule 2004 discovery
			search term hits (9.5).
	07/04/04	0.0	D : D 0004
Marienko, Anna	07/21/21	2.2	Review Rule 2004 discovery search term hits.
Rincon, Cristina M.	07/21/21	1.6	Review Rule 2004 discovery search term hits.
Sanfilippo, Anthony Joseph	07/21/21	14.1	Review Rule 2004 discovery search term hits.
Echegaray, Pablo	07/22/21	6.2	Review Rule 2004 discovery search term hits.
Houston, Kamali	07/22/21	0.3	Correspondence with C. Rincon regarding document review.
Joshi, Neeraj	07/22/21	5.3	Correspondence with C. Rincon and Davis Polk Discovery
•			Review team regarding Rule 2004 discovery terms (0.2);
			review Rule 2004 discovery search term hits (5.1).
Rincon, Cristina M.	07/22/21	2.2	Perform quality control related to Rule 2004 discovery.
Sanfilippo, Anthony	07/22/21	6.5	Review Rule 2004 discovery search term hits.
Joseph	OTTELTE T	0.0	The view Thate 200 Fallocovery deal of Fernice.
Rincon, Cristina M.	07/23/21	2.6	Revise Newrest settlement agreement (0.3); draft Rule 9019
			motion regarding Newrest settlement (1.1); finalize production
			of Rule 2004 documents (1.2).
Graulich, Timothy	07/25/21	0.7	Correspondence with J. McClammy regarding litigation issue
McClammy, James I.	07/25/21	0.8	Correspondence with T. Graulich and others regarding
			potential temporary restraining order issue.
Rincon, Cristina M.	07/26/21	1.0	Draft Rule 9019 motion regarding Newrest settlement.
Graulich, Timothy	07/28/21	0.4	Call with T. Goren regarding temporary restraining order.
McClammy, James I.	07/29/21	1.0	Call with M. Bilbao regarding Newrest MSA (0.4);
			correspondence with Davis Polk Litigation team regarding
			Newrest settlement issues (0.3); correspondence with C.
			Rincon regarding same (0.3).
Rincon, Cristina M.	07/29/21	0.3	Correspondence with J. McClammy regarding status of
			Newrest settlement.
McClammy, James I.	07/30/21	0.6	Email with Davis Polk Litigation team regarding Newrest settlement.
Rincon, Cristina M.	07/30/21	0.2	Email Aeroméxico regarding details of administrator actions i
Total AM440 Autama	tio.	406.0	Spain.
Total AM110 Automa Stay/Litigation	แบ	126.3	

	Time Detail By Project			
Name	Date	Hours	Narrative	
Erickson, Jarret	07/01/21	2.9	Review and revise exhibits to omnibus claims objections (1.3); correspondence with claimants regarding claims objections (0.8); correspondence with M. Melcer regarding same and other claims workstreams (0.8).	
Melcer, Moshe	07/01/21	2.8	Review trades claim filings (0.1); correspondence with Aeroméxico regarding customer claim objections (0.3); correspondence with J. Erickson and AlixPartners regarding upcoming claim objections (0.6); revise customer claim emails (1.3); email with Epiq regarding customer claim objections (0.5).	
Erickson, Jarret	07/02/21	4.8	Review and revise omnibus claims objections (2.7); correspondence with claimants regarding claims objections (1.1); correspondence with M. Melcer regarding same and other claims workstreams (1.0).	
Melcer, Moshe	07/02/21	3.4	Correspondence with J. Erickson regarding omnibus claim objection (0.2); correspondence with same and AlixPartners regarding upcoming omnibus claim objections (0.5); review and revise omnibus claims objection (2.7).	
Melcer, Moshe Erickson, Jarret	07/04/21 07/05/21	0.9 2.6	Draft Certificate of No Objection to omnibus claims objection. Review and revise omnibus claims objections (1.8); review and revise Certificate of No Objection to same (0.4); correspondence with M. Melcer regarding same (0.4).	
Melcer, Moshe	07/05/21	1.5	Review and revise omnibus claims objections (0.3); draft response to claimant regarding same (0.1); revise Certificate of No Objection to same (0.5); correspondence with R. Steinberg regarding claims workstreams (0.6).	
Erickson, Jarret	07/06/21	5.2	Review and revise omnibus claims objections and related exhibits (3.2); correspondence with claimants regarding claims objections (0.3); correspondence with AlixPartners and M. Melcer regarding same and other claims workstreams (1.7).	
Jerrard, Erik	07/06/21	1.6	Email with J. Erickson and M. Melcer regarding claims issues (0.8); review potential claims objections (0.8).	
Melcer, Moshe	07/06/21	5.1	Review and revise omnibus claims objection (3.0); call with AlixPartners and Davis Polk Claims teams regarding upcoming claim objections (0.3); call with claimant and others regarding response to claim objection (0.2) (partial attendance); correspondence with J. Erickson regarding upcoming omnibus claim objections (0.3); email with Aeroméxico regarding same (0.5); call with R. Steinberg regarding same (0.3); email with Sainz Abogados, Epiq, and AlixPartners Claims teams regarding same (0.3); update claimant inbound tracker (0.2).	
Steinberg, Richard J.	07/06/21	4.5	Call with M. Melcer regarding omnibus claims objections (0.3); correspondence with same regarding same (0.7); review and revise omnibus claim objections (0.8); correspondence with J. Erickson and M. Melcer regarding same (1.0); correspondence with AlixPartners and Epiq regarding same (0.7); call with Mijares Angoitia regarding response filed to same (0.4); correspondence with J. Erickson regarding same (0.1); call with AlixPartners and Davis Polk Claims teams regarding upcoming omnibus claims objections (0.3); email with Aeroméxico regarding same (0.2).	
Erickson, Jarret	07/07/21	5.7	Review and revise omnibus claims objections and related exhibits (2.4); correspondence with claimants regarding claims objections (0.7); correspondence with AlixPartners and M. Melcer regarding same and other claims workstreams (2.6).	

		Time	Detail By Project
Name	Date	Hours	Narrative
Jerrard, Erik	07/07/21	1.6	Correspondence with R. Steinberg regarding claims (0.1); review draft claims objections (1.1); email with J. Erickson regarding same (0.4).
Melcer, Moshe	07/07/21	6.3	Review and revise omnibus claims objection (4.3); revise schedules for upcoming omnibus claim objections (0.5); email with E. Jerrard regarding same (0.3); email with Sainz Abogados, AlixPartners, and Epiq regarding same (0.5); call with claimant regarding omnibus claims objection (0.2); draft Certificate of No Objection to same (0.5).
Steinberg, Richard J.	07/07/21	3.0	Correspondence with J. Erickson regarding omnibus claims objections (0.1); email with same and E. Jerrard regarding same (0.5); correspondence with M. Melcer regarding same (0.2); call with claimants regarding informal responses to same (0.1); review and revise omnibus claims objections (2.1).
Erickson, Jarret	07/08/21	3.1	Review, revise and finalize omnibus claims objections and related exhibits (2.4); correspondence with AlixPartners and M. Melcer regarding same and other claims workstreams (0.7).
Graulich, Timothy Jerrard, Erik	07/08/21 07/08/21	0.6 0.7	Call with M. Landess regarding aircraft claims. Call with J. Eisen regarding claims withdrawal (0.2); correspondence with R. Steinberg regarding claims withdrawal issue (0.5).
Melcer, Moshe	07/08/21	8.4	Correspondence with T. Graulich, T. Green, and Skyworks regarding fleet claims (0.6); review and revise Certificate of No Objection to omnibus claims objection (0.9); correspondence with R. Steinberg regarding same (0.1); email with Chambers regarding same (0.4); review and revise omnibus claims objections and schedules regarding same (5.3); call with AlixPartners regarding same (0.1); correspondence with J. Erickson regarding omnibus claim objection workstreams (0.4); correspondence with O. Altman regarding omnibus claim objections (0.1); correspondence with J. Erickson and R. Steinberg regarding fleet claims (0.4); review customer emails (0.1).
Steinberg, Richard J.	07/08/21	5.1	Review and revise omnibus claims objections (1.1); correspondence with J. Erickson and M. Melcer regarding same (1.0); correspondence with E. Jerrard regarding same (0.1); coordinate claims objections filing (2.4); email with claimants regarding claims transfers (0.3); call with AlixPartners regarding same (0.2).
Sturm, Josh	07/08/21	1.6	Correspondence with Davis Polk team regarding pending fleet claims (0.9); call with Davis Polk and White & Case teams regarding same (0.7).
Melcer, Moshe	07/09/21	0.9	Email with Chambers regarding omnibus claims objections (0.8); correspondence with M. Masaro regarding draft contract and claims regarding same (0.1).
Steinberg, Richard J.	07/09/21	0.6	Call with claimants regarding claims transfers (0.5); correspondence with M. Masaro regarding claim withdrawals (0.1).
Szanzer, Steven Z.	07/09/21	0.6	Correspondence with Davis Polk Fleet team regarding fleet claims.
Melcer, Moshe Melcer, Moshe Erickson, Jarret	07/10/21 07/11/21 07/12/21	0.1 0.5 1.0	Email with Epiq regarding claim objections. Draft response to claimant regarding claim objection. Correspondence with Epiq regarding delivery of omnibus claims objections to customer claimants. 17

		Time	Detail By Project
Name	Date	Hours	Narrative
Jerrard, Erik	07/12/21	0.2	Correspondence with R. Steinberg regarding claims issues and objections.
Melcer, Moshe	07/12/21	0.4	Review and track correspondence from claimants (0.1); call with R. Steinberg regarding omnibus claims objections (0.3).
Steinberg, Richard J.	07/12/21	3.4	Emails with claimants regarding informal responses to omnibus claims objections (2.0); call with claimant regarding omnibus claims objections (0.5); call with Epiq regarding same (0.1); correspondence with J. Erickson and E. Jerrard regarding same (0.2); call with M. Melcer regarding same (0.3); email with S. Szanzer regarding Exim claims (0.3).
Szanzer, Steven Z.	07/12/21	0.6	Correspondence with M. Melcer regarding claims issues (0.4); correspondence with R. Steinberg regarding same (0.2).
Jerrard, Erik	07/13/21	0.7	Email with Davis Polk Restructuring team regarding claims issues.
Melcer, Moshe	07/13/21	2.7	Review correspondence from claimant regarding claim objection (0.5); draft response to same (1.0); call with claimant regarding same (0.1); revise claimant inbound tracker (0.7); analyze claims regarding aircraft parts (0.4).
Steinberg, Richard J.	07/13/21	5.3	Respond to informal responses to omnibus claims objections (4.2); email with AlixPartners and Epiq regarding same (0.1); email with White & Case regarding Exim claims (0.2); review Barclay's transfer of claim (0.4); draft statement regarding same (0.4).
Szanzer, Steven Z.	07/13/21	0.4	Review emails with Davis Polk team regarding claims reconciliations.
Melcer, Moshe	07/14/21	3.2	Respond to informal responses to omnibus claims objections (1.6); revise claimant inbound tracker (0.8); call with R. Steinberg and AlixPartners regarding upcoming omnibus claims objections (0.4); correspondence with R. Steinberg regarding same (0.4).
Steinberg, Richard J.	07/14/21	7.9	Respond to omnibus claims objections (6.6); call with AlixPartners and M. Melcer regarding upcoming omnibus claims objections (0.4); call with Epiq regarding claims relating to Rule 9019 orders and responses to omnibus claims objections (0.4); correspondence with White & Case and Vedder Price regarding Exim claims (0.5).
Szanzer, Steven Z.	07/14/21	0.7	Review Bar Date Order (0.4); correspondence with Davis Polk team regarding Ex-Im claims (0.3).
Jerrard, Erik	07/15/21	1.1	Review and revise potential claims statement filing (0.9); email with R. Steinberg regarding same (0.2).
Melcer, Moshe	07/15/21	0.1	Review correspondence from claimant regarding claim objection.
Steinberg, Richard J.	07/15/21	2.8	Respond to informal responses to omnibus claims objections (1.8); email with AlixPartners regarding Santander claims (0.5); email with S. Piraino regarding same (0.1); email with Epiq regarding Ex-Im claims (0.4).
Melcer, Moshe Steinberg, Richard J.	07/16/21 07/16/21	0.4 4.8	Review precedent satisfaction procedures. Correspondence with Aeroméxico regarding customer claims objections (0.4); email with Epiq regarding Ex-Im claims (0.3); email with E. Jerrard regarding claims reconciliation process next steps (1.3); email with S. Piraino regarding Santander claims (0.1); email with Santander regarding same (0.2); respond to informal responses to omnibus claims objections (1.9); correspondence with M. Melcer regarding same (0.6).
Steinberg, Richard J. Green, Thomas S.	07/18/21 07/19/21	0.7 0.1	Respond to informal responses to omnibus claims objections. Correspondence with R. Steinberg regarding fleet claims. 18

		Time	Detail By Project
Name	Date	Hours	Narrative
Melcer, Moshe	07/19/21	2.5	Analyze fleet claims (0.4); correspondence with R. Steinberg regarding same (0.2); update claimant inbound tracker (0.6); correspondence with claimant regarding omnibus claim objection (0.4); correspondence with R. Steinberg regarding outstanding claims workstreams (0.5); correspondence with A. Romero-Wagner regarding same (0.3); email with Cleary Gottlieb regarding withdrawn claim (0.1).
Steinberg, Richard J.	07/19/21	4.9	Email with AlixPartners regarding upcoming omnibus claims objections (0.3); respond to informal responses to omnibus claims objections (1.8); research regarding claims objections and satisfied claims procedures (1.5); email with Davis Polk Fleet team regarding fleet claims settlements (0.4); email with AlixPartners regarding same (0.9).
Melcer, Moshe	07/20/21	1.3	Call with R. Steinberg and A. Romero-Wagner regarding claims workstreams (0.5); update claimant inbound tracker (0.5); correspondence with claimant regarding claim objection (0.3).
Romero-Wagner, Alex B.	07/20/21	0.5	Call with R. Steinberg and M. Melcer regarding claims objections issues.
Steinberg, Richard J.	07/20/21	3.6	Call with M. Melcer and A. Romero-Wagner regarding omnibus claims objections (0.5); email with AlixPartners regarding settled claims (0.1); respond to informal responses to omnibus claims objections (1.1); email with AlixPartners and Epiq regarding customer claims tracker (1.5); email with M. Melcer regarding fleet claims settlements (0.4).
Green, Thomas S. Steinberg, Richard J.	07/21/21 07/21/21	0.5 4.7	Correspondence with R. Steinberg regarding claims. Draft fleet claims settlement spreadsheet (1.0); update claimant inbound tracker (1.5); call with AlixPartners and Epiq regarding informal responses to claims objections (0.9); call with Epiq regarding claim withdrawals (0.2); respond to informal responses to omnibus claims objections (1.1).
Szanzer, Steven Z.	07/21/21	0.5	Correspondence with T. Green and R. Steinberg regarding fleet claim settlement issues.
Jerrard, Erik Steinberg, Richard J.	07/22/21 07/22/21	0.4 1.5	Call with R. Steinberg regarding omnibus claims objections. Call with E. Jerrard regarding omnibus claims objections (0.4); research regarding agency claims (0.4); email with AlixPartners regarding same (0.2); revise fleet claims settlement spreadsheet (0.5).
Szanzer, Steven Z.	07/22/21	0.3	Correspondence with Skyworks regarding SMBC claims settlement.
Steinberg, Richard J.	07/23/21	1.4	Email with AlixPartners and Epiq regarding informal responses to claims objections (0.2); respond to informal responses to omnibus claims objections (1.0); email with White & Case regarding Ex-Im claims (0.2).
Szanzer, Steven Z.	07/23/21	0.2	Review emails regarding Ex-Im claims.
Szanzer, Steven Z. Jerrard, Erik	07/25/21 07/26/21	0.2 0.7	Correspondence with White & Case regarding Ex-Im claims. Call with R. Steinberg, T. Thoroddsen and Aeroméxico to discuss upcoming claims objections.
Steinberg, Richard J.	07/26/21	2.3	Call with AlixPartners, Skyworks, and White & Case regarding Ex-Im claims (0.7); call with E. Jerrard, T. Thoroddsen and Aeroméxico to discuss upcoming claims objections (0.7); response to informal responses to claims objections (0.9).
Szanzer, Steven Z.	07/26/21	0.3	Correspondence with Skyworks, White & Case, and Davis Polk Fleet team regarding BBAM claim.
Steinberg, Richard J.	07/27/21	3.1	Correspondence with AlixPartners regarding claims objections (0.5); draft customer emails regarding same (1.2); respond to

		Time	Detail By Project
Name	Date	Hours	Narrative
Steinberg, Richard J.	07/28/21	3.4	informal responses to claims objections (0.9); email with White & Case and O'Melveny & Myers regarding Ex-Im claims (0.5). Respond to omnibus claims objections (0.9); email with Epiq and Sainz Abogados regarding same (0.3); draft customer claim correspondence (1.0); email with AlixPartners regarding same and incoming claims objections (0.4); correspondence with T. Green regarding Ex-Im claims (0.2); call with O'Melveny & Myers regarding same (0.3); email with same
Steinberg, Richard J.	07/29/21	3.2	and AlixPartners regarding same (0.3). Draft customer claim correspondence (0.8); email with AlixPartners regarding same (0.4); email with Aeroméxico regarding same (0.2); respond to informal responses to claims objections and other inbound claims (1.8).
Melcer, Moshe	07/30/21	1.6	Correspondence with T. Green regarding claims settlement motion (0.2); review and revise same (0.4); call with R. Steinberg regarding open claims workstreams (0.3); correspondence with E. Jerrard and R. Steinberg regarding upcoming objections (0.3); correspondence with R. Steinberg, Sainz Abogados, and claimant regarding claim objection (0.2); revise claimant correspondence tracker (0.2).
Steinberg, Richard J.	07/30/21	2.0	Correspondence with E. Jerrard regarding claims objections (0.4); call with M. Melcer regarding open claims workstreams (0.3); respond to informal responses to claims objections (1.3).
Melcer, Moshe	07/31/21	0.7	Review email from R. Steinberg regarding upcoming claim objection (0.1); review and revise claims settlement motion (0.6).
Total AM130 Bar Date/Estimation/Clair Allowance Issues	ns	150.4	
AM140 Corporate Go	vernance. Board	d Matters and	d Communications
Piraino, Stephen D.	07/01/21	0.3	
Graulich, Timothy	07/02/21	0.5	Call with A. Sainz and S. Piraino regarding Board issues.
Piraino, Stephen D.	07/02/21	1.2	Call with T. Graulich and A. Sainz regarding Board issues (0.5); review and revise Board letter (0.7).
McClammy, James I.	07/03/21	0.2	Review and comment on Board letter.
Huebner, Marshall S.	07/05/21	0.1	Review Board letter.
Piraino, Stephen D.	07/05/21	0.7	Review and revise Board letter.
Graulich, Timothy	07/06/21	0.4	Call with A. Sainz regarding Board issues.
Piraino, Stephen D.	07/08/21	0.4	Review and revise Board minutes.
Steinberg, Richard J.	07/14/21	0.3	Email with S. Piraino and M. Masaro regarding Board issues.
Masaro, Matthew Bruno	07/22/21	4.0	Research Plan issues for incorporation into Board materials (3.0); correspondence with R. Steinberg, S. Piraino, and others regarding same (1.0).
Steinberg, Richard J.	07/22/21	2.9	Correspondence with S. Piraino regarding Board materials regarding Disclosure Statement (0.4); research issues regarding same (2.5)
Jerrard, Erik	07/23/21	8.0	Review and revise Board letter regarding exit financing.
Piraino, Stephen D.	07/23/21	0.4	Review and revise Board letter.
Steinberg, Richard J.	07/23/21	2.7	Draft Board materials regarding Disclosure Statement.
Graulich, Timothy	07/25/21	1.8	Review and revise Board materials regarding Disclosure Statement.
Jerrard, Erik Graulich, Timothy	07/25/21 07/26/21	5.2 2.2	Extensive drafting of Board materials regarding exit financing. Call with Board Restructuring Committee regarding exit financing proposal.

Time Detail By Project					
Name	Date	Hours	Narrative		
Huebner, Marshall S.	07/26/21	2.1	Attend Special Committee meeting.		
Jerrard, Erik	07/26/21	1.2	Review and revise Board materials on exit financing process.		
Piraino, Stephen D.	07/26/21	0.7	Call with T. Graulich and E. Jerrard regarding Board		
•			Restructuring Committee meeting.		
Graulich, Timothy	07/27/21	3.1	Prepare for Board meeting.		
Graulich, Timothy	07/28/21	8.6	Attend Board Restructuring Committee call (3.8); prepare for same (2.2); correspondence with Davis Polk team regarding same (2.6).		
Huebner, Marshall S.	07/28/21	3.4	Attend Board meeting (1.5); correspondence with T. Graulich and others regarding preparation for same (1.9).		
Jerrard, Erik	07/28/21	1.5	Attend Board meeting regarding final valuation.		
Piraino, Stephen D.	07/28/21	1.9	Review and revise Board materials (0.4); attend Board meeting (1.5).		
Huebner, Marshall S.	07/29/21	0.4	Correspondence with T. Graulich regarding Board updates.		
Total AM140 Corpora	ito	47.0			
Governance, Board M Communications		47.0			
AM150 Creditor/UCC	AHC Issues				
Rincon, Cristina M.	07/01/21	0.5	Call with Willkie Farr and Davis Polk Restructuring teams regarding creditor issues.		
Graulich, Timothy	07/06/21	0.8	Call with S. Star and B. Miller regarding call with Creditors Committee advisor and Debtor co-advisors.		
Jerrard, Erik	07/06/21	0.7	Attend weekly call with Creditors Committee advisor and Debtor co-advisors (AlixPartners, Skyworks, others).		
Masaro, Matthew Bruno	07/06/21	8.0	Attend weekly call with Creditors Committee advisor and Debtor co-advisors (AlixPartners, Skyworks, others).		
Piraino, Stephen D.	07/06/21	1.8	Attend weekly call with Creditors Committee advisor and Debtor co-advisors (AlixPartners, Skyworks, others) (0.8); review Creditors Committee exit financing letter (0.6); email with co-advisors regarding exit financing fee reimbursement (0.4).		
Graulich, Timothy	07/08/21	0.9	Call with R. Sanchez Baker regarding PLM issues.		
Jerrard, Erik	07/13/21	0.7	Attend weekly call with Creditors Committee advisors and Debtor co-advisors (AlixPartners, Skyworks, others).		
Masaro, Matthew	07/13/21	0.3	Attend weekly call with Creditors Committee advisors and		
Bruno			Debtor co-advisors (AlixPartners, Skyworks, others) (partial attendance).		
Piraino, Stephen D.	07/13/21	0.9	Attend weekly call with Creditors Committee advisor and Debtor co-advisors (AlixPartners, Skyworks, others) (0.7); email with T. Graulich and A. Troconis regarding PLM (0.2).		
Steinberg, Richard J.	07/14/21	0.2	Review correspondence from Creditors Committee regarding PLM.		
Jackson, Vanessa L.	07/15/21	0.8	Review existing PLM structure to analyze for potential DIP issues.		
Graulich, Timothy	07/16/21	0.8	Call with R. Sanchez Baker regarding PLM valuation.		
Jerrard, Erik	07/20/21	1.2	Call with counsel to the Creditors Committee regarding Plan and valuation allocation (0.3); correspondence with S. Piraino regarding same (0.4); attend weekly call with Creditors Committee advisor and Debtor co-advisors (AlixPartners, Skyworks, others) (0.5).		
Piraino, Stephen D.	07/20/21	0.5	Attend weekly call with Creditors Committee advisor and Debtor co-advisors (AlixPartners, Skyworks, others).		
Steinberg, Richard J.	07/20/21	0.8	Attend weekly call with Creditors Committee advisors and Debtor co-advisors (AlixPartners, Skyworks, others).		

Time Detail By Project					
Name	Date	Hours	Narrative		
Jackson, Vanessa L.	07/21/21	1.5	Correspondence with Davis Polk team regarding PLM		
Steinberg, Richard J.	07/21/21	0.8	structure. Email with the Davis Polk Finance team regarding PLM (0.4) email with Sainz Abogados regarding same (0.2); email with		
			K. Lee regarding same (0.2).		
Jackson, Vanessa L.	07/22/21	2.0	Review considerations relating to PLM.		
Piraino, Stephen D.	07/22/21	1.0	Email with Davis Polk team regarding PLM (0.2); correspondence with J. Barsalona regarding Ad Hoc Group issues (0.2).		
Steinberg, Richard J.	07/22/21	0.3	Email with Davis Polk Finance team regarding PLM (0.1); email with L. Lee regarding same (0.2).		
Piraino, Stephen D.	07/27/21	1.3	Attend weekly call with Creditors Committee advisor and Debtor co-advisors (AlixPartners, Skyworks, others) (0.6); correspondence with J. Barsalona and others regarding Ad Hoc Group issues (0.3); review and analyze correspondence from UCC (0.4).		
Steinberg, Richard J.	07/27/21	0.7	Attend weekly call with Creditors Committee advisors and Debtor co-advisors (AlixPartners, Skyworks, others).		
Piraino, Stephen D.	07/29/21	0.1	Call with D. Abbot regarding Creditors Committee issues.		
Total AM150 Creditor Issues	/UCC/AHC	19.4			
AM470 Cuetemer/Ver	ndor/Non Airere	ft Lagga/Nan	-Aircraft Contract Issues		
O'Sullivan, Damian	07/01/21	2.3	Review and revise notices of assumption and rejection.		
Masaro, Matthew Bruno	07/02/21	0.5	Review and revise proposed contract rejection order (0.2); correspondence with S. Piraino, Chambers and others regarding same (0.3).		
Piraino, Stephen D.	07/02/21	0.3	Correspondence with M. Masaro regarding contract rejection order.		
Katz, Michael	07/05/21	0.2	Review foreign airport vendor agreement (0.1); email with Aeroméxico regarding same (0.1).		
Katz, Michael	07/06/21	0.3	Call with Aeroméxico and AlixPartners regarding vendor payment escalations.		
Masaro, Matthew	07/06/21	0.1	Correspondence with M. Melcer, S. Piraino, and others		
Bruno	07/00/04	0.4	regarding contract rejection.		
Piraino, Stephen D.	07/06/21	0.4	Call with Aeroméxico and AlixPartners regarding vendor payment escalations (0.3); email with AlixPartners regarding vendor issue (0.1).		
Masaro, Matthew Bruno	07/07/21	2.4	Review and revise stipulation and agreed order for contract rejection resolution (2.2); correspondence with S. Piraino and others regarding same (0.2).		
Piraino, Stephen D.	07/07/21	0.1	Email with M. DeGraf regarding bond requirement.		
Masaro, Matthew Bruno	07/08/21	1.0	Review and revise contract rejection stipulation (0.5); correspondence with S. Piraino, Willkie Farr, and others regarding same (0.3); correspondence with Chambers, third-party counsel, and others regarding rejection order (0.2).		
Piraino, Stephen D.	07/08/21	0.5	Email with M. Pina and K. Beckeman regarding vendor issue (0.2); email with M. Masaro and Willkie Farr regarding vendor stipulation (0.3).		
Masaro, Matthew Bruno	07/09/21	2.5	Correspondence with S. Piraino and others regarding contra rejection stipulation (0.4); review and revise contract termination amendment (1.8); correspondence with S. Pirain Aeroméxico, and others regarding same (0.3).		
Piraino, Stephen D.	07/09/21	1.1	Correspondence with M. Masaro regarding contract issues		

Time Detail By Project					
Name	Date	Hours	Narrative		
Masaro, Matthew Bruno	07/10/21	0.5	(0.7); review and revise contract termination agreement (0.4). Correspondence with S. Piraino and others regarding contract rejection.		
Katz, Michael	07/12/21	0.3	Call with Aeroméxico and AlixPartners regarding vendor payment escalations.		
Masaro, Matthew Bruno	07/12/21	0.5	Correspondence with S. Piraino and others regarding contract rejection.		
Piraino, Stephen D.	07/12/21	0.7	Review vendor stipulation (0.2); call with Aeroméxico and AlixPartners regarding vendor payment escalations (0.3); email with M. Masaro regarding vendor agreement (0.2).		
Katz, Michael	07/13/21	0.2	Correspondence with M. Masaro regarding vendor contract language.		
Masaro, Matthew Bruno	07/13/21	0.6	Review amendment to vendor contract (0.4); correspondence with M. Katz and others regarding same (0.2).		
Piraino, Stephen D.	07/13/21	0.2	Correspondence with M. Masaro regarding vendor stipulation.		
Masaro, Matthew	07/14/21	0.2	Correspondence with Aeroméxico, and others regarding		
Bruno	01114121	0.2	vendor contract.		
Masaro, Matthew Bruno	07/15/21	0.5	Call with Aeroméxico and others regarding vendor agreement.		
Piraino, Stephen D.	07/16/21	0.9	Review and analyze vendor contract.		
Katz, Michael	07/19/21	0.1	Call with Aeroméxico and AlixPartners regarding vendor payment escalations.		
Masaro, Matthew Bruno	07/19/21	0.4	Review and revise contract amendment with vendor (0.3); correspondence with S. Piraino, Aeroméxico, and others regarding same (0.1).		
Piraino, Stephen D.	07/19/21	0.3	Review and analyze vendor contract.		
Piraino, Stephen D.	07/20/21	0.8	Call with J. Wallden regarding airline contracts (0.6); correspondence with D. Abbot regarding Airline contracts (0.2).		
Katz, Michael	07/21/21	0.1	Call with Aeroméxico and AlixPartners regarding vendor payment escalations.		
Piraino, Stephen D.	07/21/21	0.2	Email with M. Katz regarding vendor escalation issues.		
Katz, Michael	07/22/21	0.3	Review vendor contract (0.2); correspondence with S. Piraino regarding same (0.1).		
Masaro, Matthew Bruno	07/24/21	1.0	Review and revise CEBURES Notices of Presentment (0.8); correspondence with S. Piraino and Greenberg Traurig regarding same (0.2).		
Katz, Michael	07/26/21	0.3	Call with Aeroméxico and AlixPartners regarding vendor payment escalations (0.2); email correspondence with Aeromexico regarding vendor contract (0.1).		
Katz, Michael	07/28/21	0.9	Prepare form language for contracts (0.3); email with S. Piraino regarding same (0.1); call with Aeroméxico and AlixPartners regarding vendor payment escalations (0.2); review service orders for contractual obligations (0.2); email with S. Piraino regarding same (0.1).		
Masaro, Matthew Bruno	07/28/21	0.7	Correspondence with Cleary Gottlieb, Willkie Farr, and others regarding notice of presentment for contract settlement.		
Katz, Michael	07/29/21	0.3	Correspondence with Aeromexico regarding purchase order analysis (0.1); correspondence with Aeromexico regarding form language for contracts (0.2); correspondence with S. Piraino regarding same (0.1).		
Masaro, Matthew Bruno	07/29/21	0.6	Correspond with third-party counsel regarding contract termination (0.1); review and revise notice of presentment (0.5).		
Piraino, Stephen D. Masaro, Matthew	07/29/21 07/30/21	0.3 0.4	Call with J. Wallden and D. Abbot regarding airline contracts. Review and revise proposed stipulation and agreed order		

		Time	Detail By Project
Name	Date	Hours	Narrative
Bruno			regarding lease setoff (0.2); correspondence with Court and others regarding same (0.2).
Total AM170 Customer/Vendor/No Lease/Non-Aircraft C Issues		23.0	
AM180 Employee/Per	nsion Issues		
Masaro, Matthew Bruno	07/13/21	0.5	Review precedent decision regarding severance motions (0.4); correspondence with T. Graulich and others regarding same (0.1).
Piraino, Stephen D.	07/22/21	0.2	Call with S. Robles regarding employee issues.
Total AM180 Employed Issues	ee/Pension	0.7	
AM190 Financing Borchardt, Leo	07/01/21	1.6	Attend daily contingency update call with Aeroméxico and Rothschild (1.0); review issues list regarding exit financing commitment letter (0.6).
Cheng, Eric Y.	07/01/21	1.4	• ,
Graulich, Timothy	07/01/21	7.4	Call with D. Abbott regarding exit financing (0.5); call with A. Conesa and R. Sanchez Baker regarding same (0.8); call with T. Goren regarding same (0.5); call with counsel to potential investor regarding same (0.4); call with L. Donahue regarding same (0.8); call with E. Jerrard regarding exit financing commitment letter (0.6); review issues list for same (2.2); review DIP credit agreement (1.6).
Jackson, Vanessa L.	07/01/21	3.1	Attend daily contingency update call with Aeroméxico and Rothschild (1.0); review exit financing grid (2.1).
Jerrard, Erik	07/01/21	6.8	Attend daily contingency update call with Aeroméxico and Rothschild (1.0); correspondence with Davis Polk Corporate and Finance teams regarding potential bidder advisors debt proposal (1.3); correspondence with T. Graulich regarding fee calculation interpretation (0.5); analyze and research fee calculation interpretation (3.5).
Katz, Michael	07/01/21	1.6	Review closing set index for DIP credit agreement (0.4); email with L. Lee regarding same (0.4); review closing documents for closing checklist (0.4); email with L. Lee regarding same (0.4).
Lee, Lloyd Piraino, Stephen D.	07/01/21 07/01/21	3.5 2.0	Prepare closing set index for DIP credit agreement. Attend daily contingency update call with Aeroméxico and Rothschild (1.0); call with Willkie Farr regarding exit financing issues (1.0).
Rincon, Cristina M. Troconis, Adela	07/01/21 07/01/21	0.4 4.3	Call with counsel to stakeholder regarding exit financing. Attend daily contingency update call with Aeroméxico and Rothschild (1.0); draft exit financing grid (3.3).
Weigel, Heather	07/01/21	1.0	Attend daily contingency update call with Aeroméxico and Rothschild.
Bane, Abraham	07/02/21	3.7	Correspondence with E. Jerrard regarding DIP credit agreement language (0.5); review and analyze supporting documents regarding same (2.4); draft summary regarding same (0.9).
Borchardt, Leo	07/02/21	3.0	Correspondence with A. Simmonds and H. Weigel regarding rights offering term sheet (0.2); attend daily contingency 24

		Time	Detail By Project
Name	Date	Hours	Narrative
Ford, Stephen	07/02/21	0.4	update call with Aeroméxico and Rothschild (0.8); call with T. Graulich and R. Sanchez Baker regarding equity term sheet (1.1); correspondence with E. Jerrard regarding exit financing issues (0.3); review and revise draft term sheet (0.6). Review and analyze exit financing Non-Disclosure Agreement
гога, этерпен	07/02/21	0.4	(0.2); correspondence with Rothschild regarding same (0.1); correspondence with Davis Polk team regarding execution of same (0.1).
Graulich, Timothy	07/02/21	2.7	Call with counsel to potential exit financing provider regarding exit financing proposal (0.5); call with R. Sanchez Baker regarding same (0.8); call with R. Cooper regarding Apollo's conversion rights (0.3); call with L. Borchardt and R. Sanchez Baker regarding equity term sheet (1.1).
Jackson, Vanessa L.	07/02/21	2.3	Attend daily contingency update call with Aeroméxico and Rothschild (0.7); review comments to exit financing grid (1.6).
Jerrard, Erik	07/02/21	7.2	Attend daily contingency update call with Aeroméxico and Rothschild (0.8); analyze exit financing fee calculations (2.3); email with Davis Polk Finance and Litigation teams regarding same (0.8); correspondence with A. Bane regarding same (0.7); email with T. Graulich regarding same (0.4); review and revise exit financing grid (0.6); email with A. Troconis regarding same (0.2); call with Aeroméxico, Sainz Abogados, AlixPartners, and Rothschild regarding rights offering (1.0); correspondence with L. Borchardt regarding same (0.4).
Katz, Michael	07/02/21	0.2	Review Creditors Committee diligence requests for closing set for DIP credit agreement.
Lee, Lloyd	07/02/21	0.2	Review emails with Davis Polk Finance team regarding exit financing grid.
Piraino, Stephen D.	07/02/21	2.7	Attend daily contingency update call with Aeroméxico and Rothschild (1.0); call with Aeroméxico team regarding exit financing commitment letter (1.0); call with counsel to potential financing party regarding exit financing (0.5); email with coadvisors regarding exit financing (0.2).
Simmonds, Alexander W.	07/02/21	1.3	Attend daily contingency update call with Aeroméxico and Rothschild (0.8); call with same regarding rights offering term sheet (0.5).
Troconis, Adela	07/02/21	2.5	Attend daily contingency update call with Aeroméxico and Rothschild (0.8); call with Aeroméxico, Sainz Abogados, AlixPartners, and Rothschild regarding rights offering (1.0); email with V. Jackson regarding valuation (0.3); draft exit financing grid (0.4).
Weigel, Heather	07/02/21	3.3	Call with Aeroméxico, Sainz Abogados, AlixPartners, and Rothschild regarding rights offering (1.0); review and revise rights offering term sheet in preparation for same (2.1); correspondence with A. Simmonds and L. Borchardt regarding comments to rights offering term sheet (0.2).
Borchardt, Leo	07/03/21	1.3	Review rights offering term sheet (0.8); analyze precedents regarding same (0.5).
Jackson, Vanessa L. Jerrard, Erik	07/03/21 07/03/21	1.7 0.6	Draft exit financing grid. Email with potential bidder advisors regarding exit financing proposal.
Piraino, Stephen D.	07/03/21	0.4	Email with V. Jackson regarding exit financing issues.
Troconis, Adela	07/03/21	2.2	Draft exit financing grid.
Weigel, Heather	07/03/21	2.1	Review and revise rights offering term sheet (1.2); draft analysis of issues regarding same for L. Borchardt (0.9).
Borchardt, Leo	07/04/21	0.4	Review E. Jerrard's comments to rights offering term sheet.

		Time	Detail By Project
Name	Date	Hours	Narrative
Jerrard, Erik	07/04/21	1.8	Review and revise equity commitment term sheet (1.4); email with A. Troconis regarding exit financing grid (0.4).
Piraino, Stephen D.	07/04/21	0.3	Correspondence with Davis Polk Finance team regarding exit financing.
Troconis, Adela	07/04/21	0.5	Comment on exit financing grid (0.4); email with counsel to stakeholder regarding exit financing (0.1).
Borchardt, Leo	07/05/21	1.1	Review and revise rights offering term sheet (0.5); call with advisors to potential exit financing provider regarding exit financing next steps (0.6).
Graulich, Timothy	07/05/21	0.5	Call with counsel to potential investor regarding exit financing process.
Jerrard, Erik	07/05/21	2.4	Review and revise equity commitment term sheet (1.5); email with H. Weigel regarding same (0.3); call with Ad Hoc Committee advisors regarding exit financing next steps (0.6).
Piraino, Stephen D.	07/05/21	1.1	Call with Ad Hoc Committee advisors regarding exit financing next steps (0.6); correspondence with C. Rincon regarding exit
Rincon, Cristina M.	07/05/21	2.2	financing (0.2); revise exit financing term sheet (0.3). Analyze DIP interpretation issues (2.0); correspondence with S. Piraino regarding same (0.2).
Weigel, Heather	07/05/21	1.4	Email with Davis Polk Finance team regarding rights offering term sheet (0.1); review Davis Polk Restructuring team's comments to rights offering term sheet (0.2); review and
Bane, Abraham	07/06/21	0.4	revise same (1.0). Correspondence with E. Jerrard regarding equity conversion issues.
Borchardt, Leo	07/06/21	1.9	Attend daily contingency update call with Aeroméxico and Rothschild (1.0); analyze exit financing issues (0.5); email with E. Jerrard regarding same (0.4).
Graulich, Timothy	07/06/21	3.4	Call with H. Parkhill regarding call with Creditors Committee (0.3); call with A. Conesa and R. Sanchez Baker regarding exit financing (1.0); call with S. Piraino and others regarding same (0.8); call with A. Conesa regarding exit financing process (0.8); call with R. Cooper regarding exit financing proposal (0.5).
Houston, Kamali Jackson, Vanessa L.	07/06/21 07/06/21	0.5 0.5	Review DIP financing documents. Attend daily contingency update call with Aeroméxico and
			Rothschild (partial attendance).
Jerrard, Erik	07/06/21	4.7	Email with T. Graulich regarding exit financing process (0.4); email with L. Borchardt and V. Jackson regarding same (0.8); email with Sainz Abogados regarding same (0.5); email with T. Graulich regarding rights offering and backstop court approval (0.7); email with Rothschild regarding exit financing issues (0.4); correspondence with V. Jackson regarding interpretation regarding same (0.3); analyze terms regarding same (0.6); attend daily contingency update call with Aeroméxico and Rothschild (1.0).
Lee, Lloyd	07/06/21	1.8	Revise closing set index for DIP credit agreement (0.7); compile documents for closing set for DIP credit agreement (1.1).
McClammy, James I.	07/06/21	1.0	Attend daily contingency update call with Aeroméxico and Rothschild.
Piraino, Stephen D.	07/06/21	2.5	Attend daily contingency update call with Aeroméxico and Rothschild (1.0); call with T. Graulich and others regarding exit financing (0.8); review DIP order relating to exit financing issue (0.3); review exit financing Nom-Disclosure Agreements (0.1); email with counsel to potential financing party regarding 26

		Time	Detail By Project
Name	Date	Hours	Narrative
			same (0.1); correspondence with D. DeBassio regarding exit financing data room (0.2).
Rincon, Cristina M.	07/06/21	1.2	Attend daily contingency update call with Aeroméxico and Rothschild (1.0); review Creditors Committee exit financing letter (0.2).
Troconis, Adela	07/06/21	1.5	Attend daily contingency update call with Aeroméxico and Rothschild (1.0); review comments to exit debt financing
Borchardt, Leo	07/07/21	3.0	commitment letter (0.6). Attend daily contingency update call with Aeroméxico and Rothschild (0.9); review Sainz Abogados' comments to rights offering term sheet (1.1); review E. Jerrard's comments to same (0.2); review and revise same (0.8).
Ford, Stephen	07/07/21	0.7	Coordinate execution of exit financing Non-Disclosure Agreements (0.6); correspond with Rothschild team regarding same (0.1).
Graulich, Timothy	07/07/21	6.4	Call with A. Conesa and R. Sanchez Baker regarding exit financing (0.9); call with A. Sainz regarding Creditors Committee exit financing letter (0.6); call with R. Cooper regarding Apollo proposal (0.5); review and comment on equity term sheet (2.4); review and comment on debt term sheet (2.0).
Jackson, Vanessa L.	07/07/21	0.9	Attend daily contingency update call with Aeroméxico and Rothschild.
Jerrard, Erik	07/07/21	5.8	Review and analyze proposed responses to Creditors Committee letter regarding exit financing (1.2); email with T. Graulich regarding same (0.4); correspondence with R. Steinberg, A. Sainz, R. Guiada, and S. Piraino regarding same (0.8); correspondence with R. Steinberg and S. Piraino regarding same (0.4); review and revise rights offering term sheet (1.3); email with H. Weigel regarding same (0.4); correspondence with H. Weigel, A. Siman, and S. Piraino regarding same (0.3); attend daily contingency update call with Aeroméxico and Rothschild (1.0).
Lee, Lloyd	07/07/21	0.5	Coordinate preparation of closing set for DIP credit agreement.
Piraino, Stephen D.	07/07/21	2.9	Correspondence with E. Jerrard regarding exit financing (0.4); correspondence with same, A. Siman and H. Weigel regarding exit financing tax matters (0.3); call with R. Sanchez Baker and others regarding exit financing Non-Disclosure Agreement (0.2); call with Milbank regarding same (0.2); prepare confidentiality email agreement (0.7); call with R. Arnold regarding exit financing (0.1); prepare letter to counsel to stakeholder regarding fees (0.8); email with T. Graulich and E. Jerrard regarding same (0.2); attend daily contingency update call with Aeroméxico and Rothschild (0.9).
Rincon, Cristina M.	07/07/21	0.8	Attend daily contingency update call with Aeroméxico and Rothschild (partial attendance).
Steinberg, Richard J.	07/07/21	6.1	Review Creditors Committee exit financing letter and related filings (1.1); review and revise summary regarding same (2.7); email with Davis Polk Litigation team regarding same (0.2); correspondence with Sainz Abogados regarding same (1.5); correspondence with S. Piraino and E. Jerrard regarding same (0.3); email with T. Graulich regarding same (0.3).
Troconis, Adela	07/07/21	0.9	Attend daily contingency update call with Aeroméxico and Rothschild.
Weigel, Heather	07/07/21	5.9	Correspondence with Davis Polk Finance team regarding 27

		Time	Detail By Project
Name	Date	Hours	Narrative
			rights offering issues (0.3); review and revise rights offering term sheet (2.2); incorporate comments from L. Borchardt to same (1.9); review E. Jerrard's comment to same (0.4); email with Aeroméxico regarding same (0.1); email with counsel to stakeholder regarding same (0.1); attend daily contingency update call with Aeroméxico and Rothschild (0.9).
Borchardt, Leo	07/08/21	1.0	Attend daily contingency update call with Aeroméxico and Rothschild.
Graulich, Timothy	07/08/21	4.0	Correspondence with S. Piraino and E. Jerrard regarding exit financing issues (0.8); review and comment on term sheet (3.2).
Jackson, Vanessa L.	07/08/21	0.7	Attend daily contingency update call with Aeroméxico and Rothschild.
Jerrard, Erik	07/08/21	3.2	Email with Cleary Gottlieb regarding exit financing process (0.4); email with Rothschild regarding same (0.3); review and analyze exit financing proposal (1.4); email with T. Graulich regarding exit financing process (0.4); attend daily contingency update call with Aeroméxico and Rothschild (1.2).
Lee, Lloyd	07/08/21	1.3	Review DIP closing set for DIP credit agreement in response to stakeholder diligence request.
Piraino, Stephen D.	07/08/21	2.3	Email with R. Steinberg regarding exit financing proposal (0.2); email with T. Graulich regarding same (0.2); draft response to counsel to potential stakeholder (0.2); correspondence with T. Graulich and E. Jerrard regarding exit financing; attend daily contingency update call with Aeroméxico and Rothschild (0.7).
Rincon, Cristina M.	07/08/21	0.9	Attend daily contingency update call with Aeroméxico and Rothschild (0.7); correspondence with Davis Polk Restructuring team regarding exit financing issues (0.2).
Steinberg, Richard J.	07/08/21	1.5	Email with Sainz Abogados regarding Creditors Committee exit financing letter (1.1); review exit financing proposals (0.2); draft summary of same (0.3).
Troconis, Adela	07/08/21	0.7	Attend daily contingency update call with Aeroméxico and Rothschild.
Graulich, Timothy	07/09/21	4.5	Call with A. Conesa regarding Creditors Committee exit financing letter (0.7); call with counsel to potential bidder regarding exit financing proposal (0.6); comment on equity term sheet (3.2).
Jackson, Vanessa L.	07/09/21	0.7	Attend daily contingency update call with Aeroméxico and Rothschild.
Jerrard, Erik	07/09/21	0.9	Email with Akin Gump regarding DIP election conversion (0.3); analyze DIP documentation regarding same (0.6).
McClammy, James I.	07/09/21	1.0	Attend daily contingency update call with Aeroméxico and Rothschild.
Piraino, Stephen D.	07/09/21	1.5	Attend daily contingency update call with Aeroméxico and Rothschild (0.7); correspondence with D. Botter regarding exit financing fee reimbursement (0.4); correspondence with T. Graulich and AlixPartners regarding same (0.4).
Rincon, Cristina M.	07/09/21	0.7	Attend daily contingency update call with Aeroméxico and Rothschild.
Steinberg, Richard J.	07/09/21	2.9	Email with Sainz Abogados regarding Creditors Committee response (0.3); review documentation regarding same (2.2); email with D. Abbot regarding same (0.2); email with S. Piraino regarding same (0.2).
Troconis, Adela	07/09/21	0.7	Attend daily contingency update call with Aeroméxico and Rothschild.

		Time	Detail By Project
Name	Date	Hours	Narrative
Borchardt, Leo	07/10/21	1.7	Analyze counsel to stakeholder's comments to rights offering term sheet (1.1); review and revise proposed responses to same (0.6).
Jerrard, Erik	07/10/21	1.9	Review debt and equity turns from potential bidder advisors proposal (1.5); email with Davis Polk team to coordinate review of same (0.4).
Steinberg, Richard J.	07/10/21	3.3	Email with Sainz Abogados regarding Creditors Committee response (0.2); review materials in response to same (1.5).
Troconis, Adela	07/10/21	0.9	Review counsel to stakeholder's comments to exit financing grid (0.2); comment on same (0.2); comment on exit debt financing commitment letter (0.5).
Weigel, Heather	07/10/21	2.6	Prepare responses to stakeholder counsel on comments to rights offering term sheet issues list (1.9); incorporate comments from Sainz Abogados to same (0.7).
Borchardt, Leo	07/11/21	2.4	Call with A. Sainz, T. Graulich, and others regarding rights offering term sheet (1.9); correspondence with E. Jerrard regarding same (0.2); review and revise issue list regarding same (0.3).
Graulich, Timothy	07/11/21	1.8	Call with L. Borchardt , Sainz Abogados, and others regarding equity term sheet.
Jerrard, Erik	07/11/21	2.9	Call with Davis Polk Corporate and Restructuring teams and others regarding equity term sheet (1.9); correspondence with L. Borchardt regarding same (0.2); review and revise exit financing grid (0.8).
Piraino, Stephen D.	07/11/21	2.5	Call with Davis Polk Corporate and Restructuring teams and others regarding equity term sheet (1.9); correspondence with E. Jerrard regarding exit financing (0.2); email with Akin Gump and Milbank regarding same (0.1); correspondence with R. Steinberg regarding response to Creditors Committee exit financing letter (0.3).
Steinberg, Richard J.	07/11/21	2.8	Review and revise materials in response to Creditors Committee exit financing letter (2.5); correspondence with S. Piraino regarding same (0.3).
Weigel, Heather	07/11/21	4.8	Call with Sainz Abogados team, Davis Polk Restructuring team and others regarding rights offering issues list (1.8); review and revise rights offering issues list (3.0).
Borchardt, Leo	07/12/21	1.8	
Graulich, Timothy	07/12/21	7.6	Call with A. Conesa and R. Sanchez Baker regarding exit financing issues (0.8); call with R. Cooper regarding conversion right (0.5); correspondence with V. Jackson regarding debt exit financing (0.9); correspondence with S. Piraino and E. Jerrard regarding exit financing issues (1.4); call with A. Sainz regarding exit financing timeline (0.5); call with B. Miller regarding same (0.4); review and comment on exit financing term sheet (3.1).
Jackson, Vanessa L.	07/12/21	3.1	Call with advisors regarding exit debt financing terms (0.6); review revised exit financing grid (1.6); call with Aeroméxico and co- advisors regarding same (0.9).
Jerrard, Erik	07/12/21	4.4	Call with Davis Polk team and counsel to stakeholder regarding exit financing terms (0.8); call with R. Sanchez Baker, A. Nuñes, J. Zumarraga, Rothschild, Sainz Abogados, AlixPartners and Davis Polk team regarding same (1.0); email with T. Graulich regarding exit financing process (0.4); email

		Time	Detail By Project
Name	Date	Hours	Narrative
Katz, Michael	07/12/21	1.3	with V. Jackson regarding same (0.3); call with Cleary Gottlieb and S. Piraino regarding initial valuation delivery (0.3); analyze DIP credit agreement regarding same (0.8); attend daily contingency update call with Aeroméxico and Rothschild (0.8). Attend daily contingency update call with Aeroméxico and Rothschild (partial attendance) (0.4); call with Aeroméxico and
Lee, Lloyd	07/12/21	1.6	financial advisors regarding exit financing grid (0.9). Correspondence with A. Troconis and V. Jackson regarding
McClammy, James I.	07/12/21	1.0	exit financing grid. Attend daily contingency update call with Aeroméxico and
Piraino, Stephen D.	07/12/21	7.0	Rothschild. Attend daily contingency update call with Aeroméxico and Rothschild (0.8); call with co-advisors regarding exit financing grid (0.5) (partial attendance); correspondence with Milbank regarding exit financing (0.6); correspondence with T. Graulich and E. Jerrard regarding same (1.4); call with E. Jerrard and Cleary Gottlieb regarding initial valuation delivery (0.3); correspondence with E. Jerrard regarding same (0.3); correspondence with T. Graulich regarding same (0.7); email with Willkie Farr regarding same (0.2); review and analyze issues regarding same (0.5); correspondence with R. Steinberg regarding response to Creditors Committee exit financing letter (0.5); review Creditors Committee letter and response to same (0.7); review response to Akin Gump regarding DIP professional fees (0.3); email with Aeroméxico regarding same (0.3).
Rincon, Cristina M.	07/12/21	0.8	Attend daily contingency update call with Aeroméxico and Rothschild (partial attendance).
Steinberg, Richard J.	07/12/21	2.2	Review and revise response to Creditors Committee exit financing letter (1.5); correspondence with S. Piraino regarding same (0.6); email with Sainz Abogados and Morris Nichols regarding same (0.1).
Troconis, Adela	07/12/21	4.7	Comment on exit debt financing commitment letter and exit financing grid (1.9); attend daily contingency update call with Aeroméxico and Rothschild (0.9); call with R. Sanchez Baker, A. Nuñes, J. Zumarraga, Rothschild, Sainz Abogados, AlixPartners and Davis Polk team regarding exit debt financing (1.0); call with Rothschild, AlixPartners, Sainz Abogados and Davis Polk team regarding same (0.9).
Weigel, Heather	07/12/21	0.4	Email with Aeroméxico regarding rights offering term sheet issues list (0.1); call with L. Borchardt regarding rights offering next steps (0.1); email with counsel to stakeholder regarding term sheet issues list regarding same (0.2).
Borchardt, Leo	07/13/21	2.1	Attend daily contingency update call with Aeroméxico and Rothschild (0.6); call with counsel and financing advisor to stakeholder rights offering term sheet (1.1); correspondence with H. Weigel regarding same (0.2); call with E. Jerrard and others regarding timing regarding same (0.2).
Ford, Stephen	07/13/21	0.2	Correspondence with Aeroméxico regarding exit financing Non-Disclosure Agreements (0.1); correspondence with Davis Polk Finance and Rothschild teams regarding same (0.1).
Graulich, Timothy	07/13/21	10.5	Correspondence with S. Piraino and E. Jerrard regarding exit financing issues (1.0); call with A. Conesa and R. Sanchez Baker regarding same (0.6); call with D. Abbott, A. Sainz, S. Piraino, and others regarding response to Creditors Committee exit financing letter (0.6); call with FTI regarding

		Time	Detail By Project
Name	Date	Hours	Narrative
			exit financing (0.6); call with A. Conesa regarding timing of exit financing (0.4); call with R. Cooper regarding Apollo proposal (0.4); call with counsel to stakeholder regarding equity term sheet (0.7); review Apollo proposal (0.7); call with H. Parkhill regarding valuation materials (0.8); call with L. Donahue regarding exit financing (0.9); review DIP credit agreement (1.4); review equity term sheet (2.4).
Jackson, Vanessa L.	07/13/21	2.6	Attend daily contingency update call with Aeroméxico and Rothschild (0.5); call with counsel to stakeholder regarding exit financing (0.4); review exit financing commitment letter (1.7).
Jerrard, Erik	07/13/21	7.9	Call with Morris Nichols regarding response to Creditors Committee exit financing letter (0.6); email with V. Jackson regarding exit financing (0.7); email with S. Piraino and T. Graulich regarding same (0.6); analyze DIP credit agreement regarding same (1.3); draft summary of same (0.4); review Apollo initial indication of conversion (1.2); email with Aeroméxico regarding same (0.4); call with potential bidder advisors regarding equity commitments (1.2); correspondence with H. Weigel regarding same (0.2); email with Rothschild regarding fee interpretation (0.7); attend daily contingency update call with Aeroméxico and Rothschild (0.6).
Katz, Michael	07/13/21	1.0	Review DIP credit agreement for lien capacity (0.4); call with counsel to stakeholder regarding exit financing grid responses (0.4); email with M. Masaro and A. Troconis regarding DIP lien capacity (0.2).
Lee, Lloyd	07/13/21	1.2	Email with Davis Polk Finance team regarding exit financing commitment letter (0.3); teleconference to discuss exit debt financing grid with Akin Gump, V. Jackson, and M. Katz (0.9).
Piraino, Stephen D.	07/13/21	5.1	Attend daily contingency update call with Aeroméxico and Rothschild (0.5); correspondence with E. Jerrard regarding exit financing (0.5); call with Davis Polk, Akin Gump and Rothschild teams regarding same (1.0) (partial attendance); call with Milbank regarding exit financing Non-Disclosure Agreement (0.2); review and analyze Apollo proposal (0.9); call with D. Abbott, A. Sainz, T. Graulich, and others regarding response to Creditors Committee exit financing letter (0.6); review and revise response to Creditors Committee letter (0.8); correspondence with R. Steinberg regarding same (0.2); email with T. Graulich and R. Steinberg regarding Creditors Committee exit financing letter (0.2); correspondence with Sainz Abogados regarding same (0.2).
Steinberg, Richard J.	07/13/21	3.5	Call with Sainz Abogados and Morris Nichols regarding response to Creditors Committee exit financing letter (1.0); correspondence with S. Piraino regarding same (0.3); email with Sainz Abogados and Morris Nichols regarding same (0.3); review documentation in data room regarding same (0.8); review draft response to Creditors Committee exit financing letter (1.1).
Troconis, Adela	07/13/21	3.0	Attend daily contingency update call with Aeroméxico and Rothschild (0.5); draft exit debt financing commitment letter (2.5).
Weigel, Heather	07/13/21	3.9	Call with counsel to stakeholder and financial advisor to stakeholder regarding rights offering term sheet issues list (1.1); correspondence with L. Borchardt regarding next steps regarding same (0.2); correspondence with E. Jerrard

		Time I	Detail By Project
Name	Date	Hours	Narrative
			regarding rights offering timing (0.2); research issues regarding exit financing agreements (0.8); review precedent backstop commitment agreements to prepare initial draft (1.4).
Bane, Abraham	07/14/21	1.0	Call with Davis Polk Restructuring team regarding exit financing next steps (0.7); prepare for same (0.3).
Borchardt, Leo	07/14/21	2.4	Attend daily contingency update call with Aeroméxico and Rothschild (0.8); call with Davis Polk Restructuring team regarding exit financing next steps (0.7); review precedent exit equity financing commitment letters (0.7); review information on exit financing court process (0.3).
Graulich, Timothy	07/14/21	8.8	Correspondence with L. Borchardt regarding exit financing (1.0); call with potential investors regarding same (0.7); correspondence with S. Piraino and E. Jerrard regarding same (1.3); call with A. Conesa regarding same (1.0); review DIP term sheet (0.8); email with Davis Polk team regarding exit financing committee letter (0.3); call with B. Miller regarding exit financing (0.4); review and revise DIP credit agreement (3.1).
Jackson, Vanessa L.	07/14/21	3.4	Call with Davis Polk Restructuring and Finance teams regarding exit financing updates (0.7); attend daily contingency update call with Aeroméxico and Rothschild (0.8); review revised exit financing commitment letter (1.1); review revised exit financing grid (0.8).
Jerrard, Erik	07/14/21	6.6	Draft proposed exit financing court process to Davis Polk Corporate, Finance, and Restructuring teams (1.2); analyze potential refinancing proposal (2.1); review and revise exit debt financing commitment letter (1.3); email with A. Troconis regarding same (0.3); correspondence with T. Graulich, L. Borchardt, and V. Jackson regarding exit financing process (1.0); attend daily contingency update call with Aeroméxico and Rothschild (0.7).
Katz, Michael	07/14/21	0.2	Correspondence with A. Troconis regarding exit financing commitment letter.
Lee, Lloyd	07/14/21	0.7	Call with Davis Polk Restructuring and Finances teams regarding exit financing updates.
McClammy, James I.	07/14/21	1.0	Attend daily contingency update call with Aeroméxico and Rothschild.
Melcer, Moshe	07/14/21	0.8	Correspondence with S. Piraino regarding fleet DIP disclosure requirements (0.3); correspondence with S. Szanzer regarding same (0.5).
Piraino, Stephen D.	07/14/21	1.7	Attend daily contingency update call with Aeroméxico and Rothschild (0.7); call with Davis Polk Restructuring team regarding exit financing next steps (0.7); correspondence with M. Melcer regarding DIP credit agreement requirements (0.3).
Rincon, Cristina M.	07/14/21	1.4	Attend daily contingency update call with Aeroméxico and Rothschild (0.7); call with Davis Polk Restructuring and Finance teams regarding exit financing updates (0.7).
Steinberg, Richard J.	07/14/21	0.3	Email with Sainz Abogados team regarding response to Creditors Committee exit financing letter.
Troconis, Adela	07/14/21	3.7	Draft exit debt financing commitment letter (2.3); call with Davis Polk Restructuring and Finance teams regarding exit financing updates (0.7); attend daily contingency update call with Aeroméxico and Rothschild (0.7).
Weigel, Heather	07/14/21	4.5	Call with Davis Polk Restructuring and Finances teams regarding exit financing updates (0.7); prepare responses to questions from A. Troconis regarding equity documents (0.4);

		Time I	Detail By Project
Name	Date	Hours	Narrative
Borchardt, Leo	07/15/21	1.6	review precedent exit equity financing commitment letters (0.4); prepare draft of exit equity financing commitment letters (2.9). Review draft exit financing commitment letter (0.3); attend
Boronardt, Eco	07/10/21	1.0	daily contingency update call with Aeroméxico and Rothschild (0.9); call with counsel to potential stakeholder regarding exit financing (0.4).
Graulich, Timothy	07/15/21	1.6	Review exit financing proposal.
Jackson, Vanessa L.	07/15/21	2.1	Review exit financing grid (0.7); attend daily contingency update call with Aeroméxico and Rothschild (1.0); call with counsel to stakeholder regarding exit financing grid (0.4).
Jerrard, Erik	07/15/21	4.0	Call with counsel to stakeholder regarding exit financing grid (0.5); call with H. Parkhill and R. Arnold regarding exit financing process (0.5); email with Rothschild and Davis Polk Restructuring and Finance teams regarding same (0.4); analyze fee issues regarding same (1.6); email with H. Weigel regarding exit debt financing commitment letter (0.4); attend daily contingency update call with Aeroméxico and Rothschild (0.4) (partial attendance); correspondence with S. Piraino regarding same (0.2).
Katz, Michael	07/15/21	0.5	Call with counsel to stakeholder regarding exit financing grid.
Lee, Lloyd	07/15/21	1.0	Email with Davis Polk Finance team regarding exit financing grid (0.6); call with counsel to stakeholder regarding exit financing grid (0.4).
Piraino, Stephen D.	07/15/21	1.2	Review and analyze Creditors Committee exit financing letter (0.2); attend daily contingency update call with Aeroméxico and Rothschild (1.0).
Steinberg, Richard J.	07/15/21	0.9	Revise response to Creditors Committee exit financing letter (0.5); email with S. Piraino regarding same (0.2); email with Sainz Abogados regarding same (0.1); email with Davis Polk Litigation team regarding same (0.1).
Troconis, Adela	07/15/21	4.1	Attend daily contingency update call with Aeroméxico and Rothschild (1.0); draft exit debt financing commitment letter (2.6); call with counsel to stakeholder regarding exit financing grid (0.5).
Weigel, Heather	07/15/21	0.2	Correspondence with E. Jerrard regarding exit financing updates.
Bane, Abraham	07/16/21	3.7	Call with E. Jerrard regarding Exit Financing Motion (0.2); review precedent for same (0.8); draft same (2.7).
Borchardt, Leo	07/16/21	1.0	Attend daily contingency update call with Aeroméxico and Rothschild.
Graulich, Timothy	07/16/21	8.0	Call with R. Arnold regarding exit financing grid (0.8); review and comment on same and proposal (1.6); review exit financing proposals (3.2); review and revise Plan (2.4).
Jackson, Vanessa L.	07/16/21	3.5	Attend daily contingency update call with Aeroméxico and Rothschild (1.0); comment on exit financing grid (1.0); review revised same (1.0); email with Davis Polk Finance team regarding same (0.5).
Jerrard, Erik	07/16/21	3.2	Attend daily contingency update call with Aeroméxico and Rothschild (0.9); call with A. Bane regarding exit financing motion (0.2); email with potential exit financing provider regarding court process (0.5); review proposed response to exit financing commitment letter (1.2); email with A. Troconis regarding same (0.6).
Katz, Michael Lee, Lloyd	07/16/21 07/16/21	0.1 1.1	Email with L. Lee regarding DIP reporting. Draft exit financing grid (0.2); review emails from Davis Polk

		Time I	Detail By Project
Name	Date	Hours	Narrative
Piraino, Stephen D.	07/16/21	6.5	Finance team regarding same (0.2); call with Davis Polk Finance and Restructuring teams regarding exit financing grid (0.7). Attend daily contingency update call with Aeroméxico and
			Rothschild (1.0); call with Aeroméxico, Rothschild, AlixPartners, Sainz Abogados and Davis Polk teams regarding exit financing (0.8); correspondence with potential financing party and G. Morrison regarding regulatory issues regarding same (0.3); review and revise Disclosure Statement (2.2); review and analyze Plan issues (2.2).
Troconis, Adela	07/16/21	4.7	Review and revise exit debtor financing commitment letter (2.9); attend daily contingency update call with Aeroméxico and Rothschild (1.0); call with Aeroméxico, Rothschild, AlixPartners, Sainz Abogados and Davis Polk teams regarding exit financing (0.8).
Borchardt, Leo	07/17/21	2.7	Analyze rights offering term sheet draft (1.8); call with H. Weigel and E. Jerrard regarding same (0.4); comment on issues list regarding same (0.5).
Ford, Stephen	07/17/21	2.4	Review and revise exit financing Non-Disclosure Agreement (2.3); correspondence with Davis Polk team regarding same (0.1)
Graulich, Timothy	07/17/21	0.6	Call with counsel to potential exit financing provider regarding exit financing.
Jerrard, Erik	07/17/21	4.7	Review and analyze rights offering term sheet (2.2); call with L. Borchardt and H. Weigel regarding same (0.4); analyze exit financing fee calculation and related issues (1.3); email with T. Graulich regarding same (0.4); email with Davis Polk Corporate and Finance teams regarding exit financing process (0.4).
Weigel, Heather	07/17/21	3.9	Call with L. Borchardt and E. Jerrard regarding rights offering term sheet (0.4); draft rights offering term sheet issues list (1.6); review and revise rights offering term sheet (1.9).
Bane, Abraham Borchardt, Leo	07/18/21 07/18/21	6.4 2.0	Draft Exit Financing motion and proposed order. Call with AlixPartners, Rothschild, and Sainz Abogados regarding rights offering term sheet (1.3); review and revise rights offering term sheet (0.7).
Graulich, Timothy	07/18/21	2.3	Correspondence with L. Borchardt and others regarding equity term sheet (1.5); correspondence with S. Piraino and E. Jerrard regarding same (0.5); call with potential financing provider regarding exit financing (0.3).
Jerrard, Erik	07/18/21	5.5	Call with AlixPartners, Rothschild, and Sainz Abogados regarding rights offering term sheet (1.3); correspondence with T. Graulich and S. Piraino regarding same (0.6); review rights offering term sheet (1.2); call with counsel to potential financing providers regarding exit financing (0.4); review and revise exit Non-Disclosure Agreement for advisors (1.5); email with counsel to potential providers regarding same (0.4); correspondence with S. Piraino regarding exit financing (0.2).
Simmonds, Alexander W.	07/18/21	1.4	Call with AlixPartners, Rothschild, and Sainz Abogados regarding rights offering term sheet.
Troconis, Adela Weigel, Heather	07/18/21 07/18/21	2.3 1.3	Review and revise exit financing term sheet. Call with AlixPartners, Rothschild, and Sainz Abogados
Bane, Abraham	07/19/21	2.3	regarding rights offering term sheet. Revise exit financing motion and proposed order (1.7); review draft exit debt and equity financing commitment letters for same (0.4); correspondence with E. Jerrard regarding same 34

		Time	Detail By Project
Name	Date	Hours	Narrative
Borchardt, Leo	07/19/21	2.1	(0.2). Attend daily contingency update call with Aeroméxico and Rothschild (0.9); correspondence with E. Jerrard regarding preparation for call with counsel to stakeholder (0.2); counsel to stakeholder and financial advisor to stakeholder regarding exit financing documents (0.5); review revised exit equity
Ford, Stephen	07/19/21	2.8	financing commitment letter (0.5). Coordinate execution of exit financing Non-Disclosure Agreement (0.3); review and revise exit financing Non- Disclosure Agreement (2.1); correspondence with E. Jerrard regarding same (0.4).
Graulich, Timothy Jackson, Vanessa L.	07/19/21 07/19/21	2.9 0.8	Comment on equity financing term sheet. Attend daily contingency update call with Aeroméxico and Rothschild.
Jerrard, Erik	07/19/21	7.7	Attend daily contingency update call with Aeroméxico and Rothschild (0.8); call with counsel to potential financing provider regarding DIP credit agreement and related issues (0.3); review and revise exit financing commitment letters (2.2); review and revise term sheet regarding same (2.3); correspondence with T. Graulich regarding exit financing process (0.4); call with potential financing provider regarding exit financing process (0.2); call with counsel to stakeholder and financial advisor to stakeholder regarding exit financing documents (0.5); prepare for same with L. Borchardt (0.2); call with S. Piraino regarding exit financing issues and next steps on exit financing process (0.8).
Katz, Michael McClammy, James I.	07/19/21 07/19/21	0.2 1.0	Review precedent for conditions precedent for exit facilities. Attend daily contingency update call with Aeroméxico and Rothschild.
Piraino, Stephen D.	07/19/21	1.8	Call with E. Jerrard regarding exit financing issues and process (0.8); call with counsel to stakeholder and financial advisor to stakeholder regarding equity financing commitment (0.5); call with Creditors Committee counsel regarding exit financing process (0.3); correspondence with E. Jerrard regarding exit financing issues (0.2).
Rincon, Cristina M.	07/19/21	0.4	Attend daily contingency update call with Aeroméxico and Rothschild.
Simmonds, Alexander W.	07/19/21	2.8	Attend daily contingency update call with Aeroméxico and Rothschild (0.7); call with counsel to stakeholder, stakeholder counsel, and financial advisor to stakeholder regarding equity financing commitment (0.6); review rights offering issues list (0.7); comment on exit financing commitment letter (0.8).
Troconis, Adela	07/19/21	1.1	Attend daily contingency update call with Aeroméxico and Rothschild (0.7); draft exit financing term sheet (0.4).
Weigel, Heather	07/19/21	1.4	Call with Sainz Abogados and counsel to stakeholder regarding rights offering term sheet (0.5); email with Davis Polk team and Sainz Abogados regarding rights offering term sheet (0.2); attend daily contingency update call with Aeroméxico and Rothschild (0.7).
Bane, Abraham	07/20/21	1.0	Draft Exit Financing motion (0.8); correspondence with E. Jerrard regarding same (0.2).
Borchardt, Leo	07/20/21	4.8	Attend daily contingency update call with Aeroméxico and Rothschild (0.9); call with Davis Polk team regarding exit financing proposal securities law issues (0.3); prepare for same (1.0); analyze law regarding same (1.0); review exit equity financing commitment letter (1.6).

		Time	Detail By Project
Name	Date	Hours	Narrative
Ford, Stephen	07/20/21	4.9	Coordinate execution of exit financing Non-Disclosure Agreements (0.4); correspondence with E. Jerrard regarding same (0.1); correspondence with exit financing Non-Disclosure Agreement counterparty regarding same (0.3); correspondence with Rothschild regarding same (0.2); review and revise exit financing Non-Disclosure Agreements (3.9).
Graulich, Timothy	07/20/21	8.5	Call with A. Conesa and R. Sanchez Baker regarding exit financing (0.7); review exit financing term sheet (1.2); correspondence with S. Piraino and E. Jerrard regarding exit financing next steps (1.1); call with H. Parkhill regarding final valuation materials (0.7); call with Creditors Committee advisors regarding exit financing issues (0.6); call with J. Arrigunaga regarding Board approval issues (0.4); review and revise Disclosure Statement (3.8).
Jackson, Vanessa L.	07/20/21	1.6	Review exit financing grid (0.5); review exit financing term sheet (1.1).
Jerrard, Erik	07/20/21	6.1	Attend daily contingency update call with Aeroméxico and Rothschild (0.9); correspondence with L. Borchardt regarding exit financing proposal (0.3); call with S. Piraino, Rothschild team, and others regarding exit financing (0.8); correspondence with T. Graulich and S. Piraino regarding same (1.7); review and revise exit financing commitment letter (1.8); email with L. Borchardt, A. Simmonds, and H. Weigel regarding same (0.4).
Katz, Michael	07/20/21	1.7	Review and revise conditions annex to exit financing commitment letter (1.5); email with A. Troconis regarding same (0.2).
Lee, Lloyd	07/20/21	0.7	Email with Davis Polk Finance team regarding exit financing grid and rights offering term sheet
Piraino, Stephen D.	07/20/21	2.7	Call with Davis Polk team regarding securities law issues regarding exit financing proposals (0.3); call with E. Jerrard, Rothschild team, and others regarding exit financing (0.8); correspondence with T. Graulich and E. Jerrard regarding exit financing (0.7); attend daily contingency update call with Aeroméxico and Rothschild (0.9).
Simmonds, Alexander W.	07/20/21	3.6	Attend daily contingency update call with Aeroméxico and Rothschild (0.9); correspondence with L. Borchardt regarding securities law issue regarding exit financing (2.7).
Troconis, Adela	07/20/21	5.6	Attend daily contingency update call with Aeroméxico and Rothschild (1.0); draft exit financing term sheet (4.6).
Weigel, Heather	07/20/21	4.1	Review revised draft of rights offering term sheet (0.5); summarize revisions regarding same (0.4); review and revise equity financing commitment letter (2.1); correspondence with L. Borchardt regarding same (1.1).
Bane, Abraham Borchardt, Leo	07/21/21 07/21/21	0.8 5.1	Draft declaration in support of Exit Financing motion. Call with counsel to stakeholder and E. Jerrard regarding securities laws analysis regarding rights offering (0.3); review precedent tights offering memorandum (2.2); review rights offering term sheet (0.4); attend daily contingency update call with Aeroméxico and Rothschild (0.9); call with Sainz Abogados regarding securities law issues regarding exit financing (0.5); correspondence with Davis Polk team regarding same (0.3); review and comment on rights offering term sheet (0.5).
Ford, Stephen	07/21/21	1.2	Call with advisors for exit financing Non-Disclosure Agreement counterparty regarding exit financing issues (0.3); review and 36

		Time	Detail By Project
Name	Date	Hours	Narrative
Graulich, Timothy	07/21/21	9.1	revise exit financing Non-Disclosure Agreement (0.6); correspondence with Davis Polk and Rothschild teams regarding same (0.1); correspondence with Davis Polk team regarding execution of same (0.2). Correspondence with S. Piraino and E. Jerrard regarding exit financing issues (1.6); call with R. Cooper regarding exit proposal (0.4); call with stakeholder regarding exit proposal (0.4); review and revise Disclosure Statement (1.9); review and revise Plan (1.9); call with H. Parkhill regarding exit financing proposal (0.3); call with A. Conesa and R. Sanchez Baker regarding same (0.8); review revised exit financing proposal (1.8).
Jackson, Vanessa L.	07/21/21	3.3	Attend daily contingency update call with Aeroméxico and Rothschild (0.9); review exit financing commitment letter (2.4).
Jerrard, Erik	07/21/21	8.2	Call with Aeroméxico, Rothschild, AlixPartners, and Davis Polk Finance team regarding exit financing grid (0.5); call with counsel to stakeholder and L. Borchardt regarding securities laws analysis regarding rights offering (0.3); call with potential financing provider counsel regarding exit process (0.5); correspondence with S. Piraino regarding same (0.3); call with same and others regarding exit financing (1.6); email with potential exit financing counterparty regarding exit financing Non-Disclosure Agreement issues (0.4); review and revise equity financing term sheet (1.4); review and revise exit financing commitment letters (0.7); review and revise Exit Financing motion (2.9); email with V. Jackson and A. Troconis regarding debt financing commitment (0.4).
Jerrard, Erik	07/21/21	1.1	Attend daily contingency update call with Aeroméxico and Rothschild.
Katz, Michael	07/21/21	1.8	Correspondence with AlixPartners and Rothschild regarding exit financing issues (0.1); review and revise conditionality provisions (1.1); correspondence with V. Jackson regarding the same (0.2); call with AlixPartners and Aeroméxico regarding exit financing grid proposal (0.4).
Lee, Lloyd	07/21/21	0.7	Call with Davis Polk Finance and Restructuring teams regarding exit financing grid (0.4); email with Davis Polk Finance team regarding exit financing facility (0.3).
Piraino, Stephen D.	07/21/21	3.8	Call with E. Jerrard and others regarding exit financing (1.6); call with potential financing provider regarding same (0.5); correspondence with E. Jerrard regarding exit financing securities law issues (0.7); attend daily contingency update call with Aeroméxico and Rothschild (1.0).
Simmonds, Alexander W.	07/21/21	7.1	Review and revise rights offering term sheet and issues list regarding same (4.2); correspondence with Rothschild, AlixPartners, and Sainz Abogados teams regarding revised rights offering term sheet (0.4); attend daily contingency update call with Aeroméxico and Rothschild (0.9); call with Sainz Abogados team regarding securities law issues regarding exit financing (0.5); correspondence with L. Borchardt, S. Piraino, and M. Masaro regarding same (0.7); call with counsel to stakeholder regarding same (0.4).
Troconis, Adela	07/21/21	6.0	Email with counsel to stakeholder regarding exit financing grid (0.3); attend daily contingency update call with Aeroméxico and Rothschild (1.0); call with Aeroméxico, Rothschild, AlixPartners, and Davis Polk Finance team regarding exit financing grid (0.5); review and comment on exit debt

		Time	Detail By Project
Name	Date	Hours	Narrative
Weigel, Heather	07/21/21	1.9	financing commitment letter (4.2). Review and revise rights offering term sheet (1.3); review and revise exit equity financing commitment letter (0.4); correspondence with Aeroméxico and advisors regarding same (0.1); correspondence with counsel to stakeholder and
Bane, Abraham	07/22/21	3.3	advisors regarding same (0.1). Correspondence with M. Masaro and R. Steinberg regarding exit financing proposal (0.5); review case law regarding issue related to same (0.4); revise Exit Financing motion (2.3);
Borchardt, Leo	07/22/21	1.5	correspondence with E. Jerrard regarding same (0.1). Attend daily contingency update call with Aeroméxico and Rothschild (0.8); review revised rights offering term sheet
Graulich, Timothy	07/22/21	4.1	(0.7). Call with A. Conesa and R. Sanchez Baker regarding exit financing (0.8); correspondence with S. Piraino and E. Jerrard regarding exit financing proposal (1.7); call with B. Miller regarding same (0.5); call with M. Huebner regarding Plan and term sheet issues (0.4); call with A. Sainz regarding exit financing proposal (0.7).
Jackson, Vanessa L.	07/22/21	1.8	Attend daily contingency update call with Aeroméxico and Rothschild (0.8); review revised exit financing commitment letter (1.0).
Jerrard, Erik	07/22/21	9.1	Call with S. Piraino and others regarding exit financing process status and strategy (1.0); correspondence with S. Piraino regarding exit financing documents (0.4); review and revise debt and exit financing proposal commitment documents (2.3); email with Davis Polk Restructuring and Corporate teams regarding same (0.7); email with counsel to stakeholder regarding exit financing Non-Disclosure Agreement (0.8); review and revise Exit Financing motion (2.3); review precedent regarding same (0.4); attend daily contingency update call with Aeroméxico and Rothschild (1.2); correspondence with S. Piraino regarding same (0.3).
Lee, Lloyd Piraino, Stephen D.	07/22/21 07/22/21	0.2 3.0	Review emails with Davis Polk team regarding exit financing. Call with Sainz Abogados team regarding exit financing issues (0.9); call with E. Jerrard and others regarding process and strategy regarding same (1.0); correspondence with T. Graulich and others regarding exit financing securities law issues (0.5); call with Willkie Farr and others regarding exit financing (0.6).
Simmonds, Alexander W.	07/22/21	1.6	Review rights offer term sheet (0.3); review Sainz Abogados' comments to same (0.3); correspondence with L. Borchardt and H. Weigel regarding same (0.2); attend daily contingency update call with Aeroméxico and Rothschild (0.8) (partial attendance).
Troconis, Adela	07/22/21	6.2	Attend daily contingency update call with Aeroméxico and Rothschild (0.9); review, analyze and comment on exit debt financing commitment letters (5.3).
Weigel, Heather Bane, Abraham	07/22/21 07/23/21	1.8 3.9	Review and revise rights offering term sheet. Review and revise Exit Financing motion (1.4); draft declaration in support of same (2.1); correspondence with E. Jerrard regarding same (0.2); correspondence with Rothschild, Sainz Abogados, and Davis Polk team regarding same (0.2).
Borchardt, Leo	07/23/21	2.4	Call with potential exit financing provider regarding exit commitment letter issues (1.1); prepare for same (0.9);

		Time	Detail By Project
Name	Date	Hours	Narrative
Ford, Stephen	07/23/21	3.7	correspondence with E. Jerrard regarding same (0.3); call with same regarding same (0.1). Review and revise exit financing Non-Disclosure Agreements (3.2); correspondence with E. Jerrard regarding same (0.2); correspondence with Rothschild regarding same (0.2); call
Graulich, Timothy	07/23/21	6.9	with counterparty regarding same (0.1). Call with A. Conesa and R. Sanchez Baker regarding exit financing process (1.0); review rights offering term sheet (2.2); correspondence with H. Weigel regarding same (1.3); comment on revised debt term sheet (2.4).
Jackson, Vanessa L. Jerrard, Erik	07/23/21 07/23/21	0.7 8.8	Review exit financing commitment letter. Correspondence with T. Graulich regarding exit financing strategy (0.6); email with same regarding final valuation materials and related process (0.4); call with potential exit financing provider regarding exit financing process and issues (0.8); correspondence with counsel to potential lender group regarding exit process (0.7); review and revise Exit Financing motion (1.4); analyze exit commitment proposal issues (2.6); review and revise exit commitment documents (0.8); call with potential exit financing provider regarding exit commitment letter issues (1.1); prepare for same (0.3); call with L. Borchardt regarding same (0.1).
Katz, Michael	07/23/21	0.2	Correspondence with Aeroméxico and financial advisors regarding comments to debt term sheet.
Piraino, Stephen D.	07/23/21	4.8	Attend daily contingency update call with Aeroméxico and Rothschild (0.9); correspondence with T. Graulich and E. Jerrard regarding exit financing (1.4); email with counsel to potential exit financing parties regarding exit financing Non-Disclosure Agreement (0.5); call with potential exit financing provider and others regarding exit financing (2.0).
Simmonds, Alexander W.	07/23/21	3.2	Review and revise exit equity financing commitment letter (1.6); correspondence with L. Borchardt and E. Jerrard regarding same (0.4); call with counsel to stakeholder regarding rights offering term sheet (1.2).
Troconis, Adela	07/23/21	1.5	Comment on exit debt financing commitment letter (0.8); comment on term sheet regarding same (0.7).
Weigel, Heather	07/23/21	1.9	Call with counsel to stakeholder, financial advisor to stakeholder, and Sainz Abogados regarding rights offering (1.2); review exit equity financing commitment letter (0.7).
Borchardt, Leo	07/24/21	2.9	Review and comment on Exit Financing motion (1.4); review exit debt financing commitment letter (0.5); review exit equity financing commitment letter (0.6); call with potential exit financing provider regarding exit financing commitment letter (0.4).
Ford, Stephen	07/24/21	1.2	Correspondence with Skyworks and Rothschild regarding exit financing Non-Disclosure Agreement (0.1); correspondence with exit financing Non-Disclosure Agreement counterparty regarding same (0.1); correspondence with Davis Polk team and Rothschild regarding exit financing Non-Disclosure Agreement (0.5); correspondence with Aeroméxico regarding same (0.2); correspondence with exit financing Non-Disclosure Agreement counterparty regarding same (0.1); correspondence with Davis Polk team regarding execution of same (0.1); call with M. Sutter regarding same (0.1).
Jackson, Vanessa L.	07/24/21	4.8	Review and revise exit financing commitment letter (1.3); review and revise term sheet regarding same (1.7); call with

		Time	Detail By Project
Name	Date	Hours	Narrative
Jerrard, Erik	07/24/21	2.3	counsel to stakeholder and Davis Polk Finance team regarding exit debt financing commitment letter (0.6); correspondence with Davis Polk Finance team regarding exit financing issue (1.2). Call with counsel to stakeholder and Davis Polk Finance team regarding exit debt financing commitment letter (0.6); call with counsel to stakeholder and Davis Polk teams regarding exit
Katz, Michael	07/24/21	0.8	equity financing commitment letter (0.4); review and analyze exit financing commitment letters (1.3). Review exit financing grid issues list (0.1); correspondence with Rothschild and counsel to stakeholder regarding same
Piraino, Stephen D.	07/24/21	0.2	(0.7). Email with Creditors Committee and Aeroméxico regarding
Simmonds, Alexander W.	07/24/21	3.6	exit financing Non-Disclosure Agreement. Call with counsel to stakeholder and Davis Polk teams regarding exit equity financing commitment letter (0.5); call with potential exit financing provider regarding exit financing commitment letter (0.4); review exit equity financing commitment letter (0.4); review exit debt financing commitment letter (0.3); review and comment on Exit Financing motion (1.0); review and comment on declaration in support of same (0.8); correspondence with A. Bane regarding same (0.2).
Troconis, Adela	07/24/21	7.5	Review and comment on exit debt financing commitment letter (3.5); review and comment on term sheet regarding same (3.4); call with counsel to stakeholder and Davis Polk Finance team regarding same (0.6).
Weigel, Heather	07/24/21	1.2	Review and revise exit equity financing commitment letter (0.8); call with potential exit financing provider regarding exit financing commitment letter (0.4).
Borchardt, Leo	07/25/21	2.1	Review and comment on rights offering term sheet (1.2); review and revise issue list regarding same (0.9).
Graulich, Timothy Jerrard, Erik	07/25/21 07/25/21	1.0 2.9	Call with A. Conesa regarding exit financing. Call with S. Piraino, C. Rincon, and others regarding exit
			financing process (0.8); call with S. Piraino regarding same (0.2); review and revise proposed exit financing commitment materials (1.4); email with Davis Polk Finance team regarding exit financing issues (0.5).
Piraino, Stephen D.	07/25/21	1.0	Call with C. Rincon, E. Jerrard and others regarding exit financing process (0.8); call with E. Jerrard regarding same (0.2).
Rincon, Cristina M.	07/25/21	0.8	Call with E. Jerrard, S. Piraino, and others regarding exit financing process.
Simmonds, Alexander W.	07/25/21	6.7	Review and revise rights offering term sheet issues list (1.9); correspondence with L. Borchardt and E. Jerrard regarding same (0.3); review and revise rights offering term sheet (4.1); correspondence Aeroméxico and counsel to stakeholder regarding same (0.4).
Troconis, Adela	07/25/21	0.3	Email with Davis Polk Finance team regarding exit debt financing commitment letter and term sheet regarding same.
Bane, Abraham Borchardt, Leo	07/26/21 07/26/21	1.3 1.6	Revise Exit Financing motion and proposed order. Analyze exit equity financing commitment letter (0.4); call with Aeroméxico and co-advisors regarding same and rights offering term sheet (1.0); review revised draft of same (0.2).
Ford, Stephen	07/26/21	1.3	Review and revise exit financing Non-Disclosure Agreements (1.1); coordinate execution of same (0.2).

		Time	Detail By Project
Name	Date	Hours	Narrative
Graulich, Timothy	07/26/21	7.2	Call with A. Conesa and R. Sanchez Baker regarding exit financing (1.0); review Apollo exit financing proposal (0.4); review exit financing proposal (1.8); review of exit financing proposal (2.1); call with R. Cooper regarding Apollo exit financing proposal (0.4); call with A. Sainz regarding exit financing (0.8); call with H. Parkhill regarding exit financing proposals (0.7).
Jackson, Vanessa L. Jerrard, Erik	07/26/21 07/26/21	1.1 3.2	Attend update call with company and Rothschild. Email with L. Borchardt regarding exit financing term sheet drafting issues (0.3); review exit financing proposals (0.7); correspondence with T. Graulich and S. Piraino regarding exit financing (1.3); attend daily contingency update call with Aeroméxico and Rothschild (0.9).
Katz, Michael	07/26/21	0.1	Review various email correspondences regarding financing proposal.
Piraino, Stephen D.	07/26/21	4.0	Attend daily contingency update call with Aeroméxico and Rothschild (1.3); call with T. Graulich and E. Jerrard regarding exit financing matters (1.3); call with E. Jerrard regarding exit financing (0.3); review exit financing term sheets (0.7); correspondence with T. Graulich regarding exit financing matters (0.4).
Simmonds, Alexander W.	07/26/21	2.6	Review and comment on exit equity financing commitment letter (0.4); correspondence with Sainz Abogados and Rothschild regarding same (0.8); call with A. Cortes and Aeroméxico team regarding rights offering term sheet (1.0); revise rights offering term sheet (0.5); correspondence with counsel to potential stakeholder regarding same (0.4).
Talamás Velázquez, Ernesto	07/26/21	2.0	Review Mexican IPO prospectus (1.0); prepare translation of applicable sections (1.0).
Troconis, Adela	07/26/21	0.3	Review and revise Exit Financing motion.
Bane, Abraham	07/27/21	1.3	Review case law regarding exit financing issue (0.9); revise Exit Financing motion (0.4).
Borchardt, Leo	07/27/21	1.5	Review exit equity financing commitment letter and term sheet regarding same (1.1); correspondence with A. Simmonds regarding principal issues (0.2); call with E. Jerrard regarding exit financing process (0.2).
Ford, Stephen	07/27/21	0.3	Coordinate execution of exit financing Non-Disclosure Agreement.
Graulich, Timothy	07/27/21	7.6	Call with A. Conesa and R. Sanchez Baker regarding exit financing (1.0); call with shareholder counsel regarding exit
Jerrard, Erik	07/27/21	4.7	process (1.2); review exit financing final proposals (5.4). Call with R. Arnold regarding exit financing (0.2); call with S. Piraino and others regarding exit financing process update (0.6); correspondence with T. Graulich regarding same (0.6); call with S. Alessio Robles regarding exit financing process (0.1); call with shareholders' counsel and others regarding same (0.7); extensive email with T. Graulich and S. Piraino regarding exit financing issues (2.1); email with Morris Nichols regarding exit financing fee issues (0.2); call with L. Borchardt regarding exit financing process (0.2).
Katz, Michael	07/27/21	0.5	Review collateral closing set (0.4); correspondences with L. Lee regarding same (0.1).
Lee, Lloyd	07/27/21	1.8	Email with Davis Polk Finance team regarding exit financing (0.4); draft collateral agreement closing set (1.4).
Piraino, Stephen D.	07/27/21	5.3	Attend daily contingency update call with Aeroméxico and Rothschild (1.0); correspondence with E. Jerrard regarding

		Time	Detail By Project
Name	Date	Hours	Narrative
Simmondo	07/07/04	2.5	exit financing (1.4); call with E. Jerrard and others regarding exit financing update (0.6); correspondence with T. Graulich regarding same (0.7); call with counsel to potential financing providers regarding exit financing issues (0.9).
Simmonds, Alexander W.	07/27/21	2.5	Review exit equity financing commitment letter (0.5); review term sheet regarding same (0.4); prepare summary regarding same (0.9); research precedent rights offerings (0.7).
Bane, Abraham	07/28/21	0.8	Revise Exit Financing motion and supporting declaration.
Borchardt, Leo	07/28/21	0.3	Call with E. Jerrard regarding exit financing process.
Graulich, Timothy	07/28/21	4.2	Call with A. Conesa regarding exit financing (0.9); prepare for mediation request (3.3).
Jerrard, Erik	07/28/21	8.0	Review and analyze Creditors Committee exit financing letter (0.6); email with T. Graulich regarding same (0.3); email with V. Jackson regarding exit financing process (0.3); call with L. Borchardt regarding exit financing (0.3); analyze schedule 2.12 of DIP credit agreement regarding exit financing issues (1.6); draft final valuations materials cover note (1.4); email with Davis Polk Restructuring team (M. Huebner, T. Graulich, S. Piraino) regarding same (0.4); email with Davis Polk Restructuring team regarding final valuation delivery (0.5); attend daily contingency update call with Aeroméxico and Rothschild (1.1).
Piraino, Stephen D.	07/28/21	3.6	Correspondence with E. Jerrard regarding exit financing (0.9); call with counsel to potential exit financing party regarding same (0.2); review letter from potential exit financing party regarding same (0.2); extensive correspondence with T. Graulich and E. Jerrard regarding exit financing process (0.8); review and revise final valuation materials cover note (0.4); attend daily contingency update call with Aeroméxico and Rothschild (1.1).
Bane, Abraham	07/29/21	2.2	Correspondence with T. Graulich, J. McClammy and others regarding Mediation Statement (0.6); correspondence with S. Piraino, E. Jerrard, and M. Masaro regarding same (0.3); review mediation statement precedent (0.4); draft Mediation Statement (0.8).
Graulich, Timothy	07/29/21	11.2	Review and revise final valuation materials (2.2); prepare for Chambers conference regarding mediation (1.8); attend Chambers conference regarding mediation (0.5); prepare for mediation (2.3); call with J. Lane regarding Chamber conference regarding mediation (1.3); call with A. Schwartz regarding same (0.5); draft outline of Mediation Statement (2.6).
Jerrard, Erik	07/29/21	8.8	Attend daily contingency update call with Aeroméxico and Rothschild (0.2) (partial attendance); call with S. Piraino regarding exit financing and related mediation (0.3); correspondence with T. Graulich regarding exit financing (0.5); correspondence with same and S. Piraino regarding mediation preparation (0.5); attend Chambers conference regarding mediation (0.7); call with Judge Lane and others regarding same (1.4); call with Davis Polk Litigation team regarding same (1.1); email with Davis Polk team regarding same (0.5); finalize final valuations materials cover note (0.6); correspondence with Rothschild and S. Piraino regarding exit financing next steps (0.3); analyze schedule 2.12 of DIP loan agreement to prepare for Mediation Statement (2.8).

		Time	Detail By Project
Name	Date	Hours	Narrative
Katz, Michael	07/29/21	0.2	Review email with Davis Polk team regarding collateral
Masaro, Matthew Bruno	07/29/21	5.1	supplement requirement for new engine. Review and revise Mediation order (0.9); correspondence with S. Piraino and others regarding same (0.5); attend Chambers conference regarding mediation (0.7); correspondence with S. Piraino and others regarding same (0.7); correspondence with S. Piraino, T. Graulich, and others regarding mediation (1.3); call with Judge Lane and other mediation parties regarding
Piraino, Stephen D.	07/29/21	7.1	same (1.0) (partial attendance). Revise exit financing mediation relevant event (0.4); correspondence with T. Graulich and E. Jerrard regarding exit financing (0.9); attend Chamber conference regarding mediation (0.7); call with E. Jerrard regarding exit financing and related mediation (0.3); call with Judge Lane and others regarding same (1.4); correspondence with T. Graulich regarding exit financing mediation (0.2); call with Davis Polk Litigation team regarding same (0.8); correspondence with M. Masaro and E. Jerrard regarding same (0.3); correspondence with M. Masaro regarding same (0.5); correspondence with Davis Polk team regarding same (0.7); review and revise Mediation order (0.4); call with Rothschild regarding exit financing (0.1); attend daily contingency update call with Aeroméxico and Rothschild (0.4).
Rincon, Cristina M. Steinberg, Richard J.	07/29/21 07/29/21	0.8 4.1	Call with Davis Polk Restructuring team regarding mediation. Attend Chambers conference regarding mediation (1.5); call with Judge Lane and others regarding same (1.4); call with Davis Polk Litigation and Restructuring teams regarding mediation (1.2).
Bane, Abraham	07/30/21	4.1	Draft overview of Mediation Statement (0.6); correspondence with T. Graulich and others regarding same (0.3); draft Mediation Statement (3.1); correspondence with E. Jerrard regarding same (0.1).
Graulich, Timothy	07/30/21	6.8	Call with H. Parkhill and L. Donahue regarding mediation (0.4); call with A. Conesa and R. Sanchez Baker regarding same (1.0); correspondence with S. Piraino and E. Jerrard regarding Mediation Statement (1.4); call with counsel to potential exit financing provider regarding mediation (0.8); revise outline of Mediation Statement (3.2).
Huebner, Marshall S.	07/30/21	0.5	Correspondence with Davis Polk Restructuring team regarding mediation.
Jerrard, Erik	07/30/21	7.4	Call with Rothschild regarding exit financing process (0.3); attend daily contingency update call with Aeroméxico and Rothschild (0.8); correspondence with S. Piraino regarding mediation (0.4); correspondence with same and T. Graulich regarding same and next steps (0.9); review and revise Mediation Statement outline (1.2); review and revise Mediation Statement (3.6); correspondence with Cleary Gottlieb regarding DIP credit agreement (0.2).
Katz, Michael	07/30/21	0.6	Correspondence with A. Troconis regarding status of exit
Masaro, Matthew Bruno	07/30/21	6.9	financing process and collateral request. Review and revise Mediation Statement (4.4); correspondence with Sainz Abogados, S. Piraino, and others regarding same (1.2); review and revise Mediation order (0.7); correspondence with Aeroméxico, S. Piraino, and others regarding same (0.6).
Piraino, Stephen D.	07/30/21	6.7	Attend daily contingency update call with Aeroméxico and Rothschild (1.0); call with Rothschild team regarding mediation

		Detail By Project	
Name	Date	Hours	Narrative
			(0.3); review Mediation Statement outline (1.2); correspondence with E. Jerrard regarding mediation (0.2); review and revise Mediation order (1.0); correspondence with T. Graulich and E. Jerrard regarding mediation (0.9); review and revise relevant event regarding mediation (0.5); review and revise Mediation Statement (1.4); correspondence with C. Rincon regarding Mediation order (0.2).
Rincon, Cristina M.	07/30/21	0.7	Call with Davis Polk Restructuring team regarding mediation procedures (0.4); review same (0.3).
Steinberg, Richard J.	07/30/21	8.1	Extensive review and revision of Mediation Statement.
Troconis, Adela	07/30/21	0.7	Correspondence with M. Katz regarding status of exit financing process.
Bane, Abraham	07/31/21	1.7	Review E. Jerrard's comments to Mediation Statement (0.8); revise same (0.9).
Jerrard, Erik	07/31/21	7.1	Review and revise DIP process overview section of Mediation Statement (6.4); email with A. Bane regarding same (0.7).
Masaro, Matthew Bruno	07/31/21	2.7	Review and revise Mediation order (0.5); correspondence with S. Piraino and others regarding same (0.8); review and revise Mediation Statement (1.0); correspondence with D. O'Sullivan and others regarding same (0.4).
O'Sullivan, Damian	07/31/21	2.6	Review and revise Mexican law considerations section of Mediation Statement.
Piraino, Stephen D.	07/31/21	2.2	Review and revise Mediation order (0.7); review and revise Mediation Statement (1.2); correspondence with R. Steinberg regarding same (0.3).
Steinberg, Richard J.	07/31/21	8.3	Extensive drafting and revising of Mediation Statement.
Total AM190 Financir	ng	796.2	
AM200 General Case	Administration		
Jerrard, Erik	07/01/21	0.5	Review relevant event disclosure (0.3); correspondence with S. Piraino and T. Graulich regarding same (0.2).
Rincon, Cristina M.	07/01/21	0.5	Correspondence with J. McClammy regarding case workstreams.
Huebner, Marshall S. Melcer, Moshe	07/02/21 07/02/21	0.4 0.2	Correspondence with T. Graulich regarding case updates. Correspondence with E. Jerrard regarding outstanding
			workstreams.
Piraino, Stephen D.	07/02/21	1.3	Correspondence with E. Jerrard regarding case updates (0.9); email to T. Graulich regarding case updates (0.4).
Melcer, Moshe Jerrard, Erik	07/04/21 07/06/21	0.8 3.5	Draft July Omnibus Hearing agenda. Correspondence with T. Graulich and S. Piraino regarding case strategy (0.8); correspondence with R. Steinberg and S. Piraino regarding same (0.5); prepare for weekly workstreams call with Davis Polk Restructuring team (1.9); coordinate with M. Melcer on filing July Omnibus Hearing agenda (0.3).
Masaro, Matthew Bruno	07/06/21	0.1	Correspondence with M. Melcer regarding Certificate of No Objection to severance motion.
Melcer, Moshe	07/06/21	1.0	Revise case status summary (0.3); draft July Omnibus Hearing agenda (0.5); draft Certificate of No Objection to severance motion (0.3).
Piraino, Stephen D.	07/06/21	1.2	Correspondence with E. Jerrard regarding case updates (0.6); correspondence with R. Steinberg and E. Jerrard regarding same (0.6).
Steinberg, Richard J.	07/06/21	0.6	Correspondence with E. Jerrard and S. Piraino regarding case updates.

		Time	Detail By Project
Name	Date	Hours	Narrative
Sturm, Josh	07/06/21	0.3	Correspondence with T. Graulich and others regarding case
Bane, Abraham	07/07/21	1.1	updates. Attend weekly workstreams call with Davis Polk Restructuring team (0.8); review and revise letter to Ad Hoc Group (0.3);
Ford, Stephen	07/07/21	0.8	correspondence with S. Piraino regarding same (0.12. Attend weekly workstreams call with Davis Polk Restructuring team.
Jerrard, Erik	07/07/21	2.1	Correspondence with T. Graulich, S. Piraino, and J. McClammy regarding case process (0.5); email with Cleary Gottlieb regarding same (0.5); attend weekly workstreams call with Davis Polk Restructuring team (0.8); prepare for same (0.3).
Masaro, Matthew Bruno	07/07/21	0.8	Attend weekly workstreams call with Davis Polk Restructuring team.
Melcer, Moshe	07/07/21	1.3	Draft notice of cancellation of July 8th Hearing (0.5); attend weekly workstreams call with Davis Polk Restructuring team (0.8).
Piraino, Stephen D.	07/07/21	1.1	Attend weekly workstreams call with Davis Polk Restructuring team (0.8); correspondence with E. Jerrard regarding case updates (0.3).
Steinberg, Richard J.	07/07/21	0.9	Attend weekly workstreams call with Davis Polk Restructuring team.
Sturm, Josh	07/07/21	0.2	Analyze case workstreams issues.
Jerrard, Erik	07/08/21	1.1	Review and revise Certificate of No Objection to omnibus claims objections (0.4); email with M. Melcer regarding submission of orders (0.7).
Masaro, Matthew Bruno	07/08/21	0.2	Correspondence with Chambers and M. Melcer regarding Certificate of No Objection and proposed order to severance motion.
Piraino, Stephen D. Jerrard, Erik	07/08/21 07/09/21	0.3 0.5	Correspondence with E. Jerrard regarding case updates. Correspondence with S. Piraino regarding case updates and next steps.
Piraino, Stephen D.	07/09/21	0.5	Correspondence with E. Jerrard regarding case updates.
Jerrard, Erik	07/12/21	1.4	Correspondence with S. Piraino regarding case updates.
Masaro, Matthew Bruno	07/12/21	0.4	Correspondence with AlixPartners regarding monthly operating report, and Rule 2015.3 report.
Piraino, Stephen D. Jerrard, Erik	07/12/21 07/13/21	0.2 0.8	Correspondence with E. Jerrard regarding case updates. Correspondence with T. Graulich and S. Piraino regarding
Malaar Maaba	07/13/21	0.2	case updates (0.6); call with S. Piraino regarding same (0.2).
Melcer, Moshe Piraino, Stephen D.	07/13/21	0.2 1.2	Review and revise case status summary. Correspondence with T. Graulich and E. Jerrard regarding
Bane, Abraham	07/14/21	1.0	case updates (1.0); call with E. Jerrard regarding same (0.2). Attend weekly workstreams call with Davis Polk Restructuring team.
Ford, Stephen	07/14/21	1.3	Attend weekly workstreams call with Davis Polk Restructuring team.
Green, Thomas S.	07/14/21	1.2	Attend weekly workstreams call with Davis Polk Restructuring team.
Jerrard, Erik	07/14/21	4.1	Attend weekly workstreams call with Davis Polk Restructuring team (1.3); prepare for same (1.6); correspondence with S. Piraino regarding same (0.4); email regarding potential monthly operating report issues (0.5); correspondence with R. Steinberg regarding same (0.3).
Masaro, Matthew Bruno	07/14/21	1.4	Attend weekly workstreams call with Davis Polk Restructuring team (1.3); prepare for same (0.1).
Melcer, Moshe	07/14/21	1.4	Attend weekly workstreams call with Davis Polk Restructuring

		111110	Detail By Project
Name	Date	Hours	Narrative
			team (1.3); revise case status summary (0.1).
O'Sullivan, Damian	07/14/21	1.1	Attend weekly workstreams call with Davis Polk Restructuring team (partial attendance).
Piraino, Stephen D.	07/14/21	1.7	Attend weekly workstreams call with Davis Polk Restructuring
•			team (1.3); correspondence with E. Jerrard regarding case status (0.4).
Steinberg, Richard J.	07/14/21	1.1	Attend weekly workstreams call with Davis Polk Restructuring team (partial attendance).
Szanzer, Steven Z.	07/14/21	1.3	Attend weekly workstreams call with Davis Polk Restructuring team.
Piraino, Stephen D.	07/15/21	1.0	Correspondence with E. Jerrard regarding case updates.
Jerrard, Erik	07/16/21	0.4	Correspondence with S. Piraino regarding case updates.
Piraino, Stephen D.	07/16/21	0.4	Correspondence with E. Jerrard regarding case updates.
Jerrard, Erik	07/19/21	0.9	Email with M. Melcer regarding monthly operating report (0.2);
,			call with M. Melcer to discuss case updates (0.2); call with T.
			Graulich regarding case update (0.3); debrief from same with
			S. Piraino (0.2).
Piraino, Stephen D.	07/19/21	0.8	Correspondence with E. Jerrard regarding case updates.
Jerrard, Erik	07/20/21	2.4	Prepare for weekly workstreams call with Davis Polk
oorara, Erik	01720721	2.1	Restructuring team (2.2); correspondence with S. Piraino
			regarding case updates (0.2).
Masaro, Matthew	07/20/21	0.3	Review monthly operating report (0.2); correspondence with
Bruno	01120121	0.0	S. Piraino and others regarding same (0.1).
Piraino, Stephen D.	07/20/21	0.4	Correspondence with E. Jerrard regarding case updates.
Bane, Abraham	07/20/21		
bane, Abraham	07/21/21	1.0	Attend weekly workstreams call with Davis Polk Restructuring
Fand Otamban	07/04/04	4.0	team.
Ford, Stephen	07/21/21	1.0	Attend weekly workstreams call with Davis Polk Restructuring
0 1:1 7: 11	07/04/04	4.0	team.
Graulich, Timothy	07/21/21	1.0	Attend weekly workstreams call with Davis Polk Restructuring
	07/04/04	4.0	team.
Green, Thomas S.	07/21/21	1.3	Attend weekly workstreams call with Davis Polk Restructuring
			team (1.0); call with Chambers regarding hearing scheduling
			(0.3).
Jerrard, Erik	07/21/21	2.5	Attend weekly workstreams call with Davis Polk Restructuring
			team (1.0); call with AlixPartners and M. Masaro monthly
			operating report (0.7); review monthly operating report in
			preparation for same (0.8).
Masaro, Matthew	07/21/21	1.8	Attend weekly workstreams call with Davis Polk Restructuring
Bruno			team (1.0); call with AlixPartners and E. Jerrard regarding
			monthly operating report (0.7); review draft monthly operating
			report (0.1).
Melcer, Moshe	07/21/21	0.1	Revise case summary status.
O'Sullivan, Damian	07/21/21	1.0	Attend weekly workstreams call with Davis Polk Restructuring
-		-	team.
Piraino, Stephen D.	07/21/21	2.3	Attend weekly workstreams call with Davis Polk Restructuring
,	0.72.72.		team (1.0); correspondence with E. Jerrard regarding case
			updates (1.3).
Romero-Wagner,	07/21/21	1.0	Attend weekly workstreams call with Davis Polk Restructuring
Alex B.	01/21/21	1.0	team.
Steinberg, Richard J.	07/21/21	1.1	Attend weekly workstreams call with Davis Polk Restructuring
otellibery, Michard J.	01121121	1.1	•
Czanzar Stavan Z	07/24/24	4 4	team.
Szanzer, Steven Z.	07/21/21	1.4	Correspondence with Chambers regarding upcoming fleet
			filings (0.4); attend weekly workstreams call with Davis Polk
Dinaina Otaula D	07/00/04	4.0	Restructuring team (1.0).
Piraino, Stephen D.	07/22/21	1.9	Correspondence with E. Jerrard regarding case updates.
Jerrard, Erik	07/26/21	0.1	Correspondence with S. Piraino regarding case updates.
			46

		Time	Detail By Project
Name	Date	Hours	Narrative
Masaro, Matthew	07/26/21	0.2	Review and revise monthly operating report (0.1);
Bruno	07/27/24	2.1	correspondence with AlixPartners regarding same (0.1).
Jerrard, Erik	07/27/21	3.1	Correspondence with S. Piraino regarding case updates (0.6); prepare for weekly workstreams call with Davis Polk
			Restructuring team (1.7).
Bane, Abraham	07/28/21	1.0	Attend weekly workstreams call with Davis Polk Restructuring
	0=100101		team.
Ford, Stephen	07/28/21	1.0	Attend weekly workstreams call with Davis Polk Restructuring team.
Graulich, Timothy	07/28/21	1.0	Correspondence with S. Piraino regarding case workstreams.
Green, Thomas S.	07/28/21	0.5	Attend weekly workstreams call with Davis Polk Restructuring
Groom, rinomac c.	01120121	0.0	team (partial attendance).
Jerrard, Erik	07/28/21	1.4	Attend weekly workstreams call with Davis Polk Restructuring
			team (1.0); email with J. Barsalona regarding case updates
	07/00/04		(0.4).
Masaro, Matthew Bruno	07/28/21	1.0	Attend weekly workstreams call with Davis Polk Restructuring team.
Melcer, Moshe	07/28/21	0.7	Attend weekly workstreams call with Davis Polk Restructuring
Meicel, Mosile	01120121	0.7	team (partial attendance).
Piraino, Stephen D.	07/28/21	1.0	Attend weekly workstreams call with Davis Polk Restructuring
, ,			team.
Romero-Wagner,	07/28/21	1.0	Attend weekly workstreams call with Davis Polk Restructuring
Alex B.			team.
Steinberg, Richard J.	07/28/21	1.0	Attend weekly workstreams call with Davis Polk Restructuring
Czanzar Stavan Z	07/28/21	1.1	team.
Szanzer, Steven Z.	07/28/21	1.1	Attend weekly workstreams call with Davis Polk Restructuring team (1.0); review agenda regarding same (0.1).
Masaro, Matthew	07/29/21	0.4	Review monthly operating reports (0.1); correspondence with
Bruno	0.72072.	• • • • • • • • • • • • • • • • • • • •	AlixPartners, T. Graulich, and others regarding same (0.2);
			correspondence with M. Giddens and O. Altman regarding
			same (0.1).
Jerrard, Erik	07/30/21	0.2	
Masaro, Matthew	07/30/21	0.2	Correspondence with T. Graulich and others regarding
Bruno			monthly operating report.
Total AM200 General	Case	80.0	
Administration			
AM210 Non-DPW Ret	ention and Fee I	201102	
Jerrard, Erik	07/06/21	0.3	Email with T. Graulich regarding KPMG retention application.
Piraino, Stephen D.	07/07/21	0.4	Review KPMG retention application (0.2); email Davis Polk
			team regarding same (0.2).
Jerrard, Erik	07/08/21	2.8	Email with Morris Nichols regarding The Lee Group ("TLG")
			and De La Vega retentions (0.8); review and revise KPMG
			retention application (1.6); email with Morris Nichols team
Jerrard, Erik	07/09/21	2.6	regarding same (0.4). Review and revise TLG retention materials (0.8); review and
Jenaiu, Liik	07709721	2.0	revise De La Vega retention materials (0.7); correspondence
			with J. Barsalona and M. Fu regarding same (0.3); review
			revised draft of same (0.8).
Masaro, Matthew	07/09/21	0.2	Correspondence with Morris Nichols and Aeroméxico
Bruno	07/10/01		regarding De La Vega retention.
Jerrard, Erik	07/12/21	1.3	Review De La Vega retention application (0.6); email with
			Morris Nichols regarding same (0.4); review TLG retention
Masaro, Matthew	07/12/21	0.3	application (0.3). Correspondence with AlixPartners and others regarding
iviasaio, ivialliiew	01112121	0.3	Correspondence with All altiters and others regarding

		Time	Detail By Project
Name	Date	Hours	Narrative
Bruno Bane, Abraham	07/13/21	1.0	retention applications. Review potential parties of interest (0.3); conduct semi-annual review of same (0.6); correspondence with co-advisors regarding same (0.1).
Jerrard, Erik	07/13/21	1.2	Revise KPMG retention application (0.4); email with Morris Nichols regarding same (0.3); email with A. Bane regarding conflicts disclosure update (0.2); analyze retention orders regarding same (0.3).
Masaro, Matthew Bruno	07/14/21	0.4	Review Epiq's retention order (0.3); correspondence with Epiq regarding same (0.1).
Jerrard, Erik	07/19/21	0.4	Call with J. Barsalona and KPMG counsel regarding KPMG retention application.
Jerrard, Erik	07/20/21	0.8	Call with J. Barsalona regarding KPMG and other retentions (0.3); call with A. Schwartz regarding De la Vega retention (0.3); call with J. Barsalona regarding same (0.2).
Jerrard, Erik	07/21/21	0.6	Review KPMG analysis from Morris Nichols (0.4); email with Morris Nichols regarding same (0.2).
Masaro, Matthew Bruno	07/23/21	0.3	Review and revise ordinary course professional supplement (0.2); correspondence with M. Fu and E. Jerrard regarding same (0.1).
Jerrard, Erik	07/28/21	2.0	Review and revise KPMG retention application (0.7); call with A. Schwartz regarding same (0.3); correspondence with T. Graulich regarding same (0.3); correspondence with S. Piraino regarding same (0.3); email with R. Sanchez Baker regarding same (0.4).
Szanzer, Steven Z.	07/28/21	0.3	Correspondence with A. Andreeva and Davis Polk Fleet team regarding retaining ordinary course professional for fleet workstream.
Jerrard, Erik Masaro, Matthew Bruno	07/30/21 07/30/21	0.3 0.3	Review and revise ordinary course professional supplement. Correspondence with AlixPartners, T. Graulich and others regarding ordinary course professionals retention.
Total AM210 Non-DF and Fee Issues	PW Retention	15.5	
AM230 Plan/Disclos	ure Statement		
Bane, Abraham	07/01/21	2.7	Review and revise Plan (2.1); correspondence with S. Ford regarding same (0.4); correspondence with M. Masaro regarding same (0.2).
Ford, Stephen	07/01/21	6.9	Correspondence with E. Jerrard and A. Bane regarding Plan (0.8); correspondence with E. Jerrard regarding same (0.1); correspondence with A. Bane regarding same (0.1); review and revise Plan (3.7); research issues regarding same (2.2).
O'Sullivan, Damian	07/01/21	3.3	Review precedent and Plan regarding same (0.8); review and revise notices of non-voting status (1.1); review and revise notice of confirmation hearing (0.2); review precedent in connection with same (0.3); review M. Masaro's comments to Disclosure Statement exhibits (0.2); update workstreams summary (0.3); correspondence with M. Masaro regarding Disclosure Statement motion exhibits status (0.4).
Piraino, Stephen D. Bane, Abraham	07/01/21 07/02/21	2.3 1.9	Review and revise Disclosure Statement. Review and revise Plan (1.8); correspondence with S. Ford
Ford, Stephen	07/02/21	7.8	regarding same (0.1). Research issues regarding Plan (2.0); review and revise Plan (5.3); correspondence with A. Bane and M. Masaro regarding same (0.5).

		Time	Detail By Project
Name	Date	Hours	Narrative
Graulich, Timothy	07/02/21	4.0	Review and comment on Disclosure Statement.
Masaro, Matthew	07/02/21	2.7	Review and revise Disclosure Statement motion and related
Bruno			exhibits (1.7); correspondence with Epiq and others regarding
			same (0.4); correspondence with A. Bane and S. Ford
			regarding Plan distributions (0.3); correspondence with S.
			Piraino regarding Disclosure Statement workstreams (0.3).
Piraino, Stephen D.	07/02/21	1.0	Correspondence with M. Masaro regarding Disclosure Statement.
Bane, Abraham	07/06/21	0.7	Review S. Ford's comments to Plan (0.4); revise same (0.3).
Ford, Stephen	07/06/21	8.2	Review and revise Plan (4.7); research issues regarding same (3.5).
Graulich, Timothy	07/06/21	3.8	Review and revise Disclosure Statement.
Masaro, Matthew	07/06/21	2.5	Correspondence with T. Graulich and others regarding Plan
Bruno			(0.1); correspondence with Rothschild, AlixPartners, and
			others regarding same (0.2); correspondence with E. Jerrard,
			S. Piraino, and others regarding same and Disclosure
			Statement (0.2); call with R. Steinberg regarding Disclosure
			Statement (1.0); review and revise exhibits related to same
			(1.0).
Piraino, Stephen D.	07/06/21	0.7	Review and revise Disclosure Statement.
Steinberg, Richard J.	07/06/21	1.0	Call with M. Masaro regarding Disclosure Statement.
Ford, Stephen	07/07/21	0.5	Review and revise Plan.
Jerrard, Erik	07/07/21	0.6	Call with AlixPartners and Rothschild regarding Disclosure
			Statement and related exhibits.
Masaro, Matthew	07/07/21	1.8	Review and revise Disclosure Statement exhibits (0.7);
Bruno			research issues regarding same (0.8); correspondence with S.
			Piraino, R. Steinberg, and others regarding same and Plan (0.2).
Piraino, Stephen D.	07/07/21	1.1	Correspondence with M. Masaro regarding Disclosure
			Statement (0.1); prepare for call on release provisions (0.5);
			call with AlixPartners and Rothschild regarding Disclosure
			Statement and related exhibits (0.5).
Steinberg, Richard J.	07/07/21	0.5	Call with AlixPartners and Rothschild regarding Disclosure
O ,			Statement and related exhibits.
Ford, Stephen	07/08/21	2.6	Review and revise Plan.
Graulich, Timothy	07/08/21	2.3	Review and revise Disclosure Statement.
Jerrard, Erik	07/08/21	2.1	Call with R. Steinberg, M. Masaro, and others regarding Plan
,			and Disclosure Statement (0.5); review and revise Plan (1.6).
Masaro, Matthew	07/08/21	3.6	Call with R. Steinberg, E. Jerrard, and others regarding Plan
Bruno			and Disclosure Statement (0.5); correspondence with R.
			Steinberg regarding Disclosure Statement (0.8); precedent
			review of releases (1.1); draft summary materials regarding
			same (1.2).
O'Sullivan, Damian	07/08/21	0.2	Correspondence with M. Masaro regarding revisions to non-
•			voting status notices (0.1); review precedent regarding same
			(0.1).
Piraino, Stephen D.	07/08/21	1.9	Call with E. Jerrard, M. Masaro, and others regarding Plan
· •			and Disclosure Statement (0.5); analyze Plan issues (1.3).
Steinberg, Richard J.	07/08/21	1.0	Call with E. Jerrard, M. Masaro, and others regarding Plan
3 ,			and Disclosure Statement (0.5); correspondence with M.
			Masaro regarding Disclosure Statement (0.5).
Graulich, Timothy	07/09/21	3.4	Review and revise Plan.
Masaro, Matthew	07/09/21	1.9	Review and revise release provision summary materials (0.8);
Bruno	'		call with R. Steinberg and others regarding same (0.2); review
			and revise Disclosure Statement exhibits (0.6);
			correspondence with Epiq and others regarding same (0.3).
			49

		Time	Detail By Project
Name	Date	Hours	Narrative
O'Sullivan, Damian	07/09/21	0.5	Review and revise notices of non-voting status.
Piraino, Stephen D.	07/09/21	4.1	Review and analyze Disclosure Statement issues.
Steinberg, Richard J.	07/09/21	2.9	Review release precedent and revise comparison term
			summary (1.6); call with M. Masaro regarding same (0.2);
			review and revise Disclosure Statement (1.1).
Ford, Stephen	07/10/21	1.0	Review and revise Plan (0.9); correspondence with E. Jerrard
			regarding same (0.1).
Jerrard, Erik	07/11/21	3.7	Review and revise Plan.
O'Sullivan, Damian	07/11/21	2.7	Review and revise non-voting status notices regarding opt-out
·			mechanics (2.4); correspondence with M. Masaro regarding same (0.3).
Bane, Abraham	07/12/21	1.1	Review E. Jerrard's comments to Plan (0.6); revise same (0.5).
Ford, Stephen	07/12/21	2.0	Review and revise Disclosure Statement.
Jerrard, Erik	07/12/21	2.0	Review and revise Plan (1.7); email with S. Ford and A. Bane
Corrara, Erik	01712721	2.0	regarding same (0.3).
Masaro, Matthew	07/12/21	1.8	Review and analyze Disclosure Statement issues.
Bruno	*****		
Bane, Abraham	07/13/21	0.4	Correspondence with S. Ford regarding Plan.
Ford, Stephen	07/13/21	1.2	Conference with A. Bane regarding Plan (0.4); review and
			revise Plan (0.8).
Masaro, Matthew	07/13/21	1.2	Review and revise Disclosure Statement, Disclosure
Bruno			Statement motion, and related exhibits (0.9); call with S.
			Piraino regarding solicitation materials (0.3).
Piraino, Stephen D.	07/13/21	0.7	Call with M. Masaro regarding solicitation materials (0.3);
•			review solicitation materials issues list (0.4).
Bane, Abraham	07/14/21	0.2	Correspondence with S. Ford regarding Plan structure.
Ford, Stephen	07/14/21	2.9	Review and revise Plan (1.8); research issues regarding same
			(1.0); correspondence with A. Bane regarding same (0.1).
Masaro, Matthew	07/14/21	2.4	Review Mexican law memorandum relating to Plan execution
Bruno			issues (1.0); correspondence with Sainz Abogados, Epiq, and
			others regarding same (0.8); review and revise Disclosure
			Statement (0.4); correspondence with S. Piraino and others
			regarding same (0.2).
O'Sullivan, Damian	07/14/21	1.1	Review and revise ballots and solicitation procedures (0.5);
			review and revise Disclosure Statement (0.6).
Piraino, Stephen D.	07/14/21	4.2	
			regarding Disclosure Statement (0.8); analyze issues
			regarding Plan (0.9).
Ford, Stephen	07/15/21	4.5	Research issues regarding Plan structuring and distribution
			analysis.
Graulich, Timothy	07/15/21	4.8	Review and revise Plan (2.4); review and revise Disclosure
			Statement (2.4).
Masaro, Matthew	07/15/21	3.3	Call with Sainz Abogados, Epiq, and Davis Polk team
Bruno			regarding solicitation procedures and next steps (0.5);
			correspondence with same regarding same (2.0); review and
			revise Disclosure Statement, Disclosure Statement motion,
Olovilia B	07/45/04		and related exhibits (0.8).
O'Sullivan, Damian	07/15/21	5.6	Call with Sainz Abogados, Epiq and Davis Polk team
			regarding solicitation procedures and next steps (0.5);
			correspondence with S. Piraino, M. Masaro and R. Steinberg
			regarding Disclosure Statement (0.2); review and revise
			Disclosure Statement (4.2); correspondence with M. Masaro
Diraina Stanban D	07/15/01	47	regarding same (0.7).
Piraino, Stephen D.	07/15/21	4.7	Review Disclosure Statement motion (0.5); call with Epiq regarding solicitation procedures (0.6); correspondence with
I			50

		Time	Detail By Project
Name	Date	Hours	Narrative
Steinberg, Richard J.	07/15/21	1.1	R. Steinberg and M. Masaro regarding Disclosure Statement (0.3); review and revise Disclosure Statement (3.1); correspondence with M. Masaro regarding same (0.2). Call with Sainz Abogados, Epiq, and Davis Polk team regarding solicitation procedures and next steps (0.5); correspondence with S. Piraino and M. Masaro regarding Disclosure Statement (0.4); correspondence with M. Masaro
Ford, Stephen	07/16/21	3.1	regarding same (0.2). Review and revise Plan.
Jerrard, Erik	07/16/21	1.2	Review and revise Plan.
Masaro, Matthew Bruno	07/16/21	0.2	Correspond with S. Piraino and others regarding Disclosure Statement.
O'Sullivan, Damian	07/16/21	3.4	Review and revise Disclosure Statement (3.0); review Sainz Abogados comments to ballots (0.3); correspondence with M. Masaro regarding same (0.1).
Steinberg, Richard J.	07/16/21	3.3	Review and revise Disclosure Statement.
Masaro, Matthew Bruno	07/17/21	2.3	Review and revise Disclosure Statement (1.9); correspond with R. Steinberg and others regarding same (0.4).
O'Sullivan, Damian	07/17/21	0.5	Review and revise Disclosure Statement's Mexican law section.
Steinberg, Richard J.	07/17/21	1.6	Review and revise Disclosure Statement.
Masaro, Matthew Bruno	07/18/21	1.1	Review and revise Disclosure Statement (0.7); correspondence with R. Steinberg, Sainz Abogados, and
Steinberg, Richard J.	07/18/21	5.1	others regarding same (0.4). Review and revise Disclosure Statement.
Bane, Abraham	07/19/21	0.9	Review and revise Disclosure Statement. Review and revise Plan (0.8); correspondence with M. Masaro regarding same (0.1).
Ford, Stephen	07/19/21	1.1	Review and revise Plan (1.0); correspondence with M. Masaro regarding same (0.1).
Graulich, Timothy	07/19/21	3.8	Review and revise Plan (1.9); review and revise Disclosure Statement (1.9).
Jerrard, Erik	07/19/21	2.0	Call with Davis Polk Restructuring team and AlixPartners regarding Disclosure Statement (0.5); review and revise Plan (1.5).
Masaro, Matthew Bruno	07/19/21	2.6	Correspondence with L. Farr, J. Donnelly, Rothschild, AlixPartners, S. Piraino, R. Steinberg, and others regarding Disclosure Statement (2.1); review and revise Disclosure Statement (0.5).
O'Sullivan, Damian	07/19/21	1.9	Review and revise Disclosure Statement (1.1); review Sainz Abogados' comments to same (0.3); call with Davis Polk Restructuring team and AlixPartners regarding Disclosure Statement (0.5).
Piraino, Stephen D.	07/19/21	3.8	Call with Rothschild regarding Plan issues (0.3); review and revise Plan (1.7); review and revise Disclosure Statement (1.8).
Steinberg, Richard J.	07/19/21	4.3	Review and revise Disclosure Statement (3.5); call regarding Disclosure Statement with AlixPartners and Rothschild (0.8).
Jerrard, Erik	07/20/21	4.0	Detailed review and analysis of Plan (3.6); email with S. Ford and A. Bane regarding same (0.4).
Masaro, Matthew Bruno	07/20/21	4.7	Review and revise Disclosure Statement (2.7); correspondence with S. Piraino, R. Steinberg, and others regarding same (1.3).
O'Sullivan, Damian	07/20/21	2.6	Call with Davis Polk Corporate and Restructuring team regarding securities issues in Disclosure Statement (0.3); research and review precedent Mexican prospectuses regarding same (1.9); correspondence with M. Masaro

		Time	Detail By Project
Name	Date	Hours	Narrative
Piraino, Stephen D.	07/20/21	3.6	regarding same (0.4). Call with Willkie Farr and others regarding Plan structure (0.2); correspondence with E. Jerrard regarding same (0.3); review precedent securities disclosures (0.8); email with M. Masaro regarding securities disclosures (0.4); review and analyze Plan issues (1.9).
Steinberg, Richard J.	07/20/21	2.5	Review and revise Disclosure Statement (1.9); correspondence with Davis Polk Corporate team regarding same (0.6).
Ford, Stephen	07/21/21	2.0	Review and revise Plan.
Masaro, Matthew Bruno	07/21/21	8.9	Research precedent regarding securities law issues in Disclosure Statement (2.8); correspondence with D. O'Sullivan, Sainz Abogados, S. Piraino, Akin Gump, and others regarding same (1.6); review and revise Disclosure Statement (0.9); correspondence with AlixPartners and others regarding same (0.4); review and revise Disclosure Statement materials (0.2); correspondence with S. Piraino and R. Steinberg regarding same (0.2); review rights offering
O'Sullivan, Damian	07/21/21	0.6	memoranda (2.8). Correspondence with M. Masaro and others regarding precedents regarding securities issues in Disclosure Statement (0.4); review same (0.2).
Piraino, Stephen D.	07/21/21	2.7	Review and revise Disclosure Statement (1.8); review and analyze Plan issues (0.9).
Steinberg, Richard J.	07/21/21	3.2	Correspondence with M. Masaro regarding Disclosure Statement (0.6); call with Sainz Abogados regarding rights offering and securities law issues regarding Disclosure Statement (0.7); draft Disclosure Statement issues list (0.8); review and revise Disclosure Statement (1.1).
Bane, Abraham	07/22/21	2.3	Call with E. Jerrard, S. Piraino, and others regarding Plan (1.8); correspondence with S. Ford regarding same (0.1); revise same (0.4).
Ford, Stephen	07/22/21	3.5	Review and revise Plan (1.7); call with M. Masaro, E. Jerrard, and others regarding same (1.8).
Graulich, Timothy	07/22/21	4.8	Review and comment on Plan (2.4); review and comment on Disclosure Statement (2.4).
Huebner, Marshall S.	07/22/21	0.4	Call with T. Graulich regarding Plan and term sheet issues.
Jerrard, Erik	07/22/21	2.8	Call with M. Masaro, S. Ford, and others regarding Plan (1.8); review draft Plan in preparation for same (1.0).
Masaro, Matthew Bruno	07/22/21	4.0	Review and revise Disclosure Statement (1.0); correspondence with R. Steinberg, S. Piraino, D. O'Sullivan, and others regarding same (1.2); call with S. Ford, E. Jerrard, and others regarding Plan (1.8).
O'Sullivan, Damian	07/22/21	1.4	Review liquidation analysis exhibit to Disclosure Statement and precedent regarding same (1.2); correspondence with M. Masaro regarding same (0.2).
Piraino, Stephen D.	07/22/21	2.2	Review and revise Disclosure Statement (0.8); call with M. Masaro, S. Ford, and others regarding Plan (1.4) (partial attendance).
Steinberg, Richard J.	07/22/21	3.8	Correspondence with S. Piraino and M. Masaro regarding Disclosure Statement (0.4); correspondence with M. Masaro and A. Bane regarding absolute priority rule (0.7); correspondence with E. Jerrard and S. Ford regarding Plan and Disclosure Statement (0.9); review and revise Disclosure Statement (1.8).
Bane, Abraham	07/23/21	4.7	Call with S. Ford regarding Plan (1.3); review and revise Plan

		Time I	Detail By Project
Name	Date	Hours	Narrative
			(3.4).
Ford, Stephen	07/23/21	2.6	Review and revise Plan (1.3); call with A. Bane regarding same (1.3).
Graulich, Timothy	07/23/21	3.5	Review and revise Plan (1.7); review and revise Disclosure Statement (1.8).
Masaro, Matthew Bruno	07/23/21	3.7	Review and revise Disclosure Statement (2.9); correspondence with R. Steinberg, S. Piraino, D. O'Sullivan, and others regarding same (0.8).
Piraino, Stephen D.	07/23/21	1.9	Review and revise Disclosure Statement.
Steinberg, Richard J.	07/23/21	3.9	Revise Disclosure Statement (2.9); email with co-advisors regarding same (1.0).
Bane, Abraham	07/24/21	1.9	Review and revise Plan.
Ford, Stephen	07/24/21	8.3	Review and revise Plan (3.8); research issues regarding same (3.5); draft issues list regarding same (1.0).
Masaro, Matthew Bruno	07/24/21	3.3	Revise and revise Disclosure Statement (3.0); correspondence with D. O'Sullivan, S. Piraino, AlixPartners,
O'Sullivan, Damian	07/24/21	5.1	Sainz Abogados, and others regarding same (0.3). Review and revise risk factors in Disclosure Statement (4.5); correspondence with M. Masaro regarding same (0.6).
Piraino, Stephen D.	07/24/21	0.4	Correspondence with M. Masaro regarding Disclosure
Steinberg, Richard J.	07/24/21	4.1	Statement (0.2); revise Disclosure Statement insert (0.2). Review and revise Disclosure Statement (3.9); email with Sainz Abogados regarding same (0.2).
Bane, Abraham	07/25/21	4.6	Call with S. Ford regarding Plan (0.8); review and revise Plan
Ford, Stephen	07/25/21	4.2	(3.8). Review and revise Plan (3.4); call with A. Bane regarding same (0.8).
Masaro, Matthew Bruno	07/25/21	5.0	Review and revise Disclosure Statement (4.5); correspondence with R. Steinberg and others regarding same (0.3).
Piraino, Stephen D.	07/25/21	0.9	Review and revise Disclosure Statement.
Steinberg, Richard J.	07/25/21	8.6	Extensive review and revision of Disclosure Statement (7.1); correspondence with M. Masaro regarding same (0.5); email with S. Piraino regarding same (0.5); email with S. Ford and A. Bane regarding same (0.1); email with Davis Polk Fleet team regarding same (0.3); email with Davis Polk Litigation team regarding same (0.1).
Bane, Abraham	07/26/21	0.6	Correspondence with M. Masaro regarding Plan (0.1); correspondence with S. Ford regarding same (0.1); review E. Jerrard's comments to same (0.4).
Ford, Stephen	07/26/21	1.7	Review and revise Plan.
Jerrard, Erik	07/26/21	5.1	Call with AlixPartners and others regarding Plan (0.8); review and revise Plan (4.3).
Masaro, Matthew Bruno	07/26/21	9.3	Review and revise Disclosure Statement (4.0); correspondence with AlixPartners, Sainz Abogados, Aeroméxico, and others regarding same (0.5); disclosure statement drafting session with S. Piraino and R. Steinberg (4.8).
Piraino, Stephen D.	07/26/21	4.8	Disclosure statement drafting session with R. Steinberg and M. Masaro.
Steinberg, Richard J.	07/26/21	9.3	Review and revise Disclosure Statement (2.9); disclosure statement drafting session with S. Piraino and M. Masaro (4.8); email with Sainz Abogados regarding same (0.3); call with Creditors' Committee's professionals regarding Plan framework (0.8); correspondence with M. Masaro regarding Disclosure Statement (0.5).

		Time	Detail By Project
Name	Date	Hours	Narrative
Bane, Abraham	07/27/21	7.5	Call with Davis Polk Restructuring team regarding Plan (1.0); review and revise Plan (3.5); correspondence with S. Ford regarding same (0.7); revise Plan issues list (0.6); correspondence with AlixPartners, Rothschild, and Sainz Abogados regarding same (0.2); correspondence with M. Masaro regarding same (0.1); review case law regarding Plan provision (1.2); correspondence with S. Piraino regarding same (0.2).
Ford, Stephen	07/27/21	7.4	
Jerrard, Erik	07/27/21	2.2	Call with Davis Polk Restructuring team regarding Plan (1.0); analyze Plan issues (1.2).
Masaro, Matthew Bruno	07/27/21	10.8	Review and revise Disclosure Statement (5.6); correspondence with R. Steinberg, S. Piraino, and AlixPartners regarding same (3.3); call with AlixPartners, Rothschild, S. Piraino, and others regarding same (0.9); call with Davis Polk Restructuring team regarding Plan (1.0).
Piraino, Stephen D.	07/27/21	3.1	Review and revise Plan (0.8); call with Davis Polk Restructuring team regarding same (1.0); correspondence with E. Jerrard regarding Plan (0.4); call with AlixPartners, Rothschild, R. Steinberg, and others regarding Disclosure
Steinberg, Richard J.	07/27/21	6.9	Statement (0.9). Call with AlixPartners, Rothschild, S. Piraino, and others regarding Disclosure Statement (0.9); review and revise Disclosure Statement (4.1); correspondence with M. Masaro regarding same (0.4); call with Davis Polk Restructuring team regarding Plan (1.0); email with Davis Polk team regarding
Bane, Abraham	07/28/21	4.4	same (0.5). Review and revise Plan (3.6); call with S. Ford regarding same (0.4); correspondence with M. Masaro regarding same (0.2); correspondence with E. Jerrard regarding same (0.1); correspondence with Epiq team regarding same (0.1).
Ford, Stephen	07/28/21	2.4	Review and revise Plan (2.2); call with A. Bane regarding same (0.2).
Jerrard, Erik	07/28/21	3.7	Email with Davis Polk Restructuring team regarding Plan and Disclosure Statement (0.9); review and analyze Plan (2.8).
Masaro, Matthew Bruno	07/28/21	7.2	Review and revise Disclosure Statement (4.2); correspondence with AlixPartners, S. Piraino, R. Steinberg, and Davis Polk Tax team regarding same (3.0).
O'Sullivan, Damian	07/28/21	2.0	Review and revise Disclosure Statement (1.2); research and review issues regarding financial projections exhibits to same (0.6); correspondence with M. Masaro regarding same (0.2).
Piraino, Stephen D.	07/28/21	1.6	Correspondence with M. Masaro and R. Steinberg regarding Disclosure Statement (1.3); call with Rothschild regarding same (0.3).
Steinberg, Richard J.	07/28/21	8.2	Review and revise Disclosure Statement (4.9); correspondence with S. Piraino and M. Masaro regarding same (2.0); email with T. Graulich regarding same (0.3); call with AlixPartners regarding same (0.2); email with co-advisors regarding same (0.8).
Bane, Abraham	07/29/21	0.9	Revise Plan (0.8); correspondence with S. Ford regarding same (0.1).
Ford, Stephen	07/29/21	1.3	Review and revise Plan (1.2); correspondence with A. Bane regarding same (0.1).
Masaro, Matthew	07/29/21	3.0	Review and revise Disclosure Statement and exhibits

Time Detail By Project				
Name	Date	Hours	Narrative	
Bruno			supporting same (1.7); correspondence with AlixPartners, R. Steinberg, and others regarding same (0.9); call with Davis Polk Tax team and others regarding same (0.4).	
Piraino, Stephen D.	07/29/21	1.2	Analyze Plan issues (0.9); email with R. Sanchez Baker and others regarding Disclosure Statement (0.3).	
Steinberg, Richard J.	07/29/21	4.3	Review and revise Disclosure Statement (3.3); email with T. Graulich and S. Piraino regarding same (0.3); correspondence with S. Piraino regarding same (0.3); email with Sainz Abogados regarding same (0.3).	
Total AM230 Plan/Dis Statement	sclosure	410.9		
			tatements/Applications and Budget	
Jerrard, Erik	07/02/21	1.0	Review, revise, and finalize May Monthly Fee Statement.	
Total AM240 DPW Retention/Preparatio Statements/Applicati Budget		1.0		
AM250 IP, Regulatory				
Herts, Dylan	07/01/21	0.1	Email with M. Yeowart regarding global antitrust filings.	
Piraino, Stephen D.	07/01/21	0.2	Correspondence with G. Morrison regarding antitrust issues.	
Spearing, Nicholas	07/01/21	0.3	Analyze foreign direct investment issues.	
Morrison, Gregory S.	07/02/21	0.5	Draft antitrust diligence inquiries for Ad Hoc Committee.	
Piraino, Stephen D.	07/02/21	0.2	Correspondence with G. Morrison regarding antitrust issues.	
Altus, Leslie J.	07/05/21	0.2	Review rights offering term sheet (0.1); email with A. Siman regarding same (0.1).	
Burke, Arthur J.	07/05/21	0.5	Correspondence with Davis Polk Antitrust team regarding Department of Justice strategy and timing.	
Herts, Dylan	07/06/21	0.1	Review global antitrust filing analysis.	
Siman, Ariel	07/06/21	0.9	Review rights offering term sheet.	
Spearing, Nicholas	07/06/21	1.7	Correspondence with Aeroméxico and advisers regarding Austrian and Spanish filings (0.5); analyze jurisdictional and timing issues regarding same (0.6); correspondence with loca counsel regarding same (0.6).	
Burke, Arthur J.	07/07/21	1.0	Correspondence with Davis Polk Antitrust team regarding antitrust analysis and related competition filings (0.6); call wit Aeroméxico, Aziz & Kaye, Sainz Abogados, Callol, and Davis Polk Antitrust team regarding global antitrust filing (0.4).	
Herts, Dylan	07/07/21	0.7	Call with Aeroméxico, Aziz & Kaye, Sainz Abogados, Callol, and Davis Polk Antitrust team regarding global antitrust filing (0.4); prepare for same (0.2); correspondence with G. Morrison regarding same (0.1).	
Morrison, Gregory S.	07/07/21	0.5	Call with Aeroméxico, Aziz & Kaye, Sainz Abogados, Callol, and Davis Polk Antitrust team regarding global antitrust filing.	
Piraino, Stephen D.	07/07/21	0.2	Email with A. Aranalde regarding USDA.	
Siman, Ariel	07/07/21	1.5	Review rights offering term sheet.	
Altus, Leslie J.	07/08/21	3.3	Review rights offering term sheet (0.6); correspondence with L. Altus and S. Piraino regarding same (0.7).	
De Mullewie, Léonore	07/08/21	1.2	Analyze issues regarding global filing.	
Donnelly, Jacob M.	07/08/21	0.2	Email with L. Farr and L. Altus regarding rights offering term sheet (0.1); coordinate call regarding same (0.1).	
Graulich, Timothy	07/08/21	0.5	Correspondence with S. Piraino regarding antitrust issues.	
McClammy, James I.	07/08/21	0.4	Correspondence with Davis Polk Antitrust team regarding	

		i ii iie i	Detail By Project
Name	Date	Hours	Narrative
Dinaire Otenhan D	07/00/04	4.0	antitrust issues.
Piraino, Stephen D.	07/08/21	1.8	Correspondence with L. De Mullewie regarding antitrust issues (0.3); correspondence with G. Morrison regarding same
			(0.2); correspondence with L. Altus and A. Siman regarding
			tax implications of exit financing proposal (1.3).
Siman, Ariel	07/08/21	1.3	Review rights offering term sheet (0.6); correspondence with
•			L. Altus and S. Piraino regarding same (0.7).
Altus, Leslie J.	07/09/21	0.9	Call with J. Donnelly, A. Siman, and L. Farr regarding rights
5	07/00/04	0.5	offering term sheet and Plan tax issues.
Burke, Arthur J.	07/09/21	0.5	Correspondence with Davis Polk Antitrust team regarding
Donnelly, Jacob M.	07/09/21	0.8	Department of Justice strategy and timing. Call with L. Altus, A. Siman, and L. Farr regarding rights
Domineny, Jacob Ivi.	01/09/21	0.0	offering term sheet and Plan tax issues.
Farr, Lucy W.	07/09/21	1.9	Call with L. Altus, A. Siman, and J. Donnelly regarding rights
, ,			offering term sheet and Plan tax issues (0.9); correspondence
			with Davis Polk Tax team regarding same (1.0).
Siman, Ariel	07/09/21	1.9	Call with L. Altus, L. Farr, and J. Donnelly regarding rights
			offering term sheet and Plan tax issues (0.9); review rights
Donnelly, Jacob M.	07/12/21	0.3	offering and related items (1.0). Draft summary to L. Farr and L. Altus regarding outstanding
Donnelly, Jacob M.	07/12/21	0.3	tax issues.
Herts, Dylan	07/12/21	0.3	Email to L. Farr and L. Altus regarding income tax exemption
rione, Dylan	01712721	0.0	eligibility.
Piraino, Stephen D.	07/12/21	0.2	Correspondence with G. Morrison and others regarding
			antitrust issues.
Siman, Ariel	07/12/21	1.0	Call with Davis Polk Tax team regarding gross income tax
Dannally, Jasah M	07/40/04	2.0	considerations.
Donnelly, Jacob M.	07/13/21	3.2	Email to L. Farr and L. Altus regarding outstanding points on eligibility for income tax exemption after restructuring.
Siman, Ariel	07/13/21	0.8	Review gross income tax issue.
Donnelly, Jacob M.	07/14/21	0.9	Draft summary to L. Farr and L. Altus regarding outstanding
,			tax issues.
Donnelly, Jacob M.	07/14/21	0.2	Correspondence with A. Siman and E. Goldman regarding ex
			financing commitment letters.
Farr, Lucy W.	07/14/21	0.4	Correspondence with E. Goldman regarding exit financing tax
Siman, Ariel	07/14/21	1.0	issues. Review exit financing commitment letter.
Altus, Leslie J.	07/14/21	0.1	Email with A. Siman regarding exit financing tax issues.
De Mullewie,	07/15/21	0.2	Analyze global antitrust filings.
Léonore	01,10,21	V	, a.a., j_= g. c. a. a. a. a. a. a. a. a. g. a.
Donnelly, Jacob M.	07/15/21	0.2	Review correspondence from A. Siman regarding exit
			financing tax issues.
Farr, Lucy W.	07/15/21	0.3	Email with Davis Polk Tax team regarding exit financing tax
Ciman Arial	07/45/04	1 5	issues.
Siman, Ariel De Mullewie,	07/15/21 07/16/21	1.5 1.5	Analyze tax consequence of Plan issues. Analyze Global antitrust filing issues.
Léonore	01/10/21	1.5	Analyze Global antitidst filling issues.
Herts, Dylan	07/16/21	0.1	Review emails with Davis Polk Antitrust team regarding Globa
, ,			antitrust filing.
Morrison, Gregory S.	07/16/21	0.1	Call with potential financing provider counsel regarding
			antitrust regulatory risk information requests.
Altus, Leslie J.	07/19/21	1.1	Review Apollo materials (0.3); call with financial advisors and
Do Mullowio	07/10/04	4.0	others regarding same (0.8).
De Mullewie, Léonore	07/19/21	1.0	Analyze Global antitrust filing.
Donnelly, Jacob M.	07/19/21	2.1	Correspondence with L. Altus, L. Farr, A. Siman, and S.
,, 00000 IVI.	317 107 E 1	۷.۱	56

		Time I	Detail By Project
Name	Date	Hours	Narrative
			Piraino regarding outstanding tax issues and Disclosure Statement (0.7); correspondence with L. Altus and A. Siman regarding Disclosure Statement (0.1); research documents regarding outstanding debt issues (1.3).
Farr, Lucy W.	07/19/21	1.2	Correspondence with Davis Polk Tax team regarding tax issues.
Piraino, Stephen D. Siman, Ariel	07/19/21 07/19/21	0.8 1.5	Call with Davis Polk Tax team regarding tax issues. Correspondence with Davis Polk Tax team regarding Disclosure Statement issues.
Spearing, Nicholas	07/19/21	0.3	Correspondence with Davis Polk Antitrust team regarding status of antitrust issues.
Donnelly, Jacob M.	07/20/21	0.2	Email with A. Siman, M. Masaro regarding Disclosure Statement issues.
Piraino, Stephen D.	07/20/21	0.1	Correspondence with S. Robles regarding antitrust issues.
Siman, Ariel	07/20/21	1.5	Review Plan tax issues.
Altus, Leslie J.	07/21/21	0.5	Email with Davis Polk Tax team regarding call with Cleary Gottlieb Tax team and others.
Donnelly, Jacob M.	07/21/21	0.3	Email with A. Siman regarding financial statements (0.1); email with L. Farr, L. Altus, S. Piraino, A. Siman, J. Lee (Cleary Gottlieb), and C. Goodman (Cleary Gottlieb) regarding call on tax issues (0.2).
Farr, Lucy W.	07/21/21	0.8	Email with Davis Polk Tax team regarding tax issues.
Piraino, Stephen D.	07/21/21	0.3	Correspondence with Davis Polk Tax team regarding tax issues.
Siman, Ariel	07/21/21	2.9	Review Plan tax issues.
Spearing, Nicholas	07/21/21	2.1	Review market share data (1.1); correspondence with Morgan Lewis regarding antitrust timing (1.0).
Altus, Leslie J.	07/22/21	1.4	Correspondence with Davis Polk Tax team regarding Disclosure Statement issues (0.9); review summary of research regarding same (0.5).
Donnelly, Jacob M.	07/22/21	3.0	Analyze foreign investment issues (1.5); call with Davis Polk Tax and Restructuring teams regarding Plan tax issues (0.5); coordinate same (0.2); email with L. Farr and L. Altus regarding foreign investment analysis (0.2); email with A. Siman regarding proposed creditor plans (0.6).
Farr, Lucy W.	07/22/21	0.3	Email with Davis Polk Tax team regarding tax issues.
Piraino, Stephen D.	07/22/21	0.7	
Siman, Ariel	07/22/21	4.5	Draft tax related issues list for exit financing and Plan documents.
Spearing, Nicholas	07/22/21	1.6	Analyze and coordinate antitrust issues (0.8); correspondence with Morgan Lewis regarding same (0.8).
Altus, Leslie J.	07/23/21	1.3	Review summary of research on tax issues (0.5); call with Cleary Gottlieb Tax team and others regarding tax issues (0.5); correspondence with J. Donnelly and S. Piraino
Donnelly, Jacob M.	07/23/21	1.0	regarding same (0.3). Call with Cleary Gottlieb Tax team and others regarding tax issues (0.5); correspondence with L. Altus and S. Piraino regarding open tax issues (0.3); correspondence with A. Siman regarding same (0.1); research issues regarding same
Herts, Dylan	07/23/21	0.2	(0.1). Call with G. Morrison regarding antitrust analysis status (0.1); prepare for same (0.1).
Morrison, Gregory S.	07/23/21	0.1	Call with D. Herts regarding antitrust analysis status.
Piraino, Stephen D.	07/23/21	0.5	Call with Cleary Gottlieb Tax team and others regarding tax

		Time	Detail By Project
Name	Date	Hours	Narrative
Siman, Ariel	07/23/21	2.0	issues. Call with Cleary Gottlieb Tax Team and others regarding tax issues (0.5); correspondence with Davis Polk Tax team regarding same (1.5).
Spearing, Nicholas Altus, Leslie J.	07/23/21 07/25/21	1.1 2.3	Analyze and coordinate antitrust issues. Research federal and state tax issues (1.2); email with Davis Polk Tax team regarding same (1.1).
Farr, Lucy W. Altus, Leslie J.	07/25/21 07/26/21	1.3 0.4	Review authorities regarding state tax issue. Review summary of research on tax issue (0.3); email with J. Donnelly and A. Siman regarding same (0.1).
Burke, Arthur J.	07/26/21	0.5	Correspondence with Davis Polk Antitrust team regarding Department of Justice timing and strategy.
Donnelly, Jacob M. Farr, Lucy W.	07/26/21 07/26/21	1.6 0.4	Research tax issues. Correspondence with Davis Polk Tax team regarding state tax
Herts, Dylan	07/26/21	0.3	issues. Correspondence with S. Piraino regarding antitrust issue (0.2); email with A. Burke and G. Morrison regarding same (0.1).
Piraino, Stephen D.	07/26/21	0.2	Correspondence with A. Burke and D. Herts regarding antitrust issues.
Siman, Ariel Spearing, Nicholas	07/26/21 07/26/21	2.8 0.4	Analyze state tax issues. Correspondence with foreign officials regarding antitrust filing process.
Altus, Leslie J.	07/27/21	1.3	Email with A. Siman and J. Donnelly regarding state tax issues (0.3); review summaries of research regarding same (0.5); correspondence with A. Siman and J. Donnelly regarding next steps regarding same (0.5).
Burke, Arthur J.	07/27/21	0.5	Correspondence with Davis Polk Antitrust team regarding Department of Justice strategy and timing.
Donnelly, Jacob M.	07/27/21	1.7	Email with S. Piraino, E. Jerrard, and M. Masaro regarding tax information requests (0.2); review research on aviation agreement (0.1); correspondence with L. Altus and A. Siman regarding tax issues (0.3); email with M. DeGraf and T. Thoroddsen regarding tax information requests (0.2); research issues regarding aviation agreement (0.3); email with L. Altus regarding same (0.4); review 1120-F forms (0.2).
Graulich, Timothy Herts, Dylan	07/27/21 07/27/21	0.5 2.1	Correspondence with A. Burke regarding antitrust issues. Call with Davis Polk Restructuring and Antitrust teams regarding antitrust issues (0.3); email with same regarding same (0.4); research issues regarding same (1.3).
Jerrard, Erik	07/27/21	0.4	Call with Davis Polk Restructuring and Antitrust teams regarding antitrust issues.
Piraino, Stephen D. Rincon, Cristina M.	07/27/21 07/27/21	0.5 0.4	Correspondence with A. Burke regarding antitrust issues. Revise settlement agreement (0.2); email with Aeroméxico regarding same (0.2).
Siman, Ariel Altus, Leslie J.	07/27/21 07/28/21	1.5 1.1	Research issues regarding gross income tax. Review 1120-F forms (0.5); review aviation agreement (0.3); call with Davis Polk Restructuring team regarding same (0.3).
Donnelly, Jacob M.	07/28/21	1.0	Coordinate call with L. Altus, A. Siman, and S. Piraino regarding outstanding tax issues (0.1); research issues regarding statements on tax returns (0.4); correspondence with L. Altus, A. Siman, and S. Piraino regarding outstanding tax issues (0.3); coordinate call with tax advisors and others regarding tax returns (0.2).
Piraino, Stephen D.	07/28/21	0.3	Call with Davis Polk Restructuring team regarding aviation agreement.
Siman, Ariel	07/28/21	1.0	Analyze gross income tax issue.

		Time	Detail By Project
Name	Date	Hours	Narrative
Altus, Leslie J.	07/29/21	0.6	Review analysis regarding state tax issues (0.2); call with S. Piraino, tax advisors, and others regarding same (0.2); correspondence with L. Farr regarding same (0.2).
De Mullewie, Léonore	07/29/21	1.0	Analyze Global antitrust filing.
Donnelly, Jacob M.	07/29/21	0.3	Call with L. Altus, tax advisors, and others regarding state tax issues.
Piraino, Stephen D.	07/29/21	0.2	Call with L. Altus, tax advisors, and others regarding state tax issues.
Siman, Ariel	07/29/21	0.6	Correspondence with Davis Polk Tax team regarding gross income tax issues.
Spearing, Nicholas	07/29/21	0.7	Review and revise Global antirust analysis.
De Mullewie, Léonore	07/30/21	1.0	Analyze Global antitrust filing.
Spearing, Nicholas	07/30/21	1.3	Finalize and submit Global antitrust filing (0.7); review update regarding same (0.6).
Total AM250 IP, Reg Tax	ulatory and	98.2	
AM260 Hearing Prep			
Jerrard, Erik	07/01/21	0.5	Call with A. Schwartz regarding upcoming hearing (0.1); email with A. Schwartz regarding same (0.2); email with Morris Nichols team regarding same (0.3).
Jerrard, Erik	07/06/21	0.6	Email with M. Melcer regarding hearing preparation (0.4); call with J. Eisen regarding upcoming hearing (0.2).
Jerrard, Erik	07/07/21	2.7	Call with A. Schwartz regarding retentions and upcoming hearing (1.6); email with T. Graulich regarding same (0.3); email to J. Eisen regarding July Omnibus Hearing (0.7); follow-up call with same regarding same (0.1).
Piraino, Stephen D.	07/07/21	0.1	Correspondence with A. Schwartz regarding July Omnibus Hearing.
Jerrard, Erik	07/15/21	1.6	Prepare talking points for status conference (1.4); email with S. Piraino and T. Graulich regarding same (0.2).
Total AM260 Hearing Preparation/Attenda		5.5	
AM270 Credit Card F	Receivables		
White, Erika D.	07/06/21	0.4	Review and comment on extension to credit card processing agreement.
Steinberg, Richard J.	07/14/21	0.5	Email with Rothschild and Aeroméxico regarding Deutsche Bank/AMEX facility.
White, Erika D.	07/15/21	0.3	Review extension of Elavon agreement.
Masaro, Matthew Bruno	07/20/21	8.0	Review CEBURES documentation and Rule 9019 orders (0.6); correspond with S. Piraino and others regarding same
Masaro, Matthew Bruno	07/23/21	1.0	(0.2). Review and revise CEBURES notices of presentment (0.7); correspondence with S. Piraino and others regarding same (0.3).
Piraino, Stephen D.	07/23/21	0.2	Correspondence with M. Masaro regarding CEBURES.
Piraino, Stephen D.	07/24/21	0.2	
Masaro, Matthew Bruno	07/26/21	0.8	Review, revise CEBURES Notice of Presentments (0.3); correspondence with S. Piraino, Willkie Farr, Cleary Gottlieb,
Steinberg, Richard J.	07/29/21	0.3	and Greenberg Traurig regarding same (0.4). Email with E. White regarding BBVA facility.

20-11563-scc Doc 1979 Filed 10/26/21 Entered 10/26/21 20:59:12 Main Document Pg 217 of 357

Invoice No.7038417

Invoice Date: September 15, 2021

Time Detail By Project				
Name	Date	Hours	Narrative	
White, Erika D.	07/29/21	1.2	Review status of credit card securitization amendments.	
Total AM270 Credit Card Receivables		5.7		
TOTAL		2,052.9		

DISBURSEMENT SUMMARY				
Description	Amount			
Court and related fees	\$108.32			
Postage, courier & freight	\$244.31			
Outside Documents & Research	\$649.97			
Meals	\$80.00			
Travel	\$504.56			
Computer research	\$2,744.61			
TOTAL	\$4,331.77			

DISBURSEMENT DETAIL						
Date	Vendor Name	Expense Type	Description	Amount		
07/13/21		Computer research	LEXIS; US TREATISES;DOC ACCESS	\$65.14		
07/13/21		Computer research	Westlaw usage by BANE,ABRAHAM on 07/13/2021	\$101.91		
07/20/21		Computer research	Westlaw usage by STEINBERG,RICH on 07/20/2021	\$13.54		
07/21/21		Computer research	LEXIS; SEARCH;ACCESS CHARGE	\$106.34		
07/21/21		Computer research	LEXIS; SEARCH;ACCESS CHARGE	\$106.34		
07/21/21		Computer research	LEXIS; US TREATISES;DOC ACCESS	\$102.04		

Invoice Date: September 15, 2021

DISBURSEMENT DETAIL Expense Date Vendor Name Description Amount Type 07/22/21 Computer LEXIS; US TREATISES; DOC ACCESS \$102.04 research 07/22/21 Computer Westlaw usage by STEINBERG, RICH on \$54.17 research 07/22/2021 07/22/21 Computer Westlaw usage by BANE.ABRAHAM on \$542.93 research 07/22/2021 07/24/21 Computer Westlaw usage by STEINBERG, RICH on \$186.12 research 07/24/2021 07/26/21 Computer Westlaw usage by DONNELLY, JACOB on \$53.56 research 07/26/2021 07/27/21 Computer Westlaw usage by DONNELLY, JACOB on \$26.78 research 07/27/2021 07/27/21 Computer Westlaw usage by BANE, ABRAHAM on \$194.37 research 07/27/2021 07/27/21 Computer Westlaw usage by DARTEZ, JACKSON on \$57.94 research 07/27/2021 07/27/21 Computer Westlaw usage by ZALECK, MARK on \$201.95 research 07/27/2021 LEXIS; US TREATISES; DOC ACCESS 07/27/21 Computer \$74.52 research 07/27/21 Computer LEXIS; SEARCH; ACCESS CHARGE \$77.66 research 07/27/21 Computer LEXIS: US LAW REVIEWS AND \$124.73 research JOURNALS; DOC ACCESS 07/27/21 Computer LEXIS; US TREATISES; DOC ACCESS \$273.77 research 07/28/21 Computer Westlaw usage by ZALECK, MARK on \$57.94 research 07/28/2021 07/29/21 Computer Westlaw usage by DARTEZ, JACKSON on \$177.36 research 07/29/2021 07/30/21 Computer Westlaw usage by DARTEZ, JACKSON on \$43.46 research 07/30/2021 07/31/21 Court and Pacer transactions 07/2021 \$66.40 related fees

Invoice Date: September 15, 2021

DISBURSEMENT DETAIL Expense Date Vendor Name Description Amount Type Court and 07/31/21 CourtAlert.com: B. Eng, D. Thomson; Court \$41.92 NYSD; Index No. 1:20-cv-05006; In Re: LSC related fees Communications, Inc. 07/12/21 Meals SeamlessWeb delivery from Mr. Broadway \$20.00 Kosher Restaurant to S. Szanzer at 17:43:03 SeamlessWeb delivery from Kosher Deluxe 07/15/21 Meals \$20.00 Restaurant to SZ Szanzer at 17:55:30 07/19/21 Meals SeamlessWeb delivery from Taam Tov \$20.00 Restaurant to SZ Szanzer at 15:30:58 07/26/21 Meals Payee: Masaro, Matthew Bruno, OT 7:17 PM, \$20.00 DIG - Madison Square, 07/02/21 Outside Restructuring Concepts/netDockets: Stephen \$5.44 **Documents** Ford; 7/2/2021 9:23:00 AM; Description: Single case search; Charge id: 358458 & Research Restructuring Concepts/netDockets: Richard 07/13/21 Outside \$21.78 **Documents** Steinberg; 7/13/2021 4:17:00 PM; Description: & Research Multiple case search; Charge id: 359817 07/13/21 Outside Restructuring Concepts/netDockets: Richard \$21.78 **Documents** Steinberg; 7/13/2021 4:12:00 PM; Description: Multiple case search: Charge id: 359814 & Research \$21.78 07/13/21 Outside Restructuring Concepts/netDockets: Richard **Documents** Steinberg; 7/13/2021 4:12:00 PM; Description: Multiple case search; Charge id: 359815 & Research 07/13/21 Restructuring Concepts/netDockets: Richard Outside \$21.78 Steinberg; 7/13/2021 4:15:00 PM; Description: **Documents** Multiple case search; Charge id: 359816 & Research 07/13/21 Outside Restructuring Concepts/netDockets: Richard \$3.27 **Documents** Steinberg; 7/13/2021 4:20:00 PM; Description: & Research Downloaded W0071: Docket #2857 (Main Document); Charge id: 359818 07/14/21 Outside Restructuring Concepts/netDockets: Damian \$5.44 O'Sullivan: 7/14/2021 1:29:00 PM: Description: **Documents** & Research Single case search; Charge id: 359978 Restructuring Concepts/netDockets: Damian 07/14/21 Outside \$3.27 OSullivan; 7/14/2021 1:30:00 PM; Description: **Documents** & Research Downloaded O0067: Docket #611; Charge id: 359980

Invoice Date: September 15, 2021

DISBURSEMENT DETAIL Expense Date Vendor Name Description Amount Type 07/15/21 Outside Restructuring Concepts/netDockets: Moshe \$21.78 **Documents** Melcer; 7/15/2021 7:20:00 AM; Description: & Research Multiple case search; Charge id: 360018 07/15/21 Outside Restructuring Concepts/netDockets: Moshe \$3.27 Melcer; 7/15/2021 7:21:00 AM; Description: **Documents** Downloaded M0129: Docket #1450; Charge id: & Research 360019 07/16/21 Restructuring Concepts/netDockets: Moshe Outside \$3.27 **Documents** Melcer; 7/16/2021 7:43:00 AM; Description: & Research Downloaded G0085: Docket #432: Charge id: 360234 07/16/21 Outside Restructuring Concepts/netDockets: Moshe \$3.27 Melcer; 7/16/2021 7:45:00 AM; Description: **Documents** Downloaded A0231: Docket #579; Charge id: & Research 360236 07/16/21 Outside Restructuring Concepts/netDockets: Moshe \$3.27 **Documents** Melcer: 7/16/2021 7:38:00 AM: Description: & Research Downloaded E0042: Docket #1430; Charge id: 360230 07/16/21 Restructuring Concepts/netDockets: Moshe \$5.44 Outside Melcer; 7/16/2021 7:39:00 AM; Description: **Documents** & Research Single case search; Charge id: 360231 07/16/21 Outside Restructuring Concepts/netDockets: Moshe \$3.27 Melcer; 7/16/2021 7:40:00 AM; Description: **Documents** Downloaded R0067: Docket #4306; Charge id: & Research 360232 07/16/21 Outside Restructuring Concepts/netDockets: Moshe \$3.27 Melcer; 7/16/2021 7:41:00 AM; Description: Documents Downloaded H0061: Docket #2967: Charge id: & Research 360233 07/16/21 Outside Restructuring Concepts/netDockets: Moshe \$3.27 Melcer: 7/16/2021 7:44:00 AM: Description: **Documents** Downloaded S0172: Docket #1400: Charge id: & Research 360235 07/16/21 Outside Restructuring Concepts/netDockets: Moshe \$21.78 **Documents** Melcer; 7/16/2021 7:29:00 AM; Description: & Research Multiple case search; Charge id: 360220 07/16/21 Outside Restructuring Concepts/netDockets: Moshe \$3.27 Melcer; 7/16/2021 7:31:00 AM; Description: **Documents** Downloaded A0005: Docket #13603 (Main & Research Document); Charge id: 360222

Invoice Date: September 15, 2021

DISBURSEMENT DETAIL Expense Date Vendor Name Description Amount Type Restructuring Concepts/netDockets: Moshe 07/16/21 Outside \$3.27 **Documents** Melcer: 7/16/2021 7:34:00 AM: Description: & Research Downloaded C0074: Docket #393; Charge id: 360224 07/16/21 Outside Restructuring Concepts/netDockets: Moshe \$3.27 Melcer; 7/16/2021 7:36:00 AM; Description: **Documents** & Research Downloaded G0031: Docket #5513; Charge id: 360225 07/16/21 Outside Restructuring Concepts/netDockets: Moshe \$5.44 Melcer; 7/16/2021 7:38:00 AM; Description: **Documents** & Research Single case search; Charge id: 360229 Restructuring Concepts/netDockets: Moshe 07/16/21 Outside \$21.78 Melcer; 7/16/2021 7:28:00 AM; Description: **Documents** Multiple case search; Charge id: 360219 & Research \$3.27 07/16/21 Outside Restructuring Concepts/netDockets: Moshe **Documents** Melcer; 7/16/2021 7:37:00 AM; Description: & Research Downloaded E0042: Docket #1713; Charge id: 360227 07/17/21 Outside courtlink: SEARCH ACCESS CHARGE For \$11.29 **Documents** DAMIAN O'SULLIVAN & Research courtlink: US DOCKETS DOC ACCESS For 07/17/21 Outside \$0.82 **Documents** DAMIAN O'SULLIVAN & Research 07/17/21 Outside Restructuring Concepts/netDockets: Damian \$21.78 O'Sullivan; 7/17/2021 12:45:00 PM; **Documents** & Research Description: Multiple case search; Charge id: 360406 07/17/21 Outside Restructuring Concepts/netDockets: Damian \$5.44 O'Sullivan; 7/17/2021 10:12:00 AM; **Documents** Description: Single case search; Charge id: & Research 360390 07/17/21 Restructuring Concepts/netDockets: Damian Outside \$5.44 **Documents** O'Sullivan: 7/17/2021 10:04:00 AM: & Research Description: Single case search; Charge id: 360388 07/17/21 Restructuring Concepts/netDockets: Damian Outside \$3.27 O'Sullivan; 7/17/2021 10:06:00 AM; **Documents** & Research Description: Downloaded T0145: Docket #1278; Charge id: 360389

Invoice Date: September 15, 2021

DISBURSEMENT DETAIL Expense Amount **Date Vendor Name** Description Type Restructuring Concepts/netDockets: Damian 07/17/21 Outside \$5.44 **Documents** O'Sullivan; 7/17/2021 8:05:00 AM; Description: & Research Single case search; Charge id: 360378 07/17/21 Outside Restructuring Concepts/netDockets: Damian \$3.27 O'Sullivan; 7/17/2021 10:12:00 AM; **Documents** Description: Downloaded R0034: Docket & Research #5097; Charge id: 360391 Restructuring Concepts/netDockets: Damian 07/17/21 Outside \$5.44 **Documents** O'Sullivan; 7/17/2021 8:10:00 AM; Description: Single case search: Charge id: 360380 & Research 07/17/21 Restructuring Concepts/netDockets: Damian \$5.44 Outside O'Sullivan; 7/17/2021 8:38:00 AM; Description: **Documents** Single case search; Charge id: 360381 & Research 07/17/21 Outside Restructuring Concepts/netDockets: Damian \$3.27 O'Sullivan; 7/17/2021 8:39:00 AM; Description: **Documents** & Research Downloaded M0119: Docket #1801 (Main Document); Charge id: 360382 Restructuring Concepts/netDockets: Damian 07/17/21 Outside \$5.44 **Documents** O'Sullivan; 7/17/2021 9:05:00 AM; Description: & Research Single case search; Charge id: 360383 07/17/21 Outside Restructuring Concepts/netDockets: Damian \$3.27 O'Sullivan; 7/17/2021 9:06:00 AM; Description: **Documents** Downloaded I0080: Docket #1115 (Main & Research Document); Charge id: 360384 Restructuring Concepts/netDockets: Damian 07/17/21 Outside \$5.44 **Documents** O'Sullivan; 7/17/2021 9:13:00 AM; Description: & Research Single case search; Charge id: 360385 Restructuring Concepts/netDockets: Damian 07/17/21 Outside \$5.44 **Documents** O'Sullivan; 7/17/2021 8:05:00 AM; Description: Single case search; Charge id: 360379 & Research 07/19/21 Restructuring Concepts/netDockets: Richard \$21.78 Outside **Documents** Steinberg; 7/19/2021 4:49:00 PM; Description: Multiple case search; Charge id: 360654 & Research 07/19/21 Outside Restructuring Concepts/netDockets: Richard \$21.78 Steinberg; 7/19/2021 4:49:00 PM; Description: **Documents** & Research Multiple case search; Charge id: 360655 07/19/21 Outside Restructuring Concepts/netDockets: Damian \$5.44 **Documents** O'Sullivan; 7/19/2021 8:06:00 PM; Description: & Research Single case search: Charge id: 360714

Invoice Date: September 15, 2021

DISBURSEMENT DETAIL Expense Date **Vendor Name** Description Amount Type 07/19/21 Outside Restructuring Concepts/netDockets: Damian \$3.27 O'Sullivan: 7/19/2021 8:28:00 PM; Description: **Documents** & Research Downloaded T0187: Docket #783; Charge id: 360718 07/19/21 Restructuring Concepts/netDockets: Richard Outside \$21.78 Steinberg; 7/19/2021 4:43:00 PM; Description: Documents & Research Multiple case search; Charge id: 360652 07/19/21 Restructuring Concepts/netDockets: Richard Outside \$3.27 Steinberg; 7/19/2021 4:46:00 PM; Description: **Documents** & Research Downloaded M0129: Docket #1278; Charge id: 360653 07/19/21 Outside Restructuring Concepts/netDockets: Richard \$21.78 Steinberg; 7/19/2021 11:09:00 AM; **Documents** Description: Multiple case search; Charge id: & Research 360580 07/19/21 Outside Restructuring Concepts/netDockets: Richard \$3.27 Steinberg; 7/19/2021 11:11:00 AM; **Documents** & Research Description: Downloaded T0202: Docket #418 (Exhibit B: Incorrectly Classified Claims); Charge id: 360581 07/20/21 Outside courtlink: SEARCH ACCESS CHARGE For \$7.53 Documents DAMIAN O'SULLIVAN & Research 07/20/21 courtlink: US DOCKETS DOC ACCESS For Outside \$1.88 DAMIAN O'SULLIVAN Documents & Research Restructuring Concepts/netDockets: Damian 07/20/21 Outside \$21.78 O'Sullivan; 7/20/2021 7:30:00 PM; Description: Documents Multiple case search: Charge id: 360992 & Research Restructuring Concepts/netDockets: Damian 07/20/21 Outside \$21.78 O'Sullivan; 7/20/2021 7:28:00 PM; Description: Documents Multiple case search; Charge id: 360990 & Research courtlink: SEARCH ACCESS CHARGE For 07/22/21 Outside \$3.78 **Documents** DAMIAN O'SULLIVAN & Research 07/22/21 Outside courtlink: US DOCKETS DOC ACCESS For \$1.35 DAMIAN O'SULLIVAN Documents & Research 07/22/21 Restructuring Concepts/netDockets: Damian Outside \$5.44 O'Sullivan; 7/22/2021 8:24:00 PM; Description: Documents Single case search; Charge id: 361538 & Research

Invoice Date: September 15, 2021

DISBURSEMENT DETAIL Expense Date **Vendor Name** Description Amount Type 07/22/21 Outside Restructuring Concepts/netDockets: Damian \$5.44 O'Sullivan; 7/22/2021 8:37:00 PM; Description: **Documents** & Research Single case search; Charge id: 361539 07/22/21 Outside Restructuring Concepts/netDockets: Damian \$5.44 O'Sullivan; 7/22/2021 9:01:00 PM; Description: **Documents** & Research Single case search; Charge id: 361540 07/22/21 Restructuring Concepts/netDockets: Damian \$3.27 Outside O'Sullivan; 7/22/2021 9:02:00 PM; Description: **Documents** & Research Downloaded D0004: Docket #4417 (Appendix Liquidation Analyses): Charge id: 361541 07/22/21 Restructuring Concepts/netDockets: Damian Outside \$5.44 O'Sullivan; 7/22/2021 11:14:00 AM; **Documents** Description: Single case search; Charge id: & Research 361425 07/22/21 Outside Restructuring Concepts/netDockets: Damian \$3.27 Documents O'Sullivan; 7/22/2021 8:29:00 AM; Description: & Research Downloaded M0191: Docket #520 (Main Document); Charge id: 361379 07/22/21 Outside Restructuring Concepts/netDockets: Damian \$5.44 Documents O'Sullivan; 7/22/2021 11:26:00 AM; Description: Single case search; Charge id: & Research 361429 07/22/21 Outside Restructuring Concepts/netDockets: Damian \$3.27 O'Sullivan; 7/22/2021 11:26:00 AM; **Documents** Description: Downloaded M0157: Docket #346; & Research Charge id: 361430 Restructuring Concepts/netDockets: Damian 07/22/21 Outside \$5.44 O'Sullivan; 7/22/2021 8:34:00 AM; Description: Documents & Research Single case search: Charge id: 361384 07/22/21 Outside Restructuring Concepts/netDockets: Damian \$5.44 O'Sullivan; 7/22/2021 8:29:00 AM; Description: Documents Single case search; Charge id: 361378 & Research Restructuring Concepts/netDockets: Damian 07/22/21 Outside \$5.44 **Documents** O'Sullivan: 7/22/2021 8:30:00 AM: Description: & Research Single case search; Charge id: 361380 07/22/21 Outside Restructuring Concepts/netDockets: Damian \$3.27 O'Sullivan; 7/22/2021 8:30:00 AM; Description: **Documents** & Research Downloaded R0067: Docket #6065 (Main Document); Charge id: 361381

Invoice Date: September 15, 2021

DISBURSEMENT DETAIL Expense Date Vendor Name Description Amount Type Restructuring Concepts/netDockets: Damian 07/22/21 Outside \$5.44 O'Sullivan; 7/22/2021 8:32:00 AM; Description: **Documents** & Research Single case search; Charge id: 361382 07/22/21 Outside Restructuring Concepts/netDockets: Damian \$3.27 O'Sullivan; 7/22/2021 8:33:00 AM; Description: **Documents** Downloaded W0083: Docket #1505 (Main & Research Document); Charge id: 361383 07/22/21 Outside Restructuring Concepts/netDockets: Damian \$3.27 **Documents** O'Sullivan; 7/22/2021 8:34:00 AM; Description: & Research Downloaded L0020: Docket #4418 (Main Document); Charge id: 361385 Restructuring Concepts/netDockets: Damian 07/22/21 Outside \$5.44 O'Sullivan; 7/22/2021 8:26:00 AM; Description: **Documents** Single case search; Charge id: 361374 & Research 07/22/21 Outside Restructuring Concepts/netDockets: Damian \$3.27 **Documents** O'Sullivan; 7/22/2021 8:27:00 AM; Description: & Research Downloaded C0061: Docket #1471 (Main Document); Charge id: 361375 07/25/21 Outside courtlink: SEARCH ACCESS CHARGE For \$3.78 **Documents** DAMIAN O'SULLIVAN & Research courtlink: US DOCKETS DOC ACCESS For 07/25/21 Outside \$0.26 **Documents** DAMIAN O'SULLIVAN & Research 07/25/21 Outside Restructuring Concepts/netDockets: Damian \$21.78 O'Sullivan; 7/25/2021 2:43:00 PM; Description: Documents & Research Multiple case search; Charge id: 361822 07/25/21 Restructuring Concepts/netDockets: Damian Outside \$5.44 O'Sullivan; 7/25/2021 2:44:00 PM; Description: Documents Single case search; Charge id: 361823 & Research 07/25/21 Restructuring Concepts/netDockets: Damian Outside \$21.78 **Documents** O'Sullivan; 7/25/2021 2:43:00 PM; Description: Multiple case search; Charge id: 361821 & Research 07/28/21 Outside Restructuring Concepts/netDockets: Damian \$21.78 O'Sullivan; 7/28/2021 7:14:00 AM; Description: **Documents** & Research Multiple case search; Charge id: 362325 07/28/21 Outside Restructuring Concepts/netDockets: Damian \$3.27 **Documents** O'Sullivan; 7/28/2021 7:16:00 AM; Description: & Research Downloaded D0004: Docket #4417 (Appendix Financial Projections); Charge id: 362327

Invoice Date: September 15, 2021

DISBURSEMENT DETAIL Expense Date Vendor Name Description Amount Type Restructuring Concepts/netDockets: Damian 07/28/21 Outside \$5.44 **Documents** O'Sullivan; 7/28/2021 8:49:00 AM; Description: & Research Single case search; Charge id: 362348 07/28/21 Outside Restructuring Concepts/netDockets: Damian \$3.27 O'Sullivan; 7/28/2021 8:49:00 AM; Description: **Documents** Downloaded S0095: Docket #14 (Exhibit H - I): & Research Charge id: 362349 07/28/21 Restructuring Concepts/netDockets: Damian Outside \$5.44 O'Sullivan; 7/28/2021 7:15:00 AM; Description: **Documents** & Research Single case search; Charge id: 362326 07/31/21 courtlink: SEARCH ACCESS CHARGE For Outside \$3.78 **Documents DAMIAN O'SULLIVAN** & Research 07/31/21 Outside courtlink: US DOCKETS DOC ACCESS For \$0.26 **Documents** DAMIAN O'SULLIVAN & Research 07/31/21 Outside Restructuring Concepts/netDockets: Damian \$3.27 O'Sullivan; 7/31/2021 12:42:00 PM; **Documents** & Research Description: Downloaded D0015: Docket #519; Charge id: 362757 07/31/21 Outside Restructuring Concepts/netDockets: Damian \$5.44 O'Sullivan; 7/31/2021 12:40:00 PM; **Documents** & Research Description: Single case search; Charge id: 362756 07/19/21 Postage, \$1.80 postage courier & freight 07/19/21 Postage, From Magali Giddens to CLERK'S \$25.50 OFFICE/US BANKRUPTCY COURT courier & freight \$21.49 07/20/21 Postage, From Yasmin Anderson to Shelley Chapman courier & freight 07/20/21 From Olivia Altman to CLERK'S \$25.50 Postage, OFFICE/United States Bankruptcy courier & freight Court/Southern District of New York 07/29/21 Postage. From Magali Giddens to CLERK':S \$25.93 OFFICE (Intake)/US BANKRUPTCY COURT courier & freiaht

20-11563-scc Doc 1979 Filed 10/26/21 Entered 10/26/21 20:59:12 Main Document Pg 227 of 357

Invoice No.7038417

Invoice Date: September 15, 2021

DISBURSEMENT DETAIL						
Date	Vendor Name	Expense Type	Description	Amount		
07/30/21		Postage, courier & freight	From Magali Giddens to CLERK'S OFFICE (Intake)/US BANKRUPTCY COURT	\$54.37		
07/30/21		Postage, courier & freight	From Magali Giddens to Shelley Chapman	\$89.72		
06/29/21		Travel	Car for Graulich, Timothy from airport	\$138.80		
07/12/21		Travel	Payee: Szanzer, Steven Z., OT 9:19 PM, Uber	\$52.27		
07/15/21		Travel	Payee: Szanzer, Steven Z., OT 11:33 PM	\$100.00		
07/20/21		Travel	Payee: Szanzer, Steven Z., OT 2:13 AM, Uber,	\$51.84		
07/25/21		Travel	Payee: Masaro, Matthew Bruno, OT 9:14 PM, Lyft,	\$34.94		
07/27/21		Travel	Payee: Szanzer, Steven Z., OT 11:35 PM, Uber,	\$57.84		
07/28/21		Travel	Payee: Szanzer, Steven Z., OT 9:16 PM, ,	\$68.87		
TOTAL \$4,331.77						

		Time	Detail By Project
Name	Date	Hours	Narrative
AM100 Aircraft/Engin	ies		
Melcer, Moshe	08/01/21	0.5	Review and revise motion to approve equipment transaction (0.4); review case management procedures regarding same (0.1).
Szanzer, Steven Z.	08/01/21	1.2	Review materials regarding DAE (0.3); email with Willkie Farr regarding same (0.3); correspondence with White & Case and Skyworks regarding same (0.3); correspondence with M. Melcer regarding case management order issue (0.3).
Graulich, Timothy	08/02/21	1.1	Call with C. Hansen regarding fleet issues (0.5); call with T. Goren regarding DAE motion (0.6).
Green, Thomas S.	08/02/21	4.8	Review CAE documents (1.5); call with White & Case regarding MUFG (0.4); call with Skyworks regarding CAE (0.2); call with Davis Polk Fleet team regarding fleet workstreams (0.8); review and revise SMBC (0.7); analyze fleet workstreams summary (0.3); correspondence with M. Melcer regarding fleet workstreams (0.7); correspondence with S. Szanzer regarding same (0.2).
Melcer, Moshe	08/02/21	2.7	Revise motion to approve equipment transaction (1.3); revise sealing motion regarding same (0.2); revise declaration in support of same (0.4); attend call with Davis Polk Fleet team regarding fleet workstreams (0.8).
Piraino, Stephen D. Szanzer, Steven Z.	08/02/21 08/02/21	0.3 9.0	Call with White & Case and others regarding DAE motion. Correspondence with White & Case and Aeromexico regarding replacement engine (0.2); correspondence with White & Case and T. Green regarding MUFG (0.3); review and revise CAE documents (1.4); correspondence with M. Melcer regarding same (1.3); correspondence with White & Case regarding Ex-Im notices (0.3); review and revise Clover motion (0.9); correspondence with M. Melcer regarding same (0.9); call with C. Hansen and others regarding DAE (0.7); call with Willkie Farr and C. Hansen regarding same and mediation (1.0); correspondence with Rothschild and AlixPartners regarding same (0.3); correspondence with Davis Polk team regarding Ex-Im omnibus claims agreement (0.4); call with Davis Polk Fleet team regarding fleet workstreams (0.8); correspondence with M. Melcer regarding BBAM-Merx (0.2); correspondence with White & Case and T. Green regarding Flight Safety amendment (0.3).
Graulich, Timothy Green, Thomas S.	08/03/21 08/03/21	0.6 3.6	Call with M. Landess regarding DAE motion. Call with White & Case regarding MUFG (0.3); analyze omnibus agreement regarding same (0.2); research issues regarding reply for same (1.8); call with Skyworks, White & Case, and Rothschild regarding motion to approve aircraft transactions (1.3).
Jerrard, Erik McClammy, James I.	08/03/21 08/03/21	0.7 1.1	Call with Rothschild and others regarding aircraft acquisitions. Review aircraft motion (0.4); call with advisors regarding same (0.7).
Melcer, Moshe	08/03/21	2.8	Call with Skyworks, White & Case, and Rothschild regarding motion to approve aircraft transactions (0.8) (partial attendance); correspondence with T. Green regarding same (0.2); correspondence with S. Szanzer regarding same (0.2); analyze precedent regarding same (0.4); review and revise motion to approve aircraft transactions (0.7); review and revise sealing motion regarding same (0.4); correspondence with S. Szanzer regarding same (0.1).

		Time	Detail By Project
Name	Date	Hours	Narrative
Piraino, Stephen D.	08/03/21	0.7	Call with Skyworks, White & Case, and Rothschild regarding motion to approve aircraft transactions (partial attendance).
Steinberg, Richard J.	08/03/21	1.5	Review Ex-Im omnibus amendment agreements (1.1); correspondence with T. Green regarding same (0.4).
Szanzer, Steven Z.	08/03/21	8.6	Correspondence with White & Case regarding MUFG (0.2); correspondence with T. Green regarding same (0.1); correspondence with White & Case regarding CAE documents (0.1); review and consider Skyworks' comments to same (0.5); correspondence with M. Melcer regarding same (1.0); correspondence with T. Green regarding same (1.0); correspondence with T. Graulich regarding DAE transaction issues (0.9); correspondence with Davis Polk Litigation team regarding same (0.5); correspondence with T. Green and M. Melcer regarding same (0.5); call with Skyworks, White & Case, and Rothschild regarding motion to approve aircraft transactions (1.3); correspondence with Willkie Farr regarding same (0.3); correspondence with Skyworks regarding AJR Aviation (0.1); review and revise SMBC sealing motion (1.2); correspondence with M. Melcer regarding same (0.9).
Graulich, Timothy Green, Thomas S.	08/04/21 08/04/21	0.7 3.0	Call with R. Sanchez Baker regarding DAE. Draft DAE motion reply outline (0.8); correspondence with S.
Orden, monas o.	00/04/21	3.0	Szanzer regarding same (0.3); call with advisors regarding same (0.9); analyze precedent replies regarding same (1.0).
Melcer, Moshe	08/04/21	3.0	Review and revise motion to approve equipment transaction (0.5); review and revise sealing motion regarding same (0.2); review and revise declaration in support of same (0.1); call with Aeroméxico and others regarding motion to approve aircraft transactions (0.4); review and revise motion to approve aircraft transactions (0.8); review and revise sealing motion regarding same (0.5); draft declaration in support of same (0.5).
Piraino, Stephen D.	08/04/21	0.4	Call with R. Sanchez Baker and others regarding DAE transaction.
Steinberg, Richard J.	08/04/21	5.2	Draft Ex-Im motion (4.9); email with T. Green regarding same (0.1); call with White & Case regarding same (0.2).
Szanzer, Steven Z.	08/04/21	6.1	Correspondence with Linklaters regarding DVB/MUFG (0.1); review and revise SMBC documents (0.6); correspondence with M. Melcer regarding same (0.6); correspondence with White & Case and Skyworks regarding same (0.6); correspondence with Skyworks regarding BBAM (0.3); correspondence with M. Melcer regarding same (0.2); review fleet workstream summary (0.2); correspondence with Coadvisors regarding DAE (0.4); correspondence with Willkie Farr regarding same (0.1); correspondence with T. Graulich regarding same (0.1); review and revise CAE documents (0.5); correspondence with M. Melcer regarding same (0.8); correspondence with White & Case and Skyworks regarding same (0.5); correspondence with T. Green and M. Melcer regarding Ex-Im (0.3); correspondence with White & Case regarding Chorus (0.2); correspondence with same regarding Flight Safety (0.2); correspondence with same regarding Sierra Echo (0.2).
Green, Thomas S.	08/05/21	2.4	Draft DAE motion reply outline (1.9); attend call with Davis Polk Fleet team and White & Case regarding fleet workstreams (0.5).

		Time	Detail By Project
Name	Date	Hours	Narrative
Melcer, Moshe	08/05/21	1.7	Revise motion to approve equipment transaction (0.2); attend call with Davis Polk Fleet team and White & Case regarding fleet workstreams (0.5); revise fleet status summary (0.2); draft Certificate of No Objection to North Shore motion (0.3); correspondence with S. Szanzer regarding same (0.1); review DAE motion reply (0.2); correspondence with T. Green regarding same (0.2).
Szanzer, Steven Z.	08/05/21	8.1	Correspondence with T. Green regarding DAE motion reply outline (0.8); review and revise same (3.2); correspondence with M. Melcer regarding DAE motion (0.2); correspondence with A. Rosenblatt regarding same (0.2); correspondence with White & Case regarding same (0.2); call with Aeroméxico and co-advisors regarding DAE (1.3); review analysis for same (0.4); correspondence with White & Case regarding engine replacement (0.2); correspondence with White & Case regarding SMBC (0.1); correspondence with T. Green and M. Melcer regarding DAE motion reply (0.5); correspondence with M. Melcer regarding Certificates of No Objection to aircraft motion (0.3); attend call with Davis Polk Fleet team and White & Case regarding fleet workstreams (0.5); prepare for same (0.2).
Green, Thomas S.	08/06/21	2.3	Correspondence with S. Szanzer regarding DAE motion (0.3); call with M. Melcer regarding same (0.1); analyze precedents regarding same (1.0); draft same (0.9).
McClammy, James I.	08/06/21	2.1	Review aircraftlease motion papers (0.9); correspondence with Davis Polk team regarding same (1.2).
Melcer, Moshe	08/06/21	2.4	Draft Certificate of No Objection to aircraft motion (0.4); correspondence with S. Szanzer regarding DAE motion (0.2); call with T. Green regarding same (0.1); call with Davis Polk Restructuring and Litigation teams regarding same (0.9); email with M. Masaro regarding same (0.1); correspondence with T. Green regarding same (0.1); email with L. Buchwald regarding same (0.1); review fleet summary status (0.5).
Piraino, Stephen D.	08/06/21	0.8	Call with Davis Polk Restructuring and Litigations teams regarding DAE.
Steinberg, Richard J.	08/06/21	2.2	Call with White & Case regarding Ex-Im motion (0.3); revise claims spreadsheet regarding same (0.4); revise Ex-Im motion (0.3); call with White & Case regarding Ex-Im motion (0.2); correspondence with T. Green regarding same (0.1); correspondence with M. Melcer regarding fleet workstreams (0.3); email with White & Case and O'Melveny regarding Ex-Im claims (0.2); review fleet claims (0.3); email with M. Melcer regarding same (0.1).
Szanzer, Steven Z.	08/06/21	5.7	Review and revise Certificate of No Objection to aircraft motion (0.5); correspondence with M. Melcer regarding same (0.8); call with T. Goren regarding DAE (0.4); email with Davis Polk team regarding same (0.2); correspondence with White & Case and Vedder Price regarding MUFG (0.2); review and consider comments to DAE motion reply outline (0.4); correspondence with Davis Polk team regarding same (0.4); call with Davis Polk Restructuring and Litigation teams regarding same (0.9); correspondence with M. Melcer and T. Green regarding same (1.4); correspondence with L. Buchwald regarding same (0.5).
Bane, Abraham Green, Thomas S.	08/07/21 08/07/21	0.2 8.1	Review Creditors Committee objection to DAE motion. Extensive drafting of DAE motion reply (7.1); correspondence

		Time	Detail By Project
Name	Date	Hours	Narrative
	00/07/04	4.5	with Davis Polk team regarding same (1.0).
McClammy, James I.	08/07/21	1.5	Correspondence with Davis Polk Litigation team regarding aircraft lease motion.
Melcer, Moshe	08/07/21	1.8	Review Creditors Committee objection to DAE motion (0.3); review and revise reply to same (0.9); correspondence with S.
Piraino, Stephen D.	08/07/21	1.0	Szanzer and T. Green regarding same (0.6). Call with Davis Polk team and co-advisors regarding aircraft objection (0.7); correspondence with L. Buchwald regarding same (0.3).
Szanzer, Steven Z.	08/07/21	1.7	Review and consider Creditors Committee objection to DAE motion (0.8); correspondence with S. Piraino and M. Melcer regarding same (0.5); correspondence with Davis Polk Restructuring and Litigation teams regarding reply to same
Melcer, Moshe	08/08/21	9.2	(0.4). Review and revise DAE motion reply (6.5); correspondence with S. Szanzer regarding same (0.5); call with Davis Polk, Rothschild, and AlixPartners teams regarding same (0.8); draft
Piraino, Stephen D.	08/08/21	1.0	supplemental declaration regarding same (1.4). Call with Davis Polk, Rothschild, and AlixPartners teams regarding DAE motion reply (0.8); correspondence with S. Szanzer regarding same (0.2).
Szanzer, Steven Z.	08/08/21	10.1	Call with AlixPartners and Rothschild regarding DAE reply (0.8); review and revise same (6.3); review, revise, and consider comments to same (2.0); correspondence with M. Melcer regarding same and supplemental declaration (1.0).
Graulich, Timothy	08/09/21	6.9	Attend Chambers conference regarding DAE motion (0.4); prepare for same (2.6); review and revise DAE motion reply (3.2); call with C. Hansen regarding same (0.7).
Green, Thomas S.	08/09/21	0.7	Call with A. Schwartz regarding DAE motion reply redactions (0.2); call with Davis Polk Litigation and Restructuring teams regarding same (0.5).
Melcer, Moshe	08/09/21	8.1	Review and revise DAE motion reply (5.8); call with Davis Polk Restructuring and Litigation teams regarding redactions for same (0.5); correspondence with S. Szanzer regarding same (0.7); call with same regarding same (0.2); correspondence with S. Piraino regarding same (0.1); analyze joinder to DAE objection (0.1); draft interim DAE order (0.7).
Piraino, Stephen D.	08/09/21	4.2	Correspondence with Davis Polk team regarding DAE motion (1.5); call with same regarding reply to same (0.4); correspondence with T. Graulich regarding same (0.3); correspondence with Willkie Farr and Chambers regarding conference on DAE motion (0.3); attend Chambers conference on DAE motion (0.4); prepare for same (0.5); call with Davis Polk team regarding same (0.5); review and revise interim order (0.3).
Szanzer, Steven Z.	08/09/21	12.0	Review and review DAE motion reply (1.4); review and revise supplemental declaration regarding same (0.5); correspondence with M. Melcer regarding same (0.5); call with Davis Polk Restructuring and Litigation teams regarding supplemental declaration regarding same (0.5); call with M. Melcer regarding same (0.2); attend Chambers conference regarding DAE motion (0.4); correspondence with Davis Polk team regarding same (0.8); review and consider joinder to UCC's objection (0.2); correspondence with Davis Polk Restructuring team regarding same (0.2); review, revise and consider comments to DAE motion reply and supplemental

		Time I	Detail By Project
Name	Date	Hours	Narrative
			declaration (1.5); correspondence with Davis Polk Restructuring team regarding same (1.5); correspondence with co-advisors regarding same (0.8); call with Willkie Farr regarding interim DAE interim order (0.5); review and revise same (0.5); correspondence with Davis Polk team regarding same (0.5); call with C. Hansen regarding same (0.3); review and revise DAE Certificate of No Objection to sealing motion (0.8); correspondence with Davis Polk Restructuring team regarding same (0.7); correspondence with White & Case and Norton Rose regarding CAE (0.2).
Graulich, Timothy	08/10/21	3.4	Review revised DAE order (0.6); review and revise DAE motion reply (2.8).
Green, Thomas S.	08/10/21	3.9	Correspondence with S. Piraino regarding redactions (0.2); email with Davis Polk team regarding same (0.1); review and revise Ex-Im motion (3.4); correspondence with M. Melcer regarding fleet updates (0.2).
Melcer, Moshe	08/10/21	5.5	Correspondence with T. Green regarding DAE (0.2); correspondence with M. Giddens regarding same (0.2); correspondence with S. Piraino regarding same (0.4); review and revise reply to same (1.7); draft notice of proposed interim order (0.8); draft proposed interim order (1.7); correspondence with T. Green regarding outstanding fleet workstreams (0.2); revise fleet status summary (0.3).
Piraino, Stephen D.	08/10/21	1.8	Correspondence with T. Green regarding DAE motion reply (0.3); correspondence with Davis Polk Restructuring team regarding same (0.8); correspondence with Chambers regarding same (0.3); call with A. Schwartz regarding sealing motion regarding same (0.2); correspondence with L. Buchwald regarding DAE motion (0.2).
Steinberg, Richard J.	08/10/21	1.6	Review and revise Ex-Im motion (1.1); correspondence with T. Green regarding same (0.1); email with S. Szanzer regarding same (0.4).
Szanzer, Steven Z.	08/10/21	12.4	Review and finalize DAE motion reply (1.8); review and revise supplemental declaration regarding same (1.7); correspondence with Davis Polk team, Chambers, and Willkie Farr regarding extending filing deadline for same (0.5); review and finalize proposed DAE interim order (3.0); correspondence with Clifford Chance, Willkie Farr, White & Case, and Davis Polk Restructuring team regarding same (3.0); review and revise notice for same (0.6); correspondence with M. Melcer regarding same (0.6); review emails regarding DAE redactions (0.4); correspondence with Davis Polk Restructuring team and Willkie Farr regarding Certificate of No Objection to sealing motion (0.3); review and revise same (0.5).
Green, Thomas S.	08/11/21	1.7	Call with I. Renzi regarding Ex-Im (0.1); correspondence with S. Szanzer regarding same (0.3); correspondence with R. Steinberg regarding same (0.1); review and revise Ex-Im motion (0.5); review and revise Clover order (0.7).
Melcer, Moshe	08/11/21	4.4	Draft Certificates of No Objection to fleet filings (2.5); email with Chambers regarding same (1.6); call with AlixPartners regarding DAE motion (0.1); correspondence with S. Szanzer regarding outstanding fleet workstreams (0.2).
Steinberg, Richard J.	08/11/21	0.7	Correspondence with S. Szanzer regarding Ex-Im motion and omnibus amendment agreements (0.5); email with White & Case regarding same (0.2).

		Time	Detail By Project
Name	Date	Hours	Narrative
Szanzer, Steven Z.	08/11/21	5.9	Correspondence with M. Melcer, C. Dietz, and Skyworks regarding Chorus (0.2); correspondence with Linklaters and T. Green regarding DVB/ MUFG transfer (0.2); correspondence with White & Case and Vedder Price regarding Ex-Im omnibus agreement (0.2); review Certificates of No Objections to fleet filings (0.5); correspondence with M. Melcer and T. Graulich regarding same (0.5); review and revise Ex-Im motion (3.0); call with R. Steinberg and T. Green regarding same (0.7); correspondence with T. Green and M. Melcer regarding Clover (0.3); correspondence with White & Case and Skyworks regarding SMBC (0.3).
Green, Thomas S.	08/12/21	2.0	Attend call with Davis Polk Fleet team and White & Case regarding fleet workstreams (0.6); correspondence with Davis Polk Fleet team regarding engine lease (0.2); research issues regarding same (0.4); analyze comments to Ex-Im motion (0.8).
Melcer, Moshe	08/12/21	2.1	Review fleet orders (0.3); email with White & Case and Skyworks regarding same (0.2); attend call with Davis Polk Fleet team and White & Case regarding fleet workstreams (0.6); revise fleet status summary (0.3); draft motion to approve aircraft transactions (0.4); draft sealing motion regarding same (0.2); draft declaration in support of same (0.1).
Steinberg, Richard J.	08/12/21	3.6	Emails with White & Case regarding Ex-Im omnibus amendment agreements (0.3); revise Ex-Im motion (2.8); email with M. Melcer regarding claims language in fleet proposed orders (0.3); correspondence with T. Green regarding Ex-Im (0.2).
Szanzer, Steven Z.	08/12/21	3.5	Review DAE order (0.3); correspondence with White & Case regarding DAE lease (0.1); email with co-advisors regarding DAE analyses (0.1); correspondence with Davis Polk team regarding SMBC (0.3); correspondence with Skyworks regarding Chorus (0.4); correspondence T. Green regarding same (0.4); review issues regarding same (0.4); review Ex-Im motion (0.2); review fleet workstreams summary (0.2); call with White & Case regarding same (0.8); correspondence with T. Green regarding same (0.1); correspondence with co-advisors regarding SMBC (0.2).
Green, Thomas S.	08/13/21	0.6	Correspondence with Davis Polk Fleet team regarding True Noord.
Melcer, Moshe	08/13/21	0.8	Call with Davis Polk Fleet team, White & Case, Skyworks, AlixPartners, and Rothschild regarding DAE (0.4); email with Aeroméxico regarding same (0.2); correspondence with S. Szanzer regarding outstanding fleet workstreams (0.2).
Piraino, Stephen D. Steinberg, Richard J.	08/13/21 08/13/21	0.5 3.1	Call with co-advisors regarding DAE. Review and revise Ex-Im motion (2.6); correspondence with T. Green regarding same (0.1); call with S. Szanzer regarding same (0.1); email with White & Case and Skyworks regarding same (0.3).
Szanzer, Steven Z.	08/13/21	3.0	Call with White & Case and Skyworks regarding SMBC motion (0.3); review and revise Ex-Im motion (2.2); call with R. Steinberg regarding same (0.1); call with Skyworks regarding new SMBC transaction (0.4).
Melcer, Moshe Melcer, Moshe	08/14/21 08/15/21	0.1 1.0	Email with A. Sainz regarding DAE. Revise motion to approve equipment transaction (0.2); email with T. Graulich regarding same (0.2); review opposing

		Time	Detail By Project
Name	Date	Hours	Narrative
Szanzer, Steven Z.	08/15/21	2.4	counsel's comments to motion to approve aircraft transactions (0.3); email with S. Szanzer and T. Green regarding same (0.3). Correspondence with M. Melcer (0.3); review and revise CAE
			motion (0.3); correspondence with Skyworks regarding SMBC motion (0.2); correspondence with C. Hansen and Davis Polk Fleet team regarding redactions (0.3); correspondence with White & Case and Skyworks regarding CAE and SMBC motions (0.2); review and consider comments to CAE sealing motion (0.2); correspondence with M. Melcer regarding same (0.3); review emails regarding SMBC, CAE, and JOLCO motions (0.3); call with M. Melcer regarding same (0.3).
Green, Thomas S. Melcer, Moshe	08/16/21 08/16/21	0.3 2.8	Correspondence with Davis Polk Fleet team regarding MTU. Review and revise motion to approve aircraft transaction (0.4); review and revise related sealing motion (0.5); review and revise related declaration for same (0.2); call with Clifford Chance and others regarding SMBC assumption motion (0.4); review and revise motion to approve aircraft transaction (0.6); review and revise related sealing motion (0.3); review and revise declaration for same (0.3); correspondence with S. Szanzer regarding same (0.1).
Piraino, Stephen D.	08/16/21	0.2	Correspondence with Davis Polk Fleet team regarding fleet issues.
Steinberg, Richard J.	08/16/21	1.2	Review precedent aircraft financing motions (1.0); email with S. Szanzer regarding same (0.2).
Szanzer, Steven Z.	08/16/21	7.3	Correspondence with Skyworks, White & Case, and Davis Polk Fleet team regarding CAE and SMBC motions (1.0); correspondence with White & Case and Vedder Price regarding Ex-Im (0.3); review and consider comments to SMBC assumption motion (0.5); revise same (0.5); correspondence with M. Melcer regarding same (0.6); call with Clifford Chance and others regarding same (0.4); correspondence with same and M. Melcer regarding same (0.4); correspondence with H. Rosenblat regarding new engine lease (0.3); correspondence with White & Case regarding redactions (0.2); review Clover motion (0.4); correspondence with M. Melcer regarding same (0.4); review comments to Ex-Im motion (0.3); review and revise SMBC acquisition motion (1.0); correspondence with M. Melcer regarding same (1.0).
Green, Thomas S.	08/17/21	0.7	Analyze Ex- Im motion (0.5); correspondence with S. Szanzer regarding same (0.2).
Melcer, Moshe	08/17/21	0.9	Call with S. Szanzer regarding fleet workstreams (0.4); revise fleet status summary (0.4); email with Clifford Chance regarding motion to approve aircraft transactions (0.1).
Steinberg, Richard J.	08/17/21	2.9	Review and revise Ex-Im motion (1.6); call with White & Case and Skyworks regarding same (0.8); correspondence with S. Szanzer and T. Green regarding same (0.5).
Szanzer, Steven Z.	08/17/21	5.4	Correspondence with White & Case regarding SMBC acquisition motion (0.3); review and revise same (0.7); call with M. Melcer regarding fleet workstreams (0.4); correspondence with Skyworks and White & Case regarding BBAM and JOLCO (0.4); correspondence with White & Case regarding SMBC redactions (0.2); correspondence with T. Green and R. Steinberg regarding Ex-Im (0.8); review and consider comments to motion to same (1.0); call with White &

		Time	Detail By Project
Name	Date	Hours	Narrative
Graulich, Timothy Green, Thomas S.	08/18/21 08/18/21	0.5 1.5	Case and Skyworks regarding same (0.8); correspondence with R. Steinberg regarding same (0.2); correspondence with White & Case regarding same (0.2); call with M. Melcer regarding fleet workstreams (0.4). Call with M. Landess regarding JOLCO issues. Analyze Sierra Echo documents (0.3); correspondence with A Troconis regarding DAE (0.2); correspondence with Davis Polk Fleet team regarding Ex-Im (0.5); review same (0.3);
Melcer, Moshe	08/18/21	4.5	analyze docket for rejection motions (0.2). Review and revise motion to approve aircraft transactions (0.8); review and revise related sealing motion (0.3); review and revise related declaration (0.2); correspondence with S. Szanzer regarding the same (0.1); correspondence with T. Green regarding the same (0.1); call with Skyworks and White & Case regarding motion to approve aircraft transaction (0.3) (partial attendance); draft motion to approve aircraft transactions (1.9); correspondence with N. Sokol regarding same (0.2); correspondence with S. Szanzer regarding same (0.5); correspondence with M. Masaro regarding same (0.1).
Piraino, Stephen D. Steinberg, Richard J.	08/18/21 08/18/21	1.0 2.3	Call with Skyworks and others regarding JOLCOs. Revise Ex-Im motion (1.7); email with White & Case and Skyworks regarding same (0.4); email with S. Szanzer regarding same (0.2).
Szanzer, Steven Z.	08/18/21	8.7	Correspondence with Vedder Price and White & Case regarding Ex-Im omnibus agreement (0.3); correspondence with Skyworks regarding Ex-Im motion (0.2); review and revise same (1.4); correspondence with R. Steinberg regarding same (1.4); review and consider comments to same (0.3); correspondence with White & Case regarding SMBC and CAE motion (0.4); correspondence with Cleary Gottlieb regarding same (0.3); review and consider comments to SMBC motion (0.6); correspondence with M. Melcer regarding same (0.3); correspondence with R. Johnson regarding same (0.3); correspondence with White & Case regarding Sierra Echo (0.5); call with Skyworks and White & Case regarding JOLCO (1.8); correspondence with Davis Polk Fleet team regarding rejection motion (0.8); correspondence with T. Green regarding DAE consent (0.1).
Melcer, Moshe	08/19/21	5.1	Review and revise motion to approve aircraft transactions (0.6); review and revise aircraft rejection motion (2.1); correspondence with S. Szanzer regarding same (0.1); call with Skyworks, White & Case, and Rothschild regarding same (0.8); call with White & Case and Davis Polk Fleet team regarding fleet workstreams (0.5); review and revise fleet status summary (0.3); analyze foreign aircraft finance laws (0.7).
Piraino, Stephen D.	08/19/21	1.2	Call with White & Case, Skyworks, and Rothschild regarding fleet issues.
Steinberg, Richard J.	08/19/21	0.5	Call with White & Case and Davis Polk Fleet team regarding fleet workstreams.
Szanzer, Steven Z.	08/19/21	10.5	Correspondence with T. Green regarding DVB/MUFG transfer (0.2); correspondence with N. Vislocky regarding same (0.1); correspondence with White & Case regarding Ex-Im motion (0.1); review fleet workstream summary (0.2); call with White & Case and Davis Polk Fleet team regarding fleet workstreams (0.5); review and revise rejection motion (3.9);

		Time	Detail By Project
Name	Date	Hours	Narrative
			call with M. Melcer regarding same (0.3); correspondence with White & Case and Skyworks regarding same (0.4); correspondence with R. Johnson regarding SMBC assumption motion (0.2); review comments to same (0.3); correspondence with M. Melcer regarding same (0.3); correspondence with Skyworks regarding Wings (0.1); call with same, Rothschild, and AHG advisors regarding JOLCOs (0.5); call with White & Case, Skyworks, and Rothschild regarding same (1.2); correspondence with T. Graulich and M. Melcer regarding same (0.5); email advisors regarding same (0.5); correspondence with M. Melcer regarding research for same (0.5); correspondence
Graulich, Timothy Melcer, Moshe	08/20/21 08/20/21	0.6 9.5	with White & Case regarding Avolon (0.1). Call with Skyworks regarding fleet issues. Analyze foreign aircraft finance law (1.9); review precedent assumption and rejection motions (2.1); review and revise aircraft rejection motion (2.3); draft motion to approve aircraft transactions (2.2); call with AlixPartners, Skyworks, and Davis Polk Fleet team regarding aircraft rejection motion (0.5); correspondence with S. Szanzer regarding same (0.3); correspondence with T. Green regarding same (0.2).
Steinberg, Richard J.	08/20/21	2.4	Revise Ex-Im motion (1.6); correspondence with S. Szanzer regarding same (0.1); call with AlixPartners, Skyworks, and Davis Polk Fleet team regarding aircraft rejection motion (0.3) (partial attendance); email with Vedder Price regarding same (0.1); email with White & Case and Skyworks regarding same (0.3).
Szanzer, Steven Z.	08/20/21	9.4	Correspondence with M. Melcer regarding fleet issues research (0.6); correspondence with T. Graulich and Skyworks regarding same (0.6); review JOLCO stipulation (0.2); email with Davis Polk Fleet team regarding analysis of same (0.2); correspondence with Skyworks regarding same (0.3); finalize SMBC and CAE motions (1.5); correspondence with Davis Polk Fleet team and White & Case regarding Avolon (0.2); review, revise, and finalize aircraft rejection motion (4.5); review and consider comments to Ex-Im motion (0.6); correspondence with R. Steinberg regarding same (0.5); correspondence with White & Case regarding True Noord (0.2).
Melcer, Moshe	08/21/21	0.7	Email with Chambers regarding fleet filings (0.3); email committee and potential bidder advisors regarding same (0.1); email with Clifford Chance regarding same (0.1); correspondence with S. Szanzer regarding fleet workstreams (0.2).
Szanzer, Steven Z.	08/21/21	1.3	Review emails regarding CAE, SMBC assumption, and JOLCO rejection motions (0.5); correspondence with T. Green (0.2); correspondence with M. Melcer regarding same and fleet workstreams (0.6).
Melcer, Moshe Szanzer, Steven Z.	08/22/21 08/22/21	1.3 0.3	Draft motion to approve aircraft transactions. Call with M. Melcer regarding Avolon (0.2); correspondence with White & Case regarding same (0.1).
Green, Thomas S.	08/23/21	3.1	Review Avolon documents (0.5); call with White & Case regarding same (0.1); review and revise MTU documents (0.9); call with H. Rosenblatt and A. Andreeva regarding same (0.5); call with S. Szanzer regarding same (0.3); analyze DBV stipulations (0.6); correspondence M. Giddens regarding

		Time	Detail By Project
Name	Date	Hours	Narrative
Melcer, Moshe	08/23/21	0.9	redacted documents (0.2). Review and revise motion to approve aircraft transactions (0.7); call with S. Szanzer regarding NBB (0.2).
Szanzer, Steven Z.	08/23/21	5.9	Correspondence with White & Case and Skyworks regarding Avolon (0.3); review and revise Yamasa motion (1.2); correspondence with M. Melcer regarding same (1.2); correspondence with Skyworks regarding JOLCO leases (0.2); correspondence with White & Case regarding True Noord (0.3); correspondence with T. Green regarding same (0.3); correspondence with same and N. Vislocky regarding DVB/MUFG transfer (0.2); correspondence with Davis Polk Fleet team regarding DAE (1.1); correspondence with Willkie Farr regarding same (0.3); correspondence with White & Case regarding Yamasa (0.1); call with M. Melcer regarding NBB (0.2); correspondence with M. Melcer regarding fleet issues (0.5).
Graulich, Timothy Green, Thomas S.	08/24/21 08/24/21	0.5 3.5	Call with S. Szanzer regarding JOLCO stipulations and DAE. Analyze MTU agreement (1.2); correspondence with S. Szanzer regarding same (1.2); analyze BNDES agreement (1.1).
Melcer, Moshe	08/24/21	3.7	Review and revise motion to approve aircraft transactions (0.8); call with Davis Polk Restructuring and Litigation teams and Willkie Farr regarding DAE (0.3); draft notice of final DAE order (0.9); correspondence with S. Szanzer regarding same (0.2); correspondence with T. Green regarding fleet workstreams (0.3); analyze regarding renewal of service contract (0.9); correspondence with R. Steinberg regarding same (0.3).
Steinberg, Richard J.	08/24/21	0.6	Revise Ex-Im motion (0.3); call with White & Case regarding same (0.2); email with S. Szanzer regarding same (0.1).
Szanzer, Steven Z.	08/24/21	5.6	Call with T. Graulich regarding JOLCO stipulations and DAE (0.5); correspondence with S. Campbell and M. Melcer regarding Clover (0.6); review revised Clover motion (0.2); correspondence with White & Case and Skyworks regarding same (0.2); call with Davis Polk Litigation team regarding DAE (0.4); call with Willkie Farr regarding same (0.6); correspondence with L. Buchwald and M. Melcer regarding same (0.3); correspondence with T. Graulich regarding same (0.2); email with Aeroméxico and co-advisors regarding update on same (0.2); correspondence with M. Melcer regarding final DAE order (0.4); review same (0.3); correspondence with Clifford Chance regarding same (0.1); correspondence with Davis Polk Fleet team and Skyworks regarding letter of credit issue (0.4); correspondence with M. Melcer and White & Case regarding Yamasa (0.4); review and revise motion for same (0.8).
Szanzer, Steven Z.	08/24/21	3.4	Correspondence with M. Melcer (0.7); correspondence with White & Case and M. Melcer regarding fleet issues (0.4); correspondence with Skyworks regarding BBAM (0.3); correspondence with White & Case regarding Wings (0.2); correspondence with M. Melcer regarding same (0.1); correspondence with T. Green regarding True Noord (0.3); review UCC's reservation of rights regarding DAE (0.3); review and consider comments to Ex-Im motion (0.3); correspondence with R. Steinberg regarding same (0.2); correspondence with Linklaters regarding DVB/MUFG transfer 12

		Time	Detail By Project
Name	Date	Hours	Narrative
Graulich, Timothy Green, Thomas S.	08/25/21 08/25/21	1.6 3.9	(0.4); correspondence with T. Green and A. Troconis regarding DAE consent (0.2). Call with Skyworks regarding fleet strategy. Analyze aircraft rejection procedures document (1.3); research issues regarding JOLCO (1.3); research letter of credit issues
Melcer, Moshe	08/25/21	6.6	(1.3). Analyze letter of credit issues (2.5); correspondence with R. Steinberg regarding same (0.2); draft motion to approve aircraft transactions (1.1); correspondence with S. Szanzer regarding same (0.3); review and revise motion to approve aircraft transactions (2.0); draft Certificate of No Objection and
Steinberg, Richard J.	08/25/21	4.9	final proposed DAE order (0.4); call with Clifford Chance regarding same (0.1). Review and revise Ex-Im motion (2.6); review comments from White & Case and Vedder Price regarding same (0.5); email with White & Case regarding same (0.3); review potential letter of credit claims regarding SAEL (1.1); call with Skyworks regarding same (0.2); email with S. Szanzer regarding same
Szanzer, Steven Z.	08/25/21	6.9	(0.2). Call with H. Rosenblatt regarding True Noord agreement (0.6); review and revise same (0.5); correspondence with T. Green regarding same (0.4); correspondence with R. Steinberg regarding letter of credit issue (0.3); correspondence with Skyworks and Aeroméxico regarding same (0.2); correspondence with T. Green regarding Ministry of Economy reserve issue (0.3); call with Aeroméxico and advisors regarding JOLCO (1.3); correspondence with stakeholders regarding same (0.5); review stipulation regarding same (0.4); correspondence with T. Green regarding same (0.4); correspondence with T. Graulich regarding same (0.1); correspondence with T. Green regarding schedule of leases for rejection (0.2); correspondence with M. Melcer regarding final DAE order (0.3); review same (0.4); correspondence with R. Johnson regarding same (0.3); review and consider comments to same (0.2); correspondence with White & Case regarding same (0.1).
Szanzer, Steven Z.	08/25/21	4.9	Correspondence with R. Steinberg, White & Case, and Skyworks regarding Ex-Im motion (0.4); review and consider comments to same (0.3); correspondence with R. Steinberg regarding same (0.3); review and revise Yamasa motion (0.3); correspondence with M. Melcer regarding same (0.3); review and revise NBB motion (0.6); correspondence with M. Melcer regarding same (0.6); review and revise aircraft lease assumption motion (0.6); correspondence with M. Melcer regarding same (0.6); correspondence with Linklaters regarding DVB/MUFGtransfer (0.1); review and revise SMBC acquisition motion (0.4); correspondence with M. Melcer regarding same (0.4).
Green, Thomas S.	08/26/21	1.0	Call with White & Case and Davis Polk Fleet team regarding fleet workstreams (0.5), review and revise MTU documents
Melcer, Moshe	08/26/21	2.5	(0.3), research issues regarding BBAM (0.2). Review and revise motion to approve aircraft transaction (1.5); call with White & Case and Davis Polk Fleet team regarding fleet workstreams (0.5); correspondence with T. Green regarding same (0.1); revise final DAE order (0.3);

		Time	Detail By Project
Name	Date	Hours	Narrative
Steinberg, Richard J.	08/26/21	2.5	correspondence with S. Szanzer regarding same (0.1); Revise Ex-Im motion (1.9); email with Skyworks regarding potential letter of credit claims regarding SAEL (0.2); email with White & Case regarding Ex-Im pleadings and underlying agreements (0.2); email with Vedder Price regarding same (0.2).
Szanzer, Steven Z.	08/26/21	9.6	Correspondence with Skyworks and White & Case regarding Ex-Im motion and declaration (0.3); review and same (1.5); correspondence with R. Steinberg regarding same (1.5); correspondence with White & Case and Vedder regarding Ex-Im omnibus agreements (0.2); review and revise True Noord agreement (0.3); correspondence with H. Rosenblat and T. Wolynski regarding same (0.3); correspondence with T. Green regarding same (0.3); correspondence with R. Johnson regarding final DAE order (0.3); correspondence with M. Melcer regarding same (0.2); review and revise same (0.5); review and revise Certificate of No Objection to same (0.6); correspondence with Willkie Farr regarding same (0.4); correspondence with Willkie Farr regarding same and final order regarding same (0.2); review fleet workstreams summary in preparation for call with White & Case (0.3); call with White & Case and Davis Polk Fleet team regarding fleet workstreams (0.5); correspondence with W. Melcer regarding same (0.7); correspondence with M. Melcer regarding same (0.7); correspondence with same regarding fleet workstreams (0.5).
Melcer, Moshe	08/27/21	4.4	Finalize Clover motion (0.4); correspondence with S. Szanzer regarding same (0.1); finalize Certificate of No Objection to DAE (0.4); correspondence with S. Szanzer regarding same (0.2); call with Clifford Chance regarding same (0.2); correspondence with S. Piraino regarding same (0.1); review and revise motion to approve aircraft transactions (1.4); correspondence with. S. Szanzer regarding same (0.2); draft sealing motion regarding motion to approve aircraft transactions (1.3); revise fleet status summary (0.1).
Steinberg, Richard J.	08/27/21	4.0	Review comments from Vedder Price to Ex-Im motion (0.3); correspondence with S. Szanzer regarding same (0.5); email to Vedder Price regarding same (0.2); revise Ex-Im motion (0.4); review and comment on CGF omnibus amendment agreements (2.3); email with S. Szanzer regarding same (0.3).
Szanzer, Steven Z.	08/27/21	7.8	Correspondence with B. Thorsness regarding Ex-Im motion (0.3); correspondence with R. Steinberg regarding same (0.2); review and revise same (0.5); review revised omnibus agreements regarding same (0.4); finalize Clover motion (0.5); finalize True Noord agreement (0.5); finalize Certificate of No Objection to DAE and final order regarding same (1.2); call with Willkie Farr regarding same (0.4); call with White & Case and Davis Polk Restructuring team regarding Avolon (0.8); correspondence with Skyworks regarding JOLCO leases and claims (0.4); correspondence with White & Case regarding Chorus (0.2); correspondence with M. Melcer regarding same (0.2); review and revise Sierra Echo motion (0.9); correspondence with White & Case regarding Wings motion (0.3); correspondence with same regarding NAC (0.1).

		Time	Detail By Project
Name	Date	Hours	Narrative
Melcer, Moshe	08/28/21	0.1	Email with White & Case regarding motion to approve aircraft transactions.
Melcer, Moshe	08/29/21	0.1	Email with White & Case regarding aircraft transaction.
Garg, Paavani	08/30/21	1.2	Call with S. Szanzer and others regarding assumption of aircrafts research (0.5); email with Davis Polk Fleet team regarding same (0.7).
Green, Thomas S.	08/30/21	4.6	Draft non-disclosure agreement (1.5); research Cape Town issue (1.5); review and revise MUFG omnibus agreement (1.0); correspondence with S. Szanzer regarding Cape Town (0.6).
Melcer, Moshe	08/30/21	4.9	Call with White & Case regarding aircraft transactions (0.1); review and revise motion to approve aircraft transaction (0.3); email with Clifford Chance regarding DAE (0.1); draft declaration for motion to approve aircraft transactions (0.7); draft motion to approve aircraft transactions (2.6); correspondence with S. Szanzer regarding same (0.1); call with Aeroméxico and fleet advisor team regarding same (0.8); correspondence with S. Szanzer regarding outstanding fleet workstreams (0.2).
Steinberg, Richard J.	08/30/21	2.0	Email with White & Case regarding CGF omnibus amendment agreements (0.1); email with same and Skyworks regarding Ex-Im pleadings (0.2); correspondence with M. Melcer regarding same (0.5); correspondence with S. Szanzer regarding same (0.2); review revised CGF omnibus amendment agreements (0.5): review correspondence from Aeroméxico regarding fleet financings (0.3); email with
Szanzer, Steven Z.	08/30/21	5.6	AlixPartners regarding same (0.2). Correspondence with R. Steinberg regarding HSBC fleet (0.3); correspondence with White & Case and M. Melcer regarding Carlyle (0.1); correspondence with M. Melcer regarding SMBC acquisition motion (0.4); correspondence with White & Case regarding same (0.3); call with Aeroméxico and co-advisors regarding JOLCOs (0.8); correspondence with M. Melcer regarding assumption motion regarding same (0.4); review and revise same (0.2); correspondence with White & Case and Skyworks regarding same (0.2); correspondence with M. Melcer regarding same (2.5); correspondence with same regarding Certificate of No Objections (0.4).
Szanzer, Steven Z.	08/30/21	6.2	Correspondence with H. Rosenblat and White & Case regarding True Noord agreement (0.3); call with P. Garg and others regarding assumption of aircraft research (0.5); review CGF omnibus agreement (0.8); correspondence with R. Steinberg, White & Case, and Vedder Price regarding same (0.4); review final DAE order entered (0.1); email with Aeroméxico and co-advisors regarding same (0.1); correspondence with M. Melcer regarding Chorus (0.3); review and revise Ex-Im sealing motion (0.6); correspondence with M. Melcer regarding same (0.6); correspondence with T. Green regarding rejection procedures under stipulations (0.2); review summary of same (0.3); review Non-Disclosure Agreement (0.3); correspondence with T. Green regarding same (0.2); correspondence with R. Steinberg regarding Ex-Im motion (0.2); review revised Ex-Im omnibus agreements (0.4); correspondence with R. Steinberg, White & Case, and Vedder Price regarding same (0.4); correspondence with White & Case regarding redactions regarding same (0.2);

		Time	Detail By Project
Name	Date	Hours	Narrative
			correspondence with White & Case and Skyworks regarding
Garg, Paavani	08/31/21	3.7	timing for Ex-Im filing (0.3). Review precedents on Cape Town convention (3.4); revise draft of fifth assumption notice (0.3).
Graulich, Timothy	08/31/21	2.7	Correspondence with S. Szanzer regarding JOLCOs (0.4); review and revise aircraft lease assumption motion (2.3).
Green, Thomas S.	08/31/21	1.0	Correspondence with Davis Polk team regarding Ex-Im (0.5); correspondence with A. Troconis regarding DAE (0.5).
Melcer, Moshe	08/31/21	6.6	Review and revise assumption motion (2.7); draft related sealing motion (1.2); call with Skyworks regarding same (0.2); correspondence with S. Szanzer regarding same (0.2); draft related declaration (0.6); email with M. Giddens regarding same (0.2); email with Chambers regarding same (0.3); email with creditor groups regarding same (0.2); correspondence with T. Green regarding fleet workstreams (0.3); review and revise motion to approve aircraft transactions (0.6); revise fleet status summary (0.1).
Rincon, Cristina M.	08/31/21	0.3	Review draft of SMBC motion (0.2); review email from L. Buchwald regarding same (0.1).
Steinberg, Richard J.	08/31/21	6.3	Email with AlixPartners regarding fleet financings (0.3); email with the Aeroméxico regarding same (0.1); correspondence with White & Case, Skyworks, and AlixPartners regarding Ex-Im pleadings (0.7); correspondence with S. Szanzer regarding same (0.3); revise Ex-Im motion (1.1); revise Craine declaration in support of same (2.8); revise sealing motion regarding omnibus amendment agreements (0.9); email with Vedder Price regarding same (0.1).
Szanzer, Steven Z.	08/31/21	6.3	Review and consider comments to JOLCO assumption motion (0.3); correspondence with M. Melcer regarding same (0.2); review and revise same (1.2); correspondence with Davis Polk Fleet team regarding sealing motion and declaration (1.2); correspondence with M. Melcer and T. Graulich regarding same (1.3); correspondence with White & Case regarding same (0.4); correspondence with M. Landess regarding same (0.4); review emails regarding True Noord agreement (0.2); correspondence with White & Case and Vedder Price regarding Ex-Im omnibus agreements (0.3); correspondence with J. Craine regarding timing for Ex-Im motion (0.2); correspondence with T. Graulich regarding acquisition motions (0.3); correspondence with L. Buchwald regarding same (0.3).
Szanzer, Steven Z.	08/31/21	6.8	Correspondence with White & Case regarding Ex-Im redactions (0.2); call with AlixPartners regarding Ex-Im (0.3); call with AlixPartners, Skyworks, Rothschild, and White & Case regarding same (0.6); correspondence with R. Steinberg regarding same (0.4); correspondence with T. Green regarding DAE consent (0.1); correspondence with White & Case regarding Carlyle (0.2); correspondence with M. Melcer regarding Carlyle (0.1); correspondence with Cleary Gottlieb regarding JOLCO assumption documents (0.2); finalize same (1.8); correspondence with M. Melcer regarding SMBC assumption order (0.1); correspondence with C. Brown regarding same (0.2); review and revise Avolon motion (0.3); correspondence with M. Melcer regarding same (0.2); correspondence with M. Landess regarding Wings motion (0.1); review and revise Ex-Im motion and declaration (1.0); correspondence with R. Steinberg regarding same (1.0).

		Time	Detail By Project
Name	Date	Hours	Narrative
Total AM100 Aircraft	t/Engines	445.0	
AM110 Automatic St	tay/Litigation		
Rincon, Cristina M.	08/02/21	0.2	Email with D. Olmedo regarding facts for Rule 9019 motion.
Rincon, Cristina M.	08/03/21	1.0	Revise Newrest Rule 9019 motion (0.8); email with
Dinasa Ovietina M	00/04/04	2.2	Aeroméxico regarding facts for same (0.2).
Rincon, Cristina M.	08/04/21	2.2	Review and revise Newrest Rule 9019 motion (1.2); email with Aeroméxico regarding same (1.0).
Rincon, Cristina M.	08/05/21	1.6	Review and revise Newrest Rule 9019 motion (0.8); review
			and revise declarations in support of same (0.8).
Buchwald, Lara	08/06/21	0.3	Correspondence with Davis Polk team regarding exit financing
Samet	00/00/04		discovery.
Graulich, Timothy	08/06/21	1.1	Call with Davis Polk Litigation team regarding DAE discovery (0.6); call with B. Miller regarding same (0.5).
Rincon, Cristina M.	08/06/21	0.7	Call with Davis Polk Restructuring team regarding aircraft
Taricon, Onsana ivi.	00/00/21	0.1	dispute (0.5); email with Newrest counsel and Aeroméxico
			regarding Newrest Rule 9019 motion (0.2).
Szanzer, Steven Z.	08/06/21	0.5	Correspondence with T. Gron regarding DAE discovery (0.1);
			call with Davis Polk Restructuring and Litigation team
Decelerated Lane	00/07/04	0.4	regarding same (0.4).
Buchwald, Lara Samet	08/07/21	2.1	Analyze issues regarding objection to aircraft motion (1.4); call with co-advisors regarding same (0.7).
Rincon, Cristina M.	08/07/21	0.6	Call with Davis Polk Restructuring team regarding DAE
ranoon, onouna w.	00/01/21	0.0	dispute.
Szanzer, Steven Z.	08/07/21	1.0	Review DAE discovery requests (0.5); review emails regarding
			same (0.5).
Buchwald, Lara	08/08/21	5.2	Call with AlixPartners and Rothschild regarding DAE motion
Samet			(0.6); correspondence with J. McClammy and C. Rincon
			regarding litigation strategy regarding same (0.3); correspondence with S. Piraino regarding same (0.2);
			comment on DAE motion reply (1.3); analyze discovery issues
			regarding same (2.8).
Graulich, Timothy	08/08/21	0.5	Correspondence with L. Buchwald regarding DAE discovery.
Marienko, Anna	08/08/21	1.5	Review DAE motion materials.
Rincon, Cristina M.	08/08/21	3.8	Call with advisors and Davis Polk Litigation team regarding
			DAE discovery requests (1.0); review and compile documents for production to Creditors Committee (2.3); review DAE
			motion reply (0.5).
Szanzer, Steven Z.	08/08/21	1.3	Correspondence with Davis Polk Restructuring and Litigation
			teams and co-advisors regarding DAE discovery issues (0.8);
D 1 111	00/00/04	- -	review materials for same (0.5).
Buchwald, Lara Samet	08/09/21	7.7	Analyze issues regarding DAE motion and related discovery
Samel			(2.7); correspondence with C. Rincon and A. Marienko regarding same (0.5); correspondence with S. Szanzer, S.
			Piraino, and others regarding reply regarding same (0.6); call
			with Davis Polk Restructuring and Litigation teams regarding
			same (0.6); prepare for M. Landess deposition (0.5);
			correspondence with M. Landess, C. Rincon, and A. Marienko
			regarding same (2.0); review and revise reply to DAE motion
Ford, Stephen	08/09/21	0.2	(0.8). Correspondence with Davis Polk team regarding discovery.
Marienko, Anna	08/09/21	7.9	Review documents regarding DAE discovery (3.2);
	33,30,21	7.0	correspondence with C. Rincon and L. Buchwald regarding
			DAE motion and M. Landess deposition regarding same (1.0);
			correspondence with C. Rincon and L. Buchwald regarding

		Time I	Detail By Project
Name	Date	Hours	Narrative
Rincon, Cristina M.	08/09/21	5.8	upcoming deposition of M. Landess (0.5); attend M. Landess deposition (2.0); correspondence with Davis Polk team regarding upcoming deposition of M. Landess (1.2). Review and compile documents in response DAE discovery (3.0); prepare M. Landess deposition (2.1); correspondence with L. Buchwald and A. Marienko regarding same and DAE
Szanzer, Steven Z.	08/09/21	3.0	discovery (0.7). Correspondence with Davis Polk team regarding DAE discovery and depositions (1.0); attend M. Landess deposition (2.0).
Buchwald, Lara Samet	08/10/21	3.6	Prepare for M. Landess deposition (0.6); review and revise supplemental declaration regarding DAE motion (0.7); coordinate resolution related to same (1.4); comment on interim order regarding same (0.3); email with A. Schwartz regarding redactions related to same (0.2); call with same regarding same (0.4).
Graulich, Timothy	08/10/21	2.8	Prepare for deposition of M. Landess.
Piraino, Stephen D.	08/10/21	0.5	Email with T. Graulich and R. Arnold regarding DAE discovery (0.2); correspondence with R. Steinberg regarding same (0.3).
Rincon, Cristina M.	08/10/21	0.2	Review emails with Davis Polk team regarding DAE interim order.
Buchwald, Lara Samet	08/11/21	0.4	Correspondence with Davis Polk team regarding aircraft motion.
Rincon, Cristina M.	08/11/21	1.1	Review and revise Newrest Rule 9019 motion.
Buchwald, Lara Samet	08/12/21	0.5	Analyze DAE discovery (0.3); correspondence with T. Graulich, S. Szanzer, and S. Piraino regarding same (0.2).
Graulich, Timothy	08/12/21	1.2	Review DAE discovery requests
Masaro, Matthew Bruno	08/12/21	0.4	Correspondence with C. Rincon and S. Piraino regarding Newrest litigation.
Rincon, Cristina M.	08/12/21	1.7	Analyze Newrest comments to Newrest Rule 9019 motion (1.5); review DAE discovery document request (0.1); email with Davis Polk team regarding same (0.1).
Szanzer, Steven Z.	08/12/21	0.7	Correspondence with Davis Polk team regarding DAE discovery.
Buchwald, Lara Samet	08/13/21	1.8	Analyze DAE discovery requests (1.1); call with Creditors Committee counsel regarding same (0.2); call with Aeromexico advisor group regarding same (0.5).
Graulich, Timothy	08/13/21	0.6	Correspondence with L. Buchwald regarding discovery requests.
Rincon, Cristina M.	08/13/21	1.3	Correspondence with L. Buchwald DAE discovery (0.2); call with advisors regarding same (0.3); review documents for production (0.5); review supplemental DAE discovery request (0.3).
Szanzer, Steven Z.	08/13/21	1.3	Correspondence with Davis Polk team regarding DAE discovery (0.5); call with co-advisors regarding same (0.5); review email to Management regarding same (0.2); correspondence with Davis Polk team regarding same (0.1).
Buchwald, Lara Samet	08/14/21	0.4	Analyze DAE document request.
Rincon, Cristina M.	08/15/21	0.4	Correspondence with L. Buchwald regarding DAE discovery issues (0.2); email with Davis Polk Restructuring team regarding response to same (0.2).
Buchwald, Lara Samet	08/16/21	1.8	Coordinate supplemental document production (0.6); correspondence with C. Rincon regarding same (0.5); prepare for depositions of 30(b)(6) witnesses (0.7).
Farrell, Annie	08/16/21	8.0	Revise case status summary.

		Time	Detail By Project
Name	Date	Hours	Narrative
Masaro, Matthew	08/16/21	0.3	Correspondence with Willkie Farr, Cleary Gottlieb, C. Rincon,
Bruno Criatina M	08/16/21	2.1	and S. Piraino regarding Newrest litigation. Email with W. Kocovski and M. Landess to schedule
Rincon, Cristina M.	06/16/21	3.1	deposition preparation (0.2); prepare documents for
			production (2.7); call with D. Olmedo regarding Newrest
			settlement agreement (0.1); email with S. Piraino and M.
			Masaro regarding filing Newrest Rule 9019 motion (0.1).
Szanzer, Steven Z.	08/16/21	0.6	Correspondence with Davis Polk Litigation team, M. Landess,
Buchwald, Lara	08/17/21	4.5	and W. Kocovski regarding DAE discovery and depositions. Preparation for upcoming 30(b)(6) depositions (2.5);
Samet	00/17/21	4.5	coordinate document production (0.2); call with W. Kocovski
Camot			and others regarding preparation for depositions (1.8).
Rincon, Cristina M.	08/17/21	5.4	Finalize Newrest Rule 9019 motion (1.8); email with Morris
			Nichols regarding document production (0.3); prepare for W.
			Kocovski deposition preparation (0.2); correspondence with L.
			Buchwald to prepare for W. Kocovski deposition (0.2); prepare
			W. Kocovski for deposition (2.0); review emails regarding request for Board minutes regarding DAE discovery (0.2);
			review Board minutes regarding same (0.2); email with L.
			Buchwald regarding same (0.2); review issue regarding
			disclaimer language for mediation materials (0.3).
Steinberg, Richard J.	08/17/21	0.4	Review documents for discovery production regarding DAE
			(0.2); email with Davis Polk Litigation team regarding same
0 0 7	00/47/04		(0.1); email with Sainz Abogados regarding same (0.1).
Szanzer, Steven Z.	08/17/21	2.2	Correspondence with Davis Polk Litigation team and W.
			Kocovski regarding DAE deposition preparation (0.3); participate in same (1.9).
Buchwald, Lara	08/18/21	0.4	Coordinate document production.
Samet	00/10/21	0.1	Coordinate document production.
Rincon, Cristina M.	08/18/21	1.0	Correspondence with L. Buchwald to prepare for M. Landess
			deposition (0.1); produce Board minutes in response to DAE
			discovery requests (0.2); prepare M. Landess for deposition
			(0.4); coordinate filing of notice of hearing on Newrest Rule 9019 motion (0.3).
Szanzer, Steven Z.	08/18/21	0.7	Participate in M. Landess deposition preparation.
Buchwald, Lara	08/19/21	5.2	Prepare for W. Kocovski deposition (0.5); call with W.
Samet			Kocovski and others to prepare for same (0.4); defend W.
			Kocovski deposition (3.1); analyze strategy regarding same
			(0.6); call with Davis Polk team regarding same and DAE
0 " 1 - " "	00/40/04		motion (0.6).
Graulich, Timothy	08/19/21	0.6	Call with L. Samet regarding deposition.
Rincon, Cristina M.	08/19/21	5.9	Prepare W. Kocovski for deposition (0.2); attend deposition of W. Kocovski (3.2); draft summary of W. Kocovski deposition
			(1.8); email same to Davis Polk Restructuring team and
			advisors (0.2); correspondence with T. Graulich and L.
			Buchwald regarding same (0.5).
Szanzer, Steven Z.	08/19/21	0.8	Correspondence with Davis Polk team regarding preparation
Decelorate	00/00/04		for W. Kocovski deposition.
Buchwald, Lara	08/20/21	4.5	Prepare for M. Landess deposition (0.8); call with M. Landess
Samet			regarding same (0.4); defend deposition of M. Landess (2.7); correspondence with Davis Polk team regarding same (0.4);
			connection draft summary of deposition (0.2).
Rincon, Cristina M.	08/20/21	5.0	Attend M. Landess deposition (3.8); correspondence with L.
,			Buchwald regarding same (0.2); draft summary of same (1.0).
Szanzer, Steven Z.	08/20/21	0.6	Review updates regarding W. Kocovski deposition (0.3);
			correspondence with Davis Polk team regarding same (0.3).
			19

		Time	Detail By Project
Name	Date	Hours	Narrative
Melcer, Moshe	08/21/21	0.2	Review summary of deposition.
Szanzer, Steven Z.	08/22/21	0.5	Correspondence with L. Buchwald regarding DAE depositions
			(0.3); review summary updates of same (0.2).
Buchwald, Lara	08/23/21	0.4	Correspondence with S. Szanzer regarding DAE depositions
Samet			(0.2); correspondence with Davis Polk Restructuring team
			regarding same (0.2).
Buchwald, Lara	08/24/21	0.6	Correspondence with Davis Polk team regarding DAE motion
Samet			(0.2); call with Committee counsel regarding same (0.3);
			correspondence with S. Szanzer regarding same (0.1).
Rincon, Cristina M.	08/24/21	2.0	Review W. Kocovski deposition transcript for errata (1.5); call
			with L. Buchwald and others regarding DAE motion (0.2); call
	00/00/0/		with Committee counsel regarding same (0.3).
McClammy, James I.	08/26/21	2.2	Call with Davis Polk team and Morris Nichols regarding
			potential litigation issue (1.0); correspondence with same
	00/00/04		regarding same (1.2).
Melcer, Moshe	08/26/21	1.1	Draft Certificate of No Objection to Newrest Rule 9019 motion
Dinaina Otanban D	00/00/04	0.0	(0.5); draft notice of cancellation of hearing for same (0.6).
Piraino, Stephen D.	08/26/21	0.3	Correspondence with Chambers and C. Rincon regarding
Dinasa Oriation M	00/00/04	4.7	Newrest hearing.
Rincon, Cristina M.	08/26/21	1.7	Review and revise Certificate of No Objection to Newrest Rule
			9019 motion (0.5); email with J. McClammy, M. Melcer
			regarding same (0.2); correspondence with S. Piraino
			regarding Newrest motion (0.2); call with Chambers regarding Newrest motion (0.2); correspondence with J. McClammy
Melcer, Moshe	08/27/21	0.1	regarding same (0.2); draft notice of dismissal (0.4). Review Newrest Rule 9019 motion.
Rincon, Cristina M.	08/27/21	0.1	Prepare Certificate of No Objection to Newrest Rule 9019
Milicoli, Clistilla IVI.	00/2//21	0.4	motion (0.3); correspondence with R. Steinberg regarding
			DAE document production (0.1).
Bane, Abraham	08/30/21	2.6	Draft Third Removal Extension motion (2.4); correspondence
Dane, Abraham	00/30/21	2.0	with E. Jerrard regarding same (0.2).
Bane, Abraham	08/31/21	0.6	Review and revise Third Removal Extension motion (0.4);
Barro, Abrariani	00/01/21	0.0	correspondence with E. Jerrard and T. Graulich regarding
			same (0.2).
Piraino, Stephen D.	08/31/21	0.3	Correspondence with C. Rincon regarding litigation research.
Rincon, Cristina M.	08/31/21	1.4	Correspondence with S. Piraino regarding standards for
rancon, Oncaria ivi.	00/01/21		exclusivity (0.4); research standards of exclusivity issues (1.0).
Total AM110 Automa	tic	125.3	
Stay/Litigation	uc	120.0	
AM130 Bar Date/Estii	mation/Claims <i>A</i>	Allowance Iss	ues
Melcer, Moshe	08/01/21	2.0	Correspondence with claimants regarding omnibus claim
•			objections (1.5); revise claimant inbound tracker (0.5).
Melcer, Moshe	08/02/21	0.5	Email with customer claimant regarding claims issue (0.3);
			review correspondence from claimant regarding omnibus
			claim objections (0.2).
Steinberg, Richard J.	08/02/21	0.4	Respond to informal responses to omnibus claims objections.
Steinberg, Richard J.	08/02/21	0.3	Email with O'Melveny regarding Ex-Im-related claims
- -			settlement (0.2); email with White & Case regarding same
			(0.1).
Melcer, Moshe	08/03/21	1.2	Call with Sainz Abogados and claimant regarding claim
			objection (0.6); correspondence with R. Steinberg regarding
			same (0.1); call with AlixPartners and others regarding
			customer claims (0.4); revise claimant inbound tracker (0.1).
Steinberg, Richard J.	08/03/21	1.2	Respond to informal responses to claims objections (0.4);

		Time	Detail By Project
Name	Date	Hours	Narrative
Melcer, Moshe	08/04/21	3.2	correspondence to Aeromexico regarding claim settlement (0.3); call with the AlixPartners regarding customer claims reconciliation (0.5). Call with Skyworks regarding claim settlements (0.3);
ivielcer, iviosite	00/04/21	3.2	correspondence with claimants regarding omnibus claim objections (1.5); correspondence with R. Steinberg regarding same (0.5); review and revise claimant inbound tracker (0.6); email with AlixPartners regarding same (0.1); review precedent claim objections (0.2).
Steinberg, Richard J.	08/04/21	0.9	Respond to informal responses to claim objections (0.3); correspondence with M. Melcer regarding upcoming of omnibus claims objections (0.5); review and revise correspondence to co-advisors regarding same (0.1).
Melcer, Moshe	08/05/21	2.2	Correspondence with claimants regarding omnibus claim objections (0.3); call with AlixPartners and others regarding same (0.5); call with Sainz Abogados, claimant, and others regarding same (0.4); revise claimant inbound tracker (0.2); email with AlixPartners regarding upcoming omnibus claim objections (0.2); review aircraft related claims (0.6).
Steinberg, Richard J.	08/05/21	3.3	Respond to informal inbounds received in response to omnibus claims objections (1.9); correspondence with AlixPartners regarding upcoming omnibus claims objections (1.1); email with E. Jerrard and AlixPartners regarding timeline for claims (0.3).
Melcer, Moshe	08/06/21	0.5	Correspondence with R. Steinberg regarding claims workstreams (0.3); review claimant inbound tracker (0.2).
Steinberg, Richard J.	08/06/21	1.9	Email with AlixPartners regarding upcoming omnibus claims objections and related customer outreach (0.3); respond to informal responses to omnibus claims objections (1.1); correspondence with M. Melcer regarding same (0.5).
Szanzer, Steven Z.	08/06/21	0.1	Correspondence with Vedder Price regarding Ex-Im omnibus claims agreement.
Melcer, Moshe Steinberg, Richard J.	08/07/21 08/07/21	0.2 0.7	Email with R. Steinberg regarding claims workstreams. Email with M. Melcer regarding Certificate of No Objection, revised proposed orders, and revised schedules for omnibus claims objections (0.3); reconcile inbound tracker with claim objection schedules (0.4).
Melcer, Moshe	08/08/21	2.8	Draft omnibus claims objection (2.1); correspondence with R. Steinberg regarding claims workstreams (0.1); revise claimant inbound tracker (0.4); correspondence with claimant regarding omnibus claim objection (0.2).
Steinberg, Richard J.	08/08/21	1.4	Email with Aeroméxico regarding claims settlement (0.1); email with Phillips Murrah P.C. regarding same (0.4); respond to informal inbounds received in response to claims objections (0.9).
Melcer, Moshe	08/09/21	1.4	Correspondence with claimants regarding omnibus claim objections (0.6); review and revise claimant inbound tracker (0.7); correspondence with R. Steinberg regarding same (0.1).
Steinberg, Richard J.	08/09/21	9.7	Draft Certificates of No Objection to omnibus claims objections (1.5); draft proposed order to same (1.5); draft revised schedules to same (1.5); reconcile claimant inbound tracker with claim objection schedules (1.0); email with the Aeroméxico regarding same (0.1); email with claimants and claimant's counsel regarding omnibus claims objections (0.5); draft omnibus claims objections (3.4); email with Epiq regarding informal claims objection inbounds (0.2).

		Time	Detail By Project
Name	Date	Hours	Narrative
Melcer, Moshe	08/10/21	2.5	Call with White & Case, AlixPartners, and Skyworks regarding claim dispute (0.2); revise schedules for claim objections (1.8); revise claimant inbound tracker (0.1); correspondence with R. Steinberg regarding same (0.2); review transferred claims (0.1); correspondence with R. Steinberg regarding same (0.1).
Piraino, Stephen D.	08/10/21	1.0	Call with counsel to stakeholder, financial advisor to stakeholder, Rothschild and Davis Polk team regarding claims waterfall.
Steinberg, Richard J.	08/10/21	7.8	Call with Skyworks, White & Case, and AlixPartners regarding Mission Air claim (0.2); email with Skyworks regarding same (0.1); email with White & Case regarding Ex-Im facility claims (0.5); draft omnibus claims objections (3.4); prepare summary of omnibus claims objections (1.0); email with AlixPartners regarding same (0.2); correspondence with M. Melcer regarding same (0.3); respond to informal responses to claims objections (0.5); correspondence with international airport regarding same (0.5); correspondence with Chambers regarding claims filings (0.5); review and revise Certificates of No Objection to omnibus claims objections (0.3); review claim transfers on docket (0.3).
Melcer, Moshe	08/11/21	4.7	Correspondence with R. Steinberg regarding claimant correspondence (0.1); correspondence with same regarding claims workstreams (0.2); call with AlixPartners and others regarding upcoming omnibus claim objections (0.7); revise omnibus claim objection schedules (1.3); revise Certificates of No Objection to omnibus claims objections (0.9); email with Chambers regarding same (1.2); correspondence with T. Green regarding fleet claims settlement (0.3).
Steinberg, Richard J.	08/11/21	1.1	Call with AlixPartners regarding omnibus claims objections and other claims reconciliation issues (0.6); email with AlixPartners regarding fleet claim settlement (0.5).
Melcer, Moshe	08/12/21	1.1	Review claim objection orders (0.2); revise omnibus claims objection (0.1); analyze letter from claimant (0.3); revise claimant inbound tracker (0.2); review emails from AlixPartners regarding upcoming claim objections (0.2); correspondence with R. Steinberg regarding same (0.1).
Sokol, Nate Steinberg, Richard J.	08/12/21 08/12/21	0.1 3.2	Email with R. Steinberg regarding omnibus claims objections. Email with N. Sokol regarding claims workstreams (0.2);review and revise omnibus claims objections (0.5); email with AlixPartners regarding same (0.3); email with Epiq regarding same (0.1); respond to informal inbounds received in response to claims objections (0.8); draft notices regarding omnibus claims objections (1.3).
Melcer, Moshe	08/13/21	5.1	Review and revise omnibus claims objection (4.1); call with R. Steinberg regarding same (0.3); call with AlixPartners and Epiq regarding same (0.4); revise claimant inbound tracker (0.1); correspondence with claimant regarding omnibus claims objections (0.2).
Sokol, Nate	08/13/21	0.5	Call with AlixPartners and Epiq regarding omnibus claims objections.
Steinberg, Richard J.	08/13/21	4.7	Call with AlixPartners and Epiq regarding omnibus claims objections (0.4); review and revise notice to customer regarding omnibus claims objection (3.1); email with Aeroméxico regarding same (0.3); email with Sainz Abogados regarding same (0.2); email with AlixPartners regarding same (0.4); call with M. Melcer regarding same (0.3).

Time Detail By Project			
Name	Date	Hours	Narrative
Melcer, Moshe	08/14/21	0.6	Review and revise omnibus claims objections.
Steinberg, Richard J.	08/14/21	2.8	Review and revise omnibus claims objections (2.0); review
			draft schedules regarding same (0.3); email with AlixPartners regarding same (0.5).
Melcer, Moshe	08/15/21	2.8	Review and revise omnibus claims objections.
Steinberg, Richard J.	08/15/21	2.7	Review and revise omnibus claims objections (2.4); email with AlixPartners regarding same (0.3).
Melcer, Moshe	08/16/21	3.7	Review and revise omnibus claim objections (3.5);
Steinberg, Richard J.	08/16/21	5.9	correspondence with R. Steinberg regarding same (0.2). Review and revise schedules to omnibus claims objections
			(1.5); review and revise omnibus claims objections (2.1); review correspondence to the Aeroméxico regarding same
			(0.2); correspondence with M. Melcer regarding same (1.0);
			correspondence with AlixPartners regarding claims objections
Stainhard Dichard I	00/16/01	0.4	(1.1).
Steinberg, Richard J.	08/16/21	0.4	Email with O'Melveny regarding claims settlement (0.2); email to White & Case regarding same (0.2).
Szanzer, Steven Z.	08/16/21	0.5	Correspondence with T. Green and R. Steinberg regarding
			fleet claim settlement (0.3); correspondence with T. Graulich
	00/47/04	0.0	regarding same (0.2).
Melcer, Moshe	08/17/21	3.6	Call with Davis Polk Restructuring team regarding fleet claims
			(0.5); email with Skyworks regarding fleet claims settlement (0.2); review and revise omnibus claims objection (2.7);
			correspondence with R. Steinberg regarding same (0.2).
Steinberg, Richard J.	08/17/21	4.5	Review and revise omnibus claims objections (3.5); draft Ex-
			Im claims summary (1.0).
Melcer, Moshe	08/18/21	1.6	Finalize omnibus claims objections (1.1); email with Chambers
			regarding same (0.3); email with Aeroméxico regarding same (0.1); email with T. Graulich regarding same (0.1).
Steinberg, Richard J.	08/18/21	3.9	Review and revise omnibus claims objections (2.8); call with
0 ,			Epiq and AlixPartners regarding same (0.2); correspondence
-			with M. Melcer regarding same (0.9).
Steinberg, Richard J.	08/18/21	0.3	Call with AlixPartners regarding Ex-Im claims.
Melcer, Moshe	08/19/21	0.8	Analyze claim objection (0.2); correspondence with claimant regarding claim objection (0.4); revise claimant inbound
			tracker (0.2).
Steinberg, Richard J.	08/19/21	1.0	Respond to informal inbounds received in response to claims objections.
Melcer, Moshe	08/20/21	0.1	Review correspondence with claimant regarding omnibus
Piraino, Stephen D.	08/20/21	0.3	claim objection. Email with M. Melcer and R. Steinberg regarding claims
i ilaillo, otephen b.	00/20/21	0.5	issues.
Steinberg, Richard J.	08/20/21	8.0	Correspondence with counsel to Commercial Aviation
			International regarding claims objection (0.3); review
			Commercial Aviation International claim (0.3); email with S. Piraino regarding claims transfers (0.2).
Melcer, Moshe	08/23/21	1.4	Correspond with claimants regarding claim objections (0.7);
			revise claimant inbound tracker (0.3); analyze objected claims
			(0.3); email with Clifford Chance regarding claims settlement
Steinberg, Richard J.	08/23/21	0.3	(0.1). Respond to informal inbounds received in response to claims
otemberg, Nichard J.	00/23/21	0.3	objections.
Melcer, Moshe	08/24/21	0.5	Call with Clifford Chance regarding claims settlement.
Steinberg, Richard J.	08/24/21	0.6	Respond to informal inbounds received in response to claims
	00/05/04	2.2	objections.
Melcer, Moshe	08/25/21	0.2	Review correspondence with claimant regarding claim

Time Detail By Project			
Name	Date	Hours	Narrative
Steinberg, Richard J.	08/25/21	0.6	objection. Respond to informal inbounds received in response to omnibus claims objections (0.5); email with AlixPartners
Dekhtyar, Mariya	08/26/21	0.4	regarding same (0.1). Call with M. Melcer and R. Steinberg regarding onboarding on claims workstreams.
Melcer, Moshe	08/26/21	2.9	Analyze claims issue (1.6); call with R. Steinberg and M. Dekhtyar regarding claims workstreams (0.4); review correspondence with claimants related to claim objections (0.5); revise claimant correspondence tracker (0.4).
Steinberg, Richard J.	08/26/21	2.3	Respond to informal inbounds received in response to omnibus claims objections (0.9); research priority claims issues (0.9); call with M. Melcer and M. Dekhtyar regarding claims workstreams (0.5).
Dekhtyar, Mariya	08/27/21	0.3	Review correspondence with M. Melcer and R. Steinberg regarding customer claims.
Melcer, Moshe Steinberg, Richard J.	08/27/21 08/27/21	0.1 5.1	Analyze priority claims issues. Respond to informal inbounds received in response to omnibus claims objections (2.9); review and revise correspondence to Aeroméxico regarding customer claims reconciliation (1.8); call with E. Jerrard regarding same (0.4).
Jerrard, Erik	08/29/21	1.1	Call with R. Steinberg regarding customer claims reconciliation (0.4); review related claims materials (0.7).
Dekhtyar, Mariya	08/30/21	0.7	Review correspondence with R. Steinberg, M. Melcer and others regarding customer claims (0.3); review emails with M. Melcer and claimant regarding same (0.1); revise claimant inbound tracker (0.2); email with M. Melcer regarding same (0.1).
Jerrard, Erik Melcer, Moshe	08/30/21 08/30/21	0.4 1.5	Email with creditor regarding omnibus claims objections. Email with Epiq regarding claims settlements (0.2); email with AlixPartners regarding same (0.2); analyze claims on claim objection (0.4); correspondence with claimant regarding claim objection (0.3); review claimant inbound tracker (0.3); correspondence with R. Steinberg regarding claims workstreams (0.1).
Steinberg, Richard J.	08/30/21	4.9	Review correspondence received from the Aeroméxico regarding settlements with certain airport vendors and agreement with Embraer (2.5); respond to informal inbounds received in response to omnibus claims objections (1.8); email with Aeroméxico regarding claims settlements (0.2); email with AlixPartners regarding amended claim inbound (0.4).
Szanzer, Steven Z.	08/30/21	0.4	Correspondence with M. Melcer and R. Steinberg regarding direction to Epiq regarding claims.
Dekhtyar, Mariya	08/31/21	3.0	Review emails with M. Melcer, R. Steinberg, and others regarding omnibus claims objections (0.2); review emails with R. Steinberg and others regarding same (0.1); research case law regarding claim priority issues (2.2); email with R. Steinberg regarding summary of case law on omnibus claims objections issues (0.5).
Melcer, Moshe	08/31/21	0.6	Correspondence with claimant regarding omnibus claim objection (0.3); revise claimant inbound tracker (0.2); correspondence with R. Steinberg regarding same (0.1).
Steinberg, Richard J.	08/31/21	4.8	Extensive correspondence to Aeroméxico regarding claim settlements (2.5); review response filed to omnibus claims objection (0.6); correspondence with claimant regarding claim response (0.5); respond to informal inbounds received in 24

Time Detail By Project			
Name	Date	Hours	Narrative
			response to omnibus claims objections (0.8); review precedent regarding Section 507 claims (0.4).
Total AM130 Bar		134.1	
Date/Estimation/Clair	ns		
Allowance Issues			
AM140 Corporate Go	vernance. Board	d Matters and	1 Communications
Piraino, Stephen D.	08/10/21	0.2	Review and revise Board minutes.
Piraino, Stephen D.	08/12/21	0.3	Review and revise Board minutes.
Graulich, Timothy	08/15/21	8.0	Call with H. Parkhill regarding Restructuring Committee
•			meeting (0.4); call with A. Conesa regarding Restructuring
			Committee meeting (0.4).
Graulich, Timothy	08/16/21	1.8	Attend Restructuring Committee meeting.
Masaro, Matthew	08/16/21	3.8	Research issues regarding presentation to the Board (2.8);
Bruno			review and revise same (1.0).
Piraino, Stephen D.	08/16/21	2.2	Attend Restructuring Committee meeting (1.8);
			correspondence with Davis Polk regarding Board materials for
			same (0.4).
Steinberg, Richard J.	08/16/21	0.3	Correspondence with S. Piraino regarding preparation of
Outside Time Alexa	00/47/04	4.0	Board materials for Restructuring Committee meeting.
Graulich, Timothy	08/17/21	1.0	Attend Restructuring Committee meeting.
Masaro, Matthew	08/17/21	0.8	Review and revise presentation to the Board (0.5);
Bruno			correspondence with R. Steinberg and others regarding same
Piraino, Stephen D.	08/17/21	2.5	(0.3). Attend Restructuring Committee meeting (1.0);
i ilalilo, otephen b.	00/1//21	2.5	correspondence with R. Steinberg and M. Masaro regarding
			Board materials (0.4); review and revise Board materials for
			Restructuring Committee meeting (0.8); correspondence with
			R. Steinberg regarding Board material (0.3).
Steinberg, Richard J.	08/17/21	3.2	Review and draft analysis on contracts and assumption
			considerations for Board.
Steinberg, Richard J.	08/18/21	0.9	Email with AlixPartners regarding same (0.2); correspondence
•			with S. Piraino and T. Graulich regarding same (0.7).
Graulich, Timothy	08/19/21	2.3	Review and comment on presentation to the Board.
Graulich, Timothy	08/20/21	0.6	Attend Restructuring Committee meeting.
Piraino, Stephen D.	08/20/21	1.6	Attend Restructuring Committee meeting.
Steinberg, Richard J.	08/20/21	0.7	Review Board materials (0.5); email with S. Piraino regarding
			same (0.2).
Graulich, Timothy	08/21/21	2.8	Review and revise presentation to the Board.
Masaro, Matthew	08/22/21	0.5	Review and revise presentation to Board (0.3);
Bruno	00/00/04	2.4	correspondence with S. Piraino regarding same (0.2).
Piraino, Stephen D.	08/22/21	3.4	Review and revise Board materials for Restructuring
Steinberg, Richard J.	08/22/21	0.8	Committee meeting. Review and revise presentation to the Board.
Graulich, Timothy	08/23/21	3.3	Call with A. Conesa, J. Arrigunaga, R. Sanchez Baker and
Graditori, Timotriy	00/23/21	5.5	others regarding governance and exit issues (0.8); review and
			revise Board materials for Restructuring Committee meeting
			(0.9); attend board meeting (1.6).
Piraino, Stephen D.	08/23/21	2.8	Review and revise Board materials for Restructuring
, ,			Committee meeting (0.4); call with A. Conesa, J. Arrigunaga,
			R. Sanchez Baker and others regarding governance and exit
			issues (0.8); attend Board meeting (1.6).
Graulich, Timothy	08/24/21	4.9	Correspondence with S. Piraino regarding Board meeting
			(2.2); prepare for Board meeting (2.7).
Huebner, Marshall S.	08/24/21	1.8	Correspondence with A. Conesa, J. Arrigunaga, R. Sanchez

Time Detail By Project			
Name	Date	Hours	Narrative
Jerrard, Erik	08/24/21	5.2	Baker and others regarding governance and exit issues (0.8); correspondence with T. Graulich regarding same (0.3); call with management, financial advisors and Special Committee regarding same (0.7). Draft Board materials for Restructuring Committee meeting (2.4); correspondence with S. Piraino regarding same (1.1); call with Aeroméxico and co-advisors regarding Board
Piraino, Stephen D.	08/24/21	3.4	meeting and related materials (1.7). Call with Aeroméxico team and co-advisors regarding Board meeting and related materials (1.7); review and revise Board metarials for Board related materials (2.7);
Steinberg, Richard J.	08/24/21	1.0	materials for Restructuring Committee meeting (1.7). Draft presentation to the Board (0.8); correspondence with S. Piraino regarding same (0.2).
Szanzer, Steven Z.	08/24/21	1.5	Call with Aeroméxico and co-advisors regarding upcoming Board call (1.1); correspondence with Davis Polk Restructuring team regarding same (0.4).
Graulich, Timothy	08/25/21	4.1	Call with H. Parkhill regarding presentation to Restructuring Committee (0.6); call with A. Conesa regarding Board call (0.7); attend Restructuring Committee meeting (2.8).
Jerrard, Erik	08/25/21	6.1	Call with Rothschild, Davis Polk regarding Board materials for Restructuring Committee meeting (0.9); review and revise Board materials for Restructuring Committee meeting (1.7); call with advisors and Aeroméxico to prepare for Restructuring Committee meeting (0.5); attend Board meeting (1.8); correspondence with S. Piraino regarding same (0.4); attend
Piraino, Stephen D.	08/25/21	5.2	Restructuring Committee meeting (0.8). Revise Board materials for Restructuring Committee meeting (0.4); call with Rothschild and Davis Polk Restructuring team regarding same (0.8); call with Aeroméxico team regarding Board meeting (1.0); attend Board meeting (2.5); review and
Steinberg, Richard J.	08/25/21	2.0	revise Board resolutions (0.5). Review Board materials (0.8); draft presentation regarding same (0.9); correspondence with S. Piraino regarding same
Szanzer, Steven Z.	08/25/21	0.4	(0.3). Correspondence with T. Graulich regarding Board meeting (0.2); review email regarding same (0.2).
Graulich, Timothy Jerrard, Erik	08/27/21 08/28/21	1.2 2.6	Attend Restructuring Committee meeting. Review and revise Board materials (2.3); email with T. Graulich regarding same (0.3).
Huebner, Marshall S.	08/29/21	0.8	Correspondence with Davis Polk team regarding Apollo letter to Board.
Jerrard, Erik	08/29/21	1.5	Email with Aeroméxico regarding upcoming Board meeting and related materials (0.4); review and revise related materials (1.1).
Graulich, Timothy Jerrard, Erik	08/30/21 08/30/21	1.2 5.1	Attend Restructuring Committee meeting. Correspondence with S. Piraino and T. Graulich regarding Restructuring Committee meeting (1.5); correspondence with S. Piraino regarding same (0.3); attend Restructuring Committee meeting (1.2); review and revise materials for same (2.1).
Graulich, Timothy	08/31/21	1.8	Attend Restructuring Committee meeting (1.2); prepare for same (0.6).
Jerrard, Erik	08/31/21	1.7	Attend Restructuring committee meeting (1.2); correspondence with S. Piraino regarding same (0.5).
Piraino, Stephen D.	08/31/21	1.2	Attend Restructuring Committee meeting.

Invoice Date: October 25, 2021

Time Detail By Project				
Name	Date	Hours	Narrative	
Total AM140 Corpora Governance, Board M Communications		89.3		
AM150 Creditor/UCC	AHC Issues			
Szanzer, Steven Z.	08/04/21	0.2	Correspondence with Davis Polk Restructuring team regarding claims trading.	
Piraino, Stephen D.	08/09/21	0.9	Attend weekly call with Creditors Committee advisor and Debtor co-advisors (AlixPartners, Skyworks, others).	
Jerrard, Erik	08/10/21	0.8	Attend weekly call with Creditors Committee advisor and Debtor co-advisors (AlixPartners, Skyworks, others).	
Masaro, Matthew Bruno	08/10/21	8.0	Attend weekly call with Creditors Committee advisor and Debtor co-advisors (AlixPartners, Skyworks, others).	
Piraino, Stephen D.	08/10/21	0.4	Attend weekly call with Creditors Committee advisor and Debtor co-advisors (AlixPartners, Skyworks, others) (0.4) (partial attendance).	
Steinberg, Richard J.	08/10/21	8.0	Attend weekly call with Creditors Committee advisor and Debtor co-advisors (AlixPartners, Skyworks, others).	
Steinberg, Richard J.	08/11/21	1.8	Correspondence with S. Piraino regarding PLM amendment (0.4); call with K. Lee regarding PLM amendment (0.3); correspondence with UCC and Apollo regarding same (0.9); email with K. Lee regarding same (0.2).	
Piraino, Stephen D.	08/13/21	0.3	Correspondence with Willkie team regarding intercompany balances.	
Masaro, Matthew Bruno	08/17/21	8.0	Attend weekly call with Creditors Committee and Aeroméxico advisors.	
Steinberg, Richard J.	08/17/21	0.8	Attend weekly call with Creditors Committee and Aeroméxico advisors.	
Piraino, Stephen D. Jerrard, Erik	08/22/21 08/24/21	0.7 0.8	Call with Willkie Farr regarding creditor issues. Attend weekly update call with Creditors Committee professionals, debtors and co-advisors (partial attendance).	
Masaro, Matthew Bruno	08/24/21	1.4	Attend weekly update call with Creditors Committee professionals, debtors and co-advisors.	
Piraino, Stephen D.	08/24/21	1.1	Attend weekly update call with Creditors Committee professionals, debtors and co-advisors (partial attendance).	
Rincon, Cristina M.	08/24/21	0.1	Review reservation of rights filed by Creditors Committee.	
Steinberg, Richard J.	08/24/21	1.3	Attend weekly update call with Creditors Committee professionals, debtors and co-advisors.	
Rincon, Cristina M.	08/25/21	1.4	Review M. Landess deposition for errata.	
Piraino, Stephen D.	08/30/21	1.6	Attend meeting with creditor advisors regarding business plan and related issues.	
Jerrard, Erik	08/31/21	8.0	Attend weekly update call with Creditors Committee professionals, debtors and co-advisors.	
Piraino, Stephen D.	08/31/21	0.7	Attend weekly update call with Creditors Committee professionals, debtors and co-advisors.	
Total AM150 Creditor Issues	/UCC/AHC	17.5		
AM170 Customer/Ver	ndor/Non-Aircraf	t Lease/Non	-Aircraft Contract Issues	
Katz, Michael	08/01/21	0.1	Correspondence regarding status of engine purchase.	
Katz, Michael	08/02/21	0.3	Call with Aeroméxico and AlixPartners regarding vendor payment escalations.	
Piraino, Stephen D.	08/02/21	0.2	Call with Aeroméxico and AlixPartners regarding vendor payment escalations.	
Katz, Michael	08/04/21	0.3	Call with Aeroméxico and AlixPartners regarding vendor	

		Time	Detail By Project
Name	Date	Hours	Narrative
Piraino, Stephen D.	08/04/21	0.3	payment escalations. Call with Aeroméxico and AlixPartners regarding vendor payment escalations.
Buchwald, Lara Samet	08/06/21	1.1	Review lease assumption motion and supporting documentation (0.7); correspondence with J. McClammy regarding same (0.2); correspondence with S. Szanzer regarding same (0.2).
Masaro, Matthew Bruno	08/06/21	8.0	Review and revise notice of contract assumption (0.6); correspondence with M. Melcer and others regarding same (0.2).
Melcer, Moshe	08/06/21	0.4	Draft notice of contract assumption.
Steinberg, Richard J.	08/08/21	0.9	Review proposed new product implementation commencement (0.5); review proposed PLM letter agreement (0.3); email with K. Lee regarding same (0.1).
Katz, Michael	08/09/21	0.2	Call with Aeroméxico and AlixPartners regarding vendor payment escalations.
Masaro, Matthew Bruno	08/09/21	0.7	Review and revise notice of contract assumption (0.2); correspondence with T. Graulich, S. Piraino, Willkie Farr, and Cleary Gottlieb regarding same (0.5).
Katz, Michael	08/11/21	0.2	Call with Aeroméxico and AlixPartners regarding vendor payment escalations.
Piraino, Stephen D.	08/11/21	0.4	Correspondence with R. Steinberg regarding vendor issues (0.2); call with Aeroméxico and AlixPartners regarding vendor payment escalations (0.2).
Masaro, Matthew Bruno	08/16/21	1.0	Review and revise engine contract (0.8); correspondence with S. Piraino, Aeroméxico, and others regarding same (0.2).
Steinberg, Richard J. Katz, Michael	08/17/21 08/18/21	0.4 1.0	Email with AlixPartners regarding executory contracts. Call with Aeroméxico and AlixPartners regarding vendor payment escalations (0.7); email with vendor counsel regarding contract issues (0.1); email with S. Piraino regarding outstanding vendor request (0.1); email with Aeroméxico regarding vendor contract issues (0.1).
Masaro, Matthew Bruno	08/18/21	0.2	Correspondence with M. Melcer regarding contract rejections.
Steinberg, Richard J.	08/18/21	1.5	Call with AlixPartners regarding executory contracts (0.9); correspondence with S. Ford regarding same (0.1); review precedent regarding same (0.5).
Masaro, Matthew Bruno	08/20/21	1.0	Review contract assumption procedures (0.3); correspond with K. Lee, R. Steinberg, AlixPartners, others regarding same (0.7).
Steinberg, Richard J.	08/20/21	0.9	Review Amadeus amendments (0.4); call with K. Lee regarding same (0.2); email with Aeroméxico regarding same (0.1); correspondence with M. Masaro regarding same (0.2).
Masaro, Matthew Bruno	08/21/21	0.3	Correspondence with K. Lee regarding contract assumption.
Katz, Michael	08/23/21	0.2	Call with Aeroméxico and AlixPartners regarding vendor payment escalations.
Masaro, Matthew Bruno	08/23/21	0.4	Correspondence with AlixPartners, others regarding contract assumption.
O'Sullivan, Damian	08/23/21	1.7	Research and summarize issues regarding contract assumption (1.6); correspondence with M. Masaro regarding same (0.1).
Piraino, Stephen D.	08/23/21	0.2	Call with Aeroméxico and AlixPartners regarding vendor payment escalations.
Katz, Michael	08/25/21	0.3	Call with Aeroméxico and AlixPartners regarding vendor payment escalations.

	Time Detail By Project				
Name	Date	Hours	Narrative		
Masaro, Matthew Bruno	08/26/21	0.6	Review and revise notice of contract assumption (0.3); correspondence with AlixPartners and others regarding same (0.3).		
Masaro, Matthew Bruno	08/27/21	0.6	Correspondence with M. Melcer, Cleary Gottlieb, Willkie Farr, and others regarding contract assumptions.		
Masaro, Matthew Bruno	08/30/21	0.2	Correspondence with P. Garg and others regarding notice of contract assumption.		
Melcer, Moshe	08/30/21	0.1	Correspondence with P. Garg regarding notice of contract assumption.		
Melcer, Moshe	08/31/21	0.3	Review notice of contract assumption.		
Total AM170 Customer/Vendor/No Lease/Non-Aircraft C Issues		16.8			
AM180 Employee/Pe Piraino, Stephen D.	nsion Issues 08/11/21	0.6	Correspondence with J. Wallden and T. Perez regarding labor issues.		
Total AM180 Employ Issues	ee/Pension	0.6			
AM190 Financing Bane, Abraham	08/01/21	7.8	Correspondence with E. Jerrard regarding Meditation Statement (0.6); call with Davis Polk Restructuring team regarding same (0.4); review presentation on mediation (0.4); draft Mediation Statement (5.4); prepare exhibits for same		
Graulich, Timothy	08/01/21	11.1	(0.6); review proposed Mediation order (0.4). Call with counsel to potential exit financing provider regarding mediation (0.4); review and revise Mediation order (0.5); review and revise Mediation Statement (8.8); call with A.		
Jerrard, Erik	08/01/21	3.3	Conesa regarding Mediation Statement (1.4). Review and revise Mediation Statement (3.1); correspondence		
Masaro, Matthew Bruno	08/01/21	10.1	with A. Bane regarding same (0.2). Review and revise Mediation Statement (4.6); correspondence with T. Graulich, S. Piraino, E. Jerrard, A. Bane, R. Steinberg, and others regarding same (2.9); review and revise Mediation order (1.2); correspondence with same regarding same (1.4).		
O'Sullivan, Damian	08/01/21	1.8	Review and revise Mediation order (1.3); correspondence with M. Masaro regarding same (0.2); review correspondence from		
Piraino, Stephen D.	08/01/21	3.1	Davis Polk team regarding comments regarding same (0.3). Call with Davis Polk Restructuring team regarding Mediation Statement (0.4); correspondence with M. Masaro and D. Herts regarding same (0.2); correspondence with R. Steinberg regarding same (0.2); review and revise Mediation order (0.4); review and revise Mediation Statement (1.9).		
Steinberg, Richard J.	08/01/21	8.1	Extensive drafting of Mediation Statement (7.7); call with Davis Polk Restructuring team regarding same (0.4).		
Bane, Abraham	08/02/21	4.7	Correspondence with E. Jerrard regarding Mediation Statement (0.6); call with Davis Polk Restructuring team regarding preparation for mediation (0.8); draft Mediation Statement (3.1); review Mediation proposed order (0.2).		
Graulich, Timothy	08/02/21	10.4	Call with A. Conesa and R. Sanchez Baker regarding mediation (0.9); call with H. Parkhill and L. Donahue regarding same (0.5); correspondence with E. Jerrard regarding Mediation Statement (0.4); correspondence with S. Piraino		

		Time	Detail By Project
Name	Date	Hours	Narrative
Jerrard, Erik	08/02/21	10.2	regarding mediation (1.8); extensive review and finalize Mediation Statement (6.8). Extensive review and revision of Mediation Statement (5.9); call with Aeroméxico regarding same (0.6); correspondence
			with A. Bane regarding same (0.1); call with S. Piraino and others regarding same (0.3); call with Davis Polk Restructuring team regarding mediation preparation (1.0); prepare for mediation, including detailed analysis of Section 2.12 (1.7); attend daily contingency update call with Aeroméxico and Rothschild (0.6).
Katz, Michael	08/02/21	0.4	Review DIP credit agreement and collateral assignment agreements for collateral notice to DIP agent.
Masaro, Matthew Bruno	08/02/21	13.5	Extensive review and revision of Mediation Statement (6.7); extensive correspondence with R. Steinberg, S. Piraino, and others regarding same (4.3); review and revise Mediation order (1.8); correspondence with T. Graulich and others regarding same (0.7).
McClammy, James I.	08/02/21	1.0	Review and comment on Mediation order (0.2); review and comment on Mediation Statement (0.8).
Melcer, Moshe	08/02/21	6.1	Extensive review and revise Mediation Statement (5.7); correspondence regarding mediation preparation (0.4).
O'Sullivan, Damian	08/02/21	8.0	Review Mediation order and precedents regarding same (0.6); correspondence with M. Masaro regarding same (0.2).
Piraino, Stephen D.	08/02/21	9.2	Attend daily contingency update call with Aeroméxico and Rothschild (0.6); correspondence with Davis Polk team regarding Mediation order (0.9); extensive correspondence
			with Davis Polk team and others regarding Mediation Statement (1.9); call with E. Jerrard and others regarding same (0.3); review and revise Mediation Statement (2.2); call with Aeroméxico regarding same (0.4); correspondence with mediator's Chambers regarding same (0.2); call with Sainz Abogados regarding same (0.2); correspondence with T. Graulich and E. Jerrard regarding mediation (0.4); call with Willkie Farr and others regarding same (0.9); call with Davis Polk Restructuring team regarding preparation for same (1.0); correspondence with M. Masaro regarding same (0.2).
Steinberg, Richard J.	08/02/21	9.9	Draft Mediation Statement (6.0); correspondence with AlixPartners and other co-advisors regarding same (1.1); correspondence with M. Melcer regarding same (0.3); correspondence with S. Piraino regarding same (0.4); correspondence with A. Bane and M. Masaro regarding same (0.6); correspondence with the Sainz regarding same (0.3); review and revise presentation on mediation (0.8); correspondence with S. Piraino regarding same (0.2); email with AlixPartners regarding same (0.2).
Bane, Abraham	08/03/21	1.7	Attend mediation (1.6) (partial attendance); correspondence with S. Ford regarding same (0.1).
Graulich, Timothy	08/03/21	10.1	Call with A. Conesa and R. Sanchez Baker regarding preparation for Mediation session (0.8); prepare for Mediation (5.4); call with Judge Lane and others regarding mediation (1.0); attend Mediation (1.6); call with H. Parkhill regarding proposal (1.3).
Jerrard, Erik	08/03/21	4.6	Attend mediation (2.5); correspondence with S. Piraino regarding same (0.3); correspondence with T. Graulich, S. Piraino, and S. Szanzer regarding same (1.1); correspondence with T. Graulich and S. Szanzer regarding

		Time	Detail By Project
Name	Date	Hours	Narrative
Katz, Michael	08/03/21	1.4	exit financing regarding same (0.7). Review DIP credit agreement and collateral assignment agreement (0.9); prepare notice to DIP administrative agent of new collateral (0.3); email with V. Jackson regarding same (0.2).
Masaro, Matthew Bruno	08/03/21	7.4	Correspondence with M. Melcer and S. Piraino regarding mediation (1.0); attend mediation (2.5); prepare for same (0.5); review and revise Mediation order (0.8); correspondence with counsel to stakeholder, counsel to potential exit financing provider, and others regarding same (1.7); correspondence with S. Piraino regarding same (0.5); correspondence with Rothschild and AlixPartners regarding same (0.4).
McClammy, James I.	08/03/21	3.0	Attend mediation (2.5); review materials in preparation for same (0.5).
Melcer, Moshe	08/03/21	2.5	Correspondence with Davis Polk team regarding mediation preparation (0.5); attend mediation (2.0) (partial attendance).
Piraino, Stephen D.	08/03/21	7.8	Attend daily contingency update call with Aeroméxico and Rothschild (0.9); correspondence with T. Graulich regarding mediation (0.4); prepare for mediation (1.4); attend mediation (2.5); call with Davis Polk Restructuring team regarding same (1.2); review and revise Mediation order (0.7); correspondence with M. Masaro regarding same (0.3); email with Davis Polk team regarding same (0.4).
Steinberg, Richard J.	08/03/21	2.5	Attend mediation (2.2) (partial attendance); correspondence with Davis Polk team regarding summary of same (0.3).
Szanzer, Steven Z.	08/03/21	3.5	Attend mediation (2.5); correspondence with Davis Polk team regarding same (1.0).
Graulich, Timothy	08/04/21	5.7	Call with A. Conesa and R. Sanchez regarding mediation and exit financing proposals (0.9); correspondence with S. Piraino regarding Mediation order (0.5); review revised Mediation order (0.4); call with Judge Lane regarding mediation (0.8); review revised equity exit financing commitment (1.7); review revised debt exit financing commitment (1.4).
Huebner, Marshall S. Jerrard, Erik	08/04/21 08/04/21	0.3 4.9	Correspondence with T. Graulich regarding mediation. Call with counsel to stakeholder and others regarding Mediation order (0.3); correspondence with S. Piraino regarding same (0.4); review proposals for cleansing sensitivity (0.7); research and analyze mediation confidentiality issues (1.0); correspondence with J. Weiner regarding same (0.4); call with Davis Polk Restructuring team regarding mediation (1.1); email with Davis Polk Corporate team regarding update on same (0.4); attend daily contingency update call with Aeroméxico and Rothschild (0.6) (partial attendance).
Masaro, Matthew Bruno	08/04/21	4.2	Call with counsel to stakeholder and others regarding Mediation order (0.5); call with same regarding exit financing Non-Disclosure Agreement (0.5); call with Davis Polk Restructuring team regarding same (0.7) (partial attendance); correspondence with same regarding same and Mediation order (0.7); review and revise Mediation order (0.4); correspondence with Chambers, counsel to stakeholder, and others regarding same (1.4).
Piraino, Stephen D.	08/04/21	5.8	Call with counsel to stakeholder and others regarding Mediation order (0.6); email with same regarding mediation (0.4); correspondence with M. Masaro regarding same (0.4); correspondence with T. Kessler regarding same (0.2); 31

		Time	Detail By Project
Name	Date	Hours	Narrative
			correspondence with E. Jerrard regarding same (0.3); correspondence with counsel to potential exit financing provider regarding same (0.3); correspondence with J. Margolin regarding same (0.1); call with Davis Polk Restructuring team regarding same (1.1); email with same regarding mediation information sharing (0.3); email with same regarding mediation (0.2); review and analyze mediation issues (1.0); attend daily contingency update call with
Steinberg, Richard J.	08/04/21	0.2	Aeroméxico and Rothschild (0.9). Correspondence with M. Masaro regarding mediation.
Szanzer, Steven Z.	08/04/21	1.2	Attend daily contingency update call with Aeroméxico and Rothschild (1.0); correspondence with Davis Polk team regarding exit financing proposal (0.2).
Graulich, Timothy	08/05/21	4.5	Call with same and Judge Lane regarding same (1.0); call with A. Conesa and R. Sanchez Baker regarding mediation (0.8); correspondence with S. Piraino and E. Jerrard regarding mediation and Plan (0.6); call with H. Parkhill regarding final valuation materials (0.7); call with Judge Lane regarding mediation strategy (1.4).
Jerrard, Erik	08/05/21	3.0	Call with potential bidder advisors and Debtor professionals regarding mediation information sharing (0.4); review relevant documents to prepare for same (0.3); attend mediation (0.4); call with Rothschild, AlixPartners, and others regarding schedule 2.12 and related timeline (0.8); analyze schedule 2.12 relating to same (1.1).
Masaro, Matthew Bruno	08/05/21	1.7	Call with counsel to stakeholder and others regarding Mediation order and proposal sharing (0.5); correspondence with same, counsel to potential exit financing provider, and others regarding same (0.4); attend mediation (0.4); correspondence with M. Melcer and others regarding same (0.4).
Melcer, Moshe	08/05/21	0.7	Email with S. Piraino and E. Jerrard regarding mediation (0.4); correspondence with M. Masaro regarding same (0.2); email with T. Graulich regarding same (0.1).
Piraino, Stephen D.	08/05/21	7.7	Attend daily contingency update call with Aeroméxico and Rothschild (0.6); attend mediation (0.4); prepare for same (0.2); correspondence with E. Jerrard regarding mediation (0.3); correspondence with Davis Polk team regarding Mediation order (0.4); correspondence with Rothschild regarding mediation (0.3); correspondence with J. Margolin regarding same (0.2); correspondence with T. Graulich regarding same (0.4); correspondence with T. Kessler regarding same (0.3); correspondence with counsel to potential exit financing provider regarding same (0.3); draft correspondence to mediation parties regarding same (0.2); correspondence with T. Graulich and E. Jerrard regarding same (1.8); correspondence with M. Masaro regarding same (0.5); call with Rothschild, AlixPartners, and others regarding schedule 2.12 and related timeline (0.8); call with counsel to stakeholder regarding Mediation order (0.4); correspondence with counsel to potential exit financing provider regarding mediation (0.3).
Ford, Stephen	08/06/21	4.2	Research issues regarding same (1.0); review and revise
Graulich, Timothy	08/06/21	7.8	Mediation Statement (3.0); review Mediation order (0.2). Call with A. Conesa and R. Sanchez Baker regarding

		Time	Detail By Project
Name	Date	Hours	Narrative
			mediation strategy (0.9); call with D. Botter regarding exit financing proposal (0.7); call with Judge Lane regarding mediation (1.1); call with H. Parkhill regarding creditor exit financing proposal (1.3); review and comment on Disclosure Statement (3.8).
Huebner, Marshall S.	08/06/21	0.4	Correspondence with T. Graulich regarding mediation and exit financing issues.
Jerrard, Erik	08/06/21	3.8	Analyze Section 2.12 and related exit financing process implications (0.9); email with T. Graulich and S. Piraino regarding same (0.6); call with Rothschild regarding same (0.3); attend mediation (0.8); prepare for same (0.4); email with T. Graulich and S. Piraino regarding process regarding same (0.2); attend daily contingency update call with Aeroméxico and Rothschild (0.6) (partial attendance).
Masaro, Matthew Bruno	08/06/21	1.7	Attend mediation (0.8); correspondence with S. Piraino, M. Melcer, and others regarding same and Mediation order (0.9).
Piraino, Stephen D.	08/06/21	3.3	Attend daily contingency update call with Aeroméxico and Rothschild (0.8); attend mediation (0.8); email with Davis Polk team regarding Mediation order (0.7); call with Rothschild regarding DIP credit agreement (0.3); correspondence with T. Graulich and E. Jerrard regarding exit financing process and mediation (0.5); correspondence with mediator regarding same (0.2).
Szanzer, Steven Z.	08/06/21	1.1	Review Mediation order (0.2); correspondence with Davis Polk team regarding same (0.1); attend daily contingency update call with Aeroméxico and Rothschild (0.8).
Houston, Kamali	08/07/21	1.0	Attend daily contingency update call with Aeroméxico and Rothschild.
Piraino, Stephen D.	08/07/21	0.8	Correspondence with T. Graulich regarding exit financing (0.7); correspondence with financial advisor to potential exit financing provider regarding exit financing Non-Disclosure Agreement (0.1).
Steinberg, Richard J.	08/07/21	2.5	Draft response to exit financing diligence request (1.9); call with S. Piraino regarding same (0.3); email with Sainz Abogados regarding same (0.2); email with Rothschild regarding same (0.1).
Graulich, Timothy	08/08/21	1.9	
Jerrard, Erik	08/08/21	0.7	Email with Davis Polk team regarding exit financing diligence request.
Piraino, Stephen D.	08/08/21	1.5	Review exit financing letter (0.2); correspondence with R. Steinberg regarding same (0.2); review and revise response to same (0.9); correspondence with Rothschild regarding same (0.2).
Steinberg, Richard J.	08/08/21	2.0	Email with T. Graulich regarding exit financing diligence response (0.3); correspondence with S. Piraino regarding same (0.3); email with counsels to potential exit financing providers regarding same (0.1); draft exit financing diligence request response (1.3).
Graulich, Timothy	08/09/21	3.8	Call with counsel to potential investor regarding mediation (0.5); call with S. Greenberg regarding same (0.5); call with Judge Lane regarding same (0.8); call with P. Tomaso regarding same (0.7); call with L. Moak regarding same (0.4); call with A. Conesa and R. Sanchez Baker regarding same (0.9).

	Time Detail By Project			
Name	Date	Hours	Narrative	
Jerrard, Erik	08/09/21	0.9	Attend daily contingency update call with Aeroméxico and Rothschild.	
Katz, Michael	08/09/21	0.1	Email with A. Troconis regarding notice for collateral purchase.	
Masaro, Matthew Bruno	08/09/21	0.4	Review exit financing letter (0.3); correspondence with R. Steinberg regarding same (0.1).	
Melcer, Moshe	08/09/21	0.1	Coordinate mediation attendance.	
Szanzer, Steven Z.	08/09/21	1.0	Attend daily contingency update call with Aeroméxico and Rothschild.	
Troconis, Adela	08/09/21	0.2	Review DIP credit agreement for purchase issue.	
Borchardt, Leo	08/10/21	4.2	Analyze securities law issues (2.8); correspondence with S. Piraino regarding same (0.4); call with Sainz Abogados and others regarding rights offering and securities law considerations (1.0).	
Ford, Stephen	08/10/21	0.1	Coordinate execution of exit financing Non-Disclosure Agreement.	
Graulich, Timothy	08/10/21	6.1	Call with R. Cooper regarding mediation (0.7); call with P. Tomaso and A. Sainz regarding same (0.7); call with Judge Lane regarding same (0.8); call with A. Conesa and R. Sanchez Baker regarding exit financing (1.0); call with same regarding mediation (0.8); call with S. Piraino and E. Jerrard regarding final valuation materials (1.3); correspondence with M. Huebner regarding mediation (0.8).	
Huebner, Marshall S.	08/10/21	0.5	Correspondence with T. Graulich regarding mediation and exit financing issues.	
Jerrard, Erik	08/10/21	3.7	Correspondence with T. Graulich regarding final valuation materials (0.6); call with T. Graulich and S. Piraino regarding same (1.3); call with Rothschild and AlixPartners regarding same (0.6); email with T. Graulich regarding same and related analysis of schedule 2.12 (1.2).	
Masaro, Matthew Bruno	08/10/21	1.1	Call with Sainz Abogados and others regarding securities law issues regarding rights offering (0.7); correspondence with R. Steinberg and others regarding same (0.4).	
Melcer, Moshe	08/10/21	0.1	Coordinate mediation attendance.	
Piraino, Stephen D.	08/10/21	3.7	Call with T. Graulich and E. Jerrard regarding final valuation materials (1.3); email with same regarding exit financing (0.2); call with Rothschild and AlixPartners regarding final evaluation (0.6); correspondence with L. Borchardt regarding securities law issues related to rights offerings (0.4); correspondence with M. Masaro regarding same (0.2); attend daily contingency update call with Aeroméxico and Rothschild (0.9); call with counsel to potential exit financing provider regarding mediation information sharing (0.1).	
Simmonds, Alexander W.	08/10/21	1.3	Call with Sainz Abogados regarding rights offering and securities law issues (1.0); correspondence with S. Piraino and S. Alessio Robles regarding same (0.2); correspondence with M. Masaro regarding same (0.1).	
Steinberg, Richard J.	08/10/21	2.3	Correspondence with exit financing stakeholder regarding exit financing diligence request (1.0); email with Aeromexico and co-advisors regarding same (0.6); correspondence with S. Piraino regarding same (0.2); call with Sainz Abogados regarding rights offer and securities law issues regarding same (0.5).	
Szanzer, Steven Z.	08/10/21	1.0	Attend daily contingency update call with Aeroméxico and Rothschild.	
Troconis, Adela	08/10/21	1.2	Analyze DIP credit agreement purchase issue.	

		Time	Detail By Project
Name	Date	Hours	Narrative
Ford, Stephen	08/11/21	0.9	Coordinate execution of exit financing Non-Disclosure Agreement (0.4); review and revise exit financing Non-Disclosure Agreement (0.5).
Graulich, Timothy	08/11/21	6.5	Call with counsel to potential exit financing provider regarding exit financing diligence (0.4); review and revise intercompany analysis (3.4); review revised exit financing commitment agreement (2.7).
Graulich, Timothy	08/11/21	3.3	Call with A. Conesa and R. Sanchez Baker regarding mediation with Judge Lane (1.1); call with A. Conesa and A. Sainz regarding same (0.8); review and comment on Plan waterfall analysis (1.4).
Jerrard, Erik	08/11/21	3.2	Analyze exit financing diligence request from potential bidder (0.7); review and analyze final valuation materials contractual provisions (1.5); attend daily contingency update call with Aeroméxico and Rothschild (1.0).
Melcer, Moshe Piraino, Stephen D.	08/11/21 08/11/21	0.1 1.5	Coordinate mediation attendance. Correspondence with R. Steinberg and T. Graulich regarding exit financing diligence requests (0.5); correspondence with Rothschild regarding same (0.2); attend daily contingency update call with Aeroméxico and Rothschild (0.8) (partial attendance).
Sokol, Nate Steinberg, Richard J.	08/11/21 08/11/21	0.2 3.8	Review Mediation Statement. Email with Aeromexico and co-advisors regarding response to exit financing diligence request (0.7); correspondence with S. Piraino regarding same (0.2); respond to exit financing diligence request (2.1); email with T. Graulich regarding same (0.3); call with Rothschild regarding same (0.1); email with counsel to potential exit financing provider regarding same (0.4).
Szanzer, Steven Z.	08/11/21	1.0	Attend daily contingency update call with Aeroméxico and Rothschild.
Graulich, Timothy	08/12/21	5.9	Call with R. Arnold regarding bidder due diligence (0.4); call with B. Ignaschenko regarding proposal and mediation (0.5); call with Judge Lane regarding mediation (0.8); call with L. Donahue and H. Parkhill regarding final valuation materials (1.5); review and comment on final valuation materials (2.7).
Piraino, Stephen D.	08/12/21	2.9	Call with AlixPartners team regarding intercompany claims (0.4); call with counsel to potential exit financing provider regarding same (0.3); call with counsel to potential exit financing provider regarding same (0.5); attend daily contingency update call with Aeroméxico and Rothschild (0.7) (partial attendance); call with Rothschild regarding exit financing diligence (0.3); call with counsel to potential exit financing provider regarding same (0.1); correspondence with R. Steinberg regarding same (0.3); correspondence with
Steinberg, Richard J.	08/12/21	4.9	potential exit financing parties regarding same (0.3). Correspondence with Rothschild regarding mediation and exit financing diligence issues (0.9); call with AlixPartners regarding intercompany agreements (0.4); correspondence with S. Piraino regarding same (0.3); call with AlixPartners regarding same (0.2); call with counsels to potential exit financing providers regarding same (1.7); review date rooms (1.1); email with same regarding same (0.2); email with Sainz Abogados regarding exit financing diligence (0.1).
Borchardt, Leo Graulich, Timothy	08/13/21 08/13/21	0.4 5.5	Correspondence with S. Piraino regarding equity term sheet. Call with Judge Lane regarding mediation (0.7); call with A.

		Time	Detail By Project
Name	Date	Hours	Narrative
Melcer, Moshe Piraino, Stephen D.	08/13/21 08/13/21	0.2 2.1	Conesa and R. Sanchez Baker regarding final valuation materials (0.9); call with P. Tomasco regarding mediation (0.6); review and comment on presentation on valuation (3.3). Coordinate mediation attendance. Attend daily contingency update call with Aeroméxico and Rothschild (0.7); correspondence with L. Borchardt and others regarding equity term sheet (0.7); email with T. Graulich
Simmonds,	08/13/21	2.6	regarding exit financing (0.5); email with Rothschild team regarding mediation data room (0.2). Review precedent disclosure statements regarding securities
Alexander W.	00/10/21	2.0	law issues (1.9); email with L. Borchardt regarding same (0.7).
Steinberg, Richard J.	08/13/21	4.2	Email with Rothschild regarding exit financing diligence request (2.7); email with Sainz Abogados regarding same (0.8); correspondence with S. Piraino regarding same (0.2); email with Aeroméxico regarding same (0.2); email with T. Graulich and L. Borchardt regarding exit financing proposal (0.3).
Szanzer, Steven Z.	08/13/21	0.9	Attend daily contingency update call with Aeroméxico and Rothschild (0.6); review Apollo's discussion materials (0.3).
Piraino, Stephen D.	08/14/21	0.3	Call with counsel to potential exit financing provider regarding exit financing proposal.
Katz, Michael	08/15/21	0.4	Correspondence with S. Piraino regarding exit financing process.
Piraino, Stephen D.	08/15/21	0.7	Correspondence with T. Graulich regarding exit financing issues (0.4); call with A. Troconis and others regarding exit financing process (0.3).
Troconis, Adela	08/15/21	0.3	Call with S. Piraino and others regarding exit financing process.
Borchardt, Leo	08/16/21	2.2	Review A. Simmonds memorandum on precedent disclosure statements and securities law analysis.
Graulich, Timothy	08/16/21	6.6	Call with A. Conesa and R. Sanchez Baker regarding mediation (0.8); call with Judge Lane regarding mediation (0.8); call with Creditors Committee professionals regarding same (1.0); call with A. Conesa regarding same (0.9); review valuation materials (2.3); correspondence with S. Piraino regarding mediation (0.8).
Huebner, Marshall S.	08/16/21	0.3	
Katz, Michael	08/16/21	0.1	Call with L. Lee regarding exit financing status.
Lee, Lloyd	08/16/21	0.1 0.1	Call with M. Katz regarding exit financing status.
Melcer, Moshe Piraino, Stephen D.	08/16/21 08/16/21	4.6	Attend mediation. Attend daily contingency update call with Aeroméxico and Rothschild (0.8); correspondence with T. Graulich regarding exit financing issues (1.7); call with Creditors Committee advisors regarding same (1.1); call with Aeroméxico team and co-advisors regarding same (1.0).
Szanzer, Steven Z.	08/16/21	0.8	Attend daily contingency update call with Aeroméxico and Rothschild.
Buchwald, Lara Samet	08/17/21	0.2	Correspondence with S. Piraino regarding mediation issues.
Ford, Stephen	08/17/21	0.7	Coordinate execution on exit financing Non-Disclosure Agreement.
Graulich, Timothy	08/17/21	9.1	Call with H. Parkhill and L. Donahue regarding mediation valuation (0.8); call with Judge Lane regarding mediation (0.8); correspondence with Davis Polk team regarding same (3.6); call with A. Conesa regarding valuation (1.7); review and comment on valuation materials (2.2).

		Time	Detail By Project
Name	Date	Hours	Narrative
Masaro, Matthew Bruno	08/17/21	3.1	Attend mediation (2.3); correspond with T. Graulich, S. Piraino, Chambers, and others regarding same (0.8).
Melcer, Moshe	08/17/21	0.5	Attend mediation (partial attendance).
Piraino, Stephen D.	08/17/21	3.1	Correspondence with L. Buchwald and C. Rincon regarding
Filalilo, Stephen D.	00/17/21	J. I	exit financing (0.6); attend mediation (2.0) (partial attendance)
			email with S. Ford regarding valuation (0.3); correspondence
			with T. Graulich regarding exit financing issues (0.2).
Rincon, Cristina M.	08/17/21	0.1	Correspondence with S. Piraino regarding DIP credit
Stoinhora Dichard I	08/17/21	0.5	agreement. Attend mediation (partial attendance) (0.4); email with counse
Steinberg, Richard J.	00/17/21	0.5	to exit financing provider regarding exit financing Non-
			Disclosure Agreement and diligence request (0.1).
Buchwald, Lara	08/18/21	1.0	Correspondence with S. Piraino and C. Rincon regarding
Samet	00/10/21	1.0	mediation analysis (0.6); prepare M. Landess for upcoming
Carriot			deposition (0.4).
Ford, Stephen	08/18/21	0.2	Call with counsel to potential exit financing provider regarding
, ,			exit financing Non-Disclosure Agreement.
Graulich, Timothy	08/18/21	5.3	Call with A. Conesa and R. Sanchez Baker regarding
•			mediation (1.0); call with A. Sainz regarding same (0.6); call
			with H. Parkhill regarding valuation (0.5); call with A. Conesa
			regarding same (0.4); review revised valuation materials (2.8)
Lempel, Jesse	08/18/21	0.7	Call with Davis Polk Restructuring and Litigation team
			regarding analysis of exit financing conversion.
Piraino, Stephen D.	08/18/21	2.0	Correspondence with L. Buchwald, C. Rincon, and J. Lempel
			regarding exit financing (0.6); correspondence with Rothschild
			team regarding mediation materials (0.4); attend daily
Dinasa Oriatina M	00/40/04	0.0	contingency update call with Aeroméxico and Rothschild (1.0)
Rincon, Cristina M.	08/18/21	0.6	Call with Davis Polk Restructuring and Litigation team
Szanzer, Steven Z.	08/18/21	1.1	regarding analysis of exit financing conversion. Attend daily contingency update call with Aeroméxico and
Szanzer, Steven Z.	00/10/21	1.1	Rothschild.
Ford, Stephen	08/19/21	2.1	Analyze comments to exit financing Non-Disclosure
r ora, otopriori	00/10/21		Agreement (0.9); call with opposing counsel regarding same
			(0.2); correspondence with S. Piraino regarding same (0.2);
			correspondence with same and T. Graulich regarding same
			(0.8).
Graulich, Timothy	08/19/21	4.6	Call with P. Tomasco regarding mediation (0.5); call with A.
			Conesa and R. Sanchez Baker regarding final valuation
			materials (0.9); call with Judge Lane regarding mediation
			(1.3); review DIP credit agreement (1.9).
Lempel, Jesse	08/19/21	5.3	Research exit financing issue.
Masaro, Matthew	08/19/21	1.0	Attend mediation (0.6) (partial attendance); correspondence
Bruno			with Judge Lane, T. Graulich, and S. Piraino regarding same
Piraino, Stephen D.	08/19/21	3.4	(0.4). Attend daily contingency update call with Aeroméxico and
riiaiiio, Stephen D.	00/19/21	3.4	Rothschild (1.0); email with S. Ford regarding exit financing
			Non-Disclosure Agreement (0.4); correspondence with
			Rothschild regarding mediation (0.4); attend mediation (1.0);
			correspondence with S. Szanzer regarding Plan issue (0.3);
			review and revise Plan (0.3).
Rincon, Cristina M.	08/19/21	0.9	Review draft analysis of DIP credit agreement (0.5);
•			correspondence with J. Lempel to discuss same (0.4).
Steinberg, Richard J.	08/19/21	2.0	Email with Rothschild regarding exit financing diligence
			request (0.5); review responses regarding exit financing
			diligence request (0.6); email with Sainz Abogados regarding
			same (0.2); correspondence with S. Piraino regarding same
			37

		Time	Detail By Project
Name	Date	Hours	Narrative
			(0.2); call with Sainz Abogados regarding same (0.2); email to counsel to potential exit financing provider regarding same (0.3).
Szanzer, Steven Z.	08/19/21	1.0	Attend daily contingency update call with Aeroméxico and Rothschild.
Buchwald, Lara Samet	08/20/21	0.6	Correspondence with S. Piraino regarding new exit financing bid (0.2); review and comment on contract analysis (0.4).
Graulich, Timothy	08/20/21	5.3	Call with Judge Lane regarding mediation (1.4); call with A. Conesa regarding same (0.8); review revised exit financing proposal (1.8); call with H. Parkhill regarding exit financing (1.3).
Graulich, Timothy	08/20/21	2.5	Call with A. Conesa and R. Sanchez Baker regarding mediation.
Jackson, Vanessa L.	08/20/21	0.6	Review DIP credit agreement.
Katz, Michael	08/20/21	0.3	Review DIP credit agreement (0.2); email with A. Troconis regarding same (0.1).
Lempel, Jesse	08/20/21	1.9	Analyze exit financing issue.
Masaro, Matthew	08/20/21	2.3	Review and revise restructuring support agreement (0.8);
Bruno			attend mediation (0.8); review financing proposals (0.7).
Piraino, Stephen D.	08/20/21	3.5	Attend mediation (0.5); review memorandum on exit financing issues (0.4); correspondence with T. Graulich and V. Jackson
			regarding DIP credit agreement (0.4); correspondence with Davis Polk team regarding exit financing process (0.7); review revised exit financing proposal (0.5); correspondence with Davis Polk team regarding same (0.8); email with Rothschild
			regarding mediation (0.2).
Piraino, Stephen D.	08/20/21	1.0	Attend daily contingency update call with Aeroméxico and Rothschild.
Rincon, Cristina M.	08/20/21	3.3	Revise analysis of exit financing fee issue.
Simmonds, Alexander W.	08/20/21	0.2	Correspondence with L. Borchardt and S. Piraino regarding equity term sheet.
Szanzer, Steven Z.	08/20/21	1.0	Attend daily contingency update call with Aeroméxico and Rothschild.
Troconis, Adela	08/20/21	0.3	Email with S. Piraino, V. Jackson, and M. Katz regarding DIP credit agreement.
Borchardt, Leo	08/21/21	0.9	Review proposed equity term sheet (0.3); call with counsel to potential bidder advisors regarding proposed term sheet and definitive documentation (0.5); call with A. Simmonds regarding same (0.1).
Ford, Stephen	08/21/21	0.5	Call with potential bidder advisors regarding exit financing.
Graulich, Timothy	08/21/21	1.2	Call with Davis Polk Corporate team regarding exit financing proposal (0.5); call with R. Cooper regarding same (0.3); call with Judge Lane regarding mediation (0.4).
Katz, Michael	08/21/21	1.0	Email with V. Jackson regarding exit financing commitment documents (0.5); correspondence with counsel to stakeholder regarding exit financing status (0.5).
Lee, Lloyd	08/21/21	0.5	Call with potential bidder advisors regarding exit financing.
Masaro, Matthew Bruno	08/21/21	1.4	Attend mediation (0.8); call with counsel to stakeholder, counsel to potential exit financing provider, and others
Piraino, Stephen D.	08/21/21	1.3	regarding exit financing (0.6). Call with joint proponents regarding exit financing (1.0); attend mediation (0.3) (partial attendance).
Simmonds, Alexander W.	08/21/21	1.0	Review equity term sheet (0.4); call with potential bidder advisors regarding exit financing (0.5); call with L. Borchardt regarding proposed term sheet and definitive documents (0.1).
Steinberg, Richard J.	08/21/21	0.5	Call with potential bidder advisors regarding exit financing.

		Time	Detail By Project
Name	Date	Hours	Narrative
Troconis, Adela	08/21/21	0.5	Call with counsel to stakeholder, counsel to potential exit financing provider, counsel to other potential exit financing provider, and Davis Polk teams regarding exit financing.
Graulich, Timothy	08/22/21	7.5	Call with Willkie Farr regarding mediation (0.6); correspondence with S. Piraino regarding same (0.8); call with H. Parkhill regarding final valuation materials (0.8); review and revise presentation regarding final valuation materials (3.2); call with advisors regarding same (0.8); call with A. Sainz regarding same (0.6); call with A. Conesa and A. Sainz regarding same (0.7).
Masaro, Matthew Bruno	08/22/21	4.7	Correspondence with R. Steinberg and S. Piraino regarding mediation and exit financing (1.1); review and revise motion to enter into shareholder support agreement (2.3); research issues regarding same (1.3).
Piraino, Stephen D.	08/22/21	3.6	Correspondence with T. Graulich regarding exit financing issues (0.8); correspondence with R. Steinberg regarding same (0.3); call with R. Steinberg and other regarding same (0.3); call with co-advisors regarding same and mediation (0.9); call with A. Conesa, R. Sanchez Baker and others regarding same (1.3).
Steinberg, Richard J.	08/22/21	1.2	Call with co-advisors regarding exit financing and mediation (0.9); call with S. Piraino and others regarding same (0.3).
Szanzer, Steven Z.	08/22/21	0.5	Review joint proposal for exit financing (0.3); correspondence with S. Piraino regarding same (0.2).
Borchardt, Leo	08/23/21	4.0	Review exit equity commitment letter and equity term sheet (1.0); correspondence with A. Simmonds regarding same (1.0); call with same regarding exit financing (0.2); call with Rothschild and Davis Polk Finance team regarding exit equity commitment letter (0.5); review precedent net debt definitions and working capital definitions (0.5); call with Davis Polk team regarding equity term sheet (0.8).
Graulich, Timothy	08/23/21	4.7	Call with counsel to potential investor regarding exit financing issues (0.4); call with S. Piraino regarding final valuation materials (0.7); review and revise exit financing proposal (2.2); call with A. Conesa and R. Sanchez Baker regarding valuation (0.6); call with H. Parkhill regarding exit financing (0.8).
Jackson, Vanessa L. Katz, Michael	08/23/21 08/23/21	1.2 3.9	
Masaro, Matthew Bruno	08/23/21	0.9	Review and revise motion to enter into shareholder support agreement (0.8); correspondence with T. Graulich, Judge Lane, and others regarding mediation (0.1).
Piraino, Stephen D.	08/23/21	4.2	Correspondence with A. Simmonds regarding exit financing (0.2); review exit financing proposal (0.9); call with Rothschild team regarding same (0.4); correspondence with T. Graulich regarding same (0.9); call with A. Conesa, R. Sanchez Baker, and co-advisors regarding same (1.0); correspondence with Davis Polk team regarding same (0.8).
Simmonds, Alexander W.	08/23/21	6.2	Extensive review and revision of exit equity commitment letter, equity terms sheet, and issues list regarding same (4.4); correspondence with S. Piraino regarding exit financing issues (0.4); call with L. Borchardt regarding exit financing (0.2); call with Rothschild and Davis Polk Finance team regarding exit

		Time I	Detail By Project
Name	Date	Hours	Narrative
Steinberg, Richard J.	08/23/21	0.1	equity commitment letter (0.5); research precedent capital adjustments (0.4); correspondence with R. Arnold regarding same (0.3). Email with Rothschild regarding mediation data room.
Steinberg, Richard J.	08/23/21	0.7	Call with the Aeroméxico regarding exit financing and mediation (0.6); correspondence with S. Piraino regarding same (0.1).
Szanzer, Steven Z. Troconis, Adela	08/23/21 08/23/21	0.8 3.5	Review and consider joint exit financing proposal. Review exit debt financing commitment papers (3.0); call with M. Katz regarding DIP credit agreement (0.1); review DIP credit agreement (0.4).
Borchardt, Leo	08/24/21	1.3	Call with S. Piraino to prepare for daily update call with Aeroméxico and co-advisors (0.4); call with Rothschild and AlixPartners regarding working capital adjustment (0.5); comment on memorandum regarding same (0.4).
Graulich, Timothy	08/24/21	3.8	Call with Judge Lane regarding mediation (1.2); call with R. Sanchez Baker regarding exit equity financing commitment documents (0.6); call with same regarding exit debt financing commitment documents (0.6); call with H. Parkhill regarding final valuation materials (1.4).
Huebner, Marshall S.	08/24/21	0.9	Correspondence with stakeholder regarding exit and balance sheet issues (0.5); email with T. Graulich regarding same (0.4).
Jackson, Vanessa L. Jerrard, Erik	08/24/21 08/24/21	0.8 0.7	Review DIP credit agreement. Attend daily contingency update call with Aeroméxico and Rothschild.
Katz, Michael	08/24/21	3.9	Review and revise DIP credit agreement (1.1); email with A. Troconis regarding delivery schedule (0.1); email with V. Jackson regarding DIP credit agreement (0.2); email with Cleary Gottlieb regarding same (0.1); call with advisor regarding exit financing commitment letters (0.5); prepare issues list regarding exit financing (0.5); email with S. Piraino and A. Troconis regarding same (0.3); review and revise engagement and fee letters (0.5); email with L. Lee regarding same (0.1); review and revise signature page to DIP Credit Agreement amendment (0.2); email with Davis Polk team regarding current guarantors (0.1); email with Aeroméxico regarding DIP credit agreement amendment (0.2).
Lee, Lloyd Masaro, Matthew Bruno	08/24/21 08/24/21	1.9 0.9	Review and revise exit financing commitment documents. Attend mediation.
Piraino, Stephen D.	08/24/21	6.6	Call with L. Borchardt to prepare for daily update call with Aeroméxico and co-advisors regarding exit financing (0.4); extensive correspondence with T. Graulich regarding exit financing issues (3.0); call with Rothschild and Davis Polk teams regarding debt financing (0.4) (partial attendance); call with R. Arnold regarding exit financing (0.3); call with Rothschild and Davis Polk teams regarding same (0.6); review and revise equity exit financing term sheet (0.5); call with counsel to potential exit financing provider regarding exit financing (0.2); call with counsel to stakeholder regarding same (0.1); correspondence with E. Jerrard regarding same (0.3); attend daily contingency update call with Aeroméxico and Rothschild (0.8).
Simmonds, Alexander W.	08/24/21	3.1	Attend daily update call with A. Conesa, AlixPartners, Rothschild and Davis Polk teams (1.0); call with Rothschild

		Time	Detail By Project
Name	Date	Hours	Narrative
			and AlixPartners teams regarding working capital adjustment working paper (0.5); review and comment on working capital adjustment paper (0.6); correspondence with Rothschild team regarding same (0.6); review comments to equity term sheet (0.2); correspondence with S. Piraino regarding same (0.2).
Szanzer, Steven Z.	08/24/21	0.8	Attend daily contingency update call with Aeroméxico and Rothschild.
Troconis, Adela	08/24/21	3.8	Attend daily contingency update call with Aeroméxico and Rothschild (0.8); review and comment on amendment to DIP credit agreement (1.1); call with R. Sanchez Baker, AlixPartners, Rothschild, and Sainz Abogados regarding exit debt financing (0.5); comment on exit debt commitment documents (0.7); email with Cleary Gottlieb regarding DIP credit agreement (0.7).
Borchardt, Leo	08/25/21	1.8	Analyze exit financing term sheet.
Graulich, Timothy	08/25/21	5.1	Call with Judge Lane regarding mediation (1.1); call with A. Conesa regarding final valuation materials (1.7); correspondence with S. Piraino regarding notice of default (0.5); review DIP credit agreement (1.8).
Jackson, Vanessa L.	08/25/21	3.2	Comment on exit financing commitment documents (2.4); call with Davis Polk Finance and Restructuring team regarding exit debt financing process (partial attendance). erence call with S. Piraino (0.8).
Jerrard, Erik	08/25/21	2.6	Call with Davis Polk Finance and Restructuring team regarding exit debt financing process (1.0); analyze schedule 2.12 debriefing from same (1.6).
Katz, Michael	08/25/21	5.2	Email with counsel to stakeholder regarding DIP credit agreement amendment (0.1); email with Davis Polk team regarding exit financing debt commitment letter (0.4); prepare issues list for Rothschild regarding exit financing (0.4); review and revise exit financing debt commitment letters (1.9); email with A. Troconis regarding same (0.2); email with V. Jackson regarding same (0.1); email with Rothschild and S. Piraino regarding same (0.4); correspondence with S. Piraino, A. Troconis and V. Jackson regarding status of transaction and default provisions under DIP credit agreement (1.0); email with V. Jackson regarding DIP credit agreement milestone summary (0.2); email with Aeroméxico regarding exit financing debt commitment letter (0.2); email with counsel to stakeholder regarding same (0.1); review precedents default notices (0.2).
Lee, Lloyd	08/25/21	2.8	Call with Davis Polk Finance and Restructuring team regarding exit debt financing process (1.0); draft notice of default (0.4); revise exit financing commitment documents (1.0); review emails with Davis Polk team regarding same (0.4).
Masaro, Matthew Bruno	08/25/21	3.8	Attend mediation (3.2) (multiple sessions); correspondence with S. Piraino and others regarding same (0.6).
Piraino, Stephen D.	08/25/21	2.0	Call with Aeroméxico team and co-advisors regarding exit financing (1.0); call with Davis Polk Finance and Restructuring team regarding exit debt financing process (1.0).
Simmonds, Alexander W.	08/25/21	0.9	Correspondence with L. Lee regarding exit financing commitment letters (0.2); review equity value mechanics (0.5); correspondence with W. Kocovski regarding working capital adjustments (0.2).
Troconis, Adela	08/25/21	3.0	Review and comment on exit equity and debt financing

		Time	Detail By Project
Name	Date	Hours	Narrative
Graulich, Timothy	08/26/21	6.4	commitment documents (2.0); call with Davis Polk Finance and Restructuring team regarding exit debt financing process (1.0). Call with Judge Lane regarding mediation (1.2); call with A. Conesa and R. Sanchez Baker regarding same (1.0); call with H. Parkhill regarding join bid (1.3); call with A. Conesa
Jackson, Vanessa L.	08/26/21	1.8	regarding same (0.8); review revised exit financing commitment (2.1). Review DIP credit agreement (0.9); review exit financing term
Jerrard, Erik	08/26/21	1.7	sheet (0.9). Attend mediation.
Masaro, Matthew Bruno	08/26/21	1.9	Attend mediation. Attend mediation (1.7); correspondence with Davis Polk team regarding same (0.2).
McClammy, James I.	08/26/21	0.8	Review correspondence with Davis Polk team regarding mediation and exit financing bid.
Melcer, Moshe	08/26/21	1.9	Coordinate mediation attendance (0.2); attend mediation (1.7).
Piraino, Stephen D.	08/26/21	5.5	Email with M. Melcer regarding meditation (0.2); attend mediation (1.7); call with joint proponents regarding exit financing (0.9); call with M. Sutter regarding exit financing (0.2); correspondence with T. Graulich regarding same (0.5); call with D. Abbot and others regarding same (0.5); correspondence with E. Jerrard regarding same (0.4); correspondence with Morris Nichols regarding same (0.7); email with AlixPartners regarding same (0.4).
Rincon, Cristina M.	08/26/21	0.5	Call with D. Abbott and Davis Polk Litigation and Restructuring teams regarding exit financing updates.
Graulich, Timothy	08/27/21	3.8	Call with J. Margolin regarding mediation (0.6); call with H. Parkhill regarding valuation (0.8); review presentation on mediation (2.4).
Huebner, Marshall S.	08/27/21	1.9	Call with Rothschild and others regarding exit financing issues.
Jackson, Vanessa L.	08/27/21	1.1	Review notice of default (0.5); review relevant event disclosing notice of default (0.6).
Jerrard, Erik	08/27/21	7.3	Email with V. Jackson and M. Katz regarding notice of default (0.8); review and revise notice of default (1.3); review and revise relevant event disclosing notice of default (1.1); review and revise exit timeline (2.2); analyze schedule 2.12 relating to exit timeline (1.1); email with T. Graulich regarding same (0.8).
Katz, Michael	08/27/21	2.2	Review and revise notice of default (1.0); review and revise relevant event disclosing notice of default (0.6); email with Sainz Abogados regarding revisions regarding same (0.1); email with administrative Agent, counsel to stakeholder and Clearly Gottlieb regarding notice of default (0.3); email with Aeroméxico and L. Lee regarding signature page (0.2).
Lee, Lloyd	08/27/21	0.5	Review and revise notice of default.
Masaro, Matthew Bruno	08/27/21	0.3	Correspondence with S. Piraino, Rothschild, and others regarding mediation.
Piraino, Stephen D.	08/27/21	4.2	Call with M. Sutter regarding exit financing (0.3); correspondence with E. Jerrard regarding same (0.7); correspondence with T. Graulich regarding same (0.2); call with D. Abbot regarding same (0.2); email with M. Sutter and T. Graulich regarding same (0.3); review protective order (0.2); email with T. Graulich, E. Jerrard and D. Abbot regarding same (0.4); correspondence with R. Steinberg regarding exit financing issues (0.3); correspondence with M. Masaro regarding same (0.2); correspondence with 42

		Time	Detail By Project
Name	Date	Hours	Narrative
			AlixPartners regarding same (0.2); correspondence with counsel to potential exit financing party regarding same (0.2); review relevant event for final valuation materials (0.2); email with T. Graulich regarding same (0.1); review exit financing timeline (0.4); correspondence with exit financing parties
Steinberg, Richard J.	08/27/21	0.4	regarding exit financing (0.3). Call with counsel to joint bidders regarding exit financing diligence requests (0.2); correspondence with S. Piraino regarding same (0.1); call with Davis Polk Litigation team regarding same (0.1).
Graulich, Timothy	08/28/21	3.8	Call with H. Parkhill regarding final valuation materials (0.8); review and comment on presentation on same (1.4); review and revise timeline regarding same (1.6).
Piraino, Stephen D.	08/28/21	1.1	Email with T. Graulich and E. Jerrard regarding exit financing issues (0.4); email with J. Wallden regarding exit financing diligence materials (0.3); review diligence materials (0.4).
Graulich, Timothy	08/29/21	3.2	Call with H. Parkhill regarding final valuation materials (0.6); review letter from Apollo (0.8); circulate summary of issues regarding same (1.8).
Graulich, Timothy	08/30/21	10.6	Correspondence with S. Piraino and E. Jerrard regarding final valuation materials (3.0); call with counsel to potential investor regarding exit financing issues (0.5); call with H. Parkhill regarding final valuation materials (0.8); attend meeting with creditor advisors regarding business plan and related issues (1.3); review revised final valuation materials and related timeline (2.4); review revised Plan (2.6).
Huebner, Marshall S.	08/30/21	2.1	Call with management, Debtor advisors, creditor proponent advisors to exit financing issues (1.6); call with creditors and representatives regarding same (0.5).
Jerrard, Erik	08/30/21	5.3	Correspondence with T. Graulich and S. Piraino regarding exit financing (1.9); attend meeting with creditor advisors regarding business plan and related issues (1.6); email with Rothschild regarding valuation splits (0.3); analyze valuation materials (1.5).
Piraino, Stephen D.	08/30/21	6.4	Correspondence with E. Jerrard and T. Graulich regarding exit financing issues (3.5); correspondence with E. Jerrard regarding same (0.7); call with A. Conesa, R. Sanchez Baker, J. Arrigunaga and others regarding same (1.2); review and revise exit financing process letter (0.3); review revised debt financing term sheet (0.3); email with Aeroméxico and Davis Polk teams regarding same (0.4).
Graulich, Timothy	08/31/21	6.3	Correspondence with M. Huebner regarding final valuation materials (0.9); call with A. Conesa regarding valuation (0.8); call with same and Restructuring Committee regarding valuation (2.3); review and revise process letter (2.3).
Huebner, Marshall S.	08/31/21	1.7	Call with management and advisers regarding exit financing issues (0.7); correspondence with T. Graulich regarding valuation issues (0.5); call with counsel to joint bidders regarding potential exit structures (0.5).
Jerrard, Erik	08/31/21	5.4	Review and revise bidder communication summary (2.4); email with Restructuring Committee regarding same (1.1); correspondence with S. Piraino regarding same (0.6); email with same, T. Graulich, and Rothschild regarding same (0.4); email with A. Sainz regarding same (0.4); email with counsel to stakeholder regarding grace period (0.3); distribute bidder communication (0.2).

		Time	Detail By Project
Name	Date	Hours	Narrative
Melcer, Moshe	08/31/21	0.3	Attend meeting with advisors and shareholders regarding exit financing process (0.2) (partial attendance); email with Davis Polk Plan team regarding timeline (0.1).
Piraino, Stephen D.	08/31/21	4.6	Correspondence with E. Jerrard regarding exit financing issues (0.5); correspondence with T. Graulich and E. Jerrard regarding same (0.9); correspondence with Rothschild team regarding same (0.3); call with Restructuring Committee regarding same (0.9); review and revise exit financing documents (2.0).
Troconis, Adela	08/31/21	0.3	Correspondence with T. Green regarding DIP credit agreement.
Total AM190 Financi	ng	607.0	
AM200 General Case	Administration		
Altman, Olivia	08/02/21	1.5	Review and revise exhibits and signature page for filing (1.0); correspondence with M. Masaro, M. Melcer, and others regarding same (0.5).
Jerrard, Erik	08/02/21	0.4	Correspondence with T. Graulich and S. Piraino regarding case status.
Altman, Olivia	08/03/21	0.3	Review docket filings.
Giddens, Magali	08/03/21	0.4	Review docket filings.
Jerrard, Erik	08/03/21	2.1	Prepare for weekly workstreams call with Davis Polk Restructuring team.
Melcer, Moshe	08/03/21	0.5	Review and revise case status summary (0.4); email with E. Jerrard regarding same (0.1).
Bane, Abraham	08/04/21	1.0	Attend weekly workstreams call with Davis Polk Restructuring team.
Graulich, Timothy	08/04/21	0.9	Correspondence with S. Piraino regarding workstreams.
Green, Thomas S.	08/04/21	0.6	Attend weekly workstreams call with Davis Polk Restructuring team (partial attendance).
Jerrard, Erik	08/04/21	2.5	Attend weekly workstreams call with Davis Polk Restructuring team (0.8); email with T. Graulich regarding same (0.5); coordinate upcoming omnibus hearing dates (0.8); review upcoming exclusivity and removal deadlines and related filings (0.4).
Masaro, Matthew Bruno	08/04/21	0.7	Attend weekly workstreams call with Davis Polk Restructuring team.
Melcer, Moshe	08/04/21	1.1	Attend weekly workstreams call with Davis Polk Restructuring team (0.7); review and revise case status summary (0.4).
Piraino, Stephen D.	08/04/21	0.7	Attend weekly workstreams call with Davis Polk Restructuring team.
Steinberg, Richard J.	08/04/21	1.0	Attend weekly workstreams call with Davis Polk Restructuring team (0.7); prepare for same (0.3).
Szanzer, Steven Z.	08/04/21	1.2	Attend weekly workstreams call with Davis Polk Restructuring team (0.7); review case status summary (0.5).
Giddens, Magali	08/05/21	0.3	Correspondence with M. Melcer regarding filing notice of adjournment.
Jerrard, Erik	08/05/21	4.3	Email with Chambers regarding September Omnibus Hearing (0.3); correspondence with T. Graulich and S. Piraino regarding case updates and strategy (1.9); email with R. Steinberg regarding case timeline (0.4); email with J. Eisen regarding August 12th Hearing agenda (0.4); correspondence with M. Melcer regarding upcoming hearing (0.3); review, revise and coordinate filing of notices (0.8); email with M. Melcer regarding same (0.2).

		Time	Detail By Project
Name	Date	Hours	Narrative
Melcer, Moshe	08/05/21	0.2	Draft notice of August 12th Hearing cancellation.
Altman, Olivia	08/06/21	0.5	Correspondence with Epiq and M. Masaro regarding upcoming filing and service of same (0.2); file notice of interim
O: 11 M I:	00/00/04	0.5	fee hearing (0.3).
Giddens, Magali Masaro, Matthew	08/06/21 08/08/21	0.5 0.1	Review docket filings. Correspondence with AlixPartners and others regarding
Bruno	00/00/21	0.1	monthly operating reports.
Melcer, Moshe	08/08/21	0.2	Correspondence with E. Jerrard regarding upcoming hearing.
Altman, Olivia	08/09/21	0.4	File notice of assumptions of executory contract (0.3); correspondence with Epiq regarding same (0.1).
Farrell, Annie	08/09/21	2.1	Prepare documents for production as per C. Rincon.
Jerrard, Erik	08/09/21	1.1	Review filing versions of Certificates of No Objection.
Piraino, Stephen D.	08/09/21	0.3	Correspondence with E. Jerrard regarding case updates (0.1); call with Chambers regarding case status (0.2).
Steinberg, Richard J.	08/09/21	0.2	Email with Aeroméxico regarding 2019 Statement.
Giddens, Magali	08/10/21	0.5	File notice of proposed order regarding DAE.
Jerrard, Erik	08/10/21	2.9	Prepare for weekly workstreams call with Davis Polk
			Restructuring team (1.9); call with Aeromexico and co-
Malaan Maalaa	00/40/04	0.5	advisors regarding case updates (1.0).
Melcer, Moshe Piraino, Stephen D.	08/10/21 08/10/21	0.5 0.2	Draft notice of cancellation of August 12th hearing.
Sokol, Nate	08/10/21	0.2	Correspondence with E. Jerrard regarding case updates. Email with E. Jerrard regarding case workstreams.
Altman, Olivia	08/11/21	1.5	File notice of cancellation of August 12th hearing (0.2); file
Auman, Olivia	00/11/21	1.0	Certificates of No Objections to omnibus claims (1.0); correspondence with Court regarding same (0.3).
Bane, Abraham	08/11/21	0.9	Attend weekly workstreams call with Davis Polk Restructuring team.
Ford, Stephen	08/11/21	0.9	Attend weekly workstreams call with Davis Polk Restructuring team.
Graulich, Timothy	08/11/21	0.9	Attend weekly workstreams call with Davis Polk Restructuring team.
Green, Thomas S.	08/11/21	0.5	Attend weekly workstreams call with Davis Polk Restructuring team (partial attendance).
Jerrard, Erik	08/11/21	2.5	Call with N. Sokol regarding case workstreams (0.8); correspondence with S. Ford, A. Bane, S. Piraino, and N. Sokol regarding Plan and case developments (1.4); email with Aeroméxico communications consultant regarding case status
Masaro, Matthew Bruno	08/11/21	1.2	(0.3). Attend weekly workstreams call with Davis Polk Restructuring team (0.9); correspondence with AlixPartners and others
Melcer, Moshe	08/11/21	1.6	regarding monthly operating reports (0.3). Attend weekly workstreams call with Davis Polk Restructuring
			team (0.9); revise notice of cancellation of August 12th hearing (0.3); email to Chamber regarding CEBURES notice of presentment (0.3); correspondence with M. Masaro regarding same (0.1).
Piraino, Stephen D.	08/11/21	0.9	Attend weekly workstreams call with Davis Polk Restructuring team call.
Sokol, Nate	08/11/21	2.2	Attend weekly workstreams call with Davis Polk Restructuring team (0.9); call with E. Jerrard regarding case workstreams (0.8); correspondence with S. Piraino, E. Jerrard, and others
Steinberg, Richard J.	08/11/21	0.9	regarding case workstreams (0.5). Attend weekly workstreams call with Davis Polk Restructuring team.
Szanzer, Steven Z.	08/11/21	1.5	Review August 12th Hearing agenda (0.1); attend weekly workstreams call with Davis Polk Restructuring team (0.9);

	Time Detail By Project			
Name	Date	Hours	Narrative	
			review and finalize notice of August 12th Hearing cancellation (0.3); correspondence with Davis Polk team regarding same (0.2).	
Piraino, Stephen D.	08/12/21	0.4	Correspondence with N. Sokol regarding case updates (0.2); correspondence with T. Graulich regarding same (0.2).	
Altman, Olivia	08/17/21	0.5	File Newrest motions and related documents.	
Melcer, Moshe	08/17/21	0.1	Revise case status summary.	
Altman, Olivia	08/18/21	0.5	File notice of hearing (0.2); file omnibus claims objections (0.3).	
Dekhtyar, Mariya	08/18/21	1.0	Attend weekly workstreams call with Davis Polk Restructuring team.	
Ford, Stephen	08/18/21	1.0	Attend weekly workstreams call with Davis Polk Restructuring team.	
Masaro, Matthew Bruno	08/18/21	1.0	Attend weekly workstreams call with Davis Polk Restructuring team.	
Melcer, Moshe	08/18/21	1.1	Attend weekly workstreams call with Davis Polk Restructuring team.	
Piraino, Stephen D.	08/18/21	2.7	Attend weekly workstreams call with Davis Polk Restructuring team (1.0); prepare for same (1.4); correspondence with T. Graulich regarding case updates (0.3).	
Steinberg, Richard J.	08/18/21	1.1	Attend weekly workstreams call with Davis Polk Restructuring team.	
Szanzer, Steven Z.	08/18/21	1.3	Attend weekly workstreams call with Davis Polk Restructuring team (1.1); correspondence with T. Green and Chambers regarding hearing date for CAE and SMBC motions (0.2).	
Altman, Olivia	08/19/21	0.3	File motions.	
Altman, Olivia	08/20/21	1.0	File CAE motions (0.4); file SMBC motions (0.5); coordinate	
, -		-	with Epiq regarding same (0.1).	
Giddens, Magali	08/20/21	1.6	Correspondence with M. Melcer regarding CAE filing (0.1); correspondence with T. Green regarding SMBC filings (0.2); file same (0.3); review same and CAE motions (0.9); correspondence with Epiq regarding service of SMBC documents (0.1).	
Giddens, Magali	08/21/21	0.1	Correspondence with T. Green regarding filing.	
Altman, Olivia	08/23/21	0.3	Review and revise Rule 2015.3 report.	
Masaro, Matthew Bruno	08/23/21	0.9	Review and revise Rule 2015.3 report (0.6); correspondence with AlixPartners, Aeroméxico, and others regarding same (0.2); correspondence with O. Altman and AlixPartners regarding monthly operating reports (0.1).	
Giddens, Magali	08/24/21	0.6	Review docket filings.	
Jerrard, Erik	08/24/21	3.1	Call with S. Piraino regarding case update (0.9); update workstreams summary (2.2).	
Piraino, Stephen D.	08/24/21	0.9	Call with E. Jerrard regarding case updates.	
Szanzer, Steven Z.	08/24/21	0.4	Correspondence with E. Jerrard and T. Graulich regarding call with Aeroméxico and co-advisors.	
Green, Thomas S.	08/25/21	0.9	Attend weekly workstreams call with Davis Polk Restructuring team.	
Jerrard, Erik	08/25/21	2.1	Call with R. Sanchez Baker to prepare for call with A. Schwartz (0.2); call with A. Schwartz, A. Sainz, R. Sanchez Baker, and others regarding case updates and retention (1.4); email with M. Masaro, S. Piraino, and T. Graulich regarding same (0.5).	
Masaro, Matthew Bruno	08/25/21	0.3	Review and revise Rule 2015.3 report (0.1); correspondence with Debtor professionals regarding same (0.2).	
Melcer, Moshe	08/25/21	0.4	Review and revise case status summary (0.3); email with S. Piraino, E. Jerrard, and C. Rincon regarding upcoming hearing 46	

		Time	Detail By Project
Name	Date	Hours	Narrative
Piraino, Stephen D.	08/25/21	0.7	(0.1). Call with E. Jerrard regarding case updates (0.5); call with R. Steinberg regarding various matters (0.2).
Jerrard, Erik	08/26/21	0.9	Email with T. Graulich and S. Piraino regarding case administration (0.4); call with S. Piraino regarding case updates (0.5).
Masaro, Matthew Bruno	08/26/21	0.3	Review monthly operating reports (0.1); correspondence with AlixPartners and others regarding same (0.2).
Giddens, Magali	08/27/21	1.6	File Newrest motion (0.6); file Clover document (0.6); file June Monthly Fee Statement (0.4).
Jerrard, Erik	08/27/21	0.5	Correspondence with S. Piraino regarding case updates.
Jerrard, Erik	08/29/21	1.0	Review notice of cancellation (0.3); email with Davis Polk Restructuring team regarding upcoming hearings (0.4); email with A. Bane regarding upcoming removal deadline extension motion (0.3).
Melcer, Moshe	08/29/21	0.5	Draft notice of cancellation (0.3); correspondence with S. Piraino regarding same (0.1); correspondence with M. Giddens regarding same (0.1).
Altman, Olivia	08/30/21	0.4	5 5 1
Jerrard, Erik	08/30/21	0.6	Correspondence with S. Piraino regarding case update.
Giddens, Magali	08/31/21	1.6	Correspondence with P. Garg regarding filing fifth notice of assumption (0.4); review same (0.2); prepare for filing and file same (0.3); correspondence with M. Melcer regarding filing assumption motion, sealing motion, and declaration regarding same (0.2); file same on docket (0.4); correspondence with Epig regarding service of same (0.1).
Jerrard, Erik	08/31/21	3.7	Correspondence with M. Melcer regarding case updates (0.2); correspondence with R. Steinberg regarding same (0.2); correspondence with S. Piraino regarding same (0.6); correspondence with same and T. Graulich regarding same (0.9); prepare for weekly workstreams call with Davis Polk Restructuring team (1.8).
Piraino, Stephen D.	08/31/21	0.4	Correspondence with T. Graulich regarding case updates.
Total AM200 Genera Administration	I Case	80.8	
AM210 Non-DPW Re	etention and Fee	Issues	
Jerrard, Erik	08/03/21	1.1	Email with Aeroméxico regarding KPMG (0.4); email with Morris Nichols regarding same (0.7).
Masaro, Matthew Bruno	08/05/21	0.2	Correspondence with Aeroméxico and others regarding ordinary course professionals.
Bane, Abraham	08/06/21	1.1	Draft notice of Interim Fee Hearing (0.8); correspondence with E. Jerrard regarding same (0.2); coordinate filing of same (0.1).
Jerrard, Erik	08/06/21	1.5	Email with co-advisors and Creditors Committee advisors regarding Interim Fee Hearing adjournment (0.6); review and revise notice of Interim Fee Hearing (0.7); email with A. Bane regarding same (0.2).
Jerrard, Erik Jerrard, Erik	08/08/21 08/09/21	1.7 0.3	Review and revise KPMG retention application. Call with R. Boone regarding ordinary course professionals' affidavit.
Masaro, Matthew Bruno	08/09/21	0.2	Correspondence with Aeroméxico regarding ordinary course professional retention (0.1); review affidavit and questionnaire related to same (0.1).
Jerrard, Erik	08/11/21	0.3	Email with ordinary course professional regarding ordinary

Time Detail By Project Name **Date** Hours **Narrative** course professional issue. Masaro, Matthew 08/11/21 0.1 Correspondence with E. Jerrard regarding ordinary course Bruno professional retention. Piraino, Stephen D. 08/12/21 0.2 Correspondence with Davis Polk team regarding KPMG application. 0.2 Correspondence with Morris Nichols, E. Jerrard, Copy Center, Masaro, Matthew 08/16/21 A. Schwartz, and others regarding KPMG retention. Bruno Masaro, Matthew 0.2 Correspondence with Aeroméxico and others regarding 08/20/21 Bruno ordinary course retention. Masaro, Matthew 08/23/21 Correspondence with White & Case and others regarding Bruno ordinary course retention. Review ordinary course affidavit (0.1); correspondence with Masaro, Matthew 08/24/21 0.2 Aeroméxico regarding same (0.1). Bruno Masaro, Matthew 0.2 Correspondence with E. Jerrard and T. Graulich regarding 08/25/21 Bruno ordinary course retention. Piraino, Stephen D. 08/25/21 Call with A. Schwartz, E. Jerrard, A. Sainz, and Aeroméxico team regarding retention issues. Correspondence with Aeroméxico and others regarding Masaro, Matthew 08/26/21 Bruno ordinary course retention. Correspondence with M. Melcer and others regarding ordinary Masaro, Matthew 08/30/21 0.2 Bruno course retention. **Total AM210 Non-DPW Retention** 9.5 and Fee Issues AM230 Plan/Disclosure Statement Masaro. Matthew 08/02/21 0.2 Correspondence with AlixPartners regarding Disclosure Bruno Statement. Masaro, Matthew 08/03/21 0.2 Correspondence with D. O'Sullivan and AlixPartners regarding Disclosure Statement. Bruno Review and revise Disclosure Statement (1.0); O'Sullivan, Damian 08/03/21 correspondence with M. Masaro regarding same (0.3). Ford, Stephen 08/04/21 Correspondence with Davis Polk team regarding Plan and Disclosure Statement workstreams. Graulich, Timothy 08/05/21 5.9 Call with counsel to potential investor regarding Mediation order and disclosure (0.5); review revised Disclosure Statement (3.8); review revise Plan (1.6). Review and revise motion to extend exclusivity periods. Melcer, Moshe 2.8 08/05/21 O'Sullivan, Damian Review and revise Disclosure Statement. 08/05/21 0.7 Ford. Stephen 08/06/21 Draft Plan section on mediation. 1.0 Masaro. Matthew 08/06/21 Review and revise Disclosure Statement. 0.2 Bruno Melcer. Moshe 08/06/21 1.4 Review and revise motion to extend exclusivity periods. O'Sullivan, Damian Review and revise Disclosure Statement. 08/06/21 0.7 Piraino, Stephen D. 3.2 Review and revise Disclosure Statement. 08/06/21 Masaro, Matthew Review and revise Disclosure Statement (0.8): 08/09/21 Bruno correspondence with R. Steinberg regarding same (0.2). Piraino, Stephen D. 08/09/21 2.5 Prepare issues list regarding Plan and Disclosure Statement. Call with potential exit financing provider regarding Plan. Jerrard, Erik 08/10/21 Masaro, Matthew 08/10/21 Review and revise Disclosure Statement. Bruno Steinberg, Richard J. 08/10/21 0.1 Correspondence with M. Masaro regarding Disclosure Statement. Bane, Abraham 08/11/21 Call with S. Piraino, E. Jerrard, and N. Sokol regarding Plan (0.6); review precedent plan provisions (2.2); draft summary regarding same (1.6).

Invoice No.7040999

Invoice Date: October 25, 2021

	Time Detail By Project			
Name	Date	Hours	Narrative	
Ford, Stephen	08/11/21	6.1	Research regarding Plan (2.0); review and revise same (3.5); call with A. Bane, E. Jerrard, and N. Sokol regarding same (0.6).	
Masaro, Matthew Bruno	08/11/21	3.9	Review and revise Disclosure Statement (1.3); review and revise Plan (1.3); correspondence with R. Steinberg, S. Piraino, and others regarding same (0.3).	
Piraino, Stephen D.	08/11/21	4.0	Call with Davis Polk Restructuring team regarding Plan (0.6) (partial attendance); review and revise Plan (1.6); review and revise Disclosure Statement (1.6); correspondence with T. Graulich regarding same and Plan (0.2).	
Bane, Abraham	08/12/21	0.6	Correspondence with S. Ford regarding Plan (0.2); review release precedent summary (0.1); correspondence with S. Piraino, N. Sokol, and E. Jerrard regarding same (0.3).	
Ford, Stephen	08/12/21	5.0	Review Plan and Disclosure Statement (3.5); review and revise issues list (1.0); prepare distribution list (0.5).	
Masaro, Matthew Bruno	08/12/21	6.0	Review and revise Disclosure Statement (5.0); correspondence with R. Steinberg and S. Piraino regarding same (1.0).	
Piraino, Stephen D.	08/12/21	4.3	Correspondence with R. Steinberg and M. Masaro regarding Disclosure Statement (1.1); call with Rothschild, A. Conesa and R. Sanchez Baker regarding Plan issues (1.0); review and revise Plan (1.1); review and revise Disclosure Statement (1.1).	
Sokol, Nate	08/12/21	0.4	Review third-party release research (0.1); email A. Bane regarding same (0.1); correspondence with S. Piraino regarding final evaluation materials and Plan (0.2).	
Steinberg, Richard J.	08/12/21	0.5	Correspondence with S. Piraino and M. Masaro regarding Disclosure Statement.	
Bane, Abraham	08/13/21	0.6	Review Plan issues list (0.4); correspondence with M. Masaro regarding same (0.2).	
Ford, Stephen	08/13/21	3.4	Review and revise Plan.	
Graulich, Timothy	08/13/21	2.8	Review and revise Plan.	
Masaro, Matthew Bruno	08/13/21	5.7	Correspondence with AlixPartners regarding Disclosure Statement (0.7); review and revise same (5.0).	
Piraino, Stephen D.	08/13/21	3.9	Review and revise Plan and Disclosure Statement.	
Steinberg, Richard J.	08/13/21	0.3	Correspondence with S. Piraino and M. Masaro regarding Disclosure Statement.	
Ford, Stephen	08/15/21	3.6	Review Plan draft for issues list (3.1); prepare for call with Davis Polk team regarding same (0.5).	
Ford, Stephen	08/16/21	0.4	Research Plan and Disclosure Statement issues.	
Graulich, Timothy	08/16/21	2.8	Review and revise Plan.	
Masaro, Matthew Bruno	08/16/21	2.1	Review and revise Disclosure Statement (1.7); correspondence with S. Piraino, R. Steinberg, AlixPartners, and others regarding same (0.4).	
Melcer, Moshe	08/16/21	0.3	and others regarding same (0.4). Correspondence with R. Steinberg regarding Plan (0.1); analyze issues regarding same (0.2).	
Steinberg, Richard J.	08/16/21	1.5	Review and revise Disclosure Statement (0.7); call with AlixPartners regarding letter of credit facilities (0.3); review and comment on indebtedness spreadsheet (0.3); email with AlixPartners regarding same (0.2).	
Ford, Stephen	08/17/21	5.6	Call with Davis Polk Plan team regarding Plan (0.8); review and revise Plan (2.8); research issues regarding same (2.0).	
Masaro, Matthew Bruno	08/17/21	2.4	Review and revise Disclosure Statement (1.6); correspondence with S. Piraino, R. Steinberg, and others regarding same and Plan (0.8).	
Melcer, Moshe	08/17/21	0.5	Call with Davis Polk Plan team regarding Plan.	

		Time	Detail By Project
Name	Date	Hours	Narrative
O'Sullivan, Damian	08/17/21	3.1	Review and revise ballots regarding opt out issue (1.3); correspondence with M. Masaro regarding same (0.2); call with Davis Polk Plan team regarding Plan (0.5); review and revise Disclosure Statement (1.1).
Piraino, Stephen D.	08/17/21	1.8	Review and revise Disclosure Statement (1.3); call with Davis Polk Plan team regarding Plan (0.5).
Sokol, Nate	08/17/21	1.2	Call with Davis Polk Plan team regarding Plan (0.5); email with same regarding same (0.3); review Plan exculpation provisions (0.2); review precedent of same (0.1); email with S. Ford regarding same (0.1).
Steinberg, Richard J.	08/17/21	0.5	Call with Davis Polk Restructuring team regarding Disclosure Statement.
Ford, Stephen	08/18/21	12.2	Extensive review and revision of Plan (6.8); research issues regarding same (4.5); call with M. Melcer regarding outstanding items regarding same (0.1); correspondence with N. Sokol regarding Plan (0.2); correspondence with S. Piraino regarding same (0.4); correspondence with R. Steinberg regarding Plan and Disclosure Statement (0.2).
Graulich, Timothy	08/18/21	3.1	Review and comment on Disclosure Statement.
Masaro, Matthew Bruno	08/18/21	3.3	Review and revise Disclosure Statement (2.2); correspondence with R. Steinberg, S. Piraino, and others regarding same (0.6); call with AlixPartners regarding same and Plan (0.5).
Melcer, Moshe	08/18/21	0.8	Call with R. Steinberg regarding Disclosure Statement procedures (0.3); review precedent regarding same (0.1); review precedent plans for defined terms (0.3); call with S. Ford regarding outstanding tasks regarding Plan (0.1).
Piraino, Stephen D.	08/18/21	2.1	Review and revise Plan (0.8); research issues regarding Plan (1.3).
Sokol, Nate	08/18/21	0.8	Review Plan exculpation provisions (0.2); review precedent of same (0.2); email with S. Ford regarding same (0.1); email with same and M. Melcer regarding Plan equity rights offering provisions (0.1); review precedent regarding same (0.2).
Steinberg, Richard J.	08/18/21	1.3	Review and revise Disclosure Statement.
Graulich, Timothy	08/19/21	2.8	Review and revise Disclosure Statement.
Masaro, Matthew Bruno	08/19/21	0.6	Review and revise Disclosure Statement (0.4); correspondence with S. Piraino and others regarding same (0.2).
Melcer, Moshe	08/19/21	0.7	Review precedent chapter 11 plans.
Piraino, Stephen D.	08/19/21	4.9	Call with S. Szanzer regarding Plan issue (0.4); review and revise Plan (0.2); review and revise Plan and Disclosure Statement (2.2); research various Plan issues (2.1).
Steinberg, Richard J.	08/19/21	1.4	Review and revise Plan.
Szanzer, Steven Z.	08/19/21	1.2	Call with S. Piraino regarding Plan issues (0.4); correspondence with T. Graulich regarding mediation and Plan proposals (0.8).
Ford, Stephen	08/20/21	2.9	Review and revise Plan (1.9); review Plan financing proposal (1.0).
Masaro, Matthew Bruno	08/20/21	3.9	Review and revise Disclosure Statement (3.2); correspondence with S. Piraino and others regarding same (0.7).
Piraino, Stephen D.	08/20/21	1.0	Meet with R. Steinberg and M. Masaro regarding Disclosure Statement.
Steinberg, Richard J.	08/20/21	2.3	Meet with S. Piraino and others regarding Disclosure Statement (1.0); review and revise Disclosure Statement (1.3).
Ford, Stephen	08/21/21	6.4	Review and revise Plan (5.4); review precedent plans (0.8);

		Time	Detail By Project
Name	Date	Hours	Narrative
Masaro, Matthew Bruno	08/21/21	4.1	correspondence with S. Piraino regarding same (0.2). Review and revise Disclosure Statement (3.5); correspondence with S. Piraino, R. Steinberg, and others regarding same (0.6).
Melcer, Moshe	08/21/21	1.3	Review and revise Disclosure Statement.
Steinberg, Richard J. Ford, Stephen	08/21/21 08/22/21	1.3 8.2	Review and revise Disclosure Statement. Review Sainz Abogados' comments to Plan (0.5); research issues regarding same (1.0); review and revise Plan (6.4); correspondence with M. Masaro regarding same (0.1); correspondence with S. Piraino regarding same (0.2).
Graulich, Timothy	08/22/21	2.2	Review and comment on Plan.
Masaro, Matthew Bruno	08/22/21	1.1	Review and revise Disclosure Statement (0.7); correspond with S. Piraino and R. Steinberg regarding same (0.4).
Melcer, Moshe	08/22/21	0.6	Review and revise Disclosure Statement (0.2); call with R. Steinberg regarding exclusivity periods (0.4).
O'Sullivan, Damian	08/22/21	1.5	Review and revise Disclosure Statement (1.4); correspondence with M. Masaro regarding same (0.1).
Piraino, Stephen D.	08/22/21	0.5	Review and revise Plan.
Steinberg, Richard J.	08/22/21	0.4	Call with M. Melcer regarding exclusivity periods.
Ford, Stephen	08/23/21	3.4	Review and revise Plan (3.0); correspondence with coadvisors regarding same (0.1); correspondence with S. Piraino and T. Graulich regarding same (0.3).
Graulich, Timothy	08/23/21	2.6	Review and revise Plan.
Masaro, Matthew Bruno	08/23/21	4.4	Review and revise Disclosure Statement (3.0); correspondence with S. Piraino, R. Steinberg, T. Graulich, and others regarding same (0.8); review and revise Plan (0.4);
Melcer, Moshe	08/23/21	1.4	correspondence with S. Ford and others regarding same (0.2). Review and revise motion to extend exclusivity periods (1.3);
Piraino, Stephen D.	08/23/21	1.5	correspondence with R. Steinberg regarding same (0.1). Correspondence with M. Masaro regarding Disclosure Statement (0.1); review and revise Disclosure Statement (1.1); review and revise Plan (0.3).
Steinberg, Richard J.	08/23/21	5.7	Email with AlixPartners regarding updated confirmation timeline (0.2); revise Disclosure Statement (0.6); correspondence with co-advisors regarding same (0.6); draft exclusivity extension motion (2.9); email with AlixPartners regarding updated confirmation timeline (0.2); revise Disclosure Statement (0.6); correspondence with co-advisors regarding same (0.6).
Szanzer, Steven Z.	08/23/21	0.4	• • • • • • • • • • • • • • • • • • • •
Bane, Abraham	08/24/21	1.6	Review release provisions of Plan (0.2); correspondence with E. Jerrard and S. Ford regarding same (0.2); revise Plan (0.4); correspondence with M. Masaro regarding Disclosure
Dekhtyar, Mariya	08/24/21	0.6	Statement (0.2); review co-advisor comments to Plan (0.6). Call with D. O'Sullivan regarding Disclosure Statement (0.3); email with R. Steinberg regarding same (0.1); review correspondence with Sainz Abogados regarding same (0.1); review email from M. DeGraf regarding Plan (0.1).
Ford, Stephen	08/24/21	6.2	Review and revise Plan (5.8); correspondence with S. Piraino regarding same (0.3); correspondence with E. Jerrard regarding same (0.1).
Graulich, Timothy	08/24/21	3.8	Review Plan and Disclosure Statement for final valuation materials.
Jerrard, Erik	08/24/21	2.3	Review and revise Plan (1.2); email with Davis Polk Restructuring team regarding same (0.7); call with S. Piraino, R. Steinberg and M. Melcer regarding exclusivity extension

	Time Detail By Project			
Name	Date	Hours	Narrative	
Masaro, Matthew Bruno	08/24/21	4.0	(0.4). Review and revise Disclosure Statement (1.9); correspondence with AlixPartners and others regarding same (1.1); correspondence with Davis Polk Tax team and others	
Melcer, Moshe	08/24/21	2.9	regarding same (1.0). Review and revise motion to extend exclusivity periods (1.4); correspondence with R. Steinberg regarding the same (0.1); call with S. Piraino, E. Jerrard, and R. Steinberg regarding same (0.4); review and revise Disclosure Statement (0.9); correspondence with M. Masaro regarding same (0.1).	
Piraino, Stephen D.	08/24/21	0.9	Call with Davis Polk Tax and Restructuring teams regarding Disclosure Statement (0.5); call with E. Jerrard, R. Steinberg, and M. Melcer regarding exclusivity extension (0.4).	
Steinberg, Richard J.	08/24/21	5.0	Revise exclusivity extension motion (3.5); call with M. Melcer, S. Piraino, and E. Jerrard regarding same (0.4); review and revise Disclosure Statement (0.8); correspondence with Davis Polk team and co-advisors regarding same (0.3).	
Bane, Abraham	08/25/21	1.6	Review Sainz Abogados comments to Disclosure Statement (0.9); revise Plan (0.7).	
Dekhtyar, Mariya	08/25/21	1.6	Review correspondence from Sainz Abogados and R. Steinberg regarding Disclosure Statement (0.1); correspondence with D. O'Sullivan regarding Disclosure Statement (0.1); review correspondence from M. Masaro regarding same (0.2); review and revise Disclosure Statement (0.8); email with D. O'Sullivan regarding same (0.1); call with same regarding same (0.2); email with M. Masaro, R. Steinberg, and M. Melcer regarding same (0.1).	
Jerrard, Erik	08/25/21	0.8	Email with Davis Polk team regarding Plan process updates (0.3); coordinate Plan updates (0.5).	
Masaro, Matthew Bruno	08/25/21	1.8	Review and revise Disclosure Statement (1.0); correspondence with AlixPartners, S. Piraino, R. Steinberg, and others regarding same (0.8).	
Melcer, Moshe	08/25/21	0.6	Review and revise Disclosure Statement.	
O'Sullivan, Damian	08/25/21	0.5	Review comments to Disclosure Statement (0.2); call with M. Dekhtyar regarding same (0.2); email with same regarding same (0.1).	
Steinberg, Richard J.	08/25/21	0.5	Revise Disclosure Statement (0.3); correspondence with M. Masaro regarding same (0.2).	
Garg, Paavani	08/26/21	0.6	Correspondence with M. Masaro regarding Disclosure Statement.	
Huebner, Marshall S.	08/26/21	1.9	Correspondence with T. Graulich, H. Parkhill, Restructuring Committee regarding Plan structure, exit options, and mediation.	
Masaro, Matthew Bruno	08/26/21	1.2	Review and revise Disclosure Statement (0.8); correspondence with R. Steinberg and others regarding same (0.4).	
Piraino, Stephen D. Bane, Abraham	08/26/21 08/27/21	1.6 2.2	Review and revise Plan and Disclosure Statement. Correspondence with S. Ford regarding Plan (0.3); correspondence with S. Piraino regarding same (0.2); review and revise same (1.7).	
Graulich, Timothy	08/27/21	4.1	Revise draft Disclosure Statement (2.7); review and revise solicitation and filing timeline (1.4).	
Masaro, Matthew Bruno	08/27/21	0.4	Correspondence with P. Garg, R. Steinberg, and others regarding Disclosure Statement.	
Melcer, Moshe Piraino, Stephen D.	08/27/21 08/27/21	0.1 2.4	Email with S. Piraino and E. Jerrard regarding exclusivity. Email with T. Graulich and E. Jerrard regarding exclusivity	

Time Detail By Project						
Name	Date	Hours	Narrative			
Garg, Paavani Bane, Abraham	08/28/21 08/30/21 08/30/21	3.4 0.1 0.2	(0.4); review and revise Plan and Disclosure Statement (2.0). Review and revise Disclosure Statement. Correspondence with T. Green regarding Plan.			
Masaro, Matthew Bruno Steinberg, Richard J.	08/30/21	0.2	Correspondence with P. Garg, R. Steinberg, and others regarding Disclosure Statement. Email with AlixPartners regarding Disclosure Statement.			
Bane, Abraham	08/31/21	0.7	Review and revise exclusivity extension motion (0.5); correspondence with M. Melcer regarding same (0.2).			
Melcer, Moshe	08/31/21	0.7	Revise motion to extend exclusivity periods (0.4); correspondence with E. Jerrard regarding same (0.2); correspondence with R. Steinberg regarding same (0.1).			
Steinberg, Richard J.	08/31/21	1.4	Correspondence with E. Jerrard regarding motion to extend exclusivity periods (0.4); revise motion to extend exclusivity periods (1.0).			
Total AM230 Plan/Disclosure Statement		250.0				
AM240 DPW Retention/Preparation of DPW Fee Statements/Applications and Budget						
Jerrard, Erik Jerrard, Erik	08/09/21 08/26/21	1.0 1.0	Review and revise June Monthly Fee Statement. Review and revise July Monthly Fee Statement.			
Total AM240 DPW	00/20/21	2.0	Neview and revise duly Monthly rec diatement.			
Retention/Preparatio Statements/Applicati Budget		2.0				
AM250 IP, Regulatory		0.4				
Donnelly, Jacob M. De Mullewie, Léonore	08/02/21 08/03/21	0.1 0.4	Email with S. Piraino regarding timing of tax issues. Coordinate antitrust filings.			
Donnelly, Jacob M.	08/03/21	0.3	Correspondence with S. Piraino regarding timing of tax issues (0.1); email with A. Siman regarding tax issues (0.2).			
Donnelly, Jacob M.	08/04/21	1.5	Correspondence with A. Siman regarding process for drafting tax section of Disclosure Statement (0.1); review precedent regarding same (1.0); email with S. Piraino regarding voting issue (0.4).			
Piraino, Stephen D.	08/04/21	0.4	Analyze antitrust issues (0.2); email with T. Graulich regarding same (0.2).			
Burke, Arthur J.	08/05/21	0.5	Correspondence with Davis Polk Antitrust team regarding Department of Justice status and RFI responses.			
Burke, Arthur J.	08/10/21	0.5	Correspondence with Davis Polk Antitrust team regarding Department of Justice status and strategy.			
Altus, Leslie J. Donnelly, Jacob M.	08/13/21 08/13/21	0.1	Email with Davis Polk Tax team regarding Disclosure Statement. Email with A. Siman and M. Masaro regarding tax issues			
Siman, Ariel	08/13/21	2.0	updates. Analyze tax disclosure.			
Donnelly, Jacob M.	08/15/21	2.6	Review and revise U.S. tax section of Disclosure Statement (2.3); email with A. Siman regarding same (0.3).			
De Mullewie, Léonore	08/16/21	1.0	Analyze antitrust filing information request.			
Piraino, Stephen D.	08/16/21	0.2	Call with G. Morrison regarding antitrust analysis.			
Burke, Arthur J.	08/17/21	0.5	Analyze antitrust issues.			
Siman, Ariel Donnelly, Jacob M.	08/17/21 08/23/21	0.4 0.1	Analyze tax issue. Email with S. Piraino, L. Altus, and L. Farr regarding mediation			
-			process.			

Invoice No.7040999

Invoice Date: October 25, 2021

Time Detail By Project					
Name	Date	Hours	Narrative		
Altus, Leslie J.	08/24/21	0.9	Call with Davis Polk Tax and Restructuring teams regarding Disclosure Statement (0.5); call with Davis Polk Tax team regarding same (0.4).		
Donnelly, Jacob M.	08/24/21	8.0	Call with Davis Polk Tax and Restructuring teams regarding Disclosure Statement (0.5); correspondence with L. Farr, L.		
Farr, Lucy W.	08/24/21	0.9	Altus, and A. Siman regarding same (0.3). Call with Davis Polk Tax and Restructuring teams regarding Disclosure Statement (0.5); call with Davis Polk Tax team regarding same (0.4).		
Siman, Ariel	08/24/21	1.0	Call with Davis Polk Tax and Restructuring team regarding Disclosure Statement (0.5); call with Davis Polk Tax team regarding same (0.5).		
Siman, Ariel	08/27/21	0.2			
Farr, Lucy W.	08/29/21	0.2	Review emails with Davis Polk Tax team regarding tax issues.		
Piraino, Štephen D.	08/29/21	0.2	Correspondence with Davis Polk Tax team regarding tax issues.		
Siman, Ariel	08/31/21	1.0	Review tax disclosure.		
Total AM250 IP, Regu Tax	ulatory and	15.9			
AM260 Hearing Prepa					
Szanzer, Steven Z.	08/04/21	1.7	Call with R. Sanchez Baker and others regarding DAE Hearing preparation (1.3); review materials regarding same (0.4).		
Szanzer, Steven Z.	08/05/21	0.6	Correspondence with Davis Polk team regarding September Omnibus Hearing date (0.1); correspondence with Davis Polk team regarding DAE Hearing preparation (0.5).		
Melcer, Moshe	08/06/21	1.1	Draft August 12th Hearing agenda.		
Szanzer, Steven Z.	08/06/21	0.4	Correspondence with M. Melcer regarding August 12th Hearing agenda (0.2); correspondence with E. Jerrard regarding same (0.2).		
Jerrard, Erik	08/08/21	0.4	Email with M. Melcer and R. Steinberg regarding hearing preparation.		
Melcer, Moshe	08/08/21	0.1	Revise August 12th Hearing agenda.		
Steinberg, Richard J.	08/08/21	0.5	Review and revise August 12th Hearing agenda.		
Jerrard, Erik	08/09/21	0.4	September Omnibus Hearing.		
Jerrard, Erik	08/10/21	1.0	Email with M. Melcer regarding August 12th Hearing preparation and agenda filing (0.7); correspondence with M. Melcer regarding same (0.3).		
Steinberg, Richard J.	08/11/21	0.2	Correspondence with Chambers regarding August 12th Hearing.		
Total AM260 Hearing Preparation/Attendar		6.4			
AM270 Credit Card R		0.6	Revise and revise CEBURES notice of presentment.		
Masaro, Matthew Bruno	08/06/21	0.6	nevise and revise CEBURES holice of presentment.		
Masaro, Matthew Bruno	08/09/21	0.4	Review and revise CEBURES notice of presentment (0.2); correspondence with Sainz Abogados and others regarding same (0.2).		
Masaro, Matthew Bruno	08/10/21	0.3	Review and revise CEBURES notice of presentment (0.2); correspondence with S. Piraino and others regarding same (0.1).		
Masaro, Matthew	08/11/21	1.0	Correspondence with S. Piraino, Willkie Farr, Cleary Gottlieb,		

20-11563-scc Doc 1979 Filed 10/26/21 Entered 10/26/21 20:59:12 Main Document Pg 280 of 357

Time Detail By Project					
Name	Date	Hours	Narrative		
Bruno			Greenberg Traurig, and others regarding CEBURES.		
Piraino, Stephen D.	08/11/21	0.3	Review and revise CEBURES notice of presentment.		
Green, Thomas S.	08/12/21	0.4	Correspondence with Davis Polk team regarding Elavon (0.2); analyze agreement regarding same (0.2).		
Masaro, Matthew Bruno	08/18/21	0.4	Review and revise CEBURES Rule 9019 (0.3); correspondence with S. Piraino and T. Graulich regarding same (0.1).		
Masaro, Matthew Bruno	08/19/21	1.0	Review and revise notice of presentment for CEBURES (0.7); correspondence with O. Altman and others regarding same (0.3).		
Green, Thomas S.	08/24/21	1.1	Correspondence with Aeroméxico regarding Elavon (0.5); review agreement regarding same (0.6).		
Total AM270 Credit Card Receivables		5.5			
TOTAL		1,805.7			

DISBURSEMENT SUMMARY	
Description	Amount
Court and related fees	\$3,101.78
Postage, courier & freight	\$215.31
Outside Documents & Research	\$1,384.11
Electronic Discovery Services	\$3,416.10
Meals	\$220.00
Travel	\$443.78
Computer research	\$4,738.97
TOTAL	\$13,520.05

DISBURSEMENT DETAIL Expense Date Vendor Name Description Amount Type 08/02/21 Westlaw usage by RINCON, CRISTIN on \$14.38 Computer research 08/02/2021 08/03/21 Computer Westlaw usage by DARTEZ, JACKSON on \$215.89 research 08/03/2021 08/03/21 Computer Westlaw usage by MELCER, MOSHE on \$28.76 08/03/2021 research 08/04/21 Computer Westlaw usage by DARTEZ, JACKSON on \$53.18 research 08/04/2021 08/07/21 Computer Westlaw usage by MELCER, MOSHE on \$82.28 research 08/07/2021 LEXIS; SEARCH; ACCESS CHARGE 08/07/21 Computer \$163.65 research 08/09/21 Computer Westlaw usage by DARTEZ, JACKSON on \$18.26 08/09/2021 research Westlaw usage by STEINBERG,RICH on 08/12/21 Computer \$18.26 research 08/12/2021 08/16/21 Computer LEXIS; SEARCH; ACCESS CHARGE \$203.96 research LEXIS; US TREATISES; DOC ACCESS 08/16/21 Computer \$685.01 research 08/17/21 Computer Westlaw usage by STEINBERG, RICH on \$127.14 research 08/17/2021 08/18/21 Computer LEXIS; US TREATISES; DOC ACCESS \$97.86 research 08/19/21 Computer LEXIS; SEARCH; ACCESS CHARGE \$203.96 research 08/19/21 Computer LEXIS; US TREATISES; DOC ACCESS \$880.73 research 08/19/21 Computer Westlaw usage by LEMPEL, JESSE on \$232.31 research 08/19/2021 08/20/21 Computer Westlaw usage by RINCON, CRISTIN on \$345.08 research 08/20/2021 08/20/21 Computer Westlaw usage by LEMPEL, JESSE on \$191.55 research 08/20/2021

DISBURSEMENT DETAIL Expense Date Vendor Name Description Amount Type Westlaw usage by MELCER, MOSHE on 08/20/21 Computer \$49.00 research 08/20/2021 08/24/21 Computer Westlaw usage by MELCER, MOSHE on \$145.38 research 08/24/2021 08/24/21 Computer LEXIS; SEARCH; ACCESS CHARGE \$96.76 research 08/25/21 Computer LEXIS; SEARCH; ACCESS CHARGE \$290.27 research 08/25/21 Computer Westlaw usage by STEINBERG, RICH on \$96.92 research 08/25/2021 08/25/21 Computer Westlaw usage by JERRARD, ERIK on \$32.31 research 08/25/2021 08/25/21 Computer Westlaw usage by MELCER, MOSHE on \$64.61 research 08/25/2021 08/26/21 Computer Westlaw usage by MELCER, MOSHE on \$121.43 research 08/26/2021 08/27/21 Computer Westlaw usage by BANE, ABRAHAM on \$16.15 research 08/27/2021 LEXIS; US TREATISES; DOC ACCESS 08/30/21 Computer \$112.77 research 08/31/21 Computer Westlaw usage by STEINBERG, RICH on \$151.11 research 08/31/2021 Veritext LLC VENDOR: Veritext LLC. INVOICE #: 5216415. 08/23/21 Court and \$1,295.55 related fees DATE: 8/23/2021: Transcription services for deposition of M. Landess. Reg By Lara Buchwald 08/24/21 Veritext LLC Court and VENDOR: Veritext LLC, INVOICE #: 5213309, \$1,623.71 related fees DATE: 8/24/2021: Transcriptions services for deposition of W. Kocovski 08/26/21 Court and Payee: Suchan, Ryan E., Veritext, 8/27/2021, \$27.60 related fees Transcript request for Cristina Rincon c/m: 01702-00003 08/31/21 Court and CourtAlert.com: B. Eng. D. Thomson: Court \$41.92 NYSD; Index No. 1:20-cv-05006; In Re: LSC related fees Communications. Inc.

DISBURSEMENT DETAIL Expense Amount Date **Vendor Name** Description Type Court and Pacer transactions 08/2021 \$3.60 08/31/21 related fees Court and Pacer transactions 08/2021 08/31/21 \$109.40 related fees 07/31/21 Consilio Inc Electronic VENDOR: Consilio Inc. INVOICE #: \$3.416.10 INV266866001, DATE: 7/31/2021 Davis Discovery Services Polk Grupo Aeromexcico Reg. by Cristina M. Rincon 08/03/21 SeamlessWeb delivery from Eden Wok to SZ \$20.00 Meals Szanzer at 17:09:11 08/09/21 Meals SeamlessWeb delivery from Mr. Broadway \$20.00 Kosher Restaurant to SZ Szanzer at 15:34:32 08/10/21 Meals SeamlessWeb delivery from Milk N Honey to \$20.00 SZ Szanzer at 12:42:38 08/16/21 SeamlessWeb delivery from Taam Tov \$20.00 Meals Restaurant to SZ Szanzer at 15:10:44 08/18/21 SeamlessWeb delivery from Eden Wok to SZ \$20.00 Meals Szanzer at 14:54:33 08/19/21 Meals SeamlessWeb delivery from Kosher Deluxe \$20.00 Restaurant to SZ Szanzer at 16:17:12 08/24/21 SeamlessWeb delivery from Kosher Deluxe \$20.00 Meals Restaurant to SZ Szanzer at 15:30:29 08/25/21 SeamlessWeb delivery from Milk N Honey to \$20.00 Meals SZ Szanzer at 13:36:52 08/26/21 Meals SeamlessWeb delivery from Eden Wok to SZ \$20.00 Szanzer at 13:15:18 SeamlessWeb delivery from Taam Tov 08/30/21 Meals \$20.00 Restaurant to SZ Szanzer at 16:00:31 SeamlessWeb delivery from Eden Wok to SZ 08/31/21 Meals \$20.00 Szanzer at 16:54:26 08/02/21 courtlink: US DOCKETS DOC ACCESS For \$0.28 Outside DAMIAN OSULLIVAN Documents

& Research

DISBURSEMENT DETAIL Expense Date Vendor Name Description Amount Type 08/02/21 Outside Restructuring Concepts/netDockets: [Disabled] \$3.27 **Documents** Damian O'Sullivan: 8/2/2021 2:45:00 PM: & Research Description: Downloaded G0157: Docket #954; Charge id: 362915 08/02/21 Restructuring Concepts/netDockets: [Disabled] Outside \$3.27 Damian O'Sullivan; 8/2/2021 2:48:00 PM; Documents & Research Description: Downloaded W0091: Docket #803; Charge id: 362917 08/02/21 Outside Restructuring Concepts/netDockets: [Disabled] \$5.44 Documents Damian O'Sullivan: 8/2/2021 2:45:00 PM: & Research Description: Single case search; Charge id: 362914 Restructuring Concepts/netDockets: [Disabled] 08/02/21 Outside \$5.44 Damian O'Sullivan; 8/2/2021 2:48:00 PM; **Documents** & Research Description: Single case search; Charge id: 362916 08/08/21 Outside Restructuring Concepts/netDockets: Moshe \$21.78 Melcer; 8/8/2021 10:28:00 PM; Description: **Documents** Multiple case search; Charge id: 363563 & Research 08/08/21 Restructuring Concepts/netDockets: Moshe \$3.27 Outside Melcer; 8/8/2021 10:29:00 PM; Description: **Documents** & Research Downloaded A0275: Docket #515; Charge id: 363564 08/08/21 Restructuring Concepts/netDockets: Moshe Outside \$21.78 Melcer; 8/8/2021 10:29:00 PM; Description: **Documents** & Research Multiple case search; Charge id: 363565 Restructuring Concepts/netDockets: Moshe 08/08/21 Outside \$3.27 Melcer; 8/8/2021 10:33:00 PM; Description: Documents & Research Downloaded G0157: Docket #52: Charge id: 363566 08/08/21 Outside Restructuring Concepts/netDockets: Moshe \$21.78 **Documents** Melcer: 8/8/2021 10:27:00 PM: Description: Multiple case search; Charge id: 363561 & Research 08/08/21 Outside Restructuring Concepts/netDockets: Moshe \$21.78 **Documents** Melcer; 8/8/2021 10:28:00 PM; Description: & Research Multiple case search; Charge id: 363562 08/08/21 Restructuring Concepts/netDockets: Moshe Outside \$21.78 **Documents** Melcer; 8/8/2021 10:26:00 PM; Description: Multiple case search; Charge id: 363559 & Research

DISBURSEMENT DETAIL Expense Date Vendor Name Description Amount Type Restructuring Concepts/netDockets: Moshe 08/08/21 Outside \$21.78 **Documents** Melcer: 8/8/2021 10:26:00 PM: Description: & Research Multiple case search; Charge id: 363560 08/10/21 Outside Restructuring Concepts/netDockets: Moshe \$21.78 Melcer; 8/10/2021 3:08:00 PM; Description: **Documents** & Research Multiple case search; Charge id: 363775 08/10/21 Restructuring Concepts/netDockets: Moshe \$21.78 Outside Melcer; 8/10/2021 3:08:00 PM; Description: **Documents** & Research Multiple case search; Charge id: 363776 08/11/21 Outside Restructuring Concepts/netDockets: Abraham \$5.44 **Documents** Bane; 8/11/2021 7:39:00 PM; Description: Single case search; Charge id: 363940 & Research 08/11/21 Outside Restructuring Concepts/netDockets: Abraham \$5.44 Documents Bane; 8/11/2021 6:14:00 PM; Description: & Research Single case search; Charge id: 363931 08/11/21 Outside Restructuring Concepts/netDockets: Abraham \$3.27 Bane; 8/11/2021 5:57:00 PM; Description: Documents Downloaded C0234: Docket #749; Charge id: & Research 363923 08/11/21 Restructuring Concepts/netDockets: Abraham Outside \$3.27 **Documents** Bane; 8/11/2021 5:18:00 PM; Description: Downloaded C0286: Docket #883 (Exhibit A); & Research Charge id: 363911 08/11/21 Restructuring Concepts/netDockets: Abraham Outside \$3.27 Bane; 8/11/2021 5:21:00 PM; Description: **Documents** & Research Downloaded D0071: Docket #704: Charge id: 363912 08/11/21 Outside Restructuring Concepts/netDockets: Abraham \$5.44 Bane; 8/11/2021 5:40:00 PM; Description: Documents Single case search; Charge id: 363913 & Research 08/11/21 Restructuring Concepts/netDockets: Abraham Outside \$5.44 **Documents** Bane; 8/11/2021 5:42:00 PM; Description: Single case search; Charge id: 363914 & Research 08/11/21 Outside Restructuring Concepts/netDockets: Abraham \$3.27 Bane; 8/11/2021 5:47:00 PM; Description: **Documents** & Research Downloaded C0286: Docket #921; Charge id: 363917 08/11/21 Outside Restructuring Concepts/netDockets: Abraham \$21.78 Bane: 8/11/2021 5:00:00 PM: Description: Documents & Research Multiple case search: Charge id: 363910

DISBURSEMENT DETAIL Expense Date Vendor Name Description Amount Type 08/11/21 Outside Restructuring Concepts/netDockets: Abraham \$3.27 **Documents** Bane: 8/11/2021 7:48:00 PM: Description: & Research Downloaded B0123: Docket #407; Charge id: 363942 08/11/21 Restructuring Concepts/netDockets: Abraham Outside \$3.27 Bane; 8/11/2021 7:50:00 PM; Description: **Documents** & Research Downloaded B0123: Docket #624; Charge id: 363943 08/11/21 Outside Restructuring Concepts/netDockets: Abraham \$3.27 Bane: 8/11/2021 6:20:00 PM: Description: Documents Downloaded S0251: Docket #336; Charge id: & Research 363933 08/11/21 Outside Restructuring Concepts/netDockets: Abraham \$3.27 Bane; 8/11/2021 6:21:00 PM; Description: **Documents** & Research Downloaded S0251: Docket #223; Charge id: 363934 08/11/21 Outside Restructuring Concepts/netDockets: Abraham \$5.44 Bane; 8/11/2021 6:26:00 PM; Description: **Documents** Single case search; Charge id: 363935 & Research 08/11/21 Restructuring Concepts/netDockets: Abraham \$3.27 Outside Bane; 8/11/2021 6:27:00 PM; Description: Documents & Research Downloaded G0144: Docket #512; Charge id: 363936 08/11/21 Restructuring Concepts/netDockets: Abraham Outside \$3.27 Bane; 8/11/2021 5:53:00 PM; Description: **Documents** Downloaded C0234: Docket #652; Charge id: & Research 363922 08/11/21 Outside Restructuring Concepts/netDockets: Abraham \$3.27 Bane: 8/11/2021 7:41:00 PM: Description: **Documents** & Research Downloaded B0123: Docket #591: Charge id: 363941 08/11/21 Outside Restructuring Concepts/netDockets: Abraham \$5.44 Bane: 8/11/2021 6:01:00 PM: Description: Documents Single case search; Charge id: 363924 & Research 08/11/21 Outside Restructuring Concepts/netDockets: Abraham \$3.27 **Documents** Bane: 8/11/2021 6:08:00 PM: Description: & Research Downloaded N0109: Docket #1070; Charge id: 363926 08/11/21 Restructuring Concepts/netDockets: Abraham Outside \$3.27 Bane; 8/11/2021 6:09:00 PM; Description: Documents Downloaded N0109: Docket #1069; Charge id: & Research 363927

DISBURSEMENT DETAIL Expense Date Vendor Name Description Amount Type Restructuring Concepts/netDockets: Abraham 08/11/21 Outside \$5.44 **Documents** Bane: 8/11/2021 6:13:00 PM: Description: & Research Single case search; Charge id: 363929 08/11/21 Outside Restructuring Concepts/netDockets: Abraham \$3.27 Bane; 8/11/2021 5:46:00 PM; Description: **Documents** Downloaded C0286: Docket #871; Charge id: & Research 363916 08/11/21 Restructuring Concepts/netDockets: Abraham Outside \$3.27 **Documents** Bane; 8/11/2021 6:15:00 PM; Description: & Research Downloaded S0251: Docket #440: Charge id: 363932 08/11/21 Outside Restructuring Concepts/netDockets: Abraham \$3.27 Bane; 8/11/2021 5:49:00 PM; Description: **Documents** Downloaded C0286: Docket #851 (Main & Research Document); Charge id: 363918 08/11/21 Outside Restructuring Concepts/netDockets: Abraham \$5.44 **Documents** Bane: 8/11/2021 5:49:00 PM: Description: & Research Single case search; Charge id: 363919 08/11/21 Outside Restructuring Concepts/netDockets: Abraham \$5.44 Bane; 8/11/2021 5:52:00 PM; Description: **Documents** & Research Single case search; Charge id: 363920 Restructuring Concepts/netDockets: Abraham 08/11/21 Outside \$3.27 Bane; 8/11/2021 5:52:00 PM; Description: **Documents** Downloaded C0234: Docket #182; Charge id: & Research 363921 08/16/21 Restructuring Concepts/netDockets: Stephen Outside \$5.44 Ford: 8/16/2021 10:24:00 AM: Description: Documents & Research Single case search; Charge id: 364538 08/16/21 Outside Restructuring Concepts/netDockets: Stephen \$3.27 Ford; 8/16/2021 9:48:00 AM; Description: **Documents** Downloaded S0095: Docket #14 (Main & Research Document); Charge id: 364531 Restructuring Concepts/netDockets: Stephen 08/16/21 Outside \$5.44 **Documents** Ford: 8/16/2021 9:47:00 AM: Description: & Research Single case search; Charge id: 364530 08/16/21 Outside Restructuring Concepts/netDockets: Stephen \$3.27 Ford; 8/16/2021 9:57:00 AM; Description: **Documents** & Research Downloaded S0095: Docket #239 (Main Document); Charge id: 364532

DISBURSEMENT DETAIL Expense Date Vendor Name Description Amount Type Restructuring Concepts/netDockets: Stephen 08/16/21 Outside \$3.27 **Documents** Ford; 8/16/2021 10:25:00 AM; Description: & Research Downloaded S0067: Docket #18 (Main Document); Charge id: 364539 08/17/21 Outside Restructuring Concepts/netDockets: Richard \$21.78 Steinberg; 8/17/2021 8:42:00 AM; Description: **Documents** & Research Multiple case search; Charge id: 364607 Restructuring Concepts/netDockets: Richard 08/17/21 \$21.78 Outside **Documents** Steinberg; 8/17/2021 8:43:00 AM; Description: Multiple case search: Charge id: 364608 & Research 08/17/21 Restructuring Concepts/netDockets: Richard Outside \$21.78 Steinberg; 8/17/2021 8:44:00 AM; Description: **Documents** Multiple case search; Charge id: 364609 & Research 08/17/21 Outside Restructuring Concepts/netDockets: Stephen \$5.44 Ford; 8/17/2021 10:55:00 AM; Description: **Documents** & Research Single case search; Charge id: 364622 08/17/21 Outside Restructuring Concepts/netDockets: Richard \$21.78 Steinberg; 8/17/2021 8:42:00 AM; Description: **Documents** & Research Multiple case search; Charge id: 364606 courtlink: SEARCH ACCESS CHARGE For 08/18/21 Outside \$4.04 **Documents** DAMIAN OSULLIVAN & Research 08/18/21 Outside Restructuring Concepts/netDockets: [Disabled] \$3.27 Damian O'Sullivan: 8/18/2021 8:45:00 PM: **Documents** Description: Downloaded M0129: Docket #854: & Research Charge id: 364892 08/18/21 Outside Restructuring Concepts/netDockets: [Disabled] \$3.27 **Documents** Damian O'Sullivan; 8/18/2021 8:46:00 PM; & Research Description: Downloaded T0087: Docket #3375; Charge id: 364893 08/18/21 Restructuring Concepts/netDockets: [Disabled] Outside \$21.78 **Documents** Damian O'Sullivan; 8/18/2021 8:39:00 PM; Description: Multiple case search; Charge id: & Research 364891 08/19/21 Outside Restructuring Concepts/netDockets: [Disabled] \$21.78 **Documents** Damian O'Sullivan; 8/19/2021 6:53:00 PM; Description: Multiple case search; Charge id: & Research 364996

DISBURSEMENT DETAIL Expense Date **Vendor Name** Description Amount Type Restructuring Concepts/netDockets: [Disabled] 08/19/21 Outside \$21.78 **Documents** Damian O'Sullivan: 8/19/2021 6:54:00 PM: & Research Description: Multiple case search; Charge id: 364998 Restructuring Concepts/netDockets: [Disabled] 08/19/21 Outside \$3.27 Damian O'Sullivan; 8/19/2021 6:56:00 PM; Documents & Research Description: Downloaded S0226: Docket #5330; Charge id: 364999 08/19/21 Outside Restructuring Concepts/netDockets: Moshe \$5.44 Documents Melcer; 8/19/2021 9:37:00 AM; Description: Single case search; Charge id: 364944 & Research 08/19/21 Outside Restructuring Concepts/netDockets: Moshe \$3.27 Melcer; 8/19/2021 9:42:00 AM; Description: **Documents** Downloaded F0016: Docket #889 (Appendix A & Research - Debtors' Joint Plan of Reorganization Under Chapter 11 of the): Charge id: 364946 08/19/21 Outside Restructuring Concepts/netDockets: [Disabled] \$5.44 Damian O'Sullivan; 8/19/2021 3:51:00 PM; Documents Description: Single case search; Charge id: & Research 364985 08/19/21 Outside Restructuring Concepts/netDockets: [Disabled] \$21.78 Documents Damian O'Sullivan; 8/19/2021 6:53:00 PM; & Research Description: Multiple case search; Charge id: 364994 08/19/21 Restructuring Concepts/netDockets: [Disabled] Outside \$21.78 Damian O'Sullivan; 8/19/2021 6:53:00 PM; **Documents** Description: Multiple case search; Charge id: & Research 364995 08/19/21 Outside Restructuring Concepts/netDockets: [Disabled] \$21.78 **Documents** Damian O'Sullivan: 8/19/2021 6:53:00 PM: Description: Multiple case search: Charge id: & Research 364997 08/19/21 Restructuring Concepts/netDockets: Moshe Outside \$5.44 **Documents** Melcer; 8/19/2021 9:08:00 AM; Description: & Research Single case search; Charge id: 364940 08/19/21 Outside Restructuring Concepts/netDockets: Moshe \$3.27 **Documents** Melcer; 8/19/2021 9:09:00 AM; Description: Downloaded S0095: Docket #239 (Exhibit A); & Research Charge id: 364941 08/19/21 Restructuring Concepts/netDockets: Moshe Outside \$5.44 Melcer; 8/19/2021 9:41:00 AM; Description: Documents Single case search; Charge id: 364945 & Research

DISBURSEMENT DETAIL Expense Date Vendor Name Description Amount Type Restructuring Concepts/netDockets: Moshe 08/20/21 Outside \$21.78 **Documents** Melcer: 8/20/2021 11:29:00 AM: Description: & Research Multiple case search; Charge id: 365069 08/20/21 Outside Restructuring Concepts/netDockets: Moshe \$21.78 Melcer; 8/20/2021 1:27:00 PM; Description: **Documents** Multiple case search; Charge id: 365085 & Research 08/22/21 Restructuring Concepts/netDockets: Mohini Outside \$3.27 Rarrick; 8/22/2021 5:07:00 PM; Description: **Documents** & Research Downloaded R0067: Docket #3814 (Exhibit 1 -Proposed Order): Charge id: 365185 08/22/21 Restructuring Concepts/netDockets: Mohini Outside \$21.78 Rarrick; 8/22/2021 4:45:00 PM; Description: **Documents** Multiple case search; Charge id: 365179 & Research 08/22/21 Outside Restructuring Concepts/netDockets: Mohini \$21.78 Rarrick; 8/22/2021 4:50:00 PM; Description: **Documents** & Research Multiple case search; Charge id: 365181 08/22/21 Outside Restructuring Concepts/netDockets: Mohini \$21.78 Rarrick; 8/22/2021 4:51:00 PM; Description: **Documents** & Research Multiple case search; Charge id: 365182 Restructuring Concepts/netDockets: Mohini 08/22/21 Outside \$21.78 **Documents** Rarrick; 8/22/2021 5:01:00 PM; Description: Multiple case search; Charge id: 365183 & Research 08/22/21 Outside Restructuring Concepts/netDockets: Mohini \$3.27 Rarrick: 8/22/2021 5:07:00 PM: Description: **Documents** Downloaded R0067: Docket #3814 (Main & Research Document); Charge id: 365184 08/22/21 Outside Restructuring Concepts/netDockets: Mohini \$21.78 **Documents** Rarrick; 8/22/2021 3:38:00 PM; Description: Multiple case search; Charge id: 365173 & Research 08/22/21 Outside Restructuring Concepts/netDockets: Mohini \$21.78 Rarrick; 8/22/2021 5:15:00 PM; Description: **Documents** & Research Multiple case search; Charge id: 365186 08/22/21 Outside Restructuring Concepts/netDockets: Mohini \$21.78 Rarrick; 8/22/2021 3:39:00 PM; Description: **Documents** & Research Multiple case search; Charge id: 365175 08/22/21 Outside Restructuring Concepts/netDockets: Mohini \$3.27 Documents Rarrick: 8/22/2021 3:39:00 PM: Description: & Research Downloaded W0021: Docket #2307 (Main Document): Charge id: 365176

DISBURSEMENT DETAIL Expense Date Vendor Name Description Amount Type Restructuring Concepts/netDockets: Mohini 08/22/21 Outside \$21.78 **Documents** Rarrick: 8/22/2021 3:41:00 PM: Description: & Research Multiple case search; Charge id: 365177 08/22/21 Outside Restructuring Concepts/netDockets: Mohini \$21.78 Rarrick; 8/22/2021 3:46:00 PM; Description: **Documents** Multiple case search; Charge id: 365178 & Research 08/22/21 Restructuring Concepts/netDockets: Mohini \$21.78 Outside Rarrick; 8/22/2021 3:38:00 PM; Description: **Documents** & Research Multiple case search; Charge id: 365174 08/22/21 Outside Restructuring Concepts/netDockets: Mohini \$21.78 **Documents** Rarrick; 8/22/2021 4:47:00 PM; Description: Multiple case search; Charge id: 365180 & Research 08/23/21 Outside Restructuring Concepts/netDockets: [Disabled] \$21.78 **Documents** Damian O'Sullivan; 8/23/2021 4:04:00 PM; Description: Multiple case search; Charge id: & Research 365259 08/23/21 Outside Restructuring Concepts/netDockets: [Disabled] \$21.78 Damian O'Sullivan; 8/23/2021 4:04:00 PM; **Documents** & Research Description: Multiple case search; Charge id: 365260 08/23/21 Outside Restructuring Concepts/netDockets: [Disabled] \$21.78 Damian O'Sullivan; 8/23/2021 4:33:00 PM; **Documents** & Research Description: Multiple case search; Charge id: 365262 08/23/21 Outside Restructuring Concepts/netDockets: [Disabled] \$3.27 Documents Damian O'Sullivan; 8/23/2021 4:35:00 PM; & Research Description: Downloaded R0112: Docket #40: Charge id: 365264 08/23/21 Outside Restructuring Concepts/netDockets: [Disabled] \$21.78 Damian O'Sullivan; 8/23/2021 2:09:00 PM; Documents Description: Multiple case search; Charge id: & Research 365249 Restructuring Concepts/netDockets: [Disabled] 08/23/21 Outside \$21.78 **Documents** Damian O'Sullivan: 8/23/2021 3:03:00 PM: & Research Description: Multiple case search; Charge id: 365252 08/23/21 Restructuring Concepts/netDockets: [Disabled] Outside \$21.78 Damian O'Sullivan; 8/23/2021 3:04:00 PM; **Documents** & Research Description: Multiple case search; Charge id: 365253

DISBURSEMENT DETAIL Expense Amount Date **Vendor Name** Description Type Restructuring Concepts/netDockets: [Disabled] 08/23/21 Outside \$21.78 **Documents** Damian O'Sullivan: 8/23/2021 3:04:00 PM: & Research Description: Multiple case search; Charge id: 365254 08/23/21 Restructuring Concepts/netDockets: [Disabled] Outside \$21.78 Damian O'Sullivan; 8/23/2021 3:55:00 PM; Documents & Research Description: Multiple case search; Charge id: 365256 08/23/21 Outside Restructuring Concepts/netDockets: [Disabled] \$3.27 Documents Damian O'Sullivan: 8/23/2021 1:54:00 PM: Description: Downloaded A0242: Docket #200; & Research Charge id: 365243 Restructuring Concepts/netDockets: [Disabled] 08/23/21 Outside \$21.78 Damian O'Sullivan; 8/23/2021 3:56:00 PM; **Documents** & Research Description: Multiple case search; Charge id: 365258 08/23/21 Outside Restructuring Concepts/netDockets: [Disabled] \$21.78 Damian O'Sullivan; 8/23/2021 2:04:00 PM; Documents Description: Multiple case search; Charge id: & Research 365245 Restructuring Concepts/netDockets: [Disabled] 08/23/21 Outside \$21.78 Documents Damian O'Sullivan; 8/23/2021 2:05:00 PM; & Research Description: Multiple case search; Charge id: 365246 08/23/21 Restructuring Concepts/netDockets: [Disabled] Outside \$21.78 Damian O'Sullivan; 8/23/2021 2:06:00 PM; **Documents** & Research Description: Multiple case search; Charge id: 365247 08/23/21 Outside Restructuring Concepts/netDockets: [Disabled] \$21.78 **Documents** Damian O'Sullivan: 8/23/2021 2:06:00 PM: & Research Description: Multiple case search: Charge id: 365248 08/23/21 Restructuring Concepts/netDockets: [Disabled] Outside \$21.78 Damian O'Sullivan; 8/23/2021 3:02:00 PM; **Documents** & Research Description: Multiple case search; Charge id: 365251 \$21.78 08/23/21 Outside Restructuring Concepts/netDockets: [Disabled] Damian O'Sullivan; 8/23/2021 3:55:00 PM; **Documents** & Research Description: Multiple case search; Charge id: 365257

DISBURSEMENT DETAIL Expense Date **Vendor Name** Description Amount Type Restructuring Concepts/netDockets: [Disabled] 08/23/21 Outside \$21.78 **Documents** Damian O'Sullivan: 8/23/2021 1:46:00 PM: & Research Description: Multiple case search; Charge id: 365241 Restructuring Concepts/netDockets: [Disabled] 08/23/21 Outside \$21.78 Damian O'Sullivan; 8/23/2021 1:51:00 PM; Documents & Research Description: Multiple case search; Charge id: 365242 08/23/21 Outside Restructuring Concepts/netDockets: [Disabled] \$21.78 Documents Damian O'Sullivan: 8/23/2021 1:55:00 PM: Description: Multiple case search; Charge id: & Research 365244 08/24/21 Outside Restructuring Concepts/netDockets: [Disabled] \$3.27 Damian O'Sullivan; 8/24/2021 5:52:00 AM; **Documents** & Research Description: Downloaded F0030: Docket #154 (Exhibit C - Indemnity Agreement); Charge id: 365300 08/24/21 Outside Restructuring Concepts/netDockets: [Disabled] \$3.27 Damian O'Sullivan: 8/24/2021 6:07:00 AM: **Documents** & Research Description: Downloaded H0016: Docket #1217 (Exhibit Form Management Indemnity Agreement); Charge id: 365308 08/24/21 Outside Restructuring Concepts/netDockets: [Disabled] \$3.27 **Documents** Damian O'Sullivan; 8/24/2021 5:53:00 AM; & Research Description: Downloaded G0031: Docket #5306 (Main Document); Charge id: 365302 Restructuring Concepts/netDockets: [Disabled] 08/24/21 Outside \$21.78 **Documents** Damian O'Sullivan; 8/24/2021 5:55:00 AM; & Research Description: Multiple case search; Charge id: 365303 08/24/21 Outside Restructuring Concepts/netDockets: [Disabled] \$3.27 **Documents** Damian O'Sullivan; 8/24/2021 6:04:00 AM; & Research Description: Downloaded H0016: Docket #1217 (Exhibit Amended and Restated Schedule 6.1(a)(x) - Assumed Contracts); Charge id: 365306 08/24/21 Outside Restructuring Concepts/netDockets: [Disabled] \$3.27 **Documents** Damian O'Sullivan; 8/24/2021 6:06:00 AM; Description: Downloaded H0016: Docket & Research #1217 (Main Document): Charge id: 365307

DISBURSEMENT DETAIL Expense Date **Vendor Name** Description Amount Type 08/24/21 Restructuring Concepts/netDockets: [Disabled] Outside \$21.78 **Documents** Damian O'Sullivan; 8/24/2021 5:49:00 AM; & Research Description: Multiple case search; Charge id: 365297 08/31/21 Outside Restructuring Concepts/netDockets: Moshe \$21.78 Melcer; 8/31/2021 10:13:00 AM; Description: **Documents** & Research Multiple case search; Charge id: 365945 04/24/21 From Davis Polk Office to US Trustee \$47.76 Postage, courier & freight 04/24/21 From Davis Polk Office to Judge Chapman \$58.11 Postage, courier & freight \$23.00 08/16/21 Postage, From Matthew Bruno Masaro to Andrea B. courier & Schwartz freight 08/23/21 Postage, From Magali Giddens to Mark Auriema \$32.07 courier & freight 08/23/21 Postage, From Olivia Altman to CLERK'S OFFICE \$54.37 courier & (Intake)/US BANKRUPTCY COURT/ONE freight **BOWLING GREEN/NEW YORK NY 10004** 08/03/21 Travel Payee: Szanzer, Steven Z., OT 8:49 PM, Uber \$61.70 Travel Payee: Szanzer, Steven Z., OT 12:14 AM \$59.87 08/05/21 08/09/21 Travel Payee: Szanzer, Steven Z., OT 10:22 PM, \$61.55 Uber 08/10/21 Payee: Szanzer, Steven Z., OT 8:54 PM \$78.78 Travel Payee: Szanzer, Steven Z., OT 8:45 PM 08/24/21 Travel \$65.13 08/30/21 Travel Payee: Szanzer, Steven Z., OT 10:12 PM \$52.70 08/31/21 Travel Payee: Szanzer, Steven Z., OT 9:37 PM \$64.05 **TOTAL** \$13,520.05

		Time	Detail By Project
Name	Date	Hours	Narrative
AM100 Aircraft/Engin	es		
Dekhtyar, Mariya	09/01/21	3.2	Email with P. Garg regarding aircraft leases research (0.3); correspondence with same regarding same (0.1); review and summarize assumed, rejected, and amended aircraft contract leases (2.8).
Garg, Paavani	09/01/21	0.1	Correspondence with Davis Polk Fleet team regarding fleet workstreams.
Green, Thomas S. Melcer, Moshe	09/01/21 09/01/21	2.0 2.8	Review and revise DBV stipulation. Review and revise motion to approve aircraft transactions (0.6); draft Certificate of No Objection to CAE (0.4); draft Certificate of No Objection to CAE sealing motion (0.3); email with T. Graulich regarding same (0.1); email with Chambers regarding same (0.3); call with White & Case regarding aircraft transaction (0.1); call with Akin Gump regarding motion to approve aircraft transactions (0.2); call with Clifford Chance regarding same (0.2); correspondence with S. Szanzer regarding same (0.2); draft Certificate of No Objection to SMBC (0.2); draft Certificate of No Objection to SMBC sealing motion (0.2).
Piraino, Stephen D.	09/01/21	0.8	Call with Cleary Gottlieb and others regarding JOLCOs assumption motion (0.5); review and revise Non-Disclosure Agreement (0.3).
Steinberg, Richard J.	09/01/21	3.6	Revise Ex-Im pleadings (2.5); email with Vedder Price, White & Case, and Skyworks regarding same (0.3); email with AlixPartners regarding same (0.2); call with White & Case regarding indenture trustee under Ex-Im facilities (0.2); correspondence with S. Szanzer regarding Ex-Im (0.4).
Szanzer, Steven Z.	09/01/21	6.4	Correspondence with M. Melcer regarding Avolon (0.3); correspondence with White & Case regarding same (0.3); review emails regarding JOLCOs assumption motion (0.5); correspondence with T. Green and White & Case regarding SAEL (0.2); correspondence with B. Thorsness regarding Exlm motion (0.2); review and revise same (0.8); correspondence with R. Steinberg regarding same (0.8); review and consider J. Craine's comments to Ex-Im declaration (0.2); correspondence with R. Steinberg regarding same (0.3); correspondence with J. Craine regarding same (0.2); review and revise Certificate of No Objection to CAE (0.7); correspondence with M. Melcer and T. Graulich regarding same (0.6); correspondence with L. Buchwald and M. Landess regarding aircraft acquisition motions (0.4); review and revise SMBC assumption order (0.5); correspondence with R. Johnson and M. Melcer regarding same (0.4).
Szanzer, Steven Z.	09/01/21	5.3	Correspondence with T. Green, A. Troconis, S. Piraino, and M. Landess regarding DAE consent (0.3); review emails regarding Ex-Im omnibus agreements (0.3); correspondence with AlixPartners and R. Steinberg regarding Ex-Im motion (0.2); review and revise Ex-Im sealing motion (0.5); correspondence with R. Steinberg regarding same (0.5); correspondence with R. Steinberg regarding indenture trustee claim (0.3); correspondence with C. Wallace and S. Piraino regarding JOLCOs assumption motion (0.5); correspondence with Skyworks regarding simulator issue (0.2); correspondence with M. Landess regarding Wings (0.1); correspondence with T. Green regarding BBAM (0.1); review 3

		Time	Detail By Project
Name	Date	Hours	Narrative
			and revise Chorus motion (1.5); review Certificate of No Objection to SMBC (0.2); correspondence with M. Melcer regarding same (0.2); correspondence with R. Steinberg and M. Melcer regarding settlement motions (0.4).
Dekhtyar, Mariya	09/02/21	5.0	Review and summarize assumed, rejected, and amended aircraft leases (4.8); email with P. Garg regarding same (0.2).
Garg, Paavani	09/02/21	0.8	Correspondence with T. Green and S. Piraino regarding fleet workstreams.
Graulich, Timothy	09/02/21	0.5	Call with M. Landess regarding MAX planes and related motion (0.5)
Melcer, Moshe	09/02/21	5.0	Draft motion to approve aircraft claims settlement (1.1); revise Certificate of No Objection to SMBC (0.2); revise Certificate of No Objection to SMBC sealing motion (0.2); email with Chambers regarding Certificate of No Objections (0.4); email with Clifford Chance regarding same (0.1); email with T. Graulich regarding same (0.1); revise fleet status summary (0.3); correspondence with T. Green regarding same (0.2); correspondence with S. Szanzer regarding same (0.1); call with Skyworks and AlixPartners regarding equipment lease (0.4); revise claims settlement motion (0.6); correspondence with R. Steinberg regarding same (0.1); call with Davis Polk team and advisors regarding fleet workstreams (0.6); correspondence with S. Szanzer regarding same (0.1); call with White & Case regarding fleet workstreams (0.5).
Piraino, Stephen D.	09/02/21	1.2	Correspondence with S. Szanzer, M. Melcer and co-advisors regarding lease (0.5); call with P. Garg and others regarding fleet workstreams (0.7).
Steinberg, Richard J.	09/02/21	1.9	Email with White & Case, Skyworks, and AlixPartners regarding Ex-Im pleadings (0.3); correspondence with Chambers regarding same (0.1); revise Ex-Im pleadings (0.3); email with Vedder Price regarding Ex-Im motion (0.1); email with Cleary Gottlieb regarding same (0.1); review and revise BBAM motion (0.5); review and revise Carlyle motion (0.5).
Szanzer, Steven Z.	09/02/21	8.5	Correspondence with Skyworks and AlixPartners regarding Avenger simulator (0.5); correspondence with M. Landess regarding JOLCO issues (0.5); review and revise DVB/MUFG stipulation (0.7); correspondence with T. Green regarding same (0.6); correspondence with White & Case regarding same (0.1); correspondence with P. Garg regarding fleet research (0.3); correspondence with M. Melcer regarding Certificate of No Objection to SMBC (0.3); correspondence with Akin Gump and T. Graulich regarding same (0.5); prepare for call regarding MAXs (0.1); correspondence with Skyworks, White & Case, and Davis Polk Litigation team regarding MAXs and JOLCOs (1.1); correspondence with M. Melcer regarding same (0.2); correspondence with J. Craine regarding Ex-Im motion (0.4); correspondence with T. Green regarding BBAM (0.2); correspondence with White & Case regarding Sierra Echo motion (0.3); correspondence with M. Melcer regarding same (0.2); review and revise Fly Leasing motion (0.9); correspondence with M. Melcer regarding same (0.9); correspondence with White & Case regarding Ex-Im redactions (0.2); correspondence with White & Case regarding Ex-Im redactions (0.2); correspondence with Same regarding Ex-Im redactions (0.2); correspondence with Same regarding
Dekhtyar, Mariya	09/03/21	7.7	JOLCOs (0.1). Extensive research and summarize assumed, rejected, and

		Time	Detail By Project
Name	Date	Hours	Narrative
Garg, Paavani Melcer, Moshe	09/03/21 09/03/21	0.7 3.1	amended aircraft contract leases and precedent related to same (7.4); email with P. Garg regarding same (0.3). Call with M. Melcer and others regarding fleet workstreams. Call with P. Garg and others regarding fleet workstreams (0.7); correspondence with S. Szanzer regarding same (0.2); correspondence with same and M. Landess regarding aircraft negotiations (0.1); revise fleet status summary (0.3); email with Clifford Chance regarding SMBC (0.1); review SMBC order (0.1); review and revise motion to approve aircraft transactions (0.6); review and revise Ex-Im filings (0.5); email with Chambers regarding same (0.2); email with creditor
Steinberg, Richard J.	09/03/21	1.5	groups regarding same (0.3). Revise Ex-Im Motion and related pleadings (1.1); email with White & Case, Skyworks, and Vedder Price regarding same (0.3); correspondence with S. Szanzer regarding same (0.1).
Szanzer, Steven Z.	09/03/21	5.9	Correspondence with A. Andreeva and R. Steinberg regarding Ex-Im issues (0.6); correspondence with C. Hansen regarding same (0.6); correspondence with White & Case regarding Ex-Im omnibus amendment agreement (0.2); review SMBC orders (0.2); review emails regarding same (0.1); correspondence with M. Melcer regarding NAC (0.1); correspondence with M. Melcer and M. Landess regarding BBAM and JOLCO (0.6); finalize Ex-Im pleadings for filing (2.5); correspondence with L. Buchwald and M. Melcer regarding acquisition pleadings (0.5); correspondence with M. Melcer regarding fleet workstreams (0.5).
Melcer, Moshe	09/04/21	1.0	Review and revise motion to approve aircraft transactions.
Steinberg, Richard J.	09/04/21	0.1	Email with counsel to potential exit financing provider regarding Ex-Im motion.
Melcer, Moshe	09/05/21	5.8	Review and revise motion to approve aircraft transactions (2.3); draft sealing motion regarding same (1.3); draft declaration regarding same (1.5); correspondence with S. Szanzer regarding same (0.6); revise fleet status summary (0.1).
Melcer, Moshe	09/06/21	1.6	Review and revise motion to approve aircraft transactions (1.2); correspondence with S. Szanzer regarding same (0.1); email with co-advisors regarding same (0.1); revise fleet status summary (0.2).
Szanzer, Steven Z.	09/06/21	5.1	Review Chorus motion (0.3); correspondence with M. Melcer regarding same (0.3); review revised Sierra Echo motion (0.4); correspondence with M. Melcer regarding same (0.3); review revised Wings motion (0.3); correspondence with M. Melcer regarding same (0.2); review and revise ALC motion (1.3); correspondence with M. Melcer regarding same (1.2); review emails regarding same (0.2); review emails regarding JOLCOs (0.3); review emails regarding BBAM (0.2); correspondence with Skyworks regarding Carlyle motion (0.1).
Garg, Paavani	09/07/21	1.4	Review Cape Town convention articles (0.4); correspondence with S. Massman regarding same (0.4); review assumption and assignment motions (0.6).
Graulich, Timothy	09/07/21	4.6	Call with JOLCO parties regarding assumption motion (0.8); call with Skyworks and S. Piraino regarding same (0.6); review JOLCO agreements (3.2).
Piraino, Stephen D.	09/07/21	1.4	Call with JOLCO parties regarding assumption motion (0.8); call with Skyworks and T. Graulich regarding same (0.6).
Garg, Paavani	09/08/21	0.8	Correspondence with S. Piraino regarding JOLCO assumption 5

		Time	Detail By Project
Name	Date	Hours	Narrative
Melcer, Moshe	09/08/21	0.5	motion (0.1); correspondence with P. Garg regarding same (0.1); revise claims settlement motion (0.6). Call with S. Piraino regarding JOLCO assumption motion (0.1); call with P. Garg regarding same (0.1); revise claims
Piraino, Stephen D. Steinberg, Richard J.	09/08/21 09/08/21	0.1 1.8	settlement motion (0.3). Call with M. Melcer regarding JOLCO assumption motion. Review Ex-Im proposed order received from indenture trustee (0.8); review precedent regarding same (0.7); email with
Garg, Paavani	09/09/21	2.3	O'Melveny & Myers regarding fleet issues (0.3). Review Cape Town convention precedent (0.9); correspondence with Davis Polk Fleet team regarding aircraft assumption and assignment motions (0.5); call with White &
Melcer, Moshe	09/09/21	5.0	Case regarding fleet workstreams (0.9). Call with White & Case regarding fleet workstreams (0.8); revise fleet status summary (0.3); revise motion to approve aircraft transactions (0.3); correspondence with S. Szanzer and S. Piraino regarding assumption analysis (0.5); correspondence with S. Szanzer regarding outstanding fleet workstreams (0.4); call with Skyworks regarding fleet issues (0.4); review and revise claims settlement motion (0.6); review and revise motion to approve aircraft transactions (1.3); correspondence with S. Szanzer regarding upcoming motions (0.4).
Piraino, Stephen D. Steinberg, Richard J.	09/09/21 09/09/21	0.9 1.8	Correspondence with S. Szanzer regarding JOLCOs. Communication with White & Case regarding revised Ex-Im proposed order (0.4); call with S. Szanzer regarding same (0.3); revise Ex-Im proposed order (0.3); call with Aeroméxico regarding Embraer agreements (0.4); call with White & Case and Skyworks regarding fleet workstreams (0.4).
Szanzer, Steven Z.	09/09/21	5.1	Correspondence with White & Case and Skyworks regarding JOLCO assumption motion (0.6); correspondence with S. Piraino and M. Melcer regarding same (0.5); review and revise email regarding same (0.9); correspondence with S. Piraino regarding same (0.2); correspondence with M. Melcer regarding same (0.2); correspondence with R. Steinberg regarding Embraer and Ex-Im (0.5); correspondence with Aeroméxico team regarding Embraer (0.6); correspondence with M. Melcer regarding Aircastle (0.2); correspondence with C. Dietz regarding same (0.1); review and consider comments to Ex-Im order (0.2); correspondence with R. Steinberg regarding same (0.3); correspondence with White & Case regarding same (0.3); review and revise same (0.2); correspondence with White & Case regarding Flight Safety
Szanzer, Steven Z.	09/09/21	5.5	simulators (0.3). Review and revise Fly Leasing motion (0.5); correspondence with M. Melcer regarding same (0.3); correspondence with R. Steinberg regarding same (0.2); correspondence with White & Case and Skyworks regarding same (0.3); review and consider comments to SMBC acquisition motion (0.3); correspondence with M. Melcer regarding same (0.3); correspondence with Skyworks and White & Case regarding Chorus motion (0.4); review fleet status summary (0.2); call with White & Case regarding fleet workstreams (0.9); correspondence with same and M. Melcer regarding ALC motion (0.3); correspondence with White & Case and Skyworks regarding Wings motion (0.3); correspondence with

		Time	Detail By Project
Name	Date	Hours	Narrative
			M. Melcer and White & Case regarding Total Engine Asset Management ("TEAM") (0.5); correspondence with White & Case and Skyworks regarding ALC motion (0.3); correspondence with M. Melcer regarding same (0.2); review and revise DVB/MUFG stipulation (0.3); correspondence with Linklaters regarding same (0.2).
Garg, Paavani	09/10/21	0.6	Correspondence with Davis Polk Fleet team regarding aircraft assumption motions (0.3); review Cape Town convention precedents (0.3).
Graulich, Timothy	09/10/21	0.8	Call with M. Landess regarding JOLCO assumption.
Melcer, Moshe	09/10/21	5.7	Review and revise motion to approve aircraft transaction (0.6); draft sealing motion regarding same (0.9); draft declaration regarding same (1.7); correspondence with S. Szanzer regarding same (0.3); review and revise motion to approve aircraft transactions (0.8); call with Skyworks and White & Case teams regarding aircraft assumption motion (0.8); correspondence with S. Szanzer regarding outstanding fleet workstreams (0.3); revise fleet status summary (0.3).
Steinberg, Richard J.	09/10/21	0.7	Revise Ex-Im proposed order (0.5); correspondence with S. Szanzer regarding same (0.2).
Szanzer, Steven Z.	09/10/21	7.4	Review emails regarding JOLCO assumptions (0.3); correspondence with White & Case and Skyworks regarding same (0.8); correspondence with Skyworks regarding ALC analysis (0.2); correspondence with R. Steinberg regarding Ex-Im order (0.4); correspondence with White & Case and O'Melveny & Myers regarding same (0.4); review and revise ALC motion (0.4); correspondence with M. Melcer regarding same (0.4); correspondence with L. Crowley, White & Case, and Skyworks regarding same (0.3); review comments to ALC motion (0.2); correspondence with M. Melcer regarding same (0.2); correspondence with White & Case regarding same (0.2); correspondence with M. Melcer regarding MPS (0.2); correspondence with M. Melcer regarding same (0.1); correspondence with White & Case regarding same (0.2); correspondence with White & Case regarding same (0.2); correspondence with Skyworks regarding Chorus (0.1); review and revise ALC sealing motion (0.9); review and revise declaration regarding same (1.0); correspondence with M. Melcer regarding same with M. Melcer regarding same (0.9).
Melcer, Moshe	09/11/21	1.4	Draft motion to approve equipment transaction (0.9); revise motion to approve aircraft transaction (0.4); email with Skyworks regarding same (0.1).
Garg, Paavani	09/12/21	0.3	Correspondence with Davis Poll Fleet team regarding aircraft assumption motions.
Melcer, Moshe	09/12/21	2.9	Draft motion to approve equipment transaction (0.9); review and revise motion to approve aircraft transaction (0.4); review and revise declaration regarding same (0.8); correspondence with S. Szanzer regarding same (0.5); email with Skyworks and White & Case regarding same (0.3).
Steinberg, Richard J. Szanzer, Steven Z.	09/12/21 09/12/21	0.2 3.4	Email with White & Case regarding Ex-Im proposed order. Review and consider comments to ALC motion (1.2); correspondence with M. Melcer regarding same (0.7); correspondence with Davis Polk Fleet team regarding same (0.3); correspondence with M. Melcer regarding TEAM (0.3); correspondence with White & Case regarding MPS (0.1); correspondence with M. Melcer regarding same (0.1); review

		Time	Detail By Project
Name	Date	Hours	Narrative
Garg, Paavani Melcer, Moshe	09/13/21 09/13/21	0.6 7.8	emails regarding JOLCOs (0.3); correspondence with R. Steinberg regarding Ex-Im order (0.2); correspondence with White & Case regarding same (0.2). Review Cape Town convention. Call with Clifford Chance regarding aircraft rejection motion (0.1); call with Clifford Chance and Vedder Price regarding same (0.3); revise order related to same (0.6); correspondence with S. Szanzer regarding same (0.1); email Chambers regarding same (0.2); review and revise motion to approve aircraft transactions (3.7); call with Skyworks regarding same (0.2); correspondence with S. Szanzer regarding same (0.2); review and revise declaration in support
			of motion to approve aircraft transactions (1.2); review and revise sealing motion regarding same (0.1); email with Chambers regarding same (0.3); correspondence with S. Szanzer regarding same (0.2); correspondence with S. Szanzer regarding outstanding fleet workstreams (0.6).
Szanzer, Steven Z.	09/13/21	6.1	Review and consider comments declaration in support of ALC motion (0.4); review and revise same (0.7); correspondence with M. Melcer regarding same (0.6); correspondence with same regarding scheduling hearing for ALC motion (0.2); correspondence with Davis Polk Fleet team regarding same (0.2); correspondence with R. Johnson, M. Edelman, and M. Melcer regarding JOLCO rejection order (1.2); review and consider comments to same (0.3); review and revise same (0.5); correspondence with White & Case and Skyworks regarding same (0.3); correspondence with Davis Polk Fleet team regarding same (0.3); correspondence with White & Case regarding Fly Leasing (0.3); correspondence with M. Landess and P. Garg regarding JOLCOs (0.5); correspondence with M. Melcer regarding True Noord (0.2); correspondence with M. Melcer regarding True Noord (0.2);
Szanzer, Steven Z.	09/13/21	7.2	correspondence with White & Case regarding same (0.2). Correspondence with R. Steinberg and G. Olivera regarding Ex-Im order (0.1); review and revise ALC documents (0.6); correspondence with White & Case and Skyworks regarding same (0.3); correspondence with M. Melcer regarding same (0.2); review and revise TEAM motion (1.3); correspondence with T. Wolynski and M. Melcer regarding same (1.3); review and revise Chorus motion (0.2); correspondence with M. Melcer regarding same (0.2); correspondence with White & Case regarding same (0.2); correspondence with White & Case regarding same (0.1); correspondence with T. Green regarding BBAM (0.2); correspondence with White & Case regarding same (0.1); correspondence with S. Subramaniam regarding JOLCOs (0.5); correspondence with S. Piraino regarding same (0.2); correspondence with same regarding NBB (0.5); call with M. Brod regarding same (0.5); correspondence with M. Melcer regarding motion for same (0.5).
Garg, Paavani	09/14/21	0.6	Correspondence with S. Szanzer regarding Cape Town convention (0.1); review same (0.5).
Melcer, Moshe	09/14/21	6.1	Review and revise proposed aircraft rejection order (0.2); draft Certificate of No Objection to same (0.3); draft Certificate of No Objection to Clover motion (0.3); correspondence with S.

		Time	Detail By Project
Name	Date	Hours	Narrative
			Szanzer and Skyworks regarding fleet issue (0.5); review and revise motion to approve aircraft transactions (1.1); review sealing motion regarding same (0.1); review and revise declaration regarding same (0.7); correspondence with S. Szanzer regarding same (0.4); correspondence with E. Jerrard regarding same (0.2); review and revise motion to approve equipment transaction (1.0); call with Skyworks regarding fleet issue (0.2); correspondence with S. Szanzer regarding same (0.1); correspondence with S. Szanzer regarding same and regarding outstanding fleet workstreams (0.4); call with Clifford Chance and S. Szanzer regarding motion to approve aircraft transactions (0.3); correspondence with S. Szanzer regarding
Steinberg, Richard J. Szanzer, Steven Z.	09/14/21 09/14/21	0.4 7.3	upcoming hearing on fleet issues (0.3). Email with Aeroméxico regarding response to HSBC. Correspondence with R. Steinberg, M. Melcer, and Skyworks regarding ELF (0.2); review and consider comments to JOLCO rejection order (0.2); correspondence with M. Edelman, R. Johnson, and M. Melcer regarding same (0.7); review and revise Certificate of No Objection to same (0.3); correspondence with M. Melcer regarding same (0.2); review and consider comments to ALC documents (0.9); correspondence with L. Crowley, Skyworks, and White & Case regarding same (0.5); correspondence with M. Melcer regarding same (0.5); correspondence with M. Melcer regarding Jupiter motion (1.3); review and revise same (1.4); correspondence with R. Johnson regarding Yamasa(0.3); correspondence with White & Case and Skyworks regarding same (0.3); review and revise order for same (0.5).
Szanzer, Steven Z.	09/14/21	4.8	Call with Clifford Chance and M. Melcer regarding motion to approve aircraft transactions (0.3); prepare for same (0.1); correspondence with M. Melcer regarding same (0.2); review and revise Certificates of No Objection to Ex-Im (0.4); correspondence with R. Steinberg regarding same (0.4); correspondence with R. Steinberg and White & Case regarding Ex-Im redactions (0.3); correspondence with White & Case and Pillsbury regarding ALC redactions (0.2); review JA Mitsui termination notice (0.4); correspondence with T. Graulich, P. Garg, and M. Melcer regarding same (0.4); review and revise Certificate of No Objection to Clover (0.2); correspondence with M. Melcer regarding same (0.2); correspondence with M. Melcer regarding fleet workstreams (0.5); correspondence with same regarding MPS (0.6); and review and revise MPS motion (0.6).
Garg, Paavani	09/15/21	0.9	Call with White & Case regarding fleet workstreams (0.6); correspondence with S. Szanzer regarding assumption motion (0.3).
Graulich, Timothy Melcer, Moshe	09/15/21 09/15/21	0.5 1.8	Call with M. Landess regarding JOLCO assumption motion. Review revised lease agreement (0.1); correspondence with P. Garg regarding Certificates of No Objection to JA Mitsui (0.1); revise Certificates of No Objection to Clover and aircraft rejection motions (0.2); revise motion to approve equipment transaction (0.3); correspondence with S. Szanzer and Skyworks regarding assumption motion (0.7); review revised draft to motion to approve aircraft transactions (0.2); correspondence with S. Szanzer regarding same (0.2).
Szanzer, Steven Z.	09/15/21	8.2	Correspondence with M. Melcer regarding ALC documents

		Time	Detail By Project
Name	Date	Hours	Narrative
Garg, Paavani	09/16/21	3.1	(0.3); correspondence with M. Landess, L. Crowley, and White & Case regarding same (0.2); correspondence with S. Subramaniam regarding JA Mitsui (0.5); correspondence with Skyworks regarding JOLCOs (0.8); correspondence with White & Case and G. Olivera regarding Ex-Im order (0.3); review and consider revised draft of Yamasa amended lease (0.5); correspondence with White & Case regarding same (0.5); correspondence with White & Case regarding Jupiter motion (0.3); correspondence with M. Melcer regarding same (0.2); review and revise MPS motion (0.9); correspondence with M. Melcer regarding same (0.8); review and consider JA Mitsui stipulation and termination notice (1.0); correspondence with P. Garg regarding same (0.6); email with White & Case regarding same (0.3); correspondence with Skyworks and T. Graulich regarding JA Mitsui (0.3); finalize Certificates of No Objection to Clover and SMBC motions (0.3); review and consider comments to Wings motion (0.2); correspondence with M. Melcer and S. Campbell regarding same (0.2). Review stipulation and termination notice for JOLCOs.
Green, Thomas S. Jerrard, Erik	09/16/21 09/16/21 09/16/21	7.6 0.7	Analyze JA Mitsui documents and pleadings. Call with counsel to aircraft lease counterparty regarding assumption motion (0.2); email with S. Szanzer regarding same (0.3); correspondence with counsel to aircraft counterparties regarding same (0.2).
Melcer, Moshe	09/16/21	0.1	Review email from White & Case regarding aircraft transaction.
Szanzer, Steven Z. Garg, Paavani	09/16/21	6.9	Review and consider comments to Yamasa order (0.2); review emails regarding same (0.2); review and consider M. Landess' comments to Jupiter motion (0.3); review emails from White & Case and Skyworks regarding JA Mitsui documents (0.2). Call with Davis Polk Fleet team regarding JOLCOs (0.6); call with White & Case team on fleet workstream (0.5); revise
			pleadings for JOCLO assumption motion (5.5); review Cape Town convention (0.3).
Graulich, Timothy	09/17/21	0.5	Call with M. Landess regarding fleet.
Green, Thomas S.	09/17/21	6.6	Call with White & Case regarding fleet workstreams (0.5); call with Herbert Smith Freehills regarding JA Mitsui (0.5); call with Davis Polk Fleet team regarding JOLCOs (0.5); analyze JA Mitsui documents (3.7); analyze ALC motion (1.4).
Melcer, Moshe	09/17/21	5.8	Review and revise fleet status summary (0.5); review and revise ALC motion (0.6); review and revise related sealing motion (0.1); review and revise related declaration (0.2); email with Chambers regarding same (0.3); email with creditor groups regarding same (0.2); correspondence with S. Szanzer regarding same (0.1); correspondence with T. Green regarding same (0.1); correspondence with M. Giddens regarding same (0.1); call with White & Case team regarding fleet updates (0.6); call with Chambers regarding upcoming fleet motions (0.2); correspondence with E. Jerrard regarding same (0.2); correspondence with S. Szanzer regarding same (0.3); correspondence with S. Szanzer and T. Green regarding outstanding fleet workstreams (0.5); correspondence with S. Szanzer regarding same (0.3); call with White & Case regarding comments to aircraft lease (0.1); review comments to motion to approve aircraft transactions

Time Detail By Project			
Name	Date	Hours	Narrative
			(0.3); review and revise motion to approve aircraft transaction (1.1).
Szanzer, Steven Z.	09/17/21	7.3	Correspondence with White & Case regarding JA Mitsui documents (0.6); correspondence with P. Garg regarding JA Mitsui stipulation and termination notice (0.5); review and consider comments to Jupiter motion (0.2); correspondence with M. Melcer and White & Case regarding same (0.2); correspondence with Skyworks regarding same (0.4); call with R. Johnson regarding objection deadline and comments to order (0.5); correspondence with Davis Polk Fleet team regarding JA Mitsui (0.5); correspondence with Skyworks regarding Goshawk (0.2); correspondence with White & Case and T. Green regarding BBAM (0.3); finalize ALC documentation (0.5); review and consider Jupiter amended lease (0.3); correspondence with M. Melcer regarding same (0.3); call with Herbert Smith Freehills regarding JA Mitsui (0.7); correspondence with Davis Polk team regarding sealing order (0.3); review notice of objection and circulate same (0.3); correspondence with White & Case and Skyworks regarding Avolon (0.1); call with M. Brod regarding Yamasa (0.3); correspondence with White & Case and Skyworks regarding JOLCOs (0.3); call with Davis Polk Fleet team
Melcer, Moshe	09/18/21	0.6	regarding JOLCOs (0.6); prepare for same (0.2). Draft Certificates of No Objection for assumption sealing motion (0.3); correspondence with S. Szanzer regarding same (0.1); email with Chambers regarding ALC motion (0.1); email
Szanzer, Steven Z.	09/18/21	3.0	with Skyworks and White & Case regarding same (0.1). Review and revise JA Mitsui order and notice for same (2.5); correspondence with P. Garg regarding same (0.3); correspondence with Herbert Smith Freehills regarding same (0.2).
Garg, Paavani	09/19/21	2.6	Revise pleadings relating to JOLCO assumption motion.
Graulich, Timothy	09/19/21	1.1	Review and revise aircraft assumption order.
Melcer, Moshe	09/19/21	1.2	Review and revise aircraft assumption order (0.2); email with Chambers regarding same (0.3); correspondence with P. Garg regarding same (0.1); revise Certificates of No Objection for aircraft assumption motion (0.2); email with Chambers regarding same (0.2); correspondence with S. Szanzer regarding same (0.2).
Szanzer, Steven Z.	09/19/21	4.9	Further revise JA Mitsui order and notice for same (1.5); correspondence with Davis Polk Fleet team regarding same (0.4); review and consider comments to same (0.3); correspondence with co-advisors regarding same and finalize same (1.8); correspondence with Herbert Smith Freehills regarding notice of objection (0.2); review and revise Certificate of No Objection for sealing motion (0.4); correspondence with M. Melcer regarding same (0.3).
Garg, Paavani	09/20/21	0.5	Email with White & Case regarding assumption of JOLCO leases.
Graulich, Timothy	09/20/21	5.7	Review JOLCO letter (0.6); call with M. Landess regarding same (0.8); review lease and loan agreements (4.3).
Green, Thomas S.	09/20/21	4.4	Analyze Natixis letter (1.5); correspondence with Davis Polk fleet team regarding same (1.3); conference with S. Szanzer regarding same (0.4); conference with M. Melcer regarding
McClammy, James I.	09/20/21	0.8	same (0.2); analyze stipulation (1.0). Review aircraft lease motion (0.4); correspondence with Davis

		Time	Detail By Project
Name	Date	Hours	Narrative
Melcer, Moshe	09/20/21	2.5	Polk team regarding same (0.4). Correspondence with S. Szanzer regarding motion to approve aircraft transaction (0.1); email with Vedder Price regarding SMBC rejection order (0.1); review and revise motion to approve aircraft transactions (0.9); email Holland & Knight regarding same (0.2); email with T. Graulich regarding assumption motion set for hearing (0.1); review demand letter (0.3); call with Davis Polk Fleet team, Skyworks, and White & Case regarding fleet workstreams (0.3); review and revise
Szanzer, Steven Z.	09/20/21	6.6	motion to approve aircraft transactions (0.5). Correspondence with M. Melcer regarding Jupiter motion (0.4); review and revise same (1.0); review aircraft orders entered (0.2); correspondence with related parties and coadvisors regarding same (0.2); correspondence with M. Edelman regarding SMBC rejection order (0.1); review Certificates of No Objection (0.3); review and consider comments to Wings motion (0.4); revise same (0.4); correspondence with M. Melcer regarding same (0.4); correspondence with R. Steinberg regarding Embraer (0.1); review and consider Natixis letter (0.7); correspondence with Davis Polk Fleet team and others regarding same (0.6); call with White & Case and Skyworks regarding same (0.2); correspondence with Willkie Farr regarding same (0.2); correspondence with M. Melcer and T. Wolynski regarding TEAM motion (0.3); correspondence with White & Case and M. Melcer regarding BBAM redactions (0.2); correspondence with J. Crowley and White & Case regarding ALC documents (0.1); correspondence with White & Case and Skyworks regarding Avolon (0.1); correspondence with R. Steinberg regarding Carlyle claims (0.2); correspondence with same regarding Boeing claims (0.2).
Graulich, Timothy	09/21/21	2.8	Call with M. Landess regarding JOLCO (0.5); review JOLCO agreements (2.3).
Green, Thomas S.	09/21/21	7.7	Correspondence with White & Case and Skyworks regarding JA Mitsui (2.0); research issues regarding precedent assumption orders (2.7); correspondence with C. Hansen regarding JA Mitsui research (0.3); analyze demand letter (1.9); research issues regarding Wings (0.2); correspondence with T. Graulich regarding JOLCOs (0.6).
Rincon, Cristina M.	09/21/21	1.7	Call with T. Greene regarding JOLCO issues (0.4); review JOLCO assumption objection and lease documents (1.3).
Steinberg, Richard J.	09/21/21	0.4	Email with O'Melveny & Myers and White & Case regarding indenture trustee fees in connection with Ex-Im facilities.
Green, Thomas S.	09/22/21	4.8	Analyze comments to JA Mitsui order (1.0); correspondence with T. Graulich regarding same (0.2); research issues regarding JOLCO rejection order (0.1); analyze JA Mitsui documents (2.6); call with Herbert Smith Freehills and White & Case regarding same (0.9).
Hanson, Cole	09/22/21	4.4	Research and prepare summary of Section 365 regarding assumption of aircraft leases.
McClammy, James I.	09/22/21	3.0	Correspondence with C. Rincon regarding JOLCO issues (0.5); review JOLCO underlying documents, stipulation, assumption motion and strategy considerations regarding same (2.5).
Melcer, Moshe	09/22/21	2.2	Review correspondence regarding fleet workstreams (0.7);

Time Detail By Project			
Name	Date	Hours	Narrative
Rincon, Cristina M.	09/22/21	0.3	correspondence with S. Szanzer regarding same (0.2); correspondence with T. Green regarding same (0.2); draft motion to approve aircraft transaction (1.0); correspondence with S. Szanzer regarding same (0.1). Correspondence with J. McClammy regarding JOLCO issues (0.2); review emails with Herbert Smith Freehills regarding
Steinberg, Richard J.	09/22/21	2.6	JOLCO assumption motion (0.1). Draft Embraer motion.
Szanzer, Steven Z.	09/22/21	4.2	Review and consider comments to motion to approve equipment transaction (0.3); correspondence with M. Melcer regarding same (0.2); review and consider comments to Jupiter motion (0.3); correspondence with M. Melcer regarding same (0.2); review and revise same (0.4); review emails regarding JA Mitsui (0.5); correspondence with T. Green regarding same (0.3); review loan termination notice for same (0.2); review emails regarding Chorus (0.2); review comments to Natixis letter (0.5); review emails regarding Ex-Im (0.2); review emails regarding TEAM motion (0.2); correspondence with M. Melcer regarding same (0.2); review emails regarding other JOLCOs (0.3); correspondence with M. Melcer regarding Wings motion (0.2).
Graulich, Timothy	09/23/21	4.9	Call with M. Landess regarding JOLCOs (0.7); review and revise order (1.2); review loan agreement (3.0).
Green, Thomas S.	09/23/21	4.3	Review and revise JA Mitsui order (2.6); correspondence with C. Rincon regarding same (0.2); call with White & Case regarding same (0.5); call with Davis Polk Fleet team regarding same (0.5); call with Skyworks regarding same (0.5).
Krishnan, Rahul	09/23/21	0.7	Correspondence with C. Rincon and A. Parrott regarding aircraft leases.
McClammy, James I.	09/23/21	2.4	Review JOLCO lease documents (1.6); correspondence with Davis Polk team regarding JOLCO lease issues (0.8).
Melcer, Moshe	09/23/21	8.3	Revise motion to approve aircraft transactions (0.9); draft sealing motion for same (0.8); draft declaration for same (0.9); call with Holland & Knight and others regarding same (0.3); call with Holland & Knight regarding same (0.1); email T. Graulich regarding same (0.1); call with White & Case regarding fleet workstreams (0.6); correspondence with S. Szanzer regarding same (0.2); call with Davis Polk Fleet and Litigation teams regarding aircraft assumption motion (0.9); correspondence with S. Szanzer regarding same (0.4); call with Davis Polk Fleet team, White & Case, and Skyworks regarding same and other transactions (0.7); draft notice of settled order related to same (1.2); draft motion to approve aircraft transaction (1.1); correspondence with S. Szanzer regarding assumption motion (0.1).
Rincon, Cristina M.	09/23/21	2.8	Correspondence with T. Green regarding JOLCO issues (0.1); review JOLCO lease agreements and acceleration notice (1.2); correspondence with J. McClammy regarding same (0.2); correspondence with Davis Polk Restructuring team regarding JOLCO issues (0.8); correspondence with A. Parrot and R. Krishnan regarding same (0.5).
Steinberg, Richard J.	09/23/21	0.7	Correspondence with S. Szanzer regarding Embraer agreements (0.2); call with White & Case regarding fleet workstreams (0.5).
Szanzer, Steven Z.	09/23/21	8.6	Review and revise Jupiter Landess declaration (0.5);

	Time	Detail By Project
Date	Hours	Narrative
09/23/21	7.8	correspondence with M. Melcer regarding same (0.4); correspondence with R. Steinberg regarding Embraer motion (0.4); call with White & Case regarding fleet workstreams (0.6); correspondence with M. Melcer regarding same (0.2); review emails regarding Clover claims (0.1); review emails regarding Boeing claims (0.2); correspondence with R. Steinberg and correspondence with O'Melveny & Myers and White & Case regarding Ex-Im-related fees (0.2); correspondence with White & Case regarding Yamasa (0.1); review and consider comments to Landess declaration for Jupiter motion (0.2); correspondence with M. Melcer regarding same (0.2); review and revise JA Mitsui order (1.2); correspondence with T. Green regarding same (1.4); correspondence with M. Melcer regarding JA Mitsui notice of settlement of order (0.5); correspondence with M. Melcer regarding Avolon motion (0.3); review and revise same (1.2); review and revise Wings motion (0.3); correspondence with M. Melcer and White & Case regarding same (0.3);. Review and consider comments to Jupiter motion (0.3); review and revise same (0.3); correspondence with M. Melcer regarding same (0.4); correspondence with M. Melcer regarding aircraft motion (0.3); review and revise and White & Case regarding representations and warranties letter (0.4); review and revise same (0.4); correspondence with M. Melcer regarding same (0.5); correspondence with T. Graulich regarding same (0.5); correspondence with T. Green regarding same (0.5); correspondence with T. Green regarding same (0.5); correspondence with C. Rincon and M. Mel
09/24/21	3.9	same (0.6). Review and revise notice and order for JA Mitsui (1.5); review and revise Chorus documents (1.9); correspondence with
09/24/21	5.8	Skyworks regarding Avolon (0.5). Revise Jupiter motion (0.7); revise related sealing motion (0.2); revise related declaration (0.6); email with M. Giddens regarding same (0.1); email with Chambers regarding same (0.3); email with creditor groups regarding same (0.3); email with Same regarding motion to approve aircraft transactions (0.2); correspondence with S. Szanzer regarding same (0.2); call with Holland & Knight regarding same (0.1); call with M. Landess regarding same (0.1); email with E. Jerrard regarding same (0.1); correspondence with S. Szanzer and T. Green regarding outstanding fleet workstreams (0.2); correspondence with T. Green regarding same (0.2); email with M. Landess regarding same (0.3); revise motion to approve aircraft transactions (0.7); draft related sealing motion (0.6); revise same (0.1); draft related declaration (0.7). Correspondence with Aeroméxico regarding Embraer
	09/23/21	Date Hours 09/23/21 7.8 09/24/21 3.9 09/24/21 5.8

		Time	Detail By Project
Name	Date	Hours	Narrative
Szanzer, Steven Z. Green, Thomas S.	09/24/21	10.8	agreements. Review and revise notice of settlement order (1.1); correspondence with M. Melcer regarding same (1.1); review and revise BBAM motion (0.9); correspondence with M. Melcer regarding same (0.8); correspondence with White & Case and Skyworks regarding same (0.3); review and consider comments to same (0.2); correspondence with M. Melcer regarding same (0.2); finalize Jupiter documents (0.5); review and consider comments to Chorus motion (0.3); correspondence M. Melcer regarding same (0.2); correspondence with White & Case regarding same (0.1); correspondence with M. Melcer regarding Wings motion (0.2); correspondence with Davis Polk Fleet team regarding JA Mitsui order and notice (0.5); correspondence with Aeroméxico and R. Steinberg regarding Embraer (0.2); correspondence with M. Melcer and White & Case regarding TrueNoord (0.2); correspondence with White & Case regarding GECAS (0.2); correspondence with M. Melcer regarding same (0.1); review and consider comments to Fly Leasing motion (0.3); review and consider comments to JA Mitsui order (0.7); correspondence with Davis Polk Fleet team regarding same (0.6); correspondence with Davis Polk Fleet team regarding same (0.3); review and revise Chorus sealing motion (0.5); correspondence with M. Melcer regarding same (0.5); correspondence with Freehills regarding JA Mitsui (0.4);
	33/23/2	0.10	correspondence with R. Steinberg regarding Embraer (0.3); correspondence with M. Melcer regarding fleet workstreams (0.2).
Melcer, Moshe	09/25/21	1.6	Review and revise motion to approve aircraft transaction (0.6); call with Davis Polk Fleet team regarding fleet workstreams (0.6); review and revise motion to approve aircraft transaction (0.4).
Szanzer, Steven Z.	09/25/21	1.3	Review emails regarding Avolon (0.2); review emails regarding JA Mitsui (0.3); correspondence with Davis Polk Fleet team regarding JOLCOs (0.2); call with Davis Polk Fleet team regarding fleet workstreams (0.6).
Graulich, Timothy Green, Thomas S.	09/26/21 09/26/21	1.4 9.6	Review JOLCO agreement. Call with Davis Polk Fleet team regarding JA Mitsui (0.3); review and revise TrueNoord documents (1.6); analyze NAC transaction documents (2.6); correspondence with P. Garg regarding same (0.3); call with Gibson Dunn regarding fleet issue (0.4); call with Vedder Price regarding JA Mitsui (0.4); analyze BOC omnibus agreement (2.0); correspondence S. Szanzer regarding same (0.1); call with A. Andreeva regarding same (0.2); call with Davis Polk Fleet team and Creditors Committee regarding ALC issues (0.4); call with White & Case regarding fleet workstreams (0.5); analyze workstreams summary (0.8).
Melcer, Moshe Szanzer, Steven Z.	09/26/21 09/26/21	2.8 5.4	Draft motion to approve aircraft transactions. Correspondence with Herbert Smith Freehills and Davis Polk Fleet team regarding JA Mitsui (0.6); email with Willkie Farr and Akin Gump regarding same (0.3); review and revise

		Time	Detail By Project
Name	Date	Hours	Narrative
			notice of settlement of interim order (0.5); correspondence with Davis Polk Fleet team regarding same (0.5); correspondence with Skyworks and White & Case regarding BBAM motion (0.2); correspondence with M. Melcer regarding same (0.1); correspondence with M. Melcer regarding Avolon motion (0.2); correspondence with White & Case regarding same (0.2); review and revise TrueNoord motion (0.8); correspondence with M. Melcer regarding same (0.7); review and revise Chorus motion (0.3); review and revise declaration regarding same (0.3); correspondence with M. Melcer regarding same (0.3); correspondence with White & Case regarding GECAS and ACG (0.1); correspondence with M.
Garg, Paavani	09/27/21	2.1	Melcer regarding fleet workstreams (0.3). Correspondence with T. Green regarding NAC Motion for assumption (0.4); call with White & Case regarding fleet workstream (0.5); call with Davis Polk Fleet team fleet workstream (0.5); correspondence with same regarding fleet workstream (0.7).
Giddens, Magali	09/27/21	0.4	Correspondence with M. Melcer regarding unredacted aircraft documents and review same.
McClammy, James I.	09/27/21	2.2	Review aircraft lease documents (1.7); call with Davis Polk team regarding same (0.5).
Melcer, Moshe	09/27/21	3.4	Call with Davis Polk Fleet team regarding fleet workstreams (0.6); call with C. Dietz regarding motion to approve aircraft transactions (0.1); call with A. Hussain regarding same (0.1); revise same (0.3); review and revise motion to approve aircraft transactions (0.8); email with Holland & Knight regarding same (0.1); email with Skyworks regarding Air Lease motion (0.1); review and comment on restructured aircraft agreement (0.2); email with White & Case regarding JOLCO documents (0.4); revise fleet status summary (0.7).
Szanzer, Steven Z.	09/27/21	1.1	Call with L. Whidden regarding Chorus sealing motion (0.3); correspondence with M. Melcer regarding same (0.1); review and revise NAC motion (0.9); correspondence with P. Garg and T. Green regarding same (0.9); correspondence with White & Case regarding same (0.8); review and revise BOC motion (0.6); correspondence with P. Garg regarding same (0.5); review and consider comments to BBAM motion (0.3); correspondence with M. Melcer regarding same (0.2); correspondence with Skyworks regarding TrueNoord (0.2); correspondence with M. Melcer regarding same (0.1); call with Skyworks and White & Case regarding JOLCOs (1.1); correspondence with T. Graulich regarding ALC and JOLCOs (0.4); review emails regarding TEAM motion (0.2); call with R. Johnson regarding Yamasa lease (0.3); review emails regarding JA Mitsui (0.3); correspondence with L. Crowley and White & Case regarding ALC (0.3); correspondence with White & Case and T. Green regarding Wings (0.3); call with Davis Polk Fleet team regarding fleet workstreams (0.9); call with White & Case regarding same (0.5); prepare for same (0.5); correspondence with Davis Polk Fleet team regarding same (0.4); correspondence with White & Case regarding GECAS (0.2); review and revise TEAM motion (0.2); correspondence with M. Melcer regarding same (0.3).
Garg, Paavani	09/28/21	5.1	Draft NAC motion for assumption.

		Time	Detail By Project
Name	Date	Hours	Narrative
Graulich, Timothy	09/28/21	1.7	Call with M. Landess regarding JOLCO strategy (0.8); revise order related to same (0.9).
Green, Thomas S.	09/28/21	5.7	Review and revise motion to approve equipment transaction documents (1.8); review and revise Avolon motion (0.5); call with J. Cross regarding fleet issues (0.3); analyze BOC documents (2.1); correspondence with P. Garg regarding fleet workstreams (0.4); analyze fleet workstreams summary (0.6).
Piraino, Stephen D.	09/28/21	0.4	Correspondence with J. Wallden, M. Masaro, and M. Landess regarding fleet issues.
Garg, Paavani	09/29/21	5.9	Call with advisors regarding fleet update (0.8); draft assumption motions for aircraft fleets (5.1).
Green, Thomas S.	09/29/21	5.4	Correspondence with Davis Polk Fleet team regarding NAC motion (0.7); research issues regarding same (1.8); review and revise NAC and BOC motions (2.5); correspondence with P. Garg regarding same (0.4).
Melcer, Moshe	09/29/21	1.6	Correspondence with T. Green regarding outstanding fleet workstreams (0.3); revise draft motion to approve aircraft transactions (1.2); revise fleet status summary (0.1).
Szanzer, Steven Z.	09/29/21	2.6	Review emails regarding Ex-Im (0.3); review emails regarding NAC (0.1); review emails regarding Avolon (0.2); review emails regarding BBAM (0.3); review emails regarding TrueNoord (0.2); review emails regarding JA Mitsui (0.2); review emails regarding BOC (0.2); review emails regarding motion to approve equipment transaction (0.2); review emails regarding Embraer (0.2); review email regarding Chorus (0.1); review and consider comments to Chorus motion (0.3); review emails regarding Flight Safety (0.2); review email regarding TEAM motion (0.1).
Garg, Paavani Graulich, Timothy	09/30/21 09/30/21	0.8 0.7	Call with Davis Polk Fleet team regarding fleet issues. Correspondence with M. Landess and S. Szanzer regarding JOLCO resolutions.
Green, Thomas S.	09/30/21	7.2	Call with Davis Polk Fleet team regarding fleet workstreams (0.5) (partial attendance); call with White & Case regarding fleet workstreams (0.5); review and revise ACG (0.9); analyze AerCap order and documents (1.0); call with Vedder Price regarding JA Mitsui (0.6); correspondence with M. Melcer regarding same (0.4); review and revise TrueNoord motion (0.7); correspondence with Davis Polk Fleet team regarding NAC (0.3); call with J. Cross regarding JOLCOs (0.3); research regarding stay issue (2.0).
Melcer, Moshe	09/30/21	6.4	Call with Davis Polk Fleet team regarding fleet workstreams (0.8); call with White & Case regarding fleet workstreams (0.8); correspondence with S. Szanzer regarding same (0.1); call with Holland & Knight regarding motion to approve aircraft transaction (0.1); revise same (0.4); call with White & Case, and Skyworks regarding pending aircraft negotiations (0.7); correspondence with S. Szanzer regarding same (0.3); correspondence with T. Green regarding outstanding fleet workstreams (0.4); review and revise motion to approve aircraft transactions (1.2); draft sealing motion regarding same (0.8); draft declaration regarding same (0.4); revise summary of transaction terms (0.2); review comments to sealing motion
Szanzer, Steven Z.	09/30/21	11.1	(0.2). Review emails regarding TEAM motion (0.2); call with R. Johnson regarding Yamasa lease (0.3); review emails regarding JA Mitsui (0.3); correspondence with L. Crowley and

Time Detail By Project				
Name	Date	Hours	Narrative	
			White & Case regarding ALC (0.3); correspondence with White & Case and T. Green regarding Wings (0.3); call with Davis Polk Fleet team regarding fleet workstreams (0.9); call with White & Case regarding same (0.5); prepare for same (0.5); correspondence with Davis Polk Fleet team regarding same (0.4); correspondence with White & Case regarding GECAS (0.2); review and revise TEAM motion (0.2); correspondence with M. Melcer regarding same (0.3); correspondence with White & Case regarding same (0.3); correspondence with M. Melcer regarding same (0.1); review and revise NAC motion (0.9); correspondence with P. Garg and T. Green regarding same (0.9); correspondence with White & Case regarding same (0.9); correspondence with White & Case regarding same (0.8); review and revise BOC motion (0.6); correspondence with P. Garg regarding same (0.5); review and consider comments to BBAM motion (0.3); correspondence with M. Melcer regarding same (0.2); correspondence with Skyworks regarding TrueNoord (0.2); correspondence with M. Melcer regarding same (0.1); call with Skyworks and White & Case regarding JOLCOs (1.1); correspondence with T. Graulich regarding ALC and JOLCOs (0.4).	
Total AM100 Aircraft/	Engines	441.9		
AM110 Automatic Sta Jerrard, Erik	y/Litigation 09/01/21	1.0	Review discovery documents (0.4); call with Morris Nichols and Davis Polk Litigation and Restructuring teams regarding	
McClammy, James I.	09/01/21	0.9	same (0.6). Call with D. Abbott regarding discovery issues (0.4); email with Davis Polk team regarding same (0.5).	
Piraino, Stephen D.	09/01/21	2.2	Call with Morris Nichols and Davis Polk Litigation and Restructuring teams regarding discovery documents (0.6); call with Willke Farr regarding confidentiality stipulation (0.6); email with Davis Polk team regarding confidentiality stipulation (0.2); review document production (0.8).	
Rincon, Cristina M.	09/01/21	3.7	Analyze Newrest litigation issues (0.2); call with Willke Farr regarding confidentiality stipulation (0.6); email with Davis Polk team regarding same (0.2); review confidentiality stipulation (0.1); correspondence with S. Piraino regarding call with Morris Nichols regarding document requests (0.1); call with R. Sanchez Baker and Morris Nichols regarding same (0.2); review documents produced by Apollo (1.4); call with Morris Nichols and Aeroméxico regarding discovery and document production (0.5); correspondence with A. Parrot regarding professional retention issue (0.4).	
Buchwald, Lara Samet	09/02/21	0.6	Call with Morris Nichols and Davis Polk Litigation and Restructuring teams regarding discovery documents.	
Graulich, Timothy	09/02/21	1.0	Call with D. Abbott regarding litigation issues (0.5); call with B. Miller regarding document discovery (0.5).	
Jerrard, Erik	09/02/21	0.6	Call with Morris Nichols and Davis Polk Litigation and Restructuring teams regarding discovery documents.	
Marienko, Anna McClammy, James I.	09/02/21 09/02/21	1.0 0.5	Call with Skyworks regarding DAE aircraft. Correspondence with Davis Polk Litigation team regarding discovery issues.	
Parrott, Andy T.	09/02/21	4.0	Call with Morris Nichols and Davis Polk Litigation and	

		Time	Detail By Project
Name	Date	Hours	Narrative
Piraino, Stephen D.	09/02/21	1.6	Restructuring teams regarding discovery documents (0.6); call with Willkie Farr regarding same (1.0); review case law regarding professional retention issue (2.1); correspondence with C. Rincon regarding same (0.3). Call with Morris Nichols and Davis Polk Litigation and Restructuring teams regarding discovery documents (0.6); call
Rincon, Cristina M.	09/02/21	3.6	with Willkie Farr regarding document production (1.0). Email with A. Aranalde and D. Olmedo regarding Newrest litigation issues (0.1); email with J. McClammy regarding notice of dismissal of adversary proceeding (0.1); call with Morris Nichols and Davis Polk Litigation and Restructuring teams regarding discovery documents (0.5); call with Willkie Farr regarding discovery issues (1.0); call with Morris Nichols and Davis Polk Litigation and Restructuring teams regarding discovery documents (0.4) (partial attendance); call with Fleet professionals regarding DAE motion (0.9); correspondence with A. Parrot and R. Krishna regarding litigation research (0.5); review research regarding professional retention issue (0.1).
Bane, Abraham	09/03/21	0.5	Correspondence with E. Jerrard regarding removal extension motion (0.2); finalize same (0.1); correspondence with M. Giddens regarding same (0.2).
Rincon, Cristina M.	09/03/21	0.4	Email with counsel for Newrest regarding settlement issues (0.1); review draft summary of professional retention issue research (0.3).
Melcer, Moshe Graulich, Timothy	09/05/21 09/06/21	0.3 1.2	Email with J. McClammy regarding discovery. Correspondence with J. McClammy and D. Abbott regarding DAE discovery (0.5); call with counsel for creditors regarding same (0.3); call with A. Sainz and others regarding DAE discovery (0.4).
Krishnan, Rahul	09/06/21	1.0	Correspondence with J. McClammy regarding call with Willkie Farr (0.1); call with Morris Nichols and Davis Polk Litigation and Restructuring teams regarding discovery documents (0.5); call with Willkie Farr regarding discovery and mediation issues (0.3); draft summary of same (0.1).
Melcer, Moshe	09/06/21	1.0	Call with Morris Nichols and Davis Polk Litigation and Restructuring teams regarding discovery documents (0.5); call with Debtor and creditor constituencies regarding discovery (0.5).
Parrott, Andy T.	09/06/21	1.0	Call with Morris Nichols and Davis Polk Litigation and Restructuring teams regarding discovery documents (0.5); correspondence with Willkie Farr regarding same (0.5).
Buchwald, Lara Samet	09/07/21	0.4	Comment on DAE motions.
Buchwald, Lara Samet	09/09/21	0.3	Correspondence with Aeroméxico advisor group regarding DAE leases (0.2); review draft motion papers for DAE leases (0.1).
Masaro, Matthew Bruno	09/09/21	0.2	Correspondence with S. Cunningham and others regarding bankruptcy protection notices.
Buchwald, Lara Samet	09/10/21	0.3	Comment on DAE assumption motion.
Masaro, Matthew Bruno	09/10/21	0.6	Correspondence with S. Cunningham and others regarding automatic stay relief.
Melcer, Moshe	09/11/21	0.2	Email with T. Graulich and J. McClammy regarding upcoming call on litigation strategy.
Buchwald, Lara	09/12/21	0.3	Comment on DAE assumption motion.

		Time	Detail By Project
Name	Date	Hours	Narrative
Samet	00/10/04	0.7	Coll with Marria Nichala Sainz Abarradae and Davis Dalls
Jerrard, Erik	09/12/21	0.7	Call with Morris Nichols, Sainz Abogados, and Davis Polk Litigation and Restructuring teams regarding litigation strategy.
McClammy, James I.	09/12/21	0.3	Correspondence with Davis Polk Litigation team regarding litigation issues.
Melcer, Moshe	09/12/21	1.0	Call with Morris Nichols, Sainz Abogados, and Davis Polk Litigation ad Restructuring teams regarding litigation strategy (0.7); correspondence with R. Steinberg regarding same (0.1); correspondence with S. Szanzer regarding same (0.2).
Parrott, Andy T.	09/12/21	0.7	Call with Morris Nichols, Sainz Abogados, and Davis Polk Litigation and restructuring teams regarding litigation strategy.
Masaro, Matthew Bruno	09/13/21	0.8	Review and revise automatic stay relief stipulation and agreed order (0.4); correspondence with S. Cunningham, Aeroméxico, and others regarding same (0.4).
Rincon, Cristina M.	09/13/21	0.3	Call with Cleary Gottlieb regarding creditor issues.
Graulich, Timothy	09/15/21	0.6	Call with D. Abbott regarding Apollo discovery requests.
McClammy, James I.	09/15/21	2.9	Analyze potential litigation issues (1.5); correspondence with Davis Polk team regarding potential discovery (0.8); call with Davis Polk team, Morris Nichols, Cleary Gottlieb regarding discovery issues (0.6).
Jerrard, Erik	09/18/21	0.4	Email with Davis Polk Litigation team regarding discovery requests.
McClammy, James I.	09/18/21	0.6	Call with Morris Nichols and Akin Gump regarding discovery issues.
Masaro, Matthew Bruno	09/20/21	0.1	Correspondence with Aeroméxico and others regarding automatic stay lift stipulation.
Green, Thomas S.	09/22/21	2.7	Research issues regarding automatic stay violations.
Masaro, Matthew Bruno	09/22/21	0.4	Correspondence with S. Cunningham and others regarding lift-stay stipulation.
Piraino, Stephen D.	09/22/21	0.3	Correspondence with Davis Polk Litigation team regarding lift- stay stipulation.
Parrott, Andy T.	09/23/21	0.6	Correspondence with C. Rincon regarding automatic stay issue.
Green, Thomas S.	09/24/21	3.1	Research regarding automatic stay issue.
Parrott, Andy T.	09/27/21	1.6	Research regarding estoppel issues.
Green, Thomas S.	09/28/21	0.3	
Rincon, Cristina M.	09/28/21	0.4	Correspondence with T. Graulich, J. McClammy, and D. Abbott regarding litigation issues.
Green, Thomas S.	09/29/21	2.1	Research issues regarding automatic stay.
Total AM110 Automa Stay/Litigation	tic	48.3	
AM130 Bar Date/Estimation/Claims Allowance Iss			
Melcer, Moshe	09/01/21	1.7	Correspondence with S. Szanzer and R. Steinberg regarding fleet claim settlements (0.4); draft fleet claims settlement motion (1.3).
Steinberg, Richard J. Melcer, Moshe	09/01/21 09/03/21	0.5 0.6	Call with Aeroméxico regarding agreement with Embraer. Correspondence with claimant regarding claim objection (0.3); review claims subject to claims objection (0.3).
Steinberg, Richard J.	09/03/21	0.3	Call with AlixPartners regarding claims workstreams.
Melcer, Moshe	09/05/21	0.5	Review correspondence from claimant regarding claim objection.
Melcer, Moshe	09/06/21	0.8	Correspondence with R. Steinberg regarding outstanding

		Time	Detail By Project
Name	Date	Hours	Narrative
Steinberg, Richard J.	09/07/21	0.3	workstreams (0.5); revise claimant inbound tracker (0.3). Correspondence with counsel to Wayne County Airport Authority regarding claims issue.
Dekhtyar, Mariya	09/08/21	0.1	Email with R. Steinberg regarding withdrawn claims.
Jerrard, Erik	09/08/21	0.2	Call with R. Steinberg regarding claims process.
Steinberg, Richard J.	09/08/21	2.3	Review and reconcile claims register regarding secured, administrative, and priority claims (1.1); correspondence with AlixPartners regarding same (0.3); call with E. Jerrard regarding claim process (0.2); call with Aeroméxico regarding claims settlements (0.3); review claim withdrawal and transfers (0.4).
Dekhtyar, Mariya	09/09/21	2.1	Review claims schedules (0.2); email with M. Melcer regarding claim withdrawals (0.2); call with AlixPartners and Davis Polk Restructuring team regarding upcoming claims objections (0.4) (partial attendance); call with Epiq and others regarding customer claims (0.2); email with M. Melcer regarding call with Epiq (0.2); review email to customers regarding vouchers (0.3); email with R. Steinberg regarding email to customers regarding vouchers (0.2); email with same and others regarding customer claims (0.1); call with AlixPartners, Aeroméxico, and Davis Polk Restructuring team regarding upcoming claims objections (0.3).
Melcer, Moshe	09/09/21	1.9	Call with AlixPartners and Davis Polk Restructuring team regarding upcoming claims objections (0.5); call with AlixPartners, Aeroméxico, and Davis Polk Restructuring team regarding same (0.3); correspondence with R. Steinberg regarding outstanding workstreams (0.4); revise claimant inbound tracker (0.3); email with claimants relating to prior claim objections (0.4).
Steinberg, Richard J.	09/09/21	4.5	Call with AlixPartners regarding upcoming claims objections (0.6); correspondence with Epiq regarding same and claim objections withdrawals (0.5); correspondence with M. Melcer regarding same (0.4); call with Aeroméxico and AlixPartners regarding customer claims reconciliation process (0.9); draft customer voucher notice (0.9); email with AlixPartners regarding same (0.2); correspondence with claimants in response to pending claim objections (1.0).
Szanzer, Steven Z.	09/09/21	0.6	Correspondence with M. Melcer regarding SMBC claims (0.3); correspondence with Skyworks regarding same (0.2); correspondence with Epiq regarding same (0.1).
Dekhtyar, Mariya	09/10/21	1.1	Review emails with R. Steinberg, M. Melcer, and others regarding claims (0.2); draft email with claimant regarding withdrawal of claim (0.7); review correspondence with R. Steinberg and others regarding claims issues (0.2).
Jerrard, Erik Melcer, Moshe	09/10/21 09/10/21	0.5 1.1	Email with R. Steinberg and M. Melcer regarding claims. Review opposition to claim objection (0.2); correspondence with R. Steinberg regarding same (0.3); revise claimant inbound tracker (0.2); email with Clifford Chance regarding claim objection (0.2); correspondence with S. Szanzer regarding fleet claims (0.2).
Steinberg, Richard J.	09/10/21	4.1	Draft customer correspondences regarding claim objection withdrawals and forthcoming claims objections (2.0); email correspondence with the Company regarding same (0.2); review and reconcile claims register regarding secured, administrative, and priority claims (0.9); correspondence to Epiq regarding same (0.4); communication with M. Melcer 21

		Time	Detail By Project
Name	Date	Hours	Narrative
			regarding same (0.2); respond to inbounds received in connection with claims objections (0.4).
Szanzer, Steven Z.	09/10/21	0.4	Correspondence with M. Melcer and R. Steinberg regarding
Dokhtvar Mariya	00/12/21	0.6	SMBC and Natixis claims.
Dekhtyar, Mariya	09/12/21	0.6	Email with M. Melcer and others regarding omnibus claims objections (0.1); call with M. Melcer regarding claims objections schedules and workstreams (0.5).
Melcer, Moshe	09/12/21	5.4	Call with M. Dekhtyar regarding omnibus claims objections schedules and workstreams (0.5); email with M. Dekhtyar regarding same (0.3); correspondence with R. Steinberg regarding omnibus claim objections (0.2); email with claimants regarding same (3.8); revise claimant inbound tracker (0.6).
Steinberg, Richard J.	09/12/21	0.8	Respond to informal inbounds received in response to omnibus claims objections (0.5); correspondence with M. Melcer regarding same (0.3).
Szanzer, Steven Z.	09/12/21	0.2	Correspondence with R. Steinberg and M. Melcer regarding Natixis claims.
Melcer, Moshe	09/13/21	0.6	Call with Epiq regarding customer claim communications (0.1); call with claimant regarding omnibus claim objection (0.1); correspondence with claimants regarding same (0.4).
Steinberg, Richard J.	09/13/21	2.8	Respond to informal inbounds received in response to omnibus claims objections (1.8); email with AlixPartners regarding revised schedules to claims objections (0.2); correspondence with E. Jerrard regarding omnibus claims objections (0.2); call with Holland & Knight regarding fleet claims (0.4); email with S. Szanzer regarding same (0.2).
Dekhtyar, Mariya	09/14/21	0.5	Email with M. Melcer regarding upcoming omnibus claim objections (0.1); call with same regarding same (0.2); correspondence with same and others regarding same (0.1); review emails with M. Melcer and others regarding same (0.1).
Melcer, Moshe	09/14/21	2.8	Correspondence with claimants regarding omnibus claim objection (0.7); correspondence with AlixPartners regarding upcoming omnibus claim objections (0.5); call with M. Dekhtyar regarding same (0.2); call with counsel to potential exit financing provider and others regarding claim objection (0.2); analyze counsel to potential exit financing provider claim (0.5); correspondence with R. Steinberg regarding outstanding claims workstreams (0.2); revise claimant inbound tracker (0.5).
Steinberg, Richard J.	09/14/21	1.0	Call with Milbank regarding claim (0.6); correspondence with M. Melcer regarding same (0.2); review claims register regarding same (0.2)
Dekhtyar, Mariya	09/15/21	4.0	Draft omnibus claims objections (3.7); research issues relating to same (0.3).
Melcer, Moshe	09/15/21	0.6	Draft email to advisors regarding upcoming claim objections (0.4); correspondence with Epiq regarding claimant correspondence (0.2).
Steinberg, Richard J.	09/15/21	1.7	Respond to informal inbounds received in response to omnibus claims objections (0.7); email with AlixPartners regarding revised schedules to claims objections (0.2); revise schedules omnibus claims objections (0.8).
Dekhtyar, Mariya	09/16/21	3.8	Review and revise omnibus claims objection (3.6); review letter from State Department regarding claims issue (0.1); review emails with R. Steinberg and M. Melcer regarding omnibus claims objections (0.1).
Jerrard, Erik	09/16/21	0.7	Review updated claims estimate.

		Time	Detail By Project
Name	Date	Hours	Narrative
Melcer, Moshe	09/16/21	1.5	Correspondence with claimant regarding claim objection (0.4); analyze omnibus claims objections claims (0.4); email with AlixPartners regarding same (0.2); correspondence with R. Steinberg regarding outstanding claim workstreams (0.3); draft email to claimant regarding omnibus claims objections (0.2).
Steinberg, Richard J.	09/16/21	1.9	Correspondence with Milbank regarding claims objections (0.2): correspondence with counsel to Wayne County Airport Authority regarding claims issue (0.3); respond to informal inbounds received in response to omnibus claims objections (0.6); email with AlixPartners regarding omnibus claims objections (0.4); review and revise updated claims estimate report (0.3).
Dekhtyar, Mariya	09/17/21	1.4	Review email with M. Melcer and others regarding claims issues (0.3); review and revise omnibus claims objections (1.0); email with R. Steinberg and M. Melcer regarding omnibus claims objection (0.1).
Melcer, Moshe	09/17/21	0.1	Review response to omnibus claim objection.
Steinberg, Richard J.	09/17/21	2.7	Correspondence with Milbank regarding claims issue (0.3); respond to informal inbounds received in response to omnibus claims objections and settlements (0.8); correspondence with the Department of Justice regarding claims notices (0.6); prepare tracker regarding union claims (1.0).
Melcer, Moshe	09/19/21	0.4	Review final schedules for omnibus claims objections.
Dekhtyar, Mariya	09/20/21	1.5	Review emails with R. Steinberg and others regarding claims and assumptions notice workstreams (0.1); correspondence with M. Melcer regarding claims workstreams (0.2); review email from R. Steinberg regarding claims issue (0.1); draft notice to notice parties regarding claims settlement (1.0); email with R. Steinberg regarding same (0.1).
Steinberg, Richard J.	09/20/21	0.2	Correspondence with AlixPartners, White & Case, and Skyworks regarding Boeing and PDP claims.
Dekhtyar, Mariya	09/21/21	0.4	Email with R. Steinberg regarding claims workstreams (0.1); email with same regarding claimant outreach (0.1); update claimant inbound tracker (0.2).
Steinberg, Richard J.	09/21/21	2.3	Call with Aeroméxico and co-advisors regarding customer notices and voucher process (1.1); emails with AlixPartners regarding satisfied claims (0.3); correspondences with Holland & Knight regarding fleet-related claims (0.4); correspondence with M. Dekhtyar regarding claims objections (0.2); correspondence with claimants regarding claim settlements (0.3).
Dekhtyar, Mariya	09/22/21	0.5	Email with noticing parties regarding notice of claims settlement (0.4); correspondence with R. Steinberg regarding same (0.1).
Steinberg, Richard J.	09/22/21	1.3	Draft customer notices (0.7); emails with the company (0.1); calls with various claimants (0.3); call with Perkins Coie regarding Boeing claims (0.2).
Steinberg, Richard J.	09/23/21	1.6	Communication with AlixPartners and Chambers regarding amended claims order (0.3); call with AlixPartners regarding voucher process (0.2); calls with M. Melcer regarding claims workstreams (0.4); correspondence with the Aeroméxico regarding cstomer claims (0.2); emails with AlixPartners, Skyworks, and White & Case regarding fleet-related claims (0.5).
Szanzer, Steven Z.	09/23/21	0.3	Review emails regarding Clover claims (0.1); review emails regarding Boeing claims (0.2).

Invoice No.7041000

Invoice Date: October 25, 2021

	Time Detail By Project				
Name	Date	Hours	Narrative		
Dekhtyar, Mariya	09/24/21	0.1	Email with R. Steinberg and M. Melcer regarding claims workstreams.		
Steinberg, Richard J.	09/25/21	3.0	Review and revise omnibus claims objections.		
Melcer, Moshe	09/26/21	0.1	Review email from AlixPartners regarding claims.		
Dekhtyar, Mariya	09/27/21	0.7	Call with M. Melcer and R. Steinberg regarding claims		
			workstreams (0.4); call with M. Melcer regarding same (0.2); review and revise omnibus claims objections (0.1).		
Melcer, Moshe	09/27/21	1.0	Review comments to claim settlement motion (0.3); call with		
,			R. Steinberg and M. Dekhtyar regarding claims workstreams		
			(0.4); call with M. Dekhtyar regarding same (0.3).		
Steinberg, Richard J.	09/27/21	2.0	Call with M. Dekhtyar and M. Melcer regarding claims		
3,		_	workstreams (0.4); review claims regarding upcoming claims		
			objections (0.5); correspondence with Aeroméxico and		
			AlixPartners regarding customer voucher notice (0.3); draft		
			claims customer objection notice (0.6); correspondence with		
			Epiq regarding same (0.2).		
Dekhtyar, Mariya	09/28/21	1.5	Research filings for customer programs (1.1); correspondence		
Bekingar, Mariya	03/20/21	1.5	with M. Giddens regarding same (0.2); email with R. Steinberg		
			regarding same (0.2).		
Giddens, Magali	09/28/21	3.8	Correspondence with M. Dekhtyar regarding customer		
Gidderis, Magaii	09/20/21	3.0			
			program research (0.1); research precedent regarding same		
Constant Theorem C	00/00/04	0.5	(3.7).		
Green, Thomas S.	09/28/21	0.5	Correspondence with Davis Polk Fleet team regarding Avolon		
Otaliah ana Diahand I	00/00/04	0.0	claims.		
Steinberg, Richard J.	09/28/21	0.9	Email with Aeroméxico regarding forthcoming claims objection		
			(0.1); email with AlixPartners and Epiq regarding customized		
			customer notices (0.2); review claims and concert with		
Dalah tara Maria	00/00/04	0.5	AlixPartners (0.6).		
Dekhtyar, Mariya	09/29/21	0.5	Review and revise omnibus claims objections (0.4); email with		
	00/00/04	0.0	R. Steinberg and M. Melcer regarding same (0.1).		
Melcer, Moshe	09/29/21	0.2	Review emails from AlixPartners regarding next set of claims		
0	00/00/04		objections.		
Steinberg, Richard J.	09/29/21	0.7	Call with AlixPartners regarding claims (0.2); correspondence		
			with claimants regarding proofs of claim (0.5).		
Szanzer, Steven Z.	09/29/21	0.2	Review emails regarding Boeing claims.		
Dekhtyar, Mariya	09/30/21	0.4	Correspondence with R. Steinberg and M. Melcer regarding		
			settled claims (0.2); correspondence with Epiq regarding		
			claims register (0.2).		
Melcer, Moshe	09/30/21	0.1	Review schedules for omnibus claims objections.		
Steinberg, Richard J.	09/30/21	0.4	Email with O'Melveny & Myers regarding claims settlement		
			(0.1); call with White & Case regarding same (0.1); email		
			regarding claims settlements (0.2).		
Total AM130 Bar		80.9			
Date/Estimation/Clair	ns				
Allowance Issues					
AM140 Corporate Go	vernance, Board	d Matters and	d Communications		
Graulich, Timothy	09/01/21	4.5	Attend Restructuring Committee meeting (1.3); prepare for		
, ,					
Jerrard, Erik	09/01/21	1.0			
,					
			, .		
Piraino, Stephen D	09/01/21	1.0			
, Otopilon Di	55,5 n= i	1.5			

		Time	Detail By Project
Name	Date	Hours	Narrative
Huebner, Marshall S.	09/02/21	1.1	Call with L. Donahue and Board regarding exit financing valuation issues.
Jerrard, Erik	09/02/21	0.6	Attend weekly call with Creditors Committee advisors and Debtor co-advisors (AlixPartners, Skyworks, others).
Graulich, Timothy	09/04/21	2.4	Review and revise presentation to the Board.
Steinberg, Richard J.	09/04/21	2.1	Draft Board presentation on final valuation materials.
Graulich, Timothy	09/05/21	2.2	Review and revise Board materials.
Graulich, Timothy	09/06/21	3.8	Attend Restructuring Committee meeting (1.4); review and
Gradieri, Timotriy	00/00/21	0.0	revise Board presentation on final valuation materials (2.4).
Steinberg, Richard J.	09/06/21	0.7	Review and revise Board presentation on final valuation materials.
Craulich Timothy	09/08/21	0.4	
Graulich, Timothy	09/09/21		Call with B. Miller regarding Board letter.
Graulich, Timothy	09/09/21	5.1	Attend Restructuring Committee meeting (2.0); review and comment on Board presentation on final valuation materials (3.1).
Diraina Stanhan D	00/00/21	2.8	
Piraino, Stephen D.	09/09/21	۷.0	Attend Restructuring Committee meeting (2.0); review and revise Board materials (0.8).
Blanco, Maurice	09/10/21	0.3	Emails regarding case status
	09/10/21		
Graulich, Timothy	09/10/21	8.2	Prepare for board meeting (1.8); board meeting re: final valuation materials (2.6); review and finalize final valuation materials (3.8)
Huebner, Marshall S.	09/10/21	1.1	Correspondence with T. Graulich regarding Board meeting and next steps.
Jerrard, Erik	09/10/21	3.9	Attend Restructuring Committee meeting (2.0); review and comment on Board presentation on final valuation materials
Piraino, Stephen D.	09/10/21	3.6	(1.9). Attend Restructuring Committee meeting (2.0); prepare Board materials (1.6).
Blanco, Maurice	09/13/21	3.0	Email with Davis Polk team regarding governance issues (1.5); review term sheet and letter regarding same (1.5).
Jerrard, Erik	09/14/21	1.0	Attend legal update call with C. Cervantes, D. Martinez, S. Allard, A. Sainz and others.
Graulich, Timothy	09/15/21	0.5	
Ford, Stephen	09/16/21	11.0	Draft outline to Board letter (3.0); review documentation
	00/10/21		regarding same (2.0); draft Board letter (6.0).
Graulich, Timothy	09/16/21	1.9	Review Board letter (1.1); call with A. Sainz regarding same (0.8).
Jerrard, Erik	09/16/21	3.6	Review and revise Board letter (3.2); correspondence with S. Ford regarding same (0.4).
Blanco, Maurice	09/17/21	0.2	Review case status.
Ford, Stephen	09/17/21	5.4	Review and revise Board letter (1.0); research precedent Board letters regarding same (1.0); research issue regarding
			same (3.4).
Graulich, Timothy	09/17/21	3.8	Review equity term sheet (3.1); call with H. Parkhill regarding same (0.7).
Huebner, Marshall S.	09/17/21	1.7	Review of correspondence and comments on draft correspondence regarding governance process (0.8); call with
Jerrard, Erik	09/17/21	9.0	Aeroméxico and counsel regarding same (0.9). Review and revise Board letter (4.1); call with J. De Arrigunaga regarding same (0.6); correspondence with Management and co-advisors regarding same (0.7); review and revise Board letter (3.0); email with S. Ford regarding same (0.6).
Ford, Stephen	09/18/21	3.5	Review and revise response Board letter (3.2); call with Morris Nichols and Akin Gump regarding same (0.3).
Huebner, Marshall S.	09/18/21	0.2	Review and revise Board letter.

		Time	Detail By Project
Name	Date	Hours	Narrative
Jerrard, Erik	09/18/21	4.0	Review and revise Board letter (3.1); correspondence with S. Ford regarding same (0.3); correspondence regarding same with co-advisors (0.6).
Ford, Stephen	09/19/21	1.4	Correspondence with E. Jerrard regarding Board letter (0.1); review and revise same (1.3).
Graulich, Timothy	09/19/21	2.6	Review and revise Board letter.
Huebner, Marshall S.	09/19/21	0.4	Email with Davis Polk team regarding Board issues.
Jerrard, Érik	09/19/21	3.3	Review and revise Board letter (1.7); coordinate approval of same with Aeroméxico (1.2); emails with A. Sainz, J. McClammy, and D. Abbott regarding same (0.4).
McClammy, James I.	09/19/21	0.5	Review and comment on Board letter.
Graulich, Timothy	09/20/21	2.8	Attend Restructuring Committee meeting.
Jerrard, Erik	09/20/21	5.9	Draft presentation to the Board (2.2); correspondence with S. Piraino regarding same (0.3); attend Restructuring Committee Board meeting (1.1); review and revise Board letter (1.2);
			distribute same (0.4); email with S. Ford regarding Board materials (0.7).
Piraino, Stephen D. Graulich, Timothy	09/20/21 09/21/21	1.0 1.8	Attend Restructuring Committee Board meeting. Attend Board meeting (1.3); correspondence with J.
Jerrard, Erik	09/21/21	2.3	McClammy regarding Board letter (0.5). Attend Board meeting (1.3); prepare for same and review
Piraino, Stephen D.	09/21/21	1.4	related materials (1.0). Attend Board meeting (1.1) (partial attendance); review and
			revise Board materials (0.3).
Ford, Stephen	09/22/21	1.0	Research issues regarding Board letter.
Piraino, Stephen D.	09/22/21	0.4	Correspondence with Davis Polk team regarding Board materials.
Bane, Abraham	09/23/21	5.4	Draft Board materials (4.6); correspondence with E. Jerrard and R. Steinberg regarding same (0.3); call with S. Piraino and others regarding same (0.2); correspondence with AlixPartners, Sainz Abogados, and Rothschild regarding sam (0.2); review T. Graulich's comments to same (0.1).
Jerrard, Erik	09/23/21	2.4	
Piraino, Stephen D.	09/23/21	0.5	Call with A. Bane and others regarding Board materials (0.2); review and revise Board materials (0.3).
Steinberg, Richard J.	09/23/21	1.6	Review and revise Board presentation (1.2); call with Davis Polk Restructuring team regarding same (0.4).
Bane, Abraham	09/24/21	0.5	Correspondence with S. Piraino regarding Board presentation (0.3); revise same (0.2).
Ford, Stephen	09/24/21	1.0	Review and revise Board letter.
Graulich, Timothy	09/24/21	5.3	Attend Board meeting (3.1); attend Restructuring Committee meeting (2.2).
Huebner, Marshall S.	09/24/21	1.3	Attend Board meeting (1.2); correspondence with Davis Polk team regarding same (0.1).
Jerrard, Erik	09/24/21	1.8	Attend Board meeting (1.1); prepare materials for same (0.7).
Piraino, Stephen D.	09/24/21	1.8	Attend Board meeting (1.2); call with Management and co- advisors regarding same (0.2); email with Management team regarding Board materials (0.2); email with T. Graulich regarding same (0.2).
Graulich, Timothy	09/28/21	6.9	Attend Restructuring Committee meeting (2.2); prepare for Board meeting (4.7).
Jerrard, Erik	09/28/21	2.9	Attend Restructuring Committee meeting (2.2); prepare for same (0.7).
Piraino, Stephen D.	09/28/21	2.2	Attend Restructuring Committee meeting.

Time Detail By Project			
Name	Date	Hours	Narrative
Blanco, Maurice	09/29/21	0.4	Email with Davis Polk team regarding governance issues.
Graulich, Timothy	09/29/21	2.0	Attend Board meeting.
Jerrard, Erik	09/29/21	1.2	Attend Board meeting (0.8) (partial attendance); prepare for
Piraino, Stephen D.	09/29/21	0.8	same (0.4). Attend Board meeting (partial attendance).
•			Attend Board meeting (partial attendance).
Total AM140 Corpora Governance, Board M Communications		156.4	
AM150 Creditor/UCC	AHC Issues		
Krishnan, Rahul	09/02/21	5.3	Conference with team and Morris Nichols team regarding upcoming discovery call with Willkie Farr (0.5); conference with Willkie Farr regarding potential discovery disputes (0.5); discuss case law needed for potential motion for extension of exclusivity with C. Rincon (0.5); discuss same with S. Piraino and C. Rincon (0.3); review case law in connection with same (3.5)
Krishnan, Rahul	09/03/21	2.0	Review draft motion for extension of exclusivity for case law usage (1.5); correspondence with Davis Polk team regarding same (0.5).
Graulich, Timothy	09/07/21	8.0	Attend weekly call with Creditors Committee advisor and Debtor co-advisors (AlixPartners, Skyworks, others).
Jerrard, Erik	09/07/21	0.7	Attend weekly call with Creditors Committee advisor and Debtor co-advisors (AlixPartners, Skyworks, others).
Masaro, Matthew Bruno	09/07/21	0.7	Attend weekly call with Creditors Committee advisor and Debtor co-advisors (AlixPartners, Skyworks, others).
Piraino, Stephen D.	09/07/21	0.7	Attend weekly call with Creditors Committee advisor and Debtor co-advisors (AlixPartners, Skyworks, others).
Steinberg, Richard J.	09/07/21	1.0	Attend weekly call with Creditors Committee advisor and Debtor co-advisors (AlixPartners, Skyworks, others) (0.7); prepare for same (0.3).
Krishnan, Rahul	09/12/21	0.5	Conference with team regarding potential disputes with Apollo regarding final valuation materials
Buchwald, Lara Samet	09/13/21	0.3	Comment on draft motion and supporting declaration concerning ALC aircraft.
Graulich, Timothy	09/14/21	0.6	Attend weekly call with Creditors Committee advisor and Debtor co-advisors (AlixPartners, Skyworks, others).
Jerrard, Erik	09/14/21	0.8	Attend weekly call with Creditors Committee advisor and Debtor co-advisors (AlixPartners, Skyworks, others) (0.6); prepare for same (0.2).
Masaro, Matthew Bruno	09/14/21	0.6	Attend weekly call with Creditors Committee advisor and Debtor co-advisors (AlixPartners, Skyworks, and others).
Piraino, Stephen D.	09/14/21	0.6	Attend weekly call with Creditors Committee advisor and Debtor co-advisors (AlixPartners, Skyworks, and others).
Jerrard, Erik	09/15/21	1.3	Call with Creditors Committee to discuss business plan updates.
Rincon, Cristina M.	09/17/21	0.2	Review reservation of rights letters.
Graulich, Timothy	09/21/21	0.7	Attend weekly call with Creditors Committee advisor and
Jerrard, Erik	09/21/21	0.8	Debtor co-advisors (AlixPartners, Skyworks, others). Attend weekly call with Creditors Committee advisor and Debtor co-advisors (AlixPartners, Skyworks, others)
Krishnan, Rahul	09/21/21	1.0	Debtor co-advisors (AlixPartners, Skyworks, others). Correspondence with C. Rincon regarding creditor issues (0.1); correspondence with same and others regarding same (0.2); review recent correspondence regarding same (0.7).
Masaro, Matthew	09/21/21	1.0	Attend weekly call with Creditors Committee advisor and

		Time	Detail By Project
Name	Date	Hours	Narrative
Bruno Steinberg, Richard J.	09/23/21	0.9	Debtor co-advisors (AlixPartners, Skyworks, others). Correspondence with creditors regarding uncashed checks (0.5); call with Rothschild regarding PLM (0.2); call with Rothschild regarding PLM (0.2).
Piraino, Stephen D.	09/27/21	0.3	Call with R. Steinberg and D. Zylberberg regarding PLM.
Steinberg, Richard J. Jerrard, Erik	09/27/21 09/28/21	0.3 0.8	Call with S. Piraino and D. Zylberberg regarding PLM. Attend weekly call with Creditors Committee advisor and Debtor co-advisors (AlixPartners, Skyworks, others).
Piraino, Stephen D.	09/28/21	0.9	Attend weekly call with Creditors Committee advisor and Debtor co-advisors (AlixPartners, Skyworks, others).
Total AM150 Creditor Issues	/UCC/AHC	22.8	
AM170 Customer/Ver	ndor/Non-Aircraf	ft Lease/Non	-Aircraft Contract Issues
Bane, Abraham	09/01/21	1.3	Attend weekly vendor call with AlixPartners and Aeromexico (0.5); review first day motions for vendor issue (0.6); summarize same for S. Piraino (0.2).
Katz, Michael	09/07/21	0.3	Correspondence with Aeroméxico regarding airport contract (0.2); correspondence with S. Piraino regarding same (0.1).
Masaro, Matthew Bruno	09/07/21	0.2	Review contract assumption notices.
Piraino, Stephen D.	09/07/21	0.4	Review vendor issues (0.3); correspondence with M. Katz regarding vendor issues (0.1).
Bane, Abraham	09/09/21	0.6	Call with Aeroméxico and AlixPartners regarding vendor payment escalations (0.4); correspondence with S. Piraino regarding same (0.2).
Katz, Michael	09/09/21	0.5	Correspondence with Aeroméxico regarding airport contract (0.2); correspondence with S. Piraino regarding same (0.3).
Masaro, Matthew Bruno	09/09/21	0.2	Correspondence with AlixPartners regarding contract assumption.
Piraino, Stephen D. Bane, Abraham	09/09/21 09/13/21	0.1 0.3	Email with M. Katz regarding vendor issues. Correspondence with M. Katz regarding critical vendors issues.
Katz, Michael	09/13/21	0.7	Correspondence with A. Bane regarding status of vendor items (0.1); call with Aeroméxico and AlixPartners regarding vendor payment escalations (0.3); review vendor contract (0.2); correspondence with Aeroméxico regarding same (0.1)
Piraino, Stephen D.	09/13/21	0.3	Call with Aeroméxico and AlixPartners regarding vendor payment escalations.
Steinberg, Richard J.	09/13/21	0.4	Email with K. Lee and Aeroméxico regarding Amadeus amendments and assumption (0.2); email with O'Melveny & Myers regarding Ex-Im proposed order (0.2).
Katz, Michael	09/16/21	0.8	Correspondence with Aeroméxico regarding vendor contract issue (0.1); review contract (0.5); correspondence with E. Jerrard regarding same (0.2).
Katz, Michael	09/17/21	0.3	Correspondence with E. Jerrard regarding vendor contract issue (0.1); correspondence with Aeroméxico regarding same (0.2).
Katz, Michael	09/20/21	0.3	Call with Aeroméxico and AlixPartners regarding vendor payment escalations (0.1); review vendor contract (0.1); correspondence with S. Piraino regarding same (0.1).
Hanson, Cole	09/21/21	1.1	Correspondence with T. Green regarding Section 365 research (0.4); research Section 365 assumption of aircraft leases issue (0.7).
Masaro, Matthew	09/21/21	0.9	Review and revise contract assumption order (0.6);

Time Detail By Project			
Name	Date	Hours	Narrative
Bruno			correspondence with AlixPartners, S. Piraino, and others regarding same (0.3).
Katz, Michael	09/22/21	0.1	Email with S. Piraino regarding vendor escalation contract.
Masaro, Matthew	09/22/21	1.1	Review and revise assumption notice and order (0.6);
Bruno	00/22/21		correspondence with S. Piraino, AlixPartners, and others regarding same (0.5).
Masaro, Matthew Bruno	09/23/21	0.7	Correspondence with AlixPartners and others regarding contract assumption and rejection.
Piraino, Stephen D.	09/23/21	0.4	Correspondence with Aeroméxico team regarding vendor issues.
Katz, Michael	09/24/21	0.3	Call with AlixPartners and Aeroméxico regarding contract assumption.
Masaro, Matthew Bruno	09/24/21	0.7	Correspondence with AlixPartners and others regarding contract assumptions.
Katz, Michael	09/28/21	0.1	Correspondence with Aeroméxico regarding contract questions.
Steinberg, Richard J.	09/28/21	0.6	Call with AlixPartners regarding contracts and cash payments.
Katz, Michael	09/29/21	0.8	Call with Aeroméxico and AlixPartners regarding outstanding vendor escalations.
Total AM170	. Ainoueft	13.5	
Customer/Vendor/No Lease/Non-Aircraft C Issues			
AM180 Employee/Per	neion leeuge		
Piraino, Stephen D.	09/21/21	0.6	Correspondence with Willis Towers regarding compensation
, сторо 2.	00,22		issues (0.4); correspondence with R. Arnold regarding same (0.2).
Piraino, Stephen D.	09/22/21	1.2	Call with Willis Towers regarding executive compensation issues (0.2); email with same regarding same (0.2); review executive compensation research (0.4); call with Rothschild and Willis Towers regarding executive compensation issues (0.4).
Piraino, Stephen D.	09/23/21	0.2	Correspondence with M. Masaro and other regarding potential Management Incentive Plan ("MIP").
Crandall, Jeffrey P.	09/24/21	0.2	Review executive compensation issues.
Piraino, Stephen D.	09/24/21	0.2	Correspondence with M. Masaro regarding executive
.	00/05/5		compensation matters.
Crandall, Jeffrey P.	09/26/21	0.3	Call with S. Piraino and others regarding executive compensation issues.
Piraino, Stephen D.	09/26/21	0.2	Call with J. Crandall and others regarding executive compensation issues.
Crandall, Jeffrey P.	09/29/21	0.5	Review presentation on proposed MIP (0.4); correspondence with K. Ginder regarding same (0.1).
Piraino, Stephen D.	09/29/21	0.9	Call with Aeroméxico and Willis Towers regarding executive compensation issues (0.7); correspondence with K. Ginder regarding same (0.2).
Piraino, Stephen D.	09/30/21	0.1	Email with T. Graulich regarding executive compensation issues.
Total AM180 Employed	ee/Pension	4.4	
AM190 Financing Huebner, Marshall S.	09/01/21	1.4	Call with Aeroméxico and counsel to potential exit financing provider regarding exit issues. 29

Time Detail By Project			
Name	Date	Hours	Narrative
Jerrard, Erik	09/01/21	2.1	Email with Davis Polk restructuring team regarding exit financing Non-Disclosure Agreements (0.7); email same regarding response to mediation communications (0.4); analyze exit financing process issues (1.0).
McClammy, James I.	09/01/21	0.8	Call with Davis Polk team and Creditors Committee counsel regarding bidder issues.
Melcer, Moshe	09/01/21	0.3	Coordinate upcoming meditation session.
Piraino, Stephen D.	09/01/21	0.4	Email with Davis Polk team regarding mediation.
Steinberg, Richard J.	09/01/21	0.1	Email with G. Agre regarding exit financing Non-Disclosure Agreement.
Borchardt, Leo	09/02/21	1.2	Review and discuss with A. Simmonds Rothschild proposal re: equity issuance.
Graulich, Timothy	09/02/21	4.6	Call with Judge Lane regarding mediation (0.5); attend mediation (0.8); review and revise mediation proposal (3.3).
Huebner, Marshall S.	09/02/21	1.7	Attend mediation (0.4); call with counsel to joint bidders and emails with bondholder counsel (0.5); correspondence with T. Graulich regarding exit financing issues (0.3); call with Aeroméxico regarding exit financing process (0.5).
Jerrard, Erik	09/02/21	2.1	Attend mediation (0.4); analyze schedule 2.12 regarding next mediation steps (1.2); attend daily contingency update call with Aeroméxico and Rothschild (0.5).
McClammy, James I.	09/02/21	2.2	Review Apollo letter and exit financing materials (1.2); attend mediation (1.0).
Melcer, Moshe	09/02/21	0.9	Email with T. Graulich and S. Piraino regarding meditation (0.5); attend mediation (0.4).
Piraino, Stephen D.	09/02/21	0.9	Attend daily contingency update call with Aeroméxico and Rothschild (0.5); attend mediation (0.4).
Rincon, Cristina M.	09/02/21	0.4	Attend mediation.
Simmonds,	09/02/21	1.1	Review and comment on Rothschild proposal regarding equity
Alexander W.			issuance upon emergence
Steinberg, Richard J.	09/02/21	0.1	Email with potential financing party regarding exit financing Non-Disclosure Agreements.
Szanzer, Steven Z.	09/02/21	0.5	Attend mediation.
Graulich, Timothy	09/03/21	5.7	Call with L. Donahue regarding mediation (0.6); review revised exit financing commitment letters (3.4); revised proposed settlement (1.7).
Huebner, Marshall S.	09/03/21	2.7	Correspondence with Aeroméxico and other advisers regarding exit financing issues (1.4); correspondence with T. Graulich, H. Parkhill and counsel to joint bidders regarding same (1.1); email with Davis Polk team regarding updated bid (0.2).
Jerrard, Erik	09/03/21	2.0	Attend daily contingency update call with Aeroméxico and Rothschild (0.8); coordinate execution of exit financing Non-Disclosure Agreements (0.9); correspondence with S. Piraino regarding daily contingency call (0.3).
Piraino, Stephen D.	09/03/21	2.9	Call with Cleary Gottlieb exit financing (0.4); review amended exit financing document (1.7); attend daily contingency update call with Aeroméxico and Rothschild (0.8).
Rincon, Cristina M. Szanzer, Steven Z.	09/03/21 09/03/21	0.1 0.8	Review email to Judge Lane regarding mediation. Attend daily contingency update call with Aeroméxico and
Borchardt, Leo	09/04/21	0.7	Rothschild. Review revised term sheet (0.4); correspondence with Davis Polk team regarding same (0.4).
Huebner, Marshall S.	09/04/21	0.3	Email with Davis Polk team regarding exit-financing issues.
Jackson, Vanessa L. Jerrard, Erik	09/04/21 09/04/21	0.6 2.5	Attend conference call with Rothschild (0.6). Attend daily contingency update call with Aeroméxico and

		Time	Detail By Project
Name	Date	Hours	Narrative
			Rothschild (0.6); analyze proposed exit financing commitment
Simmonds,	09/04/21	0.8	documents (1.9). Review revised exit financing equity commitment letter (0.4);
Alexander W.	00/01/21	0.0	correspondence with L. Borchardt, S. Piraino, and E. Jerrard
	00/05/04	4.0	regarding same (0.4).
Huebner, Marshall S.	09/05/21	1.3	Correspondence with T. Graulich, L. Donahue and counsel to joint bidders regarding exit financing (0.7); email with Davis
			Polk team regarding same (0.6).
Jerrard, Erik	09/05/21	2.0	Review and revise presentation on options timing (1.6); email
			with T. Graulich and R. Steinberg regarding same (0.4).
Graulich, Timothy	09/06/21	2.2	Call with H. Parkhill regarding final valuation materials (0.6);
			call with A. Conesa regarding same (0.8); correspondence with S. Piraino and E. Jerrard regarding Plan (0.8).
Huebner, Marshall S.	09/06/21	1.6	Correspondence with Davis Polk team and others regarding
			exit financing issues.
Jerrard, Erik	09/06/21	5.0	Email with potential bidders regarding exit financing Non-
			Disclosure Agreements (0.3); review and revise financing materials and next steps recommendations for Restructuring
			Committee (3.4); email with co-advisors regarding same (0.4);
			update exit financing timeline (0.9).
Graulich, Timothy	09/07/21	1.5	Call with A. Conesa regarding final valuation materials (1.2);
Jerrard, Erik	09/07/21	6.1	call with counsel to potential investor regarding same (0.3). Correspondence with S. Piraino regarding exit financing
Jenaiu, Liik	09/07/21	0.1	updates and timing (1.0); extensive analysis of exit financing
			process and timing (2.0); summarize same (2.1); attend daily
			contingency update call with Aeroméxico and Rothschild (1.0).
Piraino, Stephen D.	09/07/21	1.7	Call with counsel to joint proponents regarding exit financing
			(0.8); attend daily contingency update call with Aeroméxico and Rothschild (0.9).
Garg, Paavani	09/08/21	6.1	Revise exit financing motion.
Graulich, Timothy	09/08/21	2.8	Call with A. Conesa and R. Sanchez Baker regarding final
			valuation materials (0.9); call with P. Tomasco regarding mediation (0.6); call with S. Piraino regarding final valuation
			materials (0.8); call with L. Donahue regarding final valuation
			materials (0.5).
Jerrard, Erik	09/08/21	6.0	Correspondence with T. Graulich and S. Piraino regarding exit
			financing process (1.6); call with S. Piraino and Rothschild
			regarding same (0.5); email with Davis Polk Corporate and Finance teams regarding same (0.6); review and revise exit
			financing motion (1.9); email with P. Garg and S. Piraino
			regarding same (0.6); attend daily contingency update call
Dinaina Ctanban D	00/00/04	0.7	with Aeroméxico and Rothschild (0.8).
Piraino, Stephen D.	09/08/21	3.7	Correspondence with E. Jerrard and T. Graulich regarding exit financing process (1.6); call with E. Jerrard and Rothschild
			regarding same (0.5); correspondence with P. Garg and E.
			Jerrard regarding exit financing motion (0.6); Attend daily
Plance Maurice	00/00/04	0.0	contingency update call with Aeroméxico and Rothschild (1.0).
Blanco, Maurice	09/09/21	8.0	Correspondence with Davis Polk team regarding exit financing debt documents and related term sheets.
Garg, Paavani	09/09/21	0.7	Review and revise exit financing motion.
Graulich, Timothy	09/09/21	3.6	Call with A. Conesa and R. Sanchez Baker regarding final
			valuation materials (1.0); review and revise final valuation
Huebner, Marshall S.	09/09/21	2.0	materials (2.6). Call with Aeroméxico, counsel to joint bidders and stakeholder
aca.ioi, maioriali o.	00,00, <u>2</u> 1	2.0	regarding potential exit alternatives (1.8); correspondence with
			T. Graulich regarding bids (0.2).
			31

		Time	Detail By Project
Name	Date	Hours	Narrative
Jackson, Vanessa L.	09/09/21	2.7	Attend daily contingency update call with Aeroméxico and
Jerrard, Erik	09/09/21	8.9	Rothschild (0.7); review proposed exit documents (2.0). Correspondence with T. Graulich regarding exit financing process (0.7); call with S. Piraino regarding same (0.4); summarize requirements of section 2.12 (0.8); analyze exit financing debt issues list (0.9); draft email summary of same (1.2); extensive drafting of final valuation materials (4.1); attendadily contingency update call with Aeroméxico and
Piraino, Stephen D.	09/09/21	1.6	Rothschild (0.8). Call with E. Jerrard regarding exit financing process (0.4); email with counsel to financing parties regarding same (0.4); attend daily contingency update call with Aeroméxico and Rothschild (0.8).
Troconis, Adela	09/09/21	2.7	Correspondence with V. Jackson regarding exit financing debt commitment documents (0.3); review debt commitment papers (2.4).
Bane, Abraham	09/10/21	2.7	Draft motion to shorten exit financing (2.3); review exit financing motion (0.3); correspondence with E. Jerrard regarding same (0.1).
Borchardt, Leo	09/10/21	1.2	
Jerrard, Erik	09/10/21	7.4	Correspondence with T. Graulich and S. Piraino regarding exit financing (1.1); review and revise final valuation materials (4.5); coordinate filing and delivery of same with S. Piraino and Rothschild (0.7); email with Davis Polk Corporate and Debt teams regarding exit financing commitment papers (0.8); correspondence with L. Borchardt regarding exit financing fees (0.3).
Piraino, Stephen D.	09/10/21	3.3	Extensive correspondence with Davis Polk team regarding final valuation materials and related matters (2.3); coordinate finalization of final valuation materials with E. Jerrard and others (1.0).
Simmonds,	09/10/21	0.4	Review exit financing equity commitment letter.
Alexander W. Troconis, Adela	09/10/21	0.1	Email with Davis Polk Finance team regarding exit financing debt commitment papers.
Huebner, Marshall S. Jerrard, Erik	09/11/21 09/11/21	0.2 2.3	Email with Davis Polk team regarding DIP conversion issues. Review and revise exit financing motion (1.8); review potential cleansing obligations (0.3); email with potential exit financing providers regarding same (0.2).
McClammy, James I.	09/11/21	0.3	Correspondence with Davis Polk team regarding final valuation.
Garg, Paavani	09/12/21	0.6	Correspondence with T. Graulich, S. Piraino, and E. Jerrard regarding exit financing motion.
Jerrard, Erik	09/12/21	8.2	Review and revise exit financing motion (5.8); correspondence with T. Graulich and S. Piraino regarding same (0.6); correspondence with S. Piraino regarding DIP credit agreement (0.2); analyze DIP credit agreement (0.7); email with T. Graulich regarding exit financing (0.4); email with T. Graulich regarding Board approval of exit process (0.5).
McClammy, James I.	09/12/21	0.9	Call with Davis Polk team and Morris Nichols regarding exit financing issues.
Graulich, Timothy	09/13/21	5.4	Call with H. Parkhill and L. Donahue regarding joint proposal (0.8); call with M. Brod regarding same (0.4); call with J. Brody

		Time	Detail By Project
Name	Date	Hours	Narrative
Huebner, Marshall S.	09/13/21	0.4	regarding same (0.5); call with D. Botter regarding exit financing fee motion (0.5); call with A. Conesa and R. Sanchez Baker regarding exit financing next steps (0.8); review and revise letter to Apollo (2.4). Email with Davis Polk team regarding final evaluation
,			materials letter.
Jerrard, Erik	09/13/21	5.3	Call with Cleary Gottlieb regarding final evaluation materials (0.6); email with Davis Polk Corporate and Finance teams regarding exit financing updates (0.7); correspondence with C. Fischer regarding same (0.3); review and revise exit-financing documents (2.1); email with M. Blanco regarding notes issues (0.4); attend daily contingency update call with Aeroméxico and Rothschild (1.2).
Katz, Michael	09/13/21	0.1	Review M. Blanco's comments to exit financing debt commitment papers.
Melcer, Moshe	09/13/21	0.1	Review letter regarding final evaluation materials.
Piraino, Stephen D.	09/13/21	3.3	Correspondence with T. Graulich and E. Jerrard regarding exit financing issues (0.7); call with Cleary Gottlieb regarding final valuation materials (0.3); call with Aeroméxico and co-advisors regarding exit financing issues (0.6); call with M. Brod regarding same (0.3); call with J. Wallden regarding same (0.4); attend daily contingency update call with Aeroméxico and Rothschild (1.0) (partial attendance).
Rincon, Cristina M.	09/13/21	0.3	Review letter regarding final evaluation materials.
Blanco, Maurice	09/14/21	0.6	Correspondence with Aeroméxico regarding exit-financing issues.
Ford, Stephen	09/14/21	1.1	Review and revise exit financing Non-Disclosure Agreement.
Jackson, Vanessa L. Jerrard, Erik	09/14/21 09/14/21	3.1 8.4	Review exit financing commitment documents. Email with Cleary Gottlieb regarding final valuation materials (0.4); review and revise exit financing motion (3.6); email with counsel to stakeholder regarding exit financing process (0.9); call with R. Sanchez Baker, R. Arnold, S. Alessio, and Davis Polk Finance and Restructuring teams regarding exit financing debt commitment papers (0.4); analyze debt term sheet revised draft (1.8); email with Davis Polk Corporate and Finance teams regarding exit financing process (1.3).
Katz, Michael	09/14/21	5.0	
Piraino, Stephen D. Piraino, Stephen D.	09/14/21 09/14/21	0.8 1.1	Call with counsel to joint proponents regarding exit financing. Attend daily contingency update call with Aeroméxico and
Rincon, Cristina M.	09/14/21	0.2	Rothschild. Correspondence with J. McClammy regarding final valuation materials letter (0.1); email with S. Piraino regarding final valuation materials (0.1).
Simmonds, Alexander W.	09/14/21	0.7	Call with R. Sanchez Baker, R. Arnold, S. Alessio, and Davis Polk Finance and Restructuring teams regarding exit financing

		Time	Detail By Project
Name	Date	Hours	Narrative
Troconis, Adela	09/14/21	1.0	debt commitment papers (0.4); correspondence with E. Jerrard regarding exit financing issues (0.3). Call with R. Sanchez Baker, R. Arnold, S. Alessio, and Davis Polk Finance and Restructuring teams regarding exit financing debt commitment papers (0.4); review and comment on exit
Borchardt, Leo	09/15/21	1.0	financing debt commitment papers (0.6). Review exit financing equity commitment documents (0.5); call with ad hoc group and UCC regarding ad hoc group exit
Ford, Stephen	09/15/21	3.8	financing proposal and pathway to implementation (0.5). Coordinate execution of exit financing Non-Disclosure Agreement (1.0) draft outline to Apollo letter (1.5); review material regarding same (1.0); correspondence with E. Jerrard
Graulich, Timothy	09/15/21	7.1	regarding same (0.3). Call with Judge Lane regarding mediation (0.7); call with joint bidders regarding exit financing proposal (0.7); review revised exit financing proposal (2.4); call with J. Brody regarding exit financing (0.4); call with A. Conesa regarding same (0.7); review revise exit financing commitment letters (2.2).
Huebner, Marshall S.	09/15/21	3.4	Correspondence with stakeholders, Aeroméxico, Rothschild, and Davis Polk team regarding exit economics and structuring options.
Jerrard, Erik	09/15/21	5.6	Call with advisors to joint bidders and Davis Polk Finance team regarding exit financing commitment papers (0.7); email with V. Jackson and M. Blanco regarding same (1.0); review Creditors Committee comments to exit financing papers (2.1); call with counsel to potential exit financing provider regarding same (0.4); correspondence with T. Graulich regarding same (0.8); attend daily contingency update call with Aeroméxico and Rothschild (0.6).
Katz, Michael	09/15/21	0.9	Correspondence with counsel to stakeholder regarding investor group proposal (0.7); correspondence with Davis Polk team regarding same (0.1); correspondence with D. Larenz regarding status of exit financing transaction (0.1).
McClammy, James I.	09/15/21	2.5	Review exit financing and valuation materials (1.8); correspondence with T. Graulich, D. Abbot, and others regarding Apollo issues (0.7).
Simmonds, Alexander W.	09/15/21	1.1	• • • • • • • • • • • • • • • • • • • •
Troconis, Adela	09/15/21	0.7	Call with advisors to joint bidders and Davis Polk Finance team regarding exit financing commitment papers.
Weigel, Heather	09/15/21	0.3	Call with advisors to joint bidders and Davis Polk Finance team regarding exit financing commitment papers (partial attendance).
Borchardt, Leo	09/16/21	0.8	Review comments to exit financing equity commitment documents (0.6); correspondence with A. Simmonds regarding same (0.2).
Huebner, Marshall S.	09/16/21	0.9	Review letter from Director (0.3); correspondence with H. Parkhill and T. Graulich regarding same (0.3); calculate regarding same (0.3).
Jerrard, Erik	09/16/21	5.4	Correspondence with T. Graulich regarding exit financing (0.3); call with R. Arnold regarding same (0.2); review Creditors Committee's comments to exit financing term sheet (1.3); email with Davis Polk Corporate team regarding same (0.4); review and revise exit financing motion (3.2).

		Time	Detail By Project
Name	Date	Hours	Narrative
Katz, Michael	09/16/21	0.5	Email with Sainz Abogados regarding open tax issue (0.2); correspondence with Akin Gump regarding exit financing debt commitment question (0.2); correspondence with A. Troconis regarding same (0.1).
Simmonds, Alexander W.	09/16/21	1.2	Correspondence with A. Troconis regarding exit financing debt commitment (0.3); review Creditors Committee, AlixPartners, and E. Jerrard comments to exit financing commitment term sheet (0.7); correspondence with E. Jerrard regarding same (0.2).
Bane, Abraham	09/17/21	4.4	Review exit financing commitment documents (1.1); correspondence with E. Jerrard regarding same (0.2); review T. Graulich comments to exit financing motion (0.6); correspondence with E. Jerrard regarding same (0.1); review and revise same (2.4).
Ford, Stephen	09/17/21	1.0	Review and revise exit financing Non-Disclosure Agreement (0.5); review precedent exit financing non-disclosure agreements regarding same (0.5).
Jerrard, Erik	09/17/21	3.3	Call with R. Sanchez Baker and co-advisors regarding exit commitment term sheet (0.3); correspondence with T. Graulich regarding exit financing process (0.4); call with A. Feld regarding same (0.3); email with Akin Gump regarding exit financing (0.4); correspondence with M. Masaro and R. Steinberg regarding shareholder indemnity (0.3); call with S. Alessio Robles and others regarding same (0.6); attend daily contingency update call with Aeroméxico and Rothschild (1.0).
Rincon, Cristina M.	09/17/21	0.5	Review emails regarding letter to Apollo (0.2); review same (0.3).
Weigel, Heather	09/17/21	1.5	Review current draft of equity term sheet (0.8); correspondence with Aeroméxico and Davis Polk teams regarding exit financing term sheet and next steps (0.7).
Graulich, Timothy	09/18/21	3.7	Call with D. Dunne regarding exit financing proposal (0.5); review and revise letter to Apollo (3.2).
Huebner, Marshall S.	09/18/21	0.3	Email with third-parties regarding mediation and exit financing calculations.
Jerrard, Erik	09/18/21	1.9	Correspondence with T. Graulich to discuss exit financing process (1.0); correspondence with A. Bane regarding exit financing motion (0.2); email with co-advisors regarding same (0.7).
McClammy, James I.	09/18/21	0.7	Correspondence with Davis Polk team regarding exit financing issues.
Bane, Abraham	09/19/21	2.2	Review V. Jackson's comments to exit financing motion (0.5); review and revise same (1.6); correspondence with E. Jerrard regarding same (0.1).
Graulich, Timothy	09/19/21	2.6	Call with D. Dunne and J. Zinman regarding exit financing (0.5); call with H. Parkhill regarding exit financing proposal (0.7); call with H. Parkhill regarding same (1.4).
Huebner, Marshall S.	09/19/21	2.0	Correspondence with Rothschild, counsel for creditors, T. Graulich, and others regarding exit financing issues (1.0); review of term sheets regarding financing alternatives (1.0).
Jackson, Vanessa L. Jerrard, Erik	09/19/21 09/19/21	1.9 3.7	Review and revise exit financing motion. Correspondence with T. Graulich regarding exit financing (1.0); review and revise same (2.2); email with V. Jackson regarding exit financing (0.5).
Huebner, Marshall S. Jerrard, Erik	09/20/21 09/20/21	1.3 4.2	Email with creditors regarding exit options. Call with joint bidders advisors regarding exit financing process (0.7); review and revise exit financing documents 35

		Time	Detail By Project
Name	Date	Hours	Narrative
Masaro, Matthew	09/20/21	0.4	(1.1); email with Davis Polk Corporate and Finance teams regarding exit financing process (0.8); analyze Apollo letter (0.8); attend daily contingency update call with Aeroméxico and Rothschild (0.8). Correspondence with M. Melcer, S. Piraino, and Chambers
Bruno	00/20/2	• • • • • • • • • • • • • • • • • • • •	regarding CEBURES amended order.
Piraino, Stephen D.	09/20/21	3.1	Email with T. Graulich regarding shareholder support agreement (0.2); correspondence with E. Jerrard regarding exit financing issues (0.4); call with joint proponents regarding same (0.9); review Apollo letter (0.3); review and revise relevant event (0.5); attend daily contingency update call with Aeroméxico and Rothschild (0.8).
Rincon, Cristina M.	09/20/21	1.3	Review letter to Apollo.
Hwang, Eric	09/21/21	2.8	Call with E. Jerrard and others regarding exit financing updates (0.5); review exit financing transaction materials (1.3); review exit financing motion (1.0).
Jerrard, Erik	09/21/21	5.5	Correspondence with T. Graulich regarding exit financing (0.7); review and comment on Mexican shareholder term sheet (1.7); call with E. Hwang and others regarding exit financing updates (0.5); email with E. Hwang regarding same (0.7); email with Davis Polk Corporate and Finance teams regarding exit financing negotiation status (0.8); call with Davis Polk Litigation team and Morris Nichols regarding Apollo letter (0.6); correspondence with S. Ford regarding Board Letter (0.5).
McClammy, James I.	09/21/21	1.6	Correspondence with Davis Polk team regarding exit financing issues (0.5); review materials regarding same (1.1).
Piraino, Stephen D.	09/21/21	1.3	Call with co-advisors regarding Apollo letter (0.6); correspondence with T. Graulich and E. Jerrard regarding exit financing issues (0.5) attend daily contingency update call with Aeroméxico and Rothschild (0.2) (partial attendance).
Rincon, Cristina M.	09/21/21	1.7	Correspondence with A. Parrot and R. Krishnan regarding Apollo letter (0.1); analyze issues regarding same (1.0); correspondence with J. McClammy regarding response to Apollo letter (0.1); email with E. Jerrard and S. Piraino regarding same (0.1); review Apollo letter (0.4).
Borchardt, Leo	09/22/21	0.4	, , , , , , , , , , , , , , , , , ,
Ford, Stephen	09/22/21	2.3	Review and revise letter to Apollo (2.0); coordinate execution of exit financing Non-Disclosure Agreement (0.3).
Graulich, Timothy	09/22/21	2.7	Correspondence with M. Huebner regarding exit financing (0.6); review and revise exit financing commitment letters (2.1).
Huebner, Marshall S.	09/22/21	1.4	Correspondence with T. Graulich and H. Parkhill regarding exit financing negotiations.
Hwang, Eric	09/22/21	0.9	Review revised draft of exit term sheet.
Jerrard, Erik	09/22/21	4.5	Correspondence with T. Graulich regarding exit financing (1.4); call with Akin Gump and Milbank regarding exit financing (0.8); email with T. Graulich regarding same (0.3); review exit financing equity commitment term sheet (2.0).
Katz, Michael	09/22/21	0.2	Correspondence with Akin Gump regarding updated exit financing commitment letters (0.1); review same (0.1).
Piraino, Stephen D.	09/22/21	2.6	Call with joint proponents regarding exit financing term sheets (0.8); correspondence with E. Jerrard regarding exit financing matters (0.3); review exit financing term sheets (0.7); attend daily contingency update call with Aeroméxico and Rothschild

		Time	Detail By Project
Name	Date	Hours	Narrative
Simmonds, Alexander W.	09/22/21	0.6	(0.8). Call with Akin Gump regarding Ad Hoc Group proposal (0.4) and correspondence with Davis Polk team regarding same (0.2).
Weigel, Heather	09/22/21	8.0	Call with Akin Gump, Davis Polk, Milbank, Ducera, and Sainz Abogados teams regarding term sheets and next steps.
Ford, Stephen	09/23/21	5.5	Review and revise Board letter (2.5); review DIP credit agreement and order regarding debtor obligations (2.0); review and revise Plan (1.0).
Hwang, Eric	09/23/21	1.0	Review revised draft of exit financing term sheet.
Jerrard, Erik	09/23/21	2.7	Call with S. Piraino and others regarding exit financing (0.6); call with Quinn Emanuel regarding exit financing issues (0.7); review term sheets regarding same (0.7); attend daily contingency update call with Aeroméxico and Rothschild (0.7).
Krishnan, Rahul	09/23/21	3.3	Review and revise letter to Apollo (1.6); correspondence with C. Rincon regarding same (0.2); review correspondence with Apollo regarding DIP credit agreement (1.5).
Piraino, Stephen D.	09/23/21	4.9	Attend daily contingency update call with Aeroméxico and Rothschild (0.2) (partial attendance); call with Quinn Emanuel regarding exit financing issues (0.7); call with Aeroméxico team regarding same (0.8); correspondence with E. Jerrard regarding exit financing issues (0.3); call with E. Jerrard and others regarding same (0.6); draft exit financing term sheet (1.0); email with Davis Polk team regarding exit financing matters (0.2); review Apollo letters (0.2); review exit financing issues list (0.7); attend daily contingency update call with
Rincon, Cristina M.	09/23/21	1.4	Aeroméxico and Rothschild (0.2) (partial attendance). Analyze potential issues regarding exit financing (1.0); review letter to Apollo (0.4).
Huebner, Marshall S.	09/24/21	3.4	Correspondence with Management, Rothschild, T. Graulich, S. Piraino and creditor representatives regarding closing exit financing issues (2.6); review and revise exit financing term sheet and grid of open issues regarding same (0.8).
Jerrard, Erik	09/24/21	3.0	Attend daily contingency update call with Aeroméxico and Rothschild (0.6); review exit financing consensual deal scenarios (0.7); review revised exit financing commitment documents (1.3); review Mexican shareholder deal issues list (0.4).
McClammy, James I.	09/24/21	2.3	Review letter to Apollo and comments regarding same (0.6); review underlying documents regarding exit financing issues and strategy (1.7).
Piraino, Stephen D.	09/24/21	5.0	Correspondence with T. Graulich regarding exit financing (0.2); correspondence with E. Jerrard regarding same (0.5); call with Management and co-advisors regarding same (0.3); correspondence with M. Huebner regarding same (0.2); review exit financing term sheet (0.8); prepare and revise exit financing issues list chart (2.8); correspondence with A. Sainz regarding exit financing issues (0.2).
Steinberg, Richard J.	09/24/21	0.3	Call with Glenn Acre regarding exit financing (0.2); email with Morris Nichols regarding same (0.1).
Troconis, Adela	09/24/21	0.5	Review exit financing debt commitment documents (0.2); draft issues list regarding same (0.3).
Huebner, Marshall S.	09/25/21	8.0	Correspondence with co-advisors regarding financing scenarios and equity valuation.
Huebner, Marshall S.	09/26/21	0.9	Correspondence with T. Graulich and others regarding exit financing (0.5); email with Aeroméxico regarding same (0.4).

		Time	Detail By Project
Name	Date	Hours	Narrative
Jerrard, Erik	09/26/21	5.0	Draft exit financing term sheet annex (3.9); email with Davis Polk team regarding same (0.5); call with Ducera and Akin Gump regarding exit financing issues (0.6).
Piraino, Stephen D.	09/26/21	0.9	Call with Ducera and Akin Gump regarding exit financing issues (0.6); correspondence with E. Jerrard regarding same (0.3).
Simmonds, Alexander W.	09/26/21	0.2	Correspondence with L. Borchardt regarding exit financing issues.
Bane, Abraham	09/27/21	0.6	Review exit financing party's comments to exit financing motion.
Blanco, Maurice	09/27/21	1.0	Review exit financing term sheet (0.5); review emails with Davis Polk team regarding same (0.5).
Borchardt, Leo	09/27/21	0.6	Prepare for and participate in call with Gibson Dunn regarding American depository receipt issuance.
Graulich, Timothy	09/27/21	3.4	Call with J. Brody regarding exit financing equity commitment letter (0.5); review revised exit financing equity commitment letter (2.2); call with J. Brody regarding American depository receipt structure (0.7).
Huebner, Marshall S.	09/27/21	2.3	Call with Aeroméxico and co-advisor regarding exit financing (0.7); correspondence with T. Graulich and others regarding same (1.0); review and revise materials regarding same (0.6).
Hwang, Eric	09/27/21	4.2	Review and revise exit financing motion (3.0); review and revise declaration (1.2).
Jackson, Vanessa L.	09/27/21	1.1	Review exit financing commitment documents
Jerrard, Erik	09/27/21	1.9	Attend daily contingency update call with Aeroméxico and Rothschild (1.0); call with counsel to exit financing provider regarding potential American depository receipt listing issue (0.5); call with Rothschild regarding exit financing term sheet (0.4).
Katz, Michael	09/27/21	0.4	Email with Sainz Abogados regarding outstanding issues with exit financing debt commitment letters (0.1); correspondence with Davis Polk Tax team regarding same (0.1); correspondence with L. Davaren and A. Troconis regarding same (0.2).
Piraino, Stephen D.	09/27/21	6.0	Attend daily contingency update call with Aeroméxico and Rothschild (0.8) (partial attendance); correspondence with T. Graulich and E. Jerrard regarding exit financing issues (0.8); call with Rothschild regarding same (0.4); correspondence with E. Jerrard regarding same (0.4); call with Gibson Dunn regarding fleet issues (0.3); call with Gibson Dunn regarding securities law issues (0.4); review and revise exit financing issues list (1.5); correspondence with T. Graulich and E. Jerrard regarding exit financing issues (1.4).
Simmonds, Alexander W.	09/27/21	0.9	Review exit financing term sheet (0.3); correspondence with E. Jerrard and L. Borchardt (0.2); call with Gibson Dunn, Sainz Abogados, and Davis Polk teams regarding American depository receipt (0.4).
Troconis, Adela	09/27/21	0.8	Review exit financing debt commitment documents (0.4); prepare issues list regarding same (0.4).
Blanco, Maurice	09/28/21	0.3	Correspondence with Davis Polk team regarding exit financing.
Borchardt, Leo	09/28/21	0.7	Email with Davis Polk teams regarding exit financing issues.
Graulich, Timothy	09/28/21	1.5	Correspondence with J. McClammy regarding valuation (0.7); call with Judge Lane regarding mediation (0.8).
Hwang, Eric	09/28/21	5.4	Review and revise motion and declaration for exit financing (1.6); review and revise exit financing equity commitment letter

	Time Detail By Project			
Name	Date	Hours	Narrative	
			(3.8).	
Jackson, Vanessa L.	09/28/21	1.5	Review and revise exit financing commitment documents.	
Jerrard, Erik	09/28/21	1.7	Review exit financing commitment letter (1.3); email with	
			Davis Polk Corporate team regarding same (0.4).	
Katz, Michael	09/28/21	0.6	Prepare signature page for exit financing debt commitment letters (0.1); correspondence with Aeroméxico regarding same (0.1); email with Davis Polk Tax team regarding same (0.3); correspondence with Aeroméxico regarding exit financing	
			commitment letters (0.1).	
McClammy, James I.	09/28/21	0.8	Review valuation materials (0.4); call with Davis Polk team regarding valuation issues (0.4).	
Piraino, Stephen D.	09/28/21	3.8	Attend daily contingency update call with Aeroméxico and Rothschild (0.8); correspondence with E. Jerrard regarding exit financing and related issues (0.9); correspondence with T. Graulich regarding same (0.4); correspondence with same and E. Jerrard regarding same (1.7).	
Rincon, Cristina M.	09/28/21	0.2	Correspondence with J. McClammy and Davis Polk	
ranoon, Onsula IVI.	0012012 I	0.2	Restructuring team regarding valuation materials.	
Steinberg, Richard J.	09/28/21	0.2	Call with Rothschild regarding valuation.	
Troconis, Adela	09/28/21	1.0	Email regarding exit financing debt commitment documents	
Trocoms, Addia	03/20/21	1.0	(0.2); revise exit financing debt commitment documents (0.8).	
Borchardt, Leo	09/29/21	1.1	Review revise exit financing debt commitment documents (0.0).	
Graulich, Timothy	09/29/21	3.0	Call with J. Scherer regarding status of joint bidders'	
,	00,20,2		negotiations with investors (0.5); call with H. Parkhill and R. Arnold regarding same (0.7); call with P. Tomasco regarding settlement term sheet (0.8); call with Judge Lane regarding mediation (1.0).	
Huebner, Marshall S.	09/29/21	0.7	Correspondence with Davis Polk Finance team regarding exit financing issues.	
Hwang, Eric	09/29/21	4.0	Review comments to exit financing motion (0.4); review and review exit financing equity commitment letter (3.1); call with Quinn Emmanuel regarding exit financing and Plan (0.5).	
Jackson, Vanessa L.	09/29/21	0.5	Call with Quinn regarding exit financing and Plan.	
Jerrard, Erik	09/29/21	2.4	Review and review exit financing term sheet exhibit (1.3); distribute same to counterparties (0.3); attend daily contingency update call with Aeroméxico and Rothschild (0.8).	
Katz, Michael	09/29/21	0.7	Correspondence with Akin Gump regarding exit financing commitment letters.	
Piraino, Stephen D.	09/29/21	2.8	Attend daily contingency update call with Aeroméxico and Rothschild (0.7); call with Rothschild and Davis Polk team regarding exit financing (0.9); correspondence with E. Jerrard regarding same (0.4); call with Creditors Committee professionals regarding same (0.8).	
Rincon, Cristina M.	09/29/21	0.9	Call with Rothschild and Davis Polk team regarding exit financing.	
Simmonds, Alexander W.	09/29/21	0.6	Review exit financing commitment letter (0.3); correspondence with E. Hwang regarding same (0.3).	
Steinberg, Richard J.	09/29/21	0.8	Call with Quinn Emmanuel regarding exit financing and Plan (0.5); correspondence with S. Piraino regarding same (0.2); correspondence with E. Jerrard regarding same (0.1).	
Troconis, Adela	09/29/21	1.0	Email with Rothschild and AlixPartners regarding surety bonds (0.2); call with Akin Gump, Nader, Gibson Dunn, Sainz Abogados, Chevez and Davis Polk team regarding tax treatment of exit notes (0.8).	
Blanco, Maurice	09/30/21	0.7	Review revised exit financing term sheet.	
Borchardt, Leo	09/30/21	0.8	Review revised exit financing documents.	

		Time	Detail By Project
Name	Date	Hours	Narrative
Graulich, Timothy	09/30/21	4.1	Call with M. Williams regarding settlement (0.5); call with H. Parkhill regarding settlement proposal (0.8); review revise exit financing commitment letters (2.8).
Hwang, Eric	09/30/21	3.6	Review comments to exit financing motion and declaration (2.0); review and revise same (0.3); revise motion to shorten (0.8); review Plan language on exit financing (0.5).
Jackson, Vanessa L. Jerrard, Erik	09/30/21 09/30/21	1.2 3.0	Review and revise exit financing commitment documents. Email with V. Jackson and A. Troconis regarding DIP credit agreement implications (0.4); analyze DIP credit agreement (0.8); review and revise exit financing motion and related
Katz, Michael	09/30/21	0.2	pleadings (1.8). Correspondence regarding exit financing timing update (0.1); correspondence with V. Jackson regarding exit financing
Melcer, Moshe Piraino, Stephen D.	09/30/21 09/30/21	0.2 3.9	commitment letter (0.1). Review union claims. Attend daily contingency update call with Aeroméxico and Rothschild (0.8); correspondence with E. Jerrard regarding exit financing issues (0.5); call with Akin Gump and Ducera regarding same (0.8); correspondence with E. Jerrard and T. Graulich regarding exit financing issues (0.6); call with Ducera Milbank and Akin Gump regarding same (0.6); call with M. Brod regarding same (0.1); call with Gibson Dunn regarding same (0.5).
Steinberg, Richard J. Troconis, Adela	09/30/21 09/30/21	0.3 0.8	Review and revise exit financing term sheet. Review exit financing debt commitment documents (0.6); correspondence with A. Siman regarding tax implications of exit notes (0.2).
Total AM190 Financir	ng	391.2	,
AM200 General Case			
Altman, Olivia	09/01/21	0.9	File monthly operating reports (0.5); file Certificate of No Objection to CAE and CAE sealing (0.4).
Bane, Abraham	09/01/21	0.5	Attend weekly workstreams call with Davis Polk Restructuring team.
Dekhtyar, Mariya	09/01/21	0.4	Attend weekly workstreams call with Davis Polk Restructuring team (0.3) (partial attendance); review correspondence from A. Bane and E. Jerrard regarding final valuation update (0.1).
Garg, Paavani	09/01/21	0.5	Attend weekly workstreams call with Davis Polk Restructuring team.
Jerrard, Erik	09/01/21	1.5	Call regarding with J. Barsalona regarding case updates (0.6); review monthly operating report (0.3); attend weekly workstreams call with Davis Polk Restructuring team (0.6).
Melcer, Moshe	09/01/21	0.5	Attend weekly workstreams call with Davis Polk Restructuring team.
Piraino, Stephen D.	09/01/21	0.6	Attend weekly workstreams call with Davis Polk Restructuring team.
Steinberg, Richard J.	09/01/21	0.5	Attend weekly workstreams call with Davis Polk Restructuring team.
Szanzer, Steven Z.	09/01/21	1.0	Attend weekly workstream call with Davis Polk Restructuring team (0.5); review agenda regarding same (0.5).
Altman, Olivia Giddens, Magali	09/02/21 09/02/21	0.4 1.2	Review docket filings. Correspondence with J. Eisen regarding unredacted material (0.4); prepare and file Aeroméxico filings (0.5);
Jerrard, Erik	09/02/21	0.3	correspondence with M. Melcer regarding (0.3). Correspondence with S. Piraino regarding case updates (0.2);

		Time	Detail By Project
Name	Date	Hours	Narrative
			correspondence with R. Steinberg regarding same (0.1).
Piraino, Stephen D.	09/02/21	0.2	Correspondence with E. Jerrard regarding case updates.
Szanzer, Steven Z.	09/02/21	0.6	Attend weekly call with Creditors Committee advisors and
			Debtor co-advisors (AlixPartners, Skyworks, others).
Altman, Olivia	09/03/21	1.2	File removal extension motion (0.3); file Ex-Im documents
, -			(0.3); file motion to extend exclusivity periods (0.3);
			correspondence with Epiq regarding service (0.1).
Jerrard, Erik	09/03/21	0.7	Correspondence with S. Piraino regarding case update (0.2);
Jenard, Liik	03/03/21	0.7	review and finalize removal extension motion (0.5).
Diraina Stanhan D	00/02/24	0.5	
Piraino, Stephen D.	09/03/21	0.5	Correspondence with E. Jerrard regarding case updates.
Szanzer, Steven Z.	09/03/21	0.2	Review correspondence from Davis Polk team regarding case
			updates.
Melcer, Moshe	09/05/21	0.4	Correspondence with M. Dekhtyar regarding workstreams.
Melcer, Moshe	09/06/21	0.4	Revise case status summary.
Altman, Olivia	09/07/21	0.7	File notice of dismissal (0.3); coordinate service of unredacted
			documents (0.4).
Jerrard, Erik	09/07/21	2.7	Prepare for weekly workstreams call with Davis Polk
·			Restructuring team.
Piraino, Stephen D.	09/07/21	0.9	Correspondence with E. Jerrard regarding case updates.
Garg, Paavani	09/08/21	0.7	Attend weekly workstreams call with Davis Polk Restructuring
Carg, r davam	03/00/21	0.7	team (partial attendance).
Crauliah Timathy	09/08/21	1.0	Call with S. Piraino and E. Jerrard re: work streams
Graulich, Timothy		_	
Huebner, Marshall S.	09/08/21	0.4	Correspondence with T. Graulich regarding case updates
			(0.2); correspondence with Davis Polk team regarding same
			(0.2).
Jerrard, Erik	09/08/21	1.1	Attend weekly workstreams call with Davis Polk Restructuring
			team.
Masaro, Matthew	09/08/21	8.0	Attend weekly workstreams call with Davis Polk Restructuring
Bruno			team (partial attendance).
Piraino, Stephen D.	09/08/21	0.9	Attend weekly workstreams call with Davis Polk Restructuring
, 1			team.
Steinberg, Richard J.	09/08/21	0.8	Attend weekly workstreams call with Davis Polk Restructuring
etemberg, raenara e.	00/00/21	0.0	team.
Jerrard, Erik	09/09/21	1.6	Correspondence with S. Piraino regarding case updates (0.3)
Jenard, Liik	03/03/21	1.0	call with Rothschild regarding next steps (0.6); review draft
D: : 01 I D	00/00/04	0.0	relevant event (0.7).
Piraino, Stephen D.	09/09/21		Correspondence with E. Jerrard regarding case updates.
Steinberg, Richard J.	09/10/21	0.4	Correspondence with creditor and Aeroméxico regarding
			uncashed checks.
Jerrard, Erik	09/13/21	0.5	Call with J. Barsalona regarding case updates (0.3);
			correspondence with M. Melcer regarding same (0.2).
Piraino, Stephen D.	09/13/21	0.4	Correspondence with E. Jerrard regarding case updates.
Blanco, Maurice	09/14/21	0.7	Correspondence with Davis Polk team regarding case status.
Jerrard, Erik	09/14/21	0.6	Call with Aeroméxico and co-advisors regarding case updates
Melcer, Moshe	09/14/21	0.3	Revise case status summary.
Piraino, Stephen D.	09/14/21	0.1	Correspondence with E. Jerrard regarding case updates.
Steinberg, Richard J.	09/14/21	0.9	Prepare Certificate of No Objection for Ex-Im motion (0.7);
otomborg, Monard J.	00/14/21	0.9	email with Skyworks regarding same (0.2).
Dana Abraham	00/45/04	4.0	
Bane, Abraham	09/15/21	1.0	Attend weekly workstreams call with Davis Polk Restructuring
		_	team (partial attendance).
Blanco, Maurice	09/15/21	0.7	Email with Davis Polk team regarding case status.
Dekhtyar, Mariya	09/15/21	1.3	Attend weekly workstreams call with Davis Polk Restructuring
			team (partial attendance).
Ford, Stephen	09/15/21	1.0	Attend weekly workstreams call with Davis Polk Restructuring
•			team (partial attendance).
Garg, Paavani	09/15/21	1.7	Attend weekly workstreams call with Davis Polk Restructuring
5 ,			/1

	Time Detail By Project			
Name	Date	Hours	Narrative	
Graulich, Timothy	09/15/21	1.8	team. Attend weekly workstreams call with Davis Polk Restructuring	
·			team.	
Jerrard, Erik	09/15/21	4.8	Attend weekly workstreams calls with Davis Polk Restructuring team (1.8); prepare for same (1.8); update workstreams summary (0.7); correspondence with S. Szanzer regarding case updates (0.3); email with S. Piraino regarding same (0.2).	
Masaro, Matthew Bruno	09/15/21	0.9	Attend weekly workstreams call with Davis Polk Restructuring team (partial attendance).	
Melcer, Moshe	09/15/21	2.5	Review and revise case status summary (0.6); attend weekly workstreams call with Davis Polk Restructuring team (1.7); correspondence with M. Masaro regarding same (0.1); revise hearing cancellation notice (0.1).	
Steinberg, Richard J.	09/15/21	1.6	Attend weekly workstreams call with Davis Polk Restructuring team (partial attendance).	
Szanzer, Steven Z.	09/15/21	1.8	Attend weekly workstreams call with Davis Polk Restructuring team.	
Giddens, Magali	09/16/21	0.7	Correspondence with R. Steinberg regarding filing Certificates of No Objection to Ex-Im motion (0.1); prepare same for filing (0.1); file same (0.2); review same (0.1); review other filing (0.2).	
Huebner, Marshall S. Jerrard, Erik	09/16/21 09/16/21	0.3 2.2	Review emails regarding case background. Call with management and co-advisors regarding case updates (1.1); coordinate Certificates of No Objection submissions with Davis Polk Restructuring team (0.3); email with stakeholders regarding acceptable public filings (0.3);	
Dekhtyar, Mariya	09/17/21	0.2	analyze Non-Disclosure agreements relating to same (0.5). Review Rule 2019 filing (0.1); email with M. Melcer regarding same (0.1).	
Giddens, Magali	09/17/21	3.4	Prepare for September 20th Hearing (0.9); correspondence with M. Melcer and M. Masaro regarding Aeroméxico and advisor September 20th Hearing attendance (0.7); file hearing agenda (0.1); prepare ALC motion, sealing motion and declaration for filing (0.4); file same (0.3); review docket (1.0).	
Steinberg, Richard J.	09/17/21	0.4	Correspondence with Aeroméxico regarding uncashed checks.	
Blanco, Maurice	09/18/21	0.2	Review case status.	
Bane, Abraham	09/19/21	0.3	Review and revise Certificate of No Objection for removal motion (0.2); correspondence with M. Melcer and M. Dekhtyar regarding same (0.1).	
Dekhtyar, Mariya	09/19/21	1.7	Email with E. Jerrard regarding Certificate of No Objection for removal motion (0.3); correspondence with M. Melcer regarding same (0.3); draft Certificate of No Objection for removal motion (0.7); email with M. Melcer and A. Bane regarding same (0.1); prepare Certificate of No Objection for removal motion for filing (0.3).	
Giddens, Magali	09/19/21	2.1	Correspondence with S. Szanzer regarding September 20th Hearing attendance (0.1); correspondence with M. Masaro regarding same (0.2); register S. Szanzer regarding same (0.3); file amended September 20th Hearing agenda (0.2); file Certificates of No Objection (0.4); correspondence with Epiq	
Melcer, Moshe	09/19/21	0.5	regarding service (0.1); review docket filings (0.8). Correspondence with M. Dekhtyar regarding Certificates of No Objection for removal motion (0.3); review same (0.1); correspondence with M. Giddens regarding Certificates of No 42	

		Time	Detail By Project
Name	Date	Hours	Narrative
			Objection (0.1).
Pagnotta, Ariana	09/19/21	2.7	Submission of notice of revised order
Bane, Abraham	09/20/21	0.2	Correspondence with M. Melcer and Chambers regarding
			Certificate of No Objection for removal extension motion.
Dekhtyar, Mariya	09/20/21	0.1	Email with E. Jerrard and M. Melcer regarding Certificate of
			No Objection for removal extension motion.
Giddens, Magali	09/20/21	8.0	Correspondence with M. Melcer regarding submission of
			unredacted documents (0.2); correspondence with J. Eisen
–	00/00/0/		regarding same (0.1); review documents filed (0.5).
Jerrard, Erik	09/20/21	1.8	Call with S. Piraino regarding case updates (0.7); call with A.
			Schwartz regarding same (0.3); correspondence with T.
	00/00/0/		Graulich regarding same (0.8).
Melcer, Moshe	09/20/21	0.6	Email with Chambers regarding Certificate of No Objection to
			omnibus claims objections (0.4); email with Chambers
			regarding Certificate of No Objection for removal extension
Dinain - Otanban D	00/00/04	0.7	motion (0.2).
Piraino, Stephen D.	09/20/21	0.7	Call with E. Jerrard regarding case updates.
Steinberg, Richard J.	09/20/21	1.0	Correspondence with Davis Polk Restructuring team regarding
larged Frile	00/04/04	2.4	case workstreams.
Jerrard, Erik	09/21/21	2.1	Prepare for weekly call with Davis Polk Restructuring team
			(1.9); correspondence with S. Piraino regarding case updates
Piraina Stanhan D	00/21/21	1.2	(0.2).
Piraino, Stephen D.	09/21/21	1.3	Correspondence with E. Jerrard regarding case updates (0.9); correspondence with M. Masaro regarding same (0.2); email
			with S. Robles regarding same (0.2).
Dekhtyar, Mariya	09/22/21	1.2	Attend weekly workstreams call with Davis Polk Restructuring
Dekiliyai, Waliya	09/22/21	1.2	team (1.0) (partial attendance); email with A. Bane regarding
			same (0.1); email with same and M. Melcer regarding same
			(0.1).
Giddens, Magali	09/22/21	0.9	Review docket filings.
Graulich, Timothy	09/22/21	1.0	Attend weekly workstreams call with Davis Polk Restructuring
Oracinon, rimotry	00/22/21	1.0	team (partial attendance).
Green, Thomas S.	09/22/21	0.8	Attend weekly workstreams call with Davis Polk Restructuring
- ,			team (partial attendance).
Hwang, Eric	09/22/21	1.8	Attend weekly workstreams call with Davis Polk Restructuring
0 ,			team (1.5); correspondence with E. Jerrard regarding case
			workstreams (0.3).
Jerrard, Erik	09/22/21	1.5	Attend weekly workstreams call with Davis Polk Restructuring
			team.
Masaro, Matthew	09/22/21	1.6	Attend weekly workstreams call with Davis Polk Restructuring
Bruno			team.
Piraino, Stephen D.	09/22/21	2.2	Correspondence with T. Graulich, E. Jerrard and others
			regarding case status (1.5); correspondence with E. Jerrard
			regarding same (0.7).
Steinberg, Richard J.	09/22/21	1.5	Attend weekly workstreams call with Davis Polk Restructuring
			team.
Giddens, Magali	09/23/21	0.1	Correspondence with M. Melcer regarding September 20th
			Hearing transcript.
Jerrard, Erik	09/23/21	1.6	Call with A. Schwartz regarding case updates (0.5);
			correspondence with J. Eisen regarding case timeline (0.3);
	0010-1-1		email with T. Graulich regarding same (0.8).
Dekhtyar, Mariya	09/24/21	0.2	Correspondence with M. Melcer regarding hearing procedure.
Giddens, Magali	09/24/21	1.9	Correspondence with M. Melcer regarding filing Jupiter motion
			documents (0.1); prepare motion, sealing motion, and
			declaration for filing (0.4); file same (0.4); correspondence with
			Epiq regarding service of same (0.1); review documents (0.9).
			43

		Time	Detail By Project
Name	Date	Hours	Narrative
Jerrard, Erik	09/24/21	1.2	Correspondence with S. Piraino regarding case updates (0.4); correspondence with J. Eisen regarding hearing date and solicitation (0.2); email with T. Graulich and S. Piraino regarding same (0.6).
Altman, Olivia	09/27/21	0.4	Review July Monthly Fee Statement for filing (0.2); file same (0.2).
Jerrard, Erik	09/27/21	1.6	Correspondence with S. Piraino and T. Graulich regarding case updates (0.7); correspondence with T. Graulich regarding same (0.9).
Melcer, Moshe	09/27/21	0.6	Review case status summary.
Piraino, Stephen D.	09/27/21	0.2	Correspondence with E. Jerrard regarding case updates.
Giddens, Magali	09/28/21	0.3	Review docket and certain documents regarding case status.
Jerrard, Erik	09/28/21	1.3	Correspondence with S. Piraino regarding case updates.
Giddens, Magali	09/29/21	0.6	File notice of omnibus hearing (0.2); file notice of cancellation of October 1st Hearing (0.1); review docket (0.2); correspondence with Epiq regarding service (0.1).
Jerrard, Erik	09/29/21	1.9	Correspondence with J. Barsalona regarding case status (0.3); coordinate filing of hearing cancellation and omnibus hearing notice (0.4); correspondence with S. Piraino regarding case update (1.2).
Melcer, Moshe	09/29/21	0.3	Draft notice of cancellation for October 1st Hearing (0.2); draft notice of October 21st Hearing (0.1).
Altman, Olivia	09/30/21	0.5	File monthly operating reports.
Jerrard, Erik	09/30/21	3.7	Call with A. Schwartz regarding case updates (0.5); correspondence with S. Piraino regarding case updates (1.4); call with Akin Gump and Rothschild regarding cleansing (0.7); correspondence with T. Graulich and S. Piraino regarding case updates (1.1)
Piraino, Stephen D. Steinberg, Richard J.	09/30/21 09/30/21	0.5 0.5	Call with Rothschild and AlixPartners regarding cleansing. Call with Rothschild and AlixPartners regarding cleansing materials.
Total AM200 General Administration	Case	100.6	
AM210 Non-DPW Ret			
Bane, Abraham	09/02/21	0.9	Correspondence with Morris Nichols regarding potential parties in interest (0.3); correspondence with E. Jerrard regarding same (0.1); review and revise third removal extension motion (0.3); correspondence with T. Graulich and E. Jerrard regarding same (0.2).
Jerrard, Erik	09/07/21	2.5	Email with T. Graulich regarding KPMG (0.4); research KPMG retention issue (1.7); email with AlixPartners regarding fee application timing (0.4).
Jerrard, Erik	09/14/21	0.7	Email with co-professionals regarding fee applications and related process.
Jerrard, Erik	09/15/21	0.5	Call with D. Abbott to discuss retention (0.2); review retention papers related to potential retention issue (0.3).
Masaro, Matthew Bruno	09/20/21	0.1	Correspondence with Aeroméxico regarding ordinary course retention.
Jerrard, Erik	09/23/21	0.9	Call with Aeroméxico regarding KPMG retention (0.6); call with J. Barsalona regarding same (0.3).
Jerrard, Erik	09/24/21	0.6	Call with J. Barsalona regarding retentions (0.3); email with J. Weiss regarding same (0.3).
Jerrard, Erik	09/27/21	1.2	Review A. Schwartz's comments to KMPG application (0.6); email with KPMG regarding same (0.6).

	Time Detail By Project			
Name	Date	Hours	Narrative	
Jerrard, Erik Jerrard, Erik	09/28/21 09/29/21	1.3 1.3	Email with co-advisors regarding retention process. Call with KPMG, Creel, and Morris Nichols to discuss KPMG retention (0.9); review A. Schwartz's comments to KPMG retention application (0.4).	
Bane, Abraham	09/30/21	0.4	Correspondence with Morris Nichols regarding conflicts refresh (0.2); revise potential parties in interest list (0.2).	
Total AM210 Non-DPV and Fee Issues	W Retention	10.4		
AM230 Plan/Disclosu	re Statement			
Graulich, Timothy	09/01/21	4.4	Call with A. Conesa and A. Sanchez regarding final valuation materials (0.9); call with Judge Lane regarding mediation (1.2); call with A. Conesa and M. Huebner regarding settlement discussions (0.5); review JV agreement (1.8).	
Piraino, Stephen D.	09/01/21	2.4	Review and revise Plan and Disclosure Statement.	
Rincon, Cristina M.	09/01/21	0.9	Email with R. Krishnan regarding research issues regarding motion to extend exclusivity periods.	
Steinberg, Richard J.	09/01/21	1.1	Review and revise motion to extend exclusivity periods (0.8); correspondence with M. Melcer and others regarding same (0.3).	
Bane, Abraham	09/02/21	8.0	Review and revise motion to extend exclusivity periods (0.7); correspondence with M. Melcer regarding same (0.1).	
Graulich, Timothy	09/02/21	3.0	Call with M . Huebner and H. Parkhill regarding Plan issues (0.4); correspondence with S. Piraino regarding motion to extend exclusivity periods (0.4); review and revise motion to extend exclusivity periods (2.2).	
Jerrard, Erik	09/02/21	7.1	Review and revise motion to extend exclusivity periods (4.8); call with Davis Polk Restructuring team regarding same (0.8); email with Restructuring Committee regarding motion to extend exclusivity periods (0.5); email with Davis Polk Restructuring team regarding same (0.6); call with M. Melcer and R. Steinberg regarding same (0.4).	
Melcer, Moshe	09/02/21	3.7	Review and revise motion to extend exclusivity periods (2.2); call with Davis Polk Restructuring team regarding same (0.8); call with R. Steinberg and others regarding same (0.3); call with E. Jerrard and R. Steinberg regarding same (0.4).	
Piraino, Stephen D.	09/02/21	3.6	Call with C. Rincon and others regarding exclusivity (0.2); calls with Davis Polk team regarding exclusivity (1.5); review and revise Plan and Disclosure Statement (1.9).	
Rincon, Cristina M. Steinberg, Richard J.	09/02/21 09/02/21	0.2 4.6	Call with S. Piraino and others regarding exclusivity. Review and revise motion to extend exclusivity periods (2.8); call with Davis Polk Restructuring team regarding same (0.8); call with M. Melcer and others regarding same (0.3); call with M. Melcer and E. Jerrard regarding same (0.4); correspondence with Aeroméxico regarding same (0.3).	
Graulich, Timothy	09/03/21	3.2	Call with Cleary Gottlieb regarding foreign ownership (0.5); call with B. Miller regarding exclusivity (0.6); review and finalize exclusivity motion (2.1).	
Jerrard, Erik Masaro, Matthew Bruno	09/03/21 09/03/21	1.7 0.2	Review and finalize motion to extend exclusivity periods. Correspondence with AlixPartners and others regarding Disclosure Statement.	
Melcer, Moshe	09/03/21	2.8	Review and revise motion to extend exclusivity periods.	
Piraino, Stephen D. Rincon, Cristina M.	09/03/21 09/03/21	3.8 0.6	Review and revise Plan and Disclosure Statement. Email with A. Parrot regarding same (0.1); review motion to extend exclusivity periods (0.5).	

Time Detail By Project			
Name	Date	Hours	Narrative
Steinberg, Richard J.	09/03/21	2.2	Review and revise motion to extend exclusivity periods (0.8); email with T. Graulich and Davis Polk Litigation team regarding same (0.5); review precedent regarding same (0.9).
Graulich, Timothy	09/04/21	0.7	Call with H. Parkhill regarding exit financing commitment letters.
Steinberg, Richard J.	09/06/21	0.3	Correspondence to Chambers regarding motion to extend exclusivity periods.
Graulich, Timothy	09/07/21	3.8	Review revised Plan and Disclosure Statement.
Masaro, Matthew Bruno	09/07/21	5.5	Correspondence with R. Steinberg and others regarding Disclosure Statement (1.2); review and revise same (4.3).
Piraino, Stephen D.	09/07/21	3.9	Review and revise Disclosure Statement (2.8); correspondence with M. Masaro, R. Steinberg and others
Steinberg, Richard J.	09/07/21	0.7	regarding same (1.1). Correspondence with S. Piraino and M. Masaro regarding Disclosure Statement.
Graulich, Timothy	09/08/21	6.4	Review and comment on Plan (4.2); review and revise Disclosure Statement (2.2).
Jerrard, Erik	09/08/21	5.6	Review and revise Plan (5.2); email with Davis Polk Restructuring team regarding same (0.4).
Masaro, Matthew Bruno	09/08/21	2.5	Review and revise Plan and Disclosure Statement (1.4); correspondence with E. Jerrard, S. Piraino, R. Steinberg, and AlixPartners regarding same (1.1).
Piraino, Stephen D.	09/08/21	4.0	Review and revise Plan and Disclosure Statement (3.1); correspondence with Davis Polk team regarding same (0.9).
Steinberg, Richard J.	09/08/21	3.6	Review and revise Disclosure Statement (3.1); correspondence with S. Piraino and M. Masaro regarding same (0.5)
Bane, Abraham	09/09/21	4.5	Review joint exit financing proposal (0.8); review and revise Plan (3.3); correspondence with E. Jerrard regarding same (0.2); call with same regarding issues regarding same (0.2).
Dekhtyar, Mariya	09/09/21	1.1	Email with M. Masaro regarding Disclosure Statement revisions (0.2); call with same regarding Disclosure Statemen (0.2); review and revise Disclosure Statement (0.4); review revised Plan (0.3).
Graulich, Timothy Jerrard, Erik	09/09/21 09/09/21	3.3 2.7	Review and revise Plan and Disclosure Statement. Review and revise Plan (1.4); draft Plan issues list (1.1); call with A. Bane regarding same (0.2).
Masaro, Matthew Bruno	09/09/21	6.5	Review and revise Plan and Disclosure Statement (4.3); correspondence with R. Steinberg, S. Piraino, and others regarding same (1.1); call with M. Dekhtyar regarding Disclosure Statement (0.2); review and revise restructuring support agreement motion (0.9).
Melcer, Moshe	09/09/21	0.2	Review precedent motion to extend exclusivity periods.
Piraino, Stephen D.	09/09/21	3.7	
Steinberg, Richard J.	09/09/21	0.4	Review and revise Disclosure Statement.
Bane, Abraham	09/10/21	0.8	Review and revise Plan (0.3); correspondence with M. Masar regarding same (0.2); review revised Disclosure Statement
Dekhtyar, Mariya	09/10/21	2.4	and final valuation materials (0.3). Review and revise Disclosure Statement (2.0); email with M. Masaro regarding same (0.4).
Masaro, Matthew Bruno	09/10/21	4.9	Review and revise Plan and Disclosure Statement (2.4); compile execution version (0.8); correspondence with S. Piraino, E. Jerrard, and others regarding Plan, Disclosure Statement, and final valuation materials (1.7).

		Time	Detail By Project
Name	Date	Hours	Narrative
Piraino, Stephen D.	09/10/21	2.7	Review and revise Disclosure Statement (1.3); extensive correspondence with Davis Polk Plan and Disclosure Statement teams regarding same (1.4).
Steinberg, Richard J.	09/10/21	1.7	Review and revise Disclosure Statement (0.9); review and revise documents related to same (0.8).
Graulich, Timothy	09/11/21	1.5	Call with R. Cooper regarding final valuation materials (0.7); call with M. Brod regarding same (0.4); call with M. Williams regarding same (0.4).
Graulich, Timothy	09/12/21	2.4	Call with E. Jerrard regarding exit financing (0.7); review Cleary Gottlieb letter and call with litigators regarding same (1.7).
Dekhtyar, Mariya	09/13/21	0.1	Email with A. Bane regarding Plan and Disclosure Statement workstreams.
Ford, Stephen	09/13/21	1.5	Review Plan.
Graulich, Timothy	09/13/21	4.3	Review and revise Plan.
Jerrard, Erik	09/13/21	3.2	Review and revise Plan.
Masaro, Matthew	09/13/21	5.8	Review and revise restructuring support agreement motion
Bruno	00/10/21	0.0	(3.2); correspondence with S. Piraino and others regarding same (0.8); review and revise motion to enter into shareholder support agreement (0.5); correspondence with S. Piraino and others regarding same (0.3); correspondence with Davis Polk
			Tax team and others regarding Disclosure Statement (1.0).
Piraino, Stephen D.	09/13/21	4.1	Correspondence with M. Masaro regarding restructuring
	00, 10, 21		support agreement (0.3); review and analyze restructuring
			support agreement precedent (2.3); correspondence with T.
			Graulich regarding restructuring support agreement (0.2);
			correspondence with E. Jerrard and M. Masaro regarding
			same (0.4); call with Davis Polk Tax and Restructuring teams
			regarding Plan (partial attendance) (0.9).
Bane, Abraham	09/14/21	0.3	Review Plan issues list (0.2); correspondence with E. Jerrard
			regarding same (0.1).
Dekhtyar, Mariya	09/14/21	2.2	Review and revise shareholder support agreement motion
			(1.1); email with M. Masaro regarding same (0.1); review and
			revise restructuring support agreement (1.0).
Graulich, Timothy	09/14/21	7.5	Call with A. Conesa and R. Sanchez Baker regarding
Gradien, Timotry	00/14/21	7.0	emergence process (0.8); call with A. Conesa regarding Plan
			issues (0.6); call with creditor counsel regarding next steps
			regarding same (0.7); review and revise Plan (3.3); review and
Managa Matthews	00/44/04	6.7	revise Disclosure Statement (2.1).
Masaro, Matthew	09/14/21	6.7	Call with counsel to stakeholder, Willkie Farr, and others
Bruno			regarding Plan and next steps (0.8); review and revise
			restructuring support agreement (4.2); review and revise
			shareholder support agreement motion (1.2); correspondence
			with S. Piraino and others regarding restructuring support
			agreement and shareholder support agreement motion (0.5).
Melcer, Moshe	09/14/21	1.6	Review and revise shareholder support agreement.
Piraino, Stephen D.	09/14/21	5.1	Correspondence with E. Talamás and M. Masaro regarding
			Disclosure Statement (0.3); correspondence with Davis Polk
			team regarding Plan and Disclosure Statement (0.8);
			correspondence with M. Masaro regarding restructuring
			support agreement (0.5); review and revise restructuring
			support agreement (1.4); review and revise Plan motions
			(1.3); correspondence with co-advisors and Aeroméxico
			regarding Plan (0.8).
Steinberg, Richard J.	09/14/21	1.1	Call with advisors and joint bidders regarding Plan and
J, : 2. V.	· - · · · - ·		Disclosure Statement next steps.

	Time Detail By Project			
Name	Date	Hours	Narrative	
Talamás Velázquez, Ernesto	09/14/21	0.3	Correspondence with S. Piraino and M. Masaro regarding Disclosure Statement.	
Bane, Abraham	09/15/21	0.9	Correspondence with Davis Polk Plan team regarding Plan and Disclosure Statement (0.4); review precedent of same (0.5).	
Blanco, Maurice	09/15/21	0.8	Review and comment on Disclosure Statement.	
Borchardt, Leo	09/15/21	0.9	Review Disclosure Statement and related comments.	
Ford, Stephen	09/15/21	1.0	Review and revise Plan (0.5); review comments to Plan (0.5).	
Graulich, Timothy	09/15/21	0.8	Call with A. Conesa regarding Plan issues.	
Masaro, Matthew	09/15/21	3.2	Review and revise restructuring support agreement (2.2);	
Bruno			review and revise motion to approve shareholder support agreement (0.7); correspondence with S. Piraino and others regarding same (0.3).	
Melcer, Moshe	09/15/21	0.5	Review and revise shareholder support agreement.	
Simmonds, Alexander W.	09/15/21	1.0	Review Disclosure Statement and precedent securities law disclosures (0.7); correspondence with E. Talamás regarding same (0.3).	
Talamás Velázquez, Ernesto	09/15/21	2.7	Analyze securities law issues regarding Disclosure Statement.	
Ford, Stephen	09/16/21	0.5	Review and revise Plan.	
Graulich, Timothy	09/16/21	6.4	Review and revise Disclosure Statement (3.3); review and revise Plan (3.1).	
Jerrard, Erik	09/16/21	2.2	Correspondence with S. Ford regarding Plan (0.5); email with Davis Polk team regarding Plan tax issues (0.4); review and revise Plan (1.3).	
Giddens, Magali	09/17/21	5.6	Correspondence with S. Ford regarding Plan research (0.4); research docket, certain pleadings and transcripts regarding same (5.2).	
Graulich, Timothy	09/17/21	0.9	Call with A. Conesa and R. Sanchez Baker regarding Plan.	
Masaro, Matthew Bruno	09/17/21	8.0	Correspondence with R. Steinberg and E. Jerrard regarding Disclosure Statement, Plan, and exit financing.	
Steinberg, Richard J.	09/17/21	2.3	Revise disclosure statement (1.1); call with M. Masaro regarding same (0.5); call with AlixPartners regarding same (0.7).	
Jerrard, Erik	09/18/21	1.2	Review Creditors Committee Plan comments.	
Bane, Abraham	09/19/21	1.5	Review Creditors' Committee comments to Plan (0.6); revise Plan (0.8); correspondence with E. Jerrard regarding same (0.1).	
Jerrard, Erik	09/19/21	1.1	Call with Sainz Abogados and Davis Polk teams regarding Disclosure Statement (0.6); review Disclosure Statement (0.5).	
Masaro, Matthew Bruno	09/19/21	0.6	Call with Sainz Abogados and Davis Polk teams regarding Disclosure Statement.	
Bane, Abraham	09/20/21	2.1	Call with S. Ford regarding Plan (0.7); review and revise Plan (1.4).	
Blanco, Maurice	09/20/21	1.8	Call with V. Jackson regarding exit financing issues (0.3); email with E. Jerrard regarding same (0.2); review emails from Davis Polk team regarding same (0.2); review Disclosure Statement (0.8); correspondence with E. Talamás regarding same (0.3).	
Borchardt, Leo	09/20/21	0.6	Review draft securities laws disclosures in Disclosure Statement.	
Dekhtyar, Mariya	09/20/21	4.4	Email with S. Ford and E. Jerrard regarding Plan workstreams (0.2); call with S. Ford regarding Plan research issue (0.2); research issues regarding Plan (3.2); email with S. Ford	
Ford, Stephen	09/20/21	8.5	regarding same (0.8). Review comments to Plan (2.0); call with A. Bane regarding	

		Time	Detail By Project
Name	Date	Hours	Narrative
			same (0.7); review and revise Plan (2.0); research issues regarding Plan (3.5); correspondence with E. Jerrard regarding Plan (0.2); call with M. Dekhtyar regarding Plan (0.1).
Graulich, Timothy	09/20/21	1.5	Call with A. Conesa regarding Plan (0.9); correspondence with M. Huebner regarding Plan settlement (0.6).
Masaro, Matthew Bruno	09/20/21	3.3	Review and revise Disclosure Statement motion (2.6); correspondence with S. Piraino and others regarding same (0.4); correspondence with Davis Polk Tax team and others regarding Disclosure Statement (0.3).
Piraino, Stephen D.	09/20/21	2.9	Correspondence with M. Masaro and R. Steinberg regarding Disclosure Statement (0.8); review and revise Plan and Disclosure Statement (2.1).
Simmonds, Alexander W.	09/20/21	0.9	Review and comment on Disclosure Statement (0.5); email with E. Talamás regarding same (0.4).
Steinberg, Richard J.	09/20/21	2.1	Review and revise Plan and Disclosure Statement regarding PLM (0.5); review and revise Disclosure Statement (1.6)
Talamás Velázquez, Ernesto	09/20/21	2.2	Analyze securities laws disclosures for Disclosure Statement (2.0); correspondence with M. Blanco regarding same (0.2).
Blanco, Maurice	09/21/21	2.0	Review Disclosure Statement (0.7); research issues regarding same (0.7); correspondence with E. Talamás regarding same (0.6).
Dekhtyar, Mariya	09/21/21	8.1	Extensive research of issues regarding Plan (6.8); email with S. Ford regarding summary of same (0.7); call with same regarding same (0.5); correspondence with M. Giddens regarding research regarding same (0.1).
Ford, Stephen	09/21/21	13.0	Review and revise Plan (5.0); research issues regarding Plan (5.0); review precedent hearing transcripts in connection with Plan research (2.0); correspondence with E. Jerrard regarding research of issues regarding same (0.5); call with M. Dekhtyar
Giddens, Magali	09/21/21	0.9	regarding same (0.5). Correspondence with M. Dekhtyar regarding research regarding Plan issues (0.3); review precedent cases regarding same (0.6).
Graulich, Timothy	09/21/21	4.8	Review and provide comments to revised Plan (3.4); call with H. Parkhill regarding Plan provisions (1.4).
Jerrard, Erik	09/21/21	2.0	Call with AlixPartners and Aeroméxico regarding claims issue in Plan (0.6); call with A. Sainz and S. Robles regarding Plan treatment of CEBURES (0.6); correspondence with M. Masaro and A. Bane regarding Plan issues (0.8).
Masaro, Matthew Bruno	09/21/21	8.2	Review and revise Disclosure Statement, Disclosure Statement motion, order, exhibits, and Plan (5.5); correspondence with R. Steinberg, Rothschild, Sainz Abogados, S. Piraino, E. Jerrard, S. Ford, and others
Piraino, Stephen D.	09/21/21	2.6	regarding same (2.7). Correspondence with E. Jerrard and M. Masaro regarding Plan issues (0.4); correspondence with R. Steinberg and M. Masaro regarding Disclosure Statement (1.5); review
Steinberg, Richard J.	09/21/21	2.4	solicitation procedures motion (0.7). Call with Sainz Abogados regarding CEBURES treatment in Plan (0.4); call with Davis Polk team regarding Plan and Disclosure Statement (0.4); correspondence with S. Piraino and M. Masaro regarding Disclosure Statement (0.7); review and revise Disclosure Statement motion (0.9).
Talamás Velázquez, Ernesto	09/21/21	1.3	Analyze securities issue in Disclosure Statement.

		Time	Detail By Project
Name	Date	Hours	Narrative
Dekhtyar, Mariya	09/22/21	5.1	Call with S. Ford regarding Plan research (0.1); email with M. Masaro regarding notice of Disclosure Statement Hearing (0.1); research issues regarding Plan (4.6); email with S. Ford regarding same (0.1); email with A. Bane regarding same (0.2).
Ford, Stephen	09/22/21	10.2	Review and revise Plan (5.2); review comment to Plan from advisors (1.0); correspondence with Davis Polk team regarding Plan (1.5); research issues regarding Plan (2.4); correspondence with M. Masaro regarding Plan (0.1).
Graulich, Timothy	09/22/21	7.9	Call with A. Conesa and R. Sanchez Baker regarding Plan (0.9); call with A. Conesa regarding same (0.8); review revised term sheet (2.4); review and revise Disclosure Statement (3.8).
Hanson, Cole	09/22/21	0.4	Correspondence with M. Masaro regarding Disclosure Statement workstream.
Jerrard, Erik	09/22/21	4.3	Call with Davis Polk Tax, Restructuring teams and Rothschild regarding Disclosure Statement (0.5); analyze Plan issues (2.2); review and revise Plan (1.6).
Masaro, Matthew Bruno	09/22/21	7.8	Review and revise Disclosure Statement (1.0); correspondence with S. Piraino, Davis Polk Tax team, AlixPartners, and others regarding same (2.3); review and revise Disclosure Statement motion, order and corresponding exhibits (4.5).
Piraino, Stephen D.	09/22/21	1.2	Correspondence with R. Steinberg and M. Masaro regarding Disclosure Statement and Plan issues (0.5); correspondence with Davis Polk teams regarding Disclosure Statement (0.7).
Steinberg, Richard J.	09/22/21	0.4	Correspondence with S. Piraino, E. Jerrard, and A. Bane regarding Plan.
Bane, Abraham	09/23/21	0.7	Review revised draft of Disclosure Statement.
Dekhtyar, Mariya	09/23/21	4.6	Research Plan issues (0.8); email with S. Ford regarding same (0.3); review and revise Disclosure Statement (3.3); correspondence with A. Bane regarding Plan (0.2).
Graulich, Timothy	09/23/21	6.7	Call with D. Botter regarding Plan (0.5); call with A. Conesa and R. Sanchez Baker regarding same (0.9); call with R. Miaja regarding term sheet (0.7); call with L. Donahue and team regarding Plan (0.8); correspondence with M. Huebner regarding exit financing (0.5); review Plan (3.3).
Hanson, Cole Jerrard, Erik	09/23/21 09/23/21	4.3 4.4	Review and revise Disclosure Statement motions and exhibits. Review and revise Plan (3.2); distribute same to Board members (0.7); call with Davis Polk Tax team regarding Plan (0.5).
Masaro, Matthew Bruno	09/23/21	8.4	Review and revise Disclosure Statement (1.9); correspondence with S. Piraino, Rothschild, and others regarding same (1.2); review and revise Disclosure Statement motion, order and corresponding exhibits (4.3); correspondence with C. Hanson and others regarding same (1.0).
Steinberg, Richard J.	09/23/21	0.4	Correspondence with AlixPartners and M. Masaro regarding Disclosure Statement.
Bane, Abraham	09/24/21	6.2	Review case law regarding Plan issue (2.1); correspondence with S. Ford and M. Dekhtyar regarding same (0.1); review Disclosure Statement (0.4); draft Plan issues list (3.2); correspondence with E. Jerrard and S. Ford regarding Plan (0.4).
Blanco, Maurice	09/24/21	0.8	Correspondence with E. Talamás regarding Disclosure Statement (0.4); review same (0.4).

		Time	Detail By Project
Name	Date	Hours	Narrative
Dekhtyar, Mariya	09/24/21	3.4	Research tax issues in precedent disclosure statements (2.4); email with M. Masaro regarding same (0.4); review and revise Disclosure Statement (0.5); email with M. Masaro regarding same (0.1).
Ford, Stephen	09/24/21	3.0	Research issues regarding Plan.
Graulich, Timothy	09/24/21	6.5	Call with A. Conesa and R. Sanchez Baker regarding Plan (0.9); review revised Disclosure Statement (3.4); review revised solicitation procedures (2.2).
Hanson, Cole	09/24/21	2.2	Review and revise Disclosure Statement motion and exhibits (2.1); correspondence with M. Masaro regarding Disclosure Statement exhibits and ballots (0.1).
Jerrard, Erik	09/24/21	2.6	Correspondence with M. Masaro regarding Disclosure Statement motion (0.3); review and revise Disclosure Statement motion (2.3).
Masaro, Matthew Bruno	09/24/21	7.5	Review and revise Disclosure Statement, Disclosure Statement motion, and exhibits (6.1); correspondence with S. Piraino, R. Steinberg, AlixPartners, E. Jerrard, and others regarding same (1.4).
Steinberg, Richard J.	09/24/21	0.8	Review and revise Disclosure Statement.
Jerrard, Erik	09/25/21	2.8	Analyze cash-out issue (1.0); research issues and review precedents regarding same (1.3); email with M. Masaro and S. Piraino regarding same (0.5).
Masaro, Matthew Bruno	09/25/21	3.0	Review and revise Disclosure Statement (2.5); correspondence with S. Piraino and others regarding same (0.5).
Bane, Abraham	09/26/21	0.5	Review revised Plan issues list (0.4); correspondence with S. Ford and E. Jerrard regarding same (0.1).
Blanco, Maurice	09/26/21	1.5	Review Disclosure Statement (0.8); review emails regarding same (0.7).
Ford, Stephen	09/26/21	2.5	Review and revise Plan (1.0); review and revise Plan issues list (1.4); correspondence with E. Jerrard, A. Bane, and M. Dekhtyar regarding same (0.1).
Graulich, Timothy	09/26/21	0.5	3 3
Jerrard, Erik	09/26/21	4.2	Review and revise Plan.
Masaro, Matthew Bruno	09/26/21	3.1	Review and revise Disclosure Statement motion and exhibits (2.4); correspondence with S. Piraino and others regarding same (0.4); correspondence with Davis Polk Executive Compensation team regarding same (0.3).
Bane, Abraham	09/27/21	6.1	Extensive review and revision of Plan (5.1); correspondence with E. Jerrard regarding same (0.4); review revised equity term sheet for same (0.4); correspondence with M. Masaro and R. Steinberg regarding same (0.2).
Dekhtyar, Mariya	09/27/21	3.1	Review and revise Disclosure Statement (1.7); email with M. Masaro regarding same (0.6); research for precedent final valuation materials (0.3); email with M. Masaro regarding same (0.3); research precedent disclosure statements (0.2).
Graulich, Timothy	09/27/21	4.7	Call with A. Conesa and R. Sanchez Baker regarding Plan (0.8); review revised Disclosure Statement (2.6); call with H. Parkhill regarding Plan (1.3).
Hanson, Cole	09/27/21	4.0	Review Disclosure Statement and research regarding same (1.5); correspondence with M. Masaro regarding Disclosure Statement exhibits (0.6); review and revise Disclosure Statement motion and order regarding solicitation procedures and exhibit issues (1.9).
Jerrard, Erik	09/27/21	7.9	Review, revise, and coordinate updates to Plan based on revisions to exit financing update (4.8); email with A. Bane and

		Time	Detail By Project
Name	Date	Hours	Narrative
			M. Masaro regarding same (0.8); review and revise Plan with comments from stakeholder (1.9); analyze Plan issue regarding same (0.4).
Masaro, Matthew Bruno	09/27/21	10.4	Review and revise Disclosure Statement, Disclosure Statement motion, order, and exhibits (7.6); correspondence with AlixPartners, S. Piraino, R. Steinberg, E. Jerrard, A. Bane, and others regarding same (2.8).
Piraino, Stephen D.	09/27/21	1.9	Call with Davis Polk Restructuring team regarding Disclosure Statement (0.3); review and revise Disclosure Statement (0.7) call with S Robles and others regarding same (0.2); correspondence with M. Masaro regarding Disclosure Statement (0.7).
Steinberg, Richard J.	09/27/21	4.3	Correspondence with M. Masaro regarding Disclosure Statement (0.4); review and revise Disclosure Statement and related comments and documents (2.6); call with AlixPartners regarding Disclosure Statement treatments (0.8); review and revise Plan and exit financing documents (0.5).
Dekhtyar, Mariya	09/28/21	3.2	Review revisions to Plan (0.2); email with M. Masaro regarding Disclosure Statement (0.2); email with same and AlixPartners regarding same (0.3); review and revise Disclosure Statement (2.1); update Plan distribution tracker (0.2); email with R. Steinberg regarding Plan (0.1); correspondence with M. Masaro regarding Disclosure Statement (0.1).
Ford, Stephen	09/28/21	5.8	Review Plan comments (2.8); review and revise Plan (2.5); facilitate distribution of Plan to co-advisors (0.5).
Graulich, Timothy	09/28/21	3.7	Call with A. Conesa and R. Sanchez Baker regarding Plan (0.9); review and revise Plan (2.8).
Hanson, Cole	09/28/21	2.5	Call with Epiq regarding solicitation process and mechanics (0.6); research precedent disclosure statements (0.6); revise Disclosure Statement motion and order exhibit dates and references (0.5); review and revise Disclosure Statement motion, order, and exhibits for cover letter references (0.8).
Jerrard, Erik	09/28/21	7.8	Correspondence with J. McClammy regarding Disclosure Statement exhibits (0.3); extensive review, drafting and revision of Plan (3.8); call with Epiq regarding solicitation process and mechanics (0.6); email with Akin Gump regarding Plan issues (0.8); email with Davis Polk Restructuring team regarding Plan updates (2.3).
Masaro, Matthew Bruno	09/28/21	6.8	Review and revise Disclosure Statement, Disclosure Statement motion, order, exhibits, and Plan (4.5); correspondence with S. Piraino, E. Jerrard, R. Steinberg, and others regarding same (2.3).
Piraino, Stephen D.	09/28/21	3.0	Call with Epiq regarding solicitation (0.7); call with Davis Polk Restructuring team regarding Disclosure Statement (0.4); call with Rothschild regarding same (0.2); review and revise Plan (1.4); call with AlixPartners and Rothschild regarding Disclosure Statement (0.3).
Steinberg, Richard J.	09/28/21	4.5	Call with Epiq regarding solicitation (0.6); call with same and AlixPartners regarding Disclosure Statement materials and timing (0.3); correspondence with Davis Polk Litigation team regarding same (0.2); correspondence with M. Masaro regarding Disclosure Statement (0.2); review and revise Plan and Disclosure Statement (0.4); email with Aeroméxico regarding same (0.1); email with Simpson Thacher regarding same (0.1); review and revise Disclosure Statement 52

		Time	Detail By Project
Name	Date	Hours	Narrative
Bane, Abraham	09/29/21	2.1	comments to same, and related documents (2.6). Review and revise Plan (1.8); correspondence with S. Ford regarding same (0.3).
Dekhtyar, Mariya	09/29/21	2.4	Review and revise Disclosure Statement (1.5); update Plan distribution tracker (0.5); email with Davis Polk Plan and Disclosure Statement team regarding Disclosure Statement and Plan work (0.1); email with R. Steinberg regarding Disclosure Statement (0.2); correspondence with O. Altman regarding Plan distribution tracker (0.1).
Ford, Stephen	09/29/21	8.1	Review and revise Plan (3.4); call with Davis Polk team regarding Plan and Disclosure Statement distribution (0.2); facilitate distribution of Plan and Disclosure Statement to stakeholders (0.5); review Plan comments from stakeholders (3.0); research precedent plans in connection with comments from stakeholders (1.0).
Garg, Paavani	09/29/21	0.6	Call with advisors regarding Plan process.
Graulich, Timothy	09/29/21	4.2	Call with A. Conesa and R. Sanchez Baker regarding Plan process (1.0); review Disclosure Statement (3.2).
Hanson, Cole	09/29/21	1.7	Review and revise Disclosure Statement.
Jerrard, Erik	09/29/21	7.7	Correspondence with T. Graulich regarding Plan (1.4); extensive review and revision of Plan (4.3); review and revise Disclosure Statement (0.4); call with S. Robles regarding postemergence listing (0.2); email with Davis Polk team regarding same (0.3); correspondence with R. Steinberg regarding Disclosure Statement motion (0.3); email with same and M. Masaro regarding same (0.2); call with counsel to shareholders regarding Plan (0.6).
Piraino, Stephen D.	09/29/21	3.5	Call with J. Newdeck regarding balloting (0.2); correspondence with R. Steinberg regarding Plan (0.3); review and revise Plan and Disclosure Statement including stakeholder comments (2.3); correspondence with E. Jerrard regarding Plan (0.7).
Steinberg, Richard J.	09/29/21	7.3	Review and revise Disclosure Statement and comments to same (6.6); call with AlixPartners regarding same (0.3); correspondence with S. Piraino and E. Jerrard regarding same (0.4).
Bane, Abraham	09/30/21	9.7	Call with Davis Polk Plan and Disclosure Statement team regarding Disclosure Statement and Plan issues (0.4); call with S. Ford regarding Plan (0.3); correspondence with E. Jerrard regarding same (0.2); extensive review and revision of Plan (8.8).
Blanco, Maurice Dekhtyar, Mariya	09/30/21 09/30/21	0.8 6.7	Review revised Disclosure Statement. Research risk factors in precedent disclosure statements (5.0); email with M. Masaro regarding same (0.1); correspondence with M. Giddens regarding same (0.1); research Plan issue (1.1); review email with Davis Polk team regarding Plan revisions (0.1); email with M. Masaro and AlixPartners regarding Disclosure Statement (0.2); correspondence with M. Masaro regarding same (0.1).
Ford, Stephen	09/30/21	15.0	Review and revise Plan (8.0); correspondence with Davis Polk team and co-advisors regarding Plan (1.0); review comments to Plan (3.0); call with A. Bane regarding Plan (0.3); research issues regarding Plan (2.1); call with Davis Polk Plan and Disclosure Statement team regarding Plan and Disclosure Statement issues (0.4); correspondence with E. Jerrard regarding Plan (0.2).

Time Detail By Project			
Name	Date	Hours	Narrative
Graulich, Timothy	09/30/21	7.0	Call with A. Conesa and R. Sanchez Baker regarding Plan (0.8); call with D. Botter and D. Dunne regarding Plan (0.6); review and revise term sheet (2.2); review revised Plan (3.4).
Hanson, Cole	09/30/21	4.0	Revise Disclosure Statement motion, order, and exhibits.
Jerrard, Erik	09/30/21	7.9	Call with Davis Polk Plan and Disclosure Statement teams regarding Disclosure Statement and Plan issues (0.4); extensive review and revision of Plan (5.5); email with Davis Polk Restructuring team regarding same (0.9); call with Gibson Dunn regarding Plan process (0.5); call with Milbank and Akin Gump regarding same (0.6).
Masaro, Matthew Bruno	09/30/21	8.0	Extensive review and revision of Disclosure Statement, Disclosure Statement order, motion, exhibits, and Plan (4.8); correspondence with S. Piraino, E. Jerrard, R. Steinberg, and others regarding same (3.2).
Piraino, Stephen D.	09/30/21	5.8	Extensive correspondence with Davis Polk team regarding Plan and Disclosure Statement (1.7); call with Davis Polk Plan and Disclosure Statement ream regarding Plan and Disclosure Statement issues (0.4); call with R. Steinberg and others regarding Disclosure Statement and related documents (0.3); call with J. Rubin regarding Plan (0.2); review and revise Plan (1.3); review and revise Disclosure Statement (1.1); review and revise solicitation procedure (0.8).
Steinberg, Richard J.	09/30/21	4.2	Call with Davis Polk Plan and Disclosure Statement team regarding Plan and Disclosure Statement issues (0.4); correspondence with M. Masaro regarding Disclosure Statement (0.4); review and revise Disclosure Statement and related documents (2.9); call with S. Piraino and others regarding same (0.3); email with Sainz Abogados regarding same (0.2).
Szanzer, Steven Z. Troconis, Adela	09/30/21 09/30/21	0.2 0.2	Correspondence with T. Graulich regarding Plan. Review draft Plan.
Total AM230 Plan/Dis Statement	sclosure	581.1	
AM240 DPW Retention	n/Prenaration o	of DPW Fee S	tatements/Applications and Budget
Bane, Abraham	09/02/21	1.4	Draft exhibits for Fourth Interim Fee application (0.9); correspondence with E. Jerrard regarding same (0.2); correspondence with Davis Polk team regarding bi-annual conflicts review (0.3).
Bane, Abraham	09/03/21	1.6	Draft Fifth Supplemental Declaration (1.3); correspondence with Davis Polk team regarding same (0.3).
Bane, Abraham	09/12/21	2.6	Conducts semi-annual conflicts review (2.2); revise Fifth Supplemental Declaration of Davis Polk (0.4).
Bane, Abraham	09/13/21	2.6	Conduct conflicts check for potential parties in interest (2.3); correspondence with Davis Polk conflicts team regarding same (0.3).
Dekhtyar, Mariya	09/17/21	8.0	Draft Fourth Interim Fee Application.
Dekhtyar, Mariya	09/20/21	1.6	Review and revise Fourth Interim Fee Application.
Bane, Abraham	09/26/21	2.1	Conduct semi-annual conflicts review.
Dekhtyar, Mariya	09/29/21	0.1	Call with E. Jerrard regarding Fourth Interim Fee Application timing.
Dekhtyar, Mariya	09/30/21	0.1	Review email from E. Jerrard regarding Fourth Interim Fee Application process.
Total AM240 DPW Retention/Preparation	n of DPW Fee	12.9	

	Time Detail By Project				
Name	Date	Hours	Narrative		
Statements/Applicat Budget	ions and				
AM250 IP, Regulator					
Donnelly, Jacob M.	09/01/21	0.4	Review emails and relevant documents regarding Mexican corporate bonds for Disclosure Statement tax analysis.		
Donnelly, Jacob M.	09/02/21	1.7	Draft discussion of U.SMexico Income Tax Treaty for Disclosure Statement.		
Siman, Ariel	09/02/21	2.0	Draft tax disclosure for Disclosure Statement.		
Donnelly, Jacob M.	09/03/21	0.1	Review draft tax disclosure for Disclosure Statement.		
Siman, Ariel	09/03/21	5.5	Draft tax disclosure for Disclosure Statement.		
Donnelly, Jacob M.	09/07/21	0.7	Review revisions to tax disclosure section of Disclosure Statement.		
Donnelly, Jacob M.	09/08/21	0.4	Revise tax disclosure in Disclosure Statement.		
Altus, Leslie J.	09/09/21	0.1	Email with Davis Polk Tax team regarding Disclosure Statement.		
Donnelly, Jacob M.	09/09/21	0.1	Correspondence with A. Siman regarding tax issue.		
Siman, Ariel	09/09/21	2.0	Review and revise tax disclosure in Disclosure Statement.		
Altus, Leslie J.	09/10/21	0.1	Email with J. Donnelly regarding Disclosure Statement.		
Donnelly, Jacob M.	09/10/21	2.4	Research tax issue.		
Siman, Ariel	09/10/21	1.9	Review tax disclosure in Disclosure Statement.		
Altus, Leslie J.	09/13/21	1.5	Review Disclosure Statement (0.2); call with Davis Polk Tax and Restructuring teams regarding Plan (1.3).		
Donnelly, Jacob M.	09/13/21	2.0	Call with Davis Polk Tax and Restructuring teams regarding Plan (1.3); review and revise tax disclosure in Disclosure Statement (0.7).		
Farr, Lucy W.	09/13/21	1.3	Call with Davis Polk Tax and Restructuring teams regarding Plan.		
Siman, Ariel	09/13/21	3.2	Call with Davis Polk Tax and Restructuring teams regarding Plan (1.3); analyze tax disclosure (1.9).		
Donnelly, Jacob M.	09/14/21	3.3	Email with M. Masaro regarding revised Disclosure Statement (0.1); email with M. Rivero regarding tax consequence issues (0.3); email with T. Matlock regarding disclosure statement (0.1); review Disclosure Statement (1.0); review proposed PFIC regulations issues (0.5); review and revise tax disclosure for Disclosure Statement (1.1); email with L. Farr and L. Altus regarding same (0.2).		
Siman, Ariel	09/14/21	2.0	Review and revise tax disclosure in Disclosure Statement.		
Altus, Leslie J.	09/15/21	0.3	Review email with Davis Polk Tax team regarding Plan issues.		
Donnelly, Jacob M.	09/15/21	1.3	Draft email to S. Robles and A. Sainz regarding Mexican tax law issue (0.1); email with S. Robles regarding Mexican tax disclosure (0.2); email with L. Farr and L. Altus regarding materials on Mexican tax considerations (0.1); email with A. Siman regarding Mexican tax disclosure (0.1); review and revise tax disclosure of Disclosure Statement (0.3); email with A. Siman regarding revised tax disclosure (0.1); coordinate call with potential exit financing party regarding tax considerations (0.1); email with S. Piraino, M. Masaro, and E. Jerrard regarding stock information (0.1); email with L. Farr and L. Altus regarding revised tax disclosure in Disclosure Statement (0.2).		
Farr, Lucy W.	09/15/21	0.4	Email with Davis Polk Tax team regarding tax issues.		
Siman, Ariel	09/15/21	3.2	Review and revise tax disclosure in Disclosure Statement.		
Altus, Leslie J. Donnelly, Jacob M.	09/16/21 09/16/21	0.2 1.7	Review email regarding Plan tax issues. Email with A. Siman and E. Jerrard regarding coordinating call		

		Time	Detail By Project
Name	Date	Hours	Narrative
			on Mexican tax structuring issues (0.1); research Disclosure Statement precedents (0.4); review tax disclosure in disclosure statement precedents (1.2).
Farr, Lucy W.	09/16/21	2.1	Review materials regarding tax issues.
Altus, Leslie J.	09/17/21	4.4	Review term sheets and draft Disclosure Statement for tax issues (3.5); call with Gibson Dunn, Sainz Abogados, and Davis Polk Tax team regarding Mexican tax structuring issues (0.6); call with L. Farr, A. Siman and J. Donnelly regarding same (0.3).
Donnelly, Jacob M.	09/17/21	1.5	Email with A. Siman regarding tax disclosure, organization chart and offering memorandum (0.2); call with Gibson Dunn, Sainz Abogados, and Davis Polk Tax team regarding Mexican tax structuring issues (0.6); call with A. Siman, L. Farr, and L. Altus regarding Mexican tax structuring considerations (0.3); research check-the-box regulations regarding classification (0.3); email with A. Siman regarding same (0.1).
Farr, Lucy W.	09/17/21	1.5	Call with L. Altus, A. Siman, and J. Donnelly regarding Mexican tax structuring issues (0.3); call with Gibson Dunn, Sainz Abogados, and Davis Polk Tax team regarding same (0.6); correspondence with Davis Polk Tax team regarding same (0.6).
Jerrard, Erik	09/17/21	0.6	Call with Gibson Dunn, Sainz Abogados, and Davis Polk Tax team regarding Mexican tax structuring issues.
Siman, Ariel	09/17/21	4.5	Review and revise tax disclosure in Disclosure Statement.
Altus, Leslie J.	09/19/21	1.4	Review Disclosure Statement.
Donnelly, Jacob M.	09/19/21	2.0	Email with M. Rivero regarding subsidiaries' tax classification (0.2); draft summary of Mexican tax law implications on stock sale (1.8).
Farr, Lucy W.	09/19/21	1.9	Review and revise Disclosure Statement.
Altus, Leslie J.	09/20/21	1.0	Review and revise Disclosure Statement.
Donnelly, Jacob M.	09/20/21	3.6	Review and revise tax disclosure in Disclosure Statement (1.0); research U.SMexico Income Tax Treaty issues (1.9); comment on tax disclosure in Disclosure Statement (0.7).
Farr, Lucy W.	09/20/21	0.5	Email with Davis Polk Tax team regarding tax issues.
Siman, Ariel	09/20/21	4.0	Review and revise tax disclosure in Disclosure Statement.
Altus, Leslie J.	09/21/21	2.7	Review and revise tax disclosure in Disclosure Statement.
Donnelly, Jacob M.	09/21/21	4.1	Review tax disclosure in Disclosure Statement (2.9); review and revise Plan (0.4); email with L. Farr and L. Altus regarding revised tax disclosure (0.4); email with A. Siman regarding same (0.2); email with M. Masaro regarding precedent disclosure statement (0.2).
Farr, Lucy W.	09/21/21	0.2	Email with Davis Polk Tax team regarding tax issues.
Siman, Ariel	09/21/21	3.0	Review tax disclosure.
Altus, Leslie J.	09/22/21	3.4	Review Disclosure Statement (0.8); review email regarding same (0.1); call with Davis Polk Tax team regarding tax issues (1.2); correspondence with same regarding same (1.3).
Donnelly, Jacob M.	09/22/21	2.9	Email with L. Altus regarding revised version of Disclosure Statement (0.1); call with Davis Polk Tax team regarding tax issues (1.2); coordinate call with Sainz Abogados regarding tax issues (0.2); review and revise tax disclosure in Disclosure Statement (1.2); email with A. Siman regarding same (0.2).
Farr, Lucy W.	09/22/21	1.7	Call with Davis Polk Tax team regarding tax issues (1.2); call with Sainz Abogados regarding same (0.2); correspondence with Davis Polk Tax team regarding same (0.3).
Siman, Ariel	09/22/21	6.3	Extensive analysis of tax disclosure in Disclosure Statement and Plan.

Time Detail By Project					
Name	Date	Hours	Narrative		
Altus, Leslie J.	09/23/21	2.3	Review emails with M. Carrillo regarding Mexican tax issues (0.3); call with Sainz Abogados and Davis Polk Tax team regarding Mexican tax considerations (1.1); call with Davis Polk Tax and Restructuring teams regarding same (0.4); correspondence with A. Siman regarding same (0.2); call with Rothschild team regarding same (0.1) (partial attendance); correspondence with A. Siman regarding same (0.2).		
Donnelly, Jacob M.	09/23/21	2.5	Call with Sainz Abogados and Davis Polk Tax team regarding Mexican tax considerations (1.1); call with Davis Polk Tax and Restructuring teams regarding same (0.4); call with Rothschild and Davis Polk tax team regarding same (0.3); review draft Mexican tax disclosure from M. Carrillo (0.7).		
Farr, Lucy W.	09/23/21	1.9	Call with Sainz Abogados and Davis Polk Tax team regarding Mexican tax considerations (1.1); call with Davis Polk Tax and Restructuring teams regarding same (0.4); correspondence with same regarding same (0.4).		
Piraino, Stephen D.	09/23/21	0.7	Correspondence with Davis Polk Tax team regarding tax issues.		
Siman, Ariel	09/23/21	6.5	Review tax disclosure in Disclosure Statement and Plan term sheet.		
Altus, Leslie J.	09/24/21	0.6	Review email regarding Disclosure Statement and Mexican tax issues.		
Donnelly, Jacob M.	09/24/21	1.5	Research withholding tax risk factor precedents in SEC filings (1.4); email with L. Farr and L. Altus regarding Mexican tax disclosure (0.1).		
Piraino, Stephen D.	09/24/21	0.3	Correspondence with Davis Polk Tax team regarding Disclosure Statement.		
Siman, Ariel	09/24/21	4.5	Review US and Mexican tax disclosures in Disclosure Statement.		
Altus, Leslie J.	09/25/21	0.3	Review L. Farr's comments to tax disclosure in Disclosure Statement.		
Donnelly, Jacob M.	09/25/21	0.5	Review withholding section issues in precedent disclosure statements.		
Farr, Lucy W.	09/25/21	2.0	Review and revise tax disclosure in Disclosure Statement.		
Donnelly, Jacob M.	09/26/21	1.2	Review and revise Disclosure Statement.		
Siman, Ariel	09/26/21	3.0	Review and revise tax disclosure in Disclosure Statement.		
Altus, Leslie J.	09/27/21	4.6	Email with Davis Polk Tax team regarding Plan and Disclosure Statement (1.9); email with H. Jacobs regarding Plan and tax disclosure (0.3); review and revise tax disclosure in Disclosure Statement (2.4).		
Donnelly, Jacob M.	09/27/21	4.8	Email with M. Masaro regarding Plan and Disclosure Statement issues (0.1); review and revise tax disclosure in Disclosure Statement (1.0); email with L. Farr and L. Altus regarding same (0.1); review Plan and Disclosure Statement (0.4); review tax indemnity provisions in JOLCO lease agreements and loan agreements (1.8); revise comments to Mexican tax disclosure (0.6); review precedent regarding Mexican tax disclosure issue (0.6); email with A. Siman regarding tax disclosure and risk factor precedents (0.1); email with T. Matlock regarding tax risk factors (0.1).		
Farr, Lucy W.	09/27/21	2.2	Email with Davis Polk Tax team regarding tax issues (1.1); review tax disclosure in Disclosure Statement (1.1).		
Katz, Michael	09/27/21	0.4	Correspondence with Davis Polk Tax team regarding outstanding tax issues (0.2); call with Aeroméxico and		
Siman, Ariel	09/27/21	6.2	AlixPartners regarding outstanding vendor escalations (0.2). Review and revise tax disclosure in Disclosure Statement.		

	Time Detail By Project					
Name	Date	Hours	Narrative			
Altus, Leslie J. Donnelly, Jacob M.	09/28/21 09/28/21	0.5 2.5	Review email regarding Plan and tax disclosure. Review and revise tax disclosure in Disclosure Statement (1.2); email with M. Carrillo regarding tax risk factor in Disclosure Statement (0.2); email with L. Farr and L. Altus regarding updated tax disclosure (0.1); review revised			
Farr, Lucy W. Katz, Michael	09/28/21 09/28/21	0.4 0.1	Mexican tax summary from M. Carrillo (1.0). Email with Davis Polk team regarding tax issues. Correspondence regarding tax issues.			
Siman, Ariel Altus, Leslie J.	09/28/21 09/29/21	6.5 1.7	Review and revise tax disclosure in Disclosure Statement. Review tax disclosure in Disclosure Statement (0.9); review			
Donnelly, Jacob M.	09/29/21	1.4	Plan documents regarding same (0.8). Review and revise tax disclosure in Disclosure Statement (0.9); call with M. Carrillo, Akin Gump, and Davis Polk Tax			
Farr, Lucy W.	09/29/21	1.3	team regarding Mexican withholding tax considerations (0.5). Correspondence with Davis Polk Tax team regarding tax issues (0.8); call with M. Carrillo, Akin Gump, and Davis Polk Tax team regarding Mexican withholding tax considerations			
Siman, Ariel	09/29/21	4.0	(0.5). Review and revise tax disclosures (3.0); call with Davis Polk Tax team regarding tax disclosures (0.5); call with Milbank regarding withholding tax (0.5).			
Siman, Ariel Altus, Leslie J.	09/29/21 09/30/21	3.8 5.7	Review and revise term sheets, including gross-up provision. Review Disclosure Statement and Plan documents (4.2); correspondence with A. Siman and J. Donnelly regarding tax			
Donnelly, Jacob M.	09/30/21	4.4	issues (1.5). Review Plan (0.2); review Disclosure Statement (0.2); email with M. Masaro regarding Disclosure Statement risk factor (0.1); coordinate call with Akin Gump regarding tax issues in Disclosure Statement (0.1); call with Akin Gump and Davis Polk Tax team regarding tax issues in Disclosure Statement (0.5); email with L. Altus and M. Masaro regarding disputed claims reserve (0.2); review disputed claims sections in Mexican precedent plans and disclosure statements (0.4); call with Davis Polk Tax team regarding Plan and Disclosure Statement (1.0); review Plan (0.4); email with A. Siman, S. Piraino, L. Farr, and L. Altus regarding same (0.1); review and revise Mexican tax disclosure (0.8); revise U.S. tax disclosure (0.4).			
Farr, Lucy W.	09/30/21	2.0	Call with Davis Polk Tax team regarding tax issues (1.0); correspondence with same regarding same (1.0).			
Piraino, Stephen D.	09/30/21	1.1	Call with Akin Gump and Davis Polk Tax team regarding tax issues in Disclosure Statement (0.5); email with L. Altus regarding tax issues (0.2); correspondence with A. Siman regarding same (0.4).			
Siman, Ariel Siman, Ariel	09/30/21 09/30/21	5.0 3.5	Review and revise tax disclosure in Disclosure Statement. Review and revise term sheets, including gross-up provisions.			
Total AM250 IP, Reg Tax		181.0	,			
AM260 Hearing Prep Melcer, Moshe Jerrard, Erik	paration/Attendance 09/12/21 09/13/21	0.8 0.9	Draft September 20 Hearing agenda. Coordinate upcoming hearing dates with Chambers (0.4); call			
Jerrard, Erik Jerrard, Erik	09/14/21 09/16/21	0.3 0.4	with Aeroméxico and co-advisors regarding same (0.5). Call with J. Eisen regarding September 20 Hearing. Review and revise September 20th Hearing agenda.			

	Time Detail By Project					
Name	Date	Hours	Narrative			
Melcer, Moshe	09/16/21	0.3	Review and revise September 20th Hearing agenda.			
Garg, Paavani	09/17/21	2.9	Prepare for September 20th Hearing.			
Graulich, Timothy	09/17/21	4.2	Prepare for September 20th Hearing, including review of			
			aircraft lease.			
Jerrard, Erik	09/17/21	1.2	Call with J. Eisen regarding upcoming September 20th Hearing (0.4); correspondence with M. Melcer regarding same (0.8).			
Melcer, Moshe	09/17/21	0.9	Review and revise September 20th Hearing agenda.			
Szanzer, Steven Z.	09/17/21	1.5	Review and revise September 20th Hearing agenda (0.3); correspondence with E. Jerrard and M. Melcer regarding same (0.3); correspondence with T. Graulich regarding same (0.2); correspondence with same and E. Jerrard regarding upcoming hearing (0.4); call with Chambers regarding same (0.3).			
Garg, Paavani	09/18/21	0.6	Prepare for September 20th Hearing.			
Jerrard, Erik	09/18/21	1.5	Draft talking points on exclusivity motion and general Plan			
			update for September 20th Hearing.			
Melcer, Moshe	09/18/21	0.5	Review September 20th Hearing agenda.			
Jerrard, Erik	09/19/21	5.0	Correspondence with R. Steinberg regarding September 20th Hearing preparation (0.2); call with M. Melcer regarding same (0.2); prepare for September 20th Hearing (4.6).			
Melcer, Moshe	09/19/21	4.2	Review talking points for September 20th Hearing (0.4); call with E. Jerrard regarding hearing preparation (0.2); correspondence with R. Steinberg regarding same (0.1); draft same (2.8); review and revise September 20th Hearing agenda (0.6); email with T. Graulich regarding talking points			
Szanzer, Steven Z.	09/19/21	2.8	for same (0.1). Review and revise talking points for September 20th Hearing (1.3); correspondence with Davis Polk team regarding same (1.3); correspondence with M. Melcer regarding amended hearing agenda (0.2).			
Bane, Abraham	09/20/21	0.5	Attend September 20th Hearing.			
Dekhtyar, Mariya	09/20/21	0.7	Attend September 20th Hearing (0.6); review September 20th Hearing agenda (0.1).			
Garg, Paavani	09/20/21	0.6	Attend September 20th Hearing.			
Graulich, Timothy	09/20/21	2.5	Attend September 20th Hearing (0.6); prepare for same (1.9).			
Green, Thomas S.	09/20/21	2.8				
Jerrard, Erik	09/20/21	3.0	Review and revise September 20th Hearing talking points (0.8); correspondence with T. Graulich regarding same (0.5); attend September 20th Hearing (0.6); email with M. Melcer regarding preparation for same (0.3).			
Masaro, Matthew Bruno	09/20/21	0.4	Attend September 20th Hearing (partial attendance).			
McClammy, James I.	09/20/21	1.0	Attend September 20th Hearing (0.6); prepare for same (0.4).			
Melcer, Moshe	09/20/21	1.2	Correspondence with S. Szanzer regarding September 20th Hearing (0.3); attend September 20th Hearing (0.6); prepare for same (0.3).			
Piraino, Stephen D.	09/20/21	0.6	Attend September 20th Hearing.			
Steinberg, Richard J. Szanzer, Steven Z.	09/20/21 09/20/21	1.5 3.0	Attend September 20th Hearing (0.6); prepare for same (0.9). Attend September 20th Hearing (0.6); prepare for same (1.4); correspondence with Davis Polk Restructuring team regarding same (0.5); correspondence with White & Case, Skyworks, and Herbert Smith Freehills regarding same (0.5).			
Piraino, Stephen D.	09/23/21	0.2	Correspondence with E. Jerrard regarding hearing dates.			
Szanzer, Steven Z.	09/24/21	0.4	Correspondence with Davis Polk team regarding hearing			

20-11563-scc Doc 1979 Filed 10/26/21 Entered 10/26/21 20:59:12 Main Document Pg 352 of 357

Time Detail By Project				
Name	Date	Hours	Narrative	
			scheduling (0.2); correspondence with Chambers regarding same (0.2).	
Total AM260 Hearing 46.4 Preparation/Attendance		46.4		
AM270 Credit Card Receivables Piraino, Stephen D. 09/21/21		0.3	Call with Sainz Abogados team and others regarding CEBURES.	
Total AM270 Credit Card 0.3 Receivables		0.3		
TOTAL		2,092.1		

DISBURSEMENT SUMMARY	
Description	Amount
Court and related fees	\$225.22
Postage, courier & freight	\$249.60
Outside Documents & Research	\$145.66
Meals	\$168.80
Travel	\$288.62
Computer research	\$8,961.24
TOTAL	\$10,039.14

DISBURSEMENT DETAIL					
Date	Vendor Name	Expense Type	Description	Amount	
09/01/21		Computer research	Westlaw usage by RINCON,CRISTIN on 09/01/2021	\$78.64	
09/02/21		Computer research	Westlaw usage by STEINBERG,RICH on 09/02/2021	\$40.86	
09/02/21		Computer research	LEXIS; US TREATISES;DOC ACCESS	\$112.77	

DISBURSEMENT DETAIL Expense Date Vendor Name Description Amount Type 09/02/21 LEXIS; US TREATISES; DOC ACCESS \$563.86 Computer research 09/03/21 Computer Westlaw usage by STEINBERG,RICH on \$58.21 research 09/03/2021 09/14/21 Computer LEXIS; US TREATISES; DOC ACCESS \$134.28 research 09/15/21 Computer Westlaw usage by STEINBERG, RICH on \$216.29 research 09/15/2021 09/15/21 Computer LEXIS; SEARCH; ACCESS CHARGE \$279.87 research 09/15/21 Computer LEXIS; US TREATISES; DOC ACCESS \$268.56 research 09/16/21 Computer Westlaw usage by DARTEZ, JACKSON on \$151.36 research 09/16/2021 09/16/21 Computer LEXIS; US TREATISES; DOC ACCESS \$134.28 research 09/20/21 Computer Westlaw usage by DEKHTYAR, MARIY on \$714.18 research 09/20/2021 Westlaw usage by STEINBERG, RICH on 09/20/21 Computer \$260.90 research 09/20/2021 09/20/21 Computer LEXIS; SEARCH; ACCESS CHARGE \$267.35 research 09/20/21 Computer LEXIS; US TREATISES; DOC ACCESS \$384.82 research 09/21/21 Computer Westlaw usage by FORD, JR., STEP on \$44.46 research 09/21/2021 09/21/21 Computer Westlaw usage by DEKHTYAR, MARIY on \$246.36 research 09/21/2021 09/21/21 Computer LEXIS; US TREATISES; DOC ACCESS \$192.41 research 09/21/21 Computer LEXIS; SEARCH; ACCESS CHARGE \$133.67 research 09/22/21 Computer Westlaw usage by DEKHTYAR, MARIY on \$174.21 research 09/22/2021

DISBURSEMENT DETAIL Expense Date **Vendor Name** Description Amount Type LEXIS; SEARCH; ACCESS CHARGE 09/22/21 Computer \$1,737.76 research Computer LEXIS; US CLE COURSE OF STUDY 09/22/21 \$71.56 research MATERIALS; DOC ACCESS 09/22/21 Computer LEXIS; US JURISPRUDENCE; DOC ACCESS \$35.78 research 09/22/21 Computer LEXIS; US TREATISES; DOC ACCESS \$164.05 research 09/23/21 Computer Westlaw usage by BANE, ABRAHAM on \$264.81 research 09/23/2021 09/23/21 Computer Westlaw usage by STEINBERG,RICH on \$157.43 research 09/23/2021 Computer 09/24/21 Westlaw usage by BANE, ABRAHAM on \$1.676.83 research 09/24/2021 09/24/21 Computer Westlaw usage by JERRARD, ERIK on \$44.46 research 09/24/2021 09/27/21 Computer Westlaw usage by PARROTT, ANDREW on \$135.82 research 09/27/2021 09/27/21 Computer LEXIS; LEXIS ANSWER CARD; DOC ACCESS \$26.11 research 09/27/21 Computer LEXIS; SEARCH; ACCESS CHARGE \$146.30 research 09/30/21 Computer Westlaw usage by STEINBERG, RICH on \$42.99 research 09/30/2021 09/20/21 Court and Payee: Melcer, Moshe, CourtSolutions LLC, \$70.00 related fees 9/20/2021, 09/30/21 Court and Pacer transactions 09/2021 \$113.30 related fees 09/30/21 Court and CourtAlert.com: B. Eng, D. Thomson; Court \$41.92 related fees NYSD; Index No. 1:20-cv-05006; In Re: LSC Communications, Inc. 09/13/21 SeamlessWeb delivery from Eden Wok to SZ \$20.00 Meals Szanzer at 16:50:17 09/14/21 Meals SeamlessWeb delivery from Chipotle to M Katz \$20.00 at 19:50:46

DISBURSEMENT DETAIL Expense Date **Vendor Name** Description Amount Type SeamlessWeb delivery from Eden Wok to SZ 09/14/21 Meals \$20.00 Szanzer at 14:23:23 08:21 PM DINNER - Kombucha; FISH; 09/15/21 Meals \$20.00 ENTREE, 1 side; CLIF BARS overtime dinner from Davis Polk Cafeteria for Erik Jerrard. 09/20/21 Meals 06:50 PM Davis Polk Cafeteria - OT meal for \$17.40 E. Jerrard Payee: Masaro, Matthew Bruno, OT 6:00 PM 09/22/21 Meals \$20.00 DIG 09/28/21 Meals 07:57 PM Davis Polk Cafeteria - OT meal for \$11.40 S. Piraino 09/29/21 06:42 PM DINNER - OT meal for E. Jerrard Meals \$20.00 09/30/21 Meals SeamlessWeb delivery from Taam Tov \$20.00 Restaurant to SZ Szanzer at 17:49:04 09/03/21 Outside courtlink: SEARCH ACCESS CHARGE For \$8.93 Documents RAHUL KRISHNAN & Research 09/03/21 courtlink: US DOCKETS DOC ACCESS For Outside \$0.32 Documents RAHUL KRISHNAN & Research courtlink: SEARCH ACCESS CHARGE For 09/06/21 Outside \$26.75 MARIYA DEKHTYAR **Documents** & Research 09/06/21 Outside courtlink: US DOCKETS DOC ACCESS For \$0.32 MARIYA DEKHTYAR Documents & Research 09/08/21 Outside courtlink: COURTLINK TRACK OTHER \$1.00 **Documents** FREQUENCY TRACKS For JOSEPH FLORIO & Research 09/09/21 Outside courtlink: COURTLINK TRACK OTHER \$1.00 **Documents** FREQUENCY TRACKS For JOSEPH FLORIO & Research 09/10/21 courtlink: COURTLINK TRACK OTHER \$1.00 Outside FREQUENCY TRACKS For JOSEPH FLORIO Documents & Research

DISBURSEMENT DETAIL

Date	Vendor Name	Expense Type	Description	Amount
09/13/21		Outside Documents & Research	courtlink: COURTLINK TRACK OTHER FREQUENCY TRACKS For JOSEPH FLORIO	\$0.50
09/14/21		Outside Documents & Research	courtlink: COURTLINK TRACK OTHER FREQUENCY TRACKS For JOSEPH FLORIO	\$1.00
09/15/21		Outside Documents & Research	courtlink: COURTLINK TRACK OTHER FREQUENCY TRACKS For JOSEPH FLORIO	\$0.98
09/16/21		Outside Documents & Research	courtlink: COURTLINK TRACK OTHER FREQUENCY TRACKS For JOSEPH FLORIO	\$0.98
09/17/21		Outside Documents & Research	courtlink: COURTLINK TRACK OTHER FREQUENCY TRACKS For JOSEPH FLORIO	\$0.98
09/20/21		Outside Documents & Research	courtlink: COURTLINK TRACK OTHER FREQUENCY TRACKS For JOSEPH FLORIO	\$0.98
09/21/21		Outside Documents & Research	courtlink: COURTLINK TRACK OTHER FREQUENCY TRACKS For JOSEPH FLORIO	\$0.98
09/22/21		Outside Documents & Research	courtlink: COURTLINK TRACK OTHER FREQUENCY TRACKS For JOSEPH FLORIO	\$0.98
09/28/21		Outside Documents & Research	courtlink: SEARCH ACCESS CHARGE For MARJORIE RICHMOND	\$93.57
09/28/21		Outside Documents & Research	courtlink: US DOCKETS DOC ACCESS For MARJORIE RICHMOND	\$5.39
09/07/21		Postage, courier & freight	From Olivia Altman to CLERK'S OFFICE/United States Bankruptcy Court/Southern District of New York/One Bowling Green/New York NY 10004/Hand Delivery - NPD LOGISTICS Tracking # CSTM0355903	\$54.37
09/20/21		Postage, courier & freight	From Magali Giddens to Shelley Chapman	\$27.09

20-11563-scc Doc 1979 Filed 10/26/21 Entered 10/26/21 20:59:12 Main Document Pg 357 of 357

DISBURSEMENT DETAIL					
Date	Vendor Name	Expense Type	Description	Amount	
09/20/21		Postage, courier & freight	From Abraham Bane to Andrea Schwartz	\$34.93	
09/24/21		Postage, courier & freight	From Abraham Bane to Andrea Schwartz	\$106.06	
09/30/21		Postage, courier & freight	From Magali Giddens to Shelley Chapman	\$27.15	
09/13/21		Travel	Payee: Szanzer, Steven Z., OT 10:44 PM	\$78.09	
09/14/21		Travel	Payee: Szanzer, Steven Z., OT 9:47 PM	\$65.91	
09/28/21		Travel	Payee: Piraino, Stephen D., 9/28/2021, OT 11:12 PM, Uber, DPW, Home	\$82.93	
09/30/21		Travel	Payee: Szanzer, Steven Z., OT 9:50 PM	\$61.69	
TOTAL \$10,039.14					