Entered 11/23/21 08:27:08 Desc Main Case 20-30080 Doc 1230 Filed 11/23/21 Page 1 of 78 Document

UNITED STATES BANKRUPTCY COURT WESTERN DISTRICT OF NORTH CAROLINA **Charlotte Division**

In re

DBMP LLC,¹

Debtor.

Chapter 11

Case No. 20-30080 (JCW)

FIFTH INTERIM APPLICATION OF CAPLIN & DRYSDALE, CHARTERED FOR ALLOWANCE OF COMPENSATION AND REIMBURSEMENT OF **EXPENSES WITH RESPECT TO SERVICES RENDERED AS COUNSEL TO** THE OFFICIAL COMMITTEE OF ASBESTOS PERSONAL INJURY CLAIMANTS FOR THE PERIOD MAY 1, 2021, THROUGH AUGUST 31, 2021

Name of Applicant:

Authorized to Provide Professional Services to:

Date of Retention:

Period for which Compensation and Reimbursement are sought:

Amount of Compensation sought as actual, reasonable and necessary:

Amount of Expense Reimbursement sought as actual, reasonable and necessary:

This is an:

x interim

Caplin & Drysdale, Chartered

Official Committee of Asbestos Personal Injury Claimants

Order Entered May 4, 2020, effective as of February 14, 2020

May 1, 2021, through August 31, 2021

\$621,834.50

\$3,493.54²

final application.

The last four digits of the Debtor's taxpayer identification number are 8817. The Debtor's address is 20 Moores Road, Malvern, Pennsylvania 19355.

² This amount reflects a voluntary reduction of Caplin's expenses in the amount of \$666.00

Case 20-30080 Doc 1230 Filed 11/23/21 Entered 11/23/21 08:27:08 Desc Main Document Page 2 of 78

UNITED STATES BANKRUPTCY COURT WESTERN DISTRICT OF NORTH CAROLINA Charlotte Division

In re

Chapter 11

DBMP LLC,³

Case No. 20-30080 (JCW)

Debtor.

FIFTH INTERIM APPLICATION OF CAPLIN & DRYSDALE, CHARTERED FOR ALLOWANCE OF COMPENSATION AND REIMBURSEMENT OF EXPENSES WITH RESPECT TO SERVICES RENDERED AS COUNSEL TO THE OFFICIAL COMMITTEE OF ASBESTOS PERSONAL INJURY CLAIMANTS FOR THE PERIOD MAY 1, 2021, THROUGH AUGUST 31, 2021

Pursuant to 11 U.S.C. §§ 330 and 331, Rule 2016 of the Federal Rules of Bankruptcy Procedure and the Order Establishing Procedures for Interim Compensation and Reimbursement of Expenses of Professionals (the "Interim Compensation Order"), the law firm of Caplin & Drysdale, Chartered ("Caplin") hereby submits this fifth interim application ("Fifth Interim Application") for an Order awarding it interim compensation for professional legal services rendered as counsel to the Official Committee of Asbestos Personal Injury Claimants (the "Committee" or "ACC"), in the amount of §<u>621,834.50</u>, together with reimbursement of actual and necessary expenses incurred in the amount of §<u>3,493.54</u>,⁴ for the period commencing May 1, 2021, through August 31, 2021 (the "Application Period"). In support of this Fifth Interim Application, Caplin respectfully represents as follows:

I. JURISDICTION AND STATUTORY BASIS FOR RELIEF

This Court has subject matter jurisdiction pursuant to 28 U.S.C. §§ 1334 and 157.
This application is made pursuant to 11 U.S.C. § 331.

³ The last four digits of the Debtor's taxpayer identification number are 8817. The Debtor's address is 20 Moores Road, Malvern, Pennsylvania 19355.

⁴ This amount reflects a voluntary reduction of Caplin's expenses in the amount of \$666.00.

II. BACKGROUND

On January 23, 2020, (the "Petition Date"), the Debtor filed a voluntary petition for relief under Chapter 11 under Title 11 of the United States Code (the "Bankruptcy Code"). (Docket No. 1).

3. From the Petition Date through the date of this Fifth Interim Application, the Debtor has continued to operate its business and manage its properties as debtor-in-possession pursuant to sections 1107(a) and 1108 of the Bankruptcy Code.

4. On January 23, 2020, the Debtor filed its Motion for an Order Appointing an Ad Hoc Committee of Asbestos Personal Injury Claimants as the Official Committee of Asbestos Personal Injury Claimants (Docket No. 23). On February 5, 2020, the Office of the United States Bankruptcy Administrator (the "**Bankruptcy Administrator**") filed its Motion to Appoint Official Committee of Asbestos Claimants and Response in Opposition to the Motion of the Debtor for an Order Appointing an Ad Hoc Committee of Asbestos Personal Injury Claimants as the Official Committee of Asbestos Personal Injury Claimants (Docket No. 96). On February 14, 2020, following a hearing and further briefing by various interested parties, the Court entered an order appointing the ACC pursuant to section 1102 of the Bankruptcy Code. (Docket No. 155).

5. On March 5, 2020, the ACC filed and served its Application to Retain and Employ Robinson & Cole, LLP and Caplin as its counsel. (Docket No. 183). On May 4, 2020, the Court entered an order approving the retention application. (Docket No. 278).

6. Pursuant to the Interim Compensation Order, professionals may request monthly compensation and reimbursement. Such requests are to be served on certain identified parties for review. If no objection to a professional's request is received within fourteen (14) days of such request, the Debtor is authorized to pay 90% of the fees and 100% of the expenses requested.

7. The Interim Compensation Order also requires each retained professional to file at four-month intervals an application for interim Court approval and allowance pursuant to section 331 of the Bankruptcy Code of 100% of the compensation for services and reimbursement of expenses for prior months not already included in a previous interim fee application.

III. NARRATIVE

8. In the Application Period, Caplin performed significant reasonable and necessary

work for the Committee. Caplin's work focused on, among other tasks:

(a) reviewing, researching and analyzing, and preparing and editing materials related to evidentiary and discovery motions, including PIQ, trust discovery and defense counsel questionnaire motions, motion to reopen the PI proceeding, motion for continuance, standing motion, estimation motion, Debtor's plan, Debtor's informational brief and the Committee's responsive brief, preparing for and attending meet and confers, and communicating internally, with co-counsel and special litigation counsel, the Debtor and certain third-parties, and the FCR about these and related issues;

(b) preparing and editing deposition designations regarding the PI proceeding, analyzing issues related to discovery, reviewing and preparing 2004 discovery, witness preparation and preparing for and attending depositions, and conferring internally, with cocounsel, and the FCR about these and related issues;

(c) researching, analyzing, and preparing the complaint and motion for substantive consolidation, and communicating internally, with co-counsel and special litigation counsel, and the FCR about these and related issues;

(d) reviewing and analyzing the Findings of Fact and Conclusions of Law regarding the PI proceeding, and researching, analyzing, and preparing materials related thereto, including potential appeal-related issues;

(e) communicating with co-counsel and special litigation counsel as well as the Committee and the Committee's co-chairs about case strategy and respective tasks;

(f) researching and analyzing issues related to bankruptcy law, corporate restructuring law, and affiliates' liabilities;

(g) analyzing issues related to the Debtor's asbestos liability, and reviewing materials related thereto;

(h) preparing and reviewing its own monthly and interim fee requests;

(i) working and communicating with other Committee professionals on issues related to their respective areas of expertise; and

Case 20-30080 Doc 1230 Filed 11/23/21 Entered 11/23/21 08:27:08 Desc Main Document Page 5 of 78

(j) meeting with and advising the Committee on these and other issues, and responding to Committee inquiries.

9. A true and correct copy of the billing statements (the "**Billing Statements**") prepared for the services rendered by Caplin professionals during the Application Period are incorporated herein by reference and attached hereto as **Exhibit A**. The Billing Statements are in the same form regularly used by Caplin to bill its clients for services rendered and include the date that the services were rendered, a detailed, contemporaneous narrative description of the services, the amount of time spent for each service and the designation of the professional who performed the service. All of Caplin's work reflected in the Application was necessary, reasonable, and beneficial to the ACC and its constituency.

IV. COMPENSATION RECEIVED DURING THE APPLICATION PERIOD

10. All services for which Caplin seeks compensation were performed for or on behalf of the ACC. During the Application Period, Caplin has requested and received the following payments.

Date	Period Covered by	Requested	Requested	Payment	Payment
Requested	Request	Fees	Expenses	Received - Fees	Received - Expenses
7/16/2021	5/1/2021 - 5/31/2021	\$31,123.50	\$2,973.64	\$28,011.15	\$2,354.14
8/12/2021	$\frac{6}{1/2021} - \frac{6}{30/2021}$	\$183,120.00	\$0.00	\$164,808.00	\$0.00
10/26/2021	7/1/2021 - 7/31/2021	\$126,206.50	\$186.11	\$0.00	\$0.00
11/5/2021	8/1/2021 - 8/31/2021	\$281,384.50	\$999.79	\$0.00	\$0.00
TOTAL		\$621,834.50	\$3,493.54	\$192,819.15	\$2,354.14

11. The payments received by Caplin represent less than 100% of the total fees and expenses incurred during the Application Period. Remaining outstanding therefore, and now due and owing, is a balance of \$430,154.75 in fees and expenses incurred during the Application Period.

V. RELIEF REQUESTED

12. By this Fifth Interim Application, Caplin seeks interim allowance of \$621,834.50 in fees for services rendered during the Application Period and reimbursement of \$3,493.54 for reasonable and necessary expenses incurred during the Application Period, for a total of \$625,328.04. Caplin also seeks an order authorizing and directing the Debtor to pay the present balance of its charges for the Application Period if and to the extent the Debtor has not already paid those charges. That present balance outstanding is \$430,154.75.

13. Caplin has received no promises for payment from any third party for services rendered during the Application Period in connection with the case. There exists no agreement or understanding between Caplin and any other person for the sharing of any compensation to be received for services rendered by Caplin in the case.

14. All services for which compensation is requested by Caplin pursuant to this Application were performed for or on behalf of the ACC in the case.

VI. SUMMARY OF SERVICES RENDERED AND EXPENSES INCURRED

15. The professionals at Caplin who have provided services to or for the ACC in this case and their standard hourly rates⁵ during the Application Period were as follows:

Name	Title	Years Experience	Rate
Ann C. McMillan	Member	36	\$940
Kevin C. Maclay	Member	26	\$1,025
Todd E. Phillips	Member	15	\$815
James P. Wehner	Member	25	\$895
Jeffrey A. Liesemer	Member	27	\$895
Kevin M. Davis	Of Counsel	10	\$625
Quincy M. Crawford	Of Counsel	26	\$700
Jeanna Rickards Koski	Of Counsel	16	\$635
Nathaniel R. Miller	Associate	4	\$475
Katy C. Zendeh	Associate	3	\$450

⁵ Nonworking travel time is billed at one-half of the professional's usual hourly rate.

Case 20-30080 Doc 1230 Filed 11/23/21 Entered 11/23/21 08:27:08 Desc Main Document Page 7 of 78

Name	Title	Years Experience	Rate
Lucas H. Self	Associate	4	\$475
Shamara R. James	Associate	3	\$450
Shahriar M. Raafi	Associate	3	\$450
Cecilia Guerrero	Paralegal	22	\$380

16. As set forth in Exhibit A, Caplin rendered <u>826.6</u> hours of professional services during the Application Period, resulting in legal fees totaling <u>\$621,834.50</u> and associated reasonable and necessary expenses totaling <u>\$3,493.54</u>.

17. The total value of the services rendered by Caplin, broken down by category of professional services, among the persons rendering the services, is as follows:

Task Code by Professional	Hours	Hourly Rate	Fees
.04 Case Administration			
Todd E. Phillips	0.1	\$815.00	\$81.50
Cecilia Guerrero	1.7	\$380.00	\$646.00
.07 Fee Applications-Self			
Kevin C. Maclay	1.2	\$1,025.00	\$1,230.00
Todd E. Phillips	9.3	\$815.00	\$7,579.50
Cecilia Guerrero	33.7	\$380.00	\$12,806.00
.10 Litigation			
Ann C. McMillan	4.0	\$940.00	\$3,760.00
Kevin C. Maclay	35.7	\$1,025.00	\$36,592.50
Todd E. Phillips	149.4	\$815.00	\$121,761.00
James P. Wehner	167.0	\$895.00	\$149,465.00
Jeffrey A. Liesemer	62.8	\$895.00	\$56,206.00
Kevin M. Davis	0.8	\$625.00	\$500.00
Jeanna Rickards Koski	54.3	\$635.00	\$34,480.50
Quincy M. Crawford	10.4	\$700.00	\$7,280.00
Cecilia Guerrero	59.6	\$380.00	\$22,648.00
Nathaniel R. Miller	44.1	\$475.00	\$20,947.50
Katy C. Zendeh	5.8	\$450.00	\$2,610.00
Lucas H. Self	7.1	\$475.00	\$3,372.50

.11 Plan & Disclosure Statement			
Ann C. McMillan	1.1	\$940.00	\$1,034.00
Kevin C. Maclay	27.8	\$1,025.00	\$28,495.00
Todd E. Phillips	11.4	\$815.00	\$9,291.00
James P. Wehner	4.1	\$895.00	\$3,669.50
Jeffrey A. Liesemer	21.5	\$895.00	\$19,242.50
Kevin M. Davis	0.6	\$625.00	\$375.00
Cecilia Guerrero	0.1	\$380.00	\$38.00
Nathaniel R. Miller	23.7	\$475.00	\$11,257.50
Shamara R. James	1.5	\$450.00	\$675.00
.15 Committee Meetings/Conferences			
Ann C. McMillan	1.5	\$940.00	\$1,410.00
Kevin C. Maclay	23.5	\$1,025.00	\$24,087.50
Todd E. Phillips	22.7	\$815.00	\$18,500.50
James P. Wehner	5.0	\$895.00	\$4,475.00
Jeffrey A. Liesemer	3.9	\$895.00	\$3,490.50
Cecilia Guerrero	3.4	\$380.00	\$1,292.00
Nathaniel R. Miller	10.0	\$475.00	\$4,750.00
Shahriar M. Raafi	1.2	\$450.00	\$540.00
.17 Docket Review & Control			
Cecilia Guerrero	5.5	\$380.00	\$2,090.00
.18 Fee Applications - Others			
Todd E. Phillips	1.8	\$815.00	\$1,467.00
James P. Wehner	0.3	\$895.00	\$268.50
Cecilia Guerrero	9.0	\$380.00	\$3,420.00
TOTAL	826.6		\$621,834.50

Case 20-30080 Doc 1230 Filed 11/23/21 Entered 11/23/21 08:27:08 Desc Main Document Page 8 of 78

18. The general areas in which Caplin has rendered professional services to the ACC during the Application Period in the case may be broadly characterized as follows:

a) providing legal advice with respect to the ACC's powers and duties as an official

committee appointed under section 1102(a)(1) of the Bankruptcy Code;

Case 20-30080 Doc 1230 Filed 11/23/21 Entered 11/23/21 08:27:08 Desc Main Document Page 9 of 78

b) preparing on behalf of the ACC necessary applications, motions, complaints, answers, orders, agreements and other legal papers;

c) appearing in Court to present necessary motions, applications and pleadings and otherwise protecting the interests of the ACC; and

d) performing legal services for the ACC necessary and proper in these proceedings.

19. The generality of the foregoing description is amplified on a day-to-day basis by the Billing Statements attached as Exhibit A.

20. Set forth below are the rates for certain expenses incurred by Caplin for which reimbursement is requested pursuant to this Application, as well as the basis for such rates:

a) Copy charges: Caplin charges \$0.10 per page for copies, and such charge is based on an analysis of the cost to Caplin to make a copy;

b) Computer research charges: Caplin passes through on an exact cost basis all computer-assisted research charges; and

c) Out-going facsimile charges: Caplin charges \$0.25 for each page. These charges are based on an analysis of the cost to Caplin to send facsimile transmissions. Caplin does not pass through to its clients expenses or charges related to incoming facsimile transmissions.

21. Attached hereto as **Exhibit B** and incorporated herein by reference is a summary by category of these and all other expenses incurred by Caplin during the Application Period and for which reimbursement is requested. Further supporting documentation is available upon request.

22. A cumulative summary of Caplin's fees and expenses incurred as counsel to the ACC for the Application Period and since the Petition Date is attached as **Exhibit C**.

VII. NOTICE

23. Caplin has served a copy of this Application with the attached exhibits and Notice of Opportunity for Hearing on the Debtor, counsel to the Debtor, Bankruptcy Administrator, and counsel to the representative of future claimants. Caplin has also served the Notice of Opportunity for Hearing on such other parties as have filed a notice of appearance with this Court and requested such notice.

VIII. CONCLUSION

WHEREFORE, Caplin respectfully requests that the Court enter an Order (a) approving this Application and allowing on an interim basis Caplin's request for <u>\$621,834.50</u> in fees and reimbursement of <u>\$3,493.54</u> in expenses for the Application Period; (b) authorizing and directing the Debtor to pay the as-yet unpaid balances for the Application Period, that is, <u>\$430,154.75</u> in fees and expenses for services rendered; and (c) granting such other and further relief as the Court deems just and proper.

November 23, 2021

CAPLIN & DRYSDALE, CHARTERED

/s/ Kevin C. Maclay Kevin C. Maclay (admitted pro hac vice) Todd E. Phillips (admitted pro hac vice) One Thomas Circle, NW, Suite 1100 Washington, DC 20005 Telephone: (202) 862-5000 Facsimile: (202) 429-3301 E-mail: kmaclay@capdale.com; tphillips@capdale.com

Counsel for the Official Committee of Asbestos Personal Injury Claimants

Case 20-30080 Doc 1230 Filed 11/23/21 Entered 11/23/21 08:27:08 Desc Main Document Page 11 of 78

EXHIBIT A



A T T O R N E Y S

Telephone: (202) 862-5000

One Thomas Circle NW, Suite 1100 Washington, DC 20005 Federal Tax I.D. No.: 52-1226629 www.capdale.com

Fax: (202) 429-3301

DBMP LLC Official Committee of Asbestos Personal Injury Claimants

Invoice #: 335417 Page: 1

> \$31,123.50 \$2,973.64

> \$34,097.14

RE: DBMP LLC Bankruptcy

For Professional Services Rendered Through May 31, 2021

Total Services Total Disbursements Total Current Charges

Remittance Advice

Payment is due upon receipt. If you should have any questions, please email accounting@capdale.com.

Check Payable To: Caplin & Drysdale, Chartered Attn: Accounts Receivable One Thomas Circle NW, Suite 1100 Washington, DC 20005 Wire Transfer: Receiving Bank: Bank of America ABA Wire Routing Number: 026009593 ABA ACH Routing Number: 054001204 Swift Code: BOFAUS3N Beneficiary: Caplin & Drysdale, Chartered Account Number: 001920814809

Credit Card:

We accept American Express. A service fee of 2.4% for Corporate Cards and 2.95% for Individual Cards will be added to all payments. Please return this remittance page with your payment. Thank you.



ATTORNEYS

One Thomas Circle NW, Suite 1100 Washington, DC 20005 Federal Tax I.D. No.: 52-1226629 www.capdale.com

Fax: (202) 429-3301

DBMP LLC Official Committee of Asbestos Personal Injury Claimants

July 16, 2021 Invoice #: 335417 Page: 1

RE: DBMP LLC Bankruptcy

Telephone: (202) 862-5000

For Professional Services Rendered Through May 31, 2021

SERVICES

Date	Person	Description of Services	Hours	Rate	Amount
.04 Cas	se Administr	ation & Calendar Control			
5/31/2021	CG	Review docket and communications from TEP, D. Wright, and Debtor (.3); update docketing calendar re same (.2).	0.5	\$380.00	\$190.00
		Total	0.50		\$190.00
.07 Fee	Application	s-Self			
5/8/2021	TEP	Communicate w/ G. Thompson and KCM re monthly fee invoices.	0.1	\$815.00	\$81.50
5/10/2021	CG	Review and revise March monthly fee application.	2.1	\$380.00	\$798.00
5/11/2021	TEP	Communications w/ CG re monthly fee invoices (.2); communicate w/ L. Stoney and CG re same (.1); communications w/ KCM re same (.1).	0.4	\$815.00	\$326.00
5/13/2021	TEP	Communicate w/ G. Thompson re monthly fee invoice (.1); review monthly fee application (.5); communicate w/ KCM and CG re same (.1).	0.7	\$815.00	\$570.50
5/13/2021	CG	Review, revise, and finalize January monthly fee application (1.9); communications w/ Accounting re same (.1); communication w/ local counsel re same (.1); communication w/ TEP and KCM re same (.1); review comments from local counsel re February monthly fee application (.4); review and revise February monthly fee application (1.1); prepare same for service (.4); communications w/ TEP re same (.2).	4.3	\$380.00	\$1,634.00
5/13/2021	CG	Review and revise March and April monthly fee applications.	6.7	\$380.00	\$2,546.00

	Case 20-3	0080 Doc 1230 Filed 11/23/21 Entered 1 Document Page 14 of 78	1/23/21 08: 3	27:08 Desc July 16, 202 Invoice #:	Main 21 335417
					2
				Page:	2
SERVIC	CES				
Date	Person	Description of Services	Hours	Rate	Amount
07 F	ee Applicatior	ns-Self			
5/14/20	21 TEP	Communications w/ CG re monthly fee application (.2); communicate w/ D. Wright and C. Hardman re monthly fee applications (.1).	0.3	\$815.00	\$244.50
5/17/20	21 TEP	Review and edit monthly fee application (.4); communications w/ KCM and CG re same (.2).	0.6	\$815.00	\$489.00
5/27/20	21 TEP	Communications w/ KCM and CG re monthly fee application.	0.2	\$815.00	\$163.00
5/28/20	21 TEP	Communications w/ D. Wright and C. Hardman re monthly fee invoice.	0.2	\$815.00	\$163.00
		 Total	15.60	-	\$7,015.50
10 L	_itigation				
5/4/202	1 TEP	Prepare for and attend hearing (partial).	2.1	\$815.00	\$1,711.50
5/9/202	1 TEP	Communications w/ CG re deposition designations.	0.2	\$815.00	\$163.00
5/10/20	21 TEP	Review G. Cassada and J. Rubinstein communications re Trust discovery.	0.1	\$815.00	\$81.50
5/11/20	21 JAL	Teleconference w/ D. Neier, C. Hardman, G. Mastoris, D. Wright, J. Clasen, N. Ramsey, JPW, TEP, and G. Thompson re case developments and next steps.	0.2	\$895.00	\$179.00
5/11/20	21 JPW	Teleconference D. Neier, C. Hardman, G. Mastoris, D. Wright, J. Clasen, N. Ramsey, TEP, JAL, G. Thompson re case status.	0.2	\$895.00	\$179.00
5/11/20	21 KCM	Teleconference w/ TEP re case status and next steps.	0.4	\$1,025.00	\$410.00
5/11/20	21 TEP	Confer w/ KCM re case status and next steps (.4): attend teleconference w/ D. Neier, C. Hardman, G. Mastoris, D. Wright, J. Clasen, N. Ramsey, JPW, JAL, and G. Thompson re recent case developments and next steps (.2); review J. Ellman communication re Trust motion (.1); review N. Ramsey communication re upcoming hearing (.1).	0.8	\$815.00	\$652.00
5/12/20	21 JPW	Teleconference A. Sackett re PIQ issues.	0.2	\$895.00	\$179.00
5/12/20	21 TEP	Review J. Ellman communication re Rule 2004 motion and related order (.1); confer w/ D. Wright re post-hearing logistics (.2).	0.3	\$815.00	\$244.50
5/13/20	21 JPW	Review discovery correspondence.	0.4	\$895.00	\$358.00
5/13/20	21 TEP	Communications w/ S. Zieg communication re PIQ discovery.	0.1	\$815.00	\$81.50
5/14/20	21 TEP	Communications w/ S. Zieg and D. Wright re Bates/Starczewski discovery issue.	0.1	\$815.00	\$81.50

Case 20-30080 Doc 1230 Filed 11/23/21 Entered 11/23/21 08:27:08 Desc Main Document Page 15 of 78 July 16, 2021

July 16, 2021 Invoice #: 335417

				Page:	3
SERVICES					
Date	Person	Description of Services	Hours	Rate	Amount
10 Litiga	ation				
5/17/2021	JPW	Teleconference E. Harron, S. Zieg, E. Bradley, N. Ramsey, S. Goldman, D. Wright, A. DePeau, TEP re discovery issues (0.6); teleconference D. Wright, S. Goldman, N. Ramsey, G. Mastoris, C. Hardman, R. Cox, J. Clasen re same (0.1); teleconference TEP re same (0.2).	0.9	\$895.00	\$805.50
5/17/2021	TEP	Confer w/ JPW re discovery issue and next steps (.2); communicate w/ NRM re deposition designations filing (.1); prepare for and attend teleconference w/ E. Harron, S. Zieg, E. Bradley, N. Ramsey, S. Goldman, D. Wright, A. DePeau, and JPW re PIQ/Trust discovery issues (.6); confer w/ NRM re designations (.2).	1.1	\$815.00	\$896.50
5/17/2021	NRM	Analyze designations from E. Bradley and C. Lambe (2.2); correspond w/ CG re same (0.1); confer w/ CG re same (0.6); confer w/ TEP re same (0.2).	3.1	\$475.00	\$1,472.50
5/17/2021	CG	Review and revise deposition designations for filing (4.7); communications w/ NRM re same (.2); conference w/ NRM re same (.6).	5.5	\$380.00	\$2,090.00
5/18/2021	TEP	Communications w/ JPW re PIQ/Trust discovery and related communication.	0.1	\$815.00	\$81.50
5/19/2021	TEP	Review J. Rubinstein communication re Trust discovery issues (.1); confer w/ CG re deposition designations (.1).	0.2	\$815.00	\$163.00
5/19/2021	CG	Review and revise designations (2.1); confer w/ TEP re same (.1); communicate w/ NRM re same (.1).	2.3	\$380.00	\$874.00
5/20/2021	TEP	Review D. Wright communication re Trust discovery.	0.1	\$815.00	\$81.50
5/21/2021	JPW	Review discovery-related correspondence.	0.6	\$895.00	\$537.00
5/21/2021	TEP	Communicate w/ D. Wright, C. Hardman, C. Calvar, KCM, NRM and CG re deposition designation filing (.1); communication w/ E. Harron, S. Zieg, E. Bradley, E. Edwards, F. Parrish, N. Ramsey, D. Wright, D. Neier, C. Hardman, C. Calvar, G. Thompson, KCM, NRM, and CG re same (.1); review V. Ross communication re discovery (.1).	0.3	\$815.00	\$244.50
5/21/2021	NRM	Review correspondence re deposition designations and discovery issues.	0.1	\$475.00	\$47.50
5/24/2021	TEP	Review G. Cassada and J. Rubinstein communications re Trust discovery order.	0.2	\$815.00	\$163.00
5/25/2021	KCM	Confer w/ TEP and C. Hardman re expert protocol (.5); confer w/ TEP re same (.1).	0.6	\$1,025.00	\$615.00
5/25/2021	TEP	Communications w/ KCM re expert protocol (.1); confer w/ KCM re same (.1); confer w/ KCM and C. Hardman re same (.5).	0.7	\$815.00	\$570.50

		Document Page 16 of 78	3	July 16, 20 Invoice #:)21 335417
				Page:	4
SERVICES					
Date	Person	Description of Services	Hours	Rate	Amount
.10 Litiga	ition				
5/26/2021	JPW	Review correspondence from co-counsel re discovery-related issue.	0.6	\$895.00	\$537.00
5/26/2021	TEP	Review J. Christensen and D. Wright communications re Gross deposition (.2); review D. Wright communication re PIQ/Trust discovery briefing and communicate w/ NRM, CG and JAG re same (.1).	0.3	\$815.00	\$244.50
5/27/2021	JPW	Review draft correspondence re discovery issue.	0.2	\$895.00	\$179.00
5/27/2021	TEP	Attend meet and confer w/ G. Cassada, S. Pratt, G. Gordon, J. Ellman, K. Crandall, J. Rubinstein, T. Haggerty, D. Wright, and E. Edwards re Trust discovery issues (.7); communications w/ D. Wright re PIQ hearing (.1); communications w/ E. Bradley, NRM and CG re deposition designations (.1); review CG communication re same (.1); review D. Wright and J. Ellman communications re Gross deposition scheduling (.2).	1.2	\$815.00	\$978.00
5/27/2021	CG	Review communication from FCR counsel re designations (.4); communications w/ NRM and TEP re same (.1); review deposition transcripts and relevant pleadings re same (.7); draft email to NRM and TEP re same (.2).	1.4	\$380.00	\$532.00
5/28/2021	TEP	Review D. Wright communications re Gross deposition.	0.1	\$815.00	\$81.50
5/29/2021	TEP	Review N. Ramsey communication re Rule 2004 discovery.	0.1	\$815.00	\$81.50
5/30/2021	TEP	Communicate w/ JPW re Rule 2004 discovery.	0.1	\$815.00	\$81.50
5/31/2021	JPW	Review and analyze draft Rule 2004 discovery materials.	1.4	\$895.00	\$1,253.00
5/31/2021	CG	Review communications re discovery-issues and related deadlines.	0.9	\$380.00	\$342.00
		Total	27.20		\$17,272.50
11 Plan	& Disclosu	re Statement			
5/12/2021	TEP	Review J. Ellman and Court communications re hearing schedule.	0.1	\$815.00	\$81.50
5/14/2021	KCM	Plan/prepare re next steps and review/analyze related materials (1.1); teleconference w/ TEP re next steps (.3).	1.4	\$1,025.00	\$1,435.00
5/14/2021	TEP	Confer w/ KCM re case status and next steps.	0.3	\$815.00	\$244.50
5/20/2021	JPW	Teleconference w/ KCM and TEP re case status.	0.2	\$895.00	\$179.00
5/20/2021	KCM	Teleconference w/ JPW and TEP re case status.	0.2	\$1,025.00	\$205.00
5/20/2021	TEP	Review J. Ellman and D. Wright communications re services invoices (.2); teleconference w/ JPW and KCM re case status (.2).	0.4	\$815.00	\$326.00

Ca		Document Page 17 of 7	8	July 16, 20 Invoice #:	
				Page:	5
SERVICES					
Date	Person	Description of Services	Hours	Rate	Amount
11 Plan &	& Disclosu	re Statement			
5/25/2021	КСМ	Teleconference w/ N. Ramsey re case status and next steps.	0.3	\$1,025.00	\$307.50
		Total	2.90		\$2,778.50
15 Comn	nittee Mee	tings/Conferences			
5/13/2021	TEP	Communicate w/ Committee co-chairs re case issue.	0.1	\$815.00	\$81.50
5/14/2021	TEP	Communicate w/ Committee co-chairs re case issue (.1); communications w/ KCM re same (.1).	0.2	\$815.00	\$163.00
5/17/2021	TEP	Communicate w/ NRM re Committee co-chairs' request.	0.1	\$815.00	\$81.50
5/17/2021	NRM	Draft materials for Committee re case status (1.8); communications w/ TEP re same (0.1); communicate w/ CG re same (0.2).	2.1	\$475.00	\$997.50
5/19/2021	KCM	Teleconference w/ Committee co-chairs re case status.	0.3	\$1,025.00	\$307.50
5/25/2021	KCM	Teleconference w/ N. Ramsey and Committee co-chairs re expert protocol.	0.2	\$1,025.00	\$205.00
5/27/2021	KCM	Teleconference w/ Committee co-chair re case status.	0.8	\$1,025.00	\$820.00
5/27/2021	NRM	Draft materials for Committee re case status (0.7); correspond w/ CG and JAG re same (0.1).	0.8	\$475.00	\$380.00
5/28/2021	CG	Review communications from TEP and Debtor re upcoming deadlines and recent developments (.5); review and revise Committee materials re same (.2); communications w/ NRM re same (.2).	0.9	\$380.00	\$342.00
		Total	5.50		\$3,378.00
18 Fee A	pplication	s-Others			
5/10/2021	TEP	Confer w/ C. Hardman re monthly fee invoices (.1); communicate w/ D. Wright re same (.1).	0.2	\$815.00	\$163.00
5/14/2021	TEP	Communications w/ D. Wright and C. Hardman re monthly fee applications.	0.2	\$815.00	\$163.00
5/16/2021	TEP	Communications w/ G. Thompson re monthly fee invoices (.1); communications w/ D. Wright and C. Hardman re same (.1).	0.2	\$815.00	\$163.00
		Total	0.60		\$489.00
		- Total Professional Services	52.3	-	\$31,123.50

PERSON RECAP

Person		Title	Hours	Rate	Amount
JAL	Jeffrey A. Liesemer	Member	0.2	\$895.00	\$179.00
KCM	Kevin C. Maclay	Member	4.2	\$1,025.00	\$4,305.00

	Case 20-30080	Doc 1230	Filed 11/23/21 Document Pa	Entered 11/23 age 18 of 78	8/21 08:2	July 16, 2	
						Invoice #:	335417
						Page:	6
PERSON	IRECAP						
Person			Title		Hours	Rate	Amount
TEP	Todd E. Phillips		Member		12.5	\$815.00	\$10,187.50
JPW	James P. Wehner		Member		4.7	\$895.00	\$4,206.50
NRM	Nathaniel R. Miller		Associate		6.1	\$475.00	\$2,897.50
CG	Cecilia Guerrero		Paralegal		24.6	\$380.00	\$9,348.00
DISBUR	SEMENTS						
Date	Description of	Disburseme	nts				Amount
05/01/202	21 Database Rese	earch - Lexis -	SMR - 04/07/2021 -	04/14/2021 [.18]			\$1,251.00
05/01/202	21 Database Rese	earch - Westlav	w - CG - 04/09/21 [.1	8]			\$96.73
05/01/202	21 Database Rese	earch - Westlav	w - SMR - 04/06/21 - 04/16/21 [.18]			\$386.	
05/12/202	21 Court Reporting	g/Transcript Se	ervice - 5/4/21 hr'g transcript [.10]			\$102.00	
05/12/202	21 Court Reporting	g/Transcript Se	ervice - 3/1-3/2021 h	r'g transcript [.10]			\$1,035.00
05/12/202	21 Court Reporting	g/Transcript Se	ervice - 3/11/21 hr'g 1	transcript [.10]			\$72.00
05/12/202	21 Court Reporting	g/Transcript Se	ervice - 3/25/21 hr'g t	transcript [.10]			\$30.00
			Total Disbursemer	nts			\$2,973.64
			Total Services				\$31,123.50
			Total Disburseme				\$2,973.64
			Total Current Cha	rges			\$34,097.14

Cas	se 20-30080	Doc 1230		Entered 11/23/21 (age 19 of 78	08:27:08 Desc July 16, 202 Invoice #:	Main 21 335417
					Page:	7
TASK RECAP						
Services				Disbursements		
Category		Hours	Amount	Category		Amount
.04		0.50	\$190.00	.01		
.07		15.60	\$7,015.50	.10		\$1,239.00
.10		27.20	\$17,272.50	.18		\$1,734.64
.11		2.90	\$2,778.50			
.15		5.50	\$3,378.00			
.18		0.60	\$489.00			
		52.30	\$31,123.50			\$2,973.64

BREAKDOWN BY PERSON

Person		Category	Hours	Rate	Amount
CG	Cecilia Guerrero	.04	0.50	\$380.00	\$190.00
TEP	Todd E. Phillips	.07	2.50	\$815.00	\$2,037.50
CG	Cecilia Guerrero	.07	13.10	\$380.00	\$4,978.00
JAL	Jeffrey A. Liesemer	.10	0.20	\$895.00	\$179.00
KCM	Kevin C. Maclay	.10	1.00	\$1,025.00	\$1,025.00
TEP	Todd E. Phillips	.10	8.20	\$815.00	\$6,683.00
JPW	James P. Wehner	.10	4.50	\$895.00	\$4,027.50
NRM	Nathaniel R. Miller	.10	3.20	\$475.00	\$1,520.00
CG	Cecilia Guerrero	.10	10.10	\$380.00	\$3,838.00
KCM	Kevin C. Maclay	.11	1.90	\$1,025.00	\$1,947.50
TEP	Todd E. Phillips	.11	0.80	\$815.00	\$652.00
JPW	James P. Wehner	.11	0.20	\$895.00	\$179.00
KCM	Kevin C. Maclay	.15	1.30	\$1,025.00	\$1,332.50
TEP	Todd E. Phillips	.15	0.40	\$815.00	\$326.00
NRM	Nathaniel R. Miller	.15	2.90	\$475.00	\$1,377.50
CG	Cecilia Guerrero	.15	0.90	\$380.00	\$342.00
TEP	Todd E. Phillips	.18	0.60	\$815.00	\$489.00
			_	52.30	\$31,123.50

= =



ATTORNEY S

Telephone: (202) 862-5000

One Thomas Circle NW, Suite 1100 Washington, DC 20005 Federal Tax I.D. No.: 52-1226629 www.capdale.com

Fax: (202) 429-3301

DBMP LLC Official Committee of Asbestos Personal Injury Claimants

Invoice #: 335967 Page: 1

RE: DBMP LLC Bankruptcy

For Professional Services Rendered Through June 30, 2021

Total Services Total Current Charges \$183,120.00 \$183,120.00

Remittance Advice

Payment is due upon receipt. If you should have any questions, please email accounting@capdale.com.

Check Payable To: Caplin & Drysdale, Chartered Attn: Accounts Receivable One Thomas Circle NW, Suite 1100 Washington, DC 20005 Wire Transfer: Receiving Bank: Bank of America ABA Wire Routing Number: 026009593 ABA ACH Routing Number: 054001204 Swift Code: BOFAUS3N Beneficiary: Caplin & Drysdale, Chartered Account Number: 001920814809

Credit Card:

We accept American Express. A service fee of 2.4% for Corporate Cards and 2.95% for Individual Cards will be added to all payments. Please return this remittance page with your payment. Thank you.



ATTORNEYS

One Thomas Circle NW, Suite 1100 Washington, DC 20005 Federal Tax I.D. No.: 52-1226629 www.capdale.com

Fax: (202) 429-3301

DBMP LLC Official Committee of Asbestos Personal Injury Claimants

August 11, 2021 Invoice #: 335967 Page: 1

RE: DBMP LLC Bankruptcy

Telephone: (202) 862-5000

For Professional Services Rendered Through June 30, 2021

SERVICES

Date	Person	Description of Services	Hours	Rate	Amount
.04 Case	Administra	ation & Calendar Control			
6/14/2021	CG	Review docket and update docketing calendar (.3); communicate w/ Court re upcoming hearing (.1).	0.4	\$380.00	\$152.00
6/15/2021	CG	Review docket and update docketing calendar (.3); communications w/ Court re hearing registration (.1).	0.4	\$380.00	\$152.00
		Total	0.80		\$304.00
.07 Fee A	Application	s-Self			
6/1/2021	KCM	Teleconference w/ TEP re fee application.	0.1	\$1,025.00	\$102.50
6/1/2021	TEP	Communications w/ CG re J. Ellman email re monthly fee invoice (.1); confer w/ KCM re same (.1); confer w/ J. Ellman re same (.1).	0.3	\$815.00	\$244.50
6/1/2021	CG	Review and revise May fee statement (.6); review Debtor and TEP communications re invoice issues (.4); review invoices and related materials (.7); communications w/ TEP and KCM re same (.2); communications w/ L. Stoney re fee applications (.1).	2.0	\$380.00	\$760.00
6/6/2021	KCM	Revise/edit April monthly fee application.	0.4	\$1,025.00	\$410.00
6/6/2021	TEP	Communicate w/ G. Thompson, L. Stoney, V. Hughes and CG re monthly fee invoice.	0.1	\$815.00	\$81.50
6/6/2021	CG	Review and revise April monthly invoice (.2); communicate w/ local counsel re same (.1).	0.3	\$380.00	\$114.00

Case 20-30080 Doc 1230 Filed 11/23/21 Entered 11/23/21 08:27:08 Desc Main Document Page 22 of 78 August 11, 2021

August 11, 2021 Invoice #: 33 335967

				Page:	2
SERVICES					
Date	Person	Description of Services	Hours	Rate	Amount
07 Fee A	Application	s-Self			
6/7/2021	TEP	Review and edit monthly fee application (.3); communications w/ KCM and CG re same (.1); communicate w/ JRK and CG re same (.2); conferences w/ G. Thompson re same (.3); communications w/ KCM re same (.3); review G. Thompson communication re same (.1).	1.3	\$815.00	\$1,059.50
6/7/2021	CG	Review and revise May monthly invoice.	0.7	\$380.00	\$266.00
6/7/2021	CG	Draft and finalize Collaborati invoices.	0.5	\$380.00	\$190.00
6/8/2021	TEP	Communicate w/ G. Thompson re monthly fee application.	0.1	\$815.00	\$81.50
6/8/2021	CG	Review comments from local counsel re March fee statement and implement revisions re same (1.0); revise, finalize, and serve monthly fee application (1.2); update fee-related materials re same (.6).	2.8	\$380.00	\$1,064.00
6/9/2021	CG	Draft interim fee application (1.3); prepare March Collaborati invoice (.3).	1.6	\$380.00	\$608.00
6/14/2021	TEP	Communications w/ CG re invoice status.	0.1	\$815.00	\$81.50
6/16/2021	TEP	Prepare and edit interim fee application (1.1); communications w/ KCM and CG re same (.2).	1.3	\$815.00	\$1,059.50
6/18/2021	TEP	Review G. Thompson communication re April invoice (.1); communicate w/ CG re same (.1).	0.2	\$815.00	\$163.00
6/21/2021	CG	Review, revise, and finalize April monthly fee application.	1.2	\$380.00	\$456.00
6/24/2021	CG	Draft, revise and finalize interim fee application (1.3); execute filing and service re same (.3).	1.6	\$380.00	\$608.00
6/28/2021	TEP	Review L. Stoney communication and communicate w/ KCM, CG, and JAG re same.	0.1	\$815.00	\$81.50
6/30/2021	TEP	Communicate w/ KCM re monthly fee application (.1); confer w/ CG re same (.1).	0.2	\$815.00	\$163.00
6/30/2021	CG	Confer w/ TEP re monthly fee application.	0.1	\$380.00	\$38.00
		Total	15.00		\$7,632.00
10 Litiga	ation				
6/1/2021	JPW	Review revisions to draft DCQ.	2.9	\$895.00	\$2,595.50
6/1/2021	TEP	Confer w/ NRM re deposition designations (.1); review NRM communication re same (.1); communicate w/ E. Edwards re same (.1).	0.3	\$815.00	\$244.50
6/1/2021	NRM	Research re deposition designations (3.1); confer w/ TEP re same (0.1); draft memorandum re same (0.6); correspond w/ TEP, KCM, and CG re same (0.1); confer w/ CG re same (0.1).	4.0	\$475.00	\$1,900.00
6/1/2021	CG	Review NRM communications re deposition designations (.2); teleconference w/ NRM re same (.1).	0.3	\$380.00	\$114.00

Case 20-30080 Doc 1230 Filed 11/23/21 Entered 11/23/21 08:27:08	8 Desc Main
•	August 11, 2021

Invoice #: 335967

				Page:	3
SERVICES					
Date	Person	Description of Services	Hours	Rate	Amount
10 Litiga	ation				
6/2/2021	JAL	Review and analyze correspondence from JPW re discovery matter.	0.3	\$895.00	\$268.50
6/2/2021	JPW	Review and revise draft DCQ.	2.9	\$895.00	\$2,595.50
6/2/2021	TEP	Communications w/ E. Bradley re designations.	0.2	\$815.00	\$163.00
6/3/2021	JPW	Review briefing and related materials re trust discovery issue.	0.6	\$895.00	\$537.00
6/3/2021	TEP	Communications w/ E. Bradley re deposition designations (.1); communications w/ NRM and CG re same (.3); confer w/ J. Ellman re same (.1); communicate w/ KCM and N. Ramsey re Gross deposition (.1).	0.6	\$815.00	\$489.00
6/3/2021	NRM	Review notice of filing and summary of deposition designations (1.4); correspond w/ TEP and CG re same (0.1); confer w/ CG re same (0.1).	1.6	\$475.00	\$760.00
6/3/2021	CG	Confer w/ NRM re notice of filing and deposition designations.	0.1	\$380.00	\$38.00
6/4/2021	JAL	Review and analyze Debtor's discovery requests (0.1); review and analyze materials re same (2.4).	2.5	\$895.00	\$2,237.50
6/4/2021	JPW	Review discovery requests (0.6); review Gross deposition transcript re same (2.5).	3.1	\$895.00	\$2,774.50
6/4/2021	КСМ	Teleconference w/ N. Ramsey, D. Wright, S. Goldman, and TEP re case status and next steps (1.3); plan/prepare re next steps and review/analyze related materials (.8).	2.1	\$1,025.00	\$2,152.50
6/4/2021	TEP	Review J. Ellman communication re PIQ discovery (.1); communicate w/ N. Ramsey, D. Wright, KCM, JPW, and CG re Rule 2004 discovery (.2); communications w/ J. Ellman re designations filing (.3); communications w/ D. Wright, C. Hardman, NRM and CG re same (.2); communications w/ NRM and CG re same (.1); prepare for (.1) and attend (1.3) teleconference w/ N. Ramsey, D. Wright, S. Goldman, and KCM re case status and next steps.	2.3	\$815.00	\$1,874.50
6/4/2021	NRM	Communications w/ TEP and CG re deposition designations.	0.1	\$475.00	\$47.50
6/6/2021	JAL	Review and analyze pleadings and related materials re PI issue.	1.9	\$895.00	\$1,700.50
6/6/2021	TEP	Review N. Ramsey communication re PIQ/trust discovery objections (.2); communicate w/ JPW re same (.1); review PIQ and trust discovery briefs (2.0); prepare materials re teleconference w/ N. Ramsey re Rule 2004 discovery (.2); plan/prepare re next steps (.2).	2.7	\$815.00	\$2,200.50

Case 20-30080 Doc 1230 Filed 11/23/21 Entered 11/23/21 08:27:08 Desc Main Document Page 24 of 78 August 11, 2021

August 11, 2021 Invoice #: 335967

Page: 4

Date	Person	Description of Services	Hours	Rate	Amount
.10 Litiga	ation				
6/7/2021	JAL	Review and provide comments to co-counsel re potential draft evidentiary motion and objection to Debtor's trust discovery motion (0.7); teleconference w/ N. Ramsey, D. Wright, R. Mauceri, B. Daniels, L. Krepto, K. Fix, A. Smith, A. Sackett, P. Ebener, M. Petersen, JPW, and TEP re discovery issue and next steps (1.3); teleconference w/ D. Neier, C. Hardman, D. Wright, J. Clasen, TEP, and JPW re developments and next steps (0.6); review provide comments to co-counsel re draft discovery brief (0.8).	3.4	\$895.00	\$3,043.00
6/7/2021	JPW	Teleconference TEP re PIQ and discovery-related issues (0.3); review and revise draft Rule 2004 discovery briefs (2.7); teleconference TEP re same (0.1); teleconference N. Ramsey, D. Wright, R. Mauceri, B. Daniels, L. Krepto, K. Fix, A. Smith, A. Sackett, P. Ebener, M. Petersen, JAL, TEP re discovery issues (1.3); teleconference D. Wright, J. Clasen, C. Hardman, D. Neier, JAL, TEP re case status and strategy (0.6).	5.0	\$895.00	\$4,475.00
6/7/2021	КСМ	Communications w/ TEP re discovery and brief issues (.7); review/analyze briefs and related materials re discovery issues (.6); teleconference w/ TEP re same (.3).	1.6	\$1,025.00	\$1,640.00
6/7/2021	TEP	Communications w/ NRM re Debtor-propounded PIQ/trust discovery (1.1); review/analyze draft Rule 2004 discovery (.5); review JPW's communication re same (.1); review and edit briefs re PIQ and trust discovery (.4); confer w/ KCM re same (.3); confer w/ JPW re draft Rule 2004 briefs (.3); confer w/ JPW re draft Rule 2004 briefs (.3); communications w/ KCM re same (.2); attend teleconference w/ N. Ramsey, D. Wright, R. Mauceri, B. Daniels, L. Krepto, K. Fix, A. Smith, A. Sackett, P. Ebener, M. Petersen, JPW and JAL re potential Rule 2004 discovery (1.3); confer w/ JPW re Rule 2004 briefs (.1); communications w/ KCM re same (.2); attend teleconference w/ D. Neier, C. Hardman, D. Wright, J. Clasen, JAL, and JPW re case status and next steps (.6); confer w/ C. Hardman re next steps (.2); review E. Bradley communication and related draft motion (.2).	5.5	\$815.00	\$4,482.50
6/7/2021	NRM	Review draft interrogatories and requests for production (0.3); research re same (0.2); draft memorandum re same (0.3); correspond w/ TEP, KCM, and CG re same (0.1).	0.9	\$475.00	\$427.50

Case 20-30080 Doc 1230 Filed 11/23/21 Entered 11/23/21 08:27:08 Desc Main Document Page 25 of 78 August 11, 2021

August 11, 2021 Invoice #: 33 335967

				Page:	5
SERVICES					
Date	Person	Description of Services	Hours	Rate	Amount
.10 Litiga	ation				
6/8/2021	ACM	Review draft correspondence re PIQ issues (.2); exchange e-mails re same (.1); teleconference w/ TEP re same (.1); teleconference w/ N. Ramsey re same (.2); exchange e-mails re objections to Debtor's PIQ and trust discovery motions (.2).	0.8	\$940.00	\$752.00
6/8/2021	JAL	Review and analyze correspondence from N. Ramsey and accompanying document re discovery issue.	0.8	\$895.00	\$716.00
6/8/2021	JPW	Teleconference TEP re opposition to Debtor's discovery motions (multiple) (0.6); review and revise same (4.1); review revisions to draft DCQ (1.0).	5.7	\$895.00	\$5,101.50
6/8/2021	КСМ	Communications w/ TEP re discovery issue and related briefs (.8); teleconferences w/ TEP re same (.4).	1.2	\$1,025.00	\$1,230.00
6/8/2021	TEP	Review draft correspondence re PIQ objections (.1); communications w/ ACM, KCM, and JPW re same (.1); communications w/ KCM re same (.1); confer w/ ACM re same (.1); review revised draft PIQ brief (1.1); communications w/ JPW re same (.1); review J. Ellman communication re deposition designations (.1); communicate w/ KCM, N. Ramsey, D Wright, D. Neier, C. Hardman, S. Zieg, E. Bradley, E. Edwards, G. Thompson, F. Parrish, NRM, CG and JAG re same (.1); communications w/ CG and NRM re same (.2); communicate w/ CG re same (.1); conferences w/ JPW re PIQ and trust discovery briefs (.6); conferences w/ KCM re same (.4); review and edit draft briefs (1.6); communications w/ N. Ramsey, D. Wright, KCM and JAL re same (.3); communicate w/ KCM re brief revisions (.2).	5.2	\$815.00	\$4,238.00
6/9/2021	JAL	Review and revise draft PIQ and trust discovery briefs (2.6); draft correspondence to KCM, TEP, JPW, and NRM re same (0.4); review correspondence from JPW re proposed revision to draft discovery brief (0.2); communicate w/ TEP re same (0.1); review and revise draft motion to reopen (5.9); correspond w/ NRM re same (0.2); review revisions to proposed Rule 2004 order (0.2).	9.6	\$895.00	\$8,592.00

Case 20-30080 Doc 1230 Filed 11/23/21 Entered 11/23/21 08:27:08 Desc Main Document Page 26 of 78 August 11, 2021 August 11, 2021 Invoice #: 33

					333307
				Page:	6
SERVICES					
Date	Person	Description of Services	Hours	Rate	Amount
10 Litiga	ation				
9/2021	JPW	Review revised opposition briefs re PIQ and trust discovery (1.8); teleconference TEP re same (multiple) (0.3); teleconference N. Ramsey (partial), D. Wright, R. Mauceri, S. Goldman, J. Clasen, A. DePeau (partial), TEP re discovery issues and related briefs (1.6); teleconference TEP re same (0.2); review potential draft motions re Gross and evidentiary issues (2.8); teleconference TEP, KCM re discovery issues (partial) (0.4); review revised draft DCQ (0.9); teleconference TEP, D. Wright re discovery briefing (1.1); teleconference TEP re same (0.1).	9.2	\$895.00	\$8,234.00
/9/2021	KCM	Teleconference w/ TEP and JPW (partial) re discovery issues and briefs (.6); communicate w/ TEP re same (.1).	0.7	\$1,025.00	\$717.50
/9/2021	TEP	Review materials in prep for teleconference re PIQ and trust discovery motions (.7); review N. Ramsey communication re same (.3); conferences w/ JPW re same (.3); attend teleconference w/ N. Ramsey (partial), D. Wright, R. Mauceri, S. Goldman, J. Clasen, A. DePeau (partial), and JPW re discovery issues (1.6); confer w/ JPW re same (.2); review potential draft motions re evidentiary issues (2.3); communications w/ JAL, KCM and JPW re same (.1); confer w/ KCM and JPW (partial) re discovery issues (.6); review draft PIQ and trust discovery briefs (.1); communicate w/ D. Wright and JPW re same (.1); communications w/ NRM and CG re Debtor's notice of deposition designations (.2); confer w/ D. Wright and JPW re PIQ brief (1.1); confer w/ JPW re same (.1); confer w/ C. Hardman re litigation strategy and related issues (.2).	7.9	\$815.00	\$6,438.50
/9/2021	NRM	Revise motion to reopen (2.3); correspond w/ JAL re same (0.1); review and analyze Debtor's deposition designations (0.4); correspond w/ TEP and CG re same (0.1); research re motion to reopen (0.4); draft memorandum re same (0.1); review and implement JAL's edits re motion to reopen (2.8).	6.2	\$475.00	\$2,945.00
/9/2021	CG	Finalize designations for filing (.4); communicate w/ local counsel re same (.1).	0.5	\$380.00	\$190.00
/10/2021	JAL	Review revised motion to reopen (0.7) and communications w/ TEP, KCM and co-counsel re same (0.3); review revisions to potential draft evidentiary motion (0.4); review and revise motion to reopen (0.9); review and analyze materials re potential motion re request for bankruptcy order and motion to reopen (1.3).	3.6	\$895.00	\$3,222.00

Case 20-30080 Doc 1230 Filed 11/23/21 Entered 11/23/21 08:27:08 Desc Main Document Page 27 of 78 August 11, 2021

August 11, 2021 Invoice #: 33 335967

				Page:	7
SERVICES					
Date	Person	Description of Services	Hours	Rate	Amount
.10 Litiga	ation				
6/10/2021	JPW	Review revised drafts of discovery motions (5.8); teleconference TEP re PIQ brief, draft motion re PIQ/trust discovery issue (multiple) (0.7); teleconference N. Ramsey, D. Wright, S. Goldman, A. DePeau, J. Clasen, D. Neier, C. Hardman, C. Calvar, G. Mastoris, TEP re same (1.0); teleconference A. Sackett re DCQ (0.2).	7.7	\$895.00	\$6,891.50
6/10/2021	KCM	Teleconferences w/ TEP re briefs and related issues (.5); teleconference w/ TEP and N. Ramsey re discovery and related motions (.2).	0.7	\$1,025.00	\$717.50
6/10/2021	TEP	Review revisions to potential draft evidentiary motion (.1); prepare materials re same (.2); communications w/ N. Ramsey re same (.2); communications w/ N. Ramsey re same (.1); review C. Hardman communication re same (.1); communications w/ N. Ramsey and D. Wright re same (.1); confer w/ C. Hardman re same (.6); conferences w/ KCM re same (.5); confer w/ JPW re same (.3); confer w/ D. Wright re same (.1); attend teleconference w/ N. Ramsey, D. Wright, S. Goldman, A. DePeau, J. Clasen, D. Neier, C. Hardman, C. Calvar, G. Mastoris, and JPW re strategy issues (1.0); confer w/ KCM and N. Ramsey re same (.2); communications w/ D. Wright and JPW re PIQ brief (.3); conferences w/ JPW re same (.2); communications w/ N. Ramsey, D. Wright, S. Goldman, J. Clasen, D. Neier, C. Hardman, G. Mastoris, C. Calvar, KCM, JPW, JAL, and G. Thompson re potential draft evidentiary motion (.3); communications w/ JPW re Rule 2004 discovery (.1); confer w/ JPW re motion re PIQ/trust discovery issue (.2); communicate w/ N. Ramsey, KCM and JPW re same (.1); review same (.2); review response to asbestos trust motion (.3); communicate w/ D. Wright and JPW re same (.1); confer und JPW re same (.1); review same (.2); review response to asbestos trust motion (.3); communicate w/ ACM re same (.1); review D. Wright and R. Cox communications re PIQ brief (.2).	5.6	\$815.00	\$4,564.00
6/10/2021	NRM	Prepare materials re motion to reopen (0.2); correspond w/ TEP re same (0.1); analyze revisions to same (0.2).	0.5	\$475.00	\$237.50
6/11/2021	ACM	Review and revise objection re Rule 2004 trust discovery (1.5); exchange e-mails re same (.2).	1.7	\$940.00	\$1,598.00
6/11/2021	JAL	Review revised motion to reopen (0.5); correspondence w/ TEP and NRM providing comments re same (0.4).	0.9	\$895.00	\$805.50

Case 20-30080 Doc 1230 Filed 11/23/21 Entered 11/23/21 08:27:08 Desc Main Document Page 28 of 78 August 11, 2021

August 11, 2021 Invoice #: 335967

					000007
				Page:	8
SERVICES					
Date	Person	Description of Services	Hours	Rate	Amount
.10 Litiga	ation				
6/11/2021	JPW	Review objections re Debtor's PIQ/trust discovery motions (1.3); review draft discovery requests (0.8); teleconference TEP re draft objections, discovery requests (multiple) (0.6); teleconference N. Ramsey, D. Wright, TEP re draft motion re PIQ/trust discovery issue (0.3); teleconference TEP re same (0.1).	3.1	\$895.00	\$2,774.50
6/11/2021	TEP	Review trust discovery brief (.2); communications w/ ACM re same (.1); review and edit Rule 2004 response re trust discovery (1.9); conferences w/ JPW re same (.6); communications w/ D. Wright, ACM, and JPW re same (.2); communicate w/ KCM re same (.1); communications w/ JAL re motion to reopen (.2); review revisions to motion to reopen (1.1); communications w/ D. Wright re same (.3); attend teleconference w/ N. Ramsey, D. Wright, and JPW re draft motion re PIQ/trust discovery issue (.3); confer w/ JPW re same (.1); review S. Zieg communication re motion to reopen (.2); confer w/ D. Wright re same (.1); confer w/ C. Hardman re case status (.1); review J. Ellman, N. Ramsey, and D. Wright communications re motion to reopen filing (.2); communications w/ D. Wright re motion to reopen and trust discovery filings (.3); review G. Thompson communication re same (.1).	6.4	\$815.00	\$5,216.00
6/11/2021	KMD	Review filings re Rule 2004 discovery (0.5); review filings re reopening record (0.3).	0.8	\$625.00	\$500.00
6/11/2021	NRM	Research re motion to reopen (0.4); correspond w/ JAL and TEP re same (0.2).	0.6	\$475.00	\$285.00
6/14/2021	JAL	Review and analyze materials re discovery issues.	0.9	\$895.00	\$805.50
6/14/2021	JPW	Review revisions to DCQ (0.7); review proposed discovery (0.6); provide comments to TEP re same (0.1); teleconference C. Hardman, G. Mastoris, C. Calvar, N. Ramsey, D. Wright, J. Clasen, S. Goldman, A. DePeau (partial), G. Thompson, S. Zieg, E. Edwards, TEP re motion to reopen (0.6); teleconference TEP re PIQ/trust motion hearing (0.1).	2.1	\$895.00	\$1,879.50

Case 20-30080 Doc 1230 Filed 11/23/21 Entered 11/23/21 08:27:08 Desc Main Document Page 29 of 78 August 11, 2021 August 11, 2021 Invoice #: 3

335967

Page: 9

SERVICES

Date	Person	Description of Services	Hours	Rate	Amount
.10 Litiga	tion				
6/14/2021	TEP	Review C. Hardman, N. Ramsey, S. Goldman and D. Neier communications re motion to reopen issues (.3); communications w/ JPW re DCQ and requests for discovery (.1); communicate w/ D. Wright re draft discovery (.2); communicate w/ KCM and JPW re draft PIQ/trust motion discovery (.1); attend teleconference w/ C. Hardman, G. Mastoris, C. Calvar, N. Ramsey, D. Wright, J. Clasen, S. Goldman, A. DePeau (partial), G. Thompson, S. Zieg, E. Edwards, and JPW re motion to reopen (.6); confer w/ JPW re PIQ/trust motion hearing (.1); communicate w/ S. Zieg, E. Bradley, E. Edwards, T. Buchanan, N. Ramsey, D. Wright, KCM, and JPW re same (.2).	1.6	\$815.00	\$1,304.00
6/15/2021	КСМ	Teleconference w/ TEP re case strategy and tasks.	0.9	\$1,025.00	\$922.50
6/15/2021	TEP	Review draft potential motion re PIQ/trust discovery issues (.9); confer w/ KCM re case strategy and next steps (.9).	1.8	\$815.00	\$1,467.00
6/16/2021	JAL	Review and analyze Debtor's response to motion to reopen.	0.6	\$895.00	\$537.00
6/16/2021	JPW	Teleconference S. Zieg, E. Edwards, E. Bradley, D. Wright, TEP re potential draft evidentiary motion.	0.8	\$895.00	\$716.00
6/16/2021	TEP	Prepare for (.1) and attend teleconference w/ S. Zieg, E. Edwards, E. Bradley, D. Wright, and JPW re potential motion re PIQ/trust motion issues (.8); confer w/ JPW re same (.1); review/analyze Debtor's response to motion to reopen and related declaration (.4); review D. Wright communication re same (.1).	1.5	\$815.00	\$1,222.50
6/17/2021	JAL	Prepare for (.2) and attend (.7) hearing re motion to reopen and motion to seal; correspond w/ TEP re same (0.2); review and analyze materials re discovery issues (0.4).	1.5	\$895.00	\$1,342.50
6/17/2021	JPW	Review co-counsel communication re motion to reopen (0.3); teleconference TEP re same (0.2); review and analyze revised draft DCQ (2.3).	2.8	\$895.00	\$2,506.00
6/17/2021	TEP	Communications w/ D. Wright re motion to reopen hearing (.1); communications w/ JAL re same (.2); confer w/ JPW re same (.2); confer w/ C. Hardman re same (.2); confer w/ D. Wright, C. Hardman, S. Goldman (partial), and J. Clasen (partial) re same (.4); attend hearing (.7); communicate w/ KCM, JAL, JPW and CG re same (.1); review R. Wyner and D. Wright communications re sealing/confidentiality issues re motion to reopen (.1); review D. Wright communication re meet and confer (.1).	2.1	\$815.00	\$1,711.50

С	ase 20-30	7:08 Desc Main August 11, 2021 Invoice #: 33596			
				Page:	10
SERVICES					
Date	Person	Description of Services	Hours	Rate	Amount
.10 Litiga	ation				
6/18/2021	JPW	Review draft expert protocol and correspondence re same.	0.8	\$895.00	\$716.00
6/19/2021	TEP	Review G. Cassada communication re meet and confer.	0.1	\$815.00	\$81.50
6/21/2021	JAL	Review and revise potential draft evidentiary motion (1.5); review and revise draft discovery brief (1.6); teleconference w/ C. Hardman, C. Calvar, D. Neier (partial), N. Ramsey, D. Wright, S. Goldman, J. Clasen, A. DePeau, G. Thompson, R. Cox, TEP, and JPW re strategy, developments, and next steps (2.0); teleconference w/ KCM re same (0.1); teleconference w/ KCM and TEP re next steps (0.3); teleconference w/ KCM, TEP, N. Ramsey, and D. Wright re case strategy (0.6).	6.1	\$895.00	\$5,459.50
6/21/2021	JPW	Review and revise potential draft evidentiary motion (1.7); review draft motion re request for bankruptcy order (1.3); teleconference TEP re evidentiary issues (0.8); teleconference C. Hardman, C. Calvar, D. Neier (partial), N. Ramsey, D. Wright, S. Goldman, J. Clasen, A. DePeau, G. Thompson, R. Cox, TEP, JAL re case strategy (2.0); teleconference TEP re same (0.3).	6.1	\$895.00	\$5,459.50
6/21/2021	KCM	Teleconference w/ TEP and JAL re case status and strategy (.3); teleconference w/ JAL re case status (.1); plan/prepare re next steps and review/analyze related materials (.9); teleconference w/ TEP, JAL, N. Ramsey and D. Wright re case strategy and task allocation (.6); teleconferences w/ TEP re case status and tasks (.4).	2.3	\$1,025.00	\$2,357.50

С	ase 20-30	0080 Doc 1230 Filed 11/23/21 Entered 11/23/21 08:2 Document Page 31 of 78		27:08 Des August 11 Invoice #:	c Main , 2021 335967
				Page:	11
SERVICES					
Date	Person	Description of Services	Hours	Rate	Amount
.10 Litiga	ation				
6/21/2021	TEP	Review communication re potential draft evidentiary motion (.1); review and analyze brief re same (1.2); communications w/ KCM, JAL, JPW, NRM, CG and JAG re same (.1); review and analyze potential draft evidentiary motions (.7); conferences w/ C. Hardman re same (.6); conferences w/ JPW re evidentiary issues (.8); communications w/ JPW and D. Wright re same (.1); conferences w/ KCM re case status (.4); plan/prepare re next steps (.4); communications w/ JAL re potential draft evidentiary motion and motion re request for bankruptcy order (.1); attend teleconference w/ C. Hardman, C. Calvar, D. Neier (partial), N. Ramsey, D. Wright, S. Goldman, J. Clasen, A. DePeau, G. Thompson, R. Cox, JAL, and JPW re various case issues and strategy (2.0); confer w/ JPW re same (.3); confer w/ KCM and JAL re case issues and strategy (.3); confer w/ KCM, JAL, D. Wright, and N. Ramsey re same (.6); confer w/ C. Hardman re same (.3); confer w/ D. Wright re sequencing of potential litigation related pleadings (.3).	8.3	\$815.00	\$6,764.50
6/21/2021	CG	Review communications re trust discovery issue.	0.6	\$380.00	\$228.00
6/22/2021	JAL	Teleconference w/ KCM and TEP re case strategy and next steps.	0.1	\$895.00	\$89.50
6/22/2021	КСМ	Teleconference w/ TEP and C. Hardman re case strategy (.9); teleconference w/ TEP re same (.1); teleconference w/ TEP and JAL re case status and tasks (.1).	1.1	\$1,025.00	\$1,127.50
6/22/2021	TEP	Confer w/ C. Hardman re potential draft evidentiary motions (.1); communicate w/ KCM re same (.1); confer w/ KCM re case strategy (.1); confer w/ KCM and C. Hardman re same (.9); confer w/ KCM and JAL re same (.1); review S. Zieg and D. Wright communications re meet and confer (.1); confer w/ D. Wright re case issues and next steps (.1).	1.5	\$815.00	\$1,222.50
6/23/2021	JAL	Review draft discovery motion.	0.6	\$895.00	\$537.00
6/23/2021	JPW	Review and revise discovery motion (2.1); teleconference TEP re discovery motion (multiple) (0.2).	2.3	\$895.00	\$2,058.50

Case 20-30080 Doc 1230 Filed 11/23/21 Entered 11/23/21 08:27:08 Desc Main Page 32 of 78 August 11, 2021 Document

Invoice #: 335967 Page: 12 SERVICES Date Person **Description of Services** Hours Rate Amount .10 Litigation 6/23/2021 TEP Review D. Wright, S. Zieg, J. Ellman, and G. 1.9 \$815.00 \$1,548.50 Cassada re meet and confer and communications w/ D. Wright and JPW re same (.1); review J. Ellman communication re subpoena issue (.1); communications w/ D. Wright re same (.1); attend meet and confer w/ N. Ramsey, D. Wright, R. Mauceri, J. Ellman, G. Gordon, G. Cassada, and S. Zieg (.6); review and edit Rule 2004 motion re DCQ (.7); conferences w/ JPW re same (.2); confer w/ D. Wright re case issues (.1). TEP 6/24/2021 Review Rule 2004 motion re DCQ. 0.2 \$815.00 \$163.00 6/25/2021 JPW Review discovery motion (0.4); teleconference 0.5 \$895.00 \$447.50 TEP re same (0.1). 6/25/2021 TEP Confer w/ JPW re discovery motion. 0.1 \$815.00 \$81.50 6/28/2021 JAL Teleconference w/ D. Neier, C. Hardman, G. 0.3 \$895.00 \$268.50 Mastoris, D. Wright, J. Clasen, G. Thompson, TEP, and JPW re case status and next steps. 6/28/2021 JPW Review as-filed motion and DCQ (0.8); 1.1 \$895.00 \$984.50 teleconference D. Neier, C. Hardman, G. Mastoris, D. Wright, J. Clasen, G. Thompson, TEP, JAL re case status (0.3). TEP Confer w/ D. Neier, C. Hardman, G. Mastoris, D. 0.3 6/28/2021 \$815.00 \$244.50 Wright, J. Clasen, G. Thompson, JPW and JAL re case status. KCM Teleconference w/ TEP re next steps. 6/29/2021 0.4 \$1,025.00 \$410.00 TEP 6/29/2021 Review communications re draft motion re 1.1 \$815.00 \$896.50 request for bankruptcy order (.1); communicate w/ KCM and JPW re same (.2); confer w/ KCM re next steps (.4); plan/prepare re upcoming hearings (.3); communicate w/ CG re upcoming hearing (.1). 6/30/2021 TEP 0.7 Review and edit motion re request for bankruptcy \$815.00 \$570.50 order (.5); communications w/ KCM re same (.1); review E. Edwards communication re PIQ/trust discovery hearing (.1). 177.40 Total \$148,857.00 .11 **Plan & Disclosure Statement** 6/9/2021 KCM Teleconference w/ N. Ramsey re case status 1.1 \$1,025.00 \$1,127.50 and next steps. 6/10/2021 KCM Teleconference w/ N. Ramsey re case status 0.6 \$1,025.00 \$615.00 and next steps. KCM 6/11/2021 Teleconference w/ TEP re case status and 0.5 \$1,025.00 \$512.50 strategy. 6/11/2021 TEP Confer w/ KCM re case status and strategy. 0.5 \$815.00 \$407.50 6/15/2021 JAL Teleconference w/ KCM, TEP, and JPW re 0.1 \$89.50 \$895.00 removal issue.

С	ase 20-30	0080 Doc 1230 Filed 11/23/21 Entered 1 Document Page 33 of 78	27:08 Desc Main August 11, 2021 Invoice #: 335967		
				Page:	13
SERVICES					
Date	Person	Description of Services	Hours	Rate	Amount
.11 Plan	& Disclosu	re Statement			
6/15/2021	JPW	Confer w/ KCM, TEP, JAL re removal issue.	0.1	\$895.00	\$89.50
6/15/2021	KCM	Teleconference w/ TEP, JPW, and JAL re removal issue.	0.1	\$1,025.00	\$102.50
6/15/2021	TEP	Confer w/ KCM, JPW and JAL re removal issue and communicate w/ D. Wright re same.	0.1	\$815.00	\$81.50
6/18/2021	KCM	Teleconference w/ TEP re case status and strategy.	0.5	\$1,025.00	\$512.50
6/18/2021	TEP	Confer w/ KCM re case status and strategy.	0.5	\$815.00	\$407.50
		 Total	4.10		\$3,945.50
.15 Com	mittee Mee	tings/Conferences			
6/1/2021	KCM	Review Committee co-chairs' communications w/ TEP.	0.2	\$1,025.00	\$205.00
6/1/2021	TEP	Communications w/ KCM and Committee co-chair re discovery issue (.2); research re same (.2).	0.4	\$815.00	\$326.00
6/1/2021	NRM	Prepare materials for Committee re case status (0.2); revise same (0.1); correspond w/ TEP and CG re same (0.1).	0.4	\$475.00	\$190.00
6/1/2021	CG	Review NRM communications re revised Committee materials.	0.2	\$380.00	\$76.00
6/4/2021	TEP	Review materials for Committee and communicate w/ KCM re same.	0.1	\$815.00	\$81.50
6/4/2021	NRM	Revise materials for Committee re case status.	0.2	\$475.00	\$95.00
6/6/2021	TEP	Communicate w/ KCM, NRM and CG re Committee co-chairs' request.	0.1	\$815.00	\$81.50
6/7/2021	JPW	Teleconference KCM, TEP re Committee issue (partial).	0.1	\$895.00	\$89.50
6/7/2021	KCM	Communicate w/ Committee member re case status (.2); teleconference w/ TEP and JPW (partial) re Committee issue (.2).	0.4	\$1,025.00	\$410.00
6/7/2021	TEP	Review Committee member communications (.2); review N. Ramsey communication to Committee (.1); confer w/ KCM and JPW (partial) re Committee member inquiry (.2).	0.5	\$815.00	\$407.50
6/9/2021	ACM	Teleconference w/ KCM, JPW, TEP and Committee member re discovery issue and related briefing (.5); exchange e-mails re same (.1).	0.6	\$940.00	\$564.00
6/9/2021	JPW	Teleconference Committee member, TEP, KCM, ACM re discovery issues.	0.5	\$895.00	\$447.50
6/9/2021	КСМ	Teleconference w/ Committee member, ACM, TEP and JPW re discovery issue and related briefing.	0.5	\$1,025.00	\$512.50

Case 20-30080 Doc 1230 Filed 11/23/21 Entered 11/23/21 08:27:08 Desc Main Document Page 34 of 78 August 11, 2021 August 11, 2021 Invoice #: 33

				Page:	14
SERVICES					
Date	Person	Description of Services	Hours	Rate	Amount
15 Comr	nittee Meet	tings/Conferences			
6/9/2021	TEP	Attend teleconference w/ Committee member, ACM, KCM, and JPW re discovery issue (.5); review N. Ramsey communications to Committee (.1); confer w/ Committee member (.4); review Committee communications (.1).	1.1	\$815.00	\$896.50
6/10/2021	JPW	Attend Committee meeting.	1.0	\$895.00	\$895.00
6/10/2021	КСМ	Teleconference w/ Committee co-chair re meeting (.1); plan/prepare for Committee meeting (.8); teleconferences w/ TEP re same (.2); attend Committee meeting (1.0).	2.1	\$1,025.00	\$2,152.50
6/10/2021	TEP	Prepare agenda re Committee meeting (.2); communications w/ N. Ramsey, D. Wright and CCM re same (.1); conferences w/ KCM re Committee meeting (.2); confer w/ D. Wright re ame (.1); attend Committee meeting (1.0).		\$815.00	\$1,304.00
6/11/2021	KCM	Teleconferences w/ TEP re Committee communication.	0.2	\$1,025.00	\$205.00
6/11/2021	TEP	Confer w/ Committee member re discovery issue (.4); confer w/ KCM re same (.1); review Committee member communications (.2); conferences w/ D. Wright re Committee issue (.3); confer w/ KCM re same (.1).	1.1	\$815.00	\$896.50
6/15/2021	JPW	Review Committee correspondence.	0.2	\$895.00	\$179.00
6/15/2021	TEP	Communicate w/ KCM, NRM, and CG re Committee request.	0.1	\$815.00	\$81.50
6/15/2021	CG	Review materials re case status update for Committee.	0.3	\$380.00	\$114.00
6/16/2021	NRM	Draft materials for Committee re case status (0.2); correspond w/ CG re same (0.1).	0.3	\$475.00	\$142.50
6/17/2021	TEP	Communications w/ NRM re Committee co-chairs' request (.3); communications w/ Committee re meeting (.1); communications w/ KCM, N. Ramsey and D. Wright re same (.1); communicate w/ NRM re Committee co-chairs' request (.1); communications w/ N. Ramsey, D. Wright and KCM re Committee co-chairs' request and hearing update (.2); communicate w/ Committee co-chairs, N. Ramsey, D. Wright and KCM re Committee request (.1); review D. Wright communication to Committee (.1).	1.0	\$815.00	\$815.00
6/17/2021	NRM	Draft materials for Committee re case status (0.5); communications w/ TEP re same (0.2); correspond w/ CG re same (0.1).	0.8	\$475.00	\$380.00
6/17/2021	CG	Review communications related to upcoming deadlines re preparation of case updates for Committee (.3); communications w/ NRM re same (.1).	0.4	\$380.00	\$152.00
6/18/2021	TEP	Prepare communication to Committee (.1); communicate w/ Committee re case status (.2).	0.3	\$815.00	\$244.50

C	ase 20-30	0080 Doc 1230 Filed 11/23/21 Entered 11/23/21 08: Document Page 35 of 78		27:08 Desc Main August 11, 2021 Invoice #: 335967	
				Page:	15
SERVICES					
Date	Person	Description of Services	Hours	Rate	Amount
15 Com	mittee Mee	tings/Conferences			
6/21/2021	TEP	Communicate w/ CG, KCM, and Committee co-chairs re case status updates.	0.1	\$815.00	\$81.50
6/22/2021	КСМ	Teleconference w/ Committee co-chair re Committee issue (.1); teleconference w/ Committee member re case status (.3); teleconference w/ TEP and D. Wright re Committee communication (.5); teleconferences w/ TEP re Committee issues, task allocation and strategy (.6).	1.5	\$1,025.00	\$1,537.50
6/22/2021	TEP	Conferences w/ KCM re Committee issues and next steps (.6); prepare Committee communication (.7); confer w/ C. Hardman re same (.1); communications w/ KCM, N. Ramsey, D. Wright, D. Neier, and C. Hardman re same (.3); review D. Wright communication re same and communicate w/ KCM re same (.1); confer w/ D. Wright re same (.1); confer w/ KCM and D. Wright re same (.5); communications w/ C. Hardman re same (.1).	2.5	\$815.00	\$2,037.50
6/23/2021	КСМ	Teleconference w/ Committee co-chair re case status and strategy (1.0); teleconference w/ TEP re Committee communication (.1).	1.1	\$1,025.00	\$1,127.50
6/23/2021	TEP	Prepare and edit Committee communication (.1); communications w/ KCM, N. Ramsey, D. Wright, D. Neier, and C. Hardman re same (.2); confer w/ KCM re same (.1).	0.4	\$815.00	\$326.00
6/24/2021	KCM	Teleconference w/ D. Neier re Committee communications.	0.2	\$1,025.00	\$205.00
6/29/2021	KCM	Teleconference w/ constituent re case status.	0.4	\$1,025.00	\$410.00
		 Total	20.90		\$17,669.00
.17 Dock	et Review	& File Maintenance			
6/22/2021	CG	Review docket and update internal files re same.	1.2	\$380.00	\$456.00
6/27/2021	CG	Review dockets and update internal files re recently filed pleadings.	0.7	\$380.00	\$266.00
		Total	1.90		\$722.00
.18 Fee A	Application	s-Others			
6/6/2021	TEP	Confer w/ C. Hardman re fee invoices.	0.1	\$815.00	\$81.50
6/6/2021	TEP	Review CG and JPW communications re LAS invoices.	0.1	\$815.00	\$81.50
6/14/2021	TEP	Communications w/ D. Wright re fee application status.	0.1	\$815.00	\$81.50
6/16/2021	CG	Review communications from D. Relles re fee applications (.5); review materials re same (.6); draft LAS monthly fee applications (3.6).	4.7	\$380.00	\$1,786.00

	Case 20-30080 Doc 1230 Filed 11/23/21 Entered 11/2 Document Page 36 of 78				27:08 Des August 1 Invoice #	
					Page:	16
SERVIC	ES					
Date	Person	Description	of Services	Hours	Rate	Amount
.18 Fe	e Application	s-Others				
6/17/202	1 CG	(3.8); update	rise LAS monthly fee applications materials re same (.4); e w/ D. Relles re same (.1).	4.3	\$380.00	\$1,634.00
6/18/202	1 TEP	Confer w/ C. invoices.	Hardman and D. Wright re fee	0.3	\$815.00	\$244.50
6/21/202	1 TEP	Review C. H	ardman email re invoice review.	0.1	\$815.00	\$81.50
			Total	9.70		\$3,990.50
			Total Professional Services	229.8		\$183,120.00
PERSON	I RECAP					
Person			Title	Hours	Rate	Amount
JAL	Jeffrey A. Lie	semer	Member	33.2	\$895.00	\$29,714.00
KCM	Kevin C. Mac	lay	Member	20.9	\$1,025.00	\$21,422.50
ACM	Ann C. McMi	llan	Member	3.1	\$940.00	\$2,914.00
TEP	Todd E. Philli	ps	Member	72.7	\$815.00	\$59,250.50
JPW	James P. We	hner	Member	58.6	\$895.00	\$52,447.00
KMD	Kevin M. Dav	vis	Of Counsel	0.8	\$625.00	\$500.00
NRM	Nathaniel R.	Miller	Associate	15.6	\$475.00	\$7,410.00
CG	Cecilia Guerr	ero	Paralegal	24.9	\$380.00	\$9,462.00
			Total Services Total Current Charges			\$183,120.00 \$183,120.00

Case 20-30080	Doc 1230	Filed 11/23/2 Document	ntered 11/23/21 37 of 78	L 08:27:	08 Desc August 11, 2 Invoice #:	
					Page:	17
TASK RECAP						
Services			Disbursements			

Category	Hours	Amount	Category	Amount
.04	0.80	\$304.00	.01	
.07	15.00	\$7,632.00		
.10	177.40	\$148,857.00		
.11	4.10	\$3,945.50		
.15	20.90	\$17,669.00		
.17	1.90	\$722.00		
.18	9.70	\$3,990.50		
	229.80	\$183,120.00		\$0.00

BREAKDOWN BY PERSON

Person		Category H	ours	Rate	Amount
CG	Cecilia Guerrero	.04	0.80	\$380.00	\$304.00
KCM	Kevin C. Maclay	.07	0.50	\$1,025.00	\$512.50
TEP	Todd E. Phillips	.07	3.70	\$815.00	\$3,015.50
CG	Cecilia Guerrero	.07	10.80	\$380.00	\$4,104.00
JAL	Jeffrey A. Liesemer	.10	33.10	\$895.00	\$29,624.50
KCM	Kevin C. Maclay	.10	11.00	\$1,025.00	\$11,275.00
ACM	Ann C. McMillan	.10	2.50	\$940.00	\$2,350.00
TEP	Todd E. Phillips	.10	57.90	\$815.00	\$47,188.50
JPW	James P. Wehner	.10	56.70	\$895.00	\$50,746.50
KMD	Kevin M. Davis	.10	0.80	\$625.00	\$500.00
NRM	Nathaniel R. Miller	.10	13.90	\$475.00	\$6,602.50
CG	Cecilia Guerrero	.10	1.50	\$380.00	\$570.00
JAL	Jeffrey A. Liesemer	.11	0.10	\$895.00	\$89.50
KCM	Kevin C. Maclay	.11	2.80	\$1,025.00	\$2,870.00
TEP	Todd E. Phillips	.11	1.10	\$815.00	\$896.50
JPW	James P. Wehner	.11	0.10	\$895.00	\$89.50
KCM	Kevin C. Maclay	.15	6.60	\$1,025.00	\$6,765.00
ACM	Ann C. McMillan	.15	0.60	\$940.00	\$564.00
TEP	Todd E. Phillips	.15	9.30	\$815.00	\$7,579.50

	Case 20-30080	Doc 1230	Filed 11/23/21 Document Pa	Entered 11/23/2 age 38 of 78	1 08:27	:08 Deso August 11, Invoice #:	c Main 2021 335967
						Page:	18
BREAKI	DOWN BY PERSON						
Person			Categ	jory l	Hours	Rate	Amount
JPW	James P. Wehner		.15		1.80	\$895.00	\$1,611.00
NRM	Nathaniel R. Miller		.15		1.70	\$475.00	\$807.50
CG	Cecilia Guerrero		.15		0.90	\$380.00	\$342.00
CG	Cecilia Guerrero		.17		1.90	\$380.00	\$722.00
TEP	Todd E. Phillips		.18		0.70	\$815.00	\$570.50
CG	Cecilia Guerrero		.18		9.00	\$380.00	\$3,420.00

229.80 \$183,120.00



ATTORNEY S

Telephone: (202) 862-5000

One Thomas Circle NW, Suite 1100 Washington, DC 20005 Federal Tax I.D. No.: 52-1226629 www.capdale.com

Fax: (202) 429-3301

DBMP LLC Official Committee of Asbestos Personal Injury Claimants

Invoice #: 337279 Page: 1

> \$126,206.50 \$186.11

\$126,392.61

RE: DBMP LLC Bankruptcy

For Professional Services Rendered Through July 31, 2021

Total Services Total Disbursements Total Current Charges

Remittance Advice

Payment is due upon receipt. If you should have any questions, please email accounting@capdale.com.

Check Payable To: Caplin & Drysdale, Chartered Attn: Accounts Receivable One Thomas Circle NW, Suite 1100 Washington, DC 20005 Wire Transfer: Receiving Bank: Bank of America ABA Wire Routing Number: 026009593 ABA ACH Routing Number: 054001204 Swift Code: BOFAUS3N Beneficiary: Caplin & Drysdale, Chartered Account Number: 001920814809

Credit Card:

We accept American Express. A service fee of 2.4% for Corporate Cards and 2.95% for Individual Cards will be added to all payments. Please return this remittance page with your payment. Thank you.



ATTORNEYS

One Thomas Circle NW, Suite 1100 Washington, DC 20005 Federal Tax I.D. No.: 52-1226629 www.capdale.com

Fax: (202) 429-3301

DBMP LLC Official Committee of Asbestos Personal Injury Claimants

August 31, 2021 Invoice #: 337279 Page: 1

RE: DBMP LLC Bankruptcy

Telephone: (202) 862-5000

For Professional Services Rendered Through July 31, 2021

SERVICES

Date	Person	Description of Services	Hours	Rate	Amount
.04 Case	e Administr	ation & Calendar Control			
7/2/2021	CG	Review vendor invoices and communicate w/ MAD re same.	0.2	\$380.00	\$76.00
		 Total	0.20		\$76.00
.07 Fee	Application	s-Self			
7/1/2021	KCM	Review/edit May monthly fee application.	0.2	\$1,025.00	\$205.00
7/1/2021	TEP	Review CG communication re monthly fee application and communicate w/ C. Hardman and D. Wright re same.	0.1	\$815.00	\$81.50
7/1/2021	CG	Review and revise monthly invoice and communicate w/ local counsel re same.	0.3	\$380.00	\$114.00
7/12/2021	TEP	Communications w/ CG re monthly fee applications.	0.1	\$815.00	\$81.50
7/14/2021	TEP	Communicate w/ CG re monthly fee applications.	0.1	\$815.00	\$81.50
7/16/2021	TEP	Communicate w/ G. Thompson re monthly fee application.	0.1	\$815.00	\$81.50
7/17/2021	CG	Review and revise June monthly fee application.	1.4	\$380.00	\$532.00
7/18/2021	TEP	Communications w/ CG re monthly fee invoice (.2); communications w/ Accounting re same (.2); confer w/ CG re same (.1); review and edit monthly fee invoice (.6); communications w/ KCM and CG re same (.2).	1.3	\$815.00	\$1,059.50
7/18/2021	CG	Review and revise June monthly fee application (4.1); communicate w/ TEP re invoice issue (.1); review and revise June monthly fee application (.9); communications w/ TEP re monthly fee application (.2); confer w/ TEP re same (.1).	5.4	\$380.00	\$2,052.00

C	ase 20-30	0080 Doc 1230 Filed 11/23/21 Entered 1 Document Page 41 of 78	1/23/21 08: }	27:08 Des August 31 Invoice #:	c Main , 2021 337279
				Page:	2
SERVICES					
Date	Person	Description of Services	Hours	Rate	Amount
07 Fee A	Application	s-Self			
7/21/2021	KCM	Review/edit June monthly fee application.	0.5	\$1,025.00	\$512.50
		Total	9.50		\$4,801.00
10 Litiga	ation				
7/1/2021	TEP	Review J. Ellman communication re motion scheduling.	0.1	\$815.00	\$81.50
7/2/2021	JPW	Review Debtor's emergency motion for continuance.	0.5	\$895.00	\$447.50
7/2/2021	TEP	Review Debtor's ex parte motion re continuation (.2); review J. Ellman and D. Schili communications re potential motion for continuance (.2); communications w/ D. Wright re same (.2); conferences w/ D. Wright re same (.3); communications w/ KCM re same (.2); plan/prepare re same (.4).	1.5	\$815.00	\$1,222.50
7/2/2021	CG	Update Gross confidentiality designations.	0.2	\$380.00	\$76.00
7/4/2021	TEP	Review KCM, N. Ramsey, and J. Ellman communications re motion to continue.	0.2	\$815.00	\$163.00
7/5/2021	TEP	Review Court communication re PIQ/Trust discovery/DCQ hearing.	0.1	\$815.00	\$81.50
7/6/2021	JPW	Review draft discovery responses.	1.9	\$895.00	\$1,700.50
7/6/2021	КСМ	Teleconference w/ TEP re case issues and next steps.	0.3	\$1,025.00	\$307.50
7/6/2021	TEP	Confer w/ D. Wright re ACC discovery responses (.1); communications w/ KCM, JPW, and CG re same (.1); review draft ACC discovery responses (.2); review Court and J. Ellman communications re proposed order re hearing continuation (.1); confer w/ C. Hardman re case issues and next steps (.3); confer w/ KCM re same (.3); communications w/ D. Wright and JPW re ACC discovery responses (.2).	1.3	\$815.00	\$1,059.50
7/7/2021	TEP	Communicate w/ D. Wright re ACC discovery (.1); review J. Ellman communication re PIQ/Trust discovery motions briefing (.1).	0.2	\$815.00	\$163.00
7/8/2021	KCM	Teleconference w/ TEP re case status.	0.1	\$1,025.00	\$102.50
7/8/2021	TEP	Confer w/ KCM re case status (.1); review communications re same (.1).	0.2	\$815.00	\$163.00
7/9/2021	TEP	Communications w/ D. Wright, NRM and CG re discovery responses.	0.1	\$815.00	\$81.50
7/10/2021	KCM	Teleconference w/ TEP re case strategy and next steps.	0.6	\$1,025.00	\$615.00
7/10/2021	TEP	Confer w/ KCM re PI next steps.	0.6	\$815.00	\$489.00
7/12/2021	ACM	Exchange e-mails w/ JPW, JAL and JRK re PIQ issues (.1); review files re same (.3).	0.4	\$940.00	\$376.00

Case 20-30080 Doc 1230 Filed 11/23/21 Entered 11/23/21 08:27:08 Desc Main Document Page 42 of 78 August 31, 2021 August 31, 2021 Invoice #: 33

337279

				Page:	3
SERVICES					
Date	Person	Description of Services	Hours	Rate	Amount
.10 Litiga	ation				
7/12/2021	JAL	Teleconference w/ C. Hardman, G. Mastoris, N. Ramsey, TEP (partial), R. Cox, and G. Thompson re developments and next steps.	0.3	\$895.00	\$268.50
7/12/2021	КСМ	Teleconference w/ TEP, D. Neier and C. Hardman re case status (.3); teleconference w/ TEP re next steps (.5).	0.8	\$1,025.00	\$820.00
7/12/2021	TEP	Review N. Ramsey communication re DCQ and related deposition (.1); attend teleconference w/ C. Hardman, G. Mastoris, N. Ramsey, JAL, R. Cox, and G. Thompson re case issues (partial) (.2); confer w/ KCM, D. Neier, and C. Hardman re case status (.3); confer w/ KCM re same (.5).	1.1	\$815.00	\$896.50
7/13/2021	KCM	Teleconference w/ TEP re case strategy.	0.2	\$1,025.00	\$205.00
7/13/2021	TEP	Confer w/ D. Wright re case issues and strategy (.3); communications w/ G. Thompson, D. Wright, and R. Cox re motion to reopen order (.1); confer w/ KCM re case issues (.2); communicate w/ D. Wright re same (.1).	0.7	\$815.00	\$570.50
7/19/2021	JPW	Review draft motions (1.4); teleconference KCM and TEP re case status and strategy (0.7).	2.1	\$895.00	\$1,879.50
7/19/2021	КСМ	Teleconference w/ TEP and JPW (partial) re case status and strategy (1.0); teleconference w/ N. Ramsey, D. Wright and TEP re same (.5).	1.5	\$1,025.00	\$1,537.50
7/19/2021	TEP	Review G. Thompson communication re motion to reopen (.1); communicate w/ JPW re M. Peterson deposition (.1); confer w/ KCM and JPW (partial) re case strategy and next steps (1.0); confer w/ KCM, N. Ramsey, and D. Wright re case issues and strategy (.5); confer w/ N. Ramsey re same (1.0).	2.7	\$815.00	\$2,200.50
7/19/2021	CG	Factual research re post-PI issue.	0.1	\$380.00	\$38.00
7/20/2021	JPW	Teleconference KCM, TEP, D. Neier, C. Hardman, G. Mastoris, N. Ramsey, S. Goldman, J. Clasen, D. Wright, and A. DePeau re case strategy.	0.4	\$895.00	\$358.00
7/20/2021	КСМ	Teleconference w/ TEP, JPW, D. Neier, C. Hardman, G. Mastoris, N. Ramsey, S. Goldman, J. Clasen, D. Wright, and A. DePeau re case strategy.	0.4	\$1,025.00	\$410.00
7/20/2021	TEP	Review D. Wright communication re M. Peterson deposition (.1); communicate w/ KCM, JPW, and CG re same (.1); attend teleconference w/ KCM, JPW, D. Neier, C. Hardman, G. Mastoris, N. Ramsey, S. Goldman, J. Clasen, D. Wright, and A. DePeau re case strategy (.4).	0.6	\$815.00	\$489.00
7/21/2021	JPW	Teleconference M. Peterson, N. Ramsey, A. Sackett, D. Wright, S. Goldman re deposition.	2.7	\$895.00	\$2,416.50
7/24/2021	TEP	Communications w/ D. Wright and KCM re case issues and next steps.	0.3	\$815.00	\$244.50

Case 20-30080	Doc 1230	Filed 11/23/2	21 Entered	11/23/21 08:27:08	Desc	Main
		Document	Page 43 of	78 Aug	ust 31, 2	2021
			-	Invo	oice #:	337279

					001210
				Page:	4
SERVICES					
Date	Person	Description of Services	Hours	Rate	Amount
10 Litiga	ation				
7/25/2021	KCM	Teleconference w/ TEP re case strategy.	0.2	\$1,025.00	\$205.00
7/25/2021	TEP	Plan/prepare re case status and next steps (.3); communicate w/ ACM and KCM re Debtor's plan (.4); confer w/ KCM re case strategy (.2); review D. Wright and A. Sackett communications re deposition logistics (.1); communications w/ D. Wright re same (.1).	0.8	\$815.00	\$652.00
7/26/2021	JAL	Review and analyze correspondence from S. Zieg re discovery issue.	0.3	\$895.00	\$268.50
7/26/2021	JPW	Teleconference M. Peterson, N. Ramsey, D. Wright, S. Goldman, A. Sackett re depo issues (2.9); teleconference A. Sackett re trust issues (0.2).	3.1	\$895.00	\$2,774.50
7/26/2021	КСМ	Teleconference w/ N. Ramsey re case strategy and potential filings (.7); teleconference w/ TEP re same (.1).	0.8	\$1,025.00	\$820.00
7/26/2021	TEP	Confer w/ D. Wright re case issue and next steps (.1); communications w/ D. Wright re case issues (.1); confer w/ KCM re same (.1); confer w/ C. Hardman re same (.1); plan/prepare re next steps (.6).	1.0	\$815.00	\$815.00
7/27/2021	JPW	Attend M. Peterson deposition.	7.4	\$895.00	\$6,623.00
7/27/2021	TEP	Review C. Gieser and N. Ramsey communication re Coalition for Litigation Justice appearance (.1); communicate w/ JPW re Peterson deposition (.1).	0.2	\$815.00	\$163.00
7/28/2021	JPW	Review draft discovery briefs (2.4); research re same (0.7); teleconference TEP re case strategy (0.3).	3.4	\$895.00	\$3,043.00
7/28/2021	KCM	Teleconferences w/ TEP re case strategy and discovery briefs.	0.3	\$1,025.00	\$307.50
7/28/2021	TEP	Conferences w/ KCM re case strategy (.3); confer w/ C. Hardman re next steps (.3); confer w/ D. Wright re same (.3); communications w/ JPW re case strategy (.1); confer w/ JPW re same (.3).	1.3	\$815.00	\$1,059.50
7/29/2021	JPW	Review draft discovery responses (0.5); review Debtor filings re estimation motion (2.1); teleconference TEP re same (0.2).	2.8	\$895.00	\$2,506.00
7/29/2021	TEP	Review estimation motion (.2); communications w/ KCM, JAL, N. Ramsey, and D. Wright, re same (.2); confer w/ JPW re same (.2); communications w/ D. Wright and JPW re discovery responses (.3); communications w/ KCM re case issues (.1); review Debtor's discovery responses (.1).	1.1	\$815.00	\$896.50
7/00/000 /				*••••	***

0.9

\$895.00

\$805.50

7/30/2021

JPW

Review estimation motion.

	ase 20-30	0080 Doc 1230 Filed 11/23/21 Entered 1 Document Page 44 of 78	1/23/21 08: 3	August 31 Invoice #:	
				Page:	5
SERVICES					
Date	Person	Description of Services	Hours	Rate	Amoun
.10 Litiga	ation				
7/30/2021	TEP	Review D. Wright communication re Debtor's estimation motion (.1); prepare materials re PIQ and Trust discovery briefs (.2).	0.3	\$815.00	\$244.50
7/31/2021	TEP	Review Trust discovery reply brief (.3); review PIQ reply brief (.3).	0.6	\$815.00	\$489.00
		Total	46.70		\$41,136.00
.11 Plan	& Disclosu	re Statement			
7/2/2021	JAL	Teleconference w/ NRM re prep of potential brief re affiliates' issue.	0.1	\$895.00	\$89.50
7/2/2021	KCM	Teleconference w/ TEP re case status.	0.2	\$1,025.00	\$205.00
7/2/2021	TEP	Teleconference w/ KCM re case status.	0.2	\$815.00	\$163.00
7/2/2021	NRM	Confer w/ JAL re potential brief re affiliates' issue.	0.1	\$475.00	\$47.50
7/7/2021	NRM	Draft preliminary statement re potential brief re affiliates' issue.	1.8	\$475.00	\$855.00
7/8/2021	NRM	Draft factual sections of potential brief re affiliates' issue (3.4); research re same (1.6); correspond w/ JAL re same (0.1).	5.1	\$475.00	\$2,422.50
7/9/2021	TEP	Review briefing re potential appeal issues re PI (1.4); communications w/ JRK re same (.1).	1.5	\$815.00	\$1,222.50
7/9/2021	NRM	Draft factual and legal argument sections of potential brief re affiliates' issue (7.5); research re same (4.1); conferences w/ CG re same (0.1); correspond w/ CG re same (0.1); correspond w/ JAL re same (0.1).	11.9	\$475.00	\$5,652.50
7/9/2021	CG	Conferences w/ NRM re potential brief re affiliates' issue.	0.1	\$380.00	\$38.00
7/12/2021	JAL	Review and edit potential brief re affiliates' issue.	2.4	\$895.00	\$2,148.00
7/12/2021	TEP	Review J. Ellman communication re hearing scheduling.	0.1	\$815.00	\$81.50
7/13/2021	JAL	Review and revise potential brief re affiliates' issue.	7.1	\$895.00	\$6,354.50
7/13/2021	KCM	Teleconference w/ N. Ramsey re case strategy and next steps.	1.3	\$1,025.00	\$1,332.50
7/13/2021	TEP	Review Court communication and communicate w/ G. Thompson, KCM, N. Ramsey, and D. Wright re same (.1); review J. Ellman communications re same (.1); communicate w/ CG, JAG and NRM re hearing cancellation (.1).	0.3	\$815.00	\$244.50
7/13/2021	TEP	Review N. Ramsey and KCM communications re potential evidentiary motion.	0.1	\$815.00	\$81.50
7/14/2021	TEP	Communications w/ KCM, N. Ramsey and D. Wright re potential evidentiary brief (.1); review comments to evidentiary brief and potential motion re standing (.3).	0.4	\$815.00	\$326.00

Case 20-30080	Doc 1230	Filed 11/23/2	21 Entered 11/23/21	08:27:08 Desc Main
		Document	Page 45 of 78	August 31, 2021
				I

				Page:	6
SERVICES					
Date	Person	Description of Services	Hours	Rate	Amount
11 Plan	& Disclosu	ire Statement			
7/14/2021	NRM	Revise portions of potential brief re affiliates' issue (0.3); research re same (1.5).	1.8	\$475.00	\$855.00
7/16/2021	JPW	Review relevant filings and additional materials re potential brief re affiliates' issue.	0.4	\$895.00	\$358.00
7/16/2021	TEP	Communications w/ NRM re potential brief re affiliates' issue (.1); review materials re same (.1).	0.2	\$815.00	\$163.00
7/16/2021	NRM	Revise potential brief re affiliates' issue (1.5); research re same (0.4); draft memorandum re same (0.3).	2.2	\$475.00	\$1,045.00
7/17/2021	NRM	Correspond w/ TEP re potential brief re affiliates' issue.	0.1	\$475.00	\$47.50
7/18/2021	NRM	Revise potential brief re affiliates' issue.	0.2	\$475.00	\$95.00
7/19/2021	KCM	Review/analyze potential briefs and related materials.	1.8	\$1,025.00	\$1,845.00
7/19/2021	TEP	Review potential motion re affiliates' liability.	0.4	\$815.00	\$326.00
7/21/2021	КСМ	Review/edit potential brief re affiliate issues and review/analyze related materials (2.7); teleconference w/ TEP re same (.4).	3.1	\$1,025.00	\$3,177.50
7/21/2021	TEP	Review and edit potential motion re affiliate liability (1.5); communicate w/ NRM re same (.1); conferences w/ NRM re same (.2); confer w/ KCM re same (.4).	2.2	\$815.00	\$1,793.00
7/21/2021	NRM	Review TEP's revisions to potential brief re affiliate liability (0.3); conferences w/ TEP re same (0.2).	0.5	\$475.00	\$237.50
7/23/2021	KCM	Review/analyze Debtor's plan.	0.4	\$1,025.00	\$410.00
7/23/2021	TEP	Review KMD and D. Wright communications re plan (.1); communications w/ KCM re same (.1).	0.2	\$815.00	\$163.00
7/23/2021	KMD	Review Debtor's filed plan (0.5); correspond w/ KCM, TEP re same (0.1).	0.6	\$625.00	\$375.00
7/24/2021	KCM	Draft/revise potential brief re affiliate issues and review/analyze related materials.	2.9	\$1,025.00	\$2,972.50
7/25/2021	ACM	Review plan-related materials (.5); exchange e-mails re same (.1).	0.6	\$940.00	\$564.00
7/25/2021	JPW	Review Debtor's plan.	3.4	\$895.00	\$3,043.00
7/25/2021	KCM	Review/edit potential motion re affiliate issues and review/analyze related materials.	6.8	\$1,025.00	\$6,970.00
7/26/2021	ACM	Teleconference w/ KCM and TEP re plan-related materials.	0.2	\$940.00	\$188.00
7/26/2021	JAL	Review and analyze Debtor's plan (4.6); confer w/ TEP re exclusivity issue (.2); communicate w/ TEP re case issues and next steps (0.2); teleconference w/ KCM and TEP re draft motion re affiliate issue (0.4).	5.4	\$895.00	\$4,833.00

Case 20-30080	Doc 1230	Filed 11/23/21	Entered 11/23/21	L 08:27:08 D	esc Main
		Document P	age 46 of 78	August	31, 2021

				Page:	7
SERVICES					
Date	Person	Description of Services	Hours	Rate	Amoun
11 Plan	& Disclosu	re Statement			
7/26/2021	КСМ	Teleconference w/ TEP re case status and next steps (.2); teleconference w/ TEP and ACM re case issues (.2); teleconference w/ TEP and JAL re potential affiliate brief (.4).	0.8	\$1,025.00	\$820.00
7/26/2021	TEP	Communicate w/ JAG re draft motion re affiliate issue (.1); prepare and edit same (.4); review JAG communication re draft brief re affiliate issues (.1); communicate w/ D. Neier, C. Hardman, N. Ramsey, D. Wright, and KCM re same (.1); communicate w/ G. Thompson and R. Cox re same (.1); confer w/ KCM re same (.2); confer w/ KCM and ACM re case issues (.2); confer w/ JAL re exclusivity issues (.2); confer w/ SRJ re same (.1); review SRJ memo re same (.1); confer w/ KCM and JAL re draft motion re affiliate issue (.4).	2.0	\$815.00	\$1,630.00
7/26/2021	SRJ	Research re exclusivity issue (1.4); confer w/ TEP re same (.1).	1.5	\$450.00	\$675.00
7/27/2021	JAL	Review and revise draft crime/fraud motion (1.6); review and analyze materials re potential brief re affiliates' issue (0.3); review correspondence and accompanying materials from TEP re plan issue (0.5).	2.4	\$895.00	\$2,148.00
7/27/2021	TEP	Communications w/ JAL and JPW re crime/fraud motion.	0.1	\$815.00	\$81.50
7/28/2021	JAL	Review and analyze draft motion re PI issue (0.7); draft and revise email to KCM, TEP, and NRM re same (0.9); review markup of crime-fraud motion (0.2); review and analyze materials re potential brief re affiliate issue (1.2); review markup of potential brief re affiliate issue (0.5); teleconference w/ TEP re revisions to same (0.2); correspondence w/ TEP re same (0.1).	3.8	\$895.00	\$3,401.00
7/28/2021	TEP	Review and revise draft brief re affiliate liability (1.0); confer w/ JAL re same (.2); communicate w/ D. Wright re draft brief re PI issue (.1); review same (.1); communications w/ KCM, JAL, and NRM re same (.1); review D. Wright and S. Goldman communications re potential brief re evidentiary issue (.2); communications w/ JAL and JPW re same (.1).	1.8	\$815.00	\$1,467.00
7/29/2021	KCM	Review/analyze draft briefs and related materials and plan/prepare re next steps.	3.9	\$1,025.00	\$3,997.50
7/30/2021	JAL	Email TEP re potential evidentiary motion.	0.2	\$895.00	\$179.00
7/30/2021	KCM	Teleconference w/ N. Ramsey re case status and strategy.	0.8	\$1,025.00	\$820.00
		 Total	83.40		\$65,944.00

Case 20-30080	Doc 1230	Filed 11/23/21	Entered 11/23/21	. 08:27:08 Desc Main
		Document F	Page 47 of 78	August 31, 2021

				Page:	8
SERVICES					
Date	Person	Description of Services	Hours	Rate	Amount
.15 Comn	nittee Mee	tings/Conferences			
7/1/2021	KCM	Teleconference w/ constituent (.1); confer w/ CG re Committee inquiry (.1).	0.2	\$1,025.00	\$205.00
7/1/2021	CG	Prepare materials re Committee inquiry (.3); communications w/ KCM and TEP re same (.2); confer w/ KCM re same (.1).	0.6	\$380.00	\$228.00
7/6/2021	TEP	Communications w/ NRM and CG re Committee co-chairs' request.	0.2	\$815.00	\$163.00
7/7/2021	NRM	Draft materials for Committee re case status (1.2); review correspondence w/ TEP and CG re same (0.2); confer w/ CG re same (0.1).	1.5	\$475.00	\$712.50
7/7/2021	CG	Confer w/ NRM re case status update for Committee.	0.1	\$380.00	\$38.00
7/12/2021	ACM	Exchange e-mails w/ Committee member re PIQ issues.	0.1	\$940.00	\$94.00
7/13/2021	JAL	Review and analyze materials in connection w/ Committee inquiry (1.0); teleconference w/ KCM re same (0.3).	1.3	\$895.00	\$1,163.50
7/13/2021	KCM	Teleconference w/ JAL re Committee issue.	0.3	\$1,025.00	\$307.50
7/13/2021	NRM	Revise materials for Committee re case status (0.9); communications w/ TEP re same (0.2).	1.1	\$475.00	\$522.50
7/15/2021	TEP	Communications w/ NRM re Committee co-chairs' request.	0.1	\$815.00	\$81.50
7/15/2021	NRM	Revise materials for Committee co-chairs and members (0.4); research re same (0.8); draft memorandum re same (0.2).	1.4	\$475.00	\$665.00
7/16/2021	TEP	Communications w/ Committee co-chairs re case issue.	0.2	\$815.00	\$163.00
7/19/2021	TEP	Communicate w/ D Wright re Committee co-chairs' request (.1); communications w/ Committee co-chairs, N. Ramsey, D. Wright, and KCM re same (.3); communicate w/ Committee members re same (.1).	0.5	\$815.00	\$407.50
7/24/2021	TEP	Review N. Ramsey communication to Committee.	0.1	\$815.00	\$81.50
7/26/2021	TEP	Confer/communications w/ constituent re case status.	0.2	\$815.00	\$163.00
7/27/2021	KCM	Teleconference w/ TEP re Committee issues.	0.2	\$1,025.00	\$205.00
7/27/2021	TEP	Review N. Ramsey and Committee co-chairs' communications re case issue (.2); confer w/ KCM re same (.2).	0.4	\$815.00	\$326.00

Case 20-30080 Doc 1230 Filed 11/23/21 Entered 11/23/21 08:27:08 Desc Main Document Page 48 of 78 August 31, 2021 Invoice #: 337279

Page: 9

Date	Person	Description of Services	Hours	Rate	Amount
.15 Comr	nittee Mee	tings/Conferences			
7/28/2021	TEP	Review Committee co-chair communications re case issue (.1); communications w/ Committee co-chairs, N Ramsey, KCM, D. Wright, and C. Hardman re Committee meeting (.1); communicate w/ N. Ramsey, D. Wright and KCM re same (.1); communications w/ N. Ramsey, D. Wright, D. Neier, C. Hardman, and KCM re Committee communications (.3); communicate w/ Committee re case issue (.1); review Committee member communications re same (.1).	0.8	\$815.00	\$652.00
7/29/2021	JAL	Review and analyze Committee member comments related to potential brief re affiliate issue (0.4); teleconference w/ TEP re same (0.2).	0.6	\$895.00	\$537.00
7/29/2021	KCM	Teleconference w/ TEP re case status and Committee issues (.4); plan/prepare for Committee call (.5); teleconference w/ Committee co-chair re Committee issues (.2).	1.1	\$1,025.00	\$1,127.50
7/29/2021	TEP	Review and edit Committee meeting minutes (.3); communicate w/ D. Wright re same (.1); communications w/ Committee member re case issue (.2); communicate w/ C. Hardman re same (.1); communicate w/ KCM, JAL, and NRM re same (.1); review Committee member communication re case issue (.1); confer w/ JAL re same (.2); confer w/ KCM re Committee issue (.4).	1.5	\$815.00	\$1,222.50
7/29/2021	NRM	Review comments from Committee member re potential brief re affiliate issue (0.2); correspond w/ TEP, JAL, and JAG re same (0.1).	0.3	\$475.00	\$142.50
7/30/2021	ACM	Attend Committee meeting.	0.6	\$940.00	\$564.00
7/30/2021	JAL	Attend Committee teleconference.	0.6	\$895.00	\$537.00
7/30/2021	JPW	Attend Committee meeting (partial).	0.4	\$895.00	\$358.00
7/30/2021	КСМ	Plan/prepare for Committee meeting and review/analyze related materials (1.8); attend Committee meeting (.6); teleconference w/ N. Ramsey re Committee issues (.3).	2.7	\$1,025.00	\$2,767.50
7/30/2021	TEP	Prepare for Committee meeting (.3); attend Committee meeting (.6).	0.9	\$815.00	\$733.50
		 Total	18.00		\$14,168.00
.18 Fee A	pplication	s-Others			
7/22/2021	TEP	Communicate w/ D. Wright and C. Hardman re monthly fee invoices.	0.1	\$815.00	\$81.50
		Total	0.10		\$81.50
		Total Professional Services	157.9		\$126,206.50

	Case 20-30080	Doc 1230	Filed 11/23/21 Entered 11 Document Page 49 of 78	/23/21 08:	27:08 Des August 31 Invoice #:	
					Page:	10
PERSON	N RECAP					
Person			Title	Hours	Rate	Amount
JAL	Jeffrey A. Liesemer		Member	24.5	\$895.00	\$21,927.50
KCM	Kevin C. Maclay		Member	32.4	\$1,025.00	\$33,210.00
ACM	Ann C. McMillan		Member	1.9	\$940.00	\$1,786.00
TEP	Todd E. Phillips		Member	31.2	\$815.00	\$25,428.00
JPW	James P. Wehner		Member	29.4	\$895.00	\$26,313.00
KMD	Kevin M. Davis		Of Counsel	0.6	\$625.00	\$375.00
SRJ	Shamara R. James		Associate	1.5	\$450.00	\$675.00
NRM	Nathaniel R. Miller		Associate	28.0	\$475.00	\$13,300.00
CG	Cecilia Guerrero		Paralegal	8.4	\$380.00	\$3,192.00
DISBUR	SEMENTS					
Date	Description of	Disbursemei	nts			Amount
06/22/20	21 Court Reporting	/Transcript Se	ervice - 6/17/21 hr'g transcript [.10]			\$46.50
07/01/20	21 Database Rese	arch - Westlav	w - CG - 06/10/21. [.18]			\$70.41
07/19/20	21 Pacer Charges	- CG [.01]				\$68.40
07/19/20	21 Pacer Charges	- JAL [.01]				\$0.50
07/19/20	21 Pacer Charges	- SMR [.01]				\$0.30
			Total Disbursements			\$186.11
			Total Services			\$126,206.50
			Total Disbursements			\$186.11
			Total Current Charges			\$126,392.61

	Case 20-30080	Doc 1230	Filed 11/23/21 Document Pa	Entered 11/23/21 08 age 50 of 78	3:27:08 Desc August 31, 1 Invoice #:	Main 2021 337279
					Page:	11
TASK RE	CAP					
Services				Disbursements		
Category		Hours	Amount	Category		Amount
.04		0.20	\$76.00	.01		\$69.20
.07		9.50	\$4,801.00	.10		\$46.50
.10		46.70	\$41,136.00	.18		\$70.41
.11		83.40	\$65,944.00			
.15		18.00	\$14,168.00			
.18		0.10	\$81.50			
		157.90	\$126,206.50			\$186.11

-

BREAKDOWN BY PERSON

_

=

Person		Category H	lours	Rate	Amount
CG	Cecilia Guerrero	.04	0.20	\$380.00	\$76.00
KCM	Kevin C. Maclay	.07	0.70	\$1,025.00	\$717.50
TEP	Todd E. Phillips	.07	1.70	\$815.00	\$1,385.50
CG	Cecilia Guerrero	.07	7.10	\$380.00	\$2,698.00
JAL	Jeffrey A. Liesemer	.10	0.60	\$895.00	\$537.00
KCM	Kevin C. Maclay	.10	5.20	\$1,025.00	\$5,330.00
ACM	Ann C. McMillan	.10	0.40	\$940.00	\$376.00
TEP	Todd E. Phillips	.10	15.00	\$815.00	\$12,225.00
JPW	James P. Wehner	.10	25.20	\$895.00	\$22,554.00
CG	Cecilia Guerrero	.10	0.30	\$380.00	\$114.00
JAL	Jeffrey A. Liesemer	.11	21.40	\$895.00	\$19,153.00
KCM	Kevin C. Maclay	.11	22.00	\$1,025.00	\$22,550.00
ACM	Ann C. McMillan	.11	0.80	\$940.00	\$752.00
TEP	Todd E. Phillips	.11	9.50	\$815.00	\$7,742.50
JPW	James P. Wehner	.11	3.80	\$895.00	\$3,401.00
KMD	Kevin M. Davis	.11	0.60	\$625.00	\$375.00
SRJ	Shamara R. James	.11	1.50	\$450.00	\$675.00
NRM	Nathaniel R. Miller	.11	23.70	\$475.00	\$11,257.50
CG	Cecilia Guerrero	.11	0.10	\$380.00	\$38.00

	Case 20-30080	Doc 1230	Filed 11/23/21 Document Pa	Entered 11/23/21 age 51 of 78	. 08:27	7:08 Deso August 31, Invoice #:	c Main 2021 337279
						Page:	12
BREAKI	DOWN BY PERSON						
Person			Categ	jory H	ours	Rate	Amount
JAL	Jeffrey A. Liesemer		.15		2.50	\$895.00	\$2,237.50
KCM	Kevin C. Maclay		.15		4.50	\$1,025.00	\$4,612.50
ACM	Ann C. McMillan		.15		0.70	\$940.00	\$658.00
TEP	Todd E. Phillips		.15		4.90	\$815.00	\$3,993.50
JPW	James P. Wehner		.15		0.40	\$895.00	\$358.00
NRM	Nathaniel R. Miller		.15		4.30	\$475.00	\$2,042.50
CG	Cecilia Guerrero		.15		0.70	\$380.00	\$266.00

.18

TEP

Todd E. Phillips

157.90 \$126,206.50

\$81.50

\$815.00

0.10



ATTORNEY S

Telephone: (202) 862-5000

One Thomas Circle NW, Suite 1100 Washington, DC 20005 Federal Tax I.D. No.: 52-1226629 www.capdale.com

Fax: (202) 429-3301

DBMP LLC Official Committee of Asbestos Personal Injury Claimants

Invoice #: 337539 Page: 1

RE: DBMP LLC Bankruptcy

For Professional Services Rendered Through August 31, 2021

Total Services Total Disbursements Total Current Charges \$281,384.50 \$999.79 \$282,384.29

Remittance Advice

Payment is due upon receipt. If you should have any questions, please email accounting@capdale.com.

Check Payable To: Caplin & Drysdale, Chartered Attn: Accounts Receivable One Thomas Circle NW, Suite 1100 Washington, DC 20005 Wire Transfer: Receiving Bank: Bank of America ABA Wire Routing Number: 026009593 ABA ACH Routing Number: 054001204 Swift Code: BOFAUS3N Beneficiary: Caplin & Drysdale, Chartered Account Number: 001920814809

Credit Card:

We accept American Express. A service fee of 2.4% for Corporate Cards and 2.95% for Individual Cards will be added to all payments. Please return this remittance page with your payment. Thank you.



ATTORNEYS

One Thomas Circle NW, Suite 1100 Washington, DC 20005 Federal Tax I.D. No.: 52-1226629 www.capdale.com

Fax: (202) 429-3301

DBMP LLC Official Committee of Asbestos Personal Injury Claimants

October 29, 2021 Invoice #: 337539 Page: 1

RE: DBMP LLC Bankruptcy

Telephone: (202) 862-5000

For Professional Services Rendered Through August 31, 2021

SERVICES

Date	Person	Description of Services	Hours	Rate	Amount
.04 Case	Administr	ation & Calendar Control			
8/10/2021	CG	Communication w/ Court re Aug. 12 hearing (.1); review communications from Debtor's counsel and Court re logistics re same (.1).	0.2	\$380.00	\$76.00
8/16/2021	TEP	Review JRK and CG communications re PHV application.	0.1	\$815.00	\$81.50
		Total	0.30		\$157.50
.07 Fee A	pplication	s-Self			
8/6/2021	TEP	Review J. Ellman communication re expense issue (.1); communications w/ KCM and CG re same (.1).	0.2	\$815.00	\$163.00
8/8/2021	TEP	Communicate w/ KCM re billing issue (.1); communicate w/ D. Wright re same (.1).	0.2	\$815.00	\$163.00
8/9/2021	TEP	Confer w/ D. Wright re invoices (.2); communicate w/ J. Ellman, D. Wright, and CG re fee issue (.1).	0.3	\$815.00	\$244.50
8/30/2021	TEP	Communications w/ CG re monthly fee application (.1); confer w/ CG re same (.1).	0.2	\$815.00	\$163.00
8/30/2021	CG	Review and revise July monthly (2.6); confer w/ TEP re same (.1).	2.7	\$380.00	\$1,026.00
8/31/2021	TEP	Review and edit monthly fee application (.4); communicate w/ KCM and CG re same (.1).	0.5	\$815.00	\$407.50
		Total	4.10		\$2,167.00

.10 Litigation

Case 20-30080	Doc 1230	Filed 11/23/2	1 Entered 11/23/21	08:27:08 Desc Main
		Document	Page 54 of 78	October 29, 2021

				Page:	2
SERVICES					
Date	Person	Description of Services	Hours	Rate	Amount
.10 Litiga	tion				
8/1/2021	TEP	Review Debtor's plan and replies re trust discovery and PIQ (.7); review N. Ramsey and S. Zieg communications re trust discovery motion (.1); communicate w/ JRK re research re motion for substantive consolidation (.1); plan/prepare re same (.2).	1.1	\$815.00	\$896.50
8/2/2021	ACM	Exchange e-mails re depositions related to trust discovery.	0.1	\$940.00	\$94.00
8/2/2021	KCM	Review M. Fryling communication and teleconference w/ TEP re same.	0.1	\$1,025.00	\$102.50
8/2/2021	TEP	Communications w/ ACM re upcoming depositions (.1); confer w/ JRK re motion for substantive consolidation and related research (.1); review M. Fryling communication and confer w/ KCM re same (.1); communicate w/ G. Thompson and R. Cox re PI issue (.1); review J. Ellman communication re document production and communicate w/ KCM, JAL, JPW, NRM, CG, and JAG re same (.1); review N. Ramsey and J. Ellman communications re hearing and discovery issues (.2).	0.7	\$815.00	\$570.50
8/2/2021	JRK	Research re requirements in connection w/ substantive consolidation (8.6); confer w/ TEP re same (.1).	8.7	\$635.00	\$5,524.50
8/2/2021	CG	Review communications from Debtor re document production and hearing schedule (.2); communicate w/ Z. Djurovic (WS) re recent document production and processing of same (.3).	0.5	\$380.00	\$190.00
8/3/2021	JPW	Teleconference TEP re case status and next steps.	0.1	\$895.00	\$89.50
8/3/2021	KCM	Teleconference w/ R. Cox re case status.	0.3	\$1,025.00	\$307.50
8/3/2021	TEP	Communications w/ S. Zieg, G. Thompson, R. Cox, N. Ramsey, D. Wright, F. Parrish and E. Harron re FOF/COL and related redaction issues (.1); communications w/ R. Cox re same (.1); communications w/ J. Ellman, N. Ramsey, D. Wright and KCM re meet and confer (.1); confer w/ JPW re hearing status and next steps (.1); plan/prepare re next steps (.4); review R. Cox and J. Ellman communications re sealing issues (.2); communications w/ N. Ramsey, D. Wright and KCM re case strategy (.1); communicate w/ KCM re same (.1).	1.2	\$815.00	\$978.00
8/3/2021	JRK	Research re motion for substantive consolidation.	6.8	\$635.00	\$4,318.00
8/3/2021	JRK	Research re motion for substantive consolidation (2.7); prepare discovery re same (3.9).	6.6	\$635.00	\$4,191.00
8/4/2021	TEP	Review JRK memorandum re notice issue and communicate w/ KCM and JAL re same.	0.1	\$815.00	\$81.50

		Document Page 55 of 78	}	October 29 Invoice #:	9, 2021 337539
				Page:	3
SERVICES					
Date	Person	Description of Services	Hours	Rate	Amount
.10 Litig	ation				
8/5/2021	JPW	Review draft discovery brief (1.2); teleconference TEP and KCM re estimation issues (0.4); teleconference TEP re brief x2 (0.7).	2.3	\$895.00	\$2,058.50
8/5/2021	КСМ	Teleconference w/ TEP and JPW re strategy and estimation issues (.4); teleconference w/ TEP re motion to continue (.1); teleconference w/ N. Ramsey re case status and strategy (.6).	1.1	\$1,025.00	\$1,127.50
8/5/2021	TEP	Communications w/ R. Cox, N. Ramsey, D. Wright, and KCM re motion to continue (.2); confer w/ KCM re same (.1); confer w/ R. Cox re same (.1); review revisions to motion to continue (.2); communications w/ CG re same (.1); communications w/ R. Cox re same (.1); communication w/ KCM re case strategy and estimation issues (.1); confer w/ KCM and JPW re same (.4); confer w/ JPW re motion to continue (multiple) (.7); prepare and edit same (1.1); communicate w/ N. Ramsey, D. Wright, KCM, and JPW re same (.1); communications w/ CG re same (.1).	3.3	\$815.00	\$2,689.50
8/5/2021	JRK	Draft discovery re substantive consolidation motion.	4.1	\$635.00	\$2,603.50
8/6/2021	JPW	Review revised motion for substantive consolidation.	0.9	\$895.00	\$805.50
8/6/2021	TEP	Communications w/ R. Cox and D. Wright re ex parte motion (.2); review same (.1); confer w/ D. Wright re same (.1); communications w/ R. Cox and S. Zieg re motion to continue (.1).	0.5	\$815.00	\$407.50
8/6/2021	JRK	Review and revise discovery re substantive consolidation motion.	1.7	\$635.00	\$1,079.50
8/6/2021	NRM	Review and revise motion to continue hearing.	0.5	\$475.00	\$237.50
8/9/2021	JAL	Review draft motion for substantive consolidation.	0.3	\$895.00	\$268.50
8/9/2021	TEP	Communicate w/ G. Thompson and R. Cox re potential appeal issues (.1); communicate w/ N. Ramsey, D. Wright, and KCM re next steps (.1); communicate w/ NRM re potential appeal issues (.1); review J. Ellman communication re meet and confer and communications w/ N. Ramsey, D. Wright, KCM, E. Harron, S. Zieg, and E. Edwards re same (.2); communicate w/ JRK re estimation motion (.1).	0.6	\$815.00	\$489.00
8/9/2021	JRK	Review and revise estimation motion (4.6); research re same (4.3).	8.9	\$635.00	\$5,651.50
8/9/2021	NRM	Revise draft notices of appeal for lift stay and preliminary injunction (1.6); communications w/ TEP re same (0.2); correspond w/ JAL re same (0.1).	1.9	\$475.00	\$902.50

5	ase 20-30	0080 Doc 1230 Filed 11/23/21 Entered 1 Document Page 56 of 78	1/23/21 08: }	October 29 Invoice #:	c Main 9, 2021 337539
				Page:	2
SERVICES					
Date	Person	Description of Services	Hours	Rate	Amoun
10 Litiga	ation				
8/10/2021	ACM	Review Court's ruling re preliminary injunction (.9); exchange e-mails re same (.1).	1.0	\$940.00	\$940.00
3/10/2021	JAL	Review and analyze Court's ruling on preliminary injunction and lift-stay motions (2.5); review and revise draft Rule 2004 discovery (0.8); teleconference w/ TEP and G. Thompson re Court's ruling and next steps (0.2); teleconference w/ KCM and TEP re same (0.3); revise/edit motion for substantive consolidation (4.0); teleconferences w/ NRM re next steps (0.4); revise/edit motion for substantive consolidation (1.7); correspondence w/ NRM and TEP re same (0.2); review correspondence from JRK re same (0.1).	10.2	\$895.00	\$9,129.00
8/10/2021	JPW	Research next steps re PI ruling.	1.9	\$895.00	\$1,700.50
8/10/2021	КСМ	Teleconferences w/ TEP re PI ruling and substantive consolidation motion (.9); attend conference call w/ TEP, G. Thompson (partial), N. Ramsey (partial), D. Wright (partial), D. Neier (partial), and C. Hardman (partial) re case issues and next steps (.7); teleconference w/ TEP and JAL re motion for substantive consolidation (.3); review/analyze PI opinion and order and related materials (.6); teleconference w/ N. Ramsey, D. Wright and TEP re case strategy and next steps (.7).	3.2	\$1,025.00	\$3,280.00
8/10/2021	TEP	Review and analyze Court's ruling re PI (1.9); confer w/ KCM re same (multiple) (.6); communications w/ KCM, JAL, JPW, KMD, JRK, NRM, LHS, and CG re same (.1); confer w/ G. Thompson and JAL re motion for substantive consolidation (.2); confer w/ KCM and JAL re same (.3); communications w/ JAL, JRK, NRM, and CG re same (.2); communications w/ JRK re Rule 2004 motion (.4); review and edit same (.5); communicate w/ LHS re factual research (.1); review revisions to substantive consolidation motion (.3); communications w/ JAL re same (.2); attend teleconference w/ KCM, N. Ramsey, and D. Wright re case strategy (.7); communications w/ JAL re Rule 2004 discovery (.1); communicate w/ N. Ramsey, D. Wright, KCM, JAL, JRK, and CG re same (.1); confer w/ KCM re same (.3); communication w/ KCM and JAL re substantive consolidation motion (.2); confer w/ NRM re same (.1); attend conference call w/ KCM, G. Thompson (partial), N. Ramsey (partial), D. Wright (partial), D. Neier (partial), and C. Hardman (partial) re case issues and next steps (.7); confer w/ C. Hardman re same (.3); confer w/ CG re briefing schedule and related papers (.3); communications w/ JAL and NRM re same (.2).	7.8	\$815.00	\$6,357.0

		Document Page 57 of 78	3	October 29 Invoice #:	c Main 9, 2021 337539
				Page:	5
SERVICES					
Date	Person	Description of Services	Hours	Rate	Amount
.10 Litiga	ation				
8/10/2021	JRK	Review motion for substantive consolidation and research re same and related discovery.	9.2	\$635.00	\$5,842.00
8/10/2021	JRK	Review and analyze PI order and FOF/COL and research re same.	3.4	\$635.00	\$2,159.00
8/10/2021	KCZ	Review and analyze PI order.	4.6	\$450.00	\$2,070.00
8/10/2021	NRM	Draft portions of substantive consolidation complaint (4.6); implement revisions from JAL re same (0.8); confer w/ JAL re same (0.4); confer w/ TEP re same (0.1); communications w/ TEP re same (0.1); conferences w/ CG re same (0.1); revise draft notices of appeal (0.6); correspond w/ TEP, JAL, and LHS re same (0.1); revise Rule 2004 discovery requests (0.8); correspond w/ TEP and JAL re same (0.2); research re same (1.1).	8.9	\$475.00	\$4,227.50
8/10/2021	CG	Review communications from JAL, TEP and NRM re substantive consolidation briefing (.3); communications w/ JAL re same (.2); review and revise motion for substantive consolidation (2.3); prepare materials re same (.2); communicate w/ TEP re same (.1); conferences w/ NRM re same (.1); review draft notices of appeal (.2); confer w/ TEP re briefing schedule and related papers (.3); review communications re revisions to substantive consolidation motion and Rule 2004 motion (.4).	4.1	\$380.00	\$1,558.00
8/11/2021	JAL	Review and revise motion for substantive consolidation (0.3); teleconferences w/ TEP (2x) re developments and next steps (0.2).	0.5	\$895.00	\$447.50
8/11/2021	JPW	Review draft informational brief and related materials.	2.3	\$895.00	\$2,058.50
8/11/2021	KCM	Teleconferences w/ TEP re case status, briefs and strategy.	1.6	\$1,025.00	\$1,640.00
8/11/2021	TEP	Confer w/ JAL re potential appeal issue (multiple) (.2); confer w/ KCM re informational brief (.1); communicate w/ ACM, JPW, and JRK re informational brief (.1); communications w/ JAL, NRM, and CG re motion for substantive consolidation (.2); communicate w/ N. Ramsey, D. Wright, KCM, JAL, NRM, and CG re same (.2); communications w/ N. Ramsey, D. Wright, D. Neier, C. Hardman, and KCM re case issues (.2); confer w/ KCM re same (.2); attend meet and confer w/ G. Gordon, J. Ellman, G. Cassada, R. Worf, N. Ramsey, D. Wright, S. Zieg, T. Buchanan, and G. Thompson (.7); confer w/ KCM re case issues and strategy (1.3).	3.2	\$815.00	\$2,608.00
8/12/2021	JPW	Review and revise informational brief (5.1);	5.3	\$895.00	\$4,743.50

C	Case 20-30080 Doc 1230 Filed 11/23/21 Entered 11/23/21 08:2 Document Page 58 of 78				
				Page:	6
SERVICES					
Date	Person	Description of Services	Hours	Rate	Amount
.10 Litiga	ation				
8/12/2021	KCM	Teleconference w/ N. Ramsey and G. Gordon re hearing (.2); teleconference w/ N. Ramsey re hearing (.1).	0.3	\$1,025.00	\$307.50
8/12/2021	КСМ	Teleconference w/ TEP and N. Ramsey (partial) re case status and next steps.	1.5	\$1,025.00	\$1,537.50
8/12/2021	TEP	Prepare for status conference (.8); attend status conference (1.2); confer w/ N. Ramsey and D. Wright re same (.2); confer w/ C. Hardman re same (.3); communications w/ JPW, JRK, and ACM re informational brief (.1); communications w/ D. Wright, JPW and JRK re potential evidentiary motion (.1); plan/prepare re next steps (.4); review G. Gordon, N. Ramsey, and J. Rubinstein communications re hearing scheduling (.2); communications w/ KCM, JAL, JPW, CG and JAG re same (.2); confer w/ KCM and N. Ramsey (partial) re case issues and next steps (1.5); communications w/ JPW re informational brief (.1).	5.1	\$815.00	\$4,156.50
8/12/2021	JRK	Review revised informational brief and provide comments to JPW re same (4.7); confer w/ JPW re same (.2).	4.9	\$635.00	\$3,111.50
8/12/2021	CG	Review and revise substantive consolidation motion.	1.1	\$380.00	\$418.00
8/13/2021	JPW	Teleconference N. Ramsey, D. Wright, S. Goldman, J. Clasen, A. DePeau, D. Neier, C. Hardman, G. Mastoris, TEP re discovery and case issues (1.0); review draft discovery motions (2.3).	3.3	\$895.00	\$2,953.50
8/13/2021	TEP	Review N. Ramsey and G. Gordon communications re estimation briefing schedule (.2); communicate w/ KCM, JAL and JPW re same (.1); review materials re same (.2); prepare for status conference (.3); attend teleconference w/ G. Gordon, J. Ellman, G. Cassada, N. Ramsey, D. Wright, E. Harron, and S. Zieg re scheduling issues (.2); attend status conference (.3); communicate w/ KCM, JAL, JPW, and CG re same (.2); confer w/ N. Ramsey re case issue (.1); attend teleconference w/ N. Ramsey, D. Wright, S. Goldman, J. Clasen, A. DePeau, D. Neier, C. Hardman, G. Mastoris, and JPW re case issues (1.0).	2.6	\$815.00	\$2,119.00
8/13/2021	NRM	Communications w/ TEP, CG, and E. Forte re draft substantive consolidation brief.	0.3	\$475.00	\$142.50
8/15/2021	KCM	Teleconference w/ QMC re case status and tasks.	0.3	\$1,025.00	\$307.50
8/15/2021	QMC	Review draft crime-fraud motion (1.8); confer w/ KCM re same (.3).	2.1	\$700.00	\$1,470.00

Case 20-30080 Doc 1230 Filed 11/23/21 Entered 11/23/21 08:27:08 Desc Main Document Page 59 of 78 October 29, 2021

				Page:	7
SERVICES					
Date	Person	Description of Services	Hours	Rate	Amount
.10 Litiga	ation				
8/16/2021	JAL	Teleconference w/ D. Neier, C. Hardman, G. Mastoris, N. Ramsey, D. Wright, J. Clasen, JPW, and TEP re developments and next steps (0.6); email correspondence w/ TEP, NRM, and KCM re same (0.2); review and revise markup of motion for substantive consolidation (1.0); teleconference w/ KCM (partial), TEP, and NRM re revisions to same and next steps (0.6).	2.4	\$895.00	\$2,148.00
8/16/2021	JPW	Attend deposition of J. Garelick (4.8); attend deposition of R. Winner (3.6); teleconference D. Neier, C. Hardman, G. Mastoris, N. Ramsey, D. Wright, J. Clasen, JAL, TEP re developments and next steps (0.6).	9.0	\$895.00	\$8,055.00
8/16/2021	КСМ	Teleconference w/ TEP re case strategy and next steps (.1); teleconference w/ TEP re substantive consolidation briefing (.1); teleconference w/ TEP re revisions to same (.3); teleconference w/ TEP, JAL, and NRM re same (partial) (.2).	0.7	\$1,025.00	\$717.50
8/16/2021	TEP	Communications w/ JPW, N. Ramsey, and D. Wright re Garelick and Winner depositions (.6); communications w/ JRK and CG re same (.2); plan/prepare re depositions (.2); review N. Ramsey communication re standing and evidentiary motions (.1); communicate w/ JAL, JPW, NRM, CG, and JAG re same (.1); communicate w/ KCM, JAL, NRM, and CG re substantive consolidation papers (.2); communications w/ N. Ramsey, D. Wright, S. Goldman, KCM, JPW, and CG re Bates deposition (.2); attend teleconference w/ D. Neier, C. Hardman, G. Mastoris, N. Ramsey, D. Wright, J. Clasen, JPW, and JAL re case strategy and next steps (.6); confer w/ KCM re same (.1); communications w/ JAL, NRM, KCM, and CG re substantive consolidation papers and potential appeal (.2); confer w/ KCM re same (.1); communications w/ JAL re same (.2); review N. Ramsey revisions to substantive consolidation motion (.3); confer w/ KCM re same (.1); confer w/ D. Wright re same (.1); confer w/ KCM (partial), JAL, and NRM re same (.6); confer w/ LHS re same (.1); confer w/ NRM re same (multiple) (.2).	4.2	\$815.00	\$3,423.00
8/16/2021	QMC	Review and revise draft crime-fraud motion (2.6); review estimation motion (1.8).	4.4	\$700.00	\$3,080.00
8/16/2021	LHS1	Research substantive consolidation issue (1.3); confer w/ TEP re same (0.1).	1.4	\$475.00	\$665.00

Case 20-30080	Doc 1230	Filed 11/23/2	21 Entered 11/2	23/21 08:27:08	Desc Main	
		Document	Page 60 of 78	Octo	ober 29, 2021	
			-	Invo	ice #: 3375	539

				Page:	8
SERVICES					
Date	Person	Description of Services	Hours	Rate	Amount
10 Litiga	ation				
8/16/2021	NRM	Draft notice of appeal re preliminary injunction order (1.7); research re same (1.2); confer w/ KCM (partial), TEP, and JAL re revisions to substantive consolidation motion (0.6); conferences w/ TEP re same (0.2); review and implement revisions from N. Ramsey re substantive consolidation complaint and motion (1.4); conferences w/ CG re appeal and substantive consolidation issue (0.2).	5.3	\$475.00	\$2,517.50
8/16/2021	CG	Confer w/ NRM re appeal and substantive consolidation issue (multiple) (.2); communications w/ TEP and JRK re Garelick and Winner depositions (.1); communicate w/ TEP, JAL, and NRM re substantive consolidation motion and complaint (.2).	0.5	\$380.00	\$190.00
8/17/2021	JAL	Review and revise draft motion for substantive consolidation (0.7); teleconference w/ TEP re research re same (0.1); review and revise same (1.7); draft email to KCM and TEP re comments on revised draft of potential complaint (0.1); review markups of draft standing and waiver motions (0.4); review and analyze substantive consolidation issue (1.1); draft and revise email to TEP and KCM re same (0.7); review markup of draft informational brief (0.4); review latest revised draft of crime-fraud motion (0.3); draft and revise email to NRM re comments on proposed substantive consolidation order (0.2).	5.7	\$895.00	\$5,101.50
8/17/2021	JPW	Review revised draft discovery motion (0.9); review estimation motion and supporting materials (3.1); review revised informational brief (0.8); review depo transcripts re estimation motion (3.2).	8.0	\$895.00	\$7,160.00
8/17/2021	КСМ	Teleconference w/ NRM re notice of appeal and proposed order (.3); teleconference w/ TEP re appeal issues (.1).	0.4	\$1,025.00	\$410.00

C	Case 20-30080 Doc 1230 Filed 11/23/21 Entered 11/23/21 08:2 Document Page 61 of 78			27:08 Des October 29 Invoice #:	c Main 9, 2021 337539
				Page:	9
SERVICES					
Date	Person	Description of Services	Hours	Rate	Amount
.10 Litig	ation				
8/17/2021	TEP	Communications w/ KCM, JAL, and LHS re research issue (.2); communications w/ LHS re same (.1); review notice of appeal and communications w/ KCM, JAL, NRM, and CG re same (.5); research re same (.1); review LHS research communication re same (.1); review JAL revisions to substantive consolidation motion (.1); communications w/ N. Ramsey, D. Wright, D. Neier, C. Hardman, KCM, JAL, and NRM re notice of appeal (.4); review S. Goldman and G. Mastoris communications re evidentiary motion (.2); review revisions to complaint (.2); communications w/ KCM, JAL, and NRM re same (.3); prepare materials re same (1.0); confer w/ KCM re appeal issues (.1); communications w/ JAL re complaint revisions (.1); confer w/ NRM re same (.1); communications w/ N. Ramsey re same (.1); confer w/ D. Wright re substantive consolidation motion and related issues (.1); communications w/ D. Neier, C. Hardman, G. Mastoris, C. Calvar, N. Ramsey, D. Wright, KCM, JAL, NRM and CG re substantive consolidation papers (.3); communications w/ G. Thompson and R. Cox re Rule 2004 discovery (.3); communications w/ JAL, NRM, and CG re proposed order (.1); communicate w/ JRK and CG re Rule 2004 discovery (.1); confer w/ JAL re same (.1); confer w/ NRM re proposed order (.1).	4.7	\$815.00	\$3,830.50
8/17/2021	QMC	Review Court's PI ruling.	2.2	\$700.00	\$1,540.00
8/17/2021	LHS1	Research and review materials re substantive consolidation issue (3.7); draft email to TEP re same (0.4).	4.1	\$475.00	\$1,947.50
8/17/2021	NRM	Correspond w/ JAL, TEP, KCM, and CG re notice of appeal of preliminary injunction order (0.3); implement revisions to notice of appeal (1.2); draft proposed order granting substantive consolidation (1.4); correspond w/ JAL and CG re same (0.3); research re same (0.4); confer w/ CG re same (0.2); conferences w/ TEP re notice of appeal and proposed order (0.2); teleconference w/ KCM re same (0.3).	4.3	\$475.00	\$2,042.50
8/17/2021	CG	Review and revise substantive consolidation motion (.9); review correspondence from NRM re proposed order re same (.2); factual research re same (2.1); confer w/ NRM re same (.2); prepare materials re same (.1); communications w/ NRM re same (.2).	3.7	\$380.00	\$1,406.00
8/18/2021	JAL	Draft and revise email to TEP, KCM, NRM, and CG re proposed edits to motion for substantive consolidation (0.4); review and revise proposed substantive consolidation order (0.7).	1.1	\$895.00	\$984.50

Case 20-30080	Doc 1230	Filed 11/23/2	21 Entered 11/23/21	. 08:27:08 Desc Main
		Document	Page 62 of 78	October 29, 2021

				Page:	10
SERVICES					
Date	Person	Description of Services	Hours	Rate	Amount
.10 Litiga	tion				
8/18/2021	JPW	Review estimation materials and briefing (3.2); review and edit revised draft briefs re discovery and estimation (1.1); research estimation issues (2.9).	7.2	\$895.00	\$6,444.00
8/18/2021	TEP	Confer w/ D. Wright re substantive consolidation papers (.1); communicate w/ KCM re same (.1); communicate w/ C. Hardman re same (.1); communicate w/ JAL re same (.1); review D. Wright communication re revisions re same (.1); communications w/ JAL, NRM, and CG re same (.2); communications w/ G. Thompson re potential appeal (.2); confer w/ D. Wright re same (.1); communicate w/ G. Thompson, R. Cox, KCM, JAL, NRM, and CG re motion to exceed page limit (.1); communicate w/ KCM re brief status (.1).	1.2	\$815.00	\$978.00
8/18/2021	LHS1	Review FOF-COL.	1.6	\$475.00	\$760.00
8/18/2021	NRM	Revise proposed order granting substantive consolidation (0.3); research re same (0.5); correspond w/ TEP, JAL, and CG re same (0.2).	1.0	\$475.00	\$475.00
8/18/2021	CG	Review, revise and cite check substantive consolidation motion (4.1); review proposed order granting substantive consolidation (.3); communication w/ NRM and JAL re proposed revisions to same (.1); review communications from JAL and NRM re revisions to substantive consolidation motion and implement revisions re same (.8).	5.3	\$380.00	\$2,014.00
8/19/2021	JAL	Review correspondence from TEP re draft motions re standing and crime-fraud (0.2); teleconference w/ TEP re developments and next steps (0.1); review correspondence and accompanying materials from D. Wright re research related to motion for substantive consolidation (0.5); teleconference w/ E. Harron, S. Zieg, KCM (partial), TEP, D. Neier, C. Hardman, G. Mastoris, N. Ramsey, S. Goldman, J. Clasen, F. Parrish, G. Thompson, and R. Cox re standing motion, substantive consolidation motion, and related papers (0.8).	1.6	\$895.00	\$1,432.00
8/19/2021	JPW	Review Bates depos (1.9); research estimation issues (2.3); teleconference TEP re draft briefs (0.1).	4.3	\$895.00	\$3,848.50

C	27:08 Des October 29 Invoice #:	c Main 9, 2021 337539			
				Page:	11
SERVICES					
Date	Person	Description of Services	Hours	Rate	Amount
.10 Litig	ation				
8/19/2021	КСМ	Teleconference w/ TEP re case and filing issues (.3); communications w/ TEP re same (.8); teleconference w/ E. Harron, S. Zieg, TEP, JAL, D. Neier, C. Hardman, G. Mastoris, N. Ramsey, S. Goldman, J. Clasen, F. Parrish, G. Thompson, and R. Cox re standing motion, substantive consolidation motion, and related papers (partial) (.7); teleconference w/ E. Harron re case status (.2).	2.0	\$1,025.00	\$2,050.00
8/19/2021	TEP	Review and edit proposed order re substantive consolidation (.2); communicate w/ N. Ramsey, D. Wright, G. Thompson, R. Cox, KCM, JAL, NRM, and CG re same (.1); review C. Hardman, E. Harron, and D. Neier communications re standing motion (.2); communicate w/ E. Harron and S. Zieg re substantive consolidation motion (.1); communications w/ KCM and D. Wright re same (.1); communications w/ CG re filing (.1); communications w/ KCM and C. Hardman re same (.2); confer w/ CG re substantive consolidation papers (.1); communications w/ KCM, JAL, NRM, and CG re potential motion re PI (.3); plan/ prepare re next steps (.3); communications w/ KCM re case issues (.3); confer w/ JAL re substantive consolidation motion (.1); confer w/ JPW re informational brief (.1); attend teleconference w/ E. Harron, S. Zieg, KCM (partial), JAL, D. Neier, C. Hardman, G. Mastoris, N. Ramsey, S. Goldman, J. Clasen, F. Parrish, G. Thompson, and R. Cox re standing motion, substantive consolidation motion, and related papers (.8).	3.2	\$815.00	\$2,608.00
8/19/2021	NRM	Revise substantive consolidation motion (0.2); correspond w/ CG re same (0.1); research re draft PI motion (0.3).	0.6	\$475.00	\$285.00
8/19/2021	CG	Review, revise and cite check substantive consolidation motion (5.6); confer w/ TEP re substantive consolidation papers (.1).	5.7	\$380.00	\$2,166.00
8/20/2021	JAL	Review and revise draft Rule 2004 motion, form of subpoena, and discovery request (1.4); teleconference w/ NRM re motion for substantive consolidation and next steps (0.1); review comments and proposed edits re same (0.3); review and revise same (1.2); review and revise potential complaint (0.2).	3.2	\$895.00	\$2,864.00
8/20/2021	JPW	Teleconference S. Zieg, TEP, and E. Bradley re Bates deposition and related issues (0.4); review materials for expert depo (1.9).	2.3	\$895.00	\$2,058.50
8/20/2021	KCM	Teleconference w/ N. Ramsey, D. Wright, and TEP re case strategy (.4); communications w/ TEP re case status and tasks (.1).	0.5	\$1,025.00	\$512.50

C	ase 20-30	0080 Doc 1230 Filed 11/23/21 Entered 1 Document Page 64 of 78	1/23/21 08:2 3	27:08 Dese October 29 Invoice #:	c Main 9, 2021 337539
				Page:	12
SERVICES					
Date	Person	Description of Services	Hours	Rate	Amount
.10 Litiga	ation				
8/20/2021	TEP	Review JAL communication re substantive consolidation research (.1); communications w/ G. Thompson, R. Cox, NRM, and CG re substantive consolidation and Rule 2004 discovery issues (.3); confer w/ NRM re same (.1); review E. Harron communication re case issues (.1); communications w/ D. Wright re substantive consolidation papers (.1); communications w/ KCM and N. Ramsey re case strategy (.1); review N. Ramsey, S. Zieg, and JPW communications re Bates deposition (.2); attend teleconference w/ N. Ramsey, D. Wright, and KCM re case strategy (.4); communications w/ JAL, NRM, and CG re Rule 2004 motion (.3); attend teleconference w/ S. Zieg, JPW, and E. Bradley re Bates deposition and related issues (.4); confer w/ D. Wright re case status (.1); communications w/ KCM re same (.1).	2.3	\$815.00	\$1,874.50
8/20/2021	NRM	Correspond w/ JAL re notice issue re substantive consolidation (0.1); confer w/ JAL re draft substantive consolidation papers (0.1); revise rule 2004 motion, corresponding subpoena, and proposed order (0.8); correspond w/ JAL, TEP, and CG re same (0.3); confer w/ TEP re same (0.1); correspond w/ R. Cox re same (0.2).	1.6	\$475.00	\$760.00
8/20/2021	CG	Review, revise and cite check substantive consolidation motion.	13.9	\$380.00	\$5,282.00
8/21/2021	JAL	Revise/edit substantive consolidation complaint.	2.1	\$895.00	\$1,879.50
8/21/2021	TEP	Review JAL communication re substantive consolidation complaint.	0.1	\$815.00	\$81.50
8/21/2021	NRM	Correspond w/ CG re substantive consolidation motion and complaint.	0.1	\$475.00	\$47.50
8/22/2021	JAL	Review and analyze correspondence from R. Cox, TEP, and NRM re Rule 2004 discovery (0.2); review and revise draft standing motion (1.0).	1.2	\$895.00	\$1,074.00

C	ase 20-30	0080 Doc 1230 Filed 11/23/21 Entered 1 Document Page 65 of 7	1/23/21 08: 8	27:08 Des October 29 Invoice #:	c Main 9, 2021 337539
				Page:	13
SERVICES					
Date	Person	Description of Services	Hours	Rate	Amount
.10 Litig	ation				
8/22/2021	TEP	Communications w/ NRM re status of 2004 papers (.8); review and edit substantive consolidation and 2004 papers (.6); communications w/ R. Cox re same (.4); communicate w/ E. Harron, S. Zieg, N. Ramsey, D. Wright, D. Neier, C. Hardman, G. Thompson, R. Cox, KCM, JAL, NRM, and CG re same (.4); communications w/ N. Ramsey, D. Wright, and NRM re revisions to 2004 motion (.3); communications w/ NRM and JAL re Rule 2004 subpoena and motion (.1); review revisions to standing motion and communicate w/ C. Hardman re same (.2); review N. Ramsey communications w/ KCM re same (.1); confer w/ D. Wright re same (.1); communications w/ KCM, JAL, NRM, and CG re same (.1); confer w/ NRM re revisions to 2004 papers (multiple) (.2).	3.4	\$815.00	\$2,771.00
8/22/2021	NRM	Revise motion for 2004 discovery, and corresponding subpoena exhibit and proposed order (0.8); correspond w/ TEP re same (0.2); conferences w/ TEP re same (0.2); confer w/ CG re same (0.1).	1.3	\$475.00	\$617.50
8/22/2021	CG	Confer w/ NRM re 2004 discovery, and corresponding subpoena exhibit and proposed order.	0.1	\$380.00	\$38.00
8/23/2021	JAL	Teleconference w/ TEP re status of substantive consolidation motion and next steps.	0.1	\$895.00	\$89.50
8/23/2021	JPW	Review Bates depos and estimation materials (3.7); teleconference TEP and KCM re appeal issue (partial) (0.2).	3.9	\$895.00	\$3,490.50
8/23/2021	KCM	Teleconference w/ TEP and JPW (partial) re appeal issue.	0.3	\$1,025.00	\$307.50

C	Case 20-30	0080 Doc 1230 Filed 11/23/21 Entered 1 Document Page 66 of 78	1/23/21 08:2 3	27:08 Desc October 29 Invoice #:	
				Page:	14
SERVICES					
Date	Person	Description of Services	Hours	Rate	Amount
.10 Litig	ation				
8/23/2021	TEP	Communications w/ R. Cox and G. Thompson re Rule 2004 motion (.4); review FCR comments re Rule 2004 motion (.1); communications w/ S. Greecher re same (.1); communications w/ R. Cox. G. Thompson, KCM, JAL, NRM, CG and D. Wright re same (.2); plan/prepare re filings today (1.6); communicate w/ R. Cox re meet and confer (.1); review C. Hardman communication re standing motion (.1); communications w/ N. Ramsey, D. Wright, and KCM re same (.1); confer w/ D. Wright re case issues (.2); confer w/ G. Thompson re same (.2); confer w/ CG re substantive consolidation motion filing (.1); confer w/ JAL re same (.1); communications w/ CG, NRM, R. Cox and G. Thompson re sealing issues (.3); communications w/ JAL, NRM, and CG re proposed order (.2); confer w/ D. Neier, C. Hardman, and D. Wright re case issue (.2); review G. Gordon communication re standing motion (.1); communications w/ CG, R. Cox, and G. Thompson re Rule 2004 motion (.2); review crime-fraud brief (.1); confer w/ CG re exhibits (.1); confer w/ CG and R. Cox (partial) re same (.2); communications w/ CG and NRM re final briefs re substantive consolidation (.1); review and edit motion re extension to appeal (.3); confer w/ KCM and JPW (partial) re same (.3); communications w/ D. Wright re same (.1); confer w/ S. Zieg re substantive consolidation filings (.1); review G. Thompson communication re various filings and communicate w/ KCM and CG re same (.1).	5.9	\$815.00	\$4,808.50
8/23/2021	NRM	Revise Rule 2004 discovery motion (0.4); correspond w/ TEP, CG, R. Cox, and G. Thompson re same (0.1); correspond w/ TEP, CG, JAL, R. Cox, and G. Thompson re proposed order for substantive consolidation (0.2); review and revise draft motion to extend time to file notice of appeal and corresponding proposed order (0.5).	1.2	\$475.00	\$570.00
8/23/2021	CG	Review, revise and cite check substantive consolidation motion (6.1); confer w/ TEP re substantive consolidation motion filing (.1); confer w/ TEP re exhibits (.1); confer w/ TEP and R. Cox (partial) re same (.2); communications w/ TEP and NRM re final briefs re substantive consolidation (.1); confer w/ TEP re same (.1).	6.7	\$380.00	\$2,546.00
8/24/2021	JPW	Research estimation issues (1.2); teleconference TEP, S. Zieg, E. Bradley re depo issues (1.1); teleconference TEP re estimation issues (0.3); depo prep re expert depositions (2.8).	5.4	\$895.00	\$4,833.00

C	ase 20-30	0080 Doc 1230 Filed 11/23/21 Entered 1 Document Page 67 of 78	1/23/21 08: }	27:08 Des October 29 Invoice #:	c Main 9, 2021 337539
				Page:	15
SERVICES					
Date	Person	Description of Services	Hours	Rate	Amount
.10 Litiga	ation				
8/24/2021	TEP	Review filings re next steps (.1); communications w/ G. Thompson re various filings (.1); communications w/ G. Thompson re potential meet and confer re adversary proceeding (.1); attend teleconference w/ JPW, S. Zieg, and E. Bradley re case issues (1.1); confer w/ JPW re estimation issues (.3); communicate w/ KCM and JPW re same (.5); communications w/ N. Ramsey, D. Wright, KCM, and JPW re estimation-related call (.1); review materials re estimation motion (.6); review J. Ellman and Court communications re omnibus hearing (.1).	3.0	\$815.00	\$2,445.00
8/24/2021	QMC	Review substantive consolidation pleadings.	1.7	\$700.00	\$1,190.00
8/24/2021	KCZ	Review motion to compel.	0.5	\$450.00	\$225.00
8/25/2021	JPW	Review materials and draft outline in preparation for Bates deposition (6.4); teleconference CG re depo (0.1); teleconference TEP re draft motion (0.4); review draft motions (1.4); teleconference N. Ramsey, D. Wright, TEP, KCM (partial) re draft motions (1.1); teleconference S. Zieg, S. Greecher, E. Bradley, N. Ramsey, D. Wright, S. Goldman, TEP re estimation issues (0.7).	10.1	\$895.00	\$9,039.50
8/25/2021	KCM	Teleconference w/ N. Ramsey, D. Wright, TEP, JPW re case strategy (partial).	0.9	\$1,025.00	\$922.50
8/25/2021	TEP	Review/analyze issues re potential estimation-related motions (1.5); communications w/ KCM and JPW re same (.3); review J. Ellman, N. Ramsey, and KCM communications re meet and confer (.1); confer w/ G. Thompson re case strategy (.2); communications w/ JPW and CG re Bates deposition (.1); confer w/ JPW re case strategy (.4); communications w/ KCM, N. Ramsey, D. Wright, and JPW re same (.3); review S. Zieg communication re motion to compel and related paper (.3); review D. Wright communication re at issue waiver motion and related paper (.5); plan/prepare re next steps (.4); attend teleconference w/ N. Ramsey, D. Wright, JPW, and KCM (partial) re case strategy (1.1); attend teleconference w/ S. Zieg, S. Greecher, E. Bradley, N. Ramsey, D. Wright, S. Goldman, and JPW re estimation issues (.7); communications w/ R. Cox and G. Thompson re standing motion (.1).	6.0	\$815.00	\$4,890.00
8/25/2021	KCZ	Review adversary complaint.	0.7	\$450.00	\$315.00
8/25/2021	CG	Teleconference w/ JPW re Bates depo.	0.1	\$380.00	\$38.00
8/26/2021	JAL	Review and analyze discovery motions.	0.5	\$895.00	\$447.50

Case 20-30080	Doc 1230	Filed 11/23/	21 Entered	11/23/21	08:27:08	De	esc N	√lain
		Document	Page 68 of	78	Oc	tober	29, 2	2021
								0075

				Page:	16
SERVICES					
Date	Person	Description of Services	Hours	Rate	Amount
.10 Litiga	ation				
8/26/2021	JPW	Review and revise deposition outline in preparation re Bates depo (6.9); teleconference A. Sackett re same (0.4).	7.3	\$895.00	\$6,533.50
8/26/2021	КСМ	Teleconference w/ S. Zieg re discovery issues and next steps.	0.5	\$1,025.00	\$512.50
8/26/2021	TEP	Review J. Ellman, N. Ramsey, KCM, and D. Neier communications re meet and confer (.1); confer w/ S. Zieg re outstanding discovery issues (.2); communicate w/ G. Gordon and G. Cassada re Bates deposition (.1); review S. Zieg and V. Ross communications re Bates materials (.2); communications w/ D. Wright and R. Cox re at issue waiver motion (.2).	0.8	\$815.00	\$652.00
8/27/2021	JPW	Prepare for (2.1) and attend depo of Dr. Bates (4.5); teleconference S. Zieg re same (0.2); teleconference TEP re same (0.2).	7.0	\$895.00	\$6,265.00
8/27/2021	TEP	Confer w/ JPW re Bates deposition (.2); review transcript re same (.6).	0.8	\$815.00	\$652.00
8/27/2021	CG	Attend Bates deposition (4.5); communications w/ vendor re same (.2); prepare marked exhibits re same (.4); communications w/ JPW and TEP re same (.1).	5.2	\$380.00	\$1,976.00
8/29/2021	TEP	Communicate w/ D. Wright re estimation motions (.1); plan/prepare re next steps (.2).	0.3	\$815.00	\$244.50
8/30/2021	КСМ	Plan/prepare next steps re filings and hearing and review/analyze related materials (1.9); teleconference w/ E. Harron re potential appeal issues (.2); teleconference w/ D. Wright and TEP re case status (.2); confer w/ TEP and CG re meet and confer (.4).	2.7	\$1,025.00	\$2,767.50
8/30/2021	TEP	Confer w/ KCM and D. Wright re meet and confer (.2); communicate w/ C. Hardman re same (.1); confer w/ C. Hardman re same (.3); communications w/ C. Hardman re teleconference (.1); prepare for meet and confer (.3); attend teleconference w/ C. Hardman, D. Wright, S. Goldman, E. Harron, S. Zieg, S. Greecher re meet and confer prep (.2); attend meet and confer w/ G. Gordon, J. Ellman, J. Miller, R. Wyner, H. Steel, C. Hardman, M. Manzi, D. Wright, S. Goldman, E. Harron, S. Greecher, F. Parrish, and CG (.4); confer w/ C. Hardman re same (.1); confer w/ KCM and CG re same (.4); communicate w/ KCM, N. Ramsey, D. Wright, D. Neier, and C. Hardman re meet and confer (.1); review draft appeal extension order and communicate w/ D. Wright re same (.1).	2.3	\$815.00	\$1,874.50

		Document Page 69 of 78	5	October 2 Invoice #	
				Page:	17
SERVICES					
Date	Person	Description of Services	Hours	Rate	Amount
.10 Litig	ation				
8/30/2021	CG	Attend meet and confer w/ G. Gordon, J. Ellman, J. Miller, R. Wyner, H. Steel, C. Hardman, M. Manzi, D. Wright, S. Goldman, E. Harron, S. Greecher, F. Parrish, and TEP (.4); confer w/ KCM and TEP re same (.4).	0.8	\$380.00	\$304.00
8/31/2021	КСМ	Teleconference w/ D. Neier, C. Hardman (partial), and TEP re case schedule and strategy (.7); teleconference w/ TEP re same (.6); teleconferences w/ TEP re meet and confer (.2); teleconference w/ TEP re case issues and next steps (.6).	2.1	\$1,025.00	\$2,152.50
8/31/2021	TEP	Communicate w/ KCM, N. Ramsey, D. Wright, D. Neier, and C. Hardman re case strategy (.1); communicate w/ JPW re case issues (.1); confer w/ KCM re same (.6); plan/prepare re next steps (.1); review R. Blake communication re document production (.1); communicate w/ KCM, JAL, JPW, NRM, LHS, SMR, and CG re same (.1); attend teleconference w/ D. Neier, C. Hardman (partial), and KCM re case status and next steps (.7); confer w/ D. Wright re case issues and meet and confer (.2); communications to E. Harron and S. Zieg re same (.1); confer w/ KCM re same (multiple) (.2); draft communication to Debtor re meet and confer (.1); confer w/ E. Harron re same (.1); communications w/ N. Ramsey, D. Wright, D. Neier, C. Hardman, G. Thompson, R. Cox, F. Parrish, KCM, and CG re same (.2); confer/communications w/ S. Zieg re same (.1); communications w/ D. Neier, C. Hardman, and D. Wright re same (.1); communications w/ G. Gordon re same (.3); communications w/ ACM re Debtor's plan (.1); confer w/ KCM re case strategy and next steps (.6).	3.9	\$815.00	\$3,178.50
		Total	349.70		\$252,357.50
.11 Plan	& Disclosu	ire Statement			
8/11/2021	KCM	Teleconference w/ G. Gordon re case status, strategy and next steps (.2); teleconference w/ N. Ramsey re same (.9).	1.1	\$1,025.00	\$1,127.50
8/13/2021	ACM	Review LAS analysis.	0.3	\$940.00	\$282.00
		 Total	1.40		\$1,409.50
.15 Com	mittee Mee	tings/Conferences			
8/2/2021	KCM	Teleconference w/ Committee co-chair.	0.1	\$1,025.00	\$102.50
8/2/2021	TEP	Communicate w/ Committee re case status (.1); review N. Ramsey and Committee member communications re same (.1).	0.2	\$815.00	\$163.00
8/3/2021	ACM	Teleconference w/ KCM and Committee member	0.2	\$940.00	\$188.00

re inquiry.

Case 20-30080 Doc 1230 Filed 11/23/21 Entered 11/23/21 08:27:08 Desc Main

Case 20-30080	Doc 1230	Filed 11/23/21	Entered 11/23/21	. 08:27:08 Desc Main
		Document F	Page 70 of 78	October 29, 2021

				Page:	18
SERVICES					
Date	Person	Description of Services	Hours	Rate	Amount
15 Com	mittee Mee	tings/Conferences			
8/3/2021	KCM	Teleconference w/ Committee member and ACM re inquiry (.2); confer w/ TEP re same (.1).	0.3	\$1,025.00	\$307.50
8/3/2021	TEP	Confer w/ KCM and communicate w/ Committee re case update (.1); communications w/ Committee re same (.4); communicate w/ CG re Committee member request (.1).	0.6	\$815.00	\$489.00
8/10/2021	JAL	Attend Committee meeting.	0.8	\$895.00	\$716.00
8/10/2021	JPW	Attend Committee meeting.	0.8	\$895.00	\$716.00
8/10/2021	KCM	Teleconferences w/ Committee co-chair re PI ruling.	0.5	\$1,025.00	\$512.50
8/10/2021	KCM	Teleconferences w/ Committee members re ruling.	0.6	\$1,025.00	\$615.00
8/10/2021	KCM	Plan/prepare for Committee meeting and review/analyze related materials.	1.4	\$1,025.00	\$1,435.00
8/10/2021	KCM	Attend Committee meeting (.8); confer w/ TEP re same (.4).	1.2	\$1,025.00	\$1,230.0
8/10/2021	TEP	Confer w/ KCM re case issues and Committee meeting (.4); communications w/ Committee re same (.1); prepare for (.1) and attend Committee meeting (.8).	1.4	\$815.00	\$1,141.0
8/11/2021	KCM	Teleconference w/ Committee co-chair re negotiation issues.	0.3	\$1,025.00	\$307.5
8/11/2021	KCM	Teleconference w/ Committee co-chair and N. Ramsey re next steps.	1.7	\$1,025.00	\$1,742.5
8/12/2021	JPW	Attend Committee meeting.	0.8	\$895.00	\$716.0
8/12/2021	KCM	Plan/prepare for Committee meeting.	0.3	\$1,025.00	\$307.5
8/12/2021	KCM	Attend Committee meeting.	0.8	\$1,025.00	\$820.0
8/12/2021	KCM	Teleconference w/ TEP re Committee issues.	0.3	\$1,025.00	\$307.5
8/12/2021	KCM	Teleconference w/ Committee co-chair re next steps.	0.3	\$1,025.00	\$307.5
8/12/2021	TEP	Attend Committee call (.8); confer w/ KCM re same (.3); review N. Ramsey and Committee member communications re Committee inquiry (.2).	1.3	\$815.00	\$1,059.5
8/13/2021	TEP	Confer w/ Committee member re case status (.1); confer w/ constituent re same (.1).	0.2	\$815.00	\$163.0
8/18/2021	KCM	Teleconferences w/ TEP re Committee issues and related filings.	0.3	\$1,025.00	\$307.5
8/18/2021	TEP	Prepare communication to Committee re case status (.2); confer w/ C. Hardman re same (.3); confer w/ KCM re same (.2); confer w/ D. Wright re same (.1); communicate w/ Committee (.1); prepare materials and communications w/ Committee member re same (.3); confer w/ KCM re same (.1).	1.3	\$815.00	\$1,059.5

re same (.1).

	Case 20-30080 Doc 1230 Filed 11/23/21 Entered 11/23/21 08:2 Document Page 71 of 78				October 29 Invoice #:	c Main 9, 2021 337539
					Page:	19
SERV	/ICES					
Date		Person	Description of Services	Hours	Rate	Amount
.15	Comm	nittee Mee	tings/Conferences			
8/19/2	2021	JAL	Attend Committee meeting (partial).	0.6	\$895.00	\$537.00
8/19/2	2021	JPW	Prepare for (.1) and attend Committee meeting (1.1).	1.2	\$895.00	\$1,074.00
8/19/2	2021	KCM	Teleconference w/ TEP re Committee meeting.	0.1	\$1,025.00	\$102.50
8/19/2	2021	KCM	Teleconference w/ N. Ramsey re Committee issues.	0.5	\$1,025.00	\$512.50
8/19/2	2021	KCM	Plan/prepare for Committee meeting and review/analyze related materials.	0.7	\$1,025.00	\$717.50
8/19/2	2021	KCM	Attend Committee meeting.	1.1	\$1,025.00	\$1,127.50
8/19/2	2021	TEP	Review Committee member and D. Neier communications re case issue (.2); communicate w/ Committee re case issue (.1); review N. Ramsey communication re same (.1); review N. Ramsey and D. Wright communication re Committee meeting and confer w/ KCM re same (.1); attend Committee meeting (1.1).	1.6	\$815.00	\$1,304.00
8/23/2	2021	TEP	Review N. Ramsey and Committee co-chair communications re case issue.	0.1	\$815.00	\$81.50
8/24/2	2021	KCM	Teleconference w/ Committee member re case status.	0.2	\$1,025.00	\$205.00
8/24/2	2021	TEP	Communicate w/ KCM, NRM, and CG re Committee request.	0.1	\$815.00	\$81.50
8/26/2	2021	NRM	Revise materials for Committee co-chairs and members.	0.8	\$475.00	\$380.00
8/30/2	2021	KCM	Plan/prepare for Committee co-chair call (.2); attend Committee co-chair call w/ N. Ramsey, TEP and D. Wright (.2).	0.4	\$1,025.00	\$410.00
8/30/2	2021	TEP	Communicate w/ KCM re Committee co-chair meeting (.1); attend teleconference w/ Committee co-chairs, Committee members, KCM, N. Ramsey, and D. Wright (.2).	0.3	\$815.00	\$244.50
8/31/2	2021	TEP	Review Committee co-chair communication and related materials (.2); confer w/ NRM re Committee co-chair request (.1); confer w/ SMR re same (.1); confer w/ CG re same (.3); communications w/ NRM, SMR, and CG re same (.3).	1.0	\$815.00	\$815.00
8/31/2	2021	NRM	Confer w/ TEP re materials for Committee co-chairs and members (0.1); confer w/ CG re same (0.1); correspond w/ TEP and CG re same (0.1).	0.3	\$475.00	\$142.50
8/31/2	2021	SMR	Confer w/ TEP re materials for Committee updates (.1); review recent filings and relevant related materials re same (1.1).	1.2	\$450.00	\$540.00

С	Case 20-30	080 Doc 1230 Filed 11/23/21 Entered Document Page 72 of	11/23/21 08:2 78	27:08 Des October 2 Invoice #	
				Page:	20
SERVICES					
Date	Person	Description of Services	Hours	Rate	Amount
.15 Com	nmittee Mee	tings/Conferences			
8/31/2021	CG	Confer w/ NRM re materials for Committee co-chairs and members (.1); confer w/ TEP re same (.3); communications w/ TEP and NRM re same (.2); review Committee materials (.3).	0.9	\$380.00	\$342.00
		Total	26.80		\$23,330.50
.17 Doc	ket Review a	& File Maintenance			
8/12/2021	CG	Review dockets re recently filed pleadings and update internal files re same.	1.4	\$380.00	\$532.00
8/17/2021	CG	Review dockets re recently filed pleadings and update internal files re same.	0.5	\$380.00	\$190.00
8/24/2021	CG	Review dockets re recently filed pleadings and update internal files re same.	1.7	\$380.00	\$646.00
		Total	3.60		\$1,368.00
.18 Fee	Application	s-Others			
8/9/2021	TEP	Confer w/ S. Zieg re FTI bills.	0.4	\$815.00	\$326.00
8/17/2021	JPW	Confer w/ G. Thompson re fee-related issues.	0.3	\$895.00	\$268.50
		Total	0.70		\$594.50
		Total Professional Services	386.6		\$281,384.50

PERSON RECAP

Person JAL	Jeffrey A. Liesemer	Title Member	Hours 30.3	Rate \$895.00	Amount \$27,118.50
KCM	Kevin C. Maclay	Member	30.7	\$1,025.00	\$31,467.50
ACM	Ann C. McMillan	Member	1.6	\$940.00	\$1,504.00
TEP	Todd E. Phillips	Member	78.3	\$815.00	\$63,814.50
JPW	James P. Wehner	Member	83.7	\$895.00	\$74,911.50
QMC	Quincy M. Crawford	Of Counsel	10.4	\$700.00	\$7,280.00
JRK	Jeanna Rickards Koski	Of Counsel	54.3	\$635.00	\$34,480.50
NRM	Nathaniel R. Miller	Associate	28.1	\$475.00	\$13,347.50
SMR	Shahriar M. Raafi	Associate	1.2	\$450.00	\$540.00
LHS1	Lucas H. Self	Associate	7.1	\$475.00	\$3,372.50
KCZ	Katy C. Zendeh	Associate	5.8	\$450.00	\$2,610.00
CG	Cecilia Guerrero	Paralegal	55.1	\$380.00	\$20,938.00

Ca	ase 20-30080 Doc 1230 Filed 11/23/21 Entered 11/23/21 08:27 Document Page 73 of 78	:08 Des October 29 Invoice #:	c Main 9, 2021 337539
		Page:	21
DISBURSEN	IENTS		
Date	Description of Disbursements		Amount
08/01/2021	Database Research - Lexis - SRJ - 07/26/21. [.18]		\$396.00
08/09/2021	Database Research - Westlaw - SRJ - 07/26/21. [.18]		\$416.78
08/09/2021	Database Research - Westlaw - JAL - 07/27/21. [.18]		\$65.59
08/16/2021	Court Reporting/Transcript Service- Hr'g transcripts (8/12-8/13/21) [.11]		\$94.50
08/18/2021	FEDERAL EXPRESS- Express Mail - JAL Aug 10 [.01]		\$26.92
	Total Disbursements		\$999.79
	Total Services		\$281,384.50
	Total Disbursements		\$999.79
	Total Current Charges		\$282,384.29

	Case 20-30080	Doc 1230		Entered 11/23/21 08: ge 74 of 78	:27:08 Desc October 29, Invoice #:	
					Page:	22
TASK RE	CAP					
Services				Disbursements		
Category		Hours	Amount	Category		Amount
.04		0.30	\$157.50	.01		\$26.92
.07		4.10	\$2,167.00	.11		\$94.50
.10		349.70	\$252,357.50	.18		\$878.37
.11		1.40	\$1,409.50			
.15		26.80	\$23,330.50			
.17		3.60	\$1,368.00			
.18		0.70	\$594.50			
		386.60	\$281,384.50			\$999.79

_

-

_

BREAKDOWN BY PERSON

_

-

_

Person		Category	Hours	Rate	Amount
TEP	Todd E. Phillips	.04	0.10	\$815.00	\$81.50
CG	Cecilia Guerrero	.04	0.20	\$380.00	\$76.00
TEP	Todd E. Phillips	.07	1.40	\$815.00	\$1,141.00
CG	Cecilia Guerrero	.07	2.70	\$380.00	\$1,026.00
JAL	Jeffrey A. Liesemer	.10	28.90	\$895.00	\$25,865.50
KCM	Kevin C. Maclay	.10	18.50	\$1,025.00	\$18,962.50
ACM	Ann C. McMillan	.10	1.10	\$940.00	\$1,034.00
TEP	Todd E. Phillips	.10	68.30	\$815.00	\$55,664.50
JPW	James P. Wehner	.10	80.60	\$895.00	\$72,137.00
QMC	Quincy M. Crawford	.10	10.40	\$700.00	\$7,280.00
JRK	Jeanna Rickards Koski	.10	54.30	\$635.00	\$34,480.50
NRM	Nathaniel R. Miller	.10	27.00	\$475.00	\$12,825.00
LHS1	Lucas H. Self	.10	7.10	\$475.00	\$3,372.50
KCZ	Katy C. Zendeh	.10	5.80	\$450.00	\$2,610.00
CG	Cecilia Guerrero	.10	47.70	\$380.00	\$18,126.00
KCM	Kevin C. Maclay	.11	1.10	\$1,025.00	\$1,127.50
ACM	Ann C. McMillan	.11	0.30	\$940.00	\$282.00
JAL	Jeffrey A. Liesemer	.15	1.40	\$895.00	\$1,253.00
KCM	Kevin C. Maclay	.15	11.10	\$1,025.00	\$11,377.50
ACM	Ann C. McMillan	.15	0.20	\$940.00	\$188.00

	Case 20-30080	Doc 1230 Filed 11/23/21 Entered 11/23/21 08:27: Document Page 75 of 78		:08 Desc Main October 29, 2021 Invoice #: 337539			
						Page:	23
BREAKI	DOWN BY PERSON						
Person			Categ	jory	Hours	Rate	Amount
TEP	Todd E. Phillips		.15		8.10	\$815.00	\$6,601.50
JPW	James P. Wehner		.15		2.80	\$895.00	\$2,506.00
NRM	Nathaniel R. Miller		.15		1.10	\$475.00	\$522.50
SMR	Shahriar M. Raafi		.15		1.20	\$450.00	\$540.00
CG	Cecilia Guerrero		.15		0.90	\$380.00	\$342.00
CG	Cecilia Guerrero		.17		3.60	\$380.00	\$1,368.00
TEP	Todd E. Phillips		.18		0.40	\$815.00	\$326.00
JPW	James P. Wehner		.18		0.30	\$895.00	\$268.50

386.60

\$281,384.50

EXHIBIT B

SUMMARY OF EXPENSES FOR THE PERIOD OF MAY 1, 2021, THROUGH AUGUST 31, 2021

EXPENSE CATEGORY	AMOUNT		
Air & Train Transportation	\$0.00		
Conference Call Service	\$0.00		
Court Reporter Transcript Services	\$1,380.00		
Database Research	\$2,683.42		
Local Transportation	\$0.00		
Meals	\$0.00		
PACER Service	\$69.20		
Postage & Federal Express	\$26.92		
Travel Expenses - Ground Transportation	\$0.00		
Travel Expenses - Hotel Charges	\$0.00		
Travel Expenses - Meals	\$0.00		
Travel Expenses - Miscellaneous	\$0.00		
TOTAL	\$3,493.54		

Case 20-30080 Doc 1230 Filed 11/23/21 Entered 11/23/21 08:27:08 Desc Main Document Page 77 of 78

EXHIBIT C

CUMULATIVE SUMMARY OF COMPENSATION AND REIMBURSEMENT REQUESTED FOR THE APPLICATION PERIOD AND SINCE THE PETITION DATE

COMPENSATION SUMMARY BY PROJECT CATEGORY

PROJECT CATEGORY	Hours For Application Period	Fees For Application Period	Total Hours From Petition Date	Total Fees From Petition Date
.01 Asset Analysis & Recovery	0.0	\$0.00	3.0	\$2,128.50
.02 Asset Disposition	0.0	\$0.00	0.0	\$0.00
.03 Business Operations	0.0	\$0.00	4.6	\$3,456.00
.04 Case Administration & Calendar Control	1.8	\$727.50	55.0	\$20,366.00
.05 Claims Administration & Objections	0.0	\$0.00	0.0	\$0.00
.07 Fee Applications-Self	44.2	\$21,615.50	252.5	\$113,625.00
.08 Objections - Fee/Retention Applications	0.0	\$0.00	0.0	\$0.00
.09 Financing	0.0	\$0.00	0.0	\$0.00
.10 Litigation	601.0	\$459,623.00	7,805.5	\$4,972,243.50
.11 Plan & Disclosure Statement	91.8	\$74,077.50	652.2	\$441,011.00
.13 Tax Issues	0.0	\$0.00	0.0	\$0.00
.15 Committee Meetings/Conferences	71.2	\$58,545.50	302.9	\$246,092.50
.16 Travel	0.0	\$0.00	16.4	\$6,498.00
.17 Docket Review & File Maintenance	5.5	\$2,090.00	51.7	\$16,115.50
.18 Fee Applications-Others	11.1	\$5,155.50	32.1	\$13,521.00
.19 Retention Applications-Others	0.0	\$0.00	15.5	\$10,202.00
.20 Retention Applications-Self	0.0	\$0.00	40.2	\$22,724.00
TOTALS	826.6	\$621,834.50	9,231.6	\$5,862,470.50

Case 20-30080 Doc 1230 Filed 11/23/21 Entered 11/23/21 08:27:08 Desc Main Document Page 78 of 78

EXPENSE SUMMARY

	Expenses For	Total Expenses From
EXPENSE CATEGORY	Application Period	Petition Date
Air & Train Transportation	\$0.00	\$1,078.00
Conference Call Service	\$0.00	\$491.73
Court Reporter Transcript Services	\$1,380.00	\$2,286.60
Database Research	\$2,683.42	\$70,100.89
E-Discovery Platform & Process	\$0.00	\$16.83
Local Transportation	\$0.00	\$108.82
Meals	\$0.00	\$1,105.04
PACER Service	\$69.20	\$2,975.80
Photocopies	\$0.00	\$6,616.68
Postage & Federal Express	\$26.92	\$53.36
Travel Expenses - Ground Transportation	\$0.00	\$229.98
Travel Expenses - Hotel Charges	\$0.00	\$1,122.24
Travel Expenses - Meals	\$0.00	\$985.97
Travel Expenses - Miscellaneous	\$0.00	\$58.00
TOTAL	\$3,493.54	\$86,563.94