DAVIS POLK & WARDWELL LLP

450 Lexington Avenue

New York, New York 10017 Telephone: (212) 450-4000 Facsimile: (212) 701-5800 Marshall S. Huebner Timothy Graulich James I. McClammy

Erik Jerrard (admitted pro hac vice)

Counsel to the Debtors and Debtors in Possession

Stephen D. Piraino

UNITED STATES BANKRUPTCY COURT SOUTHERN DISTRICT OF NEW YORK

In re:

GRUPO AEROMÉXICO, S.A.B. de C.V., et al.,

Debtors.1

Chapter 11

Case No. 20-11563 (SCC)

(Jointly Administered)

FIFTEENTH MONTHLY FEE STATEMENT OF DAVIS POLK & WARDWELL LLP FOR COMPENSATION FOR SERVICES AND REIMBURSEMENT OF EXPENSES INCURRED AS COUNSEL TO THE DEBTORS AND DEBTORS IN POSSESSION FOR THE PERIOD FROM OCTOBER 1, 2021 THROUGH OCTOBER 31, 2021

Name of Applicant	Davis Polk & Wardwell LLP
Applicant's Role in Case	Counsel to Grupo Aeroméxico, S.A.B. de C.V., et al.
Date Order of Employment Signed	September 8, 2020 [ECF No. 361]
Period for which compensation and reimbursement is sought	October 1, 2021 through October 31, 2021

¹ The Debtors in these cases, along with each Debtor's registration number in the applicable jurisdiction, are as follows: Grupo Aeroméxico, S.A.B. de C.V. 286676; Aerovías de México, S.A. de C.V. 108984; Aerolitoral, S.A. de C.V. 217315; Aerovías Empresa de Cargo, S.A. de C.V. 437094-1. The Debtors' corporate headquarters is located at Paseo de la Reforma No. 243, piso 25 Colonia Cuauhtémoc, Mexico City, C.P. 06500.

Summary of Total Fees and Expenses Requested				
Total compensation requested in this statement	\$2,655,641.20 ² (80% of \$3,319,551.50)			
Total reimbursement requested in this statement	\$6,618.64 ³			
Total compensation and reimbursement requested in this statement	\$2,662,259.84			
This is a(n): \underline{X} Monthly Application $\underline{\ }$	Interim Application Final Application			

Pursuant to sections 327, 330, and 331 of chapter 11 of title 11 of the United States Code (the "Bankruptcy Code"), Rule 2016 of the Federal Rules of Bankruptcy Procedure (the "Bankruptcy Rules"), Rule 2016-1 of the Local Bankruptcy Rules for the United States Bankruptcy Court for the Southern District of New York (the "Local Rules"), the *Order Approving Application of Debtors for Authority to Employ and Retain Davis Polk & Wardwell LLP as Attorneys for the Debtors* Nunc Pro Tunc to the Petition Date, dated September 8, 2020 [ECF No. 361] (the "Retention Order"), and the *Order Pursuant to 11 U.S.C. §§ 105(a) and 331 Establishing Procedures for Interim Compensation and Reimbursement of Expenses for Retained Professionals*, dated September 8, 2020 [ECF No. 360] (the "Interim Compensation Order"), Davis Polk & Wardwell LLP ("Davis Polk"), counsel for the above-captioned debtors and debtors in possession (collectively, the "Debtors"), submits this Fifteenth Monthly Fee Statement of Services

² This amount reflects a reduction in fees in the amount of \$66,049.00 on account of voluntary write-offs. In addition to voluntary write-offs of full hours and the corresponding fees, the total also reflects a voluntary write-off in the amount of \$3,907.00 on account of applying a reduced rate for certain tasks, following discussions with the U.S. Trustee.

³ This amount reflects a reduction in expenses in the amount of \$1,788.10 on account of word processing, duplication, outside documents and research, meal, and travel charges to comply with the *Guidelines for Reviewing Applications* for Compensation and Reimbursement of Expenses Filed under 11 U.S.C. § 330 by Attorneys in Larger Chapter 11 Cases Effective November 1, 2013 (the "UST Guidelines").

Rendered and Expenses Incurred for the Period from October 1, 2021 Through October 31, 2021 (this "Fee Statement").⁴ By this Fee Statement, Davis Polk seeks (i) compensation in the amount of \$2,655,641.20, which is equal to 80% of the total amount of reasonable compensation for actual, necessary legal services that Davis Polk incurred in connection with such services during the Fee Period (i.e., \$3,319,551.50) and (ii) payment of \$6,618.64 for the actual, necessary expenses that Davis Polk incurred in connection with such services during the Fee Period.

Itemization of Services Rendered and Disbursements Incurred

- 1. Attached hereto as **Exhibit A** is a chart of the number of hours expended and fees incurred (on an aggregate basis) by Davis Polk partners, associates, law clerks and paraprofessionals during the Fee Period with respect to each of the project categories Davis Polk established in accordance with its internal billing procedures. As reflected in **Exhibit A**, Davis Polk incurred \$3,319,551.50 in fees during the Fee Period. Pursuant to this Fee Statement, Davis Polk seeks reimbursement for 80% of such fees, totaling \$2,655,641.20.
- 2. Attached hereto as **Exhibit B** is a chart of Davis Polk professionals and paraprofessionals, including the standard hourly rate for each attorney and paraprofessional who rendered services to the Debtors in connection with these chapter 11 cases during the Fee Period and the title, hourly rate, aggregate hours worked and the amount of fees earned by each professional. The blended hourly billing rate of attorneys for all services provided during the Fee Period is \$1,158.81.⁵ The blended hourly billing rate of all paraprofessionals is \$461.22.⁶

⁴ The period from October 1, 2021, through and including October 31, 2021, is referred to herein as the "Fee Period."

⁵ The blended hourly billing rate of \$1,158.81 for attorneys is derived by dividing the total fees for attorneys of \$3,292,985.50 by the total hours of 2,841.7.

⁶ The blended hourly billing rate of \$461.22 for paraprofessionals is similarly derived by dividing the total fees for paraprofessionals of \$26,566.00 by the total hours of 57.6.

20-11563-scc Doc 2213 Filed 11/30/21 Entered 11/30/21 17:42:56 Main Document Pq 4 of 114

- 3. Attached hereto as **Exhibit C** is a chart of expenses that Davis Polk incurred or disbursed in the amount of \$6,618.64 in connection with providing professional services to the Debtors during the Fee Period. These expense amounts are intended to cover Davis Polk's direct operating costs, which costs are not incorporated into Davis Polk's hourly billing rates. Only the clients for whom the services are actually used are separately charged for such services. The effect of including such expenses as part of the hourly billing rates would unfairly impose additional cost upon clients who do not require extensive photocopying, delivery and other services.
- 4. Attached hereto as **Exhibit D** are the time records of Davis Polk for the Fee Period organized by project category with a daily time log describing the time spent by each attorney and other professional during Fee Period as well as an itemization of expenses.

Notice

5. The Debtors will provide notice of this Fee Statement in accordance with the Interim Compensation Order. The Debtors submit that no other or further notice be given.

[Remainder of Page Left Blank Intentionally]

20-11563-scc Doc 2213 Filed 11/30/21 Entered 11/30/21 17:42:56 Main Document Pg 5 of 114

WHEREFORE, Davis Polk, in connection with services rendered on behalf of the Debtors,

respectfully requests (i) compensation in the amount of \$2,655,641.20 which is equal to 80% of the total

amount of reasonable compensation for actual, necessary legal services that Davis Polk incurred in

connection with such services during the Fee Period (i.e., \$3,319,551.50) and (ii) payment of \$6,618.64

for the actual, necessary expenses that Davis Polk incurred in connection with such services during the

Fee Period.

Dated:

November 30, 2021

New York, New York

DAVIS POLK & WARDWELL LLP

By: /s/ Timothy Graulich

450 Lexington Avenue

New York, New York 10017

Telephone: (212) 450-4000

Facsimile: (212) 701-5800

Marshall S. Huebner

Timothy Graulich

James I. McClammy

Stephen D. Piraino

Erik Jerrard (admitted pro hac vice)

Counsel to the Debtors and Debtors in

Possession

5

Exhibit A

Fees by Project Category

Project Category	Total Hours	Total Fees
Aircraft/Engines	520.2	\$613,009.00
Automatic Stay/Litigation	506.9	\$607,007.00
Bar Date/Estimation/Claims Allowance Issues	238.2	\$213,258.50
Corporate Governance, Board Matters and Communications	29.8	\$39,627.00
Creditor/UCC/AHC	52.0	\$64,225.50
Customer/Vendor/Non-Aircraft Lease/Non-Aircraft Contract Issues	29.6	\$24,799.00
Employee/Pension Issues	1.9	\$1,824.50
Financing	454.2	\$575,499.00
General Case Administration	125.4	\$119,204.50
Non-DPW Retention and Fee Issues	10.5	\$10,788.50
Plan/Disclosure Statement	725.6	\$827,649.00
DPW Retention/Preparation of DPW Fee Statements/Applications and Budget	36.0	\$26,424.00
IP, Regulatory and Tax	148.8	\$175,167.50
Hearing Preparation/Attendance	19.4	\$23,933.50
Credit Card Receivables	0.8	\$1,042.00
Total	2,899.3	\$3,319,551.50 ⁷

⁷ The total reflects a voluntary write-off of \$3,907.00.

Exhibit B

Professional and Paraprofessional Fees

Name of Professional Individual	Position, Year Assumed Position, Prior Relevant Experience, Year of Obtaining Relevant License to Practice	Hourly Billing Rate	Total Hours Billed	Total Compensation
Partners				
Blanco, Maurice	Partner; joined partnership 2008; admitted New York 2002	\$1,790.00	10.7	\$19,153.00
Borchardt, Leo	Partner; joined partnership in 2016; admitted New York 2007	\$1,765.00	18.6	\$32,829.00
Farr, Lucy W.	Partner; joined partnership in 2003; admitted New York 1996	\$1,790.00	21.0	\$37,590.00
Graulich, Timothy	Partner; joined partnership in 2009; admitted New York 1995	\$1,790.00	259.3	\$464,147.00
Huebner, Marshall S.	Partner; joined partnership in 2002; admitted New York 1994	\$1,790.00	39.1	\$69,989.00
Jackson, Vanessa L.	Partner; joined partnership 2019; admitted New York 2013	\$1,635.00	7.1	\$11,608.50
McClammy, James I.	Partner; joined partnership in 2015; admitted New York \$1,765.00		109.5	\$193,267.50
Partner Total:				\$828,584.00
Counsel				
Altus, Leslie J.	Counsel; joined Davis Polk 1985; admitted New York 1984 \$1,345.00		29.8	\$40,081.00
Schisa, Will	Counsel; joined Davis Polk 2017; admitted District of Columbia 2002	\$1,345.00	1.1	\$1,479.50
Sturm, Josh	Counsel; joined Davis Polk 2020; admitted New York 2007 \$1,345.00		87.4	\$117,553.00
Szanzer, Steven Z.	Counsel; joined Davis Polk 2016; admitted New York 2001 \$1,345.00		218.1	\$293,344.50
White, Erika D.	Counsel, joined Davis Polk 1981; admitted New York 1982 \$1,345.00		2.3	\$3,093.50
Zilberberg, David A.	Counsel; joined Davis Polk 2015; admitted New York 1999 \$1,345.00		1.5	\$2,017.50
Counsel Total:			340.2	\$457,569.00

Name of Professional Individual	Position, Year Assumed Position, Prior Relevant Experience, Year of Obtaining Relevant License to Practice	Hourly Billing Rate	Total Hours Billed	Total Compensation
Associates, Law Clerks an	d Legal Assistants			
Bane, Abraham	Associate; joined Davis Polk 2019; admitted New York 2020	\$835.00	81.7	\$68,219.50
Dartez, Jackson	Associate; joined Davis Polk 2018; admitted New York 2019	\$1,060.00	8.8	\$9,328.00
Dekhtyar, Mariya	Associate; joined Davis Polk 2020; admitted New York 2021	\$740.00	59.2	\$43,808.00
Donnelly, Jacob M.	Associate; joined Davis Polk 2020; admitted New York 2021	\$740.00	38.7	\$28,638.00
Ford, Stephen	Associate; joined Davis Polk 2020; admitted New York 2019	\$1,060.00	101.3	\$107,378.00
Garg, Paavani	Associate; joined Davis Polk 2019; admitted New York 2019	\$1,060.00	59.2	\$62,752.00
Green, Thomas S.	Associate; joined Davis Polk 2019; admitted New York 2016	\$1,175.00	22.8	\$26,790.00
Herts, Dylan	Associate; joined Davis Polk 2020; admitted New York 2020	\$835.00	2.7	\$2,254.50
Hwang, Eric	Associate; joined Davis Polk 2019; admitted New York 2020	\$835.00	67.5	\$56,362.50
Jerrard, Erik	Associate; joined Davis Polk 2015; admitted New York 2016	\$1,175.00	300.4	\$352,970.00
Katz, Michael	Associate; joined Davis Polk 2018; admitted New York 2019	\$1,060.00	13.0	\$13,780.00
Levenback, Ben	Associate; joined Davis Polk 2016; admitted New York 2018	\$1,155.00	4.4	\$5,082.00
Marienko, Anna	Associate; joined Davis Polk 2018; admitted New York 2019	\$1,060.00	66.8	\$70,808.00
Masaro, Matthew Bruno	Associate; joined Davis Polk in 2019; admitted New York 2020	\$835.00	129.8	\$108,383.00

Name of Professional Individual	Position, Year Assumed Position, Prior Relevant Experience, Year of Obtaining Relevant License to Practice	Hourly Billing Rate	Total Hours Billed	Total Compensation
Melcer, Moshe	Associate; joined Davis Polk 2020; admitted New Jersey 2020	\$740.00	191.8	\$141,932.00
Parrott, Andy T.	Associate; joined Davis Polk 2017; admitted New York 2018	\$1,140.00	88.4	\$100,776.00
Piraino, Stephen D.	Associate; joined Davis Polk 2014; admitted New York 2014	\$1,175.00	182.7	\$214,672.50
Rincon, Cristina M.	Associate; joined Davis Polk 2016; admitted New York 2015	\$1,175.00	87.7	\$103,047.50
Siman, Ariel	Associate; joined Davis Polk 2014; admitted New York 2014	\$1,175.00	48.7	\$57,222.50
Simmonds, Alexander W.	Associate; joined Davis Polk 2016; admitted New York 2017	\$1,155.00	38.2	\$44,121.00
Steinberg, Richard J.	Associate; joined Davis Polk 2019; admitted New York 2019	\$1,060.00	211.2	\$223,872.00
Talamás Velázquez, Ernesto	Associate; joined Davis Polk 2018; admitted New York 2019	\$1,060.00	1.7	\$1,802.00
Troconis, Adela	Associate; joined Davis Polk 2015; admitted New York 2016	\$1,175.00	9.9	\$11,632.50
Weigel, Heather	Associate; joined Davis Polk 2017; admitted New York 2018	\$1,140.00	5.8	\$6,612.00
Dacher, Matt	Law Clerk; joined Davis Polk 2021	\$600.00	18.3	\$10,980.00
Devaren, Larenz M.	Law Clerk; joined Davis Polk 2020	\$740.00	1.8	\$1,332.00
Foley, Sean C.	Law Clerk; joined Davis Polk 2021	\$600.00	15.5	\$9,300.00
Hanson, Cole	Law Clerk; joined Davis Polk 2021	\$600.00	71.5	\$42,900.00
Krishnan, Rahul	Law Clerk; joined Davis Polk 2019	\$835.00	78.4	\$65,464.00
Kudolo, Mary	Law Clerk; joined Davis Polk 2020	\$740.00	11.0	\$8,140.00

Name of Professional Individual	Position, Year Assumed Position, Prior Relevant Experience, Year of Obtaining Relevant License to Practice Hourly Billing Rate		Total Hours Billed	Total Compensation	
Lang, Cristina Lauren	Law Clerk; joined Davis Polk 2021	\$600.00	17.3	\$10,380.00	
Altman, Olivia	Legal Assistant; joined Davis Polk 2019	\$480.00	6.8	\$3,264.00	
Giddens, Magali	Legal Assistant; joined Davis Polk 2019				
Jegarl, Christine	Legal Assistant, joined Davis Polk 2021	11.9	\$4,165.00		
Bauer, Christopher William	Ediscovery Project Manager; joined Davis Polk 2005 \$540.00		1.3	\$702.00	
Healy, Laura Ediscovery Project Manager; joined Davis Polk 1990 \$540.00			8.7	\$4,698.00	
Ionescu, Alex Ediscovery Senior Litigation Technology Specialist; joined Davis Polk 2012 \$435.00				\$1,305.00	
Associates, Law Clerks an	2,093.8	\$2,037,305.50			
GRAND TOTAL					

⁸ The total reflects a voluntary write-off of \$3,907.00.

20-11563-scc Doc 2213 Filed 11/30/21 Entered 11/30/21 17:42:56 Main Document Pg 13 of 114

Exhibit C

Expense Summary

Expense Category	Service Provider (if applicable)	Total Expenses
Court & Related fees	CourtSolutions, Veritext LLC, and Pacer transactions	\$587.85
Postage, Courier & Freight	N/A	\$716.08
Outside Documents & Research	Restructuring Concepts and Courtlink	\$1,129.55
Electronic Discovery Services	Consilio Inc.	\$743.95
Meals	See Meal Detail Below	\$232.45
Travel	See Travel Detail Below	\$286.27
Computer Research	LexisNexis and Westlaw	\$2,922.49
TOTAL		\$6,618.64

	MEAL DETAIL				
Date	Provider	Meal & Number of People	Description	Amount ⁹	
10/05/21	Eden Wok	1	Overtime meal for S. Szanzer	\$20.00	
10/06/21	DIG	1	Overtime meal for M. Masaro	\$20.00	
10/11/21	Eden Wok	1	Overtime meal for S. Szanzer	\$20.00	
10/12/21	Taam Tov Restaurant	1	Overtime meal for S. Szanzer	\$20.00	
10/13/21	Milk N Honey	1	Overtime meal for S. Szanzer	\$20.00	
10/14/21	Koshe Poke	1	Overtime meal for S. Szanzer	\$20.00	
10/18/21	Davis Polk Cafeteria	1	Overtime meal for S. Piraino	\$13.30	
10/20/21	Davis Polk Cafeteria	1	Overtime meal for S. Piraino	\$13.40	
10/20/21	Kosher Poke	1	Overtime meal for S. Szanzer	\$20.00	
10/25/21	Davis Polk Cafeteria	1	Overtime meal for E. Jerrard	\$20.00	

 $^{^9}$ Where an amount for an overtime meal originally exceeded \$20.00, the amount was reduced to \$20.00 to comply with the UST Guidelines.

	MEAL DETAIL				
Date	Provider	Meal & Number Description of People		Amount ⁹	
10/26/21	Davis Polk Cafeteria	1	Overtime meal for M. Giddens	\$5.75	
10/27/21	Koshe Poke	1	Overtime meal for S. Szanzer	\$20.00	
10/28/21	DIG	1	Overtime meal for M. Masaro	\$20.00	
TOTAL				\$232.45	

TRAVEL DETAIL				
Date	Person Traveling	Description	Amount	
10/04/21	S. Szanzer	Taxi from Davis Polk offices for late night work	\$59.39	
10/06/21	M. Masaro	Taxi from Davis Polk offices for late night work	\$33.79	
10/11/21	S. Szanzer	Taxi from Davis Polk offices for late night work	\$56.84	
10/13/21	S. Szanzer	Taxi from Davis Polk offices for late night work	\$64.36	
10/14/21	S. Foley	Taxi from Davis Polk offices for late night work	\$11.16	
10/27/21	S. Szanzer	Taxi from Davis Polk offices for late night work	\$60.73	
TOTAL			\$286.27	

Exhibit D

Detailed Time Records

	Time Detail By Project						
Time ID	Name	Date	Hours	Narrative			
AM100 Airc	raft/Engines						
31075432	Garg, Paavani	10/01/21	4.6	Review and revise motion to approve aircraft transaction (4.5); call with M. Melcer regarding same (0.1).			
31226571	Green, Thomas S.	10/01/21	4.9	Call with Skyworks regarding Flight Safety (0.5); analyze memorandum regarding same (0.5); research issues regarding automatic stay (3.9).			
31157503	Melcer, Moshe	10/01/21	4.7	Review and revise motion to approve aircraft transaction (1.2); draft related sealing motion (1.3); draft declaration in support of same (0.2); correspondence with S. Szanzer regarding outstanding fleet workstreams (0.2); email with Cleary Gottlieb regarding upcoming fleet motions (0.2); call with P. Garg regarding aircraft assumption motions (0.1); correspondence with S. Szanzer regarding BOC motion (0.3); email with White & Case regarding same (0.1); draft declaration in support of same (0.7); update fleet status summary (0.4).			
31370521	Piraino, Stephen D.	10/01/21	0.7	Correspondence with J. Wallden and S. Szanzer regarding fleet rejections.			
31547591	Szanzer, Steven Z.	10/01/21	4.9	Review and revise TEAM sealing motion (0.6); review and revise declaration in support of same (0.5); correspondence with M. Melcer regarding same (0.5); review and consider comments to FLY motion (0.2); review and revise same (0.4); correspondence with M. Melcer regarding same (0.2); correspondence with Skyworks, White & Case, and Davis Polk Fleet team regarding JOLCOs (0.8); correspondence with White & Case and TrueNoord regarding motion (0.2); correspondence with M. Melcer regarding GECAS (0.1); correspondence with White & Case regarding same (0.1); correspondence with M. Melcer and White & Case regarding Fuyo (0.1); correspondence with Skyworks and White & Case regarding MPS (0.2); review and revise ACG motion (0.5); correspondence with M. Melcer regarding same (0.5).			
31180661	Szanzer, Steven Z.	10/01/21	6.3	Correspondence with M. Melcer regarding BOC motion (0.7); review and revise BOC motion (0.7); correspondence with O'Melveny & Myers regarding Ex-Im (0.2); correspondence with Davis Polk Litigation team regarding JOLCOs (0.2); correspondence with S. Piraino regarding assumption and rejection issues and consider same (0.4); correspondence with Aeroméxico and Skyworks regarding same (0.3); correspondence with Aeroméxico and T. Green regarding Flight Safety (0.8); review and revise NAC motion (1.0); correspondence with P. Garg regarding same (1.0); correspondence with Willkie Farr, Skyworks, L. Crowley, and Davis Polk Fleet team regarding ALC motion (0.6); correspondence with M. Melcer regarding			

		Time De	etail By Pro	iect
Time ID	Name	Date	Hours	Narrative
				Boomerang, TEAM, and Wings (0.2); correspondence with Cleary Gottlieb regarding same (0.2).
31159882	Garg, Paavani	10/02/21	0.3	Correspondence with Davis Polk Fleet team regarding aircraft assumption motions.
31180021	Melcer, Moshe	10/02/21	0.3	Revise aircraft rejection motion.
31180670	Szanzer, Steven Z.	10/02/21	0.6	Correspondence with Norton Rose regarding FLY motion (0.1); review and revise ACG motion (0.2); correspondence with M. Melcer regarding same (0.2); correspondence with T. Graulich regarding fleet motions (0.1).
31163438	Garg, Paavani	10/03/21	0.9	Correspondence with Davis Polk Fleet team regarding aircraft assumption motions.
31186315	Szanzer, Steven Z.	10/03/21	1.8	Correspondence with P. Garg regarding JOLCOs (0.3); review and revise Goshawk motion (0.6); correspondence with M. Melcer regarding same (0.5); correspondence with M. Melcer regarding Avolon motion (0.2); correspondence with B. Smith regarding same (0.2).
31184160 31267054	Garg, Paavani Green, Thomas S.	10/04/21 10/04/21	3.5 2.6	Review and revise aircraft assumption motion. Review and revise Fuyo motions (1.1); review BBAM motions (1.0); correspondence with M. Melcer regarding same (0.5).
31362142 31184158	McClammy, James I. Melcer, Moshe	10/04/21 10/04/21	3.5 4.1	Analyze JOLCO lease issues. Review and revise aircraft rejection motion (0.4); revise notice of hearing adjournment regarding ALC (0.3); call with S. Szanzer regarding fleet workstreams (0.5); email with Chorus regarding Chorus filings (0.2); review same (0.2); review email update from M. Landess regarding JA Mitsui (0.2); review and revise TrueNoord motion (0.6); email with Debevoise & Plimpton regarding same (0.1); revise motion to approve aircraft transaction (1.6).
31372896	Steinberg, Richard J.	10/04/21	0.9	Correspondence with S. Szanzer regarding Embraer agreements (0.2); revise Embraer motion (0.4); correspondence with Aeroméxico regarding same (0.3)
31223893	Sturm, Josh	10/04/21	1.5	Correspondence with Davis Polk Fleet team regarding pending fleet motions (1.1); correspondence with Davis Polk Fleet team regarding aircraft claims buildup (0.4).
31194931	Szanzer, Steven Z.	10/04/21	2.8	Correspondence with Herbert Smith Freehills regarding JA Mitsui (0.2); correspondence with M. Melcer regarding ALC (0.1); correspondence with Chambers regarding same (0.1); correspondence with Willkie Farr and T. Graulich regarding same (0.2); correspondence with White & Case regarding GECAS (0.2); correspondence with M. Melcer regarding same (0.1); correspondence with Aeroméxico and R. Steinberg regarding Embraer (0.3); correspondence with J. Sturm regarding Flight Safety (0.4); correspondence with J. Sturm and P. Garg regarding JOLCOs (0.3);

		Time De	tail By Pro	ject
Time ID	Name	Date	Hours	Narrative
31383932	Szanzer, Steven Z.	10/04/21	6.8	correspondence with J. Sturm regarding fleet workstreams (0.3); review Yamasa documents (0.3); correspondence with R. Johnson regarding same (0.3). Correspondence with White & Case and Skyworks regarding Fuyo JOLCO motion (0.2); review and revise same (0.9); correspondence
				with M. Melcer regarding same (0.2); correspondence with Skyworks and T. Graulich regarding same (0.2); review and revise BBAM sealing motion and declaration (0.7); correspondence with M. Melcer and T. Green regarding same (0.7); review and consider comments to TrueNoord motion (0.4); review and revise same (0.2); correspondence with M. Melcer regarding same (0.2); correspondence
				with Skyworks regarding same (0.2); review and consider comments to Avolon motion (0.8); correspondence with M. Melcer and White & Case regarding same (0.4); correspondence with Skyworks regarding same (0.3); correspondence with White & Case and Debevoise & Plimpton regarding TrueNoord redactions (0.2); correspondence with Skyworks regarding JA Mitsui (0.4); correspondence with
31190561	Garg, Paavani	10/05/21	3.5	White & Case and Skyworks regarding Yamasa (0.3); correspondence with M. Melcer regarding fleet workstreams (0.5). Correspondence with Davis Polk Fleet team regarding fleet workstreams (1.5); call with White & Case regarding same (1.0); call with opposing counsel regarding same (0.5); correspondence with Davis Polk Fleet team
31350936	Graulich, Timothy	10/05/21	5.7	regarding fleet workstream (0.5). Correspondence with Davis Polk Fleet team regarding JOLCO issues (0.5); call with C. Hansen regarding JOLCO order (0.7); correspondence with same regarding same (0.7); review and revise form of order (1.6);
31267076	Green, Thomas S.	10/05/21	5.5	review claims analysis (2.2). Review FLY lease declaration (0.2); review and revise Wings motion (1.4); review and revise Yamasa motion (0.9); review BOC lease issues (0.5); call with Skyworks regarding JOLCOs (0.5); correspondence with R. Steinberg regarding Embraer (0.5); call with White & Case regarding JOLCOs (1.0); call with Aeroméxico regarding Embraer (0.5).
31363906	McClammy, James I.	10/05/21	1.8	Analyze JOLCO lease issues (1.0); correspondence with Davis Polk team regarding same (0.8).
31189658	Melcer, Moshe	10/05/21	7.8	Revise motion to approve aircraft transactions (0.6); email with White & Case regarding same (0.1); revise fleet status summary (0.6); email with M. Landess regarding aircraft assumption motion (0.2); revise same (0.2); call with Davis

Time Detail By Project				
Time ID	Name	Date	Hours	Narrative
				Polk Fleet team regarding JA Mitsui (0.8); call with same, White & Case, and Morris Nichols regarding same (0.6); call with Davis Polk Fleet team, White & Case, Skyworks and Vedder Price regarding same (0.5); call with Davis Polk Fleet team, White & Case, and Skyworks regarding same (0.5); correspondence with J. Sturm regarding outstanding workstreams (0.2); call with Chorus regarding motion of same (0.3); revise same (0.4); revise related sealing motion (0.2); revise declaration in support of same (0.3); revise FLY motion (0.5); revise BBAM sealing motion (0.4); revise BBAM declaration (0.5); revise motion to approve aircraft transactions (0.5); correspondence with S. Szanzer regarding same (0.2); correspondence with same regarding outstanding fleet workstreams (0.2).
31370398	Piraino, Stephen D.	10/05/21	1.3	
31477159	Rincon, Cristina M.	10/05/21	2.0	Correspondence with J. McClammy regarding JOLCO leases (0.2); call with Davis Polk Restructuring team regarding same (0.8); call with White and Case regarding JOLCO leases (0.6); call with Vedder Price to discuss JOLCO assumption (0.4).
31373087	Steinberg, Richard J.	10/05/21	1.5	Call with Aeroméxico regarding Embraer (1.0); correspondence with S. Szanzer regarding same (0.3); call with Aeroméxico regarding Saftan agreements (0.2)
31224101	Sturm, Josh	10/05/21	6.9	Call with White & Case and Davis Polk Litigation team regarding JOLCO assumptions (0.5); research issues regarding same (0.5); review documents regarding same (0.8); correspondence with T. Green regarding same (0.6); call with M. Edelman regarding same (0.3); correspondence with Davis Polk Fleet team regarding JA Mitsui (0.4); review Disclosure Statement regarding same (0.2); correspondence with Norton Rose regarding same (0.4); call with Norton Rose regarding potential JOLCO dispute (0.4); review Fuyo motion (1.5); correspondence with Davis Polk Fleet team regarding same (0.4); call with M. Edelman regarding Senior Vice President claims (0.4); call with Davis Polk Fleet team and White & Case regarding same (0.5).
31212366	Szanzer, Steven Z.	10/05/21	7.4	Correspondence with M. Melcer regarding Boomerang motion (0.2); correspondence with White & Case, Skyworks, and Holland & Knight regarding BBAM sealing motion and declaration (0.2); correspondence with Skyworks and White & Case regarding Goshawk motion (0.3); review and consider comments to BOC motion (0.2); correspondence with White & Case regarding

		Time De	etail By Proj	ject
Time ID	Name	Date	Hours	Narrative
31383080	Szanzer, Steven Z.	10/05/21	6.7	same (0.1); review and consider comments to ACG motion (0.3); review and revise same (0.4); correspondence with M. Melcer, White & Case and Skyworks regarding same (0.7); correspondence Davis Polk Litigation and Fleet teams regarding JA Mitsui (1.4); review and consider comments to FLY motion (0.4); review and revise same (0.2); correspondence with M. Melcer and Norton Rose regarding same (0.2); correspondence with White & Case, Skyworks, and T. Green regarding Yamasa documents (0.4); correspondence with R. Steinberg and Aeroméxico regarding Embraer and SAFRAN (1.3); correspondence with M. Melcer regarding Chorus (0.3); review and consider comments to BBAM sealing motion and declaration (0.4); correspondence with M. Landess and Holland & Knight regarding same (0.4). Correspondence with White & Case regarding Wings redactions (0.1); correspondence with Skyworks regarding GECAS (0.2); correspondence with M. Melcer regarding Avolon motion and review and revise same (1.0); review and consider comments to Wings motion (0.3); review and revise same (0.3); correspondence with M. Melcer regarding same (0.4); review and revise same (0.3); correspondence with P. Garg regarding same (0.3); correspondence with M. Melcer and T. Green regarding same (0.6); correspondence with White & Case and T. Green regarding BMOE (0.3); correspondence with J. Sturm regarding JOLCO motions (0.3); call with Vedder Price, White & Case, and Skyworks regarding JA Mitsui (0.4); call with White & Case and Skyworks regarding Same (0.6); call with Davis Polk Fleet team regarding same (0.3); correspondence with L. Whidden, M. Landess, and M. Melcer regarding
31197467	Garg, Paavani	10/06/21	6.6	Chorus motion (0.3). Revise JOLCO assumption motions (6.3); call with J. Sturm regarding aircraft rejection procedure (0.3).
31351127 31267132	Graulich, Timothy Green, Thomas S.	10/06/21 10/06/21	1.2 2.9	Review and revise fleet order. Research automatic stay issue regarding JA Mitsui.
31196888	Melcer, Moshe	10/06/21	6.6	Finalize and compile Wings, BBAM, ACG, FLY, and Chorus motions (3.5); email with Cleary Gottlieb regarding same (0.4); correspondence with S. Szanzer regarding same (0.2); email with S. Piraino regarding same (0.1); summarize same for T. Graulich (0.5); draft JOLCO sealing motion (0.5); draft declaration in support of same (0.6); correspondence with T. Green regarding same (0.2); correspondence with P.

		Time De	tail By Pro	iect
Time ID	Name	Date	Hours	Narrative
31240738 31238823	Steinberg, Richard J. Sturm, Josh	10/06/21 10/06/21	1.0 4.1	Garg regarding motion to assume aircraft agreements (0.1); call with Norton Rose regarding FLY motion (0.1); correspondence with S. Szanzer regarding outstanding fleet workstreams (0.4). Review and revise Embraer motion. Correspondence with T. Green regarding research for JA Mitsui assumption motion (0.5);
				review Fuyo motion (0.7); correspondence with Davis Polk Fleet team regarding status of aircraft assumption motions (0.6); comment on JA Mitsui settlement order notice (0.7); correspondence with Davis Polk Fleet team regarding same (0.7); call with P. Garg regarding aircraft rejection procedures (0.3); review T. Graulich's comments to aircraft assumption motions (0.6).
31208065	Szanzer, Steven Z.	10/06/21	9.7	correspondence with R. Johnson and M. Melcer regarding Yamasa motion (0.6); correspondence with White & Case and Skyworks regarding same (0.5); correspondence with White & Case and TEAM regarding redactions (0.1); correspondence with M. Landess regarding Chorus (0.2); correspondence with P. Garg and J. Sturm regarding Fuyo motion (0.3); review and revise same (0.4); correspondence with M. Landess regarding ACG motion (0.2); correspondence with White & Case regarding AerCap (0.2); correspondence with E. Worenklein and M. Melcer regarding TrueNoord motion (0.2); correspondence with White & Case regarding Wings redactions (0.1); correspondence with S. Campbell, White & Case, and Skyworks regarding Wings documents (0.3); correspondence with L. Whidden and M. Melcer regarding Chorus documents (0.6); correspondence with T. Green regarding DAE issues (0.3); review and revise Embraer motion (1.3); correspondence with R. Steinberg regarding same (1.3); correspondence with J. Copeland and M. Melcer regarding FLY motion (0.7); correspondence with White & Case regarding Avolon (0.3); correspondence with Davis Polk team regarding JA Mitsui (0.3); review revised documents regarding same (0.2); review and revise Yamasa sealing motion (0.4); review and revise declaration in support of same (0.4); correspondence with M. Melcer regarding same (0.3); correspondence with White & Case, Skyworks and R. Johnson regarding same (0.3); correspondence with White & Case and M.
31203694	Garg, Paavani	10/07/21	2.9	Melcer regarding MPS (0.2). Call with Davis Polk Fleet team and White & Case regarding fleet workstreams (0.7); revise assumption motions for aircrafts (2.2).

		Time De	etail By Pro	ject
Time ID	Name	Date	Hours	Narrative
31351779 31203869	Graulich, Timothy Melcer, Moshe	10/07/21 10/07/21	2.2 7.0	Review and revise JOLCO analysis. Call with White & Case regarding TEAM motion (0.1); revise same (0.7); revise related sealing motion (0.4); revise declaration in support of same (0.4); correspondence with S. Szanzer regarding motion to approve aircraft transactions (0.3); revise same (0.4); correspondence with T. Graulich regarding summary of fleet filings (0.1); draft same (0.4); compile documents for fleet filings (1.7); email with creditor groups regarding same (0.4); call with Davis Polk Fleet team and White & Case regarding fleet workstreams (0.5) (partial attendance); revise fleet status summary (0.6); correspondence with P. Garg regarding Fuyo assumption motion (0.1); revise same (0.3); coordinate with White & Case regarding same (0.1); revise FLY motion (0.1); email with FLY counsel regarding same (0.1); email with Chorus regarding motion of same (0.1); email with Skyworks regarding filings
31240718	Steinberg, Richard J.	10/07/21	1.1	(0.1). Email to Embraer counsel regarding aircraft assumption and claims settlement (0.2); revise Embraer motion (0.5); email with Aeroméxico
31247025	Sturm, Josh	10/07/21	6.1	regarding same (0.4). Call with White & Case regarding aircraft rejection rights (0.6); call with Davis Polk Fleet team and White & Case regarding fleet workstreams (0.7); correspondence with P. Garg and others regarding Fuyo assumption motion (0.5); review and revise same (0.4); review correspondence with Creditors Committee and Apollo regarding same (0.3); correspondence with P. Garg and others regarding notice of settlement of Mitsui order (0.6); call with J. Cross regarding same (0.5); correspondence with same regarding same (0.3); correspondence with S. Szanzer and Davis Polk team regarding same (0.6); review correspondence regarding aircraft assumption motions (0.6); finalize Fuyo motion for filing (0.6); correspondence with M. Melcer and others regarding Mitsui negotiations (0.3); review summary of fleet filings (0.1)
31212019	Szanzer, Steven Z.	10/07/21	10.8	summary of fleet filings (0.1). Review and consider comments to TEAM documents (0.4); review and revise same (0.4); correspondence with M. Melcer regarding same (0.3); correspondence with White & Case regarding same (0.3); finalize BBAM, Chorus, ACG, Fuyo, and Wings filings (3.3); correspondence with White & Case and Skyworks regarding Yamasa (0.4); correspondence with M. Melcer regarding same (0.3); correspondence with P. Garg and J. Sturm regarding JA Mitsui (0.3); review revised order

	Time Detail By Project				
Time ID	Name	Date	Hours	Narrative	
31210102 31209431	Garg, Paavani Melcer, Moshe	10/08/21 10/08/21	1.9 4.7	for same (0.4); review and revise Avolon motion (0.4); correspondence with M. Melcer regarding same (0.3); correspondence with White & Case regarding same (0.3); call with White & Case and Skyworks regarding aircraft lease rejections (1.0); correspondence with T. Green regarding same (0.1); correspondence with M. Melcer and N. Vislocky regarding DVB and MUFG (0.3); finalize TEAM and FLY filings (1.4); call with Davis Polk Fleet team and White & Case regarding fleet workstreams (0.7); correspondence with T. Green regarding DAE issues (0.2). Review and revise aircraft assumption motions. Email with T. Graulich regarding fleet filings and upcoming motions (0.3); correspondence with J.	
				Sturm regarding JA Mitsui (0.2); correspondence with M. Giddens regarding same (0.1); review and revise JA Mitsui settled order (0.3); email with Chambers regarding same (0.2); review motion approve aircraft transactions (0.2); draft related sealing motion (0.2); draft declaration in support of same (0.4); revise motion to approve equipment transaction (0.1); draft related sealing motion (0.2); draft declaration in support of same (0.3); correspondence with T. Green regarding same (0.1); correspondence with S. Szanzer regarding Yamasa motion (0.3); revise related sealing motion (0.3); analyze same (0.5); revise related transaction document (0.5); revise declaration in support of same (0.5).	
31247061	Sturm, Josh	10/08/21	4.7	Correspondence with T. Graulich regarding Matsui order (0.3); review HSF comments to same (0.3); correspondence with P. Garg regarding same (0.2); correspondence with M. Edelman regarding same (0.4); call with M. Edelman regarding same (0.9); correspondence with T. Graulich regarding same (0.4); coordinate filing of proposed order (0.5); call to Chambers regarding JA Mitsui order (0.3); correspondence with advisors regarding Senior Vice President counter offer (0.4); correspondence with Davis Polk team regarding same (0.5); correspondence with J. Cross regarding order status (0.2); review correspondence to Chambers regarding proposed order (0.3).	
31216987	Szanzer, Steven Z.	10/08/21	2.1	Correspondence with Davis Polk team regarding JA Mitsui and Fuyo (0.8); correspondence with White & Case and Skyworks regarding JA Mitsui (0.3); review filing regarding same (0.2); correspondence with White & Case regarding redactions (0.2); correspondence with same and Skyworks regarding Goshawk motion (0.3); correspondence with same regarding BOC	

-	Name Szanzer, Steven Z.	Date 10/08/21	Hours 5.3	Marrative motion (0.2); correspondence with Pillsbury Winthrop regarding Sierra Echo (0.1); call with R. Johnson regarding Yamasa motion (0.2); correspondence with T. Graulich regarding
31383593	Szanzer, Steven Z.	10/08/21	5.3	Winthrop regarding Sierra Echo (0.1); call with R. Johnson regarding Yamasa motion (0.2); correspondence with T. Graulich regarding
				same (0.1); review lease amendment deed for same (0.2); correspondence with R. Johnson regarding same (0.2); correspondence with M. Melcer regarding same (0.1); correspondence with R. Steinberg regarding ELF (0.3); correspondence with Skyworks and White & Case regarding same (0.2); review and consider comments to Yamasa motion (1.0); review and
				revise same (1.0); correspondence with R. Johnson and M. Melcer regarding same (0.3); correspondence with White & Case and Skyworks regarding same (0.2); review and consider comments to Avolon motion (0.2); correspondence with M. Melcer regarding same (0.2); correspondence with B. Smith regarding same (0.4); correspondence with R. Johnson and White & Case regarding Yamasa redactions (0.1); correspondence with Skyworks regarding NAC motion (0.1); correspondence with M. Melcer regarding other fleet workstreams (0.5).
31216397	Melcer, Moshe	10/09/21	3.4	Draft TrueNoord sealing motion (0.3); draft TrueNoord declaration (0.2); correspondence with S. Szanzer regarding motion to approve fleet transactions (0.5); draft motion related to same (2.4).
31216990	Szanzer, Steven Z.	10/09/21	0.8	Correspondence with J. Sturm and Skyworks regarding JA Mitsui (0.3); correspondence with Davis Polk Fleet team regarding GECAS and other fleet motions (0.5).
31216614	Melcer, Moshe	10/10/21	2.5	Draft omnibus motion to approve aircraft transactions.
31247087	Sturm, Josh	10/10/21	0.4	Correspondence with Davis Polk Fleet team
31229126	Szanzer, Steven Z.	10/10/21	0.8	regarding JA Mitsui assumption arguments. Correspondence with White & Case and Skyworks regarding Yamasa (0.2); review SMBC rejection agreement (0.2); correspondence with White & Case regarding same (0.4).
	Garg, Paavani Melcer, Moshe	10/11/21 10/11/21	0.4 6.0	Revise NAC assumption motion. Call with Skyworks regarding outstanding fleet workstreams (0.6); correspondence with S. Szanzer regarding same (0.2); call with White & Case regarding motion to approve aircraft transactions (0.3); correspondence with S. Szanzer regarding same (0.1); correspondence with T. Green regarding same (0.2); review and revise same (1.1); revise related sealing motion (0.4); revise declaration in support of same (0.5); call with Holland & Knight regarding motion to approve aircraft transactions (0.4); revise motion to approve simulator transaction (0.2); revise related sealing motion (0.3);

		Time De	etail By Pro	ject
Time ID	Name	Date	Hours	Narrative
				correspondence with S. Szanzer regarding same (0.1); revise declaration in support of same (0.2); email with White & Case regarding same (0.2); draft motion to approve engine transaction (0.9); revise fleet status summary (0.3).
31226185	Steinberg, Richard J.	10/11/21	0.8	Correspondence with Embraer and its advisors (0.4); correspondence with S. Szanzer regarding Embraer (0.1); correspondence to Aeroméxico regarding same (0.3).
31278523	Sturm, Josh	10/11/21	0.9	Call with M. Edelman regarding JA Mitsui (0.5); correspondence with M. Landess regarding same (0.4).
31229325	Szanzer, Steven Z.	10/11/21	5.4	Review emails regarding TEAM (0.2); correspondence with H. Treharne regarding TrueNoord (0.2); correspondence with M. Melcer regarding same (0.1); review and revise sealing motion (0.5); review and revise declaration in support of same (0.5); correspondence with M. Melcer regarding same (0.5); correspondence with White & Case and Skyworks regarding BOC (0.3); correspondence with M. Melcer regarding BOC (0.3); review and revise Yamasa sealing motion and declaration (1.1); correspondence with M. Melcer regarding same (0.1); correspondence with White & Case and Skyworks regarding same (0.2); correspondence with Skyworks regarding ELF (0.2); correspondence with M. Melcer regarding same (0.2); review and consider comments to Yamasa documents (0.2); correspondence with White & Case and Skyworks regarding same (0.2); correspondence with White & Case and Skyworks regarding NAC motion (0.2); review and consider comments to same (0.2); correspondence with P. Garg regarding same
31383236	Szanzer, Steven Z.	10/11/21	5.8	(0.2). Call with B. Smith regarding Avolon motion (0.6);correspondence with M. Melcer regarding same (0.2); correspondence with White & Case and Skyworks regarding same (0.2); review and revise MPS sealing motion and declaration (0.9); correspondence with M. Melcer regarding same (0.9); correspondence with M. Melcer regarding ALC (0.2); correspondence with R. Steinberg regarding Embraer (0.3); review and revise Avolon motion (0.4); correspondence with M. Melcer regarding same (0.2); correspondence with White & case and Skyworks regarding same (0.2); correspondence with White & Case regarding MPS (0.3); correspondence with M. Melcer regarding TrueNoord (0.2); correspondence with White & Case regarding same (0.2);review and revise True Noord documents (0.4); correspondence with M. Melcer regarding same

Time Detail By Project					
Name	Date	Hours	Narrative		
Garg, Paavani	10/12/21	0.9	(0.4); review emails regarding JA Mitsui (0.2). Call with M. Landess and others regarding JOLCO assumptions (0.7); correspondence with Davis Polk Fleet team regarding fleet		
Graulich, Timothy	10/12/21	2.5	assumptions (0.2). Call with M. Landess and others regarding JOLCO assumptions (0.7); review and comment		
Green, Thomas S.	10/12/21	2.9	on fleet presentation (1.8). Review and revise GECAS (2.5); correspondence with M. Melcer motion to approve omnibus fleet transaction (0.4).		
Melcer, Moshe	10/12/21	4.7	Review and revise motion to approve omnibus fleet transaction (1.0); call with T. Green regarding same (0.4); correspondence with S. Szanzer regarding same (0.3); correspondence with same regarding Yamasa (0.1); revise Yamasa motion (0.3); revise sealing motion related to same (0.2); revise declaration in support of same (0.2); email with Cleary Gottlieb regarding same (0.1); review and revise TrueNoord motion (1.2); review and revise related sealing motion (0.3); review and revise declaration in support of same (0.3); email with Cleary Gottlieb regarding same (0.1); email with T. Graulich regarding TrueNoord and Yamasa (0.2).		
Sturm, Josh	10/12/21	3.6	Review fleet assumption analysis (1.5); review Rothschild's comments to same (0.3); correspondence with White & Case and Rothschild regarding same (0.3); call with Rothschild, AlixPartners, and Skyworks regarding JOLCO decisions (1.0); correspondence with T. Graulich regarding		
Szanzer, Steven Z.	10/12/21	7.2	same (0.5). Correspondence with Debevoise & Plimpton regarding TrueNoord documents (0.2); correspondence with M. Melcer regarding same (0.2); review and consider comments to same (0.2); correspondence with M. Melcer regarding same (0.2); correspondence with Debevoise & Plimpton regarding same (0.1); correspondence with White & Case and Skyworks regarding same (0.3); correspondence with M. Melcer regarding Chorus documents (0.2); correspondence with MPS regarding motion (0.2); correspondence with M. Melcer regarding same (0.1); correspondence with same regarding Avolon documents (0.4); review and consider comments to BOC motion (0.3); correspondence with M. Melcer regarding same and related documents (0.2); correspondence with same regarding Yamasa documents (0.3); call with R. Johnson regarding same (0.2); correspondence with A. Andreeva regarding DVB and MUFG (0.3); review and consider comments to MPS sealing motion and		
	Garg, Paavani Graulich, Timothy Green, Thomas S. Melcer, Moshe Sturm, Josh	Name Date Garg, Paavani 10/12/21 Graulich, Timothy 10/12/21 Green, Thomas S. 10/12/21 Melcer, Moshe 10/12/21 Sturm, Josh 10/12/21	Name Date Hours Garg, Paavani 10/12/21 0.9 Graulich, Timothy 10/12/21 2.5 Green, Thomas S. 10/12/21 2.9 Melcer, Moshe 10/12/21 4.7 Sturm, Josh 10/12/21 3.6		

	Time Detail By Project				
Time ID	Name	Date	Hours	Narrative	
				declaration (0.3); correspondence with M. Melcer regarding same (0.5); review and consider comments to NAC motion (0.3); review and revise same (0.2); correspondence with P. Garg and White & Case regarding same (0.2); call with advisors regarding JOLCOs (0.9); correspondence with Davis Polk team regarding same (0.3); review analysis and email regarding same (0.2); correspondence with M. Melcer regarding GECAS (0.4); review and consider comments to Avolon motion (0.3); correspondence with M. Melcer regarding same	
31235021	Melcer, Moshe	10/13/21	5.5	(0.2). Review and revise motion to approve fleet transactions (1.9); correspondence with S. Szanzer regarding same (0.2); call with Chambers regarding recent fleet filings (0.3); correspondence with S. Szanzer regarding outstanding fleet workstreams (0.2); revise Avolon motion (0.7); revise related sealing motion (0.2); revise related declaration (0.5); revise fleet status summary (0.4); email with White & Case regarding SMBC (0.2); finalize Yamasa motion (0.3); correspondence with S. Szanzer regarding same (0.1); email with Chambers regarding Yamasa and TrueNoord filings (0.3); email with creditor groups regarding same (0.2).	
31249740	Sturm, Josh	10/13/21	2.4	Call with M. Edelman regarding JA Mitsui notice (0.8); correspondence with M. Landess and Davis Polk Fleet team regarding same (0.3); review aircraft assumption analysis (0.6); correspondence with Skyworks and Davis Polk regarding same (0.3); review correspondence regarding additional MAX aircraft assumptions (0.3); review correspondence regarding ALC motion (0.1).	
31244937	Szanzer, Steven Z.	10/13/21	10.4	Correspondence with J. Sturm regarding JOLCO analysis (0.2); correspondence with Skyworks regarding same (0.2); correspondence with same regarding Avolon (0.2); finalize Yamasa documents for filing (1.5); review and consider comments to MPS declaration (0.1); correspondence with M. Melcer regarding same (0.1); correspondence with MPS regarding same (0.3); finalize TrueNoord documents for filing (0.7); correspondence with D. Sinclair regarding ALC (0.4); correspondence with T. Graulich regarding same (0.4); correspondence with Rothschild and AlixPartners regarding same (0.3); correspondence with White & Case regarding SMBC (0.2); correspondence with T. Green regarding and O'Melveny & Myers regarding Ex-Im fees (0.2); correspondence with T. Green regarding BOC lease amendment (0.2); correspondence	

	Time Detail By Project					
Time ID	Name	Date	Hours	Narrative		
31243106	Garg, Paavani	10/14/21	4.0	with White & Case regarding same (0.4); review and consider comments to Avolon motion (0.3); review and revise GECAS motion (4.0); correspondence with M. Melcer regarding same (0.1); correspondence with T. Graulich regarding fleet issues (0.3); correspondence with M. Melcer regarding fleet workstreams (0.3). Call with Davis Polk Fleet team and White & Case regarding fleet workstreams (0.9); call with White & Case, Davis Polk Fleet team, and Morris Nichols regarding JA Mitsui (0.8); review case law for termination notices on aircraft		
31266920	Green, Thomas S.	10/14/21	1.2	leases (2.3). Research issue regarding automatic stay issue		
31241706	Melcer, Moshe	10/14/21	5.2	and JA Mitsui. Call with Davis Polk Fleet team and White & Case regarding fleet workstreams (0.9); call with White & Case, Davis Polk Fleet team, and Morris Nichols regarding JA Mitsui (0.8); revise Certificates of No Objection to Jupiter motion (0.2); correspondence with T. Green regarding outstanding fleet workstreams (0.3); correspondence with S. Szanzer regarding motion to approve fleet transactions (0.2); review and revise same (1.4); call with Holland & Knight regarding Avolon (0.1); revise related motions (0.4); revise motion to approve aircraft transaction (0.6); email with White & Case regarding same (0.1); correspondence with S. Szanzer regarding outstanding fleet workstreams (0.2).		
31249779	Sturm, Josh	10/14/21	5.2	Call with J. Cross regarding status of Mitsui discussions (0.3); correspondence with J. Cross regarding foreclosure notice (0.2); review same (0.4); call with M. Edelman regarding same (0.5); correspondence with Davis Polk Restructuring team regarding same (1.4); correspondence with T. Graulich regarding same (0.2); correspondence with P. Garg regarding materials relating to JA Mitsui notices (0.2); call with White & Case, Davis Polk Fleet team, and Morris Nichols regarding JA Mitsui (0.9); correspondence with Skyworks regarding status of Senior Vice President negotiations (0.2); review correspondence regarding hearing adjournment regarding ALC (0.4); call with Davis Polk Fleet team and White & Case regarding fleet workstreams (0.5) (partial attendance).		
31250558	Szanzer, Steven Z.	10/14/21	10.4	Correspondence with Aeroméxico regarding ALC (0.2); correspondence with D. Sinclair regarding same (0.2); correspondence with Chambers regarding same (0.1); review and revise BOC lease amendment (0.4); correspondence with T. Green regarding same (0.3); correspondence with White & Case regarding same (0.4); review and consider		

Time Detail By Project					
Time ID	Name	Date	Hours	Narrative	
			,,,,,,,,	comments to BOC motion (0.3); review and revise same (0.4); correspondence with M. Melcer regarding same (0.3); correspondence with Skyworks and White & Case regarding same (0.3); review and revise Jupiter Certificate of No Objection (0.3); correspondence with M. Melcer regarding same (0.3); correspondence with Linklaters and White & Case regarding DVB/MUFG (0.3); review and revise Avolon documents (0.8); correspondence with M. Melcer regarding same (0.8); correspondence with J. Sturm, Skyworks, White & Case, and Norton Rose regarding JA Mitsui (0.7); review foreclosure notice (0.8); call with Davis Polk Fleet team and White & Case regarding fleet	
				workstreams (0.9); review and revise GECAS motion (2.0); correspondence with M. Melcer regarding same (0.5); correspondence with	
31249214	Garg, Paavani	10/15/21	3.1	Aeroméxico regarding Embraer (0.1). Call with Herbert Smith Freehills regarding fleet workstreams (0.5); strategize on assumption of JOLCO aircrafts (2.6).	
31266918 31248923	Green, Thomas S. Melcer, Moshe	10/15/21 10/15/21	2.8 5.1	Research automatic stay and JA Mitsui issue. Revise Avolon motion (2.2); revise related sealing motion (0.5); review and revise declaration in support of same (0.9); call with Holland & Knight and others regarding same (0.2); correspondence with S. Szanzer regarding outstanding fleet workstreams (0.3); email with White & Case and Skyworks regarding ALC motion (0.3); correspondence with S. Szanzer regarding same (0.1); review comments to motion to approve fleet transactions (0.3); email with White & Case regarding upcoming fleet motions (0.3).	
31287289	Sturm, Josh	10/15/21	5.4	Correspondence with M. Landess and debtor advisors regarding JOLCO negotiations (1.2); call with M. Edelman and J. Cross regarding same (1.5); coordinate with Morris & Nichols regarding letters to JOLCO lessor (1.1); review Fuyo termination notice (0.3); correspondence with advisors regarding same (0.5); call with same regarding same (0.8).	
31257817	Szanzer, Steven Z.	10/15/21	6.5	Finalize Avolon documents for filing (2.3); correspondence regarding Jupiter documents (0.1); correspondence with White & Case regarding AerCap (0.2); correspondence with M. Melcer regarding same (0.1); review lease amendment for same (0.5); correspondence with T. Green regarding same (0.4); review and consider comments to GECAS (0.3); correspondence with White & Case regarding same (0.3); correspondence with M. Melcer regarding same (0.2); correspondence with T. Graulich and J. Sturm regarding Fuyo (0.3); correspondence with White & Case regarding	

Time Detail By Project					
Time ID	Name	Date	Hours	Narrative	
				same and JA Mitsui (0.3); correspondence with R. Johnson, M. Melcer, and T. Graulich regarding SMBC (0.5); correspondence with White & Case and Skyworks regarding SMBC (0.4); correspondence with R. Steinberg regarding Embraer (0.1); correspondence with	
31254323	Garg, Paavani	10/16/21	0.5	M. Melcer regarding fleet workstreams (0.5). Correspondence with Aeroméxico and opposing	
31255353	Melcer, Moshe	10/16/21	2.9	counsel regarding JOLCO aircrafts. Correspondence with S. Szanzer regarding fleet motions (0.3); email with Chambers regarding Avolon motion (0.2); draft sealing motion for MAX motion (1.2); draft SMBC Rule 9019 motion (1.2).	
31287312	Sturm, Josh	10/16/21	1.1	Correspondence with M. Landess and advisors regarding JOLCO negotiations (0.4); correspondence with M. Edelman regarding same (0.4); correspondence with T. Green regarding automatic stay research (0.3).	
31257819	Szanzer, Steven Z.	10/16/21	0.6	Correspondence with Davis Polk Fleet team and Skyworks regarding JOLCOs (0.2); correspondence with M. Melcer regarding fleet updates (0.4).	
31225050	Garg, Paavani	10/17/21	0.3	Correspondence with White & Case and Skyworks regarding JOLCO assumption motion.	
31255665	Melcer, Moshe	10/17/21	2.9	Draft SMBC Rule 9019 motion (0.3); review letters regarding JOLCO aircraft (0.3); draft motion to approve aircraft transactions (1.6); revise motion to approve fleet transactions (0.7).	
31287320	Sturm, Josh	10/17/21	4.5	Correspondence with M. Landess and advisors regarding JOLCO negotiations (0.8); call with M. Edelman regarding same (0.6); correspondence with Davis Polk Fleet team coordinating extension of JOLCO objection deadline (0.3); comment on same (0.3); comment on research regarding automatic stay (0.2); review proposed JOLCO letter of intent (0.8); correspondence with advisors regarding same (0.4); review letter regarding Fuyo termination (0.8); correspondence with Debtors' advisors regarding same (0.3).	
31261984	Szanzer, Steven Z.	10/17/21	4.6	Review and consider comments to SMBC Rule 9019 motion (0.4); review and revise same (0.3); correspondence with White & Case and Skyworks regarding same (0.4); correspondence with M. Melcer regarding same (0.4); review Davis Polk Fleet team correspondence regarding JOLCOs (0.3); review letters regarding same (0.4); correspondence with Aeroméxico and advisors regarding JOLCOs (0.5); review letter of intent for same (0.5); correspondence with Davis Polk Fleet team, White & Case, and Skyworks regarding same (0.5); correspondence with White & Case and Vedder Price regarding Ad Hoc Committee Group (0.2); review and revise	

Time Detail By Project				
Time ID	Name	Date	Hours	Narrative
31261712	Garg, Paavani	10/18/21	2.8	GECAS motion (0.2); correspondence with M. Melcer regarding same (0.2); correspondence with White & Case regarding same (0.3). Call with Herbert Smith Freehills regarding fleet assumptions (0.3); correspondence with J. Sturm regarding same (0.4); strategize
31267383	Graulich, Timothy	10/18/21	2.2	JOLCO strategy (0.4); review and revise correspondence regarding fleet issues (0.4);
31260629	Melcer, Moshe	10/18/21	2.6	review and revise aircraft stipulation (1.4). Revise motion to approve aircraft transaction (0.5); revise related sealing motion (0.3); draft related declaration (1.0); email with Chambers regarding objection deadlines (0.3); email with creditor groups regarding Avolon (0.2); correspondence with S. Szanzer regarding outstanding fleet workstreams (0.1); correspondence with J. Sturm regarding same (0.1); correspondence with T. Green regarding same (0.1).
31380357	Steinberg, Richard J.	10/18/21	0.3	Correspondence with Safran regarding aircraft lease assumption.
31288611 31270178	Sturm, Josh Szanzer, Steven Z.	10/18/21	7.1	Correspondence with S. Szanzer, M. Melcer and White & Case regarding 35119 (0.2); review JOLCO letter of intent revisions (0.8); call with Skyworks regarding same (0.3); call with Morris Nichols regarding same (0.6); call with M. Edelman regarding JOLCO (0.6); correspondence with T. Graulich and others regarding same (0.7); correspondence with White & Case regarding same (0.5); correspondence with M. Melcer regarding JOLCO agenda (0.4); call with Chambers regarding same (0.3); review correspondence with same regarding deadline extension (0.3); call with Willkie Farr regarding JOLCO negotiations (0.5); call with M. Edelman and J. Cross regarding same (1.1); review letter regarding JOLCO stay violations (0.5); correspondence with T. Graulich and advisors regarding same (0.3). Review and consider comments to SMBC
31210110	SZANZOI, OLEVENZ.	10/10/21	7.1	motion (0.6); correspondence with Skyworks regarding same (0.3); correspondence with M. Melcer regarding same (0.5); review and revise same (0.5); correspondence with Clifford Chance regarding same (0.2); correspondence with Davis Polk Fleet team, White & Case, Skyworks, Morris Nichols, and Willkie Farr regarding JOLCOs (1.5); correspondence with B. Thorsness regarding ACG (0.2); correspondence with M. Melcer regarding same (0.2); correspondence with White & Case regarding same (0.2); correspondence with Chambers regarding same (0.2);

Time Detail By Project					
Time ID	Name	Date	Hours	Narrative	
				correspondence with White & Case regarding BOC (0.3); correspondence with T. Green and M. Melcer regarding ELFC (0.1); correspondence with P. Garg regarding NAC (0.1); review and revise SMBC sealing motion (0.4); correspondence with M. Melcer regarding same (0.2); correspondence with White & Case regarding same (0.1); correspondence with Skyworks regarding same (0.1); correspondence with M. Landess and L. Crowley regarding ALC (0.2); correspondence with White & Case regarding MPS (0.1); correspondence with M. Melcer regarding fleet workstreams (0.5); review Creditors Committee's objection (0.5).	
31229593 31269565	Garg, Paavani Melcer, Moshe	10/19/21 10/19/21	1.1 0.3	Strategize regarding JOLCO fleet assumptions. Revise draft declaration regarding aircraft transaction.	
31380596	Steinberg, Richard J.	10/19/21	0.1	Email with AlixPartners regarding Ex-Im	
31337023	Sturm, Josh	10/19/21	5.7	payments. Call with M. Edelman regarding JOLCO negotiations (0.6); correspondence with M. Landess regarding same (0.4); correspondence with A. Andreeva regarding letter (0.3); call with NTT counsel regarding same (0.6); call with advisors regarding same (0.4); analyze tolling agreement for JOLCO aircraft (0.8); correspondence with M. Edelman regarding same (0.4); correspondence with advisors regarding same (0.6); correspondence with Davis Polk Fleet team regarding agenda fleet items (0.9); coordinate correspondence with Chambers regarding extension of JOLCO deadline (0.3); correspondence with M. Edelman and J. Cross regarding JOLCO hearing (0.4).	
31280444	Szanzer, Steven Z.	10/19/21	6.9	Correspondence with H. Treharne and M. Melcer regarding TrueNoord (0.2); correspondence with White & Case and S. Postle regarding BOC and consider issues (1.0); correspondence with J. Sturm, M. Landess, and White & Case regarding JOLCOs (0.4); correspondence with T. Green and B. Parlin regarding ELFC (0.2); review and revise SMBC declaration (0.8); correspondence with T. Green and M. Melcer regarding same (0.7); correspondence with White & Case regarding MPS (0.2); correspondence with White & Case and F. Breslin regarding SMBC (0.2); correspondence with A. Andreeva and B. Thorsness regarding ACG (1.1); review and consider comments to BOC motion (0.3); correspondence with B. Parlin regarding same (0.2); review and revise SMBC-Natixis 9019 motion (0.5); correspondence with T. Green regarding same (0.5); correspondence with C.	

Time Detail By Project					
Time ID	Name	Date	Hours	Narrative	
31235667	Garg, Paavani	10/20/21	3.2	White & Case regarding fleet workstreams (1.0);	
31377297	Graulich, Timothy	10/20/21	2.3	strategize regarding JOLCO assumptions (2.2). Call with C. Hansen regarding fleet issues (0.5);	
31278015	Melcer, Moshe	10/20/21	7.5	review and comment on fleet motion (1.8). Draft Certificates of No Objection for recent fleet motions (2.7); email with Chambers regarding same (1.1); review and revise motion to approve aircraft transaction (0.9); revise motion to approve equipment transaction (0.7); correspondence with T. Green regarding same (0.2); call with White & Case regarding MPS motion (0.1); call with Davis Polk Fleet team, Skyworks, and White & Case regarding fleet workstreams (1.0); review JOLCO objection (0.3); call with Skyworks regarding Avolon (0.1); call with TrueNoord regarding timing (0.1); correspondence with S. Szanzer regarding	
31337234	Sturm, Josh	10/20/21	3.7	outstanding fleet workstreams (0.3). Call with Davis Polk Fleet team, White & Case, and Skyworks regarding fleet workstreams (0.6) (partial attendance); call with M. Edelman and J. Cross regarding JOLCO negotiations (1.3); correspondence with M. Edelman regarding tolling agreement (0.4); correspondence with Morris Nichols regarding same (0.3); review JOLCO objections (0.8); correspondence with advisors regarding same (0.3).	
31287917	Szanzer, Steven Z.	10/20/21	11.6	Correspondence with White & Case regarding CAE (0.8); correspondence with same and H. Treharne regarding TrueNoord (0.1); correspondence with White & Case regarding SMBC (0.3); finalize Certificates of No Objection (1.0); correspondence with M. Melcer regarding same (1.1); correspondence with T. Graulich regarding same (1.1); correspondence with M. Melcer regarding MPS documents (0.3); correspondence with White & Case regarding same (0.2); correspondence with Skyworks regarding same (0.3); correspondence with White & Case regarding MOE (0.4); correspondence with M. Melcer regarding SMBC-Natixis Rule 9019 motion (0.2); review and revise Carlyle motion (0.4); correspondence with White & Case regarding same (0.5); correspondence with White & Case regarding same (0.5); review assumption protocols (0.2); correspondence with M. Melcer regarding same (0.2); correspondence with White & Case regarding same (0.1); review and consider comments to NAC motion (0.3); revise same (0.3); correspondence with P. Garg regarding same (0.2); review emails regarding JOLCOs	

Time Detail By Project					
Time ID	Name	Date	Hours	Narrative	
				tolling agreements (0.2); review fleet workstream summary (0.2); call with Davis Polk Fleet team, White & Case, and Skyworks regarding fleet workstreams (1.0); review and revise ELFC motion (0.7); correspondence with M. Melcer regarding same (0.5); correspondence with White & Case regarding same (0.5).	
31284448 31284527	Garg, Paavani Melcer, Moshe	10/21/21 10/21/21	3.3 6.9	Review objections to JOLCO motions. Analyze and summarize fleet claim settlements (4.3); revise motion to approve fleet transactions (0.5); call with Sidley Austin regarding same (0.1); correspondence with S. Szanzer regarding same (0.3); draft related sealing motion (0.7); draft declaration in support of same (1.0).	
31337400	Sturm, Josh	10/21/21	0.7		
31294668	Szanzer, Steven Z.	10/21/21	5.2	Finalize MPS documents for filing (1.0); review aircraft orders entered (0.5); correspondence with Davis Polk Fleet team regarding same (0.5); correspondence with Skyworks regarding SMBC-Natixis Rule 9019 motion (0.3); correspondence with D. Lopes and White & Case regarding Chorus aircraft lease agreements (0.2); correspondence with White & Case and S. Postle regarding BOC (0.4); correspondence with White & Case and Skyworks regarding same (0.2); correspondence with Davis Polk Fleet team, White & Case, and Skyworks regarding fleet update calls (0.3); correspondence with Davis Polk Fleet team and White & Case regarding AerCap (0.3); review and consider comments to GECAS motion (0.4); review and revise same (0.3); correspondence with M. Melcer regarding same (0.4); correspondence with Sidley and White & Case regarding same (0.4).	
31547689	Szanzer, Steven Z.	10/21/21	4.4	Review and consider comments to Carlyle motion (0.4); correspondence with M. Melcer regarding same (0.4); correspondence with Skyworks and B. Parlin regarding ELFC motion (0.2); correspondence with Skyworks regarding fleet orders (0.2); correspondence with White & Case regarding CAE (0.4); correspondence with Clifford Chance and White & Case regarding SMBC acquisition (0.1); review and consider comments to BOC motion (0.4); review and revise same (0.4); correspondence with M. Melcer regarding same (0.4); review and consider comments to Sierra Echo motion (0.4); review and revise same (0.5); correspondence with M. Melcer regarding same (0.4); correspondence with P. Garg and Skyworks	

Time Detail By Project					
Time ID	Name	Date	Hours	Narrative	
31291763	Melcer, Moshe	10/22/21	1.4	regarding NAC motion (0.2). Revise GECAS motion (0.9); revise motion to approve aircraft transaction (0.3); email with	
31337434	Sturm, Josh	10/22/21	0.9	White & Case regarding same (0.2). Review correspondence regarding GECAS agreement bankruptcy provisions (0.4); review correspondence regarding MPS motion (0.2);	
31300024	Szanzer, Steven Z.	10/22/21	8.4	correspondence regarding MPS motion (0.2); correspondence with advisors regarding fleet calls (0.3). Call with Skyworks regarding fleet issues (0.5); review and consider comments to GECAS motion (0.3); review and revise same (0.4); correspondence with M. Melcer regarding same (0.4); correspondence with White & Case and M. Burke regarding same (0.4); review and revise AerCap motion (0.7); correspondence with M. Melcer regarding same (0.7); review comments to same (0.2); correspondence with White & Case regarding same (0.2); correspondence with M. Melcer and White & Case regarding Sierra Echo motion (0.3); review and revise NAC motion (0.3); correspondence with Skyworks and P. Garg regarding same (0.3); correspondence with B. Parlin regarding BOC motion (0.1); review emails regarding BOC (0.3); correspondence with M. Melcer regarding Carlyle motion (0.2); review and consider	
31337441	Sturm Josh	10/23/21	0.2	comments to same (0.2); correspondence with White & Case and M. Melcer regarding same (0.2); correspondence with M. Melcer regarding SMBC acquisition declaration (0.2); correspondence with White & Case regarding same (0.1); review GECAS lease amendments (0.8); correspondence with White & Case regarding same (0.7); review and consider comments to Embraer motion (0.3); correspondence with E. Steinberg and Aeroméxico regarding same (0.2); review and consider comments to ELFC motion (0.2); correspondence with White & Case regarding same (0.2).	
31337441	Sturm, Josh			Correspondence with M. Landess regarding Senior Vice President negotiations.	
31298377 31337455	Garg, Paavani Sturm, Josh	10/24/21 10/24/21	0.5 0.3	Review and revise aircraft assumption motions. Correspondence with Morris Nichols and advisors regarding JOLCO litigation.	
31303806	Garg, Paavani	10/25/21	1.4	Call with Herbert Smith Freehills regarding fleet workstreams (0.6); call with White & Case regarding same (0.8).	
31303897	Melcer, Moshe	10/25/21	4.0	Draft Certificates of No Objection for TrueNoord and Yamasa (1.3); revise motion to approve aircraft transactions (0.4); revise declaration in support of same (0.8); correspondence with S. Szanzer regarding outstanding fleet workstreams (0.3); correspondence with T. Green regarding same (0.2); call with Davis Polk	

		Time Detail By Project				
Time ID	Name	Date	Hours	Narrative		
31379214 31344783	Steinberg, Richard J. Sturm, Josh	10/25/21 10/25/21	0.6 5.0	Fleet team, White & Case, and Skyworks regarding same (0.9); correspondence with J. Sturm regarding JA Mitsui (0.1). Call with the Aeroméxico regarding Embraer. Call with Morris Nichols and Herbert Smith Freehills regarding JOLCO litigation (0.4); prepare for same (0.4); call with Herbert Smith Freehills and Vedder Price regarding JOLCO negotiations (1.2); correspondence with advisors regarding JOLCO objections (0.8); review same (0.6); call with Davis Polk Fleet team, White & Case, and Skyworks regarding fleet workstreams (1.0); correspondence with White & Case regarding JOLCO notices (0.3);		
31316179	Szanzer, Steven Z.	10/25/21	5.9	correspondence with M. Edelman regarding status of tolling agreement (0.3). Correspondence with Davis Polk Fleet team and		
				advisors regarding JOLCOs (0.3); correspondence with J. Sturm regarding same (0.2); correspondence with White & Case and Skyworks regarding BOC (0.4); review and revise GECAS documents (0.6); correspondence with M. Melcer regarding same (0.6); correspondence with White & Case, Skyworks, and Sidley Austin regarding same (0.5); correspondence with M. Landess, M. Melcer, and Clifford Chance regarding SMBC-Natixis Rule 9019 motion (0.4); correspondence with White & Case regarding Flight Safety (0.1); review and consider comments to Carlyle motion (0.3); correspondence with M. Melcer regarding same (0.2); correspondence with White & Case regarding EPCOR (0.2); review and consider comments to ELFC motion (0.2); review and revise same (0.2); correspondence with M. Melcer regarding same (0.2); correspondence with B. Parlin regarding same (0.2); review and consider comments to Landess SMBC MAX declaration (0.3); review and revise same (0.2); correspondence with M. Melcer regarding same (0.3); correspondence with M. Landess regarding same (0.3).		
31547815	Szanzer, Steven Z.	10/25/21	5.0	Call with R. Johnson regarding SMBC Max Motion (0.2); correspondence with White & Case regarding same (0.2); correspondence with M. Melcer regarding same (0.2); review and consider comments to same (0.2); correspondence with M. Melcer regarding same (0.2); correspondence with White & Case and Skyworks regarding same (0.1); correspondence with White & Case regarding Sierra Echo (0.4); correspondence with C. Hansen regarding redactions (0.2); review and consider comments to Goshawk motion (0.3);		

		Time De	etail By Proj	ject
Time ID	Name	Date	Hours	Narrative
				correspondence with M. Melcer regarding letter of credit issue (0.2); review documents for same (0.2); email White & Case regarding same (0.2); correspondence with Skyworks regarding AerCap motion (0.2); correspondence with M. Melcer regarding same (0.1); call with Davis Polk Fleet team, White & Case, and Skyworks regarding fleet workstreams (0.9); correspondence with M. Melcer regarding same (0.4); review and consider comments to Embraer motion (0.2); correspondence with Aeroméxico regarding same (0.3); correspondence with R. Steinberg regarding
31314959	Garg, Paavani	10/26/21	1.7	regarding JOLCOs (1.0); strategize regarding
31312427 31378569	Melcer, Moshe Steinberg, Richard J.	10/26/21	0.6	JOLCO assumption (0.7). Revise GECAS motion (3.3); call with White & Case regarding same (0.3); correspondence with M. Giddens regarding same (0.1); revise related sealing motion (0.6); revise declaration in support of same (0.4); call with Sidley Austin and others regarding same (0.1); correspondence with S. Szanzer regarding same (0.1); email with Chambers regarding same (0.2); call with Norton Rose regarding motion to approve aircraft transactions (0.2); revise same (0.3); call with Skyworks regarding fleet claims and workstreams (0.3); call with Skyworks, and White & Case regarding simulator negotiations (0.3); review motion to approve aircraft transactions (0.1); call with Clifford Chance regarding same (0.2). Correspondence with S. Szanzer regarding Embraer (0.2); revise Embraer motion (0.2); correspondence to Embraer regarding same
31344763	Sturm, Josh	10/26/21	4.6	(0.2). Call with Morris Nichols and White & Case regarding JOLCO litigation (1.0); prepare for same (1.2); correspondence with NTT regarding JOLCO call (0.4); correspondence with advisors regarding same (0.3); correspondence with M. Edelman regarding tolling agreement (0.1); call with M. Edelman regarding outstanding transaction items (0.3); review JOLCO term sheet (0.5); review correspondence with White & Case and Skyworks regarding same (0.8).
31325319	Szanzer, Steven Z.	10/26/21	11.8	Correspondence with White & Case and S. Postle regarding BOC (0.2); correspondence with White & Case regarding CAE (0.2); review and consider comments to AerCap motion (0.2); correspondence with M. Melcer regarding same (0.2); review and consider comments to Carlyle motion (0.4); correspondence with J. Copeland and M. Melcer regarding same (0.4); review and revise same (0.5); review and revise Embraer

		Time Det	ail By Proj	iect
Time ID	Name	Date	Hours	Narrative
				motion (0.5); correspondence with R. Steinberg regarding same (0.6); correspondence with Skyworks regarding Beautech (0.1); finalize GECAS documents for filing (2.5); review and consider comments to ELFC motion (0.2); correspondence with M. Melcer regarding same (0.2); correspondence with B. Parlin regarding same (0.1); correspondence with C. Hansen regarding redactions (0.3); correspondence with R. Johnson and M. Melcer regarding Yamasa (0.2); review and consider comments to SMBC MAX motion and correspondence (0.2); correspondence with M. Melcer regarding same (0.2); correspondence with White & Case regarding same (0.1); call with White & Case and Morris Nichols regarding JOLCOs (1.0); correspondence with White & Case and Skyworks regarding Flight Safety (0.4); finalize Certificates of No Objection for fleet filing (1.5); review and revise Genesis motion (0.6); correspondence with M. Melcer regarding same
				(0.6); correspondence with M. Melcer regarding letter of credit issue (0.1); correspondence with
31292390	Garg, Paavani	10/27/21	1.2	same regarding engine leases (0.3). Call with White & Case and Skyworks regarding JOLCO assumption (0.8); strategize regarding JOLCO assumption (0.4).
31320878	Melcer, Moshe	10/27/21	6.1	Revise SMBC motion (0.4); revise related sealing motion (0.2); review and revise declaration in support of same (1.1); email with Chambers regarding same (0.2); call with Clifford Chance regarding same (0.2); correspondence with S. Szanzer regarding same (0.2); call with White & Case regarding same (0.1); call with same regarding GECAS motion (0.1); revise motion to approve aircraft assumption (0.7); email with Vedder Price regarding same (0.1); call with Holland & Knight regarding motion to approve aircraft transaction (0.2); call with S. Szanzer regarding outstanding workstreams (0.2); correspondence with T. Green regarding same (0.3); draft sealing motion for motion to approve aircraft transaction (0.8); draft declaration in support of same (0.6); coordinate regarding SMBC motion (0.7).
31378144	Steinberg, Richard J.	10/27/21	0.5	Email with AlixPartners regarding Safran agreements (0.3); call with Aeroméxico regarding same (0.2).
31344757	Sturm, Josh	10/27/21	1.8	Correspondence with Herbert Smith Freehills regarding call regarding JOLCOs (0.3); call with M. Edelman regarding JOLCO term sheet (0.5); correspondence with advisors regarding same (0.4); correspondence with Davis Polk Fleet and Plan teams regarding Plan terms of JOLCO letter of intent (0.4); review correspondence regarding Nuevo Acuerdo 787 (0.2).

	Time Detail By Project				
Time ID	Name	Date	Hours	Narrative	
31342200	Szanzer, Steven Z.	10/27/21	6.1	Correspondence with Skyworks and M. Melcer regarding Genesis motion (0.3); review revised Carlyle motion (0.2); correspondence with J. Copeland regarding same (0.2); correspondence with M. Melcer regarding same (0.2); correspondence with T. Wolynski and M. Burke regarding GECAS (0.3); correspondence with White & Case and S. Postle regarding BOC (0.3); correspondence with B. Parlin, C. Dietz, and M. Melcer regarding same (0.6); correspondence with R. Steinberg regarding Exlm (0.2); correspondence with O'Melveny & Myers regarding same (0.2); finalize SMBC MAX documents for filing (1.8); correspondence with Skyworks regarding Avenger (0.3); review and consider comments to AerCap motion (0.3); correspondence with M. Melcer regarding same (0.2); review emails regarding CAE (0.2); correspondence with S. Silverman regarding GECAS (0.1); call with N. Vislocky regarding MUFG (0.2); correspondence with M. Melcer regarding other fleet workstreams (0.5).	
31331171	Garg, Paavani	10/28/21	4.8	Call with Davis Polk Fleet team, White & Case, and Skyworks regarding fleet workstreams (0.5); draft JOLCO assumption motion (4.3).	
31329150	Melcer, Moshe	10/28/21	5.4	Revise Avolon and Air Lease Certificates of No Objection (0.4); email with Chambers regarding same (0.3); analyze and distribute new fleet filings (0.4); call with Davis Polk Fleet team, Skyworks, and White & Case regarding fleet workstreams (0.6); call with Skyworks, lessor, and others regarding potential transactions (0.5); revise motion to approve aircraft transaction (0.6); revise related sealing motion (0.5); revise declaration in support of same (0.8); email with Davis Polk Fleet team regarding SMBC motion (0.3); correspondence with C. Rincon regarding same (0.1); revise fleet status summary (0.4); correspondence with S. Szanzer regarding outstanding fleet workstreams (0.2); email with White & Case and Skyworks regarding upcoming motions (0.3).	
31550871	Rincon, Cristina M.	10/28/21	0.1	Correspondence with M. Melcer regarding fleet motions.	
31376922	Steinberg, Richard J.	10/28/21	1.2	Correspondence with Skyworks regarding Aircastle (0.3); email with Aeroméxico regarding Embraer (0.5); correspondence with S. Szanzer regarding same (0.2); revise Embraer motion (0.2).	
31340977	Sturm, Josh	10/28/21	2.6	Review NTT JOLCO letter (0.5); correspondence with Davis Polk Fleet team regarding same (0.3); correspondence with Davis Polk team, Skyworks and White & Case regarding Senior Vice President negotiations (1.1); call with Davis Polk Fleet team, White & Case, and Skyworks regarding fleet	

	Time Detail By Project					
Time ID	Name	Date	Hours	Narrative		
31342393	Szanzer, Steven Z.	10/28/21	4.5	workstreams (0.5); correspondence with NTT counsel regarding call on fleet issues (0.2). Review and revise Certificates of No Objection (0.2); review and revise notice of cancellation of hearing (0.2); correspondence with M. Melcer regarding same (0.3); correspondence with C. Hansen and M. Melcer regarding redactions (0.3); correspondence with Embraer regarding motion (0.2); correspondence with R. Steinberg regarding same (0.2); correspondence with S. Postle and White & Case regarding BOC (0.4); review and revise Carlyle sealing motion (0.3); review and revise declaration in support of same (0.3); correspondence with M. Melcer regarding same (0.4); correspondence with J. Copeland, White & Case and Skyworks regarding same (0.4); review and revise ELFC documents (0.4);		
31547975	Szanzer, Steven Z.	10/28/21	3.8	correspondence with M. Melcer regarding same (0.4); correspondence with B. Parlin, White & Case and Skyworks regarding same (0.5). Correspondence with M. Rexnick and M. Melcer regarding TEAM (0.2); correspondence with A. Andreeva regarding ALC motion (0.1); call with Skyworks and Beautech regarding transaction (0.5); correspondence with Davis Polk Fleet team, White & Case and Skyworks regarding GECAS (0.4); review fleet workstream summary (0.3); call with Davis Polk Fleet team, White & Case, and Skyworks regarding fleet workstreams (0.5); correspondence with White & Case regarding Macquarie and SAEL (0.3); review email regarding Sierra Echo (0.1); review and revise BOC sealing motion and declaration (0.4); correspondence with M. Melcer regarding same (0.4); correspondence with B. Parlin,		
31338904 31340561	Garg, Paavani Melcer, Moshe	10/29/21 10/29/21	1.5 4.0	White & Case and Skyworks regarding same (0.6). Review JOLCO letter of intent. Call with Skyworks regarding fleet claims (0.3); call with Clifford Chance regarding same (0.1); correspondence with S. Szanzer regarding motion to approve aircraft transaction (0.2); email with White & Case and Skyworks regarding same (0.1); call with White & Case, Skyworks, and S. Szanzer regarding commercial negotiations (0.4); email with Chambers regarding Avolon order (0.1); call with Skyworks regarding upcoming fleet motions (0.2); revise motion to approve aircraft transactions (0.7); revise Carlyle sealing motion (0.4); revise declaration in support of same (0.3); email with White & Case and Skyworks regarding same (0.2); revise BOC sealing motion (0.3); revise declaration in support of same (0.3); email with White & Case and Skyworks regarding same (0.1); revise fleet		

		Time De	tail By Pro	ject
Time ID	Name	Date	Hours	Narrative
31376014	Steinberg, Richard J.	10/29/21	0.4	status summary (0.3). Correspondence with M. Melcer regarding JP lease claims (0.3); email with Skyworks
31360896 31350071	Sturm, Josh Szanzer, Steven Z.	10/29/21	0.3 5.6	regarding same (0.1). Review letter of intent. Correspondence with White & Case, S. Postle, Skyworks, and B. Parlin regarding BOC (0.7); correspondence with M. Melcer regarding same (0.6); correspondence with White & Case regarding Carlyle redactions (0.1); correspondence with C. Dietz regarding GECAS (0.1); review and consider comments to Goshawk motion (0.4); review and revise same (0.4); correspondence with M. Melcer regarding same (0.3); correspondence with Skyworks and M. Melcer regarding SAEL (0.3); correspondence with same and White & Case regarding MOE (0.4); correspondence with E. Jerrard and M. Melcer regarding MAX motions (0.2); correspondence with Skyworks, White & Case, and M. Melcer regarding Macquarie (0.2); call with White & Case, Skyworks, and M. Melcer regarding commercial negotiations (0.4); correspondence with P. Garg regarding NAC (0.2); correspondence with White & Case and Skyworks regarding Carlyle (0.3); correspondence with M. Melcer regarding same (0.2); correspondence with M. Melcer regarding fleet workstreams (0.8).
31349775 31348936	Garg, Paavani Melcer, Moshe	10/30/21 10/30/21	1.0 1.3	Revise NAC assumption motion. Draft motion to approve engine transaction (1.0); draft motion to approve aircraft transaction (0.3).
31349419	Melcer, Moshe	10/31/21	0.9	Draft motion to approve aircraft transaction (0.6); correspondence with R. Steinberg regarding Embraer (0.2); email with Cleary Gottlieb regarding same (0.1).
31375566	Steinberg, Richard J.	10/31/21	0.7	Email with S. Szanzer regarding Embraer (0.2); correspondence with Aeroméxico regarding same (0.3); correspondence with M. Melcer regarding same (0.2).
31363956	Szanzer, Steven Z.	10/31/21	2.3	Review NAC sealing motion and declaration (0.3); correspondence with P. Garg regarding same (0.2); review and revise Embraer declaration (0.7); correspondence with R. Steinberg and M. Melcer regarding same (0.6); correspondence with R. Sanchez regarding same (0.1); correspondence with M. Landess regarding Carlyle documents (0.1); correspondence with White & Case regarding Boomerang (0.1); correspondence with Davis Polk Fleet team regarding MAX motions (0.2).
Total AM100	Aircraft/Engines		520.2	
AM110 Auto 31233728	matic Stay/Litigation Masaro, Matthew Bruno	10/04/21	0.1	Correspondence with S. Cunningham and

Time Detail By Project					
Time ID	Name	Date	Hours	Narrative	
31486252	Graulich, Timothy	10/06/21	4.2	others regarding automatic stay stipulation. Review Apollo discovery requests.	
31206762	Huebner, Marshall S.	10/06/21	0.2		
31363854	McClammy, James I.	10/06/21	4.0	discovery issue. Coordinate discovery responses (1.5); review documents regarding to discovery issues (2.5).	
31486536	Graulich, Timothy	10/07/21	2.3	Correspondence with J. McClammy regarding Apollo discovery request (0.5); review discovery response (1.8).	
31378313 31016152	Krishnan, Rahul Parrott, Andy T.	10/07/21 10/07/21	0.5 3.8	Call with advisors regarding discovery request. Research issues regarding estoppel (3.2); correspondence with J. McClammy regarding discovery (0.5); correspondence with C. Rincon regarding same (0.1).	
31372648	Piraino, Stephen D.	10/07/21	1.8	Review document requests (0.4); email with Davis Polk team regarding document request (0.7); email with same regarding discovery issues (0.7).	
31208236 31215291	Rincon, Cristina M. Graulich, Timothy	10/07/21 10/08/21	1.3 6.2	Review Apollo discovery requests. Correspondence with J. McClammy regarding discovery requests (0.9); call with Cleary Gottlieb regarding same (0.6); review creditors Committee discovery request (4.7).	
31225739	Krishnan, Rahul	10/08/21	0.7	Call with Davis Polk Litigation team regarding discovery request call with Cleary Gottlieb (0.5); correspondence with same regarding same (0.2).	
31361777	McClammy, James I.	10/08/21	3.0	Review Delta materials (1.2); review discovery requests (1.0); correspondence with Davis Polk	
31212940	Parrott, Andy T.	10/08/21	4.9	Litigation team regarding same (0.8). Correspondence with J. McClammy regarding discovery (0.9); research issues regarding estoppel (2.9); draft summary regarding same	
31387132	Piraino, Stephen D.	10/08/21	0.5	(0.6); review discovery requests (0.5). Call with Rothschild regarding Apollo discovery requests.	
31213146	Rincon, Cristina M.	10/08/21	1.8	Call with Rothschild regarding Apollo discovery requests (0.5); call with Cleary Gottlieb and Paul Weiss regarding same (0.5); call with Davis Polk team regarding same (0.8).	
31240675	Steinberg, Richard J.	10/08/21	0.4		
31216604	Graulich, Timothy	10/09/21	1.2	· ·	
31215719	Parrott, Andy T.	10/09/21	3.6	Correspondence with J. McClammy regarding Creditors Committee discovery requests (0.5); research issues regarding estoppel (2.4); draft summary regarding same (0.7).	
31226674	Graulich, Timothy	10/10/21	3.2		

	Time Detail By Project				
Time ID	Name	Date	Hours	Narrative	
31220837	Krishnan, Rahul	10/10/21	0.4	Coordinate call with Willkie Farr regarding its discovery requests (0.1); call with Willkie Farr regarding same (0.3).	
31384931	Piraino, Stephen D.	10/10/21	0.4	Call with Cleary Gottlieb and Paul Weiss regarding Apollo discovery requests.	
31217360	Rincon, Cristina M.	10/10/21	0.6	Call with Cleary Gottlieb and Paul Weiss regarding Apollo discovery requests (0.4); call with Willkie Farr regarding Creditors Committee discovery request (0.2).	
31380299	Steinberg, Richard J.	10/10/21	0.6	Call with Cleary Gottlieb and Paul Weiss regarding Apollo discovery requests (0.4); prepare for same (0.2).	
31226611	Graulich, Timothy	10/11/21	1.7	Call with H. Parkhill regarding deposition request (0.4); correspondence with L. Barefoot regarding same (0.6); correspondence with J. McClammy regarding same (0.7).	
31378546	Krishnan, Rahul	10/11/21	5.0	Review documents for potential production (3.0); coordinate production logistics of same (0.5); draft responses and objections to requests for production (1.5).	
31363815	McClammy, James I.	10/11/21	2.3	Review discovery requests (0.8); correspondence with Davis Polk team regarding discovery issues (0.6); correspondence with Davis Polk Litigation team regarding Creditors Committee discovery request (0.9).	
31220587	Parrott, Andy T.	10/11/21	4.5	Correspondence with J. McClammy regarding discovery (0.7); draft responses to requests for admission (3.8).	
31372947	Piraino, Stephen D.	10/11/21	3.2	Call with Sainz Abogados regarding litigation issues (0.3); call with Hughes Hubbard regarding Apollo discovery requests (0.4); call with Rothschild regarding same (0.6); call with Creditors Committee regarding discovery requests (0.5); correspondence with Davis Polk Litigation team regarding same (1.4).	
31221038	Rincon, Cristina M.	10/11/21	3.8		
31233901	Graulich, Timothy	10/12/21	2.3	Correspondence with J. McClammy regarding discovery requests (0.5); review revised discovery requests (1.8).	
31257190	Jerrard, Erik	10/12/21	0.3	Correspondence with J. McClammy and C. Rincon regarding discovery issues.	
31279033	Krishnan, Rahul	10/12/21	5.5	Call with advisors regarding document requests and interrogatories from Apollo (1.5); correspondence with C. Rincon regarding same (0.5); review Board materials in response to same (0.8); prepare same for production (0.7); draft interrogatory responses and objections to Apollo's interrogatories (2.0).	
31380747	Marienko, Anna	10/12/21	4.2	Correspondence with C. Rincon regarding	

		Time D	etail By Pro	ject
Time ID	Name	Date	Hours	Narrative
				Apollo discovery request (0.8); draft discovery request (3.4).
31226831	Masaro, Matthew Bruno	10/12/21	0.3	Correspondence with local counsel regarding
31360155	McClammy, James I.	10/12/21	2.3	automatic stay stipulation. Correspondence with Davis Polk Litigation team regarding discovery issues (0.8);
31229164	Parrott, Andy T.	10/12/21	5.9	correspondence with C. Rincon regarding same (0.3); review discovery responses (1.2). Review documents in response to Apollo document request (5.1); draft response to request for admission (0.3); call with Paul Weiss
31387238	Piraino, Stephen D.	10/12/21	0.3	regarding discovery (0.5). Correspondence with J. McClammy and T.
31232504	Rincon, Cristina M.	10/12/21	5.6	Graulich regarding discovery. Analyze discovery request (0.6); call with Apollo regarding discovery request (0.7); call with Akin Gump regarding Apollo discovery (0.2); correspondence with J. McClammy regarding same (0.2); correspondence with Davis Polk Restructuring team regarding notice of default (0.2); analyze Apollo discovery issues (0.9); analyze search term and document collection (2.8).
31486625	Graulich, Timothy	10/13/21	2.1	Correspondence with J. McClammy regarding discovery issues (0.7); review discovery requests (1.4).
31243542	Healy, Laura	10/13/21	1.9	Correspondence with C. Rincon, L. Lewis, A. lonescu, P. Toohey, and Consilio regarding document review.
31238465	Ionescu, Alex	10/13/21	3.0	Analyze Aeroméxico materials in preparation for
31278882	Krishnan, Rahul	10/13/21	13.7	document production and attorney. Draft interrogatory responses and objections to Apollo's interrogatories (5.2); correspondence with C. Rincon regarding same (0.5); correspondence with advisors and J. McClammy regarding same (1.0); review and revise same (3.0); call with Davis Polk Litigation team regarding discovery request response status (0.9); correspondence with C. Rincon regarding documents for production to Creditors Committee and Apollo (0.5); review same (1.7); prepare documents for production (0.9).
31363129	McClammy, James I.	10/13/21	6.3	Correspondence with Davis Polk Litigation team regarding discovery issues (1.2); prepare discovery responses (5.1).
31236185	Parrott, Andy T.	10/13/21	5.4	Call with Sainz Abogados, Rothschild, and Morris Nichols regarding discovery (0.5); draft response to request for admission (1.0); review documents in response to discovery requests (3.9).
31370243	Piraino, Stephen D.	10/13/21	1.0	Call with co-advisors regarding discovery issues.
31235271	Rincon, Cristina M.	10/13/21	5.6	Revise responses to Apollo discovery request (3.1); call with R. Azar regarding document collection (0.3); call with Hughes Hubbard

		Time D	etail By Proj	ject
Time ID	Name	Date	Hours	Narrative
31249844	Dacher, Matt	10/14/21	10.5	regarding discovery requests (0.4); analyze discovery issues (0.3); respond to discovery (1.5). Review documents for production to Apollo and Creditors Committee (9.6); correspondence with C. Rincon regarding document review and production to Apollo and Creditors Committee
31250919	Dartez, Jackson	10/14/21	6.7	(0.9). Review documents for production to Apollo and Creditors Committee.
31486655	Graulich, Timothy	10/14/21	1.8	Review and revise responses to discovery requests.
31268817	Krishnan, Rahul	10/14/21	12.8	Correspondence with C. Rincon and J. McClammy regarding progress on discovery request responses (0.5); correspondence with C. Rincon regarding documents for review (0.7); review and revise responses to Apollo's interrogatories (0.8); correspondence with advisors regarding same (0.5); revise same (0.7); correspondence with J. McClammy regarding same (0.3); finalize responses to Apollo's interrogatories (1.5); correspondence with C. Rincon regarding document review (0.8); review documents for production to Apollo and Creditors Committee (7.0).
31243382	Lang, Cristina Lauren	10/14/21	10.7	Review documents for production to Apollo and Creditors Committee (9.8); call with Davis Polk Litigation team regarding discovery request response status (0.9).
31380788 31362485	Marienko, Anna McClammy, James I.	10/14/21 10/14/21	8.3 1.0	Draft requests for production. Call with advisors regarding JOLCO lease
31242763	Parrott, Andy T.	10/14/21	11.0	issues. Correspondence with C. Rincon regarding document review (0.5); review documents for production to Creditors Committee and Apollo (10.5).
31268339	Rincon, Cristina M.	10/14/21	11.8	Review and revise responses to Apollo discovery requests (1.0); correspondence with eDiscovery and Consilio regarding document review (1.5); correspondence with Davis Polk team regarding document review (1.0); review documents for production to Apollo and Creditors Committee (6.5); analyze discovery requests (1.8).
31260833	Dacher, Matt	10/15/21	0.5	Review documents for production to Apollo and Creditors Committee.
31250922	Dartez, Jackson	10/15/21	2.1	Review documents for production to Apollo and Creditors Committee.
31248800	Foley, Sean C.	10/15/21	2.2	Review documents for production to Apollo and Creditors Committee.
31260770	Krishnan, Rahul	10/15/21	5.1	Review documents for production to Apollo and Creditors Committee (3.5); correspondence with C. Rincon regarding same (0.1); review Board materials in response to same (1.3); correspondence with C. Rincon regarding same (0.2).

		Time Do	etail By Pro	ject
Time ID	Name	Date	Hours	Narrative
31247989	Lang, Cristina Lauren	10/15/21	3.2	Review documents for production to Apollo and Creditors Committee.
31310609	Marienko, Anna	10/15/21	6.7	Draft request for production to Apollo (5.9); correspondence with Davis Polk team regarding same (0.8).
31486117	McClammy, James I.	10/15/21	3.2	Analyze discovery issues.
31249123	Parrott, Andy T.	10/15/21	2.1	Review documents for production to Creditors Committee and Apollo.
31249104	Rincon, Cristina M.	10/15/21	9.7	Review documents for production to Apollo and Creditors Committee (7.2); meet with Davis Polk team regarding document review (1.0); review and analyze Creditors Committee's objection to Disclosure Statement (0.7); call with Rothschild and Morris Nichols regarding document production (0.8).
31310584	Marienko, Anna	10/16/21	5.2	Draft response to Creditors Committee request for production.
31422727	McClammy, James I.	10/16/21	2.1	Analyze discovery response issues.
31254889	Rincon, Cristina M.	10/16/21	0.5	Review and revise discovery offensive requests.
31270051	Bauer, Christopher William	10/18/21	0.5	Analyze document production issues.
31378796	Krishnan, Rahul	10/18/21	0.5	Call with Willkie Farr and others regarding discovery request.
31512783	McClammy, James I.	10/18/21	4.4	Call with Davis Polk Litigation team regarding discovery (0.8); review Delta proposal and documents (1.6); prepare for depositions (2.0).
31349168	Rincon, Cristina M.	10/18/21	0.9	Analyze incoming production issues (0.1); call with C. Gartman regarding discovery issues (0.2); correspondence with J. McClammy regarding same (0.3); call with Willkie Farr regarding scheduling depositions (0.2); produce documents for production (0.1).
31267805	Simmonds, Alexander W.	10/18/21	2.1	Correspondence with E. Jerrard regarding exit financing issues (0.2); correspondence with J. Donnelly regarding same (0.4); review and revise equity subscription agreement (1.3); correspondence with Akin Gump team regarding same (0.2).
31380476	Steinberg, Richard J.	10/18/21	1.1	Review and revise Deutsche Bank stipulation (0.9); correspondence with S. Piraino regarding same (0.2).
31275371	Bauer, Christopher William	10/19/21	8.0	Analyze document production issues.
31513533	Graulich, Timothy	10/19/21	2.8	Review discovery responses.
31512823	McClammy, James I.	10/19/21	5.3	Analyze discovery issues.
31271080	Rincon, Cristina M.	10/19/21	0.5	Correspondence with J. McClammy regarding discovery requests (0.2); email with H. Parkhill regarding deposition (0.1); correspondence with C. Bauer regarding document production (0.2).
31377358	Graulich, Timothy	10/20/21	4.3	Correspondence with J. McClammy regarding Rule 30(b)(6) issues (0.8); review discovery response (3.5).
31379257	Krishnan, Rahul	10/20/21	3.5	Correspondence with Davis Polk Litigation team regarding deposition notices (0.5); draft issues list related to same (1.5); correspondence with

Time Detail By Project					
Time ID	Name	Date	Hours	Narrative	
31310567	Marienko, Anna	10/20/21	5.4	C. Rincon regarding same (0.2); coordinate with document vendor regarding same (0.3); call with advisors regarding depositions (1.0). Draft responses and objections to Creditors Committee discovery request (2.7); draft responses and objections to Creditors	
31512887	McClammy, James I.	10/20/21	3.7	Committee deposition notice (2.7). Correspondence with Davis Polk Litigation team regarding discovery issues (1.3); prepare for	
31271672	Parrott, Andy T.	10/20/21	2.9	upcoming discovery (2.4). Review documents for production to Creditors Committee and Apollo (2.3); call with Davis Polk team, Sainz Abogados, and Rothschild regarding discovery (0.6).	
31387794	Piraino, Stephen D.	10/20/21	8.0	Call with Davis Polk team, Sainz Abogados, and Rothschild regarding discovery.	
31279322 31279450	Rincon, Cristina M. Rincon, Cristina M.	10/20/21 10/20/21	0.3 2.3	Produce documents to Milbank. Review revised draft of R&Os to discovery requests (0.4); call with J. Kane regarding discovery (0.3); call with C. Gartman regarding same (0.3); call with Rothschild, Sainz Abogados, and Davis Polk Restructuring team regarding discovery issues (0.8); review coding form for deposition preparation document review (0.1); review responses and objections to Creditors Committee notice (0.4).	
31377719 31379409	Graulich, Timothy Krishnan, Rahul	10/21/21 10/21/21	2.2 2.5	Review discovery requests. Call with advisors regarding depositions (0.5); call with Davis Polk Litigation team regarding document review (0.5); review deposition documents (1.5).	
31310548	Marienko, Anna	10/21/21	4.8	Draft responses and objections to Apollo's discovery request (3.2); draft requests for	
31363004	McClammy, James I.	10/21/21	5.0	production to Apollo (1.6). Prepare for deposition (3.6); correspondence with Davis Polk team regarding discovery issues	
31287373	Parrott, Andy T.	10/21/21	4.6	(1.4). Correspondence with C. Rincon regarding document review (0.3); correspondence with J. McClammy regarding same (0.2); review	
31290764	Rincon, Cristina M.	10/21/21	2.2	documents for deposition preparation (4.1). Review deposition notices (0.2); call with C. Gartman regarding discovery issues (0.1); email with Davis Polk Litigation team regarding same (0.1); correspondence with A. Parrot and R. Krishnan regarding document review and deposition preparation (0.4); call with Creditors Committee regarding depositions (0.3); review J. McClammy comments to discovery responses and objections (0.1); analyze document collection for supplemental production (0.5); call with Paul Weiss regarding Apollo's discovery requests (0.5).	
31513741 31300435	Graulich, Timothy Jerrard, Erik	10/22/21 10/22/21	0.6 0.9	Call with J. McClammy regarding depositions. Correspondence with T. Graulich regarding discovery and depositions (0.6); call with S.	

		Time De	etail By Pro	ject
Time ID	Name	Date	Hours	Narrative
31512490	Krishnan, Rahul	10/22/21	3.6	Piraino regarding same (0.3). Call with Davis Polk Litigation team regarding same (0.5); review discovery issues (0.9); draft summary of discovery for Davis Polk Litigation team (0.5); review documents in preparation for depositions (1.7).
31310557	Marienko, Anna	10/22/21	1.0	Draft request for production to the Creditors Committee (0.5); draft deposition notices to
31512936	McClammy, James I.	10/22/21	2.7	same (0.5). Correspondence with Davis Polk team regarding discovery (1.0); review documents regarding upcoming depositions (1.7).
31293680	Parrott, Andy T.	10/22/21	6.6	Correspondence with J. McClammy regarding deposition preparation (0.5); review documents for production to Creditors Committee and Apollo (6.1).
31401757	Piraino, Stephen D.	10/22/21	0.7	
31292408	Rincon, Cristina M. Krishnan, Rahul	10/22/21	2.4	Coordinate call with Morris Nichols and Rothschild regarding deposition notices (0.1); correspondence with Morris Nichols and Sainz Abogados regarding offensive discovery (0.1); call with Davis Polk restructuring team, Morris Nichols and Sainz Abogados regarding discovery (0.8); analyze discovery issues (1.0); call with Aeroméxico regarding same (0.7); revise responses and objections to Apollo and Creditors Committee discovery requests (0.3); call with J. Kane regarding discovery issues (0.2); coordinate meet and confer with Apollo and Creditors Committee regarding discovery issues (0.1). Draft discovery summary in preparation for meet
				and confer regarding same (1.0); correspondence with C. Rincon regarding same (0.3); call with Davis Polk Litigation team regarding discovery issues (0.4); attend meet and confer with Creditors Committee and Apollo (0.5); (partial attendance); correspondence with C. Rincon regarding same (0.2).
31310531	Marienko, Anna	10/23/21	4.5	Draft requests for production and deposition notice to Creditors Committee.
31357741	McClammy, James I.	10/23/21	4.3	Correspondence with Davis Polk Litigation team regarding discovery issues (0.8); review discovery responses and comment (1.2); review deposition preparation materials (2.3).
31299165	Parrott, Andy T.	10/23/21	5.9	Meet with Creditors Committee regarding discovery (0.7); review documents for deposition preparation (5.2).
31384846	Piraino, Stephen D.	10/23/21	0.7	Attend meet and confer with Creditors Committee and Apollo.
31298760	Rincon, Cristina M.	10/23/21	2.4	Committee and Apollo. Call with Akin Gump regarding discovery issues (0.1); review discovery request tracker (0.6); attend meet and confer with Creditors Committee and Apollo (0.7); revise offensive

	Time Detail By Project				
Time ID	Name	Date	Hours	Narrative	
31381028 31362782	Steinberg, Richard J. Krishnan, Rahul	10/23/21 10/24/21	0.3 6.0	discovery requests (0.7); analyze same (0.3). Email with C. Rincon regarding discovery. Review documents in preparation for depositions (4.3); correspondence with Davis Polk Litigation team regarding same (0.3); review case law regarding objections from other parties (1.2); correspondence with Davis Polk	
31300881	Lang, Cristina Lauren	10/24/21	3.1	Litigation team regarding same (0.2). Review documents for production to Apollo and	
31310521	Marienko, Anna	10/24/21	4.2	Creditors Committee. Draft requests for production and deposition notice to Creditors Committee.	
31357752	McClammy, James I.	10/24/21	3.7	Correspondence with Davis Polk Litigation team regarding discovery issues (0.4); prepare for upcoming depositions (3.3).	
31299940 31384862	Parrott, Andy T. Piraino, Stephen D.	10/24/21 10/24/21	4.6 0.4	Review documents for deposition preparation. Call with Davis Polk and Morris Nichols teams regarding discovery.	
31300250	Rincon, Cristina M.	10/24/21	1.7	Email with AlixPartners regarding Rule 30(b)(6) deposition (0.1); review documents for production (0.7); call with L. Donahue regarding deposition preparation (0.9).	
31324276	Dacher, Matt	10/25/21	7.3	Review documents for production to Apollo and Creditors Committee.	
31303836	Foley, Sean C.	10/25/21	4.6	Review documents for production to Apollo and Creditors Committee.	
31378254	Graulich, Timothy	10/25/21	4.6	Review discovery response (2.8); call with A. Conesa regarding discovery issues (1.3); call with D. Abbott regarding discovery (0.5).	
31374913	Krishnan, Rahul	10/25/21	6.8	Review documents to prepare for deposition (5.9); correspondence with Davis Polk Litigation team regarding same (0.1); call with same to prepare for deposition (0.4); correspondence with same regarding case law regarding objections (0.4).	
31306624	Lang, Cristina Lauren	10/25/21	0.3	Review documents for production to Apollo and Creditors Committee.	
31310389	Marienko, Anna	10/25/21	8.7	Draft responses and objections to Apollo's discovery request (2.9); draft responses and objections to Apollo's deposition notice (2.9); draft response and objections to Creditors Committee deposition notice (2.9).	
31358908	McClammy, James I.	10/25/21	4.9	Correspondence with Davis Polk Litigation team regarding discovery issues (0.8); call with same regarding same (0.5); prepare for upcoming depositions (3.6).	
31304329	Parrott, Andy T.	10/25/21	10.8	Review documents for production to Apollo and Creditors Committee (1.4); review documents for deposition preparation (5.5); draft outline for deposition preparation (3.9).	
31323922	Piraino, Stephen D.	10/25/21	0.6	Call with Davis Polk, Morris Nichols, and Sainz Abogados teams regarding litigation issues.	
31304486	Rincon, Cristina M.	10/25/21	4.4	Call with Davis Polk Restructuring team, Morris Nichols, and Sainz Abogados regarding depositions (0.6); review document review status (0.2); correspondence with Davis Polk	

	Time Detail By Project				
Time ID	Name	Date	Hours	Narrative	
				Litigation team regarding discovery issues (0.5); finalize responses and objections to discovery requests (0.7); call with Hughes Hubbard regarding discovery issues (0.9); draft summary of same (0.2); review documents for deposition preparation (0.8); correspondence with A. Parrot regarding deposition preparation (0.2); correspondence with R. Krishnan regarding same (0.1); serve responses and objections on Apollo and Creditors Committee (0.1); analyze production from Akin Gump (0.1).	
31315390	Jegarl, Christine	10/26/21	0.5	Prepare deposition materials.	
31375420	Krishnan, Rahul	10/26/21	3.0	Draft deposition preparation materials (2.7); correspondence with Davis Polk Litigation team regarding same (0.3).	
31358775	McClammy, James I.	10/26/21	5.6	Prepare regarding upcoming depositions (4.0); correspondence with Davis Polk Litigation team regarding discovery issues (0.6); review discovery responses (1.0).	
31384737	Piraino, Stephen D.	10/26/21	0.6	Correspondence with C. Rincon regarding discovery.	
31313476	Rincon, Cristina M.	10/26/21	3.7	Call with Willkie Farr regarding depositions (0.2); correspondence with S. Piraino regarding Delta term sheet and offensive discovery (0.4); review outline of deposition preparation materials (0.3); email with Milbank regarding deposition scheduling (0.1); call with Morris Nichols regarding discovery issues (0.4); email with A. Schwartz regarding deposition scheduling (0.1); correspondence with S. Piraino regarding same (0.2); analyze confidentiality designation issues (0.4); quality control review documents for production (1.6).	
31378516	Graulich, Timothy	10/27/21	3.6	Prepare for deposition.	
31335914	Healy, Laura	10/27/21	1.9	Correspondence with C. Rincon, A. Parrott, and Consilio regarding productions.	
31334884	Huebner, Marshall S.	10/27/21	0.2	discovery issues.	
31376933	Krishnan, Rahul	10/27/21	3.0	Review documents for deposition preparation (2.8); correspondence with A. Parrott regarding same (0.2).	
31333508	Marienko, Anna	10/27/21	3.4	Draft discovery requests to Creditors Committee.	
31357688	McClammy, James I.	10/27/21	6.5	Prepare for depositions (3.7); review discovery responses (1.2); review and comment on default notice response (0.6); call with advisors regarding same (0.4); correspondence with Davis Polk Litigation team regarding discover issues (0.6).	
31324564	Parrott, Andy T.	10/27/21	6.5	Review documents for deposition preparation (4.5); draft witness preparation outline (2.0).	
31384780	Piraino, Stephen D.	10/27/21	0.3	Correspondence with Davis Polk team regarding discovery issues.	
31328838	Rincon, Cristina M.	10/27/21	6.6	Review documents for production (0.4); review documents for production (1.0); correspondence with J. McClammy and J. Barsalona regarding	

		Time Det	tail By Proj	iect
Time ID	Name	Date	Hours	Narrative
				document confidentiality issue (0.3); call with Hughes Hubbard regarding same (0.4); prepare for H. Parkhill deposition (1.0); review emails regarding meet and confer with Apollo and Creditors Committee (0.1); call with Javier and R. Sanchez Baker regarding discovery disputes (1.0); prepare H. Parkhill for deposition (2.0); correspondence with J. McClammy regarding discovery issues (0.2); email with Morris Nichols regarding deposition logistics (0.1); email with E. Castellanos regarding same (0.1).
31380600	Marienko, Anna	10/28/21	3.0	Draft discovery requests to Apollo and Creditors Committee (2.5); correspondence with Davis Polk Litigation team regarding same (0.5).
31357598	McClammy, James I.	10/28/21	4.3	Prepare for upcoming deposition.
31331198	Parrott, Andy T.	10/28/21	4.9	Correspondence with C. Rincon regarding Apollo proposal (0.3); review documents for deposition preparation (4.6).
31332334	Rincon, Cristina M.	10/28/21	5.4	Call with C. Gartman regarding litigation issues (0.2); email with Davis Polk team regarding same (0.2); review materials to prepare for L. Donahue deposition (2.0); prepare H. Parkhill for deposition (2.0); review H. Parkhill deposition preparation materials (0.4); correspondence with Davis Polk Litigation team regarding matter
31361110	Troconis, Adela	10/28/21	0.6	status (0.6). Review response to Apollo's communication regarding alleged default under DIP Credit Agreement.
31378873	Graulich, Timothy	10/29/21	4.7	Review discovery responses (2.3); prepare for deposition (2.4).
31513164	McClammy, James I.	10/29/21	4.2	Prepare for depositions (3.4); email with Davis Polk Litigation team regarding discovery issues (0.5); call with Paul Weiss regarding same (0.3).
31513130	Rincon, Cristina M.	10/29/21	0.5	Review emails regarding proposal negotiations (0.2); call with J. Eisen regarding objection deadline (0.1); email with Creditors Committee and A. Schwartz regarding same and deposition schedule (0.1); email with Apollo regarding deposition scheduling (0.1).
31340844	Rincon, Cristina M.	10/29/21	0.6	Correspondence with J. McClammy regarding matter status.
31357494	McClammy, James I.	10/30/21	2.4	Prepare for depositions.
31514743	Graulich, Timothy	10/31/21	1.3	Call with R. Cooper regarding litigation schedule.
31513197	McClammy, James I.	10/31/21	0.3	Email with Davis Polk Litigation team regarding discovery issues.
31351041	Rincon, Cristina M.	10/31/21	0.2	Email with Consilio regarding production of Board minutes.
Total AM110	Automatic Stay/Litigation	on	506.9	
	Date/Estimation/Claims A			
31180014 31180412	Melcer, Moshe Melcer, Moshe	10/02/21 10/03/21	0.1 4.5	Review schedule for omnibus claims objections. Compile omnibus claims objections (2.8);

	Time Detail By Project				
Time ID	Name	Date	Hours	Narrative	
31189077 31183210	Steinberg, Richard J. Melcer, Moshe	10/03/21 10/04/21	5.2 4.7	Review and revise omnibus claims objections	
31372736	Steinberg, Richard J.	10/04/21	4.7	(2.9); review and finalize related schedules (1.5); correspondence with R. Steinberg regarding same (0.3). Review and revise omnibus claims objections (3.3); correspondence with AlixPartners and M. Melcer regarding same (1.0); correspondence with Boeing counsel regarding claims objections	
31189788	Melcer, Moshe	10/05/21	0.8	(0.2); email with Aeroméxico regarding same (0.2) Email with Chambers regarding omnibus claims objections (0.6); correspondence with claimant regarding omnibus claim objection (0.2).	
31477164 31373275	Rincon, Cristina M. Steinberg, Richard J.	10/05/21 10/05/21	1.6 1.5	Analyze JOLCO claims. Call with Milbank regarding claims (0.4); respond to inbounds received in connections with claims (1.1).	
31204608	Hanson, Cole	10/06/21	0.4	Call with M. Melcer regarding claims workstream.	
31199675	Masaro, Matthew Bruno	10/06/21	0.3	Review proofs of claim (0.2); correspondence with S. Piraino and M. Melcer regarding same (0.1).	
31196953	Melcer, Moshe	10/06/21	1.2	Call with C. Hanson regarding claims workstreams (0.4); review correspondence from claimants regarding omnibus claim objections (0.3); call with R. Steinberg regarding same (0.2); review transferred claims (0.3).	
31387114	Piraino, Stephen D.	10/06/21	0.2		
31240724	Steinberg, Richard J.	10/06/21	2.9	Call with M. Melcer regarding omnibus claim objections (0.2); call with S. Piraino regarding claims workstreams (0.2); review claims register regarding transfer agreements (1.0); correspondence with Aeroméxico regarding customer claims (0.6); correspondence with AlixPartners regarding claims workstreams (0.9).	
31204610	Hanson, Cole	10/07/21	3.4	Review and update claimant inbound tracker (1.9); call with Davis Polk Claims team regarding claims and vouchers (0.5); call with Davis Polk Claims team and Aeroméxico regarding same (0.5); call with Davis Polk Claims team and AlixPartners regarding same (0.3); correspondence with M. Melcer and R. Steinberg regarding claimant objections next	
31204481	Melcer, Moshe	10/07/21	2.4	steps (0.2). Call with Davis Polk Claims team and Aeroméxico regarding claims and vouchers (0.5); call with Davis Polk Claims team and AlixPartners regarding same (0.3); correspondence with C. Hanson regarding claimant correspondence tracker (0.2); call with	

	Time Detail By Project						
Time ID	Name	Date	Hours	Narrative			
				Davis Polk Claims team regarding claims and vouchers (0.5); correspondence with R. Steinberg regarding same (0.2); correspondence with claimants regarding			
31372624	Piraino, Stephen D.	10/07/21	0.2	omnibus claim objections (0.7). Email with T. Graulich and R. Steinberg regarding claims issue.			
31240692	Steinberg, Richard J.	10/07/21	4.8	Call with Davis Polk Claims team regarding claims and vouchers (0.5); call with same and Aeroméxico regarding same (0.5); call with Davis Polk Claims team and AlixPartners regarding same (0.3); call with same regarding airline claim (0.2); call with Alliance Ground counsel and Cargo Security regarding claims settlement (0.2); revise customer voucher notices (1.1); correspondence with claimants regarding claims objections (0.7); respond to informal emails received in connection with			
31211994	Hanson, Cole	10/08/21	4.1	claims objections (1.3). Review claimant inbound tracker (1.0); correspondence with claimants regarding			
31209272	Melcer, Moshe	10/08/21	1.9	omnibus claim objections (3.1). Correspondence with R. Steinberg regarding claims workstreams (0.2); correspondence with C. Hanson regarding same (0.3); correspondence with claimants regarding			
31240677	Steinberg, Richard J.	10/08/21	1.8	omnibus claim objections (1.4). Respond to informal emails received in connection with claims objections (0.5); correspondence with Davis Polk Claims team and AlixPartners regarding claims issues (0.9); call with Holland & Knight regarding fleet claims			
31247081	Sturm, Josh	10/09/21	0.3	(0.3); email with Skyworks regarding same (0.1). Review correspondence with M. Landess regarding discussions with FTI over aircraft			
31220423	Hanson, Cole	10/11/21	3.7	lease claims. Review and revise claimant inbound tracker (0.7); correspondence with claimants regarding omnibus claims objection responses (3.0).			
31257015	Jerrard, Erik	10/11/21	0.9	Correspondence with T. Thoroddsen and R. Steinberg regarding claims analysis (0.4);			
31223223	Melcer, Moshe	10/11/21	1.5	review related claims materials (0.5). Call with Aeritas counsel and R. Steinberg regarding proofs of claim (0.4); correspondence with C. Hanson regarding outstanding claims workstreams (0.2); correspondence with R. Steinberg regarding fleet claims (0.3); correspondence with same regarding JOLCO claims (0.1); correspondence with claimants regarding omnibus claim objections (0.3); call with Skyworks and others regarding Aircastle claims settlement (0.2).			
31372953	Piraino, Stephen D.	10/11/21	0.4	Call with AlixPartners regarding claims (0.2); email with J. Wallden regarding same (0.2).			
31473661	Steinberg, Richard J.	10/11/21	2.6	Correspondence with M. Melcer regarding fleet claims (0.3); call with Skyworks regarding same			

		Time De	etail By Pro	ject
Time ID	Name	Date	Hours	Narrative
				(0.3); call with Aeritas counsel and R. Steinberg regarding proof of claim (0.4); correspondence with M. Melcer regarding same (0.2); correspondence with Aeroméxico, Epiq and AlixPartners regarding voucher process (0.3); respond to informal correspondences received in response to claims objections (1.1).
31473666	Sturm, Josh	10/11/21	0.6	Correspondence with M. Landess and Davis Polk team regarding fleet claims.
31227819	Hanson, Cole	10/12/21	3.1	Review outstanding claimant objection responses.
31230099	Melcer, Moshe	10/12/21	1.8	Review and revise draft customer voucher emails (0.4); call with Epiq regarding same (0.1); review correspondence with claimants regarding omnibus claim objections (0.5); call with advisors regarding aircraft claims (0.8).
31228692	Steinberg, Richard J.	10/12/21	2.2	Call with AlixPartners regarding claims and voting (0.6); correspondence with S. Piraino and M. Melcer regarding same (0.2); correspondence with Epiq and AlixPartners regarding voucher notices (0.4); correspondence with AlixPartners regarding claims issues (1.0).
31239210	Hanson, Cole	10/13/21	2.1	Review claimant objection responses (1.5); update claimant inbound tracker (0.6).
31239214	Melcer, Moshe	10/13/21	0.1	Email with C. Hanson regarding claimant correspondence.
31240670	Steinberg, Richard J.	10/13/21	1.0	Respond to informal correspondences received in response to claims objections (0.5); respond to informal correspondence regarding vouchers (0.5).
31249733	Sturm, Josh	10/13/21	0.3	Review notice of claims transfer (0.1); correspondence with Davis Polk team regarding same (0.2).
31260676	Dekhtyar, Mariya	10/14/21	0.6	Research claims information for claimant inbound tracker (0.2); email with M. Melcer regarding claimant inbound tracker (0.1); email with same regarding omnibus claims objections (0.1); email with C. Hansen regarding claims issue (0.1); review email from Davis Polk Claims team regarding voucher issue (0.1).
31249989	Hanson, Cole	10/14/21	3.5	Respond to claimants regarding omnibus claims objections (2.8); update claimant inbound tracker (0.7).
31240600	Melcer, Moshe	10/14/21	1.7	Correspondence with claimant regarding claim objection (0.1); correspondence with R. Steinberg regarding fleet claims (0.6); correspondence with J. Sturm regarding same (0.2); call with Skyworks regarding same (0.3); draft email update regarding same (0.5).
31243684	Steinberg, Richard J.	10/14/21	4.0	Respond to informal inbounds received in response to claims objections (1.5); respond to informal inbounds regarding vouchers (0.5); correspondence with WCAA counsel regarding claims issues (0.5); correspondence with M. Melcer regarding claims (0.8); correspondence

		Time De	etail By Pro	ject
Time ID	Name	Date	Hours	Narrative
31249775	Sturm, Josh	10/14/21	0.8	with O'Melveny & Myers regarding claims settlement (0.5); email with AlixPartners regarding same (0.2). Correspondence with M. Melcer regarding claim objection process (0.3); review correspondence
31473739	Szanzer, Steven Z.	10/14/21	0.1	regarding claims register of aircraft claims (0.5). Review emails regarding Ex-Im claim withdrawal.
31260888	Dekhtyar, Mariya	10/15/21	0.6	Call with C. Hansen regarding customer voucher process (0.4); review claimant inbound tracker and related correspondence (0.1); email with M. Melcer regarding customer response (0.1).
31250150	Hanson, Cole	10/15/21	1.9	Call with M. Dekhtyar regarding customer voucher process (0.4); review claimant objection responses and update tracker (1.5).
31250597	Melcer, Moshe	10/15/21	0.4	Review email from claimant regarding vouchers (0.1); call with Holland & Knight regarding Avolon claims (0.1); call with Skyworks regarding same (0.1); correspondence with O. Altman regarding same (0.1).
31379969	Steinberg, Richard J.	10/15/21	1.5	Respond to claims inbounds (1.1); draft voucher notices (0.2); email with Epiq regarding same (0.2).
31513302 31273470	Graulich, Timothy Dekhtyar, Mariya	10/16/21 10/18/21	1.8 1.3	Review claims analysis. Email with C. Hanson regarding claims issue (0.1); review emails with Davis Polk Claims team regarding claims issue (0.1); draft email to customer regarding voucher (0.5); email with C. Hanson regarding email to Epiq regarding same (0.1); review and revise voucher redemption form (0.1); email with C. Hanson regarding voucher issues (0.2); email with Epiq regarding
31262281	Hanson, Cole	10/18/21	4.0	customer vouchers (0.2). Update claims objection tracker and customer
31262594	Melcer, Moshe	10/18/21	1.7	responses. Call with AlixPartners regarding claims (0.9) (partial attendance); call with R. Steinberg and C. Hanson regarding Plan support (0.4); review emails from claimants regarding claim objections (0.4).
31380364	Steinberg, Richard J.	10/18/21	6.3	Call with AlixPartners regarding debt claims (1.2); review debt claims analysis (1.1); correspondence to claimants holding unresolved debt claims (0.6); call with M. Melcer and C. Hanson regarding Plan support (0.4); respond to outstanding claims objection issues list (1.7); respond to claims and voucher questions received from Epiq (0.9); email with Skyworks regarding rejection damages claims (0.2); email with S. Piraino regarding claims related to derivatives and swap agreements (0.2).
31277083	Dekhtyar, Mariya	10/19/21	1.4	

		Time De	tail By Pro	ject
Time ID	Name	Date	Hours	Narrative
31268759	Hanson, Cole	10/19/21	1.5	withdrawal (0.1); email with claimant regarding objection (0.1); email with R. Steinberg regarding voucher inquiry (0.1); email with customer regarding ticket issues (0.1). Revise claims objection tracker (0.8); draft
31380569	Steinberg, Richard J.	10/19/21	4.5	customer responses (0.7). Call with Epiq regarding claims and voucher questions (0.3); correspondence to Aeroméxico regarding voucher issues (0.5); respond to claims correspondence (0.6); call with AlixPartners regarding customer claims (0.6); review materials in connection with claims settlements (0.5); draft claims settlement
31313554	Dekhtyar, Mariya	10/20/21	1.1	with R. Steinberg regarding same (0.2); call with R. Steinberg regarding claims settlement stipulations (0.2); call with Davis Polk Claims team and AlixPartners regarding customer claims (0.4) (partial attendance); call with Davis Polk Claims team regarding upcoming
31280536	Hanson, Cole	10/20/21	1.8	objections (0.2). Draft correspondence for customer claims objection responses (1.1); call with Davis Polk Claims team and AlixPartners regarding
31512253	Jerrard, Erik	10/20/21	0.4	customer claims (0.7). Correspondence with R. Steinberg regarding
31509952	Melcer, Moshe	10/20/21	1.8	supplemental customer programs motion. Correspondence with S. Szanzer regarding claims settlement motion (0.2); revise same (0.3); correspondence with R. Steinberg regarding outstanding claims workstreams (0.4); call with Davis Polk Claims team and AlixPartners regarding customer claims (0.7); call with Davis Polk Claims team regarding upcoming objections (0.2).
31387800 31380677	Piraino, Stephen D. Steinberg, Richard J.	10/20/21 10/20/21	0.6 2.7	Call with AlixPartners regarding claims. Call with M. Dekhtyar regarding claims settlement stipulations (0.2); correspondence with E. Jerrard regarding customer claims (0.7); call with Davis Polk Claims team and AlixPartners regarding customer claims (0.7); prepare for same (0.1); call with Davis Polk Claims team regarding upcoming objections (0.2); correspondence with same regarding same (0.4); respond to correspondence received from Epiq regarding customer claimants (0.4).
31320434	Dekhtyar, Mariya	10/21/21	3.8	Email with R. Steinberg regarding supplemental customer programs motion (0.6); research patent claim issues (0.6); review and revise supplemental customer program motion (1.3); correspondence with R. Steinberg regarding same and other claims issues (0.4); review and revise declaration for supplemental customer programs motion (0.7); review and comment on

	Time Detail By Project					
Time ID	Name	Date	Hours	Narrative		
31285638	Hanson, Cole	10/21/21	4.3	customer claims procedures (0.1); email with R. Steinberg regarding same (0.1). Review and audit all customer claims objection		
31380805	Steinberg, Richard J.	10/21/21	8.2	responses (4.0); correspondence with R. Steinberg regarding customer claims (0.3). Draft supplemental customer programs motion		
				(4.0); draft customer claims procedures (1.8); correspondence with E. Jerrard regarding same (0.6); call with AlixPartners regarding claims estimates (0.9); email with same and Rothschild regarding same (0.4); draft analysis of same for Akin Gump (0.5).		
31320559	Dekhtyar, Mariya	10/22/21	0.7	Review supplemental customer programs motion (0.3); email with R. Steinberg regarding same (0.3); correspondence with same regarding same (0.1).		
31293102	Hanson, Cole	10/22/21	3.3	Review claims objection responses and revise tracker (2.9); call with M. Melcer regarding outstanding customer claims issues (0.4).		
31291951	Melcer, Moshe	10/22/21	2.0	Call with C. Hanson regarding outstanding claims workstreams (0.4); correspondence with claimants regarding claim objections (0.3); review supplemental customer programs motion (1.0); call with R. Steinberg regarding foregoing (0.3).		
31510002	Melcer, Moshe	10/22/21	1.4	Correspondence with R. Steinberg regarding fleet claims (0.1); draft motion to approve claims settlement (1.3).		
31380936	Steinberg, Richard J.	10/22/21	2.8	Review and revise supplemental customer programs motion (2.6); email with E. Jerrard regarding same (0.2).		
31299143	Hanson, Cole	10/23/21	2.8	Call with Davis Polk Restructuring team regarding non-customer claims issues (0.4); prepare for same (0.1); review draft of supplemental customer program motion and draft issue list regarding same (1.4); call with AlixPartners team regarding unresolved customer claims (0.7); correspondence with R. Steinberg regarding unresolved claims (0.2).		
31300408	Jerrard, Erik	10/23/21	3.7	Review and revise supplemental customer programs motion (3.0); discuss same with R. Steinberg (0.3); call with Davis Polk Restructuring team regarding non-customer claims issues (0.4).		
31384852	Piraino, Stephen D.	10/23/21	0.4	,		
31381007	Steinberg, Richard J.	10/23/21	6.4	-		
31313647	Dekhtyar, Mariya	10/24/21	1.3	Research patent claims issue (0.6); email with R. Steinberg regarding same (0.7).		
31378089	Graulich, Timothy	10/24/21	2.2	Review and comment on supplemental customer programs motion.		
31298893	Hanson, Cole	10/24/21	1.5	Review and respond to outstanding customer		

		Time De	etail By Pro	ject
Time ID	Name	Date	Hours	Narrative
31301273	Melcer, Moshe	10/24/21	2.2	claims emails (1.3); call with M. Melcer regarding claims correspondence (0.2). Correspondence with R. Steinberg regarding outstanding claims workstreams (0.3); review correspondence with claimants relating to claims, objections, and vouchers, and respond to same (1.7); call with C. Hanson regarding
31381041	Steinberg, Richard J.	10/24/21	4.5	claims correspondence (0.2). Respond to claims correspondence (1.5); review unresolved claims (3.0).
31331035	Dekhtyar, Mariya	10/25/21	0.5	Correspondence with M. Moshe regarding claims call (0.1); call with Davis Polk Claims team and AlixPartners regarding claims issues (0.4).
31304292 31305299	Hanson, Cole Melcer, Moshe	10/25/21 10/25/21	3.0 2.3	Revise claimant objection response tracker. Call with Davis Polk Claims team and AlixPartners regarding claims issues (0.8); review claims summary (1.3); review correspondence with claimants regarding vouchers (0.2);
31510144	Melcer, Moshe	10/25/21	4.7	call with Skyworks regarding fleet claims (0.2); call with same and Avolon regarding Avolon claims (0.2); correspondence with S. Szanzer regarding letters of credit claims (0.1); review and revise fleet claim summary (1.7); analyze claims related to same (1.7); correspondence with T. Green regarding claims settlement
31379263	Steinberg, Richard J.	10/25/21	8.3	motion (0.1); review and revise same (0.7). Respond to claims correspondence (2.4); call with Epiq regarding same (0.3); correspondence with M. Melcer regarding voting analysis by class and outstanding claims analysis (1.0); review and revise same (0.7); revise supplemental customer programs motion (2.5); draft customized cover notice to accompany same (0.8); correspondence with E. Jerrard
31332497	Dekhtyar, Mariya	10/26/21	2.4	regarding same (0.6). Email with R. Steinberg regarding supplemental customers program motion (0.5); correspondence with same and M. Melcer regarding same (0.1); correspondence with R. Steinberg regarding same (0.2); email with Akin Gump, Willkie Farr, Gibson Dunn, and Milbank Tweed regarding same (0.2); review and revise supplemental customer programs motion (0.6); email with Epiq regarding notice for same (0.3); call with Aeroméxico and AlixPartners regarding supplemental customer programs motion (0.5).
31313544	Hanson, Cole	10/26/21	1.3	
31327702	Jerrard, Erik	10/26/21	3.3	Call with Davis Polk Claims team, T. Thoroddsen, and Aeroméxico regarding supplemental customer programs motion (0.8);

		Time Det	ail By Proj	ject
Time ID	Name	Date	Hours	Narrative
04540000	Malaca Marka	40/00/04	0.0	review and revise customer programs motions (2.5).
31510222	Melcer, Moshe	10/26/21	2.6	Correspondence with T. Green regarding claims settlement motion (0.1); review and revise supplemental customer programs motion (0.9); draft declaration in support of same (0.4); call with Davis Polk Claims team, T. Thoroddsen, and Aeroméxico regarding supplemental customer programs motion (0.7); call with Epiq, AlixPartners, and Davis Polk team regarding same (0.5).
31384758	Piraino, Stephen D.	10/26/21	0.5	Call with Davis Polk Claims team, T. Thoroddsen, and Aeroméxico regarding supplemental customer programs motion (partial attendance).
31378347	Steinberg, Richard J.	10/26/21	9.0	Call with Epiq regarding voucher redemption program (0.4); call with Davis Polk Claims team, T. Thoroddsen, and Aeroméxico regarding supplemental customer programs motion (0.8); prepare for same (0.7); correspondence with E. Jerrard regarding same (0.8); prepare notice for same (1.2); review and revise same (1.1); respond to claims correspondence (0.8); prepare outstanding claims analysis (1.1); email with AlixPartners regarding same (0.2); draft declaration in support of supplemental customer programs motion (1.9).
31510267	Szanzer, Steven Z.	10/26/21	0.4	
31349913	Dekhtyar, Mariya	10/27/21	2.4	Call with Davis Polk Claims team regarding claims workstreams (0.9); call with M. Melcer regarding claims issues (0.1); prepare for call regarding claims issue with R. Steinberg and others (0.1); call with claimant counsel and R. Steinberg regarding proofs of claim and settlement (0.1); update claimant tracker (0.2); review and revise supplemental customer programs motion (0.1); email with T. Graulich regarding same (0.2); draft email to claimant counsel regarding omnibus claims objection (0.2); email with R. Steinberg regarding claims issues (0.1); correspondence with same regarding same (0.1); correspondence with Davis Polk team regarding supplemental customer claims motion (0.1); email with R. Steinberg regarding email to claimant counsel regarding claim settlement (0.1); email with claimant counsel regarding settlement (0.1).
31325551	Hanson, Cole	10/27/21	2.7	Call with Davis Polk Claims team regarding claims workstreams (0.9); update claimant inbound tracker (1.6); call with M. Melcer regarding claims workstream (0.2).
31348648	Jerrard, Erik	10/27/21	1.7	Review and comment on supplemental customer programs motion (1.3); correspondence with R. Steinberg regarding

	Time Detail By Project					
Time ID	Name	Date	Hours	Narrative		
31510314	Melcer, Moshe	10/27/21	3.4	same (0.4). Email with White & Case regarding Boeing claims (0.3); call with Davis Polk Claims team regarding claims workstreams (0.9); call with M. Dekhtyar regarding claims issues (0.1); call with C. Hanson regarding claims workstreams (0.2); analyze and revise Plan support tracker (1.6); correspondence with R. Steinberg regarding		
31428424	Steinberg, Richard J.	10/27/21	8.8	same (0.3). Attend weekly workstreams call with Davis Polk Claims team (1.0); respond to informal correspondence received in response to claim objections (1.1); call with claimant counsel regarding claims issue (0.5); email with the Aeroméxico regarding supplemental customer program motion (0.2); review and revise supplemental customer programs motion (1.2); email with Epiq regarding same (0.2); correspondence with Chambers regarding same (0.1); correspondence with Epiq regarding voucher programs (0.2); correspondence with O'Melveny & Myers regarding Wells Fargo claims (0.5); correspondence with S. Szanzer regarding same (0.2); review and revise claims analysis (1.9); correspondence with M. Melcer regarding same (0.4); email with Rothschild regarding fleet claims (0.2); prepare claims workstreams summary and timeline (1.1)		
31510348	Szanzer, Steven Z.	10/27/21	0.2	Correspondence with White & Case and		
31336890 31330824	Hanson, Cole Melcer, Moshe	10/28/21 10/28/21	0.6 2.0	Skyworks regarding SMBC claims. Update claimant inbound tracker. Call with R. Steinberg and AlixPartners regarding claims analysis (0.8); correspondence with R. Steinberg and Skyworks regarding fleet claims (0.3); analyze issues regarding same (0.8); review correspondence from claimant regarding objection (0.1).		
31376550	Steinberg, Richard J.	10/28/21	1.2	Call with M. Melcer and AlixPartners regarding claims analysis (0.8); correspondence with AlixPartners regarding Banco Santander claims (0.4).		
31340989	Sturm, Josh	10/28/21	0.8	Correspondence with Davis Polk team and White & Case and Skyworks regarding lessor claim amounts.		
31349990	Dekhtyar, Mariya	10/29/21	1.8	Review claims settlement procedures (0.1); draft emails to customers regarding vouchers (0.3); email with C. Hanson regarding same (0.1); review correspondences with AlixPartners and claimants regarding voucher issues (0.4); correspondence with C. Hanson regarding same (0.2); email with AlixPartners regarding same (0.1); email with R. Steinberg regarding settlement issues (0.1); email with Epiq regarding vouchers (0.2); draft email to Dentons regarding claim (0.2); correspondence with Davis Polk Claims team and others regarding		

Time ID 31347534 31345093 31510739	Name Hanson, Cole Melcer, Moshe Steinberg, Richard J.	Date 10/29/21 10/29/21	2.5 0.8	Claims issues (0.1). Draft responses to outstanding claimant objections.
31345093	Melcer, Moshe			Draft responses to outstanding claimant objections.
31345093	Melcer, Moshe			objections.
		10/29/21	0.8	
		10/20/21	0.0	Email with AlixPartners regarding upcoming
31510739	Steinhera Richard I			objections (0.1); call with Skyworks regarding claims settlement (0.2); correspondence with F Steinberg regarding same (0.3); email with Skyworks regarding same (0.2).
	Stemberg, Nichard J.	10/29/21	4.5	Correspondence with M. Masaro regarding Honeywell claims (0.2); correspondence with Dentons regarding settlement of claim (0.3); review and respond to informal and formal correspondence received in connection with claims objections (2.3); email with Davis Polk Claims team and AlixPartners regarding claims objections (0.6); correspondence with Davis Polk Claims team and others regarding claims issues (0.7); correspondence with Allen Overy regarding Banco Santander claims (0.4).
31349009	Melcer, Moshe	10/30/21	1.7	Draft response to claimant regarding response to claim objection (0.2); draft omnibus claims objection (1.5).
Total AM130	Bar Date/Estimation/Cla	aims	238.2	, (-1)
AM140 Corpo 31370588 31217443	orate Governance, Boar Piraino, Stephen D. Rincon, Cristina M.	d Matters and 0 10/01/21 10/10/21	Communica 0.4 0.7	tions Revise relevant event regarding Plan filing. Review Board presentation on Apollo discover request.
31477729	Graulich, Timothy	10/11/21	0.4	Call with P. Carter regarding Board issues
31257010	Jerrard, Erik	10/11/21	0.4	Attend update call with Aeroméxico
01201010	oonara, zm	10, 11, 21	0.0	management and co-advisors.
31269010	Blanco, Maurice	10/12/21	0.2	Email with Davis Polk team regarding listing.
31486624	Graulich, Timothy	10/13/21	2.6	Review and revise Board materials.
31370231	Piraino, Stephen D.	10/13/21	0.5	Correspondence with E. Jerrard regarding Board materials.
31375877	Graulich, Timothy	10/14/21	3.4	Attend Board meeting (0.9); prepare for same (2.5).
31257335	Jerrard, Erik	10/14/21	2.2	Draft Board materials (1.3); attend Board meeting (0.9).
31370079	Piraino, Stephen D.	10/14/21	1.9	Review and revise Board materials (1.0); atter Board meeting (0.9).
31267391	Graulich, Timothy	10/18/21	2.3	Prepare for Board meeting.
31512167	Hwang, Eric	10/18/21	3.8	Prepare Board presentation on exit financing (3.7); correspondence with E. Jerrard regardin same (0.1).
31387462	Piraino, Stephen D.	10/18/21	0.7	Review and revise Board materials.
31319075	Jerrard, Erik	10/19/21	3.2	Attend Board meeting (1.8); prepare and revie materials for same (1.4).
31387467	Piraino, Stephen D.	10/19/21	3.4	Review and revise Board materials (1.4); atter Board meeting (1.8); correspondence with A. Sainz regarding governance issues (0.2).
31513682	Piraino, Stephen D.	10/22/21	0.5	Call with Quinn Emmanuel regarding corporate governance.
31317242	Huebner, Marshall S.	10/25/21	0.7	Review Board presentation (0.4);

	Time Detail By Project					
Time ID	Name	Date	Hours	Narrative		
	Jerrard, Erik Piraino, Stephen D. O Corporate Governance, I O Communications	10/29/21 10/29/21 Board	1.1 1.0 29.8	correspondence with Davis Polk team regarding same (0.3). Attend Restructuring Committee meeting. Attend Restructuring Committee meeting.		
AM1E0 Cros	liter/IJCC/AHC leaves					
31350672	litor/UCC/AHC Issues Graulich, Timothy	10/03/21	1.3	Call with B. Miller and T. Goren regarding meeting with Creditors Committee (0.7); call with H. Parkhill regarding presentation to the Creditors Committee (0.6).		
31180497	Jerrard, Erik	10/03/21	3.0	Call with Aeroméxico and co-advisors regarding Creditors Committee presentation (0.6); review Creditors Committee presentation (1.2); call with Creditors Committee advisors and co-advisors		
31187040	Piraino, Stephen D.	10/03/21	1.8	regarding same (1.2). Call with Creditors Committee professionals regarding creditor issues (1.2); call with Aeroméxico and co-advisors regarding Creditors		
31486166	Graulich, Timothy	10/04/21	5.7	Committee presentation (0.6). Attend Creditors Committee presentation with advisors and principals (1.5) (partial attendance); review revised exit financing		
31223040	Jerrard, Erik	10/04/21	2.5	motion (4.2). Attend Creditors Committee presentation with advisors and principals (1.9); review materials in preparation for same (0.6).		
31372286	Piraino, Stephen D.	10/04/21	1.9	Attend Creditors Committee presentation with advisors and principals.		
31188467	Rincon, Cristina M.	10/04/21	0.1	Review emails with Aeroméxico team regarding Caracara lease.		
31223430	Jerrard, Erik	10/05/21	0.8	Attend weekly call with Creditors Committee advisor and Debtor co-advisors (AlixPartners, Skyworks, others).		
31104945	Masaro, Matthew Bruno	10/05/21	0.6	Attend weekly call with Creditors Committee advisor and Debtor co-advisors (AlixPartners, Skyworks, others) (partial attendance).		
31191546	Rincon, Cristina M.	10/05/21	0.5	Attend weekly call with Creditors Committee advisor and Debtor co-advisors (AlixPartners, Skyworks, others) (partial attendance).		
31373246	Steinberg, Richard J.	10/05/21	0.7	Attend weekly call with Creditors Committee advisor and Debtor co-advisors (AlixPartners, Skyworks, others).		
31233899	Graulich, Timothy	10/12/21	0.4	Attend weekly call with Creditors Committee advisor and Debtor co-advisors (AlixPartners, Skyworks, others).		
31257186	Jerrard, Erik	10/12/21	0.6	Attend weekly call with Creditors Committee advisor and Debtor co-advisors (AlixPartners, Skyworks, others) (0.4); prepare for same (0.2).		
31387243	Piraino, Stephen D.	10/12/21	1.4	, , , , , , , , , , , , , , , , , , , ,		

Time Detail By Project					
Time ID	Name	Date	Hours	Narrative	
31231120	Steinberg, Richard J.	10/12/21	0.4	(0.8). Attend weekly call with Creditors Committee advisor and Debtor co-advisors (AlixPartners,	
31237798	Szanzer, Steven Z.	10/12/21	0.4	Skyworks, others). Attend weekly call with Creditors Committee advisor and Debtor co-advisors (AlixPartners, Skyworks, others).	
31380770	Marienko, Anna	10/13/21	7.4	Draft Debtors' discovery requests for production to Apollo and agent.	
31375922	Graulich, Timothy	10/14/21	1.3	Call with Creditors Committee regarding creditor issues (0.5) (partial attendance); call with R. Sanchez Baker regarding PLM (0.8).	
31370157	Piraino, Stephen D.	10/14/21	1.1	Call with Creditors Committee regarding creditor issues.	
31387461	Piraino, Stephen D.	10/18/21	0.2	Correspondence with R. Steinberg regarding Deutsche Bank issue.	
31319067	Jerrard, Erik	10/19/21	0.7	Attend weekly call with Creditors Committee advisor and Debtor co-advisors (AlixPartners, Skyworks, others).	
31266945	Masaro, Matthew Bruno	10/19/21	0.4	Attend weekly call with Creditors Committee advisor and Debtor co-advisors (AlixPartners, Skyworks, others) (partial attendance).	
31380552	Steinberg, Richard J.	10/19/21	1.4	Attend weekly call with Creditors Committee advisor and Debtor co-advisors (AlixPartners, Skyworks, others) (0.7); prepare for same (0.3); call with Simpson Thacher regarding PLM transaction (0.3); correspondence with S.	
31387803	Piraino, Stephen D.	10/20/21	0.7	PLM (0.4); email with R. Steinberg regarding	
31380717	Steinberg, Richard J.	10/20/21	0.4	Deutsche Bank stipulation (0.3). Call with Simpson regarding PLM transaction (0.3); correspondence with S. Piraino regarding same (0.1).	
31401577	Piraino, Stephen D.	10/21/21	1.3	Correspondence with Davis Polk team regarding PLM.	
31380871	Steinberg, Richard J.	10/21/21	1.0		
31513740	Graulich, Timothy	10/22/21	0.8	Call with H. Parkhill regarding PLM.	
31401780	Piraino, Stephen D.	10/22/21	1.4	Prepare for PLM call (0.5); correspondence with Davis Polk team regarding PLM transaction (0.8); call with R. Steinberg regarding same(0.1).	
31380888	Steinberg, Richard J.	10/22/21	0.9	Call with Vedder Price and Aimia regarding PLM transaction (0.8); call with S. Piraino regarding same (0.1).	
31323918 31379129	Piraino, Stephen D. Steinberg, Richard J.	10/25/21 10/25/21	0.1 0.8	Email with R. Steinberg regarding PLM (0.1). Review PLM transaction materials (0.5); email	
31285813	Masaro, Matthew Bruno	10/26/21	0.9	with S. Piraino regarding same (0.3). Attend weekly call with Creditors Committee advisor and Debtor co-advisors (AlixPartners, Skyworks, others).	
31384765	Piraino, Stephen D.	10/26/21	0.8	Attend weekly call with Creditors Committee advisor and Debtor co-advisors (AlixPartners, Skyworks, others).	
31378424	Steinberg, Richard J.	10/26/21	0.6	Attend weekly call with Creditors Committee	

	Time Detail By Project					
Time ID	Name	Date	Hours	Narrative		
31384771	Piraino, Stephen D.	10/27/21	0.9	advisor and Debtor co-advisors (AlixPartners, Skyworks, others) (partial attendance). Call with R. Steinberg regarding PLM documents (0.5); review and analyze PLM		
31377755	Steinberg, Richard J.	10/27/21	2.1	documents (0.4). Review and revise PLM documents (1.1); call with S. Piraino regarding same (0.5); correspondence with Rothschild regarding same (0.2); email with Aeroméxico regarding same (0.3).		
31379388	Piraino, Stephen D.	10/28/21	1.8	Review and analyze PLM documents.		
31376803	Steinberg, Richard J.	10/28/21	0.3	Email with Aeroméxico and co-advisors regarding PLM documents.		
31376069	Steinberg, Richard J.	10/29/21	2.1	Review and revise PLM documents (1.3); correspondence with S. Piraino regarding same (0.2); correspondence with Vedder Price, Aeroméxico and co-advisors regarding same (0.6).		
31374346	Steinberg, Richard J.	10/31/21	0.5	Review revised PLM documents.		
	0 Creditor/UCC/AHC Issue		52.0			
31168599 31168780 31180864 31188651 31233714	tomer/Vendor/Non-Aircraf Katz, Michael Melcer, Moshe Katz, Michael Katz, Michael Masaro, Matthew Bruno	10/01/21 10/03/21 10/04/21 10/04/21	0.3 0.3 0.1 0.8	Correspondence with AlixPartners and Aeroméxico regarding contract assumption. Draft notice of contract assumption. Correspondence with S. Piraino and M. Masaro regarding contract assumption call. Correspondence with S. Piraino and V. Mendoza regarding vendor contract issue (0.2); call with Aeroméxico and AlixPartners regarding vendor payment escalations (0.2); review contract for vendor escalation (0.4). Correspondence with AlixPartners and others regarding contract assumption and rejection procedures (0.5); correspondence with M. Melcer and others regarding contract assumption notice (0.4).		
31188712	Melcer, Moshe	10/04/21	0.2	Review and revise notice of contract assumption.		
31194079	Katz, Michael	10/05/21	0.3	Correspondence with Aeroméxico regarding outstanding contract.		
31233746	Masaro, Matthew Bruno	10/05/21	0.2	Correspondence with Aeroméxico and AlixPartners regarding contract assumption notice.		
31201819	Katz, Michael	10/06/21	0.3	Call with Aeroméxico and AlixPartners regarding vendor payment escalations.		
31197197	Masaro, Matthew Bruno	10/06/21	0.2	Correspondence with Aeroméxico and AlixPartners regarding contract assumptions.		
31205131	Masaro, Matthew Bruno	10/08/21	0.1	Correspondence with AlixPartners and M. Melcer regarding contract assumptions.		
31212758	Melcer, Moshe	10/08/21	0.1	Review and revise notice of contract assumption.		
31387165	Piraino, Stephen D.	10/08/21	1.3	Email with Aeroméxico regarding vendor issues (0.4); review and analyze vendor issue (0.9).		
31210741	Masaro, Matthew Bruno	10/11/21	0.3	Correspondence with M. Melcer and others		

Time ID Name Date Hours Narrative 31221479
31221479 Melcer, Moshe 10/11/21 0.6 Review and revise notice of contract assumption. 31240477 Katz, Michael 10/13/21 0.4 Correspondence with Aeroméxico regarding revision to vendor contract (0.2); call with Aeroméxico and AlixPartners regarding vendor payment escalations (0.2). 31253497 Hanson, Cole 10/15/21 0.5 Review and revise notice of contract assumption. 31251883 Melcer, Moshe 10/15/21 0.4 Review and revise notice of contract assumption. 31263405 Katz, Michael 10/18/21 0.7 Correspondences with Aeroméxico regarding vendor contract (0.2); call with Aeroméxico and AlixPartners regarding vendor payment escalations (0.4); correspondence with vendor counsel regarding status of contract (0.1); correspondence with S. Piraino regarding same (0.1). 31272055 Katz, Michael 10/19/21 0.4 Review and revise security agreement (0.3); correspondence with S. Piraino regarding same (0.1). 31240540 Masaro, Matthew Bruno 10/19/21 0.4 Correspondence with vendor counsel regarding status of contract (0.3); correspondence with Davis Polk team regarding same (0.1). 31275749 Masaro, Matthew Bruno 10/19/21 0.2 Correspondence with K. Lee and others regarding contract assumptions. 31275749 Masaro, Matthew Bruno 10/20/21 1.0 Correspondence with Melcer regarding contract assumptions (0.2); correspondence with AlixPartners regarding contract assumptions (0.3); correspondence with AlixPartners and others regarding contract assumptions (0.3); correspondence with AlixPartners and others regarding contract assumptions (0.4); correspondence with AlixPartners and others regarding contract assumptions (0.4); correspondence with Mithle & Case regarding same (0.4). 31401586 Piraino, Stephen D. 10/21/21 1.7 Call with vendor counsel regarding contract issues (0.7); research vendor issues (0.8); email
assumption. 31240477 Katz, Michael 10/13/21 0.4 Correspondence with Aeroméxico regarding revision to vendor contract (0.2); call with Aeroméxico and AlixPartners regarding vendor payment escalations (0.2). 31253497 Hanson, Cole 10/15/21 0.5 Review and revise notice of contract assumption. 31263405 Katz, Michael 10/18/21 0.7 Correspondences with Aeroméxico regarding vendor contract (0.2); call with Aeroméxico and AlixPartners regarding vendor contract (0.2); call with Aeroméxico and AlixPartners regarding vendor contract (0.2); call with Aeroméxico and AlixPartners regarding vendor contract (0.2); call with Aeroméxico and AlixPartners regarding vendor contract (0.1); call with Aeroméxico and AlixPartners regarding vendor payment escalations (0.4); correspondence with vendor counsel regarding vendor contract (0.3); correspondence with vendor counsel regarding vendor contract (0.1). 31272055 Katz, Michael 10/19/21 0.4 Review and revise security agreement (0.3); correspondence with Davis Polk team regarding same (0.1). 31240540 Masaro, Matthew Bruno 10/19/21 0.2 Correspondence with Vendor counsel regarding same (0.1). 31275749 Masaro, Matthew Bruno 10/20/21 1.0 Correspondence with M. Melcer regarding contract assumptions. 31275749 Masaro, Matthew Bruno 10/20/21 1.0 Correspondence with M. Melcer regarding contract assumptions (0.2); correspondence with AlixPartners regarding contract assumptions (0.3); correspondence with AlixPartners and others regarding contract amendment (0.3); correspondence with AlixPartners and others regarding contract assumptions (0.4); correspondence with White & Case regarding same (0.4). 31401586 Piraino, Stephen D. 10/21/21 1.7 Call with vendor counsel regarding contract issues (0.7); research vendor issues (0.8); email
revision to vendor contract (0.2); call with Aeroméxico and AlixPartners regarding vendor payment escalations (0.2). 31251883 Melcer, Moshe 10/15/21 0.5 Review and revise notice of contract assumption. 31263405 Katz, Michael 10/18/21 0.7 Correspondences with Aeroméxico and AlixPartners regarding vendor contract (0.2); call with Aeroméxico and AlixPartners regarding vendor contract (0.2); call with Aeroméxico and AlixPartners regarding status of contract (0.1). 31215940 Masaro, Matthew Bruno 10/18/21 0.4 Review and revise security agreement (0.3); correspondence with S. Piraino regarding same (0.1). 31272055 Katz, Michael 10/19/21 0.4 Correspondence with vendor counsel regarding same (0.1). 31240540 Masaro, Matthew Bruno 10/19/21 0.2 Correspondence with K. Lee and others regarding contract assumptions. 31275749 Masaro, Matthew Bruno 10/20/21 1.0 Correspondence with K. Lee and others regarding contract assumptions; (0.2); correspondence with AlixPartners regarding same (0.3). 31285817 Masaro, Matthew Bruno 10/21/21 1.1 Correspondence with AlixPartners and others regarding contract assumptions (0.3); correspondence with AlixPartners regarding contract assumptions (0.3); correspondence with AlixPartners regarding contract assumptions (0.3); correspondence with AlixPartners regarding contract assumptions (0.3); correspondence with MixPartners and others regarding contract assumptions (0.4); correspondence with MixPartners and others regarding contract assumptions (0.4); correspondence with MixPartners and others regarding contract assumptions (0.4); correspondence with MixPartners and others regarding contract assumptions (0.4); correspondence with MixPartners and others regarding contract assumptions (0.4); correspondence with MixPartners and others regarding contract assumptions (0.4); correspondence with MixPartners and others regarding contract assumptions (0.4); correspondence with MixPartners and others regarding contract assumptions (0.4); correspondence with White & Case regarding same (0.4).
Aeroméxico and AlixPartners regarding vendor payment escalations (0.2). 31253497 Hanson, Cole 10/15/21 0.5 Review and revise notice of contract assumption. 31251883 Melcer, Moshe 10/15/21 0.4 Review and revise notice of contract assumption. 31263405 Katz, Michael 10/18/21 0.7 Correspondences with Aeroméxico regarding vendor contract (0.2); call with Aeroméxico and AlixPartners regarding vendor payment escalations (0.4); correspondence with vendor counsel regarding status of contract (0.1). 31215940 Masaro, Matthew Bruno 10/18/21 0.4 Review and revise security agreement (0.3); correspondence with S. Piraino regarding same (0.1). 31272055 Katz, Michael 10/19/21 0.4 Correspondence with vendor counsel regarding same (0.1). 31240540 Masaro, Matthew Bruno 10/19/21 0.2 Correspondence with Vendor counsel regarding status of contract (0.3); correspondence with Davis Polk team regarding same (0.1). 31275749 Masaro, Matthew Bruno 10/20/21 1.0 Correspondence with M. Melcer regarding contract assumptions, (0.2); correspondence with M. Melcer regarding contract assumptions (0.2); correspondence with M. Melcer regarding contract assumptions (0.3); correspondence with MikPartners regarding contract amendments (0.2); analyze contract assumptions (0.3); correspondence with AlixPartners and others regarding contract assumptions on Aeroméxico regarding contract assumptions (0.4); correspondence with MikPartners and others regarding contract assumptions (0.4); correspondence with MikPartners and others regarding contract assumptions (0.4); correspondence with MikPartners and others regarding contract assumptions (0.4); correspondence with MikPartners and others regarding contract assumptions (0.4); correspondence with MikPartners and others regarding contract assumptions (0.4); correspondence with MikPartners and others regarding contract assumptions (0.4); correspondence with MikPartners and others regarding contract assumptions (0.4); correspondence with White & Case regarding same (0.4).
31253497 Hanson, Cole 10/15/21 0.5 Review and revise notice of contract assumption. 31251883 Melcer, Moshe 10/15/21 0.4 Review and revise notice of contract assumption. 31263405 Katz, Michael 10/18/21 0.7 Correspondences with Aeroméxico regarding vendor contract (0.2); call with Aeroméxico and AlixPartners regarding vendor payment escalations (0.4); correspondence with vendor counsel regarding status of contract (0.1). 31215940 Masaro, Matthew Bruno 10/18/21 0.4 Review and revise security agreement (0.3); correspondence with vendor counsel regarding same (0.1). 31272055 Katz, Michael 10/19/21 0.4 Correspondence with vendor counsel regarding same (0.1). 31240540 Masaro, Matthew Bruno 10/19/21 0.2 Correspondence with K. Lee and others regarding contract assumptions. 31275749 Masaro, Matthew Bruno 10/20/21 1.0 Correspondence with M. Melcer regarding contract assumptions (0.2); correspondence with AlixPartners regarding contract assumptions (0.3); correspondence with AlixPartners regarding contract assumptions (0.3); correspondence with AlixPartners regarding contract assumptions (0.3); correspondence with AlixPartners and others regarding contract assumptions (0.4); correspondence with MikPartners and others regarding contract assumptions (0.4); correspondence with MikPartners and others regarding contract assumptions (0.4); correspondence with MikPartners and others regarding contract assumptions (0.4); correspondence with White & Case regarding same (0.4). 31401586 Piraino, Stephen D. 10/21/21 1.7 Call with vendor counsel regarding contract issues (0.7); research vendor issues (0.8); email
assumption. 31251883 Melcer, Moshe 10/15/21 0.4 Review and revise notice of contract assumption. 31263405 Katz, Michael 10/18/21 0.7 Correspondences with Aeroméxico regarding vendor contract (0.2); call with Aeroméxico and AlixPartners regarding vendor payment escalations (0.4); correspondence with vendor counsel regarding status of contract (0.1). 31215940 Masaro, Matthew Bruno 10/18/21 0.4 Review and revise security agreement (0.3); correspondence with S. Piraino regarding same (0.1). 31272055 Katz, Michael 10/19/21 0.4 Correspondence with vendor counsel regarding same (0.1). 31240540 Masaro, Matthew Bruno 10/19/21 0.2 Correspondence with vendor counsel regarding status of contract (0.3); correspondence with Davis Polk team regarding same (0.1). 31275749 Masaro, Matthew Bruno 10/20/21 1.0 Correspondence with M. Melcer regarding contract assumptions; (0.2); correspondence with M. R. Steinberg and K. Lee regarding contract amendments (0.2); analyze contract assumptions (0.3); correspondence with AlixPartners regarding same (0.3). 31285817 Masaro, Matthew Bruno 10/21/21 1.1 Correspondence with S. Piraino and Aeroméxico regarding contract amendment (0.3); correspondence with M. MikiPartners and others regarding contract assumptions (0.4); correspondence with White & Case regarding same (0.4). 31401586 Piraino, Stephen D. 10/21/21 1.7 Call with vendor counsel regarding contract issues (0.7); research vendor issues (0.8); email
31251883 Melcer, Moshe 31263405 Katz, Michael 10/18/21 0.4 Review and revise notice of contract assumption. Correspondences with Aeroméxico regarding vendor contract (0.2); call with Aeroméxico and AlixPartners regarding vendor payment escalations (0.4); correspondence with vendor counsel regarding status of contract (0.1). 31215940 Masaro, Matthew Bruno 31272055 Katz, Michael 10/19/21 0.4 Review and revise security agreement (0.3); correspondence with S. Piraino regarding same (0.1). Correspondence with vendor counsel regarding status of contract (0.3); correspondence with Davis Polk team regarding same (0.1). 31240540 Masaro, Matthew Bruno 31275749 Masaro, Matthew Bruno 10/20/21 10.0 Correspondence with M. Melcer regarding contract assumptions. Correspondence with M. Melcer regarding contract assumptions (0.2); correspondence with M. Steinberg and K. Lee regarding contract amendments (0.2); analyze contract amendments (0.2); analyze contract amendments (0.3); correspondence with AlixPartners regarding contract amendment (0.3); correspondence with AlixPartners and others regarding contract amendment (0.3); correspondence with AlixPartners and others regarding contract assumptions (0.4); correspondence with White & Case regarding same (0.4). 31401586 Piraino, Stephen D. 10/21/21 1.7 Call with vendor counsel regarding contract issues (0.7); research vendor issues (0.8); email
assumption. O.7 Correspondences with Aeroméxico regarding vendor contract (0.2); call with Aeroméxico and AlixPartners regarding vendor payment escalations (0.4); correspondence with vendor counsel regarding status of contract (0.1). Review and revise security agreement (0.3); correspondence with S. Piraino regarding same (0.1). Katz, Michael 10/19/21 0.4 Correspondence with vendor counsel regarding same (0.1). Alizer Polk team regarding same (0.1). Alizer Polk team regarding same (0.1). Alizer Polk team regarding same (0.1). Correspondence with K. Lee and others regarding contract assumptions. Correspondence with M. Melcer regarding contract assumptions. Correspondence with M. Lee regarding contract assumptions (0.2); correspondence with R. Steinberg and K. Lee regarding contract assumptions (0.2); correspondence with AlixPartners regarding same (0.3). Masaro, Matthew Bruno 10/21/21 1.1 Correspondence with S. Piraino and Aeroméxico or egarding contract assumptions (0.3); correspondence with AlixPartners and others regarding contract assumptions (0.4); correspondence with Mithe & Case regarding same (0.4). Piraino, Stephen D. 10/21/21 1.7 Call with vendor counsel regarding contract issues (0.7); research vendor issues (0.8); email
vendor contract (0.2); call with Aeroméxico and AlixPartners regarding vendor payment escalations (0.4); correspondence with vendor counsel regarding status of contract (0.1). 31215940 Masaro, Matthew Bruno 10/18/21 0.4 Review and revise security agreement (0.3); correspondence with S. Piraino regarding same (0.1). 31272055 Katz, Michael 10/19/21 0.4 Correspondence with vendor counsel regarding same (0.1). 31240540 Masaro, Matthew Bruno 10/19/21 0.2 Correspondence with K. Lee and others regarding contract assumptions. 31275749 Masaro, Matthew Bruno 10/20/21 1.0 Correspondence with M. Melcer regarding contract assumptions; (0.2); correspondence with R. Steinberg and K. Lee regarding contract amendments (0.2); analyze contract amendments (0.2); analyze contract assumptions (0.3); correspondence with AlixPartners regarding same (0.3). 31285817 Masaro, Matthew Bruno 10/21/21 1.1 Correspondence with S. Piraino and Aeroméxico regarding contract amendment (0.3); correspondence with N. Piraino and Aeroméxico regarding contract amendment (0.3); correspondence with M. MixPartners and others regarding contract assumptions (0.4); correspondence with White & Case regarding same (0.4). 31401586 Piraino, Stephen D. 10/21/21 1.7 Call with vendor counsel regarding contract issues (0.7); research vendor issues (0.8); email
AlixPartners regarding vendor payment escalations (0.4); correspondence with vendor counsel regarding status of contract (0.1). Review and revise security agreement (0.3); correspondence with S. Piraino regarding same (0.1). Katz, Michael 10/19/21 0.4 Correspondence with vendor counsel regarding same (0.1). Torrespondence with vendor counsel regarding status of contract (0.3); correspondence with Davis Polk team regarding same (0.1). AlixPartners regarding contract assumptions. AlixPartners regarding contract (0.3); correspondence with Davis Polk team regarding same (0.1). Correspondence with K. Lee and others regarding contract assumptions. Correspondence with M. Melcer regarding contract assumptions; (0.2); correspondence with R. Steinberg and K. Lee regarding contract amendments (0.2); analyze contract assumptions (0.3); correspondence with AlixPartners regarding same (0.3). Torrespondence with S. Piraino and Aeroméxico regarding contract amendment (0.3); correspondence with AlixPartners and others regarding contract assumptions (0.4); correspondence with White & Case regarding same (0.4). Firaino, Stephen D. 10/21/21 1.7 Call with vendor counsel regarding contract issues (0.7); research vendor issues (0.8); email
escalations (0.4); correspondence with vendor counsel regarding status of contract (0.1). Review and revise security agreement (0.3); correspondence with S. Piraino regarding same (0.1). Katz, Michael 10/19/21 0.4 Correspondence with vendor counsel regarding status of contract (0.3); correspondence with Davis Polk team regarding same (0.1). Correspondence with K. Lee and others regarding contract assumptions. Masaro, Matthew Bruno 10/20/21 1.0 Correspondence with M. Melcer regarding contract assumptions; (0.2); correspondence with R. Steinberg and K. Lee regarding contract assumptions (0.3); correspondence with AlixPartners regarding same (0.3). Masaro, Matthew Bruno 10/21/21 1.1 Correspondence with S. Piraino and Aeroméxico regarding contract amendment (0.3); correspondence with AlixPartners and others regarding contract assumptions (0.4); correspondence with White & Case regarding same (0.4). Piraino, Stephen D. 10/21/21 1.7 Call with vendor counsel regarding contract issues (0.7); research vendor issues (0.8); email
counsel regarding status of contract (0.1). 31215940 Masaro, Matthew Bruno 10/18/21 0.4 Review and revise security agreement (0.3); correspondence with S. Piraino regarding same (0.1). 31272055 Katz, Michael 10/19/21 0.4 Correspondence with vendor counsel regarding status of contract (0.3); correspondence with Davis Polk team regarding same (0.1). 31240540 Masaro, Matthew Bruno 10/19/21 0.2 Correspondence with K. Lee and others regarding contract assumptions. 31275749 Masaro, Matthew Bruno 10/20/21 1.0 Correspondence with M. Melcer regarding contract assumptions; (0.2); correspondence with R. Steinberg and K. Lee regarding contract amendments (0.2); analyze contract assumptions (0.3); correspondence with AlixPartners regarding same (0.3). 31285817 Masaro, Matthew Bruno 10/21/21 1.1 Correspondence with S. Piraino and Aeroméxico regarding contract amendment (0.3); correspondence with AlixPartners and others regarding contract assumptions (0.4); correspondence with White & Case regarding same (0.4). 31401586 Piraino, Stephen D. 10/21/21 1.7 Call with vendor counsel regarding contract issues (0.8); email
correspondence with S. Piraino regarding same (0.1). 31272055 Katz, Michael 10/19/21 0.4 Correspondence with vendor counsel regarding status of contract (0.3); correspondence with Davis Polk team regarding same (0.1). 31240540 Masaro, Matthew Bruno 10/19/21 0.2 Correspondence with K. Lee and others regarding contract assumptions. 31275749 Masaro, Matthew Bruno 10/20/21 1.0 Correspondence with M. Melcer regarding contract assumptions; (0.2); correspondence with R. Steinberg and K. Lee regarding contract amendments (0.2); analyze contract assumptions (0.3); correspondence with AlixPartners regarding same (0.3). 31285817 Masaro, Matthew Bruno 10/21/21 1.1 Correspondence with S. Piraino and Aeroméxico regarding contract amendment (0.3); correspondence with AlixPartners and others regarding contract assumptions (0.4); correspondence with White & Case regarding same (0.4). 31401586 Piraino, Stephen D. 10/21/21 1.7 Call with vendor counsel regarding contract issues (0.7); research vendor issues (0.8); email
(0.1). 31272055 Katz, Michael 10/19/21 0.4 Correspondence with vendor counsel regarding status of contract (0.3); correspondence with Davis Polk team regarding same (0.1). 31240540 Masaro, Matthew Bruno 10/19/21 0.2 Correspondence with K. Lee and others regarding contract assumptions. 31275749 Masaro, Matthew Bruno 10/20/21 1.0 Correspondence with M. Melcer regarding contract assumptions; (0.2); correspondence with R. Steinberg and K. Lee regarding contract assumptions (0.3); correspondence with AlixPartners regarding same (0.3). 31285817 Masaro, Matthew Bruno 10/21/21 1.1 Correspondence with S. Piraino and Aeroméxico regarding contract amendment (0.3); correspondence with AlixPartners and others regarding contract assumptions (0.4); correspondence with White & Case regarding same (0.4). 31401586 Piraino, Stephen D. 10/21/21 1.7 Call with vendor counsel regarding contract issues (0.7); research vendor issues (0.8); email
31272055 Katz, Michael 10/19/21 0.4 Correspondence with vendor counsel regarding status of contract (0.3); correspondence with Davis Polk team regarding same (0.1). 31240540 Masaro, Matthew Bruno 10/19/21 0.2 Correspondence with K. Lee and others regarding contract assumptions. 31275749 Masaro, Matthew Bruno 10/20/21 1.0 Correspondence with M. Melcer regarding contract assumptions; (0.2); correspondence with R. Steinberg and K. Lee regarding contract assumptions (0.3); correspondence with AlixPartners regarding same (0.3). 31285817 Masaro, Matthew Bruno 10/21/21 1.1 Correspondence with S. Piraino and Aeroméxico regarding contract amendment (0.3); correspondence with AlixPartners and others regarding contract assumptions (0.4); correspondence with White & Case regarding same (0.4). 31401586 Piraino, Stephen D. 10/21/21 1.7 Call with vendor counsel regarding contract issues (0.7); research vendor issues (0.8); email
Davis Polk team regarding same (0.1). 31240540 Masaro, Matthew Bruno 10/19/21 0.2 Correspondence with K. Lee and others regarding contract assumptions. 31275749 Masaro, Matthew Bruno 10/20/21 1.0 Correspondence with M. Melcer regarding contract assumptions; (0.2); correspondence with R. Steinberg and K. Lee regarding contract amendments (0.2); analyze contract assumptions (0.3); correspondence with AlixPartners regarding same (0.3). 31285817 Masaro, Matthew Bruno 10/21/21 1.1 Correspondence with S. Piraino and Aeroméxico regarding contract amendment (0.3); correspondence with AlixPartners and others regarding contract assumptions (0.4); correspondence with White & Case regarding same (0.4). 31401586 Piraino, Stephen D. 10/21/21 1.7 Call with vendor counsel regarding contract issues (0.7); research vendor issues (0.8); email
31240540 Masaro, Matthew Bruno 10/19/21 0.2 Correspondence with K. Lee and others regarding contract assumptions. 31275749 Masaro, Matthew Bruno 10/20/21 1.0 Correspondence with M. Melcer regarding contract assumptions; (0.2); correspondence with R. Steinberg and K. Lee regarding contract amendments (0.2); analyze contract assumptions (0.3); correspondence with AlixPartners regarding same (0.3). 31285817 Masaro, Matthew Bruno 10/21/21 1.1 Correspondence with S. Piraino and Aeroméxico regarding contract amendment (0.3); correspondence with AlixPartners and others regarding contract assumptions (0.4); correspondence with White & Case regarding same (0.4). 31401586 Piraino, Stephen D. 10/21/21 1.7 Call with vendor counsel regarding contract issues (0.7); research vendor issues (0.8); email
regarding contract assumptions. 1.0 Correspondence with M. Melcer regarding contract assumptions; (0.2); correspondence with R. Steinberg and K. Lee regarding contract amendments (0.2); analyze contract assumptions (0.3); correspondence with AlixPartners regarding same (0.3). 1.1 Correspondence with S. Piraino and Aeroméxico regarding contract amendment (0.3); correspondence with AlixPartners and others regarding contract assumptions (0.4); correspondence with White & Case regarding same (0.4). 31401586 Piraino, Stephen D. 10/21/21 1.7 Call with vendor counsel regarding contract issues (0.7); research vendor issues (0.8); email
31275749 Masaro, Matthew Bruno 10/20/21 1.0 Correspondence with M. Melcer regarding contract assumptions; (0.2); correspondence with R. Steinberg and K. Lee regarding contract amendments (0.2); analyze contract assumptions (0.3); correspondence with AlixPartners regarding same (0.3). 31285817 Masaro, Matthew Bruno 10/21/21 1.1 Correspondence with S. Piraino and Aeroméxico regarding contract amendment (0.3); correspondence with AlixPartners and others regarding contract assumptions (0.4); correspondence with White & Case regarding same (0.4). 31401586 Piraino, Stephen D. 10/21/21 1.7 Call with vendor counsel regarding contract issues (0.7); research vendor issues (0.8); email
with R. Steinberg and K. Lee regarding contract amendments (0.2); analyze contract assumptions (0.3); correspondence with AlixPartners regarding same (0.3). 31285817 Masaro, Matthew Bruno 10/21/21 1.1 Correspondence with S. Piraino and Aeroméxico regarding contract amendment (0.3); correspondence with AlixPartners and others regarding contract assumptions (0.4); correspondence with White & Case regarding same (0.4). 31401586 Piraino, Stephen D. 10/21/21 1.7 Call with vendor counsel regarding contract issues (0.7); research vendor issues (0.8); email
amendments (0.2); analyze contract assumptions (0.3); correspondence with AlixPartners regarding same (0.3). 31285817 Masaro, Matthew Bruno 10/21/21 1.1 Correspondence with S. Piraino and Aeroméxico regarding contract amendment (0.3); correspondence with AlixPartners and others regarding contract assumptions (0.4); correspondence with White & Case regarding same (0.4). 31401586 Piraino, Stephen D. 10/21/21 1.7 Call with vendor counsel regarding contract issues (0.7); research vendor issues (0.8); email
assumptions (0.3); correspondence with AlixPartners regarding same (0.3). 31285817 Masaro, Matthew Bruno 10/21/21 1.1 Correspondence with S. Piraino and Aeroméxico regarding contract amendment (0.3); correspondence with AlixPartners and others regarding contract assumptions (0.4); correspondence with White & Case regarding same (0.4). 31401586 Piraino, Stephen D. 10/21/21 1.7 Call with vendor counsel regarding contract issues (0.7); research vendor issues (0.8); email
31285817 Masaro, Matthew Bruno 10/21/21 1.1 Correspondence with S. Piraino and Aeroméxico regarding contract amendment (0.3); correspondence with AlixPartners and others regarding contract assumptions (0.4); correspondence with White & Case regarding same (0.4). 31401586 Piraino, Stephen D. 10/21/21 1.1 Correspondence with S. Piraino and Aeroméxico regarding contract assumptions (0.4); correspondence with White & Case regarding same (0.4). 1.2 Call with vendor counsel regarding contract issues (0.7); research vendor issues (0.8); email
Aeroméxico regarding contract amendment (0.3); correspondence with AlixPartners and others regarding contract assumptions (0.4); correspondence with White & Case regarding same (0.4). 31401586 Piraino, Stephen D. 10/21/21 1.7 Call with vendor counsel regarding contract issues (0.7); research vendor issues (0.8); email
(0.3); correspondence with AlixPartners and others regarding contract assumptions (0.4); correspondence with White & Case regarding same (0.4). 31401586 Piraino, Stephen D. 10/21/21 1.7 Call with vendor counsel regarding contract issues (0.7); research vendor issues (0.8); email
others regarding contract assumptions (0.4); correspondence with White & Case regarding same (0.4). 31401586 Piraino, Stephen D. 10/21/21 1.7 Call with vendor counsel regarding contract issues (0.7); research vendor issues (0.8); email
same (0.4). 31401586 Piraino, Stephen D. 10/21/21 1.7 Call with vendor counsel regarding contract issues (0.7); research vendor issues (0.8); email
31401586 Piraino, Stephen D. 10/21/21 1.7 Call with vendor counsel regarding contract issues (0.7); research vendor issues (0.8); email
issues (0.7); research vendor issues (0.8); email
(0.0)
with Davis Polk team regarding same (0.2).
31305699 Masaro, Matthew Bruno 10/25/21 1.6 Review and revise contract amendment (0.8); correspondence with White & Case,
AlixPartners, Cleary Gottlieb, and others
regarding same and contract assumptions (0.8).
31319116 Katz, Michael 10/26/21 0.3 Call with Aeroméxico and AlixPartners regarding
vendor payment escalations (partial attendance).
31311942 Masaro, Matthew Bruno 10/26/21 1.5 Review and revise contract amendments (0.4);
correspondence with White & Case,
AlixPartners, S. Piraino, and others regarding contract assumptions (1.1).
31324540 Katz, Michael 10/27/21 0.3 Correspondence with S. Piraino regarding
vendor escalations (0.2); call with Aeroméxico
and AlixPartners regarding vendor payment escalations (0.1).
31320395 Masaro, Matthew Bruno 10/27/21 0.6 Review and revise contract amendments (0.2);
correspondence with AlixPartners regarding

	Time Detail By Project						
Time ID	Name	Date	Hours	Narrative			
24227270	Malaan Maska	40/07/04	0.5	same (0.2); correspondence with M. Melcer regarding assumption notice (0.2).			
31327276 31384775	Melcer, Moshe Piraino, Stephen D.	10/27/21 10/27/21	0.5 0.7	Review and revise contract assumption notice. Call with vendor counsel regarding vendor payment escalations (0.5); email with M. Katz regarding same (0.2).			
31384485	Masaro, Matthew Bruno	10/28/21	0.5	Correspondence with Aeroméxico regarding contract amendment.			
31349993	Dekhtyar, Mariya	10/29/21	2.1	Correspondence with M. Masaro regarding executory contract issue (0.1); research executory contract issue (0.8); correspondence with C. Hanson regarding same (0.4); prepare summary of research on executory contracts (0.4); research and revise case law on prepetition claims issue (0.4).			
31347535	Hanson, Cole	10/29/21	4.1	Research issues regarding indemnity agreement.			
31331297	Masaro, Matthew Bruno	10/29/21	0.9	Correspondence with Honeywell, White & Case, and others regarding contract amendment (0.7); correspondence with S. Piraino and contract counterparty counsel regarding assumption notice (0.2).			
31378724	Piraino, Stephen D.	10/29/21	0.2				
31350005	Dekhtyar, Mariya	10/30/21	1.3	Research administrative claim priority issues (1.1); correspondence with M. Masaro regarding same (0.2).			
31347778	Hanson, Cole	10/30/21	2.2	Draft summary of research on indemnity agreements.			
	Customer/Vendor/Non-A Aircraft Contract Issues	ircraft	29.6	5			
AM180 Emp 31233718	loyee/Pension Issues Masaro, Matthew Bruno	10/04/21	0.5	Correspondence with Sainz Abogados, S. Piraino, AlixPartners, and others regarding employment issues.			
31372300	Piraino, Stephen D.	10/04/21	0.3	Correspondence with Sainz Abogados and AlixPartners regarding employment issues.			
31199347	Masaro, Matthew Bruno	10/06/21	0.6	Correspondence with S. Piraino and others regarding employee retirement.			
31387126	Piraino, Stephen D.	10/06/21	0.4	Correspondence with M. Masaro regarding employee issues.			
31205120	Masaro, Matthew Bruno	10/11/21	0.1	Correspondence with AlixPartners regarding employee wages and retirement inquiries.			
Total AM180 Employee/Pension Issues			1.9				
AM190 Finaı							
31364874	Blanco, Maurice	10/01/21	1.0	Email with Davis Polk team regarding exit financing debt documents and related documents.			
31488326	Graulich, Timothy	10/01/21	2.1	Call with J. Brody regarding exit financing proposal (0.6); call with J. Zinman regarding exit financing proposal (1.5).			
31159745	Hwang, Eric	10/01/21	2.2	Review and incorporate comments to exit financing motion and declaration.			

Time ID		Time Detail By Project					
oommitment letter (0.4); email with co-advisors regarding same (0.7); attend daily contingency update call with Aeroméxico and co-advisors (1.0). 31158291 Katz, Michael 10/01/21 0.2 Review correspondence regarding exit financing update. 31370567 Piraino, Stephen D. 10/01/21 1.0 Attend daily contingency update call with Aeroméxico and co-advisors. 31186049 Troconis, Adela 10/01/21 1.0 Attend daily contingency update call with Aeroméxico and co-advisors. 311850583 Graulich, Timothy 10/02/21 0.4 Review Plan (0.2); email with Davis Polk Finance team regarding exit financing proposal (0.7); call with P. Tomasco regarding same (0.8); review and comment on exit financing term shee (1.9). 31209565 Jerrard, Erik 10/02/21 0.5 Review exit financing term sheet (1.9). 31179541 Steinberg, Richard J. 10/02/21 0.5 Review with financing term sheet. 31365047 Blanco, Maurice 10/03/21 0.7 Correspondence with Davis Polk team regarding gross up. 31486141 Graulich, Timothy 10/03/21 2.3 Call with D. Botter regarding skif financing term sheet (1.6); review and revise Mexican investor term sheet (1.7). 31184960 Huebner, Marshall S. 10/03/21 0.6 Review emails regarding shareholder issues (0.6); correspondence with T. Graulich regarding same (0.3); correspondence with T. Graulich regarding same regarding exit financing notes. 31181101 Katz, Michael 10/03/21 0.8 Call with Davis Polk Finance and Tax teams regarding exit financing notes (0.6); coll with Davis Polk Finance and Tax teams regarding exit financing for the Coll same regarding exit financing notes (0.6); comment on exit financing notes (0.6); comm	Time ID	Name	Date	Hours	Narrative		
31158291 Katz, Michael 10/01/21 0.2 Review correspondence regarding exit financing update. 31370567 Piraino, Stephen D. 10/01/21 1.0 Attend daily contingency update call with Aeroméxico and co-advisors. 31186049 Troconis, Adela 10/01/21 0.4 Review Plan (0.2); email with Davis Polk Finance team regarding exit financing debt commitment documents (0.2). 31350583 Graulich, Timothy 10/02/21 3.4 Call with Rothschild regarding exit financing debt commitment documents (0.2). 31209565 Jerrard, Erik 10/02/21 0.5 Review and revise equity term sheet. 31179541 Steinberg, Richard J. 10/02/21 0.5 Review with financing term sheets. 31186647 Blanco, Maurice 10/03/21 0.7 Correspondence with Davis Polk team regarding gross up. 31184661 Graulich, Timothy 10/03/21 2.3 Call with D. Botter regarding exit financing term sheet (1.9). 31184960 Huebner, Marshall S. 10/03/21 0.6 Review emails regarding shareholder issues (0.3); correspondence with T. Graulich regarding sme (0.3). 31181467 Jackson, Vanessa L. 10/03/21 0.8 Call with Davis Polk Finance and Tax team regarding exit financing notes (0.8); call with Davis Polk	31179356	Jerrard, Erik	10/01/21	2.1	commitment letter (0.4); email with co-advisors regarding same (0.7); attend daily contingency update call with Aeroméxico and co-advisors		
Sacramon Stephen D. 10/01/21 10. Attend daily contingency update call with Aeroméxico and co-advisors.	31158291	Katz, Michael	10/01/21	0.2	Review correspondence regarding exit financing		
31186049 Troconis, Adela 10/01/21 0.4 Review Plan (0.2); email with Davis Polk Finance team regarding exit financing debt commitment documents (0.2). 31350583 Graulich, Timothy 10/02/21 3.4 Call with Nothschild regarding exit financing proposal (0.7); call with P. Tomasco regarding same (0.8); review and comment on exit financing term sheet (1.9) 31209565 3179541 31480614 Steinberg, Richard J. 10/02/21 0.4 Review exit financing term sheets. 31365047 Blanco, Maunice 10/03/21 0.7 Correspondence with Davis Polk team regarding gross up. 31486141 Graulich, Timothy 10/03/21 2.3 Call with D. Botter regarding exit financing term sheet (0.6); review and revise Mexican investor term sheet (1.7). 31184960 Huebner, Marshall S. 10/03/21 0.6 Review emails regarding sate floating same (0.3). 31181467 Jackson, Vanessa L. 10/03/21 0.8 Call with Davis Polk Finance and Tax team regarding exit financing notes. 31181467 Jackson, Vanessa L. 10/03/21 3.6 Draft issues list for equity commitment term sheet and related analysis (2.3); call with Davis Polk Finance and Tax team regarding exit financing notes. 31181101 Katz, Michael 10/03/21 0.8 Call with Davis Polk Finance and Tax teams regarding exit financing notes. 31187035 Piraino, Stephen D. 10/03/21 2.2 Revise equity financing term sheet (1.0); call with Davis Polk Finance and Tax teams regarding exit financing notes (0.7); call with Akin Gump and Milbank regarding exit financing notes (0.7); call with Davis Polk Finance and Tax teams regarding exit financing notes (0.7); call with Davis Polk Finance and Tax teams regarding exit financing notes (0.7); call with Davis Polk Finance and Tax teams regarding exit financing notes (0.7); call with Davis Polk Finance and Tax teams regarding exit financing notes (0.7); call with Davis Polk Finance and Tax	31370567	Piraino, Stephen D.	10/01/21	1.0	Attend daily contingency update call with		
31350583 Graulich, Timothy 10/02/21 3.4 Call with Rothschild regarding ext financing proposal (0.7); call with P. Tomasco regarding same (0.8); review and comment on exit financing term sheet (1.9).	31186049	Troconis, Adela	10/01/21	0.4	Review Plan (0.2); email with Davis Polk Finance team regarding exit financing debt		
31209565 Jerrard, Erik 10/02/21 0.5 Review exit financing term sheets. 31179541 Steinberg, Richard J. 10/02/21 0.4 Review and revise equity term sheet. 31365047 Blanco, Maurice 10/03/21 0.7 Correspondence with Davis Polk team regarding gross up. 31486141 Graulich, Timothy 10/03/21 2.3 Call with D. Botter regarding exit financing term sheet (0.6); review and revise Mexican investor term sheet (1.7). 31184960 Huebner, Marshall S. 10/03/21 0.6 Review emails regarding shareholder issues (0.3); correspondence with T. Graulich regarding same (0.3). 31181467 Jackson, Vanessa L. 10/03/21 0.8 Call with Davis Polk Finance and Tax team regarding exit financing notes. 31222893 Jerrard, Erik 10/03/21 3.6 Draft issues list for equity commitment term sheet and related analysis (2.3); call with Davis Polk Finance and Tax teams regarding exit financing notes (0.8); call with Akin Gump and Milbank regarding exit financing (0.5). 3118101 Katz, Michael 10/03/21 0.8 Call with Davis Polk Finance and Tax teams regarding exit financing notes. 31187035 Piraino, Stephen D. 10/03/21 0.8 Call with Davis Polk Finance and Tax teams regarding exit financing notes (0.7); call with Akin Gump and Milbank regarding exit financing determinent and tax teams regarding exit financing notes (0.7); call with Akin Gump and Milbank regarding exit financing d	31350583	Graulich, Timothy	10/02/21	3.4	Call with Rothschild regarding exit financing proposal (0.7); call with P. Tomasco regarding same (0.8); review and comment on exit		
31365047 Blanco, Maurice 10/03/21 0.7 Correspondence with Davis Polk team regarding gross up. 2.3 Call with D. Botter regarding exit financing term sheet (0.6); review and revise Mexican investor term sheet (1.7). 31184960 Huebner, Marshall S. 10/03/21 0.6 Review emails regarding shareholder issues (0.3); correspondence with T. Graulich regarding same (0.3). 31181467 Jackson, Vanessa L. 10/03/21 0.8 Call with Davis Polk Finance and Tax team regarding exit financing notes. 31222893 Jerrard, Erik 10/03/21 3.6 Draft issues list for equity commitment term sheet and related analysis (2.3); call with Davis Polk Finance and Tax teams regarding exit financing notes (0.8); call with Akin Gump and Milbank regarding exit financing (0.5). 31181101 Katz, Michael 10/03/21 0.8 Call with Davis Polk Finance and Tax teams regarding exit financing notes (0.7); call with Davis Polk Finance and Tax teams regarding exit financing notes (0.7); call with Davis Polk Finance and Tax teams regarding exit financing notes (0.7); call with Davis Polk Finance and Tax teams regarding exit financing notes (0.7); call with Davis Polk Finance and Tax teams regarding exit financing notes (0.7); call with Davis Polk Finance and Tax teams regarding exit financing debt commitment ax issue (0.1); comment on exit financing debt commitment documents (1.4). 31348952 Bane, Abraham 10/04/21 2.2 Correspondence with Milbank regarding exit financing debt commitment documents (1.4). 31365160 Blanco, Maurice 10/04/21 2.0 Correspondence with Davis Polk team regarding exit financing debt commitment documents (1.4). 31365160 Graulich, Timothy 10/04/21 3.5 Call with Davis Polk team regarding exit financing debt commitment documents (1.4). 31365160 Graulich, Timothy 10/04/21 3.5 Call with Davis Polk team regarding exit financing debt commitment documents (1.4). 31365160 31904/21 3.5 Call with Davis Polk team regarding exit financing debt commitment debt issues. 31904/21 31904/21 319	31209565	Jerrard, Erik	10/02/21	0.5			
gross up. 2.3 Call with D. Botter regarding exit financing term sheet (0.6); review and revise Mexican investor term sheet (1.7). 31184960 Huebner, Marshall S. 10/03/21 0.6 Review emails regarding shareholder issues (0.3); correspondence with T. Graulich regarding same (0.3). 31181467 Jackson, Vanessa L. 10/03/21 0.8 Call with Davis Polk Finance and Tax team regarding exit financing notes. 31222893 Jerrard, Erik 10/03/21 0.8 Call with Davis Polk Finance and Tax team regarding exit financing notes (0.8); call with Akin Gump and Milbank regarding exit financing notes (0.8); call with Akin Gump and Milbank regarding exit financing notes (0.8); call with Akin Gump and Milbank regarding exit financing notes (0.8); call with Davis Polk Finance and Tax teams regarding exit financing notes (0.7); call with Davis Polk Finance and Tax teams regarding exit financing notes (0.7); call with Akin Gump and Milbank regarding exit financing notes (0.7); call with Akin Gump and Milbank regarding exit financing notes (0.7); call with Akin Gump and Milbank regarding exit financing notes (0.8); correspondence with A. Siman regarding exit financing notes (0.8); correspondence with A. Siman regarding exit financing notes (0.8); correspondence with Milbank regarding exit financing debt commitment documents (1.4). 31348952 Bane, Abraham 10/04/21 0.2 Correspondence with Milbank regarding exit financing debt commitment documents (1.4). 31365160 Blanco, Maurice 10/04/21 2.0 Correspondence with Milbank regarding exit financing debt suses. 31486165 Graulich, Timothy 10/04/21 0.5 Call with joint bidders regarding exit financing fee motion. 31191974 Huebner, Marshall S. 10/04/21 1.3 Correspondence with Aeroméxico, T. Graulich, and R. Cooper regarding exit financing.	31179541			0.4			
31486141 Graulich, Timothy 10/03/21 2.3 Čall with D. Botter regarding exit financing term sheet (0.6); review and revise Mexican investor term sheet (1.7). 31184960 Huebner, Marshall S. 10/03/21 0.6 Review emails regarding shareholder issues (0.3); correspondence with T. Graulich regarding same (0.3). 31181467 Jackson, Vanessa L. 10/03/21 0.8 Call with Davis Polk Finance and Tax team regarding exit financing notes. 31222893 Jerrard, Erik 10/03/21 3.6 Draft issues list for equity commitment term sheet and Tax teams regarding exit financing notes (0.8); call with Davis Polk Finance and Tax teams regarding exit financing notes (0.8); call with Davis Polk Finance and Tax teams regarding exit financing notes. 31181101 Katz, Michael 10/03/21 0.8 Call with Davis Polk Finance and Tax teams regarding exit financing notes (0.7); call with Davis Polk Finance and Tax teams regarding exit financing notes (0.7); call with Davis Polk Finance and Tax teams regarding exit financing notes (0.7); call with Akin Gump and Milbank regarding exit financing (0.5). 31186630 Troconis, Adela 10/03/21 2.3 Call with Davis Polk Finance and Tax teams regarding exit financing debt commitment tax issue (0.1); comment on exit financing debt commitment documents (1.4). 31348952 Bane, Abraham 10/04/21 0.2 Correspondence with Milbank regarding exit financing debt commitment documents (1.4). 31365160 Blanco, Maurice 10/04/21 0.2 Correspondence with Davis Polk team regarding axis issues, cleansing issues, and exit financing debt issues. 31486165 Graulich, Timothy 10/04/21 0.5 Call with joint bidders regarding exit financing fee motion.	31365047	Blanco, Maurice	10/03/21	0.7			
31181467 Jackson, Vanessa L. 10/03/21 0.8 Call with Davis Polk Finance and Tax team regarding exit financing notes. 31222893 Jerrard, Erik 10/03/21 3.6 Draft issues list for equity commitment term sheet and related analysis (2.3); call with Davis Polk Finance and Tax teams regarding exit financing notes (0.8); call with Davis Polk Finance and Tax teams regarding exit financing notes (0.8); call with Akin Gump and Milbank regarding exit financing (0.5). 31181101 Katz, Michael 10/03/21 0.8 Call with Davis Polk Finance and Tax teams regarding exit financing notes. 31187035 Piraino, Stephen D. 10/03/21 2.2 Revise equity financing term sheet (1.0); call with Davis Polk Finance and Tax teams regarding exit financing notes (0.7); call with Davis Polk Finance with Akin Gump and Milbank regarding exit financing (0.5). 31186630 Troconis, Adela 10/03/21 2.3 Call with Davis Polk Finance and Tax teams regarding exit financing notes (0.8); correspondence with A. Siman regarding exit financing debt commitment tax issue (0.1); comment on exit financing debt commitment documents (1.4). 31348952 Bane, Abraham 10/04/21 0.2 Correspondence with Milbank regarding exit financing. 31365160 Blanco, Maurice 10/04/21 2.0 Correspondence with Davis Polk team regarding tax issues, cleansing issues, and exit financing debt care sissues. 31486165 Graulich, Timothy 10/04/21 0.5 Call with joint bidders regarding exit financing fee motion. 31191974 Huebner, Marshall S. 10/04/21 1.3 Correspondence with Aeroméxico, T. Graulich, and R. Cooper regarding exit financing.	31486141	Graulich, Timothy	10/03/21	2.3	Call with D. Botter regarding exit financing term sheet (0.6); review and revise Mexican investor		
31181467 Jackson, Vanessa L. 10/03/21 0.8 Call with Davis Polk Finance and Tax team regarding exit financing notes. 31222893 Jerrard, Erik 10/03/21 3.6 Draft issues list for equity commitment term sheet and related analysis (2.3); call with Davis Polk Finance and Tax teams regarding exit financing notes (0.8); call with Akin Gump and Milbank regarding exit financing notes. 31181101 Katz, Michael 10/03/21 0.8 Call with Davis Polk Finance and Tax teams regarding exit financing notes. 31187035 Piraino, Stephen D. 10/03/21 2.2 Revise equity financing term sheet (1.0); call with Davis Polk Finance and Tax teams regarding exit financing notes (0.7); call with Davis Polk Finance and Tax teams regarding exit financing notes (0.7); call with Davis Polk Finance and Tax teams regarding exit financing debt commitment tax issue (0.1); comment on exit financing notes (0.8); correspondence with A. Siman regarding exit financing debt commitment tax issue (0.1); comment on exit financing debt commitment documents (1.4). 31348952 Bane, Abraham 10/04/21 2.0 Correspondence with Milbank regarding exit financing. 31365160 Blanco, Maurice 10/04/21 2.0 Correspondence with Davis Polk team regarding tax issues, cleansing issues, and exit financing debt issues. 31486165 Graulich, Timothy 10/04/21 0.5 Call with joint bidders regarding exit financing fee motion. 31191974 Huebner, Marshall S. 10/04/21 1.3 Correspondence with Aeroméxico, T. Graulich, and R. Cooper regarding exit financing.	31184960	Huebner, Marshall S.	10/03/21	0.6	(0.3); correspondence with T. Graulich regarding		
31222893	31181467	Jackson, Vanessa L.	10/03/21	8.0	Call with Davis Polk Finance and Tax team		
31181101 Katz, Michael 10/03/21 0.8 Call with Davis Polk Finance and Tax teams regarding exit financing notes. 31187035 Piraino, Stephen D. 10/03/21 2.2 Revise equity financing term sheet (1.0); call with Davis Polk Finance and Tax teams regarding exit financing notes (0.7); call with Akin Gump and Milbank regarding exit financing (0.5). 31186630 Troconis, Adela 10/03/21 2.3 Call with Davis Polk Finance and Tax teams regarding exit financing notes (0.8); correspondence with A. Siman regarding exit financing debt commitment tax issue (0.1); comment on exit financing debt commitment documents (1.4). 31348952 Bane, Abraham 10/04/21 0.2 Correspondence with Milbank regarding exit financing. 31365160 Blanco, Maurice 10/04/21 2.0 Correspondence with Davis Polk team regarding tax issues, cleansing issues, and exit financing debt issues. 31486165 Graulich, Timothy 10/04/21 0.5 Call with joint bidders regarding exit financing fee motion. 31191974 Huebner, Marshall S. 10/04/21 1.3 Correspondence with Aeroméxico, T. Graulich, and R. Cooper regarding exit financing.	31222893	Jerrard, Erik	10/03/21	3.6	Draft issues list for equity commitment term sheet and related analysis (2.3); call with Davis Polk Finance and Tax teams regarding exit financing notes (0.8); call with Akin Gump and		
31187035 Piraino, Stephen D. 10/03/21 2.2 Revise equity financing term sheet (1.0); call with Davis Polk Finance and Tax teams regarding exit financing notes (0.7); call with Akin Gump and Milbank regarding exit financing (0.5). Troconis, Adela 10/03/21 2.3 Call with Davis Polk Finance and Tax teams regarding exit financing notes (0.8); correspondence with A. Siman regarding exit financing debt commitment tax issue (0.1); comment on exit financing debt commitment documents (1.4). 31348952 Bane, Abraham 10/04/21 0.2 Correspondence with Milbank regarding exit financing. 31365160 Blanco, Maurice 10/04/21 2.0 Correspondence with Davis Polk team regarding tax issues, cleansing issues, and exit financing debt issues. 31486165 Graulich, Timothy 10/04/21 0.5 Call with joint bidders regarding exit financing fee motion. 31191974 Huebner, Marshall S. 10/04/21 1.3 Correspondence with Aeroméxico, T. Graulich, and R. Cooper regarding exit financing.	31181101	Katz, Michael	10/03/21	0.8	Call with Davis Polk Finance and Tax teams		
31186630 Troconis, Adela 10/03/21 2.3 Call with Davis Polk Finance and Tax teams regarding exit financing notes (0.8); correspondence with A. Siman regarding exit financing debt commitment tax issue (0.1); comment on exit financing debt commitment documents (1.4). 31348952 Bane, Abraham 10/04/21 0.2 Correspondence with Milbank regarding exit financing. 31365160 Blanco, Maurice 10/04/21 2.0 Correspondence with Davis Polk team regarding tax issues, cleansing issues, and exit financing debt issues. 31486165 Graulich, Timothy 10/04/21 0.5 Call with joint bidders regarding exit financing fee motion. 31191974 Huebner, Marshall S. 10/04/21 1.3 Correspondence with Aeroméxico, T. Graulich, and R. Cooper regarding exit financing.	31187035	Piraino, Stephen D.	10/03/21	2.2	Revise equity financing term sheet (1.0); call with Davis Polk Finance and Tax teams regarding exit financing notes (0.7); call with Akin Gump and Milbank regarding exit financing		
31348952 Bane, Abraham 10/04/21 0.2 Correspondence with Milbank regarding exit financing. 31365160 Blanco, Maurice 10/04/21 2.0 Correspondence with Davis Polk team regarding tax issues, cleansing issues, and exit financing debt issues. 31486165 Graulich, Timothy 10/04/21 0.5 Call with joint bidders regarding exit financing fee motion. 31191974 Huebner, Marshall S. 10/04/21 1.3 Correspondence with Aeroméxico, T. Graulich, and R. Cooper regarding exit financing.	31186630	Troconis, Adela	10/03/21	2.3	Call with Davis Polk Finance and Tax teams regarding exit financing notes (0.8); correspondence with A. Siman regarding exit financing debt commitment tax issue (0.1); comment on exit financing debt commitment		
31365160 Blanco, Maurice 10/04/21 2.0 Correspondence with Davis Polk team regarding tax issues, cleansing issues, and exit financing debt issues. 31486165 Graulich, Timothy 10/04/21 0.5 Call with joint bidders regarding exit financing fee motion. 31191974 Huebner, Marshall S. 10/04/21 1.3 Correspondence with Aeroméxico, T. Graulich, and R. Cooper regarding exit financing.	31348952	Bane, Abraham	10/04/21	0.2	Correspondence with Milbank regarding exit		
31486165 Graulich, Timothy 10/04/21 0.5 Call with joint bidders regarding exit financing fee motion. 31191974 Huebner, Marshall S. 10/04/21 1.3 Correspondence with Aeroméxico, T. Graulich, and R. Cooper regarding exit financing.	31365160	Blanco, Maurice	10/04/21	2.0	Correspondence with Davis Polk team regarding tax issues, cleansing issues, and exit financing		
31191974 Huebner, Marshall S. 10/04/21 1.3 Correspondence with Aeroméxico, T. Graulich, and R. Cooper regarding exit financing.	31486165	Graulich, Timothy	10/04/21	0.5	Call with joint bidders regarding exit financing		
	31191974	Huebner, Marshall S.	10/04/21		Correspondence with Aeroméxico, T. Graulich,		

		Time De	etail By Pro	ject
Time ID	Name	Date	Hours	Narrative
31187003	Jackson, Vanessa L.	10/04/21	1.0	Call with tax advisors regarding withholding tax under notes.
31284568	Jerrard, Erik	10/04/21	8.9	Attend daily contingency update call with Aeroméxico and co-advisors (0.8) (partial attendance); review and analyze exit financing term sheets (2.6); email with A. Troconis regarding same (0.4); extensive review and revision of exit financing motion and
31186587	Katz, Michael	10/04/21	1.3	corresponding pleadings (5.1). Call with tax advisors regarding debt commitment tax issue (1.0); correspondence with Davis Polk team regarding same (0.3).
31372275	Piraino, Stephen D.	10/04/21	1.3	
31372308	Piraino, Stephen D.	10/04/21	3.4	Call with joint proponents regarding exit financing issues (1.1); call with J. Wallden regarding same (0.3); prepare foreign investment talking points (0.9); call with A. Sainz regarding exit financing issues (0.2); review and revise Mexican investor term sheet (0.9).
31186245	Rincon, Cristina M.	10/04/21	1.3	Call with Creditors Committee regarding exit financing proposal.
31218055	Troconis, Adela	10/04/21	1.2	Call with Akin Gump regarding debt term sheet (0.1); email with M. Blanco regarding same (0.1); call with tax advisors regarding debt
31365262	Blanco, Maurice	10/05/21	1.9	commitment tax issue (1.0). Email with Davis Polk team regarding exit
31486182	Graulich, Timothy	10/05/21	3.5	financing debt commitment letter. Review and comment on Mexican investor term sheet (0.4); call with R. Cooper regarding potential Apollo proposal (0.4); call with P. Tomasco regarding Mexican investor term sheet (0.5); review and revise Mexican investor term sheet (2.2).
31201198	Huebner, Marshall S.	10/05/21	1.6	Correspondence with Davis Polk team regarding exit financing (0.8); correspondence with
31192156	Hwang, Eric	10/05/21	3.5	shareholder counsel regarding same (0.8). Review case law regarding exit financing motion issue (1.7); review and revise exit financing motion (0.8); call with Aeroméxico and others regarding exit financing proposal (1.0).
31217869	Jackson, Vanessa L.	10/05/21	0.5	Call with Aeroméxico and others regarding exit financing proposal (partial attendance).
31284571	Jerrard, Erik	10/05/21	7.0	Attend daily contingency update call with Aeroméxico and co-advisors (0.9) (partial attendance); call with Aeroméxico and others regarding exit financing proposal (1.0); review and revise exit financing motion and related pleadings (3.6); call with Akin Gump and Milbank regarding Mexican investor term sheet (0.6); email with Davis Polk Corporate and Finance teams regarding exit financing documents (0.9).
31195512	Katz, Michael	10/05/21	1.7	Call with Aeroméxico and others regarding exit financing proposal (1.0); correspondence with A. Troconis and V. Jackson regarding same (0.2);

		Time De	tail By Pro	ject
Time ID	Name	Date	Hours	Narrative
31370370	Piraino, Stephen D.	10/05/21	5.6	review and revise exit financing term sheet (0.3); correspondence with A. Troconis and tax advisors regarding same (0.2). Review and revise Mexican investor term sheet (1.0); call with A. Sainz and others regarding same (0.3); call with same and investors counsel regarding same (1.0); call with counsel to joint proponents regarding exit financing (0.7); correspondence with E. Jerrard and T. Graulich regarding same (0.9); call with J. Margolin regarding Mexican investor term sheet (0.3); correspondence with M. Brod regarding same (0.7); review and revise Mexican investor term
31370384	Piraino, Stephen D.	10/05/21	0.8	sheet (0.7). Attend daily contingency update call with Aeroméxico and co-advisors (partial
31218100	Troconis, Adela	10/05/21	0.9	attendance). Email with Davis Polk team regarding exit financing debt commitment documents (0.3); call with Aeroméxico and others regarding exit financing proposal (0.2) (partial attendance); email with Akin Gump regarding same (0.2); call with M. Sutter regarding same (0.2)
31100269	Weigel, Heather	10/05/21	1.1	with M. Sutter regarding same (0.2). Attend daily contingency update call with Aeroméxico and co-advisors.
31486214	Ford, Stephen	10/06/21	1.5	Review and revise exit financing motion.
31486253	Graulich, Timothy	10/06/21	3.4	Call with H. Parkhill regarding exit financing term sheet (0.7); call with P. Tomasco regarding same (0.5); correspondence with H. Huebner regarding same (0.5); call with Judge Lane regarding mediation (1.1); review UCC counterproposal (0.6).
31206754	Huebner, Marshall S.	10/06/21	1.8	Correspondence with Davis Polk team, Rothschild, Aeroméxico, Milbank, Quinn Emmanuel, Akin Gump and others regarding shareholder issues (1.2); call with E. Jerrard, H. Parkhill, and others regarding exit financing
31196850	Hwang, Eric	10/06/21	7.5	(0.6). Correspondence with E. Jerrard on exit financing motion (0.3); review and revise exit financing motion (2.5); review and revise equity term sheet and exit financing equity term sheet letter (1.9); review and revise declaration in support of exit financing motion (2.0); coordinate with Davis Polk Finance team and advisors regarding exit financing documents (0.8).
31199110 31223733	Jackson, Vanessa L. Jerrard, Erik	10/06/21 10/06/21	1.8 14.0	Finalize exit financing commitment documents. Extensive review and revision of exit financing motion (5.6); review stakeholder comments to same (1.3); review and revise exit financing commitment letters (0.7); correspondence with E. Hwang regarding same (0.9); correspondence with A. Schwartz regarding exit financing (1.4); draft summary of exit financing motion process for Board (2.3); call with M.

Time Detail By Project						
Time ID	Name	Date	Hours	Narrative		
31199064	Katz, Michael	10/06/21	1.3	Huebner, H. Parkhill, and others regarding exit financing (0.6); call with R. Sanchez Baker, Rothschild, and others regarding debt baskets (0.5); call with bidders regarding exit financing negotiations (0.5); call with Davis Polk Restructuring team regarding exit financing motion (0.2). Revise exit financing term sheet (0.1); correspondence with A. Troconis regarding same (0.1); call with Rothschild regarding debt baskets (0.2); review exit financing term sheet in advance of call with Rothschild (0.1); review and revise exit financing letter (0.6); correspondence		
31387121	Piraino, Stephen D.	10/06/21	5.8	with A. Troconis regarding same (0.1); email with Akin Gump regarding revised draft (0.1). Call with Davis Polk Restructuring team regarding exit financing motion (0.2); prepare for same (0.2); call with joint proponents regarding		
				exit financing issues (1.2); review exit financing term sheet (1.2); prepare summary of same (1.0); call with R. Sanchez Baker, Rothschild, and others regarding debt baskets (0.6); email with Aeroméxico, Milbank, Akin Gump and others regarding exit financing term sheets (1.4).		
31240721	Steinberg, Richard J.	10/06/21	0.2	Call with Davis Polk Restructuring team regarding exit financing motion.		
31218111	Troconis, Adela	10/06/21	0.2	Call with Rothschild regarding exit financing debt commitment letters.		
31365468	Blanco, Maurice	10/07/21	1.2			
31235418	Devaren, Larenz M.	10/07/21	1.8	Review and revise exit financing commitment letter and exit financing term sheets.		
31486516	Graulich, Timothy	10/07/21	4.4	Call with D. Botter regarding exit financing term sheet (0.5); call with H. Parkhill regarding debt term sheet (1.0); call with joint bidders regarding exit financing updates (0.8); review and revise		
31212544	Huebner, Marshall S.	10/07/21	1.7	exit financing motion (2.1). Correspondence with advisors and others		
31204853	Hwang, Eric	10/07/21	11.6	regarding exit financing issues. Review and revise equity term sheet (0.7); review and revise exit financing motion, declaration, and related documents (6.6);		
31217887	Jackson, Vanessa L.	10/07/21	1.2	correspondence with Davis Polk Finance team regarding debt term sheet status (0.3); call with advisors regarding exit financing term sheets (0.3); call with Akin Gump, bidders, co-counsel, and others regarding same (0.7); call with Davis Polk team regarding exit financing status (0.5); finalize exit financing documents for filing (2.5). Call with E. Jerrard, Akin Gump, Ducera, and R. Arnold regarding debt term sheet (0.7); call with E. Jerrard, R. Arnold, and others to prepare for same (0.2) (partial attendance); call with Aeroméxico regarding exit financing debt commitment documents (0.3).		

		Time De	etail By Pro	ject
Time ID	Name	Date	Hours	Narrative
31202985	Jerrard, Erik	10/07/21	16.5	Call with Akin Gump, bidders co-counsel, and others regarding exit financing term sheets (0.7); correspondence with T. Graulich regarding exit financing process and pending filing (2.4); correspondence with E. Hwang regarding same (1.4); correspondence with S. Piraino regarding same (0.9); call with R. Arnold regarding same (0.6); call with J. Rubin regarding same (0.6); call with M. Brod regarding same (0.3); call with V. Jackson, Akin Gump, Ducera, and R. Arnold regarding debt term sheet (0.8); with V. Jackson, R. Arnold, and others to prepare for same (0.4); email with Quinn Emmanuel regarding exit financing filing (0.8); analyze Quinn Emmanuel's comments to same (0.4); email with L. Borchardt regarding listing language (0.7); review and finalize exit financing motion for filing (2.9); attend daily contingency update call with Aeroméxico and co-advisors (1.0); correspondence with T. Graulich regarding exit financing motion (0.5); call with Hughes Hubbard and others regarding same (0.4); review exit financing motion regarding same (1.1); coordinate filing of same (0.3); email with Aeroméxico regarding same (0.4).
31208553	Katz, Michael	10/07/21	3.3	Correspondence with A. Troconis and White & Case regarding collateral for the exit financing (0.5); call with financial advisors regarding debt baskets for debt term sheet (0.3); call with Akin Gump, bidders co-counsel, and others regarding exit financing term sheets (0.7); correspondence with advisors and Aeroméxico regarding comments from Akin Gump to exit financing documents (0.1); call with advisors regarding exit financing term sheets (0.3); email with tax advisors regarding exit financing letters (0.1); prepare issues list regarding same (0.7); review comments to exit financing letters (0.4); correspondence with A. Troconis and L. Devaren regarding same (0.2).
31477660 31359686	Masaro, Matthew Bruno McClammy, James I.	10/07/21 10/07/21	0.8 1.0	Review exit financing motion. Attend daily contingency update call with Aeroméxico and co-advisors.
31372617	Piraino, Stephen D.	10/07/21	5.2	Call with counsel to join proponents regarding exit financing issues (0.7); correspondence with E. Jerrard regarding same (0.9); review and revise summary of exit financing motion (0.3); call with Akin Gump and others regarding exit financing issues (1.2); review and revise issues list on exit financing issues (0.9); correspondence with Milbank team regarding same (0.2); attend daily contingency update call with Aeroméxico and co-advisors (1.0).
31218151	Troconis, Adela	10/07/21	2.2	

Time Detail By Project					
Time ID	Name	Date	Hours	Narrative	
31193338	Weigel, Heather	10/07/21	0.9	exit financing term sheets (0.7); call with R. Sanchez Baker and Rothschild regarding same (0.3); email with M. Katz regarding exit financing collateral package (0.3); review and comment on exit financing documents (0.5). Review proposed language regarding registration and listing (0.2); call with Akin Gump, bidders co-counsel, and others regarding	
31486569	Graulich, Timothy	10/08/21	2.6	exit financing term sheets (0.7). Review and finalize exit financing motion.	
31221135	Huebner, Marshall S.	10/08/21	0.4		
31210804	Hwang, Eric	10/08/21	0.3	financing term sheet. Email with Chambers regarding exit financing documents.	
31387137	Piraino, Stephen D.	10/08/21	0.7	Correspondence with E. Jerrard, Aeroméxico, and Akin Gump regarding non-disclosure	
31221079	Jerrard, Erik	10/09/21	1.2	agreement. Email with Davis Polk Corporate and Restructuring teams regarding equity subscription agreement (0.4); review equity	
31217174	Hwang, Eric	10/10/21	3.5	subscription agreement (0.8). Review and revise equity subscription	
31372740	Borchardt, Leo	10/11/21	1.8	agreement. Review and revise equity subscription agreement.	
31477728	Graulich, Timothy	10/11/21	2.5	Review equity subscription agreement (2.2); call with D. Botter regarding exit financing issues (0.3).	
31220844	Hwang, Eric	10/11/21	6.7	Review and revise equity subscription agreement (6.3); call with E. Jerrard and A.	
31220309	Jerrard, Erik	10/11/21	3.5	Simmonds regarding same (0.4). Review and revise equity subscription agreement (3.1); call with E. Hwang and others regarding same (0.4).	
31372944	Piraino, Stephen D.	10/11/21	0.7	Attend daily contingency update call with Aeroméxico and co-advisors.	
31241034	Simmonds, Alexander W.	10/11/21	2.1	Review and revise equity subscription agreement (1.4); call with E. Jerrard and E. Hwang regarding same (0.4); correspondence with L. Borchardt and H. Weigel regarding equity subscription agreement, listing, and registration (0.2); correspondence with counsel to Ad Hoc Group regarding listing and registration (0.1).	
31372787	Borchardt, Leo	10/12/21	3.7	,	
31477838	Graulich, Timothy	10/12/21	2.0	Call with joint bidders regarding exit financing term sheet (0.7); call with same regarding Mexican investors issue (0.8); call with A. Conesa regarding exit financing term sheet (0.5);	
31236525	Huebner, Marshall S.	10/12/21	0.9	Correspondence with Aeroméxico management and T. Graulich regarding exit financing process.	

	Time Detail By Project					
Time ID	Name	Date	Hours	Narrative		
31231527	Hwang, Eric	10/12/21	0.7	Correspondence with Davis Polk team regarding equity term sheet.		
31257185	Jerrard, Erik	10/12/21	3.5	Call with Akin Gump, Milbank, and others regarding exit financing terms (0.7); call with joint bidder advisors and others regarding exit financing term sheet (0.9); attend daily contingency update call with Aeroméxico and co-advisors (0.9); call with Milbank and others regarding registration and listing (0.6); email with R. Sanchez Baker regarding same (0.4).		
31486593	Piraino, Stephen D.	10/12/21	4.7	Call with joint proponents regarding exit financing term sheets (0.7); preparation for same (0.7); attend daily contingency update call with Aeroméxico and co-advisors (0.9); call with Akin Gump, Milbank, and others regarding exit financing terms (0.7); correspondence with E. Jerrard regarding same (0.9); review and revise equity subscription agreement (0.8).		
31241056	Simmonds, Alexander W.	10/12/21	8.7	Extensive review and revision of equity subscription agreement (8.4); correspondence with L. Borchardt and H. Weigel regarding same (0.3).		
31221925	Weigel, Heather	10/12/21	3.4	Review and revise equity subscription agreement.		
31372804	Borchardt, Leo	10/13/21	2.1	Call with R. Sanchez Baker, E. Jerrard, and S. Robles regarding listing and registration (0.6); review and revise equity subscription agreement (1.2); correspondence with A. Simmonds regarding same (0.3).		
31486623 31244720	Graulich, Timothy Huebner, Marshall S.	10/13/21 10/13/21	3.3 1.7			
31235148	Hwang, Eric	10/13/21	3.0	Review and revise equity subscription agreement (2.6); correspondence with Davis Polk team regarding same (0.4).		
31315306	Jackson, Vanessa L.	10/13/21	0.5	Review and comment on relevant event in connection with DIP facility.		
31257280	Jerrard, Erik	10/13/21	3.8	Review revised exit financing term sheets and related analysis (2.8); call with R. Sanchez Baker, L. Borchardt, and S. Robles regarding listing and registration (0.6); call with A. Schwartz regarding exit financing (0.4).		
31370216	Piraino, Stephen D.	10/13/21	3.3			
31241211	Simmonds, Alexander W.	10/13/21	3.9	Review and revise equity subscription agreement (2.6); correspondence with L. Borchardt regarding same (0.3); correspondence with E. Hwang and E. Jerrard regarding same (0.2); correspondence with		

	Time Detail By Project				
Time ID	Name	Date	Hours	Narrative	
				Davis Polk Tax team and others regarding same (0.8).	
31251293	Troconis, Adela	10/13/21	0.4	Review and comment on relevant event in connection with DIP facility.	
31372831	Borchardt, Leo	10/14/21	1.4	Review and comment on equity subscription agreement (1.2); correspondence with A.	
31244971	Foley, Sean C.	10/14/21	8.7	Simmonds regarding same (0.2). Correspondence with C. Rincon regarding document review and production (0.9); review documents for production to Apollo and Creditors Committee (7.8).	
31486656	Graulich, Timothy	10/14/21	3.9	Call with D. Botter regarding exit financing term sheet (0.7); review and revise exit financing term sheet (3.2).	
31242432	Hwang, Eric	10/14/21	1.7	Draft notice papers (0.4); correspondence with Davis Polk team regarding distributions (0.4); correspondence with A. Simmonds and others regarding equity subscription agreement (0.6); review exit financing equity commitment letter (0.3).	
31257336	Jerrard, Erik	10/14/21	0.6	Call with joint bidder counsel regarding exit financing term sheet.	
31370114	Piraino, Stephen D.	10/14/21	8.0	Call with M. Brod regarding exit financing issues (0.2); call with Akin Gump regarding same (0.6).	
31255992	Simmonds, Alexander W.	10/14/21	3.8	Correspondence with E. Jerrard, E. Hwang, and H. Weigel regarding same (0.7); review and revise equity subscription agreement (2.6); correspondence with L. Borchardt regarding same (0.2); correspondence with Sainz Abogados and Aeroméxico regarding same (0.3).	
31274569	Zilberberg, David A.	10/14/21	1.5	Review and revise equity subscription agreement.	
31372883	Borchardt, Leo	10/15/21	2.2	Review and comment on equity subscription agreement (1.9); review emails regarding same (0.3).	
31478075	Huebner, Marshall S.	10/15/21	0.4	Attend daily contingency update call with Aeroméxico and co-advisors (partial attendance).	
31250055	Hwang, Eric	10/15/21	5.7	Draft reply outline for exit financing (2.5); draft talking points for exit financing motion (3.2).	
31289495	Jerrard, Erik	10/15/21	0.7	• • • • • • • • • • • • • • • • • • • •	
31363635	McClammy, James I.	10/15/21	1.5	Attend daily contingency update call with Aeroméxico and co-advisors (0.7); correspondence with Davis Polk team regarding Delta issues (0.8).	
31387262	Piraino, Stephen D.	10/15/21	0.4	Attend daily contingency update call with Aeroméxico and co-advisors.	
31259662	Simmonds, Alexander W.	10/15/21	0.4	Attend daily contingency update call with Aeroméxico and co-advisors (partial attendance).	
31376716	Graulich, Timothy	10/16/21	0.6	Call with counsel for bidders regarding exit financing.	
31268414 31513464	Hwang, Eric Graulich, Timothy	10/16/21 10/18/21	0.1 1.0	Review update on exit financing timeline. Correspondence with S. Piraino and E. Jerrard	

	Time Detail By Project					
Time ID	Name	Date	Hours	Narrative		
31264630	Hwang, Eric	10/18/21	0.2	regarding equity subscription agreement. Review comments to equity subscription agreement.		
31260837	Jerrard, Erik	10/18/21	6.1	Call with E. Hwang to discuss equity exit financing (0.2); review and revise equity subscription agreement (3.8); email with Davis Polk Restructuring and Finance team relating to same (0.2); attend daily contingency update call with Aeroméxico and co-advisors (1.0); correspondence with S. Piraino regarding same (0.2); correspondence with T. Graulich regarding same (0.7).		
31362667	McClammy, James I.	10/18/21	1.0	Attend daily contingency update call with Aeroméxico and co-advisors.		
31387456	Piraino, Stephen D.	10/18/21	3.3	Review and revise equity subscription agreement (2.1); correspondence with T. Graulich regarding same (1.0); call with M. Brod regarding exit financing issues (0.2).		
31372865	Borchardt, Leo	10/19/21	0.4	Review equity subscription agreement.		
31545183	Graulich, Timothy	10/19/21	3.2			
31273745	Hwang, Eric	10/19/21	0.1	Review correspondence regarding equity subscription agreement.		
31319079	Jerrard, Erik	10/19/21	2.9	Review and revise governance term sheet revised draft from Quinn Emmanuel (1.3); call with Hughes Hubbard regarding exit financing (0.6); attend daily contingency update call with Aeroméxico and co-advisors (1.0).		
31362710	McClammy, James I.	10/19/21	1.0	,		
31387463	Piraino, Stephen D.	10/19/21	1.7	Attend daily contingency update call with Aeroméxico and co-advisors(1.0); correspondence with Davis Polk team regarding exit financing issues. (0.7).		
31271425	Rincon, Cristina M.	10/19/21	1.0	Call with Skyworks and AlixPartners regarding exit financing proposal.		
31291655	Simmonds, Alexander W.	10/19/21	1.4	Review and revise equity subscription agreement (0.9); correspondence with A. Siman regarding exit financing (0.3); correspondence with Sainz Abogados team regarding tax provisions to equity subscription agreement (0.2).		
31380621	Steinberg, Richard J.	10/19/21	0.5	Correspondence with E. White regarding Deutsche Bank and Amex stay stipulation (0.2); revise same (0.3).		
31277277	Hwang, Eric	10/20/21	0.9	Attend daily contingency update call with Aeroméxico and co-advisors.		
31314766 31324434	Jackson, Vanessa L. Jerrard, Erik	10/20/21 10/20/21	0.3 5.8	Review amendment to exit financing document. Call with AlixPartners and Rothschild regarding convenience class analysis (0.5); call with Hughes Hubbard regarding exit financing (0.5); call with Akin Gump and Ducera regarding same (0.6); call with Akin Gump, Milbank Tweed, and Ducera regarding same (0.6); call with Gibson Dunn regarding exit financing process (0.3); review draft amendment to DIP facility (0.4); email with V. Jackson and T. Graulich regarding		

		Time De	etail By Pro	ject
Time ID	Name	Date	Hours	Narrative
				same (0.6); review and update exit financing
31422756	Jerrard, Erik	10/20/21	1.1	commitment term sheet (2.3). Attend daily contingency update call with
21422760	McClammy James I	10/20/21	2.2	Aeroméxico and co-advisors.
31422769	McClammy, James I.	10/20/21	2.3	Attend daily contingency update call with Aeroméxico and co-advisors (1.0); analyze
21545100	Diraina Stanhan D	10/20/21	2.0	Delta proposal (1.3). Call with joint proponents regarding term sheets
31545198	Piraino, Stephen D.	10/20/21	3.0	(1.0); review term sheets (0.9); attend daily
				contingency update call with Aeroméxico and
31380738	Steinberg, Richard J.	10/20/21	0.6	co-advisors (1.1). Call with Cleary Gottlieb regarding Deutsche
	•			Bank and Amex stay stipulation (0.2); email with
31372899	Borchardt, Leo	10/21/21	1.4	E. White and S. Piraino regarding same (0.4). Review and comment on equity term sheet and
04540005		40/04/04	0.0	exit financing equity commitment letter.
31513625	Graulich, Timothy	10/21/21	3.3	Review revised equity term sheet (2.2); correspondence with E. Jerrard regarding equity
				term sheet (0.5); call with A. Sainz regarding
31286760	Hwang, Eric	10/21/21	4.1	tender offer (0.6). Draft exit financing reply summary (1.1); call
	0 ,			with Davis Polk Corporate and Restructuring
				teams regarding exit commitment term sheet (0.5); correspondence with E. Jerrard regarding
				updates to same (0.3); review and revise equity
31324948	Jerrard, Erik	10/21/21	8.2	documents (2.2). Call with Hughes Hubbard, Akin Gump, and
	•			Milbank regarding exit financing commitment
				letter (0.6); analyze equity financing issues relating to term sheet (0.8); review and revise
				exit financing equity commitment letter and term
				sheet (1.2); email with E. Hwang regarding same (0.4); review and revise equity
				subscription agreement (3.1); call with Davis
				Polk Restructuring and Corporate teams regarding equity commitment term sheet (0.5);
				attend daily contingency update call with
				Aeroméxico and co-advisors (1.0); call with Sainz Abogados, counsel and Mexican counsel
				to joint bidders regarding Mexican tender offer
31422781	McClammy, James I.	10/21/21	1.9	(0.6). Attend daily contingency update call with
31422701	McClailling, James I.	10/21/21	1.5	Aeroméxico and co-advisors (1.0); analyze
31401562	Diraina Stanhan D	10/21/21	1.9	Delta term sheet (0.9). Attend daily contingency update call with
31401302	Piraino, Stephen D.	10/21/21	1.9	Action daily contingency update call with Aeroméxico and co-advisors (0.8) (partial
				attendance); call with Hughes Hubbard, Akin
				Gump, and Milbank regarding exit financing commitment letter (0.6); call with Davis Polk
				Corporate and Restructuring teams regarding
31292016	Simmonds, Alexander	10/21/21	2.8	equity commitment term sheet (0.5). Review exit financing equity commitment letter
	W.		-	(0.3); review and revise equity term sheet (1.8);
				call with Davis Polk Corporate and Restructuring teams regarding equity commitment term sheet
				(0.5); correspondence with L. Borchardt and E.

	Time Detail By Project					
Time ID	Name	Date	Hours	Narrative		
31380836	Steinberg, Richard J.	10/21/21	0.2	Jerrard (0.2). Review Deutsche Bank and Amex stay		
				stipulation.		
31372913	Borchardt, Leo	10/22/21	0.6	Call with Ad Hoc Group advisors regarding equity commitment term sheet (0.4); call with A.		
31513739	Graulich, Timothy	10/22/21	2.2	Simmonds regarding same (0.2). Review revised equity term sheet.		
31292873	Hwang, Eric	10/22/21	0.9	Draft exit financing reply summary (0.5);		
				correspondence with A. Simmonds and others on exit financing (0.4).		
31422787	Jerrard, Erik	10/22/21	4.5	Attend daily contingency update call with		
				Aeroméxico and co-advisors (1.0); call with Ad		
				Hoc Group advisors regarding equity commitment term sheet (0.4); call with Akin		
				Gump regarding same (0.3); analyze equity exit		
				financing issues (1.3); review equity subscription		
				agreement comments (1.1); correspondence with A. Siman regarding same (0.4).		
31379494	Krishnan, Rahul	10/22/21	0.4	Call with Ad Hoc Group Advisors regarding		
24264007	McClammy James I	10/00/01	2.2	equity commitment term sheet.		
31361887	McClammy, James I.	10/22/21	2.3	Attend daily contingency update call with Aeroméxico and co-advisors (1.0); review Delta		
				proposal (0.5); correspondence with Davis Polk		
31401753	Piraino, Stephen D.	10/22/21	2.7	team regarding Delta proposal (0.8). Attend daily contingency update call with		
31401733	i ilaillo, otephen b.	10/22/21	2.1	Aeroméxico and co-advisors (1.0); extensive		
				correspondence with Akin Gump and Milbank		
31293875	Rincon, Cristina M.	10/22/21	1.0	regarding exit financing documents (1.7). Attend daily contingency update call with		
01200070	rancon, onsuna w.	10/22/21	1.0	Aeroméxico and co-advisors.		
31297723	Simmonds, Alexander	10/22/21	0.9	Call with Ad Hoc Group advisors regarding		
	W.			equity commitment term sheet (0.4); call with L. Borchardt regarding same (0.2); review Davis		
				Polk Tax team and Sainz Abogados		
				correspondence regarding equity subscription agreement (0.3).		
31380944	Steinberg, Richard J.	10/22/21	0.2	Correspondence to Chambers regarding		
				Deutsche Bank and Amex stay stipulation.		
31245284	Weigel, Heather	10/22/21	0.4	Call with Ad Hoc Group advisors regarding equity commitment term sheet.		
31372925	Borchardt, Leo	10/23/21	1.2	Review and comment on revised exit financing		
21209670	Hwong Erio	10/23/21	2.0	equity commitment letter and equity term sheet.		
31298670	Hwang, Eric	10/23/21	3.0	Review and revise equity term sheet (1.5); draft issues list on same (1.5).		
31298768	Jerrard, Erik	10/23/21	2.2	Review and revise exit financing equity		
				commitment letter (0.4); review and revise equity subscription agreement (1.8).		
31318081	Simmonds, Alexander	10/23/21	4.8	Review and comment on exit financing equity		
	W.			commitment letter and equity commitment term		
				sheet (1.4); correspondence with E. Jerrard, E. Hwang, L. Borchardt, and Davis Polk Tax team		
				regarding same (0.7); review and revise equity		
21200274	Hwong Fris	10/24/24	0.0	subscription agreement (2.7).		
31300374	Hwang, Eric	10/24/21	0.9	Review and revise equity documents (0.5); correspondence with creditor groups regarding		
				same (0.4).		

	Time Detail By Project				
Time ID	Name	Date	Hours	Narrative	
31299995	Jerrard, Erik	10/24/21	2.1	Review and revise equity subscription agreement (1.7); email with E. Hwang regarding same (0.4).	
31318116	Simmonds, Alexander W.	10/24/21	0.4	Correspondence with E. Jerrard and E. Hwang regarding equity commitment term sheet (0.3); correspondence with J. Donnelly regarding exit financing issues (0.1).	
31362276 31372852	Blanco, Maurice Borchardt, Leo	10/25/21 10/25/21	0.8 3.8	Review exit financing debt commitment letter. Call with Davis Polk Corporate and Restructuring teams regarding equity commitment term sheet (0.6); review and revise equity subscription agreement and related term sheet (1.8); review precedents regarding same (1.4).	
31304667	Hwang, Eric	10/25/21	2.1	Call with E. Jerrard regarding exit financing next steps (0.4); review equity subscription agreement rider (0.9); call with L. Borchardt and others regarding exit financing documents (0.5); review comments to equity subscription agreement (0.3).	
31313174	Jackson, Vanessa L.	10/25/21	0.6	Review revised exit financing commitment documents.	
31327942	Jerrard, Erik	10/25/21	5.9	Call with Davis Polk Corporate and Restructuring teams regarding equity commitment term sheet (0.6); review and revise equity subscription agreement (0.7); review and revise issues list regarding same (0.4); email with A. Simmonds regarding subscription agreement feedback (0.6); call with E. Hwang regarding exit financing next steps (0.4); call with Hughes Hubbard, Akin Gump, and Milbank regarding exit financing (0.9); email with Davis Polk Finance team regarding exit debt financing commitment next steps (0.4); call with Akin Gump and Milbank Tweed regarding exit financing issues (0.7); attend daily contingency update call with Aeroméxico and co-advisor (1.0); prepare for same (0.2).	
31309429	Katz, Michael	10/25/21	0.1	Review correspondence regarding exit financing.	
31428499	McClammy, James I.	10/25/21	1.0	Attend daily contingency update call with Aeroméxico and co-advisors.	
31428503	Piraino, Stephen D.	10/25/21	6.6	Attend daily contingency update call with Aeroméxico and co-advisors (1.0); prepare for same (0.4); prepare issues list regarding exit financing (0.7); call with M. Brod regarding term sheets (0.3); call with Sainz Abogados and Milbank Tweed regarding exit financing issues (0.6); call with joint bidders regarding exit financing term sheet (0.4); correspondence with T. Graulich regarding same and exit financing issues (0.7); call with Akin Gump, Milbank and Hughes Hubbard regarding term sheets (1.1); review revised term sheets (0.7); email with M. Huebner and T. Graulich regarding same (0.5); email with P. Tomasco and M. Brod regarding	

Time Detail By Project					
Time ID	Name	Date	Hours	Narrative	
31327477	Simmonds, Alexander W.	10/25/21	2.8	exit financing issue (0.2). Correspondence with A. Siman regarding exit financing issues (0.4); revise equity subscription agreement (0.7); call with Davis Polk Corporate and Restructuring teams regarding equity comment term sheet (0.6); prepare equity	
31379371	Steinberg, Richard J.	10/25/21	0.5	subscription issues list (1.1). Review exit financing equity commitment letter (0.3); correspondence with Chambers regarding Deutsche Bank and Amex stay stipulation (0.1); cmail to Clean Cottling regarding same (0.1)	
31358506	Troconis, Adela	10/25/21	1.3	email to Cleary Gottlieb regarding same (0.1). Review and comment on exit debt commitment documents.	
31514133	Graulich, Timothy	10/26/21	2.3	Call with D. Botter regarding joint bid (0.5); review revised exit financing term sheet (1.2); call with B. Miller and T. Goren regarding same (0.6).	
31428571	Huebner, Marshall S.	10/26/21	1.3	Attend daily contingency update call with Aeroméxico and co-advisors (1.0); correspondence with advisors regarding exit financing issues (0.3).	
31334733	Huebner, Marshall S.	10/26/21	0.6	Review and analyze issues regarding exit financing proposal.	
31370099	Hwang, Eric	10/26/21	0.6	Review equity document revisions.	
31428508	Jerrard, Erik	10/26/21	1.1	Attend daily contingency update call with Aeroméxico and co-advisors.	
31428513	Piraino, Stephen D.	10/26/21	1.5	Attend daily contingency update call with Aeroméxico and co-advisors (1.0); call with M. Brod regarding exit financing issues (0.2); revise exit financing term sheet (0.3).	
31314724	Rincon, Cristina M.	10/26/21	0.9	Attend daily contingency update call with Aeroméxico and co-advisors.	
31327592	Simmonds, Alexander W.	10/26/21	1.7	Correspondence with A. Siman regarding exit financing issues (0.2); review and revise equity subscription agreement (0.8); correspondence with Rothschild and Sainz Abogados teams regarding equity subscription agreement open items (0.4); correspondence with A. Burke and D. Herts regarding same (0.3).	
31379128	Steinberg, Richard J.	10/26/21	0.2	• • • • • • • • • • • • • • • • • • • •	
31514261	Ford, Stephen	10/27/21	2.2	Review Apollo letter and Davis Polk proposed response (1.0); correspondence with Davis Polk team regarding Apollo response letter (0.8); review exit financing proposal (0.4).	
31514177 31334874	Graulich, Timothy Huebner, Marshall S.	10/27/21 10/27/21	2.2 3.6	Review equity subscription agreement. Correspondence with Aeromexico, PJT Partners, Delta, Rothschild, Davis Polk, and creditor representatives regarding Apollo offer and valuation and considerations.	
31322251	Hwang, Eric	10/27/21	0.3	Review correspondence regarding equity subscription agreement.	
31326556	Jackson, Vanessa L.	10/27/21	0.4	Call with Davis Polk Restructuring and Finance teams regarding Apollo letter.	
31324071	Jerrard, Erik	10/27/21	1.9	Call with co-advisors regarding response to notice of default (0.8); attend daily contingency	

		Time De	etail By Pro	ject
Time ID	Name	Date	Hours	Narrative
				update call with Aeroméxico and co-advisors (1.1).
31325286	Katz, Michael	10/27/21	0.4	Call with Davis Polk Restructuring and Finance teams regarding Apollo letter.
31428522	McClammy, James I.	10/27/21	1.0	Attend daily contingency update call with Aeroméxico and co-advisors.
31511068	Parrott, Andy T.	10/27/21	0.4	Call with Willkie Farr and Paul Weiss regarding exit financing.
31428536	Piraino, Stephen D.	10/27/21	1.3	Attend daily contingency update call with Aeroméxico and co-advisors (1.1); prepare for same (0.2).
31327678	Simmonds, Alexander W.	10/27/21	0.8	Revise equity subscription agreement (0.3); correspondence with S. Robles regarding same (0.3); correspondence with D. Herts regarding same (0.2).
31363089	Troconis, Adela	10/27/21	0.4	Call with Rothschild, Sainz Abogados, AlixPartners and Davis Polk team regarding response to Apollo letter.
31514372	Graulich, Timothy	10/28/21	0.6	Correspondence with E. Jerrard regarding equity issues.
31343930	Huebner, Marshall S.	10/28/21	2.8	Email with financial advisors regarding exit financing issues (0.5); correspondence with Aeromexico and co-advisors regarding same (0.5); correspondence with Delta, advisors, and others regarding financial analysis of proposals (0.9); analyze financial analysis of proposals
31332263 31329212	Hwang, Eric Jerrard, Erik	10/28/21 10/28/21	0.9 5.0	(0.9). Review and revise equity term sheet. Attend daily contingency update call with Aeroméxico and co-advisors (1.1); call with A. Sainz Abogados, H. Parkhill, and others regarding exit financing (1.2); email with Davis Polk Restructuring team regarding same (1.3); call with advisors to joint bidders regarding same (0.7); email with L. Borchardt and A. Simmonds regarding update on deal term
31377237	Krishnan, Rahul	10/28/21	3.0	regarding same (0.7). Coordinate production of documents (0.8); prepare materials for deposition preparation (2.2).
31513096	McClammy, James I.	10/28/21	1.0	Attend daily contingency update call with Aeroméxico and co-advisors.
31379353	Piraino, Stephen D.	10/28/21	2.3	Call with D. Abbott regarding term sheets (0.2); call with advisors to joint bidders regarding exit financing (0.7); correspondence with E. Jerrard regarding same (1.0); call with M. Brod
31337289	Simmonds, Alexander W.	10/28/21	1.2	regarding exit financing matters (0.4). Correspondence with E. Jerrard and AlixPartners regarding subscription agreement (0.4); review and revise subscription agreement (0.5); correspondence with Sainz Abogados regarding same (0.3).
31369911	Huebner, Marshall S.	10/29/21	2.6	Correspondence with Aeroméxico, financial advisors, Davis Polk team and creditor representatives regarding new bid, financial analysis, and positions of multiple parties

		Time De	etail By Pro	iect
Time ID	Name	Date	Hours	Narrative
31341318	Hwang, Eric	10/29/21	1.2	regarding same. Review transaction proposal (0.7); correspondence with Davis Polk team regarding same (0.5).
31348604	Jerrard, Erik	10/29/21	3.1	Call with Creditors Committee advisors, joint bidders, and principals regarding exit financing proposal revisions (0.8); review joint bidder proposal (1.2); correspondence with S. Piraino regarding same (0.4); attend daily contingency update call with Aeroméxico and co-advisors (0.7).
31357527	McClammy, James I.	10/29/21	1.0	Attend daily contingency update call with Aeroméxico and co-advisors.
31378694	Piraino, Stephen D.	10/29/21	1.1	Call with Creditors Committee advisors, joint bidders, and principals regarding exit financing proposal revisions (0.8); correspondence with M. Brod regarding exit financing issues (0.3).
31428545	Rincon, Cristina M.	10/29/21	0.6	Attend daily contingency update call with Aeroméxico and co-advisors.
31361876	Simmonds, Alexander W.	10/29/21	0.4	Revise subscription agreement.
31376255	Steinberg, Richard J.	10/29/21	0.4	Email with the Aeroméxico regarding Deutsche Bank and Amex facility (0.1); review agreements regarding same (0.3).
31514633	Jerrard, Erik	10/30/21	0.8	Call with R. Arnold and Creditors Committee advisors regarding joint bidder proposal calculation.
31360976	Piraino, Stephen D.	10/30/21	0.5	Call with co-advisors regarding exit financing issues (partial attendance).
31369754	Huebner, Marshall S.	10/31/21	2.3	Call with Aeroméxico, AlixPartners, and Rothschild regarding bidding update (1.1); correspondence with Apollo and Creditors Committee regarding joint bidders issues (1.2).
31545278	Jerrard, Erik	10/31/21	1.2	review and revise response to notice of default (0.8); email with Davis Polk team and coadvisors regarding same (0.4);
31360905	Piraino, Stephen D.	10/31/21	1.8	Call with Cleary Gottlieb regarding Chambers conference (0.1); correspondence with E. Jerrard regarding exit financing matters (0.3); call with Aeroméxico team and co-advisors regarding exit financing matter (1.0); review revised equity term sheet (0.4).
31351473	Rincon, Cristina M.	10/31/21	1.1	Call with Aeroméxico, AlixPartners, and Rothschild regarding bidding update.
Total AM190	Financing		454.2	
	eral Case Administration			
31241976	Altman, Olivia	10/01/21	1.0	Prepare and file Disclosure Statement motion (0.5); prepare and file Disclosure Statement
31194032	Giddens, Magali	10/01/21	2.6	(0.5). Correspondence with M. Masaro regarding Plan and Disclosure Statement filing (0.1); call with J. Saraceni regarding same (0.2); correspondence with S. Ford regarding Plan filing (0.5); prepare Plan for filing (0.2);file same (0.3); review Plan

Time Detail By Project				
Time ID	Name	Date	Hours	Narrative
24457456	larmand Frile	40/04/04	0.4	(0.9); review Disclosure Statement (0.4).
31157456	Jerrard, Erik	10/01/21	0.4	Call with A. Feld to discuss cleansing.
31370577 31179237	Piraino, Stephen D. Jerrard, Erik	10/01/21 10/02/21	0.5 1.7	Call with Akin Gump regarding cleansing. Analyze cleansing issues (1.3); email with
311/923/	Jenaiu, Enk	10/02/21	1.7	restricted parties regarding same (0.4).
31473510	Melcer, Moshe	10/02/21	0.5	Draft notice of hearing adjournment of air lease
01110010	Melder, Meerle	10/02/21	0.0	hearing.
31222899	Jerrard, Erik	10/03/21	1.5	Email with M. Melcer regarding case hearing
				status (0.3); email with M. Sutter regarding
				cleansing (0.4); analyze related Non-Disclosure
				Statement issue (0.8).
31181445	Melcer, Moshe	10/03/21	1.5	Correspondence with S. Szanzer and T. Green
				regarding notice of hearing adjournment
				regarding ALC (0.1); revise same (0.4);
				correspondence with T. Green regarding outstanding fleet workstreams (0.5); review and
				comment on revised draft of order from counsel
				to aircraft lessor (0.5).
31473521	Szanzer, Steven Z.	10/03/21	0.3	Correspondence with M. Melcer regarding
	,			notice of hearing adjournment regarding ALC.
31244226	Altman, Olivia	10/04/21	0.5	File Fifth Supplemental Declaration (0.3);
				correspondence with M. Masaro and Epiq
				regarding service of Fifth Supplemental
				Declaration (0.2).
31249702	Giddens, Magali	10/04/21	2.8	Correspondence with M. Melcer regarding filings
				(0.1); prepare documents for filing, including
				omnibus claims objection motion, notice of hearing, and notice of hearing adjournment
				(0.7); file omnibus claims objection notice (0.3);
				file notice of hearing (0.3); file notice of hearing
				adjournment (0.3); correspondence with Epiq
				regarding service of same (0.2); review
				documents regarding same (0.9).
31486163	Graulich, Timothy	10/04/21	1.9	Call with D. Botter regarding cleansing materials
				(0.6); call with A. Schwartz regarding case
24402700	lamand Fulls	40/04/04	0.7	status (1.3).
31183728	Jerrard, Erik	10/04/21	2.7	Email with Aeroméxico regarding cleansing issues (0.7); email with Akin Gump regarding
				same (0.3); call with M. Sutter and others
				regarding cleansing (0.4); draft supplemental
				cleansing language (1.3).
31477631	Masaro, Matthew Bruno	10/04/21	1.1	Correspondence with M. Melcer and Epiq
				regarding service and other issues related to
				Disclosure Statement motion.
31485834	Piraino, Stephen D.	10/04/21	0.7	Correspondence with Davis Polk team and
04.470500	0	40/04/04	0.0	Rothschild regarding cleansing.
31473539	Szanzer, Steven Z.	10/04/21	0.6	Review and revise notice of hearing
				adjournment regarding same (0.4); correspondence with M. Melcer regarding same
				(0.2).
31223425	Jerrard, Erik	10/05/21	2.8	Email with M. Sutter regarding cleansing (0.6);
	· · -·· -·, - · · · ·	· • ·	2.0	prepare for weekly Davis Polk Restructuring
				team call (1.7); correspondence with T. Graulich
				and S. Piraino regarding case updates (0.5).
31195386	Melcer, Moshe	10/05/21	0.4	Revise case status summary.
31351692	Bane, Abraham	10/06/21	1.0	Attend weekly call with Davis Polk restructuring

Time Detail By Project					
Time ID	Name	Date	Hours	Narrative	
31365384	Blanco, Maurice	10/06/21	0.5	team (0.6); prepare for same (0.4). Email with Davis Polk team regarding case status.	
31197173	Ford, Stephen	10/06/21	0.5	Attend weekly workstreams call with Davis Polk Restructuring team.	
31178880	Garg, Paavani	10/06/21	0.5	Attend weekly workstreams call with Davis Polk Restructuring team.	
31351082	Graulich, Timothy	10/06/21	1.0	Attend weekly workstreams call with Davis Polk Restructuring team (0.6); prepare for same (0.4).	
31204611	Hanson, Cole	10/06/21	0.5	Attend weekly workstreams call with Davis Polk Restructuring team.	
31196803	Jerrard, Erik	10/06/21	1.6	Attend weekly workstreams call with Davis Polk Restructuring team (0.6); revise case status summary (0.8); correspondence with M. Melcer regarding same (0.2).	
31197196	Masaro, Matthew Bruno	10/06/21	0.6	Attend weekly workstreams call with Davis Polk Restructuring team.	
31197106	Melcer, Moshe	10/06/21	0.8	Attend weekly workstreams call with Davis Polk Restructuring team (0.6); draft summary of same (0.2).	
31387111	Piraino, Stephen D.	10/06/21	0.5	Attend weekly workstreams call with Davis Polk Restructuring team (partial attendance).	
31240723	Steinberg, Richard J.	10/06/21	0.5	Attend weekly workstreams call with Davis Polk Restructuring team.	
31238817	Sturm, Josh	10/06/21	1.0	Attend weekly workstreams call with Davis Polk Restructuring team (0.6); correspondence regarding same (0.4).	
31207419	Szanzer, Steven Z.	10/06/21	0.8	Attend weekly workstreams call with Davis Polk Restructuring team (0.6); review case status summary (0.2).	
31244360	Altman, Olivia	10/07/21	0.9	Prepare and file TEAM and Wings fleet motions (0.4); file Aerovias Rule 9019 Jet Leasing motion (0.1); file exit financing motion (0.2); correspondence with M. Moshe and E. Hwang regarding motions (0.1); correspondence with Epiq regarding service (0.1).	
31246497	Giddens, Magali	10/07/21	4.2	Research regarding Disclosure Statement hearing transcripts (3.0); file motion to extend exclusivity periods (0.3); correspondence with E. Hwang regarding exit financing motion filing (0.2); review court filings (0.7).	
31477310	Hwang, Eric	10/07/21	0.4	()	
31477303	Jerrard, Erik	10/07/21	2.2		
31246016	Altman, Olivia	10/08/21	0.4	Coordinate unredacted documents for court.	
31249502 31351791	Giddens, Magali Graulich, Timothy	10/08/21 10/08/21	0.2 0.8	Call with A. Schwartz and A. Conesa regarding	
31221999	Jerrard, Erik	10/08/21	1.7	case status. Coordinate Non-Disclosure Agreement cleansing (1.3); email with restricted holders and	

	Time Detail By Project					
Time ID	Name	Date	Hours	Narrative		
31228716	Huebner, Marshall S.	10/11/21	0.3	S. Piraino regarding same (0.4). Email with Davis Polk team regarding case updates.		
31244484	Dekhtyar, Mariya	10/12/21	0.1	Review case status summary.		
31232367	Melcer, Moshe	10/12/21	0.6	Review and revise case status summary.		
31296282	Altman, Olivia	10/13/21	1.0	File Yamasa fleet motions and notice of cancellation of hearing (0.8); correspondence with Epiq regarding service (0.2).		
31247561	Bane, Abraham	10/13/21	0.9	Attend weekly workstreams call with Davis Polk Restructuring team.		
31244558	Dekhtyar, Mariya	10/13/21	0.8	Attend weekly workstreams call with Davis Polk Restructuring team (partial attendance).		
31230824	Garg, Paavani	10/13/21	8.0	Attend weekly workstreams call with Davis Polk Restructuring team (partial attendance).		
31370785	Graulich, Timothy	10/13/21	1.0	Attend weekly workstreams call with Davis Polk Restructuring team.		
31235153	Hanson, Cole	10/13/21	0.9	Attend weekly workstreams call with Davis Polk Restructuring team.		
31477432	Hwang, Eric	10/13/21	0.9	Attend weekly workstreams call with Davis Polk Restructuring team.		
31234737	Jerrard, Erik	10/13/21	2.7	Attend weekly workstreams call with Davis Polk Restructuring team (1.0); prepare for same (1.3); call with A. Schwartz regarding case updates (0.2); correspondence with M. Melcer regarding same (0.2).		
31233769	Masaro, Matthew Bruno	10/13/21	1.0	Attend weekly workstreams call with Davis Polk Restructuring team.		
31235033	Melcer, Moshe	10/13/21	1.2	Attend weekly workstreams call with Davis Polk Restructuring team and take notes (1.0); revise case status summary (0.2).		
31370193	Piraino, Stephen D.	10/13/21	1.0	Attend weekly workstreams call with Davis Polk Restructuring team.		
31240657	Steinberg, Richard J.	10/13/21	0.9	Attend weekly workstreams call with Davis Polk Restructuring team.		
31249747	Sturm, Josh	10/13/21	1.1	Attend weekly workstreams call with Davis Polk Restructuring team (1.0); review case status summary (0.1).		
31244940	Szanzer, Steven Z.	10/13/21	1.0	Attend weekly workstreams call with Davis Polk Restructuring team.		
31279200	Giddens, Magali	10/14/21	0.3	File Certificates of No Objection regarding Jupiter lease motion and Jupiter sealing motion (0.2); correspondence with M. Melcer regarding same (0.1).		
31246028	Melcer, Moshe	10/14/21	0.1	Email with Chambers regarding filed motions.		
31296371	Altman, Olivia	10/15/21	0.9	File Plan and Disclosure Statement and notices of filing same (0.5); file Avolon fleet motions and declaration (0.4).		
31279341	Giddens, Magali	10/15/21	1.3	Correspondence with R. Steinberg regarding notice of adjournment of Disclosure Statement motion, Commitment Letter motion, and ALC motion (0.1); prepare for and file same (0.2); correspondence with R. Steinberg regarding dock entry modifications (0.1); request		

Time Detail By Project					
Time ID	Name	Date	Hours	Narrative	
				modification (0.1); correspondence with M. Masaro regarding filing Sixth Notice of Assumption motion (0.1); prepare same for filing and file same (0.2); correspondence with Epiq regarding service of documents (0.1); review notice of assumption and notice of adjournment	
31266589	Healy, Laura	10/15/21	0.4	(0.4). Correspondence with C. Rincon and Consilio regarding production.	
31247971	Jerrard, Erik	10/15/21	1.4	Prepare for Chambers conference.	
31279484	Giddens, Magali	10/16/21	0.7	Correspondence with R. Steinberg regarding filing notice of adjournment (0.1); prepare same for filing (0.1); file same (0.2); correspondence with Epiq regarding same (0.1); review docket filings (0.2).	
31262290	Huebner, Marshall S.	10/16/21	0.5	Correspondence with T. Graulich regarding case updates.	
31254358	Jerrard, Erik	10/16/21	2.3	Review and revise notice and coordinate filing (0.5); correspondence with S. Piraino regarding case timeline (0.4); email with Davis Polk team regarding same (0.8); email with counsel to stakeholders regarding same (0.6).	
31255341	Melcer, Moshe	10/16/21	0.2	Correspondence with R. Steinberg regarding workstreams.	
31515115	Steinberg, Richard J.	10/16/21	0.8	Prepare notice of adjournment regarding Disclosure Statement motion and other motions (0.6); correspondence with E. Jerrard regarding same (0.2).	
31279102	Healy, Laura	10/18/21	0.5	Correspondence with C. Rincon regarding document production.	
31387453	Piraino, Stephen D.	10/18/21	1.7	Call with Aeroméxico regarding case updates (1.0); correspondence with E. Jerrard regarding case updates (0.7).	
31515168	Bane, Abraham	10/19/21	0.5	Draft notice of cancellation of October 21 hearing (0.4); correspondence with E. Jerrard regarding same (0.1).	
31278122 31319070	Huebner, Marshall S. Jerrard, Erik	10/19/21 10/19/21	0.3 1.6	0 0 1	
31341558	Altman, Olivia	10/20/21	1.0	File notice of cancellation and notice of interim fee hearing (0.4); file Certificates of No Objection regarding exclusivity extension motion, total asset management motion, and related sealing motion (0.6).	
31313569	Bane, Abraham	10/20/21	0.9	Attend weekly workstreams call with Davis Polk Restructuring team.	
31313534	Dekhtyar, Mariya	10/20/21	0.8	Attend weekly workstreams call with Davis Polk Restructuring team (partial attendance).	
31277223	Garg, Paavani	10/20/21	0.9	Attend weekly workstreams call with Davis Polk Restructuring team.	
31377253	Graulich, Timothy	10/20/21	0.7	Attend weekly workstreams call with Davis Polk Restructuring team (partial attendance).	
31276757	Jerrard, Erik	10/20/21	1.5	Attend weekly workstreams call with Davis Polk Restructuring team (1.0); review and revise update of workstreams (0.3); call with S. Piraino regarding case updates (0.2).	

Time Detail By Project					
Time ID	Name	Date	Hours	Narrative	
31277196	Melcer, Moshe	10/20/21	1.0	Attend weekly workstreams call with Davis Polk	
31387789	Piraino, Stephen D.	10/20/21	1.2	Restructuring team (1.0); call with E. Jerrard	
31380662	Steinberg, Richard J.	10/20/21	1.0	regarding case updates (0.2). Attend weekly workstreams call with Davis Polk Restructuring team.	
31337231	Sturm, Josh	10/20/21	1.1	Attend weekly workstreams call with Davis Polk	
31287836	Szanzer, Steven Z.	10/20/21	1.2	Restructuring team. Attend weekly workstreams call with Davis Polk Restructuring team (1.0); review agenda for same (0.2).	
31341646	Altman, Olivia	10/21/21	0.4	File MPS motions (0.2); correspondence with M. Melcer regarding same (0.1); coordinate service with Epiq (0.1).	
31342437	Giddens, Magali	10/21/21	0.9	Review recent docket filings.	
31299060	Healy, Laura	10/21/21	0.4	Correspondence with L. Anastacio and P	
31307513	Huebner, Marshall S.	10/21/21	0.8	Toohey regarding collection and production. Correspondence with Aeroméxico regarding case updates (0.4); email with Davis Polk team	
31401579	Piraino, Stephen D.	10/21/21	0.7	regarding same (0.4). Review indemnity agreement (0.4); email with T.	
31342949	Giddens, Magali	10/22/21	1.0	Graulich regarding same (0.3) Correspondence with M. Dekhtyar regarding filing August and September monthly fee statements (0.1); prepare for filing (0.4); file August and September Monthly Fee Statements (0.4); correspondence with Epiq regarding same	
31306516	Healy, Laura	10/22/21	0.3	(0.1). Correspondence with C. Rincon regarding	
	·			productions.	
31300433 31306631	Jerrard, Erik Healy, Laura	10/22/21 10/23/21	0.2 0.2	Call with A. Schwartz to discuss case status. Correspondence with C. Rincon and Consilio	
31308996	Huebner, Marshall S.	10/23/21	0.5	regarding productions. Correspondence with T. Graulich regarding case status.	
31300406	Jerrard, Erik	10/23/21	2.2		
31327946	Jerrard, Erik	10/25/21	2.3		
31323896	Piraino, Stephen D.	10/25/21	8.0	Call with E. Jerrard regarding case updates.	
31375684	Altman, Olivia	10/26/21	0.3	File Certificates of No Objection regarding Yamasa aircraft motion, related sealing motion, and Aerolitoral motion.	
31369485	Giddens, Magali	10/26/21	2.1	Correspondence with M. Dekhtyar regarding filing Fourth Interim Fee Application (0.1); review same in preparation for filing (0.3); file same (0.3); correspondence with Epiq regarding same (0.1); prepare for filing and file GECAS Motions and declaration (0.4); review filed documents (0.9).	
31327297	Healy, Laura	10/26/21	1.4	` ,	
31327692	Jerrard, Erik	10/26/21	0.3	Correspondence with T. Graulich regarding case updates.	
•			74		

Time Detail By Project					
Time ID	Name	Date	Hours	Narrative	
31312490	Melcer, Moshe	10/26/21	2.6	Draft confirmation tracker and compile related precedent (2.3); revise case status summary (0.3).	
31384733	Piraino, Stephen D.	10/26/21	1.0	Correspondence with J. Eisen regarding chambers conference (0.2); coordinate Chambers conference attendance (0.4); correspondence with E. Jerrard regarding case updates (0.2); correspondence with T. Graulich regarding same (0.2).	
31514033	Rincon, Cristina M.	10/26/21	0.6	Correspondence with T. Graulich and J. McClammy regarding case updates.	
31375911	Altman, Olivia	10/27/21	0.4	File assumption notice (0.1); file fleet filings (0.2); file customer programs (0.1).	
31349774	Bane, Abraham	10/27/21	0.9	Attend weekly workstreams call with Davis Polk Restructuring team.	
31349897	Dekhtyar, Mariya	10/27/21	1.1	Attend weekly workstreams call with Davis Polk Restructuring team (1.0); review email from E. Jerrard regarding case process and timeline (0.1).	
31321931	Garg, Paavani	10/27/21	1.1		
31378461	Graulich, Timothy	10/27/21	1.0	Attend weekly workstreams call with Davis Polk Restructuring team.	
31422717	Hwang, Eric	10/27/21	0.7	Attend weekly workstreams call with Davis Polk Restructuring team (partial attendance).	
31348643	Jerrard, Erik	10/27/21	1.0	Attend weekly workstreams call with Davis Polk Restructuring team.	
31320380	Masaro, Matthew Bruno	10/27/21	1.0	Attend weekly workstreams call with Davis Polk Restructuring team.	
31322185	Melcer, Moshe	10/27/21	1.0	Attend weekly workstreams call with Davis Polk Restructuring team.	
31384769	Piraino, Stephen D.	10/27/21	1.1	Attend weekly workstreams call with Davis Polk Restructuring team.	
31377607	Steinberg, Richard J.	10/27/21	0.9	Attend weekly workstreams call with Davis Polk Restructuring team.	
31344760	Sturm, Josh	10/27/21	1.0	Attend weekly workstreams call with Davis Polk Restructuring team.	
31342256	Szanzer, Steven Z.	10/27/21	1.2		
31514883	Dekhtyar, Mariya	10/28/21	0.1	Review email from R. Steinberg to Chambers regarding second customer programs motion.	
31378296	Giddens, Magali	10/28/21	0.7	Correspondence with J Eisen regarding sending GECAS motions to Judge and redacted documents to Judge Chapman (0.1); correspondence with M. Melcer regarding same (0.1); correspondence with O. Altman regarding forwarding motions and declarations file (0.1); review documents O. Altman documents filed (0.4).	
31345775	Healy, Laura	10/28/21	1.7	Correspondence with C. Rincon and V. Soltanovich regarding collection.	
31334528	Jegarl, Christine	10/28/21	6.4	Prepare portfolio of depositions preparation materials.	
Total AM200) General Case Administra	ation	125.4		

		Time Def	tail By Proj	ject
Time ID	Name	Date	Hours	Narrative
AM210 Non-	DPW Retention and Fee Is	ssues		
31223034 31109598	Jerrard, Erik Masaro, Matthew Bruno	10/04/21 10/05/21	0.3 0.2	Call with P. Hoban regarding fee applications. Correspondence with Aeroméxico regarding ordinary course retention.
31206760	Huebner, Marshall S.	10/06/21	0.9	Correspondence with T. Graulich and A. Schwartz regarding KPMG issues.
31205127	Masaro, Matthew Bruno	10/07/21	0.1	Correspondence with Aeroméxico and Norton Rose regarding ordinary course professional retention.
31216434	Bane, Abraham	10/08/21	0.4	Correspondence with E. Jerrard regarding KPMG issues.
31221991	Jerrard, Erik	10/08/21	0.9	Email with T. Graulich regarding KPMG retention (0.3); email with Creditors Committee regarding fee application process (0.3); email with co-professionals regarding fee application process (0.3).
31257012	Jerrard, Erik	10/11/21	0.9	Review and revise KPMG retention application (0.6); email with M. Fu regarding same (0.3).
31319081	Jerrard, Erik	10/19/21	0.8	Email with co-professionals regarding interim fee applications.
31327953	Jerrard, Erik	10/25/21	0.4	Call with J. Barsalona regarding professionals' interim fee applications and related status.
31313416	Jerrard, Erik	10/26/21	1.4	Call with AlixPartners regarding interim fee applications (0.2); email with co-professionals regarding filing interim fee applications (1.2).
31285811	Masaro, Matthew Bruno	10/26/21	0.1	Correspondence with Aeroméxico and Morris Nichols regarding ordinary course retention.
31349847	Bane, Abraham	10/27/21	0.4	Correspondence with Davis Polk team regarding interim fee applications.
31348646	Jerrard, Erik	10/27/21	0.7	Email with co-advisors regarding fee applications.
31384379	Masaro, Matthew Bruno	10/27/21	0.1	Correspondence with Aeroméxico and Morris Nichols regarding ordinary course professional retention.
31345035	Bane, Abraham	10/28/21	0.9	Correspondence with M. Dekhtyar regarding interim fee applications (0.5); correspondence with Aeroméxico professionals regarding same (0.4).
31393307	Giddens, Magali	10/29/21	1.9	Review interim application and organize fee application material.
31384796	Masaro, Matthew Bruno	10/29/21	0.1	Correspondence with Morris Nichols and Aeroméxico regarding ordinary course professional retention.
Total AM210	Non-DPW Retention and	Fee Issues	10.5	
AM230 Plan	/Disclosure Statement			
31247745	Bane, Abraham	10/01/21	7.9	Call with A. Andreeva regarding Plan (0.2); correspondence with White & Case regarding same (0.2); correspondence with Quinn Emmanuel regarding same (0.3); review E. Jerrard's comments to Plan (0.3); review and revise Plan (1.3); correspondence with M. Dekhtyar regarding Plan provision (0.2); correspondence with R. Steinberg and M.

	Time Detail By Project						
Time ID	Name	Date	Hours	Narrative			
31180078	Dekhtyar, Mariya	10/01/21	9.2	Masaro regarding same (0.3); review precedent regarding same (0.4); extensive review and revision of Plan (4.7). Review and revise Disclosure Statement (7.0); email with Davis Polk Plan and Disclosure Statement team regarding same (0.2); correspondence with M. Masaro and others regarding Disclosure Statement (0.6); email with A. Bane regarding same (0.4); email with M. Masaro regarding same (0.3); email with O. Altman regarding same (0.2); compile exhibits and saving documents for Disclosure Statement (0.2); undeted Plan distribution treater (0.2)			
31295490	Ford, Stephen	10/01/21	10.2	(0.3); update Plan distribution tracker (0.2). Review and revise Plan (5.1); incorporate comments of co-advisors and key stakeholders into Plan (4.6); propose Plan for filing (0.5)			
31349907	Graulich, Timothy	10/01/21	8.7	into Plan (4.6); prepare Plan for filing (0.5). Call with A. Conesa and R. Sanchez Baker regarding Plan (0.9); call with UCC advisors regarding settlement term sheet (0.6); call with A. Sainz regarding Plan (0.6); review and comment on Plan (3.4); review and comment on Disclosure Statement (3.2).			
31158056	Hanson, Cole	10/01/21	2.3	Revise Disclosure Statement motion and exhibits.			
31184400	Huebner, Marshall S.	10/01/21	0.8	Correspondence with Aeroméxico and T. Graulich regarding Plan issues and filing.			
31179359	Jerrard, Erik	10/01/21	11.1	Call with Aeroméxico regarding Plan (0.4); correspondence with S. Ford and A. Bane regarding same (0.3); correspondence with S. Ford regarding same (0.4); correspondence with S. Piraino regarding process regarding same (2.1); extensive review and revision of Plan (5.4); review and incorporation of stakeholder comments to Plan (1.8); finalize Plan for filing (0.7).			
31161262	Masaro, Matthew Bruno	10/01/21	8.3	Review and revise Disclosure Statement, Plan, Disclosure Statement motion, and proposed order (5.4); correspondence with Aeroméxico, R. Steinberg, S. Piraino, and others regarding same (2.9).			
31164386 31370540	Melcer, Moshe Piraino, Stephen D.	10/01/21 10/01/21	0.5 7.0	Revise Disclosure Statement. Correspondence with E. Jerrard regarding Plan (2.1); correspondence with same and T. Graulich regarding same (0.6); correspondence with M. Masaro and R. Steinberg regarding same and Disclosure Statement (1.3); review and revise Disclosure Statement (2.2); review and revise Delta term sheet (0.8).			
31164326	Steinberg, Richard J.	10/01/21	4.2	Correspondence with S. Piraino, M. Masaro and E. Jerrard regarding Disclosure Statement, Plan, and related documents (0.3); review and revise Disclosure Statement (3.9).			
31180029 31184391	Melcer, Moshe Ford, Stephen	10/02/21 10/04/21	0.2 2.2	Review Disclosure Statement motion. Call with Milbank regarding Disclosure Statement (1.0); correspondence with M. Masaro regarding same (0.1); correspondence			

	Time Detail By Project					
Time ID	Name	Date	Hours	Narrative		
				with A. Bane regarding Plan (0.1); review revisions to Plan (1.0).		
31350721	Graulich, Timothy	10/04/21	0.9	Call with A. Conesa and R. Sanchez Baker regarding Plan process.		
31179074	Masaro, Matthew Bruno	10/04/21	1.2	Correspondence with M. Kudolo regarding Disclosure Statement and related items (0.5); correspondence with O. Altman and others regarding service of Disclosure Statement and Disclosure Statement motion (0.3); correspondence with E. Jerrard and others regarding Disclosure Statement motion (0.4).		
31193322	Ford, Stephen	10/05/21	2.5	Review and revise Plan.		
31202930	Graulich, Timothy	10/05/21	2.3	Call with A. Conesa and R. Sanchez Baker regarding Plan issues (1.0); correspondence with S. Piraino regarding same (0.6); call with B. Miller and T. Goren regarding same (0.7).		
31223432	Jerrard, Erik	10/05/21	2.3	Correspondence with R. Steinberg regarding motion to extend exclusivity periods (0.7); review and revise motion to extend exclusivity periods (1.3); email with R. Steinberg regarding same (0.3).		
31191692	Masaro, Matthew Bruno	10/05/21	0.9	Correspondence with Epiq and others regarding solicitation (0.2); correspondence with Akin Gump regarding Disclosure Statement motion and order (0.2); correspondence with Sainz Abogados, S. Piraino, Greenberg Traurig, and others regarding same (0.3); correspondence with Davis Polk Tax team regarding Disclosure Statement (0.2).		
31193558	Steinberg, Richard J.	10/05/21	4.0	Correspondence with E. Jerrard regarding exclusivity (0.3); review and revise motion to extend exclusivity periods (3.4); correspondence with Davis Polk team regarding same (0.3).		
31198510	Ford, Stephen	10/06/21	0.5	Review Disclosure Statement.		
31215290	Graulich, Timothy	10/06/21	0.8	Call with A. Conesa and R. Sanchez Baker regarding Plan.		
31204612	Hanson, Cole	10/06/21	0.7	Correspondence with R. Steinberg regarding Disclosure Statement Hearing tracker (0.1); prepare and update Disclosure Statement Hearing inquiry tracker (0.6).		
31264237	Kudolo, Mary	10/06/21	1.5	Review solicitation version of precedent disclosure statements.		
31197198	Masaro, Matthew Bruno	10/06/21	2.8	Correspondence with R. Steinberg and others regarding Disclosure Statement and Disclosure Statement hearing (0.6); review precedent Disclosure Statement hearing transcript, talking points, and related research (2.2).		
31387118	Piraino, Stephen D.	10/06/21	2.1	Review disclosure statement precedents (1.7); correspondence with M. Masaro regarding Disclosure Statement (0.4).		
31240725	Steinberg, Richard J.	10/06/21	0.2	Correspondence with M. Masaro regarding Disclosure Statement.		
31216451	Bane, Abraham	10/07/21	2.7	Review proposed solicitation materials (0.6);		

	Time Detail By Project					
Time ID	Name	Date	Hours	Narrative		
				correspondence with M. Masaro regarding same (0.2); review Plan summary precedents (0.8); review motion to extend exclusivity periods (0.4); review and revise Plan issues list (0.3); correspondence with Epiq regarding Plan mechanics (0.4).		
31351737	Graulich, Timothy	10/07/21	0.9	Call with A. Conesa and R. Sanchez Baker regarding Plan issues.		
31306450	Kudolo, Mary	10/07/21	3.4	Review and draft summary of precedent Disclosure Statement documents (3.0); review precedent for foreign debtor issue (0.4).		
31205129	Masaro, Matthew Bruno	10/07/21	3.6	Correspondence with Epiq, M. Melcer, and others regarding Disclosure Statement hearing notices (0.4); correspondence with T. Graulich and others regarding Disclosure Statement issues (0.3); review precedent disclosure statement hearing transcripts (0.5); correspondence with S. Piraino and others regarding same (0.1); correspondence with same regarding Disclosure Statement order exhibits (0.3); review and revise same (0.7); correspondence with Sainz Abogados and M. Kudolo regarding translations for same (0.4); research issues regarding same (0.3); review and revise Disclosure Statement (0.6).		
31240695	Steinberg, Richard J.	10/07/21	1.7	Correspondence with S. Piraino regarding Disclosure Statement, Plan, and related documents (0.2); review and revise motion to extend exclusivity periods (0.7); correspondence with Aeroméxico, Chambers, and key constituencies regarding same (0.8).		
31216433	Bane, Abraham	10/08/21	6.3	Review exit financing term sheets in connection with Plan (0.8); draft Plan issues list (2.3); review and revise Plan (3.2).		
31212187	Ford, Stephen	10/08/21	0.6	Review Plan.		
31351804	Graulich, Timothy	10/08/21	8.0	Call with A. Conesa and R. Sanchez Baker		
31477677	Masaro, Matthew Bruno	10/08/21	1.9	regarding Plan issues. Correspondence with Rothschild, S. Piraino, Greenberg Traurig, and others regarding CEBURES (0.8); review and revise Disclosure Statement (0.2); correspondence with S. Piraino and others regarding same (0.1); correspondence with A. Bane and others regarding exhibits to same (0.3); review and revise same (0.1); correspondence with Epiq and others regarding solicitation and voting (0.4).		
31486069	McClammy, James I.	10/08/21	2.2	Review Plan documents.		
31214193 31387141	Melcer, Moshe Piraino, Stephen D.	10/08/21 10/08/21	0.1 4.1	Analyze Disclosure Statement related filings. Email with Rothschild, M. Masaro, and others regarding CEBURES (0.5); email with M. Masaro regarding Disclosure Statement (0.2); call with Hughes Hubbard, Akin Gump and Milbank regarding exit financing term sheet (0.2); review and coordinate Disclosure		

Statement Stat		Time Detail By Project					
131216814	Time ID	Name	Date	Hours	Narrative		
31216944 Masaro, Matthew Bruno 10/09/21 0.2 Correspondence with S. Piraino and others regarding Disclosure Statement.							
Tegarding Disclosure Statement. Tegarding Disclosure Statement.							
13129514 Steinberg, Richard J. 10/09/21 0.9 Review and revise Disclosure Statement. 10/10/21 3.5 Draft solicitation materials (2.6); review precedent for same (0.6); review E. Jørrard's comments to Plan issues list (0.3). 31216771 Ford, Stephen 10/10/21 4.0 Review and revise Plan issues list (1.0); review and revise Plan issues list (1.0); review and revise Plan issues list (0.3). 4.0 Review and revise Plan issues list (0.1); review and revise Plan issues list (0.8); email with S. Ford and A. Bane regarding same (0.4); email with T. Graulich and S. Piraino regarding Plan lissues (1.0). 3.1216975 Masaro, Matthew Bruno 10/10/21 3.0 Correspondence with S. Piraino and others regarding Disclosure Statement. 3.1216948 Melcer, Moshe 10/10/21 4.0 Review and revise Disclosure Statement. 3.13246948 Melcer, Moshe 10/10/21 4.0 Review and revise Disclosure Statement. 3.13246948 Piraino, Stephen D. 10/10/21 5.0 Correspondence with R. Steinberg regarding Plan. 3.1324697 Steinberg, Richard J. 10/10/21 5.0 Review and revise Disclosure Statement. 3.1324697 Steinberg, Richard J. 10/10/21 5.0 Review and revise Disclosure Statement. 3.1324697 Steinberg, Richard J. 10/11/21 5.0 Call with S. Ford regarding Plan. 3.1324697 Steinberg Plan. 3.1324697 Steinberg Plan. 3.1324697 Steinberg Plan. 3.13446 Steinberg Plan. 3.1	31215944	Masaro, Matthew Bruno	10/09/21	0.2			
31222507 Bane, Abraham 10/10/21 3-5 Draft solicitation materials (2.6); review precedent for same (0.6); review E. Jerrard's comments to Plan issues list (0.3)	0.4070544	0	10/00/04				
precedent for same (0.6); review E. Jerrard's comments to Plan issues list (0.3) and revise Plan issues list (1.0); review and revise Plan issues list (1.0); review and revise Plan issues list (1.0); review and revise Plan issues list (0.8); email with S. Ford and A. Bane regarding psame (0.4); email with S. Ford and A. Bane regarding psame (0.4); email with T. Graulich and S. Piraino regarding Plan issues list (0.8); email with S. Ford and A. Bane regarding Plan issues (1.0). 31216975 Masaro, Matthew Bruno 10/10/21 0.3 Correspondence with S. Piraino and others regarding Disclosure Statement. 31216948 Melcer, Moshe 10/10/21 0.7 Correspondence with S. Steinberg regarding Statement. 31216949 Piraino, Stephen D. 10/10/21 0.7 Correspondence with R. Steinberg regarding Statement. 31228267 Steinberg, Richard J. 10/10/21 0.6 Review and revise Disclosure Statement. 31228267 Bane, Abraham 10/11/21 0.6 Review and revise Disclosure Statement. 31222896 Ford, Stephen 10/11/21 0.5 Call with S. Ford regarding Plan (0.5); correspondence with M. Masaro regarding Solicitation materials (0.2); draft same (0.4); review Epiq's comments to Plan (0.8); revise Plan issues list (0.3); extensive review and revision to Plan (6.4). 31222896 Ford, Stephen 10/11/21 0.5 Call with A. Bane regarding Plan (0.6); draft same (0.4); review Epiq's comments to Plan (0.8); revise Plan issues list (0.3); extensive review and revise Plan (3.7). 31257014 Jerrard, Erik 10/11/21 2.6 Review and revise Plan (3.7). 31257014 Jerrard, Erik 10/11/21 2.6 Review and revise Plan (3.3). 31220508 Masaro, Matthew Bruno 10/11/21 5.6 Review and revise Plan (3.3). 31220508 Melcer, Moshe 10/11/21 5.7 Call with A. Conesa and R. Sanchez Baker regarding Disclosure Statement (1.9); draft same devision by the provise Plan (3.5). Correspondence with R. Steinberg (3.5) review and revise notice of amended Disclosure Statement and Plan (0.5); correspondence with R. Steinberg regarding Disclosure Statement (1.3); call with Conesa and R. Steinberg (3.5); review and revis							
Comments to Plan issues list (0.3).	31222507	Bane, Abraham	10/10/21	3.5			
31216771 Ford, Stephen 10/10/21 4.0 Review and revise Plan issues list (1.0); review and revise Plan (3.0), and revise Plan issues list (1.0); review and revise Plan issues list (1.0.8); email with S. Ford and A. Bane regarding same (0.4); email with S. Ford and A. Bane regarding same (0.4); email with S. Graulich and S. Piraino regarding Plan issues (1.0).							
and revise Plan (3.0). Analyze Plan structuring issues (3.1); review and revise Plan issues list (0.8); email with S. Ford and A. Bane regarding same (0.4); email with S. Ford and A. Bane regarding same (0.4); email with T. Graullich and S. Pirtaino regarding Plan issues (1.0). Correspondence with S. Piraino and others regarding Disclosure Statement. All Praino, Stephen D. 10/10/21 0.7 Review and revise Disclosure Statement (3.8); correspondence with R. Steinberg regarding Same (0.2). Piraino, Stephen D. 10/10/21 0.6 Review and revise Disclosure Statement. Steinberg, Richard J. 10/10/21 0.6 Review and revise Disclosure Statement. Steinberg, Richard J. 10/11/21 0.6 Review and revise Disclosure Statement. Steinberg, Richard J. 10/11/21 0.6 Review and revise Disclosure Statement. Steinberg regarding Plan. Steinber	21216771	Ford Stanban	10/10/01	4.0			
31218356 Jerrard, Erik 10/10/21 5.3 Analyze Plan structuring issues (3.1); review and revise Plan issues list (0.3), email with S. Ford and A. Bane regarding same (0.4); email with S. Ford and A. Bane regarding Plan issues (1.0). 31216975 Masaro, Matthew Bruno 10/10/21 0.3 Correspondence with S. Piraino and others regarding Disclosure Statement. 31216948 Melcer, Moshe 10/10/21 0.4 Review and revise Disclosure Statement (3.8); correspondence with R. Steinberg regarding Same (0.2). 31384936 Piraino, Stephen D. 10/10/21 0.7 Correspondence with R. Steinberg regarding Plan (3.7); Steinberg, Richard J. 10/10/21 0.8 Review and revise Disclosure Statement. 31228267 Steinberg, Richard J. 10/11/21 0.8 Review and revise Disclosure Statement. 31228268 Ford, Stephen 10/11/21 0.8 Review and revise Disclosure Statement. 3122896 Ford, Stephen 10/11/21 0.5 Call with S. Ford regarding Plan (0.5); correspondence with M. Steinberg regarding same (0.3); correspondence with M. Masaro regarding solicitation materials (0.2); draft same (0.4); review Epid's comments to Plan (0.8); review Plan issues list (0.3); extensive review and revision to Plan (6.4). 3122896 Ford, Stephen 10/11/21 0.5 Call with A. Conesa and R. Sanchez Baker regarding Plan (0.8); review and revise Plan (3.7). 31257014 Jerrard, Erik 10/11/21 2.6 Review and revise Plan (3.7). 31257014 Vericular Stephen 10/11/21 2.6 Review and revise Plan (3.7). 31257014 Masaro, Matthew Bruno 10/11/21 3.8 Research and review precedent motion for amended Disclosure Statement (1.9); draft exhibits regarding Same (1.3). Piraino, and others regarding Disclosure Statement (1.9); draft exhibits regarding Same (1.3). Piraino, and others regarding Disclosure Statement (1.9); correspondence with R. Steinberg, S. Piraino, and others regarding Disclosure Statement (1.9); correspondence with R. Steinberg (0.7); review and revise plan and Disclosure Statement (0.7); review and revise plan and Disclosure Statement (1.3); call with Rother berg Traurig regarding CEBURES (0.5); corresponden	31210771	Ford, Stephen	10/10/21	4.0			
and revise Plan issues list (0.8); email with S. Ford and A. Bane regarding same (0.4); email with T. Graulich and S. Piraino and others regarding Plan issues (1.0). 31216975 Masaro, Matthew Bruno 10/10/21 0.3 Correspondence with S. Piraino and others regarding Disclosure Statement (3.8); correspondence with R. Steinberg regarding Same (0.2). 31216948 Melcer, Moshe 10/10/21 0.7 Correspondence with R. Steinberg regarding Same (0.2). 31384936 Piraino, Stephen D. 10/10/21 0.7 Correspondence with E. Jerrard regarding Plan. (3.1379537 Steinberg, Richard J. 10/10/21 0.6 Review and revise Disclosure Statement. (3.8); correspondence with R. Steinberg regarding Plan. (3.1379537 Steinberg, Richard J. 10/10/21 0.6 Review and revise Disclosure Statement. (3.8); correspondence with R. Steinberg regarding Plan. (3.9); correspondence with M. Masaro regarding Solicitation materials (0.2); draft same (0.4); review Epic's comments to Plan (0.5); correspondence with M. Masaro regarding Solicitation materials (0.2); draft same (0.4); review Epic's comments to Plan (0.8); revise Plan issues list (0.3); extensive review and revised Plan (3.7); eview Plan (3.7); eview and comment on revised Plan (3.7). 31220508 Masaro, Matthew Bruno 10/11/21 3.8 Research and review precedent motion for amended Disclosure Statement (0.6); draft exhibits regarding plan (0.6); draft exhibits regarding pasme (1.3). 31220508 Masaro, Matthew Bruno 10/11/21 5.1 Call with A. Coness and R. Sanchez Baker regarding Disclosure Statement (1.9); draft exhibits regarding same (1.3). 31220508 Masaro, Matthew Bruno 10/11/21 5.1 Call with Creenberg Traurig and others regarding Disclosure Statement, order and exhibits (1.1); review and revise solice of amended Disclosure Statement, order and exhibits (1.1); review and revise motice of amended Disclosure Statement (1.9); draft exhibits regarding Disclosure Statement, order and exhibits (1.1); review and revise plan and Disclosure Statement (1.0.5); correspondence with R. Steinberg regarding Disclosure Statement (1	31219356	Jorrard Erik	10/10/21	5.3			
Second Statement (0.4); email with T. Graulich and S. Piraino regarding Plan issues (1.0).	31210330	Jenaiu, Enk	10/10/21	5.5			
With T. Graulich and S. Piraino regarding Plan issues (1.0): Correspondence with S. Piraino and others regarding Disclosure Statement (3.8); correspondence with R. Steinberg regarding Same (0.2): Correspondence with R. Steinberg regarding Same (0.2): correspondence with R. Steinberg regarding Same (0.2): correspondence with R. Steinberg regarding Plan. Steinberg, Richard J. 10/10/21 0.6 Review and revise Disclosure Statement. Call with S. Ford regarding Plan (0.5); correspondence with R. Steinberg regarding Plan. (2.2): correspondence with R. Steinberg regarding Plan. (3.1): correspondence with M. Masaro regarding solicitation materials (0.2); draft same (0.3); correspondence with M. Masaro regarding solicitation materials (0.2); draft same (0.4); review Epic's comments to Plan (0.8); revise Plan issues list (0.2); draft same (0.4); review Epic's comments to Plan (0.8); revise Plan issues list (0.2); draft same (0.4); review Epic's comments to Plan (0.8); revise Plan issues list (0.2); draft same (0.4); review Epic's comments to Plan (0.8); revise Plan issues list (0.2); draft same regarding Plan (0.8); review and revise review and revise plan (3.7). Serview and comment on revised Plan (3.7). Serview and comment on revised Plan (3.7). Serview and revise Plan. (3.7). Fraino, and others regarding Disclosure Statement (1.9); draft exhibits regarding same (1.3). Serview and revise partial plan (3.7), review and revise same and Plan (3.1);							
issues (1.0). 31216948 Masaro, Matthew Bruno 10/10/21 0.3 Correspondence with S. Piraino and others regarding Disclosure Statement. 31216948 Melcer, Moshe 10/10/21 4.0 Review and revise Disclosure Statement (3.8); correspondence with R. Steinberg regarding same (0.2). 31384936 Piraino, Stephen D. 10/10/21 0.7 Correspondence with E. Jerrard regarding Plan. Steinberg, Richard J. 10/10/21 0.6 Review and revise Disclosure Statement. 31228267 Bane, Abraham 10/11/21 0.6 Review and revise Disclosure Statement. 31228267 Bane, Abraham 10/11/21 0.6 Review and revise Disclosure Statement. 31228269 Steinberg, Richard J. 10/10/21 0.6 Review and revise Disclosure Statement. 31228260 Steinberg, Richard J. 10/11/21 0.5 Call with A. Bane regarding Plan (0.8); revise Plan issues list (0.3); extensive review and revision to Plan (6.4). 31228260 Ford, Stephen 10/11/21 0.5 Call with A. Bane regarding Plan (0.8); revise Plan issues list (0.3); extensive review and revise Plan issues plan issue							
31216975 Masaro, Matthew Bruno 10/10/21 0.3 Correspondence with S. Piraino and others regarding Disclosure Statement.							
Tegarding Disclosure Statement (3.8); correspondence with R. Steinberg regarding Plan (3.8); correspondence with R. Steinberg regarding Plan (3.7); correspondence with R. Steinberg regarding Plan (3.7); review and revise Disclosure Statement (3.8); correspondence with R. Steinberg regarding Plan (3.7); review and revise Disclosure Statement. (3.8); correspondence with R. Steinberg regarding Plan (3.7); revise Plan issues list (0.3); extensive review and revise Disclosure Statement. (3.8); revise Plan issues list (0.3); extensive review and revise Plan (3.7); revise Plan issues list (0.3); extensive review and revision to Plan (6.4). (3.7); revise Plan issues list (0.3); extensive review and revise or Plan (3.7); revise Plan issues list (0.3); extensive review and revise Plan (3.7). (3.7); revise Plan issues Plan (3.7); revise Plan (3.7); review and revise Plan (3.7); revise Plan (3.7); revise Plan (3.7); review and revise Statement (4.7); review and revise same and Plan (3.1); review and revise same and Plan (3.7); review and revise	31216975	Masaro Matthew Bruno	10/10/21	0.3			
31216948 Melcer, Moshe 10/10/21 4.0 Review and revise Disclosure Statement (3.8); correspondence with R. Steinberg regarding same (0.2). 31384936 Piraino, Stephen D. 10/10/21 0.7 Correspondence with E. Jerrard regarding Plan. 31379537 Steinberg, Richard J. 10/10/21 0.6 Review and revise Disclosure Statement. 31228267 Bane, Abraham 10/11/21 8.9 Call with S. Ford regarding Plan (0.5); correspondence with M. Masaro regarding solicitation materials (0.2); draft same (0.4); review Epiq's comments to Plan (0.8); revise Plan issues list (0.3); extensive review and revision to Plan (6.4). 31222896 Ford, Stephen 10/11/21 0.5 Call with A. Boan regarding Plan. 31226591 Graulich, Timothy 10/11/21 4.5 Call with A. Conesa and R. Sanchez Baker regarding Plan (0.8); review and comment on revised Plan (3.7). 31257014 Jerrard, Erik 10/11/21 2.6 Review and revise Plan. 3122058 Masaro, Matthew Bruno 10/11/21 3.8 Research and review precedent motion for amended Disclosure Statement (0.6); draft exhibits regarding plan (0.5); correspondence with R. Steinberg regarding Disclosure Statement and Plan (0.5); correspondence with R. Steinberg regarding Disclosure Statement and Plan (0.5); correspondence with R. Steinberg regarding Disclosure Statement and Plan (0.5); correspondence with R. Steinberg rega	01210070	Madaro, Mattrow Brane	10/10/21	0.0			
same (0.2). 31384936 Piraino, Stephen D. 10/10/21 0.7 Correspondence with E. Jerrard regarding Plan. 31379537 Steinberg, Richard J. 10/10/21 0.6 Review and revise Disclosure Statement. (0.5); correspondence with R. Steinberg regarding Plan. (0.5); correspondence with R. Steinberg regarding same (0.3); correspondence with M. Masaro regarding solicitation materials (0.2); draft same (0.4); review Epiq's comments to Plan (0.8); revise Plan issues list (0.3); extensive review and revision to Plan (6.4). 31222896 Ford, Stephen 10/11/21 0.5 Call with A. Bane regarding Plan. (0.8); revise Plan issues list (0.3); extensive review and revision to Plan (6.4). 31226591 Graulich, Timothy 10/11/21 4.5 Call with A. Bane regarding Plan. (3.7). 31257014 Jerrard, Erik 10/11/21 2.6 Review and revise Plan. 31307259 Kudolo, Mary 10/11/21 3.8 Research and review precedent motion for amended Disclosure Statement (0.6); draft notice of amended Disclosure Statement (0.6); draft notice of amended Disclosure Statement (1.9); draft exhibits regarding pame (1.3). 31220508 Masaro, Matthew Bruno 10/11/21 5.1 Call with Greenberg Traurig and others regarding Disclosure Statement, order and exhibits (1.1); review and revise same and Plan (3.1); review and revise same and Plan (7.1); review and revise plan and Disclosure Statement (7.3); call with Rothschild and Greenberg Traurig regarding Disclosure Statement (7.3); call with	31216948	Melcer Moshe	10/10/21	4.0			
\$\text{same (0.2).} \text{same (0.2).} \text{31384936} \text{Piraino, Stephen D. } \text{10/10/21 } \text{10/10/21 } \text{0.6 Review and revise Disclosure Statement.} \text{31228267} \text{Bane, Abraham} \text{10/11/21 } \text{10/10/21 } 8.9 Call with S. Ford regarding Plan (0.5); correspondence with M. Masaro regarding solicitation materials (0.2); draft same (0.4); review Epiq's comments to Plan (0.6); correspondence with M. Masaro regarding solicitation materials (0.2); draft same (0.4); review Epiq's comments to Plan (0.6); revise Plan issues list (0.3); extensive review and revision to Plan (0.6). The plan (0.6) is revised Plan (0.6); revise Plan issues list (0.3); extensive review and revision to Plan (0.6); draft same (0.6); revise Plan (0.6); draft same (0.6);	01210010	mercer, meene	10/10/21				
31384936 Piraino, Stephen D. 10/10/21 0.7 Correspondence with E. Jerrard regarding Plan. 312928267 Steinberg, Richard J. 10/10/21 0.6 Review and revise Disclosure Statement. 31228267 Bane, Abraham 10/11/21 8.9 Call with S. Ford regarding Plan (0.5); correspondence with M. Masaro regarding same (0.3); correspondence with M. Masaro regarding same (0.4); review Epiq's comments to Plan (0.8); revise Plan issues list (0.3); extensive review and revision to Plan (6.4). 31222896 Ford, Stephen 10/11/21 0.5 Call with A. Bane regarding Plan. 31226591 Graulich, Timothy 10/11/21 4.5 Call with A. Conesa and R. Sanchez Baker regarding Plan (0.8); review and comment on revised Plan (3.7). 31257014 Jerrard, Erik 10/11/21 3.8 Research and review precedent motion for amended Disclosure Statement (0.6); draft notice of amended Disclosure Statement (0.6); draft notice of amended Disclosure Statement (1.9); draft exhibits regarding same (1.3). 31220508 Masaro, Matthew Bruno 10/11/21 5.1 Call with Greenberg Traurig and others regarding Disclosure Statement, oncirc of amended Disclosure Statement, oncirc of amended Disclosure Statement, oncirc of amended Disclosure Statement, order and exhibits (1.1); review and revise same and Plan (3.1); review and revise notice of amended Disclosure Statement (0.2); review Apollo comments to same (0.7); review and revise Plan and Disclosure Statement (1.3							
31379537 Steinberg, Richard J. 10/10/21 0.6 Review and revise Disclosure Statement. 31228267 Bane, Abraham 10/11/21 8.9 Call with S. Ford regarding Plan (0.5); correspondence with M. Masaro regarding solicitation materials (0.2); draft same (0.4); review Epiq's comments to Plan (0.8); revise Plan issues list (0.3); extensive review and revision to Plan (6.4). 31222896 Ford, Stephen 10/11/21 0.5 Call with A. Bane regarding Plan. 31226591 Graulich, Timothy 10/11/21 4.5 Call with A. Conesa and R. Sanchez Baker regarding Plan (0.8); review and comment on revised Plan (3.7). 31257014 Jerrard, Erik 10/11/21 2.6 Review and revise Plan. 3122059 Kudolo, Mary 10/11/21 3.8 Research and review precedent motion for amended Disclosure Statement (0.6); draft notice of amended Disclosure Statement (1.9); draft exhibits regarding same (1.3). 31220508 Masaro, Matthew Bruno 10/11/21 5.1 Call with Greenberg Traurig and others regarding Disclosure Statement and Plan (0.5); correspondence with R. Steinberg, S. Piraino, and others regarding Disclosure Statement, order and exhibits (1.1); review and revise motice of amended Disclosure Statement (1.7); review and revise Plan and Disclosure Statement (0.2); review Apollo comments to same (0.7); review and revise Plan and Disclosure Statement (1.3); call with Rothschild and Greenberg Traurig regarding CEBURES (0.5); correspondence with T. Grauli	31384936	Piraino, Stephen D.	10/10/21	0.7			
31228267 Bane, Abraham 10/11/21 8.9 Call with S. Ford regarding Plan (0.5); correspondence with R. Steinberg regarding same (0.3); correspondence with M. Masaro regarding solicitation materials (0.2); draft same (0.4); review Epiq's comments to Plan (0.8); revise Plan issues list (0.3); extensive review and revision to Plan (6.4). 31222896 Ford, Stephen 10/11/21 0.5 Call with A. Bane regarding Plan. 31226591 Graulich, Timothy 10/11/21 4.5 Call with A. Conesa and R. Sanchez Baker regarding Plan (0.8); review and comment on revised Plan (3.7). 31257014 Jerrard, Erik 10/11/21 3.8 Research and review precedent motion for amended Disclosure Statement (0.6); draft notice of amended Disclosure Statement (0.6); draft notice of amended Disclosure Statement (1.9); draft exhibits regarding same (1.3). 31220508 Masaro, Matthew Bruno 10/11/21 5.1 Call with Greenberg Traurig and others regarding Disclosure Statement and Plan (0.5); correspondence with R. Steinberg, S. Piraino, and others regarding Disclosure Statement and Plan (0.5); correspondence with R. Steinberg regarding Disclosure Statement (0.4). 31220174 Melcer, Moshe 10/11/21 0.5 Revise Disclosure Statement and Disclosure Statement (1.3); review and revise same and Plan (3.1); review and revise same and Plan (3.1); review and revise same (0.7); review and revise Plan and Disclosure Statement (1.3); call with Rothschild and Greenberg Traurig regarding Disclosure Statement (1.3); call with Rothschild and Greenberg Tra	31379537		10/10/21				
correspondence with R. Steinberg regarding same (0.3); correspondence with M. Masaro regarding solicitation materials (0.2); farft same (0.4); review Epiq's comments to Plan (0.8); revise Plan issues list (0.3); extensive review and revision to Plan (6.4). 31222896 Ford, Stephen 10/11/21 0.5 Call with A. Bane regarding Plan. 31226591 Graulich, Timothy 10/11/21 2.6 Review and R. Sanchez Baker regarding Plan (0.8); review and comment on revised Plan (3.7). 31257014 Jerrard, Erik 10/11/21 2.6 Review and revise Plan. 31307259 Kudolo, Mary 10/11/21 3.8 Research and review precedent motion for amended Disclosure Statement (0.6); draft notice of amended Disclosure Statement (1.9); draft exhibits regarding same (1.3). 31220508 Masaro, Matthew Bruno 10/11/21 5.1 Call with Greenberg Traurig and others regarding Disclosure Statement and Plan (0.5); correspondence with R. Steinberg, S. Piraino, and others regarding Disclosure Statement, order and exhibits (1.1); review and revise same and Plan (3.1); review and revise notice of amended Disclosure Statement, order and exhibits (1.1); review and revise same and Plan (3.1); review and revise same (0.5); correspondence with R. Steinberg regarding Disclosure Statement (1.2); review Apollo comments to same (0.7); review and revise Plan (0.5); correspondence with R. Steinberg regarding CEBURES (0.5); correspondence with T. Graulich regarding same (0.3).			10/11/21	8.9	Call with S. Ford regarding Plan (0.5);		
same (0.3); correspondence with M. Masaro regarding solicitation materials (0.2); draft same (0.4); review Epiq's comments to Plan (0.8); revise Plan issues list (0.3); extensive review and revision to Plan (6.4). 31226591 Ford, Stephen 10/11/21 0.5 Call with A. Bane regarding Plan. 31226591 Graulich, Timothy 10/11/21 4.5 Call with A. Conesa and R. Sanchez Baker regarding Plan (0.8); review and comment on revised Plan (3.7). 31257014 Jerrard, Erik 10/11/21 2.6 Review and revise Plan. 31307259 Kudolo, Mary 10/11/21 3.8 Research and review precedent motion for amended Disclosure Statement (0.6); draft notice of amended Disclosure Statement (1.9); draft exhibits regarding same (1.3). 31220508 Masaro, Matthew Bruno 10/11/21 5.1 Call with Greenberg Traurig and others regarding Disclosure Statement and Plan (0.5); correspondence with R. Steinberg, S. Piraino, and others regarding Disclosure Statement, order and exhibits (1.1); review and revise same and Plan (3.1); review and revise notice of amended Disclosure Statement. 31220174 Melcer, Moshe 10/11/21 0.5 Revise Disclosure Statement. 31220174 Melcer, Moshe 10/11/21 3.5 Correspondence with R. Steinberg regarding Disclosure Statement (0.2); review Apollo comments to same (0.7); review and revise Plan (0.5); correspondence with R. Steinberg regarding Disclosure Statement (1.3); call with Rothschild and Greenberg Traurig regarding CEBURES (0.5); correspondence with T. Graulich regarding same (0.3).		,					
Co. Plan (Stephen 10/11/21 10.5 Call with A. Bane regarding Plan.							
Section Paragram					regarding solicitation materials (0.2); draft same		
31222896 Ford, Stephen 10/11/21 0.5 Call with A. Bane regarding Plan. 31226591 Graulich, Timothy 10/11/21 4.5 Call with A. Conesa and R. Sanchez Baker regarding Plan (0.8); review and comment on revised Plan (3.7). 31257014 Jerrard, Erik 10/11/21 3.8 Review and revise Plan. 31307259 Kudolo, Mary 10/11/21 3.8 Review and revise precedent motion for amended Disclosure Statement (0.6); draft notice of amended Disclosure Statement (1.9); draft exhibits regarding same (1.3). 31220508 Masaro, Matthew Bruno 10/11/21 5.1 Call with Greenberg Traurig and others regarding Disclosure Statement and Plan (0.5); correspondence with R. Steinberg, S. Piraino, and others regarding Disclosure Statement and Plan (0.5); correspondence with R. Steinberg, S. Piraino, and Plan (3.1); review and revise same and Plan (3.1); review and revise Disclosure Statement (0.2); review Apollo comments to same (0.7); review and revise Plan and Disclosure Statement (1.3); call with Rothschild and Greenberg Traurig regarding CEBURES (0.5); correspondence with T. Graulich regarding same (0.3).							
31222896 Ford, Stephen 10/11/21 0.5 Call with A. Conesa and R. Sanchez Baker regarding Plan (0.8); review and comment on revised Plan (3.7). 31257014 Jerrard, Erik 10/11/21 2.6 Review and revise Plan. 31307259 Kudolo, Mary 10/11/21 3.8 Research and revise precedent motion for amended Disclosure Statement (0.6); draft notice of amended Disclosure Statement (1.9); draft exhibits regarding same (1.3). 31220508 Masaro, Matthew Bruno 10/11/21 5.1 Call with Greenberg Traurig and others regarding Disclosure Statement and Plan (0.5); correspondence with R. Steinberg, S. Piraino, and others regarding Disclosure Statement, order and exhibits (1.1); review and revise same and Plan (3.1); review and revise notice of amended Disclosure Statement and Disclosure Statement order (0.4). 31220174 Melcer, Moshe 10/11/21 0.5 Revise Disclosure Statement. 31372939 Piraino, Stephen D. 10/11/21 3.5 Correspondence with E. Jerrard regarding Plan (0.5); correspondence with R. Steinberg regarding Disclosure Statement (0.2); review Apollo comments to same (0.7); review and revise Plan and Disclosure Statement (1.3); call with Rothschild and Greenberg Traurig regarding CEBURES (0.5); correspondence with T. Graulich regarding same (0.3). 31226202 Steinberg, Richard J. 10/11/21 3.4 Correspondence with M. Masaro and A. Bane							
31226591 Graulich, Timothy 10/11/21 4.5 Call with A. Conesa and R. Sanchez Baker regarding Plan (0.8); review and comment on revised Plan (3.7). 31257014 Jerrard, Erik 10/11/21 2.6 Review and revise Plan. 31307259 Kudolo, Mary 10/11/21 3.8 Research and review precedent motion for amended Disclosure Statement (0.6); draft notice of amended Disclosure Statement (1.9); draft exhibits regarding same (1.3). 31220508 Masaro, Matthew Bruno 10/11/21 5.1 Call with Greenberg Traurig and others regarding Disclosure Statement and Plan (0.5); correspondence with R. Steinberg, S. Piraino, and others regarding Disclosure Statement, order and exhibits (1.1); review and revise same and Plan (3.1); review and revise notice of amended Disclosure Statement and Disclosure Statement order (0.4). 31220174 Melcer, Moshe 10/11/21 0.5 Revise Disclosure Statement. 31372939 Piraino, Stephen D. 10/11/21 3.5 Correspondence with E. Jerrard regarding Plan (0.5); correspondence with R. Steinberg (0.2); review Apollo comments to same (0.7); review and revise Plan and Disclosure Statement (1.3); call with Rothschild and Greenberg Traurig regarding CEBURES (0.5); correspondence with T. Graulich regarding same (0.3). 31226202 Steinberg, Richard J. 10/11/21 3.4 Correspondence with M. Masaro and A. Bane							
regarding Plan (0.8); review and comment on revised Plan (3.7). 31257014 Jerrard, Erik 10/11/21 2.6 Review and revise Plan. 31307259 Kudolo, Mary 10/11/21 3.8 Research and review precedent motion for amended Disclosure Statement (0.6); draft notice of amended Disclosure Statement (1.9); draft exhibits regarding same (1.3). 31220508 Masaro, Matthew Bruno 10/11/21 5.1 Call with Greenberg Traurig and others regarding Disclosure Statement and Plan (0.5); correspondence with R. Steinberg, S. Piraino, and others regarding Disclosure Statement, order and exhibits (1.1); review and revise same and Plan (3.1); review and revise same and Plan (3.1); review and revise notice of amended Disclosure Statement and Disclosure Statement order (0.4). 31220174 Melcer, Moshe 10/11/21 0.5 Revise Disclosure Statement. 31372939 Piraino, Stephen D. 10/11/21 3.5 Correspondence with E. Jerrard regarding Plan (0.5); correspondence with R. Steinberg regarding Disclosure Statement (0.2); review Apollo comments to same (0.7); review and revise Plan and Disclosure Statement (1.3); call with Rothschild and Greenberg Traurig regarding CEBURES (0.5); correspondence with T. Graulich regarding same (0.3). 31226202 Steinberg, Richard J. 10/11/21 3.4 Correspondence with M. Masaro and A. Bane							
revised Plan (3.7). 31257014 Jerrard, Erik 10/11/21 2.6 Review and revise Plan. 31307259 Kudolo, Mary 10/11/21 3.8 Research and review precedent motion for amended Disclosure Statement (0.6); draft notice of amended Disclosure Statement (1.9); draft exhibits regarding same (1.3). 31220508 Masaro, Matthew Bruno 10/11/21 5.1 Call with Greenberg Traurig and others regarding Disclosure Statement and Plan (0.5); correspondence with R. Steinberg, S. Piraino, and others regarding Disclosure Statement, order and exhibits (1.1); review and revise same and Plan (3.1); review and revise notice of amended Disclosure Statement and Disclosure Statement order (0.4). 31220174 Melcer, Moshe 10/11/21 0.5 Revise Disclosure Statement. 31372939 Piraino, Stephen D. 10/11/21 3.5 Correspondence with E. Jerrard regarding Plan (0.5); correspondence with R. Steinberg regarding Disclosure Statement (0.2); review Apollo comments to same (0.7); review and revise Plan and Disclosure Statement (1.3); call with Rothschild and Greenberg Traurig regarding CEBURES (0.5); correspondence with T. Graulich regarding same (0.3). 31226202 Steinberg, Richard J. 10/11/21 3.4 Correspondence with M. Masaro and A. Bane	31226591	Graulich, Timothy	10/11/21	4.5			
31257014 Jerrard, Erik 10/11/21 2.6 Review and revise Plan. 31307259 Kudolo, Mary 10/11/21 3.8 Research and review precedent motion for amended Disclosure Statement (0.6); draft notice of amended Disclosure Statement (1.9); draft exhibits regarding same (1.3). 31220508 Masaro, Matthew Bruno 10/11/21 5.1 Call with Greenberg Traurig and others regarding Disclosure Statement and Plan (0.5); correspondence with R. Steinberg, S. Piraino, and others regarding Disclosure Statement, order and exhibits (1.1); review and revise same and Plan (3.1); review and revise of amended Disclosure Statement and Disclosure Statement order (0.4).							
Steinberg, Richard J. 10/11/21 3.8 Research and review precedent motion for amended Disclosure Statement (0.6); draft notice of amended Disclosure Statement (1.9); draft exhibits regarding same (1.3).	04057044		40/44/04	0.0			
amended Disclosure Statement (0.6); draft notice of amended Disclosure Statement (1.9); draft exhibits regarding same (1.3). 31220508 Masaro, Matthew Bruno 10/11/21 5.1 Call with Greenberg Traurig and others regarding Disclosure Statement and Plan (0.5); correspondence with R. Steinberg, S. Piraino, and others regarding Disclosure Statement, order and exhibits (1.1); review and revise same and Plan (3.1); review and revise notice of amended Disclosure Statement and Disclosure Statement order (0.4). 31220174 Melcer, Moshe 10/11/21 0.5 Revise Disclosure Statement. Piraino, Stephen D. 10/11/21 3.5 Correspondence with E. Jerrard regarding Plan (0.5); correspondence with R. Steinberg regarding Disclosure Statement (0.2); review Apollo comments to same (0.7); review and revise Plan and Disclosure Statement (1.3); call with Rothschild and Greenberg Traurig regarding CEBURES (0.5); correspondence with T. Graulich regarding same (0.3). 31226202 Steinberg, Richard J. 10/11/21 3.4 Correspondence with M. Masaro and A. Bane							
notice of amended Disclosure Statement (1.9); draft exhibits regarding same (1.3). 31220508 Masaro, Matthew Bruno 10/11/21 5.1 Call with Greenberg Traurig and others regarding Disclosure Statement and Plan (0.5); correspondence with R. Steinberg, S. Piraino, and others regarding Disclosure Statement, order and exhibits (1.1); review and revise same and Plan (3.1); review and revise notice of amended Disclosure Statement and Disclosure Statement order (0.4). 31220174 Melcer, Moshe 10/11/21 0.5 Revise Disclosure Statement. 31372939 Piraino, Stephen D. 10/11/21 3.5 Correspondence with E. Jerrard regarding Plan (0.5); correspondence with R. Steinberg regarding Disclosure Statement (0.2); review Apollo comments to same (0.7); review and revise Plan and Disclosure Statement (1.3); call with Rothschild and Greenberg Traurig regarding CEBURES (0.5); correspondence with T. Graulich regarding same (0.3). 31226202 Steinberg, Richard J. 10/11/21 3.4 Correspondence with M. Masaro and A. Bane	31307259	Kudolo, Mary	10/11/21	3.8			
draft exhibits regarding same (1.3). 31220508 Masaro, Matthew Bruno 10/11/21 5.1 Call with Greenberg Traurig and others regarding Disclosure Statement and Plan (0.5); correspondence with R. Steinberg, S. Piraino, and others regarding Disclosure Statement, order and exhibits (1.1); review and revise same and Plan (3.1); review and revise notice of amended Disclosure Statement and Disclosure Statement order (0.4). 31220174 Melcer, Moshe 10/11/21 0.5 Revise Disclosure Statement. 31372939 Piraino, Stephen D. 10/11/21 3.5 Correspondence with E. Jerrard regarding Plan (0.5); correspondence with R. Steinberg regarding Disclosure Statement (0.2); review Apollo comments to same (0.7); review and revise Plan and Disclosure Statement (1.3); call with Rothschild and Greenberg Traurig regarding CEBURES (0.5); correspondence with T. Graulich regarding same (0.3). 31226202 Steinberg, Richard J. 10/11/21 3.4 Correspondence with M. Masaro and A. Bane							
31220508 Masaro, Matthew Bruno 10/11/21 5.1 Call with Greenberg Traurig and others regarding Disclosure Statement and Plan (0.5); correspondence with R. Steinberg, S. Piraino, and others regarding Disclosure Statement, order and exhibits (1.1); review and revise same and Plan (3.1); review and revise notice of amended Disclosure Statement and Disclosure Statement order (0.4). 31220174 Melcer, Moshe 10/11/21 0.5 Revise Disclosure Statement. 31372939 Piraino, Stephen D. 10/11/21 3.5 Correspondence with E. Jerrard regarding Plan (0.5); correspondence with R. Steinberg regarding Disclosure Statement (0.2); review Apollo comments to same (0.7); review and revise Plan and Disclosure Statement (1.3); call with Rothschild and Greenberg Traurig regarding CEBURES (0.5); correspondence with T. Graulich regarding same (0.3). 31226202 Steinberg, Richard J. 10/11/21 3.4 Correspondence with M. Masaro and A. Bane							
regarding Disclosure Statement and Plan (0.5); correspondence with R. Steinberg, S. Piraino, and others regarding Disclosure Statement, order and exhibits (1.1); review and revise same and Plan (3.1); review and revise notice of amended Disclosure Statement and Disclosure Statement order (0.4). 31220174 Melcer, Moshe 10/11/21 0.5 Revise Disclosure Statement. 31372939 Piraino, Stephen D. 10/11/21 3.5 Correspondence with E. Jerrard regarding Plan (0.5); correspondence with R. Steinberg regarding Disclosure Statement (0.2); review Apollo comments to same (0.7); review and revise Plan and Disclosure Statement (1.3); call with Rothschild and Greenberg Traurig regarding CEBURES (0.5); correspondence with T. Graulich regarding same (0.3). 31226202 Steinberg, Richard J. 10/11/21 3.4 Correspondence with M. Masaro and A. Bane	31220508	Masaro Matthew Bruno	10/11/21	5.1			
correspondence with R. Steinberg, S. Piraino, and others regarding Disclosure Statement, order and exhibits (1.1); review and revise same and Plan (3.1); review and revise notice of amended Disclosure Statement and Disclosure Statement order (0.4). 31220174 Melcer, Moshe 10/11/21 0.5 Revise Disclosure Statement. 31372939 Piraino, Stephen D. 10/11/21 3.5 Correspondence with E. Jerrard regarding Plan (0.5); correspondence with R. Steinberg regarding Disclosure Statement (0.2); review Apollo comments to same (0.7); review and revise Plan and Disclosure Statement (1.3); call with Rothschild and Greenberg Traurig regarding CEBURES (0.5); correspondence with T. Graulich regarding same (0.3). 31226202 Steinberg, Richard J. 10/11/21 3.4 Correspondence with M. Masaro and A. Bane	31220300	Masaro, Matthew Bruno	10/11/21	5.1			
and others regarding Disclosure Statement, order and exhibits (1.1); review and revise same and Plan (3.1); review and revise notice of amended Disclosure Statement and Disclosure Statement order (0.4). 31220174 Melcer, Moshe 10/11/21 0.5 Revise Disclosure Statement. Piraino, Stephen D. 10/11/21 3.5 Correspondence with E. Jerrard regarding Plan (0.5); correspondence with R. Steinberg regarding Disclosure Statement (0.2); review Apollo comments to same (0.7); review and revise Plan and Disclosure Statement (1.3); call with Rothschild and Greenberg Traurig regarding CEBURES (0.5); correspondence with T. Graulich regarding same (0.3). 31226202 Steinberg, Richard J. 10/11/21 3.4 Correspondence with M. Masaro and A. Bane							
order and exhibits (1.1); review and revise same and Plan (3.1); review and revise notice of amended Disclosure Statement and Disclosure Statement order (0.4). Melcer, Moshe 10/11/21 0.5 Revise Disclosure Statement. Piraino, Stephen D. 10/11/21 3.5 Correspondence with E. Jerrard regarding Plan (0.5); correspondence with R. Steinberg regarding Disclosure Statement (0.2); review Apollo comments to same (0.7); review and revise Plan and Disclosure Statement (1.3); call with Rothschild and Greenberg Traurig regarding CEBURES (0.5); correspondence with T. Graulich regarding same (0.3). Steinberg, Richard J. 10/11/21 3.4 Correspondence with M. Masaro and A. Bane							
and Plan (3.1); review and revise notice of amended Disclosure Statement and Disclosure Statement order (0.4). 31220174 Melcer, Moshe 10/11/21 0.5 Revise Disclosure Statement. 31372939 Piraino, Stephen D. 10/11/21 3.5 Correspondence with E. Jerrard regarding Plan (0.5); correspondence with R. Steinberg regarding Disclosure Statement (0.2); review Apollo comments to same (0.7); review and revise Plan and Disclosure Statement (1.3); call with Rothschild and Greenberg Traurig regarding CEBURES (0.5); correspondence with T. Graulich regarding same (0.3). 31226202 Steinberg, Richard J. 10/11/21 3.4 Correspondence with M. Masaro and A. Bane							
amended Disclosure Statement and Disclosure Statement order (0.4). Melcer, Moshe 10/11/21 0.5 Revise Disclosure Statement. 31372939 Piraino, Stephen D. 10/11/21 3.5 Correspondence with E. Jerrard regarding Plan (0.5); correspondence with R. Steinberg regarding Disclosure Statement (0.2); review Apollo comments to same (0.7); review and revise Plan and Disclosure Statement (1.3); call with Rothschild and Greenberg Traurig regarding CEBURES (0.5); correspondence with T. Graulich regarding same (0.3). 31226202 Steinberg, Richard J. 10/11/21 3.4 Correspondence with M. Masaro and A. Bane							
31220174 Melcer, Moshe Piraino, Stephen D. 10/11/21 0.5 Revise Disclosure Statement. 31372939 Piraino, Stephen D. 10/11/21 3.5 Correspondence with E. Jerrard regarding Plan (0.5); correspondence with R. Steinberg regarding Disclosure Statement (0.2); review Apollo comments to same (0.7); review and revise Plan and Disclosure Statement (1.3); call with Rothschild and Greenberg Traurig regarding CEBURES (0.5); correspondence with T. Graulich regarding same (0.3). 31226202 Steinberg, Richard J. 10/11/21 3.4 Correspondence with M. Masaro and A. Bane							
31220174 Melcer, Moshe Piraino, Stephen D. 10/11/21 0.5 Revise Disclosure Statement. 31372939 Piraino, Stephen D. 10/11/21 3.5 Correspondence with E. Jerrard regarding Plan (0.5); correspondence with R. Steinberg regarding Disclosure Statement (0.2); review Apollo comments to same (0.7); review and revise Plan and Disclosure Statement (1.3); call with Rothschild and Greenberg Traurig regarding CEBURES (0.5); correspondence with T. Graulich regarding same (0.3). 31226202 Steinberg, Richard J. 10/11/21 3.4 Correspondence with M. Masaro and A. Bane					Statement order (0.4).		
(0.5); correspondence with R. Steinberg regarding Disclosure Statement (0.2); review Apollo comments to same (0.7); review and revise Plan and Disclosure Statement (1.3); call with Rothschild and Greenberg Traurig regarding CEBURES (0.5); correspondence with T. Graulich regarding same (0.3). 31226202 Steinberg, Richard J. 10/11/21 3.4 Correspondence with M. Masaro and A. Bane	31220174	Melcer, Moshe	10/11/21	0.5			
regarding Disclosure Statement (0.2); review Apollo comments to same (0.7); review and revise Plan and Disclosure Statement (1.3); call with Rothschild and Greenberg Traurig regarding CEBURES (0.5); correspondence with T. Graulich regarding same (0.3). 31226202 Steinberg, Richard J. 10/11/21 3.4 Correspondence with M. Masaro and A. Bane	31372939	Piraino, Stephen D.	10/11/21	3.5	Correspondence with E. Jerrard regarding Plan		
Apollo comments to same (0.7); review and revise Plan and Disclosure Statement (1.3); call with Rothschild and Greenberg Traurig regarding CEBURES (0.5); correspondence with T. Graulich regarding same (0.3). 31226202 Steinberg, Richard J. 10/11/21 3.4 Correspondence with M. Masaro and A. Bane							
revise Plan and Disclosure Statement (1.3); call with Rothschild and Greenberg Traurig regarding CEBURES (0.5); correspondence with T. Graulich regarding same (0.3). 31226202 Steinberg, Richard J. 10/11/21 3.4 Correspondence with M. Masaro and A. Bane							
with Rothschild and Greenberg Traurig regarding CEBURES (0.5); correspondence with T. Graulich regarding same (0.3). 31226202 Steinberg, Richard J. 10/11/21 3.4 Correspondence with M. Masaro and A. Bane							
regarding CEBURES (0.5); correspondence with T. Graulich regarding same (0.3). 31226202 Steinberg, Richard J. 10/11/21 3.4 Correspondence with M. Masaro and A. Bane							
T. Graulich regarding same (0.3). 31226202 Steinberg, Richard J. 10/11/21 3.4 Correspondence with M. Masaro and A. Bane							
31226202 Steinberg, Richard J. 10/11/21 3.4 Correspondence with M. Masaro and A. Bane							
o .	04000000	Otaliahana Diaka III	40/44/04	2.4			
	31226202	Steinberg, Richard J.	10/11/21	3.4	Correspondence with M. Masaro and A. Bane		

		Time Deta	ail By Pro	ject
Time ID	Name	Date	Hours	Narrative
				regarding Disclosure Statement and Plan (0.2); review Plan and Disclosure Statement regarding PLM (0.7); correspondence with S. Piraino regarding same (0.2); review and revise Disclosure Statement (2.1); correspondence with M. Melcer regarding same (0.2).
31351513	Bane, Abraham	10/12/21	2.3	Call with CEBURUS representative, Epiq, and others regarding Plan (0.6); call with Davis Polk Plan team regarding Plan issues list (0.3); review and revise Plan (1.3); correspondence with Davis Polk Plan team regarding same (0.1).
31244454	Dekhtyar, Mariya	10/12/21	0.3	Correspondence with M. Masaro regarding ballots and notices.
31233897	Graulich, Timothy	10/12/21	5.1	Call with H. Parkhill regarding Plan issues (0.6); call with A. Conesa and R. Sanchez Baker regarding Plan issues (1.8); review revised Plan (2.7).
31231274	Hanson, Cole	10/12/21	1.1	Review and revise Disclosure Statement and related exhibits.
31227836	Jerrard, Erik	10/12/21	6.7	Review and revise Plan (4.8); email with A. Bane and S. Ford regarding Plan issues (0.7); call with Epiq, Sainz Abogados, Greenberg Traurig and others regarding solicitation (0.6); correspondence with T. Graulich to discuss Plan updates (0.3); call with Davis Polk Plan team regarding Plan issues list (0.3).
31353393	Kudolo, Mary	10/12/21	2.3	Revisions to notices of amended Disclosure Statements.
31226834	Masaro, Matthew Bruno	10/12/21	6.5	Review and revise Disclosure Statement (2.3); correspondence with S. Piraino, R. Steinberg, and others regarding same (0.5); review and revise Disclosure Statement order and exhibits (2.7); correspondence with Epiq and others regarding same (0.4); call with Epiq, Sainz Abogados, Greenberg Traurig and others regarding solicitation (0.6).
31228057	Melcer, Moshe	10/12/21	1.2	Call with AlixPartners and others regarding claims voting (0.5); draft claims rider for Disclosure Statement (0.7).
31387241	Piraino, Stephen D.	10/12/21	2.0	Call with R. Steinberg regarding PLM treatment in Plan and Disclosure Statement (0.2); call with Epiq, Sainz Abogados, Greenberg Traurig, and others regarding solicitation (0.6); email with M. Masaro, R. Steinberg and others regarding Disclosure Statement (0.9); call with Davis Polk Plan team regarding Plan issues (0.3).
31477195	Steinberg, Richard J.	10/12/21	4.8	Call with Akin Gump regarding PLM treatment in Plan and Disclosure Statement (0.5); call with S. Piraino regarding same (0.2); review and revise Disclosure Statement regarding customer claims (2.1); correspondence with M. Melcer regarding same (0.2); review and revise Disclosure Statement and Plan regarding PLM (0.9); review and revise Disclosure Statement and Plan regarding voting (0.5); correspondence with

	Time Detail By Project					
Time ID	Name	Date	Hours	Narrative		
				Cleary Gottlieb regarding Deutsche Bank/Amex and BBVA facilities in connection with Plan and Disclosure Statement (0.4).		
31237800	Szanzer, Steven Z.	10/12/21	0.3	Correspondence with A. Bane regarding Plan issue.		
30781881 31247582	White, Erika D. Bane, Abraham	10/12/21 10/13/21	0.2 5.1	Review Plan treatment of credit card contracts. Call with Davis Polk Plan team regarding Plan (0.9); correspondence with S. Ford regarding same (0.4); correspondence with same regarding same (0.5); correspondence with E. Jerrard regarding revised notice of filing for same and Disclosure Statement (0.2); review		
31244548	Dekhtyar, Mariya	10/13/21	2.0	and revise Plan (3.1). Review and revise ballots and notices (1.7); email with M. Masaro regarding same (0.2); call		
31230152	Ford, Stephen	10/13/21	9.0	with same regarding same (0.1). Call with Davis Polk Plan team regarding Plan (0.9); correspondence with A. Bane regarding same (0.6); review exit financing term sheet and comments in connection with Plan (3.1); review		
31370808	Graulich, Timothy	10/13/21	2.7	and revise Plan (4.4). Call with A. Conesa and R. Sanchez Baker regarding Plan issues (0.8); call with L. Borchardt regarding Plan issues list (0.7); correspondence with S. Piraino and E. Jerrard		
31236252	Hanson, Cole	10/13/21	0.6	regarding Plan issues (1.2). Review and revise Disclosure Statement and		
31257277	Jerrard, Erik	10/13/21	9.3	related exhibits. Correspondence with S. Ford regarding Plan (0.3); extensive revision and revision of Plan (7.9); email with stakeholders and advisors regarding same (0.4); email with S. Piraino, M. Masaro, S. Ford, and A. Bane regarding same		
31233780	Masaro, Matthew Bruno	10/13/21	11.0	(0.7). Review and revise Disclosure Statement, Disclosure Statement order, and related exhibits (5.7); correspondence with S. Piraino, E. Jerrard, R. Steinberg, and others regarding same (3.3); correspondence with Epiq regarding solicitation (0.5); correspondence with Akin Gump and others regarding same (0.5); correspondence with Akin Gump, Gibson Dunn, Milbank, and Aeroméxico regarding Disclosure Statement (1.0).		
31240503 31370209	Melcer, Moshe Piraino, Stephen D.	10/13/21 10/13/21	0.2 4.7	Draft fleet rider for Disclosure Statement. Call with Sainz Abogados and Rothschild regarding preemptive rights (1.3); call with ad hoc noteholder group regarding same (0.6); call with Davis Polk Plan team regarding Plan issues (0.5) (partial attendance); call with Davis Polk team regarding Disclosure Statement (0.8); review and revise Disclosure Statement (0.8); review Delta term sheet (0.5); correspondence with Davis Polk team regarding same (0.2).		
31240668	Steinberg, Richard J.	10/13/21	5.7	Call with Davis Polk Plan team regarding Plan		

	Time Detail By Project					
Time ID	Name	Date	Hours	Narrative		
				issues (1.7); review and revise Plan and Disclosure Statement (4.0).		
31244939	Szanzer, Steven Z.	10/13/21	0.3	Correspondence with T. Graulich regarding Plan		
24247620	Pana Ahraham	10/14/21	0.4	and exit financing status.		
31247639	Bane, Abraham	10/14/21	8.4	Call with Epiq regarding Plan distribution (0.5); call with Epiq and CEBURES common		
				representative regarding same (0.6); review A.		
				Schwartz's comments to Plan (0.4); call with E. Jerrard regarding Plan (0.5); extensive review		
				and revision to Plan (4.8); correspondence with		
				R. Steinberg regarding claim provisions in same (0.4); correspondence with M. Masaro and S.		
				Ford regarding Plan (0.4); draft notice of revised		
				Plan and notice of revised Disclosure Statement		
31260553	Dekhtyar, Mariya	10/14/21	0.6	(0.8). Update Plan distribution tracker (0.1); review		
0.20000	2011.194.1, 1114.1.194		0.0	and revise beneficial holder ballot (0.1); email		
				with M. Masaro regarding same (0.1); call with Epiq regarding Plan distribution (0.3) (partial		
				attendance).		
31374601	Ford, Stephen	10/14/21	8.8	Call with Davis Polk Plan team regarding Plan		
				distribution (0.4); review comments from stakeholders to Plan (3.4); review and revise		
				Plan (5.0).		
31375909 31247318	Graulich, Timothy Hanson, Cole	10/14/21 10/14/21	4.9 0.5	Review revised Plan. Review and revise ballots and notices of non-		
31247316	Harison, Cole	10/14/21	0.5	voting status.		
31241443	Jerrard, Erik	10/14/21	12.3	Call with Creditors Committee principals, joint		
				bidder principals, and advisors regarding proposed Plan and exit financing (1.1); email		
				with Davis Polk Plan team regarding Plan		
				updates and related analysis (1.4); review and revise Plan (4.1); email with T. Graulich		
				regarding releases (0.4); correspondence with		
				A. Schwartz regarding Disclosure Statement		
				(1.2); call with A. Bane regarding Plan (0.5); correspondence with S. Piraino and T. Graulich		
				regarding Plan and case status (2.9); call with		
				Epiq regarding Plan distribution (0.5); correspondence with S. Ford regarding Plan		
				issues (0.2).		
31240536	Masaro, Matthew Bruno	10/14/21	10.7	Revise and revise Disclosure Statement, Disclosure Statement order, and related exhibits		
				(4.7); correspondence with S. Piraino, E.		
				Jerrard, R. Steinberg, A. Bane, S. Ford, and		
				others regarding same (2.8); correspondence with AlixPartners regarding same (0.6); call with		
				Akin Gump and others regarding solicitation		
				(0.5); call with Greenberg Traurig, Epiq, and others regarding CEBURES solicitation (0.5);		
				call with Epiq regarding Plan distribution (0.5);		
				correspondence with same regarding solicitation (0.3); review and revise Plan (0.8).		
31240630	Melcer, Moshe	10/14/21	0.4	Revise Disclosure Statement.		
31370101	Piraino, Stephen D.	10/14/21	6.3	Correspondence with A. Sainz regarding Delta		
1			00	term sheet (0.2); correspondence with M.		

	Time Detail By Project					
Time ID	Name	Date	Hours	Narrative		
				Masaro regarding Akin Gump regarding solicitation procedures (1.1); correspondence with T. Graulich regarding Delta terms sheet (0.4); review and revise Delta term sheet (0.6); correspondence with parties in interest regarding MIP (0.9); correspondence with Hughes Hubbard regarding Delta term sheet (0.2); extensive correspondence with T. Graulich		
31244323	Steinberg, Richard J.	10/14/21	5.6	and E. Jerrard regarding Plan (3.9). Call with Epiq regarding distributions under the Plan (0.4); review and revise claims provision of Plan (1.9); call with CEBURES, Epiq, Davis Polk team, and Sainz Abogados regarding Plan (0.7); email with AlixPartners regarding voting analysis (0.2); review and revise Disclosure Statement (2.0); correspondence with M. Masaro regarding Plan (0.4).		
31235845 31282242	White, Erika D. Bane, Abraham	10/14/21 10/15/21	0.2 7.4	Review Plan treatment of credit card contracts. Extensive review and revision of Plan (4.8); review comments stakeholders regarding same (0.7); correspondence with E. Jerrard regarding same (0.2); correspondence with S. Ford regarding Plan (0.2); correspondence with M. Masaro regarding same and Disclosure Statement (0.3); review exit financing term sheets regarding same (0.6); finalize revised Plan and Disclosure Statement for filing (0.4); correspondence with T. Graulich regarding same (0.2).		
31260865	Dekhtyar, Mariya	10/15/21	1.0	Compile Disclosure Statement exhibits (0.7); email with M. Masaro regarding same (0.2); update Plan distribution tracker (0.1).		
31250084	Ford, Stephen	10/15/21	6.7	Review and revise Plan (5.0); correspondence with E. Jerrard regarding same (0.5); prepare documents for Plan filing (1.0); correspondence		
31376581	Graulich, Timothy	10/15/21	12.3	with A. Bane regarding same (0.2). Call with A. Conesa and R. Sanchez Baker regarding Plan issues (0.8); extensive review and finalization Plan and Disclosure Statement (11.5).		
31250862 31262137	Hanson, Cole Huebner, Marshall S.	10/15/21 10/15/21	1.0 0.6	Draft tracker for analysis of responses to Plan. Correspondence with T. Graulich, Creditors Committee and creditors regarding Plan filing		
31257346	Jerrard, Erik	10/15/21	7.6	issues and timing. Review, revise, and finalize Plan for filing (6.2); email with Davis Polk Restructuring team regarding same (0.6); correspondence with T. Graulich and S. Piraino regarding same (0.8).		
31247865	Masaro, Matthew Bruno	10/15/21	6.8	Review and revise Disclosure Statement, Plan, Disclosure Statement order, and related exhibits (3.4); correspondence with E. Jerrard, S. Piraino, R. Steinberg, Aeroméxico, Akin Gump, AlixPartners, and others regarding same (3.4).		
31250111 31387258	Melcer, Moshe Piraino, Stephen D.	10/15/21 10/15/21	0.3 7.8	Revise Disclosure Statement. Extensive correspondence with M. Masaro, E. Jerrard, T. Graulich, and others regarding Plan		

Time Detail By Project					
Time ID	Name	Date	Hours	Narrative	
31379935	Steinberg, Richard J.	10/15/21	9.0	and Disclosure Statement (3.9); review and revise Disclosure Statement (2.2); call with creditors and other stakeholders regarding Plan and Disclosure Statement (1.7). Revise Plan and Disclosure Statement in connection with BBVA and DB/Amex facilities (1.0); email with Cleary Gottlieb regarding same (0.3); review and revise Disclosure Statement (2.3); review and revise objection to same (1.4); correspondence with Chambers regarding same and Plan (0.3); correspondence with Aeroméxico regarding same (0.2); prepare Plan vertice analysis (2.5)	
31249332	White, Erika D.	10/15/21	1.3	voting analysis (3.5). Correspondence with T. Green regarding Plan treatment of credit card contracts (0.4); review credit card contracts (0.9).	
31320122	Masaro, Matthew Bruno	10/16/21	0.3	Correspondence with S. Piraino and R. Steinberg regarding Disclosure Statement and hearing on same.	
31359052	McClammy, James I.	10/16/21	1.4	Review Plan documents.	
31380251	Steinberg, Richard J.	10/16/21	6.1	Prepare Plan voting analysis (4.4); correspondence with S. Piraino, Rothschild, Skyworks and others regarding same (1.2); correspondence with M. Melcer regarding same (0.5).	
31286765 31320134	Jerrard, Erik Masaro, Matthew Bruno	10/17/21 10/17/21	2.5 0.2	Review and analysis of Plan comments. Correspondence with C. Hanson and others regarding Plan and Disclosure Statement objection.	
31267390	Graulich, Timothy	10/18/21	4.3	Call with A. Conesa and R. Sanchez Baker regarding Plan issues (1.0); call with D. Botter regarding Plan (0.5); review revised Plan (2.8).	
31261224	Hanson, Cole	10/18/21	0.6	Revise objection and reservation of rights tracker.	
31273524	Huebner, Marshall S.	10/18/21	2.1	Correspondence with senior management and other advisers regarding Plan issues (1.1); correspondence with J. McClammy regarding documentation for confirmation hearing (0.3); correspondence with T. Graulich regarding Plan settlements (0.7).	
31313582 31264842	Jerrard, Erik Masaro, Matthew Bruno	10/18/21 10/18/21	1.5 4.2	Review and revise Plan issues list.	
31387459	Piraino, Stephen D.	10/18/21	2.6	Call with R. Steinberg regarding Disclosure Statement (0.2); call with AlixPartners team regarding Plan timeline (0.5); review and revise solicitation materials (1.5); email with M. Masaro and R. Steinberg regarding Disclosure	

	Time Detail By Project						
Time ID	Name	Date	Hours	Narrative			
31380380	Steinberg, Richard J.	10/18/21	0.9	Statement and related matters (0.4). Call with AlixPartners and Rothschild regarding Plan and Disclosure Statement timeline (0.7); call with S. Piraino regarding Disclosure			
31376810	Graulich, Timothy	10/19/21	5.4	Statement (0.2). Call with A. Conesa and R. Sanchez Baker regarding Plan issues (1.0); call with P. Tomasco regarding Plan and term sheet (0.5); call with D. Botter regarding Plan (0.5); review			
31274476 31266944	Hanson, Cole Masaro, Matthew Bruno	10/19/21 10/19/21	1.5 0.5	revised Disclosure Statement (3.4). Revise ballots and exhibits. Correspondence with Sainz Abogados team regarding Plan, Disclosure Statement, and ballots (0.2); correspondence with R. Steinberg, S. Piraino, and Epiq regarding Disclosure			
31387477	Piraino, Stephen D.	10/19/21	2.5	Statement and solicitation and voting (0.3). Call with Hughes Hubbard and Quinn Emmanuel regarding Plan issues (0.6); review and revise term sheet (0.4); correspondence with T. Graulich, J. Margolin and others regarding same (1.5).			
31380612	Steinberg, Richard J.	10/19/21	0.7	Email with Rothschild regarding Plan voting, support and holdings (0.3); correspondence with M. Masaro regarding Disclosure Statement (0.4).			
31277189	Ford, Stephen	10/20/21	0.9	Correspondence with Davis Polk team regarding Plan and Disclosure Statement.			
31377188	Graulich, Timothy	10/20/21	4.1	Call with A. Conesa and R. Sanchez Baker regarding Plan issues (0.9); review and comment on term sheet (3.2).			
31288528	Huebner, Marshall S.	10/20/21	0.8	Correspondence with Aeroméxico regarding Plan issues and updates (0.4); correspondence with T. Graulich regarding same (0.4).			
31512254	Jerrard, Erik	10/20/21	1.4	Review and revise Plan (0.8); call with Davis Polk Tax team regarding Plan tax issues (0.6).			
31275748	Masaro, Matthew Bruno	10/20/21	2.6	Correspondence with S. Piraino, Sainz Abogados team, and others regarding Disclosure Statement (2.0); correspondence with Greenberg Traurig regarding same and Plan (0.3); correspondence with AlixPartners regarding Delta claims (0.3).			
31387795	Piraino, Stephen D.	10/20/21	1.6	Correspondence with R. Steinberg and M. Masaro regarding Disclosure Statement (0.3); review Plan and Disclosure Statement comments (0.5); correspondence with R. Steinberg and M. Masaro regarding Disclosure Statement (0.3); review Plan and Disclosure Statement comments (0.5).			
31380692	Steinberg, Richard J.	10/20/21	3.1	Call with AlixPartners and Rothschild regarding convenience class (0.5); correspondence with M. Masaro regarding same (0.2); call with Davis Polk Tax team regarding Plan tax issues (0.6); correspondence with S. Piraino and M. Masaro regarding revisions to Plan and Disclosure Statement (0.3); review Certificate of No Objection regarding exclusivity motion (0.2);			

	Time Detail By Project						
Time ID	Name	Date	Hours	Narrative			
				email with Akin Gump regarding claims pool and Plan support (1.3).			
31287832	Szanzer, Steven Z.	10/20/21	0.5	Correspondence with T. Graulich regarding Plan status.			
31289624	Ford, Stephen	10/21/21	0.7	Call with Davis Polk Tax and Sainz Abogados teams regarding Plan.			
31377702	Graulich, Timothy	10/21/21	5.2	Call with S. Piraino regarding term sheet (0.5); call with A. Conesa and R. Sanchez Baker regarding Plan issues (0.9); review revised Plan (3.8).			
31285146	Jerrard, Erik	10/21/21	0.6	Call with Davis Polk Tax team and Mexican tax advisors regarding disputed claims reserve.			
31233768	Masaro, Matthew Bruno	10/21/21	3.5	Correspondence with Sainz Abogados, Akin Gump, and others regarding Mexican tender offer (0.5); correspondence with Davis Polk Tax team and others regarding disputed claims reserve (1.0); correspondence with Epiq and others regarding revised solicitation timeline (0.3); review and revise Disclosure Statement order and solicitation materials (1.3); correspondence with S. Piraino and others regarding CEBURES meeting (0.4).			
31401580	Piraino, Stephen D.	10/21/21	1.8	Call with T. Graulich regarding term sheet (0.5); review and revise term sheet (0.7); call with Sainz Abogados team regarding Mexican law issues (0.6).			
31380822	Steinberg, Richard J.	10/21/21	1.4	,			
31377987	Graulich, Timothy	10/22/21	6.1	Call with A. Conesa and R. Conesa regarding Plan issues (0.9); call with D. Botter regarding same (0.6); call with B. Miller and T. Goren regarding Disclosure Statement (0.4); call with P. Tomasco regarding Plan issue (0.5); review and revise Plan (3.7).			
31307342	Huebner, Marshall S.	10/22/21	0.8	Correspondence with D. Dunne and others regarding Plan issues (0.5); correspondence with Aeroméxico regarding same (0.3).			
31292352	Jerrard, Erik	10/22/21	3.5	Correspondence with S. Ford regarding Plan structuring (0.3); analyze Plan creditor distribution and structuring issues (2.8); call with R. Steinberg regarding customer programs treats and claims issue in Plan (0.4).			
31294055	Masaro, Matthew Bruno	10/22/21	1.3	Correspondence with Sainz Abogados and S. Piraino regarding notice of Mexican brokerage requirement (0.4); correspondence with M. Melcer and R. Steinberg regarding voting and solicitation (0.2); correspondence with S. Piraino, E. Jerrard, Rothschild, Sainz Abogados and others regarding CEBURES meeting (0.7).			
31401794 31380910	Piraino, Stephen D. Steinberg, Richard J.	10/22/21 10/22/21	2.2 5.1	Review and revise term sheets. Revise Disclosure Statement (0.3); correspondence with M. Masaro regarding same (0.2); call with E. Jerrard regarding customer programs treats and claims issue in Plan (0.4); review letter to Creditors Committee regarding			

	Time Detail By Project					
Time ID	Name	Date	Hours	Narrative		
				Plan (0.4); email with T. Graulich regarding claims and Plan support (0.7); revise voting analysis and outstanding claims analysis (3.1).		
31320360	Masaro, Matthew Bruno	10/23/21	0.5	Correspondence with R. Steinberg and Epiq regarding solicitation.		
31381012	Steinberg, Richard J.	10/23/21	0.6	Review and revise Disclosure Statement and Plan regarding customer claims.		
31303810	Bane, Abraham	10/24/21	3.1	Correspondence with E. Jerrard and S. Ford regarding Plan (0.4); review and revise Plan (2.1); review and revise issues list (0.4); correspondence with S. Ford regarding same (0.2).		
31300695	Ford, Stephen	10/24/21	5.1	Correspondence with E. Jerrard and A. Bane regarding Plan (0.3); review and revise Plan (3.7); review and revise Plan issues list (1.1).		
31309025	Huebner, Marshall S.	10/24/21	0.5	Correspondence with T. Graulich and Aeroméxico regarding Plan developments.		
31314706	Jerrard, Erik	10/24/21	1.5	Review and analyze Plan developments.		
31302125	Melcer, Moshe	10/24/21	0.1	Email with S. Szanzer regarding Plan classes.		
31350034	Bane, Abraham	10/25/21	1.1	Revise Plan and Plan issues list (0.4); review E. Jerrard comments to same (0.2); review fleet provisions in Plan (0.3); correspondence with Davis Polk Fleet team regarding same (0.2).		
31331025	Dekhtyar, Mariya	10/25/21	0.9	Email with R. Steinberg regarding Disclosure Statement draft (0.1); review and revise Disclosure Statement (0.8).		
31306601	Ford, Stephen	10/25/21	5.2	Update Plan issues list (2.0); review and revise Plan (3.2).		
31378210	Graulich, Timothy	10/25/21	3.5	Correspondence with M. Huebner regarding Plan issues (0.5); call with A. Conesa and R. Sanchez Baker regarding Plan issues (0.8); call with L. Donahue regarding same (0.5); review incentive Plan presentation (1.7).		
31317235	Huebner, Marshall S.	10/25/21	2.0	Email with Aeromexico, advisors, and multiple stakeholders regarding open issues on Plan and various term sheets (0.9); call with management team and financial advisors regarding same (0.8); call with P. Carter regarding open issues with Delta (0.3).		
31314077 31303848	Jegarl, Christine Jerrard, Erik	10/25/21 10/25/21	5.0 4.2	Review research summary on Plan issues. Extensive revision of Plan and analysis of plan		
31305698	Masaro, Matthew Bruno	10/25/21	3.7	correspondence with Epiq, S. Piraino, and others regarding solicitation, voting, and distribution (0.3); correspondence with AlixPartners and others regarding Disclosure Statement (0.5); review and revise same (1.1); correspondence with R. Steinberg and S. Piraino regarding same (0.6); correspondence with Greenberg Traurig and others regarding Disclosure Statement and CEBURES meeting (0.4); review and revise presentation for same (0.4); review and revise Disclosure Statement order (0.2); correspondence with R. Steinberg, S. Piraino, and others regarding same (0.2).		
31323913	Piraino, Stephen D.	10/25/21	0.1	Call with J. Rubin regarding Plan.		

	Time Detail By Project					
Time ID	Name	Date	Hours	Narrative		
31379213	Steinberg, Richard J.	10/25/21	2.0	Call with Epiq regarding solicitation (0.8); call with AlixPartners regarding case timeline (0.7); revise proposed order approving Disclosure Statement (0.5).		
31344787	Sturm, Josh	10/25/21	0.2	Correspondence with Davis Polk team regarding description of claims in Plan.		
31339208	Bane, Abraham	10/26/21	1.0	Call with E. Jerrard regarding Plan (0.3); review comments from same regarding same (0.2); correspondence with A. Schwartz regarding same (0.2); correspondence with Davis Polk Tax team regarding same (0.3).		
31314695	Ford, Stephen	10/26/21	8.4	Research issues regarding Plan (2.5); review and revise Plan (2.1); call with Chubb regarding Plan (1.3); incorporate Chubb comments regarding Plan (2.5).		
31378414	Graulich, Timothy	10/26/21	5.0	Call with A. Conesa and R. Sanchez Baker regarding Plan issues (1.2); review revised Plan (3.8).		
31320173	Hanson, Cole	10/26/21	2.4	Review and revise notice of Disclosure Statement order (0.6); review and revise Disclosure Statement exhibits (1.8).		
31334748	Huebner, Marshall S.	10/26/21	3.0	Call with shareholders regarding emergence issues and MIP (0.5); call with Willis Towers regarding same (0.8); correspondence with Davis Polk team regarding compensation structure issue (1.7).		
31327695	Jerrard, Erik	10/26/21	5.4	Review and revise Plan (2.3); call with A. Bane regarding same (0.3); correspondence with M. Masaro regarding same (0.3); review solicitation materials (0.8); call with Rothschild, AlixPartners, and R. Steinberg regarding convenience class (0.6); call with S. Piraino regarding Plan and Disclosure Statement (0.6); call with Chubb counsel, S. Piraino, and others regarding Disclosure Statement (0.5).		
31311943	Masaro, Matthew Bruno	10/26/21	4.7	Review and revise Disclosure Statement order, exhibits, and Disclosure Statement (4.0); correspondence with S. Piraino, R. Steinberg, E. Jerrard, and others regarding same (0.7).		
31319614 31384751	Melcer, Moshe Piraino, Stephen D.	10/26/21 10/26/21	0.6 2.6	Review and revise Disclosure Statement.		
31378388	Steinberg, Richard J.	10/26/21	2.1	Call with Rothschild, AlixPartners, and E. Jerrard regarding convenience class (0.6); revise Disclosure Statement (0.3); draft customer claims notice of non-voting status (0.6); revise Plan (0.6).		
31349788	Bane, Abraham	10/27/21	1.9			

	Time Detail By Project					
Time ID	Name	Date	Hours	Narrative		
				(0.1); review and revise Plan to reflect same (1.4).		
31322231	Ford, Stephen	10/27/21	3.5	Correspondence with Davis Polk team regarding Plan and Disclosure Statement strategy (1.0); review and revise Plan (2.3); call with Akin Gump, Rothschild, and Davis Polk team regarding Plan (0.2).		
31329592	Graulich, Timothy	10/27/21	4.0	Call with S. Piraino and E. Jerrard regarding Plan and subscription agreement issues (1.2); review and revise term sheet (1.9); call with A. Conesa regarding Plan issues (0.9)		
31348641	Jerrard, Erik	10/27/21	10.3	Extensive review and revision of Plan (5.8); email with Davis Polk Restructuring team regarding same (0.5); analyze Plan precedents (1.2); call with joint bidder advisors regarding Plan (0.6); analyze DIP schedule 2.12 as it relates to Plan (0.7); call with S. Piraino and T. Graulich regarding Plan subscription agreement (0.8) (partial attendance); review Plan comments from A. Schwartz (0.4); call with A. Bane regarding Plan (0.3).		
31320400	Masaro, Matthew Bruno	10/27/21	2.7	Review and revise Disclosure Statement, Disclosure Statement order, exhibits, and Plan (1.4); correspondence with S. Piraino, R. Steinberg, and Epiq regarding same (0.6); correspondence with C. Hanson regarding notice of revised Disclosure Statement and Disclosure Statement order (0.1); review and revise same (0.1); correspondence with Willkie Farr regarding Disclosure Statement order and solicitation documents (0.5).		
31321066 31384773	Melcer, Moshe Piraino, Stephen D.	10/27/21 10/27/21	0.5 3.7	Review and revise Disclosure Statement. Call with T. Graulich and E. Jerrard regarding Plan and subscription agreement (1.2); extensive correspondence with Akin Gump, Milbank, Hughes Hubbard and Davis Polk team regarding term sheets and related issues (2.2); review Delta term sheet (0.3).		
31378236	Steinberg, Richard J.	10/27/21	0.7	Email with T. Graulich regarding class voting analysis, Plan support analysis, and outstanding claims analysis.		
31342281	Szanzer, Steven Z.	10/27/21	0.7	•		
31344612	Bane, Abraham	10/28/21	2.1	Revise solicitation materials (1.1); correspondence with R. Steinberg and M. Masaro regarding same (0.2); correspondence with S. Ford regarding Plan issue (0.4); review precedent regarding same (0.4).		
31332593	Ford, Stephen	10/28/21	5.0	Correspondence with E. Jerrard regarding Plan (0.3); review and revise Plan (4.4); correspondence with creditor groups regarding Plan (0.3).		
31378647	Graulich, Timothy	10/28/21	9.2	Call with D. Botter regarding Plan (0.5); call with A. Conesa and R. Sanchez Baker regarding		

	Time Detail By Project					
Time ID	Name	Date	Hours	Narrative		
31348664	Jerrard, Erik	10/28/21	8.0	Plan issues (1.0); call with L. Donahue regarding same (0.5); review revised Plan proposal (1.8); review revised Plan (3.1); review and comment on Plan proposal comparison (2.3). Call with AlixPartners and Rothschild regarding convenience class (0.6); research issues regarding same (0.7); analyze Plan structuring and related issues (3.4); email with S. Ford and A. Bane regarding Plan issue (0.7); call with J.		
31331298	Masaro, Matthew Bruno	10/28/21	5.8	Rubin and M. Brod regarding cash-out option and releases in Plan (0.7); correspondence with S. Piraino regarding Plan (0.8); review and revise Plan (1.1). Correspondence with M. Melcer, Rothschild, R. Steinberg, AlixPartners, E. Jerrard, and S. Piraino regarding Plan, convenience class, and Disclosure Statement (1.0); correspondence with AlixPartners, S. Piraino, and R. Steinberg regarding Disclosure Statement (1.6); review and revise same (2.8); correspondence with A.		
31331674 31379362	Melcer, Moshe Piraino, Stephen D.	10/28/21 10/28/21	0.3 3.6	Bane regarding Plan summary (0.2); correspondence with Sainz Abogados regarding notice of Mexican brokerage requirement and Disclosure Statement (0.2). Revise Disclosure Statement. Call with AlixPartners and Rothschild regarding convenience classes (0.5); correspondence with M. Masaro regarding Disclosure Statement		
31376624	Steinberg, Richard J.	10/28/21	5.9	matters (0.1); analyze and coordinate Disclosure Statement and solicitation materials (2.2); review Plan (0.8). Call with AlixPartners and Rothschild regarding convenience classes (0.6); review Plan Summary (0.5); review and revise class voting analysis, Plan support analysis, and outstanding claims analysis (4.0); correspondence with M. Melcer regarding same (0.6); correspondence with M. Masaro regarding Disclosure Statement		
31342414	Szanzer, Steven Z.	10/28/21	1.3	(0.2). Correspondence with Davis Polk team and AlixPartners regarding Plan classification issues		
31348921	Bane, Abraham	10/29/21	3.3	and consider same. Call with A. Schwartz and others regarding Plan (0.8); call with Davis Polk Plan team regarding Plan issues (0.6); review and revise Plan to reflect same (1.7); correspondence with S. Ford		
31349992	Dekhtyar, Mariya	10/29/21	0.6	regarding same (0.2). Research precedent disclosure statements (0.1); call with Davis Polk Plan team regarding Plan issues (0.5).		
31340857	Ford, Stephen	10/29/21	9.0	Research issues regarding Plan (3.0); review exit financing proposal regarding same (2.0); call with Davis Polk Plan team regarding Plan issues (0.6); review and revise Plan (3.4).		
31378832	Graulich, Timothy	10/29/21	6.5	Call with joint bidders regarding proposal (0.8); review and revise comparison regarding same		

	Time Detail By Project					
Time ID	Name	Date	Hours	Narrative		
				(2.1); call with A. Conesa and R. Sanchez Baker regarding Plan issues (1.0); call with independent directors regarding same (1.3); correspondence with S. Piraino and E. Jerrard regarding Plan revisions (0.7); call with PJT		
31347530	Hanson, Cole	10/29/21	1.1	Partners regarding Plan issues (0.6). Call with Davis Polk Plan team regarding Plan issues (0.5); draft notice of Disclosure Statement (0.6).		
31340436	Jerrard, Erik	10/29/21	3.6	Call with A. Schwartz and others regarding Plan (0.8); analyze exit financing and related Plan filing and timing issues (2.1); email with T. Graulich regarding same (0.7).		
31341051	Masaro, Matthew Bruno	10/29/21	9.2	Extensive review and revision of Disclosure Statement, Disclosure Statement order, exhibits, and Plan (6.2); correspondence with R. Steinberg, E. Jerrard, S. Piraino, S. Ford, and A. Bane regarding same (2.2); correspondence with J. Sullivan and S. Kjontvedt regarding cash opt-in election (0.7); correspondence with Akin Gump, Sainz Abogados, and others notice of		
31378942	Piraino, Stephen D.	10/29/21	0.5	Mexican brokerage requirement (0.1). Review and research Disclosure Statement		
31375859	Steinberg, Richard J.	10/29/21	5.0	Revise Disclosure Statement and related documents (2.9); correspondence with S. Piraino and M. Masaro regarding same (0.5); call with Davis Polk Plan team regarding Plan		
31510716	Sturm, Josh	10/29/21	0.5	issues (0.6); update voting analysis (1.0). Correspondence with Davis Polk Fleet team regarding fleet assumption provisions in Plan		
31350078	Szanzer, Steven Z.	10/29/21	0.5	(0.3); review same (0.2). Review materials regarding updated joint		
31349772	Bane, Abraham	10/30/21	0.5	creditor Plan proposal. Revise Plan (0.4); correspondence with S. Ford		
31364104	Blanco, Maurice	10/30/21	1.3	regarding same (0.1). Review and revise Disclosure Statement (0.7); email with Davis Polk team regarding same (0.6).		
31350008 31347030	Dekhtyar, Mariya Ford, Stephen	10/30/21 10/30/21	1.1 9.2	Review and revise Disclosure Statement. Extensive review and revision of Plan (7.1); research issues regarding same (2.1).		
31349422	Graulich, Timothy	10/30/21	7.7	Call with M. Huebner regarding Plan (0.5); call with H. Parkhill, A. Sainz and others regarding same (1.1); call with D. Botter regarding same (0.6); call with A. Conesa regarding same (0.6); review and comment on Plan (4.9).		
31369606 31365734	Huebner, Marshall S. Jerrard, Erik	10/30/21 10/30/21	0.5 7.3	Call with T. Graulich regarding Plan. Call with H. Parkhill, A. Sainz, and others regarding Plan (1.1); prepare for same (0.2); review and revise Plan (3.7); email with Davis Polk Restructuring team regarding Plan issues (1.4); email with stakeholder regarding Disclosure Statement and exit financing issues (0.3); analyze pleadings regarding same (0.6).		
31348015	Masaro, Matthew Bruno	10/30/21	5.3	Review and revise Disclosure Statement and		

		Time De	etail By Pro	iect
Time ID	Name	Date	Hours	Narrative
31360991	Piraino, Stephen D.	10/30/21	2.2	Plan (3.6); correspondence with R. Steinberg, S. Piraino, E. Jerrard, S. Ford, and others regarding same (1.7). Correspondence with R. Steinberg and E. Jerrard regarding Disclosure Statement and Plan (0.4); review and revise Disclosure
31375701	Steinberg, Richard J.	10/30/21	3.8	Statement (1.5); review Plan (0.3). Review and revise Disclosure Statement and related documents (3.2); correspondence with S. Piraino and M. Masaro regarding same (0.6).
31348599	Talamás Velázquez, Ernesto	10/30/21	1.7	Review and revise Disclosure Statement.
31483750	Bane, Abraham	10/31/21	1.6	Review and revise Plan (1.3); correspondence with M. Masaro regarding same (0.2); correspondence with R. Steinberg regarding same (0.1).
31364116	Blanco, Maurice	10/31/21	1.1	Review and revise Disclosure Statement (0.6); email with Davis Polk team regarding same (0.5).
31350030	Ford, Stephen	10/31/21	4.0	Review and revise Plan.
31379018	Graulich, Timothy	10/31/21	7.6	Review and comment on Plan (3.7); review and comment on Disclosure Statement (2.7); call with A. Conesa regarding Plan issues (1.2).
31349950	Jerrard, Erik	10/31/21	8.1	Call with advisors and management regarding Plan (0.6); correspondence with S. Ford to discuss Plan (0.4); correspondence with M. Masaro regarding Disclosure Statement (0.3); extensive review and revision of Plan (6.4); email with Aeroméxico regarding plan issues (0.4).
31350348	Masaro, Matthew Bruno	10/31/21	7.2	Review and revise Disclosure Statement and Plan (5.3); correspondence with R. Steinberg, S. Piraino, E. Jerrard, S. Ford, and A. Bane regarding same (1.9).
31357475	McClammy, James I.	10/31/21	3.3	Correspondence with T. Graulich regarding Plan status (1.3); call with Aeroméxico and advisors regarding Plan negotiations and next steps (1.2); review revised Plan and Disclosure Statement (0.8).
31360959	Piraino, Stephen D.	10/31/21	0.7	Call with Davis Polk and Rothschild teams regarding Disclosure Statement (0.2); review and revise Disclosure Statement (0.5).
31374613	Steinberg, Richard J.	10/31/21	2.5	Review and revise Disclosure Statement and related documents (1.9); correspondence with M. Masaro regarding same (0.3); email with Rothschild regarding same (0.3).
Total AM230) Plan/Disclosure Stateme	ent	725.6	
AM240 DPW 31348945	/ Retention/Preparation of Bane, Abraham	DPW Fee Sta 10/04/21	tements/Ap 0.6	Correspondence with E. Jerrard regarding Davis Polk Fifth Supplemental Declaration (0.3); finalize same (0.1); coordinate filing of same
31223041 31244444	Jerrard, Erik Dekhtyar, Mariya	10/04/21 10/12/21	0.5 6.6	(0.2). Review Fifth Supplemental Declaration. Email with A. Bane regarding Fourth Interim Fee

	Time Detail By Project						
Time ID	Name	Date	Hours	Narrative			
				Application.			
31260652	Dekhtyar, Mariya	10/14/21	0.1	Email with A. Scalzo regarding Fourth Interim Fee Application issues.			
31351424	Bane, Abraham	10/18/21	0.3	Correspondence with M. Dekhtyar regarding Davis Polk budget.			
31273417	Dekhtyar, Mariya	10/18/21	8.0	Review and revise Fourth Interim Fee Application (0.7); email with A. Bane regarding same (0.1).			
31313565	Dekhtyar, Mariya	10/20/21	0.9	Review and revise Fourth Interim Fee			
31304194	Bane, Abraham	10/21/21	2.3	Application. Revise Fourth Interim Fee Application (1.7); call with M. Dekhtyar regarding same (0.2); correspondence with E. Jerrard regarding status			
31290154	Melcer, Moshe	10/21/21	0.3	of same (0.2); correspondence with M. Melcer regarding same (0.2). Review and revise Fourth Interim Fee			
31320542	Dekhtyar, Mariya	10/22/21	0.8	Application. Review and revise Fourth Interim Fee Application (0.6); call with A. Bane regarding			
31300436	Jerrard, Erik	10/22/21	0.8	same (0.2). Review and finalize August and September Monthly Fee Statements.			
31313618	Dekhtyar, Mariya	10/23/21	1.7	Review and revise Fourth Interim Fee Application.			
31313636	Dekhtyar, Mariya	10/24/21	0.7	Review and revise Fourth Interim Fee Application.			
31350045	Bane, Abraham	10/25/21	2.4	Review and revise Fourth Interim Fee Application (2.1); correspondence with E.			
31331159	Dekhtyar, Mariya	10/25/21	5.4	Jerrard and M. Dekhtyar regarding same (0.3). Review and revise Fourth Interim Fee Application (3.4); email with A. Bane regarding same (0.8); correspondence with same regarding same (0.1); call with N. Kurian regarding same (0.2); email with M. Giddens regarding same (0.2); correspondence with N. Kurian and A. Bane regarding same (0.1); review comments from A. Bane to Fourth Interim Fee Application (0.1); call with A. Bane regarding Fourth Interim Fee Application (0.2); email with E. Jerrard regarding same (0.2); review comments from E. Jerrard to Fourth			
31368217	Giddens, Magali	10/25/21	2.6	Interim Fee Application (0.1). Correspondence with M. Dekhtyar regarding Fourth Interim Fee Application issues (0.2); correspondence with E. Castillo regarding same (0.4); review excel regarding same (0.5); correspondence with M. Dekhtyar and E. Castillo regarding same (0.3); review Fourth			
31339269	Bane, Abraham	10/26/21	1.3	Interim Fee Application disbursements(1.2). Review and finalize Fourth Interim Fee Application (0.6); correspondence with M. Dekhtyar regarding same (0.4); correspondence with M. Giddens regarding same (0.1);			

	Time Detail By Project					
Time ID	Name	Date	Hours	Narrative		
				correspondence with T. Graulich regarding same (0.2).		
31331502	Dekhtyar, Mariya	10/26/21	2.3	Email with A. Bane regarding Fourth Interim Fee Application issues (0.2); compile Fourth Interim Fee Application (0.5); email with E. Jerrard regarding Fourth Interim Fee Application (0.1); email with T. Graulich regarding same (0.2); review and revise Fourth Interim Fee Application (0.3); correspondence with M. Giddens regarding same (0.4); email with A. Bane regarding compiled Fourth Interim invoice (0.1); correspondence with same regarding Fourth Interim Fee Application (0.2); email with M. Giddens regarding same (0.1); review Fourth Interim Fee Application compiled file issues (0.2).		
31369512	Giddens, Magali	10/26/21	4.6	Review and compile Fourth Interim Fee Application disbursements.		
31327690 31513267	Jerrard, Erik Jerrard, Erik	10/26/21 10/27/21	0.6 0.4	Finalize Fourth Interim Fee Application for filing. Email with A. Bane regarding Fourth Interim Fee Application.		
Total AM240 DPW Retention/Preparation of DPW Fee Statements/Applications and Budget			36.0	, application.		
AM250 IP, R 31184963	Regulatory and Tax Altus, Leslie J.	10/01/21	0.8	Correspondence with A. Siman regarding exit financing issues (0.5); respond to email regarding tax disclosure in Disclosure Statement (0.3).		
31160377	Donnelly, Jacob M.	10/01/21	3.4	Review and revise tax disclosure in Disclosure Statement (2.3); review revisions to Mexican tax disclosure (0.5); email with S. Piraino regarding tax disclosure in Disclosure Statement (0.3); email with A. Siman regarding same (0.3).		
31048802	Farr, Lucy W.	10/01/21	0.7	Review and revise tax disclosure in Disclosure Statement (0.5); email with Davis Polk Tax team regarding tax issues (0.2).		
31370551	Piraino, Stephen D.	10/01/21	8.0	Correspondence with Davis Polk Tax team regarding Plan and Disclosure Statement.		
31263137	Siman, Ariel	10/01/21	12.1	Review and revise tax disclosures in Disclosure Statement (6.6); review exit financing term sheets, including gross up provision (4.0); correspondence with Davis Polk Tax team regarding same (1.5).		
31184976	Altus, Leslie J.	10/02/21	1.6	Review email regarding exit financing issues (0.4); call with L. Farr and A. Siman regarding same (1.2).		
31000827	Farr, Lucy W.	10/02/21	1.2			
31184997	Altus, Leslie J.	10/03/21	2.3	Review email regarding Plan and financing documents (1.1); call with Davis Polk team regarding same (0.8); correspondence with Davis Polk Tax team regarding same (0.4).		
31180620	Donnelly, Jacob M.	10/03/21	3.2	Call with Davis Polk Tax team regarding same (0.4). withholding (0.5); research tax treatment of		

	Time Detail By Project					
Time ID	Name	Date	Hours	Narrative		
				disputed claims reserves (0.5); email with L. Farr and L. Altus regarding same (0.2); prepare chart of tax withholding precedent treatment (1.9); email with L. Farr and L. Altus regarding		
31011948	Farr, Lucy W.	10/03/21	1.5	same (0.1). Call with Davis Polk Tax team regarding exit financing issues (1.2); correspondence with		
31227612	Levenback, Ben	10/03/21	1.4	same regarding same (0.3). Call with L. Farr and L. Altus regarding exit financing issues (1.2); correspondence with same regarding same (0.2).		
31263214	Siman, Ariel	10/03/21	3.9	Review exit financing term sheets regarding gross-up provision (2.7); call with L. Farr and L. Altus regarding financing issues (1.2).		
31194020	Altus, Leslie J.	10/04/21	1.4	Call with Davis Polk Tax and Finance teams, Chevez, and Sainz Abogados regarding tax withholding (0.9); email with Davis Polk Tax		
31185898	Donnelly, Jacob M.	10/04/21	1.7	team regarding tax issues. (0.5). Call with Davis Polk Tax and Finance teams, Chevez, and Sainz Abogados regarding tax withholding (0.9); coordinate call with R. Sanchez Baker regarding same (0.3); email with L. Altus regarding disputed claims reserves (0.2); research tax treatment of disputed claims reserve (0.3).		
31148659	Farr, Lucy W.	10/04/21	1.8	Call with Davis Polk Tax and Finance teams, Chevez, and Sainz Abogados regarding tax withholding (0.9); correspondence with Davis Polk Tax team regarding tax issues (0.9).		
31198037	Altus, Leslie J.	10/05/21	2.9	Analyze exit financing and Mexico tax issues (0.8); correspondence with L. Farr regarding same (0.5); call with Davis Polk Tax and Finance teams, Aeroméxico, Chevez, and Sainz Abogados regarding tax withholding (0.7); call with Davis Polk Tax team regarding debt term sheet tax implications (0.5); review debt term		
31192054	Donnelly, Jacob M.	10/05/21	3.3	sheet (0.4). Research disputed ownership fund rules issues (0.7); call with Davis Polk Tax and Finance team, Aeroméxico, Chevez, and Sainz Abogados regarding tax withholding (0.7); prepare for call with L. Farr, L. Altus, and B. Levenback regarding debt term sheet tax implications (0.5); call with Davis Polk tax team regarding same (0.5); review and revise debt term sheet (0.8); email with A. Troconis and E.		
31188196	Farr, Lucy W.	10/05/21	2.8	Jerrard regarding same (0.1). Call with Davis Polk Tax and Finance teams, Aeroméxico, Chevez, and Sainz Abogados regarding tax withholding (0.7); call with Davis Polk Tax team regarding debt term sheet tax implications (0.5); correspondence with Davis		
31232204	Levenback, Ben	10/05/21	1.9	Polk Tax team regarding tax issues (1.6). Call with Davis Polk Tax team regarding debt term sheet tax implications (0.5); call with Davis Polk Tax and Finance teams, Aeroméxico,		

Time Detail By Project					
Time ID	Name	Date	Hours	Narrative	
31199489 31220973	Donnelly, Jacob M. Altus, Leslie J.	10/06/21 10/07/21	0.2 2.0	Chevez, and Sainz Abogados regarding tax withholding (0.7); prepare for same (0.4); review revision to debt term sheet (0.3). Email with E. Jerrard regarding debt term sheet. Review debt term sheet (0.9); call with Davis Polk Tax and Restructuring teams regarding call with advisors (0.3); call with Akin Gump and Davis Polk Tax and Restructuring teams	
31217773	Donnelly, Jacob M.	10/07/21	1.0	regarding debt term sheet (0.4); correspondence with Davis Polk Tax team regarding same (0.4). Call with Davis Polk Tax and Restructuring teams regarding call with advisors (0.3); call with Akin Gump and Davis Polk Tax and Restructuring teams regarding debt term sheet	
31196629	Farr, Lucy W.	10/07/21	1.2	teams regarding call with advisors (0.3); call with Akin Gump and Davis Polk Tax and Restructuring teams regarding debt term sheet	
31227730	Levenback, Ben	10/07/21	1.1	(0.4); correspondence with Davis Polk Tax team regarding tax issues (0.5). Call with Davis Polk Tax and Restructuring teams regarding call with advisors (0.3); call with Akin Gump and Davis Polk Tax and Restructuring teams regarding debt term sheet	
31221091 31387157 31231555 31387247	Altus, Leslie J. Piraino, Stephen D. Donnelly, Jacob M. Piraino, Stephen D.	10/08/21 10/08/21 10/12/21 10/12/21	0.3 0.6 0.1 0.3	(0.4); review revisions to debt term sheet (0.2); email with J. Donnelly regarding same (0.2). Review email regarding exit financing issues. Call with G. Morrison regarding antitrust issues. Email with S. Piraino regarding tax issues. Call with W. Schisa and others regarding	
31256896	Schisa, Will	10/12/21	0.3	sanctions issues. Call with S. Piraino and others regarding	
31242587	Altus, Leslie J.	10/13/21	0.1	sanctions issues. Review correspondence from Davis Polk restructuring team regarding Disclosure	
31370198	Piraino, Stephen D.	10/13/21	0.1	Statement. Correspondence with G. Morrison regarding antitrust issues.	
31250273	Altus, Leslie J.	10/14/21	0.3	Correspondence with J. Donnelly regarding Plan and Disclosure Statement.	
31246637	Donnelly, Jacob M.	10/14/21	1.4	Review and revise Plan and Disclosure Statement (0.7); research disputed claims reserves tax implications (0.3); email with L. Altus regarding Disclosure Statement and Plan issues, including disputed claims reserve issue (0.4).	
31208254	Farr, Lucy W.	10/14/21	0.2	Email with Davis Polk Tax team regarding tax issues.	
31256766	Schisa, Will	10/14/21	0.8	Review and comment on sanctions provisions of equity subscription agreement.	
31250378	Donnelly, Jacob M.	10/15/21	1.5	Review equity subscription agreement (1.3); email with A. Simmonds regarding equity term sheet (0.1); email with AlixPartners regarding financials (0.1).	

	Time Detail By Project					
Time ID	Name	Date	Hours	Narrative		
31268858 31260641	Altus, Leslie J. Donnelly, Jacob M.	10/18/21 10/18/21	0.2 1.7	L. Farr and L. Altus regarding equity subscription agreement and updated PFIC analysis (0.2); email with L. Farr regarding equity subscription agreement and disputed claims reserve (0.1); email with A. Simmonds regarding equity subscription agreement (0.2); correspondence with A. Siman regarding tax issues (0.1); schedule call with L. Farr, L. Altus, and A. Siman regarding disputed claims reserve (0.1); research authorities regarding disputed		
31248851	Farr, Lucy W.	10/18/21	0.3	claims reserves (0.3). Email with Davis Polk team regarding tax issues.		
31307814	Siman, Ariel	10/18/21	0.6	Review and revise subscription agreement.		
31279576	Altus, Leslie J.	10/19/21	0.6	Call with Davis Polk Tax team regarding disputed claims reserve.		
31269210	Donnelly, Jacob M.	10/19/21	4.8	Call with Davis Polk Tax team regarding disputed claims reserve (0.7); research issues regarding disputed claims reserves (3.8); email		
31268214	Farr, Lucy W.	10/19/21	0.7	with S. Piraino regarding same (0.3). Call with Davis Polk Tax team regarding disputed claims reserve.		
31307821	Siman, Ariel	10/19/21	1.9	Review and revise equity subscription agreement.		
31295352	Altus, Leslie J.	10/20/21	2.4	Review subscription agreement issues (0.7); analyze Plan issues (1.0); call with Davis Polk Restructuring team regarding disputed claims reserve (0.7).		
31275581	Donnelly, Jacob M.	10/20/21	3.1	Call with Davis Polk Restructuring team regarding disputed claims serve (0.7); call with Davis Polk Tax Team regarding same (0.7); research issues regarding same (1.7).		
31387791	Piraino, Stephen D.	10/20/21	0.6	Call with Davis Polk Tax team regarding disputed claims reserve.		
31295406	Altus, Leslie J.	10/21/21	1.6	•		
31286122	Donnelly, Jacob M.	10/21/21	4.0	Call with Davis Polk Tax team and Akin Gump regarding disputed claims reserve (0.5); research issues regarding disputed claims reserve (1.8); call with Davis Polk Tax team and Sainz Abogados regarding same (0.8); coordinate call with Davis Polk Tax team and Sainz Abogados regarding same (0.1); email with L. Farr and L. Altus regarding same (0.3); email with Sainz Abogados regarding same (0.4); email with Davis Polk team regarding same (0.1).		
31284859	Farr, Lucy W.	10/21/21	1.3			

	Time Detail By Project					
Time ID	Name	Date	Hours	Narrative		
31309469	Siman, Ariel	10/21/21	8.7	Review tax treatment of disputed claims reserve (3.7); call with L. Altus and L. Farr regarding same (1.0); review and revise equity subscription agreement (4.0).		
31333296	Altus, Leslie J.	10/22/21	1.0	Review research summary from J. Donnelly regarding Plan issues.		
31333312	Altus, Leslie J.	10/23/21	8.0	Review and revise equity subscription agreement.		
31298853	Donnelly, Jacob M.	10/23/21	8.0	Review and revise equity subscription agreement.		
31333468	Altus, Leslie J.	10/24/21	1.5	Review and revise Plan.		
31300084	Donnelly, Jacob M.	10/24/21	1.3	Consolidate tax comments to equity subscription agreement into revised draft (0.5); review Plan and trust agreement precedents regarding distributions from disputed claims reserve (0.8).		
31196631	Farr, Lucy W.	10/24/21	1.0	Review and revise equity subscription agreement.		
31305429	Donnelly, Jacob M.	10/25/21	0.4	Review Delta term sheet.		
31293516	Farr, Lucy W.	10/25/21	1.5	Call with Davis Polk Tax team regarding disputed claims reserve.		
31372333	Siman, Ariel	10/25/21	4.5	Review and revise equity subscription agreement (2.0); review Plan, including the disputed claims reserve provision (2.5).		
31333368	Altus, Leslie J.	10/26/21	0.2	. , ,		
31316796	Donnelly, Jacob M.	10/26/21	0.2	Email with Davis Polk team regarding equity subscription agreement (0.1); coordinate call with Davis Polk Tax team regarding disputed claims reserve (0.1).		
31313295	Farr, Lucy W.	10/26/21	2.0	Call with Davis Polk Tax team regarding disputed claims reserve (1.5); review research on same (0.5).		
31316406	Herts, Dylan	10/26/21	1.2			
31378719	Siman, Ariel	10/26/21	3.3	•		
31333383	Altus, Leslie J.	10/27/21	4.5			
31323684	Donnelly, Jacob M.	10/27/21	2.9			
31324221	Farr, Lucy W.	10/27/21	1.6	Call with Davis Polk Tax team regarding disputed claims reserve (1.5); review issues regarding same (0.1).		
31322032	Herts, Dylan	10/27/21	1.4	3 4 ,		
31379675	Siman, Ariel	10/27/21	5.0	Review disputed claims reserve arrangement (4.5); correspondence with Mexican team regarding same (0.5).		
			99			

	Time Detail By Project					
Time ID	Name	Date	Hours	Narrative		
31342217	Altus, Leslie J.	10/28/21	0.6	Email with Davis Polk Tax team regarding trust issues.		
31334630	Farr, Lucy W.	10/28/21	0.7	Email with Davis Polk Tax team regarding disputed claim reserve.		
31379846	Siman, Ariel	10/28/21	1.5	Review disputed claims reserve arrangement.		
31359123	Altus, Leslie J.	10/29/21	0.8	Analyze Plan tax issue. Email with M. Verdolini and D. Schnabel		
31341134	Donnelly, Jacob M.	10/29/21	0.4	regarding call to discuss disputed claims reserve (0.2); review email regarding tax issues (0.2).		
31320557	Farr, Lucy W.	10/29/21	0.3	Èmail with Davis Polk Tax team regarding tax issues.		
31338951	Herts, Dylan	10/29/21	0.1	Email with G. Morrison regarding antitrust analysis.		
31379962	Siman, Ariel	10/29/21	3.5	Review tax treatment of disputed claims reserve.		
31359160	Altus, Leslie J.	10/30/21	0.7	Review email and related documents regarding financing arrangements.		
31359193	Altus, Leslie J.	10/31/21	3.2	Research and analyze Plan issues and revised Plan structure (2.3); call with Davis Polk Tax team regarding disputed claims reserve (0.9).		
31351637	Donnelly, Jacob M.	10/31/21	3.3	Call with Davis Polk Tax team regarding disputed claims reserve (0.9); draft outline of tax treatments of disputed claims reserve (2.4).		
31336585	Farr, Lucy W.	10/31/21	2.2	Call with Davis Polk Tax team regarding disputed claims reserve (0.9); correspondence with same regarding same (1.3).		
31379450	Siman, Ariel	10/31/21	3.7	Review and revise Plan, including proposed preferred equity provisions.		
Total AM25	0 IP, Regulatory and Tax	•	148.8			
AM260 Hear	ring Preparation/Attenda	ance				
31186576	Melcer, Moshe	10/04/21	0.4	Draft notice of November Omnibus Hearing (0.2); email Chambers regarding same (0.1); email with T. Graulich regarding same (0.1).		
31232602	Melcer, Moshe	10/12/21	0.1	Draft October 21st Hearing agenda.		
31237809	Szanzer, Steven Z.	10/12/21	1.2	Correspondence with M. Melcer and T. Green regarding fleet motions hearings (0.5); correspondence with Chambers regarding same (0.2); review and revise notice of hearing cancelation (0.3); correspondence with M. Melcer regarding same (0.2).		
31239822	Melcer, Moshe	10/13/21	1.0	Review and revise October 21st Hearing agenda.		
31243243 31252640	Melcer, Moshe Melcer, Moshe	10/14/21 10/15/21	0.1 0.4	Review October 21st Hearing agenda. Review and revise October 21st Hearing		
31428556	Graulich, Timothy	10/16/21	1.1	agenda. Attend Chambers conference (0.8); prepare for Chambers conference (0.3).		
31422733	Jerrard, Erik	10/16/21	2.1	Attend Chambers conference (0.9); prepare for same (1.2).		
31264674	Piraino, Stephen D.	10/16/21	2.5	Call with joint bidders regarding Chambers conference (0.8); prepare for chambers conference (0.2); attend Chambers conference (0.9); correspondence with Davis Polk team regarding same (0.6).		

20-11563-scc Doc 2213 Filed 11/30/21 Entered 11/30/21 17:42:56 Main Document Pg 114 of 114

Invoice No.7040912

Time Detail By Project					
Time ID	Name	Date	Hours	Narrative	
31380203	Steinberg, Richard J.	10/16/21	0.9	Attend Chambers conference.	
31263582	Melcer, Moshe	10/18/21	0.6	Review and revise October 21st Hearing agenda.	
31351486	Bane, Abraham	10/19/21	0.9	Draft Fourth Interim Fee Hearing notice (0.8); correspondence with E. Jerrard regarding same (0.1).	
31319072	Jerrard, Erik	10/19/21	1.5	Call with J. Eisen regarding upcoming hearing (0.4); email with Davis Polk Restructuring and Fleet teams regarding same (0.7); review and revise October 21st Hearing agenda (0.4).	
31423245	Graulich, Timothy	10/26/21	2.6	Prepare for Chambers conference (2.1); attend same (0.5).	
31423022	Masaro, Matthew Bruno	10/26/21	0.4	Attend Chambers conference.	
31422843	McClammy, James I.	10/26/21	8.0	Attend Chambers conference (0.5); prepare for same (0.3).	
31384755	Piraino, Stephen D.	10/26/21	0.5	Attend Chambers conference.	
31319160	Rincon, Cristina M.	10/26/21	0.5	Attend Chambers conference.	
31378537	Steinberg, Richard J.	10/26/21	0.3	Attend Chambers conference (partial attendance).	
31325351	Szanzer, Steven Z.	10/26/21	0.8	Correspondence with Chambers regarding upcoming hearing (0.2); correspondence with M. Melcer regarding same (0.2); review and revise notice of hearing cancellation (0.2); correspondence with M. Melcer regarding same (0.2).	
31349852	Bane, Abraham	10/29/21	0.7		
Total AM260	Hearing Preparation/Atte	endance	19.4		
AM270 Cred	lit Card Receivables				
31255050	White, Erika D.	10/19/21	0.3	Review Deutsche Bank request for lift stay to file UCC continuation statement.	
31277864	White, Erika D.	10/20/21	0.1	Review lift stay motion for UCC-1 extension.	
31524742	Piraino, Stephen D.	10/25/21	0.2		
31284763	White, Erika D.	10/28/21	0.2	Review certificate accompanying financial reporting.	
Total AM270 Credit Card Receivables					
TOTAL		2,899.3			