IN THE UNITED STATES BANKRUPTCY COURT FOR THE WESTERN DISTRICT OF NORTH CAROLINA CHARLOTTE DIVISION

In re:)
) Chapter 11
DBMP LLC,¹)
) Case No. 20-30080 (JCW)
)
	Debtor.)

FIFTH INTERIM FEE APPLICATION OF FTI CONSULTING, INC., AS FINANCIAL ADVISOR TO THE OFFICIAL COMMITTEE OF ASBESTOS PERSONAL INJURY CLAIMANTS OF DBMP LLC AND THE FUTURE CLAIMANTS' REPRESENATIVE, FOR PAYMENT OF INTERIM COMPENSATION AND REIMBURSEMENT OF EXPENSES INCURRED FOR THE PERIOD MAY 1, 2021 THROUGH AUGUST 31, 2021

Name of applicant:	FTI Consulting, Inc.
Authorized to provide professional services to:	Official Committee of Asbestos Personal Injury Claimants of DBMP LLC & Future Claimants' Representative
Date retention approved:	April 29, 2020 nunc pro tunc March 6, 2020 and July 17, 2020 nunc pro tunc June 11, 2020
Period for which compensation and reimbursement is sought:	May 1, 2021 through August 31, 2021
Amount of compensation sought as actual, reasonable, and necessary:	\$ 195,056.00
Amount of expenses sought as actual, reasonable, and necessary:	\$ 0.00
Total amount of compensation paid as actual, reasonable and necessary for applicable period:	\$ 174,706.20
Total amount of expenses reimbursement paid as actual, reasonable and necessary for applicable period:	\$ 0.00
Total amount of unpaid fees and expenses sought for applicable period:	\$ 20,349.80

¹ The last four digits of the Debtor's federal tax identification number are 8817. The Debtor's mailing address is 20 Moores Road, Malvern, Pennsylvania 19355

Case 20-30080 Doc 1288 Filed 01/14/22 Entered 01/14/22 16:28:42 Desc Main Document Page 2 of 31

This is a/an __ monthly __x interim ___ final application

This is the Fifth Interim Fee Application for compensation and reimbursement of expenses.

Fee Statement		Requested	Requested		Approved		Total Compensation and Expenses		Unpaid Fees &
Date Served	Filing Period	Fees	Expenses	Approved Fees	Expenses	10% Holdback	Sought	Write Off	Expenses
First	March 6, 2020 - March	\$ 97,613.00	\$ 318.21	\$ 97,613.00	\$ 318.21	\$ 9,761.30	\$ 97,931.21	\$ -	\$ -
5/22/2020	31, 2020	\$ 97,013.00	\$ 316.21	\$ 97,013.00	\$ 516.21	\$ 9,761.30	\$ 97,951.21	Ş -	Ş -
Second	April 1, 2020 - April 30,	31,232.00		31,232.00	_	3,123.20	31,232.00		
6/18/2020	2020	31,232.00	_	31,232.00	-	3,123.20	31,232.00	-	_
Third	May 1, 2020 - May 31,	29,791.50		29,791.50	_	2,979.15	29,791.50	_	
7/23/2020	2020	29,791.50	-	29,791.50	-	2,979.15	29,791.50	-	-
Fourth	June 1, 2020 - June 30,	105,359.00		105,359.00	_	10,535.90	105,359.00	_	_
8/12/2020	2020	103,339.00	_	103,339.00	_	10,333.90	103,339.00	-	_
Fifth	July 1, 2020 - July 31,	69,559.50		69,559.50	_	6,955.95	69,559.50		
10/13/2020	2020	09,559.50	-	09,559.50	-	0,955.95	09,559.50		-
Sixth	August 1, 2020 - August	78,658.50		78,658.50	_	7,865.85	78,658.50		
10/16/2020	31, 2020	76,036.30	-	76,036.30	-	7,803.83	76,036.30	-	-
Seventh	September 1, 2020 -	228,173.00	227.43	205,355.70	227.43	22,817.30	228,400.43		
11/24/2020	September 30, 2020	228,173.00	227.43	205,355.70	227.43	22,817.30	228,400.43	-	-
Eighth	October 1, 2020 -	412,534.50	35.60	371,281.05	35.60	41,253.45	412,570.10		
12/15/2020	October 31, 2020	412,554.50	33.00	3/1,281.05	35.00	41,255.45	412,570.10	-	-
Ninth	November 1, 2020 -	120,000 50		12F 100 FF		12 000 05	120 000 50	_	
2/17/2021	November 30, 2020	139,009.50	-	125,108.55	-	13,900.95	139,009.50	-	-
Tenth	December 1, 2020 -	62.024.50		FC (22 OF		6 202 45	62.024.50		
2/17/2021	December 31, 2020	62,924.50	-	56,632.05	-	6,292.45	62,924.50	-	-
Eleventh	January 1, 2021 -	38,415.00		34,573.50	_	3,841.50	38,415.00	_	
5/20/2021	January 31, 2021	38,415.00	-	34,573.50	-	3,841.50	38,415.00		-
Twelfth	February 1, 2021 -	160 590 50		144 520 55	_	16.059.05	160 590 50		
5/20/2021	February 28, 2021	160,589.50	-	144,530.55	-	16,058.95	160,589.50	-	-
Thirteenth	March 1, 2021 -	57,745.50		51,970.95	_	5,774.55	57,745.50		
6/17/2021	March 31, 2021	57,745.50	-	51,970.95	-	5,774.55	57,745.50	-	-
Fourteenth	April 1, 2021 -	53,794.00	_	48,414.60	_	5,379.40	53,794.00		
6/24/2021	April 30, 2021	55,794.00	-	46,414.00	-	5,379.40	55,794.00	-	-
Fifteenth	May 1, 2021 -	63,651.50		57,286.35	_	6 265 15	63,651.50		7,209.35
7/21/2021	May 31, 2021	03,031.30	-	57,280.33	-	6,365.15	03,031.30	-	7,209.33
Sixteenth	June 1, 2021 -	57,629.50	_	51,866.55	_	5,762.95	57,629.50		5,762.95
8/30/2021	June 30, 2021	57,029.50		31,800.55		5,762.95	57,029.50		5,762.95
Seventeenth	July 1, 2021 -	24.096.00	_	20 677 40	_	2 409 60	24 006 00		3 409 60
11/8/2021	July 31, 2021	34,086.00		30,677.40		3,408.60	34,086.00		3,408.60
Eighteenth	August 1, 2021 -	20,000,00		25 720 40		2.000.00	20,000,00		2.000.00
11/8/2021	August 31, 2021	39,689.00	-	35,720.10	-	3,968.90	39,689.00	-	3,968.90
Total Compens	ation	\$ 1,760,455.00	\$ 581.24	\$ 1,625,630.85	\$ 581.24	\$ 176,045.50	\$ 1,761,036.24	\$ -	\$ 20,349.80

SUMMARY OF FTI CONSULTING, INC. COMPENSATION BY PROFESSIONAL May 1, 2021 through August 31, 2021

The FTI Consulting professionals that rendered professional services in the case during the Fifth Interim Period are:

Professional	Position	Specialty	Billing Rate	Total Hours	Total Fees
Diaz, Matthew	Senior Managing Director	Restructuring	\$1,120	24.2	\$ 27,104.00
Tully, Conor	Senior Managing Director	Restructuring	1,120	16.0	17,920.00
Adlewska, Anna	Managing Director	Strategic Communications - France	760	0.8	608.00
Berkin, Michael	Managing Director	Restructuring	935	76.6	71,621.00
Thalassinos, Angelo	Managing Director	Strategic Communications - New York	760	12.2	9,272.00
Bubb, Evelyn	Director	Strategic Communications - New York	550	0.3	165.00
Chodor, Joshua	Sr Consultant	Strategic Communications - New York	450	1.7	765.00
Jean, Mathilde	Sr Consultant	Strategic Communications - France	450	2.5	1,125.00
Shapiro, Jill	Sr Consultant	Restructuring	580	74.1	42,978.00
Tirabassi, Kathryn	Sr Consultant	Restructuring	635	16.2	10,287.00
Denis, Laura	Consultant	Strategic Communications - France	350	17.0	5,950.00
Hansen, Sean	Consultant	Restructuring	430	5.7	2,451.00
Klain, Katiana	Consultant	Strategic Communications - New York	350	12.5	4,375.00
Hellmund-Mora, Marili	Project Assistant	Restructuring	290	1.5	435.00
TOTAL				261.3	\$ 195,056.00

COMPENSATION BY PROJECT CATEGORY May 1, 2021 through August 31, 2021

		Total	Total Compensation		Total Compensation
Task	m 1 p	Hours During the	During the	Total Hours During	During the
Code	Task Description	Application Period 104.9	Application Period	the Engagement 225.5	Engagement
_	Current Operating Results & Events	104.9	\$ 86,243.00	223.3	\$ 183,330.50
3	Cash & Liquidity Analysis	-	\$ - \$ -	-	\$ - \$ -
4	Financing Matters (DIP, Exit, Other) Trade Vendor Issues	-	\$ - \$ -	-	\$ - \$ -
5	Real Estate Issues	-	\$ - \$ -	=	\$ - \$ -
-	Asset Sales	=	•	=	•
6		-	\$ -	-	\$ - \$ -
7	Analysis of Business Plan	=	\$ -	- 22.0	
8	Valuation and Related Matters	-	\$ -	32.8	\$ 22,086.50
9	Analysis of Employee Compensation Programs	-	\$ -	-	\$ -
10	Analysis of Tax Issues	-	\$ -	-	\$ -
11	Prepare for and Attendance at Court Hearings	6.7	\$ 4,638.50	69.1	\$ 49,133.00
12	Analysis of SOFAs & SOALs	-	\$ -	51.8	\$ 32,710.00
13	Analysis of Other Miscellaneous Motions	-	\$ -	16.2	\$ 12,441.50
14	Analysis of Claims/Liabilities Subject to Compromise	-	\$ -	-	\$ -
15	Analysis of Interco. Claims, Related Party Transactions	-	\$ -	-	\$ -
16	POR & DS - Analysis, Negotiation and Formulation	2.2	\$ 2,464.00	2.2	\$ 2,464.00
17	Wind Down Monitoring	-	\$ -	-	\$ -
18	Potential Avoidance Actions & Litigation Matters	23.7	\$ 19,413.50	1,065.6	\$ 842,322.00
19	Case Management	31.7	\$ 27,639.00	179.3	\$ 148,437.00
20	General Meeting with Debtor & Debtors' Professionals	-	\$ -	-	\$ -
21	General Meetings with Committee & Committee Counsel	-	\$ -	23.9	\$ 23,353.00
22	Meetings with Other Parties	-	\$ -	2.4	\$ 1,281.00
23	Firm Retention	-	\$ -	58.4	\$ 44,494.50
24	Preparation of Fee Application	28.5	\$ 17,823.00	136.5	\$ 74,176.50
25	Travel Time	-	\$ -	-	\$ -
26	Review Restructuring Transaction and Related Information	-	\$ -	13.7	\$ 10,544.50
27	Environmental Analysis	-	\$ -	-	\$ -
28	ACC - Specific Analysis	-	\$ -	58.3	\$ 46,986.00
29	FCR - Specific Analysis	7.5	\$ 6,300.00	114.9	\$ 85,381.00
30	Calls with the FCR or FCR's Counsel	11.9	\$ 10,403.00	87.0	\$ 72,016.50
31	Communications Planning and Execution	44.2	\$ 20,132.00	187.3	\$ 99,615.00
32	Trial Services	=	\$ -	23.7	\$ 9,682.50
Total	Compensation	261.3	\$ 195,056.00	2,348.6	\$ 1,760,455.00

Case 20-30080 Doc 1288 Filed 01/14/22 Entered 01/14/22 16:28:42 Desc Main Document Page 5 of 31

EXPENSES BY EXPENSE CLASSIFICATION May 1, 2021 through August 31, 2021

	Total Expenses During the	Total Expenses During the
Expense Type	Application Period	Engagement
Airfare	-	-
Lodging	-	-
Transportation	-	318.21
Working Meals	-	20.00
Other	-	243.03
Total Expenses	\$ -	\$ 581.24

SUMMARY OF PREVIOUS INTERIM FEE APPLICATIONS FILED BY FTI CONSULTING, INC.

Date Filed	Docket Number	Compensation Period	Requested Fees	Requested Expenses	Approved Fees	Approved Expenses	Docket No. Approving Application
Date Fileu				Expenses	Approved rees	Expenses	Application
6/26/2020	351	March 6, 2020 - April 30, 2020	\$ 128,845.00	\$ 318.21	\$ 128,845.00	\$ 318.21	389
10/16/2020	534	May 1, 2020 - August 31, 2020	283,368.50	-	283,368.50	-	556
2/17/2021	677	September 1, 2020 - December 31, 2020	842,641.50	263.03	842,641.50	263.03	779
6/24/2021	894	January 1, 2021 - April 30, 2021	310,544.00	-	310,544.00	-	939
TOTAL		March 6, 2020 - April 30, 2021	1,565,399.00	581.24	1,565,399.00	581.24	

IN THE UNITED STATES BANKRUPTCY COURT FOR THE WESTERN DISTRICT OF NORTH CAROLINA CHARLOTTE DIVISION

In re:)
) Chapter 11
DBMP LLC, ²)
) Case No. 20-30080 (JCW)
)
	Debtor.)

FIFTH INTERIM FEE APPLICATION OF FTI CONSULTING, INC.,
AS FINANCIAL ADVISOR TO THE COMMITTEE OF ASBESTOS CLAIMANTS OF
DBMP LLC AND THE FUTURE CLAIMANTS' REPRESENTATIVE, FOR PAYMENT
OF INTERIM COMPENSATION AND REIMBURSEMENT OF EXPENSES
INCURRED FOR THE PERIOD
MAY 1, 2021 THROUGH AUGUST 31, 2021

FTI Consulting, Inc. ("<u>FTI</u>"), financial advisor to the Official Committee of Asbestos Personal Injury Claimants (the "<u>Committee</u>") of DBMP LLC (the "<u>Debtor</u>") and the Future Claimants' Representative (the "<u>FCR</u>"), hereby submits its fifth interim fee application (the "<u>Fifth Interim Fee Application</u>") for allowance of compensation for professional services rendered and reimbursement of actual and necessary expenses incurred for the period May 1, 2021 through August 31, 2021 (the "<u>Application Period</u>").

INTRODUCTION

- 1. On January 23, 2020 (the "<u>Petition Date</u>"), the Debtor commenced this proceeding (the "<u>Chapter 11 Case</u>") by filing a petition for relief under Chapter 11 of the Bankruptcy Code.
- 2. Pursuant to sections 1107 and 1108 of the Bankruptcy Code, the Debtor has continued to operate its businesses and manage its properties and assets as debtor in possession. No trustee or examiner has been appointed in this Chapter 11 Case.

² The last four digits of the Debtor's federal tax identification number are 8817. The Debtor's mailing address is 20 Moores Road, Malvern, Pennsylvania 19355

- 3. On February 14, 2020, the Committee selected Robinson & Cole, LLP ("Robinson & Cole") and Caplin & Drysdale, Chartered ("Caplin & Drysdale"), and together with Robinson & Cole, the "Committee Counsel") to serve as its bankruptcy counsel in the Chapter 11 Case [Docket No. 183].
 - 4. On March 6, 2020, the Committee selected FTI as its financial advisor.
 - 5. On June 11, 2020, the FCR selected FTI as its financial advisor.

FTI'S FEE STATEMENTS DURING THE FIFTH INTERIM FEE PERIOD

- 6. In accordance with the Guidelines for Compensation and Expense Reimbursement of Professionals promulgated by the Court (the "Compensation Guidelines"), since its engagement FTI has submitted monthly invoices with fee and expense detail describing the fees and expenses incurred by such retained professional in accordance and any additional information required by the Compensation Guidelines.
- 7. During the Application Period, FTI provided the notice parties with the following monthly fee statements:
 - For May 1, 2021 through May 31, 2021 fees of \$63,651.50 and no expenses, (the "Fifteenth Monthly Statement").
 - For June 1, 2021 through June 30, 2021 fees of \$57,629.50 and no expenses, (the "Sixteenth Monthly Statement").
 - For July 1, 2021 through July 31, 2021 fees of \$34,086.00 and no expenses, (the "Seventeenth Monthly Statement").
 - For August 1, 2021 through August 31, 2021 fees of \$39,689.00 and no expenses, (the "Eighteenth Monthly Statement").

- 8. FTI does not hold a retainer in respect of its services as financial advisor to the Committee.
- 9. In total, FTI submitted Monthly Fee Statements during the Fifth Interim Fee Period for fees of \$195,056.00 and no expenses. A chart summarizing the Monthly Fee Statements submitted during the Application Period is below:

Fee							Total Compensation		
Statement		Requested	Requested		Approved		and Expenses		Unpaid Fees &
Date Served	Filing Period	Fees	Expenses	Approved Fees	Expenses	10% Holdback	Sought	Write Off	Expenses
Fifteenth 7/21/2021	May 1, 2021 - May 31, 2021	63,651.50	-	57,286.35	-	6,365.15	63,651.50	-	7,209.35
Sixteenth 8/30/2021	June 1, 2021 - June 30, 2021	57,629.50	-	51,866.55	-	5,762.95	57,629.50	-	5,762.95
Seventeenth 11/8/2021	July 1, 2021 - July 31, 2021	34,086.00	-	30,677.40	-	3,408.60	34,086.00	-	3,408.60
Eighteenth 11/8/2021	August 1, 2021 - August 31, 2021	39,689.00	-	35,720.10	-	3,968.90	39,689.00	-	3,968.90
Total Compensa	ation	\$ 195,056.00	\$ -	\$ 175,550.40	\$ -	\$ 19,505.60	\$ 195,056.00	\$ -	\$ 20,349.80

10. Pursuant to the Interim Fee Order, FTI submits this Fifth Interim Fee Application seeking interim approval and allowance of compensation in the amount of \$195,056.00 incurred during the Application Period, as detailed in the chart above.

SUMMARY OF SERVICES

- 11. The professional services performed by FTI were necessary and appropriate to the administration of the Debtor's chapter 11 case. These services were in the best interests of the Debtor, the Committee, the FCR, and other parities in interest. The compensation requested is commensurate with the complexity and nature of the issues and tasks involved.
- 12. Time by each professional and paraprofessional during the Interim Period, and a summary of the time incurred by task, followed by detailed time entries, are attached hereto as **Exhibit A, Exhibit B,** and **Exhibit C**.
- 13. During the Interim Period, FTI provided extensive financial services to the Committee and the FCR. The primary services rendered by FTI include, but are not limited to, the

categories set forth below (each a " $\underline{\text{Task Code}}$ ") which were billed pursuant to the requirements of Section C(8)(c) of the U.S. Trustee Guidelines:

COMPENSATION BY PROJECT CATEGORY

- 14. The following is a summary of the primary activities performed by FTI professionals and paraprofessionals during the Application Period, organized by project billing category.
 - 15. Current Operating Results & Events (1) 104.9 Hours/ \$86,243.00 Fees

FTI spent time in this category analyzing and preparing summary reports related to DBMP and CertainTeed LLC's current financial results. Additionally, FTI spent substantial time investigating Millwork & Panel LLC's ("M&P") operations. FTI prepared a report related to M&P's operations and formation.

16. Communications Planning and Execution (31) – 44.2 Hours/ \$20,132.00 Fees

FTI developed a communications strategy and key messaging of outstanding case issues.

FTI corresponded with counsel to discuss messaging and strategy going forward. FTI prepared weekly media coverage reports to stay current with coverage in both New York and France.

BASIS FOR RELIEF REQUESTED

- 17. Section 331 of the Bankruptcy Code provides for interim compensation of professionals and incorporates the substantive standards of Section 330 of the Bankruptcy Code to govern the Court's award of such compensation. Section 330 of the Bankruptcy Code provides that a court may award a professional employed under Section 1103 of the Bankruptcy Code "reasonable compensation for actual, necessary services rendered . . . and . . . reimbursement for actual, necessary expenses." 11 U.S.C. § 330(a)(1)(A) and (B).
 - 18. Section 330 of the Bankruptcy Code also sets forth the criteria for the award of such

Case 20-30080 Doc 1288 Filed 01/14/22 Entered 01/14/22 16:28:42 Desc Main Document Page 11 of 31

compensation and reimbursement:

In determining the amount of reasonable compensation to be awarded to . . . [a] professional person, the court shall consider the nature, the extent, and the value of such services, taking into account all relevant factors, including --

- (a) the time spent on such services;
- (b) the rates charged for such services;
- (c) whether the services were necessary to the administration of, or beneficial at the time at which the service was rendered toward the completion of, a case under this title;
- (d) whether the services were performed within a reasonable amount of time commensurate with the complexity, importance, and nature of the problem, issue, or task addressed;
- (e) with respect to a professional person, whether the person is board certified or otherwise has demonstrated skill and experience in the bankruptcy field; and
- (f) whether the compensation is reasonable based on the customary compensation charged by comparably skilled practitioners in cases other than cases under this title. *Id.* § 330(a)(3)(A)-(F).
- 19. The foregoing professional services performed by FTI were appropriate and necessary to the effective administration of the Chapter 11 Case. The services were in the best interests of the Committee and the FCR. Compensation for the foregoing services as requested is commensurate with the complexity, importance, and nature of the problems, as well as issues or

tasks involved. The professional services were performed in an appropriately expeditious and efficient manner.

- 20. In accordance with Section 504 of the Bankruptcy Code and Fed. R. Bankr. P. 2016(a), no agreement or understanding exists between FTI and any other person for the sharing of compensation received or to be received for services rendered in or in connection with this case.
- 21. No agreement or understanding prohibited by 18 U.S.C. § 155 has been or will be made by FTI.

THE REQUESTED COMPENSATION SHOULD BE ALLOWED

22. The services for which FTI seeks compensation in this Application Period were, at the time rendered, necessary for, beneficial to, and in the best interests of, the Committee, the FCR and the Debtor's estate. The services rendered by FTI were consistently performed in a timely manner commensurate with the complexity, importance, and nature of the issues involved. In accordance with the factors enumerated in sections 330 of the Bankruptcy Code, it is respectfully submitted that the amount requested by FTI is fair and reasonable given (a) the complexity of this case, (b) the time expended, (c) the nature and extent of the services rendered, (d) the value of such services, and (e) the costs of comparable services other than in a case under this title.

NO PRIOR REQUEST

23. No prior request for the relief sought in this Fifth Interim Fee Application has been made to this or any other court in connection with the Chapter 11 Case apart from the delivery of the monthly fee statements.

RESERVATION OF RIGHTS

24. The Committee and the FCR expressly reserves all rights with respect to challenging the validity, propriety, jurisdiction and venue of this Chapter 11 Case, including

Case 20-30080 Doc 1288 Filed 01/14/22 Entered 01/14/22 16:28:42 Desc Main Document Page 13 of 31

without limitation seeking to dismiss the Chapter 11 Case pursuant 11 U.S.C. § 1112 and seeking to transfer the Chapter 11 Case pursuant to 28 U.S.C. § 1406, 1408 and 11 U.S.C. § 105.

NOTICE

25. Notice of this Fifth Interim Fee Application has been provided in accordance with the Interim Fee Order. FTI submits that no other or further notice need be provided.

CONCLUSION

WHEREFORE, FTI respectfully requests that the Court: (i) enter the form of order attached as <u>Schedule 1</u> granting the Fifth Interim Fee Application and authorizing interim allowance of compensation in the amount of \$195,056.00 for professional services rendered on behalf of the Committee and the FCR; (ii) direct payment by the Debtor of the foregoing amounts; and (iii) grant such other and further relief as the Court deems just and proper.

Dated: New York, New York January 14, 2022

FTI CONSULTING, INC.

/s/ Conor Tully

Conor Tully Senior Managing Director FTI CONSULTING, INC. 3 Times Square, 10th Floor New York, NY 10036 Telephone: (212) 841-9335

conor.tully@fticonsulting.com

Financial Advisor to the Official Committee of Asbestos Claimants of DBMP LLC and the Future Claimants' Representative Dated: January 14, 2022

Charlotte, North Carolina

HAMILTON STEPHENS STEELE + MARTIN, PLLC

/s/ Glenn C. Thompson

Glenn C. Thompson (Bar No. 37221) 525 North Tryon Street, Suite 1400 Charlotte, North Carolina 28202 Telephone: (704) 344-1117 Facsimile: (704) 344-1483

gthompson@lawhssm.com

Counsel to the Official Committee of Asbestos Personal Injury Claimants Case 20-30080 Doc 1288 Filed 01/14/22 Entered 01/14/22 16:28:42 Desc Main Document Page 15 of 31

Exhibit A

Case 20-30080 Doc 1288 Filed 01/14/22 Entered 01/14/22 16:28:42 Desc Main Document Page 16 of 31

EXHIBIT A DBMP LLC - CASE NO. 20-30080 SUMMARY OF HOURS BY PROFESSIONAL FOR THE PERIOD MAY 1, 2021 TO AUGUST 31, 2021

Professional	Position	Specialty	Billing Rate	Total Hours	Total Fees
Diaz, Matthew	Senior Managing Director	Restructuring	\$1,120	24.2	\$ 27,104.00
Tully, Conor	Senior Managing Director	Restructuring	1,120	16.0	17,920.00
Adlewska, Anna	Managing Director	Strategic Communications - France	760	0.8	608.00
Berkin, Michael	Managing Director	Restructuring	935	76.6	71,621.00
Thalassinos, Angelo	Managing Director	Strategic Communications - New York	760	12.2	9,272.00
Bubb, Evelyn	Director	Strategic Communications - New York	550	0.3	165.00
Chodor, Joshua	Sr Consultant	Strategic Communications - New York	450	1.7	765.00
Jean, Mathilde	Sr Consultant	Strategic Communications - France	450	2.5	1,125.00
Shapiro, Jill	Sr Consultant	Restructuring	580	74.1	42,978.00
Tirabassi, Kathryn	Sr Consultant	Restructuring	635	16.2	10,287.00
Denis, Laura	Consultant	Strategic Communications - France	350	17.0	5,950.00
Hansen, Sean	Consultant	Restructuring	430	5.7	2,451.00
Klain, Katiana	Consultant	Strategic Communications - New York	350	12.5	4,375.00
Hellmund-Mora, Marili	Project Assistant	Restructuring	290	1.5	435.00
TOTAL				261.3	\$ 195,056.00

Case 20-30080 Doc 1288 Filed 01/14/22 Entered 01/14/22 16:28:42 Desc Main Document Page 17 of 31

Exhibit B

Case 20-30080 Doc 1288 Filed 01/14/22 Entered 01/14/22 16:28:42 Desc Main Document Page 18 of 31

EXHIBIT B

DBMP LLC - CASE NO. 20-30080 SUMMARY OF HOURS BY TASK FOR THE PERIOD MAY 1, 2021 TO AUGUST 31, 2021

Task		Total	Total
Code	Task Description	Hours	Fees
1	Current Operating Results & Events	104.9	\$ 86,243.00
11	Prepare for and Attendance at Court Hearings	6.7	4,638.50
16	POR & DS - Analysis, Negotiation and Formulation	2.2	2,464.00
18	Potential Avoidance Actions & Litigation Matters	23.7	19,413.50
19	Case Management	31.7	27,639.00
24	Preparation of Fee Application	28.5	17,823.00
29	FCR - Specific Analysis	7.5	6,300.00
30	Calls with the FCR or FCR's Counsel	11.9	10,403.00
31	Communications Planning and Execution	44.2	20,132.00
	TOTAL	261.3	\$ 195,056.00

Case 20-30080 Doc 1288 Filed 01/14/22 Entered 01/14/22 16:28:42 Desc Main Document Page 19 of 31

Exhibit C

Task Category	Date	Professional	Hours	Activity
1	5/1/2021	Diaz, Matthew	0.4	Review the March 2021 monthly status report.
1	5/3/2021	Diaz, Matthew	0.5	Review the financial update report for the FCR.
1	5/3/2021	Tirabassi, Kathryn	0.6	Prepare update re: March 2021 monthly status report.
1	5/3/2021	Berkin, Michael	1.3	Review and analyze March 2021 DBMP monthly status report.
1	5/10/2021	Berkin, Michael	2.1	Prepare detailed outline for analyzing M&P operations.
1	5/11/2021	Berkin, Michael	1.2	Review key documents re: M&P operations and formation.
1	5/11/2021	Berkin, Michael	1.8	Prepare analysis re: M&P operations and formation.
1	5/11/2021	Berkin, Michael	2.2	Review key documents re: M&P operations.
1	5/12/2021	Berkin, Michael	2.2	Review key documents re: M&P formation.
1	5/12/2021	Berkin, Michael	2.3	Develop questions re: M&P operations and formation.
1	5/12/2021	Berkin, Michael	1.1	Review key documents re: M&P operations and formation.
1	5/12/2021	Berkin, Michael	1.4	Review key documents re: M&P operations.
1	5/13/2021	Berkin, Michael	3.4	Develop key issues re: M&P operations.
1	5/18/2021	Berkin, Michael	3.2	Research industry issues.
1	5/18/2021	Berkin, Michael	2.5	*
1	5/18/2021	Berkin, Michael	2.3	Review information re: M&P operations and formation.
1	5/21/2021	Diaz, Matthew	0.4	*
1	5/21/2021	Berkin, Michael	3.7	Develop materials re: M&P operations and formation.
1	5/25/2021	Berkin, Michael		Review and analyze Saint-Gobain credit rating report.
1	5/25/2021	Berkin, Michael		Prepare materials re: M&P operations and formation.
1	5/25/2021	Berkin, Michael	3.3	Research key issues re: M&P operations and formation.
1	5/25/2021	Shapiro, Jill	0.9	Review key documents re: M&P operations and formation.
1	5/26/2021	Shapiro, Jill	2.6	1 1
1	5/27/2021	Shapiro, Jill	1.4	1 1
1	5/28/2021	Shapiro, Jill	3.7	Prepare report and develop key issues re: M&P operations and formation.
1	5/28/2021	Shapiro, Jill	3.9	Continue to prepare report re: M&P operations and formation.
1	5/31/2021	Shapiro, Jill		Update report re: M&P operations and formation.
1	6/1/2021	Hansen, Sean	0.3	Prepare update re: April 2021 monthly status report.
1	6/1/2021	Tirabassi, Kathryn	0.5	Analyze April 2021 monthly status report.
1	6/2/2021	Diaz, Matthew	0.4	Review April 2021 monthly status report.
1	6/2/2021	Berkin, Michael		Review and analyze April 2021 monthly status report.
1	6/3/2021	Berkin, Michael		Review and prepare updates to report re: M&P operations.
1	6/7/2021	Diaz, Matthew	0.4	Review 1Q2021 New CT financial results.
1	6/7/2021	Tirabassi, Kathryn	4.1	Review New CT 1Q2021 financial statements.
1	6/8/2021	Shapiro, Jill	3.8	
1	6/13/2021	Tirabassi, Kathryn	0.4	Prepare summary re: New CT 1Q2021 financials.
1	6/14/2021	Tirabassi, Kathryn	2.1	Incorporate updates to summary re: New CT 1Q2021 financials.
1	6/14/2021	Berkin, Michael	1.4	Review and provide updates to New CT 1Q2021 financial report.
1	6/14/2021	Diaz, Matthew	1.2	
1	6/22/2021	Berkin, Michael		Further develop report re: M&P operations.
1	6/23/2021	Berkin, Michael	1.2	Review and update report re: M&P operations.
1	6/23/2021	Shapiro, Jill	3.4	1
1	6/24/2021	Diaz, Matthew	0.6	Review DBMP question list re: New CT's operating performance.
1	6/24/2021	Diaz, Matthew	0.9	
1	6/24/2021	Berkin, Michael	1.2	Review and update questions for Debtor re: New CT financial statements.

Case 20-30080 Doc 1288 Filed 01/14/22 Entered 01/14/22 16:28:42 Desc Main Document Page 21 of 31

Task Category	Date	Professional	Hours	Activity
1	6/25/2021	Diaz, Matthew	0.4	Review DBMP information request list based on current financial results
1	6/28/2021	Tirabassi, Kathryn	0.5	Incorporate updates to request list.
1	6/28/2021	Shapiro, Jill	0.4	Prepare information request list re: M&P operations.
1	6/30/2021	Hansen, Sean	0.2	Prepare update re: May 2021 monthly status report.
1	7/9/2021	Diaz, Matthew	0.3	Review May 2021 monthly status report.
1	7/9/2021	Tirabassi, Kathryn	0.6	Review May monthly status report.
1	7/9/2021	Tully, Conor	0.4	Review analysis re: monthly status report.
1	7/9/2021	Diaz, Matthew	0.3	Provide comments to analysis re: monthly status report.
1	7/12/2021	Diaz, Matthew	0.2	Review DBMP service agreements.
1	7/21/2021	Shapiro, Jill	0.9	Update M&P operations report.
1	7/24/2021	Berkin, Michael	1.5	Review and analyze periodic report regarding DBMP controlled entities.
1	7/25/2021	Diaz, Matthew	1.4	Review M&P operations report.
1	7/26/2021	Berkin, Michael	1.1	Develop updates to M&P presentation to ACC/FCR.
1	7/26/2021	Shapiro, Jill		Update M&P operations report.
1	7/28/2021	Shapiro, Jill		Update report re: M&P operations.
1	7/28/2021	Diaz, Matthew		Review the updated M&P operations report.
1	7/29/2021	Berkin, Michael		Review updates to M&P presentation to ACC/FCR.
1	7/30/2021	Diaz, Matthew	0.6	Review and provide comments on the M&P operations report.
1	7/31/2021	Berkin, Michael	1.1	Review and analyze June 2021 monthly status report.
1	8/2/2021	Hansen, Sean	0.4	Provide update re: June monthly status report.
1	8/3/2021	Diaz, Matthew	0.5	Review June 2021 monthly status report.
1	8/3/2021	Tirabassi, Kathryn	0.6	Analyze June 2021 monthly status report.
1	8/3/2021	Shapiro, Jill	0.5	Update M&P report.
1	8/4/2021	Berkin, Michael	0.8	Review draft presentation to FCR re: monthly status report.
1	8/4/2021	Shapiro, Jill	0.7	Update M&P report.
1	8/6/2021	Berkin, Michael	0.7	Review M&P operations report.
1	8/6/2021	Shapiro, Jill	0.8	Finalize M&P report.
1	8/12/2021	Berkin, Michael	1.6	Analyze M&P margins in relation to CertainTeed margins.
1	8/13/2021	Berkin, Michael	2.2	Prepare presentation to FCR re: M&P operations.
1	8/30/2021	Hansen, Sean	0.3	Review July monthly status report.
1	8/31/2021	Berkin, Michael	1.1	Review and analyze July 2021 monthly status report.
1 Total			104.9	
11	5/4/2021	Shapiro, Jill	1.7	[Partial] Participate (telephonically) in hearing re: request for additional depositions.
11	5/4/2021	Shapiro, Jill	0.5	Prepare update for team re: hearing.
11	5/4/2021	Thalassinos, Angelo	1.7	
11	6/17/2021	Shapiro, Jill	0.7	Participate (telephonically) in hearing re: request to reopen the record.
11	6/17/2021	Shapiro, Jill	0.3	Prepare update re: hearing for request to reopen the record.
11	6/17/2021	Thalassinos, Angelo	0.7	[Partial] Participate (telephonically) in hearing re: request to reopen the record.
11	8/11/2021	Thalassinos, Angelo	0.4	Review matters scheduled to be heard at August 12 hearing.
11	8/17/2021	Berkin, Michael	0.7	Review audio transcript from hearing re: plan issues.
11 Total			6.7	

Case 20-30080 Doc 1288 Filed 01/14/22 Entered 01/14/22 16:28:42 Desc Main Document Page 22 of 31

Task Category	Date	Professional	Hours	Activity
16	7/25/2021	Diaz, Matthew	1.6	Review the Debtor's proposed plan of reorganization and TDP procedures.
16	7/28/2021	Diaz, Matthew	0.6	Review the Debtor's plan and related next steps.
16 Total		,	2.2	1
18	6/10/2021	Berkin, Michael		Review ACC and FCR's findings of facts re: preliminary injunction
		,		hearing.
18	6/10/2021	Berkin, Michael	1.6	Review Debtor's findings of facts re: preliminary injunction hearing.
		ŕ		
18	6/18/2021	Diaz, Matthew	1.2	Review the findings of facts in connection with the preliminary injunction
				hearing.
18	6/22/2021	Shapiro, Jill	3.4	Review Debtor's findings of facts in connection with preliminary
				injunction hearing.
18	6/23/2021	Shapiro, Jill	3.9	Prepare summary re: Debtor's findings of facts in connection with
				preliminary injunction hearing.
18	7/31/2021	Berkin, Michael	1.5	Review and analyze Debtor's estimation motion.
18	8/10/2021	Diaz, Matthew	0.7	1 , 3
18	8/10/2021	Shapiro, Jill	0.5	Review findings of facts and conclusions of law.
18	8/10/2021	Tully, Conor	1.1	Review recent ruling and related matters.
18	8/11/2021	Shapiro, Jill	2.6	8 8
18	8/15/2021	Diaz, Matthew	1.2	Review the preliminary injunction opinion.
18	8/23/2021	Tully, Conor	0.9	
				discovery requests.
18	8/25/2021	Berkin, Michael	2.5	Review and analyze ACC complaint ordering substantive consolidation.
18	8/31/2021	Tully, Conor	0.5	Review recent information from counsel re: claims estimates.
18	8/31/2021	Tirabassi, Kathryn	0.3	Review exhibits re: Bates deposition.
18 Total			23.7	
19	5/5/2021	Berkin, Michael		Identify issues to update workplan.
19	5/12/2021	Diaz, Matthew		Review open items and related next steps.
19	5/12/2021	Tirabassi, Kathryn	0.2	Review key next steps re: workplan.
19	5/12/2021	Berkin, Michael	0.3	Identify issues to update workplan.
19	5/12/2021	Berkin, Michael	0.2	1 1
19	5/12/2021	Shapiro, Jill		Review workplan re: outstanding items.
19	5/13/2021	Tully, Conor		Review case updates and docket activity.
19	5/17/2021	Tully, Conor	0.5	Review case status and recent updates from team.
19	5/18/2021	Tully, Conor	0.4	1
19	5/20/2021	Diaz, Matthew	0.3	1
19	5/20/2021	Tully, Conor		Review case status and recent updates from team.
19	5/20/2021	Tirabassi, Kathryn		Review key next steps.
19	5/20/2021	Berkin, Michael	0.3	Identify issues to update workplan.
19	5/20/2021	Berkin, Michael	0.2	1 1
19	5/20/2021	Shapiro, Jill	0.4	
19	5/26/2021	Berkin, Michael		Identify issues to update workplan.
19	5/26/2021	Berkin, Michael	0.2	1 1
19	5/27/2021	Tully, Conor	0.7	•
19	5/27/2021	Diaz, Matthew	0.3	Review open items and related next steps.
19	6/1/2021	Hansen, Sean	0.3	1 1
19	6/2/2021	Diaz, Matthew	0.3	Review workplan re: open items.

Task Category	Date	Professional	Hours	Activity
19	6/2/2021	Berkin, Michael	0.3	Identify issues to update workplan.
19	6/2/2021	Berkin, Michael	0.2	Develop workplan to address case issues.
19	6/2/2021	Shapiro, Jill	0.4	Review workplan re: outstanding items.
19	6/7/2021	Hansen, Sean	0.4	Prepare updates to case calendar.
19	6/7/2021	Tully, Conor	0.9	Review case status and open items.
19	6/9/2021	Diaz, Matthew	0.5	Review case open items and related next steps.
19	6/9/2021	Tirabassi, Kathryn	0.2	Review key next steps.
19	6/9/2021	Berkin, Michael	0.3	Identify issues to update workplan.
19	6/9/2021	Berkin, Michael	0.2	Develop workplan to address case issues.
19	6/9/2021	Shapiro, Jill	0.3	Review workplan re: outstanding items.
19	6/11/2021	Hansen, Sean	0.3	Prepare updates to workplan.
19	6/14/2021	Tully, Conor	0.3	Review docket re: recent filings.
19	6/16/2021	Tully, Conor		Review case updates and open items.
19	6/16/2021	Tirabassi, Kathryn		Review key next steps.
19	6/16/2021	Berkin, Michael	0.3	Identify issues to update workplan.
19	6/16/2021	Berkin, Michael	0.2	Develop workplan to address case issues.
19	6/16/2021	Shapiro, Jill		Review workplan re: outstanding items.
19	6/21/2021	Hansen, Sean		Prepare updates to case calendar.
19	6/23/2021	Diaz, Matthew		
19	6/23/2021	Berkin, Michael	0.3	Identify issues to update workplan.
19	6/23/2021	Berkin, Michael		Develop workplan to address case issues.
19	6/25/2021	Hansen, Sean		Prepare updates to workplan.
19	6/30/2021	Tirabassi, Kathryn		Review key next steps.
19	6/30/2021	Berkin, Michael	0.3	Identify issues to update workplan.
19	6/30/2021	Shapiro, Jill		Review workplan and outstanding items.
19	7/2/2021	Tully, Conor		Review case update and docket activity.
19	7/2/2021	Hansen, Sean		Prepare updates to workplan.
19	7/7/2021	Tully, Conor		Review case updates and docket activity.
19	7/7/2021	Diaz, Matthew		Review case open items and related next steps.
19	7/7/2021	Tirabassi, Kathryn		Review key next steps.
19	7/7/2021	Berkin, Michael		Identify issues to update workplan.
19	7/7/2021	Berkin, Michael		Develop workplan to address case issues.
19	7/12/2021	Tully, Conor		Review docket and updates from counsel re: case status.
19	7/14/2021	Shapiro, Jill		Review and update workplan re: outstanding items.
19	7/14/2021	Tully, Conor		Review status updates from team.
19	7/21/2021	Tully, Conor		Review workplan and open items.
19	7/21/2021	Tirabassi, Kathryn		Review key next steps.
19	7/21/2021	Shapiro, Jill		Review and update work plan.
19	7/21/2021	Hansen, Sean		Review docket re: new filings.
19	7/21/2021	Diaz, Matthew		Review open items and related next steps.
19	7/26/2021	Tully, Conor		Review open items and related flext steps. Review case updates and open items.
19	7/27/2021	Tully, Conor		Review case updates and docket updates.
19	7/27/2021	Hansen, Sean		Review docket re: new filings.
19	7/28/2021	Tirabassi, Kathryn		
19 19	7/28/2021	•		Review key next steps on the case.
		Berkin, Michael	0.3	
19	7/28/2021 7/28/2021	Berkin, Michael Shapiro, Jill	0.2	Develop workplan to address case issues. Review work plan and open items.
19	//////////			

Case 20-30080 Doc 1288 Filed 01/14/22 Entered 01/14/22 16:28:42 Desc Main Document Page 24 of 31

Task Category	Date	Professional	Hours	Activity
19	7/30/2021	Tully, Conor	0.8	Review open items and related next steps.
19	8/4/2021	Diaz, Matthew	0.4	Review next steps and open items.
19	8/4/2021	Tirabassi, Kathryn	0.2	Review key next steps.
19	8/4/2021	Berkin, Michael	0.3	Identify issues to update workplan.
19	8/4/2021	Berkin, Michael	0.2	Develop workplan to address case issues.
19	8/4/2021	Shapiro, Jill	0.3	Review workplan re: open items.
19	8/4/2021	Tully, Conor	0.2	Prepare update re: case status.
19	8/5/2021	Hansen, Sean	0.4	Review docket re: new filings.
19	8/11/2021	Tirabassi, Kathryn	0.3	Review key next steps.
19	8/11/2021	Berkin, Michael	0.3	Identify issues to update workplan.
19	8/11/2021	Berkin, Michael	0.4	Develop workplan to address case issues.
19	8/11/2021	Hansen, Sean		Review docket re: new filings.
19	8/11/2021	Tully, Conor		Review workplan and open items.
19	8/13/2021	Hansen, Sean		Prepare updates to workplan.
19	8/18/2021	Tully, Conor		Review case updates and recent docket activity.
19	8/18/2021	Diaz, Matthew		
19	8/18/2021	Tirabassi, Kathryn		Review key next steps.
19	8/18/2021	Berkin, Michael	0.3	Identify issues to update workplan.
19	8/18/2021	Berkin, Michael		Develop workplan to address case issues.
19	8/18/2021	Shapiro, Jill		Review workplan re: open items.
19	8/18/2021	Hansen, Sean		Prepare updates to case calendar.
19	8/24/2021	Hansen, Sean		Review docket re: new filings.
19	8/25/2021	Tirabassi, Kathryn	0.3	Review key next steps.
19	8/25/2021	Berkin, Michael	0.2	Identify issues to update workplan.
19	8/25/2021			
		Berkin, Michael		Develop workplan to address case issues.
19	8/25/2021	Shapiro, Jill	0.2	1 1
19 19 Total	8/25/2021	Tully, Conor	0.3 31.7	Review updates from FTI team re: case status.
24	5/5/2021	Shapiro, Jill		Prepare updates to March fee statement.
24	5/10/2021	Diaz, Matthew		Review the March fee statement.
24	5/10/2021	Shapiro, Jill		Update March fee statement.
24	5/13/2021	Shapiro, Jill		Update January Fee Statement.
24	5/13/2021	Shapiro, Jill		Update February Fee Statement.
24	5/14/2021	Shapiro, Jill		Finalize February Fee Statement.
24	5/14/2021	Shapiro, Jill		Prepare April Fee Statement.
24	5/19/2021	Shapiro, Jill		Finalize January and February Fee Statements.
24	5/19/2021	Shapiro, Jill	1.0	Prepare April Fee Statement.
24	5/20/2021	Shapiro, Jill		Finalize January Fee Statement.
24	5/20/2021	-		
		Shapiro, Jill		•
24	5/20/2021	Shapiro, Jill		Prepare April Fee Statement.
24	5/21/2021	Diaz, Matthew		Review the April Fee Statement.
24	5/21/2021	Shapiro, Jill	0.4	Finalize April Fee Statement.
24	6/2/2021	Shapiro, Jill	1.7	Prepare fourth interim fee application.
24	6/3/2021	Shapiro, Jill	1.3	Update fourth interim fee application.
24	6/4/2021	Diaz, Matthew		Review the fourth interim fee application.
24	6/6/2021	Shapiro, Jill		
24	6/7/2021	Shapiro, Jill		Update March 2021 fee statement.
24	6/8/2021	Shapiro, Jill	1.1	Update fourth interim fee application.

Case 20-30080 Doc 1288 Filed 01/14/22 Entered 01/14/22 16:28:42 Desc Main Document Page 25 of 31

Task Category	Date	Professional	Hours	Activity
24	6/17/2021	Hellmund-Mora, Maril	0.5	Update and finalize the March 2021 fee statement.
24	6/17/2021	Shapiro, Jill	0.1	Finalize March 2021 fee statement.
24	6/17/2021	Shapiro, Jill	0.4	Prepare May 2021 fee statement.
24	6/18/2021	Diaz, Matthew	0.5	Review May 2021 fee statement.
24	6/18/2021	Shapiro, Jill	1.8	Prepare May 2021 fee statement.
24	6/21/2021	Shapiro, Jill	0.4	Update April 2021 fee statement.
24	6/21/2021	Shapiro, Jill	0.4	Update fourth interim fee application.
24	6/24/2021	Shapiro, Jill	1.1	Update and finalize April 2021 and interim fee application.
24	7/16/2021	Shapiro, Jill	0.3	Update May fee statement.
24	7/19/2021	Shapiro, Jill	0.2	Revise May fee statement.
24	7/21/2021	Hellmund-Mora, Mari	0.5	Update and finalize the May fee statement.
24	7/21/2021	Shapiro, Jill	0.4	Update and finalize May fee statement.
24	7/22/2021	Shapiro, Jill	2.5	Prepare June fee statement.
24	7/23/2021	Diaz, Matthew	0.6	Review the June fee statement.
24	7/23/2021	Shapiro, Jill	0.3	Update June fee statement.
24	7/26/2021	Shapiro, Jill	0.3	Revise June fee statement.
24	8/10/2021	Shapiro, Jill	0.4	Finalize June fee statement.
24	8/19/2021	Shapiro, Jill	1.3	Prepare July fee statement.
24	8/23/2021	Tully, Conor	0.5	Review July fee statement.
24	8/23/2021	Shapiro, Jill	0.6	Prepare July fee statement.
24	8/30/2021	Hellmund-Mora, Mari	0.5	Update and finalize the June fee statement.
24	8/30/2021	Shapiro, Jill	0.7	Finalize June Fee Statement.
24 Total	0.00.00		28.5	
29	5/4/2021	Berkin, Michael		Prepare for call with FCR.
29	6/21/2021	Tirabassi, Kathryn		Prepare analysis for FCR.
29	7/13/2021	Diaz, Matthew		Research and develop analysis is response to questions coming out of the
				call with the FCR.
29	7/13/2021	Shapiro, Jill	0.6	Review intercompany agreements in connection with FCR follow up
29	7/14/2021	Tully, Conor	0.4	questions. Review documents related to financial diligence requested by the FCR.
		• • • • • • • • • • • • • • • • • • • •		
29	7/14/2021	Shapiro, Jill	1.2	Prepare analysis in connection with FCR follow up questions.
29	7/27/2021	Berkin, Michael	0.5	Prepare for bi-weekly FCR call.
29	8/3/2021	Diaz, Matthew	0.5	Review the report to the FCR.
29	8/13/2021	Tully, Conor	0.5	Review materials and agenda in advance of FCR conference call.
29	8/13/2021	Shapiro, Jill	0.6	Review update report in preparation for FCR call.
29	8/24/2021	Tully, Conor	0.8	Prepare for bi-weekly call with the FCR re: case updates.
29 Total			7.5	
30	5/4/2021	Berkin, Michael	0.7	Participate on bi-weekly FCR call.
30	5/4/2021	Tirabassi, Kathryn	0.7	Participate on bi-weekly FCR call.
30	5/4/2021	Shapiro, Jill	0.7	Participate on bi-weekly FCR call.
30	6/1/2021	Berkin, Michael	0.5	Prepare for call with FCR.
30	6/1/2021	Tully, Conor	0.3	Participate on bi-weekly FCR call.
30	6/1/2021	Berkin, Michael	0.3	Participate on bi-weekly FCR call.
30	6/1/2021	Tirabassi, Kathryn	0.3	Participate on bi-weekly FCR call.
30	6/15/2021	Berkin, Michael	0.5	Prepare for call with FCR.
	6/15/2021	Diaz, Matthew	0.3	Prepare for call with the FCR.
30	0/13/2021	Diaz, matine w	0.5	repare for can with the reck.

Case 20-30080 Doc 1288 Filed 01/14/22 Entered 01/14/22 16:28:42 Desc Main Document Page 26 of 31

Task Category	Date	Professional	Hours	Activity
30	6/15/2021	Berkin, Michael	0.8	Participate on bi-weekly FCR call.
30	6/15/2021	Diaz, Matthew	0.8	Participate on bi-weekly FCR call.
30	6/15/2021	Tirabassi, Kathryn	0.8	Participate on bi-weekly FCR call.
30	6/29/2021	Tully, Conor	0.3	Review agenda and prepare for call with the FCR.
30	6/29/2021	Tully, Conor	0.3	Participate on bi-weekly FCR call.
30	6/29/2021	Tirabassi, Kathryn	0.3	Participate on bi-weekly FCR call.
30	6/29/2021	Shapiro, Jill	0.3	Participate on bi-weekly FCR call.
30	7/13/2021	Diaz, Matthew	0.7	Participate on bi-weekly FCR call.
30	7/27/2021	Berkin, Michael	0.4	Participate on bi-weekly FCR call.
30	7/27/2021	Diaz, Matthew	0.4	Participate on bi-weekly FCR call.
30	7/27/2021	Tirabassi, Kathryn	0.4	Participate on bi-weekly FCR call.
30	8/13/2021	Berkin, Michael	0.6	Participate on bi-weekly call with the FCR.
30	8/13/2021	Tully, Conor	0.6	Participate on bi-weekly call with the FCR.
30	8/13/2021	Shapiro, Jill	0.6	Participate on bi-weekly call with the FCR.
30 Total			11.9	
31	5/3/2021	Thalassinos, Angelo	0.2	Review media coverage report and related developments.
31	5/6/2021	Klain, Katiana	0.8	Prepare media coverage report.
31	5/7/2021	Denis, Laura	1.0	Prepare media report re: French media.
31	5/12/2021	Denis, Laura	1.0	Monitor asbestos related news in the French media.
31	5/13/2021	Klain, Katiana	0.7	Prepare media coverage report.
31	5/13/2021	Thalassinos, Angelo	0.2	Review media coverage report and related developments.
31	5/14/2021	Klain, Katiana	0.5	Prepare weekly coverage report.
31	5/17/2021	Thalassinos, Angelo	0.7	Prepare update for ACC Counsel re: communication strategy.
31	5/20/2021	Klain, Katiana	0.8	Compile weekly coverage report.
31	5/20/2021	Thalassinos, Angelo	0.1	Review media coverage report re: case developments.
31	5/21/2021	Denis, Laura	1.5	Review Saint Gobain news and prepare media report re: French media
31	5/27/2021	Klain, Katiana	0.7	Prepare media coverage report re: case developments.
31	5/28/2021	Denis, Laura	1.0	Prepare media report re: asbestos and Saint Gobain news.
31	6/3/2021	Klain, Katiana	0.6	Compile media coverage report re: asbestos related news.
31	6/4/2021	Thalassinos, Angelo	0.2	Review media and other coverage re: chapter 11 and asbestos developments.
31	6/4/2021	Jean, Mathilde	0.1	Review French media re: Saint Gobain related articles.
31	6/4/2021	Denis, Laura		Prepare media report re: French media.
31	6/9/2021	Thalassinos, Angelo	0.2	
31	6/10/2021	Klain, Katiana		Compile media coverage report re: case developments.
31	6/10/2021	Thalassinos, Angelo		Review media coverage re: chapter 11 and asbestos developments.
31	6/11/2021	Jean, Mathilde	0.5	Review media report re: asbestos related news.
31	6/11/2021	Denis, Laura	1.5	Monitor asbestos related news in the French media.
31	6/14/2021	Thalassinos, Angelo	0.2	Review media coverage report re: chapter 11 and asbestos developmen
31	6/15/2021	Thalassinos, Angelo	0.3	Prepare communications strategy.
31	6/16/2021	Thalassinos, Angelo	0.2	C.
31	6/17/2021	Klain, Katiana	0.6	Compile media coverage report re: asbestos related news.
31	6/17/2021	Thalassinos, Angelo	0.3	23
31	6/18/2021	Denis, Laura	1.5	Review Saint Gobain news re: asbestos related media.
31	6/24/2021	Klain, Katiana	0.5	Compile media coverage report re: case developments.

Case 20-30080 Doc 1288 Filed 01/14/22 Entered 01/14/22 16:28:42 Desc Main Document Page 27 of 31

Task Category	Date	Professional	Hours	Activity
31	6/25/2021	Klain, Katiana	0.2	Prepare and coordinate communications strategy.
31	6/25/2021	Jean, Mathilde		Monitor asbestos and Saint Gobain related articles in the French media.
31	6/25/2021	Denis, Laura	1.0	Prepare media report re: Saint Gobain news.
31	6/28/2021	Thalassinos, Angelo	0.2	Review media coverage report re: chapter 11 and asbestos developments
31	6/30/2021	Klain, Katiana	1.0	Compile media and social research for circulation to ACC.
31	7/2/2021	Jean, Mathilde	0.3	Review French media re: Saint Gobain related articles.
31	7/2/2021	Denis, Laura	1.5	Monitor asbestos related news in the French media.
31	7/8/2021	Klain, Katiana	0.7	Compile media coverage report re: case developments.
31	7/9/2021	Jean, Mathilde	0.3	Monitor asbestos and Saint Gobain related articles in the French media.
31	7/9/2021	Denis, Laura	1.5	Prepare media report re: French media.
31	7/15/2021	Klain, Katiana	0.6	Compile media coverage report re: asbestos related news.
31	7/21/2021	Klain, Katiana	0.3	Prepare media coverage report re: asbestos related developments.
31	7/22/2021	Klain, Katiana	0.6	Compile media coverage report re: case developments.
31	7/23/2021	Denis, Laura	1.5	Prepare media report re: Saint Gobain news.
31	7/29/2021	Klain, Katiana	0.7	Compile media coverage report re: asbestos related news.
31	7/30/2021	Jean, Mathilde	0.3	Review media report re: asbestos related news.
31	7/30/2021	Denis, Laura	1.5	Review Saint Gobain news re: asbestos related media.
31	8/4/2021	Thalassinos, Angelo	0.8	Review asbestos association communications planning.
31	8/4/2021	Thalassinos, Angelo	0.4	Review media re: chapter 11 and other related asbestos developments.
31	8/4/2021	Thalassinos, Angelo	0.2	Review preliminary injunction ruling status and related timeline.
31	8/5/2021	Klain, Katiana	0.8	Compile media coverage re: recent developments.
31	8/5/2021	Thalassinos, Angelo	0.6	Review and update communications workplan.
31	8/5/2021	Thalassinos, Angelo	0.1	Review media re: chapter 11 and other related asbestos developments.
31	8/5/2021	Jean, Mathilde	0.3	Review French media communications.
31	8/5/2021	Denis, Laura	1.5	Monitor asbestos related news in the French media.
31	8/9/2021	Thalassinos, Angelo	0.1	Plan communications strategy re: pending preliminary injunction ruling.
31	8/10/2021	Bubb, Evelyn	0.3	Review media statement and circulate article.
31	8/10/2021	Klain, Katiana	0.2	Review media coverage report.
31	8/10/2021	Chodor, Joshua	0.2	Prepare correspondences re: media coverage following preliminary injunction ruling.
31	8/10/2021	Thalassinos, Angelo	2.0	Review preliminary injunction ruling and draft communications strategy
31	8/10/2021	Thalassinos, Angelo	0.5	Review communications strategy re: recent developments.
31	8/12/2021	Klain, Katiana		Prepare media list and compile media coverage.
31	8/12/2021	Chodor, Joshua		Analyze media coverage re: new case developments resulting from hearing.
31	8/12/2021	Thalassinos, Angelo	0.3	Coordinate communications strategy re: inbound media inquiries.
31	8/13/2021	Thalassinos, Angelo Thalassinos, Angelo		Review media coverage re: chapter 11 case.
31	8/18/2021	Thalassinos, Angelo		Correspond with Counsel re: communications planning.
31	8/19/2021	Chodor, Joshua		Prepare weekly media coverage report.
~ ~	8/20/2021	Klain, Katiana		Prepare updates to media list.

Case 20-30080 Doc 1288 Filed 01/14/22 Entered 01/14/22 16:28:42 Desc Main Document Page 28 of 31

Task Category	Date	Professional	Hours	Activity
31	8/23/2021	Chodor, Joshua	0.2	Update key messaging template for use with reactive media inquiries.
31	8/23/2021	Thalassinos, Angelo	0.4	Coordinate inbound media opportunity and related media list.
31	8/24/2021	Thalassinos, Angelo	0.5	Review substantive consolidation complaint, related filings and develop communications strategy.
31	8/25/2021	Thalassinos, Angelo	0.2	Review asbestos developments in France.
31	8/25/2021	Jean, Mathilde	0.5	Analyze latest French media re: case developments.
31	8/25/2021	Adlewska, Anna	0.8	Coordinate French media monitoring.
31	8/26/2021	Chodor, Joshua	0.3	Analyze and circulate relevant media coverage on divisive merger statute.
31 Total			44.2	
Grand Total			261.3	

Case 20-30080 Doc 1288 Filed 01/14/22 Entered 01/14/22 16:28:42 Desc Main Document Page 29 of 31

Schedule 1

IN THE UNITED STATES BANKRUPTCY COURT FOR THE WESTERN DISTRICT OF NORTH CAROLINA CHARLOTTE DIVISION

In re:)		
) Chap	oter 11	
DBMP LLC, ¹)		
) Case	No. 20-30080 (JO	CW
)		
	Debtor.)		

ORDER GRANTING THE FIFTH INTERIM FEE APPLICATION OF FTI CONSULTING, INC., AS FINANCIAL ADVISOR TO THE COMMITTEE OF ASBESTOS CLAIMANTS AND THE FUTURE CLAIMANTS' REPRESENATIVE OF DBMP LLC, FOR PAYMENT OF INTERIM COMPENSATION AND REIMBURSEMENT OF EXPENSES INCURRED FOR THE PERIOD MAY 1, 2021 THROUGH AUGUST 31, 2021

This matter coming before the Court on the Fifth Interim Fee Application of FTI Consulting, Inc., as Financial Advisor to the Official Committee of Asbestos Personal Injury Claimants and the Future Claimants' Representative of DBMP LLC, for Payment of Interim Compensation and Reimbursement of Expenses Incurred for the Period May 1, 2021 through August 31, 2021 (the "Fifth Interim Fee Application")² filed by FTI Consulting, Inc. ("FTI"), financial advisor to the Official Committee of Asbestos Personal Injury Claimants (the "Committee") and the Future Claimants' Representative ("FCR") of DBMP LLC (the "Debtor"); the Court having reviewed the Fifth Interim Fee Application; the Court having found that: (a) the Court has jurisdiction over this matter pursuant to 28 U.S.C. §§ 157 and 1334; (b) this is a core proceeding pursuant to 28 U.S.C. § 157(b); (c) notice of the Fifth Interim Fee Application was sufficient pursuant to Local Rule 2002-1(g) and the Order Establishing Procedures for Interim

¹ The last four digits of the Debtor's federal tax identification number are 8817. The Debtor's mailing address is 20 Moores Road, Malvern, Pennsylvania 19355

² Capitalized terms used herein and not otherwise defined shall have the meanings ascribed to them in the Fifth Interim Fee Application.

Compensation and Reimbursement of Expenses of Retained Professionals [D.I. 150] (the "Interim Fee Order") and no other or further notice is required; (d) the compensation requested in the Fifth Interim Fee Application is reasonable and for actual and necessary services rendered by FTI on behalf of the Committee and the FCR during the period from May 1, 2021 through August 31, 2021 (the "Fee Period"); (e) the expenses for which reimbursement is sought in the Fifth Interim Fee Application are actual and necessary expenses incurred by FTI during the Fee Period on behalf of the Committee and the FCR; and (f) the Fifth Interim Fee Application fully complies with the Interim Fee Order, the Bankruptcy Code, the Bankruptcy Rules, the Local Rules, and the Guidelines; and the Court having determined that the legal and factual bases set forth in the Fifth Interim Fee Application establish just cause for the relief granted herein:

IT IS HEREBY ORDERED AND DECREED THAT:

- 1. The Fifth Interim Fee Application is GRANTED.
- 2. FTI is awarded, on an interim basis, compensation for professional services rendered during the Fee Period in the amount of \$195,056.00.
- 3. The Debtor is authorized and directed to pay FTI promptly the fees and expenses approved in this Order to the extent such amounts have not been paid previously by the Debtor.
- 4. The Debtor and FTI are authorized and empowered to take all actions necessary to implement the relief granted in this Order.
- 5. This Court shall retain exclusive jurisdiction over any and all matters arising from or related to the implementation, enforcement, or interpretation of this Order.

This Order has been signed electronically The Judge's signature and court's seal appear at the top of the Order. United States Bankruptcy Court