IN THE UNITED STATES BANKRUPTCY COURT FOR THE SOUTHERN DISTRICT OF TEXAS HOUSTON DIVISION

In re:		Chapter 11
CHESAPEAKE ENERGY CORPORATION, et al.,1)	Case No. 20-33233 (DRJ)
Debtors.)	Jointly Administered
)	

SEVENTH MONTHLY FEE STATEMENT OF PRICEWATERHOUSECOOPERS LLP FOR SERVICES RENDERED AND REIMBURSEMENT OF EXPENSES AS AUDIT SERVICES AND TAX CONSULTING SERVICES PROVIDER FOR THE DEBTORS FOR THE PERIOD JANUARY 1, 2021 THROUGH JANUARY 15, 2021

Name of Applicant:	PricewaterhouseCoopers LLP ("PwC")			
Applicant's Role in Case:	Audit Services and Tax Consulting Services Provider to the Debtors			
Date Order of Employment Signed:	Effective June 28, 2020 (Order entered October 14, 2020, D.I. 1373)			
	Beginning of Period End of Period			
Time period covered by this Statement: 01/01		2021	01/15/2021	
Time period(s) covered by prior Applications:	n/a	a	n/a	
Total amounts awarded in all prior Application	ıs:		n/a	
Total fees requested in this Statement:		\$202,626.00 (80% of \$253,282.50)		
Total expenses requested in this Statement:		\$0.00		
Total fees and expenses requested in this Staten (exclusive of holdback amount):	\$202,626.00			
Total actual hours covered by this Statement:			1,090.50	
Blended hourly rate for professionals:			\$212.75	

This is a(n) \underline{X} monthly ___ interim __ final application. No prior application has been filed with respect to this Seventh Monthly Period.

A complete list of each of the Debtors in these chapter 11 cases may be obtained on the website of the Debtors' claims and noticing agent at https://dm.epiq11.com/chesapeake. The location of Debtor Chesapeake Energy Corporation's principal place of business and the Debtors' service address in these chapter 11 cases is 6100 North Western Avenue, Oklahoma City, Oklahoma 73118.

Pursuant to sections 327, 330, and 331 of title 11 of the United States Code (the "Bankruptcy Code"), Rule 2016 of the Federal Rules of Bankruptcy Procedure (the "Bankruptcy Rules"), Rule 2016-1 of the Local Bankruptcy Rules of the United States Bankruptcy Court for the Southern District of Texas (the "Local Rules") and the Court's *Order Establishing Procedures for Interim Compensation and Reimbursement of Expenses for Professionals* [D.I. 656] (the "Interim Compensation Order"), PricewaterhouseCoopers LLP ("PwC"), as the audit services and tax consulting services provider for debtor Chesapeake Energy Corporation and its above-captioned debtor affiliates (collectively, the "Debtors"), hereby files this Seventh Monthly Fee Statement (the "Seventh Monthly Fee Statement") for payment of compensation for professional services rendered to the Debtors and for reimbursement of actual and necessary expenses incurred in connection therewith for the period commencing January 1, 2021 through and including January 15, 2021 (the "Seventh Monthly Period"). In support of the Seventh Monthly Fee Statement, PwC respectfully states as follows:

- 1. On September 11, 2020, the Debtors filed the *Debtors' Application for Entry of an Order Authorizing the Retention and Employment of PricewaterhouseCoopers LLP as Audit Services and Tax Consulting Services Provider to the Debtors Effective as of June 28, 2020* (D.I. 1148) (the "Retention Application").
- 2. On October 14, 2020, the Court entered *Order Authorizing the Retention and Employment of PricewaterhouseCoopers LLP as Audit Services and Tax Consulting Services Provider to the Debtors Effective as of June 28, 2020* (D.I. 1373) (the "Retention Order").
- 3. The Interim Compensation Order sets forth the procedures for interim compensation and reimbursement of expenses for all professionals in these cases. In particular, the

2

² Capitalized terms used but not otherwise defined herein shall have the meanings ascribed to such terms in the Interim Compensation Order.

Interim Compensation Order provides that each Professional seeking interim allowance of its fees and expenses may file a notice with the Court with a monthly fee statement for services rendered and reimbursement of expenses incurred during the preceding month (a "Monthly Fee Statement") to the Notice Parties. Each Notice Party or party in interest shall have fourteen days after services of a Monthly Fee Statement (the "Objection Deadline") to object to the requested fees and expenses. Upon expiration of such 14-day period, the Debtors are authorized and directed to pay the Professional an amount equal to 80 percent of the fees and 100 percent of the expenses requested in the applicable Monthly Fee Statement.

- 4. By this Seventh Monthly Fee Statement, PwC requests interim allowance of \$253,282.50 and payment of \$202,626.00 (80% of \$253,282.50) as compensation for professional services rendered during the Seventh Monthly Period; PwC did not incur any expenses for reimbursement during the Seventh Monthly Period. PwC's professionals expended a total of 1,190.50 hours during the Seventh Monthly Period for which compensation is requested. All services for which compensation is requested by PwC were performed for or on behalf of the Debtors.
- 5. During the Seventh Monthly Period, PwC professionals provided audit services and tax consulting services to the Debtors in accordance with the terms and conditions within the Engagement Letters (attached to the Retention Application), as requested by the Debtors and agreed to by PwC, and pursuant to the Retention Order. A summary of the hours and compensation sought by project category is shown below:

		Total
Type of Services	Hours	Compensation
Fixed Fee Services	1,096.50	\$180,000.00
Hourly Fee Services	94.00	\$73,382.50
Total - Hours and Compensation Sought for Reimbursement	1,190,50	\$253,282,50

- 6. The Seventh Monthly Fee Statement is comprised of several exhibits which are attached hereto as follows:
 - Exhibit A, provides a summary of the hours and compensation by project;
- **Exhibit B**, provides the name and position of each professional, cumulative hours worked by each professional;
- <u>Exhibit C</u>, provides the daily time for each of the professionals within each of the work types or subcategories (tracked in half-hour (0.5) increments);
- <u>Exhibit D</u>, provides the summary of the hourly fees, including the name and position of each professional, cumulative hours worked by project, hourly billing rates for the hourly compensation, and the corresponding compensation requested; and
- <u>Exhibit E</u>, provides the daily activity descriptions for the hourly compensation, including the activity description, time and billing rates associated with each activity.

Fixed Fee Services

7. Consolidated Audit Services – 2020 – During the Seventh Monthly Period, PwC's audit professionals continued working on: (i) the consolidated financial statements of the Debtors' at January 15, 2021 and for the year then ending; and (ii) the effectiveness of the Debtors' internal controls over financial reporting as of January 15, 2021 and preparation of a report for same; and a review of the Debtors' unaudited consolidated quarterly financial information for the quarter ended June 30, 2020, before filing the Form 10-Q. The Debtors and PwC agreed to a base fee of \$3,200,000 (billed in seven payments, \$500,000 for each of six months (July 2020 through December 2020) and \$200,000 for one month (January 2021). PwC will continue to report the hours incurred by its professionals until the final deliverables are provided to the Debtors. Pursuant with conversations with Debtors' management, PwC has agreed to a reduced its January 2021 payment, totaling \$180,000.

Hourly Fee Engagements

8. **Incremental Bankruptcy Accounting and Auditing** – During the Seventh Monthly Period, PwC performed procedures around the evaluation of new technical accounting

4

positions related to the accounting considerations that exist as a result of the bankruptcy. Additionally, as a result of the Debtors' bankruptcy cases and consistent with independent Audit Services, incremental audit procedures are necessary for bankruptcy specific items, such as special requests from Debtors' management and related procedures for transactions specific to the consolidated quarterly and annual financial statements. PwC professionals performed incremental accounting and review procedures for the consolidated quarterly financial statements, such procedures included accounting for debt during bankruptcy, assessment of the Debtors' accounting for the post-petition fees incurred directly related to the bankruptcy, consultation on the disclosures related bankruptcy presentation under ASC 852, evaluation of the Debtors' cut-off, classification, and presentation of liabilities subject to compromise on the balance sheet, and other potential restructuring impacts. Incremental auditing services were also performed over the reporting disclosures required under applicable accounting standards for Debtors' reporting while in bankruptcy. PwC professionals assessed the bankruptcy related business processes which were implemented by the Debtors to manage the risk related to bankruptcy accounting and reporting. Finally, PwC performed additional procedures not contemplated in the fixed fee related to the validation of disclosures and tie out of the disclosures related to the new financial statement line items that were created as a result of the bankruptcy proceeding and such services were billed hourly consistent with the Retention Order and the Engagement Letters.

Summary of Expenses Incurred

9. Based upon a review of PwC's internal billing records, PwC professionals did not incur out-of-pocket expenditures during the Seventh Monthly Period.

Reservation

10. Although every effort has been made to include all fees and expenses incurred in

the Seventh Monthly Period, some fees and expenses may not be included in this Seventh Monthly

Fee Statement due to delays caused by accounting and processing. PwC reserves the right to make

a further or supplemental request to this Court for allowance of such fees and expenses not included

herein. Subsequent fee statements will be filed in accordance with the Bankruptcy Code, the

Bankruptcy Rules, Bankruptcy Local Rules, and the Interim Compensation Order.

WHEREFORE, by this Monthly Fee Statement, PwC respectfully requests allowance of

its fees and expenses incurred during the Seventh Monthly Period in the total amount of

\$202,626.00, consisting of: (a) \$202,626.00 (80% of \$253,282.50) of the fees incurred on behalf

of the Debtors for reasonable and necessary professional services rendered by PwC; and (b) \$0.00

for actual and necessary costs and expenses, and that such fees and expenses be paid as

administrative expenses of the Debtors' estates.

Dated: March 4, 2021

ohn P. McNamara John P. McNamara, Partner

PricewaterhouseCoopers LLP

211 North Robinson Avenue, Suite 1400

Oklahoma City, OK 73102

Audit Services and Tax Consulting Services

Provider for the Debtors

6

CHESAPEAKE ENERGY CORPORATION, et al, Case No. 20-33233 (DRJ) PricewaterhouseCoopers LLP – Audit Services and Tax Consulting Services for the Debtors

Hours and Compensation Submission For the Period January 1, 2021 through January 15, 2021

Enclosure:

PricewaterhouseCoopers invoice for professional fees rendered and expenses incurred Fees, \$253,282.50 Expenses, \$0.00

Hours and Compensation:	Exhibits:
Summary by Project Category	A
Estimated "Fixed Fee" Service	
Summary of Hours by Project and Professional	В
Professional Services by Project, Professional and Date	C
Hourly and Case Administration Services	
Summary of Hours and Fees by Project and Professional	D
Professional Services by Project, Professional and Date	E
Expenditures Incurred and Reimbursement Sought (none)	

CHESAPEAKE ENERGY CORPORATION, et al. (Case No. 20-33233 DRJ) PricewaterhouseCoopers LLP - Independent Auditor and Accounting Services Provider Summary by Project Category and Billing Category				
For the Period January 1, 2021 through January 15, 2021		Total		
Project Category and Billing Category	Hours Compensat			
Fixed Fee Services				
Independent Audit Services				
2020 Consolidated Audit Services	1,096.50	\$180,000.00		
Subtotal - Hours and Compensation - Fixed Fee Services	1,096.50	\$180,000.00		
Hourly Services				
Incremental Bankruptcy Accounting Services				
Accounting Advisory and Assistance	87.20	\$68,099.70		
Correspondence, Calls and Meetings with Management	6.80	\$5,182.80		
Subtotal - Hours and Compensation - Hourly Services	94.00	\$73,282.50		
Total - Hours and Compensation Sought for Reimbursement	1,190.50	\$253,282.50		

CHESAPEAKE ENERGY CORPORATION, et al. (Case No. 20-33233 DRJ)

PricewaterhouseCoopers LLP - Independent Auditor and Accounting Services Provider

Fixed Fee Services - Summary of Hours and Fees by Project and Professional

For the Period January 1, 2021 through January 15, 2021

Total

oject Category and Professional	Position	Hours	Total Compensation
2020 Consolidated Audit Services			
Bryan Christopher Coleman	Partner	7.00)
Gregory D Fein	Partner	1.00)
James H Prettyman	Partner	1.00)
John P McNamara	Partner	17.00)
John Wynn Phillips	Partner	2.00)
Samuel Kent Sparks	Director	54.00)
Benjamin Scott Bahlmann	Senior Manager	10.00)
Chad Parkhurst	Senior Manager	2.00)
Hochol Edmond Lim	Senior Manager	1.00)
Christi Brewer	Manager	20.00)
Jennifer Rosemarie Yee	Manager	52.00)
Michelle Hartmann	Manager	1.10)
Reed Edwin Haines	Manager	3.20)
Ryan Goga	Manager	74.00)
Adam Miller Wiley	Senior Associate	90.00)
Bailey Elizabeth Bellomy	Senior Associate	51.20)
Cesar D Lopez	Senior Associate	11.40)
Hayden W Deberry	Senior Associate	74.40)
Tyler Scott Burgin	Senior Associate	88.00)
Ashley Kay Youngwolfe	Associate	99.10)
Collin McKay Short	Associate	51.00)
Gabrielle Hooper	Associate	62.50)
Jordan Matthew Meyer	Associate	38.50)
Kelsey Jo Ann Kitson	Associate	82.50)
Rachel Dawn Sierra	Associate	1.80)
Samuel Tucker Laverde	Associate	66.00)
Shelby Nicole Hackney	Associate	90.00)
Suilen Bik	Associate	4.10)
Thomas Jefferson Davies	Associate	36.00)
William Brian Putnam	Associate	4.70)

CHESAPEAKE ENERGY CORPORATION, et al. (Case No. 20-33233 DRJ)

PricewaterhouseCoopers LLP - Independent Auditor and Accounting Services Provider

Fixed Fee Services - Summary of Hours and Fees by Project and Professional

For the Period January 1, 2021 through January 15, 2021

Project Category and Professional Position	Hours	Compensation	
Subtotal - 2020 Consolidated Audit Services	1,096.50	\$180,000.00	
Total - Hours and Compensation - Fixed Fee Services	1,096.50	\$180,000.00	

Exhibit C

Date	Name	Position	Description	Hours
Independer	nt Audit Services			
1/4/2021	Bryan Christopher Coleman	Partner	0121F0001: Planning - 3.0 - Identify Risks - Understand cybersecurity.	1.00
1/4/2021	Bailey Elizabeth Bellomy	Senior Associate	0121F0002: Meetings - Status / Debriefs - PwC only internal status meetings - B Bellomy, S Hackney, J Meyer, A Youngwolfe (all PwC) to discuss year end testing approach.	1.00
1/4/2021	Bailey Elizabeth Bellomy	Senior Associate	0121F0003: Other Audit/Audit Related Activities - Risk Assurance - Automated Controls - Review controls testing and leave review notes.	1.20
1/4/2021	Bailey Elizabeth Bellomy	Senior Associate	0121F0004: Information Technology General Controls - Risk Assurance - Access Programs & Data - Client inquiry / follow-up.	0.30
1/4/2021	Shelby Nicole Hackney	Associate	0121F0005: Meetings - Status / Debriefs - PwC only internal status meetings - B Bellomy, S Hackney, J Meyer, A Youngwolfe (all PwC) to discuss year end testing approach.	1.00
1/4/2021	Jordan Matthew Meyer	Associate	0121F0006: Meetings - Status / Debriefs - PwC only internal status meetings - B Bellomy, S Hackney, J Meyer, A Youngwolfe (all PwC) to discuss year end testing approach.	1.00
1/4/2021	Shelby Nicole Hackney	Associate	0121F0007: Engagement Management - Project Management - Engagement Economics / Monitoring Activities.	1.00
1/4/2021	Jordan Matthew Meyer	Associate	0121F0008: Engagement Management - Project Management - Engagement Economics / Monitoring Activities.	0.50
1/4/2021	Shelby Nicole Hackney	Associate	0121F0009: Other Audit/Audit Related Activities - Risk Assurance - Key Reports - Review key reports testing and leave review notes.	1.00
1/4/2021	Shelby Nicole Hackney	Associate	0121F0010: Other Audit/Audit Related Activities - Risk Assurance - SOD/Restricted Access - Client inquiry / follow-up.	0.50

Exhibit C

Date	Name	Position	Description	Hours
1/4/2021	Shelby Nicole Hackney	Associate	0121F0011: Information Technology General Controls - Risk Assurance - Program Changes - Review controls testing.	1.00
1/4/2021	Shelby Nicole Hackney	Associate	0121F0012: Information Technology General Controls - Risk Assurance - Program Changes - Documentation of testing.	0.50
1/4/2021	Jordan Matthew Meyer	Associate	0121F0013: Information Technology General Controls - Risk Assurance - Program Changes - Client inquiry / follow-up.	1.00
1/4/2021	Shelby Nicole Hackney	Associate	0121F0014: Information Technology General Controls - Risk Assurance - Access Programs & Data - Documentation of testing.	0.50
1/4/2021	Shelby Nicole Hackney	Associate	0121F0015: Information Technology General Controls - Risk Assurance - Access Programs & Data - Client inquiry / follow-up.	0.50
1/4/2021	Shelby Nicole Hackney	Associate	0121F0016: Information Technology General Controls - Risk Assurance - Access Programs & Data - Review controls testing.	2.00
1/4/2021	Jordan Matthew Meyer	Associate	0121F0017: Information Technology General Controls - Risk Assurance - Access Programs & Data - Client inquiry / follow-up.	2.00
1/4/2021	Shelby Nicole Hackney	Associate	0121F0018: Information Technology General Controls - Risk Assurance - Computer Operations - Review controls testing.	0.50
1/4/2021	Ashley Kay Youngwolfe	Associate	0121F0019: Meetings - Status / Debriefs - PwC only internal status meetings - B Bellomy, S Hackney, J Meyer, A Youngwolfe (all PwC) to discuss year end testing approach.	1.00
1/4/2021	Ashley Kay Youngwolfe	Associate	0121F0020: Engagement Management - Project Management - Engagement Economics / Monitoring Activities.	0.50
1/4/2021	Ashley Kay Youngwolfe	Associate	0121F0021: Other Audit/Audit Related Activities - Risk Assurance - Key Reports - Documentation of testing.	0.50

Exhibit C

Date	Name	Position	Description	Hours
1/4/2021	Ashley Kay Youngwolfe	Associate	0121F0022: Other Audit/Audit Related Activities - Risk Assurance - Automated Controls - Documentation of testing.	1.90
1/4/2021	Ashley Kay Youngwolfe	Associate	0121F0023: Information Technology General Controls - Risk Assurance - Access Programs & Data - Documentation of testing.	2.20
1/4/2021	Ashley Kay Youngwolfe	Associate	0121F0024: Information Technology General Controls - Risk Assurance - Computer Operations - Documentation of testing.	3.00
1/4/2021	Samuel Kent Sparks	Director	0121F0025: Meetings - Status / Debriefs - Client status meetings / PBC request updates.	1.00
1/4/2021	Samuel Kent Sparks	Director	0121F0026: Engagement Management - Project Management - Engagement Economics / Monitoring Activities.	2.00
1/4/2021	Samuel Kent Sparks	Director	0121F0027: Engagement Management - Project Management - Core audit team and Risk Assurance Coordination/Communication.	1.00
1/4/2021	Hayden W Deberry	Senior Associate	0121F0028: Controls testing - Entity-Level Controls - Review controls testing and leave review notes.	0.50
1/4/2021	Reed Edwin Haines	Manager	0121F0029: Meetings - PwC only internal status meetings - Partner discussion, possible state CODI issues.	1.00
1/4/2021	Ryan Goga	Manager	0121F0030: Engagement Management - Project Management - Review database workflow.	1.00
1/4/2021	Jennifer Rosemarie Yee	Manager	0121F0031: Engagement Management - Project Management - Engagement Economics / Monitoring Activities.	2.00
1/4/2021	Jennifer Rosemarie Yee	Manager	0121F0032: Continue Engagement Management - Project Management - Engagement Economics / Monitoring Activities.	2.00
1/4/2021	Ryan Goga	Manager	0121F0033: Controls testing - Revenue & Receivables - Review controls testing and leave review notes.	4.50

Exhibit C

Date	Name	Position	Description	Hours
1/4/2021	Ryan Goga	Manager	0121F0034: Substantive Audit Procedures - Derivatives & Hedges - Review detailed testing and leave review comments.	1.50
1/4/2021	Hayden W Deberry	Senior Associate	0121F0035: Meetings - Status / Debriefs - PwC only internal status meetings - H Deberry, K Kitson, G Hooper (all PwC) to discuss capitalized payroll testing approach.	0.50
1/4/2021	Hayden W Deberry	Senior Associate	0121F0036: Engagement Management - Project Management - Review and prioritize upcoming tasks.	1.80
1/4/2021	Hayden W Deberry	Senior Associate	0121F0037: Engagement Management - Project Management - Audit Board / PBC Management.	0.80
1/4/2021	Hayden W Deberry	Senior Associate	0121F0038: Other Audit/Audit Related Activities - Core assurance - Journal Entries - Review interim journal entry testing.	0.50
1/4/2021	Hayden W Deberry	Senior Associate	0121F0039: Controls testing - Period-end Financial Reporting - Review controls testing and leave review notes.	2.00
1/4/2021	Hayden W Deberry	Senior Associate	0121F0040: Substantive Audit Procedures - Capital & Equity - Review dividends paid and payable documentation.	1.00
1/4/2021	Kelsey Jo Ann Kitson	Associate	0121F0041: Meetings - Status / Debriefs - PwC only internal status meetings - H Deberry, K Kitson, G Hooper (all PwC) to discuss capitalized payroll testing approach.	0.50
1/4/2021	Gabrielle Hooper	Associate	0121F0042: Meetings - Status / Debriefs - PwC only internal status meetings - H Deberry, K Kitson, G Hooper (all PwC) to discuss capitalized payroll testing approach.	0.50
1/4/2021	Collin McKay Short	Associate	0121F0043: Other Audit/Audit Related Activities - Core assurance - Journal Entries - Respond to review comments on interim journal entry testing and update documentation.	2.00

Exhibit C

Date	Name	Position	Description	Hours
1/4/2021	Collin McKay Short	Associate	0121F0044: Controls testing - Revenue & Receivables - Review selection support.	3.00
1/4/2021	Gabrielle Hooper	Associate	0121F0045: Controls testing - Payroll - Documentation of control testing.	1.60
1/4/2021	Gabrielle Hooper	Associate	0121F0046: Controls testing - Entity-Level Controls - Documentation of control testing.	3.00
1/4/2021	Kelsey Jo Ann Kitson	Associate	0121F0047: Substantive Audit Procedures - L2 Optional - Oil & Gas Reserves - Client inquiry / follow-up.	0.50
1/4/2021	Kelsey Jo Ann Kitson	Associate	0121F0048: Substantive Audit Procedures - L2 Optional - Oil & Gas Reserves - Documentation of business process.	0.50
1/4/2021	Gabrielle Hooper	Associate	0121F0049: Substantive Audit Procedures - Payroll Accrual / Expense - Test headcount data.	1.90
1/4/2021	John P McNamara	Partner	0121F0050: Lead Engagement Partner Time - Review and Supervision - Partner Time - Review and Supervision - Partner Time.	2.00
1/4/2021	Adam Miller Wiley	Senior Associate	0121F0051: Controls testing - Revenue & Receivables - Review controls testing and leave review notes.	4.20
1/4/2021	Tyler Scott Burgin	Senior Associate	0121F0052: Substantive Audit Procedures - PP&E / Leases / Depreciation - Reserves estimate template.	4.00
1/4/2021	Samuel Tucker Laverde	Associate	0121F0053: Controls testing - Revenue & Receivables - Documentation of control testing.	3.10
1/4/2021	Kelsey Jo Ann Kitson	Associate	0121F0054: Controls testing - L2 Optional - Oil & Gas Reserves - Documentation of control testing.	3.10
1/4/2021	Adam Miller Wiley	Senior Associate	0121F0055: Continue Controls testing - Revenue & Receivables - Review controls testing and leave review notes.	3.80

Exhibit C

Date	Name	Position	Description	Hours
1/4/2021	Kelsey Jo Ann Kitson	Associate	0121F0056: Continue Controls testing - L2 Optional - Oil & Gas Reserves - Documentation of control testing.	2.90
1/4/2021	Samuel Tucker Laverde	Associate	0121F0057: Continue Controls testing - Revenue & Receivables - Documentation of control testing.	3.10
1/4/2021	Tyler Scott Burgin	Senior Associate	0121F0058: Continue Substantive Audit Procedures - PP&E / Leases / Depreciation - Reserves estimate template.	4.00
1/5/2021	Samuel Kent Sparks	Director	0121F0059: Meetings - Status / Debriefs - Client status meetings / PBC request updates.	1.00
1/5/2021	Samuel Kent Sparks	Director	0121F0060: Engagement Management - Project Management - Core audit team and Risk Assurance Coordination/Communication.	1.00
1/5/2021	Samuel Kent Sparks	Director	0121F0061: Engagement Management - Project Management - Engagement Economics / Monitoring Activities.	1.00
1/5/2021	Samuel Kent Sparks	Director	0121F0062: Engagement Management - Project Management - Review budgeted resources per EMT and complete monthly monitoring.	1.00
1/5/2021	Bailey Elizabeth Bellomy	Senior Associate	0121F0063: Meetings - Status / Debriefs - Client meeting to discuss PBC requests.	0.50
1/5/2021	Bailey Elizabeth Bellomy	Senior Associate	0121F0064: Planning - 3.0 - Identify Risks - Understand cybersecurity.	2.50
1/5/2021	Bailey Elizabeth Bellomy	Senior Associate	0121F0065: Information Technology General Controls - Risk Assurance - Computer Operations - Review controls testing and leave review notes.	1.50
1/5/2021	Bailey Elizabeth Bellomy	Senior Associate	0121F0066: Information Technology General Controls - Risk Assurance - Computer Operations - Client inquiry / follow-up.	0.50
1/5/2021	Shelby Nicole Hackney	Associate	0121F0067: Planning - 3.0 - Identify Risks - Understand cybersecurity.	0.50

Exhibit C

Date	Name	Position	Description	Hours
1/5/2021	Shelby Nicole Hackney	Associate	0121F0068: Engagement Management - Project Management - Audit Board / PBC Management.	0.50
1/5/2021	Shelby Nicole Hackney	Associate	0121F0069: Engagement Management - Project Management - Core audit team and Risk Assurance Coordination/Communication.	0.50
1/5/2021	Jordan Matthew Meyer	Associate	0121F0070: Engagement Management - Project Management - Update AuditBoard PBC requests.	0.50
1/5/2021	Shelby Nicole Hackney	Associate	0121F0071: Other Audit/Audit Related Activities - Risk Assurance - Key Reports - Compile screenshot support.	0.50
1/5/2021	Shelby Nicole Hackney	Associate	0121F0072: Information Technology General Controls - Risk Assurance - Program Changes - Documentation of testing.	0.50
1/5/2021	Shelby Nicole Hackney	Associate	0121F0073: Information Technology General Controls - Risk Assurance - Program Changes - Review selection support.	0.50
1/5/2021	Shelby Nicole Hackney	Associate	0121F0074: Information Technology General Controls - Risk Assurance - Access Programs & Data - Review controls testing.	2.00
1/5/2021	Shelby Nicole Hackney	Associate	0121F0075: Information Technology General Controls - Risk Assurance - Access Programs & Data - Review selection support.	1.00
1/5/2021	Shelby Nicole Hackney	Associate	0121F0076: Information Technology General Controls - Risk Assurance - Access Programs & Data - Documentation of testing.	2.00
1/5/2021	Jordan Matthew Meyer	Associate	0121F0077: Information Technology General Controls - Risk Assurance - Access Programs & Data - Client inquiry / follow-up.	0.50
1/5/2021	Jennifer Rosemarie Yee	Manager	0121F0078: Engagement Management - Project Management - Engagement Economics / Monitoring Activities.	2.00

Exhibit C

Date	Name	Position	Description	Hours
1/5/2021	Jennifer Rosemarie Yee	Manager	0121F0079: Continue Engagement Management - Project Management - Engagement Economics / Monitoring Activities.	2.00
1/5/2021	Jordan Matthew Meyer	Associate	0121F0080: Information Technology General Controls - Risk Assurance - Access Programs & Data - Review interim controls testing documentation.	0.50
1/5/2021	Ryan Goga	Manager	0121F0081: Substantive Audit Procedures - Revenue - Review revenue detailed testing and draft review notes.	2.00
1/5/2021	Ryan Goga	Manager	0121F0082: Substantive Audit Procedures - Derivatives & Hedges - Review detailed testing and leave review comments.	1.00
1/5/2021	Shelby Nicole Hackney	Associate	0121F0083: Information Technology General Controls - Risk Assurance - Computer Operations - Review controls testing.	0.50
1/5/2021	Shelby Nicole Hackney	Associate	0121F0084: Information Technology General Controls - Risk Assurance - Computer Operations - Documentation of testing.	1.50
1/5/2021	Hayden W Deberry	Senior Associate	0121F0085: Meetings - Status / Debriefs - Client status meetings / PBC request updates.	0.50
1/5/2021	Ashley Kay Youngwolfe	Associate	0121F0086: Information Technology General Controls - Risk Assurance - Access Programs & Data - Documentation of testing.	3.10
1/5/2021	Ashley Kay Youngwolfe	Associate	0121F0087: Information Technology General Controls - Risk Assurance - Access Programs & Data - Review controls documentation and leave review notes.	2.10
1/5/2021	Ashley Kay Youngwolfe	Associate	0121F0088: Information Technology General Controls - Risk Assurance - Computer Operations - Documentation of testing.	3.80
1/5/2021	Ashley Kay Youngwolfe	Associate	0121F0089: Information Technology General Controls - Risk Assurance - Computer Operations - Review controls documentation and leave review notes.	0.50

Exhibit C

Date	Name	Position	Description	Hours
1/5/2021	Hayden W Deberry	Senior Associate	0121F0090: Other Audit/Audit Related Activities - Core assurance - Journal Entries - Review journal entry interim testing and leave review notes.	3.50
1/5/2021	Hayden W Deberry	Senior Associate	0121F0091: Other Audit/Audit Related Activities - Core assurance - Journal Entries - Client inquiry / follow-up.	0.50
1/5/2021	Hayden W Deberry	Senior Associate	0121F0092: Controls testing - Purchasing & Payables - Review controls testing and leave review notes.	1.00
1/5/2021	Hayden W Deberry	Senior Associate	0121F0093: Controls testing - Period-end Financial Reporting - Review controls testing and leave review notes.	1.00
1/5/2021	Michelle Hartmann	Manager	0121F0094: Other Audit/Audit Related Activities - Data Assurance - Journal Entries - Review journal entry output and integrity checks.	1.10
1/5/2021	Hayden W Deberry	Senior Associate	0121F0095: Substantive Audit Procedures - Notes Payable & Long-term Debt - Review notes payable listing to send confirmations.	1.00
1/5/2021	Collin McKay Short	Associate	0121F0096: Other Audit/Audit Related Activities - Core assurance - Journal Entries - Respond to review comments on interim journal entry testing and update documentation.	1.00
1/5/2021	Collin McKay Short	Associate	0121F0097: Controls testing - Revenue & Receivables - Review selection support.	2.50
1/5/2021	Kelsey Jo Ann Kitson	Associate	0121F0098: Controls testing - L2 Optional - Oil & Gas Reserves - Documentation of control testing.	4.50
1/5/2021	Kelsey Jo Ann Kitson	Associate	0121F0099: Substantive Audit Procedures - PP&E / Leases / Depreciation - Documentation of testing.	2.00
1/5/2021	William Brian Putnam	Associate	0121F0100: COE - Cash - Substantive Testing - Review selection support.	0.10
1/5/2021	William Brian Putnam	Associate	0121F0101: COE - Debt - Substantive Testing - Documentation of testing.	1.30

Exhibit C

Date	Name	Position	Description	Hours
1/5/2021	John P McNamara	Partner	0121F0102: Lead Engagement Partner Time - Review and Supervision - Partner Time - Review and Supervision - Partner Time.	2.00
1/5/2021	Adam Miller Wiley	Senior Associate	0121F0103: Controls testing - Revenue & Receivables - Review controls testing and leave review notes.	4.20
1/5/2021	Tyler Scott Burgin	Senior Associate	0121F0104: Substantive Audit Procedures - PP&E / Leases / Depreciation - Eagle Ford, Mid-con, PRB risk assessment review notes, RES.EXP_3.0, SE asset groups.	4.00
1/5/2021	Ryan Goga	Manager	0121F0105: Controls testing - Revenue & Receivables - Review controls testing and leave review notes.	2.60
1/5/2021	Samuel Tucker Laverde	Associate	0121F0106: Controls testing - Revenue & Receivables - Documentation of control testing.	2.60
1/5/2021	Adam Miller Wiley	Senior Associate	0121F0107: Continue Controls testing - Revenue & Receivables - Review controls testing and leave review notes.	3.80
1/5/2021	Ryan Goga	Manager	0121F0108: Continue Controls testing - Revenue & Receivables - Review controls testing and leave review notes.	2.40
1/5/2021	Samuel Tucker Laverde	Associate	0121F0109: Continue Controls testing - Revenue & Receivables - Documentation of control testing.	2.80
1/5/2021	Tyler Scott Burgin	Senior Associate	0121F0110: Continue Substantive Audit Procedures - PP&E / Leases / Depreciation - Eagle Ford, Mid-con, PRB risk assessment review notes, RES.EXP_3.0, SE asset groups.	4.00
1/6/2021	Samuel Kent Sparks	Director	0121F0111: Meetings - Status / Debriefs - Client status meetings / PBC request updates.	1.00
1/6/2021	Samuel Kent Sparks	Director	0121F0112: Engagement Management - Project Management - Core audit team and Risk Assurance Coordination/Communication.	1.00

Exhibit C

Date	Name	Position	Description	Hours
1/6/2021	Samuel Kent Sparks	Director	0121F0113: Engagement Management - Project Management - Engagement Economics / Monitoring Activities.	1.00
1/6/2021	Ryan Goga	Manager	0121F0114: Engagement Management - Project Management - Review database workflow.	1.00
1/6/2021	Ryan Goga	Manager	0121F0115: Controls testing - Revenue & Receivables - Review controls testing and leave review notes.	3.00
1/6/2021	Jennifer Rosemarie Yee	Manager	0121F0116: Controls testing - Payroll - Review controls testing and leave review notes.	1.00
1/6/2021	Jennifer Rosemarie Yee	Manager	0121F0117: Controls testing - Purchasing & Payables - Review controls testing and leave review notes.	1.00
1/6/2021	Jennifer Rosemarie Yee	Manager	0121F0118: Substantive Audit Procedures - PP&E / Leases / Depreciation - O&G - Evaluate triggering event.	1.00
1/6/2021	Jennifer Rosemarie Yee	Manager	0121F0119: Substantive Audit Procedures - PP&E / Leases / Depreciation - PP&E - Impairment / Triggering event.	1.00
1/6/2021	Ryan Goga	Manager	0121F0120: Substantive Audit Procedures - Revenue - Review revenue detailed testing and draft review notes.	1.50
1/6/2021	Hayden W Deberry	Senior Associate	0121F0121: Completion and reporting - Completion Activities - Scope legal expense detail for legal confirmations.	1.00
1/6/2021	Bailey Elizabeth Bellomy	Senior Associate	0121F0122: Meetings - Status / Debriefs - PwC only internal status meetings - B Bellomy, S Hackney, J Meyer, A Youngwolfe (all PwC) to discuss year end testing approach.	0.50
1/6/2021	Bailey Elizabeth Bellomy	Senior Associate	0121F0123: Planning - 3.0 - Identify Risks - Understand cybersecurity.	1.80

Exhibit C

Date	Name	Position	Description	Hours
1/6/2021	Bailey Elizabeth Bellomy	Senior Associate	0121F0124: Information Technology General Controls - Risk Assurance - Access Programs & Data - Review controls testing and leave review notes.	1.00
1/6/2021	Bailey Elizabeth Bellomy	Senior Associate	0121F0125: Information Technology General Controls - Risk Assurance - Access Programs & Data - Documentation of testing.	1.80
1/6/2021	Shelby Nicole Hackney	Associate	0121F0126: Meetings - Status / Debriefs - PwC only internal status meetings - B Bellomy, S Hackney, J Meyer, A Youngwolfe (all PwC) to discuss year end testing approach.	0.50
1/6/2021	Jordan Matthew Meyer	Associate	0121F0127: Meetings - Status / Debriefs - PwC only internal status meetings - B Bellomy, S Hackney, J Meyer, A Youngwolfe (all PwC) to discuss year end testing approach.	0.50
1/6/2021	Shelby Nicole Hackney	Associate	0121F0128: Other Audit/Audit Related Activities - Risk Assurance - Key Reports - Documentation of testing.	0.50
1/6/2021	Shelby Nicole Hackney	Associate	0121F0129: Other Audit/Audit Related Activities - Risk Assurance - Automated Controls - Review controls testing.	0.50
1/6/2021	Shelby Nicole Hackney	Associate	0121F0130: Information Technology General Controls - Risk Assurance - Program Changes - Documentation of testing.	0.50
1/6/2021	Shelby Nicole Hackney	Associate	0121F0131: Information Technology General Controls - Risk Assurance - Access Programs & Data - Review controls testing.	3.50
1/6/2021	Shelby Nicole Hackney	Associate	0121F0132: Information Technology General Controls - Risk Assurance - Access Programs & Data - Client inquiry / follow-up.	1.00
1/6/2021	Shelby Nicole Hackney	Associate	0121F0133: Information Technology General Controls - Risk Assurance - Access Programs & Data - Documentation of testing.	4.00
1/6/2021	Jordan Matthew Meyer	Associate	0121F0134: Information Technology General Controls - Risk Assurance - Access Programs & Data - Review interim controls testing documentation.	1.50

Exhibit C

Date	Name	Position	Description	Hours
1/6/2021	Jordan Matthew Meyer	Associate	0121F0135: Information Technology General Controls - Risk Assurance - Access Programs & Data - Sample selection.	1.00
1/6/2021	Ashley Kay Youngwolfe	Associate	0121F0136: Meetings - Status / Debriefs - PwC only internal status meetings - B Bellomy, S Hackney, J Meyer, A Youngwolfe (all PwC) to discuss year end testing approach.	0.50
1/6/2021	Ashley Kay Youngwolfe	Associate	0121F0137: Information Technology General Controls - Risk Assurance - Access Programs & Data - Review controls documentation and leave review notes.	1.30
1/6/2021	Hayden W Deberry	Senior Associate	0121F0138: Engagement Management - Project Management - Coordination with RTM on year-end testing.	1.00
1/6/2021	Hayden W Deberry	Senior Associate	0121F0139: Engagement Management - Project Management - Core audit team and Risk Assurance Coordination/Communication.	1.50
1/6/2021	Hayden W Deberry	Senior Associate	0121F0140: Other Audit/Audit Related Activities - Core assurance - Journal Entries - HALO set up for year-end journal entry testing.	1.30
1/6/2021	Tyler Scott Burgin	Senior Associate	0121F0141: Controls testing - Property, Plant & Equipment - RES.DIF_6.0, Reserves update testing.	2.00
1/6/2021	Hayden W Deberry	Senior Associate	0121F0142: Controls testing - UOO - Review controls testing and leave review notes.	1.00
1/6/2021	Hayden W Deberry	Senior Associate	0121F0143: Substantive Audit Procedures - Notes Payable & Long-term Debt - Discount / Premium Amortization.	1.00
1/6/2021	Hayden W Deberry	Senior Associate	0121F0144: Substantive Audit Procedures - Notes Payable & Long-term Debt - Additions / Extinguishments / Modifications.	1.00
1/6/2021	Collin McKay Short	Associate	0121F0145: Controls testing - Revenue & Receivables - Review selection support.	2.00

Exhibit C

Date	Name	Position	Description	Hours
1/6/2021	Collin McKay Short	Associate	0121F0146: Controls testing - Period-end Financial Reporting - Client inquiry / follow-up.	2.00
1/6/2021	Gabrielle Hooper	Associate	0121F0147: Controls testing - Entity-Level Controls - Documentation of control testing.	3.80
1/6/2021	Kelsey Jo Ann Kitson	Associate	0121F0148: Substantive Audit Procedures - PP&E / Leases / Depreciation - O&G - Test evaluation of unproved properties.	4.00
1/6/2021	Gabrielle Hooper	Associate	0121F0149: Substantive Audit Procedures - Revenue - Review selection support.	2.20
1/6/2021	Kelsey Jo Ann Kitson	Associate	0121F0150: Substantive Audit Procedures - L2 Optional - Oil & Gas Reserves - Documentation of business process.	0.50
1/6/2021	William Brian Putnam	Associate	0121F0151: COE - Debt - Substantive Testing - Documentation of testing.	0.30
1/6/2021	Thomas Jefferson Davies	Associate	0121F0152: Substantive Audit Procedures - Accrued & Other Current Liabilities - Classification of operating expenses.	4.00
1/6/2021	John P McNamara	Partner	0121F0153: Lead Engagement Partner Time - Review and Supervision - Partner Time - Review and Supervision - Partner Time.	1.00
1/6/2021	Ashley Kay Youngwolfe	Associate	0121F0154: Information Technology General Controls - Risk Assurance - Access Programs & Data - Documentation of testing.	4.30
1/6/2021	Adam Miller Wiley	Senior Associate	0121F0155: Controls testing - Purchasing & Payables - Review controls testing and leave review notes.	4.20
1/6/2021	Tyler Scott Burgin	Senior Associate	0121F0156: Substantive Audit Procedures - PP&E / Leases / Depreciation - Mid-con, Eagle Ford, PRB Risk Assessment.	3.00
1/6/2021	Samuel Tucker Laverde	Associate	0121F0157: Controls testing - Revenue & Receivables - Documentation of control testing.	3.10

Exhibit C

Date	Name	Position	Description	Hours
1/6/2021	Kelsey Jo Ann Kitson	Associate	0121F0158: Controls testing - L2 Optional - Oil & Gas Reserves - Documentation of control testing.	2.70
1/6/2021	Ashley Kay Youngwolfe	Associate	0121F0159: Continue Information Technology General Controls - Risk Assurance - Access Programs & Data - Documentation of testing.	4.40
1/6/2021	Adam Miller Wiley	Senior Associate	0121F0160: Continue Controls testing - Purchasing & Payables - Review controls testing and leave review notes.	3.80
1/6/2021	Kelsey Jo Ann Kitson	Associate	0121F0161: Continue Controls testing - L2 Optional - Oil & Gas Reserves - Documentation of control testing.	2.80
1/6/2021	Samuel Tucker Laverde	Associate	0121F0162: Continue Controls testing - Revenue & Receivables - Documentation of control testing.	3.10
1/6/2021	Tyler Scott Burgin	Senior Associate	0121F0163: Continue Substantive Audit Procedures - PP&E / Leases / Depreciation - Mid-con, Eagle Ford, PRB Risk Assessment.	3.00
1/7/2021	Samuel Kent Sparks	Director	0121F0164: Meetings - Status / Debriefs - Client status meetings / PBC request updates.	1.00
1/7/2021	Samuel Kent Sparks	Director	0121F0165: Engagement Management - Project Management - Core audit team and Risk Assurance Coordination/Communication.	1.00
1/7/2021	Samuel Kent Sparks	Director	0121F0166: Engagement Management - Project Management - Engagement Economics / Monitoring Activities.	1.00
1/7/2021	Samuel Kent Sparks	Director	0121F0167: Engagement Management - Project Management - Draft agenda for status meeting with client.	1.00
1/7/2021	John Wynn Phillips	Partner	0121F0168: Quality Review Partner (QRP) Time - Quality Review Partner (QRP) Time - Review and Supervision - QRP Time.	1.00
1/7/2021	Ryan Goga	Manager	0121F0169: Controls testing - Revenue & Receivables - Review controls testing and leave review notes.	3.00

Exhibit C

Date	Name	Position	Description	Hours
1/7/2021	Jennifer Rosemarie Yee	Manager	0121F0170: Controls testing - Revenue & Receivables - Review controls testing and leave review notes.	1.00
1/7/2021	Jennifer Rosemarie Yee	Manager	0121F0171: Controls testing - Payroll - Review controls testing and leave review notes.	1.00
1/7/2021	Jennifer Rosemarie Yee	Manager	0121F0172: Substantive Audit Procedures - PP&E / Leases / Depreciation - O&G - Evaluate triggering event.	1.00
1/7/2021	Jennifer Rosemarie Yee	Manager	0121F0173: Substantive Audit Procedures - Other - Related Parties - Review related parties substantive testing and leave review notes.	1.00
1/7/2021	Ryan Goga	Manager	0121F0174: Substantive Audit Procedures - Derivatives & Hedges - Review detailed testing and leave review comments.	1.00
1/7/2021	Cesar D Lopez	Senior Associate	0121F0175: COE - Cash - Substantive Testing - Review bank reconciliation testing.	0.80
1/7/2021	Hayden W Deberry	Senior Associate	0121F0176: Meetings - Status / Debriefs - Client status meetings / PBC request updates.	0.50
1/7/2021	Bryan Christopher Coleman	Partner	0121F0177: Meetings - Status / Debriefs - Client status meetings / PBC request updates.	2.00
1/7/2021	Bailey Elizabeth Bellomy	Senior Associate	0121F0178: Meetings - Status / Debriefs - Internal Audit meetings / coordination on UOO controls testing.	0.50
1/7/2021	Hayden W Deberry	Senior Associate	0121F0179: Completion and reporting - Completion Activities - Lawyers letters / Litigation, claims and assessments procedures.	0.80
1/7/2021	Hayden W Deberry	Senior Associate	0121F0180: Other Audit/Audit Related Activities - Financial Reporting & Consolidation - Verify accuracy of condensed consolidating financial statements pursuant to S-X Rule 3-10.	0.50

Exhibit C

Date	Name	Position	Description	Hours
1/7/2021	Hayden W Deberry	Senior Associate	0121F0181: Other Audit/Audit Related Activities - Financial Reporting & Consolidation - Test account mapping for consolidation process.	0.50
1/7/2021	Bailey Elizabeth Bellomy	Senior Associate	0121F0182: Meetings - Status / Debriefs - PwC only internal status meetings - B Bellomy, A Youngwolfe (PwC) to discuss review comments.	0.20
1/7/2021	Bailey Elizabeth Bellomy	Senior Associate	0121F0183: Planning - 3.0 - Identify Risks - Understand cybersecurity.	0.50
1/7/2021	Bailey Elizabeth Bellomy	Senior Associate	0121F0184: Information Technology General Controls - Risk Assurance - Access Programs & Data - Review controls testing and leave review notes.	3.80
1/7/2021	Bailey Elizabeth Bellomy	Senior Associate	0121F0185: Information Technology General Controls - Risk Assurance - Access Programs & Data - Documentation of testing.	1.60
1/7/2021	Shelby Nicole Hackney	Associate	0121F0186: Meetings - Status / Debriefs - Internal Audit meetings / coordination on UOO controls testing.	1.00
1/7/2021	Shelby Nicole Hackney	Associate	0121F0187: Other Audit/Audit Related Activities - Risk Assurance - SOD/Restricted Access - Documentation of testing.	3.00
1/7/2021	Shelby Nicole Hackney	Associate	0121F0188: Information Technology General Controls - Risk Assurance - Program Changes - Client inquiry / follow-up.	0.50
1/7/2021	Shelby Nicole Hackney	Associate	0121F0189: Information Technology General Controls - Risk Assurance - Access Programs & Data - Documentation of testing.	4.00
1/7/2021	Shelby Nicole Hackney	Associate	0121F0190: Information Technology General Controls - Risk Assurance - Access Programs & Data - Review controls testing.	1.00
1/7/2021	Jordan Matthew Meyer	Associate	0121F0191: Information Technology General Controls - Risk Assurance - Access Programs & Data - Review interim controls testing documentation.	2.00

Exhibit C

Date	Name	Position	Description	Hours
1/7/2021	Shelby Nicole Hackney	Associate	0121F0192: Information Technology General Controls - Risk Assurance - Computer Operations - Review selection support.	0.50
1/7/2021	Shelby Nicole Hackney	Associate	0121F0193: Information Technology General Controls - Risk Assurance - Computer Operations - Documentation of testing.	0.50
1/7/2021	Ashley Kay Youngwolfe	Associate	0121F0194: Meetings - Status / Debriefs - PwC only internal status meetings - B Bellomy, A Youngwolfe (PwC) to discuss review comments.	0.20
1/7/2021	Hayden W Deberry	Senior Associate	0121F0195: Controls testing - Entity-Level Controls - Review controls testing and leave review notes.	1.00
1/7/2021	Hayden W Deberry	Senior Associate	0121F0196: Substantive Audit Procedures - Capital & Equity - Review shares conversion testing.	2.00
1/7/2021	Hayden W Deberry	Senior Associate	0121F0197: Substantive Audit Procedures - Notes Payable & Long-term Debt - Additions / Extinguishments / Modifications.	2.50
1/7/2021	Kelsey Jo Ann Kitson	Associate	0121F0198: Meetings - Status / Debriefs - PwC only internal status meetings - K Kitson, G Hooper (PwC) to discuss capitalized payroll support provided by client.	0.50
1/7/2021	Gabrielle Hooper	Associate	0121F0199: Meetings - Status / Debriefs - PwC only internal status meetings - K Kitson, G Hooper (PwC) to discuss capitalized payroll support provided by client.	0.50
1/7/2021	Collin McKay Short	Associate	0121F0200: Other Audit/Audit Related Activities - Core assurance - Journal Entries - Set up HALO for year-end journal entry testing.	0.50
1/7/2021	Collin McKay Short	Associate	0121F0201: Controls testing - Period-end Financial Reporting - Documentation of control testing.	1.00
1/7/2021	Gabrielle Hooper	Associate	0121F0202: Controls testing - Entity-Level Controls - Review selection support.	1.20

Exhibit C

Date	Name	Position	Description	Hours
1/7/2021	Gabrielle Hooper	Associate	0121F0203: Substantive Audit Procedures - Revenue - Review selection support.	2.60
1/7/2021	Collin McKay Short	Associate	0121F0204: Substantive Audit Procedures - Revenue - Marketing netback testing.	1.00
1/7/2021	Collin McKay Short	Associate	0121F0205: Substantive Audit Procedures - Other Operating Income / Expense - Documentation of testing.	2.00
1/7/2021	Gabrielle Hooper	Associate	0121F0206: Substantive Audit Procedures - Capital & Equity - Documentation of control testing.	3.40
1/7/2021	Collin McKay Short	Associate	0121F0207: Substantive Audit Procedures - Notes Payable & Long-term Debt - Review selection support.	1.00
1/7/2021	Gabrielle Hooper	Associate	0121F0208: Substantive Audit Procedures - Accounts Receivable - Review selection support.	0.30
1/7/2021	Gabrielle Hooper	Associate	0121F0209: Substantive Audit Procedures - Payroll Accrual / Expense - Test headcount data.	1.00
1/7/2021	Thomas Jefferson Davies	Associate	0121F0210: Substantive Audit Procedures - Accrued & Other Current Liabilities - Classification of operating expenses.	3.00
1/7/2021	John P McNamara	Partner	0121F0211: Lead Engagement Partner Time - Review and Supervision - Partner Time - Review and Supervision - Partner Time.	2.50
1/7/2021	Christi Brewer	Manager	0121F0212: Engagement Management - Project Management - Supervision and review.	3.00
1/7/2021	Ashley Kay Youngwolfe	Associate	0121F0213: Information Technology General Controls - Risk Assurance - Access Programs & Data - Documentation of testing.	4.90
1/7/2021	Adam Miller Wiley	Senior Associate	0121F0214: Substantive Audit Procedures - Revenue - Review revenue strategy memo.	4.20

Exhibit C

Date	Name	Position	Description	Hours
1/7/2021	Tyler Scott Burgin	Senior Associate	0121F0215: Substantive Audit Procedures - PP&E / Leases / Depreciation - Eagle Ford, Mid-con, PRB Risk assessments, Q1 SE Impairment EGA.	4.00
1/7/2021	Samuel Tucker Laverde	Associate	0121F0216: Controls testing - Revenue & Receivables - Documentation of control testing.	3.10
1/7/2021	Kelsey Jo Ann Kitson	Associate	0121F0217: Substantive Audit Procedures - PP&E / Leases / Depreciation - PP&E - Depreciation expense.	3.10
1/7/2021	Kelsey Jo Ann Kitson	Associate	0121F0218: Substantive Audit Procedures - PP&E / Leases / Depreciation - O&G - Test evaluation of unproved properties.	2.70
1/7/2021	Ryan Goga	Manager	0121F0219: Substantive Audit Procedures - PP&E / Leases / Depreciation - PP&E - Impairment / Triggering event.	2.60
1/7/2021	Ashley Kay Youngwolfe	Associate	0121F0220: Continue Information Technology General Controls - Risk Assurance - Access Programs & Data - Documentation of testing.	4.90
1/7/2021	Adam Miller Wiley	Senior Associate	0121F0221: Continue Substantive Audit Procedures - Revenue - Review revenue strategy memo.	3.80
1/7/2021	Kelsey Jo Ann Kitson	Associate	0121F0222: Continue Substantive Audit Procedures - PP&E / Leases / Depreciation - PP&E - Depreciation expense.	2.90
1/7/2021	Kelsey Jo Ann Kitson	Associate	0121F0223: Continue Substantive Audit Procedures - PP&E / Leases / Depreciation - O&G - Test evaluation of unproved properties.	2.80
1/7/2021	Ryan Goga	Manager	0121F0224: Continue Substantive Audit Procedures - PP&E / Leases / Depreciation - PP&E - Impairment / Triggering event.	2.40
1/7/2021	Samuel Tucker Laverde	Associate	0121F0225: Continue Controls testing - Revenue & Receivables - Documentation of control testing.	2.10

Exhibit C

Date	Name	Position	Description	Hours
1/7/2021	Tyler Scott Burgin	Senior Associate	0121F0226: Continue Substantive Audit Procedures - PP&E / Leases / Depreciation - Eagle Ford, Mid-con, PRB Risk assessments, Q1 SE Impairment EGA.	4.00
1/7/2021	Christi Brewer	Manager	0121F0227: Engagement Management and Project Management - Supervision and review.	3.50
1/7/2021	Christi Brewer	Manager	0121F0228: Continue Engagement Management and Project Management - Supervision and review.	3.50
1/8/2021	Jennifer Rosemarie Yee	Manager	0121F0229: Engagement Management - Project Management - Engagement Economics / Monitoring Activities.	2.00
1/8/2021	Ryan Goga	Manager	0121F0230: Controls testing - Revenue & Receivables - Review controls testing and leave review notes.	1.00
1/8/2021	Jennifer Rosemarie Yee	Manager	0121F0231: Substantive Audit Procedures - PP&E / Leases / Depreciation - O&G - Test evaluation of unproved properties.	1.00
1/8/2021	Ryan Goga	Manager	0121F0232: Substantive Audit Procedures - Revenue - Review revenue detailed testing and draft review notes.	2.00
1/8/2021	Jennifer Rosemarie Yee	Manager	0121F0233: Substantive Audit Procedures - Capital & Equity - Review test share splits documentation.	1.00
1/8/2021	Ryan Goga	Manager	0121F0234: Substantive Audit Procedures - Derivatives & Hedges - Review detailed testing and leave review comments.	2.00
1/8/2021	Cesar D Lopez	Senior Associate	0121F0235: COE - Debt - Project Management - Monitor hours charged against budget.	0.30
1/8/2021	Hayden W Deberry	Senior Associate	0121F0236: Completion and reporting - Completion Activities - Lawyers letters / Litigation, claims and assessments procedures.	0.80

Exhibit C

Date	Name	Position	Description	Hours
1/8/2021	Hayden W Deberry	Senior Associate	0121F0237: Engagement Management - Project Management - Audit Board / PBC Management.	0.50
1/8/2021	Hayden W Deberry	Senior Associate	0121F0238: Other Audit/Audit Related Activities - Core assurance - Journal Entries - HALO set up for year-end journal entry testing.	1.00
1/8/2021	Bailey Elizabeth Bellomy	Senior Associate	0121F0239: Meetings - Status / Debriefs - PwC only internal status meetings - B Bellomy, J Meyer (PwC) to review key report testing for follow-ups with client.	1.00
1/8/2021	Bailey Elizabeth Bellomy	Senior Associate	0121F0240: Planning - 3.0 - Identify Risks - Understand cybersecurity.	0.50
1/8/2021	Bailey Elizabeth Bellomy	Senior Associate	0121F0241: Information Technology General Controls - Risk Assurance - Access Programs & Data - Documentation of testing.	2.00
1/8/2021	Bailey Elizabeth Bellomy	Senior Associate	0121F0242: Information Technology General Controls - Risk Assurance - Access Programs & Data - Review controls testing and leave review notes.	1.50
1/8/2021	Bailey Elizabeth Bellomy	Senior Associate	0121F0243: Information Technology General Controls - Risk Assurance - Access Programs & Data - Sample selection.	1.00
1/8/2021	Jordan Matthew Meyer	Associate	0121F0244: Meetings - Status / Debriefs - PwC only internal status meetings - B Bellomy, J Meyer (PwC) to review key report testing for follow-ups with client.	1.00
1/8/2021	Shelby Nicole Hackney	Associate	0121F0245: Other Audit/Audit Related Activities - Risk Assurance - Key Reports - Documentation of testing.	0.50
1/8/2021	Shelby Nicole Hackney	Associate	0121F0246: Other Audit/Audit Related Activities - Risk Assurance - Key Reports - Review key reports testing and leave review notes.	0.50
1/8/2021	Shelby Nicole Hackney	Associate	0121F0247: Other Audit/Audit Related Activities - Risk Assurance - Automated Controls - Review controls testing.	0.50

Exhibit C

Date	Name	Position	Description	Hours
1/8/2021	Shelby Nicole Hackney	Associate	0121F0248: Other Audit/Audit Related Activities - Risk Assurance - Automated Controls - Documentation of testing.	0.50
1/8/2021	Shelby Nicole Hackney	Associate	0121F0249: Information Technology General Controls - Risk Assurance - Access Programs & Data - Review controls testing.	1.00
1/8/2021	Shelby Nicole Hackney	Associate	0121F0250: Information Technology General Controls - Risk Assurance - Access Programs & Data - Documentation of testing.	3.50
1/8/2021	Jordan Matthew Meyer	Associate	0121F0251: Information Technology General Controls - Risk Assurance - Access Programs & Data - Client inquiry / follow-up.	0.50
1/8/2021	Shelby Nicole Hackney	Associate	0121F0252: Information Technology General Controls - Risk Assurance - Computer Operations - Review controls testing.	1.00
1/8/2021	Ashley Kay Youngwolfe	Associate	0121F0253: Engagement Management - Project Management - Engagement Economics / Monitoring Activities.	0.50
1/8/2021	Ashley Kay Youngwolfe	Associate	0121F0254: Other Audit/Audit Related Activities - Risk Assurance - Key Reports - Documentation of testing.	0.80
1/8/2021	Ashley Kay Youngwolfe	Associate	0121F0255: Information Technology General Controls - Risk Assurance - Access Programs & Data - Review controls documentation and leave review notes.	0.50
1/8/2021	Ashley Kay Youngwolfe	Associate	0121F0256: Information Technology General Controls - Risk Assurance - Computer Operations - Review controls documentation and leave review notes.	0.50
1/8/2021	Ashley Kay Youngwolfe	Associate	0121F0257: Information Technology General Controls - Risk Assurance - Computer Operations - Documentation of testing.	2.30
1/8/2021	Bryan Christopher Coleman	Partner	0121F0258: Meetings - Status / Debriefs - Client status meetings / PBC request updates.	2.00

Exhibit C

1/8/2021Hayden W DeberrySenior Associate0121F0259: Substantive Audit Procedures - Notes Payable & Long-term Debt - Additions / Extinguishments / Modifications.1/8/2021Hayden W DeberrySenior Associate0121F0260: Substantive Audit Procedures - Accrued & Other Current Liabilities - Classification of operating expenses.1/8/2021Gabrielle HooperAssociate0121F0261: Substantive Audit Procedures - Revenue - Review selection support.1/8/2021Collin McKay ShortAssociate0121F0262: Engagement Management - Project Management - Audit Board / PBC Management.1/8/2021Collin McKay ShortAssociate0121F0263: Controls testing - Period-end Financial Reporting - Documentation of control testing.1/8/2021Gabrielle HooperAssociate0121F0264: Controls testing - Entity-Level Controls - Documentation of control testing.1/8/2021Samuel Tucker LaverdeAssociate0121F0265: Substantive Audit Procedures - Revenue - Documentation of testing - test revenue transactions.1/8/2021Collin McKay ShortAssociate0121F0266: Substantive Audit Procedures - Revenue - Marketing netback testing.1/8/2021Gabrielle HooperAssociate0121F0267: Substantive Audit Procedures - Other - Related Parties - Documentation of business process.1/8/2021Kelsey Jo Ann KitsonAssociate0121F0269: Substantive Audit Procedures - Derivatives & Hedges - Valuation of Derivatives.1/8/2021Kelsey Jo Ann KitsonAssociate0121F0269: Substantive Audit Procedures - L2 Optional - Oil & Gas Reserves - Reserves estimate testing.1/8/2021Gabrielle HooperAssociate0121F0269: Subst	Date	Name	Position	Description	Hours
Liabilities - Classification of operating expenses. 1/8/2021 Gabrielle Hooper Associate 0121F0261: Substantive Audit Procedures - Revenue - Review selection support. 1/8/2021 Collin McKay Short Associate 0121F0262: Engagement Management - Project Management - Audit Board / PBC Management. 1/8/2021 Collin McKay Short Associate 0121F0263: Controls testing - Period-end Financial Reporting - Documentation of control testing. 1/8/2021 Gabrielle Hooper Associate 0121F0264: Controls testing - Entity-Level Controls - Documentation of control testing. 1/8/2021 Samuel Tucker Associate 0121F0265: Substantive Audit Procedures - Revenue - Documentation of testing - test revenue transactions. 1/8/2021 Collin McKay Short Associate 0121F0266: Substantive Audit Procedures - Revenue - Marketing netback testing. 1/8/2021 Gabrielle Hooper Associate 0121F0267: Substantive Audit Procedures - Other - Related Parties - Documentation of business process. 1/8/2021 Kelsey Jo Ann Kitson Associate 0121F0268: Substantive Audit Procedures - Derivatives & Hedges - Valuation of Derivatives. 1/8/2021 Kelsey Jo Ann Kitson Associate 0121F0269: Substantive Audit Procedures - L2 Optional - Oil & Gas Reserves - Reserves estimate testing. 1/8/2021 Gabrielle Hooper Associate 0121F0270: Substantive Audit Procedures - Payroll Accrual / Expense -	1/8/2021	Hayden W Deberry	Senior Associate	•	1.50
support. 1/8/2021 Collin McKay Short Associate 0121F0262: Engagement Management - Project Management - Audit Board / PBC Management. 1/8/2021 Collin McKay Short Associate 0121F0263: Controls testing - Period-end Financial Reporting - Documentation of control testing. 1/8/2021 Gabrielle Hooper Associate 0121F0264: Controls testing - Entity-Level Controls - Documentation of control testing. 1/8/2021 Samuel Tucker Associate 0121F0265: Substantive Audit Procedures - Revenue - Documentation of testing - test revenue transactions. 1/8/2021 Collin McKay Short Associate 0121F0266: Substantive Audit Procedures - Revenue - Marketing netback testing. 1/8/2021 Gabrielle Hooper Associate 0121F0267: Substantive Audit Procedures - Other - Related Parties - Documentation of business process. 1/8/2021 Kelsey Jo Ann Kitson Associate 0121F0268: Substantive Audit Procedures - Derivatives & Hedges - Valuation of Derivatives. 1/8/2021 Kelsey Jo Ann Kitson Associate 0121F0269: Substantive Audit Procedures - L2 Optional - Oil & Gas Reserves - Reserves - Reserves estimate testing. 1/8/2021 Gabrielle Hooper Associate 0121F0270: Substantive Audit Procedures - Payroll Accrual / Expense -	1/8/2021	Hayden W Deberry	Senior Associate		0.80
Board / PBC Management. 1/8/2021 Collin McKay Short Associate 0121F0263: Controls testing - Period-end Financial Reporting - Documentation of control testing. 1/8/2021 Gabrielle Hooper Associate 0121F0264: Controls testing - Entity-Level Controls - Documentation of control testing. 1/8/2021 Samuel Tucker Associate 0121F0265: Substantive Audit Procedures - Revenue - Documentation of testing - test revenue transactions. 1/8/2021 Collin McKay Short Associate 0121F0266: Substantive Audit Procedures - Revenue - Marketing netback testing. 1/8/2021 Gabrielle Hooper Associate 0121F0267: Substantive Audit Procedures - Other - Related Parties - Documentation of business process. 1/8/2021 Kelsey Jo Ann Kitson Associate 0121F0268: Substantive Audit Procedures - Derivatives & Hedges - Valuation of Derivatives. 1/8/2021 Kelsey Jo Ann Kitson Associate 0121F0269: Substantive Audit Procedures - L2 Optional - Oil & Gas Reserves - Reserves estimate testing. 1/8/2021 Gabrielle Hooper Associate 0121F0270: Substantive Audit Procedures - Payroll Accrual / Expense -	1/8/2021	Gabrielle Hooper	Associate		0.20
Documentation of control testing. 1/8/2021 Gabrielle Hooper Associate 0121F0264: Controls testing - Entity-Level Controls - Documentation of control testing. 1/8/2021 Samuel Tucker Laverde 0121F0265: Substantive Audit Procedures - Revenue - Documentation of testing - test revenue transactions. 1/8/2021 Collin McKay Short Associate 0121F0266: Substantive Audit Procedures - Revenue - Marketing netback testing. 1/8/2021 Gabrielle Hooper Associate 0121F0267: Substantive Audit Procedures - Other - Related Parties - Documentation of business process. 1/8/2021 Kelsey Jo Ann Kitson Associate 0121F0268: Substantive Audit Procedures - Derivatives & Hedges - Valuation of Derivatives. 1/8/2021 Kelsey Jo Ann Kitson Associate 0121F0269: Substantive Audit Procedures - L2 Optional - Oil & Gas Reserves - Reserves estimate testing. 1/8/2021 Gabrielle Hooper Associate 0121F0270: Substantive Audit Procedures - Payroll Accrual / Expense -	1/8/2021	Collin McKay Short	Associate		1.00
control testing. 1/8/2021 Samuel Tucker Laverde Associate 0121F0265: Substantive Audit Procedures - Revenue - Documentation of testing - test revenue transactions. 1/8/2021 Collin McKay Short Associate 0121F0266: Substantive Audit Procedures - Revenue - Marketing netback testing. 1/8/2021 Gabrielle Hooper Associate 0121F0267: Substantive Audit Procedures - Other - Related Parties - Documentation of business process. 1/8/2021 Kelsey Jo Ann Kitson Associate 0121F0268: Substantive Audit Procedures - Derivatives & Hedges - Valuation of Derivatives. 1/8/2021 Kelsey Jo Ann Kitson Associate 0121F0269: Substantive Audit Procedures - L2 Optional - Oil & Gas Reserves - Reserves estimate testing. 1/8/2021 Gabrielle Hooper Associate 0121F0270: Substantive Audit Procedures - Payroll Accrual / Expense -	1/8/2021	Collin McKay Short	Associate		1.00
Laverde testing - test revenue transactions. 1/8/2021 Collin McKay Short Associate 0121F0266: Substantive Audit Procedures - Revenue - Marketing netback testing. 1/8/2021 Gabrielle Hooper Associate 0121F0267: Substantive Audit Procedures - Other - Related Parties - Documentation of business process. 1/8/2021 Kelsey Jo Ann Kitson Associate 0121F0268: Substantive Audit Procedures - Derivatives & Hedges - Valuation of Derivatives. 1/8/2021 Kelsey Jo Ann Kitson Associate 0121F0269: Substantive Audit Procedures - L2 Optional - Oil & Gas Reserves - Reserves estimate testing. 1/8/2021 Gabrielle Hooper Associate 0121F0270: Substantive Audit Procedures - Payroll Accrual / Expense -	1/8/2021	Gabrielle Hooper	Associate		1.30
testing. 1/8/2021 Gabrielle Hooper Associate 0121F0267: Substantive Audit Procedures - Other - Related Parties - Documentation of business process. 1/8/2021 Kelsey Jo Ann Kitson Associate 0121F0268: Substantive Audit Procedures - Derivatives & Hedges - Valuation of Derivatives. 1/8/2021 Kelsey Jo Ann Kitson Associate 0121F0269: Substantive Audit Procedures - L2 Optional - Oil & Gas Reserves - Reserves estimate testing. 1/8/2021 Gabrielle Hooper Associate 0121F0270: Substantive Audit Procedures - Payroll Accrual / Expense -	1/8/2021		Associate		4.00
Documentation of business process. 1/8/2021 Kelsey Jo Ann Kitson Associate 0121F0268: Substantive Audit Procedures - Derivatives & Hedges - Valuation of Derivatives. 1/8/2021 Kelsey Jo Ann Kitson Associate 0121F0269: Substantive Audit Procedures - L2 Optional - Oil & Gas Reserves - Reserves estimate testing. 1/8/2021 Gabrielle Hooper Associate 0121F0270: Substantive Audit Procedures - Payroll Accrual / Expense -	1/8/2021	Collin McKay Short	Associate	e	3.00
Valuation of Derivatives. 1/8/2021 Kelsey Jo Ann Kitson Associate 0121F0269: Substantive Audit Procedures - L2 Optional - Oil & Gas Reserves - Reserves estimate testing. 1/8/2021 Gabrielle Hooper Associate 0121F0270: Substantive Audit Procedures - Payroll Accrual / Expense -	1/8/2021	Gabrielle Hooper	Associate		0.60
Reserves - Reserves estimate testing. 1/8/2021 Gabrielle Hooper Associate 0121F0270: Substantive Audit Procedures - Payroll Accrual / Expense -	1/8/2021	Kelsey Jo Ann Kitson	Associate	· · · · · · · · · · · · · · · · · · ·	0.50
	1/8/2021	Kelsey Jo Ann Kitson	Associate	•	1.00
	1/8/2021	Gabrielle Hooper	Associate	· · · · · · · · · · · · · · · · · · ·	1.20

Exhibit C

Date	Name	Position	Description	Hours
1/8/2021	Thomas Jefferson Davies	Associate	0121F0271: Substantive Audit Procedures - Accrued & Other Current Liabilities - Classification of operating expenses.	1.00
1/8/2021	John P McNamara	Partner	0121F0272: Lead Engagement Partner Time - Review and Supervision - Partner Time - Review and Supervision - Partner Time.	2.00
1/8/2021	Ashley Kay Youngwolfe	Associate	0121F0273: Information Technology General Controls - Risk Assurance - Access Programs & Data - Documentation of testing.	2.60
1/8/2021	Kelsey Jo Ann Kitson	Associate	0121F0274: Substantive Audit Procedures - PP&E / Leases / Depreciation - O&G - Test evaluation of unproved properties.	4.20
1/8/2021	Adam Miller Wiley	Senior Associate	0121F0275: Controls testing - Revenue & Receivables - Review controls testing and leave review notes.	4.20
1/8/2021	Tyler Scott Burgin	Senior Associate	0121F0276: Substantive Audit Procedures - PP&E / Leases / Depreciation - Shrink and Yield, LOE review notes; Q1 SE Impairment EGA.	4.00
1/8/2021	Ashley Kay Youngwolfe	Associate	0121F0277: Continue Information Technology General Controls - Risk Assurance - Access Programs & Data - Documentation of testing.	2.50
1/8/2021	Adam Miller Wiley	Senior Associate	0121F0278: Continue Controls testing - Revenue & Receivables - Review controls testing and leave review notes.	3.80
1/8/2021	Kelsey Jo Ann Kitson	Associate	0121F0279: Continue Substantive Audit Procedures - PP&E / Leases / Depreciation - O&G - Test evaluation of unproved properties.	4.30
1/8/2021	Tyler Scott Burgin	Senior Associate	0121F0280: Continue Substantive Audit Procedures - PP&E / Leases / Depreciation - Shrink and Yield, LOE review notes; Q1 SE Impairment EGA.	4.00
1/9/2021	William Brian Putnam	Associate	0121F0281: COE - Debt - Substantive Testing - Documentation of testing.	0.50

Exhibit C

Date	Name	Position	Description	Hours
1/10/2021	Cesar D Lopez	Senior Associate	0121F0282: COE - Debt - Substantive Testing - Review testing of notes payable activity.	1.50
1/11/2021	Chad Parkhurst	Senior Manager	0121F0283: Other Audit/Audit Related Activities - Data Assurance - Journal Entries - Review journal entry output and integrity checks.	1.00
1/11/2021	Samuel Kent Sparks	Director	0121F0284: Meetings - Status / Debriefs - Client status meetings / PBC request updates.	1.00
1/11/2021	Samuel Kent Sparks	Director	0121F0285: Engagement Management - Project Management - Engagement Economics / Monitoring Activities.	1.00
1/11/2021	Samuel Kent Sparks	Director	0121F0286: Engagement Management - Project Management - Core audit team and Risk Assurance Coordination/Communication.	1.00
1/11/2021	Samuel Kent Sparks	Director	0121F0287: Controls testing - Property, Plant & Equipment - Review controls testing and leave review notes.	1.00
1/11/2021	Samuel Kent Sparks	Director	0121F0288: Controls testing - Period-end Financial Reporting - Review controls testing and leave review notes.	1.00
1/11/2021	Samuel Kent Sparks	Director	0121F0289: Controls testing - Entity-Level Controls - Review controls testing and leave review notes.	1.00
1/11/2021	Samuel Kent Sparks	Director	0121F0290: Controls testing - Business Combinations - Review controls testing and leave review notes.	1.00
1/11/2021	Jennifer Rosemarie Yee	Manager	0121F0291: Meetings - Status / Debriefs - Client status meetings / PBC request updates.	1.00
1/11/2021	Jennifer Rosemarie Yee	Manager	0121F0292: Meetings - Status / Debriefs - PwC only internal status meetings - J Yee, A Wiley, H Deberry (all PwC) to touch base on TreasuryDebt & AP COE test plans.	1.00

Exhibit C

Date	Name	Position	Description	Hours
1/11/2021	Jennifer Rosemarie Yee	Manager	0121F0293: Engagement Management - Project Management - Engagement Economics / Monitoring Activities.	2.00
1/11/2021	Ryan Goga	Manager	0121F0294: Controls testing - Revenue & Receivables - Review controls testing and leave review notes.	3.00
1/11/2021	Jennifer Rosemarie Yee	Manager	0121F0295: Substantive Audit Procedures - Capital & Equity - Review lead schedule for non-controlling interests.	1.00
1/11/2021	Jennifer Rosemarie Yee	Manager	0121F0296: Substantive Audit Procedures - Payroll Accrual / Expense - Test headcount data.	1.00
1/11/2021	Cesar D Lopez	Senior Associate	0121F0297: COE - Equity - Project Management - Review equity roll forward.	0.30
1/11/2021	Hayden W Deberry	Senior Associate	0121F0298: Meetings - Status / Debriefs - Client status meetings / PBC request updates.	0.50
1/11/2021	Hayden W Deberry	Senior Associate	0121F0299: Meetings - Status / Debriefs - PwC only internal status meetings - J Yee, A Wiley, H Deberry (all PwC) to touch base on TreasuryDebt & AP COE test plans.	1.00
1/11/2021	Tyler Scott Burgin	Senior Associate	0121F0300: Engagement Management - Project Management - Bi-weekly status with both associates and managers.	2.00
1/11/2021	Adam Miller Wiley	Senior Associate	0121F0301: Meetings - Status / Debriefs - PwC only internal status meetings - J Yee, A Wiley, H Deberry (all PwC) to touch base on TreasuryDebt & AP COE test plans.	1.00
1/11/2021	Hayden W Deberry	Senior Associate	0121F0302: Other Audit/Audit Related Activities - Core assurance - Journal Entries - Client inquiry / follow-up.	3.10
1/11/2021	Bryan Christopher Coleman	Partner	0121F0303: Meetings - Status / Debriefs - Client status meetings / PBC request updates.	1.00

Exhibit C

Date	Name	Position	Description	Hours
1/11/2021	Benjamin Scott Bahlmann	Senior Manager	0121F0304: Information Technology General Controls - Risk Assurance - Access Programs & Data - Perform review of Access to Programs & Data controls testing.	2.00
1/11/2021	Bailey Elizabeth Bellomy	Senior Associate	0121F0305: Meetings - Status / Debriefs - PwC only internal status meetings - B Bellomy, S Hackney, J Meyer, A Youngwolfe (all PwC) to discuss year-end controls testing.	1.00
1/11/2021	Bailey Elizabeth Bellomy	Senior Associate	0121F0306: Information Technology General Controls - Risk Assurance - Access Programs & Data - Documentation of testing.	2.00
1/11/2021	Bailey Elizabeth Bellomy	Senior Associate	0121F0307: Information Technology General Controls - Risk Assurance - Access Programs & Data - Review controls testing and leave review notes.	2.00
1/11/2021	Bailey Elizabeth Bellomy	Senior Associate	0121F0308: Information Technology General Controls - Risk Assurance - Computer Operations - Documentation of testing.	1.00
1/11/2021	Shelby Nicole Hackney	Associate	0121F0309: Meetings - Status / Debriefs - PwC only internal status meetings - B Bellomy, S Hackney, J Meyer, A Youngwolfe (all PwC) to discuss year-end controls testing.	1.00
1/11/2021	Jordan Matthew Meyer	Associate	0121F0310: Meetings - Status / Debriefs - PwC only internal status meetings - B Bellomy, S Hackney, J Meyer, A Youngwolfe (all PwC) to discuss year-end controls testing.	1.00
1/11/2021	Shelby Nicole Hackney	Associate	0121F0311: Engagement Management - Project Management - Engagement Economics / Monitoring Activities.	1.00
1/11/2021	Shelby Nicole Hackney	Associate	0121F0312: Other Audit/Audit Related Activities - Risk Assurance - Key Reports - Compile screenshot support.	0.50
1/11/2021	Adam Miller Wiley	Senior Associate	0121F0313: Meetings - Status / Debriefs - Client status meetings / PBC request updates.	1.00

Exhibit C

Date	Name	Position	Description	Hours
1/11/2021	Shelby Nicole Hackney	Associate	0121F0314: Other Audit/Audit Related Activities - Risk Assurance - Key Reports - Client inquiry / follow-up.	0.50
1/11/2021	Tyler Scott Burgin	Senior Associate	0121F0315: Controls testing - Property, Plant & Equipment - RES.DIF_4.0 and 5.0, RES.EXP_3.0 discussions.	2.00
1/11/2021	Hayden W Deberry	Senior Associate	0121F0316: Controls testing - Entity-Level Controls - Client inquiry / follow-up.	1.50
1/11/2021	Hayden W Deberry	Senior Associate	0121F0317: Substantive Audit Procedures - Notes Payable & Long-term Debt - Discount / Premium Amortization.	0.80
1/11/2021	Hayden W Deberry	Senior Associate	0121F0318: Substantive Audit Procedures - Payroll Accrual / Expense - Scoping of payroll expenses.	0.50
1/11/2021	Hayden W Deberry	Senior Associate	0121F0319: Substantive Audit Procedures - Payroll Accrual / Expense - Test headcount data.	0.50
1/11/2021	Kelsey Jo Ann Kitson	Associate	0121F0320: Meetings - Status / Debriefs - PwC only internal status meetings - K Kitson, G Hooper, C Short (PwC) to resolve quality check items.	0.50
1/11/2021	Gabrielle Hooper	Associate	0121F0321: Meetings - Status / Debriefs - Client status meetings / PBC request updates.	0.50
1/11/2021	Gabrielle Hooper	Associate	0121F0322: Meetings - Status / Debriefs - PwC only internal status meetings - K Kitson, G Hooper, C Short (PwC) to resolve quality check items.	0.50
1/11/2021	Collin McKay Short	Associate	0121F0323: Meetings - Status / Debriefs - PwC only internal status meetings - K Kitson, G Hooper, C Short (PwC) to resolve quality check items.	0.50
1/11/2021	Shelby Nicole Hackney	Associate	0121F0324: Other Audit/Audit Related Activities - Risk Assurance - Key Reports - Documentation of testing.	0.50

Exhibit C

Date	Name	Position	Description	Hours
1/11/2021	Shelby Nicole Hackney	Associate	0121F0325: Information Technology General Controls - Risk Assurance - Program Changes - Sample selection.	0.50
1/11/2021	Shelby Nicole Hackney	Associate	0121F0326: Information Technology General Controls - Risk Assurance - Program Changes - Client inquiry / follow-up.	0.50
1/11/2021	Jordan Matthew Meyer	Associate	0121F0327: Information Technology General Controls - Risk Assurance - Program Changes - Client inquiry / follow-up.	0.50
1/11/2021	Shelby Nicole Hackney	Associate	0121F0328: Information Technology General Controls - Risk Assurance - Access Programs & Data - Documentation of testing.	2.00
1/11/2021	Shelby Nicole Hackney	Associate	0121F0329: Information Technology General Controls - Risk Assurance - Access Programs & Data - Respond to manager review notes and update.	1.50
1/11/2021	Jordan Matthew Meyer	Associate	0121F0330: Information Technology General Controls - Risk Assurance - Access Programs & Data - Documentation of testing.	2.00
1/11/2021	Shelby Nicole Hackney	Associate	0121F0331: Information Technology General Controls - Risk Assurance - Computer Operations - Review controls testing.	1.00
1/11/2021	Ashley Kay Youngwolfe	Associate	0121F0332: Meetings - Status / Debriefs - PwC only internal status meetings - B Bellomy, S Hackney, J Meyer, A Youngwolfe (all PwC) to discuss year-end controls testing.	1.00
1/11/2021	Ashley Kay Youngwolfe	Associate	0121F0333: Engagement Management - Project Management - Engagement Economics / Monitoring Activities.	1.50
1/11/2021	Ashley Kay Youngwolfe	Associate	0121F0334: Information Technology General Controls - Risk Assurance - Access Programs & Data - Review controls documentation and leave review notes.	0.70

Exhibit C

Name	Position	Description	Hours
Ashley Kay Youngwolfe	Associate	0121F0335: Information Technology General Controls - Risk Assurance - Computer Operations - Review controls documentation and leave review notes.	0.50
Collin McKay Short	Associate	0121F0336: Other Audit/Audit Related Activities - Core assurance - Journal Entries - Documentation of journal entry testing.	1.00
Collin McKay Short	Associate	0121F0337: Controls testing - Purchasing & Payables - Documentation of control testing.	2.00
Gabrielle Hooper	Associate	0121F0338: Controls testing - L2 Optional - Oil & Gas Reserves - Documentation of control testing.	3.20
Collin McKay Short	Associate	0121F0339: Substantive Audit Procedures - PP&E / Leases / Depreciation - Documentation of testing.	1.00
Gabrielle Hooper	Associate	0121F0340: Substantive Audit Procedures - Accrued & Other Current Liabilities - Capex Accrual.	1.80
Gabrielle Hooper	Associate	0121F0341: Substantive Audit Procedures - Payroll Accrual / Expense - Test headcount data.	1.30
William Brian Putnam	Associate	0121F0342: COE - Cash - Substantive Testing - Review selection support.	0.30
Thomas Jefferson Davies	Associate	0121F0343: Controls testing - Revenue & Receivables - Documentation of control testing.	4.00
John P McNamara	Partner	0121F0344: Lead Engagement Partner Time - Review and Supervision - Partner Time - Review and Supervision - Partner Time.	2.00
Adam Miller Wiley	Senior Associate	0121F0345: Controls testing - Revenue & Receivables - Review controls testing and leave review notes.	4.20
Ashley Kay Youngwolfe	Associate	0121F0346: Information Technology General Controls - Risk Assurance - Access Programs & Data - Documentation of testing.	3.20
	Ashley Kay Youngwolfe Collin McKay Short Collin McKay Short Gabrielle Hooper Collin McKay Short Gabrielle Hooper Gabrielle Hooper William Brian Putnam Thomas Jefferson Davies John P McNamara Adam Miller Wiley Ashley Kay	Ashley Kay Youngwolfe Collin McKay Short Associate Collin McKay Short Associate Gabrielle Hooper Associate Collin McKay Short Associate Collin McKay Short Associate Gabrielle Hooper Associate Gabrielle Hooper Associate William Brian Putnam Associate Thomas Jefferson Associate Thomas Jefferson Pavies John P McNamara Partner Adam Miller Wiley Senior Associate Ashley Kay Associate	Ashley Kay Youngwolfe Associate O121F0335: Information Technology General Controls - Risk Assurance - Computer Operations - Review controls documentation and leave review notes. Collin McKay Short Associate O121F0336: Other Audit/Audit Related Activities - Core assurance - Journal Entries - Documentation of journal entry testing. Collin McKay Short Associate O121F0337: Controls testing - Purchasing & Payables - Documentation of control testing. Gabrielle Hooper Associate O121F0338: Controls testing - L2 Optional - Oil & Gas Reserves - Documentation of control testing. Collin McKay Short Associate O121F0339: Substantive Audit Procedures - PP&E / Leases / Depreciation - Documentation of testing. Gabrielle Hooper Associate O121F0340: Substantive Audit Procedures - Accrued & Other Current Liabilities - Capex Accrual. Gabrielle Hooper Associate O121F0341: Substantive Audit Procedures - Payroll Accrual / Expense - Test headcount data. William Brian Putnam Associate O121F0342: COE - Cash - Substantive Testing - Review selection support. Thomas Jefferson Davies O121F0343: Controls testing - Revenue & Receivables - Documentation of control testing. John P McNamara Partner O121F0344: Lead Engagement Partner Time - Review and Supervision - Partner Time - Review and Supervision - Partner Time. Adam Miller Wiley Senior Associate O121F0345: Controls testing - Revenue & Receivables - Review controls testing and leave review notes. Ashley Kay Associate O121F0346: Information Technology General Controls - Risk Assurance

Exhibit C

Date	Name	Position	Description	Hours
1/11/2021	Samuel Tucker Laverde	Associate	0121F0347: Controls testing - Revenue & Receivables - Documentation of control testing.	4.10
1/11/2021	Kelsey Jo Ann Kitson	Associate	0121F0348: Controls testing - L2 Optional - Oil & Gas Reserves - Documentation of control testing.	3.90
1/11/2021	Tyler Scott Burgin	Senior Associate	0121F0349: Substantive Audit Procedures - PP&E / Leases / Depreciation - SE Impairment - Q1.	3.00
1/11/2021	Ryan Goga	Manager	0121F0350: Substantive Audit Procedures - PP&E / Leases / Depreciation - PP&E - Impairment / Triggering event.	3.10
1/11/2021	Ashley Kay Youngwolfe	Associate	0121F0351: Continue Information Technology General Controls - Risk Assurance - Access Programs & Data - Documentation of testing.	3.40
1/11/2021	Adam Miller Wiley	Senior Associate	0121F0352: Continue Controls testing - Revenue & Receivables - Review controls testing and leave review notes.	3.80
1/11/2021	Kelsey Jo Ann Kitson	Associate	0121F0353: Continue Controls testing - L2 Optional - Oil & Gas Reserves - Documentation of control testing.	4.10
1/11/2021	Ryan Goga	Manager	0121F0354: Continue Substantive Audit Procedures - PP&E / Leases / Depreciation - PP&E - Impairment / Triggering event.	2.90
1/11/2021	Samuel Tucker Laverde	Associate	0121F0355: Continue Controls testing - Revenue & Receivables - Documentation of control testing.	3.90
1/11/2021	Tyler Scott Burgin	Senior Associate	0121F0356: Continue Substantive Audit Procedures - PP&E / Leases / Depreciation - SE Impairment - Q1.	4.00
1/12/2021	Samuel Kent Sparks	Director	0121F0357: Meetings - Status / Debriefs - Client status meetings / PBC request updates.	1.00
1/12/2021	Samuel Kent Sparks	Director	0121F0358: Engagement Management - Project Management - Engagement Economics / Monitoring Activities.	2.00

Exhibit C

1/12/2021 Samuel Kent Sparks Director 0121F0359: Engagement Management - Project Management - Core au team and Risk Assurance Coordination/Communication. 1/12/2021 Samuel Kent Sparks Director 0121F0360: Controls testing - Property, Plant & Equipment - Review controls testing and leave review notes. 1/12/2021 Samuel Kent Sparks Director 0121F0361: Controls testing - Period-end Financial Reporting - Review controls testing and leave review notes. 1/12/2021 Samuel Kent Sparks Director 0121F0362: Controls testing - Entity-Level Controls - Review controls testing and leave review notes. 1/12/2021 Samuel Kent Sparks Director 0121F0363: Controls testing - Business Combinations - Review control testing and leave review notes. 1/12/2021 Jennifer Rosemarie Manager 0121F0364: Engagement Management - Project Management - Engagement Economics / Monitoring Activities. 1/12/2021 Ryan Goga Manager 0121F0365: Controls testing - Revenue & Receivables - Review control testing and leave review notes.	Hours
controls testing and leave review notes. 1/12/2021 Samuel Kent Sparks Director 0121F0361: Controls testing - Period-end Financial Reporting - Review controls testing and leave review notes. 1/12/2021 Samuel Kent Sparks Director 0121F0362: Controls testing - Entity-Level Controls - Review controls testing and leave review notes. 1/12/2021 Samuel Kent Sparks Director 0121F0363: Controls testing - Business Combinations - Review control testing and leave review notes. 1/12/2021 Jennifer Rosemarie Manager 0121F0364: Engagement Management - Project Management - Engagement Economics / Monitoring Activities. 1/12/2021 Ryan Goga Manager 0121F0365: Controls testing - Revenue & Receivables - Review controls testing - Revenue & Receivables - Revenue & Receivables - Review controls - Revenue &	it 1.00
controls testing and leave review notes. 1/12/2021 Samuel Kent Sparks Director 0121F0362: Controls testing - Entity-Level Controls - Review controls testing and leave review notes. 1/12/2021 Samuel Kent Sparks Director 0121F0363: Controls testing - Business Combinations - Review control testing and leave review notes. 1/12/2021 Jennifer Rosemarie Manager 0121F0364: Engagement Management - Project Management - Engagement Economics / Monitoring Activities. 1/12/2021 Ryan Goga Manager 0121F0365: Controls testing - Revenue & Receivables - Review controls - Revenue & Receivables - Revenue & Revenue & Rec	1.00
testing and leave review notes. 1/12/2021 Samuel Kent Sparks Director 0121F0363: Controls testing - Business Combinations - Review control testing and leave review notes. 1/12/2021 Jennifer Rosemarie Manager 0121F0364: Engagement Management - Project Management - Engagement Economics / Monitoring Activities. 1/12/2021 Ryan Goga Manager 0121F0365: Controls testing - Revenue & Receivables - Review controls	1.00
testing and leave review notes. 1/12/2021 Jennifer Rosemarie Yee O121F0364: Engagement Management - Project Management - Engagement Economics / Monitoring Activities. 1/12/2021 Ryan Goga Manager O121F0365: Controls testing - Revenue & Receivables - Review controls	1.00
Yee Engagement Economics / Monitoring Activities. 1/12/2021 Ryan Goga Manager 0121F0365: Controls testing - Revenue & Receivables - Review control	1.00
	2.00
	1.00
1/12/2021 Jennifer Rosemarie Manager 0121F0366: Substantive Audit Procedures - PP&E / Leases / Pee Depreciation - O&G - Classification of held-by-production leases.	2.00
1/12/2021 Jennifer Rosemarie Manager O121F0367: Substantive Audit Procedures - Capital & Equity - Review testing for other components of equity and leave review comments.	2.00
1/12/2021 Ryan Goga Manager 0121F0368: Substantive Audit Procedures - Derivatives & Hedges - Respond to review comments and update documentation.	1.00
1/12/2021 Cesar D Lopez Senior Associate 0121F0369: COE - Debt - Substantive Testing - Review debt roll forward	d. 0.30
1/12/2021 Hayden W Deberry Senior Associate 0121F0370: Meetings - Status / Debriefs - Client status meetings / PBC request updates.	0.50

Exhibit C

Date	Name	Position	Description	Hours
1/12/2021	Hayden W Deberry	Senior Associate	0121F0371: Completion and reporting - Completion Activities - Lawyers letters / Litigation, claims and assessments procedures.	0.50
1/12/2021	Hayden W Deberry	Senior Associate	0121F0372: Engagement Management - Project Management - Review and prioritize upcoming tasks based on PBCs submitted by client.	3.00
1/12/2021	Hayden W Deberry	Senior Associate	0121F0373: Other Audit/Audit Related Activities - Core assurance - Journal Entries - Client inquiry / follow-up.	2.30
1/12/2021	Hayden W Deberry	Senior Associate	0121F0374: Controls testing - Purchasing & Payables - Respond to manager review comments and update documentation.	0.80
1/12/2021	Hayden W Deberry	Senior Associate	0121F0375: Controls testing - Entity-Level Controls - Review controls testing and leave review notes.	0.50
1/12/2021	Gabrielle Hooper	Associate	0121F0376: Meetings - Status / Debriefs - Client status meetings / PBC request updates.	0.70
1/12/2021	Gabrielle Hooper	Associate	0121F0377: Substantive Audit Procedures - L2 Optional - Oil & Gas Reserves - Documentation of testing.	0.50
1/12/2021	Benjamin Scott Bahlmann	Senior Manager	0121F0378: Information Technology General Controls - Risk Assurance - Computer Operations - Review of internal audits work related to computer operations controls testing.	2.00
1/12/2021	Bailey Elizabeth Bellomy	Senior Associate	0121F0379: Meetings - Status / Debriefs - PwC only internal status meetings - B Bellomy, J Meyer (PwC) to discuss manager review comments.	0.50
1/12/2021	Bailey Elizabeth Bellomy	Senior Associate	0121F0380: Meetings - Status / Debriefs - Internal Audit meetings / coordination on UOO controls testing.	0.50
1/12/2021	Bailey Elizabeth Bellomy	Senior Associate	0121F0381: Information Technology General Controls - Risk Assurance - Access Programs & Data - Review controls testing and leave review notes.	2.50

Exhibit C

Date	Name	Position	Description	Hours
1/12/2021	Bailey Elizabeth Bellomy	Senior Associate	0121F0382: Information Technology General Controls - Risk Assurance - Computer Operations - Respond to manager review comments and update controls testing.	2.00
1/12/2021	Shelby Nicole Hackney	Associate	0121F0383: Meetings - Status / Debriefs - Internal Audit meetings / coordination on UOO controls testing.	0.50
1/12/2021	Jordan Matthew Meyer	Associate	0121F0384: Meetings - Status / Debriefs - PwC only internal status meetings - B Bellomy, J Meyer (PwC) to discuss manager review comments.	0.50
1/12/2021	Jordan Matthew Meyer	Associate	0121F0385: Engagement Management - Project Management - Update AuditBoard PBC requests.	0.50
1/12/2021	Shelby Nicole Hackney	Associate	0121F0386: Other Audit/Audit Related Activities - Risk Assurance - Key Reports - Compile screenshot support.	0.50
1/12/2021	Shelby Nicole Hackney	Associate	0121F0387: Other Audit/Audit Related Activities - Risk Assurance - Key Reports - Documentation of testing.	0.50
1/12/2021	Shelby Nicole Hackney	Associate	0121F0388: Information Technology General Controls - Risk Assurance - Program Changes - Review controls testing.	1.00
1/12/2021	Shelby Nicole Hackney	Associate	0121F0389: Information Technology General Controls - Risk Assurance - Program Changes - Review selection support.	0.50
1/12/2021	Shelby Nicole Hackney	Associate	0121F0390: Information Technology General Controls - Risk Assurance - Program Changes - Documentation of testing.	1.00
1/12/2021	Jordan Matthew Meyer	Associate	0121F0391: Information Technology General Controls - Risk Assurance - Program Changes - Sample selection.	0.50
1/12/2021	Jordan Matthew Meyer	Associate	0121F0392: Information Technology General Controls - Risk Assurance - Program Changes - Documentation of testing.	0.50

Exhibit C

Date	Name	Position	Description	Hours
1/12/2021	Shelby Nicole Hackney	Associate	0121F0393: Information Technology General Controls - Risk Assurance - Access Programs & Data - Documentation of testing.	2.00
1/12/2021	Shelby Nicole Hackney	Associate	0121F0394: Information Technology General Controls - Risk Assurance - Access Programs & Data - Respond to manager review notes and update.	2.00
1/12/2021	Jordan Matthew Meyer	Associate	0121F0395: Information Technology General Controls - Risk Assurance - Access Programs & Data - Documentation of testing.	1.50
1/12/2021	Jordan Matthew Meyer	Associate	0121F0396: Information Technology General Controls - Risk Assurance - Access Programs & Data - Review selection support.	0.50
1/12/2021	Shelby Nicole Hackney	Associate	0121F0397: Information Technology General Controls - Risk Assurance - Computer Operations - Review controls testing.	1.00
1/12/2021	Ashley Kay Youngwolfe	Associate	0121F0398: Information Technology General Controls - Risk Assurance - Access Programs & Data - Review controls documentation and leave review notes.	0.80
1/12/2021	Ashley Kay Youngwolfe	Associate	0121F0399: Information Technology General Controls - Risk Assurance - Computer Operations - Review controls documentation and leave review notes.	0.30
1/12/2021	Ashley Kay Youngwolfe	Associate	0121F0400: Information Technology General Controls - Risk Assurance - Computer Operations - Documentation of testing.	3.50
1/12/2021	Rachel Dawn Sierra	Associate	0121F0401: Quarters - Quarter 4 - Planning Activites.	1.80
1/12/2021	Collin McKay Short	Associate	0121F0402: Controls testing - Purchasing & Payables - Documentation of control testing.	1.00
1/12/2021	Kelsey Jo Ann Kitson	Associate	0121F0403: Substantive Audit Procedures - PP&E / Leases / Depreciation - Documentation of testing.	0.50
1/12/2021	Gabrielle Hooper	Associate	0121F0404: Substantive Audit Procedures - Revenue - Sample selection.	2.10

Exhibit C

Date	Name	Position	Description	Hours
1/12/2021	Collin McKay Short	Associate	0121F0405: Substantive Audit Procedures - Revenue - Marketing netback testing.	1.00
1/12/2021	Gabrielle Hooper	Associate	0121F0406: Substantive Audit Procedures - Other Operating Income / Expense - Documentation of testing.	1.80
1/12/2021	Kelsey Jo Ann Kitson	Associate	0121F0407: Substantive Audit Procedures - Derivatives & Hedges - Verify recognition of gains/losses.	2.00
1/12/2021	Kelsey Jo Ann Kitson	Associate	0121F0408: Substantive Audit Procedures - L2 Optional - Oil & Gas Reserves - Reserves estimate testing.	0.50
1/12/2021	Gabrielle Hooper	Associate	0121F0409: Substantive Audit Procedures - L2 Optional - Oil & Gas Reserves - Review selection support.	2.30
1/12/2021	William Brian Putnam	Associate	0121F0410: COE - Cash - Substantive Testing - Documentation of testing.	1.00
1/12/2021	Suilen Bik	Associate	0121F0411: Quarters - Quarter 4 - Planning Activities.	4.10
1/12/2021	Thomas Jefferson Davies	Associate	0121F0412: Substantive Audit Procedures - Accrued & Other Current Liabilities - Classification of operating expenses.	2.00
1/12/2021	John P McNamara	Partner	0121F0413: Lead Engagement Partner Time - Review and Supervision - Partner Time - Review and Supervision - Partner Time.	2.00
1/12/2021	Tyler Scott Burgin	Senior Associate	0121F0414: Substantive Audit Procedures - PP&E / Leases / Depreciation - Q2 and Q3 leasehold review, Q1 SE Impairment.	4.00
1/12/2021	Samuel Tucker Laverde	Associate	0121F0415: Controls testing - Revenue & Receivables - Documentation of control testing.	4.10
1/12/2021	Ashley Kay Youngwolfe	Associate	0121F0416: Information Technology General Controls - Risk Assurance - Access Programs & Data - Documentation of testing.	3.00

Exhibit C

Date	Name	Position	Description	Hours
1/12/2021	Ryan Goga	Manager	0121F0417: Substantive Audit Procedures - PP&E / Leases / Depreciation - PP&E - Impairment / Triggering event.	3.10
1/12/2021	Thomas Jefferson Davies	Associate	0121F0418: Controls testing - Property, Plant & Equipment - Documentation of control testing.	3.10
1/12/2021	Kelsey Jo Ann Kitson	Associate	0121F0419: Controls testing - L2 Optional - Oil & Gas Reserves - Documentation of control testing.	2.70
1/12/2021	Adam Miller Wiley	Senior Associate	0121F0420: Controls testing - Revenue & Receivables - Review controls testing and leave review notes.	2.60
1/12/2021	Adam Miller Wiley	Senior Associate	0121F0421: Substantive Audit Procedures - PP&E / Leases / Depreciation - O&G - Impairment assessment - Proved property.	2.60
1/12/2021	Collin McKay Short	Associate	0121F0422: Substantive Audit Procedures - PP&E / Leases / Depreciation - Documentation of testing.	2.60
1/12/2021	Ashley Kay Youngwolfe	Associate	0121F0423: Continue Information Technology General Controls - Risk Assurance - Access Programs & Data - Documentation of testing.	2.90
1/12/2021	Adam Miller Wiley	Senior Associate	0121F0424: Continue Controls testing - Revenue & Receivables - Review controls testing and leave review notes.	2.40
1/12/2021	Adam Miller Wiley	Senior Associate	0121F0425: Continue Substantive Audit Procedures - PP&E / Leases / Depreciation - O&G - Impairment assessment - Proved property.	2.40
1/12/2021	Collin McKay Short	Associate	0121F0426: Continue Substantive Audit Procedures - PP&E / Leases / Depreciation - Documentation of testing.	2.40
1/12/2021	Kelsey Jo Ann Kitson	Associate	0121F0427: Continue Controls testing - L2 Optional - Oil & Gas Reserves - Documentation of control testing.	2.80
1/12/2021	Ryan Goga	Manager	0121F0428: Continue Substantive Audit Procedures - PP&E / Leases / Depreciation - PP&E - Impairment / Triggering event.	2.90

Exhibit C

Date	Name	Position	Description	Hours
1/12/2021	Samuel Tucker Laverde	Associate	0121F0429: Continue Controls testing - Revenue & Receivables - Documentation of control testing.	3.90
1/12/2021	Thomas Jefferson Davies	Associate	0121F0430: Continue Controls testing - Property, Plant & Equipment - Documentation of control testing.	2.90
1/12/2021	Tyler Scott Burgin	Senior Associate	0121F0431: Continue Substantive Audit Procedures - PP&E / Leases / Depreciation - Q2 and Q3 leasehold review, Q1 SE Impairment.	4.00
1/12/2021	Tyler Scott Burgin	Senior Associate	0121F0432: Continue review of Substantive Audit Procedures - PP&E / Leases / Depreciation - Q2 and Q3 leasehold review, Q1 SE Impairment.	3.00
1/13/2021	Gregory D Fein	Partner	0121F0433: Meetings - Client status meetings / PBC request updates - State Regroup.	0.50
1/13/2021	Samuel Kent Sparks	Director	0121F0434: Meetings - Status / Debriefs - Client status meetings / PBC request updates.	1.00
1/13/2021	Samuel Kent Sparks	Director	0121F0435: Meetings - Status / Debriefs - PwC only internal status meetings - K Sparks, J Yee, G Hooper (all PwC) - discuss partner review comments and update documentation.	1.00
1/13/2021	Samuel Kent Sparks	Director	0121F0436: Engagement Management - Project Management - Core audit team and Risk Assurance Coordination/Communication.	1.00
1/13/2021	Samuel Kent Sparks	Director	0121F0437: Engagement Management - Project Management - Engagement Economics / Monitoring Activities.	2.00
1/13/2021	Samuel Kent Sparks	Director	0121F0438: Controls testing - Period-end Financial Reporting - Review controls testing and leave review notes.	1.00
1/13/2021	Samuel Kent Sparks	Director	0121F0439: Controls testing - Business Combinations - Review controls testing and leave review notes.	1.00

Exhibit C

Date	Name	Position	Description	Hours
1/13/2021	Samuel Kent Sparks	Director	0121F0440: Substantive Audit Procedures - Capital & Equity - Review substantive testing and draft review comments.	1.00
1/13/2021	Reed Edwin Haines	Manager	0121F0441: Meetings - PwC only internal status meetings - Internal regroup on state CODI issues.	0.50
1/13/2021	Jennifer Rosemarie Yee	Manager	0121F0442: Meetings - Status / Debriefs - PwC only internal status meetings - K Sparks, J Yee, G Hooper (all PwC) - discuss partner review comments and update documentation.	1.00
1/13/2021	Ryan Goga	Manager	0121F0443: Engagement Management - Project Management - Review/update EMT for budgeted resources.	1.00
1/13/2021	Ryan Goga	Manager	0121F0444: Controls testing - Revenue & Receivables - Review controls testing and leave review notes.	4.00
1/13/2021	Ryan Goga	Manager	0121F0445: Substantive Audit Procedures - PP&E / Leases / Depreciation - Review O&G substantive testing and leave review notes.	2.00
1/13/2021	Jennifer Rosemarie Yee	Manager	0121F0446: Substantive Audit Procedures - PP&E / Leases / Depreciation - O&G - Classification of unevaluated lease information.	3.00
1/13/2021	Jennifer Rosemarie Yee	Manager	0121F0447: Substantive Audit Procedures - PP&E / Leases / Depreciation - O&G - Impairment accounting policy.	3.00
1/13/2021	Cesar D Lopez	Senior Associate	0121F0448: COE - Debt - Substantive Testing - Review notes payable listing.	2.20
1/13/2021	Hayden W Deberry	Senior Associate	0121F0449: Engagement Management - Project Management - Update AuditBoard PBC requests.	0.50
1/13/2021	Hayden W Deberry	Senior Associate	0121F0450: Other Audit/Audit Related Activities - Core assurance - Journal Entries - Respond to manager review comments and update testing documentation.	2.50

Exhibit C

Date	Name	Position	Description	Hours
1/13/2021	Tyler Scott Burgin	Senior Associate	0121F0451: Controls testing - Property, Plant & Equipment - RES.DIF_1.0 and 5.0, RES.TAX_1.0.	3.00
1/13/2021	Hayden W Deberry	Senior Associate	0121F0452: Controls testing - Entity-Level Controls - Respond to manager review comments and update documentation.	1.80
1/13/2021	Hayden W Deberry	Senior Associate	0121F0453: Substantive Audit Procedures - Accrued & Other Current Liabilities - Scoping of accrued liabilities testing.	2.40
1/13/2021	Hayden W Deberry	Senior Associate	0121F0454: Substantive Audit Procedures - Accrued & Other Current Liabilities - Classification of operating expenses.	0.80
1/13/2021	Hayden W Deberry	Senior Associate	0121F0455: Substantive Audit Procedures - Payroll Accrual / Expense - Test headcount data.	1.30
1/13/2021	Gabrielle Hooper	Associate	0121F0456: Meetings - Status / Debriefs - Client status meetings / PBC request updates.	0.50
1/13/2021	Gabrielle Hooper	Associate	0121F0457: Meetings - Status / Debriefs - PwC only internal status meetings - K Sparks, J Yee, G Hooper (all PwC) - discuss partner review comments and update documentation.	1.00
1/13/2021	Bryan Christopher Coleman	Partner	0121F0458: Other Audit/Audit Related Activities - Risk Assurance - Key Reports - Review key reports testing documentation and draft review comments.	1.00
1/13/2021	Benjamin Scott Bahlmann	Senior Manager	0121F0459: Information Technology General Controls - Risk Assurance - Program Changes - Review of testing associated with program change controls.	2.00
1/13/2021	Bailey Elizabeth Bellomy	Senior Associate	0121F0460: Meetings - Status / Debriefs - PwC only internal status meetings - B Bellomy, S Hackney, J Meyer, A Youngwolfe (all PwC) - touch base on status of testing & adjust workflow.	0.50

Exhibit C

Date	Name	Position	Description	Hours
1/13/2021	Bailey Elizabeth Bellomy	Senior Associate	0121F0461: Information Technology General Controls - Risk Assurance - Access Programs & Data - Respond to manager review comments and update controls testing.	3.00
1/13/2021	Bailey Elizabeth Bellomy	Senior Associate	0121F0462: Information Technology General Controls - Risk Assurance - Computer Operations - Review controls testing and leave review notes.	2.50
1/13/2021	Shelby Nicole Hackney	Associate	0121F0463: Meetings - Status / Debriefs - PwC only internal status meetings - B Bellomy, S Hackney, J Meyer, A Youngwolfe (all PwC) - touch base on status of testing & adjust workflow.	0.50
1/13/2021	Jordan Matthew Meyer	Associate	0121F0464: Meetings - Status / Debriefs - PwC only internal status meetings - B Bellomy, S Hackney, J Meyer, A Youngwolfe (all PwC) - touch base on status of testing & adjust workflow.	0.50
1/13/2021	Shelby Nicole Hackney	Associate	0121F0465: Engagement Management - Project Management - Engagement Economics / Monitoring Activities.	0.50
1/13/2021	Gabrielle Hooper	Associate	0121F0466: Other Audit/Audit Related Activities - Financial Reporting & Consolidation - Review consistency of other information with financial statements.	1.20
1/13/2021	Collin McKay Short	Associate	0121F0467: Other Audit/Audit Related Activities - Core assurance - Journal Entries - Set up HALO for year-end journal entry testing.	1.00
1/13/2021	Shelby Nicole Hackney	Associate	0121F0468: Information Technology General Controls - Risk Assurance - Program Changes - Documentation of testing.	0.50
1/13/2021	Shelby Nicole Hackney	Associate	0121F0469: Information Technology General Controls - Risk Assurance - Program Changes - Review selection support.	1.00
1/13/2021	Shelby Nicole Hackney	Associate	0121F0470: Information Technology General Controls - Risk Assurance - Program Changes - Sample selection.	0.50

Exhibit C

Date	Name	Position	Description	Hours
1/13/2021	Jordan Matthew Meyer	Associate	0121F0471: Information Technology General Controls - Risk Assurance - Program Changes - Documentation of testing.	0.50
1/13/2021	Shelby Nicole Hackney	Associate	0121F0472: Information Technology General Controls - Risk Assurance - Access Programs & Data - Review selection support.	1.00
1/13/2021	Shelby Nicole Hackney	Associate	0121F0473: Information Technology General Controls - Risk Assurance - Access Programs & Data - Documentation of testing.	1.00
1/13/2021	Shelby Nicole Hackney	Associate	0121F0474: Information Technology General Controls - Risk Assurance - Access Programs & Data - Respond to manager review notes and update.	2.00
1/13/2021	Jordan Matthew Meyer	Associate	0121F0475: Information Technology General Controls - Risk Assurance - Access Programs & Data - Review selection support.	2.00
1/13/2021	Jordan Matthew Meyer	Associate	0121F0476: Information Technology General Controls - Risk Assurance - Access Programs & Data - Respond to manager comments and update testing.	0.50
1/13/2021	Shelby Nicole Hackney	Associate	0121F0477: Information Technology General Controls - Risk Assurance - Computer Operations - Documentation of testing.	1.00
1/13/2021	Shelby Nicole Hackney	Associate	0121F0478: Information Technology General Controls - Risk Assurance - Computer Operations - Review controls testing.	1.00
1/13/2021	Ashley Kay Youngwolfe	Associate	0121F0479: Meetings - Status / Debriefs - PwC only internal status meetings - B Bellomy, S Hackney, J Meyer, A Youngwolfe (all PwC) - touch base on status of testing & adjust workflow.	0.50
1/13/2021	Ashley Kay Youngwolfe	Associate	0121F0480: Information Technology General Controls - Risk Assurance - Access Programs & Data - Documentation of testing.	3.90

Exhibit C

Date	Name	Position	Description	Hours
1/13/2021	Ashley Kay Youngwolfe	Associate	0121F0481: Information Technology General Controls - Risk Assurance - Access Programs & Data - Review controls documentation and leave review notes.	0.50
1/13/2021	Ashley Kay Youngwolfe	Associate	0121F0482: Information Technology General Controls - Risk Assurance - Computer Operations - Review controls documentation and leave review notes.	0.40
1/13/2021	Collin McKay Short	Associate	0121F0483: Controls testing - Purchasing & Payables - Documentation of control testing.	0.50
1/13/2021	Gabrielle Hooper	Associate	0121F0484: Controls testing - Entity-Level Controls - Documentation of control testing.	2.10
1/13/2021	Collin McKay Short	Associate	0121F0485: Substantive Audit Procedures - PP&E / Leases / Depreciation - Documentation of testing.	2.00
1/13/2021	Gabrielle Hooper	Associate	0121F0486: Substantive Audit Procedures - Revenue - Documentation of testing - test revenue transactions.	3.30
1/13/2021	Collin McKay Short	Associate	0121F0487: Substantive Audit Procedures - Capital & Equity - Dividends paid and payable.	1.00
1/13/2021	Kelsey Jo Ann Kitson	Associate	0121F0488: Substantive Audit Procedures - L2 Optional - Oil & Gas Reserves - Client inquiry / follow-up.	1.00
1/13/2021	William Brian Putnam	Associate	0121F0489: COE - Cash - Substantive Testing - Review selection support.	0.10
1/13/2021	Thomas Jefferson Davies	Associate	0121F0490: Controls testing - Revenue & Receivables - Documentation of control testing.	4.00
1/13/2021	Thomas Jefferson Davies	Associate	0121F0491: Substantive Audit Procedures - Accrued & Other Current Liabilities - Classification of operating expenses.	2.00

Exhibit C

Date	Name	Position	Description	Hours
1/13/2021	John P McNamara	Partner	0121F0492: Lead Engagement Partner Time - Review and Supervision - Partner Time - Review and Supervision - Partner Time.	2.00
1/13/2021	Adam Miller Wiley	Senior Associate	0121F0493: Controls testing - Revenue & Receivables - Review of management review control testing and document review comments.	3.00
1/13/2021	Tyler Scott Burgin	Senior Associate	0121F0494: Substantive Audit Procedures - PP&E / Leases / Depreciation - Q1 Shrink/Yield, Q2/Q3 Leasehold, Q1 SE Impairment.	4.00
1/13/2021	Ashley Kay Youngwolfe	Associate	0121F0495: Information Technology General Controls - Risk Assurance - Computer Operations - Documentation of testing.	2.70
1/13/2021	Jordan Matthew Meyer	Associate	0121F0496: Information Technology General Controls - Risk Assurance - Access Programs & Data - Documentation of testing.	2.50
1/13/2021	Samuel Tucker Laverde	Associate	0121F0497: Controls testing - Revenue & Receivables - Documentation of control testing.	3.20
1/13/2021	Kelsey Jo Ann Kitson	Associate	0121F0498: Substantive Audit Procedures - Derivatives & Hedges - Verify recognition of gains/losses.	2.70
1/13/2021	Ashley Kay Youngwolfe	Associate	0121F0499: Continue Information Technology General Controls - Risk Assurance - Computer Operations - Documentation of testing.	2.70
1/13/2021	Jordan Matthew Meyer	Associate	0121F0500: Continue Information Technology General Controls - Risk Assurance - Access Programs & Data - Documentation of testing.	2.50
1/13/2021	Adam Miller Wiley	Senior Associate	0121F0501: Continue Controls testing - Revenue & Receivables - Review of management review control testing and document review comments.	3.50
1/13/2021	Kelsey Jo Ann Kitson	Associate	0121F0502: Continue Substantive Audit Procedures - Derivatives & Hedges - Verify recognition of gains/losses.	2.80
1/13/2021	Samuel Tucker Laverde	Associate	0121F0503: Continue Controls testing - Revenue & Receivables - Documentation of control testing.	3.30

Exhibit C

Date	Name	Position	Description	Hours
1/13/2021	Tyler Scott Burgin	Senior Associate	0121F0504: Continue Substantive Audit Procedures - PP&E / Leases / Depreciation - Q1 Shrink/Yield, Q2/Q3 Leasehold, Q1 SE Impairment.	4.00
1/13/2021	Adam Miller Wiley	Senior Associate	0121F0505: Controls testing related Revenue & Receivables - Review of management review control testing and document review comments.	3.50
1/14/2021	Samuel Kent Sparks	Director	0121F0506: Meetings - Status / Debriefs - PwC only internal status meetings - K Sparks, J Yee (PwC) to discuss CAM reporting documentation.	1.00
1/14/2021	Samuel Kent Sparks	Director	0121F0507: Meetings - Status / Debriefs - Client status meetings / PBC request updates.	1.00
1/14/2021	Samuel Kent Sparks	Director	0121F0508: Engagement Management - Project Management - Draft agenda for status meeting with client.	1.00
1/14/2021	Samuel Kent Sparks	Director	0121F0509: Engagement Management - Project Management - Core audit team and Risk Assurance Coordination/Communication.	1.00
1/14/2021	Samuel Kent Sparks	Director	0121F0510: Engagement Management - Project Management - Engagement Economics / Monitoring Activities.	1.00
1/14/2021	Samuel Kent Sparks	Director	0121F0511: Controls testing - Period-end Financial Reporting - Review controls testing and leave review notes.	1.00
1/14/2021	Samuel Kent Sparks	Director	0121F0512: Controls testing - Business Combinations - Review controls testing and leave review notes.	1.00
1/14/2021	Samuel Kent Sparks	Director	0121F0513: Substantive Audit Procedures - Capital & Equity - Review substantive testing and draft review comments.	1.00
1/14/2021	Reed Edwin Haines	Manager	0121F0514: Meetings - Client status meetings / PBC request updates - Coordination of internal stakeholders.	1.00

Exhibit C

Date	Name	Position	Description	Hours
1/14/2021	Jennifer Rosemarie Yee	Manager	0121F0515: Meetings - Status / Debriefs - PwC only internal status meetings - K Sparks, J Yee (PwC) to discuss CAM reporting documentation.	1.00
1/14/2021	Ryan Goga	Manager	0121F0516: Substantive Audit Procedures - PP&E / Leases / Depreciation - Review O&G substantive testing and leave review notes.	1.00
1/14/2021	Jennifer Rosemarie Yee	Manager	0121F0517: Substantive Audit Procedures - PP&E / Leases / Depreciation - O&G - Classification of held-by-production leases.	3.00
1/14/2021	Jennifer Rosemarie Yee	Manager	0121F0518: Substantive Audit Procedures - PP&E / Leases / Depreciation - O&G - Classification of unevaluated lease information.	2.00
1/14/2021	Jennifer Rosemarie Yee	Manager	0121F0519: Substantive Audit Procedures - Capital & Equity - Share based grants and exercises.	1.00
1/14/2021	Ryan Goga	Manager	0121F0520: Substantive Audit Procedures - Derivatives & Hedges - Review scoping for derivative confirmations.	0.50
1/14/2021	Jennifer Rosemarie Yee	Manager	0121F0521: Substantive Audit Procedures - Payroll Accrual / Expense - Test headcount data.	1.00
1/14/2021	Hayden W Deberry	Senior Associate	0121F0522: Meetings - Status / Debriefs - Client status meetings / PBC request updates.	0.50
1/14/2021	Hayden W Deberry	Senior Associate	0121F0523: Meetings - Status / Debriefs - PwC only internal status meetings - H Deberry, K Kitson, S Laverde, G Hooper, C Short (all PwC) - to discuss progress on testing.	0.50
1/14/2021	Hayden W Deberry	Senior Associate	0121F0524: Completion and reporting - Completion Activities - Assess the work of internal audit.	0.70
1/14/2021	Hayden W Deberry	Senior Associate	0121F0525: Engagement Management - Project Management - Set up dashboard to monitor progress of Internal Audit controls testing.	2.00

Exhibit C

Date	Name	Position	Description	Hours
1/14/2021	Hayden W Deberry	Senior Associate	0121F0526: Other Audit/Audit Related Activities - Core assurance - Journal Entries - Respond to manager review comments and update testing documentation.	0.50
1/14/2021	Hayden W Deberry	Senior Associate	0121F0527: Controls testing - Purchasing & Payables - Respond to manager review comments and update documentation.	2.00
1/14/2021	Hayden W Deberry	Senior Associate	0121F0528: Substantive Audit Procedures - Capital & Equity - Dividends paid and payable.	1.80
1/14/2021	Hayden W Deberry	Senior Associate	0121F0529: Substantive Audit Procedures - Accrued & Other Current Liabilities - Scoping of accrued liabilities testing.	2.30
1/14/2021	Kelsey Jo Ann Kitson	Associate	0121F0530: Meetings - Status / Debriefs - PwC only internal status meetings - H Deberry, K Kitson, S Laverde, G Hooper, C Short (all PwC) - to discuss progress on testing.	0.50
1/14/2021	Samuel Tucker Laverde	Associate	0121F0531: Meetings - Status / Debriefs - PwC only internal status meetings - H Deberry, K Kitson, S Laverde, G Hooper, C Short (all PwC) - to discuss progress on testing.	0.50
1/14/2021	Gabrielle Hooper	Associate	0121F0532: Meetings - Status / Debriefs - PwC only internal status meetings - H Deberry, K Kitson, S Laverde, G Hooper, C Short (all PwC) - to discuss progress on testing.	0.50
1/14/2021	Collin McKay Short	Associate	0121F0533: Meetings - Status / Debriefs - PwC only internal status meetings - H Deberry, K Kitson, S Laverde, G Hooper, C Short (all PwC) - to discuss progress on testing.	0.50
1/14/2021	Collin McKay Short	Associate	0121F0534: Completion and reporting - Completion Activities - Assess the work of internal audit.	4.00
1/14/2021	Benjamin Scott Bahlmann	Senior Manager	0121F0535: Other Audit/Audit Related Activities - Risk Assurance - Key Reports - Review of internal audits key reports testing.	2.00
	24		reports recording.	

Exhibit C

Date	Name	Position	Description	Hours
1/14/2021	Bailey Elizabeth Bellomy	Senior Associate	0121F0536: Meetings - Status / Debriefs - Internal Audit meetings / coordination on UOO controls testing.	1.00
1/14/2021	Bailey Elizabeth Bellomy	Senior Associate	0121F0537: Meetings - Status / Debriefs - PwC only internal status meetings - B Bellomy, S Hackney, J Meyer, A Youngwolfe (all PwC) - discuss SAP key report testing questions.	0.50
1/14/2021	Bailey Elizabeth Bellomy	Senior Associate	0121F0538: Information Technology General Controls - Risk Assurance - Access Programs & Data - Client inquiry / follow-up.	2.00
1/14/2021	Shelby Nicole Hackney	Associate	0121F0539: Meetings - Status / Debriefs - PwC only internal status meetings - B Bellomy, S Hackney, J Meyer, A Youngwolfe (all PwC) - discuss SAP key report testing questions.	0.50
1/14/2021	Jordan Matthew Meyer	Associate	0121F0540: Meetings - Status / Debriefs - PwC only internal status meetings - B Bellomy, S Hackney, J Meyer, A Youngwolfe (all PwC) - discuss SAP key report testing questions.	0.50
1/14/2021	Shelby Nicole Hackney	Associate	0121F0541: Engagement Management - Project Management - Engagement Economics / Monitoring Activities.	0.50
1/14/2021	Shelby Nicole Hackney	Associate	0121F0542: Other Audit/Audit Related Activities - Risk Assurance - Automated Controls - Documentation of testing.	1.00
1/14/2021	Shelby Nicole Hackney	Associate	0121F0543: Information Technology General Controls - Risk Assurance - Program Changes - Client inquiry / follow-up.	0.50
1/14/2021	Shelby Nicole Hackney	Associate	0121F0544: Information Technology General Controls - Risk Assurance - Program Changes - Sample selection.	0.50
1/14/2021	Shelby Nicole Hackney	Associate	0121F0545: Information Technology General Controls - Risk Assurance - Access Programs & Data - Documentation of testing.	2.00

Exhibit C

Date	Name	Position	Description	Hours
1/14/2021	Shelby Nicole Hackney	Associate	0121F0546: Information Technology General Controls - Risk Assurance - Access Programs & Data - Respond to manager review notes and update.	0.50
1/14/2021	Jordan Matthew Meyer	Associate	0121F0547: Information Technology General Controls - Risk Assurance - Access Programs & Data - Documentation of testing.	2.00
1/14/2021	Shelby Nicole Hackney	Associate	0121F0548: Information Technology General Controls - Risk Assurance - Computer Operations - Review controls testing.	0.50
1/14/2021	Shelby Nicole Hackney	Associate	0121F0549: Information Technology General Controls - Risk Assurance - Computer Operations - Client inquiry / follow-up.	1.00
1/14/2021	Shelby Nicole Hackney	Associate	0121F0550: Information Technology General Controls - Risk Assurance - Computer Operations - Documentation of testing.	0.50
1/14/2021	Ashley Kay Youngwolfe	Associate	0121F0551: Meetings - Status / Debriefs - PwC only internal status meetings - B Bellomy, S Hackney, J Meyer, A Youngwolfe (all PwC) - discuss SAP key report testing questions.	0.50
1/14/2021	Ashley Kay Youngwolfe	Associate	0121F0552: Information Technology General Controls - Risk Assurance - Access Programs & Data - Documentation of testing.	4.50
1/14/2021	Ashley Kay Youngwolfe	Associate	0121F0553: Information Technology General Controls - Risk Assurance - Access Programs & Data - Address manager review comments and update testing documentation.	0.50
1/14/2021	Ashley Kay Youngwolfe	Associate	0121F0554: Information Technology General Controls - Risk Assurance - Computer Operations - Documentation of testing.	4.30
1/14/2021	Collin McKay Short	Associate	0121F0555: Substantive Audit Procedures - Capital & Equity - Dividends paid and payable.	1.00
1/14/2021	Collin McKay Short	Associate	0121F0556: Substantive Audit Procedures - Capital & Equity - Conversion of securities.	1.00

Exhibit C

Date	Name	Position	Description	Hours
1/14/2021	Kelsey Jo Ann Kitson	Associate	0121F0557: Substantive Audit Procedures - Derivatives & Hedges - Verify recognition of gains/losses.	1.00
1/14/2021	Kelsey Jo Ann Kitson	Associate	0121F0558: Substantive Audit Procedures - Derivatives & Hedges - Test inputs into Mobius.	2.00
1/14/2021	Kelsey Jo Ann Kitson	Associate	0121F0559: Substantive Audit Procedures - Derivatives & Hedges - Review selection support.	2.00
1/14/2021	Gabrielle Hooper	Associate	0121F0560: Substantive Audit Procedures - Accrued & Other Current Liabilities - Capex Accrual.	1.80
1/14/2021	Kelsey Jo Ann Kitson	Associate	0121F0561: Substantive Audit Procedures - L2 Optional - Oil & Gas Reserves - Assess reserves inputs.	3.00
1/14/2021	John P McNamara	Partner	0121F0562: Lead Engagement Partner Time - Review and Supervision - Partner Time - Review and Supervision - Partner Time.	1.50
1/14/2021	John Wynn Phillips	Partner	0121F0563: Quality Review Partner (QRP) Time - Quality Review Partner (QRP) Time - Review and Supervision - QRP Time.	1.00
1/14/2021	Adam Miller Wiley	Senior Associate	0121F0564: Controls testing - Revenue & Receivables - Review of management review control testing and document review comments.	3.00
1/14/2021	Tyler Scott Burgin	Senior Associate	0121F0565: Substantive Audit Procedures - PP&E / Leases / Depreciation - Q3 lease information, Q2/Q3 leasehold, Q1 impairment.	3.00
1/14/2021	Samuel Tucker Laverde	Associate	0121F0566: Controls testing - Revenue & Receivables - Documentation of control testing.	4.10
1/14/2021	Christi Brewer	Manager	0121F0567: Engagement Management - Project Management - Supervision and review.	3.00
1/14/2021	Ryan Goga	Manager	0121F0568: Controls testing - Revenue & Receivables - Review management review controls testing and draft review notes.	3.10

Exhibit C

Date	Name	Position	Description	Hours
1/14/2021	Thomas Jefferson Davies	Associate	0121F0569: Substantive Audit Procedures - Accounts Payable - Documentation of control testing.	3.10
1/14/2021	Gabrielle Hooper	Associate	0121F0570: Substantive Audit Procedures - Revenue - Documentation of testing - test revenue transactions.	2.80
1/14/2021	Cesar D Lopez	Senior Associate	0121F0571: COE - Debt - Substantive Testing - Review testing of notes payable activity.	2.60
1/14/2021	Christi Brewer	Manager	0121F0572: Continue review of Engagement Management - Project Management - Supervision.	3.50
1/14/2021	Christi Brewer	Manager	0121F0573: Continue Engagement Management - Project Management - Supervision and review.	3.50
1/14/2021	Adam Miller Wiley	Senior Associate	0121F0574: Continue Controls testing - Revenue & Receivables - Review of management review control testing and document review comments.	3.50
1/14/2021	Cesar D Lopez	Senior Associate	0121F0575: Continue COE - Debt - Substantive Testing - USP00240797 - Review testing of notes payable activity.	2.40
1/14/2021	Gabrielle Hooper	Associate	0121F0576: Continue Substantive Audit Procedures - Revenue - Documentation of testing - test revenue transactions.	2.80
1/14/2021	Ryan Goga	Manager	0121F0577: Continue Controls testing - Revenue & Receivables - Review management review controls testing and draft review notes.	2.90
1/14/2021	Samuel Tucker Laverde	Associate	0121F0578: Continue Controls testing - Revenue & Receivables - Documentation of control testing.	3.90
1/14/2021	Thomas Jefferson Davies	Associate	0121F0579: Continue Controls testing - Property, Plant & Equipment - Documentation of control testing.	2.90
1/14/2021	Tyler Scott Burgin	Senior Associate	0121F0580: Continue Substantive Audit Procedures - PP&E / Leases / Depreciation - Q3 lease information, Q2/Q3 leasehold, Q1 impairment.	3.00

Exhibit C

Date	Name	Position	Description	Hours
1/14/2021	Tyler Scott Burgin	Senior Associate	0121F0581: Continue review of Substantive Audit Procedures - PP&E / Leases / Depreciation - Q3 lease information, Q2/Q3 leasehold, Q1 impairment.	3.00
1/14/2021	Adam Miller Wiley	Senior Associate	0121F0582: Controls testing of Revenue & Receivables - Review of management review control testing and document review comments.	3.50
1/15/2021	Gregory D Fein	Partner	0121F0583: Substantive Audit Procedures - State and local taxes - IC Project - SALT.	0.50
1/15/2021	James H Prettyman	Partner	0121F0584: Meetings - Client status meetings / PBC request updates - Chesapeake - conf call follow-up.	1.00
1/15/2021	Samuel Kent Sparks	Director	0121F0585: Meetings - Status / Debriefs - Client status meetings / PBC request updates.	1.00
1/15/2021	Samuel Kent Sparks	Director	0121F0586: Meetings - Status / Debriefs - PwC only internal status meetings - K Sparks, J Yee, A Wiley (all PwC) - discuss bankruptcy considerations to include in documentation for year-end testing.	1.00
1/15/2021	Samuel Kent Sparks	Director	0121F0587: Engagement Management - Project Management - Engagement Economics / Monitoring Activities.	2.00
1/15/2021	Samuel Kent Sparks	Director	0121F0588: Engagement Management - Project Management - Core audit team and Risk Assurance Coordination/Communication.	1.00
1/15/2021	Samuel Kent Sparks	Director	0121F0589: Controls testing - Period-end Financial Reporting - Review controls testing and leave review notes.	1.00
1/15/2021	Samuel Kent Sparks	Director	0121F0590: Controls testing - Business Combinations - Review controls testing and leave review notes.	1.00
1/15/2021	Samuel Kent Sparks	Director	0121F0591: Substantive Audit Procedures - Capital & Equity - Review substantive testing and draft review comments.	1.00

Exhibit C

Date	Name	Position	Description	Hours
1/15/2021	Hochol Edmond Lim	Senior Manager	0121F0592: COE - Cash - Substantive Testing - Review cash substantive testing and leave review comments.	1.00
1/15/2021	Reed Edwin Haines	Manager	0121F0593: Meetings - Client status meetings / PBC request updates - Client call with CHK to discuss state CODI concerns.	0.70
1/15/2021	Jennifer Rosemarie Yee	Manager	0121F0594: Meetings - Status / Debriefs - PwC only internal status meetings - K Sparks, J Yee, A Wiley (all PwC) - discuss bankruptcy considerations to include in documentation for year-end testing.	1.00
1/15/2021	Jennifer Rosemarie Yee	Manager	0121F0595: Engagement Management - Project Management - Engagement Economics / Monitoring Activities.	2.00
1/15/2021	Ryan Goga	Manager	0121F0596: Controls testing - Revenue & Receivables - Review management review controls testing and draft review notes.	3.00
1/15/2021	Ryan Goga	Manager	0121F0597: Substantive Audit Procedures - PP&E / Leases / Depreciation - Review O&G substantive testing and leave review notes.	3.00
1/15/2021	Ryan Goga	Manager	0121F0598: Substantive Audit Procedures - Revenue - Review revenue strategy approach memo.	2.00
1/15/2021	Jennifer Rosemarie Yee	Manager	0121F0599: Substantive Audit Procedures - Capital & Equity - Dividends paid and payable.	2.00
1/15/2021	Cesar D Lopez	Senior Associate	0121F0600: COE - Debt - Substantive Testing - Review debt roll forward.	1.00
1/15/2021	Hayden W Deberry	Senior Associate	0121F0601: Completion and reporting - Completion Activities - Assess the work of internal audit.	2.00
1/15/2021	Hayden W Deberry	Senior Associate	0121F0602: Engagement Management - Project Management - Update AuditBoard PBC requests.	0.50
1/15/2021	Hayden W Deberry	Senior Associate	0121F0603: Engagement Management - Project Management - Core audit team and Risk Assurance Coordination/Communication.	0.50

Exhibit C

Date	Name	Position	Description	Hours
1/15/2021	Adam Miller Wiley	Senior Associate	0121F0604: Meetings - Status / Debriefs - Client status meetings / PBC request updates.	4.00
1/15/2021	Adam Miller Wiley	Senior Associate	0121F0605: Meetings - Status / Debriefs - PwC only internal status meetings - K Sparks, J Yee, A Wiley (all PwC) - discuss bankruptcy considerations to include in documentation for year-end testing.	1.00
1/15/2021	Hayden W Deberry	Senior Associate	0121F0606: Substantive Audit Procedures - Accrued & Other Current Liabilities - Make selections and post to AuditBoard.	1.50
1/15/2021	Benjamin Scott Bahlmann	Senior Manager	0121F0607: Completion and reporting - SUM/SAD/CDWs - Review mangement audit responses for IT SAD/CDWs.	2.00
1/15/2021	Bailey Elizabeth Bellomy	Senior Associate	0121F0608: Other Audit/Audit Related Activities - Risk Assurance - Key Reports - Documentation of testing.	1.00
1/15/2021	Bailey Elizabeth Bellomy	Senior Associate	0121F0609: Information Technology General Controls - Risk Assurance - Access Programs & Data - Review controls testing and leave review notes.	3.00
1/15/2021	Bailey Elizabeth Bellomy	Senior Associate	0121F0610: Information Technology General Controls - Risk Assurance - Computer Operations - Respond to manager review comments and update controls testing.	1.00
1/15/2021	Shelby Nicole Hackney	Associate	0121F0611: Other Audit/Audit Related Activities - Risk Assurance - Key Reports - Documentation of testing.	2.00
1/15/2021	Shelby Nicole Hackney	Associate	0121F0612: Other Audit/Audit Related Activities - Risk Assurance - Key Reports - Address manager review comments and update testing.	1.00
1/15/2021	Jordan Matthew Meyer	Associate	0121F0613: Other Audit/Audit Related Activities - Risk Assurance - Key Reports - Review key reports testing and leave review notes.	1.00
1/15/2021	Shelby Nicole Hackney	Associate	0121F0614: Other Audit/Audit Related Activities - Risk Assurance - Automated Controls - Respond to manager review notes and update.	1.00

Exhibit C

Date	Name	Position	Description	Hours
1/15/2021	Jordan Matthew Meyer	Associate	0121F0615: Information Technology General Controls - Risk Assurance - Program Changes - Respond to manager comments and update testing.	1.00
1/15/2021	Jordan Matthew Meyer	Associate	0121F0616: Information Technology General Controls - Risk Assurance - Program Changes - Documentation of testing.	1.00
1/15/2021	Shelby Nicole Hackney	Associate	0121F0617: Information Technology General Controls - Risk Assurance - Access Programs & Data - Respond to manager review notes and update.	1.00
1/15/2021	Shelby Nicole Hackney	Associate	0121F0618: Information Technology General Controls - Risk Assurance - Access Programs & Data - Documentation of testing.	2.00
1/15/2021	Jordan Matthew Meyer	Associate	0121F0619: Information Technology General Controls - Risk Assurance - Access Programs & Data - Documentation of testing.	3.00
1/15/2021	Jordan Matthew Meyer	Associate	0121F0620: Information Technology General Controls - Risk Assurance - Access Programs & Data - Review interim controls testing documentation.	1.00
1/15/2021	Jordan Matthew Meyer	Associate	0121F0621: Information Technology General Controls - Risk Assurance - Access Programs & Data - Client inquiry / follow-up.	0.50
1/15/2021	Shelby Nicole Hackney	Associate	0121F0622: Information Technology General Controls - Risk Assurance - Computer Operations - Client inquiry / follow-up.	0.50
1/15/2021	Shelby Nicole Hackney	Associate	0121F0623: Information Technology General Controls - Risk Assurance - Computer Operations - Respond to manager review notes and update.	1.00
1/15/2021	Ashley Kay Youngwolfe	Associate	0121F0624: Engagement Management - Project Management - Engagement Economics / Monitoring Activities.	0.50
1/15/2021	Ashley Kay Youngwolfe	Associate	0121F0625: Other Audit/Audit Related Activities - Risk Assurance - Key Reports - Review key reports testing and leave review comments.	0.50

Exhibit C

Date	Name	Position	Description	Hours
1/15/2021	Ashley Kay Youngwolfe	Associate	0121F0626: Information Technology General Controls - Risk Assurance - Access Programs & Data - Address manager review comments and update testing documentation.	0.50
1/15/2021	Ashley Kay Youngwolfe	Associate	0121F0627: Information Technology General Controls - Risk Assurance - Computer Operations - Address manager review comments and update testing documentation.	1.40
1/15/2021	Ashley Kay Youngwolfe	Associate	0121F0628: Information Technology General Controls - Risk Assurance - Computer Operations - Documentation of testing.	0.60
1/15/2021	Collin McKay Short	Associate	0121F0629: Controls testing - Revenue & Receivables - Review selection support.	2.00
1/15/2021	Collin McKay Short	Associate	0121F0630: Substantive Audit Procedures - Revenue - Marketing netback testing.	1.00
1/15/2021	Collin McKay Short	Associate	0121F0631: Substantive Audit Procedures - Capital & Equity - Other components of equity.	1.50
1/15/2021	Kelsey Jo Ann Kitson	Associate	0121F0632: Substantive Audit Procedures - Derivatives & Hedges - Lead Schedule / Scoping.	4.00
1/15/2021	Kelsey Jo Ann Kitson	Associate	0121F0633: Substantive Audit Procedures - Derivatives & Hedges - Review selection support.	0.50
1/15/2021	Collin McKay Short	Associate	0121F0634: Substantive Audit Procedures - Notes Payable & Long-term Debt - Review notes payable lead schedule.	1.00
1/15/2021	William Brian Putnam	Associate	0121F0635: COE - Debt - Substantive Testing - Documentation of testing.	1.10
1/15/2021	Thomas Jefferson Davies	Associate	0121F0636: Substantive Audit Procedures - Accounts Payable - Documentation of control testing.	4.00

Exhibit C

Date	Name	Position	Description	Hours
1/15/2021	Chad Parkhurst	Senior Manager	0121F0637: Other Audit/Audit Related Activities - Data Assurance - Journal Entries - Review journal entry output and integrity checks.	1.00
1/15/2021	Ashley Kay Youngwolfe	Associate	0121F0638: Information Technology General Controls - Risk Assurance - Access Programs & Data - Documentation of testing.	2.50
1/15/2021	Samuel Tucker Laverde	Associate	0121F0639: Substantive Audit Procedures - Revenue - Revenue Reconciliation.	4.10
1/15/2021	Gabrielle Hooper	Associate	0121F0640: Substantive Audit Procedures - Revenue - Documentation of testing - test revenue transactions.	3.20
1/15/2021	Tyler Scott Burgin	Senior Associate	0121F0641: Substantive Audit Procedures - PP&E / Leases / Depreciation - YE CAPEX accrual, Q1 impairment.	3.00
1/15/2021	Adam Miller Wiley	Senior Associate	0121F0642: Engagement Management - Project Management - Engagement Economics / Monitoring Activities.	2.60
1/15/2021	Ashley Kay Youngwolfe	Associate	0121F0643: Continue Information Technology General Controls - Risk Assurance - Access Programs & Data - Documentation of testing.	3.00
1/15/2021	Adam Miller Wiley	Senior Associate	0121F0644: Continue Engagement Management - Project Management - Engagement Economics / Monitoring Activities.	2.40
1/15/2021	Gabrielle Hooper	Associate	0121F0645: Continue Substantive Audit Procedures - Revenue - Documentation of testing - test revenue transactions.	3.30
1/15/2021	Samuel Tucker Laverde	Associate	0121F0646: Continue Substantive Audit Procedures - Revenue - Revenue Reconciliation.	3.90
1/15/2021	Tyler Scott Burgin	Senior Associate	0121F0647: Continue Substantive Audit Procedures - PP&E / Leases / Depreciation - YE CAPEX accrual, Q1 impairment.	3.00
1/31/2021	PricewaterhouseCoop ers	Partner	0121F0648: Lead Engagement Partner Time - Review and Supervision - Partner Time - Planning Activities - Partner Time.	

Case 20-33233 Document 3185 Filed in TXSB on 03/08/21 Page 69 of 78

CHESAPEAKE ENERGY CORPORATION, et al. (Case No. 20-33233 DRJ)

Exhibit C

Date	Name	Position	Description	Hours		
Total -	Hours - Independen	t Audit Services		1,096.50		
Total - Hours - Fixed Fee Services 1,						

CHESAPEAKE ENERGY CORPORATION, et al. (Case No. 20-33233 DRJ) Exhibit D
PricewaterhouseCoopers LLP - Independent Auditor and Accounting Services Provider
Hourly Services and Case Administration - Summary of Hours / Fees by Project and Professional
For the Period January 1, 2021 through January 15, 2021

Project Category and Professional	Position	Rate	Hours (Total Compensation
Hourly Services				
Incremental Bankruptcy Accounting	g Services			
Rajeeb Das	Partner	\$994	1.10	\$1,093.40
John P McNamara	Partner	\$932	7.50	\$6,990.00
Douglas B Struckman	Partner	\$994	2.30	\$2,286.20
William Tim Stuhlreyer	Senior Managing Director	\$994	1.00	\$994.00
Robert Swartz	Senior Managing Director	\$994	12.00	\$11,928.00
Brett A Matzek	Senior Managing Director	\$994	1.00	\$994.00
Steven Brent Abbott	Director	\$600	5.50	\$3,300.00
Samuel Kent Sparks	Director	\$600	2.50	\$1,500.00
Joshua T Goodelman	Director	\$899	27.10	\$24,362.90
Mohammed Younus Yousuf	Manager	\$701	2.00	\$1,402.00
Theofanis Nicholas	Senior Associate	\$576	5.00	\$2,880.00
Erika Rabb	Senior Associate	\$576	27.00	\$15,552.00
Subtotal - Incremental Bankruptcy	94.00	\$73,282.50		
Total - Hourly Services			94.00	\$73,282.50
Total - Hours and Compensation - Administration	Hourly Services and Case		94.00	\$73,282.50

Exhibit E

Date	Name	Position I	Description I	Rate	Hour	s	Cor	Total npensation
Hourly Ser	rvices							
Incrementa	l Bankruptcy Accou	inting Services						
Accounting	Advisory and Assis	<u>tance</u>						
12/19/2020	William Tim Stuhlreyer	Senior Managing Director	0121H0001: Provide additional consultation responses to valuation questions.	egarding	the	\$994	1.00	\$994.00
1/4/2021	Joshua T Goodelman	Director	0121H0002: Review case updates including deconfirmation hearings.	ebriefs fr	rom	\$899	2.10	\$1,887.90
1/4/2021	Robert Swartz	Senior Managing Director	0121H0003: Review of amended plan of reorg disclosures.	anizatio	n	\$994	0.50	\$497.00
1/4/2021	Steven Brent Abbott	Director	0121H0004: Substantive Audit Procedures - Y rollforward testing - Income Taxes - Review Somemo.		32	\$600	1.00	\$600.00
1/5/2021	Joshua T Goodelman	Director	0121H0005: Review the Company's draft of its 4 column workbook.	s prelimi	nary	\$899	0.40	\$359.60
1/5/2021	Joshua T Goodelman	Director	0121H0006: Review confirmation hearing doc	umentati	ion.	\$899	0.90	\$809.10
1/5/2021	Joshua T Goodelman	Director	0121H0007: Review confirmation hearing eve documentation day 10.	nts and c	court	\$899	0.70	\$629.30
1/5/2021	John P McNamara	Partner	0121H0008: Review draft of client 4 column f model.	resh star	t	\$932	1.00	\$932.00
1/6/2021	Joshua T Goodelman	Director	0121H0009: Review the Company's draft of its 4 column workbook.	s prelimi	nary	\$899	1.50	\$1,348.50
1/6/2021	Joshua T Goodelman	Director	0121H0010: Review confirmation hearing eve documentation day 11 - judge's feedback.	nts and c	court	\$899	1.30	\$1,168.70

Exhibit E

Date	Name	Position I	Description Rate Ho	ours	Coi	Total npensation
1/7/2021	Joshua T Goodelman	Director	0121H0011: Review of Epiq website for Update court dockets, including treatment of claims classes.	\$899	1.00	\$899.00
1/7/2021	Joshua T Goodelman	Director	0121H0012: Review confirmation hearing events and court documentation.	\$899	1.10	\$988.90
1/7/2021	John P McNamara	Partner	0121H0013: Review latest court dockets for any accounting implications.	\$932	1.00	\$932.00
1/7/2021	John P McNamara	Partner	0121H0014: Meeting to discuss audit updates - J.McNamara, K.Sparks, J.Goodelman, R.Swartz (all PwC).	\$932	0.50	\$466.00
1/7/2021	Joshua T Goodelman	Director	0121H0015: Meeting to discuss audit updates - J.McNamara, K.Sparks, J.Goodelman, R.Swartz (all PwC).	\$899	0.50	\$449.50
1/7/2021	Robert Swartz	Senior Managing Director	0121H0016: Meeting to discuss audit updates - J.McNamara, K.Sparks, J.Goodelman, R.Swartz (all PwC).	\$994	0.50	\$497.00
1/7/2021	Samuel Kent Sparks	Director	0121H0017: Meeting to discuss audit updates - J.McNamara, K.Sparks, J.Goodelman, R.Swartz (all PwC).	\$600	0.50	\$300.00
1/8/2021	Erika Rabb	Senior Associate	0121H0018: Review updated claims reconciliation.	\$576	1.40	\$806.40
1/8/2021	Erika Rabb	Senior Associate	0121H0019: Update review of court dockets for reporting implications - including claim treatments.	\$576	1.60	\$921.60
1/8/2021	Joshua T Goodelman	Director	0121H0020: Review confirmation hearing events and court documentation related to those events over the confirmation hearing period.	\$899	2.00	\$1,798.00
1/9/2021	Robert Swartz	Senior Managing Director	0121H0021: Review of court dockets and confirmation hearing proceeding updates.	\$994	0.50	\$497.00
1/11/2021	Erika Rabb	Senior Associate	0121H0022: Review plan amendments for accounting considerations.	\$576	2.10	\$1,209.60

Exhibit E

Date	Name	Position I	Description	Rate	Hou	rs	Cor	Total npensation
1/11/2021	Erika Rabb	Senior Associate	0121H0023: Review confirmation hearing do for accounting implications.	cumentat	ion	\$576	1.90	\$1,094.40
1/11/2021	Joshua T Goodelman	Director	0121H0024: Review of documentation and w workstreams, including task allocations.	orkpaper		\$899	1.00	\$899.00
1/11/2021	Joshua T Goodelman	Director	0121H0025: Fresh start reporting and 4 colum accounting advisory.	nn disclos	sure	\$899	1.10	\$988.90
1/11/2021	Robert Swartz	Senior Managing Director	0121H0026: Audit timing planning based on calendar.	10-K filir	ng	\$994	1.00	\$994.00
1/11/2021	John P McNamara	Partner	0121H0027: Research fresh start accounting of	considera	tions.	\$932	1.00	\$932.00
1/11/2021	Theofanis Nicholas	Senior Associate	0121H0028: Prepare the draft memo for both Campus and Sayre locations.	the Corp	orate	\$576	1.00	\$576.00
1/12/2021	Erika Rabb	Senior Associate	0121H0029: Update documentation of bankru procedures performed for year end audit.	iptcy aud	it	\$576	2.60	\$1,497.60
1/12/2021	Erika Rabb	Senior Associate	0121H0030: Summarized latest filed key doc review procedures.	kets for a	udit	\$576	1.40	\$806.40
1/12/2021	Joshua T Goodelman	Director	0121H0031: Planning for timing for fresh-sta review, including review of preliminary audit	•	ng	\$899	2.50	\$2,247.50
1/12/2021	Joshua T Goodelman	Director	0121H0032: Review of court dockets and corhearing proceeding updates.	nfirmatior	1	\$899	2.00	\$1,798.00
1/12/2021	Robert Swartz	Senior Managing Director	0121H0033: Planning for timing for fresh-sta review, including review of preliminary audit	•	ng	\$994	2.50	\$2,485.00
1/12/2021	Douglas B Struckman	Partner	0121H0034: Review the cost approach analysis by Stout for the Corporate Campus and Sayre			\$994	0.50	\$497.00

Exhibit E

Date	Name	Position 1	Description Rate	Hours	Cor	Total mpensation
1/12/2021	Mohammed Younus Yousuf	Manager	0121H0035: Review the cost approach analysis performe by Stout for the Corporate Campus and Sayre locations.	d \$701	2.00	\$1,402.00
1/12/2021	Theofanis Nicholas	Senior Associate	0121H0036: Complete the draft memo for both the Corporate Campus and Sayre locations and submitted for initial internal review.	\$576	3.50	\$2,016.00
1/12/2021	Steven Brent Abbott	Director	0121H0037: Prepare for meeting to discuss audit updates	. \$600	1.00	\$600.00
1/12/2021	John P McNamara	Partner	0121H0038: Meeting to discuss audit updates - J.McNamara, K.Sparks, J.Goodelman, R.Swartz, S.Abbo (all PwC).	\$932 tt	0.50	\$466.00
1/12/2021	Joshua T Goodelman	Director	0121H0039: Meeting to discuss audit updates - J.McNamara, K.Sparks, J.Goodelman, R.Swartz, S.Abbo (all PwC).	\$899 tt	0.50	\$449.50
1/12/2021	Robert Swartz	Senior Managing Director	0121H0040: Meeting to discuss audit updates - J.McNamara, K.Sparks, J.Goodelman, R.Swartz, S.Abbo (all PwC).	\$994 tt	0.50	\$497.00
1/12/2021	Samuel Kent Sparks	Director	0121H0041: Meeting to discuss audit updates - J.McNamara, K.Sparks, J.Goodelman, R.Swartz, S.Abbo (all PwC).	\$600 tt	0.50	\$300.00
1/12/2021	Steven Brent Abbott	Director	0121H0042: Meeting to discuss audit updates - J.McNamara, K.Sparks, J.Goodelman, R.Swartz, S.Abbo (all PwC).	\$600 tt	0.50	\$300.00
1/13/2021	Erika Rabb	Senior Associate	0121H0043: Review valuation analysis for accounting considerations.	\$576	1.20	\$691.20
1/13/2021	Erika Rabb	Senior Associate	0121H0044: Review final confirmation hearing documentation for accounting implications.	\$576	1.50	\$864.00

Exhibit E

Date	Name	Position I	Description Rate Hou	ırs	Cor	Total npensation
1/13/2021	Joshua T Goodelman	Director	0121H0045: Review technical accounting for rights offering treatment.	\$899	1.80	\$1,618.20
1/13/2021	Joshua T Goodelman	Director	0121H0046: Review and draft 4 column example in advance of client meeting to provide clarity on expected deliverable(s).	\$899	1.30	\$1,168.70
1/13/2021	Robert Swartz	Senior Managing Director	0121H0047: Preliminary scoping for fresh-start reporting procedures.	\$994	2.00	\$1,988.00
1/13/2021	John P McNamara	Partner	0121H0048: Research fresh start accounting considerations.	\$932	1.50	\$1,398.00
1/14/2021	Erika Rabb	Senior Associate	0121H0049: Review fifth amended plan of reorganization for accounting implications.	\$576	2.50	\$1,440.00
1/14/2021	Erika Rabb	Senior Associate	0121H0050: Update summary of bankruptcy procedures memorandum.	\$576	1.50	\$864.00
1/14/2021	Erika Rabb	Senior Associate	0121H0051: Compile detail of incremental audit procedures to be performed.	\$576	1.00	\$576.00
1/14/2021	Joshua T Goodelman	Director	0121H0052: Review conditions precedent and considerations of impact to timing of emergence including applicable accounting cut-off.	\$899	0.90	\$809.10
1/14/2021	Robert Swartz	Senior Managing Director	0121H0053: Review of plan confirmation materials.	\$994	1.00	\$994.00
1/14/2021	John P McNamara	Partner	0121H0054: Review of amended plan of reorganization and court dockets for any accounting implications.	\$932	1.00	\$932.00
1/14/2021	Brett A Matzek	Senior Managing Director	0121H0055: Review of draft client documentation.	\$994	1.00	\$994.00
1/14/2021	Douglas B Struckman	Partner	0121H0056: Review the cost approach analysis performed by Stout for the Corporate Campus and Sayre locations.	\$994	1.80	\$1,789.20

Exhibit E

Date	Name	Position	Description Rate Ho	ours	Cor	Total npensation
1/14/2021	Theofanis Nicholas	Senior Associate	0121H0057: Update of the draft memo for both the Corporate Campus and Sayre locations after internal review.	\$576	0.50	\$288.00
1/14/2021	Steven Brent Abbott	Director	0121H0058: Substantive Audit Procedures Y/E and rollforward testing. Income Tax Review and Section 382 Memo.	\$600	2.00	\$1,200.00
1/14/2021	Rajeeb Das	Partner	0121H0059: Perform review of the pro-forma accounting presentation.	\$994	1.10	\$1,093.40
1/14/2021	John P McNamara	Partner	0121H0060: Meeting to discuss audit updates - J.McNamara, K.Sparks, J.Goodelman, R.Swartz (all PwC).	\$932	0.50	\$466.00
1/14/2021	Joshua T Goodelman	Director	0121H0061: Meeting to discuss audit updates - J.McNamara, K.Sparks, J.Goodelman, R.Swartz (all PwC).	\$899	0.50	\$449.50
1/14/2021	Robert Swartz	Senior Managing Director	0121H0062: Meeting to discuss audit updates - J.McNamara, K.Sparks, J.Goodelman, R.Swartz (all PwC).	\$994	0.50	\$497.00
1/14/2021	Samuel Kent Sparks	Director	0121H0063: Meeting to discuss audit updates - J.McNamara, K.Sparks, J.Goodelman, R.Swartz (all PwC).	\$600	0.50	\$300.00
1/15/2021	Erika Rabb	Senior Associate	0121H0064: Update summary of accounting implications from confirmed plan.	\$576	3.20	\$1,843.20
1/15/2021	Erika Rabb	Senior Associate	0121H0065: Compile emergence accounting considerations.	\$576	1.70	\$979.20
1/15/2021	Erika Rabb	Senior Associate	0121H0066: Review Update treatment of claims classes.	\$576	1.10	\$633.60
1/15/2021	Joshua T Goodelman	Director	0121H0067: Review of Q4 accounting considerations provided by the company.	\$899	2.00	\$1,798.00
1/15/2021	Robert Swartz	Senior Managing Director	0121H0068: Review of Q4 accounting considerations provided by the company.	\$994	2.00	\$1,988.00

Exhibit E

Date	Name	Position 1	Description Rate Hou	ırs	Co	Total mpensation
1/15/2021	Steven Brent Abbott	Director	0121H0069: Updates to the slide deck in preparation to client meeting.	\$600	1.00	\$600.00
Subtotal - I	Hours and Compens	ation - Accounting A	Advisory and Assistance		87.20	\$68,099.70
Correspond	lence, Calls and Me	etings with Manage	<u>ment</u>			
1/11/2021	Joshua T Goodelman	Director	0121H0070: Prepare for Client's Q4 update meeting - PwC audit team and client accounting team.	\$899	0.50	\$449.50
1/11/2021	Joshua T Goodelman	Director	0121H0071: Meeting with client to discuss 4 column workbook - G.Larson, S.Grose, K.Shirley (CHK).	\$899	0.50	\$449.50
1/13/2021	Erika Rabb	Senior Associate	0121H0072: Preparation for client meeting to discuss 4 column workbook.	\$576	1.80	\$1,036.80
1/13/2021	Erika Rabb	Senior Associate	0121H0073: Meeting to discuss 4 column workbook R. Swartz, J. Goodelman, E. Rabb, K. Sparks (PwC) G. Larson, S. Grose, K. Shirley (CHK).	\$576	0.50	\$288.00
1/13/2021	Joshua T Goodelman	Director	0121H0074: Meeting to discuss 4 column workbook R. Swartz, J. Goodelman, E. Rabb, K. Sparks (PwC) G. Larson, S. Grose, K. Shirley (CHK).	\$899	0.50	\$449.50
1/13/2021	Robert Swartz	Senior Managing Director	0121H0075: Meeting to discuss 4 column workbook R. Swartz, J. Goodelman, E. Rabb, K. Sparks (PwC) G. Larson, S. Grose, K. Shirley (CHK).	\$994	0.50	\$497.00
1/13/2021	Samuel Kent Sparks	Director	0121H0076: Meeting to discuss 4 column workbook R. Swartz, J. Goodelman, E. Rabb, K. Sparks (PwC) G. Larson, S. Grose, K. Shirley (CHK).	\$600	0.50	\$300.00

Exhibit E

Date	Name	Position	Description Rate Hou	urs	Co	Total mpensation
1/14/2021	John P McNamara	Partner	0121H0077: Client meeting to discuss bankruptcy events and fresh-start reporting - J.McNamara, K.Sparks, R.Swartz, J.Goodelman (all PwC) - W.Buergler, G.Larson, S.Grose, TJ.Nance (all CHK).	\$932	0.50	\$466.00
1/14/2021	Joshua T Goodelman	Director	0121H0078: Client meeting to discuss bankruptcy events and fresh-start reporting - J.McNamara, K.Sparks, R.Swartz, J.Goodelman (all PwC) - W.Buergler, G.Larson, S.Grose, TJ.Nance (all CHK).	\$899	0.50	\$449.50
1/14/2021	Robert Swartz	Senior Managing Director	0121H0079: Client meeting to discuss bankruptcy events and fresh-start reporting - J.McNamara, K.Sparks, R.Swartz, J.Goodelman (all PwC) - W.Buergler, G.Larson, S.Grose, TJ.Nance (all CHK).	\$994	0.50	\$497.00
1/14/2021	Samuel Kent Sparks	Director	0121H0080: Client meeting to discuss bankruptcy events and fresh-start reporting - J.McNamara, K.Sparks, R.Swartz, J.Goodelman (all PwC) - W.Buergler, G.Larson, S.Grose, TJ.Nance (all CHK).	\$600	0.50	\$300.00
Subtotal - I	Hours and Compensa	ation - Corresponde	nce, Calls and Meetings with Management		6.80	\$5,182.80
Subtotal	l - Hours and Compo	ensation - Increme	ental Bankruptcy Accounting Services		94.00	\$73,282.50
Subtotal -	Hours and Compen	nsation - Hourly S	ervices		94.00	\$73,282.50
Total - Ho	urs and Compensat	tion - Hourly Serv	ices and Case Administration		94.00	\$73,282.50