DAVIS POLK & WARDWELL LLP

450 Lexington Avenue

New York, New York 10017
Telephone: (212) 450-4000
Facsimile: (212) 701-5800
Marshall S. Huebner
Timothy Graulich
James I. McClammy
Stephen D. Piraino

Erik Jerrard (admitted pro hac vice)

Counsel to the Debtors and Debtors in Possession

UNITED STATES BANKRUPTCY COURT SOUTHERN DISTRICT OF NEW YORK

In re:

GRUPO AEROMÉXICO, S.A.B. de C.V., et al.,

Debtors.1

Chapter 11

Case No. 20-11563 (SCC)

(Jointly Administered)

THIRTEENTH MONTHLY FEE STATEMENT OF DAVIS POLK & WARDWELL LLP FOR COMPENSATION FOR SERVICES AND REIMBURSEMENT OF EXPENSES INCURRED AS COUNSEL TO THE DEBTORS AND DEBTORS IN POSSESSION FOR THE PERIOD FROM AUGUST 1, 2021 THROUGH AUGUST 31, 2021

Name of Applicant	Davis Polk & Wardwell LLP
Applicant's Role in Case	Counsel to Grupo Aeroméxico, S.A.B. de C.V., et al.
Date Order of Employment Signed	September 8, 2020 [ECF No. 361]
Period for which compensation and reimbursement is sought	August 1, 2021 through August 31, 2021

¹ The Debtors in these cases, along with each Debtor's registration number in the applicable jurisdiction, are as follows: Grupo Aeroméxico, S.A.B. de C.V. 286676; Aerovías de México, S.A. de C.V. 108984; Aerolitoral, S.A. de C.V. 217315; Aerovías Empresa de Cargo, S.A. de C.V. 437094-1. The Debtors' corporate headquarters is located at Paseo de la Reforma No. 243, piso 25 Colonia Cuauhtémoc, Mexico City, C.P. 06500.

Summary of Total Fees and Expenses Requested			
Total compensation requested in this statement	\$1,735,965.20 ² (80% of \$2,169,956.50)		
Total reimbursement requested in this statement	\$13,520.05 ³		
Total compensation and reimbursement requested in this statement	\$1,749,485.25		
This is a(n): X Monthly Application Interim Application Final Application			

Pursuant to sections 327, 330, and 331 of chapter 11 of title 11 of the United States Code (the "Bankruptcy Code"), Rule 2016 of the Federal Rules of Bankruptcy Procedure (the "Bankruptcy Rules"), Rule 2016-1 of the Local Bankruptcy Rules for the United States Bankruptcy Court for the Southern District of New York (the "Local Rules"), the Order Approving Application of Debtors for Authority to Employ and Retain Davis Polk & Wardwell LLP as Attorneys for the Debtors Nunc Pro Tunc to the Petition Date, dated September 8, 2020 [ECF No. 361] (the "Retention Order"), and the Order Pursuant to 11 U.S.C. §§ 105(a) and 331 Establishing Procedures for Interim Compensation and Reimbursement of Expenses for Retained Professionals, dated September 8, 2020 [ECF No. 360] (the "Interim Compensation Order"), Davis Polk & Wardwell LLP ("Davis Polk"), counsel for the above-captioned debtors and debtors in possession (collectively, the "Debtors"), submits this Thirteenth Monthly Fee Statement of

² This amount reflects a reduction in fees in the amount of \$57,925.00 on account of voluntary write-offs.

³ This amount reflects a reduction in expenses in the amount of \$571.42 on account of word processing, meal, and duplication charges to comply with the *Guidelines for Reviewing Applications for Compensation and Reimbursement of Expenses Filed under 11 U.S.C. § 330 by Attorneys in Larger Chapter 11 Cases Effective November 1, 2013* (the "**UST Guidelines**").

Services Rendered and Expenses Incurred for the Period from August 1, 2021 Through August 31, 2021 (this "Fee Statement").⁴ By this Fee Statement, Davis Polk seeks (i) compensation in the amount of \$1,735,965.20, which is equal to 80% of the total amount of reasonable compensation for actual, necessary legal services that Davis Polk incurred in connection with such services during the Fee Period (i.e., \$2,169,956.50) and (ii) payment of \$13,520.05 for the actual, necessary expenses that Davis Polk incurred in connection with such services during the Fee Period.

Itemization of Services Rendered and Disbursements Incurred

- 1. Attached hereto as **Exhibit A** is a chart of the number of hours expended and fees incurred (on an aggregate basis) by Davis Polk partners, associates, law clerks and paraprofessionals during the Fee Period with respect to each of the project categories Davis Polk established in accordance with its internal billing procedures. As reflected in **Exhibit A**, Davis Polk incurred \$2,169,956.50 in fees during the Fee Period. Pursuant to this Fee Statement, Davis Polk seeks reimbursement for 80% of such fees, totaling \$1,735,965.20.
- 2. Attached hereto as **Exhibit B** is a chart of Davis Polk professionals and paraprofessionals, including the standard hourly rate for each attorney and paraprofessional who rendered services to the Debtors in connection with these chapter 11 cases during the Fee Period and the title, hourly rate, aggregate hours worked and the amount of fees earned by each professional. The blended hourly billing rate of attorneys for all services provided during the Fee Period is \$1,208.92.⁵ The blended hourly billing rate of all paraprofessionals is \$458.21.⁶

⁴ The period from August 1, 2021, through and including August 31, 2021, is referred to herein as the "Fee Period."

⁵ The blended hourly billing rate of \$1,208.92 for attorneys is derived by dividing the total fees for attorneys of \$2,162,029.50 by the total hours of 1,788.40.

⁶ The blended hourly billing rate of \$458.21 for paraprofessionals is similarly derived by dividing the total fees for paraprofessionals of \$7,927.00 by the total hours of 17.3.

20-11563-scc Doc 1958 Filed 10/22/21 Entered 10/22/21 20:24:16 Main Document Pg 4 of 68

- 3. Attached hereto as **Exhibit C** is a chart of expenses that Davis Polk incurred or disbursed in the amount of \$13,520.05 in connection with providing professional services to the Debtors during the Fee Period. These expense amounts are intended to cover Davis Polk's direct operating costs, which costs are not incorporated into Davis Polk's hourly billing rates. Only the clients for whom the services are actually used are separately charged for such services. The effect of including such expenses as part of the hourly billing rates would unfairly impose additional cost upon clients who do not require extensive photocopying, delivery and other services.
- 4. Attached hereto as **Exhibit D** are the time records of Davis Polk for the Fee Period organized by project category with a daily time log describing the time spent by each attorney and other professional during Fee Period as well as an itemization of expenses.

Notice

5. The Debtors will provide notice of this Fee Statement in accordance with the Interim Compensation Order. The Debtors submit that no other or further notice be given.

[Remainder of Page Left Blank Intentionally]

20-11563-scc Doc 1958 Filed 10/22/21 Entered 10/22/21 20:24:16 Main Document Pg 5 of 68

WHEREFORE, Davis Polk, in connection with services rendered on behalf of the Debtors,

respectfully requests (i) compensation in the amount of \$1,735,965.20 which is equal to 80% of the

total amount of reasonable compensation for actual, necessary legal services that Davis Polk incurred

in connection with such services during the Fee Period (i.e., \$2,169,956.50) and (ii) payment of

\$13,520.05 for the actual, necessary expenses that Davis Polk incurred in connection with such services

during the Fee Period.

Dated:

October 22, 2021

New York, New York

DAVIS POLK & WARDWELL LLP

By: /s/ Timothy Graulich

450 Lexington Avenue

New York, New York 10017

Telephone: (212) 450-4000

Facsimile: (212) 701-5800

Marshall S. Huebner

Timothy Graulich

James I. McClammy

Stephen D. Piraino

Erik Jerrard (admitted pro hac vice)

Counsel to the Debtors and Debtors in

Possession

5

20-11563-scc Doc 1958 Filed 10/22/21 Entered 10/22/21 20:24:16 Main Document Pg 6 of 68

Exhibit A

Fees by Project Category

Project Category	Total Hours	Total Fees
Aircraft/Engines	445.0	\$521,460.50
Automatic Stay/Litigation	125.3	\$174,452.50
Bar Date/Estimation/Claims Allowance Issues	134.1	\$126,106.00
Corporate Governance, Board Matters and Communications	89.3	\$119,959.00
Creditor/UCC/AHC	17.5	\$19,036.00
Customer/Vendor/Non-Aircraft Lease/Non-Aircraft Contract Issues	16.8	\$16,605.00
Employee/Pension Issues	0.6	\$705.00
Financing	607.0	\$797,158.50
General Case Administration	80.8	\$79,110.00
Non-DPW Retention and Fee Issues	9.5	\$10,074.50
Plan/Disclosure Statement	250.0	\$272,327.50
DPW Retention/Preparation of DPW Fee Statements/Applications and Budget	2.0	\$2,350.00
IP, Regulatory and Tax	15.9	\$18,031.00
Hearing Preparation/Attendance	6.4	\$7,376.50
Credit Card Receivables	5.5	\$5,204.50
Total	1,805.7	\$2,169,956.50

20-11563-scc Doc 1958 Filed 10/22/21 Entered 10/22/21 20:24:16 Main Document Pg 8 of 68

Exhibit B

Professional and Paraprofessional Fees

Name of Professional Individual	Position, Year Assumed Position, Prior Relevant Experience, Year of Obtaining Relevant License to Practice	Hourly Billing Rate	Total Hours Billed	Total Compensation	
Partners					
Borchardt, Leo	Partner; joined partnership in 2016; admitted New York 2007	\$1,765.00	14.8	\$26,122.00	
Buchwald, Lara Samet	Partner; joined partnership 2017; admitted New York 2009	\$1,765.00	42.3	\$74,659.50	
Burke, Arthur J.	Partner; joined partnership 2000; admitted New York 1994	\$1,790.00	1.5	\$2,685.00	
Farr, Lucy W.	Partner; joined partnership in 2003; admitted New York 1996	\$1,790.00	1.1	\$1,969.00	
Graulich, Timothy	Partner; joined partnership in 2009; admitted New York 1995	\$1,790.00	255.5	\$457,345.00	
Huebner, Marshall S.	Partner; joined partnership in 2002; admitted New York 1994	Partner; joined partnership in 2002; admitted New York \$1,790.00			
Jackson, Vanessa L.	Partner; joined partnership 2019; admitted New York 2013	\$1,635.00	8.7	\$14,224.50	
McClammy, James I.	ny, James I. Partner; joined partnership in 2015; admitted New York \$1,765.		11.7	\$20,650.50	
Partner Total:			348.2	\$620,209.50	
Counsel					
Altus, Leslie J.	Counsel; joined Davis Polk 1985; admitted New York 1984	\$1,345.00	1.0	\$1,345.00	
Szanzer, Steven Z.	Counsel; joined Davis Polk 2016; admitted New York 2001 \$1,345.00		242.3	\$325,893.50	
Counsel Total:	243.3	\$327,238.50			
Associates, Law Clerks a	nd Legal Assistants			•	
Bane, Abraham	Associate; joined Davis Polk 2019; admitted New York 2020 \$835.00		32.4	\$27,054.00	
De Mullewie, Leonore	Associate; joined Davis Polk 2019; admitted Brussels 2016	\$1,155.00	1.4	\$1,617.00	

Name of Professional Individual	Position, Year Assumed Position, Prior Relevant Experience, Year of Obtaining Relevant License to Practice	Hourly Billing Rate	Total Hours Billed	Total Compensation
Dekhtyar, Mariya	Associate; joined Davis Polk 2020; admitted New York 2021	\$740.00	7.6	\$5,624.00
Donnelly, Jacob M.	Associate; joined Davis Polk 2020; admitted New York 2021	\$740.00	5.5	\$4,070.00
Ford, Stephen	Associate; joined Davis Polk 2020; admitted New York 2019	\$1,060.00	75.9	\$80,454.00
Garg, Paavani	Associate; joined Davis Polk 2019; admitted New York 2019	\$1,060.00	8.9	\$9,434.00
Green, Thomas S.	Associate; joined Davis Polk 2019; admitted New York 2016	\$1,175.00	56.2	\$66,035.00
Jerrard, Erik	Associate; joined Davis Polk 2015; admitted New York 2016	\$1,175.00	128.6	\$151,105.00
Katz, Michael	Associate; joined Davis Polk 2018; admitted New York 2019	\$1,060.00	21.5	\$22,790.00
Lee, Lloyd	Associate; joined Davis Polk 2020; admitted New York 2021	\$740.00	5.8	\$4,292.00
Lempel, Jesse	Associate; joined Davis Polk 2020; admitted New York 2020	\$835.00	7.9	\$6,596.50
Marienko, Anna	Associate; joined Davis Polk 2018; admitted New York 2019	\$1,060.00	9.4	\$9,964.00
Masaro, Matthew Bruno	Associate; joined Davis Polk in 2019; admitted New York 2020	\$835.00	133.3	\$111,305.50
Melcer, Moshe	Associate; joined Davis Polk 2020; admitted New Jersey 2020	\$740.00	184.8	\$136,752.00
O'Sullivan, Damian	Associate; joined Davis Polk 2020; admitted New Jersey 2021	\$740.00	12.1	\$8,954.00
Piraino, Stephen D.	Associate; joined Davis Polk 2014; admitted New York 2014	\$1,175.00	197.5	\$232,062.50
Rincon, Cristina M.	Associate; joined Davis Polk 2016; admitted New York 2015	\$1,175.00	53.7	\$63,097.50

Name of Professional Individual	Position, Year Assumed Position, Prior Relevant Experience, Year of Obtaining Relevant License to Practice	Hourly Billing Rate	Total Hours Billed	Total Compensation
Siman, Ariel	Associate; joined Davis Polk 2014; admitted New York 2014	\$1,175.00	4.6	\$5,405.00
Simmonds, Alexander W.	Associate; joined Davis Polk 2016; admitted New York 2017	\$1,155.00	15.3	\$17,671.50
Sokol, Nate	Associate; joined Davis Polk 2016; admitted New York 2017	\$1,155.00	5.7	\$6,583.50
Steinberg, Richard J.	Associate; joined Davis Polk 2019; admitted New York 2019	\$1,060.00	214.7	\$227,582.00
Troconis, Adela	Associate; joined Davis Polk 2015; admitted New York 2016	\$1,175.00	13.1	\$15,392.50
Houston, Kamali	Law Clerk; joined Davis Polk 2020 \$740.00		1.0	\$740.00
Altman, Olivia	Legal Assistant; joined Davis Polk 2019	\$480.00	7.2	\$3,456.00
Farrell, Annie	Legal Assistant; joined Davis Polk 2020	2.9	\$1,015.00	
Giddens, Magali	Legal Assistant; joined Davis Polk 2019	7.2	\$3,456.00	
Associates, Law Clerks and	1,214.20	\$1,222,508.50		
GRAND TOTAL	1,805.70	\$2,169,956.50		

20-11563-scc Doc 1958 Filed 10/22/21 Entered 10/22/21 20:24:16 Main Document Pg 12 of 68

Exhibit C

Expense Summary

Expense Category	Service Provider (if applicable)	Total Expenses
Court & Related fees	Veritext, CourtAlert.com and Pacer transactions	\$3,101.78
Postage, Courier & Freight	N/A	\$215.31
Outside Documents & Research	Courtlink and Restructuring Concepts	\$1,384.11
Electronic Discovery Services	Consilio Inc.	\$3,416.10
Meals	See Meal Detail Below	\$220.00
Travel	See Travel Detail Below	\$443.78
Computer Research	LexisNexis and Westlaw	\$4,738.97
TOTAL		\$13,520.05

	MEAL DETAIL			
Date	Provider	Meal & Number of People	Description	Amount ⁷
08/03/2021	Eden Wok	1	Overtime meal for S. Szanzer	\$20.00
08/09/2021	Mr. Broadway Kosher Restaurant	1	Overtime meal for S. Szanzer	\$20.00
08/10/2021	Milk N Honey	1	Overtime meal for S. Szanzer	\$20.00
08/16/2021	Taam Tov Restaurant	1	Overtime meal for S. Szanzer	\$20.00
08/18/2021	Eden Wok	1	Overtime meal for S. Szanzer	\$20.00
08/19/2021	Kosher Deluxe Restaurant	1	Overtime meal for S. Szanzer	\$20.00
08/24/2021	Kosher Deluxe Restaurant	1	Overtime meal for S. Szanzer	\$20.00
08/25/2021	Milk N Honey	1	Overtime meal for S. Szanzer	\$20.00
08/26/2021	Eden Wok	1	Overtime meal for S. Szanzer	\$20.00
08/30/2021	Taam Tov Restaurant	1	Overtime meal for S. Szanzer	\$20.00

 $^{^{7}}$ Where an amount for an overtime meal originally exceeded \$20.00, the amount was reduced to \$20.00 to comply with the UST Guidelines.

	MEAL DETAIL			
Date	Provider	Meal & Number of People	Description	Amount ⁷
08/31/2021	Eden Wok	1	Overtime meal for S. Szanzer	\$20.00
TOTAL \$220.00				\$220.00

TRAVEL DETAIL				
Date	Person Description		Amount	
08/03/2021	S. Szanzer	Taxi from Davis Polk offices for late night work	\$61.70	
08/05/2021	S. Szanzer	Taxi from Davis Polk offices for late night work	\$59.87	
08/09/2021	S. Szanzer	Taxi from Davis Polk offices for late night work	\$61.55	
08/10/2021	S. Szanzer	Taxi from Davis Polk offices for late night work	\$78.78	
08/24/2021	S. Szanzer	Taxi from Davis Polk offices for late night work	\$65.13	
08/30/2021	S. Szanzer	Taxi from Davis Polk offices for late night work	\$52.70	
08/31/2021	S. Szanzer	Taxi from Davis Polk offices for late night work	\$64.05	
TOTAL			\$443.78	

20-11563-scc Doc 1958 Filed 10/22/21 Entered 10/22/21 20:24:16 Main Document Pg 15 of 68

Exhibit D

Detailed Time Records

		Time	Detail By Project
Name	Date	Hours	Narrative
AM100 Aircraft/Engin	ies		
Melcer, Moshe	08/01/21	0.5	Review and revise motion to approve equipment transaction (0.4); review case management procedures regarding same (0.1).
Szanzer, Steven Z.	08/01/21	1.2	Review materials regarding DAE (0.3); email with Willkie Farr regarding same (0.3); correspondence with White & Case and Skyworks regarding same (0.3); correspondence with M. Melcer regarding case management order issue (0.3).
Graulich, Timothy	08/02/21	1.1	Call with C. Hansen regarding fleet issues (0.5); call with T. Goren regarding DAE motion (0.6).
Green, Thomas S.	08/02/21	4.8	Review CAE documents (1.5); call with White & Case regarding MUFG (0.4); call with Skyworks regarding CAE (0.2); call with Davis Polk Fleet team regarding fleet workstreams (0.8); review and revise SMBC (0.7); analyze fleet workstreams summary (0.3); correspondence with M. Melcer regarding fleet workstreams (0.7); correspondence with S. Szanzer regarding same (0.2).
Melcer, Moshe	08/02/21	2.7	Revise motion to approve equipment transaction (1.3); revise sealing motion regarding same (0.2); revise declaration in support of same (0.4); attend call with Davis Polk Fleet team regarding fleet workstreams (0.8).
Piraino, Stephen D. Szanzer, Steven Z.	08/02/21 08/02/21	0.3 9.0	Call with White & Case and others regarding DAE motion. Correspondence with White & Case and Aeromexico regarding replacement engine (0.2); correspondence with White & Case and T. Green regarding MUFG (0.3); review and revise CAE documents (1.4); correspondence with M. Melcer regarding same (1.3); correspondence with White & Case regarding Ex-Im notices (0.3); review and revise Clover motion (0.9); correspondence with M. Melcer regarding same (0.9); call with C. Hansen and others regarding DAE (0.7); call with Willkie Farr and C. Hansen regarding same and mediation (1.0); correspondence with Rothschild and AlixPartners regarding same (0.3); correspondence with Davis Polk team regarding Ex-Im omnibus claims agreement (0.4); call with Davis Polk Fleet team regarding fleet workstreams (0.8); correspondence with M. Melcer regarding BBAM-Merx (0.2); correspondence with White & Case and T. Green regarding Flight Safety amendment (0.3).
Graulich, Timothy Green, Thomas S.	08/03/21 08/03/21	0.6 3.6	Call with M. Landess regarding DAE motion. Call with White & Case regarding MUFG (0.3); analyze omnibus agreement regarding same (0.2); research issues regarding reply for same (1.8); call with Skyworks, White & Case, and Rothschild regarding motion to approve aircraft transactions (1.3).
Jerrard, Erik McClammy, James I.	08/03/21 08/03/21	0.7 1.1	Call with Rothschild and others regarding aircraft acquisitions. Review aircraft motion (0.4); call with advisors regarding same (0.7).
Melcer, Moshe	08/03/21	2.8	Call with Skyworks, White & Case, and Rothschild regarding motion to approve aircraft transactions (0.8) (partial attendance); correspondence with T. Green regarding same (0.2); correspondence with S. Szanzer regarding same (0.2); analyze precedent regarding same (0.4); review and revise motion to approve aircraft transactions (0.7); review and revise sealing motion regarding same (0.4); correspondence with S. Szanzer regarding same (0.1).

		Time	Detail By Project
Name	Date	Hours	Narrative
Piraino, Stephen D.	08/03/21	0.7	Call with Skyworks, White & Case, and Rothschild regarding motion to approve aircraft transactions (partial attendance).
Steinberg, Richard J.	08/03/21	1.5	Review Ex-Im omnibus amendment agreements (1.1); correspondence with T. Green regarding same (0.4).
Szanzer, Steven Z.	08/03/21	8.6	Correspondence with White & Case regarding MUFG (0.2); correspondence with T. Green regarding same (0.1); correspondence with White & Case regarding CAE documents (0.1); review and consider Skyworks' comments to same (0.5); correspondence with M. Melcer regarding same (1.0); correspondence with T. Green regarding same (1.0); correspondence with T. Graulich regarding DAE transaction issues (0.9); correspondence with Davis Polk Litigation team regarding same (0.5); correspondence with T. Green and M. Melcer regarding same (0.5); call with Skyworks, White & Case, and Rothschild regarding motion to approve aircraft transactions (1.3); correspondence with Willkie Farr regarding same (0.3); correspondence with Skyworks regarding AJR Aviation (0.1); review and revise SMBC sealing motion (1.2); correspondence with M. Melcer regarding same (0.9).
Graulich, Timothy Green, Thomas S.	08/04/21 08/04/21	0.7 3.0	Call with R. Sanchez Baker regarding DAE. Draft DAE motion reply outline (0.8); correspondence with S. Szanzer regarding same (0.3); call with advisors regarding
Melcer, Moshe	08/04/21	3.0	same (0.9); analyze precedent replies regarding same (1.0). Review and revise motion to approve equipment transaction (0.5); review and revise sealing motion regarding same (0.2); review and revise declaration in support of same (0.1); call with Aeroméxico and others regarding motion to approve aircraft transactions (0.4); review and revise motion to approve aircraft transactions (0.8); review and revise sealing motion regarding same (0.5); draft declaration in support of same (0.5).
Piraino, Stephen D.	08/04/21	0.4	Call with R. Sanchez Baker and others regarding DAE transaction.
Steinberg, Richard J.	08/04/21	5.2	Draft Ex-Im motion (4.9); email with T. Green regarding same (0.1); call with White & Case regarding same (0.2).
Szanzer, Steven Z.	08/04/21	6.1	Correspondence with Linklaters regarding DVB/MUFG (0.1); review and revise SMBC documents (0.6); correspondence with M. Melcer regarding same (0.6); correspondence with White & Case and Skyworks regarding same (0.6); correspondence with Skyworks regarding BBAM (0.3); correspondence with M. Melcer regarding same (0.2); review fleet workstream summary (0.2); correspondence with coadvisors regarding DAE (0.4); correspondence with Willkie Farr regarding same (0.1); correspondence with T. Graulich regarding same (0.1); review and revise CAE documents (0.5); correspondence with M. Melcer regarding same (0.8); correspondence with White & Case and Skyworks regarding same (0.5); correspondence with T. Green and M. Melcer regarding Ex-Im (0.3); correspondence with White & Case regarding Chorus (0.2); correspondence with same regarding Flight Safety (0.2); correspondence with same regarding Sierra Echo (0.2).
Green, Thomas S.	08/05/21	2.4	Draft DAE motion reply outline (1.9); attend call with Davis Polk Fleet team and White & Case regarding fleet workstreams (0.5).

		Time	Detail By Project
Name	Date	Hours	Narrative
Melcer, Moshe	08/05/21	1.7	Revise motion to approve equipment transaction (0.2); attend call with Davis Polk Fleet team and White & Case regarding fleet workstreams (0.5); revise fleet status summary (0.2); draft Certificate of No Objection to North Shore motion (0.3); correspondence with S. Szanzer regarding same (0.1); review DAE motion reply (0.2); correspondence with T. Green regarding same (0.2).
Szanzer, Steven Z.	08/05/21	8.1	Correspondence with T. Green regarding DAE motion reply outline (0.8); review and revise same (3.2); correspondence with M. Melcer regarding DAE motion (0.2); correspondence with A. Rosenblatt regarding same (0.2); correspondence with White & Case regarding same (0.2); call with Aeroméxico and co-advisors regarding DAE (1.3); review analysis for same (0.4); correspondence with White & Case regarding engine replacement (0.2); correspondence with White & Case regarding SMBC (0.1); correspondence with T. Green and M. Melcer regarding DAE motion reply (0.5); correspondence with M. Melcer regarding Certificates of No Objection to aircraft motion (0.3); attend call with Davis Polk Fleet team and White & Case regarding fleet workstreams (0.5); prepare for same (0.2).
Green, Thomas S.	08/06/21	2.3	Correspondence with S. Szanzer regarding DAE motion (0.3); call with M. Melcer regarding same (0.1); analyze precedents regarding same (1.0); draft same (0.9).
McClammy, James I.	08/06/21	2.1	Review aircraftlease motion papers (0.9); correspondence with Davis Polk team regarding same (1.2).
Melcer, Moshe	08/06/21	2.4	Draft Certificate of No Objection to aircraft motion (0.4); correspondence with S. Szanzer regarding DAE motion (0.2); call with T. Green regarding same (0.1); call with Davis Polk Restructuring and Litigation teams regarding same (0.9); email with M. Masaro regarding same (0.1); correspondence with T. Green regarding same (0.1); email with L. Buchwald regarding same (0.1); review fleet summary status (0.5).
Piraino, Stephen D.	08/06/21	0.8	Call with Davis Polk Restructuring and Litigations teams regarding DAE.
Steinberg, Richard J.	08/06/21	2.2	Call with White & Case regarding Ex-Im motion (0.3); revise claims spreadsheet regarding same (0.4); revise Ex-Im motion (0.3); call with White & Case regarding Ex-Im motion (0.2); correspondence with T. Green regarding same (0.1); correspondence with M. Melcer regarding fleet workstreams (0.3); email with White & Case and O'Melveny regarding Ex-Im claims (0.2); review fleet claims (0.3); email with M. Melcer regarding same (0.1).
Szanzer, Steven Z.	08/06/21	5.7	Review and revise Certificate of No Objection to aircraft motion (0.5); correspondence with M. Melcer regarding same (0.8); call with T. Goren regarding DAE (0.4); email with Davis Polk team regarding same (0.2); correspondence with White & Case and Vedder Price regarding MUFG (0.2); review and consider comments to DAE motion reply outline (0.4); correspondence with Davis Polk team regarding same (0.4); call with Davis Polk Restructuring and Litigation teams regarding same (0.9); correspondence with M. Melcer and T. Green regarding same (1.4); correspondence with L. Buchwald regarding same (0.5).
Bane, Abraham Green, Thomas S.	08/07/21 08/07/21	0.2 8.1	Review Creditors Committee objection to DAE motion. Extensive drafting of DAE motion reply (7.1); correspondence

Time Detail By Project			
Name	Date	Hours	Narrative
	00/07/04	4.5	with Davis Polk team regarding same (1.0).
McClammy, James I.	08/07/21	1.5	Correspondence with Davis Polk Litigation team regarding aircraft lease motion.
Melcer, Moshe	08/07/21	1.8	Review Creditors Committee objection to DAE motion (0.3); review and revise reply to same (0.9); correspondence with S.
Piraino, Stephen D.	08/07/21	1.0	Szanzer and T. Green regarding same (0.6). Call with Davis Polk team and co-advisors regarding aircraft objection (0.7); correspondence with L. Buchwald regarding same (0.3).
Szanzer, Steven Z.	08/07/21	1.7	Review and consider Creditors Committee objection to DAE motion (0.8); correspondence with S. Piraino and M. Melcer regarding same (0.5); correspondence with Davis Polk Restructuring and Litigation teams regarding reply to same
Melcer, Moshe	08/08/21	9.2	(0.4). Review and revise DAE motion reply (6.5); correspondence with S. Szanzer regarding same (0.5); call with Davis Polk, Rothschild, and AlixPartners teams regarding same (0.8); draft
Piraino, Stephen D.	08/08/21	1.0	supplemental declaration regarding same (1.4). Call with Davis Polk, Rothschild, and AlixPartners teams regarding DAE motion reply (0.8); correspondence with S. Szanzer regarding same (0.2).
Szanzer, Steven Z.	08/08/21	10.1	Call with AlixPartners and Rothschild regarding DAE reply (0.8); review and revise same (6.3); review, revise, and consider comments to same (2.0); correspondence with M. Melcer regarding same and supplemental declaration (1.0).
Graulich, Timothy	08/09/21	6.9	Attend Chambers conference regarding DAE motion (0.4); prepare for same (2.6); review and revise DAE motion reply (3.2); call with C. Hansen regarding same (0.7).
Green, Thomas S.	08/09/21	0.7	Call with A. Schwartz regarding DAE motion reply redactions (0.2); call with Davis Polk Litigation and Restructuring teams regarding same (0.5).
Melcer, Moshe	08/09/21	8.1	Review and revise DAE motion reply (5.8); call with Davis Polk Restructuring and Litigation teams regarding redactions for same (0.5); correspondence with S. Szanzer regarding same (0.7); call with same regarding same (0.2); correspondence with S. Piraino regarding same (0.1); analyze joinder to DAE objection (0.1); draft interim DAE order (0.7).
Piraino, Stephen D.	08/09/21	4.2	Correspondence with Davis Polk team regarding DAE motion (1.5); call with same regarding reply to same (0.4); correspondence with T. Graulich regarding same (0.3); correspondence with Willkie Farr and Chambers regarding conference on DAE motion (0.3); attend Chambers conference on DAE motion (0.4); prepare for same (0.5); call with Davis Polk team regarding same (0.5); review and revise interim order (0.3).
Szanzer, Steven Z.	08/09/21	12.0	Review and review DAE motion reply (1.4); review and revise supplemental declaration regarding same (0.5); correspondence with M. Melcer regarding same (0.5); call with Davis Polk Restructuring and Litigation teams regarding supplemental declaration regarding same (0.5); call with M. Melcer regarding same (0.2); attend Chambers conference regarding DAE motion (0.4); correspondence with Davis Polk team regarding same (0.8); review and consider joinder to UCC's objection (0.2); correspondence with Davis Polk Restructuring team regarding same (0.2); review, revise and consider comments to DAE motion reply and supplemental

		Time I	Detail By Project
Name	Date	Hours	Narrative
			declaration (1.5); correspondence with Davis Polk Restructuring team regarding same (1.5); correspondence with co-advisors regarding same (0.8); call with Willkie Farr regarding interim DAE interim order (0.5); review and revise same (0.5); correspondence with Davis Polk team regarding same (0.5); call with C. Hansen regarding same (0.3); review and revise DAE Certificate of No Objection to sealing motion (0.8); correspondence with Davis Polk Restructuring team regarding same (0.7); correspondence with White & Case and Norton Rose regarding CAE (0.2).
Graulich, Timothy	08/10/21	3.4	Review revised DAE order (0.6); review and revise DAE motion reply (2.8).
Green, Thomas S.	08/10/21	3.9	Correspondence with S. Piraino regarding redactions (0.2); email with Davis Polk team regarding same (0.1); review and revise Ex-Im motion (3.4); correspondence with M. Melcer regarding fleet updates (0.2).
Melcer, Moshe	08/10/21	5.5	Correspondence with T. Green regarding DAE (0.2); correspondence with M. Giddens regarding same (0.2); correspondence with S. Piraino regarding same (0.4); review and revise reply to same (1.7); draft notice of proposed interim order (0.8); draft proposed interim order (1.7); correspondence with T. Green regarding outstanding fleet workstreams (0.2); revise fleet status summary (0.3).
Piraino, Stephen D.	08/10/21	1.8	Correspondence with T. Green regarding DAE motion reply (0.3); correspondence with Davis Polk Restructuring team regarding same (0.8); correspondence with Chambers regarding same (0.3); call with A. Schwartz regarding sealing motion regarding same (0.2); correspondence with L. Buchwald regarding DAE motion (0.2).
Steinberg, Richard J.	08/10/21	1.6	Review and revise Ex-Im motion (1.1); correspondence with T. Green regarding same (0.1); email with S. Szanzer regarding same (0.4).
Szanzer, Steven Z.	08/10/21	12.4	Review and finalize DAE motion reply (1.8); review and revise supplemental declaration regarding same (1.7); correspondence with Davis Polk team, Chambers, and Willkie Farr regarding extending filing deadline for same (0.5); review and finalize proposed DAE interim order (3.0); correspondence with Clifford Chance, Willkie Farr, White & Case, and Davis Polk Restructuring team regarding same (3.0); review and revise notice for same (0.6); correspondence with M. Melcer regarding same (0.6); review emails regarding DAE redactions (0.4); correspondence with Davis Polk Restructuring team and Willkie Farr regarding Certificate of No Objection to sealing motion (0.3); review and revise same (0.5).
Green, Thomas S.	08/11/21	1.7	Call with I. Renzi regarding Ex-Im (0.1); correspondence with S. Szanzer regarding same (0.3); correspondence with R. Steinberg regarding same (0.1); review and revise Ex-Im motion (0.5); review and revise Clover order (0.7).
Melcer, Moshe	08/11/21	4.4	Draft Certificates of No Objection to fleet filings (2.5); email with Chambers regarding same (1.6); call with AlixPartners regarding DAE motion (0.1); correspondence with S. Szanzer regarding outstanding fleet workstreams (0.2).
Steinberg, Richard J.	08/11/21	0.7	Correspondence with S. Szanzer regarding Ex-Im motion and omnibus amendment agreements (0.5); email with White & Case regarding same (0.2).

	Time Detail By Project			
Name	Date	Hours	Narrative	
Szanzer, Steven Z.	08/11/21	5.9	Correspondence with M. Melcer, C. Dietz, and Skyworks regarding Chorus (0.2); correspondence with Linklaters and T. Green regarding DVB/ MUFG transfer (0.2); correspondence with White & Case and Vedder Price regarding Ex-Im omnibus agreement (0.2); review Certificates of No Objections to fleet filings (0.5); correspondence with M. Melcer and T. Graulich regarding same (0.5); review and revise Ex-Im motion (3.0); call with R. Steinberg and T. Green regarding same (0.7); correspondence with T. Green and M. Melcer regarding Clover (0.3); correspondence with White & Case and Skyworks regarding SMBC (0.3).	
Green, Thomas S.	08/12/21	2.0	Attend call with Davis Polk Fleet team and White & Case regarding fleet workstreams (0.6); correspondence with Davis Polk Fleet team regarding engine lease (0.2); research issues regarding same (0.4); analyze comments to Ex-Im motion (0.8).	
Melcer, Moshe	08/12/21	2.1	Review fleet orders (0.3); email with White & Case and Skyworks regarding same (0.2); attend call with Davis Polk Fleet team and White & Case regarding fleet workstreams (0.6); revise fleet status summary (0.3); draft motion to approve aircraft transactions (0.4); draft sealing motion regarding same (0.2); draft declaration in support of same (0.1).	
Steinberg, Richard J.	08/12/21	3.6	Emails with White & Case regarding Ex-Im omnibus amendment agreements (0.3); revise Ex-Im motion (2.8); email with M. Melcer regarding claims language in fleet proposed orders (0.3); correspondence with T. Green regarding Ex-Im (0.2).	
Szanzer, Steven Z.	08/12/21	3.5	Review DAE order (0.3); correspondence with White & Case regarding DAE lease (0.1); email with co-advisors regarding DAE analyses (0.1); correspondence with Davis Polk team regarding SMBC (0.3); correspondence with Skyworks regarding Chorus (0.4); correspondence T. Green regarding same (0.4); review issues regarding same (0.4); review Ex-Im motion (0.2); review fleet workstreams summary (0.2); call with White & Case regarding same (0.8); correspondence with T. Green regarding same (0.1); correspondence with co-advisors regarding SMBC (0.2).	
Green, Thomas S.	08/13/21	0.6	Correspondence with Davis Polk Fleet team regarding True Noord.	
Melcer, Moshe	08/13/21	0.8	Call with Davis Polk Fleet team, White & Case, Skyworks, AlixPartners, and Rothschild regarding DAE (0.4); email with Aeroméxico regarding same (0.2); correspondence with S. Szanzer regarding outstanding fleet workstreams (0.2).	
Piraino, Stephen D. Steinberg, Richard J.	08/13/21 08/13/21	0.5 3.1	Call with co-advisors regarding DAE. Review and revise Ex-Im motion (2.6); correspondence with T. Green regarding same (0.1); call with S. Szanzer regarding same (0.1); email with White & Case and Skyworks regarding same (0.3).	
Szanzer, Steven Z.	08/13/21	3.0	Call with White & Case and Skyworks regarding SMBC motion (0.3); review and revise Ex-Im motion (2.2); call with R. Steinberg regarding same (0.1); call with Skyworks regarding new SMBC transaction (0.4).	
Melcer, Moshe Melcer, Moshe	08/14/21 08/15/21	0.1 1.0	Email with A. Sainz regarding DAE. Revise motion to approve equipment transaction (0.2); email with T. Graulich regarding same (0.2); review opposing	

	Time Detail By Project			
Name	Date	Hours	Narrative	
Szanzer, Steven Z.	08/15/21	2.4	counsel's comments to motion to approve aircraft transactions (0.3); email with S. Szanzer and T. Green regarding same (0.3). Correspondence with M. Melcer (0.3); review and revise CAE	
			motion (0.3); correspondence with Skyworks regarding SMBC motion (0.2); correspondence with C. Hansen and Davis Polk Fleet team regarding redactions (0.3); correspondence with White & Case and Skyworks regarding CAE and SMBC motions (0.2); review and consider comments to CAE sealing motion (0.2); correspondence with M. Melcer regarding same (0.3); review emails regarding SMBC, CAE, and JOLCO motions (0.3); call with M. Melcer regarding same (0.3).	
Green, Thomas S. Melcer, Moshe	08/16/21 08/16/21	0.3 2.8	Correspondence with Davis Polk Fleet team regarding MTU. Review and revise motion to approve aircraft transaction (0.4); review and revise related sealing motion (0.5); review and revise related declaration for same (0.2); call with Clifford Chance and others regarding SMBC assumption motion (0.4); review and revise motion to approve aircraft transaction (0.6); review and revise related sealing motion (0.3); review and revise declaration for same (0.3); correspondence with S. Szanzer regarding same (0.1).	
Piraino, Stephen D.	08/16/21	0.2	Correspondence with Davis Polk Fleet team regarding fleet issues.	
Steinberg, Richard J.	08/16/21	1.2	Review precedent aircraft financing motions (1.0); email with S. Szanzer regarding same (0.2).	
Szanzer, Steven Z.	08/16/21	7.3	Correspondence with Skyworks, White & Case, and Davis Polk Fleet team regarding CAE and SMBC motions (1.0); correspondence with White & Case and Vedder Price regarding Ex-Im (0.3); review and consider comments to SMBC assumption motion (0.5); revise same (0.5); correspondence with M. Melcer regarding same (0.6); call with Clifford Chance and others regarding same (0.4); correspondence with same and M. Melcer regarding same (0.4); correspondence with H. Rosenblat regarding new engine lease (0.3); correspondence with White & Case regarding redactions (0.2); review Clover motion (0.4); correspondence with M. Melcer regarding same (0.4); review comments to Ex-Im motion (0.3); review and revise SMBC acquisition motion (1.0); correspondence with M. Melcer regarding same (1.0).	
Green, Thomas S.	08/17/21	0.7	Analyze Ex- Im motion (0.5); correspondence with S. Szanzer regarding same (0.2).	
Melcer, Moshe	08/17/21	0.9	Call with S. Szanzer regarding fleet workstreams (0.4); revise fleet status summary (0.4); email with Clifford Chance regarding motion to approve aircraft transactions (0.1).	
Steinberg, Richard J.	08/17/21	2.9	Review and revise Ex-Im motion (1.6); call with White & Case and Skyworks regarding same (0.8); correspondence with S. Szanzer and T. Green regarding same (0.5).	
Szanzer, Steven Z.	08/17/21	5.4	Correspondence with White & Case regarding SMBC acquisition motion (0.3); review and revise same (0.7); call with M. Melcer regarding fleet workstreams (0.4); correspondence with Skyworks and White & Case regarding BBAM and JOLCO (0.4); correspondence with White & Case regarding SMBC redactions (0.2); correspondence with T. Green and R. Steinberg regarding Ex-Im (0.8); review and consider comments to motion to same (1.0); call with White &	

		Time	Detail By Project
Name	Date	Hours	Narrative
Graulich, Timothy Green, Thomas S.	08/18/21 08/18/21	0.5 1.5	Case and Skyworks regarding same (0.8); correspondence with R. Steinberg regarding same (0.2); correspondence with White & Case regarding same (0.2); call with M. Melcer regarding fleet workstreams (0.4). Call with M. Landess regarding JOLCO issues. Analyze Sierra Echo documents (0.3); correspondence with A Troconis regarding DAE (0.2); correspondence with Davis Polk Fleet team regarding Ex-Im (0.5); review same (0.3);
Melcer, Moshe	08/18/21	4.5	analyze docket for rejection motions (0.2). Review and revise motion to approve aircraft transactions (0.8); review and revise related sealing motion (0.3); review and revise related declaration (0.2); correspondence with S. Szanzer regarding the same (0.1); correspondence with T. Green regarding the same (0.1); call with Skyworks and White & Case regarding motion to approve aircraft transaction (0.3) (partial attendance); draft motion to approve aircraft transactions (1.9); correspondence with N. Sokol regarding same (0.2); correspondence with S. Szanzer regarding same (0.5); correspondence with M. Masaro regarding same (0.1).
Piraino, Stephen D. Steinberg, Richard J.	08/18/21 08/18/21	1.0 2.3	Call with Skyworks and others regarding JOLCOs. Revise Ex-Im motion (1.7); email with White & Case and Skyworks regarding same (0.4); email with S. Szanzer regarding same (0.2).
Szanzer, Steven Z.	08/18/21	8.7	Correspondence with Vedder Price and White & Case regarding Ex-Im omnibus agreement (0.3); correspondence with Skyworks regarding Ex-Im motion (0.2); review and revise same (1.4); correspondence with R. Steinberg regarding same (1.4); review and consider comments to same (0.3); correspondence with White & Case regarding SMBC and CAE motion (0.4); correspondence with Cleary Gottlieb regarding same (0.3); review and consider comments to SMBC motion (0.6); correspondence with M. Melcer regarding same (0.3); correspondence with R. Johnson regarding same (0.3); correspondence with White & Case regarding Sierra Echo (0.5); call with Skyworks and White & Case regarding JOLCO (1.8); correspondence with Davis Polk Fleet team regarding rejection motion (0.8); correspondence with T. Green regarding DAE consent (0.1).
Melcer, Moshe	08/19/21	5.1	Review and revise motion to approve aircraft transactions (0.6); review and revise aircraft rejection motion (2.1); correspondence with S. Szanzer regarding same (0.1); call with Skyworks, White & Case, and Rothschild regarding same (0.8); call with White & Case and Davis Polk Fleet team regarding fleet workstreams (0.5); review and revise fleet status summary (0.3); analyze foreign aircraft finance laws (0.7).
Piraino, Stephen D.	08/19/21	1.2	Call with White & Case, Skyworks, and Rothschild regarding fleet issues.
Steinberg, Richard J.	08/19/21	0.5	Call with White & Case and Davis Polk Fleet team regarding fleet workstreams.
Szanzer, Steven Z.	08/19/21	10.5	Correspondence with T. Green regarding DVB/MUFG transfer (0.2); correspondence with N. Vislocky regarding same (0.1); correspondence with White & Case regarding Ex-Im motion (0.1); review fleet workstream summary (0.2); call with White & Case and Davis Polk Fleet team regarding fleet workstreams (0.5); review and revise rejection motion (3.9);

		Time	Detail By Project
Name	Date	Hours	Narrative
			call with M. Melcer regarding same (0.3); correspondence with White & Case and Skyworks regarding same (0.4); correspondence with R. Johnson regarding SMBC assumption motion (0.2); review comments to same (0.3); correspondence with M. Melcer regarding same (0.3); correspondence with Skyworks regarding Wings (0.1); call with same, Rothschild, and AHG advisors regarding JOLCOs (0.5); call with White & Case, Skyworks, and Rothschild regarding same (1.2); correspondence with T. Graulich and M. Melcer regarding same (0.5); email advisors regarding same (0.5); correspondence with M. Melcer regarding research for same (0.5); correspondence
Graulich, Timothy Melcer, Moshe	08/20/21 08/20/21	0.6 9.5	with White & Case regarding Avolon (0.1). Call with Skyworks regarding fleet issues. Analyze foreign aircraft finance law (1.9); review precedent assumption and rejection motions (2.1); review and revise aircraft rejection motion (2.3); draft motion to approve aircraft transactions (2.2); call with AlixPartners, Skyworks, and Davis Polk Fleet team regarding aircraft rejection motion (0.5); correspondence with S. Szanzer regarding same (0.3); correspondence with T. Green regarding same (0.2).
Steinberg, Richard J.	08/20/21	2.4	Revise Ex-Im motion (1.6); correspondence with S. Szanzer regarding same (0.1); call with AlixPartners, Skyworks, and Davis Polk Fleet team regarding aircraft rejection motion (0.3) (partial attendance); email with Vedder Price regarding same (0.1); email with White & Case and Skyworks regarding same (0.3).
Szanzer, Steven Z.	08/20/21	9.4	Correspondence with M. Melcer regarding fleet issues research (0.6); correspondence with T. Graulich and Skyworks regarding same (0.6); review JOLCO stipulation (0.2); email with Davis Polk Fleet team regarding analysis of same (0.2); correspondence with Skyworks regarding same (0.3); finalize SMBC and CAE motions (1.5); correspondence with Davis Polk Fleet team and White & Case regarding Avolon (0.2); review, revise, and finalize aircraft rejection motion (4.5); review and consider comments to Ex-Im motion (0.6); correspondence with R. Steinberg regarding same (0.5); correspondence with White & Case regarding True Noord (0.2).
Melcer, Moshe	08/21/21	0.7	Email with Chambers regarding fleet filings (0.3); email committee and potential bidder advisors regarding same (0.1); email with Clifford Chance regarding same (0.1); correspondence with S. Szanzer regarding fleet workstreams (0.2).
Szanzer, Steven Z.	08/21/21	1.3	Review emails regarding CAE, SMBC assumption, and JOLCO rejection motions (0.5); correspondence with T. Green (0.2); correspondence with M. Melcer regarding same and fleet workstreams (0.6).
Melcer, Moshe Szanzer, Steven Z.	08/22/21 08/22/21	1.3 0.3	Draft motion to approve aircraft transactions. Call with M. Melcer regarding Avolon (0.2); correspondence with White & Case regarding same (0.1).
Green, Thomas S.	08/23/21	3.1	Review Avolon documents (0.5); call with White & Case regarding same (0.1); review and revise MTU documents (0.9); call with H. Rosenblatt and A. Andreeva regarding same (0.5); call with S. Szanzer regarding same (0.3); analyze DBV stipulations (0.6); correspondence M. Giddens regarding

		Time	Detail By Project
Name	Date	Hours	Narrative
Melcer, Moshe	08/23/21	0.9	redacted documents (0.2). Review and revise motion to approve aircraft transactions (0.7); call with S. Szanzer regarding NBB (0.2).
Szanzer, Steven Z.	08/23/21	5.9	Correspondence with White & Case and Skyworks regarding Avolon (0.3); review and revise Yamasa motion (1.2); correspondence with M. Melcer regarding same (1.2); correspondence with Skyworks regarding JOLCO leases (0.2); correspondence with White & Case regarding True Noord (0.3); correspondence with T. Green regarding same (0.3); correspondence with same and N. Vislocky regarding DVB/MUFG transfer (0.2); correspondence with Davis Polk Fleet team regarding DAE (1.1); correspondence with Willkie Farr regarding same (0.3); correspondence with White & Case regarding Yamasa (0.1); call with M. Melcer regarding NBB (0.2); correspondence with M. Melcer regarding fleet issues (0.5).
Graulich, Timothy Green, Thomas S.	08/24/21 08/24/21	0.5 3.5	Call with S. Szanzer regarding JOLCO stipulations and DAE. Analyze MTU agreement (1.2); correspondence with S. Szanzer regarding same (1.2); analyze BNDES agreement (1.1).
Melcer, Moshe	08/24/21	3.7	Review and revise motion to approve aircraft transactions (0.8); call with Davis Polk Restructuring and Litigation teams and Willkie Farr regarding DAE (0.3); draft notice of final DAE order (0.9); correspondence with S. Szanzer regarding same (0.2); correspondence with T. Green regarding fleet workstreams (0.3); analyze regarding renewal of service contract (0.9); correspondence with R. Steinberg regarding same (0.3).
Steinberg, Richard J.	08/24/21	0.6	Revise Ex-Im motion (0.3); call with White & Case regarding same (0.2); email with S. Szanzer regarding same (0.1).
Szanzer, Steven Z.	08/24/21	5.6	Call with T. Graulich regarding JOLCO stipulations and DAE (0.5); correspondence with S. Campbell and M. Melcer regarding Clover (0.6); review revised Clover motion (0.2); correspondence with White & Case and Skyworks regarding same (0.2); call with Davis Polk Litigation team regarding DAE (0.4); call with Willkie Farr regarding same (0.6); correspondence with L. Buchwald and M. Melcer regarding same (0.3); correspondence with T. Graulich regarding same (0.2); email with Aeroméxico and co-advisors regarding update on same (0.2); correspondence with M. Melcer regarding final DAE order (0.4); review same (0.3); correspondence with Clifford Chance regarding same (0.1); correspondence with Davis Polk Fleet team and Skyworks regarding letter of credit issue (0.4); correspondence with M. Melcer and White & Case regarding Yamasa (0.4); review and revise motion for same (0.8).
Szanzer, Steven Z.	08/24/21	3.4	Correspondence with M. Melcer (0.7); correspondence with White & Case and M. Melcer regarding fleet issues (0.4); correspondence with Skyworks regarding BBAM (0.3); correspondence with White & Case regarding Wings (0.2); correspondence with M. Melcer regarding same (0.1); correspondence with T. Green regarding True Noord (0.3); review UCC's reservation of rights regarding DAE (0.3); review and consider comments to Ex-Im motion (0.3); correspondence with R. Steinberg regarding same (0.2); correspondence with Linklaters regarding DVB/MUFG transfer 12

		Time	Detail By Project
Name	Date	Hours	Narrative
Graulich, Timothy Green, Thomas S.	08/25/21 08/25/21	1.6 3.9	(0.4); correspondence with T. Green and A. Troconis regarding DAE consent (0.2). Call with Skyworks regarding fleet strategy. Analyze aircraft rejection procedures document (1.3); research issues regarding JOLCO (1.3); research letter of credit issues
Melcer, Moshe	08/25/21	6.6	(1.3). Analyze letter of credit issues (2.5); correspondence with R. Steinberg regarding same (0.2); draft motion to approve aircraft transactions (1.1); correspondence with S. Szanzer regarding same (0.3); review and revise motion to approve aircraft transactions (2.0); draft Certificate of No Objection and
Steinberg, Richard J.	08/25/21	4.9	final proposed DAE order (0.4); call with Clifford Chance regarding same (0.1). Review and revise Ex-Im motion (2.6); review comments from White & Case and Vedder Price regarding same (0.5); email with White & Case regarding same (0.3); review potential letter of credit claims regarding SAEL (1.1); call with Skyworks regarding same (0.2); email with S. Szanzer regarding same
Szanzer, Steven Z.	08/25/21	6.9	(0.2). Call with H. Rosenblatt regarding True Noord agreement (0.6); review and revise same (0.5); correspondence with T. Green regarding same (0.4); correspondence with R. Steinberg regarding letter of credit issue (0.3); correspondence with Skyworks and Aeroméxico regarding same (0.2); correspondence with T. Green regarding Ministry of Economy reserve issue (0.3); call with Aeroméxico and advisors regarding JOLCO (1.3); correspondence with stakeholders regarding same (0.5); review stipulation regarding same (0.4); correspondence with T. Green regarding same (0.4); correspondence with T. Graulich regarding same (0.1); correspondence with T. Green regarding schedule of leases for rejection (0.2); correspondence with M. Melcer regarding final DAE order (0.3); review same (0.4); correspondence with R. Johnson regarding same (0.3); review and consider comments to same (0.2); correspondence with White & Case regarding same (0.1).
Szanzer, Steven Z.	08/25/21	4.9	Correspondence with R. Steinberg, White & Case, and Skyworks regarding Ex-Im motion (0.4); review and consider comments to same (0.3); correspondence with R. Steinberg regarding same (0.3); review and revise Yamasa motion (0.3); correspondence with M. Melcer regarding same (0.3); review and revise NBB motion (0.6); correspondence with M. Melcer regarding same (0.6); review and revise aircraft lease assumption motion (0.6); correspondence with M. Melcer regarding same (0.6); correspondence with Linklaters regarding DVB/MUFGtransfer (0.1); review and revise SMBC acquisition motion (0.4); correspondence with M. Melcer regarding same (0.4).
Green, Thomas S.	08/26/21	1.0	Call with White & Case and Davis Polk Fleet team regarding fleet workstreams (0.5), review and revise MTU documents
Melcer, Moshe	08/26/21	2.5	(0.3), research issues regarding BBAM (0.2). Review and revise motion to approve aircraft transaction (1.5); call with White & Case and Davis Polk Fleet team regarding fleet workstreams (0.5); correspondence with T. Green regarding same (0.1); revise final DAE order (0.3);

		Time	Detail By Project
Name	Date	Hours	Narrative
Steinberg, Richard J.	08/26/21	2.5	correspondence with S. Szanzer regarding same (0.1); Revise Ex-Im motion (1.9); email with Skyworks regarding potential letter of credit claims regarding SAEL (0.2); email with White & Case regarding Ex-Im pleadings and underlying agreements (0.2); email with Vedder Price regarding same (0.2).
Szanzer, Steven Z.	08/26/21	9.6	Correspondence with Skyworks and White & Case regarding Ex-Im motion and declaration (0.3); review and same (1.5); correspondence with R. Steinberg regarding same (1.5); correspondence with White & Case and Vedder regarding Ex-Im omnibus agreements (0.2); review and revise True Noord agreement (0.3); correspondence with H. Rosenblat and T. Wolynski regarding same (0.3); correspondence with T. Green regarding same (0.3); correspondence with R. Johnson regarding final DAE order (0.3); correspondence with M. Melcer regarding same (0.2); review and revise same (0.5); review and revise Certificate of No Objection to same (0.6); correspondence with M. Melcer regarding same (0.4); correspondence with Willkie Farr regarding same and final order regarding same (0.2); review fleet workstreams summary in preparation for call with White & Case (0.3); call with White & Case and Davis Polk Fleet team regarding fleet workstreams (0.5); correspondence with W. Melcer regarding same (0.7); correspondence with M. Melcer regarding same (0.7); correspondence with Same regarding fleet workstreams (0.5).
Melcer, Moshe	08/27/21	4.4	Finalize Clover motion (0.4); correspondence with S. Szanzer regarding same (0.1); finalize Certificate of No Objection to DAE (0.4); correspondence with S. Szanzer regarding same (0.2); call with Clifford Chance regarding same (0.2); correspondence with S. Piraino regarding same (0.1); review and revise motion to approve aircraft transactions (1.4); correspondence with. S. Szanzer regarding same (0.2); draft sealing motion regarding motion to approve aircraft transactions (1.3); revise fleet status summary (0.1).
Steinberg, Richard J.	08/27/21	4.0	Review comments from Vedder Price to Ex-Im motion (0.3); correspondence with S. Szanzer regarding same (0.5); email to Vedder Price regarding same (0.2); revise Ex-Im motion (0.4); review and comment on CGF omnibus amendment agreements (2.3); email with S. Szanzer regarding same (0.3).
Szanzer, Steven Z.	08/27/21	7.8	Correspondence with B. Thorsness regarding Ex-Im motion (0.3); correspondence with R. Steinberg regarding same (0.2); review and revise same (0.5); review revised omnibus agreements regarding same (0.4); finalize Clover motion (0.5); finalize True Noord agreement (0.5); finalize Certificate of No Objection to DAE and final order regarding same (1.2); call with Willkie Farr regarding same (0.4); call with White & Case and Davis Polk Restructuring team regarding Avolon (0.8); correspondence with Skyworks regarding JOLCO leases and claims (0.4); correspondence with White & Case regarding Chorus (0.2); correspondence with M. Melcer regarding same (0.2); review and revise Sierra Echo motion (0.9); correspondence with White & Case regarding Wings motion (0.3); correspondence with same regarding NAC (0.1).

	Time Detail By Project			
Name	Date	Hours	Narrative	
Melcer, Moshe	08/28/21	0.1	Email with White & Case regarding motion to approve aircraft transactions.	
Melcer, Moshe	08/29/21	0.1	Email with White & Case regarding aircraft transaction.	
Garg, Paavani	08/30/21	1.2	Call with S. Szanzer and others regarding assumption of aircrafts research (0.5); email with Davis Polk Fleet team regarding same (0.7).	
Green, Thomas S.	08/30/21	4.6	Draft non-disclosure agreement (1.5); research Cape Town issue (1.5); review and revise MUFG omnibus agreement (1.0); correspondence with S. Szanzer regarding Cape Town (0.6).	
Melcer, Moshe	08/30/21	4.9	Call with White & Case regarding aircraft transactions (0.1); review and revise motion to approve aircraft transaction (0.3); email with Clifford Chance regarding DAE (0.1); draft declaration for motion to approve aircraft transactions (0.7); draft motion to approve aircraft transactions (2.6); correspondence with S. Szanzer regarding same (0.1); call with Aeroméxico and fleet advisor team regarding same (0.8); correspondence with S. Szanzer regarding outstanding fleet workstreams (0.2).	
Steinberg, Richard J.	08/30/21	2.0	Email with White & Case regarding CGF omnibus amendment agreements (0.1); email with same and Skyworks regarding Ex-Im pleadings (0.2); correspondence with M. Melcer regarding same (0.5); correspondence with S. Szanzer regarding same (0.2); review revised CGF omnibus amendment agreements (0.5): review correspondence from Aeroméxico regarding fleet financings (0.3); email with	
Szanzer, Steven Z.	08/30/21	5.6	AlixPartners regarding same (0.2). Correspondence with R. Steinberg regarding HSBC fleet (0.3); correspondence with White & Case and M. Melcer regarding Carlyle (0.1); correspondence with M. Melcer regarding SMBC acquisition motion (0.4); correspondence with White & Case regarding same (0.3); call with Aeroméxico and co-advisors regarding JOLCOs (0.8); correspondence with M. Melcer regarding assumption motion regarding same (0.4); review and revise same (0.2); correspondence with White & Case and Skyworks regarding same (0.2); correspondence with M. Melcer regarding same (2.5); correspondence with same regarding Certificate of No Objections (0.4).	
Szanzer, Steven Z.	08/30/21	6.2	Correspondence with H. Rosenblat and White & Case regarding True Noord agreement (0.3); call with P. Garg and others regarding assumption of aircraft research (0.5); review CGF omnibus agreement (0.8); correspondence with R. Steinberg, White & Case, and Vedder Price regarding same (0.4); review final DAE order entered (0.1); email with Aeroméxico and co-advisors regarding same (0.1); correspondence with M. Melcer regarding Chorus (0.3); review and revise Ex-Im sealing motion (0.6); correspondence with M. Melcer regarding same (0.6); correspondence with T. Green regarding rejection procedures under stipulations (0.2); review summary of same (0.3); review Non-Disclosure Agreement (0.3); correspondence with T. Green regarding same (0.2); correspondence with R. Steinberg regarding Ex-Im motion (0.2); review revised Ex-Im omnibus agreements (0.4); correspondence with R. Steinberg, White & Case, and Vedder Price regarding same (0.4); correspondence with White & Case regarding redactions regarding same (0.2);	

		Time	Detail By Project
Name	Date	Hours	Narrative
			correspondence with White & Case and Skyworks regarding timing for Ex-Im filing (0.3).
Garg, Paavani	08/31/21	3.7	Review precedents on Cape Town convention (3.4); revise draft of fifth assumption notice (0.3).
Graulich, Timothy	08/31/21	2.7	Correspondence with S. Szanzer regarding JOLCOs (0.4); review and revise aircraft lease assumption motion (2.3).
Green, Thomas S.	08/31/21	1.0	Correspondence with Davis Polk team regarding Ex-Im (0.5); correspondence with A. Troconis regarding DAE (0.5).
Melcer, Moshe	08/31/21	6.6	Review and revise assumption motion (2.7); draft related sealing motion (1.2); call with Skyworks regarding same (0.2); correspondence with S. Szanzer regarding same (0.2); draft related declaration (0.6); email with M. Giddens regarding same (0.2); email with Chambers regarding same (0.3); email with creditor groups regarding same (0.2); correspondence with T. Green regarding fleet workstreams (0.3); review and revise motion to approve aircraft transactions (0.6); revise fleet status summary (0.1).
Rincon, Cristina M.	08/31/21	0.3	Review draft of SMBC motion (0.2); review email from L. Buchwald regarding same (0.1).
Steinberg, Richard J.	08/31/21	6.3	Email with AlixPartners regarding fleet financings (0.3); email with the Aeroméxico regarding same (0.1); correspondence with White & Case, Skyworks, and AlixPartners regarding Ex-Im pleadings (0.7); correspondence with S. Szanzer regarding same (0.3); revise Ex-Im motion (1.1); revise Craine declaration in support of same (2.8); revise sealing motion regarding omnibus amendment agreements (0.9); email with Vedder Price regarding same (0.1).
Szanzer, Steven Z.	08/31/21	6.3	Review and consider comments to JOLCO assumption motion (0.3); correspondence with M. Melcer regarding same (0.2); review and revise same (1.2); correspondence with Davis Polk Fleet team regarding sealing motion and declaration (1.2); correspondence with M. Melcer and T. Graulich regarding same (1.3); correspondence with White & Case regarding same (0.4); correspondence with M. Landess regarding same (0.4); review emails regarding True Noord agreement (0.2); correspondence with White & Case and Vedder Price regarding Ex-Im omnibus agreements (0.3); correspondence with J. Craine regarding timing for Ex-Im motion (0.2); correspondence with T. Graulich regarding acquisition motions (0.3); correspondence with L. Buchwald regarding same (0.3).
Szanzer, Steven Z.	08/31/21	6.8	Correspondence with White & Case regarding Ex-Im redactions (0.2); call with AlixPartners regarding Ex-Im (0.3); call with AlixPartners, Skyworks, Rothschild, and White & Case regarding same (0.6); correspondence with R. Steinberg regarding same (0.4); correspondence with T. Green regarding DAE consent (0.1); correspondence with White & Case regarding Carlyle (0.2); correspondence with M. Melcer regarding Carlyle (0.1); correspondence with Cleary Gottlieb regarding JOLCO assumption documents (0.2); finalize same (1.8); correspondence with M. Melcer regarding SMBC assumption order (0.1); correspondence with C. Brown regarding same (0.2); review and revise Avolon motion (0.3); correspondence with M. Melcer regarding same (0.2); correspondence with M. Landess regarding Wings motion (0.1); review and revise Ex-Im motion and declaration (1.0); correspondence with R. Steinberg regarding same (1.0).

Time Detail By Project			
Name	Date	Hours	Narrative
Total AM100 Aircraf	t/Engines	445.0	
AM110 Automatic St	tay/Litigation		
Rincon, Cristina M.	08/02/21	0.2	
Rincon, Cristina M.	08/03/21	1.0	Revise Newrest Rule 9019 motion (0.8); email with
			Aeroméxico regarding facts for same (0.2).
Rincon, Cristina M.	08/04/21	2.2	Review and revise Newrest Rule 9019 motion (1.2); email with
Dinaan Criatina M	00/05/04	1.6	Aeroméxico regarding same (1.0).
Rincon, Cristina M.	08/05/21	1.6	Review and revise Newrest Rule 9019 motion (0.8); review and revise declarations in support of same (0.8).
Buchwald, Lara	08/06/21	0.3	Correspondence with Davis Polk team regarding exit financing
Samet	00/00/21	0.5	discovery.
Graulich, Timothy	08/06/21	1.1	Call with Davis Polk Litigation team regarding DAE discovery
G. G			(0.6); call with B. Miller regarding same (0.5).
Rincon, Cristina M.	08/06/21	0.7	Call with Davis Polk Restructuring team regarding aircraft
			dispute (0.5); email with Newrest counsel and Aeroméxico
			regarding Newrest Rule 9019 motion (0.2).
Szanzer, Steven Z.	08/06/21	0.5	Correspondence with T. Gron regarding DAE discovery (0.1);
			call with Davis Polk Restructuring and Litigation team
Dualeurald Laws	00/07/04	2.4	regarding same (0.4).
Buchwald, Lara	08/07/21	2.1	Analyze issues regarding objection to aircraft motion (1.4); call
Samet Rincon, Cristina M.	08/07/21	0.6	with co-advisors regarding same (0.7). Call with Davis Polk Restructuring team regarding DAE
Milicoll, Chaulia IVI.	00/07/21	0.0	dispute.
Szanzer, Steven Z.	08/07/21	1.0	Review DAE discovery requests (0.5); review emails regarding
ozanzor, otovom z.	00/01/21	1.0	same (0.5).
Buchwald, Lara	08/08/21	5.2	Call with AlixPartners and Rothschild regarding DAE motion
Samet			(0.6); correspondence with J. McClammy and C. Rincon
			regarding litigation strategy regarding same (0.3);
			correspondence with S. Piraino regarding same (0.2);
			comment on DAE motion reply (1.3); analyze discovery issues
One viliale Time attent	00/00/04	0.5	regarding same (2.8).
Graulich, Timothy Marienko, Anna	08/08/21 08/08/21	0.5 1.5	Correspondence with L. Buchwald regarding DAE discovery. Review DAE motion materials.
Rincon, Cristina M.	08/08/21	3.8	Call with advisors and Davis Polk Litigation team regarding
Milicon, Onsulia IVI.	00/00/21	3.0	DAE discovery requests (1.0); review and compile documents
			for production to Creditors Committee (2.3); review DAE
			motion reply (0.5).
Szanzer, Steven Z.	08/08/21	1.3	Correspondence with Davis Polk Restructuring and Litigation
			teams and co-advisors regarding DAE discovery issues (0.8);
	22/22/24		review materials for same (0.5).
Buchwald, Lara	08/09/21	7.7	Analyze issues regarding DAE motion and related discovery
Samet			(2.7); correspondence with C. Rincon and A. Marienko
			regarding same (0.5); correspondence with S. Szanzer, S. Piraino, and others regarding reply regarding same (0.6); call
			with Davis Polk Restructuring and Litigation teams regarding
			same (0.6); prepare for M. Landess deposition (0.5);
			correspondence with M. Landess, C. Rincon, and A. Marienko
			regarding same (2.0); review and revise reply to DAE motion
			(0.8).
Ford, Stephen	08/09/21	0.2	Correspondence with Davis Polk team regarding discovery.
Marienko, Anna	08/09/21	7.9	Review documents regarding DAE discovery (3.2);
			correspondence with C. Rincon and L. Buchwald regarding
			DAE motion and M. Landess deposition regarding same (1.0);
			correspondence with C. Rincon and L. Buchwald regarding

		Time	Detail By Project
Name	Date	Hours	Narrative
Rincon, Cristina M.	08/09/21	5.8	upcoming deposition of M. Landess (0.5); attend M. Landess deposition (2.0); correspondence with Davis Polk team regarding upcoming deposition of M. Landess (1.2). Review and compile documents in response DAE discovery (3.0); prepare M. Landess deposition (2.1); correspondence with L. Buchwald and A. Marienko regarding same and DAE
Szanzer, Steven Z.	08/09/21	3.0	discovery (0.7). Correspondence with Davis Polk team regarding DAE discovery and depositions (1.0); attend M. Landess deposition (2.0).
Buchwald, Lara Samet	08/10/21	3.6	Prepare for M. Landess deposition (0.6); review and revise supplemental declaration regarding DAE motion (0.7); coordinate resolution related to same (1.4); comment on interim order regarding same (0.3); email with A. Schwartz regarding redactions related to same (0.2); call with same regarding same (0.4).
Graulich, Timothy	08/10/21	2.8	Prepare for deposition of M. Landess.
Piraino, Stephen D.	08/10/21	0.5	Email with T. Graulich and R. Arnold regarding DAE discovery (0.2); correspondence with R. Steinberg regarding same (0.3).
Rincon, Cristina M.	08/10/21	0.2	Review emails with Davis Polk team regarding DAE interim order.
Buchwald, Lara Samet	08/11/21	0.4	Correspondence with Davis Polk team regarding aircraft motion.
Rincon, Cristina M.	08/11/21	1.1	Review and revise Newrest Rule 9019 motion.
Buchwald, Lara Samet	08/12/21	0.5	Analyze DAE discovery (0.3); correspondence with T. Graulich, S. Szanzer, and S. Piraino regarding same (0.2).
Graulich, Timothy	08/12/21	1.2	Review DAE discovery requests
Masaro, Matthew Bruno	08/12/21	0.4	Correspondence with C. Rincon and S. Piraino regarding Newrest litigation.
Rincon, Cristina M.	08/12/21	1.7	Analyze Newrest comments to Newrest Rule 9019 motion (1.5); review DAE discovery document request (0.1); email with Davis Polk team regarding same (0.1).
Szanzer, Steven Z.	08/12/21	0.7	Correspondence with Davis Polk team regarding DAE discovery.
Buchwald, Lara Samet	08/13/21	1.8	Analyze DAE discovery requests (1.1); call with Creditors Committee counsel regarding same (0.2); call with Aeromexico advisor group regarding same (0.5).
Graulich, Timothy	08/13/21	0.6	Correspondence with L. Buchwald regarding discovery requests.
Rincon, Cristina M.	08/13/21	1.3	Correspondence with L. Buchwald DAE discovery (0.2); call with advisors regarding same (0.3); review documents for production (0.5); review supplemental DAE discovery request (0.3).
Szanzer, Steven Z.	08/13/21	1.3	Correspondence with Davis Polk team regarding DAE discovery (0.5); call with co-advisors regarding same (0.5); review email to Management regarding same (0.2); correspondence with Davis Polk team regarding same (0.1).
Buchwald, Lara Samet	08/14/21	0.4	Analyze DAE document request.
Rincon, Cristina M.	08/15/21	0.4	Correspondence with L. Buchwald regarding DAE discovery issues (0.2); email with Davis Polk Restructuring team regarding response to same (0.2).
Buchwald, Lara Samet	08/16/21	1.8	Coordinate supplemental document production (0.6); correspondence with C. Rincon regarding same (0.5); prepare for depositions of 30(b)(6) witnesses (0.7).
Farrell, Annie	08/16/21	0.8	Revise case status summary.

		Time	Detail By Project
Name	Date	Hours	Narrative
Masaro, Matthew	08/16/21	0.3	Correspondence with Willkie Farr, Cleary Gottlieb, C. Rincon,
Bruno Rincon, Cristina M.	08/16/21	3.1	and S. Piraino regarding Newrest litigation. Email with W. Kocovski and M. Landess to schedule deposition preparation (0.2); prepare documents for production (2.7); call with D. Olmedo regarding Newrest settlement agreement (0.1); email with S. Piraino and M. Masaro regarding filing Newrest Rule 9019 motion (0.1).
Szanzer, Steven Z.	08/16/21	0.6	Correspondence with Davis Polk Litigation team, M. Landess, and W. Kocovski regarding DAE discovery and depositions.
Buchwald, Lara Samet	08/17/21	4.5	Preparation for upcoming 30(b)(6) depositions (2.5); coordinate document production (0.2); call with W. Kocovski and others regarding preparation for depositions (1.8).
Rincon, Cristina M.	08/17/21	5.4	Finalize Newrest Rule 9019 motion (1.8); email with Morris Nichols regarding document production (0.3); prepare for W. Kocovski deposition preparation (0.2); correspondence with L. Buchwald to prepare for W. Kocovski deposition (0.2); prepare W. Kocovski for deposition (2.0); review emails regarding request for Board minutes regarding DAE discovery (0.2); review Board minutes regarding same (0.2); email with L. Buchwald regarding same (0.2); review issue regarding disclaimer language for mediation materials (0.3).
Steinberg, Richard J.	08/17/21	0.4	Review documents for discovery production regarding DAE (0.2); email with Davis Polk Litigation team regarding same (0.1); email with Sainz Abogados regarding same (0.1).
Szanzer, Steven Z.	08/17/21	2.2	Correspondence with Davis Polk Litigation team and W. Kocovski regarding DAE deposition preparation (0.3); participate in same (1.9).
Buchwald, Lara Samet	08/18/21	0.4	Coordinate document production.
Rincon, Cristina M.	08/18/21	1.0	Correspondence with L. Buchwald to prepare for M. Landess deposition (0.1); produce Board minutes in response to DAE discovery requests (0.2); prepare M. Landess for deposition (0.4); coordinate filing of notice of hearing on Newrest Rule 9019 motion (0.3).
Szanzer, Steven Z. Buchwald, Lara Samet	08/18/21 08/19/21	0.7 5.2	Participate in M. Landess deposition preparation. Prepare for W. Kocovski deposition (0.5); call with W. Kocovski and others to prepare for same (0.4); defend W. Kocovski deposition (3.1); analyze strategy regarding same (0.6); call with Davis Polk team regarding same and DAE motion (0.6).
Graulich, Timothy Rincon, Cristina M.	08/19/21 08/19/21	0.6 5.9	Call with L. Samet regarding deposition. Prepare W. Kocovski for deposition (0.2); attend deposition of W. Kocovski (3.2); draft summary of W. Kocovski deposition (1.8); email same to Davis Polk Restructuring team and advisors (0.2); correspondence with T. Graulich and L. Buchwald regarding same (0.5).
Szanzer, Steven Z.	08/19/21	0.8	Correspondence with Davis Polk team regarding preparation for W. Kocovski deposition.
Buchwald, Lara Samet	08/20/21	4.5	Prepare for M. Landess deposition (0.8); call with M. Landess regarding same (0.4); defend deposition of M. Landess (2.7); correspondence with Davis Polk team regarding same (0.4); comment on draft summary of deposition (0.2).
Rincon, Cristina M.	08/20/21	5.0	Attend M. Landess deposition (3.8); correspondence with L. Buchwald regarding same (0.2); draft summary of same (1.0).
Szanzer, Steven Z.	08/20/21	0.6	Review updates regarding W. Kocovski deposition (0.3); correspondence with Davis Polk team regarding same (0.3).

Time Detail By Project						
Name	Date	Hours	Narrative			
Melcer, Moshe	08/21/21	0.2	Review summary of deposition.			
Szanzer, Steven Z.	08/22/21	0.5	Correspondence with L. Buchwald regarding DAE depositions			
			(0.3); review summary updates of same (0.2).			
Buchwald, Lara	08/23/21	0.4	Correspondence with S. Szanzer regarding DAE depositions			
Samet			(0.2); correspondence with Davis Polk Restructuring team			
			regarding same (0.2).			
Buchwald, Lara	08/24/21	0.6	Correspondence with Davis Polk team regarding DAE motion			
Samet			(0.2); call with Committee counsel regarding same (0.3);			
			correspondence with S. Szanzer regarding same (0.1).			
Rincon, Cristina M.	08/24/21	2.0	Review W. Kocovski deposition transcript for errata (1.5); call			
			with L. Buchwald and others regarding DAE motion (0.2); call			
	00/00/0/		with Committee counsel regarding same (0.3).			
McClammy, James I.	08/26/21	2.2	Call with Davis Polk team and Morris Nichols regarding			
			potential litigation issue (1.0); correspondence with same			
	00/00/04		regarding same (1.2).			
Melcer, Moshe	08/26/21	1.1	Draft Certificate of No Objection to Newrest Rule 9019 motion			
Dinaina Otanban D	00/00/04	0.0	(0.5); draft notice of cancellation of hearing for same (0.6).			
Piraino, Stephen D.	08/26/21	0.3	Correspondence with Chambers and C. Rincon regarding			
Dinasa Oriatina M	00/00/04	4.7	Newrest hearing.			
Rincon, Cristina M.	08/26/21	1.7	Review and revise Certificate of No Objection to Newrest Rule			
			9019 motion (0.5); email with J. McClammy, M. Melcer			
			regarding same (0.2); correspondence with S. Piraino			
			regarding Newrest motion (0.2); call with Chambers regarding Newrest motion (0.2); correspondence with J. McClammy			
Melcer, Moshe	08/27/21	0.1	regarding same (0.2); draft notice of dismissal (0.4). Review Newrest Rule 9019 motion.			
Rincon, Cristina M.	08/27/21	0.1	Prepare Certificate of No Objection to Newrest Rule 9019			
Milicoli, Clistilla IVI.	00/2//21	0.4	motion (0.3); correspondence with R. Steinberg regarding			
			DAE document production (0.1).			
Bane, Abraham	08/30/21	2.6	Draft Third Removal Extension motion (2.4); correspondence			
Dane, Abraham	00/30/21	2.0	with E. Jerrard regarding same (0.2).			
Bane, Abraham	08/31/21	0.6	Review and revise Third Removal Extension motion (0.4);			
Barro, Abrariani	00/01/21	0.0	correspondence with E. Jerrard and T. Graulich regarding			
			same (0.2).			
Piraino, Stephen D.	08/31/21	0.3	Correspondence with C. Rincon regarding litigation research.			
Rincon, Cristina M.	08/31/21	1.4	Correspondence with S. Piraino regarding standards for			
rancon, oncana m.	00/01/21		exclusivity (0.4); research standards of exclusivity issues (1.0).			
Total AM110 Automa	tic	125.3				
Stay/Litigation	uc	120.0				
AM130 Bar Date/Estir	AM130 Bar Date/Estimation/Claims Allowance Issues					
Melcer, Moshe	08/01/21	2.0	Correspondence with claimants regarding omnibus claim			
*			objections (1.5); revise claimant inbound tracker (0.5).			
Melcer, Moshe	08/02/21	0.5	Email with customer claimant regarding claims issue (0.3);			
			review correspondence from claimant regarding omnibus			
			claim objections (0.2).			
Steinberg, Richard J.	08/02/21	0.4	Respond to informal responses to omnibus claims objections.			
Steinberg, Richard J.	08/02/21	0.3	Email with O'Melveny regarding Ex-Im-related claims			
_			settlement (0.2); email with White & Case regarding same			
			(0.1).			
Melcer, Moshe	08/03/21	1.2	Call with Sainz Abogados and claimant regarding claim			
			objection (0.6); correspondence with R. Steinberg regarding			
			same (0.1); call with AlixPartners and others regarding			
			customer claims (0.4); revise claimant inbound tracker (0.1).			
Steinberg, Richard J.	08/03/21	1.2	Respond to informal responses to claims objections (0.4);			

	Time Detail By Project			
Name	Date	Hours	Narrative	
Melcer, Moshe	08/04/21	3.2	correspondence to Aeromexico regarding claim settlement (0.3); call with the AlixPartners regarding customer claims reconciliation (0.5). Call with Skyworks regarding claim settlements (0.3);	
ivielcer, iviosite	00/04/21	3.2	correspondence with claimants regarding omnibus claim objections (1.5); correspondence with R. Steinberg regarding same (0.5); review and revise claimant inbound tracker (0.6); email with AlixPartners regarding same (0.1); review precedent claim objections (0.2).	
Steinberg, Richard J.	08/04/21	0.9	Respond to informal responses to claim objections (0.3); correspondence with M. Melcer regarding upcoming of omnibus claims objections (0.5); review and revise correspondence to co-advisors regarding same (0.1).	
Melcer, Moshe	08/05/21	2.2	Correspondence with claimants regarding omnibus claim objections (0.3); call with AlixPartners and others regarding same (0.5); call with Sainz Abogados, claimant, and others regarding same (0.4); revise claimant inbound tracker (0.2); email with AlixPartners regarding upcoming omnibus claim objections (0.2); review aircraft related claims (0.6).	
Steinberg, Richard J.	08/05/21	3.3	Respond to informal inbounds received in response to omnibus claims objections (1.9); correspondence with AlixPartners regarding upcoming omnibus claims objections (1.1); email with E. Jerrard and AlixPartners regarding timeline for claims (0.3).	
Melcer, Moshe	08/06/21	0.5	Correspondence with R. Steinberg regarding claims workstreams (0.3); review claimant inbound tracker (0.2).	
Steinberg, Richard J.	08/06/21	1.9	Email with AlixPartners regarding upcoming omnibus claims objections and related customer outreach (0.3); respond to informal responses to omnibus claims objections (1.1); correspondence with M. Melcer regarding same (0.5).	
Szanzer, Steven Z.	08/06/21	0.1	Correspondence with Vedder Price regarding Ex-Im omnibus claims agreement.	
Melcer, Moshe Steinberg, Richard J.	08/07/21 08/07/21	0.2 0.7	Email with R. Steinberg regarding claims workstreams. Email with M. Melcer regarding Certificate of No Objection, revised proposed orders, and revised schedules for omnibus claims objections (0.3); reconcile inbound tracker with claim objection schedules (0.4).	
Melcer, Moshe	08/08/21	2.8	Draft omnibus claims objection (2.1); correspondence with R. Steinberg regarding claims workstreams (0.1); revise claimant inbound tracker (0.4); correspondence with claimant regarding omnibus claim objection (0.2).	
Steinberg, Richard J.	08/08/21	1.4	Email with Aeroméxico regarding claims settlement (0.1); email with Phillips Murrah P.C. regarding same (0.4); respond to informal inbounds received in response to claims objections (0.9).	
Melcer, Moshe	08/09/21	1.4	Correspondence with claimants regarding omnibus claim objections (0.6); review and revise claimant inbound tracker (0.7); correspondence with R. Steinberg regarding same (0.1).	
Steinberg, Richard J.	08/09/21	9.7	Draft Certificates of No Objection to omnibus claims objections (1.5); draft proposed order to same (1.5); draft revised schedules to same (1.5); reconcile claimant inbound tracker with claim objection schedules (1.0); email with the Aeroméxico regarding same (0.1); email with claimants and claimant's counsel regarding omnibus claims objections (0.5); draft omnibus claims objections (3.4); email with Epiq regarding informal claims objection inbounds (0.2).	

Time Detail By Project			
Name	Date	Hours	Narrative
Melcer, Moshe	08/10/21	2.5	Call with White & Case, AlixPartners, and Skyworks regarding claim dispute (0.2); revise schedules for claim objections (1.8); revise claimant inbound tracker (0.1); correspondence with R. Steinberg regarding same (0.2); review transferred claims (0.1); correspondence with R. Steinberg regarding same (0.1).
Piraino, Stephen D.	08/10/21	1.0	Call with counsel to stakeholder, financial advisor to stakeholder, Rothschild and Davis Polk team regarding claims waterfall.
Steinberg, Richard J.	08/10/21	7.8	Call with Skyworks, White & Case, and AlixPartners regarding Mission Air claim (0.2); email with Skyworks regarding same (0.1); email with White & Case regarding Ex-Im facility claims (0.5); draft omnibus claims objections (3.4); prepare summary of omnibus claims objections (1.0); email with AlixPartners regarding same (0.2); correspondence with M. Melcer regarding same (0.3); respond to informal responses to claims objections (0.5); correspondence with international airport regarding same (0.5); correspondence with Chambers regarding claims filings (0.5); review and revise Certificates of No Objection to omnibus claims objections (0.3); review claim transfers on docket (0.3).
Melcer, Moshe	08/11/21	4.7	Correspondence with R. Steinberg regarding claimant correspondence (0.1); correspondence with same regarding claims workstreams (0.2); call with AlixPartners and others regarding upcoming omnibus claim objections (0.7); revise omnibus claim objection schedules (1.3); revise Certificates of No Objection to omnibus claims objections (0.9); email with Chambers regarding same (1.2); correspondence with T. Green regarding fleet claims settlement (0.3).
Steinberg, Richard J.	08/11/21	1.1	Call with AlixPartners regarding omnibus claims objections and other claims reconciliation issues (0.6); email with AlixPartners regarding fleet claim settlement (0.5).
Melcer, Moshe	08/12/21	1.1	Review claim objection orders (0.2); revise omnibus claims objection (0.1); analyze letter from claimant (0.3); revise claimant inbound tracker (0.2); review emails from AlixPartners regarding upcoming claim objections (0.2); correspondence with R. Steinberg regarding same (0.1).
Sokol, Nate Steinberg, Richard J.	08/12/21 08/12/21	0.1 3.2	Email with R. Steinberg regarding omnibus claims objections. Email with N. Sokol regarding claims workstreams (0.2);review and revise omnibus claims objections (0.5); email with AlixPartners regarding same (0.3); email with Epiq regarding same (0.1); respond to informal inbounds received in response to claims objections (0.8); draft notices regarding omnibus claims objections (1.3).
Melcer, Moshe	08/13/21	5.1	Review and revise omnibus claims objection (4.1); call with R. Steinberg regarding same (0.3); call with AlixPartners and Epiq regarding same (0.4); revise claimant inbound tracker (0.1); correspondence with claimant regarding omnibus claims objections (0.2).
Sokol, Nate	08/13/21	0.5	Call with AlixPartners and Epiq regarding omnibus claims objections.
Steinberg, Richard J.	08/13/21	4.7	Call with AlixPartners and Epiq regarding omnibus claims objections (0.4); review and revise notice to customer regarding omnibus claims objection (3.1); email with Aeroméxico regarding same (0.3); email with Sainz Abogados regarding same (0.2); email with AlixPartners regarding same (0.4); call with M. Melcer regarding same (0.3).

Time Detail By Project			
Name	Date	Hours	Narrative
Melcer, Moshe	08/14/21	0.6	Review and revise omnibus claims objections.
Steinberg, Richard J.	08/14/21	2.8	Review and revise omnibus claims objections (2.0); review
· · · · · · · · · · · · · · · ·			draft schedules regarding same (0.3); email with AlixPartners
			regarding same (0.5).
Melcer, Moshe	08/15/21	2.8	Review and revise omnibus claims objections.
Steinberg, Richard J.	08/15/21	2.7	Review and revise omnibus claims objections (2.4); email with
J ,			AlixPartners regarding same (0.3).
Melcer, Moshe	08/16/21	3.7	Review and revise omnibus claim objections (3.5);
•			correspondence with R. Steinberg regarding same (0.2).
Steinberg, Richard J.	08/16/21	5.9	Review and revise schedules to omnibus claims objections
•			(1.5); review and revise omnibus claims objections (2.1);
			review correspondence to the Aeroméxico regarding same
			(0.2); correspondence with M. Melcer regarding same (1.0);
			correspondence with AlixPartners regarding claims objections
			(1.1).
Steinberg, Richard J.	08/16/21	0.4	Email with O'Melveny regarding claims settlement (0.2); email
			to White & Case regarding same (0.2).
Szanzer, Steven Z.	08/16/21	0.5	Correspondence with T. Green and R. Steinberg regarding
			fleet claim settlement (0.3); correspondence with T. Graulich
			regarding same (0.2).
Melcer, Moshe	08/17/21	3.6	Call with Davis Polk Restructuring team regarding fleet claims
			(0.5); email with Skyworks regarding fleet claims settlement
			(0.2); review and revise omnibus claims objection (2.7);
			correspondence with R. Steinberg regarding same (0.2).
Steinberg, Richard J.	08/17/21	4.5	Review and revise omnibus claims objections (3.5); draft Ex-
			Im claims summary (1.0).
Melcer, Moshe	08/18/21	1.6	Finalize omnibus claims objections (1.1); email with Chambers
			regarding same (0.3); email with Aeroméxico regarding same
	22112121		(0.1); email with T. Graulich regarding same (0.1).
Steinberg, Richard J.	08/18/21	3.9	Review and revise omnibus claims objections (2.8); call with
			Epiq and AlixPartners regarding same (0.2); correspondence
Otaliahaan Diahaad I	00/40/04	0.0	with M. Melcer regarding same (0.9).
Steinberg, Richard J.	08/18/21	0.3	Call with AlixPartners regarding Ex-Im claims.
Melcer, Moshe	08/19/21	0.8	Analyze claim objection (0.2); correspondence with claimant
			regarding claim objection (0.4); revise claimant inbound
Steinberg, Richard J.	08/19/21	1.0	tracker (0.2). Respond to informal inbounds received in response to claims
Stelliberg, Richard J.	00/19/21	1.0	objections.
Melcer, Moshe	08/20/21	0.1	Review correspondence with claimant regarding omnibus
Wichell, Wiosite	00/20/21	0.1	claim objection.
Piraino, Stephen D.	08/20/21	0.3	Email with M. Melcer and R. Steinberg regarding claims
r iraino, otoprion b.	00/20/21	0.5	issues.
Steinberg, Richard J.	08/20/21	0.8	Correspondence with counsel to Commercial Aviation
etemberg, raenara e.	00/20/21	0.0	International regarding claims objection (0.3); review
			Commercial Aviation International claim (0.3); email with S.
			Piraino regarding claims transfers (0.2).
Melcer, Moshe	08/23/21	1.4	Correspond with claimants regarding claim objections (0.7);
,			revise claimant inbound tracker (0.3); analyze objected claims
			(0.3); email with Clifford Chance regarding claims settlement
			(0.1).
Steinberg, Richard J.	08/23/21	0.3	Respond to informal inbounds received in response to claims
.			objections.
Melcer, Moshe	08/24/21	0.5	Call with Clifford Chance regarding claims settlement.
Steinberg, Richard J.	08/24/21	0.6	Respond to informal inbounds received in response to claims
3 .			objections.
Melcer, Moshe	08/25/21	0.2	Review correspondence with claimant regarding claim

		Time	Detail By Project
Name	Date	Hours	Narrative
Steinberg, Richard J.	08/25/21	0.6	objection. Respond to informal inbounds received in response to omnibus claims objections (0.5); email with AlixPartners regarding same (0.1).
Dekhtyar, Mariya	08/26/21	0.4	Call with M. Melcer and R. Steinberg regarding onboarding on claims workstreams.
Melcer, Moshe	08/26/21	2.9	Analyze claims issue (1.6); call with R. Steinberg and M. Dekhtyar regarding claims workstreams (0.4); review correspondence with claimants related to claim objections (0.5); revise claimant correspondence tracker (0.4).
Steinberg, Richard J.	08/26/21	2.3	Respond to informal inbounds received in response to omnibus claims objections (0.9); research priority claims issues (0.9); call with M. Melcer and M. Dekhtyar regarding claims workstreams (0.5).
Dekhtyar, Mariya	08/27/21	0.3	Review correspondence with M. Melcer and R. Steinberg regarding customer claims.
Melcer, Moshe	08/27/21	0.1	Analyze priority claims issues.
Steinberg, Richard J.	08/27/21	5.1	Respond to informal inbounds received in response to omnibus claims objections (2.9); review and revise correspondence to Aeroméxico regarding customer claims reconciliation (1.8); call with E. Jerrard regarding same (0.4).
Jerrard, Erik	08/29/21	1.1	Call with R. Steinberg regarding customer claims reconciliation (0.4); review related claims materials (0.7).
Dekhtyar, Mariya	08/30/21	0.7	Review correspondence with R. Steinberg, M. Melcer and others regarding customer claims (0.3); review emails with M. Melcer and claimant regarding same (0.1); revise claimant inbound tracker (0.2); email with M. Melcer regarding same (0.1).
Jerrard, Erik Melcer, Moshe	08/30/21 08/30/21	0.4 1.5	Email with creditor regarding omnibus claims objections. Email with Epiq regarding claims settlements (0.2); email with AlixPartners regarding same (0.2); analyze claims on claim objection (0.4); correspondence with claimant regarding claim objection (0.3); review claimant inbound tracker (0.3); correspondence with R. Steinberg regarding claims workstreams (0.1).
Steinberg, Richard J.	08/30/21	4.9	Review correspondence received from the Aeroméxico regarding settlements with certain airport vendors and agreement with Embraer (2.5); respond to informal inbounds received in response to omnibus claims objections (1.8); email with Aeroméxico regarding claims settlements (0.2); email with AlixPartners regarding amended claim inbound (0.4).
Szanzer, Steven Z.	08/30/21	0.4	Correspondence with M. Melcer and R. Steinberg regarding direction to Epiq regarding claims.
Dekhtyar, Mariya	08/31/21	3.0	Review emails with M. Melcer, R. Steinberg, and others regarding omnibus claims objections (0.2); review emails with R. Steinberg and others regarding same (0.1); research case law regarding claim priority issues (2.2); email with R. Steinberg regarding summary of case law on omnibus claims objections issues (0.5).
Melcer, Moshe	08/31/21	0.6	Correspondence with claimant regarding omnibus claim objection (0.3); revise claimant inbound tracker (0.2); correspondence with R. Steinberg regarding same (0.1).
Steinberg, Richard J.	08/31/21	4.8	Extensive correspondence to Aeroméxico regarding claim settlements (2.5); review response filed to omnibus claims objection (0.6); correspondence with claimant regarding claim response (0.5); respond to informal inbounds received in

		Time I	Detail By Project
Name	Date	Hours	Narrative
			response to omnibus claims objections (0.8); review precedent regarding Section 507 claims (0.4).
Total AM130 Bar		134.1	
Date/Estimation/Clair	ns		
Allowance Issues			
AM140 Corporate Go	vernance. Board	d Matters and	1 Communications
Piraino, Stephen D.	08/10/21	0.2	Review and revise Board minutes.
Piraino, Stephen D.	08/12/21	0.3	Review and revise Board minutes.
Graulich, Timothy	08/15/21	8.0	Call with H. Parkhill regarding Restructuring Committee
•			meeting (0.4); call with A. Conesa regarding Restructuring
			Committee meeting (0.4).
Graulich, Timothy	08/16/21	1.8	Attend Restructuring Committee meeting.
Masaro, Matthew	08/16/21	3.8	Research issues regarding presentation to the Board (2.8);
Bruno			review and revise same (1.0).
Piraino, Stephen D.	08/16/21	2.2	Attend Restructuring Committee meeting (1.8);
			correspondence with Davis Polk regarding Board materials for
			same (0.4).
Steinberg, Richard J.	08/16/21	0.3	Correspondence with S. Piraino regarding preparation of
Outside Time Alexa	00/47/04	4.0	Board materials for Restructuring Committee meeting.
Graulich, Timothy	08/17/21	1.0	Attend Restructuring Committee meeting.
Masaro, Matthew	08/17/21	0.8	Review and revise presentation to the Board (0.5);
Bruno			correspondence with R. Steinberg and others regarding same
Piraino, Stephen D.	08/17/21	2.5	(0.3). Attend Restructuring Committee meeting (1.0);
r Iraino, Stephen D.	00/17/21	2.0	correspondence with R. Steinberg and M. Masaro regarding
			Board materials (0.4); review and revise Board materials for
			Restructuring Committee meeting (0.8); correspondence with
			R. Steinberg regarding Board material (0.3).
Steinberg, Richard J.	08/17/21	3.2	Review and draft analysis on contracts and assumption
			considerations for Board.
Steinberg, Richard J.	08/18/21	0.9	Email with AlixPartners regarding same (0.2); correspondence
O ,			with S. Piraino and T. Graulich regarding same (0.7).
Graulich, Timothy	08/19/21	2.3	Review and comment on presentation to the Board.
Graulich, Timothy	08/20/21	0.6	Attend Restructuring Committee meeting.
Piraino, Stephen D.	08/20/21	1.6	Attend Restructuring Committee meeting.
Steinberg, Richard J.	08/20/21	0.7	Review Board materials (0.5); email with S. Piraino regarding
			same (0.2).
Graulich, Timothy	08/21/21	2.8	Review and revise presentation to the Board.
Masaro, Matthew	08/22/21	0.5	Review and revise presentation to Board (0.3);
Bruno	00/00/04	2.4	correspondence with S. Piraino regarding same (0.2).
Piraino, Stephen D.	08/22/21	3.4	Review and revise Board materials for Restructuring
Steinberg, Richard J.	08/22/21	0.8	Committee meeting. Review and revise presentation to the Board.
Graulich, Timothy	08/23/21	3.3	Call with A. Conesa, J. Arrigunaga, R. Sanchez Baker and
Graditori, Timotriy	00/23/21	5.5	others regarding governance and exit issues (0.8); review and
			revise Board materials for Restructuring Committee meeting
			(0.9); attend board meeting (1.6).
Piraino, Stephen D.	08/23/21	2.8	Review and revise Board materials for Restructuring
, ,			Committee meeting (0.4); call with A. Conesa, J. Arrigunaga,
			R. Sanchez Baker and others regarding governance and exit
			issues (0.8); attend Board meeting (1.6).
Graulich, Timothy	08/24/21	4.9	Correspondence with S. Piraino regarding Board meeting
			(2.2); prepare for Board meeting (2.7).
Huebner, Marshall S.	08/24/21	1.8	Correspondence with A. Conesa, J. Arrigunaga, R. Sanchez

		Time	Detail By Project
Name	Date	Hours	Narrative
Jerrard, Erik	08/24/21	5.2	Baker and others regarding governance and exit issues (0.8); correspondence with T. Graulich regarding same (0.3); call with management, financial advisors and Special Committee regarding same (0.7). Draft Board materials for Restructuring Committee meeting (2.4); correspondence with S. Piraino regarding same (1.1); call with Aeroméxico and co-advisors regarding Board
Piraino, Stephen D.	08/24/21	3.4	meeting and related materials (1.7). Call with Aeroméxico team and co-advisors regarding Board meeting and related materials (1.7); review and revise Board metarials for Board related materials (2.7);
Steinberg, Richard J.	08/24/21	1.0	materials for Restructuring Committee meeting (1.7). Draft presentation to the Board (0.8); correspondence with S. Piraino regarding same (0.2).
Szanzer, Steven Z.	08/24/21	1.5	Call with Aeroméxico and co-advisors regarding upcoming Board call (1.1); correspondence with Davis Polk Restructuring team regarding same (0.4).
Graulich, Timothy	08/25/21	4.1	Call with H. Parkhill regarding presentation to Restructuring Committee (0.6); call with A. Conesa regarding Board call (0.7); attend Restructuring Committee meeting (2.8).
Jerrard, Erik	08/25/21	6.1	Call with Rothschild, Davis Polk regarding Board materials for Restructuring Committee meeting (0.9); review and revise Board materials for Restructuring Committee meeting (1.7); call with advisors and Aeroméxico to prepare for Restructuring Committee meeting (0.5); attend Board meeting (1.8); correspondence with S. Piraino regarding same (0.4); attend
Piraino, Stephen D.	08/25/21	5.2	Restructuring Committee meeting (0.8). Revise Board materials for Restructuring Committee meeting (0.4); call with Rothschild and Davis Polk Restructuring team regarding same (0.8); call with Aeroméxico team regarding Board meeting (1.0); attend Board meeting (2.5); review and
Steinberg, Richard J.	08/25/21	2.0	revise Board resolutions (0.5). Review Board materials (0.8); draft presentation regarding same (0.9); correspondence with S. Piraino regarding same
Szanzer, Steven Z.	08/25/21	0.4	(0.3). Correspondence with T. Graulich regarding Board meeting (0.2); review email regarding same (0.2).
Graulich, Timothy Jerrard, Erik	08/27/21 08/28/21	1.2 2.6	Attend Restructuring Committee meeting. Review and revise Board materials (2.3); email with T. Graulich regarding same (0.3).
Huebner, Marshall S.	08/29/21	0.8	Correspondence with Davis Polk team regarding Apollo letter to Board.
Jerrard, Erik	08/29/21	1.5	Email with Aeroméxico regarding upcoming Board meeting and related materials (0.4); review and revise related materials (1.1).
Graulich, Timothy Jerrard, Erik	08/30/21 08/30/21	1.2 5.1	Attend Restructuring Committee meeting. Correspondence with S. Piraino and T. Graulich regarding Restructuring Committee meeting (1.5); correspondence with S. Piraino regarding same (0.3); attend Restructuring Committee meeting (1.2); review and revise materials for same (2.1).
Graulich, Timothy	08/31/21	1.8	Attend Restructuring Committee meeting (1.2); prepare for same (0.6).
Jerrard, Erik	08/31/21	1.7	Attend Restructuring committee meeting (1.2); correspondence with S. Piraino regarding same (0.5).
Piraino, Stephen D.	08/31/21	1.2	Attend Restructuring Committee meeting.

	Time Detail By Project				
Name	Date	Hours	Narrative		
	Total AM140 Corporate Governance, Board Matters and Communications				
AM150 Creditor/UCC	/AHC Issues				
Szanzer, Steven Z.	08/04/21	0.2	Correspondence with Davis Polk Restructuring team regarding claims trading.		
Piraino, Stephen D.	08/09/21	0.9	Attend weekly call with Creditors Committee advisor and Debtor co-advisors (AlixPartners, Skyworks, others).		
Jerrard, Erik	08/10/21	8.0	Attend weekly call with Creditors Committee advisor and		
Masaro, Matthew Bruno	08/10/21	0.8	Debtor co-advisors (AlixPartners, Skyworks, others). Attend weekly call with Creditors Committee advisor and Debtor co-advisors (AlixPartners, Skyworks, others).		
Piraino, Stephen D.	08/10/21	0.4	Attend weekly call with Creditors Committee advisor and Debtor co-advisors (AlixPartners, Skyworks, others) (0.4) (partial attendance).		
Steinberg, Richard J.	08/10/21	0.8	Attend weekly call with Creditors Committee advisor and Debtor co-advisors (AlixPartners, Skyworks, others).		
Steinberg, Richard J.	08/11/21	1.8	Correspondence with S. Piraino regarding PLM amendment (0.4); call with K. Lee regarding PLM amendment (0.3); correspondence with UCC and Apollo regarding same (0.9); email with K. Lee regarding same (0.2).		
Piraino, Stephen D.	08/13/21	0.3	Correspondence with Willkie team regarding intercompany balances.		
Masaro, Matthew Bruno	08/17/21	0.8	Attend weekly call with Creditors Committee and Aeroméxico advisors.		
Steinberg, Richard J.	08/17/21	0.8	Attend weekly call with Creditors Committee and Aeroméxico advisors.		
Piraino, Stephen D.	08/22/21	0.7	Call with Willkie Farr regarding creditor issues.		
Jerrard, Erik	08/24/21	8.0	Attend weekly update call with Creditors Committee professionals, debtors and co-advisors (partial attendance).		
Masaro, Matthew Bruno	08/24/21	1.4	Attend weekly update call with Creditors Committee professionals, debtors and co-advisors.		
Piraino, Stephen D.	08/24/21	1.1	Attend weekly update call with Creditors Committee professionals, debtors and co-advisors (partial attendance).		
Rincon, Cristina M.	08/24/21	0.1	Review reservation of rights filed by Creditors Committee.		
Steinberg, Richard J.	08/24/21	1.3	Attend weekly update call with Creditors Committee		
-			professionals, debtors and co-advisors.		
Rincon, Cristina M.	08/25/21	1.4	Review M. Landess deposition for errata.		
Piraino, Stephen D.	08/30/21	1.6	Attend meeting with creditor advisors regarding business plan and related issues.		
Jerrard, Erik	08/31/21	8.0	Attend weekly update call with Creditors Committee professionals, debtors and co-advisors.		
Piraino, Stephen D.	08/31/21	0.7	Attend weekly update call with Creditors Committee professionals, debtors and co-advisors.		
Total AM150 Creditor Issues	r/UCC/AHC	17.5			
			-Aircraft Contract Issues		
Katz, Michael	08/01/21	0.1	Correspondence regarding status of engine purchase.		
Katz, Michael	08/02/21	0.3	Call with Aeroméxico and AlixPartners regarding vendor		
Piraino, Stephen D.	08/02/21	0.2	payment escalations. Call with Aeroméxico and AlixPartners regarding vendor		
•			payment escalations.		
Katz, Michael	08/04/21	0.3	Call with Aeroméxico and AlixPartners regarding vendor		

		Time	Detail By Project
Name	Date	Hours	Narrative
Piraino, Stephen D.	08/04/21	0.3	payment escalations. Call with Aeroméxico and AlixPartners regarding vendor payment escalations.
Buchwald, Lara Samet	08/06/21	1.1	Review lease assumption motion and supporting documentation (0.7); correspondence with J. McClammy regarding same (0.2); correspondence with S. Szanzer regarding same (0.2).
Masaro, Matthew Bruno	08/06/21	0.8	Review and revise notice of contract assumption (0.6); correspondence with M. Melcer and others regarding same (0.2).
Melcer, Moshe	08/06/21	0.4	Draft notice of contract assumption.
Steinberg, Richard J.	08/08/21	0.9	Review proposed new product implementation commencement (0.5); review proposed PLM letter agreement (0.3); email with K. Lee regarding same (0.1).
Katz, Michael	08/09/21	0.2	Call with Aeroméxico and AlixPartners regarding vendor payment escalations.
Masaro, Matthew Bruno	08/09/21	0.7	Review and revise notice of contract assumption (0.2); correspondence with T. Graulich, S. Piraino, Willkie Farr, and Cleary Gottlieb regarding same (0.5).
Katz, Michael	08/11/21	0.2	Call with Aeroméxico and AlixPartners regarding vendor payment escalations.
Piraino, Stephen D.	08/11/21	0.4	Correspondence with R. Steinberg regarding vendor issues (0.2); call with Aeroméxico and AlixPartners regarding vendor payment escalations (0.2).
Masaro, Matthew Bruno	08/16/21	1.0	Review and revise engine contract (0.8); correspondence with S. Piraino, Aeroméxico, and others regarding same (0.2).
Steinberg, Richard J. Katz, Michael	08/17/21 08/18/21	0.4 1.0	Email with AlixPartners regarding executory contracts. Call with Aeroméxico and AlixPartners regarding vendor payment escalations (0.7); email with vendor counsel regarding contract issues (0.1); email with S. Piraino regarding outstanding vendor request (0.1); email with Aeroméxico regarding vendor contract issues (0.1).
Masaro, Matthew Bruno	08/18/21	0.2	Correspondence with M. Melcer regarding contract rejections.
Steinberg, Richard J.	08/18/21	1.5	Call with AlixPartners regarding executory contracts (0.9); correspondence with S. Ford regarding same (0.1); review precedent regarding same (0.5).
Masaro, Matthew Bruno	08/20/21	1.0	Review contract assumption procedures (0.3); correspond with K. Lee, R. Steinberg, AlixPartners, others regarding same (0.7).
Steinberg, Richard J.	08/20/21	0.9	Review Amadeus amendments (0.4); call with K. Lee regarding same (0.2); email with Aeroméxico regarding same (0.1); correspondence with M. Masaro regarding same (0.2).
Masaro, Matthew Bruno	08/21/21	0.3	Correspondence with K. Lee regarding contract assumption.
Katz, Michael	08/23/21	0.2	Call with Aeroméxico and AlixPartners regarding vendor payment escalations.
Masaro, Matthew Bruno	08/23/21	0.4	Correspondence with AlixPartners, others regarding contract assumption.
O'Sullivan, Damian	08/23/21	1.7	Research and summarize issues regarding contract assumption (1.6); correspondence with M. Masaro regarding same (0.1).
Piraino, Stephen D.	08/23/21	0.2	Call with Aeroméxico and AlixPartners regarding vendor payment escalations.
Katz, Michael	08/25/21	0.3	Call with Aeroméxico and AlixPartners regarding vendor payment escalations.

Time Detail By Project			
Name	Date	Hours	Narrative
Masaro, Matthew Bruno	08/26/21	0.6	Review and revise notice of contract assumption (0.3); correspondence with AlixPartners and others regarding same (0.3).
Masaro, Matthew Bruno	08/27/21	0.6	Correspondence with M. Melcer, Cleary Gottlieb, Willkie Farr, and others regarding contract assumptions.
Masaro, Matthew Bruno	08/30/21	0.2	Correspondence with P. Garg and others regarding notice of contract assumption.
Melcer, Moshe	08/30/21	0.1	Correspondence with P. Garg regarding notice of contract assumption.
Melcer, Moshe	08/31/21	0.3	Review notice of contract assumption.
Total AM170 Customer/Vendor/No Lease/Non-Aircraft C Issues		16.8	
AM180 Employee/Per Piraino, Stephen D.	nsion Issues 08/11/21	0.6	Correspondence with J. Wallden and T. Perez regarding labor issues.
Total AM180 Employers	ee/Pension	0.6	
AM190 Financing Bane, Abraham	08/01/21	7.8	Correspondence with E. Jerrard regarding Meditation Statement (0.6); call with Davis Polk Restructuring team regarding same (0.4); review presentation on mediation (0.4); draft Mediation Statement (5.4); prepare exhibits for same
Graulich, Timothy	08/01/21	11.1	(0.6); review proposed Mediation order (0.4). Call with counsel to potential exit financing provider regarding mediation (0.4); review and revise Mediation order (0.5); review and revise Mediation Statement (8.8); call with A.
Jerrard, Erik	08/01/21	3.3	Conesa regarding Mediation Statement (1.4). Review and revise Mediation Statement (3.1); correspondence
Masaro, Matthew Bruno	08/01/21	10.1	with A. Bane regarding same (0.2). Review and revise Mediation Statement (4.6); correspondence with T. Graulich, S. Piraino, E. Jerrard, A. Bane, R. Steinberg, and others regarding same (2.9); review and revise Mediation order (1.2); correspondence with same regarding same (1.4).
O'Sullivan, Damian	08/01/21	1.8	Review and revise Mediation order (1.3); correspondence with M. Masaro regarding same (0.2); review correspondence from
Piraino, Stephen D.	08/01/21	3.1	Davis Polk team regarding comments regarding same (0.3). Call with Davis Polk Restructuring team regarding Mediation Statement (0.4); correspondence with M. Masaro and D. Herts regarding same (0.2); correspondence with R. Steinberg regarding same (0.2); review and revise Mediation order (0.4);
Steinberg, Richard J.	08/01/21	8.1	review and revise Mediation Statement (1.9). Extensive drafting of Mediation Statement (7.7); call with Davis Polk Restructuring team regarding same (0.4).
Bane, Abraham	08/02/21	4.7	Correspondence with E. Jerrard regarding Mediation Statement (0.6); call with Davis Polk Restructuring team regarding preparation for mediation (0.8); draft Mediation Statement (3.1); review Mediation proposed order (0.2).
Graulich, Timothy	08/02/21	10.4	Call with A. Conesa and R. Sanchez Baker regarding mediation (0.9); call with H. Parkhill and L. Donahue regarding same (0.5); correspondence with E. Jerrard regarding Mediation Statement (0.4); correspondence with S. Piraino

		Time	Detail By Project
Name	Date	Hours	Narrative
Jerrard, Erik	08/02/21	10.2	regarding mediation (1.8); extensive review and finalize Mediation Statement (6.8). Extensive review and revision of Mediation Statement (5.9); call with Aeroméxico regarding same (0.6); correspondence
			with A. Bane regarding same (0.1); call with S. Piraino and others regarding same (0.3); call with Davis Polk Restructuring team regarding mediation preparation (1.0); prepare for mediation, including detailed analysis of Section 2.12 (1.7); attend daily contingency update call with Aeroméxico and Rothschild (0.6).
Katz, Michael	08/02/21	0.4	Review DIP credit agreement and collateral assignment agreements for collateral notice to DIP agent.
Masaro, Matthew Bruno	08/02/21	13.5	Extensive review and revision of Mediation Statement (6.7); extensive correspondence with R. Steinberg, S. Piraino, and others regarding same (4.3); review and revise Mediation order (1.8); correspondence with T. Graulich and others regarding same (0.7).
McClammy, James I.	08/02/21	1.0	Review and comment on Mediation order (0.2); review and comment on Mediation Statement (0.8).
Melcer, Moshe	08/02/21	6.1	Extensive review and revise Mediation Statement (5.7); correspondence regarding mediation preparation (0.4).
O'Sullivan, Damian	08/02/21	8.0	Review Mediation order and precedents regarding same (0.6); correspondence with M. Masaro regarding same (0.2).
Piraino, Stephen D.	08/02/21	9.2	Attend daily contingency update call with Aeroméxico and Rothschild (0.6); correspondence with Davis Polk team regarding Mediation order (0.9); extensive correspondence
			with Davis Polk team and others regarding Mediation Statement (1.9); call with E. Jerrard and others regarding same (0.3); review and revise Mediation Statement (2.2); call with Aeroméxico regarding same (0.4); correspondence with mediator's Chambers regarding same (0.2); call with Sainz Abogados regarding same (0.2); correspondence with T. Graulich and E. Jerrard regarding mediation (0.4); call with Willkie Farr and others regarding same (0.9); call with Davis Polk Restructuring team regarding preparation for same (1.0); correspondence with M. Masaro regarding same (0.2).
Steinberg, Richard J.	08/02/21	9.9	Draft Mediation Statement (6.0); correspondence with AlixPartners and other co-advisors regarding same (1.1); correspondence with M. Melcer regarding same (0.3); correspondence with S. Piraino regarding same (0.4); correspondence with A. Bane and M. Masaro regarding same (0.6); correspondence with the Sainz regarding same (0.3); review and revise presentation on mediation (0.8); correspondence with S. Piraino regarding same (0.2); email with AlixPartners regarding same (0.2).
Bane, Abraham	08/03/21	1.7	Attend mediation (1.6) (partial attendance); correspondence with S. Ford regarding same (0.1).
Graulich, Timothy	08/03/21	10.1	Call with A. Conesa and R. Sanchez Baker regarding preparation for Mediation session (0.8); prepare for Mediation (5.4); call with Judge Lane and others regarding mediation (1.0); attend Mediation (1.6); call with H. Parkhill regarding proposal (1.3).
Jerrard, Erik	08/03/21	4.6	Attend mediation (2.5); correspondence with S. Piraino regarding same (0.3); correspondence with T. Graulich, S. Piraino, and S. Szanzer regarding same (1.1); correspondence with T. Graulich and S. Szanzer regarding

		Time	Detail By Project
Name	Date	Hours	Narrative
Katz, Michael	08/03/21	1.4	exit financing regarding same (0.7). Review DIP credit agreement and collateral assignment agreement (0.9); prepare notice to DIP administrative agent of new collateral (0.3); email with V. Jackson regarding same (0.2).
Masaro, Matthew Bruno	08/03/21	7.4	Correspondence with M. Melcer and S. Piraino regarding mediation (1.0); attend mediation (2.5); prepare for same (0.5); review and revise Mediation order (0.8); correspondence with counsel to stakeholder, counsel to potential exit financing provider, and others regarding same (1.7); correspondence with S. Piraino regarding same (0.5); correspondence with Rothschild and AlixPartners regarding same (0.4).
McClammy, James I.	08/03/21	3.0	Attend mediation (2.5); review materials in preparation for same (0.5).
Melcer, Moshe	08/03/21	2.5	Correspondence with Davis Polk team regarding mediation preparation (0.5); attend mediation (2.0) (partial attendance).
Piraino, Stephen D.	08/03/21	7.8	Attend daily contingency update call with Aeroméxico and Rothschild (0.9); correspondence with T. Graulich regarding mediation (0.4); prepare for mediation (1.4); attend mediation (2.5); call with Davis Polk Restructuring team regarding same (1.2); review and revise Mediation order (0.7); correspondence with M. Masaro regarding same (0.3); email with Davis Polk team regarding same (0.4).
Steinberg, Richard J.	08/03/21	2.5	Attend mediation (2.2) (partial attendance); correspondence with Davis Polk team regarding summary of same (0.3).
Szanzer, Steven Z.	08/03/21	3.5	Attend mediation (2.5); correspondence with Davis Polk team regarding same (1.0).
Graulich, Timothy	08/04/21	5.7	Call with A. Conesa and R. Sanchez regarding mediation and exit financing proposals (0.9); correspondence with S. Piraino regarding Mediation order (0.5); review revised Mediation order (0.4); call with Judge Lane regarding mediation (0.8); review revised equity exit financing commitment (1.7); review revised debt exit financing commitment (1.4).
Huebner, Marshall S. Jerrard, Erik	08/04/21 08/04/21	0.3 4.9	Correspondence with T. Graulich regarding mediation. Call with counsel to stakeholder and others regarding Mediation order (0.3); correspondence with S. Piraino regarding same (0.4); review proposals for cleansing sensitivity (0.7); research and analyze mediation confidentiality issues (1.0); correspondence with J. Weiner regarding same (0.4); call with Davis Polk Restructuring team regarding mediation (1.1); email with Davis Polk Corporate team regarding update on same (0.4); attend daily contingency update call with Aeroméxico and Rothschild (0.6) (partial attendance).
Masaro, Matthew Bruno	08/04/21	4.2	Call with counsel to stakeholder and others regarding Mediation order (0.5); call with same regarding exit financing Non-Disclosure Agreement (0.5); call with Davis Polk Restructuring team regarding same (0.7) (partial attendance); correspondence with same regarding same and Mediation order (0.7); review and revise Mediation order (0.4); correspondence with Chambers, counsel to stakeholder, and others regarding same (1.4).
Piraino, Stephen D.	08/04/21	5.8	Call with counsel to stakeholder and others regarding Mediation order (0.6); email with same regarding mediation (0.4); correspondence with M. Masaro regarding same (0.4); correspondence with T. Kessler regarding same (0.2); 31

		Time	Detail By Project
Name	Date	Hours	Narrative
			correspondence with E. Jerrard regarding same (0.3); correspondence with counsel to potential exit financing provider regarding same (0.3); correspondence with J. Margolin regarding same (0.1); call with Davis Polk Restructuring team regarding same (1.1); email with same regarding mediation information sharing (0.3); email with same regarding mediation (0.2); review and analyze mediation issues (1.0); attend daily contingency update call with
Steinberg, Richard J.	08/04/21	0.2	Aeroméxico and Rothschild (0.9). Correspondence with M. Masaro regarding mediation.
Szanzer, Steven Z.	08/04/21	1.2	Attend daily contingency update call with Aeroméxico and Rothschild (1.0); correspondence with Davis Polk team regarding exit financing proposal (0.2).
Graulich, Timothy	08/05/21	4.5	Call with same and Judge Lane regarding same (1.0); call with A. Conesa and R. Sanchez Baker regarding mediation (0.8); correspondence with S. Piraino and E. Jerrard regarding mediation and Plan (0.6); call with H. Parkhill regarding final valuation materials (0.7); call with Judge Lane regarding mediation strategy (1.4).
Jerrard, Erik	08/05/21	3.0	Call with potential bidder advisors and Debtor professionals regarding mediation information sharing (0.4); review relevant documents to prepare for same (0.3); attend mediation (0.4); call with Rothschild, AlixPartners, and others regarding schedule 2.12 and related timeline (0.8); analyze schedule 2.12 relating to same (1.1).
Masaro, Matthew Bruno	08/05/21	1.7	Call with counsel to stakeholder and others regarding Mediation order and proposal sharing (0.5); correspondence with same, counsel to potential exit financing provider, and others regarding same (0.4); attend mediation (0.4); correspondence with M. Melcer and others regarding same (0.4).
Melcer, Moshe	08/05/21	0.7	Email with S. Piraino and E. Jerrard regarding mediation (0.4); correspondence with M. Masaro regarding same (0.2); email with T. Graulich regarding same (0.1).
Piraino, Stephen D.	08/05/21	7.7	Attend daily contingency update call with Aeroméxico and Rothschild (0.6); attend mediation (0.4); prepare for same (0.2); correspondence with E. Jerrard regarding mediation (0.3); correspondence with Davis Polk team regarding Mediation order (0.4); correspondence with Rothschild regarding mediation (0.3); correspondence with J. Margolin regarding same (0.2); correspondence with T. Graulich regarding same (0.4); correspondence with T. Kessler regarding same (0.3); correspondence with counsel to potential exit financing provider regarding same (0.3); draft correspondence to mediation parties regarding same (0.2); correspondence with T. Graulich and E. Jerrard regarding same (1.8); correspondence with M. Masaro regarding same (0.5); call with Rothschild, AlixPartners, and others regarding schedule 2.12 and related timeline (0.8); call with counsel to stakeholder regarding Mediation order (0.4); correspondence with counsel to potential exit financing provider regarding mediation (0.3).
Ford, Stephen	08/06/21	4.2	Research issues regarding same (1.0); review and revise
Graulich, Timothy	08/06/21	7.8	Mediation Statement (3.0); review Mediation order (0.2). Call with A. Conesa and R. Sanchez Baker regarding

		Time	Detail By Project
Name	Date	Hours	Narrative
			mediation strategy (0.9); call with D. Botter regarding exit financing proposal (0.7); call with Judge Lane regarding mediation (1.1); call with H. Parkhill regarding creditor exit financing proposal (1.3); review and comment on Disclosure
Huebner, Marshall S.	08/06/21	0.4	Statement (3.8). Correspondence with T. Graulich regarding mediation and exit financing issues.
Jerrard, Erik	08/06/21	3.8	Analyze Section 2.12 and related exit financing process implications (0.9); email with T. Graulich and S. Piraino regarding same (0.6); call with Rothschild regarding same (0.3); attend mediation (0.8); prepare for same (0.4); email with T. Graulich and S. Piraino regarding process regarding same (0.2); attend daily contingency update call with Aeroméxico and Rothschild (0.6) (partial attendance).
Masaro, Matthew Bruno	08/06/21	1.7	Attend mediation (0.8); correspondence with S. Piraino, M. Melcer, and others regarding same and Mediation order (0.9).
Piraino, Stephen D.	08/06/21	3.3	Attend daily contingency update call with Aeroméxico and Rothschild (0.8); attend mediation (0.8); email with Davis Polk team regarding Mediation order (0.7); call with Rothschild regarding DIP credit agreement (0.3); correspondence with T. Graulich and E. Jerrard regarding exit financing process and mediation (0.5); correspondence with mediator regarding same (0.2).
Szanzer, Steven Z.	08/06/21	1.1	Review Mediation order (0.2); correspondence with Davis Polk team regarding same (0.1); attend daily contingency update call with Aeroméxico and Rothschild (0.8).
Houston, Kamali	08/07/21	1.0	Attend daily contingency update call with Aeroméxico and Rothschild.
Piraino, Stephen D.	08/07/21	0.8	Correspondence with T. Graulich regarding exit financing (0.7); correspondence with financial advisor to potential exit financing provider regarding exit financing Non-Disclosure Agreement (0.1).
Steinberg, Richard J.	08/07/21	2.5	Draft response to exit financing diligence request (1.9); call with S. Piraino regarding same (0.3); email with Sainz Abogados regarding same (0.2); email with Rothschild regarding same (0.1).
Graulich, Timothy	08/08/21	1.9	
Jerrard, Erik	08/08/21	0.7	Email with Davis Polk team regarding exit financing diligence request.
Piraino, Stephen D.	08/08/21	1.5	Review exit financing letter (0.2); correspondence with R. Steinberg regarding same (0.2); review and revise response to same (0.9); correspondence with Rothschild regarding same (0.2).
Steinberg, Richard J.	08/08/21	2.0	Email with T. Graulich regarding exit financing diligence response (0.3); correspondence with S. Piraino regarding same (0.3); email with counsels to potential exit financing providers regarding same (0.1); draft exit financing diligence request response (1.3).
Graulich, Timothy	08/09/21	3.8	Call with counsel to potential investor regarding mediation (0.5); call with S. Greenberg regarding same (0.5); call with Judge Lane regarding same (0.8); call with P. Tomaso regarding same (0.7); call with L. Moak regarding same (0.4); call with A. Conesa and R. Sanchez Baker regarding same (0.9).

		Time	Detail By Project
Name	Date	Hours	Narrative
Jerrard, Erik	08/09/21	0.9	Attend daily contingency update call with Aeroméxico and Rothschild.
Katz, Michael	08/09/21	0.1	Email with A. Troconis regarding notice for collateral purchase.
Masaro, Matthew Bruno	08/09/21	0.4	Review exit financing letter (0.3); correspondence with R. Steinberg regarding same (0.1).
Melcer, Moshe	08/09/21	0.1	Coordinate mediation attendance.
Szanzer, Steven Z.	08/09/21	1.0	Attend daily contingency update call with Aeroméxico and Rothschild.
Troconis, Adela	08/09/21	0.2	Review DIP credit agreement for purchase issue.
Borchardt, Leo	08/10/21	4.2	Analyze securities law issues (2.8); correspondence with S. Piraino regarding same (0.4); call with Sainz Abogados and others regarding rights offering and securities law considerations (1.0).
Ford, Stephen	08/10/21	0.1	Coordinate execution of exit financing Non-Disclosure Agreement.
Graulich, Timothy	08/10/21	6.1	Call with R. Cooper regarding mediation (0.7); call with P. Tomaso and A. Sainz regarding same (0.7); call with Judge Lane regarding same (0.8); call with A. Conesa and R. Sanchez Baker regarding exit financing (1.0); call with same regarding mediation (0.8); call with S. Piraino and E. Jerrard regarding final valuation materials (1.3); correspondence with M. Huebner regarding mediation (0.8).
Huebner, Marshall S.	08/10/21	0.5	Correspondence with T. Graulich regarding mediation and exi financing issues.
Jerrard, Erik	08/10/21	3.7	Correspondence with T. Graulich regarding final valuation materials (0.6); call with T. Graulich and S. Piraino regarding same (1.3); call with Rothschild and AlixPartners regarding same (0.6); email with T. Graulich regarding same and related analysis of schedule 2.12 (1.2).
Masaro, Matthew Bruno	08/10/21	1.1	Call with Sainz Abogados and others regarding securities law issues regarding rights offering (0.7); correspondence with R. Steinberg and others regarding same (0.4).
Melcer, Moshe	08/10/21	0.1	Coordinate mediation attendance.
Piraino, Stephen D.	08/10/21	3.7	Call with T. Graulich and E. Jerrard regarding final valuation materials (1.3); email with same regarding exit financing (0.2); call with Rothschild and AlixPartners regarding final evaluation (0.6); correspondence with L. Borchardt regarding securities law issues related to rights offerings (0.4); correspondence with M. Masaro regarding same (0.2); attend daily contingency update call with Aeroméxico and Rothschild (0.9); call with counsel to potential exit financing provider regarding mediation information sharing (0.1).
Simmonds, Alexander W.	08/10/21	1.3	Call with Sainz Abogados regarding rights offering and securities law issues (1.0); correspondence with S. Piraino and S. Alessio Robles regarding same (0.2); correspondence with M. Masaro regarding same (0.1).
Steinberg, Richard J.	08/10/21	2.3	Correspondence with exit financing stakeholder regarding exifinancing diligence request (1.0); email with Aeromexico and co-advisors regarding same (0.6); correspondence with S. Piraino regarding same (0.2); call with Sainz Abogados regarding rights offer and securities law issues regarding same (0.5).
Szanzer, Steven Z.	08/10/21	1.0	Attend daily contingency update call with Aeroméxico and Rothschild.
Troconis, Adela	08/10/21	1.2	Analyze DIP credit agreement purchase issue.

		Time	Detail By Project
Name	Date	Hours	Narrative
Ford, Stephen	08/11/21	0.9	Coordinate execution of exit financing Non-Disclosure Agreement (0.4); review and revise exit financing Non-Disclosure Agreement (0.5).
Graulich, Timothy	08/11/21	3.3	Call with A. Conesa and R. Sanchez Baker regarding mediation with Judge Lane (1.1); call with A. Conesa and A. Sainz regarding same (0.8); review and comment on Plan waterfall analysis (1.4).
Graulich, Timothy	08/11/21	6.5	Call with counsel to potential exit financing provider regarding exit financing diligence (0.4); review and revise intercompany analysis (3.4); review revised exit financing commitment agreement (2.7).
Jerrard, Erik	08/11/21	3.2	Analyze exit financing diligence request from potential bidder (0.7); review and analyze final valuation materials contractual provisions (1.5); attend daily contingency update call with Aeroméxico and Rothschild (1.0).
Melcer, Moshe Piraino, Stephen D.	08/11/21 08/11/21	0.1 1.5	Coordinate mediation attendance. Correspondence with R. Steinberg and T. Graulich regarding exit financing diligence requests (0.5); correspondence with Rothschild regarding same (0.2); attend daily contingency update call with Aeroméxico and Rothschild (0.8) (partial attendance).
Sokol, Nate Steinberg, Richard J.	08/11/21 08/11/21	0.2 3.8	Review Mediation Statement. Email with Aeromexico and co-advisors regarding response to exit financing diligence request (0.7); correspondence with S. Piraino regarding same (0.2); respond to exit financing diligence request (2.1); email with T. Graulich regarding same (0.3); call with Rothschild regarding same (0.1); email with counsel to potential exit financing provider regarding same (0.4).
Szanzer, Steven Z.	08/11/21	1.0	Attend daily contingency update call with Aeroméxico and Rothschild.
Graulich, Timothy	08/12/21	5.9	Call with R. Arnold regarding bidder due diligence (0.4); call with B. Ignaschenko regarding proposal and mediation (0.5); call with Judge Lane regarding mediation (0.8); call with L. Donahue and H. Parkhill regarding final valuation materials
Piraino, Stephen D.	08/12/21	2.9	(1.5); review and comment on final valuation materials (2.7). Call with AlixPartners team regarding intercompany claims (0.4); call with counsel to potential exit financing provider regarding same (0.3); call with counsel to potential exit financing provider regarding same (0.5); attend daily contingency update call with Aeroméxico and Rothschild (0.7) (partial attendance); call with Rothschild regarding exit financing diligence (0.3); call with counsel to potential exit financing provider regarding same (0.1); correspondence with R. Steinberg regarding same (0.3); correspondence with
Steinberg, Richard J.	08/12/21	4.9	potential exit financing parties regarding same (0.3). Correspondence with Rothschild regarding mediation and exit financing diligence issues (0.9); call with AlixPartners regarding intercompany agreements (0.4); correspondence with S. Piraino regarding same (0.3); call with AlixPartners regarding same (0.2); call with counsels to potential exit financing providers regarding same (1.7); review date rooms (1.1); email with same regarding same (0.2); email with Sainz Abogados regarding exit financing diligence (0.1).
Borchardt, Leo Graulich, Timothy	08/13/21 08/13/21	0.4 5.5	Correspondence with S. Piraino regarding equity term sheet. Call with Judge Lane regarding mediation (0.7); call with A.

		Time	Detail By Project
Name	Date	Hours	Narrative
Melcer, Moshe Piraino, Stephen D.	08/13/21 08/13/21	0.2 2.1	Conesa and R. Sanchez Baker regarding final valuation materials (0.9); call with P. Tomasco regarding mediation (0.6); review and comment on presentation on valuation (3.3). Coordinate mediation attendance. Attend daily contingency update call with Aeroméxico and Rothschild (0.7); correspondence with L. Borchardt and others regarding equity term sheet (0.7); email with T. Graulich regarding exit financing (0.5); email with Rothschild team
Simmonds, Alexander W.	08/13/21	2.6	regarding mediation data room (0.2). Review precedent disclosure statements regarding securities law issues (1.9); email with L. Borchardt regarding same (0.7).
Steinberg, Richard J.	08/13/21	4.2	Email with Rothschild regarding exit financing diligence request (2.7); email with Sainz Abogados regarding same (0.8); correspondence with S. Piraino regarding same (0.2); email with Aeroméxico regarding same (0.2); email with Aeroméxico regarding same (0.2); email with T. Graulich and L. Borchardt regarding exit financing proposal (0.3).
Szanzer, Steven Z.	08/13/21	0.9	Attend daily contingency update call with Aeroméxico and Rothschild (0.6); review Apollo's discussion materials (0.3).
Piraino, Stephen D.	08/14/21	0.3	Call with counsel to potential exit financing provider regarding exit financing proposal.
Katz, Michael	08/15/21	0.4	Correspondence with S. Piraino regarding exit financing process.
Piraino, Stephen D.	08/15/21	0.7	Correspondence with T. Graulich regarding exit financing issues (0.4); call with A. Troconis and others regarding exit financing process (0.3).
Troconis, Adela	08/15/21	0.3	Call with S. Piraino and others regarding exit financing process.
Borchardt, Leo	08/16/21	2.2	Review A. Simmonds memorandum on precedent disclosure statements and securities law analysis.
Graulich, Timothy	08/16/21	6.6	Call with A. Conesa and R. Sanchez Baker regarding mediation (0.8); call with Judge Lane regarding mediation (0.8); call with Creditors Committee professionals regarding same (1.0); call with A. Conesa regarding same (0.9); review valuation materials (2.3); correspondence with S. Piraino regarding mediation (0.8).
Huebner, Marshall S. Katz, Michael	08/16/21 08/16/21	0.3 0.1	Correspondence with T. Graulich regarding mediation.
Lee, Lloyd	08/16/21	0.1	Call with L. Lee regarding exit financing status. Call with M. Katz regarding exit financing status.
Melcer, Moshe Piraino, Stephen D.	08/16/21 08/16/21	0.1 4.6	Attend mediation. Attend daily contingency update call with Aeroméxico and Rothschild (0.8); correspondence with T. Graulich regarding exit financing issues (1.7); call with Creditors Committee advisors regarding same (1.1); call with Aeroméxico team and co-advisors regarding same (1.0).
Szanzer, Steven Z.	08/16/21	0.8	Attend daily contingency update call with Aeroméxico and Rothschild.
Buchwald, Lara Samet	08/17/21	0.2	Correspondence with S. Piraino regarding mediation issues.
Ford, Stephen	08/17/21	0.7	Coordinate execution on exit financing Non-Disclosure Agreement.
Graulich, Timothy	08/17/21	9.1	Call with H. Parkhill and L. Donahue regarding mediation valuation (0.8); call with Judge Lane regarding mediation (0.8); correspondence with Davis Polk team regarding same (3.6); call with A. Conesa regarding valuation (1.7); review and comment on valuation materials (2.2).

		Time	Detail By Project
Name	Date	Hours	Narrative
Masaro, Matthew Bruno	08/17/21	3.1	Attend mediation (2.3); correspond with T. Graulich, S. Piraino, Chambers, and others regarding same (0.8).
Melcer, Moshe	08/17/21	0.5	Attend mediation (partial attendance).
Piraino, Stephen D.	08/17/21	3.1	Correspondence with L. Buchwald and C. Rincon regarding exit financing (0.6); attend mediation (2.0) (partial attendance); email with S. Ford regarding valuation (0.3); correspondence with T. Graulich regarding exit financing issues (0.2).
Rincon, Cristina M.	08/17/21	0.1	Correspondence with S. Piraino regarding DIP credit agreement.
Steinberg, Richard J.	08/17/21	0.5	Attend mediation (partial attendance) (0.4); email with counsel to exit financing provider regarding exit financing Non-Disclosure Agreement and diligence request (0.1).
Buchwald, Lara Samet	08/18/21	1.0	Correspondence with S. Piraino and C. Rincon regarding mediation analysis (0.6); prepare M. Landess for upcoming deposition (0.4).
Ford, Stephen	08/18/21	0.2	Call with counsel to potential exit financing provider regarding exit financing Non-Disclosure Agreement.
Graulich, Timothy	08/18/21	5.3	Call with A. Conesa and R. Sanchez Baker regarding mediation (1.0); call with A. Sainz regarding same (0.6); call with H. Parkhill regarding valuation (0.5); call with A. Conesa regarding same (0.4); review revised valuation materials (2.8).
Lempel, Jesse	08/18/21	0.7	Call with Davis Polk Restructuring and Litigation team regarding analysis of exit financing conversion.
Piraino, Stephen D.	08/18/21	2.0	Correspondence with L. Buchwald, C. Rincon, and J. Lempel regarding exit financing (0.6); correspondence with Rothschild team regarding mediation materials (0.4); attend daily contingency update call with Aeroméxico and Rothschild (1.0).
Rincon, Cristina M.	08/18/21	0.6	Call with Davis Polk Restructuring and Litigation team regarding analysis of exit financing conversion.
Szanzer, Steven Z.	08/18/21	1.1	Attend daily contingency update call with Aeroméxico and Rothschild.
Ford, Stephen	08/19/21	2.1	Analyze comments to exit financing Non-Disclosure Agreement (0.9); call with opposing counsel regarding same (0.2); correspondence with S. Piraino regarding same (0.2); correspondence with same and T. Graulich regarding same (0.8).
Graulich, Timothy	08/19/21	4.6	Call with P. Tomasco regarding mediation (0.5); call with A. Conesa and R. Sanchez Baker regarding final valuation materials (0.9); call with Judge Lane regarding mediation (1.3); review DIP credit agreement (1.9).
Lempel, Jesse Masaro, Matthew Bruno	08/19/21 08/19/21	5.3 1.0	Research exit financing issue. Attend mediation (0.6) (partial attendance); correspondence with Judge Lane, T. Graulich, and S. Piraino regarding same (0.4).
Piraino, Stephen D.	08/19/21	3.4	Attend daily contingency update call with Aeroméxico and Rothschild (1.0); email with S. Ford regarding exit financing Non-Disclosure Agreement (0.4); correspondence with Rothschild regarding mediation (0.4); attend mediation (1.0); correspondence with S. Szanzer regarding Plan issue (0.3); review and revise Plan (0.3).
Rincon, Cristina M.	08/19/21	0.9	Review draft analysis of DIP credit agreement (0.5); correspondence with J. Lempel to discuss same (0.4).
Steinberg, Richard J.	08/19/21	2.0	Email with Rothschild regarding exit financing diligence request (0.5); review responses regarding exit financing diligence request (0.6); email with Sainz Abogados regarding same (0.2); correspondence with S. Piraino regarding same 37

		Time	Detail By Project
Name	Date	Hours	Narrative
			(0.2); call with Sainz Abogados regarding same (0.2); email to counsel to potential exit financing provider regarding same (0.3).
Szanzer, Steven Z.	08/19/21	1.0	Attend daily contingency update call with Aeroméxico and Rothschild.
Buchwald, Lara Samet	08/20/21	0.6	Correspondence with S. Piraino regarding new exit financing bid (0.2); review and comment on contract analysis (0.4).
Graulich, Timothy	08/20/21	5.3	Call with Judge Lane regarding mediation (1.4); call with A. Conesa regarding same (0.8); review revised exit financing proposal (1.8); call with H. Parkhill regarding exit financing (1.3).
Graulich, Timothy	08/20/21	2.5	Call with A. Conesa and R. Sanchez Baker regarding mediation.
Jackson, Vanessa L.	08/20/21	0.6	Review DIP credit agreement.
Katz, Michael	08/20/21	0.3	Review DIP credit agreement (0.2); email with A. Troconis regarding same (0.1).
Lempel, Jesse	08/20/21	1.9	Analyze exit financing issue.
Masaro, Matthew	08/20/21	2.3	Review and revise restructuring support agreement (0.8);
Bruno			attend mediation (0.8); review financing proposals (0.7).
Piraino, Stephen D.	08/20/21	1.0	Attend daily contingency update call with Aeroméxico and Rothschild.
Piraino, Stephen D.	08/20/21	3.5	Attend mediation (0.5); review memorandum on exit financing issues (0.4); correspondence with T. Graulich and V. Jackson regarding DIP credit agreement (0.4); correspondence with Davis Polk team regarding exit financing process (0.7); review revised exit financing proposal (0.5); correspondence with Davis Polk team regarding same (0.8); email with Rothschild
Rincon, Cristina M.	08/20/21	3.3	regarding mediation (0.2). Revise analysis of exit financing fee issue.
Simmonds, Alexander W.	08/20/21	0.2	Correspondence with L. Borchardt and S. Piraino regarding equity term sheet.
Szanzer, Steven Z.	08/20/21	1.0	Attend daily contingency update call with Aeroméxico and Rothschild.
Troconis, Adela	08/20/21	0.3	Email with S. Piraino, V. Jackson, and M. Katz regarding DIP credit agreement.
Borchardt, Leo	08/21/21	0.9	Review proposed equity term sheet (0.3); call with counsel to potential bidder advisors regarding proposed term sheet and definitive documentation (0.5); call with A. Simmonds regarding same (0.1).
Ford, Stephen	08/21/21	0.5	Call with potential bidder advisors regarding exit financing.
Graulich, Timothy	08/21/21	1.2	Call with Davis Polk Corporate team regarding exit financing proposal (0.5); call with R. Cooper regarding same (0.3); call with Judge Lane regarding mediation (0.4).
Katz, Michael	08/21/21	1.0	Email with V. Jackson regarding exit financing commitment documents (0.5); correspondence with counsel to stakeholder regarding exit financing status (0.5).
Lee, Lloyd	08/21/21	0.5	Call with potential bidder advisors regarding exit financing.
Masaro, Matthew Bruno	08/21/21	1.4	Attend mediation (0.8); call with counsel to stakeholder, counsel to potential exit financing provider, and others
Piraino, Stephen D.	08/21/21	1.3	regarding exit financing (0.6). Call with joint proponents regarding exit financing (1.0); attend
Simmonds, Alexander W.	08/21/21	1.0	mediation (0.3) (partial attendance). Review equity term sheet (0.4); call with potential bidder advisors regarding exit financing (0.5); call with L. Borchardt
Steinberg, Richard J.	08/21/21	0.5	regarding proposed term sheet and definitive documents (0.1). Call with potential bidder advisors regarding exit financing.

		Time I	Detail By Project
Name	Date	Hours	Narrative
Troconis, Adela	08/21/21	0.5	Call with counsel to stakeholder, counsel to potential exit financing provider, counsel to other potential exit financing provider, and Davis Polk teams regarding exit financing.
Graulich, Timothy	08/22/21	7.5	Call with Willkie Farr regarding mediation (0.6); correspondence with S. Piraino regarding same (0.8); call with H. Parkhill regarding final valuation materials (0.8); review and revise presentation regarding final valuation materials (3.2); call with advisors regarding same (0.8); call with A. Sainz regarding same (0.6); call with A. Conesa and A. Sainz regarding same (0.7).
Masaro, Matthew Bruno	08/22/21	4.7	Correspondence with R. Steinberg and S. Piraino regarding mediation and exit financing (1.1); review and revise motion to enter into shareholder support agreement (2.3); research issues regarding same (1.3).
Piraino, Stephen D.	08/22/21	3.6	Correspondence with T. Graulich regarding exit financing issues (0.8); correspondence with R. Steinberg regarding same (0.3); call with R. Steinberg and other regarding same (0.3); call with co-advisors regarding same and mediation (0.9); call with A. Conesa, R. Sanchez Baker and others regarding same (1.3).
Steinberg, Richard J.	08/22/21	1.2	Call with co-advisors regarding exit financing and mediation (0.9); call with S. Piraino and others regarding same (0.3).
Szanzer, Steven Z.	08/22/21	0.5	Review joint proposal for exit financing (0.3); correspondence with S. Piraino regarding same (0.2).
Borchardt, Leo	08/23/21	4.0	Review exit equity commitment letter and equity term sheet (1.0); correspondence with A. Simmonds regarding same (1.0); call with same regarding exit financing (0.2); call with Rothschild and Davis Polk Finance team regarding exit equity commitment letter (0.5); review precedent net debt definitions and working capital definitions (0.5); call with Davis Polk team regarding equity term sheet (0.8).
Graulich, Timothy	08/23/21	4.7	Call with counsel to potential investor regarding exit financing issues (0.4); call with S. Piraino regarding final valuation materials (0.7); review and revise exit financing proposal (2.2); call with A. Conesa and R. Sanchez Baker regarding valuation (0.6); call with H. Parkhill regarding exit financing (0.8).
Jackson, Vanessa L. Katz, Michael	08/23/21 08/23/21	1.2 3.9	Review exit financing commitment documents. Email with Sainz Abogados regarding Mexican issues list for updated exit debt commitment letters (0.4); review and revise DIP credit agreement (2.8); call with A. Troconis regarding same (0.2); email with same and S. Piraino regarding same (0.4); email with A. Troconis regarding same (0.1).
Masaro, Matthew Bruno	08/23/21	0.9	Review and revise motion to enter into shareholder support agreement (0.8); correspondence with T. Graulich, Judge Lane, and others regarding mediation (0.1).
Piraino, Stephen D.	08/23/21	4.2	Correspondence with A. Simmonds regarding exit financing (0.2); review exit financing proposal (0.9); call with Rothschild team regarding same (0.4); correspondence with T. Graulich regarding same (0.9); call with A. Conesa, R. Sanchez Baker, and co-advisors regarding same (1.0); correspondence with Davis Polk team regarding same (0.8).
Simmonds, Alexander W.	08/23/21	6.2	Extensive review and revision of exit equity commitment letter, equity terms sheet, and issues list regarding same (4.4); correspondence with S. Piraino regarding exit financing issues (0.4); call with L. Borchardt regarding exit financing (0.2); call with Rothschild and Davis Polk Finance team regarding exit

		Time	Detail By Project
Name	Date	Hours	Narrative
Steinberg, Richard J.	08/23/21	0.1	equity commitment letter (0.5); research precedent capital adjustments (0.4); correspondence with R. Arnold regarding same (0.3). Email with Rothschild regarding mediation data room.
Steinberg, Richard J.	08/23/21	0.7	Call with the Aeroméxico regarding exit financing and mediation (0.6); correspondence with S. Piraino regarding same (0.1).
Szanzer, Steven Z.	08/23/21	8.0	Review and consider joint exit financing proposal.
Troconis, Adela	08/23/21	3.5	Review exit debt financing commitment papers (3.0); call with M. Katz regarding DIP credit agreement (0.1); review DIP credit agreement (0.4).
Borchardt, Leo	08/24/21	1.3	Call with S. Piraino to prepare for daily update call with Aeroméxico and co-advisors (0.4); call with Rothschild and AlixPartners regarding working capital adjustment (0.5); comment on memorandum regarding same (0.4).
Graulich, Timothy	08/24/21	3.8	Call with Judge Lane regarding mediation (1.2); call with R. Sanchez Baker regarding exit equity financing commitment documents (0.6); call with same regarding exit debt financing commitment documents (0.6); call with H. Parkhill regarding final valuation materials (1.4).
Huebner, Marshall S.	08/24/21	0.9	Correspondence with stakeholder regarding exit and balance sheet issues (0.5); email with T. Graulich regarding same (0.4).
Jackson, Vanessa L. Jerrard, Erik	08/24/21 08/24/21	0.8 0.7	Review DIP credit agreement. Attend daily contingency update call with Aeroméxico and Rothschild.
Katz, Michael	08/24/21	3.9	Review and revise DIP credit agreement (1.1); email with A. Troconis regarding delivery schedule (0.1); email with V. Jackson regarding DIP credit agreement (0.2); email with Cleary Gottlieb regarding same (0.1); call with advisor regarding exit financing commitment letters (0.5); prepare issues list regarding exit financing (0.5); email with S. Piraino and A. Troconis regarding same (0.3); review and revise engagement and fee letters (0.5); email with L. Lee regarding same (0.1); review and revise signature page to DIP Credit Agreement amendment (0.2); email with Davis Polk team regarding current guarantors (0.1); email with Aeroméxico regarding DIP credit agreement amendment (0.2).
Lee, Lloyd	08/24/21	1.9	Review and revise exit financing commitment documents.
Masaro, Matthew Bruno	08/24/21	0.9	Attend mediation.
Piraino, Stephen D.	08/24/21	6.6	Call with L. Borchardt to prepare for daily update call with Aeroméxico and co-advisors regarding exit financing (0.4); extensive correspondence with T. Graulich regarding exit financing issues (3.0); call with Rothschild and Davis Polk teams regarding debt financing (0.4) (partial attendance); call with R. Arnold regarding exit financing (0.3); call with Rothschild and Davis Polk teams regarding same (0.6); review and revise equity exit financing term sheet (0.5); call with counsel to potential exit financing provider regarding exit financing (0.2); call with counsel to stakeholder regarding same (0.1); correspondence with E. Jerrard regarding same (0.3); attend daily contingency update call with Aeroméxico and Rothschild (0.8).
Simmonds, Alexander W.	08/24/21	3.1	Attend daily update call with A. Conesa, AlixPartners, Rothschild and Davis Polk teams (1.0); call with Rothschild

		Time	Detail By Project
Name	Date	Hours	Narrative
			and AlixPartners teams regarding working capital adjustment working paper (0.5); review and comment on working capital adjustment paper (0.6); correspondence with Rothschild team regarding same (0.6); review comments to equity term sheet (0.2); correspondence with S. Piraino regarding same (0.2).
Szanzer, Steven Z.	08/24/21	0.8	Attend daily contingency update call with Aeroméxico and Rothschild.
Troconis, Adela	08/24/21	3.8	Attend daily contingency update call with Aeroméxico and Rothschild (0.8); review and comment on amendment to DIP credit agreement (1.1); call with R. Sanchez Baker, AlixPartners, Rothschild, and Sainz Abogados regarding exit debt financing (0.5); comment on exit debt commitment documents (0.7); email with Cleary Gottlieb regarding DIP credit agreement (0.7).
Borchardt, Leo	08/25/21	1.8	Analyze exit financing term sheet.
Graulich, Timothy	08/25/21	5.1	Call with Judge Lane regarding mediation (1.1); call with A. Conesa regarding final valuation materials (1.7); correspondence with S. Piraino regarding notice of default (0.5); review DIP credit agreement (1.8).
Jackson, Vanessa L.	08/25/21	3.2	Comment on exit financing commitment documents (2.4); call with Davis Polk Finance and Restructuring team regarding exit debt financing process (partial attendance). erence call with S. Piraino (0.8).
Jerrard, Erik	08/25/21	2.6	Call with Davis Polk Finance and Restructuring team regarding exit debt financing process (1.0); analyze schedule 2.12 debriefing from same (1.6).
Katz, Michael	08/25/21	5.2	Email with counsel to stakeholder regarding DIP credit agreement amendment (0.1); email with Davis Polk team regarding exit financing debt commitment letter (0.4); prepare issues list for Rothschild regarding exit financing (0.4); review and revise exit financing debt commitment letters (1.9); email with A. Troconis regarding same (0.2); email with V. Jackson regarding same (0.1); email with Rothschild and S. Piraino regarding same (0.4); correspondence with S. Piraino, A. Troconis and V. Jackson regarding status of transaction and default provisions under DIP credit agreement (1.0); email with V. Jackson regarding DIP credit agreement milestone summary (0.2); email with Aeroméxico regarding exit financing debt commitment letter (0.2); email with counsel to stakeholder regarding same (0.1); review precedents default notices (0.2).
Lee, Lloyd	08/25/21	2.8	Call with Davis Polk Finance and Restructuring team regarding exit debt financing process (1.0); draft notice of default (0.4); revise exit financing commitment documents (1.0); review emails with Davis Polk team regarding same (0.4).
Masaro, Matthew Bruno	08/25/21	3.8	Attend mediation (3.2) (multiple sessions); correspondence with S. Piraino and others regarding same (0.6).
Piraino, Stephen D.	08/25/21	2.0	Call with Aeroméxico team and co-advisors regarding exit financing (1.0); call with Davis Polk Finance and Restructuring team regarding exit debt financing process (1.0).
Simmonds, Alexander W.	08/25/21	0.9	Correspondence with L. Lee regarding exit financing commitment letters (0.2); review equity value mechanics (0.5); correspondence with W. Kocovski regarding working capital adjustments (0.2).
Troconis, Adela	08/25/21	3.0	Review and comment on exit equity and debt financing

		Time	Detail By Project
Name	Date	Hours	Narrative
Graulich, Timothy	08/26/21	6.4	commitment documents (2.0); call with Davis Polk Finance and Restructuring team regarding exit debt financing process (1.0). Call with Judge Lane regarding mediation (1.2); call with A. Conesa and R. Sanchez Baker regarding same (1.0); call with H. Parkhill regarding join bid (1.3); call with A. Conesa regarding same (0.8); review revised exit financing
Jackson, Vanessa L.	08/26/21	1.8	commitment (2.1). Review DIP credit agreement (0.9); review exit financing term
Jerrard, Erik	08/26/21	1.7	sheet (0.9). Attend mediation.
Masaro, Matthew Bruno	08/26/21	1.9	Attend mediation (1.7); correspondence with Davis Polk team regarding same (0.2).
McClammy, James I.	08/26/21	8.0	Review correspondence with Davis Polk team regarding mediation and exit financing bid.
Melcer, Moshe Piraino, Stephen D.	08/26/21 08/26/21	1.9 5.5	Coordinate mediation attendance (0.2); attend mediation (1.7). Email with M. Melcer regarding mediation (0.2); attend mediation (1.7); call with joint proponents regarding exit financing (0.9); call with M. Sutter regarding exit financing (0.2); correspondence with T. Graulich regarding same (0.5); call with D. Abbot and others regarding same (0.5); correspondence with E. Jerrard regarding same (0.4); correspondence with Morris Nichols regarding same (0.7); email with AlixPartners regarding same (0.4).
Rincon, Cristina M.	08/26/21	0.5	Call with D. Abbott and Davis Polk Litigation and Restructuring teams regarding exit financing updates.
Graulich, Timothy	08/27/21	3.8	Call with J. Margolin regarding mediation (0.6); call with H. Parkhill regarding valuation (0.8); review presentation on mediation (2.4).
Huebner, Marshall S.	08/27/21	1.9	Call with Rothschild and others regarding exit financing issues.
Jackson, Vanessa L.	08/27/21	1.1	Review notice of default (0.5); review relevant event disclosing notice of default (0.6).
Jerrard, Erik	08/27/21	7.3	Email with V. Jackson and M. Katz regarding notice of default (0.8); review and revise notice of default (1.3); review and revise relevant event disclosing notice of default (1.1); review and revise exit timeline (2.2); analyze schedule 2.12 relating to exit timeline (1.1); email with T. Graulich regarding same (0.8).
Katz, Michael	08/27/21	2.2	Review and revise notice of default (1.0); review and revise relevant event disclosing notice of default (0.6); email with Sainz Abogados regarding revisions regarding same (0.1); email with administrative Agent, counsel to stakeholder and Clearly Gottlieb regarding notice of default (0.3); email with Aeroméxico and L. Lee regarding signature page (0.2).
Lee, Lloyd	08/27/21	0.5	Review and revise notice of default.
Masaro, Matthew Bruno	08/27/21	0.3	Correspondence with S. Piraino, Rothschild, and others regarding mediation.
Piraino, Stephen D.	08/27/21	4.2	Call with M. Sutter regarding exit financing (0.3); correspondence with E. Jerrard regarding same (0.7); correspondence with T. Graulich regarding same (0.2); call with D. Abbot regarding same (0.2); email with M. Sutter and T. Graulich regarding same (0.3); review protective order (0.2); email with T. Graulich, E. Jerrard and D. Abbot regarding same (0.4); correspondence with R. Steinberg regarding exit financing issues (0.3); correspondence with M. Masaro regarding same (0.2); correspondence with 42

		Time	Detail By Project
Name	Date	Hours	Narrative
			AlixPartners regarding same (0.2); correspondence with counsel to potential exit financing party regarding same (0.2); review relevant event for final valuation materials (0.2); email with T. Graulich regarding same (0.1); review exit financing timeline (0.4); correspondence with exit financing parties
Steinberg, Richard J.	08/27/21	0.4	regarding exit financing (0.3). Call with counsel to joint bidders regarding exit financing diligence requests (0.2); correspondence with S. Piraino regarding same (0.1); call with Davis Polk Litigation team regarding same (0.1).
Graulich, Timothy	08/28/21	3.8	Call with H. Parkhill regarding final valuation materials (0.8); review and comment on presentation on same (1.4); review and revise timeline regarding same (1.6).
Piraino, Stephen D.	08/28/21	1.1	Email with T. Graulich and E. Jerrard regarding exit financing issues (0.4); email with J. Wallden regarding exit financing diligence materials (0.3); review diligence materials (0.4).
Graulich, Timothy	08/29/21	3.2	Call with H. Parkhill regarding final valuation materials (0.6); review letter from Apollo (0.8); circulate summary of issues regarding same (1.8).
Graulich, Timothy	08/30/21	10.6	Correspondence with S. Piraino and E. Jerrard regarding final valuation materials (3.0); call with counsel to potential investor regarding exit financing issues (0.5); call with H. Parkhill regarding final valuation materials (0.8); attend meeting with creditor advisors regarding business plan and related issues (1.3); review revised final valuation materials and related timeline (2.4); review revised Plan (2.6).
Huebner, Marshall S.	08/30/21	2.1	Call with management, Debtor advisors, creditor proponent advisors to exit financing issues (1.6); call with creditors and representatives regarding same (0.5).
Jerrard, Erik	08/30/21	5.3	Correspondence with T. Graulich and S. Piraino regarding exit financing (1.9); attend meeting with creditor advisors regarding business plan and related issues (1.6); email with Rothschild regarding valuation splits (0.3); analyze valuation materials (1.5).
Piraino, Stephen D.	08/30/21	6.4	Correspondence with E. Jerrard and T. Graulich regarding exit financing issues (3.5); correspondence with E. Jerrard regarding same (0.7); call with A. Conesa, R. Sanchez Baker, J. Arrigunaga and others regarding same (1.2); review and revise exit financing process letter (0.3); review revised debt financing term sheet (0.3); email with Aeroméxico and Davis Polk teams regarding same (0.4).
Graulich, Timothy	08/31/21	6.3	Correspondence with M. Huebner regarding final valuation materials (0.9); call with A. Conesa regarding valuation (0.8); call with same and Restructuring Committee regarding valuation (2.3); review and revise process letter (2.3).
Huebner, Marshall S.	08/31/21	1.7	Call with management and advisers regarding exit financing issues (0.7); correspondence with T. Graulich regarding valuation issues (0.5); call with counsel to joint bidders regarding potential exit structures (0.5).
Jerrard, Erik	08/31/21	5.4	Review and revise bidder communication summary (2.4); email with Restructuring Committee regarding same (1.1); correspondence with S. Piraino regarding same (0.6); email with same, T. Graulich, and Rothschild regarding same (0.4); email with A. Sainz regarding same (0.4); email with counsel to stakeholder regarding grace period (0.3); distribute bidder communication (0.2).

		Time	Detail By Project
Name	Date	Hours	Narrative
Melcer, Moshe	08/31/21	0.3	Attend meeting with advisors and shareholders regarding exit financing process (0.2) (partial attendance); email with Davis Polk Plan team regarding timeline (0.1).
Piraino, Stephen D.	08/31/21	4.6	Correspondence with E. Jerrard regarding exit financing issues (0.5); correspondence with T. Graulich and E. Jerrard regarding same (0.9); correspondence with Rothschild team regarding same (0.3); call with Restructuring Committee regarding same (0.9); review and revise exit financing documents (2.0).
Troconis, Adela	08/31/21	0.3	Correspondence with T. Green regarding DIP credit agreement.
Total AM190 Financia	ng	607.0	
AM200 General Case	Administration		
Altman, Olivia	08/02/21	1.5	Review and revise exhibits and signature page for filing (1.0); correspondence with M. Masaro, M. Melcer, and others regarding same (0.5).
Jerrard, Erik	08/02/21	0.4	Correspondence with T. Graulich and S. Piraino regarding case status.
Altman, Olivia	08/03/21	0.3	Review docket filings.
Giddens, Magali	08/03/21	0.4	Review docket filings.
Jerrard, Erik	08/03/21	2.1	Prepare for weekly workstreams call with Davis Polk Restructuring team.
Melcer, Moshe	08/03/21	0.5	Review and revise case status summary (0.4); email with E. Jerrard regarding same (0.1).
Bane, Abraham	08/04/21	1.0	Attend weekly workstreams call with Davis Polk Restructuring team.
Graulich, Timothy	08/04/21	0.9	Correspondence with S. Piraino regarding workstreams.
Green, Thomas S.	08/04/21	0.6	Attend weekly workstreams call with Davis Polk Restructuring team (partial attendance).
Jerrard, Erik	08/04/21	2.5	Attend weekly workstreams call with Davis Polk Restructuring team (0.8); email with T. Graulich regarding same (0.5); coordinate upcoming omnibus hearing dates (0.8); review upcoming exclusivity and removal deadlines and related filings (0.4).
Masaro, Matthew Bruno	08/04/21	0.7	Attend weekly workstreams call with Davis Polk Restructuring team.
Melcer, Moshe	08/04/21	1.1	Attend weekly workstreams call with Davis Polk Restructuring team (0.7); review and revise case status summary (0.4).
Piraino, Stephen D.	08/04/21	0.7	Attend weekly workstreams call with Davis Polk Restructuring team.
Steinberg, Richard J.	08/04/21	1.0	Attend weekly workstreams call with Davis Polk Restructuring team (0.7); prepare for same (0.3).
Szanzer, Steven Z.	08/04/21	1.2	Attend weekly workstreams call with Davis Polk Restructuring team (0.7); review case status summary (0.5).
Giddens, Magali	08/05/21	0.3	Correspondence with M. Melcer regarding filing notice of adjournment.
Jerrard, Erik	08/05/21	4.3	Email with Chambers regarding September Omnibus Hearing (0.3); correspondence with T. Graulich and S. Piraino regarding case updates and strategy (1.9); email with R. Steinberg regarding case timeline (0.4); email with J. Eisen regarding August 12th Hearing agenda (0.4); correspondence with M. Melcer regarding upcoming hearing (0.3); review, revise and coordinate filing of notices (0.8); email with M. Melcer regarding same (0.2).

		Time	Detail By Project
Name	Date	Hours	Narrative
Melcer, Moshe	08/05/21	0.2	Draft notice of August 12th Hearing cancellation.
Altman, Olivia	08/06/21	0.5	Correspondence with Epiq and M. Masaro regarding
			upcoming filing and service of same (0.2); file notice of interim
			fee hearing (0.3).
Giddens, Magali	08/06/21	0.5	Review docket filings.
Masaro, Matthew	08/08/21	0.1	Correspondence with AlixPartners and others regarding
Bruno			monthly operating reports.
Melcer, Moshe	08/08/21	0.2	Correspondence with E. Jerrard regarding upcoming hearing.
Altman, Olivia	08/09/21	0.4	File notice of assumptions of executory contract (0.3);
- II A :	00/00/04	0.4	correspondence with Epiq regarding same (0.1).
Farrell, Annie	08/09/21	2.1	Prepare documents for production as per C. Rincon.
Jerrard, Erik	08/09/21	1.1	Review filing versions of Certificates of No Objection.
Piraino, Stephen D.	08/09/21	0.3	Correspondence with E. Jerrard regarding case updates (0.1);
Ctainbara Diabard I	00/00/04	0.0	call with Chambers regarding case status (0.2).
Steinberg, Richard J.	08/09/21 08/10/21	0.2	Email with Aeroméxico regarding 2019 Statement.
Giddens, Magali Jerrard, Erik	08/10/21	0.5 2.9	File notice of proposed order regarding DAE. Prepare for weekly workstreams call with Davis Polk
Jenaru, Enk	00/10/21	2.9	Restructuring team (1.9); call with Aeromexico and co-
			advisors regarding case updates (1.0).
Melcer, Moshe	08/10/21	0.5	Draft notice of cancellation of August 12th hearing.
Piraino, Stephen D.	08/10/21	0.3	Correspondence with E. Jerrard regarding case updates.
Sokol, Nate	08/10/21	0.2	Email with E. Jerrard regarding case workstreams.
Altman, Olivia	08/11/21	1.5	File notice of cancellation of August 12th hearing (0.2); file
Aithan, Olivia	00/11/21	1.0	Certificates of No Objections to omnibus claims (1.0);
			correspondence with Court regarding same (0.3).
Bane, Abraham	08/11/21	0.9	Attend weekly workstreams call with Davis Polk Restructuring
			team.
Ford, Stephen	08/11/21	0.9	Attend weekly workstreams call with Davis Polk Restructuring
Graulich, Timothy	08/11/21	0.9	team. Attend weekly workstreams call with Davis Polk Restructuring
Graditori, Tilliotriy	00/11/21	0.9	team.
Green, Thomas S.	08/11/21	0.5	Attend weekly workstreams call with Davis Polk Restructuring
G. 55.1, 1.115.11.25 5.		0.0	team (partial attendance).
Jerrard, Erik	08/11/21	2.5	Call with N. Sokol regarding case workstreams (0.8);
			correspondence with S. Ford, A. Bane, S. Piraino, and N.
			Sokol regarding Plan and case developments (1.4); email with
			Aeroméxico communications consultant regarding case status
			(0.3).
Masaro, Matthew	08/11/21	1.2	Attend weekly workstreams call with Davis Polk Restructuring
Bruno			team (0.9); correspondence with AlixPartners and others
			regarding monthly operating reports (0.3).
Melcer, Moshe	08/11/21	1.6	Attend weekly workstreams call with Davis Polk Restructuring
			team (0.9); revise notice of cancellation of August 12th
			hearing (0.3); email to Chamber regarding CEBURES notice
			of presentment (0.3); correspondence with M. Masaro
5: : 6: . 5	00/44/04		regarding same (0.1).
Piraino, Stephen D.	08/11/21	0.9	Attend weekly workstreams call with Davis Polk Restructuring
Calcal Nata	00/44/04	0.0	team call.
Sokol, Nate	08/11/21	2.2	Attend weekly workstreams call with Davis Polk Restructuring
			team (0.9); call with E. Jerrard regarding case workstreams
			(0.8); correspondence with S. Piraino, E. Jerrard, and others
Stoinhora Dichard !	00/11/01	0.0	regarding case workstreams (0.5).
Steinberg, Richard J.	08/11/21	0.9	Attend weekly workstreams call with Davis Polk Restructuring team.
Szanzer Steven 7	08/11/21	1.5	team. Review August 12th Hearing agenda (0.1); attend weekly
Szanzer, Steven Z.	00/11/21	1.3	workstreams call with Davis Polk Restructuring team (0.9);
			workstreams call with Davis Polk Restructuring team (0.9);

Jerrard, Erik

Masaro, Matthew

Melcer, Moshe

Bruno

08/25/21

08/25/21

08/25/21

Time Detail By Project Hours **Narrative** Name **Date** review and finalize notice of August 12th Hearing cancellation (0.3); correspondence with Davis Polk team regarding same (0.2).Piraino, Stephen D. 08/12/21 0.4 Correspondence with N. Sokol regarding case updates (0.2); correspondence with T. Graulich regarding same (0.2). 0.5 File Newrest motions and related documents. Altman, Olivia 08/17/21 Melcer, Moshe Revise case status summary. 08/17/21 0.1 Altman, Olivia 08/18/21 0.5 File notice of hearing (0.2); file omnibus claims objections Dekhtyar, Mariya 1.0 Attend weekly workstreams call with Davis Polk Restructuring 08/18/21 Ford, Stephen 1.0 Attend weekly workstreams call with Davis Polk Restructuring 08/18/21 Masaro, Matthew 1.0 Attend weekly workstreams call with Davis Polk Restructuring 08/18/21 Bruno Melcer, Moshe 08/18/21 1.1 Attend weekly workstreams call with Davis Polk Restructuring Piraino, Stephen D. 08/18/21 2.7 Attend weekly workstreams call with Davis Polk Restructuring team (1.0); prepare for same (1.4); correspondence with T. Graulich regarding case updates (0.3). Attend weekly workstreams call with Davis Polk Restructuring Steinberg, Richard J. 08/18/21 1.1 team. Szanzer, Steven Z. 08/18/21 1.3 Attend weekly workstreams call with Davis Polk Restructuring team (1.1): correspondence with T. Green and Chambers regarding hearing date for CAE and SMBC motions (0.2). Altman, Olivia 08/19/21 0.3 File motions. Altman, Olivia File CAE motions (0.4); file SMBC motions (0.5); coordinate 08/20/21 with Epiq regarding same (0.1). Correspondence with M. Melcer regarding CAE filing (0.1); Giddens, Magali 08/20/21 correspondence with T. Green regarding SMBC filings (0.2); file same (0.3): review same and CAE motions (0.9): correspondence with Epiq regarding service of SMBC documents (0.1). Correspondence with T. Green regarding filing. Giddens, Magali 08/21/21 0.1 Altman, Olivia Review and revise Rule 2015.3 report. 08/23/21 0.3 Review and revise Rule 2015.3 report (0.6); correspondence Masaro, Matthew 0.9 08/23/21 with AlixPartners, Aeroméxico, and others regarding same Bruno (0.2): correspondence with O. Altman and AlixPartners regarding monthly operating reports (0.1). Review docket filings. Giddens, Magali 08/24/21 0.6 Jerrard, Erik Call with S. Piraino regarding case update (0.9); update 08/24/21 workstreams summary (2.2). Call with E. Jerrard regarding case updates. Piraino, Stephen D. 08/24/21 0.9 Szanzer, Steven Z. Correspondence with E. Jerrard and T. Graulich regarding call 08/24/21 with Aeroméxico and co-advisors. Green, Thomas S. 08/25/21 0.9 Attend weekly workstreams call with Davis Polk Restructuring

team.

Call with R. Sanchez Baker to prepare for call with A. Schwartz (0.2); call with A. Schwartz, A. Sainz, R. Sanchez Baker, and others regarding case updates and retention (1.4); email with M. Masaro, S. Piraino, and T. Graulich regarding

0.3 Review and revise Rule 2015.3 report (0.1); correspondence

Review and revise case status summary (0.3); email with S. Piraino, E. Jerrard, and C. Rincon regarding upcoming hearing

with Debtor professionals regarding same (0.2).

2.1

		Time	Detail By Project
Name	Date	Hours	Narrative
Piraino, Stephen D.	08/25/21	0.7	(0.1). Call with E. Jerrard regarding case updates (0.5); call with R. Steinberg regarding various matters (0.2).
Jerrard, Erik	08/26/21	0.9	Email with T. Graulich and S. Piraino regarding case administration (0.4); call with S. Piraino regarding case updates (0.5).
Masaro, Matthew Bruno	08/26/21	0.3	Review monthly operating reports (0.1); correspondence with AlixPartners and others regarding same (0.2).
Giddens, Magali	08/27/21	1.6	File Newrest motion (0.6); file Clover document (0.6); file June Monthly Fee Statement (0.4).
Jerrard, Erik	08/27/21	0.5	Correspondence with S. Piraino regarding case updates.
Jerrard, Erik	08/29/21	1.0	Review notice of cancellation (0.3); email with Davis Polk Restructuring team regarding upcoming hearings (0.4); email with A. Bane regarding upcoming removal deadline extension motion (0.3).
Melcer, Moshe	08/29/21	0.5	Draft notice of cancellation (0.3); correspondence with S. Piraino regarding same (0.1); correspondence with M. Giddens regarding same (0.1).
Altman, Olivia	08/30/21	0.4	5 5 1
Jerrard, Erik	08/30/21	0.6	Correspondence with S. Piraino regarding case update.
Giddens, Magali	08/31/21	1.6	Correspondence with P. Garg regarding filing fifth notice of assumption (0.4); review same (0.2); prepare for filing and file same (0.3); correspondence with M. Melcer regarding filing assumption motion, sealing motion, and declaration regarding same (0.2); file same on docket (0.4); correspondence with Epig regarding service of same (0.1).
Jerrard, Erik	08/31/21	3.7	Correspondence with M. Melcer regarding case updates (0.2); correspondence with R. Steinberg regarding same (0.2); correspondence with S. Piraino regarding same (0.6); correspondence with same and T. Graulich regarding same (0.9); prepare for weekly workstreams call with Davis Polk Restructuring team (1.8).
Piraino, Stephen D.	08/31/21	0.4	Correspondence with T. Graulich regarding case updates.
Total AM200 Genera Administration	I Case	80.8	
AM210 Non-DPW Re	etention and Fee	Issues	
Jerrard, Erik	08/03/21	1.1	Email with Aeroméxico regarding KPMG (0.4); email with Morris Nichols regarding same (0.7).
Masaro, Matthew Bruno	08/05/21	0.2	Correspondence with Aeroméxico and others regarding ordinary course professionals.
Bane, Abraham	08/06/21	1.1	Draft notice of Interim Fee Hearing (0.8); correspondence with E. Jerrard regarding same (0.2); coordinate filing of same (0.1).
Jerrard, Erik	08/06/21	1.5	Email with co-advisors and Creditors Committee advisors regarding Interim Fee Hearing adjournment (0.6); review and revise notice of Interim Fee Hearing (0.7); email with A. Bane regarding same (0.2).
Jerrard, Erik Jerrard, Erik	08/08/21 08/09/21	1.7 0.3	Review and revise KPMG retention application. Call with R. Boone regarding ordinary course professionals' affidavit.
Masaro, Matthew Bruno	08/09/21	0.2	Correspondence with Aeroméxico regarding ordinary course professional retention (0.1); review affidavit and questionnaire related to same (0.1).
Jerrard, Erik	08/11/21	0.3	Email with ordinary course professional regarding ordinary

		Time	Detail By Project
Name	Date	Hours	Narrative
	00/44/04		course professional issue.
Masaro, Matthew Bruno	08/11/21	0.1	Correspondence with E. Jerrard regarding ordinary course professional retention.
Piraino, Stephen D.	08/12/21	0.2	Correspondence with Davis Polk team regarding KPMG
r iraino, otophon b.	00/12/21	0.2	application.
Masaro, Matthew	08/16/21	0.2	Correspondence with Morris Nichols, E. Jerrard, Copy Center,
Bruno			A. Schwartz, and others regarding KPMG retention.
Masaro, Matthew	08/20/21	0.2	Correspondence with Aeroméxico and others regarding
Bruno Masaro, Matthew	08/23/21	0.4	ordinary course retention. Correspondence with White & Case and others regarding
Bruno	00/23/21	0.4	ordinary course retention.
Masaro, Matthew	08/24/21	0.2	Review ordinary course affidavit (0.1); correspondence with
Bruno			Aeroméxico regarding same (0.1).
Masaro, Matthew	08/25/21	0.2	Correspondence with E. Jerrard and T. Graulich regarding
Bruno			ordinary course retention.
Piraino, Stephen D.	08/25/21	1.2	Call with A. Schwartz, E. Jerrard, A. Sainz, and Aeroméxico
Masaro, Matthew	08/26/21	0.2	team regarding retention issues. Correspondence with Aeroméxico and others regarding
Bruno	00/20/21	0.2	ordinary course retention.
Masaro, Matthew	08/30/21	0.2	Correspondence with M. Melcer and others regarding ordinary
Bruno			course retention.
Total AM210 Non-DP	W Retention	9.5	
and Fee Issues			
AM230 Plan/Disclosu	ure Statement		
Masaro, Matthew	08/02/21	0.2	Correspondence with AlixPartners regarding Disclosure
Bruno	20/20/21		Statement.
Masaro, Matthew	08/03/21	0.2	Correspondence with D. O'Sullivan and AlixPartners regarding
Bruno O'Sullivan, Damian	08/03/21	1.3	Disclosure Statement. Review and revise Disclosure Statement (1.0);
O Sullivari, Darrilari	00/03/21	1.5	correspondence with M. Masaro regarding same (0.3).
Ford, Stephen	08/04/21	0.7	Correspondence with Davis Polk team regarding Plan and
, 1			Disclosure Statement workstreams.
Graulich, Timothy	08/05/21	5.9	Call with counsel to potential investor regarding Mediation
			order and disclosure (0.5); review revised Disclosure
	00/05/04	0.0	Statement (3.8); review revise Plan (1.6).
Melcer, Moshe	08/05/21	2.8	Review and revise motion to extend exclusivity periods.
O'Sullivan, Damian Ford, Stephen	08/05/21 08/06/21	0.7 1.0	Review and revise Disclosure Statement. Draft Plan section on mediation.
Masaro, Matthew	08/06/21	0.2	Review and revise Disclosure Statement.
Bruno	00/00/21	0.2	Neview and revise bisologure statement.
Melcer, Moshe	08/06/21	1.4	Review and revise motion to extend exclusivity periods.
O'Sullivan, Damian	08/06/21	0.7	Review and revise Disclosure Statement.
Piraino, Stephen D.	08/06/21	3.2	Review and revise Disclosure Statement.
Masaro, Matthew	08/09/21	1.0	Review and revise Disclosure Statement (0.8);
Bruno			correspondence with R. Steinberg regarding same (0.2).
Piraino, Stephen D.	08/09/21	2.5	Prepare issues list regarding Plan and Disclosure Statement.
Jerrard, Erik	08/10/21	1.0	Call with potential exit financing provider regarding Plan.
Masaro, Matthew	08/10/21	1.3	Review and revise Disclosure Statement.
Bruno	00/40/04	0.4	Company dense with M. Manage was well as Direct
Steinberg, Richard J.	08/10/21	0.1	Correspondence with M. Masaro regarding Disclosure
Bane, Abraham	08/11/21	4.4	Statement. Call with S. Piraino, E. Jerrard, and N. Sokol regarding Plan
Dano, Abianani	00/11/21	4.4	
			(0.6); review precedent plan provisions (2.2); draft summary

Time Detail By Project			
Name	Date	Hours	Narrative
Ford, Stephen	08/11/21	6.1	Research regarding Plan (2.0); review and revise same (3.5); call with A. Bane, E. Jerrard, and N. Sokol regarding same (0.6).
Masaro, Matthew Bruno	08/11/21	3.9	Review and revise Disclosure Statement (1.3); review and revise Plan (1.3); correspondence with R. Steinberg, S. Piraino, and others regarding same (0.3).
Piraino, Stephen D.	08/11/21	4.0	Call with Davis Polk Restructuring team regarding Plan (0.6) (partial attendance); review and revise Plan (1.6); review and revise Disclosure Statement (1.6); correspondence with T. Graulich regarding same and Plan (0.2).
Bane, Abraham	08/12/21	0.6	Correspondence with S. Ford regarding Plan (0.2); review release precedent summary (0.1); correspondence with S. Piraino, N. Sokol, and E. Jerrard regarding same (0.3).
Ford, Stephen	08/12/21	5.0	Review Plan and Disclosure Statement (3.5); review and revise issues list (1.0); prepare distribution list (0.5).
Masaro, Matthew Bruno	08/12/21	6.0	Review and revise Disclosure Statement (5.0); correspondence with R. Steinberg and S. Piraino regarding same (1.0).
Piraino, Stephen D.	08/12/21	4.3	Correspondence with R. Steinberg and M. Masaro regarding Disclosure Statement (1.1); call with Rothschild, A. Conesa and R. Sanchez Baker regarding Plan issues (1.0); review and revise Plan (1.1); review and revise Disclosure Statement (1.1).
Sokol, Nate	08/12/21	0.4	Review third-party release research (0.1); email A. Bane regarding same (0.1); correspondence with S. Piraino regarding final evaluation materials and Plan (0.2).
Steinberg, Richard J.	08/12/21	0.5	Correspondence with S. Piraino and M. Masaro regarding Disclosure Statement.
Bane, Abraham	08/13/21	0.6	Review Plan issues list (0.4); correspondence with M. Masaro regarding same (0.2).
Ford, Stephen	08/13/21	3.4	Review and revise Plan.
Graulich, Timothy	08/13/21	2.8	Review and revise Plan.
Masaro, Matthew Bruno	08/13/21	5.7	Correspondence with AlixPartners regarding Disclosure Statement (0.7); review and revise same (5.0).
Piraino, Stephen D. Steinberg, Richard J.	08/13/21 08/13/21	3.9 0.3	Review and revise Plan and Disclosure Statement. Correspondence with S. Piraino and M. Masaro regarding Disclosure Statement.
Ford, Stephen	08/15/21	3.6	Review Plan draft for issues list (3.1); prepare for call with Davis Polk team regarding same (0.5).
Ford, Stephen	08/16/21	0.4	Research Plan and Disclosure Statement issues.
Graulich, Timothy	08/16/21	2.8	Review and revise Plan.
Masaro, Matthew Bruno	08/16/21	2.1	Review and revise Disclosure Statement (1.7); correspondence with S. Piraino, R. Steinberg, AlixPartners, and others regarding same (0.4).
Melcer, Moshe	08/16/21	0.3	Correspondence with R. Steinberg regarding Plan (0.1); analyze issues regarding same (0.2).
Steinberg, Richard J.	08/16/21	1.5	Review and revise Disclosure Statement (0.7); call with AlixPartners regarding letter of credit facilities (0.3); review and comment on indebtedness spreadsheet (0.3); email with AlixPartners regarding same (0.2).
Ford, Stephen	08/17/21	5.6	Call with Davis Polk Plan team regarding Plan (0.8); review and revise Plan (2.8); research issues regarding same (2.0).
Masaro, Matthew Bruno	08/17/21	2.4	Review and revise Disclosure Statement (1.6); correspondence with S. Piraino, R. Steinberg, and others regarding same and Plan (0.8).
Melcer, Moshe	08/17/21	0.5	Call with Davis Polk Plan team regarding Plan.

Time Detail By Project			
Name	Date	Hours	Narrative
O'Sullivan, Damian	08/17/21	3.1	Review and revise ballots regarding opt out issue (1.3); correspondence with M. Masaro regarding same (0.2); call with Davis Polk Plan team regarding Plan (0.5); review and revise Disclosure Statement (1.1).
Piraino, Stephen D.	08/17/21	1.8	Review and revise Disclosure Statement (1.3); call with Davis Polk Plan team regarding Plan (0.5).
Sokol, Nate	08/17/21	1.2	Call with Davis Polk Plan team regarding Plan (0.5); email with same regarding same (0.3); review Plan exculpation provisions (0.2); review precedent of same (0.1); email with S. Ford regarding same (0.1).
Steinberg, Richard J.	08/17/21	0.5	Call with Davis Polk Restructuring team regarding Disclosure Statement.
Ford, Stephen	08/18/21	12.2	Extensive review and revision of Plan (6.8); research issues regarding same (4.5); call with M. Melcer regarding outstanding items regarding same (0.1); correspondence with N. Sokol regarding Plan (0.2); correspondence with S. Piraino regarding same (0.4); correspondence with R. Steinberg regarding Plan and Disclosure Statement (0.2).
Graulich, Timothy	08/18/21	3.1	Review and comment on Disclosure Statement.
Masaro, Matthew Bruno	08/18/21	3.3	Review and revise Disclosure Statement (2.2); correspondence with R. Steinberg, S. Piraino, and others regarding same (0.6); call with AlixPartners regarding same and Plan (0.5).
Melcer, Moshe	08/18/21	0.8	Call with R. Steinberg regarding Disclosure Statement procedures (0.3); review precedent regarding same (0.1); review precedent plans for defined terms (0.3); call with S. Ford regarding outstanding tasks regarding Plan (0.1).
Piraino, Stephen D.	08/18/21	2.1	Review and revise Plan (0.8); research issues regarding Plan (1.3).
Sokol, Nate	08/18/21	0.8	Review Plan exculpation provisions (0.2); review precedent of same (0.2); email with S. Ford regarding same (0.1); email with same and M. Melcer regarding Plan equity rights offering provisions (0.1); review precedent regarding same (0.2).
Steinberg, Richard J.	08/18/21	1.3	Review and revise Disclosure Statement.
Graulich, Timothy	08/19/21	2.8	Review and revise Disclosure Statement.
Masaro, Matthew Bruno	08/19/21	0.6	Review and revise Disclosure Statement (0.4); correspondence with S. Piraino and others regarding same (0.2).
Melcer, Moshe	08/19/21	0.7	Review precedent chapter 11 plans.
Piraino, Stephen D.	08/19/21	4.9	Call with S. Szanzer regarding Plan issue (0.4); review and revise Plan (0.2); review and revise Plan and Disclosure Statement (2.2); research various Plan issues (2.1).
Steinberg, Richard J.	08/19/21	1.4	
Szanzer, Steven Z.	08/19/21	1.2	
Ford, Stephen	08/20/21	2.9	Review and revise Plan (1.9); review Plan financing proposal (1.0).
Masaro, Matthew Bruno	08/20/21	3.9	Review and revise Disclosure Statement (3.2); correspondence with S. Piraino and others regarding same (0.7).
Piraino, Stephen D.	08/20/21	1.0	Meet with R. Steinberg and M. Masaro regarding Disclosure Statement.
Steinberg, Richard J.	08/20/21	2.3	Meet with S. Piraino and others regarding Disclosure Statement (1.0); review and revise Disclosure Statement (1.3).
Ford, Stephen	08/21/21	6.4	Review and revise Plan (5.4); review precedent plans (0.8);

		Time	Detail By Project
Name	Date	Hours	Narrative
NASSAUS NASHIBAAA	00/04/04	4.4	correspondence with S. Piraino regarding same (0.2).
Masaro, Matthew Bruno	08/21/21	4.1	Review and revise Disclosure Statement (3.5);
bruno			correspondence with S. Piraino, R. Steinberg, and others regarding same (0.6).
Melcer, Moshe	08/21/21	1.3	Review and revise Disclosure Statement.
Steinberg, Richard J.	08/21/21	1.3	Review and revise Disclosure Statement.
Ford, Stephen	08/22/21	8.2	Review Sainz Abogados' comments to Plan (0.5); research
r ord, otephen	00/22/21	0.2	issues regarding same (1.0); review and revise Plan (6.4);
			correspondence with M. Masaro regarding same (0.1);
			correspondence with S. Piraino regarding same (0.1),
Graulich, Timothy	08/22/21	2.2	Review and comment on Plan.
Masaro, Matthew	08/22/21	1.1	Review and revise Disclosure Statement (0.7); correspond
Bruno	00/22/21		with S. Piraino and R. Steinberg regarding same (0.4).
Melcer, Moshe	08/22/21	0.6	Review and revise Disclosure Statement (0.2); call with R.
,			Steinberg regarding exclusivity periods (0.4).
O'Sullivan, Damian	08/22/21	1.5	Review and revise Disclosure Statement (1.4);
•			correspondence with M. Masaro regarding same (0.1).
Piraino, Stephen D.	08/22/21	0.5	Review and revise Plan.
Steinberg, Richard J.	08/22/21	0.4	Call with M. Melcer regarding exclusivity periods.
Ford, Stephen	08/23/21	3.4	Review and revise Plan (3.0); correspondence with co-
•			advisors regarding same (0.1); correspondence with S. Piraino
			and T. Graulich regarding same (0.3).
Graulich, Timothy	08/23/21	2.6	Review and revise Plan.
Masaro, Matthew	08/23/21	4.4	Review and revise Disclosure Statement (3.0);
Bruno			correspondence with S. Piraino, R. Steinberg, T. Graulich, and
			others regarding same (0.8); review and revise Plan (0.4);
			correspondence with S. Ford and others regarding same (0.2).
Melcer, Moshe	08/23/21	1.4	Review and revise motion to extend exclusivity periods (1.3);
			correspondence with R. Steinberg regarding same (0.1).
Piraino, Stephen D.	08/23/21	1.5	Correspondence with M. Masaro regarding Disclosure
			Statement (0.1); review and revise Disclosure Statement (1.1);
			review and revise Plan (0.3).
Steinberg, Richard J.	08/23/21	5.7	Email with AlixPartners regarding updated confirmation
			timeline (0.2); revise Disclosure Statement (0.6);
			correspondence with co-advisors regarding same (0.6); draft
			exclusivity extension motion (2.9); email with AlixPartners
			regarding updated confirmation timeline (0.2); revise
			Disclosure Statement (0.6); correspondence with co-advisors
C	00/00/04	0.4	regarding same (0.6).
Szanzer, Steven Z.	08/23/21	0.4	Correspondence with Davis Polk team regarding Plan.
Bane, Abraham	08/24/21	1.6	Review release provisions of Plan (0.2); correspondence with
			E. Jerrard and S. Ford regarding same (0.2); revise Plan (0.4);
			correspondence with M. Masaro regarding Disclosure
Dekhtyar, Mariya	08/24/21	0.6	Statement (0.2); review co-advisor comments to Plan (0.6). Call with D. O'Sullivan regarding Disclosure Statement (0.3);
Dekiliyai, Mailya	00/24/21	0.0	email with R. Steinberg regarding same (0.1); review
			correspondence with Sainz Abogados regarding same (0.1);
			review email from M. DeGraf regarding Plan (0.1).
Ford, Stephen	08/24/21	6.2	Review and revise Plan (5.8); correspondence with S. Piraino
i oiu, otepiieii	00/2 4 /2	0.2	regarding same (0.3); correspondence with E. Jerrard
			regarding same (0.3), correspondence with E. Jerrard regarding same (0.1).
Graulich, Timothy	08/24/21	3.8	Review Plan and Disclosure Statement for final valuation
Graunon, Timotry	JUIZ71Z I	3.0	materials.
Jerrard, Erik	08/24/21	2.3	Review and revise Plan (1.2); email with Davis Polk
Jonard, Link	3012-112 I	2.0	Restructuring team regarding same (0.7); call with S. Piraino,
			R. Steinberg and M. Melcer regarding exclusivity extension
			51

Time Detail By Project			
Name	Date	Hours	Narrative
Masaro, Matthew Bruno	08/24/21	4.0	(0.4). Review and revise Disclosure Statement (1.9); correspondence with AlixPartners and others regarding same (1.1); correspondence with Davis Polk Tax team and others
Melcer, Moshe	08/24/21	2.9	regarding same (1.0). Review and revise motion to extend exclusivity periods (1.4); correspondence with R. Steinberg regarding the same (0.1); call with S. Piraino, E. Jerrard, and R. Steinberg regarding same (0.4); review and revise Disclosure Statement (0.9); correspondence with M. Masaro regarding same (0.1).
Piraino, Stephen D.	08/24/21	0.9	Call with Davis Polk Tax and Restructuring teams regarding Disclosure Statement (0.5); call with E. Jerrard, R. Steinberg, and M. Melcer regarding exclusivity extension (0.4).
Steinberg, Richard J.	08/24/21	5.0	Revise exclusivity extension motion (3.5); call with M. Melcer, S. Piraino, and E. Jerrard regarding same (0.4); review and revise Disclosure Statement (0.8); correspondence with Davis Polk team and co-advisors regarding same (0.3).
Bane, Abraham	08/25/21	1.6	Review Sainz Abogados comments to Disclosure Statement (0.9); revise Plan (0.7).
Dekhtyar, Mariya	08/25/21	1.6	Review correspondence from Sainz Abogados and R. Steinberg regarding Disclosure Statement (0.1); correspondence with D. O'Sullivan regarding Disclosure Statement (0.1); review correspondence from M. Masaro regarding same (0.2); review and revise Disclosure Statement (0.8); email with D. O'Sullivan regarding same (0.1); call with same regarding same (0.2); email with M. Masaro, R. Steinberg, and M. Melcer regarding same (0.1).
Jerrard, Erik	08/25/21	8.0	Email with Davis Polk team regarding Plan process updates (0.3); coordinate Plan updates (0.5).
Masaro, Matthew Bruno	08/25/21	1.8	Review and revise Disclosure Statement (1.0); correspondence with AlixPartners, S. Piraino, R. Steinberg, and others regarding same (0.8).
Melcer, Moshe	08/25/21	0.6	Review and revise Disclosure Statement.
O'Sullivan, Damian	08/25/21	0.5	Review comments to Disclosure Statement (0.2); call with M. Dekhtyar regarding same (0.2); email with same regarding same (0.1).
Steinberg, Richard J.	08/25/21	0.5	Revise Disclosure Statement (0.3); correspondence with M. Masaro regarding same (0.2).
Garg, Paavani	08/26/21	0.6	Correspondence with M. Masaro regarding Disclosure Statement.
Huebner, Marshall S.	08/26/21	1.9	Correspondence with T. Graulich, H. Parkhill, Restructuring Committee regarding Plan structure, exit options, and mediation.
Masaro, Matthew Bruno	08/26/21	1.2	Review and revise Disclosure Statement (0.8); correspondence with R. Steinberg and others regarding same (0.4).
Piraino, Stephen D. Bane, Abraham	08/26/21 08/27/21	1.6 2.2	Review and revise Plan and Disclosure Statement. Correspondence with S. Ford regarding Plan (0.3); correspondence with S. Piraino regarding same (0.2); review and revise same (1.7).
Graulich, Timothy	08/27/21	4.1	Revise draft Disclosure Statement (2.7); review and revise solicitation and filing timeline (1.4).
Masaro, Matthew Bruno	08/27/21	0.4	Correspondence with P. Garg, R. Steinberg, and others regarding Disclosure Statement.
Melcer, Moshe Piraino, Stephen D.	08/27/21 08/27/21	0.1 2.4	Email with S. Piraino and E. Jerrard regarding exclusivity. Email with T. Graulich and E. Jerrard regarding exclusivity

Time Detail By Project				
Name	Date	Hours	Narrative	
	00/00/04	0.4	(0.4); review and revise Plan and Disclosure Statement (2.0).	
Garg, Paavani	08/28/21	3.4	Review and revise Disclosure Statement.	
Bane, Abraham	08/30/21	0.1	Correspondence with T. Green regarding Plan.	
Masaro, Matthew	08/30/21	0.2	Correspondence with P. Garg, R. Steinberg, and others	
Bruno			regarding Disclosure Statement.	
Steinberg, Richard J.	08/30/21	0.1	Email with AlixPartners regarding Disclosure Statement.	
Bane, Abraham	08/31/21	0.7	Review and revise exclusivity extension motion (0.5);	
			correspondence with M. Melcer regarding same (0.2).	
Melcer, Moshe	08/31/21	0.7	Revise motion to extend exclusivity periods (0.4);	
			correspondence with E. Jerrard regarding same (0.2);	
			correspondence with R. Steinberg regarding same (0.1).	
Steinberg, Richard J.	08/31/21	1.4	Correspondence with E. Jerrard regarding motion to extend	
-			exclusivity periods (0.4); revise motion to extend exclusivity	
			periods (1.0).	
Total AM230 Plan/Dis	closura	250.0		
Statement	ciosuie	230.0		
Statement				
AM240 DDW Potentio	n/Proparation of	DPW Foo St	tatements/Applications and Budget	
Jerrard, Erik	08/09/21	1.0	Review and revise June Monthly Fee Statement.	
Jerrard, Erik	08/26/21	1.0	Review and revise July Monthly Fee Statement.	
·	00/20/21		Review and revise July Monthly Fee Statement.	
Total AM240 DPW		2.0		
Retention/Preparation				
Statements/Application	ons and			
Budget				
AM250 IP, Regulatory				
Donnelly, Jacob M.	08/02/21	0.1	Email with S. Piraino regarding timing of tax issues.	
De Mullewie,	08/03/21	0.4	Coordinate antitrust filings.	
Léonore				
Donnelly, Jacob M.	08/03/21	0.3	Correspondence with S. Piraino regarding timing of tax issues	
			(0.1); email with A. Siman regarding tax issues (0.2).	
Donnelly, Jacob M.	08/04/21	1.5	Correspondence with A. Siman regarding process for drafting	
-			tax section of Disclosure Statement (0.1); review precedent	
			regarding same (1.0); email with S. Piraino regarding voting	
			issue (0.4).	
Piraino, Stephen D.	08/04/21	0.4	` ,	
, ,		_	same (0.2).	
Burke, Arthur J.	08/05/21	0.5	Correspondence with Davis Polk Antitrust team regarding	
_ = ===================================			Department of Justice status and RFI responses.	
Burke, Arthur J.	08/10/21	0.5	Correspondence with Davis Polk Antitrust team regarding	
Barko, Artifar 6.	00/10/21	0.0	Department of Justice status and strategy.	
Altus, Leslie J.	08/13/21	0.1	Email with Davis Polk Tax team regarding Disclosure	
Altus, Leslie J.	00/13/21	0.1	Statement.	
Donnelly, Jacob M.	08/13/21	0.1	Email with A. Siman and M. Masaro regarding tax issues	
Donnelly, Jacob IVI.	00/13/21	0.1		
Siman, Ariel	08/13/21	2.0	updates. Analyze tax disclosure.	
Donnelly, Jacob M.	08/15/21		Review and revise U.S. tax section of Disclosure Statement	
שטוווופווץ, Jacob IVI.	00/13/21	2.6	(2.3); email with A. Siman regarding same (0.3).	
Do Mullovio	00/16/01	4.0		
De Mullewie,	08/16/21	1.0	Analyze antitrust filing information request.	
Léonore	00/46/04	0.0	Call with C. Marriago regarding and throat and the	
Piraino, Stephen D.	08/16/21	0.2	Call with G. Morrison regarding antitrust analysis.	
Burke, Arthur J.	08/17/21	0.5	Analyze antitrust issues.	
Siman, Ariel	08/17/21	0.4	Analyze tax issue.	
Donnelly, Jacob M.	08/23/21	0.1	Email with S. Piraino, L. Altus, and L. Farr regarding mediation	
			process.	

Time Detail By Project				
Name	Date	Hours	Narrative	
Altus, Leslie J.	08/24/21	0.9	Call with Davis Polk Tax and Restructuring teams regarding Disclosure Statement (0.5); call with Davis Polk Tax team regarding same (0.4).	
Donnelly, Jacob M.	08/24/21	0.8	Call with Davis Polk Tax and Restructuring teams regarding Disclosure Statement (0.5); correspondence with L. Farr, L. Altus, and A. Siman regarding same (0.3).	
Farr, Lucy W.	08/24/21	0.9	Call with Davis Polk Tax and Restructuring teams regarding Disclosure Statement (0.5); call with Davis Polk Tax team regarding same (0.4).	
Siman, Ariel	08/24/21	1.0	Call with Davis Polk Tax and Restructuring team regarding Disclosure Statement (0.5); call with Davis Polk Tax team regarding same (0.5).	
Siman, Ariel	08/27/21	0.2	Email with Davis Polk Tax team regarding tax issues	
Farr, Lucy W.	08/29/21	0.2	Review emails with Davis Polk Tax team regarding tax issues.	
Piraino, Stephen D.	08/29/21	0.2	Correspondence with Davis Polk Tax team regarding tax issues.	
Siman, Ariel	08/31/21	1.0	Review tax disclosure.	
Total AM250 IP, Regu Tax	latory and	15.9		
AM260 Hearing Prepa				
Szanzer, Steven Z.	08/04/21	1.7	Call with R. Sanchez Baker and others regarding DAE Hearing preparation (1.3); review materials regarding same (0.4).	
Szanzer, Steven Z.	08/05/21	0.6	Correspondence with Davis Polk team regarding September Omnibus Hearing date (0.1); correspondence with Davis Polk team regarding DAE Hearing preparation (0.5).	
Melcer, Moshe	08/06/21	1.1	Draft August 12th Hearing agenda.	
Szanzer, Steven Z.	08/06/21	0.4	Correspondence with M. Melcer regarding August 12th Hearing agenda (0.2); correspondence with E. Jerrard	
Jerrard, Erik	08/08/21	0.4	regarding same (0.2). Email with M. Melcer and R. Steinberg regarding hearing preparation.	
Melcer, Moshe	08/08/21	0.1	Revise August 12th Hearing agenda.	
Steinberg, Richard J. Jerrard, Erik	08/08/21 08/09/21	0.5 0.4	Review and revise August 12th Hearing agenda. Correspondence with Chambers and S. Piraino regarding	
Jerrard, Erik	08/10/21	1.0	September Omnibus Hearing. Email with M. Melcer regarding August 12th Hearing preparation and agenda filing (0.7); correspondence with M.	
Steinberg, Richard J.	08/11/21	0.2	Melcer regarding same (0.3). Correspondence with Chambers regarding August 12th Hearing.	
Total AM260 Hearing Preparation/Attendar	ıce	6.4	J	
AM270 Credit Card R	acaivables			
Masaro, Matthew Bruno	08/06/21	0.6	Revise and revise CEBURES notice of presentment.	
Masaro, Matthew Bruno	08/09/21	0.4	Review and revise CEBURES notice of presentment (0.2); correspondence with Sainz Abogados and others regarding same (0.2).	
Masaro, Matthew Bruno	08/10/21	0.3	Review and revise CEBURES notice of presentment (0.2); correspondence with S. Piraino and others regarding same (0.1).	
Masaro, Matthew	08/11/21	1.0	Correspondence with S. Piraino, Willkie Farr, Cleary Gottlieb, 54	

20-11563-scc Doc 1958 Filed 10/22/21 Entered 10/22/21 20:24:16 Main Document Pg 68 of 68

Time Detail By Project			
Name	Date	Hours	Narrative
Bruno			Greenberg Traurig, and others regarding CEBURES.
Piraino, Stephen D.	08/11/21	0.3	Review and revise CEBURES notice of presentment.
Green, Thomas S.	08/12/21	0.4	Correspondence with Davis Polk team regarding Elavon (0.2); analyze agreement regarding same (0.2).
Masaro, Matthew Bruno	08/18/21	0.4	Review and revise CEBURES Rule 9019 (0.3); correspondence with S. Piraino and T. Graulich regarding same (0.1).
Masaro, Matthew Bruno	08/19/21	1.0	Review and revise notice of presentment for CEBURES (0.7); correspondence with O. Altman and others regarding same (0.3).
Green, Thomas S.	08/24/21	1.1	Correspondence with Aeroméxico regarding Elavon (0.5); review agreement regarding same (0.6).
Total AM270 Credit Card Receivables		5.5	
TOTAL		1,805.7	