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JONES DAY

Corinne Ball

Todd Geremia

Benjamin Rosenblum

Andrew Butler

250 Vesey Street

New York, New York 10281
Telephone:  (212) 326-3939
Facsimile: (212) 755-7306

Counsel for the Debtor
and Debtor in Possession

UNITED STATES BANKRUPTCY COURT
SOUTHERN DISTRICT OF NEW YORK

In re: : Chapter 11

THE ROMAN CATHOLIC DIOCESE OF : Case No. 20-12345 (MG)
ROCKVILLE CENTRE, NEW YORK, :

Debtor.!

NOTICE OF TWENTY-NINTH
MONTHLY FEE STATEMENT
OF JONES DAY FOR COMPENSATION
FOR SERVICES RENDERED AND REIMBURSEMENT
OF EXPENSES INCURRED AS COUNSEL TO THE DEBTOR
FOR THE PERIOD FROM FEBRUARY 1, 2023 THROUGH FEBRUARY 28, 2023

Name of Applicant: Jones Day

Authorized to Provide Services to: The Roman Catholic Diocese of Rockville Centre, New
York

Date of Retention: November 4, 2020, nunc pro tunc to October 1, 2020

Period for Which Compensation and February 1, 2023 through February 28, 2023
Expense Reimbursement is Sought:

! The Debtor in this chapter 11 case is The Roman Catholic Diocese of Rockville Centre, New York, the last
four digits of its federal tax identification number are 7437, and its mailing address is P.O. Box 9023, Rockville Centre,
NY 11571-9023.



20-12345-mg Doc 1964 Filed 03/30/23 Entered 03/30/23 17:48:00 Main Document
Pg 2 of 66

Amount of Compensation Requested $1,493,916.75
(after 10% discount):

Less 20% Holdback: $298,783.35
Net of Holdback: $1,195,133.40

Amount of Expense Reimbursement
Requested: $13,865.78

Total Compensation (Net of
Holdback) and Expense
Reimbursement Requested: $1,208,999.18

This is a X __ Monthly Interim __ Final Fee Statement

[Remainder of Page Intentionally Blank]



20-12345-mg Doc 1964 Filed 03/30/23 Entered 03/30/23 17:48:00 Main Document
Pg 3 of 66

In accordance with the Order Authorizing Procedures for Interim Compensation and
Reimbursement of Expenses of Professionals, entered on November 4, 2020 [Docket No. 129]

(the “Interim Compensation Order”),? Jones Day hereby submits this twenty-ninth monthly fee

statement (the “Twenty-Ninth Monthly Fee Statement”), seeking compensation for services

rendered and reimbursement of expenses incurred as counsel to the Debtor, for the period from

February 1, 2023 through February 28, 2023 (the “Twenty-Ninth Monthly Fee Period”). By this

Twenty-Ninth Monthly Fee Statement, and after taking into account certain voluntary discounts,’
Jones Day seeks payment in the amount of $1,208,999.18 which comprises (i) 80% of the total
amount of compensation sought for actual and necessary services rendered during the Twenty-
Ninth Monthly Fee Period and (ii) reimbursement of 100% of actual and necessary expenses
incurred in connection with such services.
SERVICES RENDERED AND EXPENSES INCURRED

1. Attached hereto as Exhibit A is a summary of Jones Day professionals by
individual, setting forth the (a) name and title of each individual who provided services during the
Twenty-Ninth Monthly Fee Period, (b) aggregate hours spent by each individual, (c) hourly billing
rate for each such individual at Jones Day’s then-current billing rates, (d) amount of fees earned

by each Jones Day professional, and (e) year of bar admission for each attorney. The blended

2 Capitalized terms not otherwise defined herein shall have the meanings ascribed to such terms in the Interim
Compensation Order.

3 The total amount sought for fees reflects (a) voluntary write offs in the amount of $2,393.75 in fees and
$138.96 in costs (b) application of a subsequent 10% discount on all fees, pursuant to an agreed practice between
Jones Day and the Debtor which was implemented prior to the Petition Date and disclosed in the Debtor’s retention
application.
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hourly billing rate of Jones Day timekeepers during the Twenty-Ninth Monthly Fee Period is
approximately $792.*

2. Attached hereto as Exhibit B is a summary of the services rendered and
compensation sought, by project category, for the Twenty-Ninth Monthly Fee Period.

3. Attached hereto as Exhibit C is a summary of expenses incurred and
reimbursement sought, by expense type, for the Twenty-Ninth Monthly Fee Period.

4. Attached hereto as Exhibit D is a copy of the Jones Day invoice for the

Twenty-Ninth Monthly Fee Period.

4 The blended rate is comprised of all Jones Day timekeepers who provided services during the Twenty-Ninth
Monthly Fee Period.
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NOTICE AND OBJECTION PROCEDURES

5. Notice of this Twenty-Ninth Monthly Fee Statement shall be given to the
following parties (collectively, the “Notice Parties”): (i) The Roman Catholic Diocese of Rockville
Centre, P.O. Box 9023, Rockville Centre, NY 11571-9023 Attn: Thomas Renker, Email:
trenker@drvc.com; (i) counsel to the Debtor, Jones Day, 250 Vesey Street, New York, NY 10281
Attn: Corinne Ball, Esq., Email: cball@jonesday.com, Benjamin Rosenblum, Esq., Email:
brosenblum@jonesday.com, and Andrew Butler, Esq., Email: abutler@jonesday.com;
(ii1) counsel to the Committee: Pachulski Stang Ziehl and Jones LLP, 780 Third Avenue, 36th
Floor, New York, New York, 10017, Attn: Ilan D. Scharf, Esq., Email: ischarf@pszjlaw.com,
Karen B. Dine, Esq., Email: kdine@pszjlaw.com, and Brittany M. Michael, Esq.,
bmichael@pszjlaw.com; and (iv) the Office of the United States Trustee, U.S. Federal Office
Building, 201 Varick Street, Suite 1006, New York, New York 10014, Attn: Greg Zipes, Email:
Greg.Zipes@usdoj.gov, and Shara Cornell, Email: Shara.Cornell@usdoj.gov.

6. Objections to this Twenty-Ninth Monthly Fee Statement, if any, must be
served via electronic mail upon Jones Day, 250 Vesey Street, New York, New York 10281, Attn:
Benjamin Rosenblum (brosenblum@jonesday.com) and Andrew Butler (abutler@jonesday.com)

no later than April 14, 2023 at 5:00 p.m. (prevailing Eastern Time) (the “Objection Deadline”),

setting forth the nature of the objection and the specific amount of fees or expenses at issue.

7. If no objections to this Twenty-Ninth Monthly Fee Statement are received
by the Objection Deadline, the Debtor shall promptly pay Jones Day 80% of the fees and 100% of
the expenses identified in this Twenty-Ninth Monthly Fee Statement.

8. To the extent that an objection to the Twenty-Ninth Monthly Fee Statement

is received on or before the Objection Deadline, the Debtor shall withhold payment of that portion



20-12345-mg Doc 1964 Filed 03/30/23 Entered 03/30/23 17:48:00 Main Document
Pg 6 of 66

of this Twenty-Ninth Monthly Fee Statement to which the objection is directed and promptly pay
the remainder of the fees and expenses in the percentages set forth above. To the extent such an
objection is not resolved, it shall be preserved and scheduled for consideration at the next interim

fee application hearing.

NO PRIOR REQUEST

9. No prior request for the relief sought in this Twenty-Ninth Monthly Fee

Statement has been made to this or any other court.

Dated: March 30, 2023 /s/ Corinne Ball
New York, New York JONES DAY

Corinne Ball

Todd Geremia

Benjamin Rosenblum

Andrew Butler

250 Vesey Street

New York, NY 10281

Telephone:  (212) 326-3939

Facsimile: (212) 755-7306

Email: cball@jonesday.com
trgeremia@jonesday.com
brosenblum@jonesday.com
abutler@jonesday.com

Counsel to the Debtor and
Debtor in Possession
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EXHIBIT A

PROFESSIONAL PERSON SUMMARY
February 1. 2023 — February 28, 2023

YEAR OF WITH 10%
NAME apmission | RATE | hiscount |  HOURS AMOUNT
PARTNER
Corinne Ball 1979 $1,950.00 $1,755.00 57.70 $101,263.50
John Casais 1996 $1,450.00 $1,305.00 3.70 $4,828.50
Christopher DiPompeo 2009 $1,400.00 $1,260.00 10.10 $12,726.00
Victoria Dorfman 2004 $1,325.00 $1,192.50 50.20 $59,863.50
Todd Geremia 1999 $1,450.00 $1,305.00 132.40 $172,782.00
Ed Joyce 1987 $1,500.00 $1,350.00 16.70 $22,545.00
Demetra Karamanos 2012 $1,350.00 $1,215.00 10.60 $12,879.00
Nicholas Morin 2014 $1,225.00 $1,102.50 134.00 $147,735.00
Bruce Olcott 1995 $1,375.00 $1,237.50 7.30 $9,033.75
Stephen Parrinello 2008 $1,350.00 $1,215.00 4.30 $5,224.50
Benjamin Rosenblum 2005 $1,550.00 $1,395.00 108.50 $151,357.50
Brian Sedlak 1993 $1,400.00 $1,260.00 19.10 $24,066.00
Eric Stephens 2009 $1,350.00 $1,215.00 143.60 $174,474.00
TOTAL PARTNER: 698.20 $898,778.25
ASSOCIATE
Marissa Alfano 2017 $675.00 $607.50 41.30 $25,089.75
Alyssa Aubuchon 2021 $725.00 $652.50 3.50 $2,283.75
Nick Buchta 2020 $625.00 $562.50 2.30 $1,293.75
Chane Buck 2017 $900.00 $810.00 38.60 $31,266.00
Andrew Butler 2017 $1,000.00 $900.00 140.20 $126,180.00
Melissa Chan 2021 $825.00 $742.50 12.90 $9,578.25
Emma Dolgos 2020 $825.00 $742.50 15.10 $11,211.75
Summer Flowers 2021 $725.00 $652.50 5.20 $3,393.00
Emerald Gearing 2021 $725.00 $652.50 2.70 $1,761.75
Justin Harris 2020 $825.00 $742.50 12.50 $9,281.25
Joshua Hoyt 2020 $675.00 $607.50 57.60 $34,992.00
Brian Johnson 2021 $725.00 $652.50 6.30 $4,110.75
Julius Kairey 2018 $875.00 $787.50 62.40 $49,140.00
Caleb Ohmer 2019 $825.00 $742.50 74.80 $55,539.00
Ryan Sims 2016 $950.00 $855.00 5.20 $4,446.00
Tanna Weisel 2016 $775.00 $697.50 6.70 $4,673.25
Nathan Yeary 2020 $775.00 $697.50 108.80 $75,888.00
TOTAL ASSOCIATE: 596.10 $450,128.25
LAW CLERK
N Orujlu 2022 $650.00 $585.00 54.00 $31,590.00
Benjamin Sandberg 2022 $650.00 $585.00 40.70 $23,809.50
W Quaranta 2023 $650.00 $585.00 55.20 $32,292.00
Abraham Tawil 2022 $650.00 $585.00 31.30 $18,310.50
Christopher Zepf 2022 $525.00 $472.50 18.10 $8,552.25
TOTAL LAW CLERK: 199.30 $114,554.25
PARALEGAL & STAFF
Cindy Gugg N/A $450.00 $405.00 72.00 $29,160.00
Sara Peterson N/A $400.00 $360.00 3.60 $1,296.00
TOTAL LEGAL SUPPORT: 75.60 $30,456.00
TOTAL: 1,569.20 $1,493,916.75
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EXHIBIT B
COMPENSATION BY PROJECT CATEGORY

February 1. 2023 — February 28, 2023

TOTAL TOTAL FEES
PROJECT CATEGORY HOURS
Asset Disposition 340.60 $340,089.75
Business Operations 5.80 $6,259.50
Case Administration 6.10 $2,767.50
Claims Administration and Objections 567.40 $567,049.50
Court Hearings 4.70 $6,862.50
Fee/Employment Applications 9.80 $6,889.50
Financing and Cash Collateral 73.10 $57,312.00
Litigation and Adversary Proceedings 295.00 $241,026.75
Meetings 15.10 $20,695.50
Plan and Disclosure Statement 251.60 $244,964.25
TOTAL 1,569.20 $1,493,916.75
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EXHIBIT C

EXPENSE SUMMARY

February 1, 2023 — February 28, 2023

Computerized Research Services $20.69
Courier Services $73.75
Court Reporter Fees $1,113.20
Hosting Charges $12,387.78
Postage $41.40
Research Fees $228.96
TOTAL $13,865.78
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EXHIBIT D

TIME DETAIL
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JONES DAY

New York Office
250 Vesey Street
New York, NY 10281-1047
(212) 326-3939

March 30, 2023 131253
Invoice: 230902054

Diocese of Rockville Centre

Attn: Thomas G. Renker, Esq.

50 North Park Avenue

P.O. Box 9023

Rockville Centre, NY 11571-9023

United States of America

For legal services rendered for the period through February 28, 2023:

Asset Disposition 377,877.50

Business Operations 6,955.00

Case Administration 3,075.00

Claims Administration and Objections 630,055.00

Court Hearings 7,625.00

Fee/Employment Applications 7,655.00

Financing and Cash Collateral 63,680.00

Litigation and Adversary Proceedings 267,807.50

Meetings 22.,995.00

Plan and Disclosure Statement 272,182.50
USD 1,659,907.50

Less Client Discount: (165,990.75)
USD 1,493,916.75

Total Billed Disbursements USD 13,865.78

TOTAL USD 1,507,782.53
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JONES DAY
131253 Page: 2
March 30, 2023
Diocese of Rockville Centre Invoice: 230902054

Disbursement & Charges Summary

Computerized Research Services 20.69
Courier Services 73.75
Court Reporter Fees 1,113.20
Hosting Charges 12,387.78
Postage Charges 41.40
Research Fees 228.96

USD 13,865.78
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JONES DAY

131253 Page: 3

March 30, 2023

Diocese of Rockville Centre Invoice: 230902054

Timekeeper/Fee Earner Summary — February 28, 2023
Timekeeper/Fee Earner Bar

Name Title Year Hours Rate Amount
C Ball Partner 1979 57.70 1,755.00 101,263.50
J D Casais Partner 1996 3.70 1,305.00 4,828.50
C J DiPompeo Partner 2009 10.10 1,260.00 12,726.00
V Dotrfman Partner 2004 50.20 1,192.50 59,863.50
T R Geremia Partner 1999 132.40 1,305.00 172,782.00
E M Joyce Partner 1987 16.70 1,350.00 22.,545.00
D Karamanos Partner 2012 10.60 1,215.00 12,879.00
N J Morin Partner 2014 134.00 1,102.50 147,735.00
B A Olcott Partner 1995 7.30 1,237.50 9,033.75
S P Parrinello Partner 2008 4.30 1,215.00 5,224.50
B Rosenblum Partner 2005 108.50 1,395.00 151,357.50
B L Sedlak Partner 1993 19.10 1,260.00 24.066.00
E P Stephens Partner 2009 143.60 1,215.00 174,474.00
Total 698.20 898,778.25
M C Alfano Associate 2017 41.30 607.50 25,089.75
A L Aubuchon Associate 2021 3.50 652.50 2,283.75
N Buchta Associate 2020 2.30 562.50 1,293.75
C Buck Associate 2017 38.60 810.00 31,266.00
A M Butler Associate 2017 140.20 900.00 126,180.00
M K Chan Associate 2021 12.90 742.50 9,578.25
E M Dolgos Associate 2020 15.10 742.50 11,211.75
S L Flowers Associate 2021 5.20 652.50 3,393.00
E A Gearing Associate 2021 2.70 652.50 1,761.75
] B Harris Associate 2020 12.50 742.50 9,281.25
J T Hoyt Associate 2020 57.60 607.50 34,992.00
B B Johnson Associate 2021 6.30 652.50 4,110.75
J Kairey Associate 2018 62.40 787.50 49,140.00
C D Ohmer Associate 2019 74.80 742.50 55,539.00
R Sims Associate 2016 5.20 855.00 4,446.00
T Wiesel Associate 2020 6.70 697.50 4,673.25
N P Yeary Associate 2020 108.80 697.50 75,888.00
Total 596.10 450,128.25
N Orujlu Law Clerk 2022 54.00 585.00 31,590.00
W P Quaranta Law Clerk 2023 55.20 585.00 32,292.00
B C Sandberg Law Clerk 2022 40.70 585.00 23,809.50
A R Tawil Law Clerk 2022 31.30 585.00 18,310.50
C Zepf Law Clerk 2022 18.10 472.50 8,552.25
Total 199.30 114,554.25
CM Gugg Paralegal 72.00 405.00 29,160.00
Total 72.00 29,160.00

S M Peterson Project Manager 3.60 360.00 1,296.00
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Pg 14 of 66
JONES DAY
Bar
Year Hours
3.60
1,569.20

Page: 4
March 30, 2023
Invoice: 230902054

Rate Amount
1,296.00
USD 1,493,916.75
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JONES DAY
131253 Page: 5
March 30, 2023
Diocese of Rockville Centre Invoice: 230902054
Fee Detail
Date of Service Timekeepet/Fee Earner Name Hours
Asset Disposition
02/01/23 C Ball 0.90

Communications regarding CFN issues and cell tower PSA.

02/01/23 C Buck 2.50
Review lease agreements (2.00); emails with clients and Alston regarding NDAs (0.50).

02/01/23 N J Morin 6.40

Review documentation related to cell tower sale process (1.00); confer with Ball (Jones Day) regarding same
(0.50); review and revise potential bidder sale documentation (1.50); call with Vincequerra (Alston) regarding
sale (0.20); confer with Yeary (Jones Day) regarding sale-related research (0.40); call with White (Jefferies) on
sale process (0.30); draft materials related to sale process (1.50); review certain research relating to sale process
(0.50); call with White and Cane (both Jefferies) relating to sale process (0.50).

02/01/23 B A Olcott 0.50

Call with Morin (Jones Day) on buyer outreach issue, notes on same (0.20); prepare responses to bidder
questions on spectrum and tower regulatory issues and emails on same (0.30).

02/01/23 R Sims 4.10

Review and analyze T-Mobile objection to sale (0.70); analyze caselaw cited therein (0.90); analyze legal
arguments in response to T-Mobile brief (0.50); draft memo regarding same (0.40); research regarding sale
considerations (1.60).

02/01/23 E P Stephens 0.50
Teleconference with Morin (Jones Day) regarding CFN negotiations.

02/02/23 C Buck 1.90

Emails regarding NDAs (0.30); prepare revised assumption and assignment notice (0.70); review leases and
discuss with Morin (Jones Day) (0.90).

02/02/23 D Karamanos 0.50

Attention to email correspondence.

02/02/23 N J Morin 3.50

Call with Dine (Pachulski) regarding sale process (0.30); draft materials related to sale process (3.00); discuss
contract list with Buck (Jones Day) (0.20).

02/03/23 C Ball 1.20

Review and revise press statement on disclosure statement filed by UCC (0.80); review Reed Smith comments
to NDA with Morin (Jones Day) (0.40).

02/03/23 N J Motin 1.50

Confer with Yeary (Jones Day) regarding sale research (0.50); draft summary of sale process matters and
circulate same to Ball (Jones Day) (1.00).
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JONES DAY
131253 Page: 6
March 30, 2023
Diocese of Rockville Centre Invoice: 230902054
02/06/23 C Buck 1.30
Call with Jefferies regarding leases and review lease summary.
02/06/23 N J Morin 5.60

Review and revise sale materials and circulate revisions to same to Cane (Jefferies) (0.40); draft correspondence
to Ball (Jones Day) regarding sale process (0.30); review and revise sale materials concerning potential bidder
(0.50); communicate with Sahn (Forchelli) regarding real property issues relating to sale (0.20); follow up with
Buck (Jones Day) regarding cell tower leases (0.10); follow up with Cane (Jefferies) regarding sale matters
(0.20); call with Ball and Stephens (both Jones Day) regarding sale (0.50); call with White (Jefferies) regarding
sale matters (0.50); communicate with Vincequerra (Alston) regarding sale (0.20); review materials related to
potential bidder and develop issues list regarding same (2.00); communicate with White (Jefferies) regarding
same (0.20); confer with Ball (Jones Day) regarding spectrum (0.50).

02/06/23 B A Olcott 2.30

Internal call on open issues in advance of final bid deadline (0.90); call to Coran (Creditors Committee)
regarding sale status and notes on same (0.20); call to counsel for potential acquirer on auction participation
and notes on same (0.20); follow up emails with Ball and Morin (both Jones Day) on results of same (0.20);
call with Jeffries on status of auction preparations and bidders, notes on same (0.80).

02/06/23 E P Stephens 1.10

Teleconference with Ball, Morin, and Olcott (all Jones Day) regarding spectrum and towers (0.30);
teleconference with Ball, Morin, Olcott (all Jones Day), White, and Cane (both Jefferies) regarding spectrum
(0.80).

02/07/23 C Ball 1.80

Communications regarding CEN Syosset PD (0.40); call with Gilardi (Ropes & Gray) (0.60); call with Morin
(Jones Day) regarding TMO next steps on CFN/Celltowers (0.80).

02/07/23 C Buck 2.30

Review lease terms.

02/07/23 N ] Morin 8.00

Confer with Ball (Jones Day) on sale matters (0.40); draft portion of materials related to cell towers (0.50);
confer with Ball and Butler (both Jones Day) regarding same (0.30); communicate with client regarding same
(0.10); review cell tower leases relating to cure list (1.00); confer with Buck (Jones Day) related to cell tower
leases and other sale matters (0.70); review additional cure notice materials from Buck (Jones Day) (0.30);
follow up with Buck (Jones Day) regarding same (0.40); draft materials related to sale and circulate same to
Ball (Jones Day) and White (Jefferies) (0.70); call with potential bidder and White (Jefferies) (0.50); review and
revise draft bidder asset purchase agreement and confer with Karamanos and Wiesel (both Jones Day)
regarding same (1.80); revise draft sale order and circulate same (with escrow agreement) to potential bidder

(1.30).

02/07/23 B A Olcott 0.40

Participate in call with potential acquirer on auction procedures, notes on same.

02/07/23 E P Stephens 0.60

Attention to spectrum and towers next steps.
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JONES DAY
131253 Page: 7
March 30, 2023

Diocese of Rockville Centre Invoice: 230902054
02/08/23 C Ball 0.90

Confer with Morin and Karamanos (both Jones Day) regarding sale agreements.
02/08/23 C Buck 1.00

Further work regarding lease terms (0.80); email with Alston regarding NDA (0.20).
02/08/23 N J Motin 5.20

Confer with Ball (Jones Day) regarding sale process (0.20); review emails from Buck (Jones Day) regarding sale
process (0.20); discuss same with Buck (Jones Day) (0.30); call with White (Jefferies) regarding sale process
(0.20); review and revise potential bidder materials and communicate with potential bidder regarding same
(1.00); confer with Karamanos and Wiesel (both Jones Day) regarding same (0.30); follow up with Ball (Jones
Day) on sale process (0.20); follow up with Cane (Jefferies) regarding sale process (0.30); draft analysis relating
to sale process (1.00); [WORK ON SALE] (1.50).

02/08/23 B A Olcott 0.40
Call with Morin (Jones Day) on litigation strategy.

02/08/23 B L Sedlak 0.50

Review and revise easement language.

02/08/23 T Wiesel 1.50

Revise asset purchase agreement (1.20); communicate with real estate team regarding asset purchase agreement
and easements (0.30).

02/09/23 C Ball 0.70
Review CFN options with Morin (Jones Day).

02/09/23 C Buck 0.50

Research regarding potential acquirer.

02/09/23 N J Morin 4.10

Draft materials related to sale and confer with Ball and Stephens (both Jones Day) related to same (3.00);
communicate with White (Jefferies) regarding sale-related issues (0.50); communicate with Ciriello (Alvarez &
Marsal) regarding sale-related matters (0.30); communicate with client regarding sale-related issues (0.30).

02/09/23 B C Sandberg 2.10

Draft and revise calendar timeline for upcoming deadlines in sale, preliminary injunction litigation, and claim
objections (2.00); confer with Butler (Jones Day) regarding same (0.10).

02/09/23 R Sims 1.10
Research regarding sale issues (0.70); review and analyze T-Mobile sale objection (0.40).

02/09/23 E P Stephens 0.50

Attention to tower and spectrum disposition.

02/10/23 C Ball 2.10

Confer with Morin (Jones Day) regarding Dine (Pachulski) position on Catholic Faith Network and cell tower
(0.60); parish counsel call (0.80); review revised memo (0.40); communications with Morin (Jones Day) and
Renker (DRVC) on spectrum sale (0.30).
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JONES DAY
131253 Page: 8
March 30, 2023
Diocese of Rockville Centre Invoice: 230902054
02/10/23 C Buck 0.60
Emails regarding NDAs.
02/10/23 N J Morin 2.30

Respond to client email on sale process (0.20); follow up with White (Jefferies) and Wiesel (Jones Day)
regarding sale process (0.20); confer with Butler (Jones Day) regarding timeline (0.10); call with Dine
(Pachulski) regarding sale process (0.30); confer with Ball (Jones Day) regarding sale process (0.40); call with
White (Jefferies) regarding sale process (0.20); circulate revised bidder materials to potential bidder (0.20); call
with potential bidder regarding sale process (0.40); call with Schmidt (Kramer) regarding sale process (0.30).

02/10/23 E P Stephens 0.50

Review Committee discovery requests (0.10); attention to tower and spectrum disposition (0.40).

02/12/23 C Ball 0.40
Discuss CFN and Cell towers with Morin (Jones Day).

02/12/23 N ] Morin 0.30

Communicate internally and with Jefferies team on sale.

02/13/23 C Ball 0.40

Confer with Morin (Jones Day) regarding spectrum.

02/13/23 C Buck 1.00

Review Dish leases (0.50); revise assumption notice (0.50).

02/13/23 D Karamanos 0.50

Attention to email correspondence.

02/13/23 N ] Morin 2.80

Review potential bidder materials (0.30); discuss same with real property team including Sedlak (Jones Day)
(0.50); review research related to sale (1.50); discuss same with Yeary (Jones Day) (0.50).

02/13/23 C D Ohmer 7.30

Draft comments to the Grantee’s form easement.

02/13/23 B L Sedlak 2.30

Review PSA and easement (1.30); conference regarding same (1.00).

02/13/23 T Wiesel 0.60

Communicate with Epiq and Jefferies regarding escrow (0.20); confer internally regarding asset purchase
agreement (0.40).

02/14/23 C Ball 0.90
Communicate with Donnelly (SiriusXM) and Schmidt (Kramer Levin) regarding demands on CEN cell tower.
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02/14/23 C Buck 0.70

Emails to Jones Day team and client regarding NDAs (0.40); review assumption notice (0.30).

02/14/23 N J Morin 7.80

Review draft materials related to potential bidder and communicate with Sedlak (Jones Day) regarding same
(0.90); circulate same materials to potential bidder and client (0.50); review notice materials related to sale
process (1.20); review sale-related research and draft materials related to same (2.10); review and revise
materials related to potential bidder and circulate same to Sedlak and Karamanos (both Jones Day) (0.70); call
with Ball (Jones Day) regarding sale process (0.40); call with Ball (Jones Day), Donnelly (CFN) and Schmidt
(Kramer) regarding sale (0.50); review additional materials relating to sale process (0.50); revise potential
bidder materials and recirculate same to potential bidder (1.00).

02/14/23 C D Ohmer 2.50

Draft comments to the easement agreement.

02/14/23 B L Sedlak 2.30

Review local counsel comments (1.00); review purchaser comments (1.00); revise easement (0.30).

02/14/23 T Wiesel 0.50

Revise asset purchase agreement.

02/15/23 C Ball 0.90

Communications with Van Osselear (ADR) regarding Arrowood and UCC (0.70); communications with Law
(Reed Smith) regarding Arrowood financials (0.20).

02/15/23 C Buck 1.40
Finalize assumption notice for filing (0.50); prepare schedule to APA (0.90).

02/15/23 N J Morin 7.00

Revise potential bidder materials and circulate same to client and potential bidder (1.80); revise other sale
process materials and circulate revised version of same to Buck (Jones Day) (0.50); prepare for call with
potential bidder (0.50); call with potential bidder and White (Jefferies) (0.50); follow up with Sedlak (Jones
Day) regarding potential bidder materials (0.10); follow up with White (Jefferies) regarding sale process (0.20);
review and revise escrow agreement (0.20); communicate with client on sale process (0.30); communicate with
client on cell tower tenant question (0.10); communicate with potential bidder on bidder materials (0.20);
confer with Buck (Jones Day) regarding same (0.30); communicate with potential bidder regarding documents
(0.30); confer with Sedlak (Jones Day) and others regarding potential bidder documents (0.50); revise potential
bidder materials and circulate same to client (1.50).

02/15/23 C D Ohmer 5.00

Draft comments to the easement agreement.

02/15/23 B A Olcott 0.60

Participate in tower easement call and emails and notes on same.

02/15/23 B L Sedlak 2.50

Review and revise easement (0.50); multiple conferences with Ohmer (Jones Day) (1.00); review
correspondence and local counsel comments (0.50); review comments from purchaser (0.50).
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02/15/23 T Wiesel 0.70

Call with potential acquirer (0.60); internal transaction planning (0.10).

02/16/23 C Ball 0.60
Communications with Schmidt (Kramer Levin) regarding CFN.

02/16/23 C Buck 0.40
Emails with Jones Day team and client regarding NDA.

02/16/23 N J Morin 5.50

Communicate with Epiq team regarding escrow (0.20); confer with Ball (Jones Day) regarding sale matters
(0.40); call with potential bidder (0.50); call with Schmidt (Kramer) (0.30); revise potential bidder
documentation and recirculate same to potential bidder (1.50); call with White (Jefferies) regarding sale process
(0.10); follow up with Ball (Jones Day) on sale process (0.20); communicate with client regarding sale process
(0.60); follow up with Schmidt (Kramer) on sale (0.20); communications with potential bidder and Sedlak
(Jones Day) regarding sale (0.50); communicate with Ball (Jones Day) and White (Jefferies) regarding sale
(0.50); follow up with client regarding same (0.50).

02/16/23 C D Ohmer 3.20

Draft comments to the easement agreement (1.00); attention to real estate documents (2.20).

02/16/23 B L Sedlak 2.70

Multiple calls regarding easement (1.70); review and revise same (1.00).

02/17/23 C Buck 1.00
Draft notice of APA.
02/17/23 N J Motin 7.00

Review and revise potential bidder sale documentation and recirculate to potential bidder (1.80); multiple
communications with Ball (Jones Day), Stephens (Jones Day), and White (Jefferies) on sale matters (0.70);
communicate with Kane (Jefferies) regarding sale matters (0.50); follow up with Ball (Jones Day) on sale
matters (0.30); follow up with White (Jefferies) regarding same (0.20); call with potential bidder regarding sale
matters (0.30); follow up with Cane (Jefferies) regarding same (0.20); review additional bidder materials and
circulate same to internal team (including Karamanos, Sedlak and Olcott (all Jones Day) and Jefferies team
(including White and Cane) (1.00); call with White (Jefferies) regarding same (0.30); follow up with Ball
(Olcott) regarding same (0.20); review and revise bidder materials (0.60); communicate with client regarding
same (0.30); call with Schmidt (Kramer) regarding sale matters (0.30); follow up with client, Ball (Jones Day)
and White (Jefferies) regarding same (0.30).

02/17/23 C D Ohmer 1.50

Attention to real estate documents (1.50).

02/17/23 T Wiesel 0.60

Prepare asset purchase agreement for execution (0.40); review asset purchase agreement markup (0.20).

02/18/23 C Ball 0.90

Communications to Morgner (Jefferies) regarding sale issues.
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02/18/23 N J Morin 4.70

Review and revise potential bidder sale materials and circulate same to internal team (including Sedlak,,
Karamanos, and Olcott (all Jones Day)) and Jefferies team (including White (Jefferies) (4.10); call with Snipas
(Forchelli), White (Jefferies), and Ohmer (Jones Day) on potential bidder sale materials (0.60).

02/18/23 C D Ohmer 6.40
Draft comments to the asset purchase agreement (2.70); attention to real estate documents (3.20); call with
client (0.50).

02/18/23 B A Olcott 0.20

Review APA and notes on same.

02/18/23 B L Sedlak 2.00

Confer with Ohmer (Jones Day); review revised asset purchase agreement.

02/18/23 T Wiesel 1.50

Revise asset purchase agreement.

02/19/23 C Buck 1.50
Revise Sale Order.

02/19/23 D Karamanos 2.60

Review and revise asset purchase agreement.

02/19/23 N J Morin 1.80

Communicate with Schmidt (Kramer) regarding sale process (0.30); follow up with Ball (Jones Day) regarding
sale process (0.30); call with Perrone (CFN) and Schmidt (Kramer) regarding diligence questions (0.50); follow
up with Cane (Jefferies) regarding same (0.20); multiple calls with White (Jefferies) on sale matters (0.30); call
with Ball (Jones Day) on same (0.20).

02/19/23 S P Parrinello 1.00

Confer with Wiesel and Morin (both Jones Day) regarding tax matters relating to sale of cell towers (0.30);
review and analysis of APA and state and local tax analysis (0.70).

02/19/23 T Wiesel 1.30

Revise asset purchase agreement (1.00); update asset purchase agreement (0.10); confer internally about asset
purchase agreement (0.20).

02/20/23 C Buck 0.90

Revise asset purchase agreement (0.50); review service of Sale Notice (0.40).

02/20/23 N J Morin 6.50

Review and revise potential bidder documentation and circulate same to Karamanos, Wiesel and Sedlak (all
Jones Day) (1.00); draft materials relating to sale process (3.00); respond to correspondence from White
(Jefferies) (0.20); call with potential bidder (0.20); call with Schmidt (KKramer) regarding sale (0.20); review
research and further draft materials relating to sale process (1.60); review documents and follow up with
Schmidt (Kramer) (0.30).
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02/20/23 C D Ohmer 1.50

Draft comments to the easement agreement.
02/20/23 S P Parrinello 0.50

Confer with Wynne (Jones Day) regarding state and local transfer tax analysis.
02/20/23 B L Sedlak 0.70

Review comments to asset purchase agreement.
02/21/23 C Buck 1.00

Prepare supplemental service of Sale Notice (0.70); emails to client and Epiq regarding escrow agreement

(0.30).
02/21/23 N J Morin 5.00

Review materials and communicate with Snipas (Forchelli) regarding sale (0.40); call with potential bidder and
White (Jefferies) regarding sale process (0.70); confer with Buck (Jones Day) regarding sale (0.10);
communicate with client regarding sale (0.30); confer with Yeary (Jones Day) regarding research (0.30); call
with Stephens (Jones Day) regarding sale (0.20); call with Snipas (Forchelli) and Ohmer (Jones Day) regarding
sale (0.50); call with Morgner and White (both Jefferies) regarding sale (0.20); draft follow up to Ball (Jones
Day) regarding same (0.50); follow up with Ohmer (Jones Day) regarding real property (0.20); communicate
with Tran (Epiq) regarding escrow (0.10); communicate with potential bidder regarding real property (0.30);
follow up with Snipas (Forchelli) regarding real property (0.20); call with Schmidt (Kramer) regarding sale
(0.20); revise escrow and circulate to potential bidder (0.30); confer with Buck (Jones Day) regarding escrow
(0.10); follow up with potential bidder regarding questions (0.20); follow up with Buck (Jones Day) regarding
materials (0.20).

02/21/23 C D Ohmer 5.70

Revise real estate portions of the bid drafts.

02/21/23 S P Parrinello 0.50

Confer with Wiesel (Jones Day) regarding transfer tax analysis.

02/21/23 E P Stephens 0.20

Teleconference with Morin (Jones Day) regarding asset disposition.

02/21/23 N P Yeary 1.50
Research related to sale matter (1.00); analyze same (0.50).

02/22/23 C Buck 1.30

Emails with Jones Day team, client, and Epiq regarding escrow agreements (0.50); review bid documents and
discuss with Morin (Jones Day) (0.80).

02/22/23 D Karamanos 0.60

Attention to email correspondence.

02/22/23 N J Mortin 5.00
Communicate with Tran (Epiq) regarding escrow (0.10); communicate with White (Jefferies) regarding bidders
(0.20); communicate with potential bidder regarding escrow and additional documentation (0.50); review
escrow agreement and discuss with Buck (Jones Day) (0.40); communicate with client regarding cell tower
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diligence item (0.20); review bid and communicate with White (Jefferies) regarding additional information
(0.30); confer with Olcott (Jones Day) regarding sale process (0.30); communicate with White (Jefferies)
regarding same (0.30); review bids and follow up with bidder regarding additional information (1.50); follow
up with White (Jefferies) on bids (0.50); confer with Ball (Jones Day) regarding bids (0.40); call with Dine
(Pachulski) and Morgner (Jefferies) regarding sale (0.30).

02/22/23 C D Ohmer 1.20

Revise real estate portions of the bid drafts.

02/22/23 B A Olcott 0.60

Emails and calls on possible buyer participation in auction, notes on same (0.30); participate in portion of call
with UCC on initial bidding results (0.30).

02/23/23 C Ball 1.30
Bids and next steps on Spectrum (0.60); call with Jefferies (0.70).

02/23/23 C Buck 3.60

Emails to client and Epiq regarding escrow agreement (0.50); review bid and organize documents (0.60);
organize bid documents (1.00); emails to consultation parties regarding bids (0.50); coordinate logistics for
auction (1.00).

02/23/23 D Karamanos 1.20
Attention to email correspondence (0.50). Call to discuss bids (0.70).

02/23/23 N J Morin 8.00

Confer with Buck (Jones Day) regarding next steps regarding sale process (0.50); follow up with Ball (Jones
Day) regarding sale (0.30); review bids and develop work plan for next steps involving Karamanos, Olcott and
Sedlak (all Jones Day) (2.70); review and revise bidder asset purchase agreements and circulate same internally,
including to Karamanos (Jones Day) (2.50); communicate with Snipas (Forchelli) on sale status and next steps
(0.50); communicate with bidder regarding bid documentation (0.30); call with White (Jefferies) regarding next
steps on sale process (0.50); follow up with Ball (Jones Day) regarding same (0.50); communicate with bidder
regarding auction logistics (0.20).

02/23/23 C D Ohmer 7.00
Revise real estate portions of the bid drafts.

02/23/23 B A Olcott 0.50

Call on next steps in auction process, notes on same.

02/23/23 S P Parrinello 1.00

Review and analysis of APA and easement (0.50); confer with Dickson, Morin and Ohmer (all Jones Day)
regarding the same (0.50).

02/23/23 E P Stephens 0.40

Teleconference with Morin, Karamanos, Olcott (all Jones Day), White, Cane, Brown, and Morgner (all
Jefferies) regarding bids and next steps.

02/24/23 C Ball 2.00
Review Stang (Pachulski) correspondence (0.70); confer with Morin (Jones Day) regarding same (0.30);
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communications with Schmidt (Kramer Levin) regarding same (0.30); review Spectrum bid summaries (0.70).

02/24/23 C Buck 6.20

Revise APA (2.70); review adequate assurance information (1.00); coordinate logistics for auction and emails
to attendees regarding auction (2.50).

02/24/23 D Karamanos 2.50
Review APAs.
02/24/23 N J Morin 7.50

Communicate with client on sale status (0.30); follow up with White (Jefferies) regarding same (0.20);
coordinate with Buck (Jones Day) regarding sale items, including adequate assurance (0.50); communicate with
bidder on auction logistics (0.10); call with bidder and White (Jefferies) (0.40); review and revise bidders’ asset
purchase agreements and confer internally regarding same (2.50); coordinate with Buck (Jones Day) on update
to consultation parties (0.20); call with Snipas (Forchelli) regarding real property matters (0.30); revise
additional bid documentation (including sale orders) for certain bidders (1.00); circulate revised versions of bid
documentation to certain bidders (0.50); review UCC letter (0.50); correspond with Ball (Jones Day) regarding
same (0.50); call with Sandberg (Jones Day) regarding settlement agreement (0.50).

02/24/23 C D Ohmer 9.50

Draft real estate comments to the APA and easement (4.00); review option agreement for the Islip property
(1.50); coordinate with local counsel (2.00); diligence properties to be granted (2.00).

02/24/23 S P Parrinello 0.50

Review and analysis of APA and easement drafts.

02/24/23 B C Sandberg 0.50
Review email from Morin (Jones Day) (0.20); confer with Morin (Jones Day) regarding research project (0.30).

02/24/23 B L Sedlak 2.80

Review correspondence, offer summary, and real estate issues.

02/25/23 N J Morin 1.00

Brief research regarding matters related to sale.

02/25/23 B C Sandberg 3.90

Research section 363(f) sales and send findings regarding same to Morin (Jones Day).

02/26/23 C Buck 0.90
Draft Notice of Revised BPs.

02/26/23 N J Morin 1.50

Discuss research with Sandberg (Jones Day) (0.50); review certain research (1.00).

02/26/23 C D Ohmer 3.50

Draft real estate comments to the APA and easement.
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02/26/23 B C Sandberg 5.30

Review email from Morin (Jones Day) ) (0.30); research section 363(f) sales (1.00); call with Morin (Jones Day)
regarding case law (0.30); research adequate protection, mootness, and related issues (2.50); send findings
regarding same to Morin (Jones Day) (1.20).

02/27/23 C Ball 1.20
Call regarding Spectrum with Jefferies and client (0.90); prepate for same (0.30).

02/27/23 C Buck 4.00
Prepare logistics for auction (1.00); review bids (2.30); attend client call (0.70).

02/27/23 D Karamanos 1.00
Call to discuss bids.

02/27/23 N J Motin 11.00
Review and revise bid documentation (4.00); review caselaw (3.00); client call (1.00); draft letter (1.50); calls
(1.50).

02/27/23 C D Ohmer 7.00

Draft comments to APA and easement.

02/27/23 B A Olcott 1.00

Participate in call with Jefferies on auction process next steps, spectrum disposition.

02/27/23 S P Parrinello 0.80
Review and analysis of most recent draft APA (0.50); confer with Morin (Jones Day) regarding the same
(0.30).

02/27/23 B C Sandberg 4.80

Confer with Morin (Jones Day) regarding research for letter in response to UCC (0.40); continue researching
various legal issues arising in this context (2.60); confer with Morin and Butler (both Jones Day) regarding
same (0.30); continue research and send findings to Morin (Jones Day) regarding same (1.50).

02/27/23 E P Stephens 2.00

Draft termination letter (1.00); teleconference with Ball, Morin, Olcott (all Jones Day), Renker (DRVC),
Ciriello (Alvarez & Marsal), and White (Jefferies) regarding cell towers and spectrum next steps (1.00).

02/28/23 C Ball 1.40

Communications with Jefferies regarding cell towers and Spectrum (0.70); review and revise response to UCC

on CFN (0.70).

02/28/23 C Buck 4.60

Review sample auction scripts (0.50); review T-Mobile Bid packet (0.50); emails to consultation parties
regarding revised bidding procedures and finalize revised bidding procedures for filing (0.50); review contracts
list (0.60); draft adequate assurance letter (0.50); prepare for auction and emails with bidders, Jones Day team,
and consultation parties regarding auction (2.00).

02/28/23 D Karamanos 1.70
Call to discuss APA (0.60); review APA (1.10).



20-12345-mg Doc 1964 Filed 03/30/23 Entered 03/30/23 17:48:00 Main Document

Pg 26 of 66
JONES DAY
131253 Page: 16
March 30, 2023
Diocese of Rockville Centre Invoice: 230902054
02/28/23 N J Morin 10.00

Call with Ohmer (Jones Day) regarding real property issues (0.50); review and revise bidder asset purchase
agreement and circulate same internally, including to Karamanos, Sedlak and Olcott (all Jones Day) (1.80);
confer with Stephens (Jones Day) regarding real property matters (0.30); confer with Buck (Jones Day)
regarding cell tower leases (0.20); call with Borriello (Togut) regarding real property matters (0.30); call with
White (Jefferies) regarding sale (0.30); confer with Karamanos (Jones Day) regarding asset purchase agreement
(0.50); communicate with Snipas (Forchelli) regarding asset purchase agreement (0.30); confer with Buck
(Jones Day) regarding adequate assurance (0.20); communicate with Schmidt (Kramer) regarding diligence and
other items (0.30); confer with Buck (Jones Day) regarding next steps (0.30); call with Morgner and White
(both Jefferies) regarding bids (0.50); communicate with Tran (Epiq) regarding escrow (0.20); communicate
with bidders regarding auction and revisions to bid documentation (1.00); confer with Buck (Jones Day)
regarding revisions to bidding procedures (0.30); revise bidder asset purchase agreement and communicate
with bidder regarding same (1.10); draft auction materials and circulate same to Morgner and White (both
Jefferies) (0.90); draft communications relating to baseline bid and qualified bids (0.70); confer with Buck
(Jones Day) regarding same (0.30).

02/28/23 C D Ohmer 13.50

Draft comments to APA and easement.

02/28/23 B A Olcott 0.80

Emails on Verizon request for information, notes on same (0.20); participate in call on auction procedures
and response to Verizon, notes on same (0.60).

02/28/23 B C Sandberg 3.50

Review draft letter from Morin (Jones Day) (0.30); confer with Ball (Jones Day) regarding potential argument
for letter (0.20); research argument (2.70); confer with Ball (Jones Day) regarding findings (0.30).

02/28/23 B L Sedlak 3.30

Confer with Ohmer (Jones Day) regarding modifications to APA and Easement (0.80); multiple conferences
regarding same (0.50); review and revise documents (1.00); conference with potential acquirer regarding
changes to documentation (1.00).

Matter Total 340.60

Business Operations

02/03/23 B Rosenblum 0.50

Communicate with parish counsel regarding parish matters.

02/06/23 A M Butler 0.40

Attend to parish transfer disclosure issues.

02/07/23 A M Butler 1.60

Review various business operations issues (1.50); confer with Morin (Jones Day) regarding same (0.10).

02/08/23 A M Butler 0.30

Confer with Ciriello (Alvarez & Marsal) and client regarding business operations questions.
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02/10/23 B Rosenblum 0.50
Communicate with parish counsel regarding parish matters.
02/16/23 A M Butler 0.30
Review business operations questions from client and respond to same.
02/17/23 A M Butler 0.60
Confer with client regarding business operations questions.
02/17/23 B Rosenblum 0.50
Communicate with parish counsel regarding parish matters.
02/22/23 B Rosenblum 0.10
Communicate with Alvarez & Marsal regarding payment notices.
02/24/23 A M Butler 0.50
Confer with client regarding business operations question.
02/24/23 B Rosenblum 0.50
Communicate with parish counsel regarding parish matters.
Matter Total 5.80
Case Administration
02/01/23 CM Gugg 0.70

Review and e-file redacted agreed coverage summary in adversary proceeding (0.20); prepare submission to
court of under seal filings (0.50).

02/02/23 A M Butler 0.60

Review and prepare filings for Alvarez & Marsal.

02/02/23 CM Gugg 0.20

Review and e-file Alvarez & Marsal declaration.

02/06/23 CM Gugg 1.10

Prepare submission to clerk of filed papers and un-redacted exhibits under seal in connection with claim
objection motions (0.90); review and electronically file amended schedules (0.20).

02/08/23 CM Gugg 0.10

Review and electronically file notice of status conference.

02/10/23 CM Gugg 0.40
Case research (0.20); pull documents (0.20).
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02/15/23 CM Gugg 0.20

Review and electronically file supplemental notice.
02/17/23 CM Gugg 0.70

Perform online reseatch requested by Ball (Jones Day).
02/21/23 CM Gugg 0.40

Confer with Yeary (Jones Day) regarding research request (0.20); communications with Westlaw rep regarding
additional filings to be retrieved (0.20).

02/22/23 CM Gugg 0.50

Assemble copies of filings for submission to court.

02/23/23 CM Gugg 0.60

Review and electronically file adjournment of hearing on claim objections and withdrawal of clams (0.30); and
assemble documents in connection with proposed additional claim objections (0.30).

02/24/23 CM Gugg 0.20

Confer with Yeary (Jones Day) regarding requested research document retrieval (0.10); communicate with
Westlaw CourtExpress regarding requested research document retrieval (0.10).

02/28/23 CM Gugg 0.40

Review and electronically file monthly operating report (0.20); review and electronically file notice of revised
bidding procedures (0.20).

Matter Total 6.10

Claims Administration and Objections

02/01/23 V Dorfman 1.00

Confer with Geremia (Jones Day) regarding claim objections (0.30); review and analyze materials relating to
claim objections (0.70).

02/01/23 T R Geremia 4.70

Draft omnibus claim objection.

02/01/23 CM Gugg 4.00

Begin redacting documents to be included in claim objection motions.

02/01/23 B Rosenblum 0.10

Respond to client inquiry regarding bar date order.

02/01/23 E P Stephens 0.90

Attention to claim valuation planning (0.70); teleconference with Rosenblum (Jones Day) regarding claim
valuation planning (0.20).
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02/02/23 A M Butler 1.90

Review next steps on claim objections (1.00); confer with Rosenblum and Geremia (both Jones Day) regarding
same (0.50); review and revise declaration (0.40).

02/02/23 V Dotfman 0.60

Confer with Geremia (Jones Day) regarding claim objections (0.20); review and analyze materials relating to
claim objections (0.40).

02/02/23 T R Getremia 7.10

Prepare and finalize omnibus claims objection and declaration in support of same.

02/02/23 CM Gugg 6.70

Complete preparation of redacted documents to be included in claim objection motions (0.70); prepare
schedules and exhibits to be included in omnibus motions (3.20); draft individualized notices (2.00); confer
with Geremia (Jones Day) (0.80).

02/02/23 B Rosenblum 4.20

Participate in claim objection strategy call (0.60); revise claim objections (1.20); review/analyze claims (2.30);
confer with Geremia (Jones Day) regarding same (0.10)

02/02/23 E P Stephens 0.80

Teleconference with Kramer (Reed Smith) and Sochurek (claims expert) regarding valuation next steps (0.60).
Attention to claim objection planning (0.20).

02/03/23 A M Butler 10.20

Review and revise claim objections (4.00); finalize objections and prepare for filing (3.00); attend to service
issues for claim objections (2.00); confer with Rosenblum, Geremia, Gugg (all Jones Day) regarding same
(0.80); follow up with Rosenblum (Jones Day) regarding same (0.40);

02/03/23 T R Geremia 9.50

Revise and finalize omnibus claims objection.

02/03/23 CM Gugg 12.50

Complete preparation of redacted documents to be included in claim objection motions (0.80); prepare
schedules and exhibits to be included in omnibus motions (9.00); review and electronically file papers (0.50);
multiple communications with Epiq regarding service (1.00); and multiple discussions with Geremia,
Rosenblum and Butler (all Jones Day) (1.20).

02/03/23 B Rosenblum 0.50

Participate in claim objection call.

02/05/23 E P Stephens 0.60

Review claim objections.

02/06/23 M C Alfano 0.40

Confer with Butler (Jones Day) regarding proof of claim omnibus objections (0.10); review DRVC docket
(0.30).
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02/06/23 A M Butler 4.10

Review next steps on claim objections (1.50); calls with Geremia, Rosenblum (both Jones Day) regarding claim
objections (1.40); confer with Alfano (Jones Day) regarding same (0.20); review claim issues (1.00).

02/06/23 M K Chan 0.40

Confer with Geremia and Gugg (both Jones Day) regarding claim objections letters (0.30); confer with
Geremia (Jones Day) regarding draft language for did not supervise claims (0.10).

02/06/23 V Dorfman 1.40

Confer with Geremia (Jones Day) regarding claim objections (0.50); review and analyze materials relating to
claim objections (0.90).

02/06/23 T R Geremia 5.20

Draft next round of omnibus claims objection on grounds of do not supervise (3.50); call with Rosenblum,
Butler, and Gugg (all Jones Day) regarding claims objections (0.50); call with Gugg and Chan (both Jones Day)
regarding claims objections (0.50); call with Dorfman (Jones Day) regarding do not supervise round of claim
objections (0.70).

02/06/23 CM Gugg 6.00
Prepare objection notices to claimants (5.00); confer with Geremia, Rosenblum and Butler (all Jones Day)
(1.00).

02/06/23 B Rosenblum 6.00

Participate in claim objection meetings (1.00); attention to analysis of claims and claim objections (5.00).

02/06/23 E P Stephens 0.30

Teleconference with Rosenblum (Jones Day) regarding claim valuation.

02/07/23 M C Alfano 5.20

Confer with Butler (Jones Day) concerning claim objections filings (0.70); draft seventh omnibus claim
objection and schedules (2.20); draft eighth omnibus objection and schedule (2.30).

02/07/23 A M Butler 4.00

Review and prepare for next steps on claim objections (2.50); confer with Rosenblum (Jones Day) regarding
same (0.50); confer with Alfano (Jones Day) regarding same (1.00).

02/07/23 V Dotfman 1.50

Confer with Geremia (Jones Day) regarding claim objections (0.40); review and analyze materials relating to
claim objections (1.10).

02/07/23 E A Gearing 0.80

Confer with Geremia (Jones Day) (0.20); draft brief summaries regarding certain claim objections (0.50);
attend to email communication (0.10).

02/07/23 T R Getremia 5.90

Draft and finalize next round of letters notifying claimants of omnibus claim objections (1.20); draft omnibus
claim objections on ground of do not supervise (4.70).

02/07/23 CM Gugg 6.60

Prepare objection notices to claimants (5.80); confer with Geremia, Rosenblum and Butler (all Jones Day)
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(0.80).
02/07/23 J Kairey 3.20

Confer with Geremia and Butler (both Jones Day) for introduction to matter (0.70); review background
materials (1.40); collect materials for use in Cassidy declaration (1.10).

02/07/23 B Rosenblum 7.10

Review/analyze proofs of claim subject to objection and attention to claim objections (5.00); confer with
Stephens (Jones Day) regarding claim objections (0.10); confer with Butler (Jones Day) regarding same (0.40);
confer with Ball (Jones Day) regarding claim objection letters (0.10); draft memo to client regarding claim
objections (0.70); confer internally regarding same (0.20); analyze responses to letters (0.50); email to Stephens
and Geremia (both Jones Day) regarding same (0.10).

02/07/23 E P Stephens 6.30

Attention to claim valuation planning (5.50); teleconference with Kramer (Reed Smith), Sochurek, and Terrell
(claims expert) regarding claim valuation (0.80).

02/08/23 M C Alfano 0.40

Confer with Butler (Jones Day) about IRCP releases (0.20); revise seventh and eighth omnibus objections and
declaration (0.20).

02/08/23 C Ball 0.40

Discuss claim valuation and objections with Stephens (Jones Day).

02/08/23 A M Butler 6.00

Review and revise claim objections and claim objection letters (5.00); call with Rosenblum, Geremia, Kairey
(all Jones Day) regarding claim objections (1.00).

02/08/23 E A Gearing 0.30
Confer with Geremia (Jones Day).

02/08/23 T R Geremia 5.30

Draft letters to claimants concerning omnibus claim objections (1.80); draft next round of omnibus claims
objections (2.50); meet with Butler and Rosenblum (both Jones Day) regarding claim objections (1.00).

02/08/23 CM Gugg 9.90

Continue preparing objection notice to claimants (6.60); prepare service of notice upon pro se and counsel
claimants (2.50); confer with Geremia, Rosenblum and Butler (all Jones Day) (0.80).

02/08/23 J Kairey 5.00

Confer with Geremia, Butler, and Rosenblum (all Jones Day) regarding matter (0.70); draft declaration (4.20);
send same to Geremia (Jones Day) (0.10).

02/08/23 B Rosenblum 4.50

Attention to claim objections and claim objection letters (3.90); participate in meeting regarding claim
objections (0.60).

02/08/23 E P Stephens 5.20

Attention to claim valuation planning.



20-12345-mg Doc 1964 Filed 03/30/23 Entered 03/30/23 17:48:00 Main Document

Pg 32 of 66
JONES DAY
131253 Page: 22
March 30, 2023
Diocese of Rockville Centre Invoice: 230902054
02/09/23 M C Alfano 0.10
Confer with Gugg (Jones Day) concerning IRCP releases.
02/09/23 A M Butler 3.00

Review claim objection drafts (1.50); draft revised notices (0.50); confer with Rosenblum (Jones Day)
regarding next steps on objections (0.50); review documents supporting claim objections (0.50).

02/09/23 T R Geremia 6.80

Draft omnibus claim objection regarding do not supervise and supporting declaration.

02/09/23 CM Gugg 0.30

Assemble exhibits to seventh omnibus claims objections.

02/09/23 J Kairey 4.70

Review latest version of declaration and cross-check factual claims (1.90); review and revise brief for fifth
omnibus objections, including cite check (2.50); confer with Geremia, Rosenblum, and Butler (all Jones Day)
regarding same (0.30).

02/09/23 B Rosenblum 6.90

Review cases on claim objections (2.80); revise claim objection filings (1.70); attention to claim letters (1.20);
confer with Ball (Jones Day) regarding same (0.10); refine claim objection timeline (0.20); numerous
discussions with Geremia (Jones Day) regarding claim objections (0.80); confer with Butler (Jones Day)
regarding same (0.10).

02/09/23 E P Stephens 2.70

Attention to claim valuation planning (2.10); teleconference with Kramer (Reed Smith) and Sochurek (claims
expert) regarding claim valuation (0.40); teleconference with Biros (Feinberg Group) regarding discovery
update (0.10); teleconference with claims expert regarding claim valuation (0.10).

02/09/23 A R Tawil 3.80

Review and analyze amended claims.

02/10/23 M C Alfano 0.10
Confer with Butler (Jones Day) regarding objections.

02/10/23 A M Butler 4.80

Finalize claim objections (3.00); prepare to file same (1.00); attend to service issues with respect to same (0.60);
confer with Tran (Epiq) regarding same (0.20).

02/10/23 T R Geremia 5.80

Draft and finalize omnibus claim objection on ground of do not supervise.

02/10/23 C M Gugg 1.10

Prepare mail service of notice of objection letters upon non-email pro se claimants (0.40); prepare exhibits to
omnibus claim objections (0.40); and review and e-file fifth omnibus motion objecting to claims and
declaration in support (0.30).

02/10/23 J Kairey 4.50
Confer with Butler, Rosenblum, and Geremia (all Jones Day) regarding omnibus objections filed today (0.90);



20-12345-mg Doc 1964 Filed 03/30/23 Entered 03/30/23 17:48:00 Main Document

Pg 33 of 66
JONES DAY
131253 Page: 23
March 30, 2023
Diocese of Rockville Centre Invoice: 230902054
review and further edit and cite check brief in support of objections (3.60).
02/10/23 B Rosenblum 7.00

Draft claim objections (3.60); analyze proofs of claim for objection (2.60); confer with Geremia (Jones Day)
regarding same (0.40); confer with Gugg (Jones Day) regarding setvice (0.20); review/analyze committee letter
regarding claim objection request (0.20).

02/10/23 E P Stephens 0.80

Attention to claim valuation planning and materials.

02/13/23 M C Alfano 5.30

Meeting with Geremia, Butler and Kairey (all Jones Day) concerning claim objections (0.30); draft claim
objections and notices for claims that are amendments/duplicates and for claims that have been released
(4.80); confer with Gugg (Jones Day) concerning redactions of documents (0.20).

02/13/23 A M Butler 2.00

Review next steps on claim objections (1.50); call with Jones Day team regarding same (Geremia, Alfano,
Kairey) (0.50).

02/13/23 M K Chan 0.10

Confer with Geremia (Jones Day) regarding research.

02/13/23 V Dotfman 2.70

Review and analyze materials for claims objections and reply (1.90); draft analysis of issues for IRCP reply
(0.30); confer with Geremia (Jones Day) regarding claim objections (0.50).

02/13/23 T R Geremia 4.50

Meet with Butler and Kairey (both Jones Day) regarding do not supervise omnibus objection (0.50); meet with
Dorfman (Jones Day) regarding do not supervise claim objections (0.50); draft omnibus claim objection on do
not supervise ground (3.50).

02/13/23 CM Gugg 0.30

Prepare submission to chambers of claim objection filings.

02/13/23 J Kairey 1.50

Meeting with Butler and Geremia (both Jones Day) regarding next round of objections (0.70); research on
entity history as per Geremia (Jones Day) request (0.80).

02/13/23 B Rosenblum 1.50

Meeting regarding claim objections (1.00); analysis of email from state court counsel and memo to Geremia
(Jones Day) regarding same (0.50).

02/13/23 E P Stephens 3.10

Teleconference with Kramer (Reed Smith), Terrell, Macina (claims expert) regarding valuation work
(0.60); attention to claim valuation planning (2.30); attention to Committee claim objections (0.20).

02/13/23 A R Tawil 0.50
Meeting with Butler (Jones Day) to discuss objections.
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02/14/23 M C Alfano 1.10

Confer with Butler (Jones Day) (0.10); team call with Rosenblum, Kairey, Geremia and Butler (all Jones Day)
concerning objections (1.00).

02/14/23 A M Butler 6.00

Review and revise claim objections (3.00); prepare for call on claim objections (0.50); participate in call on
claim objections with Jones Day team (Rosenblum, Geremia, Alfano, Kairey) (1.10); confer with Rosenblum
(Jones Day) regarding next steps on claim objections (1.00); draft email to client regarding claim objections
(0.20); confer with parish counsel (Slome) regarding same (0.20).

02/14/23 M K Chan 1.10
Research case law regarding IRCP releases (0.80); draft/revise summary of research on IRCP releases (0.30).

02/14/23 V Dotfman 2.90

Review and analyze materials relating to claim objections (2.50); confer with Geremia and Chan (both Jones
Day) regarding claim objections (0.40).

02/14/23 T R Getremia 5.10

Draft omnibus claim objection on do not supervise ground and supporting declaration (3.60); research
regarding omnibus claim objection on grounds of IRCP releases (0.50); meet with Rosenblum, Butler, and
Kairey (all Jones Day) regarding claim objections (1.00).

02/14/23 CM Gugg 1.10

Assemble proofs of claim in connection with objection preparation (0.80); prepare exhibits to omnibus
motion (0.30).

02/14/23 J B Harris 0.30
Confer with Stephens and Butler (both Jones Day) regarding database of proofs of claim and strategy going
forward.

02/14/23 J Kairey 4.10

Confer with Geremia, Butler, and Rosenblum (all Jones Day) regarding next round of objections (1.00); review
relevant proofs of claim (1.70); begin draft of table containing entities and their affiliations (1.40).

02/14/23 B Rosenblum 4.00

Analyze do not supervise arguments (3.00); communicate with claims team regarding objections (1.00).

02/14/23 E P Stephens 1.90

Attention to claim valuation planning (1.60); teleconference with Butler and Harris (both Jones Day) regarding
valuation planning (0.30).

02/15/23 M C Alfano 1.60

Revise two omnibus claim objections.

02/15/23 A M Butler 1.00

Review and revise claim objections.

02/15/23 M K Chan 0.20

Confer with Geremia and Dorfman (both Jones Day) regarding research on IRCP releases.
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02/15/23 V Dorfman 1.40

Confer with Geremia and Chan (both Jones Day) regarding claim objections (0.30); review and analyze
materials relating to claim objections (1.10).

02/15/23 E A Gearing 0.30

Attend to email communication.

02/15/23 T R Geremia 4.60

Draft omnibus claims objections.

02/15/23 C M Gugg 0.80

Continued assembly of proofs of claim in connection with objection preparation.

02/15/23 J Kairey 2.30

Confer with Geremia (Jones Day) regarding next set of objections (0.40); continue draft of table of entities at
issue and their vatious affiliations (1.90).

02/15/23 E P Stephens 2.90

Attention to valuation planning (2.30); teleconference with Kramer (Reed Smith) and claims expert regarding
claim valuation (0.60).

02/16/23 M C Alfano 6.40

Confer with Gugg (Jones Day) and get compiled exhibits with declaration for objection to proofs of clam
(0.40); review proofs of claim being objected to for failure to supervise for pertinent information (4.40); confer
with Butler (Jones Day) concerning filing (0.30); review compiled redacted documents (1.10); confer with
Rosenblum (Jones Day) concerning drafts of documents for Seventh and Eighth Omnibus Objections (0.20).

02/16/23 A M Butler 1.80

Call regarding claim objection issues with client (0.80); confer with Alfano (Jones Day) regarding same (0.40);
review next steps on same (0.30); review research regarding parish claim objections (0.20); send same to
Rosenblum (Jones Day) (0.10).

02/16/23 V Dorfman 1.70

Review and analyze materials for claim objections and replies.

02/16/23 T R Geremia 5.50

Draft omnibus claims objections and supporting declaration.

02/16/23 CM Gugg 0.50

Assemble exhibits to omnibus claim objection motions.

02/16/23 J Kairey 3.20
Draft declaration for next objections (3.00); meet with Geremia (Jones Day) regarding same (0.20).

02/16/23 B Rosenblum 2.20
Call with Geremia (Jones Day) and client regarding objections (0.70); revise claim objections (1.50).
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02/16/23 E P Stephens 5.90

Teleconference with Kramer (Reed Smith) and claim expert regarding valuation planning (0.80); attention to
valuation planning (5.10).

02/17/23 M C Alfano 3.90

Attention to redactions (0.50); draft mock letter to Epiq for filing next week (0.20); review proofs of claims for
do not supetvise objection for pertinent information (2.90); confer with Butler (Jones Day) about filings
(0.30).

02/17/23 A M Butler 0.90
Prepare for next steps on claim objections (0.50); confer with Alfano (Jones Day) regarding same (0.40).

02/17/23 V Dotfman 1.80

Review and analyze materials relating to claim objections.

02/17/23 E A Gearing 0.50

Review issues chart (0.40); attend to email communications (0.10).

02/17/23 T R Geremia 0.70

Work on omnibus claim objection to claims that pre-date DRVC's formation.

02/17/23 CM Gugg 1.00

Continued assembly of proofs of claim in connection with objection preparation (0.30); update objection

schedules (0.70).

02/17/23 J Kairey 1.80

Draft and revise declaration for next objections.

02/17/23 E P Stephens 8.40

Review and analyze issues in connection with valuation planning.

02/18/23 T R Geremia 2.80

Draft brief on omnibus claim objections on do not supervise ground.

02/18/23 J Kaitey 6.70

Draft and revise declaration in support of next objections.

02/18/23 E P Stephens 5.00

Review and analyze issues in connection with valuation planning.

02/19/23 M C Alfano 1.60

Review proofs of claim being objected to for pertinent information.

02/19/23 T R Geremia 2.40

Draft declaration in support of omnibus claim objection on do not supervise grounds.
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02/19/23 N Orujlu 2.90
Review/analyze claim determination documents for petsonally identifying information to be redacted ptior to
production.
02/20/23 M C Alfano 3.80

Discuss do not supervise objections (0.10); draft sixth omnibus objection schedule and review proofs of claim
for pertinent information (2.40); draft individualized notice for sixth omnibus objection and review proofs of
claim for pertinent information (1.30).

02/20/23 M K Chan 0.20

Confer with Geremia and Dorfman (both Jones Day) regarding claim objections.

02/20/23 V Dotfman 2.60

Confer with Geremia and Chan (both Jones Day) regarding claim objections (0.70); edit claim objections and
affidavit (0.50); review and analyze materials relating to claim objections (1.40).

02/20/23 T R Geremia 7.20
Draft and revise brief and supporting declaration in support of omnibus claim objection on do not supervise
ground.

02/20/23 J Kairey 4.50

Manage exhibits and proofs of claim related to next round of objections, including organizing documents for
client review and for inclusion as part of declaration (3.80); confer with Geremia (Jones Day) regarding same

(0.70).

02/20/23 N Oruyjlu 7.00
Review/analyze claim determination documents for petsonally identifying information to be redacted ptior to
production.

02/20/23 B Rosenblum 1.50

Review and revise claim objections and related filings (1.00); communications regarding same (0.50).

02/20/23 E P Stephens 3.00

Review and analyze issues in connection with valuation planning.

02/21/23 M C Alfano 4.70

Attention to filing preparations for sixth omnibus objection (1.20); review and revise sixth omnibus objection
brief (0.50); revise eighth omnibus brief and declaration and exhibits (1.80); revise individual notice for eighth
omnibus objection (0.20); revise seventh individualized notice (0.20); revise seventh omnibus brief (0.80).

02/21/23 V Dorfman 2.70

Confer with Geremia and Chan (both Jones Day) regarding claim objections (0.40); draft analysis of issues
for claim objections (0.60); review and analyze materials for claim objections (1.70).

02/21/23 E A Gearing 0.80

Review draft declaration (0.60); attend to email communications (0.20).

02/21/23 T R Getremia 7.40

Draft and revise omnibus claim objection on do not supervise ground (5.50); draft omnibus claims objection
to claims that pre-dated DRVC formation (1.90).
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02/21/23 CM Gugg 2.80

Prepare claim objections (2.10); communications with Epiq regarding service (0.20); electronically file same
(0.20); and incorporate updates to schedules (0.30).

02/21/23 J B Harris 1.20

Communicate with experts regarding IRCP protocols and claim determination forms (0.50); meet with
Stephens (Jones Day) regarding background on the case and tasks to complete to prepare KCIC (0.70).

02/21/23 J Kairey 1.10
Review brief related to next round of omnibus objections (0.90); confer with Geremia (Jones Day) regarding
same (0.20).

02/21/23 B Rosenblum 1.20

Revise claim objections (1.00); confer with Geremia (Jones Day) regarding same (0.20).

02/21/23 E P Stephens 8.70
QC proposed IRCP production (3.10); review and analyze issues in connection with valuation preparation
(5.60).

02/22/23 M C Alfano 5.90

Attention to finalizing Seventh Omnibus Objection and individualized notice and communications with Gugg
(Jones Day) and Epiq team regarding same (4.60); draft notice of withdrawal of objection to Claim No. 90407
(1.30).

02/22/23 A M Butler 0.90

Review status of claim objections (0.40); confer with Alfano (Jones Day) regarding same (0.20); confer with
insurer counsel (Gurdus) regarding claim inquiry (0.30).

02/22/23 V Dorfman 3.20

Review and analyze materials for the claim objections (2.80); confer with Geremia and Chan (both Jones
Day) regarding claim objections (0.40).

02/22/23 T R Geremia 5.50

Review draft omnibus claim objections regarding IRCP releases and duplicate / amended claims (1.50); draft
and revise omnibus claims objections to claims that pre-date DRVC's formation and on notice grounds (2.60);
meet and confer with claimant's counsel regarding claim objections (1.40).

02/22/23 CM Gugg 5.50

Prepare claim objections (4.50); electronic filing of same (0.20); and attention to service issues (0.80).

02/22/23 J B Harris 5.30

Prepare late-filed claim determinations for production, and discuss same with Stephens (Jones Day) (4.70);
meet with Stephens (Jones Day), claims expert, and Kramer (Reed Smith) regarding valuations (0.60).

02/22/23 B Rosenblum 5.80

Attend to revisions to claim objections and supporting documentation (5.00); confer with Geremia (Jones
Day) regarding claims objections (0.80).



20-12345-mg Doc 1964 Filed 03/30/23 Entered 03/30/23 17:48:00 Main Document

Pg 39 of 66
JONES DAY
131253 Page: 29
March 30, 2023
Diocese of Rockville Centre Invoice: 230902054
02/22/23 E P Stephens 4.60

Review and analyze issues in connection with valuation planning (4.10); teleconference with Harris (Jones
Day), Kramer (Reed Smith), Terrell, and Macina (claims expert) regarding claim valuation (0.50).

02/23/23 M C Alfano 0.50
Revise withdrawal to Claim No. 90407 and finalize for filing.

02/23/23 M K Chan 0.10

Confer with Geremia (Jones Day) regarding claims objections research.

02/23/23 V Dotfman 7.10

Confer with Geremia (Jones Day) regarding claim objections (0.90); review and analyze materials for claim
objections (2.80); draft claim objections (2.90); research cases for claim objections (0.50).

02/23/23 T R Geremia 7.50

Draft and revise omnibus claim objections to claims that pre-date DRVC's formation and on notice grounds
(5.80); meet and confer with claimant's counsel regarding claim objections (1.70).

02/23/23 C M Gugg 0.50

Prepare submission to chambers of filed claim objections.

02/23/23 J B Harris 1.40

Prepare late-filed claim determinations to be turned into production set (1.20); communicate with team and
vendors regarding same (0.20).

02/23/23 J Kairey 3.40

Research for claim objections (3.10); confer with Geremia (Jones Day) regarding same (0.30).

02/23/23 B Rosenblum 2.20

Communications regarding omnibus objections process (0.50); draft email to chambers regarding adjournment
of certain omnibus objections (0.10); revise withdrawal notice (0.10); draft adjournment notice (0.10); confer
internally regarding objection status (0.20); review of objection analysis (1.10); respond to claimant inquiry
regarding objections (0.10); communicate with Tran (Epiq) regarding chambers' request for POCs (0.10);
attend to same (0.10).

02/23/23 E P Stephens 4.80

Review and analyze issues in connection with valuation planning.

02/24/23 M K Chan 0.50

Confer with Geremia, Dorfman, and Kairey (all Jones Day) regarding claims objections responses.

02/24/23 V Dorfman 7.60

Confer with Geremia, Chan and Kairey (all Jones Day) regarding claim objections (0.90); review and analyze
materials for claim objections (3.50); draft claim objections (2.40); reseatch cases for claim objections (0.80).

02/24/23 T R Geremia 8.20
Draft and revise omnibus claim objection to claims that pre-date DRVC's formation (2.70); draft and revise
omnibus claim objection on ground of no notice to DRVC (0.60); review and revise omnibus claim objection
on grounds of IRCP release and dupes / amends (1.50); draft notice lettets to claimants on grounds of IRCP
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releases (0.80); meet and confer with claimant's counsel regarding claim objections (1.30); review oppositions
to claim objections on grounds of IRCP release and research in connection with same (0.80); call with Chan,
Kairey, and Dorfman (all Jones Day) regarding omnibus claim objection reply regarding IRCP releases (0.50).

02/24/23 CM Gugg 1.30

Review and log responses to claim objection motions (0.90); update tracking schedule accordingly (0.40).

02/24/23 J B Harris 0.80

Meet with claims expert, Kramer (Reed Smith), and Stephens (Jones Day) regarding building valuation
database and strategy (0.50); communicate with team regarding redacting personal identifying information
from claim determinations (0.30).

02/24/23 J Kairey 3.00

Begin review of responses to objections (2.50); confer with Chan, Geremia, and Dorfman (all Jones Day)
regarding responses to objections (0.50).

02/24/23 B Rosenblum 3.20

Review responses to objections and review underlying documents (3.00); confer with Stephens (Jones
Day) regarding same (0.20).

02/24/23 E P Stephens 1.30

Review and analyze issues in connection with valuation planning.

02/25/23 M K Chan 0.30

Confer with Kairey (Jones Day) regarding claims objections responses.

02/25/23 J Kairey 2.30

Discuss responses to objections with Chan (Jones Day) (0.30); continue review of responses (2.00).

02/26/23 M K Chan 2.30

Confer with Dorfman (Jones Day) regarding citation of trial court order (0.20); review/analyze responses to
claim objections (1.20); draft/revise analysis of responses to claim objections (0.70); confer with Dotfman,
Geremia, and Kairey (all Jones Day) regarding analysis of responses to claim objections (0.20).

02/26/23 J Kairey 2.70

Draft part of an index of the arguments made in the responses (2.40); confer with Chan (Jones Day) regarding
the same (0.30).

02/26/23 N Orujlu 1.70
Review/analyze claim determination documents for petsonally identifying information to be redacted ptior to
production.

02/27/23 A M Butler 5.80

Review claim objections and filed responses (2.00); confer with Rosenblum (Jones Day) regarding same (1.00);
plan next steps regarding claim objections (0.50); confer with Rosenblum and Geremia (both Jones Day)
regarding same (0.20); draft materials regarding upcoming claim objections (1.50); investigate claim issues
(0.40); confer with Stephens (Jones Day) regarding same (0.20).

02/27/23 M K Chan 2.30

Confer with Geremia, Dorfman, and Kairey (all Jones Day) regarding claims objections responses (0.70);
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draft/revise analysis of claims objections responses (1.00); research case law on responses (0.60).

02/27/23 V Dotfman 7.80

Confer with Geremia, Kairey, Chan (all Jones Day) regarding claim objections and reply (1.20); review and
analyze materials relating to claim objections and reply (3.70); draft and edit claim objections and reply issues

(2.90).

02/27/23 T R Getemia 9.40

Draft and revise omnibus claim objection on grounds of no notice to DRVC (4.50); draft and revise omnibus
claim objection on grounds that claims pre-date DRVC's formation (1.60); work on omnibus claim objection
with respect to claims released through the IRCP (1.80); meet with Dorfman, Chan, and Kairey (all Jones Day)
regarding omnibus claim objection reply regarding IRCP releases (1.00); meet with Rosenblum and Butler
(both Jones Day) regarding schedule for omnibus claim objections (0.50).

02/27/23 CM Gugg 0.40

Attention to claim objection tracking updates.

02/27/23 J B Harris 2.40

Prepare late-filed claim determinations for production, including by reviewing and revising redactions of
personal identifying information.

02/27/23 J Kairey 6.90
Research various issues pertaining to responses to objections, including elements of causes of action, pleading
standards, and grounds for invalidating releases (5.60); confer with Geremia, Dorfman, and Chan (all Jones

Day) regarding the objections (0.80); review brief objecting to claims that pre-date the existence of the Diocese
(0.50).

02/27/23 B Rosenblum 0.20

Confer internally regarding claim objections.

02/28/23 M C Alfano 0.30

Confer with Butler (Jones Day) concerning research issue (0.10); update documents to tenth omnibus
objection and confer with Gugg (Jones Day) concerning updating declaration exhibits (0.20).

02/28/23 A M Butler 4.00

Review and revise upcoming claim objections.

02/28/23 M K Chan 5.40

Draft/revise and cite check eighth omnibus claims objection (2.20); confer with Dotfman and Geremia (both
Jones Day) regarding same (0.20); review/analyze complaints for allegations of notice (1.00); draft/revise
declaration in support of eighth omnibus claims objection (0.40); research case law regarding rescinding
releases (1.60).

02/28/23 V Dotfman 4.20

Confer with Geremia, Kairey, Chan (all Jones Day) regarding claim objections and reply (0.60). Review and
analyze materials relating to claim objections and reply (2.50). Draft and edit claim objections and reply issues

(1.10).

02/28/23 T R Geremia 3.00
Draft omnibus claim objection on ground that DRVC had no notice of claim (1.70); work on reply for
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omnibus claim objection for claims released through the IRCP (1.30).
02/28/23 CM Gugg 0.70

Confer with Geremia (Jones Day) regarding claim objections (0.10); draft schedule to objection motion (0.60).

02/28/23 J B Harris 1.10

Meet with claims expert team and Kramer (Reed Smith) regarding progress on the expert damages valuation
work (0.60); draft letter regarding production of late-filed IRCP claim determinations (0.30); prepare late-filed
claim determinations for production (0.20).

02/28/23 J Kairey 1.50

Additional review of responses to objections.

02/28/23 B Rosenblum 1.30

Revise seventh and eighth omnibus claim objections (1.00); communicate with client regarding additional
claim objections (0.10); review committee objections to patish claims (0.20).

Matter Total 567.40

Court Hearings

02/17/23 B Rosenblum 0.40

Call with Jones Day team and Committee counsel regarding upcoming chambers conference.

02/21/23 C Ball 1.00
Status conference (0.60); and prepare for same (0.40).

02/21/23 T R Geremia 0.60
Meet with Rosenblum (Jones Day) regarding court hearing.

02/21/23 B Rosenblum 2.70

Prepare for hearing (1.50); confer with Geremia and Ball (both Jones Day) in advance of same (0.20); attend
hearing (0.70); confer with Stephens (Jones Day) regarding same (0.10); memo to client regarding hearing
(0.20).

Matter Total 4.70

Fee/Employment Applications

02/07/23 CM Gugg 0.30

Review and electronically file monthly fee statement.

02/09/23 A M Butler 0.60

Review monthly fee statements (0.30); respond to Committee inquiry on fees (0.30).
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02/14/23 A M Butler 1.00

Review and revise monthly fee statement.
02/15/23 A M Butler 1.00

Review and revise monthly fee statement.
02/17/23 A M Butler 1.50

Review and revise monthly fee statement.
02/24/23 CM Gugg 0.20

Review draft monthly invoice in connection with preparation of monthly statement.
02/27/23 A M Butler 0.60

Draft CNO for fees (0.20); prepare to file same (0.20); confer with Gugg (Jones Day) regarding upcoming fee
filings (0.20).

02/27/23 CM Gugg 3.00

Review and electronically file certificate of no objection to monthly fee statements (0.20); update monthly fee
and disbursement schedules (0.90); draft monthly fee statement (1.90).

02/28/23 CM Gugg 1.00

Incorporate revisions to monthly fee statement and schedule (0.70); electronically file Jones Day and Alvarez
& Marsal monthly fee statements (0.30).

02/28/23 B Rosenblum 0.60

Review monthly fee statement.

Matter Total 9.80

Financing and Cash Collateral

02/01/23 C Ball 0.70
Communications regarding PSIP with Moore and McDermott (both Alvarez & Marsal).

02/01/23 N P Yeary 7.00
Research regarding matters related to post-petition financing (4.30); memorandum correspondence with
Morin (Jones Day) regarding same (0.60); confer with Morin (Jones Day) regarding same and next steps (0.30);
analyze materials related to post-petition finance issues (1.80).

02/02/23 N P Yeary 5.00
Research concerning post-petition financing issues (4.30); email memoranda to Morin (Jones Day) concerning
same (0.70).

02/03/23 N P Yeary 7.90

Revise outline concerning a post-petition financing matter (0.50); revise solicitation procedure exhibits (0.40);
confer with Morin (Jones Day) concerning sale related research (0.30); conduct research concerning sale
matter (1.20); confer with Gugg (Jones Day) regarding sale research (0.40); further research related to sale
matters (5.10).



20-12345-mg Doc 1964 Filed 03/30/23 Entered 03/30/23 17:48:00 Main Document

Pg 44 of 66
JONES DAY
131253 Page: 34
March 30, 2023
Diocese of Rockville Centre Invoice: 230902054
02/06/23 N J Morin 0.60
Review and revise DIP NDA and recirculate same to Cane (Jefferies).
02/06/23 N P Yeary 2.10
Conduct research concerning post-petition financing matters.
02/07/23 N P Yeary 4.50
Research concerning post-petition financing matters.
02/08/23 J D Casais 2.20

Attention to form of DIP (1.20); call with Dolgos (Jones Day) (0.60); call with Dolgos and Morin (both Jones
Day) (0.40).

02/08/23 E M Dolgos 4.10

Review and analyze the debtor-in-possession credit agreement (3.00); calls and correspondence with Casais
(Jones Day) to discuss deal structure and credit agreement processes (1.10).

02/08/23 N J Morin 0.70
Confer with Wiesel (Jones Day) regarding NDA (0.20); call with potential DIP lender regarding NDA (0.50).

02/08/23 N P Yeary 3.90

Confer with Morin (Jones Day) regarding next steps concerning post-petition financing and sale (0.30);
conduct research related to sale issues (3.10); email memo to Morin (Jones Day) concerning same (0.50).

02/09/23 C Ball 0.30
Review Stang (Pachulski) letter on discovery DIP loan.

02/09/23 J D Casais 1.50
Call with Dolgos and Morin (both Jones Day) (0.60); check precedents (0.50); follow up regarding patties
(0.40).

02/09/23 E M Dolgos 8.30

Draft the form of debtor-in-possession credit agreement (7.00); calls and correspondence with Morin and
Casais (both Jones Day) to discuss debtor structure, the collateral package and asset disposition timelines

(1.30).

02/09/23 N J Morin 1.90

Call with Ciriello (Alvatez & Marsal) on items related to DIP (0.50); call with Casais (Jones Day) on items
related to DIP (0.50); review DIP NDA materials and communicate with Vincequerra (Alston) regarding same
(0.50); follow up with Cane (Jefferies) regarding DIP NDA (0.20); follow up with potential DIP lender
regarding same (0.20).

02/09/23 E P Stephens 0.10
Attention to DIP discovery dispute.

02/09/23 N P Yeary 2.90

Conduct sale related research.
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02/10/23 A M Butler 0.50
Confer with Morin (Jones Day) regarding financing issues.
02/10/23 E M Dolgos 2.70

Draft the debtor-in-possession credit agreement with updates from internal collateral and guarantor
discussions (2.50); correspondence with Casais (Jones Day) on the same (0.20).

02/10/23 N J Morin 1.60

Call with Stephens (Jones Day) regarding DIP process (0.30); communicate with White (Jefferies) regarding
DIP process (0.50); communicate with Cane (Jefferies) regarding dataroom (0.10); communicate with
Vincequerra regarding NDA (0.20); confer with Butler (Jones Day) regarding DIP loan (0.50).

02/10/23 E P Stephens 0.30
Teleconference with Morin (Jones Day) regarding DIP next steps.

02/10/23 N P Yeary 5.90

Conduct research related to sale matters.

02/13/23 C Ball 0.30
Confer with Morin (Jones Day) regarding additional DIP Collateral.

02/13/23 N P Yeary 3.40

Review materials related to sale issue (1.40); confer with Morin (Jones Day) concerning same and next steps
(0.30); analyze materials related to a sale issue (1.70).

02/14/23 N P Yeary 0.80

Review materials related to post-petition financing.

02/15/23 N J Motin 0.20

Provide comments to Jefferies DIP materials.

02/15/23 N P Yeary 1.40

Analyze sale related materials (1.00); memo email to Morin (Jones Day) regarding same (0.40).

02/21/23 N Buchta 2.30
Draft proposed DIP order.

Matter Total 73.10

Litigation and Adversary Proceedings

02/01/23 A M Butler 2.50
Prepare materials to be submitted to Judge Glenn's chambers and filed under seal (1.50); confer with Gugg
(Jones Day) regarding same (0.50); review next steps in preliminary injunction litigation (0.30); confer with
DiPompeo (Jones Day) regarding same (0.20).
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02/01/23 C J DiPompeo 0.60

Call with Stephens, Geremia (both Jones Day), Fasano, and Renker (both DRVC) regarding discovery in
connection with preliminary injunction.

02/01/23 J T Hoyt 6.20
Review the insurance policies, analyzing excel sheet data to classify each claim under its appropriate insurance
policy.

02/01/23 E M Joyce 1.60
Review materials/filings regarding CVA/other diocesan bankruptey proceedings and disputed insurance
claims/settlements.

02/01/23 S M Peterson 0.30

Plan and prepare focused export to include delivery and tracking identifiers per Kim (Reed Smith).

02/01/23 B Rosenblum 0.10

Communicate with Law (Reed Smith) regarding LMI inquiry and communicate with Kahane (LMI counsel)
regarding same.

02/01/23 E P Stephens 6.80

Teleconference with Ball, Rosenblum, Geremia, Butler (all Jones Day), Kramer, Law (both Reed Smith),
Ciriello (Alvarez & Marsal), and Renker (DRVC) regarding current status and next steps (0.80); attention to
Committee financial requests (0.40); attention to PI discovery responses (4.50); teleconference with Geremia,
DiPompeo (both Jones Day), Renker, and Fasano (both DRVC) regarding PI discovery responses (0.90);
teleconference with Doodian (DRVC) regarding PI discovery responses (0.20).

02/02/23 J T Hoyt 3.00

Review the insurance policies, analyzing excel sheet data to classify each claim under its appropriate insurance
buckets to understand how/whether the plans’ proceeds will be exhausted by ongoing proceedings.

02/02/23 E M Joyce 1.40

Review materials/filings regarding other diocesan bankruptcy proceedings and insurance claims/settlements.

02/02/23 S M Peterson 0.30
Plan and prepare incremental export per Kim (Reed Smith).

02/02/23 E P Stephens 5.80

Attention to PI litigation evidence and arguments (5.10); review PI discovery responses (0.20); attention to
state court litigation developments (0.40); attention to insurer request (0.10).

02/03/23 E M Joyce 1.30

Review materials/filings regarding other diocesan bankruptcy proceedings and insurance claims/settlements.

02/03/23 E P Stephens 6.20
Attention to PI litigation planning.

02/06/23 A M Butler 0.40

Review complaint (0.20); confer with Davey (defense counsel) regarding same (0.10); confer with Stephens
(Jones Day) regarding litigation issues (0.10).
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02/06/23 E M Joyce 1.30

Review materials/filings regarding other diocesan bankruptcy proceedings and insurance claims/settlements.

02/06/23 N Orujlu 2.60

Review/analyze the bankruptcy court filings related to the Diocese's preliminaty injunction motion in
preparation for deposing counsels in state court actions.

02/06/23 S M Peterson 0.40

Plan and prepare upload of an additional copy of 14 DRVIC_BANKR production volumes per Gallagher
(Coughlin Midlige & Garland).

02/06/23 W P Quaranta 2.20

Review relevant documents prior to initial internal team meeting, including memorandum of law in support of
motion for preliminary injunction.

02/06/23 E P Stephens 4.20

Attention to PI deposition planning (1.50); teleconference with Ball (Jones Day), Chapin (DRVC), and
McDermott regarding CHS (0.50); attention to CHS outreach (0.10); attention to state court settlement
proposals (2.10).

02/07/23 C Ball 2.60

Review Arrowood litigation funder materials (2.10); emails regarding same to Stephens and Rosenblum (both
Jones Day) (0.50).

02/07/23 T R Geremia 0.50
Meet with Stephens and DiPompeo (both Jones Day) to prepare for PI discovery and briefing.

02/07/23 J T Hoyt 1.00

Review filings to prepare for conference call with team regarding PI hearing (0.50); conference call with team
regarding work to prepare for deposition and PI hearing (0.50).

02/07/23 E M Joyce 1.40

Review materials/filings regarding other diocesan bankruptcy proceedings and insurance claims (1.20); calls
and review emails with other diocesan counsel regarding same (0.20).

02/07/23 N Orujlu 2.00

Attend internal team meeting in connection with upcoming deposition trust agreements (0.40);
review/analyze the bankruptcy court filings related to the Diocese's preliminary injunction motion in
preparation for deposing counsels in state court actions (1.60).

02/07/23 W P Quaranta 1.80

Attend introductory meeting with internal team; begin gathering documents to prepare for depositions.

02/07/23 E P Stephens 0.90

Teleconference with Geremia, Orujlu, Quaranta, Zepf, and Hoyt (all Jones Day) regarding PI deposition
preparation (0.50); attention to PI deposition planning (0.40).
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02/07/23 C Zepf 1.80

Meet with Stephens (Jones Day) and rest of team to discuss legal strategy, depositions, and next steps
(0.40); review Memo of Law, plaintiffs' opposition to preliminary injunction, and other materials to prepare
for meeting with team and get up to speed on the case (1.40).

02/08/23 C Ball 2.10

Confer with DiPompeo and Rosenblum (both Jones Day) regarding next steps and insurance strategy (1.20);
communications with Heuer (Westerman) regarding timing (0.20); prepare for Togut call regarding Cemetery
(0.70).

02/08/23 J T Hoyt 0.60
Call with DiPompeo (Jones Day) to coordinate strategy to prepare for PI litigation.

02/08/23 E M Joyce 1.30
Review materials/filings tegarding other diocesan disputed insurance claims/settlements and bankruptcy
proceedings.

02/08/23 N Orujlu 5.40

Review/analyze publicly available information, court filings and discovery requests/answers involving
deponent-attorney in prepatration for his deposition.

02/08/23 W P Quaranta 0.30
Attend introductory meeting with internal team (0.90); begin gathering documents to prepare for depositions
(0.90).

02/08/23 E P Stephens 1.00

Teleconference with Ball (Jones Day), Oswald, Boriello, and Garry (all Togut) regarding CemCo (0.50);
teleconference with Boriello (Togut) regarding CemCo (0.20); attention to PI deposition planning (0.30).

02/09/23 E M Joyce 1.20

Review materials/filings regarding other diocesan/CVA insurance claims and bankruptcy proceedings.

02/09/23 N Orujlu 7.20

Review/analyze publicly available information, coutrt filings and discovery requests/answers involving
deponent-attorney in preparation for his deposition (5.70); confer with Stephens, Quaranta and Zepf (all
Jones Day) regarding strategy and next steps in connection with upcoming depositions (0.30); draft/revise a
deposition outline for deponent-attorney in preparation for his deposition (1.20).

02/09/23 W P Quaranta 2.50
Gather and analyze documents to prepare for depositions of attorney-witnesses (1.50); meet with internal team
(1.00).

02/09/23 E P Stephens 3.50

Teleconference with Orujlu, Quaranta, and Zepf (all Jones Day) regarding PI deposition planning (0.40);
attention to PI deposition planning (1.30); attention to draft deposition outlines (1.80).

02/09/23 C Zepf 1.80

Draft/revise spreadsheet, inventoty of witness documents/cases (1.40); meet with Stephens (Jones Day)
regarding preparing witness case inventories (0.40).
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02/10/23 J'T Hoyt 1.50

Call with DiPompeo (Jones Day) to discuss status of various research projects in preparation for PI hearing.

02/10/23 E M Joyce 1.20

Review vatious materials/filings regarding BSA/other diocesan insurance claims and bankruptcy proceedings.

02/10/23 N Orujlu 4.30

Confer with Stephens, Quaranta and Zepf (all Jones Day) regarding strategy and next steps in connection
with upcoming depositions (0.50); draft/revise a deposition outline for deponent-attorney in preparation for
his deposition (3.80).

02/10/23 W P Quaranta 5.80
Gather and analyze documents to prepare for depositions of attorney-witnesses (4.30); meet with internal team
(1.50).

02/10/23 B Rosenblum 1.00

Communicate with DOE counsel regarding IAC matters (0.40); confer with Ball (Jones Day) regarding
cemeteries (0.20); review tolling agreements (0.10); update client regarding same (0.30).

02/10/23 E P Stephens 2.50

Attention to PI deposition planning and logistics (1.90); teleconference with Orujlu, Quaranta, and Zepf (all
Jones Day) regarding deposition outlines (0.50); teleconference with Moore (Alvarez & Marsal) regarding
deposition preparation (0.10).

02/10/23 C Zept 1.10

Meet with Stephens (Jones Day) to discuss drafting deposition outlines and deadline (0.50); draft inventory
spreadsheet of cases handled by the law firms of the five witnesses (0.60).

02/11/23 E M Joyce 0.60

Review recent materials/filings regarding other diocesan/BSA insurance claims and bankruptcy proceedings
(0.50); calls and emails with various attorneys regarding same (0.10).

02/11/23 W P Quaranta 6.00

Finish analyzing documents relevant to depositions, and begin drafting first deposition outline.

02/12/23 J T Hoyt 5.00
Draft memorandum on bankruptcy venue provisions and applicability of that provision to pending state-court
cases.

02/12/23 W P Quaranta 2.50

Draft first deposition outline (2.30); send to Stephens (Jones Day) for feedback (0.20).

02/12/23 E P Stephens 0.50

Attention to discovery planning and next steps.

02/13/23 J T Hoyt 420

Draft memorandum on litigation issues.
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02/13/23 N Orujlu 3.50

Draft/revise a deposition outline for deponent-attorney in preparation for his deposition.

02/13/23 W P Quaranta 6.50
Draft first deposition outline.

02/13/23 E P Stephens 0.80
Attention to PI discovery planning.

02/13/23 C Zepf 4.40

Draft/prepare initial deposition outlines for state court counsel.

02/14/23 C Ball 0.70
Confer with Geremia and DiPompeo (both Jones Day) regarding PI/removal.

02/14/23 A M Butler 0.60

Confer with Davey (parish counsel) regarding state court litigation (0.40); review emails from Geremia,
Stephens, DiPompeo (all Jones Day) regarding preliminary injunction issues (0.20).

02/14/23 C J DiPompeo 1.30

Review research from Hoyt (Jones Day) regarding section 157(b)(5) (0.90); draft email memorandum to Ball
(Jones Day) regarding same (0.40).

02/14/23 J T Hoyt 2.00

Organize pending state cases by policy year.

02/14/23 N Orujlu 5.00

Draft/revise a deposition outline for deponent-attorney in preparation for his deposition.

02/14/23 W P Quaranta 3.50

Continue drafting deposition outlines.

02/14/23 B Rosenblum 0.20
Communicate with DOE counsel (0.10); confer with Ball (Jones Day) regarding IAC matters (0.10).

02/14/23 E P Stephens 0.60

Teleconference with Geremia (Jones Day), Brown, and Greenwood (both Pachulski) regarding PI deposition
logistics (0.30); attention to PI discovery planning (0.30).

02/14/23 C Zept 2.70

Draft offensive deposition outlines for state counsel witnesses.

02/15/23 A M Butler 0.70
Review next steps on state court litigation (0.40); confer with DiPompeo (Jones Day) regarding same (0.30).

02/15/23 C J DiPompeo 0.40

Confer with Stephens, Geremia, and Hoyt (all Jones Day) regarding discovery for preliminary injunction
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litigation.
02/15/23 T R Geremia 0.50
Meet with Stephens (Jones Day) regarding PI discovery.
02/15/23 J T Hoyt 0.50
Team meeting to discuss preparation for PI meeting.
02/15/23 E M Joyce 1.40
Review vatious materials/filings regarding other diocesan/BSA bankruptcy proceedings and insurance
claims/settlements.
02/15/23 S M Peterson 0.50

Prepare normalized bates series list (0.20); communicate with Consilio (eDiscovery provider) regarding
preparing two overlay production volumes to include re-confirmations (0.30).

02/15/23 E P Stephens 1.70

Teleconference with Geremia, DiPompeo, and Hoyt (all Jones Day) regarding PI litigation planning (0.40);
review draft amended LMI complaint (0.50); attention to potential state court settlements (0.20); attention to
Committee financial requests (0.50); attention to CemCo request (0.10).

02/16/23 C Ball 0.50

Communications with Heuer (Westerman) regarding seminary status (0.30); communications with Renker
(DRVC) regarding same (0.20).

02/16/23 A M Butler 1.30
Call with client regarding state court litigation issues (1.00); review preliminary injunction transfer notice issues
(0.30).

02/16/23 J T Hoyt 3.50

Research litigation strategy (2.00); draft memorandum on same (1.50).

02/16/23 S M Peterson 0.40
Review/analyze ovetlay production volumes DRVC_BANKR_045 and DRVC-IAC-008.

02/16/23 B Rosenblum 0.20
Communicate with client regarding DOE and IAC matters.

02/16/23 E P Stephens 0.60

Attention to potential state court settlements (0.30); teleconference with Butler (Jones Day), Moore, and
Ciriello (both Alvarez & Marsal) regarding UCC information requests (0.30).

02/17/23 C J DiPompeo 2.40
Draft memorandum to Ball (Jones Day) regarding litigation strategy.

02/17/23 E M Joyce 1.40

Review materials/filings regarding other diocesan/CVA bankruptey proceedings and insurance claims.
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02/17/23 S M Peterson 0.20

Communicate with Consilio (eDiscovery provider) regarding loading instructions for the anticipated new
documents today.

02/17/23 B Rosenblum 0.30

Communicate with DOE counsel regarding IAC matters.

02/17/23 E P Stephens 0.10

Attention to potential state court settlements.

02/18/23 C J DiPompeo 1.20
Draft email memorandum to Ball (Jones Day) regarding research on strategy for addressing state court
litigation.

02/19/23 S L Flowers 1.90

Review/analyze documents to redact PII.

02/19/23 B B Johnson 1.80

Redact identifying information from documents in accordance with direction from Stephens (Jones Day).

02/20/23 A L Aubuchon 2.60

Analyze IRCP memos to redact personal identifying information.

02/20/23 S L Flowers 2.50

Review/analyze documents to redact PII.

02/20/23 J T Hoyt 3.50

Coding data in Excel sheet in preparation for PI briefing to ensure appropriate claim categorization.

02/20/23 B B Johnson 3.10

Redact identifying information from documents in accordance with direction from Stephens (Jones Day).

02/20/23 E P Stephens 0.80

Attention to UCC information requests.

02/21/23 C Ball 0.20

Communications regarding IRCP discovery to UCC and insurers.

02/21/23 J T Hoyt 3.60

Code data in Excel sheet to categorize claims and prepare for PI briefing.

02/21/23 S M Peterson 0.80

Communicate with Consilio (eDiscovery provider) regarding the status of production volume DRVC-IRCP-
001 (0.10); download and extract production volume DRVC-IRCP-001 to include updating the master
production tracker and pre-loading for distribution (0.30); communicate with Consilio (eDiscovery provider)
regatding loading the production vetsion of DRVC-IRCP-001 to the Intake database (0.20); review/analyze
Consilio's load to the Intake database to include updating the master production tracker (0.20).
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02/21/23 B Rosenblum 0.10
Communicate with DOE counsel regarding IAC matters.
02/21/23 E P Stephens 0.40
Attention to state court litigation.
02/22/23 J T Hoyt 4.70

Amend Excel sheet of all outstanding state-court claims to categorize data according to insurance policy years
(1.50). Outline strategy memo (3.20).

02/22/23 E M Joyce 1.20

Review materials/filings regarding other diocesan/CVA insurance claims and bankruptcy proceedings.

02/22/23 B Rosenblum 0.20
Draft memo to client regarding IAC status.

02/22/23 E P Stephens 3.00
Attention to PI deposition preparation.

02/23/23 C J DiPompeo 0.70

Confer with Hoyt (Jones Day) regarding contingency planning for state court litigation in absence of
preliminary injunction.

02/23/23 J T Hoyt 7.50

Research for strategy memo (4.20); meeting with DiPompeo (Jones Day) regarding strategy memo (0.50);
draft memo regarding litigation strategy (2.80).

02/23/23 N Orujlu 0.90

Confer with Stephens, Quaranta and Zepf (all Jones Day) regarding strategy and next steps in connection with
upcoming depositions.

02/23/23 W P Quaranta 3.00

Meet with Stephens (Jones Day) and others from internal team (1.00); begin drafting deposition outline for
Moore (Alvarez & Marsal) (2.00).

02/23/23 B Rosenblum 0.30

Communicate with DOE counsel regarding IAC matters.

02/23/23 E P Stephens 2.20

Meeting with Orujlu, Quaranta, and Zepf (all Jones Day) regarding PI deposition preparation (1.00); attention
to PI deposition planning (1.20).

02/23/23 C Zepf 1.40

Confer internally regarding defending upcoming depositions, goals, and strategy (0.90); research Kenneth
Porter, search for dockets, bios, etc. (0.50).
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02/24/23 J'T Hoyt 8.20
Draft strategy memo regarding litigation issues.
02/24/23 N Orujlu 1.20

Draft/revise a defensive deposition preparation outline for Stephens (Jones Day) in connection with his
upcoming deposition.

02/24/23 S M Peterson 0.30

Electronically transfer new content to Consilio (eDiscovery provider) with detailed loading instructions.

02/24/23 W P Quaranta 4.50
Draft deposition outline for Moore (Alvarez & Marsal).

02/24/23 E P Stephens 4.00
Attention to PI deposition preparation.

02/24/23 C Zept 1.20

Prepate for Kenneth Porter's deposition on March 9 (0.40); pull declarations and review (0.60); pull files for
Stephens (Jones Day) deposition and send to Orulju (Jones Day) (0.20).

02/25/23 S L Flowers 0.80
Redact PII from IRCP documents.

02/25/23 W P Quaranta 3.00

Continue drafting outline for Moore (Alvarez & Marsal) deposition outline (2.80); submit to Stephens (Jones
Day) for review (0.20).

02/26/23 A L. Aubuchon 0.90

Analyze IRCP memos to redact personal identifying information.

02/26/23 B B Johnson 1.40

Review and redact documents for personally-identifying information.

02/26/23 W P Quaranta 0.10
Confer with Stephens (Jones Day) about draft of Moore (Alvarez & Marsal) deposition outline.

02/26/23 E P Stephens 1.60
Attention to PI deposition preparation.

02/27/23 A M Butler 2.00

Draft motions to extend time for removal and executory contracts (1.50); review and revise same (0.50).

02/27/23 C J DiPompeo 0.70

Participate in teleconference with Ball (Jones Day) and third party regarding state court litigation (0.50); confer
with Ball (Jones Day) regarding same (0.20).
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02/27/23 J T Hoyt 2.60
Draft strategy memo regarding post-PI strategy for cases no longer enjoined.
02/27/23 E M Joyce 1.40

Review vatious filings/materials regarding other CVA/diocesan insurance claims and bankruptey proceedings.

02/27/23 N Orujlu 2.60

Draft/revise defensive deposition preparation outline for Stephens (Jones Day) in connection with his
upcoming deposition.

02/27/23 S M Peterson 0.10
Upload and distribute additional copy of production volume DRVC-IRCP-001 to Valenza-Frost (Catlton
Fields).

02/27/23 W P Quaranta 6.50

Meet with Moore (Alvarez & Marsal) (2.50); review and update Moore (Alvarez & Marsal) deposition outline
and prepare for meeting (4.00).

02/27/23 E P Stephens 6.20
Attention to PI deposition preparation (6.00). Attention to insurer requests (0.20).

02/27/23 C Zepft 0.50

Research opposing counsel ahead of deposition including pulling together their bios from firm website and
LinkedIn, searching for relevant news articles or video clips to show witness their demeanor/speaking style.

02/28/23 N Orujlu 7.70

Draft/revise defensive deposition preparation outline for Stephens (Jones Day) in connection with his
upcoming deposition.

02/28/23 S M Peterson 0.30

Download and extract production volume DRVC-IRCP-002 to include updating the master production
tracker and pre-loading for final distribution.

02/28/23 W P Quaranta 7.00
Attend deposition with Stephens (Jones Day) and witness Moore (Alvarez & Marsal).

02/28/23 E P Stephens 8.70
Prepare and appear for Moore (Alvarez & Marsal) deposition (8.50); draft client deposition update (0.20).

02/28/23 C Zepf 3.20

Draft Ken Portet's Defensive Deposition outline (2.90), pull his biography from LinkedIn and search Google,
etc., for prep (0.30).

Matter Total 295.00

Meetings
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02/01/23 B Rosenblum 1.10

Participate in work in process call (0.60); participate in committee update call (0.30); follow up with Butler,
Ball and Morin (all Jones Day) regarding same (0.20).

02/08/23 CJ DiPompeo 1.00

Participate in teleconference regarding case status and strategy with Jones Day and Reed Smith teams.

02/08/23 T R Geremia 1.00
Weekly update and strategy call with client.

02/08/23 B Rosenblum 1.20

Participate in work in process call (1.00); participate in committee call (0.20).

02/15/23 C J DiPompeo 1.00

Participate in teleconference regarding case status and strategy with Jones Day and Reed Smith teams.

02/15/23 T R Geremia 1.70
Participate in weekly strategy and update call with client (1.20); weekly meeting with UCC counsel (0.50).

02/15/23 B Rosenblum 1.30
Participate in work in process call (1.00); additional meeting (0.30).

02/17/23 T R Geremia 0.50

Meet with counsel for UCC to prepare for upcoming chambers conference.

02/22/23 C Ball 1.00

Work in process call.

02/22/23 C J DiPompeo 0.80

Participate in teleconference with Ball, Rosenblum, Geremia, and Stephens (all Jones Day), and Kramer,
Berringer, and Law (all Reed Smith) regarding case status and strategy.

02/22/23 T R Getremia 1.50
Weekly update and strategy call with client (1.00); weekly call with UCC counsel (0.50).

02/22/23 B Rosenblum 1.30
Participate in work in process call (0.90); participate in committee update call (0.40).

02/22/23 E P Stephens 1.00

Teleconference with Ball, Rosenblum, Geremia, DiPompeo (all Jones Day), Kramer, Law, and Berringer (all
Reed Smith) regarding current status and next steps (1.00).

02/24/23 C Ball 0.70
Parish call.

Matter Total 15.10
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Plan and Disclosure Statement
02/01/23 C Ball 1.10
Prepare for client call regarding next steps.
02/01/23 A M Butler 6.30

Call with client regarding mediation and next steps (0.80); confer with Rosenblum (Jones Day) regarding same
(0.20); call with Committee regarding plan and mediation (0.40); confer with Jones Day team (Ball,
Rosenblum, Morin) regarding same (0.40); review and revise solicitation procedures motion and exhibits

(4.50).

02/01/23 B Rosenblum 0.20
Confer with Stephens (Jones Day) regarding plan litigation.

02/02/23 A M Butler 1.50

Review and revise solicitation procedures motion and exhibits.

02/03/23 A M Butler 1.50

Participate in call with parish counsel (Slome, Driscoll, Heuer) and Jones Day team (Rosenblum, Stephens,
Geremia, Ball (0.50); review and revise solicitation procedures motion (1.00).

02/03/23 B Rosenblum 6.50

Attention to committee plan and disclosure statement (4.50); communications regarding same (1.00); attention
to inquiries regarding same (1.00).

02/03/23 E P Stephens 2.00

Review amended Committee plan and disclosure statement (1.70); attention to draft plan documents (0.30).

02/04/23 C Ball 1.00
Communications with CHS counsel Gilardi (Ropes & Gray) (0.40); review Alvarez & Marsal spreadsheet
(0.60).

02/05/23 C Ball 0.60
Communications with McDermott (Alvarez & Marsal) and Chapin (DRVC) regarding workmen’s
compensation.

02/06/23 C Ball 3.20

Communications with Gilardi (Ropes & Gray) and McDermott (Alvarez & Marsal) on CHS (1.30);
communications regarding press materials (1.10); call with Jefferies on next steps (0.80).

02/06/23 A M Butler 1.50

Review and revise solicitation procedures motion (0.50); confer with Ciriello (Alvarez & Marsal) regarding
disclosure statement issues (0.80); confer with Morin (Jones Day) regarding call with client (0.20).

02/06/23 B Rosenblum 0.40
Confer with Ball (Jones Day) regarding plan (0.10); confer with Stephens (Jones Day) (0.30).
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02/07/23 A M Butler 1.10

Review next steps regarding Committee disclosure statement (0.30); confer with Tawil (Jones Day) regarding
same (0.30); review update regarding plan status conference (0.30); draft notice regarding same (0.20).

02/07/23 A R Tawil 1.00

Meet with Butler (Jones Day) to discuss disclosure statement objection research (0.50); research objections to
UCC disclosure statement (0.50).

02/08/23 C Ball 3.70

Open items call (1.20); UCC call (0.20); confer with Rosenblum, Stephens and Geremia (Jones Day) regarding
Patch response (0.70); communications regarding CHS (0.70); call with McDermott (Alvarez & Marsal) and
Chapin (DRVC) and follow up to Gilardi (Ropes & Gray) (0.90).

02/08/23 A M Butler 3.30

Call with Jones Day team (Rosenblum, Geremia, Ball, Stephens) and Reed Smith team (Kramer, Berringer,
Law) regarding plan and mediation issues (1.00); call with Committee (Stang, Michael, Dine) regarding same
(0.30); analyze planning for disclosure statement issues (0.50); review and revise solicitation procedures (0.50);
confer with Yeary (Jones Day) regarding disclosure statement litigation (0.50); confer with Morin (Jones Day)
regarding plan issues (0.50).

02/08/23 B Rosenblum 1.80

Review/analyze plan documents (1.00); communicate with Citiello (Alvarez & Marsal) regarding questions on
same (0.20); review monthly operating report (0.30); attention press inquiries regarding plan (0.30).

02/08/23 E P Stephens 1.60

Teleconference with Ball, Rosenblum, Geremia, Butler (all Jones Day), Kramer, L.aw, and Berringer (all
Reed Smith) regarding current status and next steps (1.00); attention to draft media statement (0.60).

02/08/23 A R Tawil 4.50

Research law and facts regarding disclosure statement objections.

02/08/23 N P Yeary 3.40

Confer with Butler (Jones Day) concerning Disclosure Statement issues (0.30); review and analyze disclosure
statement and plan materials (3.10).

02/09/23 C Ball 2.30

Communications with McDermott (Alvarez & Marsal) and Chapin (DRVC) regarding CHS (0.50); call with
CHS (Miller, Foy), O'Brien (CHSLI) and Gilardi (Ropes & Gray) (1.20); review projections (0.40); follow up
communications with Foy (CHS) and William Chapin (DRVC) (0.20).

02/09/23 A M Butler 7.80

Review and revise solicitation procedures motion (3.00); attend to planning for plan related filings (4.00);
confer with Ball (Jones Day) regarding same (0.80).

02/09/23 B Rosenblum 0.90

Review draft plan document.

02/09/23 E P Stephens 0.10

Review draft statement regarding child protection.
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02/09/23 N P Yeary 4.70
Conduct research concerning disclosure statement related issues.
02/10/23 C Ball 0.70

News regarding verdict upstate (0.20); confer with Geremia and Stephens (both Jones Day) regarding reversal
by Second Department (0.30); communications with Foy (CHS) and Chapin (DRVC) regarding CHS (0.20).

02/10/23 A M Butler 3.20

Confer with parish counsel (Slome, Heuer, Hulme, Driscoll) regarding plan and mediation issues (0.70); confer
with Rosenblum (Jones Day) regarding same (1.50); review and revise solicitation procedures motion (1.00).

02/10/23 E P Stephens 0.80

Teleconference with Ball, Rosenblum, Butler (all Jones Day), Roseman, Hulme, Sorensen, McMahon, Driscoll,
Heuer, and Adams (all parish counsel) regarding current status and next steps.

02/10/23 A R Tawil 0.90

Develop disclosure statement objections.

02/10/23 N P Yeary 1.00
Review materials related to disclosure statement issues (0.70); correspond with Tawil (Jones Day) regarding
same (0.30).

02/11/23 C Ball 0.60

Confer with Rosenblum and Geremia (both Jones Day) regarding UCC planned objection to parishes.

02/12/23 A M Butler 1.50

Review and revise solicitation procedures motion and exhibits.

02/12/23 A R Tawil 0.80

Revise disclosure statement objections.

02/13/23 C Ball 1.50

Confer with Rosenblum (Jones Day) regarding objection schedule (0.30); review time line (0.60); review
projection for questions on PSIP (0.60).

02/13/23 A M Butler 7.30

Review and revise solicitation procedures motion and exhibits (5.00); confer with Rosenblum (Jones Day) and
Ciriello (Alvarez & Marsal) regarding plan issues (0.60); confer with Stephens (Jones Day) regarding plan issues
(0.50); call with Jones Day team (Yeary and Tawil) regarding disclosure statement research (0.40); prepare for
same (0.40); review next steps on legal research (0.40).

02/13/23 B Rosenblum 2.70

Confer with Ball (Jones Day) (0.10); confer with Stephens (Jones Day) (0.10); communicate with Butler (Jones
Day) and Ciriello (Alvarez & Marsal) regarding plan (0.50); analysis of claims for mediation (2.00).

02/13/23 A R Tawil 3.80

Revise objections to disclosure statement.
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02/13/23 N P Yeary 5.70

Conduct research related to disclosure statement issues (2.40); review and revise disclosure statement outline
(0.80); correspond with Tawil (Jones Day) concerning same (0.10); conference with Butler and Tawil (both
Jones Day) concerning disclosure statement status and next steps (0.50); conduct further research concerning
disclosure statement issues (1.20); revise outline concerning a disclosure statement issue (0.70).

02/14/23 C Ball 0.60
Communications with Gilardi (Ropes & Gray) regarding CHS.

02/14/23 A M Butler 3.40

Review plan research (2.50); confer with Ciriello (Alvarez & Marsal) regarding plan issues (0.70); confer with
Rosenblum (Jones Day) regarding same (0.20).

02/14/23 B Rosenblum 0.90

Communicate with Slome (parish counsel) regarding case resolution (0.40); follow up call with Ciriello
(Alvarez & Marsal) and Butler (Jones Day) regarding plan (0.50).

02/14/23 A R Tawil 1.20

Supplemental research on disclosure statement objections.

02/14/23 N P Yeary 6.80

Analyze plan related materials (3.30); prepare memoranda concerning same (1.70); research concerning plan
related issues (1.80).

02/15/23 C Ball 2.70
Call with client (1.60); call with UCC (0.40); research on classification (0.70).

02/15/23 A M Butler 5.50

Call with client regarding plan issues (1.10); call with Committee (Dine, Michael) regarding status issues (0.20);
confer with Rosenblum (Jones Day) regarding next steps on plan issues (1.20); review and revise disclosure
statement research (3.00).

02/15/23 B Rosenblum 4.00

Attend to objections to committee plan/disclosure statement.

02/15/23 E P Stephens 1.00

Teleconference with Ball, Rosenblum, DiPompeo, Butler (all Jones Day), Kramer, Law, Berringer (all Reed
Smith), Moore (Alvarez & Marsal), and Renker (DRVC) regarding current status and next steps.

02/15/23 A R Tawil 0.10
Attend to email relating to disclosure statement research and review files relating to disclosure statement
objections.

02/15/23 N P Yeary 4.00

Analyze disclosure statement filed by committee (3.10); analyze materials related to disclosure statement (0.70);
correspond with Butler and Tawil (both Jones Day) regarding same (0.20).

02/16/23 C Ball 1.10

CHS review and circulate termsheet from CHS.
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02/16/23 A M Butler 8.20

Confer with Rosenblum, Geremia, Stephens, Ball (all Jones Day) regarding plan issues and scheduling for
same (2.20); legal research regarding plan and disclosure statement issues (4.00); review Committee filings
(2.00).

02/16/23 T R Geremia 2.00

Meet with Ball, Butler, and Rosenblum (all Jones Day) regarding omnibus claim objections and disclosure
statement issues.

02/16/23 B Rosenblum 6.50

Confer internally regarding chapter 11 plan and disclosure statement (1.00); review and develop objections to
committee plan and disclosure statement (5.50).

02/16/23 B C Sandberg 1.20

Research Section 502(e)(1)(B) and contingent claims (0.60); send research findings regarding same to Butler
(Jones Day) (0.60).

02/16/23 E P Stephens 1.00

Teleconference with Ball, Rosenblum, Geremia, and Butler (all Jones Day) regarding plan and next steps.

02/16/23 N P Yeary 5.30

Analyze research materials related to plan matters (1.70); correspond to Butler (Jones Day) regarding same
(0.30); review and revise outline concerning plan related matters in preparation for workstream call (0.40);
correspond with Butler (Jones Day) regarding same (0.20); review UCC plan related materials (2.70).

02/17/23 C Ball 3.70

Parish counsel call (1.00); communications regarding status conference (1.20); confer with Gugg (Jones Day)
regarding best interest test and related scholarship (0.50); review outline of issues for discovery objection
(0.40), call with UCC regarding status conference (0.60).

02/17/23 A M Butler 4.10

Call with Jones Day team (Rosenblum, Yeary, Tawil, Sandberg) regarding disclosure statement research (1.00);
call with Rosenblum (Jones Day) and Ciriello (Alvarez & Marsal) regarding plan and disclosure statement
issues (1.00); call with Committee (Stang, Dine, Michael) and Jones Day team (Geremia, Ball, Rosenblum)
regarding same (0.50); review next steps on disclosure statement research (1.00); call with parish counsel
(Heuer, Slome, Driscoll) and Rosenblum and Stephens (both Jones Day) regarding plan and mediation (0.60).

02/17/23 B Rosenblum 5.60

Confer with Butler and team (all Jones Day) regarding disclosure statement objection process (0.80); review
outline of disclosure statement objections (0.30); attention to same (3.00); communicate with Butler (Jones
Day) and Ciriello (Alvarez & Marsal) regarding plan (0.50); confer with Ball (Jones Day) regarding resolution
strategy (0.50); confer with Butler (Jones Day) regarding same (0.50).

02/17/23 B C Sandberg 4.50

Review 502(e) research cases and meeting outline in preparation for meeting (0.70); attend meeting with
Rosenblum, Butler, Tawil, and Yeary (all Jones Day) regarding disclosure statement objection research plan
(1.00); review research outline after meeting (0.20); review creditors' committee disclosure statement and plan
(1.20); review previous research regarding disclosure statement (0.80); begin research on sales of property in
the plan context (0.60).
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02/17/23 E P Stephens 0.60

Teleconference with Rosenblum, Butler (both Jones Day), Slome, Driscoll, Sorenson, Heuer, and McMahon
(all parish counsel) regarding current status and next steps.

02/17/23 A R Tawil 1.80
Meet internally to discuss disclosure statement objection (1.00); disclosure statement objection research
(0.80).

02/17/23 N P Yeary 7.80

Draft memoranda concerning a disclosure statement filed by the UCC (1.30); analyze UCC plan related
materials (3.00); call with Butler, Tawil, Sandberg, Rosenblum (all Jones Day) concerning plan related matters

and next steps (0.70); analyze case law related to disclosure statement (2.20); prepare memorandum concerning
same (0.60).

02/19/23 A R Tawil 1.20

Disclosure statement objection research.

02/20/23 C Ball 2.00
Prepare for call on CHS (0.80); prepare for conference (1.20).

02/20/23 A R Tawil 0.80

Disclosure statement objection research.

02/20/23 N P Yeary 8.10

Analyze UCC plan exhibit (3.40); conduct research related to same (0.70); analyze research materials related to
same (2.80); draft memorandum concerning same (1.20).

02/21/23 B Rosenblum 0.80
Confer with Ball (Jones Day) regarding mediation (0.40); communicate with Slome (parish counsel) regarding
same (0.40).

02/21/23 B C Sandberg 4.70

Review previous research on business judgment rule in sale context, summarize same for objection outline
(1.70); research section 1129 plan issues (2.30); research briefing and related cases for best plan arguments

(0.70).

02/21/23 A R Tawil 4.10

Research disclosure statement objection.

02/21/23 N P Yeary 5.30
Analyze plan related case law (3.80); draft memorandum concerning same (0.80); analyze plan related materials
(0.70).

02/22/23 C Ball 1.60
UCC call (0.80); call Eckstein (Kramer Levin) (0.40); communications with Renker (DRVC) regarding BOE
(0.40).

02/22/23 A M Butler 0.90

Review hearing transcript (0.60); review next steps on disclosure statement research issues (0.30).
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02/22/23 B Rosenblum 0.20

Confer with Ball (Jones Day) regarding mediation.

02/22/23 B C Sandberg 2.20

Continue research of cases dealing with plan issues (1.50); meet with Yeary and Tawil (both Jones Day) to
discuss progress (0.50); confer with Butler (Jones Day) regarding disclosure statement arguments and review
response (0.20).

02/22/23 A R Tawil 4.10

Research disclosure statement objection research; solidify outline (3.60); meeting with Yeary and Sandberg
(both Jones Day) to discuss disclosure statement objection research (0.50).

02/22/23 N P Yeary 4.70

Call with Tawil and Sandberg (both Jones Day) concerning disclosure statement research and next steps (0.50);
review materials related to disclosure statement issues (2.90); draft outline memoranda concerning same (0.60);
review pleadings filed by the UCC in connection with the same (0.70).

02/23/23 B C Sandberg 6.70

Continue researching various issues for objection to committee's disclosure statement (5.30); draft research
outline and send same to Yeary and Tawil (both Jones Day) (1.40).

02/23/23 A R Tawil 1.80

Research for disclosure objection and create outline.

02/23/23 N P Yeary 5.70

Conduct research related to disclousre statement issues (0.50); analyze materials related to disclosure
statement issues (0.60); conduct research related to same (3.80); draft a memoranda concerning same (0.80).

02/24/23 C Ball 0.40

Communications with Dine (Pachulski) regarding mediators.

02/24/23 B Rosenblum 0.30
Confer with Ball (Jones Day) regarding mediation.

02/24/23 A R Tawil 0.50

Draft outline for disclosure statement objection.

02/26/23 B Rosenblum 0.10

Confer internally regarding mediation.

02/27/23 C Ball 1.00
Call with potential mediator (0.70); outreach to DiConza (Archer Law)(0.30).

02/27/23 A M Butler 2.30

Prepare for discussion with religious order regarding plan issues (0.50); confer with Ball (Jones Day) regarding
same (0.20); confer with Yeary regarding plan research (0.50); confer with Sandberg (Jones Day) regarding
same (0.20); confer with Morin and Sandberg (both Jones Day) regarding plan and sale issues (0.50); research
regarding same (0.40).
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02/27/23 B Rosenblum 1.00
Attend to plan and disclosure statement matters.
02/27/23 B C Sandberg 0.80

Revise and finalize draft of research findings for disclosure statement objection, and send same to Yeary and
Tawil (both Jones Day).

02/28/23 C Ball 1.80

Call with Franciscans regarding settlement (0.70); prepare for same (0.30); communications regarding Alvarez
& Marsal projections and next steps (0.40); confer with Gordon and Rosenblum (both Jones Day) regarding
mediators (0.40).

02/28/23 A M Butler 7.40

Legal research regarding plan issues (3.00); review plan filings in precedent cases (1.00); confer with Ciriello
(Alvarez & Marsal) regarding plan issues (1.20); call with Rosenblum, Ball (both Jones Day) and Moore and
Ciriello (both Alvarez & Marsal) regarding plan issues (0.60); call with counsel to Franciscan Brothers
(DiConza and Adams) and Ball and Rosenblum (both Jones Day) regarding plan issues (1.20); confer with
Rosenblum (Jones Day) regarding same (0.40).

02/28/23 B Rosenblum 4.10

Call with Ball, Butler (both Jones Day), Moore and Ciriello (both Alvarez & Marsal) regarding plan-related
litigation (0.60); communicate with co-defendant counsel (0.50); attention to settlement analysis (3.00).

02/28/23 B C Sandberg 0.50

Review disclosure statement objection research from Tawil (Jones Day).

02/28/23 A R Tawil 0.40

Review and revise outline for disclosure statement objection.

Matter Total 251.60
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Disbursement Detail

Date Timekeeper/Fee Earner Name Location Amount Total
Case Administration
COMPUTERIZED RESEARCH SERVICES
02/07/23 P E Smith NYC 20.69

Vendot: Couttalert Com Inc; Invoice#: 121013-2301; Date: 1/31/2022 - January 2023
Computerized Research Services Subtotal 20.69
COURIER SERVICES
02/27/23 NYC Accounting NYC 9.25

Vendor: Transportation Consultants Of America In; Invoice#: 171698-171862; Date: 2/27/2023---Court House

1/31/2023

1 Bowling Green NY
02/27/23 NYC Accounting NYC 21.50

Vendor: Transportation Consultants Of Ametica In; Invoice#: 171698-171862; Date: 2/27/2023--- US Bankruptcy
Court 1/30/2023
1 Bowling Green

02/27/23 NYC Accounting NYC 21.50
Vendor: Transportation Consultants Of America In; Invoice#: 171698-171862; Date: 2/27/2023--- US Bankruptcy
Court 2/1/2023
1 Bowling Green

02/27/23 NYC Accounting NYC 21.50
Vendot: Transportation Consultants Of Ametica In; Invoice#: 171698-171862; Date: 2/27/2023---- US Bankruptcy
Court 2/6/2023

1 Bowling Green
Courier Services Subtotal 73.75

COURT REPORTER FEES

02/13/23 A M Butler NYC 181.50
Vendor: Veritext LLC; Invoice#: 6221500; (audio transcript - case no. 12345)
02/13/23 A M Butler NYC 447.70
Vendor: Veritext LLC; Invoice#: 5956331; (audio transcript - case no. 20-12345)
02/13/23 A M Butler NYC 181.50
Vendor: Veritext LLC; Invoice#: 6069059; (audio transcript - case no. 20-12345)
02/21/23 A M Butler NYC 302.50
Vendor: Veritext LLC; Invoice#: 6383029; (audio transcript - case no. 20-12345)
Court Reporter Fees Subtotal 1,113.20
HOSTING CHARGES
02/22/23 S M Peterson NYC 12,387.78
Vendor: Xact Data Discovety; Invoice#: XDD066098; Date: 1/31/2023 (Project Challenge - January 2023)
Hosting Charges Subtotal 12,387.78

POSTAGE CHARGES

02/27/23 NYC Accounting NYC 2.40
Postage charges. 02/10/2023
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Diocese of Rockville Centre
Date Timekeeper/Fee Earner Name

02/28/23 C Buck
Postage charges 02/24/2023

Postage Charges Subtotal

RESEARCH FEES
02/28/23 M Lewis

Page: 56
March 30, 2023
Invoice: 230902054

Location Amount Total
NYC 39.00
41.40
WAS 228.96

Vendor: West Publishing Cotporation; Invoice#: 6153131897; Date: 2/28/2023 - Westlaw court express fees

Research Fees Subtotal

Matter Total

228.96

USD 13,865.78



	1. Attached hereto as Exhibit A is a summary of Jones Day professionals by individual, setting forth the (a) name and title of each individual who provided services during the Twenty-Ninth Monthly Fee Period, (b) aggregate hours spent by each individu...
	2. Attached hereto as Exhibit B is a summary of the services rendered and compensation sought, by project category, for the Twenty-Ninth Monthly Fee Period.
	3. Attached hereto as Exhibit C is a summary of expenses incurred and reimbursement sought, by expense type, for the Twenty-Ninth Monthly Fee Period.
	4. Attached hereto as Exhibit D is a copy of the Jones Day invoice for the Twenty-Ninth Monthly Fee Period.
	5. Notice of this Twenty-Ninth Monthly Fee Statement shall be given to the following parties (collectively, the “Notice Parties”): (i) The Roman Catholic Diocese of Rockville Centre, P.O. Box 9023, Rockville Centre, NY 11571-9023 Attn: Thomas Renker, ...
	6. Objections to this Twenty-Ninth Monthly Fee Statement, if any, must be served via electronic mail upon Jones Day, 250 Vesey Street, New York, New York 10281, Attn: Benjamin Rosenblum (brosenblum@jonesday.com) and Andrew Butler (abutler@jonesday.com...
	7. If no objections to this Twenty-Ninth Monthly Fee Statement are received by the Objection Deadline, the Debtor shall promptly pay Jones Day 80% of the fees and 100% of the expenses identified in this Twenty-Ninth Monthly Fee Statement.
	8. To the extent that an objection to the Twenty-Ninth Monthly Fee Statement is received on or before the Objection Deadline, the Debtor shall withhold payment of that portion of this Twenty-Ninth Monthly Fee Statement to which the objection is direct...
	9. No prior request for the relief sought in this Twenty-Ninth Monthly Fee Statement has been made to this or any other court.



