JONES DAY Corinne Ball Todd Geremia Benjamin Rosenblum Andrew Butler 250 Vesey Street New York, New York 10281 Telephone: (212) 326-3939 Facsimile: (212) 755-7306

Counsel for the Debtor and Debtor in Possession

UNITED STATES BANKRUPTCY COURT SOUTHERN DISTRICT OF NEW YORK

In re: THE ROMAN CATHOLIC DIOCESE OF ROCKVILLE CENTRE, NEW YORK, Debtor.¹

Chapter 11

Case No. 20-12345 (MG)

NOTICE OF THIRTY-EIGHTH MONTHLY FEE STATEMENT OF JONES DAY FOR COMPENSATION FOR SERVICES RENDERED AND REIMBURSEMENT OF EXPENSES INCURRED AS COUNSEL TO THE DEBTOR FOR THE PERIOD FROM NOVEMBER 1, 2023 THROUGH NOVEMBER 30, 2023

Name of Applicant:	Jones Day
Authorized to Provide Services to:	The Roman Catholic Diocese of Rockville Centre, New York
Date of Retention:	November 4, 2020, nunc pro tunc to October 1, 2020
Period for Which Compensation and Expense Reimbursement is Sought:	November 1, 2023 through November 30, 2023

¹ The Debtor in this chapter 11 case is The Roman Catholic Diocese of Rockville Centre, New York, the last four digits of its federal tax identification number are 7437, and its mailing address is P.O. Box 9023, Rockville Centre, NY 11571-9023.

Amount of Compensation Requested (after 10% discount):	\$1,220,370.75
Less 50% Holdback:	\$610,185.37
Net of Holdback:	\$610,185.38
Amount of Expense Reimbursement Requested:	\$12,908.58
Total Compensation (Net of Holdback) and Expense Reimbursement Requested:	\$623,093.96
This is a	X Monthly Interim Final Fee Statement

[Remainder of Page Intentionally Blank]

20-12345-mg Doc 2763 Filed 12/29/23 Entered 12/29/23 14:21:24 Main Document Pg 3 of 53

In accordance with the Order Authorizing Procedures for Interim Compensation and Reimbursement of Expenses of Professionals, entered on November 4, 2020 [Docket No. 129] (the "Interim Compensation Order"),² Jones Day hereby submits this thirty-eighth monthly fee statement (the "Thirty-Eighth Monthly Fee Statement"), seeking compensation for services rendered and reimbursement of expenses incurred as counsel to the Debtor, for the period from November 1, 2023 through November 30, 2023 (the "Thirty-Eighth Monthly Fee Period"). By this Thirty-Eighth Monthly Fee Statement, and after taking into account certain voluntary discounts,³ Jones Day seeks payment in the amount of \$623,093.96, which comprises (i) 50% of the total amount of compensation sought for actual and necessary services rendered during the Thirty-Eighth Monthly Fee Period and (ii) reimbursement of 100% of actual and necessary expenses incurred in connection with such services.

SERVICES RENDERED AND EXPENSES INCURRED

1. Attached hereto as **Exhibit A** is a summary of Jones Day professionals by individual, setting forth the (a) name and title of each individual who provided services during the Thirty-Eighth Monthly Fee Period, (b) aggregate hours spent by each individual, (c) hourly billing rate for each such individual at Jones Day's then-current billing rates, (d) amount of fees earned by each Jones Day professional, and (e) year of bar admission for each attorney. The blended

² Capitalized terms not otherwise defined herein shall have the meanings ascribed to such terms in the Interim Compensation Order.

³ The total amount sought for fees reflects (a) voluntary write offs in the amount of \$18,591.75 in fees and \$791.52 in costs and (b) application of a subsequent 10% discount on all fees, pursuant to an agreed practice between Jones Day and the Debtor which was implemented prior to the Petition Date and disclosed in the Debtor's retention application.

20-12345-mg Doc 2763 Filed 12/29/23 Entered 12/29/23 14:21:24 Main Document Pg 4 of 53

hourly billing rate of Jones Day timekeepers during the Thirty-Eighth Monthly Fee Period is approximately \$793.00.⁴

2. Attached hereto as **Exhibit B** is a summary of the services rendered and compensation sought, by project category, for the Thirty-Eighth Monthly Fee Period.

3. Attached hereto as **Exhibit** C is a summary of expenses incurred and reimbursement sought, by expense type, for the Thirty-Eighth Monthly Fee Period.

4. Attached hereto as **Exhibit D** is a copy of the Jones Day invoice for the Thirty-Eighth Monthly Fee Period.

⁴ The blended rate is comprised of all Jones Day timekeepers who provided services during the Thirty-Eighth Monthly Fee Period.

20-12345-mg Doc 2763 Filed 12/29/23 Entered 12/29/23 14:21:24 Main Document Pg 5 of 53

NOTICE AND OBJECTION PROCEDURES

5. Notice of this Thirty-Eighth Monthly Fee Statement shall be given to the following parties (collectively, the "<u>Notice Parties</u>"): (i) The Roman Catholic Diocese of Rockville Centre, P.O. Box 9023, Rockville Centre, NY 11571-9023 Attn: Thomas Renker, Email: trenker@drvc.com; (ii) counsel to the Debtor, Jones Day, 250 Vesey Street, New York, NY 10281 Attn: Corinne Ball, Esq., Email: cball@jonesday.com, Benjamin Rosenblum, Esq., Email: brosenblum@jonesday.com, and Andrew Butler, Esq., Email: abutler@jonesday.com; (iii) counsel to the Committee: Pachulski Stang Ziehl and Jones LLP, 780 Third Avenue, 36th Floor, New York, New York, 10017, Attn: Ilan D. Scharf, Esq., Email: ischarf@pszjlaw.com, Karen B. Dine, Esq., Email: kdine@pszjlaw.com, and Brittany M. Michael, Esq., bmichael@pszjlaw.com; and (iv) the Office of the United States Trustee, U.S. Federal Office Building, 201 Varick Street, Suite 1006, New York, New York 10014, Attn: Greg Zipes, Email: Greg.Zipes@usdoj.gov, and Shara Cornell, Email: Shara.Cornell@usdoj.gov.

6. Objections to this Thirty-Eighth Monthly Fee Statement, if any, must be served via electronic mail upon Jones Day, 250 Vesey Street, New York, New York 10281, Attn: Benjamin Rosenblum (brosenblum@jonesday.com) and Andrew Butler (abutler@jonesday.com) no later than January 15, 2024 at 5:00 p.m. (prevailing Eastern Time) (the "<u>Objection Deadline</u>"), setting forth the nature of the objection and the specific amount of fees or expenses at issue.

7. If no objections to this Thirty-Eighth Monthly Fee Statement are received by the Objection Deadline, the Debtor shall promptly pay Jones Day 80% of the fees and 100% of the expenses identified in this Thirty-Eighth Monthly Fee Statement.

8. To the extent that an objection to the Thirty-Eighth Monthly Fee Statement is received on or before the Objection Deadline, the Debtor shall withhold payment of that portion

-3-

of this Thirty-Eighth Monthly Fee Statement to which the objection is directed and promptly pay the remainder of the fees and expenses in the percentages set forth above. To the extent such an objection is not resolved, it shall be preserved and scheduled for consideration at the next interim fee application hearing.

NO PRIOR REQUEST

9. No prior request for the relief sought in this Thirty-Eighth Monthly Fee

Statement has been made to this or any other court.

Dated: December 29, 2023 New York, New York /s/ Corinne Ball

JONES DAY Corinne Ball Todd Geremia Benjamin Rosenblum Andrew Butler 250 Vesey Street New York, NY 10281 Telephone: (212) 326-3939 Facsimile: (212) 755-7306 Email: cball@jonesday.com trgeremia@jonesday.com brosenblum@jonesday.com abutler@jonesday.com

Counsel to the Debtor and Debtor in Possession

20-12345-mg Doc 2763 Filed 12/29/23 Entered 12/29/23 14:21:24 Main Document Pg 7 of 53

EXHIBIT A

PROFESSIONAL PERSON SUMMARY November 1, 2023 – November 30, 2023

NAME	<u>YEAR OF</u> ADMISSION	<u>RATE</u>	<u>WITH 10%</u> DISCOUNT	HOURS	AMOUNT		
PARTNER							
Corinne Ball	1979	\$1,950.00	\$1,755.00	99.00	\$173,745.00		
Christopher DiPompeo	2009	\$1,400.00	\$1,260.00	11.40	\$14,364.00		
Victoria Dorfman	2004	\$1,325.00	\$1,192.50	42.80	\$51,039.00		
Todd Geremia	1999	\$1,450.00	\$1,305.00	118.00	\$153,990.00		
Edward Joyce	1987	\$1,500.00	\$1,350.00	12.10	\$16,335.00		
Nicholas Morin	2014	\$1,225.00	\$1,102.50	9.60	\$10,584.00		
Benjamin Rosenblum	2005	\$1,550.00	\$1,395.00	99.00	\$138,105.00		
Eric Stephens	2009	\$1,350.00	\$1,215.00	128.00	\$155,520.00		
	TOTAL PARTN	ER:		519.90	\$713,682.00		
ASSOCIATE					,		
Chané Buck	2017	\$950.00	\$855.00	0.60	\$513.00		
Andrew Butler	2017	\$1,000.00	\$900.00	203.80	\$183,420.00		
Melanie Chan	2021	\$825.00	\$742.50	70.30	\$52,197.75		
Christopher Cundra	2022	\$700.00	\$630.00	27.20	\$17,136.00		
Connor Farley	2023	\$725.00	\$652.50	38.40	\$25,056.00		
Joshua Hoyt	2021	\$675.00	\$607.50	11.00	\$6,682.50		
Nurlan Orujlu	2023	\$650.00	\$585.00	19.60	\$11,466.00		
William Quaranta	2023	\$650.00	\$585.00	32.60	\$19,071.00		
Anoop Sadanandan	2022	\$725.00	\$652.50	31.20	\$20,358.00		
Alexander Sapp	2022	\$650.00	\$585.00	54.10	\$31,648.50		
Abraham Tawil	2023	\$650.00	\$585.00	34.90	\$20,416.50		
Daniel Villalba	2019	\$750.00	\$675.00	4.60	\$3,105.00		
Samuel Weiss	2021	\$775.00	\$697.50	0.70	\$488.25		
Nathan Yeary	2021	\$775.00	\$697.50	86.50	\$60,333.75		
Christopher Zepf	2023	\$650.00	\$585.00	35.60	\$20,826.00		
	FOTAL ASSOCIA	ATE:		651.10	\$472,718.25		
LAW CLERK							
Collin Li	N/A	\$700.00	\$630.00	15.90	\$10,017.00		
Sean Skedzielewski	N/A	\$700.00	\$630.00	13.50	\$8,505.00		
TOTAL LAW CLERK:				29.40	\$18,522.00		
PARALEGAL & STAFF							
Cindy Gugg	N/A	\$450.00	\$405.00	36.80	\$14,904.00		
Sara Peterson	N/A	\$400.00	\$360.00	0.80	\$288.00		
Christa Smith	N/A	\$475.00	\$427.50	0.60	\$256.50		
TOTAL LEGAL SUPPORT:				38.2	\$15,448.50		
TOTAL:				1,238.60	\$1,220,370.75		

20-12345-mg Doc 2763 Filed 12/29/23 Entered 12/29/23 14:21:24 Main Document Pg 8 of 53

EXHIBIT B

COMPENSATION BY PROJECT CATEGORY

<u>November 1, 2023 – November 30, 2023</u>

PROJECT CATEGORY	TOTAL HOURS	TOTAL FEES
Asset Disposition	7.00	\$4,484.25
Business Operations	5.70	\$7,040.25
Case Administration	13.10	\$7,627.5
Claims Administration and Objections	182.30	\$183,739.50
Court Hearings	33.50	\$43,344.00
Fee/Employment Applications	22.20	\$13,558.50
Finance and Cash Collateral	12.50	\$12,206.25
Litigation and Adversary Proceedings	419.20	\$447,999.75
Meetings	27.00	\$36,540.00
Plan and Disclosure Statement	516.10	\$463,830.75
TOTAL	1,238.60	\$1,220,370.75

20-12345-mg Doc 2763 Filed 12/29/23 Entered 12/29/23 14:21:24 Main Document Pg 9 of 53

EXHIBIT C

EXPENSE SUMMARY

<u>November 1, 2023 – November 30, 2023</u>

Computerized Research Services	\$22.75
Court Reporter Fees	\$261.30
Hosting Charges	\$12,624.53
TOTAL	\$12,908.58

20-12345-mg Doc 2763 Filed 12/29/23 Entered 12/29/23 14:21:24 Main Document Pg 10 of 53

EXHIBIT D

TIME DETAIL

20-12345-mg Doc 2763 Filed 12/29/23 Entered 12/29/23 14:21:24 Main Document Pg 11 of 53

JONES DAY

 New York Office

 250 Vesey Street

 New York, NY 10281-1047

 (212) 326-3939

 Federal Identification Number: 34-0319085

December 29, 2023

131253 Invoice: 230910170

Diocese of Rockville Centre Attn: Thomas G. Renker, Esq. 50 North Park Avenue P.O. Box 9023 Rockville Centre, NY 11571-9023 United States of America

For legal services rendered for the period through November 30, 2023:

Asset Disposition	4,982.50	
Business Operations	7,822.50	
Case Administration	8,475.00	
Claims Administration and Objections	204,155.00	
Court Hearings	48,160.00	
Fee/Employment Applications	15,065.00	
Financing and Cash Collateral	13,562.50	
Litigation and Adversary Proceedings	497,777.50	
Meetings	40,600.00	
Plan and Disclosure Statement	515,367.50	
	USI	D 1,355,967.50
Less Client Discount:		(135,596.75)
	USI	D 1,220,370.75
Total Billed Disbursements	USI	D 12,908.58
TOTAL	USI	D 1,233,279.33

20-12345-mg Doc 2763 Filed 12/29/23 Entered 12/29/23 14:21:24 Main Document Pg 12 of 53 JONES DAY

131253

Diocese of Rockville Centre

Disbursement & Charges Summary

Computerized Research Services	22.75
Court Reporter Fees	261.30
Hosting Charges	12,624.53

USD 12,908.58

Page: 2 December 29, 2023 Invoice: 230910170

20-12345-mg Doc 2763 Filed 12/29/23 Entered 12/29/23 14:21:24 Main Document Pg 13 of 53 JONES DAY

131253

Diocese of Rockville Centre

Page: 3 December 29, 2023 Invoice: 230910170

Timekeeper/Fee Earner Summary – November 30, 2023

Timekeeper/Fee Earner		Bar			
Name	Title	Year	Hours	Rate	Amount
C Ball	Partner	1979	99.00	1,755.00	173,745.00
C J DiPompeo	Partner	2009	11.40	1,260.00	14,364.00
V Dorfman	Partner	2004	42.80	1,192.50	51,039.00
T R Geremia	Partner	1999	118.00	1,305.00	153,990.00
E M Joyce	Partner	1987	12.10	1,350.00	16,335.00
N J Morin	Partner	2014	9.60	1,102.50	10,584.00
B Rosenblum	Partner	2005	99.00	1,395.00	138,105.00
E P Stephens	Partner	2009	128.00	1,215.00	155,520.00
Total			519.90		713,682.00
C Buck	Associate	2017	0.60	855.00	513.00
A M Butler	Associate	2017	203.80	900.00	183,420.00
M K Chan	Associate	2021	70.30	742.50	52,197.75
C Cundra	Associate	2022	27.20	630.00	17,136.00
C J Farley	Associate	2023	38.40	652.50	25,056.00
J T Hoyt	Associate	2021	11.00	607.50	6,682.50
N Orujlu	Associate	2023	19.60	585.00	11,466.00
W P Quaranta	Associate	2023	32.60	585.00	19,071.00
A Sadanandan	Associate	2022	31.20	652.50	20,358.00
A Sapp	Associate	2022	54.10	585.00	31,648.50
A R Tawil	Associate	2023	34.90	585.00	20,416.50
D C Villalba	Associate	2019	4.60	675.00	3,105.00
S S Weiss	Associate	2021	0.70	697.50	488.25
N P Yeary	Associate	2021	86.50	697.50	60,333.75
C Zepf	Associate	2023	35.60	585.00	20,826.00
Total			651.10		472,718.25
C J Li	Law Clerk		15.90	630.00	10,017.00
S Skedzielewski	Law Clerk		13.50	630.00	8,505.00
Total			29.40		18,522.00
C M Gugg	Paralegal		36.80	405.00	14,904.00
C L Smith	Paralegal		0.60	427.50	256.50
Total			37.40		15,160.50
S M Peterson	Project Manager		0.80	360.00	288.00
Total			0.80		288.00
Total		_	1,238.60	USD	1,220,370.75

20-12345-mg Doc 2763 Filed 12/29/23 Entered 12/29/23 14:21:24 Main Document Pg 14 of 53 JONES DAY

131253

Diocese of Rockville Centre

Page: 4 December 29, 2023 Invoice: 230910170

Fee Detail

Date of Service	Timekeeper/Fee Earner Name	Hours
Asset Disposition		
11/02/23 Prepare NDA l	C Buck ist.	0.60
11/02/23 Review NDA li	S Skedzielewski ist (2.60); draft email regarding same(0.30); discuss the draft email with B	3.10 uck (Jones Day) (0.20).
11/03/23 Update NDA li	S Skedzielewski ist.	1.20
11/08/23 Draft and revis assume or reject	C J Li e tenth motion to further extend removal period and tenth motion to fur t leases.	1.40 rther extend period to
11/09/23 Draft tenth mo period.	C J Li tion to further extend period to assume or reject leases and tenth motion	0.40 n to further extend removal
	C L Smith for extension of time to assume or reject leases in connection with filing ; e-file same and forward as-filed copy to Butler (Jones Day) (0.10).	0.30 g same (0.10); prepare same
Matter Tot	al	7.00
Business Operations		
	C Ball Chapin and Lewandowski (both DRVC) regarding administrative issues (d Galardi (Ropes & Gray) regarding settlement issues (0.70).	1.10 0.40); follow up with Butler
11/02/23 Meeting with cl	A M Butler lient regarding CHS settlement issues.	0.50
11/02/23 Revise Adminis	S S Weiss strative Services Agreement for CHS workers' compensation claims.	0.70
11/03/23 Confer with Bu	C Ball atler (Jones Day) regarding CHS.	0.30
11/03/23 Email with But	A R Tawil ler (Jones Day) and Galardi (Ropes & Grey) regarding CHS settlement.	0.10
	A M Butler alardi (CHS) and Ball (Jones Day) regarding status of negotiations (0.40); nentation (0.30).	0.70 attend to status of
11/07/23 Review next ste	A M Butler eps on CHS negotiations.	0.30

20-12345-mg Doc 2763 Filed 12/29/23 Entered 12/29/23 14:21:24 Main Document Pg 15 of 53 JONES DAY

	JONES DAY	
131253 Diocese of Rocky	zille Centre	Page: 5 December 29, 2023 Invoice: 230910170
Diotese of Rocky		mvolee. 250910170
Date of Service	Timekeeper/Fee Earner Name	Hours
11/08/23 Call with G	C Ball Galardi (Ropes & Gray) regarding CHS.	0.40
11/29/23 Communic	B Rosenblum ate with Butler, Ball (both Jones Day), Moore and Ciriello (b	1.10 oth Alvarez & Marsal) regarding liquidity.
11/30/23 Review inst	A M Butler urance reporting issues (0.30); send reporting to Committee (0.50
Matter	Total	5.70
Case Administration	on	
11/15/23 Assemble o	C M Gugg courtesy copies of filings for chambers.	0.70
11/16/23 Prepare a n	A R Tawil notice of status conference.	1.00
11/17/23 Review and	C M Gugg l e-file notice of status conference.	0.20
11/20/23 Prepare age	A R Tawil enda (1.00) and certificate of no objection (0.90).	1.90
11/21/23 Draft certif	A R Tawil ficate of no objection.	1.50
11/22/23 Draft letter	T R Geremia to court to provide update regarding other matters impactin	1.20 g bankruptcy case.
11/22/23 Draft certif	A R Tawil ficate of no objection.	0.50
conference	C M Gugg d e-file certificate of no objection (0.20); review and e-file lette (0.20); review and e-file notice of agenda (0.20); review and e- tion motion (0.60); and confer with Butler (Jones Day) regard	e-file amended plan, disclosure statement
11/27/23 Review and	A R Tawil I revise agenda for filing.	1.70
11/28/23 Assemble c	C M Gugg courtesy copies of filings for court.	1.10
11/29/23	A R Tawil	0.30
	locket matters.	
	C M Gugg o request by insurers relating to specific counsel representation ling schedule relating to CVA cases (0.40); review and a file l	

Attention to request by insurers relating to specific counsel representation (0.60); confer with Rosenblum (Jones Day) regarding schedule relating to CVA cases (0.40); review and e-file Jones Day and Alvarez & Marsal monthly fee statements and monthly operating report (0.40).

20-12345-mg Doc 2763 Filed 12/29/23 Entered 12/29/23 14:21:24 Main Document Pg 16 of 53 **JONES DAY** 131253 Page: 6 December 29, 2023 Diocese of Rockville Centre Invoice: 230910170 Timekeeper/Fee Earner Name Date of Service Hours Matter Total 13.10 **Claims Administration and Objections** 11/01/23 M K Chan 1.70 Confer with Geremia (Jones Day) regarding appeals (0.20); confer with Butler (Jones Day) regarding transcript of hearing on state court claim (0.10); review/analyze transcript of hearing (0.30); draft/revise counter-designation for sixteenth omnibus objection appeal (0.90); confer with Dorfman and Geremia (both Jones Day) regarding same (0.20).11/01/23 V Dorfman 3.10 Draft/revise brief on appeal (1.20); review/analyze materials for briefs on appeal and record designation (1.50); confer with Chan and Geremia (both Jones Day) regarding appeals (0.40). 11/01/23 T R Geremia 4.30 Prepare response to order sustaining objection on late claim, in connection with appeal by claimant. 11/02/23 A M Butler 0.80 Review and revise appeal brief on claim objections. 11/02/23 M K Chan 4.50 Draft/revise briefs on appeal from twelfth omnibus objection (3.60); confer with Geremia and Dorfman (both Jones Day) regarding same (0.30); draft/revise supplemental appendix (0.60). 11/02/23 V Dorfman 3.00 Review/analyze materials for briefs on appeal and record designation (1.60); draft/revise brief on appeal (1.10); confer with Chan and Geremia (both Jones Day) regarding appeals (0.30). 11/02/23 T R Geremia 4.50 Prepare response to appellate brief on order sustaining objection to late claim. 11/02/23 0.40 C M Gugg Confer with Ball and Cundra (both Jones Day) relating to presentation data. 11/03/23 5.30M K Chan Draft/revise briefs on appeal from twelfth omnibus objection (4.30); confer with Geremia and Dorfman (both Jones Day) regarding same (0.40); confer with Gugg (Jones Day) regarding filing (0.20); draft/revise appeals tracker (0.20); review/analyze judge's individual practice rules (0.20). 11/03/23 V Dorfman 4.50Draft/revise briefs on appeal (2.40); confer with Chan and Geremia (both Jones Day) regarding appeals (0.60); review/analyze materials for briefs on appeal and record designation (1.50). 11/03/23 T R Geremia 7.80 Draft response to appellate brief on appeal from order sustaining late claim objections. 11/03/23 C M Gugg 0.50 Confer with Geremia and Chan (both Jones Day) regarding filing of appellee briefs (0.20); review and e-file appellee briefs and appendix (0.30).

0.40

11/06/23 A M Butler Follow up with claimants' counsel regarding claim withdrawal. 20-12345-mg Doc 2763 Filed 12/29/23 Entered 12/29/23 14:21:24 Main Document Pg 17 of 53 JONES DAY 131253 Page: 7

Diocese of Rockville Centre

December 29, 2023

Invoice: 230910170

Date of Service Timekeeper/Fee Earner Name Hours 3.70 11/06/23 M K Chan Confer with Geremia and Dorfman (both Jones Day) regarding appeals (0.60); review/analyze briefing in connection with motion to dismiss (0.40); confer with Stephens, Geremia, and Dorfman (all Jones Day) regarding same (0.20); draft/revise motion to seal proofs of claim (0.30); confer with Gugg and Pizzarello (both Jones Day) regarding same (0.30); draft/revise cover letter for courtesy copies and arrange for delivery (0.40); draft/revise appeals tracker (0.30); draft/revise and file notices of appearance (0.40); draft/revise declaration in support of motion to seal proofs of claim (0.80). 11/06/23 V Dorfman 1.70 Confer with Geremia and Chan (both Jones Day) regarding appeals (0.80); review/analyze materials for appeals (0.90).11/06/23 T R Geremia 4.20 Draft letter to district court regarding coordinating schedule on objection appeals (0.80); meet with Chan and Dorfman (both Jones Day) regarding appeals (0.70); work on motion to seal POCs in connection with appeal from Franciscan Brothers objection (0.90); draft response to appellate brief on appeal from claims released by BSA plan (1.80).11/06/23 0.30 C M Gugg Attention to issues relating to motion seal documents on appeal from state court litigation. 11/06/23 B Rosenblum 0.40 Review protective order (0.10); review claims flagged for objection (0.30). 11/07/23 3.90 M K Chan Review/analyze notice of appeal from ninth omnibus objection and appellate rules (0.30); confer with Geremia and Dorfman (both Jones Day) regarding appeals (0.30); draft/revise appeals tracker (0.30); draft/revise motion to seal (0.30); confer with Pizzarello (Jones Day) regarding same (0.20); draft/revise counter-designations in connection with sixteenth omnibus objection appeals (1.50); draft/revise joint status report (0.60); review/analyze brief on appeal from eleventh omnibus objection (0.40). 11/07/23 V Dorfman 1.10 Confer with Geremia and Chan (both Jones Day) regarding appeals (0.40); review/analyze materials for appeals (0.70).11/07/23 T R Geremia 2.80Address record designations for appeal from order sustaining objections (0.50); draft letter to court regarding coordinated briefing schedule on appeal (0.40); attention to sealing POCs in connection with appeal (0.40); draft response to appeal from order sustaining objection to claims released by BSA plan (1.50). 11/07/23 C M Gugg 0.40 Review and e-file appellee counter-designations. 11/08/23 M K Chan 7.00 Confer with Geremia, Stephens, and Butler (all Jones Day) regarding motion to quash (0.60); confer with Dorfman (Jones Day) regarding motion to dismiss (0.30); draft/revise appeals tracker (0.20); draft/revise counter-designation (0.20); confer with Gugg (Jones Day) regarding same (0.10); draft/revise brief on appeal from eleventh omnibus objection (5.60).

11/08/23 V Dorfman 1.50 Confer with Geremia and Chan (both Jones Day) regarding briefing (0.40); review/analyze materials regarding to appeals and briefing (1.10). 20-12345-mg Doc 2763 Filed 12/29/23 Entered 12/29/23 14:21:24 Main Document Pg 18 of 53 **JONES DAY** 131253 Page: 8 December 29, 2023 Diocese of Rockville Centre Invoice: 230910170 Date of Service Timekeeper/Fee Earner Name Hours 11/08/23 T R Geremia 2.40Draft response to appellate brief on appeal from order sustaining objection to claims released by BSA plan. 11/08/23 C M Gugg 0.20 Review and e-file appellee counter-designations. 11/09/23 0.70 M K Chan Draft/revise counter-designations for sixteenth omnibus objection appeals (0.20); confer with Gugg (Jones Day) regarding same (0.10); review/analyze reply in opposition to twelfth omnibus objection appeal (0.30); confer with Geremia and Dorfman (both Jones Day) regarding same (0.10). 11/09/23 V Dorfman 1.80 Confer with Geremia and Chan (both Jones Day) regarding appeals (0.20); review/analyze materials on appeals and releases (1.60). 11/09/23 3.70 T R Geremia Work on response to appeal from order sustaining objection to claims released by BSA plan. 11/09/23 0.30 C M Gugg Review and e-file counter designations with respect to Herman and Slater claimants appeal of sixteenth omnibus objection order. 11/09/23 0.30 B Rosenblum Analyze arguments on claim objection appeal. 11/10/23 M K Chan 6.10 Draft/revise motion for violation of protective order and mediation order (5.30); draft/revise motion to dismiss (0.80).11/10/23 3.10 T R Geremia Draft brief in response to appeal from order sustaining objection to claims released by BSA plan. 11/11/23 M K Chan 0.20 Confer with Geremia (Jones Day) regarding joint status report for twelfth omnibus objection appeal. 11/13/23 A M Butler 0.80 Review claim confidentiality agreements and related issues. 11/13/23 M K Chan 5.00Confer with Geremia and Dorfman (both Jones Day) regarding motion to dismiss (0.40); draft/revise motion (1.80); review/analyze briefing on notice issue (0.70); draft/revise motion to dismiss (2.10). 11/13/23 V Dorfman 2.70 Review/analyze materials relating to appeals and briefing (1.50); confer with Geremia and Chan (both Jones Day) regarding appeals and briefing (0.50); draft/revise motion (0.70). 11/13/23 T R Geremia 5.60 Meet with Dorfman and Chan (both Jones Day) regarding appeals from orders sustaining objections to claims (0.50); draft debtor's brief on appeal from order sustaining objection to claims released by BSA plan (5.10). 11/13/23 B Rosenblum

Comment on claim objection appeals.

0.40

20-12345-ma Doc 2763 Filed 12/29/23 Entered 12/29/23 14:21:24 Main Document Pg 19 of 53 **JONES DAY** 131253 Page: 9 December 29, 2023 Diocese of Rockville Centre Invoice: 230910170 Date of Service Timekeeper/Fee Earner Name Hours 11/14/23 C Ball 1.00 Review McMahon (parish counsel) response to Merson on appeal (0.20); communications with Rosenblum and Geremia (both Jones Day) regarding Slater attempt to stay appeals (0.60); review Herman (law firm) communications regarding appeals going forward (0.20). 11/14/23 4.10 M K Chan Confer with Geremia (Jones Day) regarding joint status report for twelfth omnibus objection appeal (0.20); communicate with counsel regarding joint status report (0.10); confer with Pizzarello (Jones Day) regarding filing (0.10); review/analyze filings to Second Circuit appeal (0.20); draft/revise appeals tracker (0.20); review/analyze letters regarding Arrowood stay and claims subject to Arrowood policies (0.40); confer with Geremia, Zepf, and Quaranta (all Jones Day) regarding same (0.20); research case law regarding notice issue (1.00); draft/revise motion to dismiss (1.70). 0.90 11/14/23 V Dorfman Review/analyze material relating to appeals. 11/14/23 1.50 C J Farley Draft memo regarding claim objection appeal. 11/14/23 B Rosenblum 0.50 Comment on BSA claim objection appellate briefing. 11/15/23 1.30 A M Butler Segregate and send POCs to defense counsel (0.50); review and revise appeal brief (0.80)11/15/23 M K Chan 4.50 Research case law in connection with appeal from eleventh omnibus objection (1.80); draft/revise and file brief on appeal from eleventh omnibus objection (2.30); confer with Geremia (Jones Day) regarding same (0.40). 11/15/23 0.90 V Dorfman Review/analyze materials on appeal. 0.90 11/15/23 C J Farley Draft memo regarding claim objection appeal. 11/15/23 T R Geremia 4.90 Draft and finalize brief on appeal from order sustaining objection to claims released by BSA plan. 11/15/23 **B** Rosenblum 0.40Review appellate filings concerning claim objections (0.30); confer with Geremia (Jones Day) regarding same (0.10).11/16/23 M K Chan 6.30 Research case law in connection with letter regarding stay (2.10); review/analyze claims tracking spreadsheet (0.40); confer with Geremia (Jones Day) regarding same (0.20); draft/revise motion to dismiss for state court litigation (3.60).11/16/23 2.70 V Dorfman Review/analyze materials relating to appeal (2.10); confer with Geremia and Chan (both Jones Day) regarding appeals (0.60). 11/16/23 T R Geremia 3.80 Draft letter to district court in connection with appeal from order sustaining debtor's sixteenth omnibus objection

to claims, addressing coordinated briefing and attempts by several claimants to impose a stay on the appellate

20-12345-mg Doc 2763 Filed 12/29/23 Entered 12/29/23 14:21:24 Main Document Pg 20 of 53 **JONES DAY** 131253 Page: 10 December 29, 2023 Diocese of Rockville Centre Invoice: 230910170 Timekeeper/Fee Earner Name Date of Service Hours process. 11/16/23 B Rosenblum 0.50 Review revised letter to district court (0.30); confer with Geremia (Jones Day) regarding same (0.10); confer with Ball (Jones Day) regarding same (0.10). 11/17/23 M K Chan 2.90 Confer with Rosenblum (Jones Day) regarding appeals tracker (0.10); confer with Geremia (Jones Day) regarding motion to dismiss in state court litigation (0.20); draft/revise counter-designation to sixteenth omnibus objection appeal (Anderson) (0.30); review/analyze response to letter regarding consolidation (0.20); draft/revise motion to dismiss in state court litigation (2.10). 11/17/23 V Dorfman 0.40 Review/analyze court filings relating to appeals. 11/17/23 6.70 C J Farley Review and revise solicitation procedures notices. 11/17/23 T R Geremia 0.30 Review letter from claimants' counsel requesting stay of appellate process in connection with claim objections. B Rosenblum 11/17/23 0.30 Review analysis of disallowed claims on appeal. 11/20/23 3.50 M K Chan Draft/revise motion to dismiss in state court litigation (2.70); confer with Geremia and Dorfman (both Jones Day) regarding appeals (0.60); confer with Geremia and Ball (both Jones Day) regarding consolidated briefing schedule (0.20).11/20/23 2.10 V Dorfman Review/analyze materials for appeals (1.40); confer with Geremia and Chan (both Jones Day) regarding appeals (0.70).0.80 11/20/23 T R Geremia Review counter-designations for appeal from order sustaining sixteenth omnibus claim objections (0.50); review order from Judge Oetken regarding scheduling and other matters (0.30). 11/21/23 1.50 M K Chan Confer with Geremia (Jones Day) regarding appeals (0.10); draft/revise motion to dismiss in state court litigation (1.10); draft/revise counter-designation for sixteenth omnibus objection (Anderson) (0.20); confer with Gugg and Geremia (both Jones Day) regarding same (0.10). 11/21/23 V Dorfman 1.80 Confer with Geremia and Chan (both Jones Day) regarding appeals and notice issues (0.30); review/analyze court order and materials related to appeal and notice (1.20); draft/revise analysis of notice (0.30). 11/21/23 C M Gugg 0.20 Review and e-file counter designations relating to Anderson claimants' appeal of sixteenth omnibus claim objection. 11/22/23 M K Chan 0.20 Confer with Geremia and Dorfman (both Jones Day) regarding motion to dismiss in state court litigation.

20-12345-mg Doc 2763 Filed 12/29/23 Entered 12/29/23 14:21:24 Main Document Pg 21 of 53 JONES DAY

	JUNES DAY	
131253	e of Rockville Centre	Page: 11 December 29, 2023 Invoice: 230910170
Dioces	e of Kockville Centre	111voice: 230910170
Date of	Service Timekeeper/Fee Earner Name	Hours
11/22/2	V Dorfman Review/analyze notice issues and briefing (0.90); confer with Chan and Geremia (b briefing (0.30).	1.20 both Jones Day) regarding notice
11/27/2	M K Chan Confer with Geremia and Dorfman (both Jones Day) regarding appeals and motion appeals tracker (0.20); research case law on due process and notice in connection w court litigation (2.30); confer with Geremia, Dorfman, Stephens, and Zepf (all Jone draft/revise proposed order on motion to dismiss (0.60).	rith motion to dismiss in state
11/27/2	V Dorfman Confer with Geremia and Chan (both Jones Day) regarding appeals and notice issu materials relating to appeals and notice (1.80); draft/revise briefing relating to notic	
11/27/2	23 T R Geremia Meet with Dorfman and Chan (both Jones Day) regarding status of appeals from o	1.00 bjection orders.
11/28/2	V Dorfman Confer with Geremia and Chan (both Jones Day) regarding appeals and notice issu materials relating to appeals and notice (2.30); draft/revise briefing relating to notic	
11/29/2	V Dorfman Review/analyze materials relating to appeals, notice briefing and releases (2.30); con (both Jones Day) regarding appeals and notice issues (0.50).	2.80 nfer with Geremia and Chan
11/30/2	M K Chan Confer with Geremia and Dorfman (both Jones Day) regarding mass torts cases (0 connection with Anderson response to order to show cause (0.80); draft/revise res (1.30).	
11/30/2	V Dorfman Confer with Geremia, Rosenblum, Stephenson, Butler and Chan (all Jones Day) reg (1.30); review/analyze materials relating to appeals, test cases and releases (2.40).	3.70 garding appeals and test cases
11/30/2	23 T R Geremia Review response from Anderson firm on district court's order to show cause why a should not be dismissed for failure to comply with rules-based deadlines.	0.50 appeals from objection orders
11/30/2	A R Tawil Draft motion to amend the bar date order.	3.80
	Matter Total	182.30
Court H	Iearings	
11/01/2	C Ball Attend hearing (1.20); prepare for same (1.10).	2.30
11/01/2	A M Butler Prepare for hearing (2.00); attend hearing (2.10).	4.10
44 104 14		2.00

11/01/23 B Rosenblum 2.80 Prepare for hearing (1.30); appear for omnibus hearing (1.00); confer with Ball and Butler (both Jones Day) 20-12345-mg Doc 2763 Filed 12/29/23 Entered 12/29/23 14:21:24 Main Document Pg 22 of 53

	JONES DAY	
131253	·	Page: 12 December 29, 2023
Diocese of Rockville	e Centre	Invoice: 230910170
Date of Service	Timekeeper/Fee Earner Name	Hours
regarding same	e (0.50).	
11/02/23 Prepare and ap	E P Stephens opear for NYC regional part court conference.	1.00
11/15/23 Respond to inc	B Rosenblum quiry from court regarding hearing schedule.	0.10
11/20/23 Communicate	B Rosenblum regarding scheduling court hearing.	0.20
11/27/23 Communicatio	B Rosenblum ons regarding omnibus hearing.	0.10
	E P Stephens e with Ball, Geremia, and Butler (all Jones Day) regarding No ovember 28 court hearing (3.20).	3.90 ovember 28 court conference (0.70);
11/28/23 Attend hearing hearing (1.20).	C Ball $g(1.10)$; prepare for same (1.90); communications with Renke	4.20 er and Fasano (both DRVC) regarding
11/28/23 Prepare for co	A M Butler urt hearing (1.00); attend court hearing (3.00).	4.00
11/28/23 Attend bankru	T R Geremia ptcy court conference (2.30); meet with client to de-brief after	3.30 er conference (1.00).
	B Rosenblum mibus hearing (2.80); communicate with Ball, Butler (both Jo ing hearing (1.20).	4.00 ones Day), Fasano and Renker (both
11/28/23 Prepare and ap	E P Stephens opear for November 28 bankruptcy court conference.	3.00
11/29/23 Communicate regarding hear	B Rosenblum with Slome (parish counsel) regarding hearing (0.30) ; commuting (0.20) .	0.50 unicate with Heuer (parish counsel)
Matter To	tal	33.50
Fee/Employment Ap	plications	
11/02/23 Review next st	A M Butler eps on fee applications.	0.50
11/06/23 Review and rev	A M Butler vise monthly fee statement.	0.30
11/06/23 Draft interim f	C M Gugg	4.80

/06/23 C M Gugg Draft interim fee application.

20-12345-mg Doc 2763 Filed 12/29/23 Entered 12/29/23 14:21:24 Main Document Pg 23 of 53 JONES DAY

	JUNES DAT	
131253 Diocese of Rockville	Page: 13 December 29, 2023 Invoice: 230910170	
	111,0100, 200, 101,0	
Date of Service	Timekeeper/Fee Earner Name	Hours
11/06/23 Review and rev	A R Tawil rise interim fee application.	1.20
11/07/23 Complete draft	C M Gugg of interim fee application.	0.70
11/07/23 Review and rev	A R Tawil rise ninth interim fee application.	1.00
11/08/23 Review and rev	A R Tawil rise interim fee application.	0.20
11/09/23 Review interim	A M Butler fee application.	0.50
11/09/23 Incorporate rev	C M Gugg visions to ninth interim fee application.	0.40
11/09/23 Review and rev	A R Tawil rise interim fee application.	0.30
11/13/23 Finalize and pr	A M Butler epare to file interim fee applications.	0.50
11/13/23 Prepare and e-t	C M Gugg file Jones Day and Alvarez & Marsal interim fee applications.	0.40
11/15/23 Review and rev	A R Tawil rise monthly fee statement.	3.50
11/17/23 Prepare certific	A R Tawil ate of no objection for monthly fee statement.	0.60
11/18/23 Review next sta	A M Butler eps on monthly fee statements and interim fee application notices.	0.50
11/20/23 Review and e-f	C M Gugg ile certificate of no objection to fee statements.	0.20
11/22/23 Review and e-f	C M Gugg ile notice of hearing in interim fee applications.	0.20
11/29/23 Review and rev	A M Butler rise monthly fee statement.	1.50
11/29/23 Draft monthly	C M Gugg fee application.	1.50
11/29/23 Attend to emai	A R Tawil l regarding monthly fee statement.	0.20

11/30/23 A M Butler 1.50 Review and revise monthly fee statement.

20-12345-mg Doc 2763 Filed 12/29/23 Entered 12/29/23 14:21:24 Main Document Pg 24 of 53 IONES DAY

JONES DAY						
131253	·	Page: 14 December 29, 2023				
Diocese of Rock	Invoice: 230910170					
Date of Service	Timekeeper/Fee Earner Name	Hours				
11/30/23 Incorpora	C M Gugg ate edits to monthly fee application.	0.60				
11/30/23 Review m	B Rosenblum nonthly fee statement.	0.60				
11/30/23 Review as	A R Tawil nd analyze interim fee applications.	0.50				
Matter Total		22.20				
Financing and Ca	ash Collateral					
11/09/23 Commun	C Ball ications with Morin (Jones Day) and Jefferies regardin	0.20 ng Spectrum and TMO.				
	N J Morin nd revise engagement letter for potential ratings agence ay) with comments (0.30).	2.50 ey (2.20); circulate same to White (Jefferies) and Ball				
	N J Morin icate with Dey (Jefferies) regarding potential ratings a ratings agency (0.20); follow up with Moore (Alvarez					
	N J Morin gagement letter regarding potential ratings agency (0.2 same (0.10).	0.30 20); follow up with Ciriello (Alvarez & Marsal)				
11/21/23 Commun	N J Morin icate with client regarding potential ratings agency en	0.30 gagement letter.				
11/22/23 Confer w	C Ball ith Morin (Jones Day) regarding terms of Spectrum fi	0.40 nancing.				
11/22/23 Confer w	N J Morin ith Ball (Jones Day) regarding potential financing.	0.20				
	N J Morin icate with Moore and Ciriello (both Alvarez & Marsal ratings agency.	0.20) relating to engagement letter markup from				
11/28/23 Review p	N J Morin otential ratings agency engagement letter and recircula	1.60 te same to client.				
	D C Villalba otential ratings agency engagement letter (0.30); confe ratings agency (0.10).	0.40 er with Morin (Jones Day) regarding motion to retain				
	N J Morin icate with client and Cane (Jefferies) on potential ratio & Marsal) regarding same (0.10).	0.30 ngs agency (0.20); communicate with Ciriello				

20-12345-mg Doc 2763 Filed 12/29/23 Entered 12/29/23 14:21:24 Main Document Pg 25 of 53 JONES DAY

JONES DAY					
131253	Page: 15 December 29, 2023				
Diocese of Rockville Centre		Invoice: 230910170			
Date of Service	Timekeeper/Fee Earner Name	Hours			
11/29/23 D C Villalba Draft motion to approve retention of ratings agent (2.50); revise same (1.70).		4.20			
11/30/23 Review and	N J Morin I revise retention materials for potential ratings agent and circulate	1.30 same to client.			
Matter Total		12.50			
Litigation and Adv	ersary Proceedings				
call (0.20); f	C Ball ations with Reed Smith and Jones Day regarding next steps (0.90); follow up with Rosenblum and Butler (both Jones Day) regarding regarding for ad Stephens (both Jones Day) regarding judge's litigation inquiry (0	next steps (0.50); confer with			
	M K Chan ate with counsel regarding access to documents for production (0.2 roduction tracker (0.10); draft/revise privilege log and send to cou				
	C Cundra n Ball (Jones Day) regarding contact information for state court contact information with eligible claims and CVA lawsuits (2.00); em.				
11/01/23 Confer with	C M Gugg n Ball (Jones Day) relating state court counsel list.	0.20			
11/01/23	S M Peterson	0.80			
Prepare fou	ar production volumes to include updating the master production t	racker.			
	E P Stephens erence talking points (0.60); attention to state court filings (1.20); at 0.80); attention to insurance contingency (0.20).	2.80 tention to state court discovery			
11/01/23 Revise state	C Zepf e court discovery tracker (0.50); organize discovery files (0.20).	0.70			
11/02/23 Revise lette	C Ball r to state court counsel.	0.30			
11/02/23 Review and	A M Butler revise Seminary sale settlement documentation (0.50); review next	1.20 t steps on litigation funding (0.70).			
11/02/23 Calls with C review same	C Cundra Gugg (Jones Day) regarding claims data annotations for state court e (0.20).	0.60 counsel contact information (0.40);			
11/02/23 Confer with	T R Geremia n Rosenblum and Butler (both Jones Day) regarding state court litig	0.60 gation.			
11/02/23 Draft letter	J T Hoyt response in opposition to remand.	0.90			

20-12345-mg Doc 2763 Filed 12/29/23 Entered 12/29/23 14:21:24 Main Document Pg 26 of 53 **JONES DAY** 131253 Page: 16 December 29, 2023 Diocese of Rockville Centre Invoice: 230910170 Date of Service Timekeeper/Fee Earner Name Hours 1.70 11/02/23 W P Quaranta Draft letter to Judge Steinman regarding state court cases where Jones Day represents a debtor as defendant (1.30); review draft response in removed case (0.40). 11/02/23 **E** P Stephens 6.00 State court discovery follow up. 5.90 11/02/23 C Zepf Review plaintiff's discovery responses in state court case (2.30); revise state court discovery tracker (0.20); draft outline of issues and facts with respect to plaintiff's discovery responses for Stephens and Geremia (both Jones Day) in state court case (2.30); draft/revise letter to health and school providers to obtain plaintiff's records, as authorized (1.10). 11/03/23 C Ball 2.80Parish counsel call (0.80); follow up with Rosenblum (Jones Day) regarding next steps (0.30); communications with Moore and Ciriello (both Alvarez & Marsal) regarding assets in dismissal and next steps (0.70); communications with Steinberg (Meltzer Lippe) (0.40); discuss CHS release of DRVC with Butler (Jones Day) (0.30); communicate with Stephens (Jones Day), Fasano (DRVC) regarding Steinman letter on schedule (0.30). 11/03/23 A M Butler 0.80 Draft bankruptcy update for state court counsel (Davey) (0.40); review and comment on Seminary settlement documentation (0.40). 0.50 11/03/23 J T Hoyt Review 157(b)(5) proceedings and draft update to team on status of motion to fix venue. 0.90 11/03/23 E M Joyce Review referenced articles/filings regarding other diocesan bankruptcy proceedings/insurance claims. 11/03/23 W P Quaranta 2.00 Communicate with external counsel about upcoming EDNY deadlines (0.40); communicate with internal team about EDNY filings (0.80); update internal tracker of removed cases (0.30); draft updated list of remanded cases for Judge Steinman (0.40); confer with Chan (Jones Day) about state court document productions (0.10). 11/03/23 **E** P Stephens 3.50 Attention to state court discovery follow up (2.40); attention to remanded cases (1.10). 11/03/23 2.30C Zepf Draft separate letters to each medical and education provider to obtain authorized records (1.60); compile letters seeking medical and school authorizations from plaintiff in state court litigation for mailing (0.70). 11/04/23 W P Quaranta 0.20 Communicate with external counsel about upcoming filing deadlines in EDNY cases. 11/06/23 C Ball 2.40Confer with Geremia (Jones Day) regarding failure to prosecute appeals and consolidated briefing (0.70); confer with Butler (Jones Day) regarding Ecclesia and next steps (0.30); confer with Sidman (Jones Day) regarding ESG and paying victims (0.50); draft and transmit response to CemCo counsel (0.30); follow up with Ciriello (Alvarez & Marsal), Renker and Fasano (both DRVC) regarding same (0.60). 11/06/23 **E** P Stephens 1.30 Attention to state court discovery follow up (0.80); teleconference with Geremia (Jones Day) regarding state court

discovery (0.20); teleconference with Adams (parish counsel) regarding state court discovery (0.30).

20-12345-mg Doc 2763 Filed 12/29/23 Entered 12/29/23 14:21:24 Main Document Pg 27 of 53 **JONES DAY** 131253 Page: 17 December 29, 2023 Diocese of Rockville Centre Invoice: 230910170 Date of Service Timekeeper/Fee Earner Name Hours 1.00 11/06/23 C Zepf Manage UPS notifications regarding letters seeking records sent in state court litigation to ensure each was properly delivered (0.20); draft letter to plaintiff in state court litigation concerning the deficiencies in their discovery responses (0.60); take call from medical facility from whom plaintiff medical records were sought in state court litigation (0.20). 11/07/23 3.50 C Ball Confer with Butler (Jones Day) regarding open items on plan, CemCo, and other tasks (0.60); confer with Stephens and Geremia (both Jones Day) regarding Pfau subpoena and next steps (0.90); communications with Giordano (defense counsel) regarding Chaminade (0.40); follow up with Fasano and Renker (both DRVC) regarding same (0.30); communications with Ciriello (Alvarez & Marsal), Renker and Father Fasano (both DRVC) regarding CemCo need for diligence (1.30). 11/07/23 A M Butler 0.50 Review status of state court litigation disclosure issues. 11/07/23 M K Chan 0.90 Confer with Stephens, Geremia, Zepf, and Quaranta (all Jones Day) regarding state court discovery. 11/07/23 T R Geremia 1.10 Meet with Stephens, Chan, Quaranta, Orujlu, and Zepf (all Jones Day) regarding state court litigation. 11/07/23 1.20 C M Gugg Draft schedule relating to school co-defendants. 11/07/23 0.90 E M Joyce Review articles/filings regarding other diocesan bankruptcy proceedings/insurance claims. 11/07/23 N Oruilu 4.00 Confer with Geremia, Stephens, Chan, Quaranta, and Zepf (all Jones Day) regarding tasks in connection with discovery in state court litigation (0.90); research legal standards in bankruptcy courts regarding violation of mediation/protective orders (3.10). 11/07/23 1.30 W P Quaranta Meet with internal team to discuss state court discovery (0.70); review internal communications and research about state court discovery (0.50); update internal tracker of removed cases and relevant filings (0.10). 11/07/23 0.30B Rosenblum Confer with Stephens (Jones Day) regarding protective order (0.10); confer with Geremia and Stephens (both Jones Day) regarding state court counsel potential violations of same (0.20). 11/07/23 A Sadanandan 4.90 Review subpoena, court's PO and Confidentiality Agreement, and background materials (1.50); research New York caselaw on moving to quash a subpoena (3.10); draft email memo on motion to quash subpoena under New York law (0.30). 11/07/23 5.30 **E** P Stephens Attention to state court discovery (4.50); meeting with Geremia, Chan, Orujlu, Quaranta, and Zepf (all Jones Day) regarding state court discovery and next steps (0.80). 11/07/23 C Zepf 8.30 Confer with Stephens (Jones Day) regarding letters to obtain records in state court litigation (0.30); meet with Geremia and Stephens (both Jones Day) regarding state court discovery matters (0.90); research on discovery issues

in NY state courts, in connection with a letter to plaintiffs outlining discovery response deficiencies in state court

20-12345-mg

Doc 2763 Filed 12/29/23 Entered 12/29/23 14:21:24 Main Document Pg 28 of 53 **JONES DAY**

131253

Diocese of Rockville Centre

Date of Service

Timekeeper/Fee Earner Name

litigation (1.60); draft/revise letter to plaintiff regarding discovery response deficiencies (5.30); call educational provider regarding authorized records pertaining to plaintiff in state court litigation (0.20).

- 11/08/23 C Ball 4.20 Attend UCC check in (0.20); follow up with Butler (Jones Day) regarding developments with UCC (0.20); review liquidation order and other Arrowood developments (0.40); communications with Renker (DRVC) and Stephens (Jones Day) regarding Arrowood liquidation impact (1.30); communications with Ciriello (Alvarez & Marsal) regarding parish financials and categorization of liabilities for related plan issues (0.40); outreach to Giordano (defense counsel) regarding settlement proposals (0.70); communications with Renker (DRVC) regarding same (0.30); confer with Stephens (Jones Day) regarding Pfau subpoena (0.70).
- 11/08/23 1.50 T R Geremia Meet with Chan, Butler, and Stephens (all Jones Day) regarding claimants' counsel breach of protective / mediation order and next steps (0.70); attention to state court litigation (0.80).
- 11/08/23 1.30 C M Gugg Revise schedule relating to school co-defendants (0.50); begin draft of schedule relating to remanded CVAs and Arrowood insurance (0.80).
- 11/08/23 A Sadanandan 6.00 Draft email memo about New York caselaw on quashing subpoenas (0.50); research New York caselaw on quashing subpoenas (5.50).

11/08/23 **E** P Stephens Attention to draft motion regarding protective order violation (2.40); teleconference with Geremia, Butler, and Chan (all Jones Day) regarding potential motion (0.70); draft UCC letter regarding protective order breaches (0.90); attention to state court discovery next steps (0.30); attention to Arrowood insolvency and next steps (1.30); attention to state court litigation (1.30).

11/08/23 1.20 C Zepf Communicate with authorized education providers regarding plaintiff's records in state court litigation (0.30); manage records received from plaintiff's authorized medical and education providers in state court litigation (0.30); review plaintiff's education records in state court litigation (0.30); confer with Stephens (Jones Day) regarding plaintiff's authorized records in state court litigation (0.30).

11/09/23 C Ball Confer with Geremia and Stephens (both Jones Day) regarding Pfau and UCC breach of protective order and mediation order (0.60); communications with Renker (DRVC) regarding legal fees (0.30); communicate with Chapin (DRVC), Butler (Jones Day) and Ciriello (Alvarez & Marsal) regarding insurance topics (0.70); communications regarding Arrowood Liquidation (0.30); communicate with Renker and Chapin (both DRVC), Law and Kramer (both Reed Smith) (0.70).

11/09/23 T R Geremia 1.70 Conference with counsel for parishes (0.60); draft letter to committee (0.40); draft letter to claimants' counsel regarding breach of mediation / protective orders (0.70).

11/09/23 C M Gugg Continued preparation of schedule relating to Arrowood and remanded cases.

- 11/09/23 0.80 E M Joyce Review articles/filings regarding other diocesan bankruptcy proceedings and Arrowood liquidation filing.
- 11/09/23 0.20 W P Quaranta Confer with Stephens (Jones Day) (0.10); review messages with external counsel about remanded cases (0.10).

Page: 18 December 29, 2023 Invoice: 230910170

Hours

6.90

2.60

5.10

20-12345-ma

131253

Doc 2763 Filed 12/29/23 Entered 12/29/23 14:21:24 Main Document Pg 29 of 53 **JONES DAY**

Page: 19

December 29, 2023

Diocese of Rockville Centre Invoice: 230910170 Date of Service Timekeeper/Fee Earner Name Hours 11/09/23 B Rosenblum 0.60 Communicate with Law (Reed Smith) and Geremia (Jones Day) regarding Arrowood liquidation. 11/09/23 A Sadanandan 3.90 Draft email memo about New York caselaw on quashing subpoenas (0.30); review draft letters to opposing counsel (1.00); research New York caselaw on quashing subpoenas (2.60). 11/09/23 **E** P Stephens 6.00 Attention to state court discovery (2.40); revise draft protective order breach letters (2.30); teleconference with Geremia (Jones Day), Davey, and Adams (both parish counsel) regarding state court discovery and conference (0.60); teleconference with Ball, Rosenblum, Geremia, Butler (all Jones Day), Law, and Berringer (both Reed Smith) regarding Arrowood next steps (0.70). 11/10/23 5.90 C Ball Communications with Father Fasano and Renker (both DRVC) regarding Chaminade and Giordano (defense counsel) (0.40); review Giordano (defense counsel) regarding Chaminade (0.20); communications with Kramer, Law (both Reed Smith) regarding Arrowood and Liquidator actions (0.60); confer with Cundra (Jones Day) regarding state court council (0.30); draft state court counsel letter (0.50); confer with Geremia (Jones Day) regarding outreach (0.60); attend parish counsel call (0.70); communications with Fasano and Renker (both DRVC) regarding Chaminade and Giordano (defense counsel) (0.40); review Giordano (defense counsel)) regarding Chaminade (0.20); communications with Law and Kramer (both Reed Smith) (Reed Smith) regarding Arrowood and Liquidator actions (0.60); confer with Cundra (Jones Day) regarding state court council (0.30); draft state court counsel letter (0.50); confer with Geremia (Jones Day) regarding outreach to state court counsel (0.60). 11/10/23 T R Geremia 1.80 Review order in connection with liquidation of Arrowood and plan for next steps (0.60); draft letter to court regarding state court litigation and review other correspondence in connection with it (1.20). 11/10/23 C M Gugg 5.10 Continued preparation of schedule relating to Arrowood and remanded cases. 11/10/23 B Rosenblum 4.80 Draft response to test case motion (1.80); analyze CVA cases (3.00) 11/10/23**E** P Stephens 4.20 Attention to state court filings (3.40); attention to draft of Judge Steinman pre-conference letter (0.80). 11/10/23 0.80 C Zepf Confer with Stephens (Jones Day) and docketing regarding state court litigation filing. 11/11/23 W P Quaranta 0.10 Review communications about Arrowood liquidation proceedings. 11/13/23 C Ball 3.40 Communications with Renker and Father Fasano (both Diocese) regarding CemCo (0.40); communications with Ciriello (Alvarez & Marsal) and Steinberg (Meltzer Lippe) regarding CemCo (0.60); follow up with Chapin (DRVC) and Ciriello (Alvarez & Marsal) regarding same (0.20); confer with Cundra (Jones Day) regarding Arrowood cases and eligible PoCs and CVA cases (1.60); review and revise communications with state court counsel (0.60). 11/13/23 A M Butler 0.50

Review status of state court litigation issues.

20-12345-mg Doc 2763 Filed 12/29/23 Entered 12/29/23 14:21:24 Main Document Pg 30 of 53

131253

JONES DAY

Page: 20

December 29, 2023 Diocese of Rockville Centre Invoice: 230910170 Date of Service Timekeeper/Fee Earner Name Hours 1.80 11/13/23 T R Geremia Meet with Judge regarding breach of protective / mediation order (1.00); meet with plaintiffs' counsel regarding state court litigation, pursuant to state court directive (0.80). 11/13/23 5.70 C M Gugg Confer with Ball, Rosenblum, Butler and Cundra (all Jones Day) regarding remanded case list (0.40); prepare schedule in response to request by co-defendants (0.70); and begin schedule relating to 157(b)(5) motion cases, insurance and proofs of claim data (4.60). 11/13/23 E M Joyce 1.10 Review articles/filings regarding other diocesan bankruptcy proceedings/insurance claims and Arrowood liquidation. 11/13/23 N Oruilu 3.20 Review/analyze state court dockets to update the court regarding status of cases. 11/13/23 W P Ouaranta 6.80 Prepare chart of specified cases as requested by Judge Steinman in preparation for November 14 judicial conference (4.50); prepare chart of remanded cases for Stephens (Jones Day) (1.10); review upcoming deadlines for cases referred back to bankruptcy court (0.40); confer with Stephens and Geremia (both Jones Day) (0.40); review communications from external counsel and Judge Steinman (0.40). 11/13/23 0.80 B Rosenblum Revise remand and status analysis (0.70); confer with Stephens (Jones Day) regarding CVA matters (0.10). E P Stephens 5.80 11/13/23 Attention to state court discovery (3.40); attention to November 14 conference preparation (1.00); meet and confer with Geremia (Jones Day), Davey, Adams, Nador, Stoneking, Mones, Moran, and Alter (parish counsel and plaintiff counsel) regarding November 14 conference (0.40); meet and confer with Geremia (Jones Day), Amala, and Nappo (both Pfau) regarding protective order breach (1.00). 11/13/23 C Zepf 1.90 Draft chart of Judge Steinman cases and disposition in discovery. 11/14/23 C Ball 6.30 Follow up with Giordano (defense counsel for co-defendants) regarding Chaminade (0.60); communications with Stephens and Geremia (both Jones Day) regarding state court conference with Steinman (1.10); finalize and transmit letters to state court counsel (3.00); communications with Judge Steinman regarding next steps and actuarial analysis (0.90); communications with Ciriello (Alvarez & Marsal) regarding Spectrum and CemCo interest rate issues (0.30); review outreach to Judge Steinman (0.20); communications with Judge Steinman regarding Stang (Pachulski) (0.20). 11/14/23 T R Geremia 3.60 Conference with state court judge (2.00); meet with Jones Day team afterwards to de-brief (1.00); draft letter to state court in response to issues raised in state court conference (0.20); attention to response to order from Delaware Chancery Court imposing stay on Arrowood-covered litigation (0.40). 11/14/23 E M Joyce 1.00Review articles/filings regarding Arrowood liquidation and other diocesan bankruptcy proceedings/insurance claims.

11/14/23 N Orujlu 0.60 Confer with Geremia, Stephens, Zepf, and Quaranta (all Jones Day) regarding next steps in state court actions in light of November 14 conference (0.40); draft/revise email to opposing counsel regarding postponing Plaintiff's 20-12345-mg Doc 2763 Filed 12/29/23 Entered 12/29/23 14:21:24 Main Document Pg 31 of 53 JONES DAY

Page: 21

131253

December 29, 2023 Diocese of Rockville Centre Invoice: 230910170 Date of Service Timekeeper/Fee Earner Name Hours deposition in state court litigation (0.20). 11/14/23 W P Quaranta 0.90 Discuss judicial conference with Stephens and Geremia (both Jones Day) (0.50); communicate with opposing counsel about cancellation of upcoming deposition (0.40). 11/14/23 0.70 B Rosenblum Participate in meeting regarding CVA litigation status (0.50); review correspondence regarding same (0.20). 11/14/23 C L Smith 0.30 Review motion to extend time to remove actions in connection with filing same (0.10); prepare same for filing (0.10); e-file same and forward as-filed motion to Butler (Jones Day) (0.10). 11/14/23 7.80 E P Stephens Prepare for state court teleconference (0.50); attend virtual conference before Judge Steinman (1.50); teleconference with Geremia (Jones Day) and Adams (parish counsel) regarding conference debrief (0.50); teleconference with Ball, Rosenblum, Geremia, and Butler (all Jones Day) regarding current status and next steps (1.00); attention to state court litigation planning (4.30). 11/14/23 C Zepf 1.80 Correspond with plaintiffs' counsel in state court litigation regarding deposition scheduling (0.20); confer with Stephens and Geremia (both Jones Day) regarding state court discovery matters (0.40); draft correspondence with Renker (DRVC) regarding authorized plaintiff's education records in state court litigation (0.40); confer with Stephens (Jones Day) regarding discovery matters in state court litigation (0.30); draft/revise letter to plaintiff's counsel regarding discovery response deficiencies in state court litigation (0.50). 0.60 11/15/23 C Ball Review Stephens (Jones Day) drafts of letters (0.30); confer with Stephens (Jones Day) regarding same (0.30). 0.40 11/15/23 T R Geremia Draft letter regarding breach of protective and mediation order. 11/15/23 2.10 C M Gugg Complete schedule relating to 157(b)(5) motion cases, insurance and proof of claim data. 11/15/23 E M Jovce 1.20 Review articles/filings regarding other diocesan bankruptcy proceedings/insurance claims and Arrowood liquidation proceedings. 11/15/23 1.30 N Oruilu Review/analyze Jones Day letter to Judge Glenn requesting a conference in preparation for researching parties' positions on state court discovery in their Preliminary Injunction motion papers (0.20); research all of the parties' positions on state court discovery in their Preliminary Injunction motion papers in connection with conference requested with Judge Glenn (1.10). 11/15/23 W P Quaranta 1.30 Update chart for Judge Steinman of requested information for remanded cases. 4.60 11/15/23 **E** P Stephens

Attention to state court discovery issues (1.50); communicate with Judge regarding protective order violations (0.20); attention to state court case tracker (0.90); draft and revise letter to Judge Glenn regarding protective order violation (1.80); review letter to Judge Glenn regarding protective order violation (0.20).

20-12345-mg Doc 2763 Filed 12/29/23 Entered 12/29/23 14:21:24 Main Document Pg 32 of 53 **JONES DAY** 131253 Page: 22 December 29, 2023 Diocese of Rockville Centre Invoice: 230910170 Date of Service Timekeeper/Fee Earner Name Hours 11/15/23 C Zepf 0.60 Confer with Stephens (Jones Day) regarding reviewing the parties' papers pertaining to state court discovery in the bankruptcy proceedings (0.20); confer with Orujlu (Jones Day) regarding reviewing the parties' papers and testimony pertaining to state court discovery in the bankruptcy proceedings (0.20); review/analyze the parties' papers pertaining to state court discovery in the bankruptcy proceedings (0.20). 11/16/23 4.40 C Ball Communications with Wright (Eversheds-Sutherland), Chapin, and Fasano (both DRVC) regarding CemCo (0.60); meeting with CemCo (2.20); follow up with Fasano (DRVC), Rosenblum, and Butler (both Jones Day) regarding next steps and plan (0.80); follow up with Adrian (Sitrick) (0.30); review reply to Slater attempt to stay appeals due to Arrowood (0.30); review correspondence with Amala (law firm) regarding violation of protective order (0.20). 11/16/23 A M Butler 0.30 Prepare status conference notice regarding discovery issue. 11/16/23 0.80 T R Geremia Address issues regarding breach of protective / mediation order by claimants' counsel. 11/16/23 N Oruilu 4.30 Research all of the parties' positions on state court discovery in their Preliminary Injunction motion papers in connection with conference requested with Judge Glenn. 4.00 11/16/23 **E** P Stephens Attention to state court coordination (1.30); attention to state court filings (2.50); attention to PO de-designation request (0.20). 11/16/23 C Zepf 4.40 Review transcripts from preliminary injunction and motion to dismiss hearings to compile excerpts regarding state court discovery (4.20); answer call from plaintiff's authorized record provider regarding search for records in state court litigation and take notes (0.20). 11/17/23 E M Joyce 1.20 Review articles/filings referenced by other attorneys regarding Arrowood liquidation and other diocesan bankruptcy proceedings. 11/17/23 W P Ouaranta 1.00 Revise chart of remanded cases for Judge Steinman. 11/17/23 B Rosenblum 1.10 Confer with Stephens and Butler (both Jones Day) regarding CVA issues. 11/17/23 **E** P Stephens 6.70 Teleconference with Geremia (Jones Day), Adams, and Davey (both parish counsel) regarding state court discovery (0.50); attention to state court planning and coordination (6.20). 11/17/23 0.50 C Zepf Communicate with plaintiff's counsel in state court litigation regarding authorized records provider (0.30); confer with Stephens (Jones Day) regarding plaintiff's authorized record providers in state court litigation (0.20). 11/18/23 B Rosenblum 0.20 Review Amala letter (0.10); review draft response to same (0.10).

11/20/23 C Ball 3.30 Communications with DiPompeo (Jones Day) regarding report to Schofield (0.60); communications with Stephens 20-12345-mg Doc 2763 Filed 12/29/23 Entered 12/29/23 14:21:24 Main Document Pg 33 of 53 **JONES DAY** 131253 Page: 23 December 29, 2023 Diocese of Rockville Centre Invoice: 230910170 Date of Service Timekeeper/Fee Earner Name Hours (Jones Day) regarding Stang (Pachulski) communications to Judge Steinman on test case motion (0.60); review test case motion (1.30); confer with Geremia and Stephens (both Jones Day) regarding motion representations on cases and notice (0.60); review Schoenfeld order (0.20). 11/20/23 A M Butler 0.80 Review Committee test case motion. 11/20/23 C J DiPompeo 3.60 Draft joint letter to Judge Schofield regarding case status (3.40); confer with Butler (Jones Day) regarding same (0.20).11/20/23T R Geremia 2.30 Prepare motion to dismiss state court litigation (0.70); review and analyze motion by Committee to select "test cases" and suspend bankruptcy case (1.60). 11/20/23 1.30 E M Joyce Review articles/court filings regarding other diocesan bankruptcy proceedings/insurance claims and Arrowood liquidation. 11/20/23 N Orujlu 4.10 Review/analyze the list of remanded cases covered by Arrowood policies in connection with filing notices of Arrowood's liquidation in federal courts (3.30); draft/revise notices of Arrowood's liquidation in federal courts (0.80).11/20/23 W P Quaranta 2.40 Revise chart of remanded cases for Judge Steinman (1.50); confer with Stephens and Geremia (both Jones Day) about proposed language for status updates in removed cases (0.20); confer with Orujlu (Jones Day) (0.10); review September letter to Judge Steinman based on request from Court (0.60). 11/20/23 5.80 **E** P Stephens Attention to state court coordination (5.20); prepare for protective order breach conference (0.30); review test case motion (0.30). 11/20/23 C Zepf 0.60 Draft/revise state court discovery tracker. 11/21/23 C Ball 1.40Call with LMI counsel regarding Arrowood and next steps (0.70); communications with Geremia and Stephens (both Jones Day) regarding Stang (Pachulski) communications to Steinman on test case motion (0.70). 11/21/23 C Cundra 0.30 Review Committee's motion to try test cases and suspend bankruptcy case. 11/21/23 C J DiPompeo 1.20Revise draft joint letter to Judge Schofield regarding status of chapter 11 case (1.10); confer with Butler (Jones Day) regarding same (0.10). 11/21/23 T R Geremia 3.60 Review and analyze UCC motion to lift stay to select "test cases" and outline response to same (0.80); draft correspondence to Judge Steinman regarding state court litigation (0.50); draft motion to dismiss action in state court litigation (1.20); draft letter to Judge Schofield regarding 157(b)(5) petition and status update (1.10).

11/21/23 N Orujlu Draft/revise notices of Arrowood's liquidation in federal courts. 2.10

20-12345-mg Doc 2763 Filed 12/29/23 Entered 12/29/23 14:21:24 Main Document Pg 34 of 53 **JONES DAY** 131253 Page: 24 December 29, 2023 Diocese of Rockville Centre Invoice: 230910170 Timekeeper/Fee Earner Name Date of Service Hours 11/21/23 W P Quaranta 2.90 Draft list of remanded cases and accompanying letter for Judge Steinman based on criteria specified by Court. 11/21/23 B Rosenblum 0.50 Prepare arguments in response to committee motion. 11/21/23 A Sadanandan 7.80 Review background materials--third-party subpoena, state court orders, confidentiality agreement, etc.--for drafting motion to quash (0.50); research caselaw on motion to quash third-party subpoenas (2.80); draft motion to quash third-party subpoena (4.50). 11/21/23 **E** P Stephens 4.50 Draft response for state court regarding test case motion (0.40); review test case motion (0.40); revise draft state court response (0.20); attention to state court discovery planning (1.70); attention to draft Arrowood notices (0.50); attention to test case motion response planning (0.40); attention to state court case coordination (0.90). 11/21/23 0.80 C Zepf Review records received from plaintiff's authorized records provider. 11/22/23 C Ball 2.20 Communications with DiPompeo (Jones Day) regarding Judge Schofield letter (0.60); communications with Geremia (Jones Day) and Renker (DRVC) regarding Stoneking correspondence with Judge Steinman (0.90); review Judge Steinman conference schedule updates with Renker, Fasano (both DRVC), and Stephens (Jones Day) (0.30); confer with Geremia (Jones Day) regarding Stoneking (plaintiff counsel) activities with Judge Steinman (0.40). 11/22/23 C J DiPompeo 3.80 Revise joint letter to Judge Schofield regarding status of bankruptcy case. 11/22/23 4.30 T R Geremia Draft and revise portions of joint update letter to Judge Schofield regarding 157(b)(5) petition (1.20); attention to state court strategy regarding subpoenas on Diocese (1.00); review proposal by Stoneking (plaintiff counsel) to designate "test cases" and prepare response to Judge Steinman regarding same (1.40); attention to motion to dismiss state court action (0.70). 11/22/23 E M Jovce 0.90 Review articles/filings regarding Arrowood bankruptcy and other diocesan bankruptcy/insurance claim proceedings. 11/22/23 3.50 W P Ouaranta Confer with Stephens (Jones Day) about discovery orders and third-party subpoenas (0.70); confer with Sadanandan (Jones Day) about discovery orders and third-party subpoenas (0.50); update list of remanded cases for Judge Steinman with information requested by Court (2.20); update internal litigation tracker with new dates for cases referred back to bankruptcy court (0.10). 11/22/23 A Sadanandan 4.60Draft motion to quash third-party subpoena (3.30); research caselaw on motion to quash third-party subpoenas (1.30).11/22/23 5.00 **E** P Stephens Attention to test case motion opposition planning (0.60); teleconference with Kramer (Reed Smith) and Terrell (KCIC) regarding test case opposition (0.20); attention to state court coordination (2.90); attention to discovery

deficiency letter (0.50); attention to third party discovery planning (0.20); attention to draft Judge Steinman

response (0.60).

20-12345-mg	Doc 2763	Pg 3	Entered 12/29/23 14:21:24 35 of 53	Main Document		
JONES DAY						
131253				Page: 25		
			Ι	December 29, 2023		
Diocese of Ro	ckville Centre		Ι	nvoice: 230910170		
Date of Service	Timekee	per/Fee Earner Name		Hours		
11/22/23	C Zepf			0.90		
Manage	e subpoenas receiv	ved from plaintiffs' cou	nsel (0.20); draft/revise state court disc	covery tracker (0.70) .		
11/05/02	W/DO			1.(0		
11/25/23 Porrise	W P Qu		n with information requested by Court	1.60		
Kevise.	list of remanded c	ases for Judge Stemma	in with information requested by Court	•		
11/26/23	C Ball			1.50		
		and Stephens (both Jor	nes Day) regarding test case issues (0.70); research regarding status		
	osed test cases (0		<i>,, , , , , , , , , , , , , , , , , , ,</i>	,, 0 0		
11/26/23	T R Ger			4.10		
Draft n	notion to dismiss	in state court litigation.				
11/26/22	P D acor	hlum		0.20		
11/26/23	B Rosen	Day) regarding test case		0.20		
Conter	with Dan Jones I	Jay) regarding test case	.5.			
11/26/23	E P Step	hens		0.30		
		ng proposed test cases.				
	, 0	01 1				
11/27/23	C Ball			1.50		
			arry (all CemCo counsel) regarding Cer			
			urding status conference (0.60); confer v	vith Geremia (Jones Day)		
regardii	ng letter to court	(0.50).				
11/27/23	T R Ger	emia		3.80		
		case state court litigatio	n.	5.00		
11/27/23	J T Hoy	I		0.50		
Review	articles regarding	state court authority to	o restrain federal courts.			
11/27/23	E M Joy			1.00		
proceed		other diocesan bankru	ptcy/insurance claim proceedings and	Arrowood insolvency		
proceed	ungs.					
11/27/23	W P Qu	aranta		2.30		
			n with information requested by Court			
			date internal tracker of cases remanded			
		s removed to federal co				
11/27/23	E P Step			3.60		
		,	on to draft motion to dismiss (1.00); att	cention to state court		
intigatio	n planning (2.10).					
11/27/23	C Zepf			0.40		
		ff's records received fr	om authorized providers.	0.10		
	,,		r			
11/28/23	C Ball			1.90		
Revise press materials (1.10); confer with Rosenblum and Butler (both Jones Day) regarding parish disclosures						
(0.40); confer with Gugg and Butler (both Jones Day) regarding chart demonstrating Arrowood impact on cases						
and star	te court counsel (0.40).				
11/20/22	ТРС	omia		4 20		
11/28/23 Draft a	T R Ger nd finalize motion	emia 1 to dismiss state court	litigation	4.20		
Diatta		i to chamba state court	115au011.			

20-12345-mg Doc 2763 Filed 12/29/23 Entered 12/29/23 14:21:24 Main Document Pg 36 of 53 **JONES DAY** 131253 Page: 26 December 29, 2023 Diocese of Rockville Centre Invoice: 230910170 Date of Service Timekeeper/Fee Earner Name Hours 11/28/23 J T Hoyt 2.70 Draft letter regarding stay of case pending in EDNY (1.60); research on the power of state courts to enjoin federal proceedings (1.10). 11/28/23 0.90 E M Joyce Review articles/filings regarding other diocesan bankruptcy/insurance claim proceedings. 11/28/23 1.30 W P Quaranta Confer with Rosenblum and Stephens (both Jones Day) about remanded cases (0.40); review list of remanded cases submitted to Judge Steinman based on conversations with Rosenblum and Stephens (both Jones Day) (0.50); confer with Hoyt (Jones Day) about Arrowood letter (0.20); confer with Geremia (Jones Day) about quashing third-party subpoenas (0.20). 11/28/23 B Rosenblum 3.00 Revise analysis of CVA litigation. 11/28/23 A Sadanandan 4.00Draft email memo on NY's caselaw on quashing subpoenas (0.30); prepare list of third-party subpoenas, and their response times (1.10); research caselaw on quashing subpoenas (2.60). 11/28/23 **E** P Stephens 6.80 Prepare for November 29 state court conference (1.10); attention to state court discovery planning (5.10); teleconference with Rosenblum (Jones Day) regarding state court litigation (0.20); teleconference with Adams (parish counsel) regarding state court litigation (0.40). 11/28/23 2.30 C Zepf Draft summary description of the documents produced to plaintiff in state court litigation, as requested by Stephens (Jones Day) (1.10); draft/revise state court discovery tracker (0.60); manage third party subpoenas received from plaintiffs' counsel (0.40); confer with Stephens (Jones Day) regarding third party subpoenas on the Diocese (0.20). 11/29/23 C Ball 1.50 Confer with Stephens (Jones Day) regarding Judge Steinman events (0.30); communications with Garry, Oswald, Steinberg (all CemCo counsel), Chapin (DRVC), and Butler (Jones Day) regarding CemCo and Ecclesia (0.60); follow up questions with Butler (Jones Day) regarding structure and Ecclesia policy limits (0.60). 11/29/23 8 20 T R Geremia Participate in state court conference of action and travel to and from Nassau County Supreme Court in connection with same (6.70); meet with Jones Day team to de-brief from conference (1.20); review draft order in connection with subpoenas on Diocese (0.30). 11/29/23 J T Hoyt 3.70 Call with DiPompeo (Jones Day) regarding state powers and status update to EDNY federal court (0.30); review caselaw related to state powers to analyze arguments to stay federal proceedings (3.40). 2.30 11/29/23 W P Quaranta Draft updated letter to Judge Steinman and related chart regarding remanded cases (1.20); draft Attachment A to proposed third-party discovery order submitted to Judge Steinman (1.10). 11/29/23 B Rosenblum 4.50 Confer with Geremia, Stephens, Butler, and Ball (all Jones Day) regarding litigation (1.00); revise litigation analysis (3.50).

20-12345-mg Doc 2763 Filed 12/29/23 Entered 12/29/23 14:21:24 Main Document Pg 37 of 53 **JONES DAY**

December 29, 2023 Diocese of Rockville Centre Invoice: 230910170 Date of Service Timekeeper/Fee Earner Name Hours 11/29/23 **E** P Stephens 10.10 Prepare and appear for November 29 state court conference (5.00); attention to conference follow up (0.60); attention to draft third party discovery order (2.00); review draft expert outline regarding test case motion (1.40); teleconference with Kramer (Reed Smith), Terrell, Macina, and Gutzler (all claims experts) regarding test case motion opposition (0.50); teleconference with Ball, Rosenblum, Geremia, and Butler (all Jones Day) regarding current status and next steps (0.60). 11/29/23 C Zepf 0.30 Draft/revise state court discovery tracker. 11/30/23 4.80 C Ball

Communications with Chapin (DRVC) regarding Ecclesia and CemCo (0.40); prepare for same (0.30); confer with Geremia and Stephens (both Jones Day) regarding overall strategy (0.60); draft and prepare decision tree (1.90); discuss press inquiries with Geremia (Jones Day) and Fasano (DRVC) (0.30); communications with Kennedy (CemCo) regarding structure questions (0.20); communications with Galardi (Ropes & Gray) regarding CHS documentation and update (0.20); review case management developments with Judge Steinman (0.30); correspond regarding same with Quaranta (Jones Day) (0.20); communications with Law (Reed Smith) regarding Global Restitution Partners (0.40).

11/30/2	3 A M Butler	1.40
	, , ,	(Stephens, Geremia, Rosenblum, Dorfman, Chan) regarding response to motion to
	suspend.	

11/30/23 M K Chan 1.30 Confer with Geremia, Stephens, Rosenblum, Dorfman, and Butler (all Jones Day) regarding response to motion for test cases (1.00); review/analyze motion for test cases (0.30).

11/30/23 C J DiPompeo Research regarding application of Arrowood stay to pending cases (2.10); confer with Hoyt (Jones Day) regarding same (0.30); confer with Hoyt and Geremia (both Jones Day) regarding same (0.40).

11/30/23 T R Geremia 5.60 Outline response to UCC motion to impose "test cases" (0.90); meet with Jones Day team regarding same (0.80); review and analyze materials regarding bellwether approach to mass tort litigation (0.90); draft response to district court order regarding Arrowood stay (0.30); conference with Hoyt and DiPompeo (both Jones Day) regarding same (0.50); correspondence with state court regarding subpoena process on Diocese (1.10); attention to strategy regarding state court litigation (1.10).

11/30/23 2.70 J T Hoyt Call with DiPompeo and Geremia (both Jones Day) regarding power of state courts to enjoin federal proceedings (0.50); research on power of state courts to enjoin federal proceedings (1.50); call with DiPompeo (Jones Day) regarding power of state courts to enjoin federal proceedings (0.30); prepare draft of letter update to Court regarding status of stay in case (0.40).

11/30/23 E M Joyce Review articles/filings regarding various other diocesan bankruptcy/insurance claim proceedings. 11/30/23 W P Quaranta 0.80

Confer with Stephens (Jones Day) about remanded cases subject to Arrowood stay and letter to Judge Steinman (0.70); communicate with external counsel about letter to court regarding Arrowood stay (0.10).

11/30/23 B Rosenblum

131253

1

Review analysis regarding CVA cases (0.60); participate in call regarding response to Committee's motion to suspend case (0.90); review/ analyze committee motion and authority cited therein (0.90); respond to client inquiry

0.90

2.80

2.80

Page: 27

20-12345-mg	Doc 2763	Pg 3	Entered 12/29/23 2 88 of 53 ES DAY	14:21:24 N	1ain Document
131253 Diocese of Ro		5013			Page: 28 ember 29, 2023 ice: 230910170
Diocese of Ro	ckville Centre			IIIVO	ice. 230910170
Date of Service	Timekee	eper/Fee Earner Name		He	DUIS
regardir	ng litigation (0.40)				
		ses (0.30); attention to a	state court coordination (4.9 state court litigations (0.40	00); teleconferen	1.70 Ince with Adams, Davey,
11/30/23 Meeting respons			Butler, and Chan (all Jones I		.10 est case motion
11/30/23 Organiz (0.50).	C Zepf e and manage su	bpoenas received from	plaintiff's counsel (0.40); de		0.90 court discovery tracker
Mat	ter Total			419	.20
Meetings					
	T R Ger ate in weekly wor nce in court (0.80	k in progress call with	client and professional tean		.30 o meeting after status
11/01/23 Particip	B Rosen ate in work in pro			(0.50
11/02/23 Confere	T R Ger ence with Ball (Jo	emia nes Day) regarding ove	rall strategy.	(0.70
11/03/23 Particip	T R Ger ate in weekly call	emia with counsel for parish	nes.	1	.00
	E P Step aference with Ball vey (all parish cou	, Rosenblum, Geremia,	, Butler (all Jones Day), Het		.20 liker, Slome, Adams,
11/06/23 Meet w	T R Ger ith client regardin	emia g overall bankruptcy st	rategy.	1	.50
11/08/23 Prepare	C Ball for next steps ca	11.		(0.60
			client and professional team		.30 th counsel for UCC
11/08/23 Particip	B Rosen ate in work in pro		60); participate in weekly cr		0.80 e call (0.20).
11/10/23 Attend	C Ball parish counsel ca	11.		(0.70
11/10/23 Particip	T R Ger ate in weekly call	emia with parish counsel.		(0.60

20-12345-mg Doc 2763 Filed 12/29/23 Entered 12/29/23 14:21:24 Main Document Pg 39 of 53 **JONES DAY** 131253 Page: 29 December 29, 2023 Diocese of Rockville Centre Invoice: 230910170 Timekeeper/Fee Earner Name Hours Date of Service 11/10/23 **E** P Stephens 0.50 Teleconference with Ball, Geremia, Rosenblum, Butler (all Jones Day), Hulme, Ryniker, Davey, Slome, Heuer, McMahon, DiConza, and Sorensen (all parish counsel) regarding current status and next steps. 11/15/23 C Ball 0.60 Call with UCC regarding update, test case motion inquiry, and plan. T R Geremia 11/15/23 0.60 Meet with counsel for UCC. 11/15/23 B Rosenblum 1.00Participate in committee update call (0.90); confer with Geremia (Jones Day) following same (0.10). 11/15/23 **E** P Stephens 1.60 Teleconference with Butler (Jones Day), Moore, and Ciriello (both Alvarez & Marsal) regarding current status and contingency planning (0.40); teleconference with Ball (Jones Day) regarding next steps (0.40); teleconference with Ball, Rosenblum, Geremia, Butler (all Jones Day), Stang, and Dine (both Pachulski) regarding open items and next steps (0.80). 11/17/23 C Ball 0.70 Call with parish counsel on status. 11/17/23 T R Geremia 1.70Participate in weekly call with parish counsel (1.20); meet with litigation counsel for parishes (0.50). 11/17/23 **E** P Stephens 1.20 Teleconference with Ball, Rosenblum, Geremia, Butler (all Jones Day), Davey, Adams, Ryniker, Slome, Heuer, and Driscoll (all parish counsel) regarding current status and next steps. 11/22/23 T R Geremia 1.40 Participate in weekly work in progress call (1.00); conference with counsel for UCC (0.40). 11/22/23 B Rosenblum 1.20 Participate in work in process call (0.90); participate in committee update call (0.20); confer with Butler (Jones Day) regarding same (0.10). 11/22/23 1.00E P Stephens Teleconference with Ball, Rosenblum, Geremia, Butler (all Jones Day), Ciriello, Moore (Alvarez & Marsal), Kramer, Law, Berringer (all Reed Smith), and Renker (DRVC) regarding current status and next steps (1.00). 11/27/23 T R Geremia 1.60 Conference with restructuring counsel for parishes (0.50); conference with litigation counsel for parishes (0.30); conference within Jones Day regarding strategy (0.80). 11/28/23 1.50 E P Stephens Teleconference with Ball, Rosenblum, Geremia, Butler (all Jones Day), Moore, Ciriello (both Alvarez & Marsal), Fasano, and Renker (both DRVC) regarding current status and next steps. 11/29/23 0.70 C Ball UCC weekly call with Stang, Dine (both Committee), McDaniel (Pachulski), Butler, and Rosenblum (both Jones Day).

20-12345-mg Doc 2763 Filed 12/29/23 Entered 12/29/23 14:21:24 Main Document

Pg 40 of 53 JONES DAY

131253 Page: 30 December 29, 2023 Diocese of Rockville Centre Invoice: 230910170 Date of Service Timekeeper/Fee Earner Name Hours 1.50 11/29/23 B Rosenblum Participate in work in process call (1.00); participate in weekly committee counsel call (0.50). Matter Total 27.00 Plan and Disclosure Statement 11/01/23 A M Butler 4.80 Confer with client regarding hearing and mediation issues (0.80); confer with Morin (Jones Day) regarding same (0.50); confer with Rosenblum (Jones Day) regarding same (1.20); draft materials regarding Seminary transaction (0.30); plan and mediation planning (2.00). 11/01/23 1.10 C J Li Shepardize and bluebook case citations (1.00); submit edits to Tawil (Jones Day) (0.10). 11/01/23 B Rosenblum 2.00Confer with Ball and Butler (both Jones Day) regarding settlement / dismissal (0.50); develop strategy in connection with same (1.50). 11/01/23 5.00 A Sapp Research, review and analyze law/precedent surrounding plan assets (2.60); draft email to Butler (Jones Day) regarding same (0.10); review and analyze case law regarding conditions on plan assets (2.00); discuss with Butler (Jones Day) regarding same (0.30). 11/01/23 **E** P Stephens 0.50 Teleconference with Ball, Rosenblum, Geremia, Butler (all Jones Day), Law, Kramer, Berringer (all Reed Smith), Moore, and Ciriello (both Alvarez & Marsal) regarding current status and next steps. 11/01/23 A R Tawil 1.30 Review and revise recovery chart for Ball (Jones Day). 11/02/23 A M Butler 4.00 Meet with Jones Day team (Geremia, Rosenblum, Ball, Stephens) regarding plan issues (2.00); plan research (2.00). 11/02/23 B Rosenblum 4.20Communications with Jones Day team regarding plan / dismissal options (2.00); confer with Stephens (Jones Day) regarding dismissal (0.40); analyze CVA cases in connection with dismissal (1.80). 11/02/23 N P Yeary 0.40Analyze confirmation schedule related materials. 11/03/23 A M Butler 7.60 Call with parish counsel (Hulme, Driscoll, Heuer, Slome) and Jones Day team (Rosenblum, Ball, Stephens, Geremia) regarding plan issues (1.20); confer with Rosenblum, Ball and Stephens (all Jones Day) regarding same (0.60); call regarding dismissal issues with Ball (Jones Day) and Ciriello (Alvarez & Marsal) (0.80); plan research (5.00).11/03/23 0.20 C J Farley Discuss research related to solicitation timelines with Butler (Jones Day). 11/03/23 B Rosenblum 2.80

Communicate with parish counsel regarding dismissal (1.10); confer with Ball (Jones Day) regarding same (0.30); confer with Stephens (Jones Day) regarding same (0.70); communicate with Butler, Ball (both Jones Day) and

20-12345-mg Doc 2763 Filed 12/29/23 Entered 12/29/23 14:21:24 Main Document Pg 41 of 53 IONES DAY

	JONES DAY	
131253		Page: 31 December 29, 2023
Diocese	of Rockville Centre	Invoice: 230910170
Date of S	ervice Timekeeper/Fee Earner Name	Hours
(Ciriello (Alvarez & Marsal) regarding same (0.70).	
11/03/23]	A Sapp Review precedent for deadlines (1.60); review authority on timing for notice per	2.30 iod (0.70).
11/03/23	E P Stephens Teleconference with Rosenblum and Butler (both Jones Day) regarding strategy	0.70 and next steps.
	N P Yeary Research concerning confirmation schedule (0.20); related correspondence with Day) (0.10).	0.30 Butler, Sapp and Farley (all Jones
11/04/23 I	C J Farley Research solicitation procedures in preparation for filing a plan and disclosure st	1.30 tatement.
11/04/23]	A Sapp Research precedent regarding timelines.	2.00
11/05/23 I	A Sapp Review and analyze precedent on timings (1.30); draft email to Butler (Jones Day	1.40 y) regarding same (0.10).
	C Ball Confer with Stephens and Rosenblum (both Jones Day) regarding plan dismissa same (0.50); call with client regarding same (1.10).	1.60 l and approach for client regarding
t	A M Butler Plan and disclosure statement research (4.00); call with client and Jones Day tear Stephens) and Alvarez & Marsal team (Moore, Ciriello) regarding same (1.50); ca team (Moore, Ciriello) regarding same (0.60); call with Ciriello (Alvarez & Marsa confer with Rosenblum and Ball (both Jones Day) regarding planning for same (all with client and Alvarez & Marsal l) regarding plan issues (0.30);
11/06/23 1	C J Farley Research precedent regarding disclosure statement notice periods.	1.80
	B Rosenblum Communicate with client regarding dismissal (1.30); confer with Butler (Jones D with Ball and Butler (both Jones Day) regarding same (0.80).	2.60 Pay) regarding plan (0.50); confer
11/06/23 I	A Sapp Research and review precedent regarding objection deadlines.	1.00
	E P Stephens Teleconference with Ball, Rosenblum, Geremia, Butler (all Jones Day), Moore, C and Renker (DRVC) regarding current status and next steps.	1.40 Ciriello (both Alvarez & Marsal),
11/06/23 I	A R Tawil Research on plan confirmation issues.	0.10
v	N P Yeary Draft solicitation procedures (2.80); research bankruptcy rules, local bankruptcy with same (0.50); confer with Butler (Jones Day) regarding plan and disclosure s completing solicitation procedures (0.30).	

20-12345-mg Doc 2763 Filed 12/29/23 Entered 12/29/23 14:21:24 Main Document Pg 42 of 53

Pg 42 of 53 JONES DAY			
131253	J 01 (20 2111	Page: 32 December 29, 2023	
Diocese of Rockville	e Centre	Invoice: 230910170	
Date of Service	Timekeeper/Fee Earner Name	Hours	
	A M Butler evise plan and disclosure statement (6.50); review next step am (Jones Day) regarding plan issues (0.40).	7.30 os on CemCo diligence issues (0.40); confer	
11/07/23 Research bank	C J Farley sruptcy procedures in preparation for filing a disclosure st	1.10 atement and plan.	
11/07/23 Confer with B	B Rosenblum Butler (Jones Day) regarding plan process.	0.50	
	A Sapp nalyze precedent regarding timing (1.10); confer with Butle elines and review email correspondence regarding same (0.)).		
11/07/23 Research on p	A R Tawil olan issues.	1.70	
	N P Yeary ion procedures (4.10); draft solicitation procedures motion ing same (0.30).	8.00 n (3.60); emails and calls with Butler (Jones	
Ciriello (Alvar Michael) and J Stephens, Cha (5.00); call wit	A M Butler at, Jones Day team (Rosenblum, Geremia, Ball, Stephens) a rez & Marsal) regarding plan and mediation issues (0.60); c Jones Day team (Ball, Rosenblum, Geremia) regarding san an) regarding mediation issues (0.70); review and revise pla h parish counsel (Heuer, Slome, Davey, Adams) regarding a issues (0.60); confer with Rosenblum and Ball (both Jone	all with Committee counsel (Stang, Dine, ne (0.10); call with internal team (Geremia, in and disclosure statement documents g mediation issues (0.60); call with CHS	
11/08/23 Review and ar	A Sapp nalyze precedent regarding dismissal of bankruptcy case.	2.20	
Moore, Ciriell teleconference	E P Stephens ee with Ball, Rosenblum, Geremia, Butler (all Jones Day), J o (both Alvarez & Marsal), and Renker (DRVC) regarding e with Ball, Rosenblum, Geremia, Butler (all Jones Day), H e, Driscoll, DiConza, Davey, and Adams (all parish couns	g current status and next steps (0.50); Ieuer, Sorensen, Hulme, McMahon,	
11/08/23 Research on p	A R Tawil olan issues.	1.60	
analyze materi	N P Yeary ion motion (4.20); review research concerning voluntary d ials related to motion to shorten (0.50); correspond with S onditional motion to dismiss portion of solicitation motion	kedzielewski (Jones Day) concerning same	
11/09/23 Review and re	A M Butler evise plan and disclosure statement documents (8.00); call	9.10 regarding same with client, Ball (Jones	

Review and revise plan and disclosure statement documents (8.00); call regarding same with client, Ball (Jones Day), Ciriello (Alvarez & Marsal), and Law (Reed Smith) (0.40); call regarding insurance plan issues with Jones Day team (Ball, Rosenblum, Stephens, Geremia) and Law and Berringer (Reed Smith) (0.70).

20-12345-mg Doc 2763 Filed 12/29/23 Entered 12/29/23 14:21:24 Main Document Pg 43 of 53 JONES DAY

131253 Page: 33 December 29, 2023 Diocese of Rockville Centre Invoice: 230910170 Timekeeper/Fee Earner Name Date of Service Hours 11/09/23 CILi 1.80 Draft and revise exhibit to solicitation motion. 11/09/23 B Rosenblum 5.10 Revise plan (4.10); confer with Butler (Jones Day) regarding same (1.00). 11/09/23 0.30 S Skedzielewski Draft motion to shorten notice and confirmation schedule. A R Tawil 11/09/23 0.60

 11/09/23
 N P Yeary
 3.80

 Draft dismissal motion component of solicitation procedures motion (3.20); confer with Skedzielewski (Jones Day) concerning scheduling motion (0.30); confer with Butler (Jones Day) concerning next steps for scheduling motion, solicitation procedures (0.30).

0.50

Communications with mediator. 11/10/23 C Ball 0.50 Communications with Van Osselaer (Van Osselaer Dispute Resolution) and Judge Cave about mediation.

Research on plan confirmation issues.

C Ball

11/10/23

11/10/23A M Butler10.20Call with parish counsel (Slome, Heuer, Driscoll, Sorensen) and Jones Day team (Stephens, Rosenblum, Ball,
Geremia) regarding plan and mediation issues (0.60); call with Ciriello (Alvarez & Marsal) and Rosenblum (Jones
Day) regarding plan and disclosure statement issues (1.00); review and revise plan and disclosure statement (8.60).

- 11/10/23
 C Cundra
 3.50

 Emails with Ball (Jones Day) regarding revisions to claims eligibility for plan distributions (0.20); research and analyze same (2.90); send revised claims eligibility list with explanations to Ball (Jones Day) for review (0.40).

 11/10/23
 C J Farley
 3.80

 Research caselaw regarding arguments to be made in support of plan confirmation (1.00); meeting with Butler (Jones Day) regarding drafting plan provisions (0.10); draft financing provisions for a proposed plan of confirmation (2.70).
 1.00

 11/10/23
 C J Li
 1.00

 Draft and send exhibit to solicitation motion to Butler (Jones Day).
 2.00
- 11/10/23B Rosenblum2.00Communicate with parish counsel regarding plan (0.80); communicate with Butler (Jones Day) and Ciriello
(Alvarez & Marsal) regarding plan (1.00); confer with Stephens (Jones Day) regarding same (0.20).
- 11/10/23
 A Sapp
 0.20

 Review correspondence with Li (Jones Day) regarding order language and provide feedback regarding same.

 11/10/23
 S Skedzielewski
 4.50

 Draft motion for entry of order scheduling hearing on approval of disclosure statement, establishing disclosure statement objection deadline, and granting other relief.
 4.50
- 11/10/23 A R Tawil 0.90 Research plan confirmation issues.

20-12345-mg Doc 2763 Filed 12/29/23 Entered 12/29/23 14:21:24 Main Document Pg 44 of 53

JONES DAY				
131253	-	Page: 34 December 29, 2023		
Diocese of Rockville	e Centre	Invoice: 230910170		
Date of Service	Timekeeper/Fee Earner Name	Hours		
11/11/23 Review and rev	A M Butler vise solicitation procedures.	3.00		
11/11/23 Draft motion t	S Skedzielewski to shorten notice of disclosure statement objections and objections to	2.70 the reorganization plan.		
11/11/23 Research plan	A R Tawil issues.	0.90		
11/13/23 Communicatio	C Ball ons with Renker and Fasano (both DRVC) regarding mediator call.	0.40		
11/13/23 Call with Ciriel revise plan mat	A M Butler llo (Alvarez & Marsal) regarding plan issues (0.30); call with client reg terials (9.00).	9.70 arding same (0.40); review and		
breakdown for state court firm remanded case Arrowood brea (0.10); analyze	C Cundra all (Jones Day) regarding claims eligibility chart under plan (0.20); rese e eligible claims and compile information on same (1.70); review draft as regarding claim eligibility and next steps (0.10); messages with Gug e list and Arrowood breakdown (0.10); compile aggregate totals data for akdown (0.20); emails and call with Ball (Jones Day) regarding modifi claim eligibility under revised criteria (2.00); revise claim eligibility cha- hens and Butler (all Jones Day) for review (0.30).	letter from Ball (Jones Day) to g (Jones Day) regarding or claim eligibility and cation to claim eligibility criteria		
11/13/23 Revise exhibit	C J Li to solicitation motion by incorporating Butler (Jones Day) edits.	0.50		
	B Rosenblum ssues (1.00); confer with Butler (Jones Day) regarding plan documents alking points regarding plan (0.10).	1.80 s (0.50); revise plan letter (0.20);		
	A Sapp Butler (Jones Day) new assignment regarding solicitation procedures n on to new version of solicitation procedures motion (2.40).	2.50 notion (0.10); draft and add		
11/13/23 Draft motion r	S Skedzielewski regarding scheduling disclosure statement hearing.	1.70		
11/13/23 Research on pl	A R Tawil an issues.	2.80		
	N P Yeary utler (Jones Day) concerning solicitation procedures and next steps (0 licitation procedures motion (0.70); review and revise solicitation not			
11/14/23 Call with Van	C Ball Osselaer (Van Osselaer Dispute Resolution) and Judge Cave.	0.80		
	A M Butler s Day team (Stephens, Rosenblum, Geremia, Ball) regarding status of n mediators regarding same (0.70); review and revise plan and disclosu			

20-12345-mg Doc 2763 Filed 12/29/23 Entered 12/29/23 14:21:24 Main Document Pg 45 of 53 **JONES DAY** 131253 Page: 35 December 29, 2023 Diocese of Rockville Centre Invoice: 230910170 Date of Service Timekeeper/Fee Earner Name Hours 11/14/23 2.60 C Cundra Revise letters to state court counsel, including determining claims eligibility under plan, and send same to state court counsel (2.30); further emails with Skaller (Levy Konigsberg) regarding letter and meeting to discuss same (0.20); emails with Geremia and Stephens (both Jones Day) regarding same (0.10). 11/14/23 0.80 T R Geremia Conference with court-appointed mediators. 11/14/23 N J Morin 1.10 Call with Butler (Jones Day) on disclosure statement (0.30); draft certain disclosure statement language and circulate same to Butler (Jones Day) (0.80). 11/14/23 **B** Rosenblum 3.90 Revise plan (3.00); communicate with mediators regarding case (0.80); confer with Ball (Jones Day) regarding same (0.10).11/14/23 1.50 A Sapp Revise disclosure statement notice to reflect review of solicitation procedures motion. 11/14/23 A R Tawil 5.60 Research regarding plan issues. 11/14/23 N P Yeary 4.50 Confer with Butler (Jones Day) concerning solicitation procedures and next steps (0.20); analyze materials related to executory contract treatment under solicitation procedures and plan (1.00); correspond with Tawil (Jones Day) regarding executory contract research (0.30); confer with Tawil and Butler (both Jones Day) concerning treatment of executory contracts and leases under solicitation procedures and plan (0.20); review and analyze notices (1.20); send analysis of notices to Butler (Jones Day) (0.30); analyze solicitation materials (1.00); correspond with Tawil (Jones Day) regarding additional solicitation notice (0.30). 0.70 11/15/23 C Ball Review Amala letter to Judge Glenn (0.40); confer with Stephens (Jones Day); regarding Slater and access to mediation documents (0.30). 9.90 11/15/23 A M Butler Call regarding plan issues with Committee (Stang, Dine) and Jones Day team (Ball, Rosenblum, Geremia, Stephens) (0.90); review and revise disclosure statement and related plan filings (9.00). 0.20 11/15/23 C Cundra Review email from plaintiffs' counsel regarding letter, past correspondence and meeting to discuss same (0.10); review past correspondence and emails with Ball (Jones Day) regarding same (0.10). 11/15/23 C J Farley 1.40 Research SDNY filing and notice procedures. 11/15/23 1.80 A Sapp Review and analyze precedent solicitation procedures in SDNY (0.50); review and analyze plan documents in anticipation of filing (1.30). 11/15/23 A R Tawil 1.10 Draft solicitation notice.

11/15/23 N P Yeary 9.00 Revise scheduling motion (2.50); confer with Farley and Butler (both Jones Day) regarding SDNY procedures 20-12345-mg Doc 2763 Filed 12/29/23 Entered 12/29/23 14:21:24 Main Document Pg 46 of 53 **JONES DAY** 131253 Page: 36 December 29, 2023 Diocese of Rockville Centre Invoice: 230910170 Date of Service Timekeeper/Fee Earner Name Hours related to plan related matters (0.30); revise order and solicitation procedures (2.00) confer with Butler (Jones Day) regarding next steps (0.20); analyze conformity check of motion, order and solicitation procedures (1.00) analyze draft notice of disallowed claim from Tawil (Jones Day), revisions to notice of disputed claim, solicitation procedures and solicitation procedures motion in light of same (0.80); revise ballots (2.00); confer with Butler (Jones Day) regarding same (0.20). 11/16/23 0.80 C Ball Follow up with Chapin (DRVC) regarding date with regulators on Ecclesia (0.20); communications with Berringer (Reed Smith) regarding LMI interrogatories (0.30); confer with Cundra (Jones Day) regarding plaintiffs' counsel response to letter (0.30). 9.70 11/16/23 A M Butler Review and revise plan materials (4.50); meetings with CemCo and client regarding plan issues (5.00); confer with Rosenblum (Jones Day) regarding same (0.20). 3.30 11/16/23 C J Farley Draft and revise solicitation procedure notice provisions. 11/16/23 0.20 B Rosenblum Confer with Butler (Jones Day) regarding plan. 11/16/23 3.40A Sapp Review and analyze solicitation materials (1.60); review and analyze plan documents and make conforming changes to ballots (1.80). 11/16/23 N P Yeary 4.20 Analyze solicitation materials (0.70); confer with Butler (Jones Day) concerning solicitation procedures, revisions to same and next steps (0.20); revise solicitation documents including procedures, motion, and order (1.70); correspond with Farley (Jones Day) regarding revisions to be made to notices (0.60); review and analyze scheduling motion (1.00). 11/17/23 C Ball 3.30 Review Merson attempt to stay appeals (0.30); review Amala letter (0.90); review correspondence from Davey (parish counsel) regarding deceased plaintiffs and updates to Judge Steinman (0.40); confer with Rosenblum and Butler (both Jones Day) regarding timing of plan and impact on press (0.60); communications with Fasano, Renker (both DRVC) and Adrian (Sitrick) regarding same (1.10). 11/17/23 11.40 A M Butler Review and revise plan materials (6.00); call with Alvarez & Marsal team (Moore, Ciriello) and Rosenblum (Jones Day) regarding same (1.00); call with parish counsel (Slome, Heuer, Driscoll) and Jones Day team (Ball, Rosenblum, Geremia, Stephens) regarding same (1.50); call with Jones Day team (Ball and Jones Day) regarding plan prep (1.50) call with client regarding same (1.40). 11/17/23 C Cundra 1.10 Messages with Butler (Jones Day) regarding research on timeline of notice of confirmation and disclosure statement hearing (0.10); research same and send findings to Butler for review (1.00). 11/17/23 0.30 T R Geremia Meet with Butler and Rosenblum (both Jones Day) regarding plan issues. 11/17/23 B Rosenblum 6.00

Review plan documents (1.00); communicate with Butler (Jones Day), Ciriello and Moore (both Alvarez & Marsal) regarding plan (1.10); communicate with parish counsel regarding plan and litigation (1.20); review revisions to plan from Butler (Jones Day) (0.10); confer with Ball (Jones Day) regarding plan (0.10); confer with Butler (Jones Day)

20-12345-mg Doc 2763 Filed 12/29/23 Entered 12/29/23 14:21:24 Main Document Pg 47 of 53 JONES DAY 131253 Page: 37

Diocese of Rockville Centre

December 29, 2023

Invoice: 230910170

1.10

Date of Service Timekeeper/Fee Earner Name Hours regarding plan (0.30); review comments from Reed Smith on plan (0.30); confer with Butler and Ball (both Jones Day) regarding plan (0.90); communicate with Butler, Ball (both Jones Day), Fasano, Renker (both DRVC), Adrian and Wilner (both Sitrick) regarding plan (1.00). 11/17/23 A Sapp 8.40 Draft and revise form of ballots for solicitation procedures motion. 11/17/23 **E** P Stephens 0.70 Teleconference with Ball and Rosenblum (both Jones Day) regarding plan and upcoming bankruptcy court conference. 4.20 11/17/23 N P Yearv Call with Butler (Jones Day) and Epiq team regarding next week filings and next steps (0.50); revise solicitation procedures motion (2.50); confer with Butler (Jones Day) regarding timing and next steps (0.50); communicate with Epiq team concerning current drafts and next steps (0.30); revise solicitation procedures (0.40). 11/18/23 C Ball 4.50Draft response to Amala regarding offer (0.90); confer regarding same with Geremia and Stephens (both Jones Day) (0.60); review plan and disclosure statement (1.80); review Kramer (Reed Smith) comments regarding same (1.20).11/18/23 A M Butler 1.00 Review and revise solicitation procedures. 11/18/23 C J Farley 0.10 Review and revise solicitation procedures notices. 11/18/23 3.30 A Sapp Create Excel tracker for all plan related documents (0.90); correspond with Butler (Jones Day) regarding same (0.10); review revised schedule and make conforming changes to ballots (0.70); draft and revise cover letter (1.60). 11/18/23 N P Yeary 1.80 Analyze Butler (Jones Day) revisions to solicitation procedures motion (0.30); analyze solicitation procedures materials (0.50); revise order approving disclosure statement and solicitation procedures (1.00).

11/19/23C Cundra9.00Additional research regarding timing of notice for combined hearing (4.30); summarize same and send findings to
Butler (Jones Day) for review (0.20); research timing for confirmation and disclosure statement hearing (4.50).

 11/19/23
 C J Farley
 1.90

 Review and revise solicitation procedures notices.

11/19/23 A Sapp Review changes to timeline and make conforming changes on ballots and cover letter.

11/20/23 C Ball 5.50 Review and comment on press release (0.40); review Stang (Pachulski) comments to Judge Steinman (0.20); discuss same with Rosenblum (Jones Day) (0.40); discuss plan disclosure statement and ballot with Butler and Rosenblum (both Jones Day) (0.80); confer with Butler (Jones Day) regarding Kramer (Reed Smith) comments on same (0.30); communications with Renker and Fasano (both DRVC) on plan schedule (0.30); review Judge Oetken order on appeals (0.40); confer with Geremia and Stephens (both Jones Day) regarding response to Amala (0.40); confer with Tawil (Jones Day) regarding Rochester disclosure statement and approach to best interest on non-debtors (0.40); review Rosenblum (Jones Day) comments on plan and disclosure statement (1.20); follow up with Rosenblum and Butler (both Jones Day) regarding same (0.70). 20-12345-mg Doc 2763 Filed 12/29/23 Entered 12/29/23 14:21:24 Main Document Pg 48 of 53 JONES DAY

131253		Page: 38 December 29, 2023
Diocese of Roc	kville Centre	Invoice: 230910170
Date of Service	Timekeeper/Fee Earner Name	Hours
	A M Butler and revise plan and solicitation documents (7.20); meet g same (1.50).	8.70 with Ball and Rosenblum (both Jones Day)
and send	C Cundra with Ball (Jones Day) regarding correspondence with An I to Ball (Jones Day) for review (0.40); send same to Ar g research on timing for notice for combined hearing ((nala (Pfau Cochran) (0.10); email Butler (Jones Day)
	C J Farley with Butler, Yeary and Sapp (all Jones Day) regarding o se solicitation procedures notices (5.50).	5.70 disclosure statement and plan timing (0.20); review
11/20/23 Review p	B Rosenblum plan and disclosure statement documents (4.00); confer	5.30 with Butler (Jones Day) regarding plan (1.30).
procedu	A Sapp comments and edits from Ball, Rosenblum and Butler (res motion, disclosure statement and cover letter and in illots and send to Butler (Jones Day) for review (0.90).	
11/20/23 Review a	E P Stephens and revise draft plan documents.	0.70
solicitatio analyze r	N P Yeary olicitation motion (1.00); confer with Butler, Sapp, Farl on procedures (0.20); analyze materials related to disclo revisions to notices, confer with Farley (Jones Day) con otices (1.90); confer with Farley (Jones Day) concerning	sure statement and solicitation procedures (0.60); cerning same and next steps (0.20); review and
(both Jos	A M Butler n Rosenblum (Jones Day) and Kramer (Reed Smith) reg nes Day) and Kramer (Reed Smith) and LMI team rega re statement documents (6.00).	
11/21/23 Review c	C J Farley disclosure statement in preparation for reply brief resea	1.00 rch.
	N J Morin n Butler (Jones Day) regarding disclosure statement and Butler (Jones Day) (0.50); communicate with White (Je	
	B Rosenblum nicate with LMI counsel regarding plan (1.00); commun garding plan (1.00); confer with Ball and Butler (both Jo	
	A Sapp motions in BSA and listen to related hearing regarding o Pay) regarding proposed edits (0.20).	4.70 challenges to ballots (4.50); draft email to Butler

20-12345-mg Doc 2763 Filed 12/29/23 Entered 12/29/23 14:21:24 Main Document Pg 49 of 53 **JONES DAY** 131253 Page: 39 December 29, 2023 Diocese of Rockville Centre Invoice: 230910170 Date of Service Timekeeper/Fee Earner Name Hours 5.90 11/21/23 N P Yeary Revise solicitation procedures and solicitation procedures motion (0.50); analyze comments from Epiq to same (1.00); confer with Butler (Jones Day) regarding solicitation documents (0.30); analyze materials related to disclosure statement and solicitation procedures (1.50); prepare outline of anticipated objections to same (0.70); further revise solicitation procedures (0.80); revise disclosure statement (0.50); communicate with Kjontvedt (Epiq) and Butler (Jones Day) regarding solicitation procedures (0.40); confer with Butler (Jones Day) concerning solicitation materials (0.20). 11/22/23 2.50 C Ball Communications with Chapin (DRVC) regarding Ecclesia regulatory issues (0.30); communications with Reed Smith, Jones Day team, Renker and Fasano (both DRVC) regarding next steps, plan, disclosure statement, and media (1.30); revise draft statements (0.60); review revisions to press materials (0.30). 11/22/23 10.20 A M Butler Call with client, Jones Day team (Ball, Rosenblum, Geremia, Stephens, DiPompeo), Alvarez & Marsal team (Moore) and Reed Smith team (Kramer, Berringer, Law) regarding plan issues (1.10); review and revise plan and disclosure statement documents (8.50); confer with client regarding plan issues (0.60). 11/22/23 C J Farley 3.40 Review and revise notices for the solicitation procedures motion. 11/22/23 T R Geremia 0.80 Revise introductory sections of plan and disclosure statement. 11/22/23 CILi 4.10 Research on plan issues (3.00); summarize and compile findings for Butler (Jones Day) (1.10). 11/22/23 B Rosenblum 8.60 Revise solicitation procedures documents (3.20); confer with Butler (Jones Day) regarding same (0.40); revise plan (4.20); confer with Butler (Jones Day) regarding same (0.30); confer with Butler (Jones Day) regarding test cases and plan (0.50). 11/22/23 N P Yeary 5.40 Analyze plan related materials concerning briefing research workstream (1.00); prepare a research outline for briefing on disclosure statement and solicitation procedures (0.60); correspond with Butler (Jones Day) regarding same (0.30); analyze materials related to disclosure statement approval order (0.40); revise disclosure statement approval order (1.40); revise disclosure statement sections concerning solicitation procedures (0.50); revise solicitation procedure documents (1.00); emails with Butler (Jones Day) concerning solicitation procedure documents and disclosure statement (0.20). 11/24/23 A M Butler 4.50 Review and revise plan and disclosure statement documents. 11/24/23 C J Li 2.90 Researched case law on restricted assets. 11/24/23 A Sapp 1.40 Review recent changes to plan and revise ballots to conform with new changes. 11/24/23 N P Yeary 1.50 Revise ballots.

Review and revise plan and disclosure statement materials.

A M Butler

11/25/23

1.80

20-12345-mg

131253

Doc 2763 Filed 12/29/23 Entered 12/29/23 14:21:24 Main Document Pg 50 of 53 **JONES DAY**

Page: 40

December 29, 2023 Diocese of Rockville Centre Invoice: 230910170 Date of Service Timekeeper/Fee Earner Name Hours 11/25/23 N P Yeary 6.10 Revise solicitation package cover letter (0.50); review and revise solicitation procedures (2.00); review and revise notices (3.50); email to Butler (Jones Day) concerning revised documents (0.10). 11/26/23 2.00 C Ball Communications with Moore, Ciriello (both Alvarez & Marsal), Butler, and Rosenblum (both Jones Day) regarding plan issues (1.20); review revised press materials from Adrian (Sitrick) (0.40); communications with parish counsel, Geremia, and Rosenblum (both Jones Day) regarding plan, disclosure statement, and related issues (0.40). 11/26/23 7.00 A M Butler Review and revise plan and disclosure statement materials (6.00); call with Alvarez & Marsal team (Moore, Ciriello) and Jones Day team (Ball, Rosenblum) regarding same (1.00). 11/26/23 4.80 B Rosenblum Revise disclosure statement (2.80); review disclosure statement exhibits (0.50); communicate with Ciriello (Alvarez & Marsal) regarding same (0.10); communicate with Butler, Ball (both Jones Day) and Moore (Alvarez & Marsal) regarding disclosure statement (1.00); confer with Butler (Jones Day) regarding disclosure statement (0.40). 11/26/23 **E** P Stephens 0.50 Review and revise draft plan press release. 11/27/23 1.90 C Ball Communications with Fasano (DRVC), Jones Day team, Moore, and Ciriello (both Alvarez & Marsal) regarding plan disclosure issues (0.60); communications with Adrian (Sitrick) regarding press related issues (0.70); follow up with regards to revisions to press release and related items with Adrian (Sitrick) (0.60). 11/27/23 10.60 A M Butler Review and revise plan and disclosure statement for filing (8.00); call with client regarding same (1.00); call with parish counsel (Slome, Driscoll, Heuer, McMahon, Hulme) regarding plan issues (0.70); call with Jones Day team regarding upcoming status conference (0.70); further call with client regarding status of plan items (0.20). 11/27/23 C J Farley 4.30 Review and revise notices filed with the disclosure statement and plan. 11/27/23 2.70CILi Review and analyze article plan (1.70); review and analyze disclosure statement (1.00). 11/27/23 B Rosenblum 5.70 Call with Fasano, Renker (both DRVC), Butler, Ball (both Jones Day) and Moore (Alvarez & Marsal) regarding disclosure statement (0.90); confer with Butler (Jones Day) regarding same (0.10); communicate with parish counsel regarding plan and disclosure statement (0.50); review plan, solicitation motion and disclosure statement (3.80); confer with Ball (Jones Day) regarding case strategy (0.20); confer with Ball (Jones Day) regarding plan and disclosure statement (0.10); confer with Butler (Jones Day) regarding same (0.10) 11/27/23 3.60 A Sapp Review correspondence from Butler (Jones Day) regarding meeting with Epiq and edits to ballots (0.10); review Epiq edits to ballots and discuss with Butler (Jones Day) prior to meeting regarding same (0.30); attend meeting with Epiq Restructuring and write up/review notes from meeting (0.30); revise ballots after receiving comments from Epiq (1.80); review docket in BSA for transcript regarding ballot issues (0.20); prepare ballots and cover letter for filing (0.90).

11/27/23 N P Yeary 7 30 Analyze comments to solicitation documents from Epiq (0.70); confer with Butler (Jones Day) and Epiq team 20-12345-mg Doc 2763 Filed 12/29/23 Entered 12/29/23 14:21:24 Main Document Pg 51 of 53 **JONES DAY** 131253 Page: 41 December 29, 2023 Diocese of Rockville Centre Invoice: 230910170 Date of Service Timekeeper/Fee Earner Name Hours concerning same (0.50); analyze solicitation related materials (0.50); revise solicitation procedures motion, procedures and order (1.50); proof read solicitation procedures motion, procedures and order (2.00); further revisions to solicitation documents, compile for filing (0.50); conversation with Butler regarding service of motion and notices (0.30); attention to service of notices and motion (0.60); communicate with Butler, Sapp, and Farley (all Jones Day) concerning plan related document filings (0.40); emails to Epiq concerning service (0.30). 11/28/23 0.70 C Ball Confer with Butler (Jones Day) regarding plan schedule and hearing. A M Butler 11/28/23 3.30 Call with client regarding plan issues (1.50); call with Jones Day team (Ball, Rosenblum, Stephens) and Alvarez & Marsal team (Ciriello, Moore) (1.00); review next steps on plan issues (0.80). 11/28/23 C Cundra 0.60 Review plan, disclosure statement and motion for combined hearing. 11/28/23 **B** Rosenblum 1.00Communicate with Butler, Ball (both Jones Day), Ciriello and Moore (both Alvarez & Marsal) regarding disclosure statement (0.80); confer with Stephens (Jones Day) regarding same (0.20). 11/28/23 **E** P Stephens 0.90 Teleconference with Ball, Rosenblum, Butler (all Jones Day), Moore, and Ciriello (both Alvarez & Marsal) regarding draft disclosure statement. 2.00 11/28/23 N P Yearv Emails with Butler (Jones Day) concerning plan related research workstream and next steps (0.30); analyze materials related to plan related briefing (1.00); revise plan related research outline (0.70). 11/29/23 C Ball 3.30 Call with Reed Smith and Jones Day teams regarding next steps (1.40); update regarding liquidity with Ciriello, Moore (both Alvarez & Marsal), Butler, and Rosenblum (both Jones Day) (0.80); review strategy with Geremia, Rosenblum, and Stephens (all Jones Day) (1.10). 11/29/23 A M Butler 6.40 Work in process call with Jones Day team (Ball, Rosenblum), Alvarez & Marsal team (Moore, Ciriello), Reed Smith team (Kramer, Berringer, Law) regarding plan issues (1.10); follow up with Ciriello (Alvarez & Marsal) regarding same (0.40); call with CemCo team (Steinberg, Garry) and Ball (Jones Day) and Ciriello (Alvarez & Marsal) (0.60); follow up with Rosenblum (Jones Day) regarding plan issues (0.60); attend to plan scheduling issues (0.60); review next steps on plan items (1.00); call with Alvarez & Marsal team (Moore, Ciriello) regarding plan issues (1.10); follow up with Jones Day team (Ball, Rosenblum, Geremia, Stephens) regarding plan and litigation issues (1.00). 11/29/23 B Rosenblum 0.40 Confer with Butler (Jones Day) regarding plan. N P Yeary 1.20 11/29/23 Prepare a research outline for plan related issues (1.00); emails to Butler (Jones Day) concerning same (0.20). 11/30/23 4.90 A M Butler Review and attend to next steps on plan and disclosure statement process (2.50); call with client and Ball (Jones Day), Ciriello (Alvarez & Marsal) regarding plan financing (0.40); assist in responses to inquiries on plan items (1.00); review plan issues with Ciriello (Alvarez & Marsal) (1.00). 11/30/23 T R Geremia 0.80

Draft and revise response to press inquiry regarding plan and state court litigation.

20-12345-mg Doc 2763 Filed 12/29/23 Entered 12/29/23 14:21:24 Main Document Pg 52 of 53

JONES DAY

Date of Service Timekeeper/Fee Earner Name Hours 11/30/23 B Rosenblum 1.40 Confer with Gugg (Jones Day) regarding disclosure statement exhibit (0.30); revise disclosure statement exhibit (0.90); confer with Butler (Jones Day) regarding solicitation procedures (0.20). 1.90 11/30/23 N P Yeary Revise proposed order approving solicitation procedures (0.70); confer with Butler (Jones Day) concerning plan related research workstream (0.50); analyze fee related materials (0.50); research concerning procedures for revised proposed order approving solicitation procedures and disclosure statement (0.20).

Matter Total

516.10

131253

Diocese of Rockville Centre

December 29, 2023

Invoice: 230910170

Page: 42

20-12345-mg Doc 2763 Filed 12/29/23 Entered 12/29/23 14:21:24 Main Document Pg 53 of 53 JONES DAY

131253

Diocese of Rockville Centre

Page: 43 December 29, 2023 Invoice: 230910170

Disbursement Detail

Date	Timekeeper/Fee Earner Name	Location	Amount	Total
Case Administration				
COMPUTERIZED RE	SEADOU SEDVICES			
11/07/23	P E Smith	NYC	22.75	
Vendor: Courtale	ert Com Inc; Invoice#: 121013-2310; Date: 10/31/2023 - (October 2023		
Computerized Research	Services Subtotal			22.75
COURT REPORTER F	FEES			
11/09/23	A M Butler	NYC	261.30	
1 1	LLC; Invoice#: 6960801; Date: 11/7/2023 (transcript - ca	se no. 20-1234	5 11/1/2023)	
Court Reporter Fees Subtotal				261.30
HOSTING CHARGES				
11/30/23	S M Peterson	WAS	12,624.53	
, ,	o Inc.; Invoice#: INVCUS1830157450; Date: 11/30/2023		,	2023
				12,624.53
Hosting Charges Subto	tai			12,024.55
Matter Total			USD	12,908.58