### UNITED STATES BANKRUPTCY COURT MIDDLE DISTRICT OF FLORIDA ORLANDO DIVISION

www.flmb.uscourts.gov

IN RE:

Chapter 11 Cases

**RED LOBSTER MANAGEMENT LLC,** Case No. 6:24-bk-02486-GER Jointly Administered with Case No. 6:24-bk-02487-GER **RED LOBSTER RESTAURANTS LLC,** RLSV, INC., Case No. 6:24-bk-02488-GER RED LOBSTER CANADA, INC., Case No. 6:24-bk-02489-GER RED LOBSTER HOSPITALITY LLC. Case No. 6:24-bk-02490-GER RL KANSAS LLC, Case No. 6:24-bk-02491-GER **RED LOBSTER SOURCING LLC,** Case No. 6:24-bk-02492-GER RED LOBSTER SUPPLY LLC, Case No. 6:24-bk-02493-GER RL COLUMBIA LLC. Case No. 6:24-bk-02494-GER RL OF FREDERICK, INC., Case No. 6:24-bk-02495-GER **RED LOBSTER OF TEXAS, INC.,** Case No. 6:24-bk-02496-GER RL MARYLAND, INC., Case No. 6:24-bk-02497-GER RED LOBSTER OF BEL AIR, INC., Case No. 6:24-bk-02498-GER RL SALISBURY, LLC, Case No. 6:24-bk-02499-GER **RED LOBSTER INTERNATIONAL HOLDINGS LLC.** Case No. 6:24-bk-02500-GER

Debtors.

### SUMMARY OF FIRST AND FINAL APPLICATION FOR COMPENSATION OF GENESIS CREDIT PARTNERS LLC AS FINANCIAL ADVISOR TO THE OFFICIAL COMMITTEE OF UNSECURED CREDITORS

(APPLICANT REQUESTS A HEARING ON THIS APPLICATION BE SET FOR SEPTEMBER 5, 2024 AT 10:00 A.M. (ET), WHEN OTHER MATTERS IN THE ABOVE-CAPTIONED CASES ARE ALREADY SET TO BE CONSIDERED)

1.	Name of Applicant:	Genesis Capital Partners LLC
2.	Services Provided To:	Official Committee of Unsecured Creditors
3.	Date of Retention:	June 4, 2024
4.	Period for this Application:	June 4, 2024 through September 5, 2024 <sup>1</sup>

<sup>&</sup>lt;sup>1</sup> Pursuant to the order of this Court [Docket No. 736], "[t]o be considered at the [September 5, 2024] Confirmation Hearing, fee applications (with all exhibits) must (a) be timely filed and served by the deadline listed above on (i) the Debtors; (ii) all committees that have been appointed; (iii) any chapter 11 trustee or examiner that has been appointed; and (iv) the U.S. Trustee, and (b) include an estimate of additional time and costs to be incurred from the end of the application period through the date of the Confirmation Hearing."

5. Amount of Compensation Sought:	\$1,159,085.00 (\$1,139,085.00 plus \$20,000.00 estimated prior to Confirmation Hearing)			
6. Amount of Expense Reimbursement:	\$13,240.61 (\$11,740.61 plus \$1,500 estimated prior to Confirmation Hearing)			
7. Amount of Original Retainer:	\$0.00			
8. Blended Hourly Rate:	\$597.47			
This is the Applicant's first and final application for compensation.				

### UNITED STATES BANKRUPTCY COURT MIDDLE DISTRICT OF FLORIDA ORLANDO DIVISION

www.flmb.uscourts.gov

IN RE:

Chapter 11 Cases

Case No. 6:24-bk-02486-GER **RED LOBSTER MANAGEMENT LLC,** Jointly Administered with Case No. 6:24-bk-02487-GER **RED LOBSTER RESTAURANTS LLC,** RLSV, INC., Case No. 6:24-bk-02488-GER RED LOBSTER CANADA, INC., Case No. 6:24-bk-02489-GER Case No. 6:24-bk-02490-GER RED LOBSTER HOSPITALITY LLC. Case No. 6:24-bk-02491-GER RL KANSAS LLC, Case No. 6:24-bk-02492-GER **RED LOBSTER SOURCING LLC, RED LOBSTER SUPPLY LLC,** Case No. 6:24-bk-02493-GER RL COLUMBIA LLC, Case No. 6:24-bk-02494-GER RL OF FREDERICK, INC., Case No. 6:24-bk-02495-GER **RED LOBSTER OF TEXAS, INC.,** Case No. 6:24-bk-02496-GER RL MARYLAND, INC., Case No. 6:24-bk-02497-GER RED LOBSTER OF BEL AIR, INC., Case No. 6:24-bk-02498-GER RL SALISBURY, LLC, Case No. 6:24-bk-02499-GER Case No. 6:24-bk-02500-GER **RED LOBSTER INTERNATIONAL HOLDINGS LLC,** 

Debtors.

### FIRST AND FINAL APPLICATION FOR COMPENSATION OF GENESIS CREDIT PARTNERS LLC AS FINANCIAL ADVISOR TO THE OFFICIAL COMMITTEE OF UNSECURED CREDITORS

Genesis Credit Partners LLC ("<u>GCP</u>" or "<u>Applicant</u>"), as financial advisor to the Official Committee of Unsecured Creditors (the "<u>Committee</u>") in the bankruptcy cases of the abovecaptioned debtors and debtors-in-possession (collectively, the "<u>Debtors</u>") hereby files this application (the "<u>Application</u>") for an order, pursuant to sections 328 and 330 of title 11 of the United States Code (the "<u>Bankruptcy Code</u>"), Rule 2016 of the Federal Rules of Bankruptcy Procedure (the "<u>Bankruptcy Rules</u>"), and Rule 2016-1 of the Local Rules of Bankruptcy Practice and Procedure of the United States Bankruptcy Court for the Middle District of Florida (the "<u>Local</u> Rules"), and consistent with the *Procedure Manual for the United States Bankruptcy Court for the* 

#### Case 6:24-bk-02486-GER Doc 928 Filed 08/21/24 Page 4 of 85

*Middle District of Florida* (the "<u>Procedure Manual</u>"), authorizing and approving the compensation for fees for services rendered and costs incurred by the Applicant for the period of June 4, 2024 through September 5, 2024 (the "<u>Compensation Period</u>") on a final basis. In support of the Application, the Committee respectfully represents as follows:

#### **Background**

1. On May 19, 2024 (the "<u>Petition Date</u>"), the Debtors filed voluntary petitions for relief under chapter 11 of the Bankruptcy Code in the United States Bankruptcy Court for the Middle District of Florida (the "<u>Bankruptcy Court</u>"), commencing these chapter 11 cases (the "<u>Chapter 11 Cases</u>").

2. The Debtors continue to operate their business and manage their affairs as debtorsin-possession pursuant to sections 1107(a) and 1108 of the Bankruptcy Code.

3. No trustee or examiner has been appointed in the Chapter 11 Cases.

4. On May 31, 2024, the Office of the United States Trustee appointed the Committee pursuant to section 1102(a)(1) of the Bankruptcy Code [Docket No. 250]. The Committee is comprised of nine (9) members: (i) Warner Bros. Discovery, Inc., on behalf of itself and its subsidiaries; (ii) Kenneth O. Lester Company, Inc. d/b/a Performance Food Group; (iii) Gordon Food Service Canada Ltd.; (iv) PepsiCo Sales, Inc.; (v) George Parker; (vi) Realty Income Corporation; (vii) Credera Enterprises Company, LLC; (viii) Rubin Postaer and Associates; and (ix) Provender Hall I, LLC and Provender Hall IV, LLC.

5. On June 3, 2024, the Committee selected Pachulski Stang Ziehl & Jones LLP ("<u>PSZ&J</u>") to serve as its lead counsel. On June 4, 2024, the Committee selected Pack Law to serve as its Florida counsel and Genesis Credit Partners LLC to serve as its financial adviser in the Chapter 11 Cases.

#### Case 6:24-bk-02486-GER Doc 928 Filed 08/21/24 Page 5 of 85

6. On July 25, 2024, this Court approved the employment and retention of GCP as financial advisor to the Committee [Docket No. 666] (the "<u>GCP Retention Order</u>") and the application therefor [Docket No. 490] (the "<u>GCP Retention Application</u>").

7. On July 19, 2024, the Debtors proposed the *Joint Chapter 11 Plan of Red Lobster Management LLC and Its Debtor Affiliates* [ECF. No. 631] (as may be amended, modified or supplemented, including as revised in Docket No. 733, the "<u>Plan</u>"). On July 29, 2024, this Court entered an order [Docket No. 736] (the "<u>Confirmation Scheduling Order</u>") setting a hearing for September 5, 2024 at 10:00 a.m. (ET) to consider confirmation of the Plan (the "<u>Confirmation Hearing</u>"). The Court further ordered, "[t]o be considered at the Confirmation Hearing, fee applications (with all exhibits) must (a) be timely filed and served by the deadline listed above on (i) the Debtors; (ii) all committees that have been appointed; (iii) any chapter 11 trustee or examiner that has been appointed; and (iv) the U.S. Trustee, and (b) include an estimate of additional time and costs to be incurred from the end of the application period through the date of the Confirmation Hearing." Docket No. 736, ¶ 51.

#### Jurisdiction and Venue

8. The Bankruptcy Court has jurisdiction over this matter pursuant to 28 U.S.C. §§ 157 and 1334. The Committee and the Applicant confirm their consent, pursuant to Bankruptcy Rule 7008, to the entry of a final order by the Bankruptcy Court in connection with this Application to the extent that it is later determined that the Bankruptcy Court, absent consent of the parties, cannot enter final orders or judgments in connection herewith consistent with Article III of the United States Constitution.

9. Venue is proper pursuant to 28 U.S.C. §§ 1408 and 1409.

### **Duties of the Applicant**

10. The professional services of the Applicant, as approved by the GCP Retention

Order, included:

- a. Familiarizing the Committee and its counsel with and analyzing the Debtor's budget, assets and liabilities, and overall financial condition;
- b. Reviewing financial and operational information furnished by the Debtor;
- c. Facilitating or assisting in monitoring any and all sale processes; analysis of marketing efforts, outreach and potential supplementation as requested; reviewing bidding procedures, stalking horse bids, indications of interest received, schedules of cures and asset purchase agreements, and assessing the economics thereof; interfacing with the Debtor's professionals; and advising the Committee regarding the process;
- d. Scrutinizing the economic terms of various agreements;
- e. Monitoring and updating the Committee on Debtors' proposed turnaround and operational improvement plans and analyzing any forecast economics and financials;
- f. Assessing the Debtors' proposed store lease rejections, including analysis of store economics, economic potential and remedies available;
- g. Assessing the Debtors' various pleadings and proposed treatment of unsecured creditor claims therefrom;
- h. Preparing, or reviewing as applicable, avoidance action and claim analyses and other investigative analyses as requested by the Committee and counsel;
- i. Investigation and assessment of various past financial and other transactions by the Debtors and the management team;
- j. Assisting the Committee in reviewing the Debtors' financial reports, including, but not limited to, statements of financial affairs, schedules of assets and liabilities, DIP budgets, and monthly operating reports;
- k. Advising the Committee on the current state of these chapter 11 cases;
- 1. Advising the Committee in negotiations with the Debtors and third parties as necessary;
- m. If necessary, participating as a witness in hearings before the Court with respect to matters upon which GCP has provided advice; and

n. Other activities as are approved by the Committee, the Committee's counsel, and as agreed to by GCP.

#### **Indexing of Tasks by Activity Code**

11. As set forth in the Exhibits to this Application, the Applicant has organized its time records by activity codes in accordance with the applicable guidelines. Accordingly, each of the time entries of the professionals of the Applicant have been indexed into such categories, the most relevant of which are listed below and summarized in the sections that follow:

- i. Business Analysis / Operations;
- ii. Committee Activities;
- iii. Plan & Disclosure Statement;
- iv. Litigation;
- v. Sale Process; and
- vi. Claims Analysis and Objections.

### I. Business Analysis / Operations:

12. During the Compensation Period, the Applicant's professionals analyzed and assessed diligence materials provided by the Debtors; benchmarked debtor-in-possession economics, professional and transaction fees, and sale process economics; engaged with the Debtors' advisors regarding materials provided; analyzed the four-wall profitability by store locations, rejection or retention rationales, and benchmarking metrics; monitored the progress of rent restructurings, analyzed and created scenarios with respect to concessions, and engaged with Debtors' advisors regarding such; met with Debtors' management team and advisors; analyzed the Debtors' 13 week cashflow budgets and long-range plan financial models; investigated underlying projection assumptions and created sensitized forecasts based on key business drivers; monitored and analyzed the Debtors' financial performance during the case; investigated the solvency of the

#### Case 6:24-bk-02486-GER Doc 928 Filed 08/21/24 Page 8 of 85

Debtors at various points in time and analyzed certain corporate actions; and assessed historical performance and future prospects for and benchmarked the Debtors' business, its key comparables and competitors, and the industry in which they operate for multiple purposes including plan feasibility and informing parties in interest of the credit quality of the reorganized Debtors.

13. The Applicant expended 1,265.1 hours in this category and is requesting\$715,420.00 for the services rendered in this category.

### **II.** Committee Activities:

14. During the Compensation Period, the Applicant's professionals prepared Committee update presentations and other materials including those related to case strategies; participated in regularly scheduled meetings with the Committee and its professionals, and the Debtors and their professionals; investigated issues of interest and created analyses as requested; analyzed and assessed various settlement proposals, their impacts on DIP financing, and estimated potential recovery scenarios; and conferred with Committee counsel on numerous issues of interest.

15. The Applicant expended 297.9 hours in this category and is requesting \$188,230.00 for the services rendered in this category.

#### III. Plan & Disclosure Statement:

16. During the Compensation Period, the Applicant's professionals analyzed ongoing drafts of the plan of reorganization and disclosure statement; assessed recovery scenarios with respect to valuation and liquidation analyses; assessed plan feasibility and other elements of interest with respect to unsecured creditors; and performed other research and analysis of the plan and disclosure statement data relative to comparable peers.

17. The Applicant expended 42.7 hours in this category and is requesting \$32,515.00 for the services rendered in this category.

### **IV.** Litigation:

18. During the Compensation Period, the Applicant's professionals researched and analyzed pre-petition events which led to the Debtors' chapter 11 filing; compiled a detailed request list of focus items to be produced by the Debtors and assisted the Committee's counsel in their investigation into causes of action, which remains ongoing.

19. The Applicant expended 47.9 hours in this category and is requesting \$27,350.00 for the services rendered in this category.

### V. Sale Process:

20. During the Compensation Period, the Applicant's professionals participated in weekly scheduled meetings with the Debtors' investment bankers; monitored the sale process; and analyzed proposed sale process procedures.

21. The Applicant expended 30.9 hours in this category and is requesting \$19,350.00 for the services rendered in this category.

### VI. Claims Analysis and Objections:

22. During the Compensation Period, the Applicant's professionals analyzed initial lease rejection lists, estimated and verified rejection damage claims; reviewed and analyzed proofs of claim to indicatively assess initial pool sizing estimates; assessed potential employee liability claims and sized the range of potential scenarios; and worked to understand underlying assumptions with respect to estimated claims pool and other calculations.

23. The Applicant expended 59.4 hours in this category and is requesting \$45,345.00 for the services rendered in this category.

### **Professional Compensation**

24. As set forth in the GCP Retention Application, the Committee desired to employ GCP and compensate GCP with reasonable fees to be determined by the Court. GCP received no retainer in these cases to represent the Committee. GCP's standard hourly rates, as set forth in the GCP Retention Application are:

Professional Level	<u>Per Hour (USD)</u>
Partners	\$750-\$1,000
Directors / Managing Directors	\$600-\$700
Associates/Vice-Presidents	\$450-\$550
Analysts	\$300-\$400

### **Evaluation of Services Rendered**

25. This Application has presented a summary of the nature and extent of the professional services the Applicant has rendered in connection with its representation of the Committee for which the Applicant seeks compensation. A mere reading of the time summary annexed hereto alone cannot completely reflect the full range of services the Applicant rendered and the complexity of the issues and the pressures of time and performance which have been placed on the Applicant in connection with the Chapter 11 Cases.

26. Section 330 of the Bankruptcy Code authorizes the Bankruptcy Court to award reasonable compensation for actual, necessary, services rendered by professionals employed by a committee appointed pursuant to section 1102. Courts in the Eleventh Circuit have determined "reasonableness" with reference to the twelve factors<sup>1</sup> set forth in *Johnson v. Georgia Highway* 

<sup>&</sup>lt;sup>1</sup> The 12 factors set forth in *Johnson* are: (1) the time and labor required; (2) the novelty and difficulty of the legal questions presented; (3) the skill required to perform the legal services properly; (4) the preclusion from other employment by the professional due to acceptance of the case; (5) the customary fee for similar work in the community; (6) whether the fee is fixed or contingent; (7) the time limitations imposed by the client or circumstances; (8) the amount involved and results obtained; (9) the experience, reputation and ability of the professionals; (10) the undesirability of the case; (11) the nature and length of the professional relationship with the client; and (12) awards in similar cases. *See Johnson* 488 F.2d at 717–19.

#### Case 6:24-bk-02486-GER Doc 928 Filed 08/21/24 Page 11 of 85

*Express, Inc.*, 488 F.2d 714, 717–19 (5th Cir. 1974).<sup>2</sup> See Grant v. George Schumann Tire & *Battery Co.*, 908 F.2d 874, 877–78 (11th Cir. 1990); *In re Rosenberg*, Case No. 09-13196-BKC-AJC, 2018 WL 3933661, at \*4–5 (July 5, 2018); *In re Warner*, 141 B.R. 762, 765 (M.D. Fla. 1992); *In re Blue Stone Real Estate*, 487 B.R. 573, 576 (Bankr. M.D. Fla. 2013). However, given the 1994 and 2005 amendments to the Bankruptcy Code, some of the *Johnson* factors are now subsumed or overlapped by the statute. *Id*.

27. Based on the standards set forth in section 330 of the Bankruptcy Code, the *Johnson* factors, relevant practice and case law in the Eleventh Circuit, and considering the nature, extent, and value of the Applicant's services, taking into account all relevant factors, the Applicant believes that the fair and reasonable value of its services rendered during the Compensation Period is \$1,139,085.00 for 1,906.5 hours worked, plus the actual and reasonable expenses incurred by Applicant necessary to perform its services in the amount of \$11,740.61.

28. Alternatively, the Applicant notes that the services rendered herein were "reasonably likely to benefit" the Committee at the time the services were rendered. Accordingly, under the "reasonable at the time" standard, the fees and costs sought herein should be approved. *See In re Woerner*, 783 F.3d 266, 276 (5th Cir. 2015).

29. <u>The Time Spent on Such Services</u>. The foregoing summary, together with the Exhibits attached hereto, details the time and extent of the professional services rendered by the Applicant for the benefit of the Committee during the Compensation Period. The total number of hours expended, 1,906.5, reveals the extensive time devoted to this matter by the Applicant on a vast spectrum of legal issues which arose in the Chapter 11 Cases during Compensation Period.

<sup>&</sup>lt;sup>2</sup> The Eleventh Circuit has adopted as binding precedent all cases decided by the former Fifth Circuit prior to the close of business on September 30, 1981. *See Bonner v. Prichard*, 661 F.2d 1206, 1209 (11th Cir. 1981).

#### Case 6:24-bk-02486-GER Doc 928 Filed 08/21/24 Page 12 of 85

30. <u>The Rates Charged for Services</u>. The compensation which the Applicant requests comports with the mandate of the Bankruptcy Code, which directs that services be evaluated in light of comparable services performed in non-bankruptcy cases in the community. The hourly rates charged by the Applicant, as set forth in the Exhibits attached hereto, range from \$300.00 to \$1,000.00 per hour, which is customary for professionals Florida of similar skill and experience.

31. <u>Time Commensurate with Complexity, Importance, and Nature of the Tasks</u>. The Applicant has devoted 1,906.5 hours of work in rendering services to the Committee, as more fully described in the Exhibits attached hereto. The fees requested represent a blended hourly rate of \$597.47. The Applicant respectfully submits that, in light of the results obtained, complexity of the issues addressed, importance of the tasks completed, and quality of the work product provided to the Committee and paper filed with the Bankruptcy Court, the aforementioned time is wholly commensurate with the tasks rendered and the rate applicable to such time is wholly reasonable.

32. <u>Skill and Expertise</u>. The Applicant is a financial advising firm that has demonstrated, both in the Chapter 11 Cases and others of like complexity, its skill and expertise in the practice of bankruptcy law. As the GCP Retention Application makes clear and states in greater detail, the relief requested herein is commensurate with the skill and expertise of the Applicant.

33. <u>Preclusion from Other Employment</u>. As set forth above and in the Exhibits attached hereto, the Applicant has devoted 1,906.5 hours of work in rendering services to the Committee. While the Applicant is aware of no other specific employment that was precluded wholesale as a result of the Applicant accepting these Chapter 11 Cases, had the Applicant not accepted employment in the Chapter 11 Cases, the 1,906.5 hours spent in the Chapter 11 Cases would have been spent on other matters that would pay an hourly compensation at the same rates as those discussed herein.

#### Case 6:24-bk-02486-GER Doc 928 Filed 08/21/24 Page 13 of 85

34. <u>Reasonable Compensation when Compared to Non-Chapter 11 Cases</u>. As set forth above and in the Exhibits attached hereto, the hourly rates charged by the Applicant range from \$300.00 to \$1,000.00 per hour, which is customary for (if not less than) professionals Florida of similar skill and experience.

### **Estimating Fees and Expenses to be Incurred Between the Date Hereof and the Confirmation Hearing**

35. Consistent with the terms of the Confirmation Scheduling Order, the Applicant estimates that it shall incur approximately \$21,500.00 for services rendered and out-of-pocket expenses incurred on behalf of the Committee between the date hereof and the Confirmation Hearing. The Applicant shall submit to this Court, prior to the Confirmation Hearing, a supplement to this Application documenting time expended and expenses incurred during such period.

[Remainder of Page Intentionally Left Blank]

### Case 6:24-bk-02486-GER Doc 928 Filed 08/21/24 Page 14 of 85

WHEREFORE, the Applicant respectfully requests the Bankruptcy Court enter an order (i) awarding the Applicant, on a final basis, the sum of \$1,139,085.00, as compensation for services rendered during the Compensation Period, and the sum of \$11,740.61, as reimbursement for actual and necessary expenses incurred during the Compensation Period, plus such other amounts as may be supplemented hereto prior to the Confirmation Hearing; (ii) authorizing and directing the Debtors' estates to pay to the Applicant, upon entry of an Order awarding the fees and expenses requested in this Application, all such fees and expenses; and (iii) granting such other and further relief as the Bankruptcy Court deems appropriate.

Dated: August 21, 2024

### **GENESIS CREDIT PARTNERS, LLC**

By: /s/ Edward Kim By: Edward Kim Title: Partner

Financial Advisor to the Official Committee of Unsecured Creditors

Submitted by:

PACK LAW 51 Northeast 24th Street, Suite 108 Miami, Florida 33137 Telephone: (305) 916-4500

By: /s/ Jessey J. Krehl

Joseph A. Pack Email: joe@packlaw.com Florida Bar No. 117882 Jessey J. Krehl Email: jessey@packlaw.com Florida Bar No. 1025848

Local Counsel to the Official Committee of Unsecured Creditors

Filer's Attestation: Pursuant to Local Rule 1001-2(g)(3) regarding signatures, Joseph A. Pack, Esq. attests that concurrence in the filing of this paper has been obtained.

### <u>CERTIFICATION REQUIRED BY</u> <u>THE GUIDELINES AND REVISED UST GUIDELINES</u><sup>3</sup>

1. I have been designated by the Applicant as the professional with responsibility in this case for compliance with the Revised UST Guidelines.

2. I have read the Applicant's Application for compensation and reimbursement of expenses. The Application complies with the Revised UST Guidelines, and the fees and expenses sought fall within the Revised UST Guidelines, except as specifically noted in this certification and described in the application.

3. The fees and expenses sought are billed at rates and in accordance with practices customarily employed by the Applicant and generally accepted by the Applicant's clients.

4. In seeking reimbursement for the expenditures described in the Exhibits attached hereto, the Applicant is seeking reimbursement only for the actual expenditure and has not marked up the actual cost to provide a profit or to recover the amortized cost of investment in staff time or equipment or capital outlay (except to the extent that the Applicant has elected to charge for inhouse photocopies and outgoing facsimile transmissions at the maximum rates permitted by the Revised UST Guidelines.

5. Furthermore, I make the following in statements in compliance with the Revised UST Guidelines:

- a. to the best of my knowledge, information, and belief, formed after reasonable inquiry, the fees and disbursements sought in the Application are permissible under the relevant rules, court orders, and Bankruptcy Code provisions, except as specifically set forth herein;
- b. except to the extent disclosed in the Application, the fees and disbursements sought in the Application are billed at rates customarily employed by the Applicant and generally accepted by the Applicant's clients. In addition, none of the professionals seeking compensation varied their hourly rate based on the geographic location of the Debtors' cases;
- c. The Applicant is seeking compensation with respect to approximately 0.0 hours and \$0.00 in fees spent reviewing or revising time records and preparing, reviewing, and revising invoices, including to redact privileged or confidential information;<sup>4</sup>
- d. The Application does not include any rate increases since retention;

<sup>&</sup>lt;sup>3</sup> While the Guidelines for Reviewing Applications for Compensation and Reimbursement of Expenses Filed Under 11 U.S.C. § 330 by Attorneys in Larger Chapter 11 Cases Effective As of November 1, 2013 (the "<u>Revised UST</u> <u>Guidelines</u>"), by their very terms cover only attorneys, I nevertheless submit this certification in an abundance of caution.

<sup>&</sup>lt;sup>4</sup> This is limited to work involved in preparing and editing billing records that would not be compensable outside of bankruptcy and does not include reasonable fees for preparing a fee application.

- e. in providing a reimbursable expense, the Applicant does not make a profit on that expense, whether the service is performed by the Applicant in-house or through a third party;
- f. in accordance with Rule 2016(a) of the Federal Rules of Bankruptcy Procedure and 11 U.S.C. § 504, no agreement or understanding exists between the Applicant and any other person for the sharing of compensation to be received in connection with the above cases except as authorized pursuant to the Bankruptcy Code, Bankruptcy Rules, and Local Rules; and
- g. All services for which compensation is sought were professional services on behalf of the Committee and not on behalf of any other person.

6. The following are the variances with the provisions of the Revised UST Guidelines, the date of the specific Court order approving the variance, and the justification for the variance: None.

I HEREBY CERTIFY the foregoing is true and correct this 21st day of August, 2024.

By: <u>/s/ Edward Kim</u> Edward Kim, Partner

### **<u>Certificate of Service</u>**

I HEREBY CERTIFY that a true and correct copy of the foregoing was served this August

21, 2024 to all interested parties registered to receive e-mail notice/service for this case via

CM/ECF Notice of Electronic Filing.

By: /s/ Jessey J. Krehl

Jessey J. Krehl, Esq.

<b>COMPENSATION</b>	AND	HOURS BY	PERSON	

Name of Professional Person	Position	Hourly Billing Rate	Total Hours	Total Compensation
Edward Kim	Partner	\$1,000.00	195.8	\$195,800.00
Jorge Gonzalez	Partner	\$1,000.00	54.1	\$54,100.00
Andre Artidiello	Director	\$700.00	319.4	\$223,580.00
Eric Mendez	Director	\$700.00	349.7	\$244,790.00
Ivan Radi	Vice President	\$550.00	367.9	\$202,345.00
Vinai Sewaliah	Analyst	\$400.00	325.9	\$130,360.00
Charles Salom	Analyst	\$300.00	129.1	\$38,730.00
Pedro Leme	Analyst	\$300.00	164.6	\$49,380.00
GRAND TOTAL:	GRAND TOTAL: 1,906.5			
<b>BLENDED RATE:</b> <sup>1</sup>	BLENDED RATE:1			

<sup>&</sup>lt;sup>1</sup> The blended rate is determined based on dividing the total requested compensation by the total number of hours billed during the Fee Application Period (as defined herein).

## COMPENSATION AND HOURS BY CATEGORY

Project Category	Total Hours	Total Fees
Business Analysis / Operations	1,265.1	\$715,420.00
Case Administration	54.1	\$37,165.00
Claims Analysis and Objections	59.4	\$45,345.00
Committee Activities	297.9	\$188,230.00
Court Filings	46.2	\$23,845.00
Court Hearings	16.9	\$10,765.00
Fee / Employment Applications	3.4	\$3,400.00
Litigation	47.9	\$27,350.00
Plan & Disclosure Statement	42.7	\$32,515.00
Sale Process	30.9	\$19,350.00
Travel Time	42.0	\$35,700.00
GRAND TOTAL:	1,906.5	\$1,139,085.00

### EXPENSE SUMMARY

Expense Category	Total Expenses
Airfare	\$1,828.95
Data Connectivity	\$58.00
Information Technology	\$3,235.53
Lodging	\$548.71
Meals	\$3,932.36
Research	\$125.00
Transportation	\$2,012.06
GRAND TOTAL:	\$11,740.61



CREDIT PARTNERS

# INVOICE

From

### Genesis Credit Partners

701 Brickell Avenue Suite 1480 Miami, FL 33131 www.gencp.com

Invoice For	Red Lobster	Invoice ID	2024-RL-1
	1	Issue Date	08/21/2024
		Due Date	09/05/2024

Subject Professional services rendered

Item Type	Description	Time (in hours)	Rate	Amount
Service	06/04/2024 - Committee - Business Analysis / Operations / Edward Kim: Selection, research and analysis of valuation comparable companies.	2.00	\$1,000.00	\$2,000.00
Service	06/04/2024 - Committee - Business Analysis / Operations / Edward Kim: Initial review of VDR materials.	1.60	\$1,000.00	\$1,600.00
Service	06/04/2024 - Committee - Court Filings / Andre Artidiello: Review of DIP Motion.	2.40	\$700.00	\$1,680.00
Service	06/04/2024 - Committee - Business Analysis / Operations / Andre Artidiello: Multiple communications with Debtor FA re kick-off call and VDR.	0.50	\$700.00	\$350.00
Service	06/04/2024 - Committee - Court Filings / Andre Artidiello: Review of first day declaration.	1.90	\$700.00	\$1,330.00
Service	06/04/2024 - Committee - Business Analysis / Operations / Andre Artidiello: Review and analysis of DIP budget.	1.30	\$700.00	\$910.00
Service	06/05/2024 - Committee - Committee Activities / Ivan Radi: Prepare committee presentation materials including organization chart.	1.50	\$550.00	\$825.00
Service	06/05/2024 - Committee - Business Analysis / Operations / Ivan Radi: Multiple communications with GCP team re lease rejections and stalking horse protections.	1.20	\$550.00	\$660.00
Service	06/05/2024 - Committee - Court Filings / Ivan Radi: Review recent court filings including docket nos. 43, 49, 37, 41, and 21.	2.90	\$550.00	\$1,595.00
Service	06/05/2024 - Committee - Business Analysis / Operations / Ivan Radi: Begin review and analysis of diligence production materials including CIM, corporate info., and employee info.	2.80	\$550.00	\$1,540.00
Service	06/05/2024 - Committee - Fee / Employment Applications / Edward Kim: Conflict and matter search.	1.00	\$1,000.00	\$1,000.00

Service	06/05/2024 - Committee - Business Analysis / Operations / Vinai Sewaliah: Review and analysis of historical store performance data.	2.10	\$400.00	\$840.00
Service	06/05/2024 - Committee - Business Analysis / Operations / Vinai Sewaliah: Continue review and analysis of historical store performance data.	2.30	\$400.00	\$920.00
Service	06/05/2024 - Committee - Sale Process / Vinai Sewaliah: Review and analysis of asset purchase agreement terms.	1.90	\$400.00	\$760.00
Service	06/05/2024 - Committee - Sale Process / Vinai Sewaliah: Review and analysis of bidding procedures order and sale process.	2.00	\$400.00	\$800.00
Service	06/05/2024 - Committee - Sale Process / Vinai Sewaliah: Continue review and analysis of bidding procedures order and sale process.	1.80	\$400.00	\$720.00
Service	06/05/2024 - Committee - Business Analysis / Operations / Eric Mendez: Begin working on DRL.	1.30	\$700.00	\$910.00
Service	06/05/2024 - Committee - Sale Process / Andre Artidiello: Review and analysis of CIM.	2.30	\$700.00	\$1,610.00
Service	06/05/2024 - Committee - Claims Analysis and Objections / Andre Artidiello: Review and updates to lease rejection analysis.	2.80	\$700.00	\$1,960.00
Service	06/05/2024 - Committee - Committee Activities / Andre Artidiello: Review and updates to committee presentation materials.	1.90	\$700.00	\$1,330.00
Service	06/05/2024 - Committee - Court Filings / Pedro Leme: Review and analysis of court filings including docket nos. 1, 10, 160, 209 and 25.	1.80	\$300.00	\$540.00
Service	06/05/2024 - Committee - Court Filings / Pedro Leme: Continue review and analysis of court filings including docket nos. 205, 127, 27, 280 and 39.	1.60	\$300.00	\$480.00
Service	06/05/2024 - Committee - Business Analysis / Operations / Pedro Leme: Research and analysis of comparable financial advisor fees.	1.70	\$300.00	\$510.00
Service	06/05/2024 - Committee - Business Analysis / Operations / Pedro Leme: Research and analysis of comparable investment banker fees.	1.50	\$300.00	\$450.00
Service	06/05/2024 - Committee - Business Analysis / Operations / Pedro Leme: Continue research and analysis of comparable financial advisor fees.	2.80	\$300.00	\$840.00
Service	06/05/2024 - Committee - Business Analysis / Operations / Pedro Leme: Additional review and analysis of comparable investment banker fees.	1.80	\$300.00	\$540.00
Service	06/05/2024 - Committee - Business Analysis / Operations / Charles Salom: Review court filings, including docket nos. 6, 43, 77.	2.10	\$300.00	\$630.00
Service	06/05/2024 - Committee - Business Analysis / Operations / Charles Salom: Review court filings, including docket nos. 6, 43, 77.	3.10	\$300.00	\$930.00
Service	06/05/2024 - Committee - Business Analysis / Operations / Charles Salom: Analysis of comparable Hilco banker compensation.	2.20	\$300.00	\$660.00

Service	06/05/2024 - Committee - Business Analysis / Operations / Charles Salom: Continue review and analysis of comparable Hilco banker compensation.	3.00	\$300.00	\$900.00
Service	06/05/2024 - Committee - Business Analysis / Operations / Jorge González: Multiple communications with GCP team re lease rejections and stalking horse protections.	1.20	\$1,000.00	\$1,200.00
Service	06/05/2024 - Committee - Business Analysis / Operations / Vinai Sewaliah: Multiple communications with GCP team re lease rejections and stalking horse protections.	1.20	\$400.00	\$480.00
Service	06/05/2024 - Committee - Business Analysis / Operations / Eric Mendez: Multiple communications with GCP team re lease rejections and stalking horse protections.	1.20	\$700.00	\$840.00
Service	06/06/2024 - Committee - Business Analysis / Operations / Edward Kim: Kick-off call with GCP, AM, Hilco and KSCP teams.	1.30	\$1,000.00	\$1,300.00
Service	06/06/2024 - Committee - Business Analysis / Operations / Edward Kim: Follow-up GCP discussion re next steps and secured lender issues.	0.70	\$1,000.00	\$700.00
Service	06/06/2024 - Committee - Case Administration / Edward Kim: Review and comments to DRL.	0.60	\$1,000.00	\$600.00
Service	06/06/2024 - Committee - Claims Analysis and Objections / Edward Kim: Analysis of proposed lease rejections and research VDR for data to size impact.	2.00	\$1,000.00	\$2,000.00
Service	06/06/2024 - Committee - Business Analysis / Operations / Ivan Radi: Kick-off call with GCP, AM, Hilco and KSCP teams.	1.30	\$550.00	\$715.00
Service	06/06/2024 - Committee - Business Analysis / Operations / Ivan Radi: Follow-up GCP discussion re next steps and secured lender issues.	0.70	\$550.00	\$385.00
Service	06/06/2024 - Committee - Business Analysis / Operations / Ivan Radi: Review and analysis of diligence production materials including RE store details, lease analysis and SQ by location.	2.80	\$550.00	\$1,540.00
Service	06/06/2024 - Committee - Business Analysis / Operations / Ivan Radi: Continue review and analysis of diligence production materials including RE store details, lease analysis and SQ by location.	2.40	\$550.00	\$1,320.00
Service	06/06/2024 - Committee - Case Administration / Ivan Radi: Updates and commentary to diligence request list.	1.90	\$550.00	\$1,045.00
Service	06/06/2024 - Committee - Business Analysis / Operations / Vinai Sewaliah: Kick-off call with GCP, AM, Hilco and KSCP teams.	1.30	\$400.00	\$520.00
Service	06/06/2024 - Committee - Business Analysis / Operations / Vinai Sewaliah: Review and analysis of FDD and RSA.	1.80	\$400.00	\$720.00
Service	06/06/2024 - Committee - Business Analysis / Operations / Vinai Sewaliah: Review and analysis of Hilco retention application.	0.90	\$400.00	\$360.00
Service	06/06/2024 - Committee - Business Analysis / Operations / Vinai Sewaliah: Analysis of comparable investment banker fees.	2.60	\$400.00	\$1,040.00
Service	06/06/2024 - Committee - Business Analysis / Operations / Vinai Sewaliah: Continue analysis of comparable investment banker fees.	1.70	\$400.00	\$680.00

Service	06/06/2024 - Committee - Case Administration / Eric Mendez: Continue working on next draft of DRL.	3.00	\$700.00	\$2,100.00
Service	06/06/2024 - Committee - Case Administration / Eric Mendez: Finalize DRL.	2.70	\$700.00	\$1,890.00
Service	06/06/2024 - Committee - Business Analysis / Operations / Eric Mendez: Kick-off call with GCP, AM, Hilco and KSCP teams.	1.30	\$700.00	\$910.00
Service	06/06/2024 - Committee - Business Analysis / Operations / Eric Mendez: Cross-check AM VDR against final DRL prior to sending to Debtors.	1.80	\$700.00	\$1,260.00
Service	06/06/2024 - Committee - Business Analysis / Operations / Eric Mendez: Read CIM ahead of further diligence requests.	2.00	\$700.00	\$1,400.00
Service	06/06/2024 - Committee - Business Analysis / Operations / Andre Artidiello: Kick-off call with GCP, AM, Hilco and KSCP teams.	1.30	\$700.00	\$910.00
Service	06/06/2024 - Committee - Business Analysis / Operations / Andre Artidiello: Analysis of store-level financials and 4-wall profitability.	2.70	\$700.00	\$1,890.00
Service	06/06/2024 - Committee - Business Analysis / Operations / Andre Artidiello: Continue analysis of store-level financials and 4-wall profitability.	1.90	\$700.00	\$1,330.00
Service	06/06/2024 - Committee - Business Analysis / Operations / Andre Artidiello: Follow-up GCP discussion re next steps and secured lender issues.	0.70	\$700.00	\$490.00
Service	06/06/2024 - Committee - Court Filings / Pedro Leme: Further review and analysis of court filings including docket nos. 259, 10, 160, 209 and 69.	0.90	\$300.00	\$270.00
Service	06/06/2024 - Committee - Business Analysis / Operations / Jorge González: Kick-off call with GCP, AM, Hilco and KSCP teams.	1.30	\$1,000.00	\$1,300.00
Service	06/06/2024 - Committee - Court Filings / Pedro Leme: Ongoing review of court filings including docket nos. 2, 190, 89, 209 and 97.	0.80	\$300.00	\$240.00
Service	06/06/2024 - Committee - Business Analysis / Operations / Jorge González: Follow-up GCP discussion re next steps and secured lender issues.	0.70	\$1,000.00	\$700.00
Service	06/07/2024 - Committee - Case Administration / Ivan Radi: Reviewed and supplemented DRL with E. Mendez.	0.70	\$550.00	\$385.00
Service	06/07/2024 - Committee - Business Analysis / Operations / Ivan Radi: Finalize review and analysis of diligence production materials including RE store details, lease analysis and SQ by location.	2.20	\$550.00	\$1,210.00
Service	06/07/2024 - Committee - Sale Process / Ivan Radi: Multiple communications with V. Sewaliah re sale procedures.	1.30	\$550.00	\$715.00
Service	06/07/2024 - Committee - Claims Analysis and Objections / Edward Kim: Research WARN act class issues, priority classifications and other relevant issues.	2.00	\$1,000.00	\$2,000.00
Service	06/07/2024 - Committee - Fee / Employment Applications / Edward Kim: Correspondence with counsel regarding retention.	0.50	\$1,000.00	\$500.00

Service	06/07/2024 - Committee - Sale Process / Vinai Sewaliah: Multiple communications with I. Radi re sale procedures.	1.30	\$400.00	\$520.00
Service	06/07/2024 - Committee - Business Analysis / Operations / Vinai Sewaliah: Review and analysis of transaction materials.	1.90	\$400.00	\$760.00
Service	06/07/2024 - Committee - Claims Analysis and Objections / Vinai Sewaliah: Review and analysis of proposed lease rejections and lease data.	2.10	\$400.00	\$840.00
Service	06/07/2024 - Committee - Claims Analysis and Objections / Vinai Sewaliah: Continue review and analysis of proposed lease rejections and lease data.	1.70	\$400.00	\$680.00
Service	06/07/2024 - Committee - Claims Analysis and Objections / Vinai Sewaliah: Finish review and analysis of proposed lease rejections and lease data.	1.30	\$400.00	\$520.00
Service	06/07/2024 - Committee - Business Analysis / Operations / Eric Mendez: Reviewed and supplemented DRL with I. Radi.	0.70	\$700.00	\$490.00
Service	06/07/2024 - Committee - Business Analysis / Operations / Eric Mendez: Begin reviewing DIP model and associated schedules.	3.00	\$700.00	\$2,100.00
Service	06/07/2024 - Committee - Business Analysis / Operations / Eric Mendez: Continue reviewing DIP budget model and associated schedules.	2.80	\$700.00	\$1,960.00
Service	06/07/2024 - Committee - Committee Activities / Eric Mendez: Call with creditor and GCP team.	0.60	\$700.00	\$420.00
Service	06/07/2024 - Committee - Claims Analysis and Objections / Eric Mendez: Reviewed WARN guidance received on earlier call with counsel.	1.10	\$700.00	\$770.00
Service	06/07/2024 - Committee - Business Analysis / Operations / Eric Mendez: Review Docket 21 and DIP model with regard to 503(b) (9).	1.20	\$700.00	\$840.00
Service	06/07/2024 - Committee - Case Administration / Andre Artidiello: Review and updates to diligence request list.	1.40	\$700.00	\$980.00
Service	06/07/2024 - Committee - Business Analysis / Operations / Andre Artidiello: Review and analysis of diligence production materials.	2.80	\$700.00	\$1,960.00
Service	06/07/2024 - Committee - Committee Activities / Andre Artidiello: Call with creditor and GCP team.	0.60	\$700.00	\$420.00
Service	06/07/2024 - Committee - Claims Analysis and Objections / Andre Artidiello: Research into WARN obligations per UCC request.	2.10	\$700.00	\$1,470.00
Service	06/07/2024 - Committee - Business Analysis / Operations / Pedro Leme: Research and analysis of comparable compensation packages for investment bankers.	1.80	\$300.00	\$540.00
Service	06/07/2024 - Committee - Business Analysis / Operations / Pedro Leme: Continue research and analysis of comparable compensation packages for investment bankers.	2.30	\$300.00	\$690.00
Service	06/07/2024 - Committee - Business Analysis / Operations / Pedro Leme: Multiple communications with I. Radi and C. Salom re spreading of historical financials.	0.90	\$300.00	\$270.00

Service	06/07/2024 - Committee - Business Analysis / Operations / Charles Salom: Research and analysis of comparable financial advisors compensation.	1.70	\$300.00	\$510.00
Service	06/07/2024 - Committee - Business Analysis / Operations / Charles Salom: Continue analysis of comparable financial advisors compensation.	2.50	\$300.00	\$750.00
Service	06/07/2024 - Committee - Business Analysis / Operations / Charles Salom: Ongoing research of comparable financial advisors compensation.	2.30	\$300.00	\$690.00
Service	06/07/2024 - Committee - Committee Activities / Jorge González: Call with creditor and GCP team.	0.60	\$1,000.00	\$600.00
Service	06/07/2024 - Committee - Business Analysis / Operations / Charles Salom: Multiple communications with I. Radi and P. Leme re spreading of historical financials.	0.90	\$300.00	\$270.00
Service	06/07/2024 - Committee - Business Analysis / Operations / Ivan Radi: Multiple communications with P. Leme and C. Salom re spreading of historical financials.	0.90	\$550.00	\$495.00
Service	06/08/2024 - Committee - Business Analysis / Operations / Vinai Sewaliah: Review and analysis of historical company financials.	1.90	\$400.00	\$760.00
Service	06/08/2024 - Committee - Business Analysis / Operations / Vinai Sewaliah: Continue review and analysis of historical company financials.	2.30	\$400.00	\$920.00
Service	06/08/2024 - Committee - Business Analysis / Operations / Vinai Sewaliah: Finish review and analysis of historical company financials.	1.10	\$400.00	\$440.00
Service	06/08/2024 - Committee - Committee Activities / Andre Artidiello: Multiple communications with I. Radi re second day hearing matters.	1.30	\$700.00	\$910.00
Service	06/08/2024 - Committee - Committee Activities / Andre Artidiello: Review and updates to committee presentation materials.	2.70	\$700.00	\$1,890.00
Service	06/08/2024 - Committee - Committee Activities / Andre Artidiello: Continue updates to committee presentation materials.	1.90	\$700.00	\$1,330.00
Service	06/08/2024 - Committee - Committee Activities / Ivan Radi: Multiple communications with A. Artidiello re second day hearing matters.	1.30	\$550.00	\$715.00
Service	06/08/2024 - Committee - Business Analysis / Operations / Ivan Radi: Multiple communications with V. Sewaliah re real estate advisor comparables.	1.10	\$550.00	\$605.00
Service	06/08/2024 - Committee - Business Analysis / Operations / Vinai Sewaliah: Multiple communications with I. Radi re real estate advisor comparables.	1.10	\$400.00	\$440.00
Service	06/09/2024 - Committee - Business Analysis / Operations / Edward Kim: Analysis of marketing materials and historical information.	1.50	\$1,000.00	\$1,500.00
Service	06/09/2024 - Committee - Business Analysis / Operations / Edward Kim: Analysis of TWCF model and audit of formulas, base data and dependencies.	2.00	\$1,000.00	\$2,000.00

Service	06/09/2024 - Committee - Business Analysis / Operations / Edward Kim: Analysis of interested party long range model and review of store-level financial data and availability of certain datatypes.	2.80	\$1,000.00	\$2,800.00
Service	06/09/2024 - Committee - Business Analysis / Operations / Edward Kim: Analysis of additional VDR materials and comments and questions to group.	1.80	\$1,000.00	\$1,800.00
Service	06/09/2024 - Committee - Business Analysis / Operations / Edward Kim: Analysis of media and other sources documenting growth and bankruptcy.	1.10	\$1,000.00	\$1,100.00
Service	06/09/2024 - Committee - Business Analysis / Operations / Eric Mendez: Review of Ordinary Course Professionals summary to evaluate reasonableness of fees.	1.00	\$700.00	\$700.00
Service	06/09/2024 - Committee - Business Analysis / Operations / Andre Artidiello: Review and updates to DIP comparables analysis.	2.80	\$700.00	\$1,960.00
Service	06/09/2024 - Committee - Business Analysis / Operations / Andre Artidiello: Continue review and updates to DIP comparables analysis.	1.30	\$700.00	\$910.00
Service	06/09/2024 - Committee - Business Analysis / Operations / Andre Artidiello: Review and updates to banker retention economics analysis.	2.20	\$700.00	\$1,540.00
Service	06/09/2024 - Committee - Business Analysis / Operations / Andre Artidiello: Continue review and updates to banker retention economics analysis.	1.90	\$700.00	\$1,330.00
Service	06/09/2024 - Committee - Business Analysis / Operations / Andre Artidiello: Multiple communications with I. Radi and V. Sewaliah re banker comps.	1.60	\$700.00	\$1,120.00
Service	06/09/2024 - Committee - Court Filings / Andre Artidiello: Review of court filings including docket nos. 93, 37, and 25	2.40	\$700.00	\$1,680.00
Service	06/09/2024 - Committee - Business Analysis / Operations / Ivan Radi: Multiple communications with A. Artidiello and V. Sewaliah re banker comps.	1.60	\$550.00	\$880.00
Service	06/09/2024 - Committee - Court Filings / Ivan Radi: Review recent court filings including docket nos. 53, 54, 69, 93, and 143.	2.60	\$550.00	\$1,430.00
Service	06/09/2024 - Committee - Business Analysis / Operations / Ivan Radi: Review and commentary to 4-wall EBITDA analysis.	2.10	\$550.00	\$1,155.00
Service	06/09/2024 - Committee - Business Analysis / Operations / Ivan Radi: Cross-reference lease rejection motions vs. profitability analysis.	1.70	\$550.00	\$935.00
Service	06/09/2024 - Committee - Business Analysis / Operations / Ivan Radi: Review and analysis of comparable real estate advisor retentions.	2.70	\$550.00	\$1,485.00
Service	06/09/2024 - Committee - Business Analysis / Operations / Vinai Sewaliah: Multiple communications with I. Radi and A. Artidiello re banker comps.	1.60	\$400.00	\$640.00
Service	06/09/2024 - Committee - Business Analysis / Operations / Vinai Sewaliah: Review and analysis of Keen Summit retention application.	0.70	\$400.00	\$280.00
	1			

\$840.00	\$400.00	2.10	06/09/2024 - Committee - Business Analysis / Operations / Vinai Sewaliah: Research and analysis of comparable real estate advisor compensation.	Service
\$720.00	\$400.00	1.80	06/09/2024 - Committee - Business Analysis / Operations / Vinai Sewaliah: Continue research and analysis of comparable real estate advisor compensation.	Service
\$960.00	\$400.00	2.40	06/09/2024 - Committee - Business Analysis / Operations / Vinai Sewaliah: Finish research and analysis of comparable real estate advisor compensation.	Service
\$800.00	\$1,000.00	0.80	06/10/2024 - Committee - Case Administration / Edward Kim: Review and edits to VDR list.	Service
\$800.00	\$1,000.00	0.80	06/10/2024 - Committee - Committee Activities / Edward Kim: Call with PSZJ, PL and GCP teams re cash management.	Service
\$1,700.00	\$1,000.00	1.70	06/10/2024 - Committee - Business Analysis / Operations / Edward Kim: Analysis of cash management motion and review of org charts and VDR materials.	Service
\$3,000.00	\$1,000.00	3.00	06/10/2024 - Committee - Business Analysis / Operations / Edward Kim: Ongoing analysis of VDR materials and logging of key data.	Service
\$1,500.00	\$1,000.00	1.50	06/10/2024 - Committee - Business Analysis / Operations / Edward Kim: Analysis of KS retention benchmarking and spot research of selected comps.	Service
\$1,400.00	\$700.00	2.00	06/10/2024 - Committee - Business Analysis / Operations / Eric Mendez: Review of DIP and corrected DIP motions ahead of call with counsel.	Service
\$2,100.00	\$700.00	3.00	06/10/2024 - Committee - Business Analysis / Operations / Eric Mendez: Review of DIP model, DIP Motion and related questions.	Service
\$1,050.00	\$700.00	1.50	06/10/2024 - Committee - Business Analysis / Operations / Eric Mendez: Review, summarize, and check Customer Obligation Programs against DIP model.	Service
\$560.00	\$700.00	0.80	06/10/2024 - Committee - Business Analysis / Operations / Eric Mendez: Begin review of cash management docket no. 37.	Service
\$560.00	\$700.00	0.80	06/10/2024 - Committee - Committee Activities / Eric Mendez: Call with PSZJ, PL and GCP teams re cash management.	Service
\$560.00	\$700.00	0.80	06/10/2024 - Committee - Committee Activities / Andre Artidiello: Call with PSZJ, PL and GCP teams re cash management.	Service
\$910.00	\$700.00	1.30	06/10/2024 - Committee - Sale Process / Andre Artidiello: Review and analysis of CIM.	Service
\$2,030.00	\$700.00	2.90	06/10/2024 - Committee - Business Analysis / Operations / Andre Artidiello: Review and analysis of data room production materials.	Service
\$840.00	\$700.00	1.20	06/10/2024 - Committee - Business Analysis / Operations / Andre Artidiello: Continue review and analysis of data room production materials.	Service
\$630.00	\$700.00	0.90	06/10/2024 - Committee - Court Filings / Andre Artidiello: Review and analysis of cash management motion.	Service

Service	06/10/2024 - Committee - Committee Activities / Ivan Radi: Call with PSZJ, PL and GCP teams re cash management.	0.80	\$550.00	\$440.00
Service	06/10/2024 - Committee - Committee Activities / Vinai Sewaliah: Call with PSZJ, PL and GCP teams re cash management.	0.80	\$400.00	\$320.00
Service	06/10/2024 - Committee - Business Analysis / Operations / Vinai Sewaliah: Analysis of comparable credit bids in bankruptcies.	2.00	\$400.00	\$800.00
Service	06/10/2024 - Committee - Business Analysis / Operations / Vinai Sewaliah: Continue analysis of comparable credit bids in bankruptcies.	1.50	\$400.00	\$600.00
Service	06/10/2024 - Committee - Business Analysis / Operations / Vinai Sewaliah: Finish analysis of comparable credit bids in bankruptcies.	1.40	\$400.00	\$560.00
Service	06/10/2024 - Committee - Business Analysis / Operations / Vinai Sewaliah: Analysis of comparable investment banker transaction fee data.	2.30	\$400.00	\$920.00
Service	06/10/2024 - Committee - Business Analysis / Operations / Vinai Sewaliah: Continue analysis of comparable investment banker transaction fee data.	2.20	\$400.00	\$880.00
Service	06/10/2024 - Committee - Business Analysis / Operations / Vinai Sewaliah: Ongoing analysis of comparable investment banker transaction fee data.	2.60	\$400.00	\$1,040.00
Service	06/10/2024 - Committee - Committee Activities / Pedro Leme: Preparation of company timeline materials.	3.30	\$300.00	\$990.00
Service	06/10/2024 - Committee - Court Filings / Pedro Leme: Review court filings including docket nos. 43, 19, 88.	0.60	\$300.00	\$180.00
Service	06/10/2024 - Committee - Court Filings / Pedro Leme: Continue review and analysis of court filings including docket nos. 49, 159, 99.	1.80	\$300.00	\$540.00
Service	06/10/2024 - Committee - Business Analysis / Operations / Pedro Leme: Review and analysis of comparable Hilco investment banker fee compensation.	3.00	\$300.00	\$900.00
Service	06/10/2024 - Committee - Court Filings / Charles Salom: Review court filings including docket nos. 190, 216, 217, 308.	2.50	\$300.00	\$750.00
Service	06/10/2024 - Committee - Committee Activities / Jorge González: Call with PSZJ, PL and GCP teams re cash management.	0.80	\$1,000.00	\$800.00
Service	06/11/2024 - Committee - Claims Analysis and Objections / Edward Kim: Analysis of store lease negotiation workbooks and audit initial assessment of rejection claims.	2.00	\$1,000.00	\$2,000.00
Service	06/11/2024 - Committee - Travel Time / Edward Kim: Travel from LA-MIA for management meeting.	5.50	\$1,000.00	\$5,500.00
Service	06/11/2024 - Committee - Business Analysis / Operations / Edward Kim: Analysis of collateral and other security provisions in interim financing order.	1.90	\$1,000.00	\$1,900.00
Service	06/11/2024 - Committee - Business Analysis / Operations / Edward Kim: Review and analysis of cash management precedents and email memo.	0.80	\$1,000.00	\$800.00

Service	06/11/2024 - Committee - Business Analysis / Operations / Edward Kim: Multiple communications with GCP team re real estate advisor and investment banker retention comparables.	1.10	\$1,000.00	\$1,100.00
Service	06/11/2024 - Committee - Business Analysis / Operations / Edward Kim: Call with GCP and AM teams to discuss cash management motion and DIP budget.	0.50	\$1,000.00	\$500.00
Service	06/11/2024 - Committee - Court Filings / Edward Kim: Review and comments to financing objection.	1.00	\$1,000.00	\$1,000.00
Service	06/11/2024 - Committee - Business Analysis / Operations / Edward Kim: Debrief with GCP team re cash management.	0.70	\$1,000.00	\$700.00
Service	06/11/2024 - Committee - Business Analysis / Operations / Edward Kim: Pre-call with GCP team re DIP budget questions.	0.80	\$1,000.00	\$800.00
Service	06/11/2024 - Committee - Business Analysis / Operations / Andre Artidiello: Multiple communications with GCP team re real estate advisor and investment banker retention comparables.	1.10	\$700.00	\$770.00
Service	06/11/2024 - Committee - Business Analysis / Operations / Andre Artidiello: Call with GCP and AM teams to discuss cash management motion and DIP budget.	0.50	\$700.00	\$350.00
Service	06/11/2024 - Committee - Business Analysis / Operations / Andre Artidiello: Pre-call with GCP team re DIP budget questions.	0.80	\$700.00	\$560.00
Service	06/11/2024 - Committee - Business Analysis / Operations / Andre Artidiello: Debrief with GCP team re cash management.	0.70	\$700.00	\$490.00
Service	06/11/2024 - Committee - Business Analysis / Operations / Andre Artidiello: Review and analysis of diligence production materials.	2.40	\$700.00	\$1,680.00
Service	06/11/2024 - Committee - Business Analysis / Operations / Andre Artidiello: Review and updates to investment banker retention comps analysis.	2.80	\$700.00	\$1,960.00
Service	06/11/2024 - Committee - Business Analysis / Operations / Andre Artidiello: Review and updates to real estate advisor retention comps analysis.	2.10	\$700.00	\$1,470.00
Service	06/11/2024 - Committee - Business Analysis / Operations / Ivan Radi: Call with GCP and AM teams to discuss cash management motion and DIP budget.	0.50	\$550.00	\$275.00
Service	06/11/2024 - Committee - Business Analysis / Operations / Ivan Radi: Continue review and analysis of comparable real estate advisor retentions.	2.80	\$550.00	\$1,540.00
Service	06/11/2024 - Committee - Business Analysis / Operations / Ivan Radi: Finalize review and analysis of comparable real estate advisor retentions.	2.60	\$550.00	\$1,430.00
Service	06/11/2024 - Committee - Business Analysis / Operations / Ivan Radi: Review and analysis of investment banker comparable analysis.	1.80	\$550.00	\$990.00
Service	06/11/2024 - Committee - Business Analysis / Operations / Ivan Radi: Continue review and analysis of investment banker comparable analysis.	2.50	\$550.00	\$1,375.00

Service	06/11/2024 - Committee - Business Analysis / Operations / Ivan Radi: Multiple communications with GCP team re real estate advisor and investment banker retention comparables.	1.10	\$550.00	\$605.00
Service	06/11/2024 - Committee - Business Analysis / Operations / Eric Mendez: Consolidated workstream progress ahead of the RL management meeting tomorrow.	2.60	\$700.00	\$1,820.00
Service	06/11/2024 - Committee - Business Analysis / Operations / Eric Mendez: Created diligence tracker for all items related to DIP, cash collateral, intercompany claims, etc.	2.50	\$700.00	\$1,750.00
Service	06/11/2024 - Committee - Business Analysis / Operations / Eric Mendez: Call with GCP and AM teams to discuss cash management motion and DIP budget.	0.50	\$700.00	\$350.00
Service	06/11/2024 - Committee - Business Analysis / Operations / Eric Mendez: Debrief with GCP team re cash management.	0.70	\$700.00	\$490.00
Service	06/11/2024 - Committee - Business Analysis / Operations / Eric Mendez: Multiple communications with GCP team re real estate advisor and investment banker retention comparables.	1.10	\$700.00	\$770.00
Service	06/11/2024 - Committee - Business Analysis / Operations / Eric Mendez: Pre-call with GCP team re DIP budget questions.	0.80	\$700.00	\$560.00
Service	06/11/2024 - Committee - Business Analysis / Operations / Eric Mendez: Review DIP objection.	0.20	\$700.00	\$140.00
Service	06/11/2024 - Committee - Business Analysis / Operations / Vinai Sewaliah: Multiple communications with GCP team re real estate advisor and investment banker retention comparables.	1.10	\$400.00	\$440.00
Service	06/11/2024 - Committee - Business Analysis / Operations / Vinai Sewaliah: Call with GCP and AM teams to discuss cash management motion and DIP budget.	0.50	\$400.00	\$200.00
Service	06/11/2024 - Committee - Committee Activities / Vinai Sewaliah: Preparation of committee presentation materials including professional fee comparisons.	1.80	\$400.00	\$720.00
Service	06/11/2024 - Committee - Committee Activities / Vinai Sewaliah: Continue preparation of committee presentation materials including professional fee comparisons.	1.40	\$400.00	\$560.00
Service	06/11/2024 - Committee - Business Analysis / Operations / Vinai Sewaliah: Pre-call with GCP team re DIP budget questions.	0.80	\$400.00	\$320.00
Service	06/11/2024 - Committee - Business Analysis / Operations / Vinai Sewaliah: Debrief with GCP team re cash management.	0.70	\$400.00	\$280.00
Service	06/11/2024 - Committee - Business Analysis / Operations / Vinai Sewaliah: Analysis of lease modification procedures.	1.90	\$400.00	\$760.00
Service	06/11/2024 - Committee - Business Analysis / Operations / Vinai Sewaliah: Continue analysis of lease modification procedures.	2.60	\$400.00	\$1,040.00
Service	06/11/2024 - Committee - Business Analysis / Operations / Pedro Leme: Review and analysis of updated cash flow reporting.	1.70	\$300.00	\$510.00
Service	06/11/2024 - Committee - Court Filings / Pedro Leme: Continue review of court filings including docket nos. 11, 217, 29.	1.60	\$300.00	\$480.00

\$630.00	\$300.00	2.10	06/11/2024 - Committee - Business Analysis / Operations / Charles Salom: Spread and analysis of Schedule of Bank Accounts.	Service
\$600.00	\$300.00	2.00	06/11/2024 - Committee - Business Analysis / Operations / Charles Salom: Continue spread and analysis of Schedule of Bank Accounts.	Service
\$840.00	\$300.00	2.80	06/11/2024 - Committee - Business Analysis / Operations / Charles Salom: Review and analysis of Comparable Investment Banker Compensation.	Service
\$570.00	\$300.00	1.90	06/11/2024 - Committee - Business Analysis / Operations / Charles Salom: Continue review and analysis of Comparable Investment Banker Compensation.	Service
\$1,100.00	\$1,000.00	1.10	06/11/2024 - Committee - Business Analysis / Operations / Jorge González: Multiple communications with GCP team re real estate advisor and investment banker retention comparables.	Service
\$500.00	\$1,000.00	0.50	06/11/2024 - Committee - Business Analysis / Operations / Jorge González: Call with GCP and AM teams to discuss cash management motion and DIP budget.	Service
\$700.00	\$1,000.00	0.70	06/11/2024 - Committee - Business Analysis / Operations / Jorge González: Debrief with GCP team re cash management.	Service
\$800.00	\$1,000.00	0.80	06/11/2024 - Committee - Business Analysis / Operations / Jorge González: Pre-call with GCP team re DIP budget questions.	Service
\$6,000.00	\$1,000.00	6.00	06/12/2024 - Committee - Travel Time / Edward Kim: Travel from Miami to Orlando and back to Miami for management meeting.	Service
\$800.00	\$1,000.00	0.80	06/12/2024 - Committee - Court Filings / Edward Kim: Analysis of revised draft objection and of interim financing order.	Service
\$1,600.00	\$1,000.00	1.60	06/12/2024 - Committee - Business Analysis / Operations / Edward Kim: Analysis of owned vs leased properties and initial review of store-level financials and performance.	Service
\$1,000.00	\$1,000.00	1.00	06/12/2024 - Committee - Committee Activities / Edward Kim: Attend committee meeting to discuss proposal for global DIP settlement.	Service
\$700.00	\$1,000.00	0.70	06/12/2024 - Committee - Business Analysis / Operations / Edward Kim: Analysis of proposed settlement and counter.	Service
\$500.00	\$1,000.00	0.50	06/12/2024 - Committee - Business Analysis / Operations / Edward Kim: Analysis of DACAs and cash management.	Service
\$4,100.00	\$1,000.00	4.10	06/12/2024 - Committee - Business Analysis / Operations / Edward Kim: Management meeting with AM and GCP teams.	Service
\$2,255.00	\$550.00	4.10	06/12/2024 - Committee - Business Analysis / Operations / Ivan Radi: Management meeting with AM and GCP teams.	Service
\$3,300.00	\$550.00	6.00	06/12/2024 - Committee - Travel Time / Ivan Radi: Travel from Miami to Orlando and back to Miami for management meeting.	Service
\$1,500.00	\$1,000.00	1.50	06/12/2024 - Committee - Business Analysis / Operations / Edward Kim: Debrief with GCP team post management meeting.	Service

Service	06/12/2024 - Committee - Business Analysis / Operations / Ivan Radi: Debrief with GCP team post management meeting.	1.50	\$550.00	\$825.00
Service	06/12/2024 - Committee - Committee Activities / Ivan Radi: Attend committee meeting to discuss proposal for global DIP settlement.	1.00	\$550.00	\$550.00
Service	06/12/2024 - Committee - Committee Activities / Ivan Radi: Review and commentary to DIP objection draft.	0.50	\$550.00	\$275.00
Service	06/12/2024 - Committee - Business Analysis / Operations / Eric Mendez: Attend committee meeting to discuss proposal for global DIP settlement.	1.00	\$700.00	\$700.00
Service	06/12/2024 - Committee - Business Analysis / Operations / Eric Mendez: Management meeting with AM and GCP teams.	4.10	\$700.00	\$2,870.00
Service	06/12/2024 - Committee - Travel Time / Eric Mendez: Travel from Miami to Orlando and back to Miami for management meeting.	6.00	\$700.00	\$4,200.00
Service	06/12/2024 - Committee - Business Analysis / Operations / Eric Mendez: Debrief with GCP team post management meeting.	1.50	\$700.00	\$1,050.00
Service	06/12/2024 - Committee - Business Analysis / Operations / Andre Artidiello: Compile waterfall analysis.	2.40	\$700.00	\$1,680.00
Service	06/12/2024 - Committee - Committee Activities / Andre Artidiello: Attend committee meeting to discuss proposal for global DIP settlement.	1.00	\$700.00	\$700.00
Service	06/12/2024 - Committee - Business Analysis / Operations / Andre Artidiello: Management meeting with AM and GCP teams.	4.10	\$700.00	\$2,870.00
Service	06/12/2024 - Committee - Business Analysis / Operations / Andre Artidiello: Debrief with GCP team post management meeting.	1.50	\$700.00	\$1,050.00
Service	06/12/2024 - Committee - Travel Time / Andre Artidiello: Travel from Miami to Orlando and back to Miami for management meeting.	6.00	\$700.00	\$4,200.00
Service	06/12/2024 - Committee - Litigation / Vinai Sewaliah: Review and commentary of DIP objection draft.	1.00	\$400.00	\$400.00
Service	06/12/2024 - Committee - Business Analysis / Operations / Vinai Sewaliah: Review and analysis of DIP budget.	2.30	\$400.00	\$920.00
Service	06/12/2024 - Committee - Business Analysis / Operations / Vinai Sewaliah: Continue review and analysis of DIP budget.	1.80	\$400.00	\$720.00
Service	06/12/2024 - Committee - Committee Activities / Vinai Sewaliah: Attend committee meeting to discuss proposal for global DIP settlement.	1.00	\$400.00	\$400.00
Service	06/12/2024 - Committee - Business Analysis / Operations / Pedro Leme: Review and analysis of comparable Hilco fee compensation.	1.70	\$300.00	\$510.00
Service	06/12/2024 - Committee - Business Analysis / Operations / Pedro Leme: Continue review and analysis of comparable Hilco fee compensation.	1.80	\$300.00	\$540.00
Service	06/12/2024 - Committee - Business Analysis / Operations / Pedro Leme: Ongoing review and analysis of comparable Hilco fee compensation.	1.60	\$300.00	\$480.00

\$390.00	\$300.00	1.30	06/12/2024 - Committee - Business Analysis / Operations / Pedro Leme: DIP forecast analysis.	Service
\$1,000.00	\$1,000.00	1.00	06/12/2024 - Committee - Committee Activities / Jorge González: Attend committee meeting to discuss proposal for global DIP settlement.	Service
\$4,100.00	\$1,000.00	4.10	06/12/2024 - Committee - Business Analysis / Operations / Jorge González: Management meeting with AM and GCP teams.	Service
\$1,500.00	\$1,000.00	1.50	06/12/2024 - Committee - Business Analysis / Operations / Jorge González: Debrief with GCP team post management meeting.	Service
\$6,000.00	\$1,000.00	6.00	06/12/2024 - Committee - Travel Time / Jorge González: Travel from Miami to Orlando and back to Miami for management meeting.	Service
\$700.00	\$1,000.00	0.70	06/13/2024 - Committee - Committee Activities / Edward Kim: Analysis of revised settlement offer and group comments.	Service
\$1,600.00	\$1,000.00	1.60	06/13/2024 - Committee - Committee Activities / Edward Kim: Analysis of revised counter offer, including discussion with J. Gonzalez and local counsel.	Service
\$1,500.00	\$1,000.00	1.50	06/13/2024 - Committee - Committee Activities / Edward Kim: Multiple communications with GCP team re settlement terms.	Service
\$825.00	\$550.00	1.50	06/13/2024 - Committee - Committee Activities / Ivan Radi: Multiple communications with GCP team re settlement terms.	Service
\$220.00	\$550.00	0.40	06/13/2024 - Committee - Committee Activities / Ivan Radi: Review latest settlement term sheet.	Service
\$1,050.00	\$700.00	1.50	06/13/2024 - Committee - Committee Activities / Eric Mendez: Multiple communications with GCP team re settlement terms.	Service
\$1,120.00	\$700.00	1.60	06/13/2024 - Committee - Case Administration / Andre Artidiello: Updates to diligence request list.	Service
\$2,030.00	\$700.00	2.90	06/13/2024 - Committee - Business Analysis / Operations / Andre Artidiello: Review and analysis of diligence production materials.	Service
\$980.00	\$700.00	1.40	06/13/2024 - Committee - Business Analysis / Operations / Andre Artidiello: Continue review of long-term business model.	Service
\$1,050.00	\$700.00	1.50	06/13/2024 - Committee - Committee Activities / Andre Artidiello: Multiple communications with GCP team re settlement terms.	Service
\$600.00	\$400.00	1.50	06/13/2024 - Committee - Committee Activities / Vinai Sewaliah: Multiple communications with GCP team re settlement terms.	Service
\$1,040.00	\$400.00	2.60	06/13/2024 - Committee - Business Analysis / Operations / Vinai Sewaliah: Research and analysis of comparable company valuations.	Service
\$760.00	\$400.00	1.90	06/13/2024 - Committee - Business Analysis / Operations / Vinai Sewaliah: Continue research and analysis of comparable company valuations.	Service
\$540.00	\$300.00	1.80	06/13/2024 - Committee - Business Analysis / Operations / Pedro Leme: Precedent transactions analysis.	Service

Service	06/13/2024 - Committee - Committee Activities / Jorge González: Analysis of revised counter offer, including discussion with E. Kim and local counsel.	1.60	\$1,000.00	\$1,600.00
Service	06/13/2024 - Committee - Committee Activities / Jorge González: Multiple communications with GCP team re settlement terms.	1.50	\$1,000.00	\$1,500.00
Service	06/14/2024 - Committee - Travel Time / Edward Kim: Travel from MIA to LAX.	6.50	\$1,000.00	\$6,500.00
Service	06/14/2024 - Committee - Court Hearings / Edward Kim: Attend second-day hearing.	1.80	\$1,000.00	\$1,800.00
Service	06/14/2024 - Committee - Business Analysis / Operations / Edward Kim: Cash management order review and comments.	0.50	\$1,000.00	\$500.00
Service	06/14/2024 - Committee - Court Hearings / Ivan Radi: Attend second-day hearing.	1.80	\$550.00	\$990.00
Service	06/14/2024 - Committee - Court Hearings / Eric Mendez: Attend second day hearing.	1.80	\$700.00	\$1,260.00
Service	06/14/2024 - Committee - Business Analysis / Operations / Eric Mendez: Consolidated management meeting notes for wider distribution.	2.10	\$700.00	\$1,470.00
Service	06/14/2024 - Committee - Court Hearings / Andre Artidiello: Attend second-day hearing.	1.80	\$700.00	\$1,260.00
Service	06/14/2024 - Committee - Business Analysis / Operations / Andre Artidiello: Review and analysis of DIP model sensitivities.	2.80	\$700.00	\$1,960.00
Service	06/14/2024 - Committee - Business Analysis / Operations / Andre Artidiello: Continue analysis of DIP model sensitivities.	1.70	\$700.00	\$1,190.00
Service	06/14/2024 - Committee - Court Hearings / Vinai Sewaliah: Attend second-day hearing.	1.80	\$400.00	\$720.00
Service	06/14/2024 - Committee - Claims Analysis and Objections / Vinai Sewaliah: Analysis of proposed lease rejections.	1.60	\$400.00	\$640.00
Service	06/14/2024 - Committee - Claims Analysis and Objections / Vinai Sewaliah: Continue analysis of proposed lease rejections.	1.30	\$400.00	\$520.00
Service	06/14/2024 - Committee - Business Analysis / Operations / Pedro Leme: Continue precedent transactions analysis.	1.90	\$300.00	\$570.00
Service	06/14/2024 - Committee - Business Analysis / Operations / Pedro Leme: Ongoing precedent transactions analysis.	1.50	\$300.00	\$450.00
Service	06/14/2024 - Committee - Business Analysis / Operations / Pedro Leme: Preparation of DCF.	3.10	\$300.00	\$930.00
Service	06/14/2024 - Committee - Business Analysis / Operations / Pedro Leme: Continue preparation of DCF.	2.30	\$300.00	\$690.00
Service	06/14/2024 - Committee - Business Analysis / Operations / Pedro Leme: Review and analysis of company's financials including profit and loss statement.	1.50	\$300.00	\$450.00
Service	06/14/2024 - Committee - Business Analysis / Operations / Pedro Leme: Preparation of comparable companies analysis including BJ's Restaurant.	2.30	\$300.00	\$690.00

Service	06/14/2024 - Committee - Business Analysis / Operations / Charles Salom: Casual dining industry analysis.	2.40	\$300.00	\$720.00
Service	06/14/2024 - Committee - Business Analysis / Operations / Charles Salom: Continue analysis of casual dining industry.	2.10	\$300.00	\$630.00
Service	06/14/2024 - Committee - Business Analysis / Operations / Charles Salom: Spread and analysis of comparable company financial statements.	2.40	\$300.00	\$720.00
Service	06/14/2024 - Committee - Business Analysis / Operations / Charles Salom: Spread and analysis of comparable company financial statements.	1.90	\$300.00	\$570.00
Service	06/14/2024 - Committee - Business Analysis / Operations / Charles Salom: Resume analysis of comparable company financial statements.	2.10	\$300.00	\$630.00
Service	06/14/2024 - Committee - Business Analysis / Operations / Charles Salom: Review and analysis of comparable company profiles including Denny's.	1.40	\$300.00	\$420.00
Service	06/14/2024 - Committee - Business Analysis / Operations / Charles Salom: Review and analysis of comparable company profiles including Texas Roadhouse.	1.20	\$300.00	\$360.00
Service	06/14/2024 - Committee - Business Analysis / Operations / Charles Salom: Review and analysis of comparable company profiles including Red Robin.	1.10	\$300.00	\$330.00
Service	06/15/2024 - Committee - Claims Analysis and Objections / Andre Artidiello: Further updates to lease analysis.	2.70	\$700.00	\$1,890.00
Service	06/15/2024 - Committee - Business Analysis / Operations / Andre Artidiello: Process model updates.	2.10	\$700.00	\$1,470.00
Service	06/15/2024 - Committee - Business Analysis / Operations / Vinai Sewaliah: Review and analysis of business licenses and related regulations.	1.50	\$400.00	\$600.00
Service	06/15/2024 - Committee - Business Analysis / Operations / Vinai Sewaliah: Continue review and analysis of business licenses and related regulations.	1.90	\$400.00	\$760.00
Service	06/15/2024 - Committee - Business Analysis / Operations / Charles Salom: Preparation of comparable companies presentation materials including Dennys, Red Robin and Texas Roadhouse.	2.80	\$300.00	\$840.00
Service	06/16/2024 - Committee - Committee Activities / Andre Artidiello: Updates to committee presentation materials.	3.10	\$700.00	\$2,170.00
Service	06/16/2024 - Committee - Business Analysis / Operations / Andre Artidiello: Further analysis of long-term business plan model.	2.60	\$700.00	\$1,820.00
Service	06/16/2024 - Committee - Business Analysis / Operations / Eric Mendez: Finalized consolidated management meeting notes.	1.70	\$700.00	\$1,190.00
Service	06/16/2024 - Committee - Business Analysis / Operations / Eric Mendez: Multiple communications with C. Salom and P. Leme re draft valuation analysis.	1.00	\$700.00	\$700.00

Service	06/16/2024 - Committee - Business Analysis / Operations / Pedro Leme: Comparable companies analysis including Texas Roadhouse.	2.30	\$300.00	\$690.00
Service	06/16/2024 - Committee - Business Analysis / Operations / Pedro Leme: Comparable companies analysis including First Watch.	2.20	\$300.00	\$660.00
Service	06/16/2024 - Committee - Business Analysis / Operations / Pedro Leme: Multiple communications with C. Salom and E. Mendez re draft valuation analysis.	1.00	\$300.00	\$300.00
Service	06/16/2024 - Committee - Business Analysis / Operations / Charles Salom: Multiple communications with E. Mendez and P. Leme re draft valuation analysis.	1.00	\$300.00	\$300.00
Service	06/17/2024 - Committee - Business Analysis / Operations / Ivan Radi: Review and commentary to draft valuation materials.	2.80	\$550.00	\$1,540.00
Service	06/17/2024 - Committee - Business Analysis / Operations / Ivan Radi: Multiple communications with P. Leme and C. Salom re draft valuation materials.	1.40	\$550.00	\$770.00
Service	06/17/2024 - Committee - Business Analysis / Operations / Ivan Radi: Review and analysis of cumulative variance materials.	1.10	\$550.00	\$605.00
Service	06/17/2024 - Committee - Committee Activities / Ivan Radi: Prepare committee presentation materials.	1.80	\$550.00	\$990.00
Service	06/17/2024 - Committee - Fee / Employment Applications / Edward Kim: Conflicts search and coordinate firm-wide search and correspondence to counsel.	0.90	\$1,000.00	\$900.00
Service	06/17/2024 - Committee - Business Analysis / Operations / Edward Kim: Analysis of performance and variance.	0.60	\$1,000.00	\$600.00
Service	06/17/2024 - Committee - Committee Activities / Edward Kim: Review of bylaws.	0.30	\$1,000.00	\$300.00
Service	06/17/2024 - Committee - Business Analysis / Operations / Vinai Sewaliah: Review and analysis of variance reporting.	0.90	\$400.00	\$360.00
Service	06/17/2024 - Committee - Business Analysis / Operations / Vinai Sewaliah: Analysis of historical capital expenditures.	1.80	\$400.00	\$720.00
Service	06/17/2024 - Committee - Business Analysis / Operations / Vinai Sewaliah: Continue analysis of historical capital expenditures.	1.40	\$400.00	\$560.00
Service	06/17/2024 - Committee - Committee Activities / Eric Mendez: Begin presentation slides for Committee update.	2.50	\$700.00	\$1,750.00
Service	06/17/2024 - Committee - Business Analysis / Operations / Pedro Leme: Analysis of Weighted Average Cost of Capital.	1.40	\$300.00	\$420.00
Service	06/17/2024 - Committee - Business Analysis / Operations / Pedro Leme: Multiple communications with E. Mendez and C. Salom re draft valuation materials.	1.40	\$300.00	\$420.00
Service	06/17/2024 - Committee - Business Analysis / Operations / Pedro Leme: Multiple communications with C. Salom and I. Radi re cure costs.	0.60	\$300.00	\$180.00

Edward Kim: Analysis of debt documents.Image: Control of the state of t					
Charles Salon: Multiple communications with P. Leme and I. RadiIntermediationService06/17/2024 - Committee - Business Analysis / Operations / Nan Radi: Multiple communications with C. Salon and P. Leme re cure0.60\$50.00Service06/18/2024 - Committee - Committee Activities / Edward Kim: Review and edits to presentation.0.50\$1,000.00Service06/18/2024 - Committee - Committee Activities / Vinai1.70\$400.00Service06/18/2024 - Committee - Committee Activities / Vinai1.50\$400.00Service06/18/2024 - Committee - Committee Activities / Vinai2.10\$400.00Service06/18/2024 - Committee - Committee Activities / Vinai2.10\$400.00Service06/18/2024 - Committee - Sale Process / Edward Kim: Discussion0.70\$1,000.00Service06/18/2024 - Committee - Sale Process / Edward Kim: Discussion0.70\$1,000.00Service06/18/2024 - Committee - Sale Process / Edward Kim: Discussion0.70\$1,000.00Service06/18/2024 - Committee - Sale Process / Edward Kim: Discussion1.90\$700.00Service06/18/2024 - Committee - Committee Activities / Andre Artidiello:1.90\$700.00Service06/18/2024 - Committee - Committee Activities / Iner Artidiello:1.90\$700.00Service06/18/2024 - Committee Activities / Van Radi:3.00\$700.00Service06/18/2024 - Committee Activities / Ivan Radi:3.00\$700.00Service06/18/2024 - Committee Activities / Ivan Radi:3.00\$700.00Service06/18/	Cha	Charles Salom: Multiple communications with P. Leme and E.	1.40	\$300.00	\$420.00
Radi: Multiple communications with C. Salom and P. Leme re cure costs.Image: Cost Cost Cost Cost Cost Cost Cost Cost	Cha	Charles Salom: Multiple communications with P. Leme and I. Radi	0.60	\$300.00	\$180.00
Review and edits to presentation.Review </td <td>Rad</td> <td>Radi: Multiple communications with C. Salom and P. Leme re cure</td> <td>0.60</td> <td>\$550.00</td> <td>\$330.00</td>	Rad	Radi: Multiple communications with C. Salom and P. Leme re cure	0.60	\$550.00	\$330.00
Sewaliah: Analysis of updated variance reporting.Image: Constraint of the second s			0.50	\$1,000.00	\$500.00
Preparation of committee presentation materials.Internal of the internal of the inter			1.70	\$400.00	\$680.00
Continue preparation of committee presentation materials.Continue preparation of committee presentation materials.Service06/18/2024 - Committee - Sale Process / Edward Kim: Discussion regarding sale process with GCP team.0.70\$1,000.00Service06/18/2024 - Committee - Business Analysis / Operations / Edward Kim: Analysis of debt documents.1.00\$1,000.00\$Service06/18/2024 - Committee - Committee Activities / Andre Artidiello: Updates to committee presentation materials.1.90\$700.00\$Service06/18/2024 - Committee - Committee Activities / Andre Artidiello: Review and updates to variance analysis.2.30\$700.00\$Service06/18/2024 - Committee - Committee Activities / Eric Mendez: Finish presentation slides for Committee presentation materials.3.00\$700.00\$Service06/18/2024 - Committee - Committee Activities / Ivan Radi: Review and commentary to committee presentation materials.1.80\$550.00\$Service06/18/2024 - Committee - Committee Activities / Ivan Radi: Review and commentary to committee presentation materials.2.10\$550.00\$Service06/18/2024 - Committee - Sale Process / Eric Mendez: Discussion regarding sale process with GCP team.0.70\$1,000.00\$Service06/18/2024 - Committee - Sale Process / Jorge González: Discussion regarding sale process with GCP team.0.70\$1,000.00\$Service06/18/2024 - Committee - Case Administration / Edward Kim: Workstream coordination call with GCP team.0.70\$1,000.00\$Service06/19/2024 - Committee -			1.50	\$400.00	\$600.00
regarding sale process with GCP team.Image: Control of Control			2.10	\$400.00	\$840.00
Edward Kim: Analysis of debt documents.Image: Committee of the com			0.70	\$1,000.00	\$700.00
Updates to committee presentation materials.Image: ServiceService06/18/2024 - Committee - Business Analysis / Operations / Andre Artidiello: Review and updates to variance analysis.2.30\$700.00\$Service06/18/2024 - Committee - Committee Activities / Eric Mendez: Finish presentation slides for Committee update.3.00\$700.00\$Service06/18/2024 - Committee - Committee Activities / Ivan Radi: Review and commentary to committee presentation materials.1.80\$550.00\$Service06/18/2024 - Committee - Committee Activities / Ivan Radi: Continue preparing committee presentation materials.2.10\$550.00\$Service06/18/2024 - Committee - Committee Activities / Ivan Radi: Continue preparing committee presentation materials.2.10\$550.00\$Service06/18/2024 - Committee - Sale Process / Eric Mendez: Discussion regarding sale process with GCP team.0.70\$1,000.00\$Service06/19/2024 - Committee - Sale Process / Jorge González: Discussion regarding sale process with GCP team.0.70\$1,000.00\$Service06/19/2024 - Committee - Case Administration / Edward Kim: Workstream coordination call with GCP team.1.10\$1,000.00\$Service06/19/2024 - Committee - Case Administration / Andre Artidiello:1.10\$700.00\$			1.00	\$1,000.00	\$1,000.00
Artidiello: Review and updates to variance analysis.Artidiello: Review and updates to variance analysis.Service06/18/2024 - Committee - Committee Activities / Eric Mendez: Finish presentation slides for Committee update.3.00\$700.00\$Service06/18/2024 - Committee - Committee Activities / Ivan Radi: Review and commentary to committee presentation materials.1.80\$550.00\$Service06/18/2024 - Committee - Committee Activities / Ivan Radi: Continue preparing committee presentation materials.2.10\$550.00\$Service06/18/2024 - Committee - Committee Activities / Ivan Radi: Continue preparing committee presentation materials.2.10\$550.00\$Service06/18/2024 - Committee - Sale Process / Eric Mendez: Discussion regarding sale process with GCP team.0.70\$700.00\$Service06/18/2024 - Committee - Sale Process / Jorge González: Discussion regarding sale process with GCP team.0.70\$1,000.00\$Service06/19/2024 - Committee - Case Administration / Edward Kim: Workstream coordination call with GCP team.1.10\$700.00\$			1.90	\$700.00	\$1,330.00
Finish presentation slides for Committee update.Image: Control of Control			2.30	\$700.00	\$1,610.00
Review and commentary to committee presentation materials.Image: Committee commit			3.00	\$700.00	\$2,100.00
Continue preparing committee presentation materials.LineContinueService06/18/2024 - Committee - Sale Process / Eric Mendez: Discussion regarding sale process with GCP team.0.70\$700.00Service06/18/2024 - Committee - Sale Process / Jorge González: Discussion regarding sale process with GCP team.0.70\$1,000.00Service06/19/2024 - Committee - Case Administration / Edward Kim: Workstream coordination call with GCP team.1.10\$1,000.00Service06/19/2024 - Committee - Case Administration / Andre Artidiello:1.10\$700.00			1.80	\$550.00	\$990.00
regarding sale process with GCP team.Image: Constant of the sale process with GCP team.Service06/18/2024 - Committee - Sale Process / Jorge González: Discussion regarding sale process with GCP team.0.70\$1,000.00Service06/19/2024 - Committee - Case Administration / Edward Kim: Workstream coordination call with GCP team.1.10\$1,000.00Service06/19/2024 - Committee - Case Administration / Andre Artidiello:1.10\$700.00			2.10	\$550.00	\$1,155.00
Discussion regarding sale process with GCP team. Image: Comparison of the second s			0.70	\$700.00	\$490.00
Workstream coordination call with GCP team. Image: Comparison of the second			0.70	\$1,000.00	\$700.00
			1.10	\$1,000.00	\$1,100.00
			1.10	\$700.00	\$770.00
Service 06/19/2024 - Committee - Committee Activities / Andre Artidiello: 0.70 \$700.00   Multiple communications with GCP team re committee presentation materials. 0.70 \$700.00	Mul	Multiple communications with GCP team re committee	0.70	\$700.00	\$490.00
Service06/19/2024 - Committee - Claims Analysis and Objections / Andre Artidiello: Updates to lease rejection and bubble stores analysis.2.80\$700.00\$			2.80	\$700.00	\$1,960.00
Service	06/19/2024 - Committee - Committee Activities / Eric Mendez: Reviewed 4-week variance results and incorporated into the committee update presentation.	2.40	\$700.00	\$1,680.00	
---------	---	------	------------	------------	
Service	06/19/2024 - Committee - Case Administration / Eric Mendez: Workstream coordination call with GCP team.	1.10	\$700.00	\$770.00	
Service	06/19/2024 - Committee - Committee Activities / Ivan Radi: Multiple communications with GCP team re global settlement terms and related materials.	0.80	\$550.00	\$440.00	
Service	06/19/2024 - Committee - Case Administration / Ivan Radi: Workstream coordination call with GCP team.	1.10	\$550.00	\$605.00	
Service	06/19/2024 - Committee - Committee Activities / Ivan Radi: Multiple communications with GCP team re committee presentation materials.	0.70	\$550.00	\$385.00	
Service	06/19/2024 - Committee - Business Analysis / Operations / Ivan Radi: Review and analysis of updated variance materials.	1.10	\$550.00	\$605.00	
Service	06/19/2024 - Committee - Case Administration / Vinai Sewaliah: Workstream coordination call with GCP team.	1.10	\$400.00	\$440.00	
Service	06/19/2024 - Committee - Committee Activities / Vinai Sewaliah: Multiple communications with GCP team re committee presentation materials.	0.70	\$400.00	\$280.00	
Service	06/19/2024 - Committee - Business Analysis / Operations / Vinai Sewaliah: Analysis of comparable restaurant businesses.	2.10	\$400.00	\$840.00	
Service	06/19/2024 - Committee - Business Analysis / Operations / Vinai Sewaliah: Continue analysis of comparable restaurant businesses.	1.30	\$400.00	\$520.00	
Service	06/19/2024 - Committee - Business Analysis / Operations / Vinai Sewaliah: Ongoing analysis of comparable restaurant businesses.	1.90	\$400.00	\$760.00	
Service	06/19/2024 - Committee - Committee Activities / Eric Mendez: Multiple communications with GCP team re global settlement terms and related materials.	0.80	\$700.00	\$560.00	
Service	06/19/2024 - Committee - Committee Activities / Edward Kim: Multiple communications with GCP team re global settlement terms and related materials.	0.80	\$1,000.00	\$800.00	
Service	06/19/2024 - Committee - Committee Activities / Jorge González: Multiple communications with GCP team re global settlement terms and related materials.	0.80	\$1,000.00	\$800.00	
Service	06/19/2024 - Committee - Case Administration / Jorge González: Workstream coordination call with GCP team.	1.10	\$1,000.00	\$1,100.00	
Service	06/19/2024 - Committee - Committee Activities / Jorge González: Multiple communications with GCP team re committee presentation materials.	0.70	\$1,000.00	\$700.00	
Service	06/20/2024 - Committee - Sale Process / Edward Kim: Weekly standing call with HCF and GCP teams.	0.40	\$1,000.00	\$400.00	
Service	06/20/2024 - Committee - Business Analysis / Operations / Edward Kim: Analysis of performance to date and research dependence on marketing.	0.80	\$1,000.00	\$800.00	

Service	06/20/2024 - Committee - Business Analysis / Operations / Eric Mendez: Began business plan outline process.	2.30	\$700.00	\$1,610.00
Service	06/20/2024 - Committee - Sale Process / Ivan Radi: Weekly standing call with HCF and GCP teams.	0.40	\$550.00	\$220.00
Service	06/20/2024 - Committee - Business Analysis / Operations / Ivan Radi: Research and analysis of real estate locations and comparable rates.	2.60	\$550.00	\$1,430.00
Service	06/20/2024 - Committee - Business Analysis / Operations / Ivan Radi: Continue research and analysis of real estate locations and comparable rates.	2.30	\$550.00	\$1,265.00
Service	06/20/2024 - Committee - Sale Process / Ivan Radi: Analysis of interested parties and bidders currently involved in sale process including existing portfolio companies.	2.80	\$550.00	\$1,540.00
Service	06/20/2024 - Committee - Sale Process / Andre Artidiello: Weekly standing call with HCF and GCP teams.	0.40	\$700.00	\$280.00
Service	06/20/2024 - Committee - Business Analysis / Operations / Andre Artidiello: Industry research re business plan comp set.	2.80	\$700.00	\$1,960.00
Service	06/20/2024 - Committee - Business Analysis / Operations / Pedro Leme: Review and analysis of comparable companies including The Cheesecake Factory, Shake Shack, and Sweet Greens.	1.90	\$300.00	\$570.00
Service	06/20/2024 - Committee - Business Analysis / Operations / Pedro Leme: Continue review and analysis of comparable companies including The Cheesecake Factory, Shake Shack, and Sweet Greens.	2.70	\$300.00	\$810.00
Service	06/20/2024 - Committee - Business Analysis / Operations / Charles Salom: Analysis of comparable companies including Cava.	2.30	\$300.00	\$690.00
Service	06/20/2024 - Committee - Business Analysis / Operations / Charles Salom: Continue review and Analysis of comparable companies including Shake Shack.	1.60	\$300.00	\$480.00
Service	06/20/2024 - Committee - Business Analysis / Operations / Charles Salom: Ongoing analysis of comparable companies including Sweet Greens.	1.40	\$300.00	\$420.00
Service	06/20/2024 - Committee - Sale Process / Vinai Sewaliah: Weekly standing call with HCF and GCP teams.	0.40	\$400.00	\$160.00
Service	06/20/2024 - Committee - Business Analysis / Operations / Vinai Sewaliah: Analysis of financial projection assumptions.	1.80	\$400.00	\$720.00
Service	06/20/2024 - Committee - Business Analysis / Operations / Vinai Sewaliah: Continue analysis of financial projection assumptions.	2.50	\$400.00	\$1,000.00
Service	06/21/2024 - Committee - Business Analysis / Operations / Edward Kim: Weekly standing call with AM and GCP teams.	0.50	\$1,000.00	\$500.00
Service	06/21/2024 - Committee - Business Analysis / Operations / Ivan Radi: Weekly standing call with AM and GCP teams.	0.50	\$550.00	\$275.00
Service	06/21/2024 - Committee - Business Analysis / Operations / Andre Artidiello: Weekly standing call with AM and GCP teams.	0.50	\$700.00	\$350.00

\$840.00	\$700.00	1.20	06/21/2024 - Committee - Case Administration / Andre Artidiello: Compile updates to investigation-related diligence request list.	Service
\$1,680.00	\$700.00	2.40	06/21/2024 - Committee - Business Analysis / Operations / Andre Artidiello: Research into casual dining sector and competitive dynamics.	Service
\$980.00	\$700.00	1.40	06/21/2024 - Committee - Business Analysis / Operations / Andre Artidiello: Continue review of diligence production materials.	Service
\$350.00	\$700.00	0.50	06/21/2024 - Committee - Business Analysis / Operations / Eric Mendez: Weekly standing call with AM and GCP teams.	Service
\$350.00	\$700.00	0.50	06/21/2024 - Committee - Business Analysis / Operations / Eric Mendez: Weekly standing call with AM and GCP teams.	Service
\$490.00	\$700.00	0.70	06/21/2024 - Committee - Business Analysis / Operations / Eric Mendez: Financial modeling assumption updates.	Service
\$2,100.00	\$700.00	3.00	06/21/2024 - Committee - Business Analysis / Operations / Eric Mendez: Business Plan financial modeling sensitivities analysis.	Service
\$200.00	\$400.00	0.50	06/21/2024 - Committee - Business Analysis / Operations / Vinai Sewaliah: Weekly standing call with AM and GCP teams.	Service
\$800.00	\$400.00	2.00	06/21/2024 - Committee - Business Analysis / Operations / Vinai Sewaliah: Research and analysis of comparable company financial profiles.	Service
\$720.00	\$400.00	1.80	06/21/2024 - Committee - Business Analysis / Operations / Vinai Sewaliah: Continue research and analysis of comparable company financial profiles.	Service
\$770.00	\$700.00	1.10	06/22/2024 - Committee - Business Analysis / Operations / Andre Artidiello: Multiple communications with I. Radi and E. Mendez re real estate update and rent reduction summary.	Service
\$980.00	\$700.00	1.40	06/22/2024 - Committee - Business Analysis / Operations / Andre Artidiello: Further updates to investigation related diligence requests.	Service
\$1,485.00	\$550.00	2.70	06/22/2024 - Committee - Business Analysis / Operations / Ivan Radi: Review and analysis of rent reduction summary and real estate update.	Service
\$605.00	\$550.00	1.10	06/22/2024 - Committee - Business Analysis / Operations / Ivan Radi: Multiple communications with A. Artidiello and E. Mendez re real estate update and rent reduction summary.	Service
\$770.00	\$700.00	1.10	06/22/2024 - Committee - Business Analysis / Operations / Eric Mendez: Multiple communications with A. Artidiello and I. Radi re real estate update and rent reduction summary.	Service
\$1,330.00	\$700.00	1.90	06/23/2024 - Committee - Business Analysis / Operations / Andre Artidiello: Continue comparable analysis.	Service
\$1,540.00	\$700.00	2.20	06/23/2024 - Committee - Business Analysis / Operations / Andre Artidiello: Further updates to comparable analysis including valuation multiples.	Service
\$640.00	\$400.00	1.60	06/23/2024 - Committee - Business Analysis / Operations / Vinai Sewaliah: Analysis of comparable consumer services company profiles.	Service

\$960.00	\$400.00	2.40	06/23/2024 - Committee - Business Analysis / Operations / Vinai Sewaliah: Continue analysis of comparable consumer services company profiles.	Service
\$1,470.00	\$700.00	2.10	06/24/2024 - Committee - Committee Activities / Andre Artidiello: Review and updates to committee presentation materials.	Service
\$1,960.00	\$700.00	2.80	06/24/2024 - Committee - Business Analysis / Operations / Andre Artidiello: Review and updates to 4-wall analysis.	Service
\$1,540.00	\$550.00	2.80	06/24/2024 - Committee - Business Analysis / Operations / Ivan Radi: Updates to 4-wall ebitda analysis by rejection tranche.	Service
\$1,375.00	\$550.00	2.50	06/24/2024 - Committee - Business Analysis / Operations / Ivan Radi: Continue updates to 4-wall ebitda analysis by rejection tranche.	Service
\$1,155.00	\$550.00	2.10	06/24/2024 - Committee - Committee Activities / Ivan Radi: Prepare committee presentation materials.	Service
\$1,750.00	\$700.00	2.50	06/24/2024 - Committee - Business Analysis / Operations / Eric Mendez: Finalized Business Plan outline process.	Service
\$2,100.00	\$700.00	3.00	06/24/2024 - Committee - Business Analysis / Operations / Eric Mendez: Identified main financial drivers in the financial model via tab tracing audit.	Service
\$1,750.00	\$700.00	2.50	06/24/2024 - Committee - Business Analysis / Operations / Eric Mendez: Continued financial modeling for the business plan analysis.	Service
\$800.00	\$400.00	2.00	06/24/2024 - Committee - Business Analysis / Operations / Vinai Sewaliah: Research and analysis of consumer industry outlook.	Service
\$560.00	\$400.00	1.40	06/24/2024 - Committee - Business Analysis / Operations / Vinai Sewaliah: Continue research and analysis of consumer industry outlook.	Service
\$1,000.00	\$1,000.00	1.00	06/25/2024 - Committee - Committee Activities / Edward Kim: Review and edits to committee presentation, including research of underlying data.	Service
\$1,890.00	\$700.00	2.70	06/25/2024 - Committee - Committee Activities / Andre Artidiello: Finalize updates to committee presentation materials.	Service
\$1,610.00	\$700.00	2.30	06/25/2024 - Committee - Committee Activities / Andre Artidiello: Review and updates to lease savings analysis by store.	Service
\$1,375.00	\$550.00	2.50	06/25/2024 - Committee - Business Analysis / Operations / Ivan Radi: Finalize updates to 4-wall ebitda analysis by rejection tranche.	Service
\$1,265.00	\$550.00	2.30	06/25/2024 - Committee - Committee Activities / Ivan Radi: Continue preparing committee presentation materials.	Service
\$1,540.00	\$550.00	2.80	06/25/2024 - Committee - Business Analysis / Operations / Ivan Radi: Review and analysis of updated store lease negotiations tracker.	Service
\$1,155.00	\$550.00	2.10	06/25/2024 - Committee - Business Analysis / Operations / Ivan Radi: Continue review and analysis of updated store lease negotiations tracker.	Service

\$605.00	\$550.00	1.10	06/25/2024 - Committee - Business Analysis / Operations / Ivan Radi: Multiple communications with A. Artidiello re store lease negotiations.	Service
\$1,900.00	\$1,000.00	1.90	06/25/2024 - Committee - Business Analysis / Operations / Edward Kim: Analysis of lease negotiation update file, comparison to historicals and review of target locations.	Service
\$2,100.00	\$700.00	3.00	06/25/2024 - Committee - Business Analysis / Operations / Eric Mendez: Model mapping detailed pre-investment and post- investment strategic initiatives in the model.	Service
\$2,100.00	\$700.00	3.00	06/25/2024 - Committee - Business Analysis / Operations / Eric Mendez: Transferred mapping exercise to a QA diligence template for discussion with AM.	Service
\$770.00	\$700.00	1.10	06/25/2024 - Committee - Business Analysis / Operations / Andre Artidiello: Multiple communications with I. Radi re store lease negotiations.	Service
\$400.00	\$1,000.00	0.40	06/26/2024 - Committee - Sale Process / Edward Kim: Call with PSZJ and GCP teams re sale process.	Service
\$1,000.00	\$1,000.00	1.00	06/26/2024 - Committee - Committee Activities / Edward Kim: UCC update call with GCP, PSZJ and KDW teams.	Service
\$280.00	\$700.00	0.40	06/26/2024 - Committee - Sale Process / Andre Artidiello: Call with PSZJ and GCP teams re sale process.	Service
\$700.00	\$700.00	1.00	06/26/2024 - Committee - Committee Activities / Andre Artidiello: UCC update call with GCP, PSZJ and KDW teams.	Service
\$600.00	\$1,000.00	0.60	06/26/2024 - Committee - Business Analysis / Operations / Edward Kim: Analysis of variance and comparison to prior period performance.	Service
\$750.00	\$300.00	2.50	06/26/2024 - Committee - Business Analysis / Operations / Charles Salom: Review rejected leases geography and trends.	Service
\$780.00	\$300.00	2.60	06/26/2024 - Committee - Business Analysis / Operations / Charles Salom: Continue review of rejected leases geography and trends.	Service
\$690.00	\$300.00	2.30	06/26/2024 - Committee - Business Analysis / Operations / Charles Salom: DCF management case.	Service
\$660.00	\$300.00	2.20	06/26/2024 - Committee - Business Analysis / Operations / Charles Salom: Continue DCF management case.	Service
\$280.00	\$700.00	0.40	06/26/2024 - Committee - Sale Process / Eric Mendez: Call with PSZJ and GCP teams re sale process.	Service
\$1,750.00	\$700.00	2.50	06/26/2024 - Committee - Committee Activities / Eric Mendez: UCC update call preparation.	Service
\$700.00	\$700.00	1.00	06/26/2024 - Committee - Committee Activities / Eric Mendez: UCC update call with GCP, PSZJ and KDW teams.	Service
\$1,120.00	\$700.00	1.60	06/26/2024 - Committee - Business Analysis / Operations / Eric Mendez: Lease rejection analysis of 228 stores.	Service

Service	06/26/2024 - Committee - Business Analysis / Operations / Eric Mendez: Begin sensitizing Business Plan financial modeling drivers.	2.90	\$700.00	\$2,030.00
Service	06/26/2024 - Committee - Committee Activities / Ivan Radi: UCC update call with GCP, PSZJ and KDW teams.	1.00	\$550.00	\$550.00
Service	06/26/2024 - Committee - Sale Process / Ivan Radi: Call with PSZJ and GCP teams re sale process.	0.40	\$550.00	\$220.00
Service	06/26/2024 - Committee - Business Analysis / Operations / Ivan Radi: Review and analysis of updated variance materials.	0.70	\$550.00	\$385.00
Service	06/26/2024 - Committee - Sale Process / Vinai Sewaliah: Call with PSZJ and GCP teams re sale process.	0.40	\$400.00	\$160.00
Service	06/26/2024 - Committee - Committee Activities / Vinai Sewaliah: UCC update call with GCP, PSZJ and KDW teams.	1.00	\$400.00	\$400.00
Service	06/26/2024 - Committee - Business Analysis / Operations / Vinai Sewaliah: Review and analysis of company employment initiatives.	2.20	\$400.00	\$880.00
Service	06/26/2024 - Committee - Business Analysis / Operations / Vinai Sewaliah: Continue review and analysis of company employment initiatives.	1.30	\$400.00	\$520.00
Service	06/26/2024 - Committee - Sale Process / Jorge González: Call with PSZJ and GCP teams re sale process.	0.40	\$1,000.00	\$400.00
Service	06/26/2024 - Committee - Committee Activities / Jorge González: UCC update call with GCP, PSZJ and KDW teams.	1.00	\$1,000.00	\$1,000.00
Service	06/27/2024 - Committee - Sale Process / Edward Kim: Weekly standing call with HCF and GCP teams.	0.50	\$1,000.00	\$500.00
Service	06/27/2024 - Committee - Fee / Employment Applications / Edward Kim: Revise and finalize retention application, including finalizing conflicts check results.	1.00	\$1,000.00	\$1,000.00
Service	06/27/2024 - Committee - Committee Activities / Ivan Radi: Prepare committee presentation materials.	2.10	\$550.00	\$1,155.00
Service	06/27/2024 - Committee - Committee Activities / Ivan Radi: Continue preparing committee presentation materials.	1.90	\$550.00	\$1,045.00
Service	06/27/2024 - Committee - Committee Activities / Ivan Radi: Multiple communications with C. Salom and P. Leme re committee presentation materials.	1.40	\$550.00	\$770.00
Service	06/27/2024 - Committee - Sale Process / Eric Mendez: Weekly standing call with HCF and GCP teams.	0.50	\$700.00	\$350.00
Service	06/27/2024 - Committee - Business Analysis / Operations / Eric Mendez: Financial modeling discussion with P. Leme re dashboard metrics and valuation.	0.60	\$700.00	\$420.00
Service	06/27/2024 - Committee - Business Analysis / Operations / Eric Mendez: Final modeling build to sensitize key Business Plan Drivers, focused on dashboard and assumptions mechanics.	3.00	\$700.00	\$2,100.00
Service	06/27/2024 - Committee - Business Analysis / Operations / Andre Artidiello: Further refinements to store closure analyis.	2.70	\$700.00	\$1,890.00

Service	06/27/2024 - Committee - Business Analysis / Operations / Andre Artidiello: Analysis of EBITDA bridge initiatives.	2.10	\$700.00	\$1,470.00
Service	06/27/2024 - Committee - Sale Process / Andre Artidiello: Weekly standing call with HCF and GCP teams.	0.50	\$700.00	\$350.00
Service	06/27/2024 - Committee - Claims Analysis and Objections / Vinai Sewaliah: Analysis of lease rejection trends.	1.60	\$400.00	\$640.00
Service	06/27/2024 - Committee - Sale Process / Vinai Sewaliah: Weekly standing call with HCF and GCP teams.	0.50	\$400.00	\$200.00
Service	06/27/2024 - Committee - Business Analysis / Operations / Vinai Sewaliah: Review and analysis of management financial projections.	2.10	\$400.00	\$840.00
Service	06/27/2024 - Committee - Business Analysis / Operations / Vinai Sewaliah: Continue review and analysis of management financial projections.	1.60	\$400.00	\$640.00
Service	06/27/2024 - Committee - Business Analysis / Operations / Vinai Sewaliah: Further review and analysis of management financial projections.	1.30	\$400.00	\$520.00
Service	06/27/2024 - Committee - Business Analysis / Operations / Charles Salom: Review round 1 and 2 rejected Leases.	2.50	\$300.00	\$750.00
Service	06/27/2024 - Committee - Business Analysis / Operations / Charles Salom: Continue review of round 1 and 2 rejected Leases.	2.10	\$300.00	\$630.00
Service	06/27/2024 - Committee - Business Analysis / Operations / Charles Salom: Review round 3 and 4 rejected Leases.	2.30	\$300.00	\$690.00
Service	06/27/2024 - Committee - Business Analysis / Operations / Charles Salom: Continue review round 3 and 4 rejected Leases.	2.10	\$300.00	\$630.00
Service	06/27/2024 - Committee - Business Analysis / Operations / Charles Salom: Preparation of Committee materials including lease rejection materials.	1.40	\$300.00	\$420.00
Service	06/27/2024 - Committee - Business Analysis / Operations / Charles Salom: Preparation of committee materials including geographic and demographics analyses.	1.70	\$300.00	\$510.00
Service	06/27/2024 - Committee - Business Analysis / Operations / Pedro Leme: Financial modeling discussion with E. Mendez re dashboard metrics and valuation.	0.60	\$300.00	\$180.00
Service	06/27/2024 - Committee - Business Analysis / Operations / Pedro Leme: Preparation of DCF metrics and assumptions.	2.40	\$300.00	\$720.00
Service	06/27/2024 - Committee - Business Analysis / Operations / Pedro Leme: Analysis of revenue drivers and management assumptions.	2.10	\$300.00	\$630.00
Service	06/27/2024 - Committee - Business Analysis / Operations / Pedro Leme: Ongoing preparation of DCF metrics and assumptions.	1.80	\$300.00	\$540.00
Service	06/27/2024 - Committee - Business Analysis / Operations / Pedro Leme: Continue analysis of revenue drivers and management assumptions.	1.80	\$300.00	\$540.00
Service	06/27/2024 - Committee - Business Analysis / Operations / Pedro Leme: Adjusted EBITDA walk assumptions.	2.00	\$300.00	\$600.00

Service	06/27/2024 - Committee - Committee Activities / Charles Salom: Multiple communications with I. Radi and P. Leme re committee presentation materials.	1.40	\$300.00	\$420.00
Service	06/27/2024 - Committee - Committee Activities / Pedro Leme: Multiple communications with C. Salom and I. Radi re committee presentation materials.	1.40	\$300.00	\$420.00
Service	06/28/2024 - Committee - Business Analysis / Operations / Edward Kim: Multiple communications with GCP team re model call follow-up, including case workstream coordination.	1.40	\$1,000.00	\$1,400.00
Service	06/28/2024 - Committee - Business Analysis / Operations / Edward Kim: Weekly standing call with AM and GCP teams.	0.90	\$1,000.00	\$900.00
Service	06/28/2024 - Committee - Business Analysis / Operations / Ivan Radi: Weekly standing call with AM and GCP teams.	0.90	\$550.00	\$495.00
Service	06/28/2024 - Committee - Court Hearings / Ivan Radi: Attend 341 Meeting of Creditors.	1.30	\$550.00	\$715.00
Service	06/28/2024 - Committee - Business Analysis / Operations / Eric Mendez: Weekly standing call with AM and GCP teams.	0.90	\$700.00	\$630.00
Service	06/28/2024 - Committee - Business Analysis / Operations / Eric Mendez: Multiple communications with GCP team re model call follow-up, including case workstream coordination.	1.40	\$700.00	\$980.00
Service	06/28/2024 - Committee - Business Analysis / Operations / Eric Mendez: Begin incorporating modeling suggestions from AM call to update Business Plan analysis.	2.50	\$700.00	\$1,750.00
Service	06/28/2024 - Committee - Court Hearings / Eric Mendez: Attend 341 Meeting of Creditors.	1.30	\$700.00	\$910.00
Service	06/28/2024 - Committee - Business Analysis / Operations / Andre Artidiello: Multiple communications with GCP team re model call follow-up, including case workstream coordination.	1.40	\$700.00	\$980.00
Service	06/28/2024 - Committee - Business Analysis / Operations / Vinai Sewaliah: Weekly standing call with AM and GCP teams.	0.90	\$400.00	\$360.00
Service	06/28/2024 - Committee - Business Analysis / Operations / Vinai Sewaliah: Multiple communications with E. Mendez re financial model assumptions.	1.40	\$400.00	\$560.00
Service	06/28/2024 - Committee - Court Hearings / Vinai Sewaliah: Attend 341 Meeting of Creditors.	1.30	\$400.00	\$520.00
Service	06/28/2024 - Committee - Business Analysis / Operations / Vinai Sewaliah: Review and analysis of revenue projection assumptions.	1.90	\$400.00	\$760.00
Service	06/28/2024 - Committee - Business Analysis / Operations / Charles Salom: Finish Preparation of committee materials including geographic and demographics analysis.	1.10	\$300.00	\$330.00
Service	06/28/2024 - Committee - Business Analysis / Operations / Charles Salom: Spread and analysis of store geographical data.	2.30	\$300.00	\$690.00
Service	06/28/2024 - Committee - Business Analysis / Operations / Charles Salom: Continue spread and analysis of store geographical data.	2.10	\$300.00	\$630.00

\$510.00	\$300.00	1.70	06/28/2024 - Committee - Business Analysis / Operations / Charles Salom: Spread of Debtor liquidation analysis.	Service
\$1,400.00	\$1,000.00	1.40	06/28/2024 - Committee - Business Analysis / Operations / Jorge González: Multiple communications with GCP team re model call follow-up, including case workstream coordination.	Service
\$980.00	\$700.00	1.40	06/28/2024 - Committee - Business Analysis / Operations / Eric Mendez: Multiple communications with V. Sewaliah re financial model assumptions.	Service
\$1,470.00	\$700.00	2.10	06/29/2024 - Committee - Business Analysis / Operations / Andre Artidiello: Review of latest diligence information.	Service
\$1,045.00	\$550.00	1.90	06/29/2024 - Committee - Business Analysis / Operations / Ivan Radi: Review and analysis of FY 2025 bridge materials.	Service
\$1,000.00	\$400.00	2.50	06/29/2024 - Committee - Business Analysis / Operations / Vinai Sewaliah: Analysis of management operating assumptions including food and beverage costs.	Service
\$760.00	\$400.00	1.90	06/29/2024 - Committee - Business Analysis / Operations / Vinai Sewaliah: Continue analysis of management operating assumptions including food and beverage costs.	Service
\$960.00	\$400.00	2.40	06/29/2024 - Committee - Business Analysis / Operations / Vinai Sewaliah: Ongoing analysis of management operating assumptions including food and beverage costs.	Service
\$1,040.00	\$400.00	2.60	06/29/2024 - Committee - Business Analysis / Operations / Vinai Sewaliah: Finalize analysis of management operating assumptions including food and beverage costs.	Service
\$1,890.00	\$700.00	2.70	06/30/2024 - Committee - Business Analysis / Operations / Andre Artidiello: Updates to model audit against recent diligence provided	Service
\$1,200.00	\$1,000.00	1.20	07/01/2024 - Committee - Business Analysis / Operations / Edward Kim: Multiple communications with GCP team re DIP model and FY25 bridge materials.	Service
\$840.00	\$700.00	1.20	07/01/2024 - Committee - Business Analysis / Operations / Andre Artidiello: Multiple communications with GCP team re DIP model and FY25 bridge materials.	Service
\$1,330.00	\$700.00	1.90	07/01/2024 - Committee - Business Analysis / Operations / Andre Artidiello: Analysis of FY25 bridge diligence materials.	Service
\$630.00	\$700.00	0.90	07/01/2024 - Committee - Business Analysis / Operations / Andre Artidiello: Call with AM re model assumptions.	Service
\$1,890.00	\$700.00	2.70	07/01/2024 - Committee - Business Analysis / Operations / Andre Artidiello: Further research into casual dining market outlook and comp set.	Service
\$660.00	\$550.00	1.20	07/01/2024 - Committee - Business Analysis / Operations / Ivan Radi: Multiple communications with GCP team re DIP model and FY25 bridge materials.	Service
\$1,320.00	\$550.00	2.40	07/01/2024 - Committee - Business Analysis / Operations / Ivan Radi: Continue review and analysis of FY25 bridge materials.	Service
\$495.00	\$550.00	0.90	07/01/2024 - Committee - Business Analysis / Operations / Ivan	Service

\$990.00	\$550.00	1.80	07/01/2024 - Committee - Business Analysis / Operations / Ivan Radi: Review and analysis of updated diligence production materials including historical PL and marketing materials.	Service
\$900.00	\$1,000.00	0.90	07/01/2024 - Committee - Business Analysis / Operations / Edward Kim: Call with AM re model assumptions.	Service
\$360.00	\$400.00	0.90	07/01/2024 - Committee - Business Analysis / Operations / Vinai Sewaliah: Call with AM re model assumptions.	Service
\$480.00	\$400.00	1.20	07/01/2024 - Committee - Business Analysis / Operations / Vinai Sewaliah: Multiple communications with GCP team re DIP model and FY25 bridge materials.	Service
\$760.00	\$400.00	1.90	07/01/2024 - Committee - Committee Activities / Vinai Sewaliah: Preparation of committee presentation materials.	Service
\$1,000.00	\$400.00	2.50	07/01/2024 - Committee - Business Analysis / Operations / Vinai Sewaliah: Analysis of industry performance metrics.	Service
\$720.00	\$400.00	1.80	07/01/2024 - Committee - Business Analysis / Operations / Vinai Sewaliah: Continue analysis of industry performance metrics.	Service
\$840.00	\$700.00	1.20	07/01/2024 - Committee - Business Analysis / Operations / Eric Mendez: Multiple communications with GCP team re DIP model and FY25 bridge materials.	Service
\$2,100.00	\$700.00	3.00	07/01/2024 - Committee - Business Analysis / Operations / Eric Mendez: Review of EBITDA bridges sent over weekend.	Service
\$2,100.00	\$700.00	3.00	07/01/2024 - Committee - Business Analysis / Operations / Eric Mendez: Incorporating EBITDA bridge analysis into the financial model.	Service
\$1,750.00	\$700.00	2.50	07/01/2024 - Committee - Business Analysis / Operations / Eric Mendez: Revised business plan deck based on updated modeling assumptions.	Service
\$1,200.00	\$1,000.00	1.20	07/01/2024 - Committee - Business Analysis / Operations / Jorge González: Multiple communications with GCP team re DIP model and FY25 bridge materials.	Service
\$1,050.00	\$700.00	1.50	07/02/2024 - Committee - Committee Activities / Andre Artidiello: Multiple communications with GCP team re business plan presentation materials.	Service
\$1,470.00	\$700.00	2.10	07/02/2024 - Committee - Business Analysis / Operations / Andre Artidiello: Compile historical guest count analysis and related outputs.	Service
\$1,960.00	\$700.00	2.80	07/02/2024 - Committee - Business Analysis / Operations / Andre Artidiello: Compile historical average check size analysis and related outputs.	Service
\$1,500.00	\$1,000.00	1.50	07/02/2024 - Committee - Committee Activities / Edward Kim: Multiple communications with GCP team re business plan presentation materials.	Service
\$1,485.00	\$550.00	2.70	07/02/2024 - Committee - Committee Activities / Ivan Radi: Prepare committee presentation materials.	Service
\$1,320.00	\$550.00	2.40	07/02/2024 - Committee - Committee Activities / Ivan Radi: Continue preparing committee presentation materials.	Service

Service	07/02/2024 - Committee - Committee Activities / Ivan Radi: Multiple communications with GCP team re business plan presentation materials.	1.50	\$550.00	\$825.00
Service	07/02/2024 - Committee - Business Analysis / Operations / Ivan Radi: Review, comparison and analysis of historical financials vs. business plan financials.	2.60	\$550.00	\$1,430.00
Service	07/02/2024 - Committee - Committee Activities / Vinai Sewaliah: Multiple communications with GCP team re business plan presentation materials.	1.50	\$400.00	\$600.00
Service	07/02/2024 - Committee - Business Analysis / Operations / Vinai Sewaliah: Research and analysis of comparable company growth and consolidation initiatives.	2.30	\$400.00	\$920.00
Service	07/02/2024 - Committee - Business Analysis / Operations / Vinai Sewaliah: Continue research and analysis of comparable company growth and consolidation initiatives.	1.60	\$400.00	\$640.00
Service	07/02/2024 - Committee - Business Analysis / Operations / Eric Mendez: Incorporate comparable companies research data into business plan analysis.	3.00	\$700.00	\$2,100.00
Service	07/02/2024 - Committee - Business Analysis / Operations / Eric Mendez: Put together cost analysis slides for business plan analysis.	3.00	\$700.00	\$2,100.00
Service	07/02/2024 - Committee - Business Analysis / Operations / Eric Mendez: Design and implement changes to business plan analysis based on recent analysis.	3.00	\$700.00	\$2,100.00
Service	07/02/2024 - Committee - Committee Activities / Pedro Leme: Preparation committee materials regarding comparable companies presentation.	2.10	\$300.00	\$630.00
Service	07/02/2024 - Committee - Committee Activities / Pedro Leme: Review committee presentation materials and provide commentary regarding content and assumptions selected.	1.90	\$300.00	\$570.00
Service	07/02/2024 - Committee - Committee Activities / Pedro Leme: Multiple communications with GCP team re business plan presentation materials.	1.50	\$300.00	\$450.00
Service	07/02/2024 - Committee - Committee Activities / Jorge González: Multiple communications with GCP team re business plan presentation materials.	1.50	\$1,000.00	\$1,500.00
Service	07/03/2024 - Committee - Sale Process / Edward Kim: Weekly standing call with Hilco and GCP re sale process.	0.30	\$1,000.00	\$300.00
Service	07/03/2024 - Committee - Committee Activities / Ivan Radi: Finalize committee presentation materials.	2.10	\$550.00	\$1,155.00
Service	07/03/2024 - Committee - Business Analysis / Operations / Ivan Radi: Continue review, comparison and analysis of historical financials vs. business plan financials.	2.80	\$550.00	\$1,540.00
Service	07/03/2024 - Committee - Sale Process / Ivan Radi: Weekly standing call with Hilco and GCP re sale process.	0.30	\$550.00	\$165.00
Service	07/03/2024 - Committee - Sale Process / Andre Artidiello: Weekly standing call with Hilco and GCP re sale process.	0.30	\$700.00	\$210.00

Service	07/03/2024 - Committee - Business Analysis / Operations / Andre Artidiello: Updates to historical cyclicality analysis.	2.90	\$700.00	\$2,030.00
Service	07/03/2024 - Committee - Business Analysis / Operations / Andre Artidiello: Review and updates to guest count analysis.	2.40	\$700.00	\$1,680.00
Service	07/03/2024 - Committee - Court Filings / Charles Salom: Review recent court fillings including docket nos. 488,490.	1.10	\$300.00	\$330.00
Service	07/03/2024 - Committee - Court Filings / Charles Salom: Review recent court fillings including docket nos. 492, 531.	1.20	\$300.00	\$360.00
Service	07/03/2024 - Committee - Court Filings / Charles Salom: Review recent court fillings including docket nos. 475, 476, 531.	1.30	\$300.00	\$390.00
Service	07/03/2024 - Committee - Sale Process / Vinai Sewaliah: Weekly standing call with Hilco and GCP re sale process.	0.30	\$400.00	\$120.00
Service	07/03/2024 - Committee - Business Analysis / Operations / Vinai Sewaliah: Analysis of comparable company historical capital expenditures.	2.80	\$400.00	\$1,120.00
Service	07/03/2024 - Committee - Business Analysis / Operations / Vinai Sewaliah: Continue analysis of comparable company historical capital expenditures.	1.60	\$400.00	\$640.00
Service	07/03/2024 - Committee - Business Analysis / Operations / Eric Mendez: Finalize committee presentation materials.	2.10	\$700.00	\$1,470.00
Service	07/03/2024 - Committee - Business Analysis / Operations / Eric Mendez: Continue review, comparison and analysis of historical financials vs. business plan financials.	2.80	\$700.00	\$1,960.00
Service	07/03/2024 - Committee - Business Analysis / Operations / Eric Mendez: Finalization of industry mapping against final of variables to sensitize in the model for the business plan analysis.	3.00	\$700.00	\$2,100.00
Service	07/03/2024 - Committee - Sale Process / Eric Mendez: Weekly standing call with Hilco and GCP re sale process.	0.30	\$700.00	\$210.00
Service	07/03/2024 - Committee - Business Analysis / Operations / Eric Mendez: Finalized Business Plan presentation template by section with creation of headers, taglines and historical financials.	3.00	\$700.00	\$2,100.00
Service	07/03/2024 - Committee - Business Analysis / Operations / Pedro Leme: Research and analysis of pricing trends in the restaurant sector.	2.50	\$300.00	\$750.00
Service	07/03/2024 - Committee - Business Analysis / Operations / Pedro Leme: Continue analysis of pricing trends in the restaurant sector.	2.30	\$300.00	\$690.00
Service	07/03/2024 - Committee - Business Analysis / Operations / Pedro Leme: Ongoing research of pricing trends in the restaurant sector.	2.20	\$300.00	\$660.00
Service	07/03/2024 - Committee - Committee Activities / Pedro Leme: Preparation of committee materials, including pricing trends.	2.40	\$300.00	\$720.00
Service	07/03/2024 - Committee - Committee Activities / Pedro Leme: Continue preparation of committee materials, including pricing trends.	2.10	\$300.00	\$630.00
Service	07/03/2024 - Committee - Committee Activities / Pedro Leme: Updates to committee materials.	1.90	\$300.00	\$570.00

Service	07/04/2024 - Committee - Business Analysis / Operations / Ivan Radi: Multiple communications with P. Leme re inflation trends and consumer dynamics in casual dining.	1.40	\$550.00	\$770.00
Service	07/04/2024 - Committee - Business Analysis / Operations / Edward Kim: Analysis of VDR data and initial review of management presentation slides.	1.60	\$1,000.00	\$1,600.00
Service	07/04/2024 - Committee - Business Analysis / Operations / Eric Mendez: Finalized core comparables leveraging mgmt. materials and equity research reports.	3.00	\$700.00	\$2,100.00
Service	07/04/2024 - Committee - Committee Activities / Pedro Leme: Ongoing preparation of committee materials.	2.20	\$300.00	\$660.00
Service	07/04/2024 - Committee - Business Analysis / Operations / Pedro Leme: Analysis of expense rationalization initiatives' impact on Profit and Loss statement.	2.10	\$300.00	\$630.00
Service	07/04/2024 - Committee - Business Analysis / Operations / Pedro Leme: Continue analysis of expense rationalization initiatives' impact on Profit and Loss statement.	1.90	\$300.00	\$570.00
Service	07/04/2024 - Committee - Business Analysis / Operations / Pedro Leme: Ongoing analysis of expense rationalization initiatives' impact on Profit and Loss statement.	3.20	\$300.00	\$960.00
Service	07/04/2024 - Committee - Business Analysis / Operations / Pedro Leme: Multiple communications with I. Radi re inflation trends and consumer dynamics in casual dining.	1.40	\$300.00	\$420.00
Service	07/05/2024 - Committee - Business Analysis / Operations / Ivan Radi: Finalize review, comparison and analysis of historical financials vs. business plan financials.	2.40	\$550.00	\$1,320.00
Service	07/05/2024 - Committee - Business Analysis / Operations / Ivan Radi: Prepare updates and variance analysis of historical financials vs. business plan financials.	2.70	\$550.00	\$1,485.00
Service	07/05/2024 - Committee - Business Analysis / Operations / Andre Artidiello: Review and analysis of industry research reports.	2.70	\$700.00	\$1,890.00
Service	07/05/2024 - Committee - Business Analysis / Operations / Andre Artidiello: Continue review and analysis of industry research reports.	2.10	\$700.00	\$1,470.00
Service	07/05/2024 - Committee - Business Analysis / Operations / Vinai Sewaliah: Finalize analysis of comparable company historical capital expenditures.	1.80	\$400.00	\$720.00
Service	07/05/2024 - Committee - Business Analysis / Operations / Vinai Sewaliah: Analysis of casual dining operating metrics including same store performance.	1.60	\$400.00	\$640.00
Service	07/05/2024 - Committee - Business Analysis / Operations / Vinai Sewaliah: Continue analysis of casual dining operating metrics including same store performance.	2.60	\$400.00	\$1,040.00
Service	07/05/2024 - Committee - Business Analysis / Operations / Vinai Sewaliah: Ongoing review of casual dining operating metrics including same store performance.	2.40	\$400.00	\$960.00

Service	07/05/2024 - Committee - Business Analysis / Operations / Vinai Sewaliah: Further analysis of casual dining operating metrics including same store performance.	2.00	\$400.00	\$800.00
Service	07/05/2024 - Committee - Business Analysis / Operations / Eric Mendez: Prepare updates and variance analysis of historical financials vs. business plan financials.	2.70	\$700.00	\$1,890.00
Service	07/05/2024 - Committee - Business Analysis / Operations / Eric Mendez: First draft of the historical analysis framework for the business plan analysis.	2.90	\$700.00	\$2,030.00
Service	07/05/2024 - Committee - Business Analysis / Operations / Eric Mendez: Began work on the single variable sensitivity analysis to begin narrowing down the business plan mapping.	3.00	\$700.00	\$2,100.00
Service	07/05/2024 - Committee - Business Analysis / Operations / Pedro Leme: Research and analysis of macroeconomic data regarding cost initiative trends affecting the restaurant sector.	2.40	\$300.00	\$720.00
Service	07/05/2024 - Committee - Business Analysis / Operations / Pedro Leme: Continue research of macroeconomic data on cost initiative trends affecting the restaurant sector.	2.10	\$300.00	\$630.00
Service	07/05/2024 - Committee - Business Analysis / Operations / Pedro Leme: Ongoing analysis of macroeconomic data on cost initiative trends affecting the restaurant sector.	1.70	\$300.00	\$510.00
Service	07/06/2024 - Committee - Business Analysis / Operations / Ivan Radi: Research and analysis of comparable companies research reports.	2.40	\$550.00	\$1,320.00
Service	07/06/2024 - Committee - Business Analysis / Operations / Ivan Radi: Continue research and analysis of comparable companies research reports.	2.70	\$550.00	\$1,485.00
Service	07/06/2024 - Committee - Business Analysis / Operations / Ivan Radi: Multiple communications with V. Sewaliah re comparable company research.	1.20	\$550.00	\$660.00
Service	07/06/2024 - Committee - Committee Activities / Ivan Radi: Review and commentary to updated business plan presentation slides.	2.20	\$550.00	\$1,210.00
Service	07/06/2024 - Committee - Business Analysis / Operations / Andre Artidiello: Updates to model sensitivity analysis.	1.70	\$700.00	\$1,190.00
Service	07/06/2024 - Committee - Business Analysis / Operations / Andre Artidiello: Review of diligence production materials.	2.30	\$700.00	\$1,610.00
Service	07/06/2024 - Committee - Business Analysis / Operations / Andre Artidiello: Research into industry off-prem trends.	1.30	\$700.00	\$910.00
Service	07/06/2024 - Committee - Business Analysis / Operations / Vinai Sewaliah: Analysis of comparable company operating expenses.	2.10	\$400.00	\$840.00
Service	07/06/2024 - Committee - Business Analysis / Operations / Vinai Sewaliah: Continue analysis of comparable company operating expenses.	1.80	\$400.00	\$720.00
Service	07/06/2024 - Committee - Business Analysis / Operations / Vinai Sewaliah: Ongoing analysis of comparable company operating expenses.	1.90	\$400.00	\$760.00

Service	07/06/2024 - Committee - Business Analysis / Operations / Eric Mendez: First draft of the industry level trends for revenue sensitivities in the business plan analysis.	2.80	\$700.00	\$1,960.00
Service	07/06/2024 - Committee - Business Analysis / Operations / Eric Mendez: Redesigned the layout of the sensitivity analysis to coincide with the revised Revenue and Cost impact analyses.	3.00	\$700.00	\$2,100.00
Service	07/06/2024 - Committee - Business Analysis / Operations / Eric Mendez: First draft of the industry level trends for cost sensitivities in the business plan analysis.	2.70	\$700.00	\$1,890.00
Service	07/06/2024 - Committee - Business Analysis / Operations / Vinai Sewaliah: Multiple communications with V. Sewaliah re comparable company research.	1.20	\$400.00	\$480.00
Service	07/07/2024 - Committee - Business Analysis / Operations / Ivan Radi: Finalize research and analysis of comparable companies research reports.	2.60	\$550.00	\$1,430.00
Service	07/07/2024 - Committee - Committee Activities / Ivan Radi: Multiple communications with E. Mendez re business plan presentation materials.	0.90	\$550.00	\$495.00
Service	07/07/2024 - Committee - Business Analysis / Operations / Andre Artidiello: Multiple communications with I. Radi re business plan off-prem assumptions and related industry trends.	1.70	\$700.00	\$1,190.00
Service	07/07/2024 - Committee - Business Analysis / Operations / Andre Artidiello: Updates to gross margin and COGS analysis.	2.70	\$700.00	\$1,890.00
Service	07/07/2024 - Committee - Business Analysis / Operations / Ivan Radi: Multiple communications with A. Artidiello re business plan off-prem assumptions and related industry trends.	1.70	\$550.00	\$935.00
Service	07/07/2024 - Committee - Business Analysis / Operations / Eric Mendez: Completed post-COVID recovery momentum draft for revenue dynamics section of the business plan.	2.30	\$700.00	\$1,610.00
Service	07/07/2024 - Committee - Committee Activities / Eric Mendez: Multiple communications with I. Radi re business plan presentation materials.	0.90	\$700.00	\$630.00
Service	07/08/2024 - Committee - Case Administration / Edward Kim: Workstream update and coordination call with GCP team.	1.40	\$1,000.00	\$1,400.00
Service	07/08/2024 - Committee - Case Administration / Andre Artidiello: Workstream update and coordination call with GCP team.	1.40	\$700.00	\$980.00
Service	07/08/2024 - Committee - Committee Activities / Andre Artidiello: Updates to committee presentation materials.	2.70	\$700.00	\$1,890.00
Service	07/08/2024 - Committee - Case Administration / Ivan Radi: Workstream update and coordination call with GCP team.	1.40	\$550.00	\$770.00
Service	07/08/2024 - Committee - Business Analysis / Operations / Ivan Radi: Review and analysis of updated lease negotiation schedule and budget to variance.	2.40	\$550.00	\$1,320.00
Service	07/08/2024 - Committee - Committee Activities / Ivan Radi: Prepare committee presentation materials.	2.70	\$550.00	\$1,485.00

Service	07/08/2024 - Committee - Business Analysis / Operations / Ivan Radi: Multiple communications with E. Mendez re business plan model and rent savings assumptions.	1.50	\$550.00	\$825.00
Service	07/08/2024 - Committee - Case Administration / Vinai Sewaliah: Workstream update and coordination call with GCP team.	1.40	\$400.00	\$560.00
Service	07/08/2024 - Committee - Committee Activities / Vinai Sewaliah: Preparation of business plan presentation materials.	1.80	\$400.00	\$720.00
Service	07/08/2024 - Committee - Committee Activities / Vinai Sewaliah: Continue preparation of business plan presentation materials.	1.90	\$400.00	\$760.00
Service	07/08/2024 - Committee - Business Analysis / Operations / Vinai Sewaliah: Research and analysis of dining company historical efficiency.	2.20	\$400.00	\$880.00
Service	07/08/2024 - Committee - Business Analysis / Operations / Vinai Sewaliah: Finalize research and analysis of dining company historical efficiency.	2.40	\$400.00	\$960.00
Service	07/08/2024 - Committee - Business Analysis / Operations / Vinai Sewaliah: Continue research and analysis of dining company historical efficiency.	2.00	\$400.00	\$800.00
Service	07/08/2024 - Committee - Business Analysis / Operations / Eric Mendez: Ran minimum and maximum leverage capacity on the model assuming base case management assumptions.	2.90	\$700.00	\$2,030.00
Service	07/08/2024 - Committee - Case Administration / Eric Mendez: Workstream update and coordination call with GCP team.	1.40	\$700.00	\$980.00
Service	07/08/2024 - Committee - Business Analysis / Operations / Eric Mendez: Multiple communications with I. Radi re business plan model and rent savings assumptions.	1.50	\$700.00	\$1,050.00
Service	07/08/2024 - Committee - Business Analysis / Operations / Eric Mendez: Multiple communications with AM team to reconcile and tie out sensitivity analysis in GCP modeling.	2.60	\$700.00	\$1,820.00
Service	07/08/2024 - Committee - Business Analysis / Operations / Eric Mendez: Research and finalize restaurant vs grocery inflation pricing for industry trends slides.	2.90	\$700.00	\$2,030.00
Service	07/08/2024 - Committee - Business Analysis / Operations / Eric Mendez: Revise leverage assumptions based on Average Guest Count sensitivities to establish minimum projection cash going forward.	2.50	\$700.00	\$1,750.00
Service	07/08/2024 - Committee - Business Analysis / Operations / Pedro Leme: Spread and analysis of store revenues and EBITDA by state, debtor tier and wave.	2.40	\$300.00	\$720.00
Service	07/08/2024 - Committee - Business Analysis / Operations / Pedro Leme: Continue spread and analysis of store revenues and EBITDA by state, debtor tier and wave.	2.20	\$300.00	\$660.00
Service	07/08/2024 - Committee - Business Analysis / Operations / Pedro Leme: Ongoing analysis of store revenues and EBITDA by state, debtor tier and wave.	1.90	\$300.00	\$570.00
Service	07/08/2024 - Committee - Business Analysis / Operations / Pedro Leme: Additional analysis of store revenues and EBITDA by state, debtor tier and wave.	1.60	\$300.00	\$480.00

Service	07/08/2024 - Committee - Business Analysis / Operations / Pedro Leme: Review and analysis of sensitized initiatives' projected assumptions.	2.40	\$300.00	\$720.00
Service	07/08/2024 - Committee - Business Analysis / Operations / Pedro Leme: Continue review and analysis of sensitized initiatives' projected assumptions.	2.20	\$300.00	\$660.00
Service	07/08/2024 - Committee - Business Analysis / Operations / Pedro Leme: Updated review and analysis of sensitized initiatives' projected assumptions.	1.90	\$300.00	\$570.00
Service	07/08/2024 - Committee - Case Administration / Jorge González: Workstream update and coordination call with GCP team.	1.40	\$1,000.00	\$1,400.00
Service	07/09/2024 - Committee - Business Analysis / Operations / Edward Kim: Weekly standing call with AM and GCP teams.	0.50	\$1,000.00	\$500.00
Service	07/09/2024 - Committee - Business Analysis / Operations / Andre Artidiello: Weekly standing call with AM and GCP teams.	0.50	\$700.00	\$350.00
Service	07/09/2024 - Committee - Business Analysis / Operations / Andre Artidiello: Review and updates to committee presentation materials.	1.90	\$700.00	\$1,330.00
Service	07/09/2024 - Committee - Business Analysis / Operations / Andre Artidiello: Updates to cumulative variance analysis.	1.20	\$700.00	\$840.00
Service	07/09/2024 - Committee - Business Analysis / Operations / Andre Artidiello: Review and updates to model sensitivity analysis.	2.70	\$700.00	\$1,890.00
Service	07/09/2024 - Committee - Committee Activities / Edward Kim: Multiple communications with GCP team re committee presentation materials.	1.20	\$1,000.00	\$1,200.00
Service	07/09/2024 - Committee - Committee Activities / Edward Kim: Review, edits and comments to committee presentation.	0.40	\$1,000.00	\$400.00
Service	07/09/2024 - Committee - Business Analysis / Operations / Edward Kim: Analysis of store and estate performance through case to date.	0.80	\$1,000.00	\$800.00
Service	07/09/2024 - Committee - Business Analysis / Operations / Edward Kim: Analysis of rent reduction and related performance data in VDR.	1.20	\$1,000.00	\$1,200.00
Service	07/09/2024 - Committee - Business Analysis / Operations / Ivan Radi: Weekly standing call with AM and GCP teams.	0.50	\$550.00	\$275.00
Service	07/09/2024 - Committee - Business Analysis / Operations / Ivan Radi: Modeling of rent reduction scenarios.	2.80	\$550.00	\$1,540.00
Service	07/09/2024 - Committee - Committee Activities / Ivan Radi: Continue preparing committee presentation materials.	2.40	\$550.00	\$1,320.00
Service	07/09/2024 - Committee - Business Analysis / Operations / Ivan Radi: Updates to variance analysis.	2.10	\$550.00	\$1,155.00
Service	07/09/2024 - Committee - Committee Activities / Ivan Radi: Multiple communications with GCP team re committee presentation materials.	1.20	\$550.00	\$660.00

\$200.00	\$400.00	0.50	07/09/2024 - Committee - Business Analysis / Operations / Vinai	Service
\$200.00	φ+00.00	0.50	Sewaliah: Weekly standing call with AM and GCP teams.	Gervice
\$840.00	\$400.00	2.10	07/09/2024 - Committee - Business Analysis / Operations / Vinai Sewaliah: Analysis of business plan sensitivities including marketing, training and employment services.	Service
\$720.00	\$400.00	1.80	07/09/2024 - Committee - Business Analysis / Operations / Vinai Sewaliah: Ongoing analysis of business plan sensitivities.	Service
\$640.00	\$400.00	1.60	07/09/2024 - Committee - Business Analysis / Operations / Vinai Sewaliah: Additiona review of business plan sensitivities.	Service
\$920.00	\$400.00	2.30	07/09/2024 - Committee - Business Analysis / Operations / Vinai Sewaliah: Continue analysis of business plan sensitivities including marketing, training and employment services.	Service
\$350.00	\$700.00	0.50	07/09/2024 - Committee - Business Analysis / Operations / Eric Mendez: Weekly standing call with AM and GCP teams.	Service
\$1,960.00	\$700.00	2.80	07/09/2024 - Committee - Business Analysis / Operations / Eric Mendez: Review of rent reduction scenarios to incorporate into the financial summary scenarios.	Service
\$840.00	\$700.00	1.20	07/09/2024 - Committee - Committee Activities / Eric Mendez: Multiple communications with GCP team re committee presentation materials.	Service
\$2,030.00	\$700.00	2.90	07/09/2024 - Committee - Business Analysis / Operations / Eric Mendez: Equity research analysis to find data to support capex spend across the industry for core competitors.	Service
\$2,100.00	\$700.00	3.00	07/09/2024 - Committee - Business Analysis / Operations / Eric Mendez: Finalize business plan slide incorporating capex spend versus company expectations.	Service
\$1,890.00	\$700.00	2.70	07/09/2024 - Committee - Business Analysis / Operations / Eric Mendez: Start off-premise competitor analysis and vendor delivery cost estimates.	Service
\$2,030.00	\$700.00	2.90	07/09/2024 - Committee - Committee Activities / Eric Mendez: Draft industry-level trends cost Impact slide.	Service
\$750.00	\$300.00	2.50	07/09/2024 - Committee - Business Analysis / Operations / Pedro Leme: Preparation of committee materials regarding Baseline Initiatives and Digital Transformation Impact.	Service
\$660.00	\$300.00	2.20	07/09/2024 - Committee - Business Analysis / Operations / Pedro Leme: Continue preparation of committee materials regarding Baseline Initiatives and Digital Transformation Impact.	Service
\$540.00	\$300.00	1.80	07/09/2024 - Committee - Business Analysis / Operations / Pedro Leme: Finished preparation of committee materials regarding Baseline Initiatives and Digital Transformation Impact.	Service
\$690.00	\$300.00	2.30	07/09/2024 - Committee - Business Analysis / Operations / Pedro Leme: Research and analysis of macroeconomic trends affecting menu pricing in the restaurant sector.	Service
\$510.00	\$300.00	1.70	07/09/2024 - Committee - Business Analysis / Operations / Pedro Leme: Continue research and analysis of macroeconomic trends affecting menu pricing in the restaurant sector.	Service

Service	07/09/2024 - Committee - Committee Activities / Jorge González: Multiple communications with GCP team re committee presentation materials.	1.20	\$1,000.00	\$1,200.00
Service	07/10/2024 - Committee - Court Hearings / Edward Kim: Attend status conference.	0.40	\$1,000.00	\$400.00
Service	07/10/2024 - Committee - Sale Process / Edward Kim: All advisors sale update call.	0.30	\$1,000.00	\$300.00
Service	07/10/2024 - Committee - Business Analysis / Operations / Edward Kim: Analyze public disclosures and annual reports of potential buyer, including transcription of key data for team.	1.90	\$1,000.00	\$1,900.00
Service	07/10/2024 - Committee - Business Analysis / Operations / Charles Salom: Spread and analysis of Business Plan sensitivities scenarios including industrial cleaner, corporate overhead, and Crunchtime.	2.40	\$300.00	\$720.00
Service	07/10/2024 - Committee - Court Hearings / Vinai Sewaliah: Attend status conference.	0.40	\$400.00	\$160.00
Service	07/10/2024 - Committee - Sale Process / Vinai Sewaliah: All advisors sale update call.	0.30	\$400.00	\$120.00
Service	07/10/2024 - Committee - Business Analysis / Operations / Vinai Sewaliah: Research and analysis of fixed and variable costs trends.	2.40	\$400.00	\$960.00
Service	07/10/2024 - Committee - Business Analysis / Operations / Vinai Sewaliah: Continue research and analysis of fixed and variable costs trends.	1.90	\$400.00	\$760.00
Service	07/10/2024 - Committee - Business Analysis / Operations / Ivan Radi: Continue modeling of rent reduction scenarios.	2.40	\$550.00	\$1,320.00
Service	07/10/2024 - Committee - Committee Activities / Ivan Radi: Finish preparing committee presentation materials.	2.10	\$550.00	\$1,155.00
Service	07/10/2024 - Committee - Court Hearings / Ivan Radi: Attend status conference.	0.40	\$550.00	\$220.00
Service	07/10/2024 - Committee - Sale Process / Ivan Radi: All advisors sale update call.	0.30	\$550.00	\$165.00
Service	07/10/2024 - Committee - Court Hearings / Andre Artidiello: Attend status conference.	0.40	\$700.00	\$280.00
Service	07/10/2024 - Committee - Sale Process / Andre Artidiello: All advisors sale update call.	0.30	\$700.00	\$210.00
Service	07/10/2024 - Committee - Business Analysis / Operations / Andre Artidiello: Review and updates to competitive market dynamics analysis and related outputs.	2.60	\$700.00	\$1,820.00
Service	07/10/2024 - Committee - Business Analysis / Operations / Andre Artidiello: Updates to case model sensitivity analysis.	1.70	\$700.00	\$1,190.00
Service	07/10/2024 - Committee - Committee Activities / Andre Artidiello: Updates to committee presentation materials.	3.20	\$700.00	\$2,240.00
Service	07/10/2024 - Committee - Committee Activities / Andre Artidiello: Further updates to committee presentation materials.	2.10	\$700.00	\$1,470.00

Service	07/10/2024 - Committee - Business Analysis / Operations / Eric Mendez: Finalized store count analysis for core competitors to estimate the 2019 - 2023 growth estimates.	2.30	\$700.00	\$1,610.00
Service	07/10/2024 - Committee - Business Analysis / Operations / Eric Mendez: Reviewed inflationary pressures forcing efficiency' slides for business plan presentation.	0.40	\$700.00	\$280.00
Service	07/10/2024 - Committee - Business Analysis / Operations / Eric Mendez: Started single-variable sensitivity analyses for average guest counts to narrow impact for sensitivity analysis.	2.60	\$700.00	\$1,820.00
Service	07/10/2024 - Committee - Business Analysis / Operations / Eric Mendez: Completed single-variable sensitivity analyses for pricing strategy to narrow impact for sensitivity analysis.	2.80	\$700.00	\$1,960.00
Service	07/10/2024 - Committee - Business Analysis / Operations / Eric Mendez: Analyzed various other top-line sensitivities.	1.50	\$700.00	\$1,050.00
Service	07/10/2024 - Committee - Committee Activities / Eric Mendez: AGC historical and as-is business plan slide, comparing against core competitors.	2.90	\$700.00	\$2,030.00
Service	07/10/2024 - Committee - Business Analysis / Operations / Eric Mendez: AGC single-variable sensitivity finalization and creation of respective slide for presentation.	2.40	\$700.00	\$1,680.00
Service	07/10/2024 - Committee - Committee Activities / Eric Mendez: Updated and finalized menu pricing-product mix initiatives slide, including competitor contrast.	2.10	\$700.00	\$1,470.00
Service	07/10/2024 - Committee - Court Hearings / Eric Mendez: Attend status conference.	0.40	\$700.00	\$280.00
Service	07/10/2024 - Committee - Sale Process / Eric Mendez: All advisors sale update call.	0.30	\$700.00	\$210.00
Service	07/10/2024 - Committee - Business Analysis / Operations / Pedro Leme: Analysis of cumulative EBITDA impact projections including Crunchtime, overtime reduction and SaaS efficiency variables.	2.40	\$300.00	\$720.00
Service	07/10/2024 - Committee - Business Analysis / Operations / Pedro Leme: Continue analysis of cumulative EBITDA impact projections including Crunchtime, overtime reduction and SaaS efficiency variables.	2.10	\$300.00	\$630.00
Service	07/10/2024 - Committee - Business Analysis / Operations / Pedro Leme: Ongoing analysis of cumulative EBITDA impact projections including Crunchtime, overtime reduction and SaaS efficiency variables.	1.80	\$300.00	\$540.00
Service	07/10/2024 - Committee - Business Analysis / Operations / Pedro Leme: Additional analysis of cumulative EBITDA impact projections including Crunchtime, overtime reduction and SaaS efficiency variables.	1.50	\$300.00	\$450.00
Service	07/10/2024 - Committee - Business Analysis / Operations / Pedro Leme: Further research and analysis of macroeconomic trends affecting menu pricing in the restaurant sector.	2.40	\$300.00	\$720.00
Service	07/10/2024 - Committee - Business Analysis / Operations / Pedro Leme: Ongoing analysis of macroeconomic trends affecting menu pricing in the restaurant sector.	2.10	\$300.00	\$630.00

Service	07/11/2024 - Committee - Sale Process / Edward Kim: Weekly standing call with HCF and GCP teams.	0.20	\$1,000.00	\$200.00
Service	07/11/2024 - Committee - Business Analysis / Operations / Charles Salom: Analysis of Business Plan sensitivities scenarios including employment advertising, employee fees, and managers in training.	2.10	\$300.00	\$630.00
Service	07/11/2024 - Committee - Business Analysis / Operations / Charles Salom: Analysis of Business Plan sensitivities scenarios including managers in training, relocation expenses and outside services.	2.30	\$300.00	\$690.00
Service	07/11/2024 - Committee - Business Analysis / Operations / Charles Salom: Ongoing analysis of Business Plan sensitivities scenarios.	1.90	\$300.00	\$570.00
Service	07/11/2024 - Committee - Sale Process / Vinai Sewaliah: Weekly standing call with HCF and GCP teams.	0.20	\$400.00	\$80.00
Service	07/11/2024 - Committee - Business Analysis / Operations / Charles Salom: Continue analysis of Business Plan sensitivities scenarios including employment advertising, employee fees, and managers in training.	2.10	\$300.00	\$630.00
Service	07/11/2024 - Committee - Committee Activities / Vinai Sewaliah: Revision of business plan figures and presentation materials.	2.10	\$400.00	\$840.00
Service	07/11/2024 - Committee - Committee Activities / Vinai Sewaliah: Continue revision of business plan figures and presentation materials.	2.80	\$400.00	\$1,120.00
Service	07/11/2024 - Committee - Committee Activities / Vinai Sewaliah: Final revisions to business plan figures and presentation materials.	1.70	\$400.00	\$680.00
Service	07/11/2024 - Committee - Business Analysis / Operations / Ivan Radi: Research and analysis of cost-based trends.	2.80	\$550.00	\$1,540.00
Service	07/11/2024 - Committee - Business Analysis / Operations / Ivan Radi: Continue research and analysis of cost-based trends.	1.50	\$550.00	\$825.00
Service	07/11/2024 - Committee - Sale Process / Ivan Radi: Weekly standing call with HCF and GCP teams.	0.20	\$550.00	\$110.00
Service	07/11/2024 - Committee - Business Analysis / Operations / Ivan Radi: Finalize modeling of rent reduction scenarios.	2.70	\$550.00	\$1,485.00
Service	07/11/2024 - Committee - Sale Process / Andre Artidiello: Weekly standing call with HCF and GCP teams.	0.20	\$700.00	\$140.00
Service	07/11/2024 - Committee - Court Hearings / Andre Artidiello: Attend omnibus hearing.	1.00	\$700.00	\$700.00
Service	07/11/2024 - Committee - Business Analysis / Operations / Andre Artidiello: Review and updates to model sensitivity analysis, including changes to rent considerations.	3.10	\$700.00	\$2,170.00
Service	07/11/2024 - Committee - Business Analysis / Operations / Andre Artidiello: Continue review and updates to model sensitivity analysis.	2.20	\$700.00	\$1,540.00
Service	07/11/2024 - Committee - Business Analysis / Operations / Eric Mendez: Update and finalize menu pricing-product mix initiatives slide, including the competitor contrast.	2.10	\$700.00	\$1,470.00

Service	07/11/2024 - Committee - Sale Process / Eric Mendez: Weekly standing call with HCF and GCP teams.	0.20	\$700.00	\$140.00
Service	07/11/2024 - Committee - Business Analysis / Operations / Eric Mendez: Review rent reduction summaries for inclusion in the business plan deck.	0.80	\$700.00	\$560.00
Service	07/11/2024 - Committee - Committee Activities / Eric Mendez: Finalize draft of industry-level trends cost impact slide.	1.90	\$700.00	\$1,330.00
Service	07/11/2024 - Committee - Business Analysis / Operations / Eric Mendez: Analyze potential sensitivity of closing additional stores.	2.50	\$700.00	\$1,750.00
Service	07/11/2024 - Committee - Business Analysis / Operations / Eric Mendez: Review baseline Initiatives to run sensitivities for each one to narrow down scope to focus on overtime reduction initiative.	3.00	\$700.00	\$2,100.00
Service	07/11/2024 - Committee - Business Analysis / Operations / Eric Mendez: Review digital transformation Initiatives to run sensitivities for each one to narrow down the scope to focus on Crunchtime.	2.80	\$700.00	\$1,960.00
Service	07/11/2024 - Committee - Business Analysis / Operations / Eric Mendez: Finalize size of sensitivity range for the overtime reduction and digital transformation initiatives, including respective slide.	2.60	\$700.00	\$1,820.00
Service	07/11/2024 - Committee - Business Analysis / Operations / Pedro Leme: Analysis of cumulative EBITDA impact projections including sales controls, new labor management IT system and repairs and maintenance variables.	2.10	\$300.00	\$630.00
Service	07/11/2024 - Committee - Business Analysis / Operations / Pedro Leme: Continue analysis of cumulative EBITDA impact projections including sales controls, new labor management IT system and repairs and maintenance variables.	1.90	\$300.00	\$570.00
Service	07/11/2024 - Committee - Business Analysis / Operations / Pedro Leme: Additional analysis of cumulative EBITDA impact projections.	2.40	\$300.00	\$720.00
Service	07/11/2024 - Committee - Business Analysis / Operations / Pedro Leme: Finalized analysis of cumulative EBITDA impact projections.	2.20	\$300.00	\$660.00
Service	07/12/2024 - Committee - Business Analysis / Operations / Charles Salom: Ongoing analysis of Business Plan sensitivities scenarios including managers in training, relocation expenses and outside services.	2.70	\$300.00	\$810.00
Service	07/12/2024 - Committee - Business Analysis / Operations / Charles Salom: Finish analysis of Business Plan sensitivities scenarios.	2.30	\$300.00	\$690.00
Service	07/12/2024 - Committee - Business Analysis / Operations / Charles Salom: Continue analysis of Business Plan sensitivities scenarios.	1.90	\$300.00	\$570.00
Service	07/12/2024 - Committee - Committee Activities / Charles Salom: Continue preparation of Committee materials re Business Plan sensitivities.	2.10	\$300.00	\$630.00
Service	07/12/2024 - Committee - Committee Activities / Charles Salom: Preparation of Committee materials re Business Plan sensitivities.	1.70	\$300.00	\$510.00

\$720.00	\$400.00	1.80	07/12/2024 - Committee - Business Analysis / Operations / Vinai Sewaliah: Analysis of company projected leverage and debt service ratios.	Service
\$760.00	\$400.00	1.90	07/12/2024 - Committee - Business Analysis / Operations / Vinai Sewaliah: Continue analysis of company projected leverage and debt service ratios.	Service
\$480.00	\$400.00	1.20	07/12/2024 - Committee - Business Analysis / Operations / Vinai Sewaliah: Complete analysis of company projected leverage and debt service ratios.	Service
\$1,800.00	\$1,000.00	1.80	07/12/2024 - Committee - Business Analysis / Operations / Edward Kim: Audit and review of rents and store viability analyses.	Service
\$935.00	\$550.00	1.70	07/12/2024 - Committee - Business Analysis / Operations / Ivan Radi: Finalize research and analysis of cost-based trends.	Service
\$1,540.00	\$550.00	2.80	07/12/2024 - Committee - Business Analysis / Operations / Ivan Radi: Additional research into comparable company trends and operating metrics.	Service
\$1,265.00	\$550.00	2.30	07/12/2024 - Committee - Business Analysis / Operations / Ivan Radi: Continue additional research into comparable company trends and operating metrics.	Service
\$1,190.00	\$700.00	1.70	07/12/2024 - Committee - Business Analysis / Operations / Andre Artidiello: Multiple communications with V. Sewaliah re latest model case analysis.	Service
\$1,680.00	\$700.00	2.40	07/12/2024 - Committee - Committee Activities / Andre Artidiello: Updates to committee presentation materials.	Service
\$1,330.00	\$700.00	1.90	07/12/2024 - Committee - Business Analysis / Operations / Andre Artidiello: Compile outputs for EBITDA bridge sensitivities.	Service
\$1,470.00	\$700.00	2.10	07/12/2024 - Committee - Committee Activities / Andre Artidiello: Multiple communications with E. Mendez re committee presentation materials.	Service
\$1,960.00	\$700.00	2.80	07/12/2024 - Committee - Business Analysis / Operations / Andre Artidiello: Diligence into expense rationalization initiatives and underlying model impacts.	Service
\$420.00	\$700.00	0.60	07/12/2024 - Committee - Business Analysis / Operations / Eric Mendez: Finalize off-premise sensitivity cost analysis, including respective slide.	Service
\$2,100.00	\$700.00	3.00	07/12/2024 - Committee - Committee Activities / Eric Mendez: Finalize single-variable illustrative summary slide and executive summary.	Service
\$1,890.00	\$700.00	2.70	07/12/2024 - Committee - Business Analysis / Operations / Eric Mendez: Research industry news to confirm no recent reports have been issued re restaurant trends and inflation reports.	Service
\$1,960.00	\$700.00	2.80	07/12/2024 - Committee - Business Analysis / Operations / Eric Mendez: Ran several analyses to narrow down scope of the combined sensitivity profit and loss and cash projection estimates.	Service
\$840.00	\$700.00	1.20	07/12/2024 - Committee - Business Analysis / Operations / Eric Mendez: Finalized the combined variable sensitivity analysis.	Service

Service	07/12/2024 - Committee - Business Analysis / Operations / Eric Mendez: Ran additional bear case scenario modifying key variables downward to summarize impact to margins and cash.	2.20	\$700.00	\$1,540.00
Service	07/12/2024 - Committee - Committee Activities / Eric Mendez: Multiple communications with A. Artidiello re committee presentation materials.	2.10	\$700.00	\$1,470.00
Service	07/12/2024 - Committee - Business Analysis / Operations / Pedro Leme: Analysis of rent reduction summary.	2.50	\$300.00	\$750.00
Service	07/12/2024 - Committee - Business Analysis / Operations / Pedro Leme: Finished analysis of rent reduction summary.	1.70	\$300.00	\$510.00
Service	07/12/2024 - Committee - Committee Activities / Pedro Leme: Preparation of presentation materials regarding lease reduction summary.	1.10	\$300.00	\$330.00
Service	07/12/2024 - Committee - Business Analysis / Operations / Vinai Sewaliah: Multiple communications with A. Artidiello re latest model case analysis.	1.70	\$400.00	\$680.00
Service	07/13/2024 - Committee - Business Analysis / Operations / Ivan Radi: Finalize additional research into comparable company trends and operating metrics.	2.00	\$550.00	\$1,100.00
Service	07/13/2024 - Committee - Business Analysis / Operations / Ivan Radi: Research and analysis of projected annual guest counts in casual dining.	2.80	\$550.00	\$1,540.00
Service	07/13/2024 - Committee - Business Analysis / Operations / Edward Kim: Initial audit and review of business plan analysis and presentation.	2.50	\$1,000.00	\$2,500.00
Service	07/13/2024 - Committee - Business Analysis / Operations / Edward Kim: Research dataroom and verify issues flagged.	2.00	\$1,000.00	\$2,000.00
Service	07/13/2024 - Committee - Business Analysis / Operations / Andre Artidiello: Updates to Modified Case and Bear Case model cases.	3.20	\$700.00	\$2,240.00
Service	07/13/2024 - Committee - Business Analysis / Operations / Andre Artidiello: Continue updates to Modified Case and Bear Case model cases.	2.10	\$700.00	\$1,470.00
Service	07/13/2024 - Committee - Business Analysis / Operations / Andre Artidiello: Analysis of industry AUVs and store counts.	2.80	\$700.00	\$1,960.00
Service	07/13/2024 - Committee - Business Analysis / Operations / Andre Artidiello: Edits to AUV, store count, and market comps output pages.	2.60	\$700.00	\$1,820.00
Service	07/13/2024 - Committee - Business Analysis / Operations / Andre Artidiello: Edits to revenue dynamics analysis.	1.20	\$700.00	\$840.00
Service	07/13/2024 - Committee - Business Analysis / Operations / Andre Artidiello: Further updates to revenue dynamics analysis.	1.60	\$700.00	\$1,120.00
Service	07/13/2024 - Committee - Business Analysis / Operations / Andre Artidiello: Multiple communications with E. Mendez re model sensitivities.	2.50	\$700.00	\$1,750.00
Service	07/13/2024 - Committee - Committee Activities / Eric Mendez: Edit draft of the presentation materials.	3.00	\$700.00	\$2,100.00

Service	07/13/2024 - Committee - Committee Activities / Eric Mendez: Edited second draft of presentation materials.	2.90	\$700.00	\$2,030.00
Service	07/13/2024 - Committee - Business Analysis / Operations / Eric Mendez: Multiple communications with A. Artidiello re model sensitivities.	2.50	\$700.00	\$1,750.00
Service	07/13/2024 - Committee - Business Analysis / Operations / Vinai Sewaliah: Analysis of comparable dining company financing terms.	1.40	\$400.00	\$560.00
Service	07/13/2024 - Committee - Business Analysis / Operations / Vinai Sewaliah: Continue analysis of comparable dining company financing terms.	1.80	\$400.00	\$720.00
Service	07/13/2024 - Committee - Committee Activities / Vinai Sewaliah: Updates of business plan presentation materials.	2.10	\$400.00	\$840.00
Service	07/13/2024 - Committee - Committee Activities / Vinai Sewaliah: Continue updates of business plan presentation materials.	2.30	\$400.00	\$920.00
Service	07/14/2024 - Committee - Committee Activities / Edward Kim: Create outputs for presentation.	1.40	\$1,000.00	\$1,400.00
Service	07/14/2024 - Committee - Committee Activities / Edward Kim: Review, audit and comments to committee presentation.	2.60	\$1,000.00	\$2,600.00
Service	07/14/2024 - Committee - Committee Activities / Edward Kim: Final review, edits and group comments to presentation.	1.10	\$1,000.00	\$1,100.00
Service	07/14/2024 - Committee - Committee Activities / Edward Kim: Multiple communications with GCP team re business plan presentation materials.	1.70	\$1,000.00	\$1,700.00
Service	07/14/2024 - Committee - Committee Activities / Andre Artidiello: Updates to committee presentation materials.	3.40	\$700.00	\$2,380.00
Service	07/14/2024 - Committee - Committee Activities / Andre Artidiello: Further updates to committee presentation materials.	2.80	\$700.00	\$1,960.00
Service	07/14/2024 - Committee - Committee Activities / Andre Artidiello: Complete updates to committee presentation materials.	1.90	\$700.00	\$1,330.00
Service	07/14/2024 - Committee - Committee Activities / Andre Artidiello: Multiple communications with GCP team re business plan presentation materials.	1.70	\$700.00	\$1,190.00
Service	07/14/2024 - Committee - Business Analysis / Operations / Andre Artidiello: Off-premise model case updates.	1.40	\$700.00	\$980.00
Service	07/14/2024 - Committee - Business Analysis / Operations / Andre Artidiello: Updates to average check size model assumptions.	2.10	\$700.00	\$1,470.00
Service	07/14/2024 - Committee - Business Analysis / Operations / Andre Artidiello: Updates to single variable sensitivity analyses.	2.60	\$700.00	\$1,820.00
Service	07/14/2024 - Committee - Committee Activities / Eric Mendez: Incorporate comments to presentation.	3.00	\$700.00	\$2,100.00
Service	07/14/2024 - Committee - Business Analysis / Operations / Eric Mendez: Reran various sensitivities to finalize the single-variable cases and update respective slides.	3.00	\$700.00	\$2,100.00

Service	07/14/2024 - Committee - Business Analysis / Operations / Eric	2.90	\$700.00	\$2,030.00
	Mendez: Reran and finalized the combined sensitivity cases based on the GCP team review.			
Service	07/14/2024 - Committee - Business Analysis / Operations / Eric Mendez: Final review of the expense rationalizations sensitivities to quantify potential impact.	2.70	\$700.00	\$1,890.00
Service	07/14/2024 - Committee - Committee Activities / Eric Mendez: Incorporate additional changes to presentation.	2.90	\$700.00	\$2,030.00
Service	07/14/2024 - Committee - Business Analysis / Operations / Eric Mendez: Multiple communications with GCP team re business plan presentation materials.	1.70	\$700.00	\$1,190.00
Service	07/14/2024 - Committee - Business Analysis / Operations / Ivan Radi: Multiple communications with P. Leme re rent savings analysis.	1.10	\$550.00	\$605.00
Service	07/14/2024 - Committee - Committee Activities / Ivan Radi: Review and commentary to business plan presentation materials.	2.10	\$550.00	\$1,155.00
Service	07/14/2024 - Committee - Committee Activities / Ivan Radi: Multiple communications with GCP team re business plan presentation materials.	1.70	\$550.00	\$935.00
Service	07/14/2024 - Committee - Committee Activities / Ivan Radi: Updates to business plan presentation materials.	2.70	\$550.00	\$1,485.00
Service	07/14/2024 - Committee - Business Analysis / Operations / Ivan Radi: Continue research and analysis of projected annual guest counts in casual dining.	1.90	\$550.00	\$1,045.00
Service	07/14/2024 - Committee - Business Analysis / Operations / Ivan Radi: Finalize research and analysis of projected annual guest counts in casual dining.	2.40	\$550.00	\$1,320.00
Service	07/14/2024 - Committee - Business Analysis / Operations / Pedro Leme: Multiple communications with I. Radi re rent savings analysis.	1.10	\$300.00	\$330.00
Service	07/14/2024 - Committee - Committee Activities / Vinai Sewaliah: Multiple communications with GCP team re business plan presentation materials.	1.70	\$400.00	\$680.00
Service	07/14/2024 - Committee - Business Analysis / Operations / Vinai Sewaliah: Research and analysis of competitor market positioning.	1.20	\$400.00	\$480.00
Service	07/14/2024 - Committee - Committee Activities / Vinai Sewaliah: Verification of business plan presentation materials.	1.30	\$400.00	\$520.00
Service	07/14/2024 - Committee - Business Analysis / Operations / Vinai Sewaliah: Continue research and analysis of competitor market positioning.	2.40	\$400.00	\$960.00
Service	07/14/2024 - Committee - Committee Activities / Jorge González: Multiple communications with GCP team re business plan presentation materials.	1.70	\$1,000.00	\$1,700.00
Service	07/15/2024 - Committee - Committee Activities / Edward Kim: Research and preparation for committee discussion re business plan.	1.30	\$1,000.00	\$1,300.00

Service	07/15/2024 - Committee - Committee Activities / Edward Kim: UCC update call with all advisors.	0.60	\$1,000.00	\$600.00
Service	07/15/2024 - Committee - Case Administration / Edward Kim: Multiple communications with GCP team re case workstream coordination.	1.10	\$1,000.00	\$1,100.00
Service	07/15/2024 - Committee - Business Analysis / Operations / Edward Kim: Analysis of BP and VDR data and go-forward financial profile.	1.10	\$1,000.00	\$1,100.00
Service	07/15/2024 - Committee - Committee Activities / Andre Artidiello: Preparation for committee update call.	1.60	\$700.00	\$1,120.00
Service	07/15/2024 - Committee - Case Administration / Andre Artidiello: Multiple communications with GCP team re case workstream coordination.	1.10	\$700.00	\$770.00
Service	07/15/2024 - Committee - Committee Activities / Andre Artidiello: Multiple communications with I. Radi and E. Mendez re committee presentation materials.	1.30	\$700.00	\$910.00
Service	07/15/2024 - Committee - Committee Activities / Eric Mendez: UCC update call with all advisors.	0.60	\$700.00	\$420.00
Service	07/15/2024 - Committee - Case Administration / Eric Mendez: Multiple communications with GCP team re case workstream coordination.	1.10	\$700.00	\$770.00
Service	07/15/2024 - Committee - Business Analysis / Operations / Eric Mendez: Review latest variance report.	1.70	\$700.00	\$1,190.00
Service	07/15/2024 - Committee - Committee Activities / Ivan Radi: UCC update call with all advisors.	0.60	\$550.00	\$330.00
Service	07/15/2024 - Committee - Committee Activities / Ivan Radi: Multiple communications with GCP team re case workstream coordination.	1.10	\$550.00	\$605.00
Service	07/15/2024 - Committee - Committee Activities / Ivan Radi: Continue updates to business plan presentation materials.	1.80	\$550.00	\$990.00
Service	07/15/2024 - Committee - Case Administration / Ivan Radi: Updates to diligence request tracker.	2.20	\$550.00	\$1,210.00
Service	07/15/2024 - Committee - Committee Activities / Ivan Radi: Multiple communications with A. Artidiello and E. Mendez re committee presentation materials.	1.30	\$550.00	\$715.00
Service	07/15/2024 - Committee - Case Administration / Vinai Sewaliah: Multiple communications with GCP team re case workstream coordination.	1.10	\$400.00	\$440.00
Service	07/15/2024 - Committee - Business Analysis / Operations / Vinai Sewaliah: Review and adjustment of historical financials.	2.10	\$400.00	\$840.00
Service	07/15/2024 - Committee - Committee Activities / Jorge González: UCC update call with all advisors.	0.60	\$1,000.00	\$600.00
Service	07/15/2024 - Committee - Case Administration / Jorge González: Multiple communications with GCP team re case workstream coordination.	1.10	\$1,000.00	\$1,100.00

Service	07/15/2024 - Committee - Committee Activities / Eric Mendez: Multiple communications with A. Artidiello and I. Radi re committee presentation materials.	1.30	\$700.00	\$910.00
Service	07/16/2024 - Committee - Business Analysis / Operations / Andre Artidiello: Reconciliation of diligence tracker and review of diligence production materials.	1.80	\$700.00	\$1,260.00
Service	07/16/2024 - Committee - Case Administration / Andre Artidiello: Multiple communications with I. Radi re outstanding case workstreams	0.90	\$700.00	\$630.00
Service	07/16/2024 - Committee - Business Analysis / Operations / Ivan Radi: Review and analysis of diligence production including owned IP, JV agreement, ASO agreements and Franchise agreements.	2.20	\$550.00	\$1,210.00
Service	07/16/2024 - Committee - Business Analysis / Operations / Ivan Radi: Continue review of diligence production including owned IP, JV agreement, ASO agreements and Franchise agreements.	2.60	\$550.00	\$1,430.00
Service	07/16/2024 - Committee - Case Administration / Ivan Radi: Multiple communications with A. Artidiello re outstanding case workstreams.	0.90	\$550.00	\$495.00
Service	07/16/2024 - Committee - Business Analysis / Operations / Vinai Sewaliah: Continue review and adjustment of historical financials.	2.50	\$400.00	\$1,000.00
Service	07/16/2024 - Committee - Business Analysis / Operations / Vinai Sewaliah: Finish review and adjustment of historical financials.	1.80	\$400.00	\$720.00
Service	07/16/2024 - Committee - Business Analysis / Operations / Vinai Sewaliah: Review and analysis of diligence materials including credit agreements.	2.40	\$400.00	\$960.00
Service	07/17/2024 - Committee - Business Analysis / Operations / Edward Kim: Analysis of VDR and research post-sale process requirements and investigative workstreams.	2.00	\$1,000.00	\$2,000.00
Service	07/17/2024 - Committee - Business Analysis / Operations / Andre Artidiello: Review and updates to diligence request list.	1.20	\$700.00	\$840.00
Service	07/17/2024 - Committee - Business Analysis / Operations / Ivan Radi: Finalize analysis of diligence production including owned IP, JV agreement, ASO agreements and Franchise agreements.	2.80	\$550.00	\$1,540.00
Service	07/17/2024 - Committee - Committee Activities / Eric Mendez: Initial review of the best interest test financial Information and projections.	1.40	\$700.00	\$980.00
Service	07/17/2024 - Committee - Case Administration / Eric Mendez: Update remaining DRL requests as part of the upcoming investigative process.	2.30	\$700.00	\$1,610.00
Service	07/17/2024 - Committee - Business Analysis / Operations / Vinai Sewaliah: Continue review and analysis of diligence materials including credit agreements.	1.70	\$400.00	\$680.00
Service	07/17/2024 - Committee - Business Analysis / Operations / Vinai Sewaliah: Review and analysis of historical financial statements including PnL statements.	2.40	\$400.00	\$960.00
Service	07/17/2024 - Committee - Business Analysis / Operations / Vinai Sewaliah: Continue review and analysis of historical financial statements including PnL statements.	2.30	\$400.00	\$920.00

Service	07/18/2024 - Committee - Sale Process / Edward Kim: Weekly standing call with GCP and HCF teams.	0.20	\$1,000.00	\$200.00
Service	07/18/2024 - Committee - Business Analysis / Operations / Edward Kim: Coordination communications with GCP team re investigative workstreams.	1.40	\$1,000.00	\$1,400.00
Service	07/18/2024 - Committee - Business Analysis / Operations / Edward Kim: Analysis of negotiated rents and impact on feasibility.	1.10	\$1,000.00	\$1,100.00
Service	07/18/2024 - Committee - Plan & Disclosure Statement / Edward Kim: Analysis of VDR and business plan elements and analysis and review of proposed plan exhibits and analyses.	2.00	\$1,000.00	\$2,000.00
Service	07/18/2024 - Committee - Business Analysis / Operations / Ivan Radi: Coordination communications with GCP team re investigative workstreams.	1.40	\$550.00	\$770.00
Service	07/18/2024 - Committee - Sale Process / Ivan Radi: Weekly standing call with GCP and HCF teams.	0.20	\$550.00	\$110.00
Service	07/18/2024 - Committee - Sale Process / Ivan Radi: Internal debrief with GCP team re sale process.	1.10	\$550.00	\$605.00
Service	07/18/2024 - Committee - Business Analysis / Operations / Ivan Radi: Review and analysis of updated FY 2025 bridge materials and updated rent reduction summary.	2.80	\$550.00	\$1,540.00
Service	07/18/2024 - Committee - Business Analysis / Operations / Andre Artidiello: Coordination communications with GCP team re investigative workstreams.	1.40	\$700.00	\$980.00
Service	07/18/2024 - Committee - Business Analysis / Operations / Charles Salom: Review and analysis of Red Lobster Income Statement including years 2015, 2016 and 2017.	1.90	\$300.00	\$570.00
Service	07/18/2024 - Committee - Business Analysis / Operations / Andre Artidiello: Reconciliation of diligence production.	0.90	\$700.00	\$630.00
Service	07/18/2024 - Committee - Business Analysis / Operations / Charles Salom: Review and analysis of Red Lobster Income Statement including years 2018, 2019 and 2020.	2.10	\$300.00	\$630.00
Service	07/18/2024 - Committee - Business Analysis / Operations / Charles Salom: Continue review and analysis of Red Lobster Income Statement including years 2018, 2019 and 2020.	2.30	\$300.00	\$690.00
Service	07/18/2024 - Committee - Business Analysis / Operations / Eric Mendez: Initial review of sales and EBITDA CIM to filings bridge for committee update.	2.10	\$700.00	\$1,470.00
Service	07/18/2024 - Committee - Sale Process / Eric Mendez: Weekly standing call with GCP and HCF.	0.20	\$700.00	\$140.00
Service	07/18/2024 - Committee - Court Hearings / Eric Mendez: Attend court hearing.	0.50	\$700.00	\$350.00
Service	07/18/2024 - Committee - Business Analysis / Operations / Eric Mendez: Coordination communications with GCP team re investigative workstreams.	1.40	\$700.00	\$980.00
Service	07/18/2024 - Committee - Sale Process / Vinai Sewaliah: Weekly standing call with GCP and HCF teams.	0.20	\$400.00	\$80.00

\$200.00	\$400.00	0.50	07/18/2024 - Committee - Court Hearings / Vinai Sewaliah: Attend court hearing.	Service
\$560.00	\$400.00	1.40	07/18/2024 - Committee - Business Analysis / Operations / Vinai Sewaliah: Coordination communications with GCP team re investigative workstreams.	Service
\$800.00	\$400.00	2.00	07/18/2024 - Committee - Court Filings / Vinai Sewaliah: Review and analysis of relevant filings for court hearing.	Service
\$1,400.00	\$1,000.00	1.40	07/18/2024 - Committee - Business Analysis / Operations / Jorge González: Coordination communications with GCP team re investigative workstreams.	Service
\$770.00	\$700.00	1.10	07/18/2024 - Committee - Sale Process / Eric Mendez: Internal debrief with GCP team re sale process.	Service
\$1,100.00	\$1,000.00	1.10	07/18/2024 - Committee - Sale Process / Edward Kim: Internal debrief with GCP team re sale process.	Service
\$300.00	\$1,000.00	0.30	07/19/2024 - Committee - Business Analysis / Operations / Edward Kim: Weekly standing call with AM and GCP teams.	Service
\$165.00	\$550.00	0.30	07/19/2024 - Committee - Business Analysis / Operations / Ivan Radi: Weekly standing call with AM and GCP teams.	Service
\$990.00	\$550.00	1.80	07/19/2024 - Committee - Case Administration / Ivan Radi: Continue updates to diligence request tracker.	Service
\$210.00	\$700.00	0.30	07/19/2024 - Committee - Business Analysis / Operations / Andre Artidiello: Weekly standing call with AM and GCP teams.	Service
\$630.00	\$300.00	2.10	07/19/2024 - Committee - Business Analysis / Operations / Charles Salom: Review and analysis of Red Lobster Income Statement including years 2021, 2022 and 2023.	Service
\$570.00	\$300.00	1.90	07/19/2024 - Committee - Business Analysis / Operations / Charles Salom: Continue Review and analysis of Red Lobster Income Statement including years 2021, 2022 and 2023.	Service
\$570.00	\$300.00	1.90	07/19/2024 - Committee - Business Analysis / Operations / Charles Salom: Review and analysis of Red Lobster Balance sheet including years 2015, 2016 and 2017.	Service
\$630.00	\$300.00	2.10	07/19/2024 - Committee - Business Analysis / Operations / Charles Salom: Review and analysis of Red Lobster Balance sheet including years 2018, 2019 and 2020.	Service
\$690.00	\$300.00	2.30	07/19/2024 - Committee - Business Analysis / Operations / Charles Salom: Review and analysis of Red Lobster Balance sheet including years 2021, 2022 and 2023.	Service
\$210.00	\$700.00	0.30	07/19/2024 - Committee - Business Analysis / Operations / Eric Mendez: Weekly standing call with AM and GCP teams.	Service
\$1,050.00	\$700.00	1.50	07/19/2024 - Committee - Plan & Disclosure Statement / Eric Mendez: Review of liquidation plan filing analysis.	Service
\$120.00	\$400.00	0.30	07/19/2024 - Committee - Business Analysis / Operations / Vinai Sewaliah: Weekly standing call with AM and GCP teams.	Service

Service	07/19/2024 - Committee - Case Administration / Vinai Sewaliah: Review of diligence materials produced and updates to diligence request list.	2.10	\$400.00	\$840.00
Service	07/19/2024 - Committee - Case Administration / Vinai Sewaliah: Continue review of diligence materials produced and updates to diligence request list.	1.30	\$400.00	\$520.00
Service	07/20/2024 - Committee - Plan & Disclosure Statement / Ivan Radi: Review and analysis of updated DS exhibits and financial projections.	0.40	\$550.00	\$220.00
Service	07/20/2024 - Committee - Plan & Disclosure Statement / Ivan Radi: Multiple communications with A. Artidiello re DS exhibits and projections.	0.50	\$550.00	\$275.00
Service	07/20/2024 - Committee - Business Analysis / Operations / Ivan Radi: Continue review and analysis of updated FY25 bridge materials and updated rent reduction summary.	2.30	\$550.00	\$1,265.00
Service	07/20/2024 - Committee - Plan & Disclosure Statement / Ivan Radi: Review and analysis of liquidation analysis model.	2.80	\$550.00	\$1,540.00
Service	07/20/2024 - Committee - Plan & Disclosure Statement / Ivan Radi: Continue review and analysis of liquidation analysis model.	2.40	\$550.00	\$1,320.00
Service	07/20/2024 - Committee - Committee Activities / Ivan Radi: Prepare committee presentation materials.	2.50	\$550.00	\$1,375.00
Service	07/20/2024 - Committee - Plan & Disclosure Statement / Andre Artidiello: Multiple communications with I. Radi re DS exhibits and projections.	0.50	\$700.00	\$350.00
Service	07/20/2024 - Committee - Business Analysis / Operations / Andre Artidiello: Review and updates to solvency analysis.	2.90	\$700.00	\$2,030.00
Service	07/20/2024 - Committee - Business Analysis / Operations / Andre Artidiello: Review and updates comparable historical capitalization analysis.	2.30	\$700.00	\$1,610.00
Service	07/20/2024 - Committee - Claims Analysis and Objections / Edward Kim: Analysis of rejection damage estimates and review of underlying contracts.	2.50	\$1,000.00	\$2,500.00
Service	07/20/2024 - Committee - Claims Analysis and Objections / Edward Kim: Continue analysis of underlying contracts and calculation of damages and comparison to Debtor estimates.	2.70	\$1,000.00	\$2,700.00
Service	07/20/2024 - Committee - Claims Analysis and Objections / Edward Kim: Finalize review and analysis of potential rejection damage claims.	2.10	\$1,000.00	\$2,100.00
Service	07/21/2024 - Committee - Claims Analysis and Objections / Edward Kim: Discussion with creditor and J. Gonzalez re POC process.	1.10	\$1,000.00	\$1,100.00
Service	07/21/2024 - Committee - Committee Activities / Andre Artidiello: Review and updates to committee presentation materials.	2.10	\$700.00	\$1,470.00
Service	07/21/2024 - Committee - Business Analysis / Operations / Andre Artidiello: Updates to historical EBITDA quality analysis.	2.90	\$700.00	\$2,030.00
Service	07/21/2024 - Committee - Business Analysis / Operations / Andre Artidiello: Continue updates to historical EBITDA quality analysis.	2.20	\$700.00	\$1,540.00

Service	07/21/2024 - Committee - Business Analysis / Operations / Ivan Radi: Finalize review and analysis of updated FY 2025 bridge materials and updated rent reduction summary.	2.60	\$550.00	\$1,430.00
Service	07/21/2024 - Committee - Committee Activities / Ivan Radi: Continue preparing committee presentation materials.	2.80	\$550.00	\$1,540.00
Service	07/21/2024 - Committee - Committee Activities / Ivan Radi: Finalize committee presentation materials.	2.40	\$550.00	\$1,320.00
Service	07/21/2024 - Committee - Plan & Disclosure Statement / Edward Kim: Analysis of VDR and initial assessment of feasibility and best interest tests.	2.00	\$1,000.00	\$2,000.00
Service	07/21/2024 - Committee - Plan & Disclosure Statement / Ivan Radi: Finalize review and analysis of liquidation analysis model.	2.70	\$550.00	\$1,485.00
Service	07/21/2024 - Committee - Litigation / Vinai Sewaliah: Preliminary research of potential litigation target.	1.80	\$400.00	\$720.00
Service	07/21/2024 - Committee - Litigation / Vinai Sewaliah: Continue preliminary research of potential litigation target.	2.60	\$400.00	\$1,040.00
Service	07/21/2024 - Committee - Litigation / Vinai Sewaliah: Ongoing research of potential litigation target.	2.80	\$400.00	\$1,120.00
Service	07/21/2024 - Committee - Claims Analysis and Objections / Jorge González: Discussion with creditor and E. Kim re POC process.	1.10	\$1,000.00	\$1,100.00
Service	07/22/2024 - Committee - Plan & Disclosure Statement / Edward Kim: Multiple communications with GCP team re liquidation analysis.	1.10	\$1,000.00	\$1,100.00
Service	07/22/2024 - Committee - Plan & Disclosure Statement / Andre Artidiello: Multiple communications with GCP team re liquidation analysis.	1.10	\$700.00	\$770.00
Service	07/22/2024 - Committee - Committee Activities / Andre Artidiello: Review and updates to committee presentation materials.	0.90	\$700.00	\$630.00
Service	07/22/2024 - Committee - Plan & Disclosure Statement / Eric Mendez: Reviewed liquidation analysis to begin laying out the committee update slides.	2.70	\$700.00	\$1,890.00
Service	07/22/2024 - Committee - Committee Activities / Eric Mendez: Put together draft of liquidation analysis summary for the UCC update presentation.	2.10	\$700.00	\$1,470.00
Service	07/22/2024 - Committee - Committee Activities / Eric Mendez: Multiple communications with I. Radi re committee presentation materials.	1.20	\$700.00	\$840.00
Service	07/22/2024 - Committee - Plan & Disclosure Statement / Eric Mendez: Multiple communications with GCP team re liquidation analysis.	1.10	\$700.00	\$770.00
Service	07/22/2024 - Committee - Business Analysis / Operations / Edward Kim: Initial review of financial statements and solvency and comparison to key corporate actions.	1.80	\$1,000.00	\$1,800.00
Service	07/22/2024 - Committee - Plan & Disclosure Statement / Ivan Radi: Review and analysis of updated liquidation analysis exhibits.	0.80	\$550.00	\$440.00

Service	07/22/2024 - Committee - Committee Activities / Ivan Radi: Multiple communications with E. Mendez re committee presentation materials.	1.20	\$550.00	\$660.00
Service	07/22/2024 - Committee - Plan & Disclosure Statement / Ivan Radi: Multiple communications with GCP team re liquidation analysis.	1.10	\$550.00	\$605.00
Service	07/22/2024 - Committee - Committee Activities / Ivan Radi: Updates to committee presentation materials.	2.30	\$550.00	\$1,265.00
Service	07/22/2024 - Committee - Plan & Disclosure Statement / Vinai Sewaliah: Multiple communications with GCP team re liquidation analysis.	1.10	\$400.00	\$440.00
Service	07/22/2024 - Committee - Plan & Disclosure Statement / Vinai Sewaliah: Review and analysis of liquidation analysis.	2.30	\$400.00	\$920.00
Service	07/22/2024 - Committee - Plan & Disclosure Statement / Jorge González: Multiple communications with GCP team re liquidation analysis.	1.10	\$1,000.00	\$1,100.00
Service	07/23/2024 - Committee - Plan & Disclosure Statement / Edward Kim: Research issues and VDR regarding liquidation analysis and disclosures.	1.00	\$1,000.00	\$1,000.00
Service	07/23/2024 - Committee - Plan & Disclosure Statement / Edward Kim: Analysis and audit of BIT modeling, focusing on differentials and issues flagged during internal discussions.	1.80	\$1,000.00	\$1,800.00
Service	07/23/2024 - Committee - Plan & Disclosure Statement / Ivan Radi: Continue review and analysis of updated liquidation analysis exhibits.	2.80	\$550.00	\$1,540.00
Service	07/23/2024 - Committee - Claims Analysis and Objections / Ivan Radi: Multiple communications with GCP team re WARN analysis and exposure.	1.50	\$550.00	\$825.00
Service	07/23/2024 - Committee - Business Analysis / Operations / Ivan Radi: Review and analysis of updated diligence production materials including latest variance report.	2.20	\$550.00	\$1,210.00
Service	07/23/2024 - Committee - Committee Activities / Ivan Radi: Continue updates to committee presentation materials.	2.90	\$550.00	\$1,595.00
Service	07/23/2024 - Committee - Committee Activities / Ivan Radi: Finalize updates to committee presentation materials.	2.20	\$550.00	\$1,210.00
Service	07/23/2024 - Committee - Claims Analysis and Objections / Andre Artidiello: Multiple communications with GCP team re WARN analysis and exposure.	1.50	\$700.00	\$1,050.00
Service	07/23/2024 - Committee - Business Analysis / Operations / Andre Artidiello: Review and updates to committee presentation materials.	1.10	\$700.00	\$770.00
Service	07/23/2024 - Committee - Claims Analysis and Objections / Vinai Sewaliah: Multiple communications with GCP team re WARN analysis and exposure.	1.50	\$400.00	\$600.00
Service	07/23/2024 - Committee - Committee Activities / Eric Mendez: Cash variance analysis for the UCC presentation.	2.20	\$700.00	\$1,540.00

Service	07/23/2024 - Committee - Committee Activities / Eric Mendez: Liquidation analysis summary for for the UCC presentation.	2.80	\$700.00	\$1,960.00
Service	07/23/2024 - Committee - Business Analysis / Operations / Eric Mendez: Consolidated GCP team comments for UCC presentation materials.	1.50	\$700.00	\$1,050.00
Service	07/23/2024 - Committee - Claims Analysis and Objections / Jorge González: Multiple communications with GCP team re WARN analysis and exposure.	1.50	\$1,000.00	\$1,500.00
Service	07/23/2024 - Committee - Claims Analysis and Objections / Edward Kim: Multiple communications with GCP team re WARN analysis and exposure.	1.50	\$1,000.00	\$1,500.00
Service	07/24/2024 - Committee - Committee Activities / Edward Kim: Multiple communications with GCP team re committee presentation materials.	1.20	\$1,000.00	\$1,200.00
Service	07/24/2024 - Committee - Claims Analysis and Objections / Edward Kim: Ongoing rejection damage and other contractual claims analysis and reconciliation with initial debtor estimates.	2.10	\$1,000.00	\$2,100.00
Service	07/24/2024 - Committee - Business Analysis / Operations / Edward Kim: Multiple communications with GCP team re updated business diligence materials and model updates.	1.40	\$1,000.00	\$1,400.00
Service	07/24/2024 - Committee - Committee Activities / Andre Artidiello: Multiple communications with GCP team re committee presentation materials.	1.20	\$700.00	\$840.00
Service	07/24/2024 - Committee - Business Analysis / Operations / Andre Artidiello: Review and analysis of updated business diligence materials.	2.30	\$700.00	\$1,610.00
Service	07/24/2024 - Committee - Business Analysis / Operations / Andre Artidiello: Multiple communications with GCP team re updated business diligence materials and model updates.	1.40	\$700.00	\$980.00
Service	07/24/2024 - Committee - Business Analysis / Operations / Andre Artidiello: Review and updates to cumulative budget to variance analysis.	2.10	\$700.00	\$1,470.00
Service	07/24/2024 - Committee - Claims Analysis and Objections / Edward Kim: Ongoing damage and contractual rejection claims analysis and reconciliation.	2.10	\$1,000.00	\$2,100.00
Service	07/24/2024 - Committee - Claims Analysis and Objections / Edward Kim: Finalize rejection and contract damage claims recalculations and reconciliation.	1.50	\$1,000.00	\$1,500.00
Service	07/24/2024 - Committee - Committee Activities / Vinai Sewaliah: Multiple communications with GCP team re committee presentation materials.	1.20	\$400.00	\$480.00
Service	07/24/2024 - Committee - Litigation / Vinai Sewaliah: Research and analysis of potential litigation target.	2.10	\$400.00	\$840.00
Service	07/24/2024 - Committee - Litigation / Vinai Sewaliah: Continue research and analysis of potential litigation target.	1.20	\$400.00	\$480.00
Service	07/24/2024 - Committee - Committee Activities / Vinai Sewaliah: Preparation of committee presentation materials.	1.90	\$400.00	\$760.00

Service	07/24/2024 - Committee - Business Analysis / Operations / Vinai Sewaliah: Multiple communications with GCP team re updated	1.40	\$400.00	\$560.00
	business diligence materials and model updates.			
Service	07/24/2024 - Committee - Business Analysis / Operations / Eric Mendez: Review actual 13-week schedule against DIP budget at filing with follow-ups to AM.	2.80	\$700.00	\$1,960.00
Service	07/24/2024 - Committee - Court Filings / Eric Mendez: Reviewed final projections and liquidity analysis in Docket 651.	1.40	\$700.00	\$980.00
Service	07/24/2024 - Committee - Business Analysis / Operations / Eric Mendez: Multiple communications with GCP team re updated business diligence materials and model updates.	1.40	\$700.00	\$980.00
Service	07/24/2024 - Committee - Committee Activities / Ivan Radi: Multiple communications with GCP team re committee presentation materials.	1.20	\$550.00	\$660.00
Service	07/24/2024 - Committee - Business Analysis / Operations / Ivan Radi: Review and analysis of budget reforecast materials.	2.30	\$550.00	\$1,265.00
Service	07/24/2024 - Committee - Business Analysis / Operations / Ivan Radi: Multiple communications with GCP team re updated business diligence materials and model updates.	1.40	\$550.00	\$770.00
Service	07/24/2024 - Committee - Business Analysis / Operations / Ivan Radi: Continue review and analysis of budget reforecast materials.	1.10	\$550.00	\$605.00
Service	07/24/2024 - Committee - Committee Activities / Jorge González: Multiple communications with GCP team re committee presentation materials.	1.20	\$1,000.00	\$1,200.00
Service	07/24/2024 - Committee - Business Analysis / Operations / Jorge González: Multiple communications with GCP team re updated business diligence materials and model updates.	1.40	\$1,000.00	\$1,400.00
Service	07/25/2024 - Committee - Business Analysis / Operations / Andre Artidiello: Review and analysis of updated projections model.	2.60	\$700.00	\$1,820.00
Service	07/25/2024 - Committee - Business Analysis / Operations / Andre Artidiello: Updates to cumulative variance analysis and related outputs.	1.20	\$700.00	\$840.00
Service	07/25/2024 - Committee - Business Analysis / Operations / Eric Mendez: Resizing debt capacity at Red Lobster given revised reforecast assumptions from AM.	2.90	\$700.00	\$2,030.00
Service	07/25/2024 - Committee - Business Analysis / Operations / Eric Mendez: Ran debt scenarios to estimate potential capacity for capex to fund growth initiatives.	2.10	\$700.00	\$1,470.00
Service	07/25/2024 - Committee - Business Analysis / Operations / Edward Kim: Initial performance benchmarking of publicly traded comparables.	2.40	\$1,000.00	\$2,400.00
Service	07/25/2024 - Committee - Business Analysis / Operations / Edward Kim: Continue benchmarking and comparative analysis of public comparables universe and pro forma projections.	2.80	\$1,000.00	\$2,800.00
Service	07/25/2024 - Committee - Business Analysis / Operations / Ivan Radi: Finalize review and analysis of budget reforecast materials.	2.70	\$550.00	\$1,485.00

Service	07/26/2024 - Committee - Business Analysis / Operations / Edward Kim: Weekly standing call with AM and GCP teams.	0.50	\$1,000.00	\$500.00
Service	07/26/2024 - Committee - Business Analysis / Operations / Vinai Sewaliah: Weekly standing call with AM and GCP teams.	0.50	\$400.00	\$200.00
Service	07/26/2024 - Committee - Business Analysis / Operations / Vinai Sewaliah: Review and analysis of reforecast materials.	1.80	\$400.00	\$720.00
Service	07/26/2024 - Committee - Business Analysis / Operations / Vinai Sewaliah: Continue review and analysis of reforecast materials.	1.90	\$400.00	\$760.00
Service	07/26/2024 - Committee - Business Analysis / Operations / Eric Mendez: Weekly standing call with AM and GCP teams.	0.50	\$700.00	\$350.00
Service	07/26/2024 - Committee - Business Analysis / Operations / Eric Mendez: Revise variance analysis combining new 6-week data with the prior original DIP model.	2.70	\$700.00	\$1,890.00
Service	07/26/2024 - Committee - Business Analysis / Operations / Eric Mendez: Revisited casual dining guest count estimates across industry reports for 2Q24.	2.10	\$700.00	\$1,470.00
Service	07/26/2024 - Committee - Business Analysis / Operations / Edward Kim: Research and analysis of VDR information and historical financials.	1.90	\$1,000.00	\$1,900.00
Service	07/26/2024 - Committee - Business Analysis / Operations / Edward Kim: Finalize VDR and historical data analysis.	1.80	\$1,000.00	\$1,800.00
Service	07/26/2024 - Committee - Business Analysis / Operations / Andre Artidiello: Review and updates to latest business plan analysis.	2.90	\$700.00	\$2,030.00
Service	07/26/2024 - Committee - Business Analysis / Operations / Andre Artidiello: Weekly standing call with AM and GCP teams.	0.50	\$700.00	\$350.00
Service	07/26/2024 - Committee - Business Analysis / Operations / Ivan Radi: Weekly standing call with AM and GCP teams.	0.50	\$550.00	\$275.00
Service	07/26/2024 - Committee - Business Analysis / Operations / Ivan Radi: Multiple communications with E. Mendez re cumulative 9- week variance.	1.20	\$550.00	\$660.00
Service	07/26/2024 - Committee - Business Analysis / Operations / Ivan Radi: Review and commentary to cumulative 9-week variance analysis.	2.10	\$550.00	\$1,155.00
Service	07/26/2024 - Committee - Business Analysis / Operations / Ivan Radi: Begin business plan sensitivity analysis.	2.80	\$550.00	\$1,540.00
Service	07/26/2024 - Committee - Business Analysis / Operations / Ivan Radi: Continue business plan sensitivity analysis.	2.50	\$550.00	\$1,375.00
Service	07/26/2024 - Committee - Business Analysis / Operations / Eric Mendez: Multiple communications with I. Radi re cumulative 9- week variance.	1.20	\$700.00	\$840.00
Service	07/27/2024 - Committee - Plan & Disclosure Statement / Edward Kim: Analysis of model and VDR and comparison to BIT documents.	1.50	\$1,000.00	\$1,500.00
Service	07/27/2024 - Committee - Plan & Disclosure Statement / Edward Kim: Audit and analysis of BIT model and comments and questions for group.	2.30	\$1,000.00	\$2,300.00
---------	---	------	------------	------------
Service	07/27/2024 - Committee - Business Analysis / Operations / Edward Kim: Analysis and research of solvency modeling.	2.10	\$1,000.00	\$2,100.00
Service	07/27/2024 - Committee - Business Analysis / Operations / Andre Artidiello: Review and analysis of historical financial statements and solvency.	2.90	\$700.00	\$2,030.00
Service	07/27/2024 - Committee - Business Analysis / Operations / Ivan Radi: Finalize business plan sensitivity analysis.	2.50	\$550.00	\$1,375.00
Service	07/27/2024 - Committee - Court Filings / Ivan Radi: Review latest court filings including dockets 681, 683, 686.	2.10	\$550.00	\$1,155.00
Service	07/28/2024 - Committee - Committee Activities / Andre Artidiello: Updates to committee presentation materials.	1.40	\$700.00	\$980.00
Service	07/29/2024 - Committee - Court Filings / Andre Artidiello: Review of latest court filings including dockets no. 734, 733, 732, and 723	3.20	\$700.00	\$2,240.00
Service	07/29/2024 - Committee - Business Analysis / Operations / Ivan Radi: Prepare updates to business plan sensitivity analysis.	2.80	\$550.00	\$1,540.00
Service	07/29/2024 - Committee - Business Analysis / Operations / Ivan Radi: Continue updates to business plan sensitivity analysis.	2.40	\$550.00	\$1,320.00
Service	07/29/2024 - Committee - Business Analysis / Operations / Eric Mendez: Finalize 9-week variance analysis.	1.80	\$700.00	\$1,260.00
Service	07/29/2024 - Committee - Business Analysis / Operations / Eric Mendez: Finalize the rest of the weekly materials pending distribution.	2.40	\$700.00	\$1,680.00
Service	07/30/2024 - Committee - Litigation / Edward Kim: Multiple communications with GCP team re litigation workstreams.	1.20	\$1,000.00	\$1,200.00
Service	07/30/2024 - Committee - Plan & Disclosure Statement / Edward Kim: Analysis of capacity, solvency and feasibility issues and scenarios and follow-up research in data room.	2.00	\$1,000.00	\$2,000.00
Service	07/30/2024 - Committee - Business Analysis / Operations / Andre Artidiello: Multiple communications with V. Sewaliah and I. Radi re solvency analysis.	1.30	\$700.00	\$910.00
Service	07/30/2024 - Committee - Litigation / Andre Artidiello: Multiple communications with GCP team re litigation workstreams.	1.20	\$700.00	\$840.00
Service	07/30/2024 - Committee - Business Analysis / Operations / Andre Artidiello: Review and updates of committee presentation materials.	1.70	\$700.00	\$1,190.00
Service	07/30/2024 - Committee - Litigation / Ivan Radi: Multiple communications with GCP team re litigation workstreams.	1.20	\$550.00	\$660.00
Service	07/30/2024 - Committee - Business Analysis / Operations / Ivan Radi: Multiple communications with V. Sewaliah and A. Artidiello re solvency analysis.	1.30	\$550.00	\$715.00
Service	07/30/2024 - Committee - Business Analysis / Operations / Ivan Radi: Prepare draft solvency analysis based on BP projections.	2.70	\$550.00	\$1,485.00

Service	07/30/2024 - Committee - Litigation / Vinai Sewaliah: Multiple communications with GCP team re litigation workstreams.	1.20	\$400.00	\$480.00
Service	07/30/2024 - Committee - Business Analysis / Operations / Vinai Sewaliah: Multiple communications with I. Radi and A. Artidiello re solvency analysis.	1.30	\$400.00	\$520.00
Service	07/30/2024 - Committee - Litigation / Vinai Sewaliah: Research and analysis of potential litigation target financial background.	1.80	\$400.00	\$720.00
Service	07/30/2024 - Committee - Litigation / Vinai Sewaliah: Continue research and analysis of potential litigation target financial background.	2.70	\$400.00	\$1,080.00
Service	07/30/2024 - Committee - Litigation / Eric Mendez: Multiple communications with GCP team re litigation workstreams.	1.20	\$700.00	\$840.00
Service	07/30/2024 - Committee - Litigation / Jorge González: Multiple communications with GCP team re litigation workstreams.	1.20	\$1,000.00	\$1,200.00
Service	07/31/2024 - Committee - Litigation / Edward Kim: Call with PSZJ and GCP teams re investigative workstreams.	0.50	\$1,000.00	\$500.00
Service	07/31/2024 - Committee - Litigation / Edward Kim: GCP and PSZJ discussion regarding litigation data request and other issues.	0.50	\$1,000.00	\$500.00
Service	07/31/2024 - Committee - Litigation / Edward Kim: Analysis of complaint and research of issues raised.	1.40	\$1,000.00	\$1,400.00
Service	07/31/2024 - Committee - Litigation / Edward Kim: Research target financials, public disclosures and other available data.	2.40	\$1,000.00	\$2,400.00
Service	07/31/2024 - Committee - Litigation / Andre Artidiello: Call with PSZJ and GCP teams re investigative workstreams.	0.50	\$700.00	\$350.00
Service	07/31/2024 - Committee - Litigation / Andre Artidiello: GCP and PSZJ discussion regarding litigation data request and other issues.	0.50	\$700.00	\$350.00
Service	07/31/2024 - Committee - Case Administration / Andre Artidiello: Multiple communications with GCP team re updates to diligence request tracker.	1.40	\$700.00	\$980.00
Service	07/31/2024 - Committee - Business Analysis / Operations / Andre Artidiello: Multiple communications with I. Radi and E. Mendez re updated business performance data.	0.80	\$700.00	\$560.00
Service	07/31/2024 - Committee - Business Analysis / Operations / Ivan Radi: Multiple communications with A. Artidiello and E. Mendez re updated business performance data.	0.80	\$550.00	\$440.00
Service	07/31/2024 - Committee - Litigation / Ivan Radi: Call with PSZJ and GCP teams re investigative workstreams.	0.50	\$550.00	\$275.00
Service	07/31/2024 - Committee - Case Administration / Ivan Radi: Multiple communications with GCP team re updates to diligence request tracker.	1.40	\$550.00	\$770.00
Service	07/31/2024 - Committee - Case Administration / Ivan Radi: Prepare updates to diligence request tracker.	2.10	\$550.00	\$1,155.00
Service	07/31/2024 - Committee - Litigation / Ivan Radi: GCP and PSZJ discussion regarding litigation data request and other issues.	0.50	\$550.00	\$275.00

Service	07/31/2024 - Committee - Case Administration / Edward Kim: Multiple communicaitons with GCP team re updates to diligence request tracker.	1.40	\$1,000.00	\$1,400.00
Service	07/31/2024 - Committee - Litigation / Vinai Sewaliah: Call with PSZJ and GCP teams re investigative workstreams.	0.50	\$400.00	\$200.00
Service	07/31/2024 - Committee - Litigation / Vinai Sewaliah: GCP and PSZJ discussion regarding litigation data request and other issues.	0.50	\$400.00	\$200.00
Service	07/31/2024 - Committee - Court Filings / Vinai Sewaliah: Review of relevant court filings including docket nos. 733 and 734.	1.80	\$400.00	\$720.00
Service	07/31/2024 - Committee - Court Filings / Vinai Sewaliah: Continue review of relevant court filings including docket nos. 733 and 734.	1.90	\$400.00	\$760.00
Service	07/31/2024 - Committee - Litigation / Vinai Sewaliah: Research and analysis of potential litigation target business relationships.	2.60	\$400.00	\$1,040.00
Service	07/31/2024 - Committee - Litigation / Eric Mendez: Call with PSZJ and GCP teams re investigative workstreams.	0.50	\$700.00	\$350.00
Service	07/31/2024 - Committee - Business Analysis / Operations / Eric Mendez: Began updating financial estimates on FY25 based on new month-to-month estimates provided by AM.	2.50	\$700.00	\$1,750.00
Service	07/31/2024 - Committee - Litigation / Jorge González: Call with PSZJ and GCP teams re investigative workstreams.	0.50	\$1,000.00	\$500.00
Service	07/31/2024 - Committee - Litigation / Jorge González: GCP and PSZJ discussion regarding litigation data request and other issues.	0.50	\$1,000.00	\$500.00
Service	07/31/2024 - Committee - Case Administration / Jorge González: Multiple communications with GCP team re updates to diligence request tracker.	1.40	\$1,000.00	\$1,400.00
Service	07/31/2024 - Committee - Business Analysis / Operations / Eric Mendez: Multiple communications with I. Radi and A. Artidiello re updated business performance data.	0.80	\$700.00	\$560.00
Service	08/01/2024 - Committee - Plan & Disclosure Statement / Edward Kim: Analysis of revisions and impacts to BIT.	1.00	\$1,000.00	\$1,000.00
Service	08/01/2024 - Committee - Litigation / Ivan Radi: Multiple communications with A. Artidiello re litigation target research.	1.20	\$550.00	\$660.00
Service	08/01/2024 - Committee - Business Analysis / Operations / Andre Artidiello: Updates to business plan model sensitivity.	1.40	\$700.00	\$980.00
Service	08/01/2024 - Committee - Litigation / Andre Artidiello: Review of draft complaint.	1.10	\$700.00	\$770.00
Service	08/01/2024 - Committee - Litigation / Andre Artidiello: Research and analysis into litigation target.	2.90	\$700.00	\$2,030.00
Service	08/01/2024 - Committee - Litigation / Andre Artidiello: Multiple communications with I. Radi re litigation target research.	1.20	\$700.00	\$840.00
Service	08/01/2024 - Committee - Litigation / Vinai Sewaliah: Review and analysis of litigation target transaction history.	2.30	\$400.00	\$920.00
Service	08/01/2024 - Committee - Litigation / Vinai Sewaliah: Continue analysis of litigation target transaction history.	1.40	\$400.00	\$560.00
		I		

Service	08/01/2024 - Committee - Litigation / Vinai Sewaliah: Ongoing review and analysis of litigation target transaction history.	2.50	\$400.00	\$1,000.00
Service	08/01/2024 - Committee - Business Analysis / Operations / Eric Mendez: Continued updating financial estimates on FY25 based on new month-to-month estimates provided by AM.	2.60	\$700.00	\$1,820.00
Service	08/01/2024 - Committee - Committee Activities / Eric Mendez: Summary update for committee on upcoming milestones.	1.00	\$700.00	\$700.00
Service	08/01/2024 - Committee - Business Analysis / Operations / Eric Mendez: Review latest rent reduction summary provided by AM.	0.70	\$700.00	\$490.00
Service	08/01/2024 - Committee - Business Analysis / Operations / Eric Mendez: Compare updated annual guest counts against prior Business Plan estimates.	2.60	\$700.00	\$1,820.00
Service	08/01/2024 - Committee - Business Analysis / Operations / Charles Salom: Review recent court filings including docket nos. 731, 732, 760.	2.30	\$300.00	\$690.00
Service	08/02/2024 - Committee - Business Analysis / Operations / Edward Kim: Weekly standing call with AM and GCP teams.	0.40	\$1,000.00	\$400.00
Service	08/02/2024 - Committee - Business Analysis / Operations / Edward Kim: Multiple communications with GCP team re updated forecast materials.	1.20	\$1,000.00	\$1,200.00
Service	08/02/2024 - Committee - Business Analysis / Operations / Vinai Sewaliah: Weekly standing call with AM and GCP teams.	0.40	\$400.00	\$160.00
Service	08/02/2024 - Committee - Business Analysis / Operations / Vinai Sewaliah: Multiple communications with GCP team re updated forecast materials.	1.20	\$400.00	\$480.00
Service	08/02/2024 - Committee - Business Analysis / Operations / Andre Artidiello: Weekly standing call with AM and GCP teams.	0.40	\$700.00	\$280.00
Service	08/02/2024 - Committee - Business Analysis / Operations / Andre Artidiello: Multiple communications with GCP team re updated forecast materials.	1.20	\$700.00	\$840.00
Service	08/02/2024 - Committee - Committee Activities / Eric Mendez: Weekly standing call with AM and GCP teams.	0.40	\$700.00	\$280.00
Service	08/02/2024 - Committee - Business Analysis / Operations / Ivan Radi: Review and analysis of updated guest count assumptions and related sales forecast.	2.80	\$550.00	\$1,540.00
Service	08/02/2024 - Committee - Business Analysis / Operations / Eric Mendez: Revision of latest 13-week cash flow analysis to evaluate post-emergency cash expectations.	2.80	\$700.00	\$1,960.00
Service	08/02/2024 - Committee - Business Analysis / Operations / Ivan Radi: Continue review and analysis of updated guest count assumptions and related sales forecast.	2.40	\$550.00	\$1,320.00
Service	08/02/2024 - Committee - Business Analysis / Operations / Ivan Radi: Review and analysis of updated rent reduction schedule.	1.70	\$550.00	\$935.00
Service	08/02/2024 - Committee - Business Analysis / Operations / Ivan Radi: Weekly standing call with AM and GCP teams.	0.40	\$550.00	\$220.00

Service	08/02/2024 - Committee - Business Analysis / Operations / Ivan	1.20	\$550.00	\$660.00
	Radi: Multiple communications with GCP team re updated forecast materials.			
Service	08/02/2024 - Committee - Business Analysis / Operations / Jorge González: Multiple communications with GCP team re updated forecast materials.	1.20	\$1,000.00	\$1,200.00
Service	08/02/2024 - Committee - Business Analysis / Operations / Vinai Sewaliah: Multiple communications with GCP team re updated forecast materials.	1.20	\$400.00	\$480.00
Service	08/02/2024 - Committee - Business Analysis / Operations / Vinai Sewaliah: Review of relevant court filings including docket 778, 779, and 780.	1.80	\$400.00	\$720.00
Service	08/02/2024 - Committee - Business Analysis / Operations / Vinai Sewaliah: Review of relevant court filings including dockets 781 and 782.	1.90	\$400.00	\$760.00
Service	08/03/2024 - Committee - Plan & Disclosure Statement / Edward Kim: Review of investigations materials and potential impact to cost of post-confirmation plan, including comments to redlined POR.	2.00	\$1,000.00	\$2,000.00
Service	08/03/2024 - Committee - Business Analysis / Operations / Ivan Radi: Continue review and analysis of updated rent reduction schedule.	1.70	\$550.00	\$935.00
Service	08/03/2024 - Committee - Committee Activities / Ivan Radi: Prepare committee presentation materials.	2.40	\$550.00	\$1,320.00
Service	08/03/2024 - Committee - Committee Activities / Edward Kim: Create outputs for presentation.	1.00	\$1,000.00	\$1,000.00
Service	08/04/2024 - Committee - Business Analysis / Operations / Ivan Radi: Review and analysis of updated solvency analysis.	2.40	\$550.00	\$1,320.00
Service	08/04/2024 - Committee - Business Analysis / Operations / Ivan Radi: Continue review and analysis of updated solvency analysis.	2.10	\$550.00	\$1,155.00
Service	08/04/2024 - Committee - Business Analysis / Operations / Ivan Radi: Research of comparable company profiles and associated multiples.	2.30	\$550.00	\$1,265.00
Service	08/04/2024 - Committee - Business Analysis / Operations / Ivan Radi: Continue research of comparable company profiles and associated multiples.	2.50	\$550.00	\$1,375.00
Service	08/04/2024 - Committee - Court Filings / Ivan Radi: Review and analysis of latest court filings including docket nos. 789, 780, 779, 778, 775.	2.70	\$550.00	\$1,485.00
Service	08/05/2024 - Committee - Business Analysis / Operations / Ivan Radi: Multiple communications with V. Sewaliah re updates to solvency analysis.	1.30	\$550.00	\$715.00
Service	08/05/2024 - Committee - Plan & Disclosure Statement / Edward Kim: Variance and ending cash estimation for POR.	1.10	\$1,000.00	\$1,100.00
Service	08/05/2024 - Committee - Committee Activities / Edward Kim: Review and comments to committee presentation and verify spreadsheet and outputs.	1.00	\$1,000.00	\$1,000.00

Service	08/05/2024 - Committee - Business Analysis / Operations / Eric Mendez: Review updated rent lease negotiations for UCC materials.	1.90	\$700.00	\$1,330.00
Service	08/05/2024 - Committee - Claims Analysis and Objections / Eric Mendez: Gather information re claim rejections.	2.20	\$700.00	\$1,540.00
Service	08/05/2024 - Committee - Business Analysis / Operations / Vinai Sewaliah: Multiple communications with I. Radi re updates to solvency analysis.	1.30	\$400.00	\$520.00
Service	08/06/2024 - Committee - Business Analysis / Operations / Ivan Radi: Provide commentary and updates to solvency analysis.	2.70	\$550.00	\$1,485.00
Service	08/06/2024 - Committee - Business Analysis / Operations / Ivan Radi: Continue preparing committee presentation materials.	2.30	\$550.00	\$1,265.00
Service	08/06/2024 - Committee - Committee Activities / Edward Kim: Research case issues and preparation for meeting.	0.70	\$1,000.00	\$700.00
Service	08/06/2024 - Committee - Committee Activities / Edward Kim: Multiple communications with GCP team re committee presentation materials.	1.20	\$1,000.00	\$1,200.00
Service	08/06/2024 - Committee - Committee Activities / Eric Mendez: Multiple communications with GCP team re committee presentation materials.	1.20	\$700.00	\$840.00
Service	08/06/2024 - Committee - Committee Activities / Ivan Radi: Finalize revisions to committee materials.	1.80	\$550.00	\$990.00
Service	08/06/2024 - Committee - Committee Activities / Ivan Radi: Multiple communications with GCP team re committee presentation materials.	1.20	\$550.00	\$660.00
Service	08/06/2024 - Committee - Committee Activities / Jorge González: Multiple communications with GCP team re committee presentation materials.	1.20	\$1,000.00	\$1,200.00
Service	08/07/2024 - Committee - Claims Analysis and Objections / Edward Kim: Initial assessment and analysis of claims report.	1.10	\$1,000.00	\$1,100.00
Service	08/07/2024 - Committee - Business Analysis / Operations / Eric Mendez: Analyze additional potential downside guest projections in model as a result of continued delays in ad spending.	2.70	\$700.00	\$1,890.00
Service	08/07/2024 - Committee - Litigation / Ivan Radi: Call with J. Walker (PSZJ) re outstanding investigations and solvency analysis.	0.20	\$550.00	\$110.00
Service	08/08/2024 - Committee - Case Administration / Eric Mendez: Update DRL re Thai union topics.	0.50	\$700.00	\$350.00
Service	08/08/2024 - Committee - Business Analysis / Operations / Eric Mendez: Solvency analysis review.	2.50	\$700.00	\$1,750.00
Service	08/08/2024 - Committee - Business Analysis / Operations / Ivan Radi: Review and updates to solvency analysis.	2.70	\$550.00	\$1,485.00
Service	08/08/2024 - Committee - Business Analysis / Operations / Ivan Radi: Continue review and updates to solvency analysis.	2.30	\$550.00	\$1,265.00

Service	08/08/2024 - Committee - Business Analysis / Operations / Ivan Radi: Multiple communications with V. Sewaliah re ongoing solvency analysis.	1.20	\$550.00	\$660.00
Service	08/08/2024 - Committee - Business Analysis / Operations / Vinai Sewaliah: Multiple communications with I. Radi re ongoing solvency analysis.	1.20	\$400.00	\$480.00
Service	08/09/2024 - Committee - Business Analysis / Operations / Edward Kim: Weekly standing call with GCP and AM teams.	0.40	\$1,000.00	\$400.00
Service	08/09/2024 - Committee - Business Analysis / Operations / Edward Kim: Multiple communications with GCP team re variance report.	1.10	\$1,000.00	\$1,100.00
Service	08/09/2024 - Committee - Business Analysis / Operations / Eric Mendez: Weekly standing call with GCP and AM teams.	0.40	\$700.00	\$280.00
Service	08/09/2024 - Committee - Business Analysis / Operations / Eric Mendez: Comparable analysis update to incorporate into latest solvency analysis.	2.40	\$700.00	\$1,680.00
Service	08/09/2024 - Committee - Business Analysis / Operations / Eric Mendez: Multiple communications with GCP team re variance report.	1.10	\$700.00	\$770.00
Service	08/09/2024 - Committee - Business Analysis / Operations / Ivan Radi: Weekly standing call with GCP and AM teams.	0.40	\$550.00	\$220.00
Service	08/09/2024 - Committee - Claims Analysis and Objections / Ivan Radi: Review and analysis of latest claims register.	2.70	\$550.00	\$1,485.00
Service	08/09/2024 - Committee - Claims Analysis and Objections / Ivan Radi: Continue review and analysis of latest claims register.	2.10	\$550.00	\$1,155.00
Service	08/09/2024 - Committee - Business Analysis / Operations / Andre Artidiello: Weekly standing call with GCP and AM teams.	0.40	\$700.00	\$280.00
Service	08/09/2024 - Committee - Business Analysis / Operations / Ivan Radi: Multiple communications with GCP team re variance report.	1.10	\$550.00	\$605.00
Service	08/09/2024 - Committee - Business Analysis / Operations / Ivan Radi: Review and commentary to updated comparables analysis.	1.90	\$550.00	\$1,045.00
Service	08/09/2024 - Committee - Business Analysis / Operations / Andre Artidiello: Multiple communications with GCP team re variance report.	1.10	\$700.00	\$770.00
Service	08/09/2024 - Committee - Business Analysis / Operations / Edward Kim: Finalize estimation of ending cash and pull forward of budget.	1.80	\$1,000.00	\$1,800.00
Service	08/09/2024 - Committee - Business Analysis / Operations / Jorge González: Multiple communications with GCP team re variance report.	1.10	\$1,000.00	\$1,100.00
Service	08/14/2024 - Committee - Business Analysis / Operations / Vinai Sewaliah: Weekly standing call with GCP and AM.	0.40	\$400.00	\$160.00
Service	08/14/2024 - Committee - Business Analysis / Operations / Vinai Sewaliah: Updates to solvency analysis.	1.50	\$400.00	\$600.00

Service	08/14/2024 - Committee - Business Analysis / Operations / Vinai Sewaliah: Continue updates to solvency analysis.	2.60	\$400.00	\$1,040.00
Service	08/14/2024 - Committee - Business Analysis / Operations / Vinai Sewaliah: Multiple communications with GCP team re variance report.	1.10	\$400.00	\$440.00
Service	08/14/2024 - Committee - Court Filings / Edward Kim: Download and analysis of key catch-up items and documents.	1.00	\$1,000.00	\$1,000.00
Service	08/14/2024 - Committee - Claims Analysis and Objections / Edward Kim: Analysis of contract rejections and estimated impacts to date.	1.50	\$1,000.00	\$1,500.00
Service	08/14/2024 - Committee - Business Analysis / Operations / Edward Kim: Discuss solvency analysis with GCP team.	1.10	\$1,000.00	\$1,100.00
Service	08/14/2024 - Committee - Business Analysis / Operations / Ivan Radi: Discuss solvency analysis with GCP team.	1.10	\$550.00	\$605.00
Service	08/14/2024 - Committee - Business Analysis / Operations / Jorge González: Discuss solvency analysis with GCP team.	1.10	\$1,000.00	\$1,100.00
Service	08/14/2024 - Committee - Business Analysis / Operations / Vinai Sewaliah: Multiple communications with GCP team re solvency analysis.	1.10	\$400.00	\$440.00
Service	08/16/2024 - Committee - Business Analysis / Operations / Edward Kim: Weekly standing call with GCP and AM teams.	0.40	\$1,000.00	\$400.00
Service	08/16/2024 - Committee - Business Analysis / Operations / Ivan Radi: Weekly standing call with GCP and AM teams.	0.40	\$550.00	\$220.00
Service	08/16/2024 - Committee - Business Analysis / Operations / Vinai Sewaliah: Weekly standing call with GCP and AM teams.	0.40	\$400.00	\$160.00
Service	08/16/2024 - Committee - Business Analysis / Operations / Ivan Radi: Multiple communications with V. Sewaliah re investigative workstreams.	1.20	\$550.00	\$660.00
Service	08/16/2024 - Committee - Business Analysis / Operations / Vinai Sewaliah: Multiple communications with I. Radi re investigative workstreams.	1.20	\$400.00	\$480.00
Service	08/16/2024 - Committee - Business Analysis / Operations / Vinai Sewaliah: Review and investigation of EBITDA adjustments.	2.10	\$400.00	\$840.00
Service	08/16/2024 - Committee - Business Analysis / Operations / Vinai Sewaliah: Review and analysis of updated variance reporting.	1.60	\$400.00	\$640.00
Service	08/19/2024 - Committee - Business Analysis / Operations / Vinai Sewaliah: Updates of internal historical financial materials.	1.30	\$400.00	\$520.00
Expense	06/04/2024 - Meals / Andre Artidiello: 06.04.24_Red Lobster_Working Meal_A. Artidiello	1.00	\$35.00	\$35.00
Expense	06/04/2024 - Meals / Jorge González: 2024.06.04_RL_Working meal (\$35 cap) J. Gonzalez	1.00	\$35.00	\$35.00
Expense	06/05/2024 - Meals / Andre Artidiello: 06.05.24_Red Lobster_Working Meal_A. Artidiello I. Radi J.Gonzalez V. Sewaliah C.Salom	1.00	\$171.42	\$171.42

Expense	06/05/2024 - Airfare / Edward Kim: Travel to Miami for Orlando management meeting.	1.00	\$1,828.95	\$1,828.95
Expense	06/05/2024 - Meals / Jorge González: 2024.06.05_RL_Working meal (\$35 cap) J. Gonzalez	1.00	\$35.00	\$35.00
Expense	06/05/2024 - Meals / Jorge González: 2024.06.05_RL_Snacks for GCP team	1.00	\$122.67	\$122.67
Expense	06/06/2024 - Transportation / Edward Kim: Brightline rail tickets from MIA-ORL-MIA for RL management meeting (E Kim, J Gonzalez, A Artidiello, E Mendez, I Radi).	1.00	\$1,005.00	\$1,005.00
Expense	06/06/2024 - Meals / Ivan Radi: I. Radi working meal	1.00	\$35.00	\$35.00
Expense	06/06/2024 - Meals / Andre Artidiello: 06.06.24_Red Lobster_Working Meal_A. Artidiello	1.00	\$35.00	\$35.00
Expense	06/07/2024 - Meals / Vinai Sewaliah: Working meal.	1.00	\$15.44	\$15.44
Expense	06/07/2024 - Meals / Jorge González: 2024.06.07_RL_Working meal (\$35 cap ea) for J. Gonzalez and E. Mendez	1.00	\$70.00	\$70.00
Expense	06/08/2024 - Meals / Andre Artidiello: 06.08.24_Red Lobster_Working Meal_A. Artidiello	1.00	\$35.00	\$35.00
Expense	06/09/2024 - Meals / Ivan Radi: I. Radi and E. Mendez working meal	1.00	\$64.63	\$64.63
Expense	06/09/2024 - Meals / Edward Kim: Working meal (lunch and dinner orders).	1.00	\$57.17	\$57.17
Expense	06/09/2024 - Meals / Andre Artidiello: 06.09.24_Red Lobster_Working Meal_A. Artidiello	1.00	\$35.00	\$35.00
Expense	06/10/2024 - Transportation / Edward Kim: Change fee for MIA-ORL (entire team).	1.00	\$111.75	\$111.75
Expense	06/10/2024 - Meals / Vinai Sewaliah: Working meal.	1.00	\$11.98	\$11.98
Expense	06/10/2024 - Meals / Pedro Leme: P.Leme working meal	1.00	\$32.95	\$32.95
Expense	06/11/2024 - Transportation / Edward Kim: Uber from home to LAX.	1.00	\$101.48	\$101.48
Expense	06/11/2024 - Data Connectivity / Edward Kim: Inflight wifi - LAX to MIA.	1.00	\$29.00	\$29.00
Expense	06/11/2024 - Transportation / Edward Kim: Uber from MIA to hotel.	1.00	\$62.27	\$62.27
Expense	06/11/2024 - Meals / Jorge González: 2024.06.11_RL_Working meal (\$35 cap ea) for GCP team	1.00	\$280.00	\$280.00
Expense	06/12/2024 - Transportation / Eric Mendez: Uber to to Brightline train in the morning.	1.00	\$19.10	\$19.10
Expense	06/12/2024 - Transportation / Edward Kim: Uber from hotel to train station for trip to Orlando.	1.00	\$40.85	\$40.85
Expense	06/12/2024 - Transportation / Edward Kim: Uber to RL headquarters for meeting (entire team).	1.00	\$81.52	\$81.52

\$80.82	\$80.82	1.00	06/12/2024 - Transportation / Edward Kim: Uber from RL HQ to train station for return trip (entire team).	Expense
\$105.82	\$105.82	1.00	06/12/2024 - Meals / Edward Kim: Travel meal for entire team (E. Kim, J. Gonzalez, A. Artidiello, E. Mendez, I. Radi)	Expense
\$22.68	\$22.68	1.00	06/12/2024 - Transportation / Ivan Radi: Uber to bright line for management meeting for I. Radi and J. Gonzalez	Expense
\$11.77	\$11.77	1.00	06/12/2024 - Meals / Jorge González: 2024.06.12_RL_Meal for J. Gonzalez at train station en route management meeting	Expense
\$86.93	\$86.93	1.00	06/12/2024 - Transportation / Andre Artidiello: 06.12.24_Red Lobster_Uber for mgmt. metting_A. Artidiello	Expense
\$25.63	\$25.63	1.00	06/12/2024 - Transportation / Andre Artidiello: 06.12.24_Red Lobster_first Uber for mgmt. metting_A. Artidiello	Expense
\$17.06	\$17.06	1.00	06/12/2024 - Meals / Pedro Leme: P.Leme Working meal	Expense
\$226.00	\$226.06	1.00	06/13/2024 - Transportation / Eric Mendez: Ft. Lauderdale to Miami Uber - Brightline was restricted to Ft. Lauderdale instead of arriving at Miami. GCP team booked an Uber XL for Ed Kim, Jorge Gonzalez, Eric Mendez and Ivan Radi.	Expense
\$17.08	\$17.08	1.00	06/13/2024 - Meals / Edward Kim: Travel meal.	Expense
\$55.33	\$55.33	1.00	06/14/2024 - Transportation / Edward Kim: Uber from hotel to MIA.	Expense
\$548.7	\$548.71	1.00	06/14/2024 - Lodging / Edward Kim: Hotel stay for management meeting.	Expense
\$29.00	\$29.00	1.00	06/14/2024 - Data Connectivity / Edward Kim: Inflight wifi	Expense
\$92.64	\$92.64	1.00	06/14/2024 - Transportation / Edward Kim: Uber from LAX to home.	Expense
\$35.00	\$35.00	1.00	06/14/2024 - Meals / Edward Kim: Working meals. (capped at \$35)	Expense
\$32.9	\$32.95	1.00	06/14/2024 - Meals / Pedro Leme: P.Leme working meal	Expense
\$139.04	\$139.04	1.00	06/17/2024 - Meals / Andre Artidiello: 06.17.24_Red Lobster_Working Meal_A. Artidiello I. Radi J.Gonzalez V. Sewaliah P. Leme	Expense
\$175.00	\$175.00	1.00	06/18/2024 - Meals / Jorge González: 2024.06.18_RL_Working meal (\$35 cap ea) for GCP team	Expense
\$14.12	\$14.12	1.00	06/19/2024 - Meals / Vinai Sewaliah: Working meal.	Expense
\$70.00	\$70.00	1.00	06/20/2024 - Meals / Andre Artidiello: Working meal for A. Artidiello and I. Radi (capped at \$70).	Expense
\$12.8	\$12.85	1.00	06/20/2024 - Meals / Charles Salom: C Salom Dinner	Expense
\$125.00	\$125.00	1.00	06/21/2024 - Research / Eric Mendez: Wall Street Prep WST Macros for Financial Modeling	Expense
\$136.08	\$136.08	1.00	06/24/2024 - Meals / Ivan Radi: GCP team working meal	Expense

Expense	06/25/2024 - Meals / Eric Mendez: Dinner for Eric Mendez, Andre Artidiello, Ivan Radi and Jorge Gonzalez	1.00	\$139.66	\$139.66
Expense	06/28/2024 - Meals / Charles Salom: C Salom Dinner	1.00	\$18.61	\$18.61
Expense	06/29/2024 - Meals / Vinai Sewaliah: Working meal.	1.00	\$12.91	\$12.91
Expense	06/30/2024 - Information Technology / Edward Kim: Research and data expenses	1.00	\$1,257.10	\$1,257.10
Expense	07/01/2024 - Meals / Andre Artidiello: 07.01.24_Red Lobster_Working Meal_A. Artidiello, J. Gonzalez, I. Radi, E. Mendez	1.00	\$137.50	\$137.50
Expense	07/01/2024 - Meals / Vinai Sewaliah: Working meal for V. Sewaliah and P. Leme.	1.00	\$73.12	\$73.12
Expense	07/02/2024 - Meals / Ivan Radi: I. Radi, P. Leme and J. Gonzalez working meal	1.00	\$97.37	\$97.37
Expense	07/03/2024 - Meals / Vinai Sewaliah: Working meal.	1.00	\$16.57	\$16.57
Expense	07/03/2024 - Meals / Pedro Leme: P.Leme working meal	1.00	\$25.92	\$25.92
Expense	07/05/2024 - Meals / Vinai Sewaliah: Working meal.	1.00	\$17.11	\$17.11
Expense	07/05/2024 - Meals / Andre Artidiello: 07.05.24_RL_Working Meal_A. Artidiello	1.00	\$35.00	\$35.00
Expense	07/05/2024 - Meals / Jorge González: 2024.07.05_RL_Working meal (\$35 cap ea) for J. Gonzalez and E. Mendez	1.00	\$70.00	\$70.00
Expense	07/06/2024 - Meals / Ivan Radi: I. Radi working meal	1.00	\$35.00	\$35.00
Expense	07/06/2024 - Meals / Andre Artidiello: 07.06.24_RL_Working Meal_A. Artidiello	1.00	\$21.17	\$21.17
Expense	07/08/2024 - Meals / Ivan Radi: I. Radi working meal	1.00	\$32.47	\$32.47
Expense	07/08/2024 - Meals / Pedro Leme: P.Leme working meal.	1.00	\$33.48	\$33.48
Expense	07/09/2024 - Meals / Andre Artidiello: 07.09.24_RL_Working Meal_A. Artidiello I. Radi J. Gonzalez E. Mendez	1.00	\$130.81	\$130.81
Expense	07/09/2024 - Meals / Edward Kim: Working meal (capped at \$35).	1.00	\$35.00	\$35.00
Expense	07/10/2024 - Meals / Edward Kim: Working meal (capped at \$35).	1.00	\$35.00	\$35.00
Expense	07/11/2024 - Meals / Ivan Radi: I. Radi working meal	1.00	\$35.00	\$35.00
Expense	07/11/2024 - Meals / Pedro Leme: P. Leme working meal	1.00	\$31.32	\$31.32
Expense	07/11/2024 - Meals / Charles Salom: C Salom Meal	1.00	\$30.17	\$30.17
Expense	07/11/2024 - Meals / Vinai Sewaliah: Working meal.	1.00	\$31.32	\$31.32
Expense	07/12/2024 - Meals / Pedro Leme: P. Leme working meal	1.00	\$34.56	\$34.56
Expense	07/12/2024 - Meals / Vinai Sewaliah: Working meal.	1.00	\$17.11	\$17.11
Expense	07/13/2024 - Meals / Edward Kim: Working meal (capped at \$35).	1.00	\$35.00	\$35.00

\$6.55	\$6.55	1.00	07/14/2024 - Meals / Edward Kim: Working lunch.	Expense
\$35.00	\$35.00	1.00	07/14/2024 - Meals / Edward Kim: Working meal (capped at \$35).	Expense
\$35.00	\$35.00	1.00	07/15/2024 - Meals / Edward Kim: Working meal (capped at \$35).	Expense
\$27.38	\$27.38	1.00	07/15/2024 - Meals / Ivan Radi: I. Radi working meal	Expense
\$35.00	\$35.00	1.00	07/18/2024 - Meals / Edward Kim: Group working meal (capped at \$35).	Expense
\$35.00	\$35.00	1.00	07/20/2024 - Meals / Ivan Radi: I. Radi working meal	Expense
\$35.00	\$35.00	1.00	07/20/2024 - Meals / Edward Kim: Working meal (capped at \$35).	Expense
\$35.00	\$35.00	1.00	07/20/2024 - Meals / Edward Kim: Working meal (lunch, capped at \$35).	Expense
\$35.00	\$35.00	1.00	07/21/2024 - Meals / Ivan Radi: I. Radi working meal	Expense
\$34.00	\$34.00	1.00	07/22/2024 - Meals / Edward Kim: Working meal.	Expense
\$34.11	\$34.11	1.00	07/23/2024 - Meals / Ivan Radi: I. Radi working meal	Expense
\$136.26	\$136.26	1.00	07/24/2024 - Meals / Ivan Radi: Working meal for E. Mendez, I. Radi, V. Sewaliah, A. Artidiello	Expense
\$35.00	\$35.00	1.00	07/24/2024 - Meals / Edward Kim: Working meal (capped at \$35).	Expense
\$35.00	\$35.00	1.00	07/26/2024 - Meals / Ivan Radi: I. Radi working meal	Expense
\$19.76	\$19.76	1.00	07/27/2024 - Meals / Edward Kim: Working meal.	Expense
\$35.00	\$35.00	1.00	07/27/2024 - Meals / Edward Kim: Working dinner (capped at \$35).	Expense
\$35.00	\$35.00	1.00	07/30/2024 - Meals / Edward Kim: Working meal (capped at \$35).	Expense
\$120.72	\$120.72	1.00	07/30/2024 - Meals / Ivan Radi: Working meal for I. Radi, A. Artidiello, J. Gonzalez, and E. Mendez.	Expense
\$35.00	\$35.00	1.00	07/31/2024 - Meals / Edward Kim: Working meal (capped at \$35).	Expense
\$1,978.43	\$1,978.43	1.00	07/31/2024 - Information Technology / Edward Kim: Research and data expenses	Expense
\$9.89	\$9.89	1.00	08/01/2024 - Meals / Vinai Sewaliah: Working meal.	Expense
\$35.00	\$35.00	1.00	08/03/2024 - Meals / Edward Kim: Working meal (capped at \$35).	Expense
\$34.48	\$34.48	1.00	08/05/2024 - Meals / Edward Kim: Working meal.	Expense
\$35.00	\$35.00	1.00	08/09/2024 - Meals / Edward Kim: Working meal (capped at \$35).	Expense

Amount Due \$1,150,825.61

EIN# 99-1981643