UNITED STATES BANKRUPTCY COURT SOUTHERN DISTRICT OF TEXAS HOUSTON DIVISION

In re:	Chapter 11
	1

RED RIVER TALC LLC,¹ Case No. 24-90505 (CML)

Debtor.

THIRD MONTHLY STATEMENT OF FEES AND EXPENSES INCURRED BY SKADDEN, ARPS, SLATE, MEAGHER & FLOM LLP AS SPECIAL COUNSEL FOR THE DEBTOR FOR THE PERIOD FROM JANUARY 1 THROUGH FEBRUARY 28, 2025

Name of Applicant: Skadden, Arps, Slate, Meagher & Flom LLP,

Special Litigation Counsel to Red River Talc

LLC

Date of Retention: August 21, 2024, effective as of November

13, 2024 [Docket No. 533]

Period for Which Fees and Expenses Were January 1 through February 28, 2025 (the

Incurred: "Application Period")

Interim Fees Incurred: \$469,387.70

Interim Payment of Fees Requested (80%): \$375,510.16

Interim Expenses Incurred: \$18,103.46

Total Fees and Expenses Due: \$393,613.62

Retainer Balance: \$859,770.70²

Retainer Balance After Deducting Monthly \$46

Fees and Expenses Requested:

\$466,157.08

Total Fees and Expenses Due: \$0.00

The last four digits of the Debtor's taxpayer identification number are 8508. The Debtor's address is 501 George Street, New Brunswick, New Jersey 08933.

² See Status of Retainer section for background on retainer adjustments.

In accordance with the Order Establishing Procedures for Interim Compensation and Reimbursement of Expenses of Retained Professionals [Docket No. 521] (the "Interim Compensation Order"), Skadden, Arps, Slate, Meagher & Flom LLP ("Skadden"), Special Litigation Counsel to Red River Talc LLC as debtor (the "Debtor"), submits its Third Monthly Statement of Fees and Expenses Incurred by Skadden, Arps, Slate, Meagher & Flom LLP as Special Litigation Counsel for the Debtor for the Period from January 1, 2025 through February 28, 2025 (the "Third Monthly Fee Statement").

Itemization of Services Rendered and Expenses Incurred

Skadden requests compensation for professional services rendered in the amount of \$469,387.70 (the "Fees"), and for reimbursement of out-of-pocket expenses incurred in the amount of \$18,103.46 (the "Expenses"), during the Application Period. Eighty percent (80%) of the Fees equals \$375,510.16 and one hundred percent (100%) of the Expenses equals \$18,103.46 for a total requested amount of \$393,613.62.³

For the period covering January 1, 2025 through January 31, 2025 (the "January Period"), summaries of the calculations for the Fees by project category and Expenses are attached hereto as Exhibit A and Exhibit B, respectively. A summary of the time expended by Skadden's professionals and paraprofessionals, together with their respective hourly rates, for the January Period is attached hereto as Exhibit C.

For the period covering February 1, 2025 through February 28, 2025 (the "February Period"), a summary of the calculations for the Fees by project category is attached

-2-

-

Consistent with its own internal policies and to comply with the "reasonableness" requirements of section 330 of the Bankruptcy Code, Skadden has reviewed its monthly service descriptions and expense detail and has determined that certain Fees and Expenses should not be charged to the Debtor. In particular, Skadden has voluntarily determined that \$32,865.10 in Fees and \$7,001.40 in Expenses will not be charged to the Debtor. This Monthly Fee Statement reflects these adjustments.

hereto as <u>Exhibit D</u>. Skadden is not seeking reimbursement of any Expenses for the February Period. A summary of the time expended by Skadden's professionals and paraprofessionals, together with their respective hourly rates, for the February Period is attached hereto as <u>Exhibit E</u>.

Skadden's invoices for the Application Period are attached hereto as $\underline{\text{Exhibit F}}$ (for the January Period) and $\underline{\text{Exhibit G}}$ (for the February Period).

Status of Retainer and LLT Payment

Prior to the formation of the Debtor and the Petition Date, on August 19, 2024, LLT Management LLC ("<u>LLT</u>") paid Skadden \$10,754,621.52 for actual and estimated fees and expenses relating to pre-petition talc-related litigation services provided by Skadden through August 31, 2024 (the "<u>LLT Payment</u>"). In addition, prior to the Petition Date, on August 20, 2024, the Debtor paid Skadden a retainer of \$500,000 for professional services and expenses to be provided to the Debtor (the "Red River Retainer").

As of the date of the Retention Application, the combined balance of the LLT Payment and the Red River Retainer was \$2,788,527.64. At the time of Skadden's second monthly fee statement [Docket No. 1063], the combined balance of the LLT Payment and the Red River Retainer was \$1,513,065.10. Upon further reconciliation of Skadden's prepetition fees, including factoring in actual August fees, the balance was reduced by \$653,294.40, resulting in a combined balance of \$859,770.70. Applying Skadden's total requested amount of \$393,613.62 for this Application Period results in a Retainer balance of \$466,157.08 for future statements.

Notice

Notice of this Monthly Fee Statement will be served upon (a) the Debtor, (I) Red River Talc LLC, c/o Accordion Partners, LLC, 1920 McKinney Avenue, Suite 950, Dallas, Texas 75201 (Attn: John Bittner, jbittner@accordion.com), (II) Red River Talc LLC, 501 George Street, New Brunswick, New Jersey 08933 (Attn: John K. Kim, Esq., jkim8@its.jnj.com) and (III) (i) Jones Day, 2727 N. Harwood, Dallas, Texas 75201 (Attn: Dan B. Prieto, dbprieto@jonesday.com; Amanda Rush, asrush@jonesday.com; and Saylor Nolan, snolan@jonesday.com) and (ii) Porter Hedges LLP, 1000 Main Street, 36th Floor, Houston, Texas 77002 (Attn: John F. Higgins, jhiggins@porterhedges.com; M. Shane Johnson, sjohnson@porterhedges.com; Megan Young-John, myoung-john@porterhedges.com; James A. Keefe, jkeefe@porterhedges.com); (b) the United States Trustee for the Southern District of Texas, 515 Rusk Street, Suite 3516, Houston, TX 77002 (Attn: Ha Minh Nguyen, ha.nguyen@usdoj.gov and Jayson B. Ruff, jayson.b.ruff@usdoj.gov); (c) counsel to the Debtor's non-debtor affiliates, Johnson & Johnson Holdco (NA) Inc. and Johnson & Johnson, White & Case LLP, 1221 Avenue of the Americas, New York, New York 10020 (Attn: Jessica C. Lauria (Boelter), jessica.boelter@whitecase.com); (d) counsel to the Official Committee of Talc Claimants, Stutzman, Bromberg, Esserman & Plifka, P.C., 2323 Bryan Street, Ste. 2200, Dallas, Texas 75201 (Attn: Sander L. Esserman, esserman@sbep-law.com and Peter C. D'Apice, dapice@sbep-law.com); and (e) counsel to the Future Claimants' Representative, Bracewell LLP, 711 Louisiana Street, Suite 2300, Houston, Texas 77002 (Attn: Nancy Davis, nancy.davis@bracewell.com, Jason G. Cohen, jason.cohen@bracewell.com). In light of the nature of the relief requested herein, Jones Day respectfully submits that no other or further notice need be provided.

WHEREFORE, pursuant to the Interim Compensation Order, Skadden respectfully requests compensation of its Fees and reimbursement of its Expenses incurred during the Application Period in the total amount of \$393,613.62, consisting of (i) \$375,510.16, which is 80% of the Fees and (ii) \$18,103.46, which is 100% of the Expenses.

Dated: March 19, 2025 New York, New York Respectfully submitted,

/s/ Richard T. Bernardo

Richard T. Bernardo (admitted *pro hac vice*) SKADDEN, ARPS, SLATE, MEAGHER &

FLOM LLP

One Manhattan West

New York, New York 10001 Telephone: (212) 735-3000

Facsimile: (212) 735-2000 richard.bernardo@skadden.com

Special Counsel to Debtor

Certificate of Service

I certify that on March 19, 2025, I caused a copy of the foregoing document to be served by the Electronic Case Filing System for the United States Bankruptcy Court for the Southern District of Texas, and will be served as set forth in the Affidavit of Service to be filed by the Debtor's claims, noticing and solicitation agent.

/s/ Richard T. Bernardo

Richard T. Bernardo

EXHIBIT A

SUMMARY OF TIME EXPENDED BY PROJECT CATEGORY (for the period January 1, 2025 through January 31, 2025)

Project Category	Total Hours	Total Fees Requested
Fee/Employment Applications	7.00	\$2,716.00
Litigation Consulting	594.10	\$389,694.10
TOTAL	601.10	\$392,410.10

EXHIBIT B

SUMMARY OF OUT-OF-POCKET EXPENSES

(for the period January 1, 2025 through January 31, 2025)

Expenses	Cost
Court Reporting	\$13,599.65
Out-Of-Town Travel	\$4,503.81
TOTAL:	\$18,103.46

EXHIBIT C

SUMMARY OF TIME EXPENDED BY ATTORNEYS AND SUPPORT STAFF (for the period January 1, 2025 through January 31, 2025)

Professional	Hourly Rate	Total Hours
Allison M. Brown	\$1,566.00	36.70
Sylvia K. Ashley	752.00	102.50
Joseph A. Caruso	752.00	145.30
Luis Chu	636.00	8.70
Jacob A. Cogdill*	509.00	53.50
Paul A. Cotler	949.00	40.40
Rupal Joshi	1,069.00	20.30
Alex Leibovitz	388.00	40.00
Wandy Liu	272.00	8.40
Stephanie E. Martin	388.00	7.00
Tariq Muhammad	255.00	17.90
Rachel Papalski	255.00	120.40
TOTAL		601.10

^{*}Law clerks are law school graduates who are not presently admitted to practice.

EXHIBIT D

SUMMARY OF TIME EXPENDED BY PROJECT CATEGORY (for the period February 1, 2025 through February 28, 2025)

Project Category	Total Hours	Total Fees Requested
Fee/Employment Applications	33.80	\$32,196.60
Litigation Consulting	121.20	\$44,781.00
TOTAL	155.00	\$76,977.60

EXHIBIT E

SUMMARY OF TIME EXPENDED BY ATTORNEYS AND SUPPORT STAFF (for the period February 1, 2025 through February 28, 2025)

Professional	Hourly Rate	Total Hours
Richard T. Bernardo	\$1,844.00	1.60
Sylvia K. Ashley	752.00	15.40
Bram A. Strochlic	1,069.00	24.60
Brian Baggetta	550.00	0.80
Carolyne Anderson	388.00	0.50
Janet B. Glick	388.00	26.10
Alex Leibovitz	388.00	14.70
Marco Li	388.00	0.50
Wandy Liu	272.00	8.10
Stephanie E. Martin	388.00	7.60
Rachel Papalski	255.00	50.60
Richard Raez	194.00	1.60
Alfred M. Raucci	388.00	0.50
Rachel Redman	388.00	1.40
Jacqueline D. Steele	388.00	1.00
TOTAL		155.00

EXHIBIT F

SKADDEN INVOICES

for the period January 1, 2025 through January 31, 2025

Skadden, Arps, Slate, Meagher & Flom IIp and affiliates

Red River Talc LLC March 13, 2025 501 George Street Bill No.: 2022753

New Brunswick, New Jersey 08933

TIN: 13-1777230

PLEASE REMIT TO:				
By Check:	SASM&F LLP P.O. Box 1764 White Plains, NY 10602	By Wire:	In US Dollars to: Citibank, N.A., New York A.B.A. Number: Swift Code: For Credit To Account: Reference Bill No.: 2022753	
If you receive a request, via email or otherwise, to change our remittance account information, please verify that this is				
	our intent	by contacting your Ska	dden contact.	

FOR PROFESSIONAL SERVICES rendered through January 31, 2025 with respect to the General Advice matter.....\$392,410.10

CHARGES AND DISBURSEMENTS

Business Travel & Lodging Court Reporting

\$ 4,503.81 13,599.65

> \$ 18,103.46 \$410,513.56





TIME SUMMARY RED RIVER TALC LLC: January 1, 2025 - January 31, 2025

MATTER #1 General Advice Bill No: 2022753 NAME RATE HOURS TOTAL PARTNER ALLISON M. BROWN \$1,566.00 36.70 \$ 57,472.20 TOTAL PARTNER 36.70 \$ 57,472.20 ASSOCIATES/LAW CLERK 102.50 \$ 77,080.00 \$752.00 SYLVIA K. ASHLEY JOSEPH A. CARUSO 752.00 145.30 109,265.60 5,533.20 LUIS CHU 636.00 8.70 JACOB A. COGDILL* 509.00 53.50 27,231.50 PAUL A. COTLER 949.00 40.40 38,339.60 RUPAL JOSHI 1,069.00 20.30 21,700.70 TOTAL ASSOCIATES/LAW CLERK 370.70 \$279,150.60 **PARALEGALS** \$388.00 40.00 \$ 15,520.00 ALEX LEIBOVITZ 388.00 7.00 2,716.00 STEPHANIE E. MARTIN 4,564.50 TARIQ MUHAMMAD 255.00 17.90 RACHEL PAPALSKI 255.00 120.40 30,702.00 TOTAL PARALEGALS 185.30 \$ 53,502.50 PARAPROFESSIONAL \$272.00 \$ 2,284.80 WANDY LIU 8.40 TOTAL PARAPROFESSIONAL 8.40 \$ 2,284.80 MATTER TOTAL 601.10 \$392,410.10

 $[\]ensuremath{^{*}}\xspace$ Law clerks are law school graduates who are not presently admitted to practice.

Skadden, Arps, Slate, Meagher & Flom IIp and affiliates ATTORNEY WORK PRODUCT PRIVILEGED AND CONFIDENTIAL

CLIENT: 273240 Red River Talc LLC Bill Date: 03/13/25 MATTER: 1 General Advice Bill Number: 2022753

NAME	DATE	HOURS	TASK	DESCRIPTION
H) FEE/EMPLOYMENT			111010	DEBORTI TION
MARTIN SE	01/21/25	2.10	7590	REVIEW DECEMBER PROFESSIONAL INVOICES FOR PRIVILEGED OR CONFIDENTIAL INFORMATION (2.1).
MARTIN SE	01/23/25	0.40	7590	EMAILS WITH A. BROWN, D. WILEY AND N. EPSTEIN RE: REVISIONS TO FIRST MONTHLY FEE APPLICATION (0.4).
MARTIN SE	01/28/25	2.70	7590	REVISE AND FINALIZE FIRST MONTHLY FEE APPLICATION (1.0); EMAILS WITH S. NOLAN, A. BROWN AND N. EPSTEIN RE: SAME (0.5); DRAFT NOVEMBER MONTHLY FEE APPLICATION (0.8); REVIEW NOVEMBER PROFESSIONAL FEES FOR PRIVILEGED AND CONFIDENTIAL INFORMATION (0.2); EMAILS WITH N. EPSTEIN AND D. WILEY RE: NOVEMBER MONTHLY FEE APPLICATION (0.2).
MARTIN SE	01/29/25	1.40	7590	REVISE AND FINALIZE FIRST MONTHLY FEE APPLICATION COVERING SEPTEMBER AND OCTOBER (1.0); EMAILS WITH S. NOLAN AND I. PEREZ RE: SAME (0.4).
MARTIN SE	01/30/25	0.40	7590	EMAILS WITH N. EPSTEIN RE: COMMENTS ON DECEMBER PRIVILEGE REVIEW FOR FEE APPLICATION (0.4).
TOTAL H) FEE/EMPL APPLICATIONS	OYMENT	7.00		\$2,716.00
S) LITIGATION CON	SULTING			
CARUSO JA	01/02/25	3.10	7601	DRAFT PRESENTATION FOR HEARING (2.7); ANALYZE PLEADINGS FOR CONFIRMATION HEARING PREP (0.4).
LEIBOVITZ A	01/02/25	5.30	7601	ORGANIZE KEY DOCUMENT PRODUCTIONS FOR ATTORNEY REVIEW (4.3); COMMUNICATE WITH W. LIU AND R. PAPALSKI RE: SAME (1.0).
LIU W	01/02/25	1.10	7601	UPDATE THE PRODUCTION LOG WITH DOCUMENT PRODUCTIONS (1.1).

Case 24-90505 Document 1404 Filed in TXSB on 03/19/25 Page 15 of 43

PAPALSKI R	01/02/25	6.60	7601	ASSEMBLE PLEADINGS AND HEARING AND DEPOSITION TRANSCRIPTS FOR ATTORNEY REVIEW (4.6); COMMUNICATE WITH COURT REPORTER AND K. FOURNIER RE: FEBRUARY CONFIRMATION HEARING (1.2); COMMUNICATE WITH K. FOURNIER (K&S) AND A. BROWN RE: PRODUCTION DATABASE (0.2); COMMUNICATE WITH A. KARP RE: RELEVANT DEPOSITION TESTIMONY (0.3); COMMUNICATE WITH R. HENSHAW AND K. FOURNIER (K&S) RE: MEETING LOGISTICS (0.3).
ASHLEY SK	01/03/25	0.30	7601	EMAILS WITH J. CARUSO RE: PREPARATION FOR CONFIRMATION HEARING (0.3).
CARUSO JA	01/03/25	7.10	7601	ANALYZE DOCUMENT PRODUCTIONS TO BE USED DURING THE CONFIRMATION HEARING (7.1).
PAPALSKI R	01/03/25	4.90	7601	ASSEMBLE PRODUCTION MATERIALS, CORRESPONDENCE, AND PLEADINGS FOR ATTORNEY REVIEW (3.6); COMMUNICATE WITH LIGHTHOUSE AND W. LIU RE: PRODUCTIONS DATABASE (0.4); UPDATE COLLECTION OF ATTORNEY WORK PRODUCT FOR ATTORNEY REVIEW (0.6); COMMUNICATE WITH COURT REPORTER RE: CONFIRMATION HEARING SCHEDULE (0.3).
CARUSO JA	01/05/25	1.50	7601	ANALYZE PRODUCTIONS IN CONNECTION WITH IDENTIFYING DOCUMENTS TO BE USED DURING THE CONFIRMATION HEARING (1.5).
ASHLEY SK	01/06/25	4.90	7601	REVIEW DOCUMENT PRODUCTION (4.6) AND MODIFY REVIEW SPREADSHEET (0.3).
ASHLEY SK	01/06/25	0.70	7601	MEET WITH J. CARUSO AND R. PAPALSKI TO DISCUSS REVIEW OF DOCUMENT PRODUCTION (0.7).
ASHLEY SK	01/06/25	0.40	7601	MEET WITH K. FOURNIER (K&S) AND J. CARUSO TO DISCUSS PREPARATION FOR FEB. 18 CONFIRMATION HEARING (0.4).
BROWN AM	01/06/25	1.00	7601	CONFERENCE CALL WITH A. WHITE, E. HAAS, J. KIM AND JONES DAY TEAM RE: HEARING PREPARATION (1.0).

Case 24-90505 Document 1404 Filed in TXSB on 03/19/25 Page 16 of 43

CARUSO JA	01/06/25	11.30	7601	ANALYZE MULTIPLE DOCUMENT PRODUCTIONS IN CONNECTION WITH IDENTIFYING DOCUMENTS TO BE USED DURING THE CONFIRMATION HEARING (9.4); CONFER WITH K. FOURNIER AND S. ASHLEY RE: DOCUMENT REVIEW STATUS (0.4); ANALYZE DEPOSITION TESTIMONY IN PREPARATION FOR MEETINGS (1.5).
PAPALSKI R	01/06/25	9.30	7601	COMMUNICATE AND COORDINATE WITH J. CARUSO AND S. ASHLEY RE: DOCUMENT REVIEW PROJECT (0.5); DRAFT SUMMARY RE: SAME (0.3); ASSIST WITH DOCUMENT REVIEW PROJECT (6.1); ATTENTION TO LOGISTICAL PREPARATION FOR UPCOMING RRT MEETINGS (0.6); COMMUNICATE WITH COURT REPORTER RE: DEPOSITION LOGISTICS (0.2); ASSEMBLE PLEADINGS FOR ATTORNEY REVIEW (1.4); COMMUNICATE WITH J. CARUSO RE: OUTLINES FOR ATTORNEY REVIEW (0.2).
ASHLEY SK	01/07/25	0.70	7601	REVIEW DOCUMENT PRODUCTION (0.7).
CARUSO JA	01/07/25	7.60	7601	ANALYZE DEPOSITION TESTIMONY FOR VARIOUS WITNESSES IN PREPARATION FOR MEETING (7.6).
COGDILL JA*	01/07/25	0.40	7601	MEET WITH J. CARUSO RE: DOCUMENT REVIEW (0.4).
LEIBOVITZ A	01/07/25	6.90	7601	ASSIST WITH DOCUMENT REVIEW (5.5); COMMUNICATE WITH J. CARUSO, S. ASHLEY, J. COGDILL, R. PAPALSKI AND T. MUHAMMAD RE: SAME (1.9).
LIU W	01/07/25	2.00	7601	REVIEW CERTAIN PRODUCTION DOCUMENTS FOR ACCURACY (2.0).
MUHAMMAD T	01/07/25	2.00	7601	ASSIST WITH DOCUMENT REVIEW PROJECT (1.2); COMMUNICATE WITH R. PAPALSKI AND A. LEIBOVITZ RE: SAME (0.8).

Case 24-90505 Document 1404 Filed in TXSB on 03/19/25 Page 17 of 43

PAPALSKI R	01/07/25	9.00	7601	COMMUNICATE WITH T. MUHAMMAD AND A. LEIBOVITZ RE: PRODUCTION REVIEW PROCESS AND NEXT STEPS (1.0); ASSIST WITH DOCUMENT REVIEW PROJECT (4.1); ATTENTION TO LOGISTICAL PREPARATION FOR CONFIRMATION HEARING AND DEPOSITIONS (0.5); DRAFT INDEX OF DOCUMENTS CITED IN DEPO OUTLINES (1.2); REVIEW DEPOSITION EXHIBITS (0.9); PREPARE MATERIALS FOR ATTORNEY USE AT CONFIRMATION HEARING PREP MEETING (1.3).
ASHLEY SK	01/08/25	0.80	7601	DISCUSS DOCUMENT PRODUCTION REVIEW AND NEXT STEPS WITH J. CARUSO (0.8).
ASHLEY SK	01/08/25	0.40	7601	ATTEND CONFIRMATION HEARING MEETING WITH E. HAAS (J&J), K. FOURNIER, (K&S) A. BROWN, J. CARUSO (0.4).
ASHLEY SK	01/08/25	8.80	7601	REVIEW DOCUMENT PRODUCTION (8.8).
BROWN AM	01/08/25	7.00	7601	MEETING WITH A. WHITE, E. HAAS, J. KIM AND JONES DAY TEAM RE: TRIAL AND EXPERT WITNESSES (7.0).
CARUSO JA	01/08/25	14.10	7601	MEET WITH DEBTOR COUNSEL AND TEAMS FROM SKADDEN, JONES DAY, AND BARNES AND THORNBURG RE: CONFIRMATION HEARING PREP (7.2); ANALYZE DOCUMENT PRODUCTIONS FOR CONFIRMATION HEARING (5.3); ANALYZE EXPERT REPORTS FOR CONFIRMATION HEARING (1.6).
COGDILL JA*	01/08/25	5.40	7601	CONDUCT DOCUMENT REVIEW IN PREPARATION FOR CONFIRMATION HEARING (5.4) .
LEIBOVITZ A	01/08/25	9.50	7601	ASSIST WITH DOCUMENT REVIEW (8.1); COMMUNICATE WITH J. CARUSO, S. ASHLEY, J. COGDILL, R. PAPALSKI AND T. MUHAMMAD RE: SAME (1.4).
MUHAMMAD T	01/08/25	2.70	7601	ASSIST WITH DOCUMENT REVIEW PROJECT (1.0); COMMUNICATE WITH R. PAPALSKI AND A. LEIBOVITZ RE: SAME (1.7).

Case 24-90505 Document 1404 Filed in TXSB on 03/19/25 Page 18 of 43

PAPALSKI R	01/08/25	14.40	7601	COMMUNICATE WITH J. CARUSO, S. ASHLEY, T. MUHAMMAD AND A. LEIBOVITZ RE: PRODUCTION ANALYSIS (2.3); ASSIST WITH DOCUMENT REVIEW PROJECT (10.3); PREPARE MATERIALS FOR USE IN DEPOSITIONS (1.2), AND ATTENTION TO LOGISTICAL PREPARATION RE: SAME (0.2); ASSEMBLE EXPERT REPORT MATERIALS FOR ATTORNEY REVIEW (0.4).
ASHLEY SK	01/09/25	7.90	7601	REVIEW DOCUMENT PRODUCTION (7.9).
BROWN AM	01/09/25	5.00	7601	PREPARE FOR (2.0) AND MEET WITH A. WHITE, E. HAAS, J. KIM, JONES DAY TEAM, AND AHC COUNSEL RE: TRIAL PREPARATION (3.0).
CARUSO JA	01/09/25	8.70	7601	MEET WITH DEBTOR COUNSEL AND TEAMS FROM SKADDEN, JONES DAY, AND BARNES AND THORNBURG AS WELL AS AHC COUNSEL RE: HEARING PREP (4.9); ANALYZE DOCUMENT PRODUCTIONS FOR HEARING (3.8).
COGDILL JA*	01/09/25	5.00	7601	CONDUCT DOCUMENT REVIEW IN PREPARATION FOR CONFIRMATION HEARING (5.0) .
LEIBOVITZ A	01/09/25	8.70	7601	ASSIST WITH DOCUMENT REVIEW (8.0); COMMUNICATE WITH J. CARUSO, S. ASHLEY, J. COGDILL, R. PAPALSKI AND T. MUHAMMAD RE: SAME (0.7).
LIU W	01/09/25	0.20	7601	COMMUNICATE/COORDINATE WITH LIGHTHOUSE TEAM TO QUALITY CHECK DOCUMENT PRODUCTIONS (0.2).
MUHAMMAD T	01/09/25	10.10	7601	ASSIST WITH DOCUMENT REVIEW PROJECT (9.1); COMMUNICATE WITH J. CARUSO, S. ASHLEY, J. COGDILL, R. PAPALSKI AND A. LEIBOVITZ RE: SAME (1.0).
PAPALSKI R	01/09/25	11.90	7601	ASSEMBLE PLEADINGS FOR ATTORNEY REVIEW (0.4); ASSIST WITH DOCUMENT REVIEW PROJECT (7.8); COMPILE DOCUMENT REVIEW FINDINGS INTO SUMMARY (2.9); COMMUNICATE WITH C. BRADSHAW (B&T) AND COURT REPORTER RE: DEPOSITION VIDEO FILES FOR ATTORNEY REVIEW (0.3); FINALIZE MATERIALS FOR USE IN DEPOSITION (0.5).
ASHLEY SK	01/10/25	1.50	7601	MEET WITH J. CARUSO, K. FOURNIER (K&S) AND R. PAPALSKI RE: CERTAIN DOCUMENT PRODUCTION REVIEW (1.5).

Case 24-90505 Document 1404 Filed in TXSB on 03/19/25 Page 19 of 43

ASHLEY SK	01/10/25	6.50	7601	REVIEW DOCUMENT PRODUCTION (6.5).
BROWN AM	01/10/25	0.70	7601	DISCUSSIONS WITH A. WHITE, J. KIM, E. HAAS AND JONES DAY TEAM RE: PREPARATION FOR CONFIRMATION HEARING (0.7).
CARUSO JA	01/10/25	7.80	7601	MEET WITH K. FOURNIER TO DISCUSS PRODUCTION ANALYSIS (0.3); ANALYZE DOCUMENT PRODUCTIONS FOR CONFIRMATION HEARING (7.5).
COGDILL JA*	01/10/25	0.20	7601	MEET WITH J. CARUSO RE: CONTINUED DOCUMENT REVIEW (0.2).
COGDILL JA*	01/10/25	2.90	7601	CONDUCT DOCUMENT REVIEW IN PREPARATION FOR CONFIRMATION HEARING (2.9).
LEIBOVITZ A	01/10/25	7.90	7601	REVIEW AND QUALITY CHECK DOCUMENT REVIEW RESULTS (6.2); COMMUNICATE WITH J. CARUSO, S. ASHLEY, J. COGDILL, R. PAPALSKI AND T. MUHAMMAD RE: SAME (1.7).
LIU W	01/10/25	1.90	7601	ASSIST WITH DOCUMENT PRODUCTION UPLOADS (1.1); UPDATE THE PRODUCTION LOG (0.3); COMMUNICATE WITH LIGHTHOUSE TEAM, A. ST. AMAND RE: SAME (0.5).
MUHAMMAD T	01/10/25	0.40	7601	ASSIST WITH DOCUMENT REVIEW PROJECT (0.1); COMMUNICATE WITH J. CARUSO, S. ASHLEY, J. COGDILL, R. PAPALSKI AND A. LEIBOVITZ RE: SAME. (0.3).
PAPALSKI R	01/10/25	9.90	7601	REVIEW AND FINALIZE SPREADSHEET SUMMARIZING DOCUMENT REVIEW PROJECT (7.1); ASSEMBLE PLEADINGS FOR ATTORNEY REVIEW (0.5); CORRESPONDENCE WITH J. QUIGLEY (STB) RE: EXPERT REPORT MATERIALS (0.1); CORRESPONDENCE WITH EVOLUTION RE: EXPERT DEPOSITION SCHEDULE (0.5); CORRESPONDENCE WITH K. FOURNIER, S. ASHLEY, AND J. CARUSO RE: DOCUMENT REVIEW PROJECT (1.4); CORRESPONDENCE WITH D. STONE RE: CONFIRMATION HEARING LOGISTICS (0.3).
CARUSO JA	01/11/25	1.50	7601	DRAFT OUTLINES FOR CONFIRMATION HEARING (1.1) ; ANALYZE DOCUMENT PRODUCTION (0.4) .

Case 24-90505 Document 1404 Filed in TXSB on 03/19/25 Page 20 of 43

LEIBOVITZ A	01/11/25	1.70	7601	REVIEW VOTING RELATED MATERIALS AND CERTAIN PRODUCTION MATERIALS (1.3); COMMUNICATE WITH J. CARUSO, S. ASHLEY, R. PAPALSKI AND T. MUHAMMAD RE: SAME (0.4).
MUHAMMAD T	01/11/25	0.60	7601	ASSIST WITH DOCUMENT REVIEW PROJECT (0.5); COMMUNICATE WITH J. CARUSO, S. ASHLEY, J. COGDILL, R. PAPALSKI AND A. LEIBOVITZ RE: SAME (0.1).
MUHAMMAD T	01/12/25	2.10	7601	ASSIST WITH DOCUMENT REVIEW PROJECT (2.0); COMMUNICATE WITH J. CARUSO, S. ASHLEY, J. COGDILL, R. PAPALSKI AND A. LEIBOVITZ RE: SAME (0.2).
PAPALSKI R	01/12/25	1.20	7601	REVISE DOCUMENT REVIEW SUMMARY (1.0); COMMUNICATION WITH J. CARUSO AND S. ASHLEY RE: SAME (0.2).
CARUSO JA	01/13/25	4.50	7601	REVIEW DOCUMENT PRODUCTIONS FOR HEARING (4.5) .
PAPALSKI R	01/13/25	4.20	7601	COMMUNICATE WITH W. LIU, A. BROWN, AND K. FOURNIER (K&S) RE: DOCUMENT REVIEW PROJECT (1.7); ASSEMBLE PLEADINGS FOR ATTORNEY REVIEW (1.0); REVIEW DOCKET AND JUDGE LOPEZ'S WEBSITE FOR 1/14/2025 HEARING TIME (0.1); COMMUNICATE WITH COURT REPORTER RE: EXPERT DEPOSITION SCHEDULE (0.5); ASSEMBLE EXPERT MATERIALS FOR ATTORNEY REVIEW (0.9).
ASHLEY SK	01/14/25	0.50	7601	MEET WITH J. CARUSO, K. FOURNIER (K&S) AND R. PAPALSKI RE: DOCUMENT PRODUCTION REVIEW (0.5).
PAPALSKI R	01/14/25	2.30	7601	CALL WITH K. FOURNIER (K&S), J. CARUSO, AND S. ASHLEY RE: PRODUCTION REVIEW (0.5); REVISE DOCUMENT REVIEW SUMMARY (0.3); COMMUNICATE WITH COURT REPORTER RE: RESCHEDULED HEARING DATE (0.2); ASSEMBLE PLEADINGS FOR ATTORNEY REVIEW (0.8); ATTENTION TO LOGISTICAL PREPARATION FOR CONFIRMATION HEARING (0.5).
BROWN AM	01/15/25	1.50	7601	DISCUSSIONS WITH G. GORDON RE: HEARING (0.5); CONFERENCE CALL WITH A. WHITE, E. HAAS, J. KIM AND JONES DAY TEAM RE: CONFIRMATION HEARING (1.0).
CARUSO JA	01/15/25	4.40	7601	ANALYZE EXPERT REPORTS FOR HEARING (4.4) .

Case 24-90505 Document 1404 Filed in TXSB on 03/19/25 Page 21 of 43

COTLER PA	01/15/25	1.20	7601	ATTEND CALL WITH R. JOSHI AND J. CARUSO RE: HEARING PREP (1.2).
COTLER PA	01/15/25	1.10	7601	REVIEW DOCUMENTS AND MATERIALS TO PREPARE PRESENTATION FOR CONFIRMATION HEARING (1.1).
PAPALSKI R	01/15/25	1.50	7601	ASSEMBLE EXPERT MATERIALS FOR ATTORNEY REVIEW (0.3); ASSEMBLE PLEADINGS FOR ATTORNEY REVIEW (1.2).
ASHLEY SK	01/16/25	0.10	7601	DISCUSS WITH J. CARUSO PREPARATION FOR MOTION TO STRIKE EXPERTS HEARING (0.1).
BROWN AM	01/16/25	3.00	7601	PREPARE FOR (1.5) AND ATTEND (1.5) HEARING ON MOTION TO STRIKE MEDICAL AND REGULATORY EXPERTS.
CARUSO JA	01/16/25	3.30	7601	ANALYZE EXPERT REPORTS FOR HEARING (2.3); ATTEND HEARING RELATED TO PENDING MOTIONS AND CASE MANAGEMENT (1.0).
ASHLEY SK	01/17/25	1.50	7601	MEET WITH A. BROWN, J. CARUSO, AND J. COGDILL RE: CONFIRMATION TRIAL (1.5).
BROWN AM	01/17/25	1.50	7601	MEETING WITH WITNESS RE: CONFIRMATION HEARING PREP (1.0) AND PARTICIPATE IN CONFERENCE CALL WITH A. WHITE, E. HAAS, J. KIM AND JONES DAY TEAM RE: CASE STATUS (0.5).
CARUSO JA	01/17/25	8.20	7601	ANALYZE DEPOSITION TESTIMONY AND PLEADINGS IN PREPARATION FOR HEARING (5.8); CONFER WITH BATES WHITES TEAM, SKADDEN TEAM, AND JONES DAY TEAM IN CONNECTION WITH DEPO AND HEARING PREP (1.5); CONFER INTERNALLY WITH SKADDEN TEAM RE: HEARING PREPARATION AND LOGISTICS (0.9).
COGDILL JA*	01/17/25	1.40	7601	MEET WITH INTERNAL TEAM RE: PREPARATION FOR CONFIRMATION HEARING (1.4) .

Case 24-90505 Document 1404 Filed in TXSB on 03/19/25 Page 22 of 43

PAPALSKI R	01/17/25	2.60	7601	ASSEMBLE UNDER SEAL PLEADINGS FOR ATTORNEY REVIEW (0.3); COMMUNICATION WITH C. BRADSHAW (B&T) RE: SAME (0.2); COMMUNICATE WITH COURT REPORTER AND C. BRADSHAW (B&T) RE: HEARING UPDATES AND POTENTIAL EXPERT DEPOSITIONS (0.5); CREATE EXPERT DEPOSITION TRACKER (0.5); ATTEND PRE-TRIAL MEETING VIA WEBEX WITH A. BROWN, J. CARUSO, S. ASHLEY, AND J. COGDILL (1.1).
ASHLEY SK	01/18/25	0.10	7601	CORRESPOND WITH J. CARUSO RE: PRESENTATIONS FOR CONFIRMATION HEARING (0.1).
CARUSO JA	01/18/25	1.90	7601	ANALYZE DEPOSITION TESTIMONY AND PLEADINGS TO DRAFT OUTLINES (1.9).
COGDILL JA*	01/18/25	1.00	7601	REVIEW EXPERT REPORTS IN PREPARATION FOR DRAFTING OUTLINES FOR HEARING (1.0).
ASHLEY SK	01/19/25	1.00	7601	REVIEW EXPERT REPORT IN PREPARATION FOR DEPOSITION (1.0) .
ASHLEY SK	01/19/25	1.50	7601	CREATE OUTLINE FOR WITNESS MATERIALS (1.5).
ASHLEY SK	01/19/25	3.10	7601	DRAFT WITNESS MATERIALS (3.1).
LIU W	01/19/25	0.60	7601	COORDINATE WITH LIGHTHOUSE TEAM TO UPLOAD REPRODUCTION TO THE PRODUCTION DATABASE (0.3); UPDATE THE PRODUCTION LOG (0.3).
ASHLEY SK	01/20/25	1.30	7601	MEET WITH R. JOSHI, J. EPSTEIN, P. COTLER, AND J. CARUSO RE: CONFIRMATION HEARING PREPARATION (1.3).
ASHLEY SK	01/20/25	5.80	7601	DRAFT AND REVISE WITNESS MATERIALS (5.8).
CARUSO JA	01/20/25	5.50	7601	ANALYZE DEPOSITION TESTIMONY FOR OUTLINES (4.2); CONFER INTERNALLY WITH SKADDEN TEAM RE: HEARING AND LOGISTICS (1.3).
JOSHI R	01/20/25	4.00	7601	CALLS AND EMAILS WITH SKADDEN TEAM RE: PLANNING FOR CONFIRMATION HEARING (3.0); DRAFT AGENDA RE: SAME (1.0).

Case 24-90505 Document 1404 Filed in TXSB on 03/19/25 Page 23 of 43

PAPALSKI R	01/20/25	1.50	7601	ATTEND MEETING RE: CONFIRMATION HEARING WITH LCI, E. GASCIONE (K&S), AND K. FOURNIER (K&S) (0.5); ASSEMBLE PRODUCTION MATERIALS AND COMMUNICATE WITH W. LIU AND A. ST. AMAND RE: SAME (0.5); ATTENTION TO LOGISTICAL PREPARATION FOR CONFIRMATION HEARING (0.5).
ASHLEY SK	01/21/25	0.50	7601	MEET WITH C. TEBEAU (CORE LEGAL CONCEPTS) AND J. CARUSO RE: PRESENTATIONS FOR CONFIRMATION HEARING (0.5).
ASHLEY SK	01/21/25	0.10	7601	MEET WITH J. CARUSO RE: PREPARATION OF WITNESS MATERIALS (0.1).
ASHLEY SK	01/21/25	8.10	7601	DRAFT WITNESS MATERIALS (8.1).
CARUSO JA	01/21/25	9.10	7601	ANALYZE DEPOSITION TESTIMONY AND DOCUMENT PRODUCTIONS FOR DRAFTING OUTLINES (8.6); CONFER WITH TRIAL GRAPHICS TEAM AND SKADDEN TEAM RE: HEARING PRESENTATIONS (0.5).
COGDILL JA*	01/21/25	0.50	7601	MEET WITH SKADDEN TEAM RE: PREPARATION OF MATERIALS FOR CONFIRMATION HEARING (0.5).
COGDILL JA*	01/21/25	5.40	7601	DRAFT SLIDES FOR HEARING (5.4).
COGDILL JA*	01/21/25	0.90	7601	REVIEW EXPERT REPORTS IN PREPARATION FOR DRAFTING OUTLINES FOR HEARING (0.9).
COTLER PA	01/21/25	0.50	7601	ATTEND CALL WITH J. CARUSO AND LCI GRAPHICS TEAM RE: PREPARATION OF PRESENTATION (0.5).
BROWN AM	01/22/25	1.50	7601	CONFERENCE CALL WITH K. FOURNIER RE: HEARING PREPARATION (0.7); CONFERENCE CALL WITH A. WHITE, E. HAAS, J. KIM AND JONES DAY TEAM RE: CASE STATUS (0.8).
CARUSO JA	01/22/25	6.10	7601	ANALYZE DEPOSITION TESTIMONY AND DOCUMENT PRODUCTIONS FOR DRAFTING OUTLINES (5.5); CONFER WITH SKADDEN, JONES DAY, AND BATES WHITE TEAM RE: EXPERT REPORTS (0.6).
COGDILL JA*	01/22/25	0.50	7601	REVIEW EXPERT REPORTS IN PREPARATION FOR DRAFTING OUTLINES FOR HEARING (0.5).
COGDILL JA*	01/22/25	0.30	7601	CORRESPOND WITH C. TEBEAU AND J. CARUSO RE: GRAPHICS FOR HEARING (0.3).

JOSHI R	01/22/25	3.00	7601	EMAILS AND CALLS WITH P. COTLER AND J. CARUSO RE: PLANNING FOR HEARING (1.0); REVIEW AND REVISE AGENDA AND ASSIGNMENTS FOR HEARING PREP (2.0).
PAPALSKI R	01/22/25	2.10	7601	ATTENTION TO LOGISTICAL PREPARATION FOR CONFIRMATION HEARING (1.3); ASSEMBLE PLEADINGS FOR ATTORNEY REVIEW (0.5); COMMUNICATION WITH W. LIU RE: PRODUCTION REVIEW (0.3).
ASHLEY SK	01/23/25	3.70	7601	ATTEND B. MORELLI DEPOSITION (3.7).
ASHLEY SK	01/23/25	0.60	7601	MEET WITH C. TEBEAU (CORE LEGAL CONCEPTS) AND J. CARUSO RE: PRESENTATIONS FOR CONFIRMATION HEARING (0.6).
BROWN AM	01/23/25	1.20	7601	CONFERENCE CALL WITH SKADDEN TEAM RE: CONFIRMATION HEARING (0.5); CONFERENCE CALL WITH A. WHITE, E. HAAS, J. KIM AND JONES DAY TEAM RE: CASE STATUS (0.7).
CARUSO JA	01/23/25	4.40	7601	ATTEND BEN MORELLI DEPOSITION (2.5); DRAFT OUTLINES FOR CONFIRMATION HEARING (1.9).
COGDILL JA*	01/23/25	0.50	7601	CORRESPOND WITH C. TEBEAU RE: HEARING GRAPHICS (0.5).
COTLER PA	01/23/25	0.20	7601	DRAFT CROSS OUTLINES (0.2).
JOSHI R	01/23/25	2.00	7601	REVIEW AND REVISE AGENDA AND ASSIGNMENTS FOR HEARING PREP (2.0); CALL WITH A. BROWN AND J. CARUSO RE: HEARING PREPARATION (1.0).
PAPALSKI R	01/23/25	1.40	7601	ASSEMBLE PLEADINGS FOR ATTORNEY REVIEW (0.8); ASSEMBLE DEPO PREP MATERIALS FOR ATTORNEY REVIEW (0.6).
ASHLEY SK	01/24/25	0.30	7601	MEET WITH P. COTLER AND J. COGDILL RE: DEPOSITION PREPARATION (0.3).
ASHLEY SK	01/24/25	0.50	7601	MEET WITH J. CARUSO, J. EPSTEIN, P. COTLER AND R. JOSHI RE: CONFIRMATION HEARING PREPARATION (0.5).
ASHLEY SK	01/24/25	4.80	7601	FACTUAL RESEARCH FOR DEPOSITION PREPARATION (4.8).
CARUSO JA	01/24/25	4.90	7601	ANALYZE DEPOSITION TESTIMONY AND DOCUMENT PRODUCTIONS FOR DRAFTING OUTLINES (4.9).
COGDILL JA*	01/24/25	1.70	7601	FACTUAL RESEARCH FOR DEPOSITION PREPARATION (1.7).

Case 24-90505 Document 1404 Filed in TXSB on 03/19/25 Page 25 of 43

COGDILL JA*	01/24/25	0.30	7601	MEET WITH SKADDEN TEAM RE: LEGAL RESEARCH FOR EXPERT DEPOSITION (0.3).
COTLER PA	01/24/25	4.80	7601	DRAFT DEPOSITION OUTLINE FOR EXPERT (4.8).
COTLER PA	01/24/25	0.90	7601	PREPARE FOR AND ATTEND DEPOSITION PREP CALL WITH R. JOSHI (0.9).
PAPALSKI R	01/24/25	4.90	7601	ASSEMBLE PLEADINGS FOR ATTORNEY REVIEW (0.9); UPDATE EXPERT FILES (1.1); COMMUNICATION WITH COURT REPORTER RE: UPDATED EXPERT DEPOSITION SCHEDULE (0.4); ASSEMBLE POTENTIAL WITNESS MATERIALS FOR ATTORNEY REVIEW (1.7); REVIEW EXPERT MATERIALS FOR FURTHER ATTORNEY REVIEW IN CONNECTION WITH DRAFTING DEPO OUTLINES (1.5).
ASHLEY SK	01/25/25	5.40	7601	RESEARCH FOR DEPOSITION PREPARATION (5.4).
ASHLEY SK	01/25/25	1.50	7601	REVIEW DRAFT MATERIALS FOR CONFIRMATION HEARING WITNESS (1.5).
COGDILL JA*	01/25/25	3.60	7601	LEGAL RESEARCH FOR DEPOSITION PREPARATION (3.6).
COGDILL JA*	01/25/25	2.10	7601	REVIEW EXPERT REPORT IN PREPARATION FOR DEPOSITION (2.1) .
PAPALSKI R	01/25/25	0.40	7601	ASSEMBLE PRODUCTION MATERIALS FOR ATTORNEY REVIEW (0.4).
ASHLEY SK	01/26/25	4.50	7601	LEGAL RESEARCH FOR DEPOSITION PREPARATION (4.5).
ASHLEY SK	01/26/25	0.30	7601	EMAIL C. TEBEAU (CORE LEGAL CONCEPTS) RE: HEARING PRESENTATIONS (0.3).
COGDILL JA*	01/26/25	2.90	7601	FACTUAL RESEARCH FOR DEPOSITION PREPARATION (2.9).
COGDILL JA*	01/26/25	0.60	7601	LEGAL RESEARCH FOR DEPOSITION PREPARATION (0.6) .
COTLER PA	01/26/25	6.60	7601	DRAFT DEPOSITION OUTLINE FOR EXPERT (6.6).
PAPALSKI R	01/26/25	2.50	7601	ASSEMBLE REQUESTED PLEADINGS FOR ATTORNEY REVIEW (1.3); COMMUNICATION WITH S. ASHLEY AND C. BRADSHAW (B&T) RE: ANALYSIS OF PRODUCTION LETTERS (0.5); ASSEMBLE PRODUCTION MATERIALS FOR ATTORNEY REVIEW (0.7).

Case 24-90505 Document 1404 Filed in TXSB on 03/19/25 Page 26 of 43

ASHLEY SK	01/27/25	0.90	7601	LEGAL RESEARCH FOR DEPOSITION PREPARATION (0.9) .
ASHLEY SK	01/27/25	0.60	7601	MEET WITH P. COTLER AND L. CHU TO DISCUSS RESEARCH FOR DEPOSITIONS (0.6).
BROWN AM	01/27/25	3.50	7601	EDIT PRESENTATION FOR CONFIRMATION HEARING (1.5); PARTICIPATE IN MEET AND CONFER WITH COALITION RE: TRIAL ISSUES (1.0); CONFERENCE CALL WITH A. WHITE, J. KIM, E. HAAS AND JONES DAY TEAM RE: CASE STATUS (1.0).
CARUSO JA	01/27/25	7.70	7601	ANALYZE DEPOSITION TESTIMONY AND DOCUMENT PRODUCTIONS FOR DRAFTING OUTLINES (5.1); ANALYZE REPORTS AND PRIOR TESTIMONY IN CONNECTION WITH DRAFTING DEPOSITION OUTLINE (2.6).
CHU L	01/27/25	3.80	7601	LEGAL RESEARCH FOR EXPERT DEPOSITION PREP (3.8).
CHU L	01/27/25	0.40	7601	CONFER WITH P. COTLER AND S. ASHLEY RE: RESEARCH FOR EXPERT WITNESS DEPOSITION (0.4).
COGDILL JA*	01/27/25	0.90	7601	FACTUAL RESEARCH FOR DEPOSITION PREPARATION (0.9).
COGDILL JA*	01/27/25	0.40	7601	CORRESPOND WITH P. COTLER RE: RESEARCH FOR DEPOSITION PREPARATION (0.4).
COTLER PA	01/27/25	5.80	7601	REVIEW MATERIALS AND POTENTIAL EXHIBITS TO BE INCLUDED IN DRAFT DEPOSITION OUTLINE (5.8).
LIU W	01/27/25	1.20	7601	ASSIST WITH UPLOADING DOCUMENT PRODUCTION TO THE DATABASE (1.2) .
PAPALSKI R	01/27/25	4.40	7601	COMMUNICATE WITH W. LIU AND A. ST. AMAND RE: PRODUCTION REVIEW (0.3); ATTENTION TO LOGISTICAL PREPARATION FOR CONFIRMATION HEARING (2.8); COMMUNICATION WITH ATTORNEY TEAM AND COURT REPORTER RE: EXPERT DEPOSITION SCHEDULE UPDATES (1.1); ASSEMBLE PLEADINGS FOR ATTORNEY REVIEW (0.2).
ASHLEY SK	01/28/25	1.90	7601	LEGAL RESEARCH FOR DEPOSITION PREPARATION (1.9).
ASHLEY SK	01/28/25	0.60	7601	REVIEW P. COTLER EMAILS RE: RESEARCH FOR DEPOSITION (0.6).

Case 24-90505 Document 1404 Filed in TXSB on 03/19/25 Page 27 of 43

BROWN AM	01/28/25	2.90	7601	EDIT PRESENTATION FOR CONFIRMATION HEARING (1.2); MEET AND CONFER WITH COALITION RE: TRIAL (0.8); CONFERENCE CALL WITH A. WHITE, E. HAAS, J. KIM AND JONES DAY TEAM RE: CASE STATUS (0.9).
CARUSO JA	01/28/25	5.30	7601	DRAFT SLIDES FOR CONFIRMATION HEARING (3.8); DRAFT OUTLINES FOR CONFIRMATION HEARING (1.5).
CHU L	01/28/25	3.60	7601	FACTUAL RESEARCH FOR DEPOSITION PREPARATION (3.6).
COGDILL JA*	01/28/25	0.80	7601	DRAFT SLIDES FOR CONFIRMATION HEARING (0.8).
COGDILL JA*	01/28/25	1.70	7601	FACTUAL RESEARCH FOR DEPOSITION PREPARATION (1.7).
JOSHI R	01/28/25	1.00	7601	DRAFT OUTLINE TOPICS FOR EXPERT DEPOSITION (0.5); EMAILS WITH SKADDEN TEAM RE: SAME (0.5).
PAPALSKI R	01/28/25	6.10	7601	ASSEMBLE PLEADINGS FOR ATTORNEY REVIEW (0.5); ATTEND TO LOGISTICS FOR CONFIRMATION HEARING (0.5); ASSEMBLE MATERIALS FOR ATTORNEY REVIEW IN CONNECTION WITH EXPERT DEPOSITION PREPARATION (2.8); COMPILE EXPERT MATERIALS FOR ATTORNEY REVIEW IN PREPARATION FOR DEPOSITION (2.3).
ASHLEY SK	01/29/25	4.20	7601	SUMMARIZE EXPERT REPORT IN PREPARATION FOR DEPOSITION (4.2) .
ASHLEY SK	01/29/25	1.50	7601	REVIEW R. JOSHI EMAILS RE: DRAFT WITNESS OUTLINE (1.5).
ASHLEY SK	01/29/25	1.00	7601	MEET WITH A. BROWN AND RED RIVER TRIAL TEAM RE: TRIAL UPDATE (1.0).
BROWN AM	01/29/25	4.20	7601	EDIT AND SUPPLEMENT CONFIRMATION HEARING MATERIALS (2.0) AND MEETING WITH J. CARUSO RE: THE SAME (1.2); DISCUSSIONS WITH JONES DAY RE: EXPERTS (0.3); PARTICIPATE IN CONFERENCE CALL WITH A. WHITE, E. HAAS, J. KIM AND JONES DAY TEAM RE: CASE STATUS (0.7).

Case 24-90505 Document 1404 Filed in TXSB on 03/19/25 Page 28 of 43

CARUSO JA	01/29/25	8.10	7601	ANALYZE PLEADINGS TO DRAFT CONFIRMATION HEARING PRESENTATIONS (3.8); ANALYZE RELEVANT DEPOSITION AND HEARING TRANSCRIPTS TO DRAFT HEARING OUTLINES (2.3); CONFER INTERNALLY WITH SKADDEN TEAM RE: CONFIRMATION HEARING (1.0); CONFER WITH JONES DAY AND BATES WHITE TEAM RE: DEPOSITION PREP (1.0).
CHU L	01/29/25	0.90	7601	ANALYZE EXPERT REPORT IN PREPARATION FOR DEPOSITION (0.9) .
COGDILL JA*	01/29/25	1.00	7601	FACTUAL RESEARCH FOR DEPOSITION PREPARATION (1.0).
COGDILL JA*	01/29/25	2.10	7601	MEET WITH EXPERT AND BATES WHITE TEAM FOR DEPOSITION PREPARATION (2.1).
COGDILL JA*	01/29/25	0.70	7601	MEET WITH A. BROWN, J. CARUSO, AND R. JOSHI RE: STATUS OF TRIAL PREPARATION (0.7).
COGDILL JA*	01/29/25	0.40	7601	REVIEW EXPERT REPORTS IN PREPARATION FOR DEPOSITION (0.4) .
COTLER PA	01/29/25	1.00	7601	DRAFT DEPOSITION OUTLINE (1.0).
COTLER PA	01/29/25	1.00	7601	ATTEND TEAM CALL WITH A. BROWN RE: CONFIRMATION HEARING PREP (1.0) .
COTLER PA	01/29/25	4.70	7601	DRAFT EXPERT DEPOSITION OUTLINE (4.7) .
JOSHI R	01/29/25	1.80	7601	EMAILS AND CALLS WITH SKADDEN TEAM RE: EXPERT REPORT ANALYSIS, HEARING PREP, AND DEPOSITION PREP (1.8).
JOSHI R	01/29/25	5.50	7601	REVIEW REBUTTAL EXPERT REPORTS IN CONNECTION WITH DEPO PREP (5.5).

Case 24-90505 Document 1404 Filed in TXSB on 03/19/25 Page 29 of 43

PAPALSKI R	01/29/25	9.40	7601	ASSEMBLE PLEADINGS FOR ATTORNEY REVIEW (0.9); ASSEMBLE EXPERT WITNESS MATERIALS FOR ATTORNEY REVIEW IN PREPARATION FOR DEPOSITIONS (3.7); COMPILE DOCUMENTS CITED IN EXPERT REPORT (1.4); ATTENTION TO LOGISTICAL PREPARATION FOR CONFIRMATION HEARING (1.7); CROSS REFERENCE DEPOSITION NOTICES AND UPDATE DEPOSITION TRACKER (0.9), COMMUNICATION WITH COURT REPORTER RE: SAME (0.4); COMMUNICATION WITH C. BRADSHAW (B&T) RE: EXPERT MATERIALS (0.4).
ASHLEY SK	01/30/25	0.80	7601	REVIEW R. JOSHI EMAILS RE: DRAFT DEPOSITION OUTLINE (0.8).
ASHLEY SK	01/30/25	3.50	7601	REVIEW EXPERT REPORT (2.5) AND CITED MATERIALS (1.0) IN PREPARATION FOR DEPOSITION.
CARUSO JA	01/30/25	5.10	7601	ANALYZE DEPOSITION TESTIMONY AND DOCUMENT PRODUCTIONS FOR DRAFTING OUTLINES (4.1); CONFER WITH JONES DAY AND BATES WHITE TEAM RE: DEPOSITION PREP (1.0).
COGDILL JA*	01/30/25	1.30	7601	MEET WITH D. EVANS AND D. TORBORG TO PREPARE FOR UPCOMING EXPERT DEPOSITION (1.3).
COGDILL JA*	01/30/25	2.60	7601	FACTUAL RESEARCH FOR DEPOSITION PREPARATION (2.6).
COTLER PA	01/30/25	2.40	7601	DRAFT DEPOSITION OUTLINE (2.4).
COTLER PA	01/30/25	1.90	7601	DRAFT EXPERT DEPOSITION OUTLINE (1.9).
JOSHI R	01/30/25	3.00	7601	REVISE EXPERT DEPOSITION OUTLINE (2.0); SUMMARIZE EXPERT REPORT IN CONNECTION WITH DEPO PREP (1.0).

PAPALSKI R	01/30/25	3.90	7601	ASSEMBLE PLEADINGS FOR ATTORNEY REVIEW (0.8); COMMUNICATION WITH W. LIU RE: RRT PRODUCTIONS DATABASE (0.3); CROSS REFERENCE NEW DEPOSITION NOTICES AND UPDATE DEPOSITION TRACKER (0.7); ASSEMBLE PLEADINGS FOR ATTORNEY REVIEW (1.5); COMMUNICATION WITH J. CARUSO RE: EXPERT DEPOSITION SCHEDULE (0.2); COMMUNICATION WITH J. COGDILL RE: DOCUMENT PRODUCTION REVIEW MATERIALS (0.2); COMMUNICATION WITH R. HENSHAW RE: RRT DEPOSITION NOTICES (0.2).
ASHLEY SK	01/31/25	9.40	7601	DRAFT SUMMARY OF EXPERT RELATED MATERIALS (9.4).
BROWN AM	01/31/25	3.70	7601	PREPARE FOR (2.1) AND PARTICIPATE IN STATUS CONFERENCE RE: TRIAL PLANS (1.2) AND FOLLOW UP CALL WITH JONES DAY TEAM AND CLIENT (0.4).
CARUSO JA	01/31/25	4.10	7601	PREPARE TALKING POINTS FOR 1/31 CMC HEARING (2.6); ATTEND 1/31 CMC HEARING (1.5).
COGDILL JA*	01/31/25	3.30	7601	DRAFT OUTLINE MODULES FOR EXPERT DEPOSITION (3.3).
COGDILL JA*	01/31/25	1.50	7601	MEET D. EVANS AND D. TORBORG TO PREPARE FOR EXPERT DEPOSITION (1.5).
COGDILL JA*	01/31/25	1.20	7601	FACTUAL RESEARCH FOR DEPOSITION PREPARATION (1.2).
COTLER PA	01/31/25	1.80	7601	DRAFT EXPERT DEPOSITION OUTLINE (1.8).
COTLER PA	01/31/25	6.50	7601	DRAFT DEPOSITION OUTLINE (6.5).
LIU W	01/31/25	1.40	7601	ASSIST WITH PREPARATION OF THE UPDATED PRODUCTION LOG (1.4).
PAPALSKI R	01/31/25	6.00	7601	ASSEMBLE PLEADINGS FOR ATTORNEY REVIEW (1.0); UPDATE DEPOSITION TRACKER (0.6); ATTENTION TO LOGISTICAL PREPARATION FOR CONFIRMATION HEARING AND EXPERT DEPOSITIONS (2.0); ASSEMBLE MATERIALS IN PREPARATION FOR EXPERT DEPOSITIONS (2.3).
TOTAL S) LITIGATI	ON	594.10		\$389,694.10
TOTAL MATTER		601.10		\$392,410.10

Case 24-90505 Document 1404 Filed in TXSB on 03/19/25 Page 31 of 43

 $[\]ensuremath{^{\star}}$ Law clerks are law school graduates who are not presently admitted to practice.

BILL DATE: 03/13/25

BILL NO: 2022753

skadden, arps, slate, meagher & flom IIp and affiliates

RED RIVER TALC LLC GENERAL ADVICE

DISBURSEMENT	DATE	INVOICE #	VENDOR/EMPLOYEE	AMOUNT	NARRATIVE
AIR/RAIL TRAVEL (EXTERNAL) (BUSINESS TRAVEL & LODGING)	01/15/25	358126	Brown AMLawyers Travel	\$ 51.00	Vendor: Lawyers Travel Invoice#: 358126 Date: 1/15/2025 - - Service Fee 5115858725 Issued Passenger: BROWN/ALLISON MEGHAN
	01/16/25	358126	Brown AMLawyers Travel	<u>2,177.92</u>	
			TOTAL AIR/RAIL TRAVEL (EXTERNAL)	2,228.92	
OUT-OF-TOWN TRAVEL (BUSINESS TRAVEL & LODGING)	01/09/25	71679835020 72005	Brown AM	\$ 560.03	Vendor: Brown AM Invoice#: 7167983502072005 Date: 2/7/2025 - Merchant: Pendry Manhattan West; Location: New York City; Check In: 01/08/2025; Check Out: 01/09/2025
	01/09/25	71679835020 72005	Brown AM	715.70	Vendor: Brown AM Invoice#: 7167983502072005 Date: 2/7/2025 - Merchant: Pendry Manhattan West; Location: New York City; Check In: 01/08/2025; Check Out: 01/09/2025
	01/09/25	71679835020 72005	Brown AM	714.96	Vendor: Brown AM Invoice#: 7167983502072005 Date: 2/7/2025 Merchant: The Pendry Manhattan West; Location: New York City; Check In: 01/08/2025; Check Out: 01/09/2025
	01/16/25	71777951021 11607	Brown AM	112.20	Vendor: Brown AM Invoice#: 7177795102111607 Date: 2/11/2025 - Merchant: Uber
	01/16/25	71777951021 11607	Brown AM	162.00	Vendor: Brown AM Invoice#: 7177795102111607 Date: 2/11/2025 - Merchant: Uber
	01/16/25	71777951021 11607	Brown AM	10.00	Vendor: Brown AM Invoice#: 7177795102111607 Date: 2/11/2025 - Merchant: United
			TOTAL OUT-OF-TOWN TRAVEL	2,274.89	

skadden, arps, slate, meagher & flom IIp and affiliates

DISBURSEMENT	DATE	INVOICE #	VENDOR/EMPLOYEE	AMOUNT	NARRATIVE
COURT REPORTING (COURT REPORTING)	01/05/25	1350	Brown AMEvolution Reporting, Inc	\$ 1,580.40	Vendor: Evolution Reporting, Inc; Invoice#: 1350; Date: 1/5/2025 - Transcript Services (Anne Andrews)
	01/09/25	1285	Brown AMEvolution Reporting, Inc	1,200.00	Vendor: Evolution Reporting, Inc; Invoice#: 1285; Date: 1/9/2025 - Court Reporting/Videographer/Document Technician (Christopher Tisi - appearance fee late cancellation)
	01/09/25	1310	Brown AMEvolution Reporting, Inc	1,308.00	Vendor: Evolution Reporting, Inc; Invoice#: 1310; Date: 1/9/2025 - Court Reporter/Videographer (Richard Golomb late cancellation)
	01/09/25	1349	Brown AMEvolution Reporting, Inc	1,418.75	Vendor: Evolution Reporting, Inc; Invoice#: 1349; Date: 1/9/2025 - Appearance Fee - Late Cancellation - Waiting Time - Videographer/Document Technician (Richard Golomb)
	01/13/25	1323	Brown AMEvolution Reporting, Inc	5,555.80	Vendor: Evolution Reporting, Inc; Invoice#: 1323; Date: 1/13/2025 - Richard Golomb Deposition
	01/29/25	1382	Brown AMEvolution Reporting, Inc	2,536.70	Vendor: Evolution Reporting, Inc; Invoice#: 1382; Date: 1/29/2025 - Transcript Services (Witness Benedict Morelli)
			TOTAL COURT REPORTING	13,599.65	Wording
			TOTAL DISBURSEMENTS:	<u>\$18,103.46</u>	

EXHIBIT G

SKADDEN INVOICES

for the period February 1, 2025 through February 28, 2025

Skadden, Arps, Slate, Meagher & Flom IIp and affiliates

Red River Talc LLC Bill No.: 2022754 501 George Street

New Brunswick, New Jersey 08933

TIN: 13-1777230

March 13, 2025

PLEASE REMIT TO:						
By Check:	SASM&F LLP P.O. Box 1764 White Plains, NY 10602	By Wire:	In US Dollars to: Citibank, N.A., New York A.B.A. Number: Swift Code: For Credit To Account: Reference Bill No.: 2022754			
If you receive a request, via email or otherwise, to change our remittance account information, please verify that this is our intent by contacting your Skadden contact.						

FOR PROFESSIONAL SERVICES rendered through February 28, 2025 with respect to the General Advice matter.....\$76,977.60

\$76,977.60

PAYMENT DUE UPON RECEIPT.



TIME SUMMARY

RED RIVER TALC LLC: February 1, 2025 - February 28, 2025

MATTER #1 General Advice			Bill No: 2022754
NAME	RATE	HOURS	TOTAL
PARTNER			
RICHARD T. BERNARDO	\$1,844.00	1.60	\$ 2,950.40
TOTAL PARTNER		1.60	\$ 2,950.40
ASSOCIATES			
SYLVIA K. ASHLEY BRAM A. STROCHLIC	\$752.00 1,069.00	15.40 24.60	\$11,580.80 26,297.40
TOTAL ASSOCIATES	1,000.00	40.00	\$37,878.20
		40.00	Ų37 , 070.20
STAFF ATTORNEY/STAFF LAW CLERK			
BRIAN BAGGETTA	\$550.00	0.80	\$ 440.00
TOTAL STAFF ATTORNEY/STAFF LAW CLERK		0.80	\$ 440.00
PARALEGALS			
JANET B. GLICK	\$388.00	26.10	\$10,126.80
ALEX LEIBOVITZ	388.00	14.70	5,703.60
STEPHANIE E. MARTIN	388.00	7.60	2,948.80
RACHEL PAPALSKI	255.00	50.60	12,903.00
RACHEL REDMAN	388.00	1.40	543.20
TOTAL PARALEGALS		100.40	\$32,225.40
PARAPROFESSIONALS			
CAROLYNE ANDERSON	\$388.00	0.50	\$ 194.00
MARCO LI	388.00	0.50	194.00
WANDY LIU	272.00	8.10	2,203.20
RICHARD RAEZ	194.00	1.60	310.40
ALFRED M. RAUCCI	388.00	0.50	194.00
JACQUELINE D. STEELE	388.00	1.00	388.00
TOTAL PARAPROFESSIONALS		12.20	\$ 3,483.60
MATTER TOTAL		<u>155.00</u>	<u>\$76,977.60</u>

CLIENT:	273240 Red River Talc LLC	Bill Date: 03/13/25
MATTER:	1 General Advice	Bill Number: 2022754

NAME	DATE	HOURS	TASK	DESCRIPTION
H) FEE/EMPLOYMENT	APPLICATIO	NS		
MARTIN SE	02/04/25	1.30	7590	REVIEW NARRATIVES FOR NOVEMBER/DECEMBER COMBINED FEE APPLICATION FOR PRIVILEGE AND CONFIDENTIALITY (1.1); EMAILS WITH S. NOLAN AND D. WILEY RE: SAME (0.2).
MARTIN SE	02/05/25	1.30	7590	REVIEW NARRATIVES FOR NOVEMBER AND DECEMBER FOR PRIVILEGE AND CONFIDENTIALITY IN CONNECTION WITH FINALIZING MONTHLY FEE APPLICATION (1.0); MEET WITH D. WILEY AND J. RADAS RE: RETAINER STATUS (0.3).
MARTIN SE	02/06/25	1.60	7590	REVISE SECOND MONTHLY FEE APPLICATION (0.8); EMAILS WITH S. NOLAN AND D. WILEY RE: SAME (0.8).
STROCHLIC BA	02/06/25	0.60	7590	CALL WITH S. MARTIN TO DISCUSS STATUS OF FEE STATEMENTS AND RELATED MATTERS (0.6).
MARTIN SE	02/07/25	2.20	7590	REVIEW AND FINALIZE SECOND MONTHLY FEE APPLICATION (1.8); EMAILS AND COORDINATION WITH S. NOLAN AND M. WEBB RE: SAME (0.4).
STROCHLIC BA	02/07/25	2.20	7590	REVIEW INTERIM COMP ORDER AND JUDGE LOPEZ RULES (0.4); REVIEW FIRST MONTHLY FEE STATEMENT FILED BY SKADDEN IN RED RIVER CASE AND BEGIN SUMMARIZING NATURE OF WORK FOR INCLUSION IN FEE APPLICATION (1.2); REVIEW MEMO RE: STATUS OF RED RIVER RETAINER (0.2); COMPILE AND BEGIN TO REVIEW SKADDEN FEE APPLICATION PRECEDENT FROM SD TEXAS (0.4).
STROCHLIC BA	02/10/25	6.20	7590	REVIEW ADDITIONAL SKADDEN SD TEXAS FEE APPLICATION PRECEDENT AND CONFER WITH SKADDEN ACCOUNTING TEAM RE: SAME (1.1); REVIEW SECOND MONTHLY SKADDEN FEE STATEMENT AND PREPARE SUMMARY OF NATURE OF WORK PERFORMED FOR FEE APPLICATION (0.9); BEGIN TO DRAFT AND REVISE FIRST INTERIM FEE APPLICATION, INCLUDING CONTINUED REVIEW OF PRECEDENT IN CONNECTION WITH SAME (4.2).

Case 24-90505 Document 1404 Filed in TXSB on 03/19/25 Page 38 of 43

STROCHLIC BA	02/11/25	5.90	7590	CONTINUE TO DRAFT AND REVISE FIRST INTERIM SKADDEN FEE APPLICATION AND EXHIBITS TO SAME (5.9).
MARTIN SE	02/12/25	1.20	7590	REVIEW PROFESSIONAL FEES FOR JANUARY FOR PRIVILEGE AND CONFIDENTIALITY IN CONNECTION WITH MONTHLY FEE APPLICATION (1.2).
STROCHLIC BA	02/12/25	1.80	7590	FURTHER REVISE DRAFT INTERIM FEE APPLICATION (0.9); CONFER INTERNALLY RE: FEE APPLICATION (0.4); DRAFT DISCLOSURE FOR FEE APPLICATION, INCLUDING REVIEW OF PRECEDENT IN CONNECTION WITH SAME (0.5).
BERNARDO RT	02/13/25	1.30	7590	REVIEW AND COMMENT ON SKADDEN FEE APPLICATION AND COMMUNICATIONS RE: SAME (1.3).
STROCHLIC BA	02/13/25	1.40	7590	REVIEW PRO HAC RULES IN SD TEXAS BANKRUPTCY COURT AND CONFER INTERNALLY RE: SAME (0.4); REVIEW INTERIM COMP ORDER TO CONFIRM PROFESSIONAL FEE PAYMENT MECHANICS (0.2); CONFER WITH R. BERNARDO AND S. MARTIN RE: FEE APPLICATION (0.4); FURTHER REVISE FEE APPLICATION PER COMMENTS FROM R. BERNARDO AND S. BELL (0.4).
BERNARDO RT	02/14/25	0.30	7590	FINAL REVIEW OF SKADDEN FEE APPLICATION (0.3).
STROCHLIC BA	02/14/25	6.10	7590	FINALIZE OPEN ITEMS IN FEE APPLICATION AND CONFER WITH SKADDEN TEAM RE: SAME AND FILING MECHANICS (1.6); REVIEW UPCOMING FEE DEADLINES AND CONFER INTERNALLY RE: SAME (0.2); COORDINATE FILING OF SAME INTERNALLY AND WITH PORTER HEDGES AND JONES DAY TEAMS (0.8); FURTHER REVISE FEE APPLICATION AND CONFER INTERNALLY RE: SAME (3.5).
STROCHLIC BA	02/24/25	0.40	7590	CONFER INTERNALLY AND WITH KIRKLAND RE: WITHDRAWAL PAPERS (0.4).
TOTAL H) FEE/EMPL APPLICATIONS	OYMENT	33.80		\$32,196.60

Case 24-90505 Document 1404 Filed in TXSB on 03/19/25 Page 39 of 43

S) LITIGATION CO	ONSULTING			
PAPALSKI R	02/01/25	9.70	7601	ASSEMBLE MATERIALS CITED IN CERTAIN DEPOSITION OUTLINES AND PREPARE SAME FOR ATTORNEY REVIEW (2.9); TAB, INDEX, AND CITE-CHECK DEPOSITION OUTLINES (5.9); CORRESPONDENCE WITH P. COTLER RE: SAME (0.5); ASSEMBLE TRIAL WORK PRODUCT FOR ATTORNEY REVIEW IN PREPARATION FOR CONFIRMATION HEARING (0.4).
ASHLEY SK	02/02/25	5.10	7601	DRAFT DEPOSITION CROSS EXAMINATION OUTLINE (5.1).
ASHLEY SK	02/02/25	1.50	7601	ATTEND DEPOSITION WITNESS PREP SESSION (1.5).
LEIBOVITZ A	02/02/25	3.50	7601	PREPARE DEPOSITION OUTLINE (3.1) AND COMMUNICATE WITH R. PAPALSKI RE: SAME (0.4).
PAPALSKI R	02/02/25	6.10	7601	ASSEMBLE PLEADINGS FOR ATTORNEY REVIEW (0.3); RESEARCH PRIOR DEPOSITION TESTIMONY IN PREPARATION FOR EXPERT DEPOSITION (1.2); COMMUNICATION WITH COURT REPORTER RE: EXPERT DEPOSITION SCHEDULE (0.5); COMPILE MATERIALS IN CONNECTION WITH EXPERT DEPOSITIONS (2.6); UPDATE DEPOSITION TRACKER (0.7); COMMUNICATION WITH LIGHTHOUSE RE: PRODUCTIONS DATABASE (0.2); COORDINATION WITH A. LEIBOVITZ RE: DEPOSITION OUTLINE PREPARATION (0.6).
RAUCCI AM	02/02/25	0.50	7601	RESEARCH MATERIALS REQUESTED BY SKADDEN TEAM (0.5).
REDMAN R	02/02/25	0.80	7601	RESEARCH PRECEDENT IN CONNECTION WITH LITIGATION MATTER (0.6); COMMUNICATIONS WITH J. SKORUPKA RE: SAME (0.2).
ANDERSON C	02/03/25	0.50	7601	RESEARCH RE: DEPOSITION TRANSCRIPTS (0.5).
ASHLEY SK	02/03/25	2.00	7601	ATTEND DEPOSITION WITNESS PREP SESSION (2.0).
LI M	02/03/25	0.50	7601	RESEARCH CASE LAW REQUESTED BY SKADDEN TEAM (0.5).
LIU W	02/03/25	3.00	7601	ASSIST WITH PREPARATION OF THE PRODUCED DOCUMENTS REFERENCED IN EXPERT REPORT FOR CO-COUNSEL (B&T) REVIEW (3.0).

Case 24-90505 Document 1404 Filed in TXSB on 03/19/25 Page 40 of 43

PAPALSKI R	02/03/25	10.00	7601	ASSEMBLE PLEADINGS FOR ATTORNEY REVIEW (1.4); ASSEMBLE TRIAL MATERIALS FOR ATTORNEY REVIEW IN PREPARATION FOR CONFIRMATION HEARING AND EXPERT DEPOSITIONS (3.1); UPDATE DEPOSITION TRACKER (0.5); COMMUNICATION WITH K. FRAZIER (SHOOK) AND P. COTLER RE: CLAIM MATTERS (0.6); COMMUNICATION WITH K. WALL (JONES DAY) RE: DEPOSITION LOGISTICAL PREPARATION (0.4); TAB, INDEX, AND ASSEMBLE MATERIALS FOR DEPOSITION OUTLINE (2.1); ASSEMBLE WITNESS RELIANCE DOCUMENTS FOR ATTORNEY REVIEW (1.5); COMMUNICATION WITH C. BRADSHAW RE: SAME (0.4).
REDMAN R	02/03/25	0.60	7601	REVIEW CASE DOCKET AND FILINGS (0.4); COMMUNICATIONS WITH J. SKORUPKA RE: SAME (0.2).
STEELE JD	02/03/25	1.00	7601	RESEARCH CASE LAW REQUESTED BY SKADDEN TEAM (1.0) .
ASHLEY SK	02/04/25	0.80	7601	REVISE DEPOSITION OUTLINE (0.8).
ASHLEY SK	02/04/25	4.50	7601	ATTEND DEPOSITION (4.5).
GLICK JB	02/04/25	6.70	7601	REVISE DEPOSITION OUTLINE AND ASSEMBLE NEWLY CITED EXHIBITS (6.7).
GLICK JB	02/04/25	2.10	7601	VIDEO CONFERENCE WITH R. PAPALSKI RE: UPDATE ON BANKRUPTCY HEARING, LOGISTICS, AND WORK FLOW (2.1).
LEIBOVITZ A	02/04/25	0.30	7601	PREPARE KEY DOCUMENTS CITED IN EXPERT REPORT FOR ATTORNEY REVIEW (0.2); COMMUNICATE WITH R. PAPALSKI RE: SAME (0.1).

Case 24-90505 Document 1404 Filed in TXSB on 03/19/25 Page 41 of 43

PAPALSKI R	02/04/25	10.20	7601	ASSEMBLE COMMUNICATIONS WITH CERTAIN PARTIES FOR ATTORNEY REVIEW (1.4); CONDUCT PRODUCTION REVIEW (0.5); ASSEMBLE COMMUNICATIONS WITH CLIENTS DOCUMENTS FOR ATTORNEY REVIEW (1.4); CONDUCT PRODUCTION REVIEW CONTINUED (0.5); VIDEO CONFERENCE WITH J. GLICK RE: UPDATE ON HEARING, LOGISTICS, AND WORK FLOW (2.1); COMMUNICATE WITH W. LIU AND A. ST. AMAND RE: PRODUCTION (0.3); ASSEMBLE WITNESS RELIANCE MATERIALS FOR C. BRADSHAW (B&T) (2.5); COMMUNICATION WITH ATTORNEY TEAM RE: EXPERT DEPOSITION INFORMATION (0.5); ASSEMBLE AND TAB MATERIALS FOR DEPOSITION OUTLINES (1.0).
ASHLEY SK	02/05/25	0.20	7601	REVIEW DRAFT EXHIBIT LIST FROM J. CARUSO (0.2).
GLICK JB	02/05/25	2.50	7601	DRAFT TRIAL EXHIBIT LIST (2.5).
LIU W	02/05/25	1.50	7601	ASSIST WITH UPLOADING THE DOCUMENT PRODUCTION FROM AD HOC COMMITTEE (1.5).
LIU W	02/05/25	2.10	7601	ASSIST WITH PREPARATION OF THE BATES OVERLAY TO UPDATE THE AD HOC COMMITTEE PRODUCTION (2.1).
PAPALSKI R	02/05/25	10.40	7601	ASSEMBLE PLEADINGS FOR ATTORNEY REVIEW (1.2); DRAFT SUPPLEMENTAL EXHIBIT LIST FOR JONES DAY (2.1) AND CORRESPONDENCE WITH J. GLICK AND J. CARUSO RE: SAME (1.9); ASSEMBLE DEPOSITION MATERIALS FOR ATTORNEY REVIEW (3.1); COMMUNICATION WITH LCI RE: LOGISTICS AND PREPARATIONS (0.5); ASSEMBLE MATERIALS FOR REVIEW BY B&T ATTORNEY TEAM (2.1).
RAEZ R	02/05/25	0.80	7601	UPLOAD PRODUCTION VOLUME AHC-OND-006 TO SKADDEN RECORDS MANAGEMENT (0.8).
RAEZ R	02/05/25	0.80	7601	UPLOAD PRODUCTION VOLUME AHC-WATTS-005 TO SKADDEN RECORDS MANAGEMENT (0.8).
ASHLEY SK	02/06/25	0.70	7601	REVIEW EMAILS RE: DEPOSITION OUTLINES (0.7).
ASHLEY SK	02/06/25	0.60	7601	EMAIL R. PAPALSKI RE: MATERIALS IN CONNECTION WITH DEPOSITION (0.6) .

Case 24-90505 Document 1404 Filed in TXSB on 03/19/25 Page 42 of 43

GLICK JB	02/06/25	0.40	7601	VIDEO CONFERENCE WITH LCI, E. GASCOINE (KING & SPALDING) AND R. PAPALSKI RE: TRIAL LOGISTICS AND SECURITY (0.4).
GLICK JB	02/06/25	0.40	7601	CALL WITH J. CARUSO AND R. PAPALSKI RE: DRAFTING TRIAL EXHIBIT LIST AND WORK FLOW (0.4).
GLICK JB	02/06/25	4.00	7601	REVISE DEPOSITION OUTLINE AND ASSEMBLE NEWLY CITED EXHIBITS (4.0) .
LEIBOVITZ A	02/06/25	0.60	7601	PREPARE KEY DOCUMENTS CITED IN EXPERT REPORT FOR ATTORNEY REVIEW (0.5); COMMUNICATE WITH R. PAPALSKI RE: SAME (0.1).
LIU W	02/06/25	1.00	7601	ASSIST WITH PREPARATION OF THE PRODUCED DOCUMENTS REFERENCED IN EXPERT REPORT FOR CO-COUNSEL (B&T) REVIEW (1.0).
PAPALSKI R	02/06/25	4.20	7601	ASSEMBLE DEPOSITION MATERIALS FOR ATTORNEY REVIEW (2.5); ATTENTION TO LOGISTICAL PREPARATION FOR RED RIVER HEARING, INCLUDING CALL WITH LCI (0.7); ASSEMBLE DEPOSITION DOCUMENTS FOR B&T ATTORNEY REVIEW IN PREPARATION FOR CONFIRMATION HEARING (0.5); UPDATE PRODUCTIONS LOG (0.5).
GLICK JB	02/07/25	8.20	7601	REVISE CROSS OUTLINES (8.2).
GLICK JB	02/07/25	1.30	7601	CALL WITH R. PAPALSKI RE: DRAFTING TRIAL EXHIBIT LIST, TRIAL LOGISTICS AND WORK FLOW (1.3).
GLICK JB	02/07/25	0.50	7601	CALL WITH A. RUTELL (KIRKLAND) RE: TECHNOLOGY/LOGISTICS FOR TRIAL SITE (0.5).
LEIBOVITZ A	02/07/25	0.10	7601	COMMUNICATE WITH J. GLICK RE: CLAIMS RELATED MATTERS (0.1).
LEIBOVITZ A	02/07/25	0.20	7601	PREPARE KEY PRODUCED DOCUMENTS CITED IN EXPERT REPORT FOR ATTORNEY REVIEW (0.1); COMMUNICATE WITH R. PAPALSKI (K&E) RE: SAME (0.1).
LEIBOVITZ A	02/10/25	0.80	7601	PREPARE POTENTIAL EXHIBITS FOR DEPOSITION AND COMMUNICATE WITH R. PAPALSKI (K&E) RE: SAME (0.8).
LEIBOVITZ A	02/10/25	4.90	7601	PREPARE DEBTOR'S EXHIBIT LIST AND COMMUNICATE WITH J. GLICK AND R. PAPALSKI (K&E) RE: SAME (4.9).

Case 24-90505 Document 1404 Filed in TXSB on 03/19/25 Page 43 of 43

TOTAL MATTER		<u>155.00</u>		\$76,977.60
TOTAL S) LITIGAT:	ION	121.20		\$44,781.00
LEIBOVITZ A	02/13/25	1.20	7601	ORGANIZE KEY PLEADINGS FOR ATTORNEY REVIEW (1.2).
BAGGETTA B	02/13/25	0.80	7601	REVISE MOTION RE: EXPERT WITNESS (0.8).
LIU W	02/11/25	0.50	7601	ATTEND MEETING WITH A. LEIBOVITZ AND R. SCHOONEWOLFF RE: CASE TRANSITION ON VARIOUS DISCOVERY ASPECTS (0.5).
LEIBOVITZ A	02/11/25	3.10	7601	PREPARE DEBTOR'S EXHIBIT LIST AND COMMUNICATE WITH J. GLICK AND R. PAPALSKI (K&E) RE: SAME (3.1).